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Biggest margin in Tuscola

Upper Thumb says
Bush over Reagan

OIL RIG FIRE -- While owner Andy Tallman was on top inspecting the dam-
age on his oil well service rig, firemen below were making sure the last of the
fire was out. Damage in the Friday afternoon fire was estimated at $5,000. Tall-
man had the rig operating again by Saturday.

Repaired by Saturday

Friday oil well rig fire
loss set at
Damage was estimated at

$5,000 when an oil well
service rig caught fire in
Grant township Friday.

Three f i re departments
were called to extinguish the
blaze.
, Owner of the rig and oil

"^.vell was Andy Tallman of
" Caro. It was located south of

McAlpine Road, between
Farverand Maxwell Roads.

Tallman said he and his
son Alex were using a torch
to clean paraf f in out of the
pipes and it caught grease
on fire. That was about l
p.m.

The Elmwood-Gagetown

Fire Department received
the call first . Fred Sullivan
of that department said
when they annved, flames
were as high as the 50-foot
tower on the service rig.

The Elkland township and
Owendale departments were
also called. It was later
discovered the f i r e was in
Elkland's territory, though
close to the boundary of the
Gagetown depar tment .

Firemen were on the
scene a l i t t l e more than an
hour, w i t h the Owcndule
department the first to
leave.

According to Tallman, the

last t ime oil had been
pumped from the low-pro-
duction well was in 1974,
when i l became no longer
pro f i t ab le to operate.

IK' since purcii<iscc» tile
well , as higher oil prices
again make pumping prof i t -
able .

The service rig was used
to remove all the sections of
pipe in the ground, which
then had to be cleaned
before they could be rein-
stalled. He and his son had
3.300 feet of pipe cleaned and
back in the ground and only
had four 29-foot sections to
go to complete the job when

the f i re broke out .
He said the service rig was

worth about $50,000. but
es t imated damage ;i! $.xOO<).

It required some new
parts, but Tal lman had the
rig back in operation by
Saturday.

-f + -f + -M-

At 9:41 a.m. last Thursday
morning, the automatic fire
alarm at Hills and Dales
General Hospital set off the
fire siren. It was a false
alarm.

Tuscola county followed a
statewide trend Tuesday
favoring George Bush over
Ronald Reagan in Michi-
gan's basically Republican
presidential primary.

Santlac and Huron count-
ies also sided with Bush for
the Republican nomination.
Also in Sanilac, a millage
renewal in Austin township
was defeated.

In the Tuscola county
election, Bush hauled in
1,665 votes to Reagan's 1,084.
Rep. John Anderson, of Illi-
nois, whose name appeared
on the ballot even though he
is running as an inde-
pendent, garnered 210 votes.
Harold Stassen received 14
votes and Benjamin Fernan-
dez, 15. The uncommitted
space drew 39 votes.

Statewide, Bush gathered
57 percent of the vote while
Reagan got 32 percent and
Anderson, 8 percent.

In Elkland township, Bush
had 175 votes to Reagan's 98
and Anderson's 15. In Elling-
ton, Bush got 35 votes,
Reagan, 24, and Anderson
received five.

In Elmwood township, the
breakdown went Bush, 40,
Reagan, 20 and Anderson, 9.
In Kingston it was Bush, 47,
Reagan, 26, and Anderson,
three. Novesta township was
one of f ive townships to
favor Reagan, giving him 39,
Bush, 2(i, and Anderson, 1.

In addition to the presi-
dential candidates, Republi-
can voters chose delegates
to the upcoming county con-
vent ion.

In Novesta township, one
of only two townships in the
county to have a contest for
delegates. County Clerk
Elsie Hicks and her hus-
band, Gerald, were elected
with 41 and 42 votes, respec-
tively. They defeated David
and Janet Moody, with 17
and 12 votes, respectively,
who are committed to Ron-
ald Reagan. The Hicks are
uncommitted.

Delegates from Precincts
1 and 2 of Elkland township
ran uncontested and all were
elected. Attending the con-
vention from Precinct 1 will
be John Marshall, 76 votes;
Mabel Marshall, 59; Esther

Why do teachers leave Cass
City? It's too small for some

~-\ By Mike Kliasohn

Cass City may be the hub
of the Thumb, but for many
new teachers here, it defi-
nitely isn't the center of
activity.

That appears to be a
major reason why many
new teachers spend only a
few years here at most, then

Cleave.
} Another reason stems

'from the fact the teachers
are new and young.

None of the teachers and
administrators to whom the
question was asked thought
that teachers leave because
of salaries.

As expressed by a second
year teacher, the pay may
be higher in metropolitan
areas, but so is rent.

V Some teachers do leave
-the profession for higher

paying jobs in other fields,
Intermediate School Princi-
pal Bob Stickle commented.

High School Principal
Russ Richards recalled see-
ing a study that showed that
most teachers eventually

TAnnual

tribute to

seniors
See special

section

move to wi th in 50 miles of
their home towns.

In comparison to sur-
rounding school districts,
which are even smaller, the
Cass City school district has
had a higher teacher turn-
over rate, at least during the
last few years.

Including counselors and
librarians, Cass City wel-
comed 15 new staff mem-
bers in September, 1975,
nine in 1976, 16 the following
year, 21 in 1978 (plus four
more at mid-year), and 10 at
the start of the current
school year.

Present staff, including
counselors and librarians,
totals 96, so during that time
span, the number of new
teachers in a year has
ranged from roughly 10-25
percent. (Some new posi-
tions have been added in the
last couple of years).

Both Supt. Donald Grouse
and school board President
Geraldine Prieskorn feel the
high number of teachers
who started in the fall of 1978
was an aftermath of the
teacher strike that spring.

Some .teachers left be-
cause they didn't get the
support of the community
they had expected, Crouse
said. "I think they were
disappointed in the reaction
from the community."

The Chronicle has only
reported the names of new
teachers in surrounding dis-
tricts the past two years.

In September, 1978, Owen-
dale-Gagetown had six new
teachers, one of whom was
hired for one year only to
replace a teacher on leave.
Last fall, there were two

new teachers, one on a
one-year only basis at that
time. Total staff numbers 27,
so including one-year tem-
porary replacements, that's
a turnover rate of 7-22
percent.

Kingston had one new
teacher in fa l l , 1978, three
last fall, of a total staff of 38
<3-8 percent). Ubly wel-
comed four new teachers in
1978, two for the present
school year, of a staff of 56
(11-3.5 percent).

Crouse pointed out that
staff turnover isn't neces-
sarily bad. "I personally feel
the staff with a mix is good. I
think it keeps the system
more alive, between young
and more experienced
teachers."

He also said the district
does not deliberately hire
new teachers fresh out of
college, with a "but" added.

"We want to get the best
person we can," he said,
pointing out that the district
does hire some teachers
with past experience.

He added just because a
teacher has taught else-
where doesn't mean he or
she is a better teacher. Thus
if it means hiring an ex-
perienced teacher with a
mediocre record who has to
be paid $4,000 a year more,
he would rather hire a new
teacher with good credent-
ials.

The contract with the Cass
City Education Association,
pretty much standard in
education, provides that new
teachers with experience
have to be paid at the same
pay rate as teachers who
have spent the same number

of years wi th in the district.
Deciding which teachers

to hire is basically a joint
decision between the super-
intendent and the principal
of the building in which the
person to be hired will teach.
The principals conduct the
ini t ia l interviews.

WHY LEAVE?

According to one high
school teacher, who is fe-
male and single, the joke
among teachers is that the
administration is trying to
keep new teachers here by

getting them to marry local
people.

One teacher who did
marry a local man said she
might have limited her stay
here to two years, but now
that she is married, will stay
longer -- provided her hus-
band doesn't have to go
elsewhere for job reasons.

"If I wasn't married,"she
added, "I'd probably be
bored."

Boredom does appear to
be a major reason why
many new teachers don't

Please turn to page 20.

Garage sales

are success
It appears that most of the

participants in last week's
community-wide garage
sale consider the event a
success and would like to see
it continued.

Aside from giving citizens
an opportunity to get rid of
many items gathering dust
around their houses and
making a little profit, many
said they feel the sales
brought customers into Cass
City stores.

"Of course anything that
brings people into the town
is good for the town," said
Gladys Albee, of 6457 Gar-
field Sti «et.

She added that many of
the bargain shoppers
seemed to be moving

smoothly from one sale to
another.

Maps showing locations of
the sales were available
from local merchants to
assist shoppers. The maps
were printed by the Cass
City Chamber of Commerce,
who sponsored the event,
and were paid for with the $5
registration fee submitted
by persons having a sale..

The final decision will be
up to the chamber board,
according to chamber Presi-
dent Tom Herron, but he
thought it likely the organi-
zation will sponsor the event
again next year.

One suggestion Mrs, Albee
Please turn to page 20,

McCullough, 75, and Marie
Roch, 63.

From Precinct 2, four
delegates were also elected.
Jack Gallagher got 110;
Edwin Karr, 99; Maynard
McConkey, 116, and Harold
Perry, 95.

In Ellington, Elmwood,
and Kingston, no delegates
were elected since none had
filed for candidacy. No one
received write-in votes for
the positions.

Voters in all three counties
stuck with another state
trend concerning the low
number of voters that turned
out.

Of the 28,369 voters regis-
tered in Tuscola county, only
3,134 - 11 percent -- went to
the polls. It was estimated
that fewer than 700,000 votes
were cast statewide.

In Elkland township, 314of
1,924 registered voters
turned out and in Elmwood,
only 75 of 664 registered
voters did so. Of 511 regis-
tered in Ellington, 77 cast
ballots. Novesta saw 83 of its
603 registered vote. Kings-

ton had 91 of its 703 regis-
tered voters turn out.

The low turnout was due to
the fact the election was
basically a Republican func-
tion, according to Mrs.
Hicks. The Democratic pri-
mary was meaningless and
even on the Republican side,
a loss in Michigan probably
will not be a major setback
for the Reagan campaign.

The former California
governor leads Bush in the
overall delegate count by a
wide margin. In fact, with
Reagan winning the Oregon
primary Tuesday he should
have the necessary number
of delegates to be nominated
at the national convention in
Detroit this summer.

The Democratic half of the
primary meant nothing
since that party already
chose its national convention
delegates in caucuses last
month.

That led President Jimmy
Carter and Sen. Edward
Kennedy, of Massachusetts,
to withdraw from the pri-
mary. Even then, Carter

received 8 write-in votes and
Kennedy, 3, in Tuscola
county.

The only Democrats on the
ballot were California Gov.
Edmund Brown Jr., who has
withdrawn from the cam-
paign, and Lyndon La-
Rouche Jr., former chief of
the U.S. Labor Party. They
received 81 and 44 votes
respectively. A total of 101
Democratic voters were un-
committed.

SANILAC COUNTY

In Sanilac county, Bush
garnered 2,084 votes to 1,692
for Reagan. "Uncom-
mitted" received 199 votes.
Fernandez received nine
votes and Stassen got four.
Ex-President Gerald Ford
received one write-in vote.

In the meaningless Demo-
cratic primary, "uncom-
mitted" received 88 votes,
Brown, 85, LaRouche, 35,
President Carter, 21 write-in
and Sen. Kennedy, eight
write-in.

Please turn to page 20.

Supreme Court to
hear O~G appeal

The Michigan Supreme
Court will hear the appeal of
the Owendale-Gagetovvn
School District concerning
the key Goslin property
transfer case.

In a decision released
Friday, the justices of (he
state's highest court granted
the district's motion to ap-
peal the October, 1979. rul-
ing of the Michigan Court of
Appeals that the property is
now part of the Cass City
School District.

"We're back to square 1,"
said an elated Owen-Gage
Supt. Ronald Erickson,
noting that it will be the first
time the Supreme Court will
hear the district's argu-
ments concerning the school
property transfer law.

Earlier in the lengthy
legal proceedings, it had
declined to hear an Owen-
Gage appeal in the Goslin
case.

The Supreme Court
granted the district's motion
for leave to appeal, giving
its attorney, James Schou-
man, un t i l Aug. 6 to submit
briefs.

The other side has until
Sept. :i() to submit the same,

with oral arguments to be
heard in November.

How long after that the
court will issue its ruling
won't be known until it does
so. In some instances, ac-
cording to Assistant Attor-
ney Gc'iieral Gerald Young,
the court issues a ruling in a
couple of months. Some-
times it takes l-l '- years to
do so.

The importance of the
Supreme Court decision to
hear the case, he explained
is, "It's safe to say we'll get
a definite answer this time."

Young is representing the
state Board of Education in
the proceedings, which in
May, 1976, approved the
transfer from Owen-Gage to
Cass City.

The more than 40 property
owners involved had ap-
pealed after the boards of
education of the Tuscola and
Huron Intermediate School
Districts in May, 1975, re-
jected the transfer request.
The Goslin territory has a
state equalized valuation of
more than $4.2 million.

The Supreme Court is
asking that briefs be sub-
mitted responding to two

questions.
The major question is

whether state law allows the
state education board to
transfer property from one
school district to another as
long as the valuation is 10
percent or less of the "los-
ing" district's valuation.

Owen-Gage contends that
once more than 10 percent of
the original district is trans-
ferred away, as has hap-
pened, a public vote of
approval is required for all
subsequent transfer re-
quests.

The second question the
high court may address is
whether the state board
acted in an arbitrary and
capricious manner, that is,
without logical reason, in
approving the transfer.

According to Young,
Owen-Gage could lose on the
10 percent rule but still win
the case if the court decides
the state board was arbi-
trary and capricious.

The question becomes
moot, however, should the
judges rule in favor of the
district on the 10 percent

Please turn to page 20.

SHOPPERS' DELIGHT - Garage sales in Cass City
Thursday, Friday and Saturday provided lots of bargains
for shoppers. Looking for some of them in the garage of
Elaine Proctor, 4794 N.'Seeger Street, were Rev. and Mrs.
Joseph Gregory of Caseville.
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- Marriage Licenses

Merrill E. Turner, 39,
Caro, and Ann E. Austin, 26,
Caro.

Ronald B. Kuenzli, 20,
Cass City, and Jul Ann
Auten, 19, Cass City.

George W. Zsolzai, 41,
Cass City, and Suzan J.

,- -Curtis, 32, Caro.
Gene L. Gilmore, 19, Mil-

•'•'•" lington, and Catherine A.
|': 'Campbell, 19, Millington.
'f. •"' Douglas A. Karr, 22, Vas-
:;. 'sar, and Nancy J. Hayes, 20,
'•' Vassar.
.. Willis D. Childs, 21, Cass

City, and Donna M. Cox, 19,
":Cass City.

Henry L. Kester, 21, May-
"'ville, and Melinda P. Berlin,
., '17, Vassar.
; • Scott E. LaBean, 19, Mil-
." lington,-and Katerina A.
'-.Schramke, 16, Fostoria.

Donald D. Boyne, 24, Mar-
Alette, and Patricia J. Moore,
.25, North Branch.

Gerald Ford
elected to
GK board

. Former President Gerald
."R. Ford was elected May 13
' to the board of directors of

GK Technologies, Inc.
The firm is the parent

company of General Cable
,in Cass City.
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Cass City Social and Personal Items Mrs, Reva Little

Phone 872-3698

A reception in the First
Presbyterian church honor-
ing two members of the
graduating class followed
the morning worship service
Sunday. Honored were Joan
Peters and Scott Krueger.

A coffee hour followed the
morning worship service in
Trinity United Methodist
church Sunday honoring ten
members of this year's
graduating class. The group
included Timothy. Fahrner,..
John Gallagher, Sandra
Guc, Dawn and Denise
Kritzman, Tammie Root,
Andrea Barnes Shagena,
Lori Teichrnan, Kevin Wagg
and Melanie Hayes.

Rev. James Braid of San-
ford, a former pastor of
Trinity United Methodist
church, was guest speaker
at the church's Sunday
morning worship service.
Rey. and Mrs. Braid and son
Mike were guests of Mr. and
Mrs. John Marshall and the
Roger Marshalls at dinner
Sunday in the John Marshall
home and at an open house
from 2-4 p.m.

The May meeting of the
Up and Atom Farm Bureau
group was a dinner meeting
at Sullivan's in Saginaw
Monday evening. The 25th
anniversary of the group
was celebrated. Thirty-six
members attended, includ-
ing a number of charter
members.

James Karr had surgery
Friday at Beaumont Hos-
pital in Royal Oak and is
reported doing well,. _

ENGAGED

6-MONTH
MONEY MARKET

CERTIFICATE
Now Paying

8.923 %
(Minimum $10,000)

Federal regulation requires substant-
ial interest penalty for deposit wi th-
drawal before maturi ty.

Bunny Newsome

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd New-
some of Cass City announce
the engagement of their
daughter, Bunny Sue, to
Dennis John Porter.

He is the son of Mr. and
Mrs. Ralph Porter of War-
ren.

A summer wedding is
being planned.

There will be a baccalaur-
eate service Sunday at 1
p.m. in the Deford Commun-
ity church honoring 12
youths from the church who
are graduating from schools
in this area. They are:
Sheila Dunford of May ville;
Toni Levine and Gerald
Adams from Owendale-
Gagetown; Mary Savicki,
Kathy Dereszynski and
Patty Cadotte from Kings-
ton High School. From Cass

•- City High School -are Tam-
mie McKee, Patty Gilliam,
Kelly Hall, Ruth Kulinski,
Walt Connolly, Matt Smith.

Mrs. William Anker and
Mrs. Howard Loomis were
among those county Exten-
sion members who left early
Tuesday on a two-day trip to
Millersburg, Ind., where
they had dinner and re-
mained overnight. They
visited the Amish commun-
ity in that area.

Mrs. Esther McCullough
had as guests from Tuesday
through Thursday of last
week Mr. and Mrs. Stanley
E. Heron, of Pontiac.

Mrs. Juanita McKay of
Pontiac spent from Friday
until Sunday with her moth-
er, Hazel Barnes.

CASS C I T Y CHRONICLE
USPS 092-700

PUBLISHED EVERY THURSDAY
AT CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

6550 MainSlreel

John Haire. publisher
ill Advert is ing Hepresentativu,
Weekly Newspapers. Inc . 2i?
Avenue, Easl Lansmy. Mich

:I class postage p.tio at Cass

STATE
V

Nahor
Michigan
Michiyar
iyan

Sec
Lily. MIC

Subscript ion Price 1 o post oltK.es in
I uscuUi Huron iiru] SuinUic Counties,

, 5 / 0 0 .1 year or 2 ytMt-j lur $1200 .1
y.-dfi. tor S1HOO S-l 00 for si* rnonlhs
riiu 3nujntlih lor $2 K

In i.lhfcr (urlb ul ttlu U:nle(l SlaliiS.
SbUO d yiMi 01 2 yt'iirs lor $ '500 6
nionlti.j $4 SO iind 3 morllhs toi S2 !)U
'j(J cenl^ uxl'c! chjryL't] lor pdf l yeiif
order Payable in.idvdnct-

pot infoirnJIiui) (by^rdnuj nt:Asf<rt[>Mi
advert ising and coirmL-ru.d ,mu jnli
pnnling. tt;U;ptione b?i' 2010

Gillette
TWIN PACK
SPECIAL!

JGilterre

SALE PRICE

Clastic or
Contemporary
Alarm*
For your bad-tide I able
choice ot attractive tumm-

* ous d
4 cl«/i> tioll alarm 30-h

yftound movflmonts

— Blow Dryers for Guys and Gals —

— Wide Selection of Frames —

— Graduation Cards —

Mrs. Paul Craig visited
her niece, Mrs. Robert Mc-
Neil of Colwood, Tuesday in
Saginaw General Hospital
where she is a surgery
patient.

18 confirmed
«/

in Lut lie ran
ceremony

Conf i rmat ion for young
people and adu l t s was held
Sunday in Good Shepherd '
Lutheran church.

Also honored in the morn-
ing worship service were
high school graduates. A
breakfast was held in their
honor in the church fel low-
ship ha l l .

Conf i rmands were: John
Connolly, Larry Smith , Hod
ney and Linda Wrigh t , Guy
Nanney, Kyle Buschlen,
Douglas Kruse, Brian St ine .
Ron Guin ther , Todd Nurn -
berger, Peter M a r t i n ,
James LaPeer, Carolyn
Zimmer, Tiana Schulx.
Michele M i l l e r , Paula Rock-
wel l , Kris Curtis and Tonya
Haag.

Gradua tes were: Barbara
Hroecker, Gail Compo, Ken
M a r t i n , Guy Nanney. Mich-
ael Neimaii. Roberl" O'Di- l l ,
Denise Okers t rom. Richard
Powell, Werner Schul/,
Karen Stine, Dave Vargo,
Bonnie Wut /ke and Linda
Zimmer .

Leather
Billfolds

From

3.50

Graduate
given CPA
certificate

The Michigan Stale Board
of Accountancy has an-
nounced that Robert L. Hen-
nessey was granted a Michi-
gan CPA cer t i f i ca te . He has
worked for the Bay City
certified public accounting1

f i rm of Weinlander, Fil/-
hugh, Bertruleil and Schair-
erPC, since May, 1978, a l te r
graduating from Saginaw
Valley Stale College in Apr i l
of that year.

A handsome selection ol all-weather bill-
folds. Infolds, credit card cases. I.D. cases,
plus more Makes a perfect gift for the
graduate!
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BEN FRANKLIN
We bring variety to life!

Where everything you buy Is guaranteed.
Cass City

Robert Hennessey

Hennessey is involved
with various industrial and
governmental audits as well
as the firm's large tax
practice.

He is the son of Mr. and
Mrs. Daniel J, Hennessey of
Cass City and resides in Bay
City with his wife Mary and
son Matthew.

Rev. and Mrs. Eldred
Kelley served breakfast
Sunday morning to 24 guests
when they entertained nine
members of the 1980 gradu-
ating class and their par-
ents. Class members hon-
ored during the early morn-
ing worship service in Salem
United Methodist church
were: Rusty Hoag, Tim
Johnson, Earney Stouten-,
burg, Laurie Ann Hartsell,
Becky Ann Hobart, Susan
Kay-Hendrick, Susan Fink-
beiner, Gail Gutierrez and
Terri Hayashi.

Vernice Zapfe, of Flint,
her daughter and family,
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Crist-
enson and children, Annette,
Tommy and Jennifer John-
son, of Fenton were visitors
Thursday at the Lyle Zapfe
home. They were here to
attend the funeral of Keith
Horner at the Novesta
Church of Christ.

Five members of this
year's graduating class
were honored during the
Sunday morning service in
the Novesta Church of
Christ. Rev. Vern Lockard
presented Bibles to Jane
Hartwick, Lester Auten III,
Libby Hartel, Karen Speirs
and Bob Warju.

A log cabin home for Mr.
and Mrs. Larry Finkbeiner,
of Oxford, had its start
Saturday when relatives and
friends gathered at the Har-
old Campbell home in El-
l ington for a log sawing bee.
The home will be built on
Metcalf Road. Participating
in the bee were Steve and
Sherman Blomberg, of Pont-
iac, Paul Melish, of Lapeer,
Rick Clark, of Ferndale, Art
Fisher and John Shagena.
Also present was George
Evans, an employee of Mr.
Campbell. Mr. and Mrs.
Sven Blomberg, of Case-
v i l l e , the parents of Mrs.
Larry Finkbeiner. and Mrs.
George Fisher Sr. also at-
tended. Mrs. Campbell
served a noon meal.

Members of the Echo
Chapter Order of Eastern
Star wi l l observe Memorial
Sunday May 25 when mem-
bers w i l l a t t end , as a body,
the 11 a .m. worship service
in Tr in i ty United Methodist
church .

Gary Tracy, of Sanford,
N.C. . and his sister Theresa
W i l l i a m s and her children
Rebecca and Bobby, who
live in Virginia, spent
Wednesday through Friday
w i t h Mr. and Mrs. Leo Tracy
and other relatives here.
Mrs. Tracy, who had been
husp i i a l i / i ' d here, returned
lo her work in Hil ls and
Dales General Hospital
Moiu lav .

V'ickoy Meininger whose
marriage to Dennis Nye will
take place June 7 in the
Novesta Church of Christ,
was guest of honor at a
bridal shower May 13 in the
church fellowship hall.
About -10 people attended.
Hostesses were Mrs. Jack
Harlwick, Mrs. Vern Lock-
ard and Mrs. Scott Hartel.

Mrs. Lee Taylor and sons
of Whitmore Lake spent the
week end with relatives
here.

The Women's Bible Study
group from the Sutton Sun-
shine United Methodist
church met Wednesday of
last week with Mrs. Payton
Loy of Millington, formerly
from the Sutton church.
Tuesday the group met with
Mrs. Don Smale on Jacob
-Road; ---

The mother-daughter ban-
quet in the Sutton-Sunshine
United Methodist church
was held Saturday at 6:30
p.m. Mrs. Lyle Lounsbury
brought as guests: Mrs.
Jessie Goodall, Mrs. Alvin
Hutchinson and Mrs. Ernest
Beardsley. Mrs. Leslie
Lounsbury had guests: her
daughter Mrs. Joyce Schad
of Clio, her daughter-in-law,
Mrs. Tom Lounsbury and
Mrs. Larry Chandler of
Caro.

Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Louns-
bury were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Fred
Janks. The afternoon was
spent in the Lounsbury
home.

Retirees
hold May
meeting
The American Association

of Retired Persons held its
monthly meeting May 8 at
the Good Shepherd Lutheran
church fellowship hall.

Forty-seven members and
guests attended. Mary Kritz-
man gave the invocation.
Marion McClorey led the
group in the Pledge of
Allegiance. President
Charles Beckett called the
meeting to order.

Ken Jensen, administra-
tor of Hills and Dales Gen-
eral Hospital, expressed his
concern for the needs of the
senior citizens.

He pointed out the pro-
grams -- meals-on-wheels,
blood pressure readings,
diabetes classes, blood
sugar testings, and many
more services - that are
available at the hospital.

Gift packs were presented
to the members from Gift
Pax Inc. of New York.

The door prize was won by
Hawe Worstell.

Chairman elected were:
program committee, Mary
Kritzman; volunteer, Clara
Eberts; legislative, Chuck
Simon, and purchasing,
Rose Worstell.

Frankie Anker recorded
the minutes in the absence of
Helen Little, who was hos-
pitalized.

Blood pressure readings
will be taken at the June 12
meeting at the fellowship
hall from noon - 12:30 p.m.

Ralph Sousa, Marion Mc-
Clorey, Rose Worstell and
Bertha McCall will be in
charge of arrangements.

ENJOY ICE CREAM

STAY SLIM
— NOW AVAILABLE —

Soft Serve

WEIGHT WATCHERS
ICE CREAM

Try One Of Our Taste Tantalizing

SANDWICHES
•Burritos
•Tacos
•Bar-B-Q Beef
•Hamburgers
•Subs
•Ham & Cheese

• Hot Dogs or Footlongs
•Pizza Roll
•Pocket Sandwiches
•Cheeseburger
•Corn Dog
•Coney Dog

This Week's
Soft Serve
Flavor

Check Our Weekly
Flavor Specials

STRAWBERRY

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Blades
spent from May 10 through
May 14 at Branch with Mr.
and Mrs. James Pearson.

Mrs. Emma Kettlewell
spent Saturday and Sunday
at Croswell, guest of Mr. and
Mrs. Foster Cutler.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest
Beardsley spent Mother's
Day with their daughter and
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Rich-
ard Beach" at Lowell.

Donald Loomis, Mrs. Don
DeLong, Mrs. Bruce Kritz-
man and Mrs. Howard
Loomis went Saturday to
Millersburg, Ind., and were
overnight guests in the Irvin
Kritzman home and while
there attended high school
graduation where Matt
Kritzman, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Irvin Kritzman, was a
member of the class.

Memorial Day
Mass Monday
at St. Agatha

The public is invited to a
Memorial Day mass at 9
a.m. Monday in the St.
Agatha Catholic church
cemetery in Gagetown.

In case of rain, the mass
will be conducted inside the
church.

It will be conducted by
Father Joseph Morales. Cub
and Girl Scouts who belong
to the parish will participate
in the program.

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN,

Hills and Dales

General Hospital

BIRTHS:

May 12, to Mr. and Mr:
Steven Sattler of Sebewai)
a boy, Steven Joshua.

May 13, to Mr. and Mrt
Dennis Kessler of Cass City
a boy, Richard Kenneth.

May 15, to Mr. and Mrs
Blaise Posluszny of Deckei
a boy, Chad Ronald.

May 15, to Mr. and Mrsl
Joseph Male of Cass City, ;
boy, Joshua Joseph.

May 15, to Mr. and Mrs1

Roger Anderson of Deford,^
girl, Melissa Joy.

May 16, to Mr. and Mrsl
Kenneth-Mieklash of'-Gas;
City, a boy, Timothy Peter

May 18, to Mr. and Mrs
Ronnie O'Neill of Marlette, a|
boy.

PATIENTS LISTED MON-
DAY, MAY 19, WERE:

Mrs. Ethel Ridley, Mrs1

Oscar Seeley, Keri Santo';
Mrs. Mary Vader, Mrs. Max
Agar, Pamela Nieboer, Joe
Frederick, James Hewitt,
Mrs. Harvey Lamoureux,
Mrs. Harold Polega, Mrs
Clayton Turner and Mrs i
Nina Shagena of Cass City, i

Mrs, Ernest Hyatt of
Decker;

Mrs. Owen Wissner, Jose
Duron, Mrs. Amelia Hall of
Sebewaing;

Theodore Miller of Cros-
well;

Mrs. Robert Hamilton of
Caseville;

Mrs. Ernest Heck of Elk-
ton;

Clair Hosner of Kingston,
Casper Kolacz of Deford,
Mrs. Alfred Wright of

Caro;
Mrs. Linda Elliott of Bad I

Axe;
Frank Weatherhead

Gagetown.

Save '/« on specially selected bridal sets. Select your
diamond engagement ring and m a t c h i n g band
from a beaut i ful specially selected group for style and
price. Every ring is guaranteed. Use your VISA, lay-
away or terms can be arranged. Also included are
3. f ine selection of wedding bands.

Brides-to-be in our Bridal Registry
Keri Dillon

For

KARMIKEL'S
DAIRY CONE

GRADUATION
and

FATHER'S
DAY

10% OFF
ALL WATCHES

Engraving Done Free
On Watches

FINE SELECTION
•Graduation Charms

•Jewelry Boxes
• Neckchains
• Wallets
• Pocket Knives

Cass City

Learning to talk is a lot
easier than learning when
not to say anything.

McConkey
Jewelry & Gift Shop

Cass City6458 Main
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Rabbit Tracks

ByJohnHaire

(And anyone else he can

get to help) I
:̂

You know that summer is about to begin when the annual
plea is heard from the Babe Ruth league. The league is
looking for a coach. Regardless there will be a tryout
Thursday, May 22, at 5 p.m. at the park. Boys not able to
attend should contact Phil Robinson or Pete Martin.

The traditional start of summer fun time has always been
Memorial Day which comes next Monday almost a week
earlier than the May 30 date that previously prevailed.

As usual that holiday means early copy at the Chronicle.
All deadlines are advanced a day so that most of the staff
can enjoy the day, too.

Speechless department: Every newsman is familiar with
complaints and establishes ways to handle them, according
to tact and temperament.

When someone calls to express appreciation like teacher
Doug Grezeszak did this week it's hem and haw time.
Newsmen aren't experienced enough to handle kudos, just
complaints.
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35"If It Fitz.,
Solitaire in bed

By Jim Fitzgerald

I coniess. I di:;::
write this I could

•'? Tuesday. I didn't forget. I:. :'-.'..
t^e polls. Frankly I see littk ;o<

in it. The race is virtually decided and the best
vote I can conceive is not to vote for any cf the can.'

You'll be seeing a new face around the main stem and the
countryside this summer. It belongs to Jim Iseler of Harbor
Beach.

A student at Central Michigan, Iseler is interning here.
He'll be handling a variety of reporting duties with special
emphasis on the annual July 4 Festival.

The weather
Wednesday
Thursday
Friday
Saturday
Sunday
Monday
Tuesday

High

65 . . . .
70 . . . .
70
66
61
72
73

Low

. .. 30

. . . . 30

. . . .37 . . . .

. . . . 5 2 . . . .

. . . . 45

. . . .34 . . . .
. . . 38

Frecip.

. . . -38 .
0
0
0

1.02
... .13 .

0 .

(Recorded at Cass City wastewater treatment plant, i

EVERY GIRL ON YOUR GRAD
GIFT LIST WILL APPRECIATE A
SHORTS AND TOPS SET FROM
TRADE WINDS.

Come In And Browse, See The
Styles And Colors Waiting Your
Selection.

The Trade Winds
Cass City • Frankenmuth • Pigeon

Others Get Quick Results With The
Chronicle's Classified Ad-—

You Will Too!

AWARD WINNERS - Cass City Girl Scouts conducted their court of
awards last Wednesday to end the 1979-80 scouting season. Winning the
most merit badges or special honors were, front row, from left, Lynn
Weippert, 32 merit badges; Tammy Hurley, Sign of the Arrow and Sign
of the Star; Lana Harris, Sign of the Star, and Marie McDaniel, Sign of
the Star and Arrow. The four, all from Troop 929, also won the forest
ranger badge. Back row, from left, Kathy Marshall, 18 merit badges,
Troop 221, and from Troop 170, Renee Szarapski and Meg Brown, both
with 22 badges.

Memorial Day
parade Monday

SHORTS
AND
TOPS

FAMOUS

BRANDS

The Memorial Day parade
takes place in Cass City
Monday, followed by serv-
ices at the Elkland township
cemetery.

The parade will start at 10
a.m., rain or shine, at the
corner of Main and West
Streets.

Led by the military color
guard and Cass City High
School band, other expected
participants include 20-30
baton twirlers from Cass
City and Caro, Little Leag-
uers, Boy Scouts and Girl
Scouts, veterans' group
members, Elkland Town-
ship Fire Department
trucks, 4-H Junior Wrang-
lers horse club, bicycles and

antique cars.
All parade entries are

asked to assemble behind
the Gamble's store starting
at 9:30 a.m., according to
village council member
Lynda Mclntosh, the parade
organizer. Anyone who
would like to participate in
the parade is asked to be in
the parking lot there at that
time.

Many of the parade ent-
ries, especially children,
will be dropping out at
Scotty McCullough Drive,
the entrance to the park.

The remaining entries will
continue on to the vi l lage
cemetery for memorial
services. Rev. P. Thomas
Wachlerhauser of the Trin-

Elementary students
to show art work

Cass City elementary stu-
dents wi l l show the i r a r t i s t i c
talents to part-ills ami (he
publ ic May 27-Juru- :), w i t h
specific dates depending on
the school.

The approximately 070
students in grades 2-(i C2-f> at
Deford) w i l l have- on display
at least one work each tha t
they have completed during
the past school year.

At Campbell Elementary,
the showing wi l l be from
fi:3()-fi p.m. Tuesday of next
week and from 9-11 a.m. the

following day. Students from
both Campbell and the inter-
mediate school (grades 5
and ( i i w i l l show their proj-
ects.

Hours at Deford Ele-
menta ry w i l l be ( > : H ( ) - ( t p .m.
Thursday. May 29.

Evergreen Elementary
students wi l l have the i r ar t
works on display June 2
from 2-4 p.m. and the follow-
ing day from 8 a.m.-4 p.m.

Coordinat ing the shows is
elementary art teacher
Trudv Muszvnski .

Fishing is not like it used
to be. It's not as good today
as it was when I started
fishing and it wasn't as good
when I started as it was for
the generation before me.

That's only important if
you happen to be a fisher-
man. But in a larger view
it's important to all of us.
It's an indication of the ever
present erosion of our nat-
ural heritage.

There aren't many places
today where you can get
away from the inroads of
civilization and enjoy the
beauty of a pristine wilder-
ness.

In Michigan's northern
lower peninsula there is a
huge tract of land called the
Pigeon River Forest area
that includes three major
rivers and uncounted feeder
streams.

It may not be the same as
it was 100 years ago but it's
largely untouched through
much of its area.

You can get something out
of fishing the Pigeon River
that you can't find in even
the world famous AuSable or
Pere Marquette rivers.

Those great trout streams
are lined by cottages and
homes, all well kept and
attractive but as out of place
in a nature setting as the
stray deer that occasionally
wanders into a bustling busi-
ness section.

From the middle of a river
in the Pigeon forest, there's
the feeling that it's just you
and nature, nothing else.

And there's plenty of
nature around. It's the home
of elk, deer, bear, bobcat,
squirrels and an array of

birds I can't name.
That area is something

great to pass on to my kids
and for them to pass on to
theirs when the time comes.

Whether that will be pos-
sible is an open question.

Right now the battle rages
between conservationists
and oil drilling interests and
from here it appears sure
that oil is winning.

There will be drilling in
the Pigeon River area. The
story that the Department of
Natural Resources tells is
that when the oil is extracted
the land will return to its
original state.

Today the oil interests are
severely restricted in where
and how they can drill.

Maybe my fears are
groundless. Maybe future
generations will enjoy what
we have today. Maybe.

If hardtop roads to accom-
modate oil tankers replace
the dirt trails there today or
new roads cut into the heart
of the wilderness area, the
area loses a little more of its
magic.

And it is magic, you know.
That feeling of peace and
pure contentment that
comes from soaking in what
the area has to offer.

It's so great that it's
almost immaterial that the
fishing isn't really all that
good any more. You know
that before you go.

Don't count on taking
home any meat for the table.
Count on collecting all that
the area has to offer and rest
easy knowing that, at least
for the present, the supply is
inexhaustible,

ity United Methodist church
wi l l be delivering the mes-
sage. Master of ceremonies
for the 21st year wi l l be Jack
Esau.

Elkland Township Super-
visor Jack Gallagher is in
charge of arrangements for
the memorial service.

The husband was awak-
ened by a soft, erotic "slap,
slap, slap" sound coming
from the other side of the
bed. He opened an eye to see
what the wife was doing. She
was putting the reds on the
blacks, and vice versa.

"Why are you playing
solitaire in bed?" he asked.
"Is it something we should
talk about?"

The husband reads Dr.
Joyce Brothers and the
other pop psychologists. He
knows the principal reason
for domestic discord is a
lack of communication be-
tween partners, especially
in the bedroom. As Ann
Landers once put it: "Tell
him what you want, Honey,
otherwise how is he going to
know?"

"Why didn't you tell me
you wanted to play cards in
bed?" the husband asked.

"I didn't think it was any
use. You never play cards
with me anywhere," she
said.

The husband couldn't deny
it. Early in their marriage,
she had persuaded him to go
to bridge school and then to
form a bridge club with
several classmates. Up until
then, he had played nothing
except poker and euchre. He
had always thought card
games were social events
calling for a steady flow of
wit ty conversation and
booze. He was dismayed to
learn that bridge players are
silent frowners, crazed by
the fear of losing, who worry
too much about getting the
cards wet. He refused to
attend the second meeting of

the bridge club and all
meetings held thereafter.

That happened almost 25
years ago but the wife is still
sore about it. She complains
that the husband didn't an-
nounce his defection from
the bridge club until the very
night of the second meeting,
thus leaving their host with
two empty seats and no time
to find substitutes. She says
this horrendous gaffe fur-
nished her friends with con-
clusive proof that she mar-
ried an ignorant slob.

The husband's defense is
that she should have known
he wouldn't attend the sec-
ond meeting of the bridge
club because of what he had
said immediately after the
first one. He had told her
he'd rather die than ever
play bridge again. She says
he should have been more
specific. He sobs a lot.

Ever since the husband
quit the bridge club, the wife
has punished him by exag-
gerating his crime. Without
actually saying it, she has
continually accused him of
refusing to ever play any
type of card game with her
while he often goes out to
play poker with the boys.
She has a sneaky talent for
making this type of charge
without using precise lan-
guage the husband can re-
fute. For instance, she an-
nounced the birth of their
third child by telling every-
one she finally had a fourth
at home.

But playing solitaire in
bed was something she had
never done before. The hus-
band feared a double-edged

complaint. In her silent
manner, was she not only
saying that she had to play
cards alone, but also that
she might as well do it in
bed?

"We have to talk," he
said. "What is it you're
trying to tell me?"

"I can't sleep," she said.
"There has to be more to it

than that. If I told Dr.
Brothers I woke up. to find
my wife playing solitaire in
bed, she would say we
should make love on a
bridge table. She would say
we should open communica-
tions concerning your real
feelings toward me. She
would say that deep down,
beneath your placid exter-
ior, you have suppressed
feelings. Any brilliant psy-
chologist could tell you that
you're missing a fulfilled life
because you refuse to recog-
nize that your husband is a
handsome, exciting man. He
is not boring."

The wife was beginning to
nod off.

The husband sensed their
marriage had reached a
crossroad. In fact, he
thought he heard traffic. She
was snoring.

That's when he made his
move. He rolled to her side
of the bed and took her in
both arms, and shook her.
Her eyes opened.

"We have to talk," he said
again.

"Say whatever it is you
want to say," she said.

"You put a red six on a red
seven," he said.

3 DAYS ONLY!
THURSDAY - FRIDAY - SATURDAY

on Glidden BEST Paints and Stain

-BEST OUAUTY.

house
paint

Glidden FAMOUS Latex Flat
Wall Paint

Beautiful, f lat finish
Scrubbable, stays colorfast
Easy water clean-up

SALE PRICE

Glidden BEST Latex Flat
House Paint
• Dries quickly, durable flat finish
• Resists blisters, peeling, cracking
• Easy water clean-up

SALE PRICE

$1099 Sugg. Reg.
$13.99

SQ999
Gal.

Gal.
Sugg. Reg

$16.99

SPRED OIL SOLID STAIN

$799Reg. $12.99 V f & &

Gal.

SPRED TRIM
HOUSE PAINT

Reg.
$17.99

SAVE

$5.00

1099
Gal.

The Paint Store
Cass City Phone 872-2445
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Lewis Spencer also an artist
CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Ex-yacht captain bails' rare sports car
Lewis Spencer is probably

the only ex-yacht captain
living in the Cass City area.

He definitely is the only
Swallow Doretti owner in

this area. Few of the English
sports cars were made 26
years ago and even fewer
made it across the ocean to
this country.

GETTING INTO the Swallow is a
tight squeeze. The door is narrow and
as evidenced by the height of the seats,
the driver and passenger sit low to the
ground.

DEERING PACKING
1 Mile North, Vz Mile East Of

Silverwood at 4608 E. Mayville Road

FRESH COUNTER MEATS
CHECK OUT PRICES ON

• LAMB x> PORK »xVEAL
^ BEEF HALVES AND QUARTERS

FOR BUSINESS TRUCKING AND
SLAUGHTERING CALL 517-761-7073

Spencer and his wife,
Helen, came here about a
year ago from Fort Lauder-
dale, Fla., where for about
the previous 20 years he
earned a living as a captain
of privately-owned yachts.

His last job was to be in
charge of a 90-footer, owned
by a Pontiac dealer.

Mrs. Spencer is a native of
this area. She and her
husband have been married
15 years, having met in
Florida.

A desire to return to this
area, plus an offer from her
brother, Gary Deering, a
carpenter, to help them
build a house, led them to
move here.

The Spencers now live in
their new house on Seeger
Road, northeast of Cass
City, down the road from her
parents, Ed and Vera Deer-
ing.

Spencer was born at Stat-
en Island, N.Y., but has
lived most of his 50 years in
Florida. He did live for a
time in California and Ne-
vada.

He attended then Michi-
gan State College for a year,
the result of his having met
some Michiganians in Flor-
ida, and worked on a high-
way project south of Kala-
mazoo after leaving MSC.

He learned to pilot boats in
the Navy, which led to his
career as a yacht captain.

HE ALSO IS A TAL-
ented artist, having sold
many of his paintings in
Florida, having had them
displayed at one-man shows
and written about in maga-
zines in that state.

Spencer also has a pen-
chant for owning and work-
ing on cars, usually foreign
and usually sports cars of
1950s and '60s vintage.

The Swallow Doretti and
1964 Mercedes-Benz sedan
that sit in his garage are the
latest examples.

He usually buys the cars
fairly inexpensively, fixes
them up and drives them
around a few years and then
sells them for a profit.

Since moving here, ho has
done some house painting
and furni ture refinishing,
hopes to reestablish his
painting for art career and is
willing to take on a car
restoring project for some-

one for the right price.
Mrs. Spencer is a recep-

tionist at General Cable.
WHAT CARS HAS

Spencer owned? With the
help of his wife, he starts
counting.

He bought a 1950 Alfa-
Romeo coupe (made in
(Italy) and later traded it
for a Mercedes-Benz 230SL
(German) sports car. He
later owned another 230SL
and now the present sedan.

There have been three
Jaguar sports cars, a 1953
MG TD and a 1957 Bentley
sedan (all English made).

The Swallow was made in
England in 1954, the only
year they were produced.

No one knows apparently
how many were made, but
Spencer guesses about 50.

THE SWALLOW WAS IN-
troduced about the same
time as two other English
sports cars that became
very popular in this country,
the Austin-Healey and the
Triumph TR-2, and the
transplanted Floridian
speculates the Doretti (Ital-
ian for Dorothy) proved
unable to compete in the
market place.

The car used the same
engine, gearbox, rear axle
and some front suspension
parts as the TR-2 and was
imported into this country
by the then Standard-
Triumph Motor Co.

Its four-cylinder 90 horse-
power engine gives it a top
speed of about 100 miles per
hour. In overdrive fifth gear,
the car can get 35 miles per
gallon on the highway.

The Swallow Coachbuild-
ing Co. before World War II
built car bodies for Jaguar
and Austin, another English
firm. After the war, it made
motorcycle sidecars. The
Doretti was apparently the
first and last car it built on
its own. The firm is appar-
ently no longer in business.

SPENCER BOUGHT THE
car f ive or six years ago
through an agent from its
original owner in Fort Laud-
erdale.

The car was well cared
for, to the extent that in the
owner's garage, it was al-
ways kept parked on a
carpet.

He has done some work on
the car, refinishing the wood

dash, dying the convertible
top a different color, having
the seats reupholstered and
installing wider wire wheels
to soften the ride.

The car has a stiff sus-
pension. "It corners pretty
much like a race car,"
Spencer said.

For that reason, Mrs.
Spencer adds, the car isn't
very comfortable to ride in.
"You hit those bumps on
M-81 going into town," she
said, gesturing with her
hands to indicate how the
car--and those in i t-- jar at
each bump.

THE CAR WAS NICE
for the warm top-down
climate of Florida, but in
Michigan, it isn't. Dirt
roads, snow and" salt don't
take too kindly to a car in
mint condition. For that
reason, plus the money
would come in handy, the
car is with regrets for sale.

The port of entry price for
the car back in 1954 was
$3,295. Spencer bought his
for about $3,000.

He's hoping to recoup his
investment and then some,
but is asking for nowhere
near the $10,000 he heard one
was selling for in California.

That car and one in Illinois
are the only other Dorettis
he knows of in this country,
though he guesses there may
be a few more.

Being such a rare car,

Spencer gets a lot of queries
as to what it is. The usual
guesses are an Austin-Healy
or an MG.

If he tells them it's a
Swallow Doretti, the usual

response is a "what's that?"
For that reason, if he

doesn't feel like talking, he
explained with a smile, "I
tell them it's an MG and
they're satisfied "

LEWIS SPENCER and his mint condition 1954 Swallow
Doretti. The car has about 65,000 miles on the odometer. It
is powered by a four-cylinder, 90 horsepower engine.

STILL TIME TO PLANT - FREE SEED
STILL AVAILABLE

FREE

ILLINOIS

EXTRA SWEET

SWEET

CORN SEED
The best you've ever tasted - yours for

the asking from the friendly folks at Thumb
National - free and without obligation,
of course.

Cass City Office

Thumb National Bank
and Trust Company

6128 E. Cass City Road

Phone 872-4311
. FREE CHECKING - NO MINIMUM, NO SERVICE CHARGE

HOURS: Mon.-Thurs. 9-4 — Fri. 9-8 — Sat. 9-12

SPECIAL OLYMPICS -- Cass City Jaycees will be paying expenses
for Cass City High School students competing in the state Special
Olympics at Central Michigan University June 5-7. Presenting the ex-
pense check last Thursday to Dean Keyser, with chapter members
looking on, was Jaycee President Jim Turner. Dean took first place in
his age group in the May 9 district Special Olympics and will be going
to CMU along with Cecil Randall, at right, first in frisbee, and Ricky
Hoag, not present, first in softball throw and second in 220 meter run.
Second from right is Jess Deatherage, first in long jump, ball throw
and 400 meters, who as a junior high student, won't be going to CMU.

Keeping cold air out

Lots of leaks can

be easily sealed
A house is like a ship float-

ing in a sea of air. The air
tries to force it's way in, like
water, through every crack.
In winter, the cold air that
leaks in has to be heated,
and it forces other, already
heated air to leak out. Here
are two suggestions from
the U.S. Department of
Energy for keeping hot and
cold air where they belong.

More Holes
In Your Pocket

When people think of
caulking and weatherstrip-
ping, they generally think of
windows and doors. But
most energy studies find
that only 20 percent of that
costly infiltration comes
through these places. The
other 80 percent gets in
underneath the baseboards,
through wall outlets,
through holes where plumb-
ing pipes and telephone

wires enter the house,
through holes around ex-
haust fans, around dryer
vents, and around sink and
bathtub drain pipes as they
exit from the house. These
gaps and holes should all be
caulked or stuffed with insu-
lation. The electrical outlets
can be sealed with inexpen-

sive gaskets that can be pur-
chased at hardware stores.

Turn off the electrical cur-
rent switch for the outlets in
question, remove the plastic
cover plates with a screw-
driver, insert the gaskets, re-
attach the plates, and turn
the current back on.

Don't Duck
the Ductwork

Where your heating and/
or air-conditioning ducts
pass through the living areas ,
of the house, there is no:
need to insulate them.

Where they pass through :
unfinished attics or base- :
ments, they are an impor- ',
tant cause of money loss.
Covering ducts can save up
to $100 a year in heating
costs and $35 in central air-
conditioning costs.

The most inexpensive ap-
proach is to use 2-inch foil-
backed insulation and to do
the ducts yourself, remem-
bering to keep the foil facing
outward. It is most important
to seal the cracks between
each section of ducting with
flexible caulk before you add
the insulation. Hidden air
leaks coming from these
cracks can limit the effec-
tiveness of the insulation.

Encircle the ducts with
insulation. Use duct tape to
seal all the. cracks between
each section of insulation,-
and also seal the seam
where each piece of insula-̂
tion joins itself.
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PEDALING AROUND

Carter and
the Cubans

By Mike Eiiasohn

Hazardous house
must be fixed
or torn down

My liberal conscience
bothers me to write this, but
here goes.

President Carter screwed
up by letting the Cuban
refugees into this country.

What he did also illu-
strates why he is screwed up
as president.

Unfortunately, I can't
stand Ronald Reagan, so I
have no doubt I will vote for
Carter come November.

I am writing this on Thurs-
day. Come Tuesday, I will
vote for George Bush in the
Republican primary, but I
don't really think my vote
will do any good.

Even if every political poll
showed Reagan would be

' clobbered by Carter and
Bush would win, the Repub-
licans would still nominate
Reagan. They would rather
be right than have their man
as president.

Back to Carter and the
Cubans.

Remember a month or so
ago, when Fidel Castro first
said he would let Cubans
leave who wanted to.

Carter said those bringing
the Cubans here would be
violating the law and we
would seize their boats.

Only a few days later, he
changed his mind and said
we would welcome the
Cuban refugees.

Last week, he changed his
mind again -- sort of. He told
Castro that if he would allow
U.S. personnel to be sta-
tioned in Cuba to screen
those who wanted to leave,
this country would provide
the planes or ships to bring
them here.

The president ordered a
halt to further individual
efforts and said any boats
involved in transporting ref-
ugees would be seized with
their owners or captains
subject to prosecution.

Castro, of course, rejected
'Carter's proposal, which
meant a hal t -- as of this
writing - to further emigra-
tion from Cuba.

That left untold thousands
of Cubans, having left their
homes and given up their
belongings, stranded on the
docks in Cuba. What hap-
pens to them now? They will
be refugees in their own
country, hated by the gov-
ernment and its supporters.

Since the boat l i f t started
about a month ago, more
than 50,000 Cubans have
come here. Like a lot of
Americans, I wonder how
we are supposed to find jobs
for them when we have
hundreds of thousands of our
own cit izens out of work.

Our unemployed, through
no fault of their own, are

swelling our welfare rolls.
Many of the Cubans will also
end up on welfare. So long to
a balanced budget.

I also object to the incon-
sistency of it all.

If you are a refugee from
Communism, we will let you
into this country. But if you
are only a refugee from
poverty, that is, from Mex-
ico, or from poverty and a
harsh non-Communist dic-
tator in Haiti, you are not
welcome and, at least in the
case of the Mexicans, we
will send you back.

The Haitians are appar-
ently being allowed to stay,
ut as shown on the NBC
ews last week, up to now,

they have received lesser
treatment than the Cubans.
(One suggested reason is
because they are black.
Carter did say last week
they will now be given equal
treatment.)

The United States has
always been the land of
opportunity for the op-
pressed from elsewhere, and
I would like to think we
should continue to do so, but
somehow, it seems like there
have to be some kind of
limits.

Meanwhile, the only win-
ner in this is Fidel Castro.
He has gotten rid of a lot of
his problems while creating
new ones in this country.

Circuit Judge Patrick R.
Joslyn Monday gave Mar-
garet McNeil 10 days to have
her dilapidated house
"made safe."

8-year-old

injured by

knife in eye
An 8-year-old Deford boy

is home from Bay Medical
Center in Bay City after
being treated for an eye
injury he received Friday
evening.

Garold Peasley, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Ray Peasley, of
Shabbona Road, was cutting
twine from a bale of hay
when the knife he was using
slipped, striking him in the
eye.

Garold was taken to Hills
and Dales General Hospital
and later transferred to Bay
Medical.

Mrs. Peasley said her son
was released Monday after-
noon and has not been
complaining of any pain. She
added the family is waiting
for the results of tests taken
while he was at the center.

She said she would not
know the seriousness of the
injury until the test results
came back.

If not, it will be torn down.
The covered basement

structure is located at the
corner of Houghton and
Brooker Streets in Cass City
and hasn't been used in
many years. Mrs. McNeil is
now a Pontiac resident.

According to assistant
Prosecutor David Myers,
who handled the case Mon-
day for the county Depart-
ment of Public Works
(DPW), Mrs. McNeil ad-
mitted to the judge that the
home is a hazard, but that
she couldn't afford to fix it.

If she doesn't comply with
the judge's order to make
the home safe, Myers said,
the DPW will then solicit at
least three bids to have the
home torn down, the bid
being awarded to the lowest
bidder.

The cost of having the
structure torn down will be
billed to Mrs. McNeil.

HOSPITAL TOUR -- In conjunction with National Hospital Week last week,
first graders from Campbell Elementary School toured Hills and Dales General
Hospital. These were some of the members of Polly Pakonen's class viewing
the laboratory.

Circuit Court News

Caro man sent to prison
for sexual misconduct

State cops get

more gas money
Approval by the appropri-

ations committees of the
House and Senate in Lansing
Tuesday of a $1.7 million
transfer to the state police
for gasoline will get troop-
ers' patrol cars back on the
road.

At the Caro state police
post, the cars were never off
the road, according to Lt.
Ken Maciejewski, the post
commander.

Because the state police
had used up their appropri-
ation for the fiscal year for
gasoline, some posts had
eliminated all routine pa-
trolling, sending out their
cars only for emergencies.

The problem was that the
legislature had based its
appropriation for gasoline
for the 1979-80 fiscal year on
a cost of 54 cents per gallon,
not the present 96 cents to
SI.02 per gallon.

STRAND-CARO
Iftfone 673-&K33

TWO ADMITTED
FOR $2.50 on

MON. and TUES.

STARTS FRIDAY MAY 23rd
AN EXCLUSIVE FIRST RUN ENGAGEMENT!
AMERICA'S NO. 1 BOX OFFICE HIT!!
Fri. and Sat. Feature @ 7:15 and 9:40
Sunday Feature @ 3:00-5:18-7:36-9:46
Mon. thru Thurs. Feature @ 7:10 and 9:28

u 'Coal Miner's Daughter'
is an achievement
in American cinema."

The posts that were in the
worst shape, Maciejewski
said, were those whose fuel
storage tanks ran dry about
the same time the money
ran dry.

At Caro, however, the post
has a large underground
storage tank and had plenty
of gasoline, so patrols never
had to be curtailed.

Like at all posts, patrol
cars are parked for 15
minutes every hour, but that
is a fuel conservation meas-
ure that goes back to before
the present problem de-
veloped.

The Caro post, Maciejew-
ski said, also stopped allow-
ing other state departments
to fuel their cars from its
storage tank, which many
other state police posts have
also done.

For the first t ime, U.S.
cotton exports may exceed
domestic use this year, pre-
dicts the Department of
Agriculture.

A Caro man was sent-
enced in Circuit Court Mon-
day to 40 months to 15 years
in the State Prison of South-
ern Michigan at Jackson for
criminal sexual conduct
(2nd degree).

Norman L. Parkin, 40, of
1297 S. Mertz Road pleaded
guilty to the charge March
17, the incident having oc-
curred Feb. 26. He was
credited with 95 days
served.

Sentence was pronounced
by Judge Patrick R. Joslyn.

Also Monday before the
judge:

Virgil C. Hall , 17, and
Bruce E. Cain Jr., 18, both of
4401 W. Saginaw Road, Vas-
sar, both pleaded guilty to a
charge of attempted grand
larceny.

Their pleas were accepted
and bond continued unt i l
sentencing July 21.

Their guilty pleas were
made in a plea bargain w i t h
the prosecution, they having
been originally charged wi th
breaking and entering an
unoccupied dwel l ing .

They pleaded g u i l t y to
having taken 11 car radi-
ators, worth more than Slild,
from Lee's Salvage March
25 in Vassar township.

Donald R. Hodge. 41, of
Silverwood, stood m u t e to a
charge of felonious assault ,
of having assaulted John
Shafor wi th a kn i fe March 27
in Mavville.

Huhiird I Iri ' i i ic'r. ('(isiniipnlitiin Magazine

"Sissy Spacek gives a virtuoso performance."
Newsweek
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CASS CASS
CITY

Thursday thru Sunday (4 Days)
May 22 • 23 • 24 - 25

Thursday "Bargain Nile" $1.50 -- 8:00 Only
Friday - Saturday - Sunday Evenings

"Mr. Toad" 7:30 & 9:25
"Lady & Tramp" 8:10 Only

DOUBLE DISNEY FUN

One of the all-time great love stories

A MEMORABLE
AK1MATION MASTEBP1EC1

'ECHNICOLORV CINEMASCOPE », ,,i,.,.,ib»iiui:nA VISTA MSTOBUTION co

If

PLUS 2ND DISNEY HIT

The Madcap Adventures
Off Mr. Toad"

STARTS WEDNESDAY
MAY 28 (7 Days)
Academy Award Winner

"Kramer vs. Kramer"

A plea of innocent was
entered and pretrial hearing
scheduled June 2. Bond was
continued.

The motion of James G.
Pratt, 22, of 2360 Swaffer
Road, Millington, to with-
draw his plea of no contest to
a charge of attempted resist-
ing or obstructing a police
officer was granted.

He had made the plea
March 13, having been
charged with trying to run
over Deputy Arthur Adam
with a farm tractor Oct. 13 in
Watertown township.

Wi l l i am W. Brown, 19, of
704 W. Huron Road, Vassar,
stood mute to two charges of
ut te r ing and publishing, of
having wr i t ten two falsified
checks totaling $472 in
March , drawn on the First
State Bank of Saginaw.

Pleas of innocent were
entered wi th pre-trial hear-
ing scheduled June 2. Bond
was cont inued.

J l I X i K C I . K . M K N T S

Monday before Circui t
Judgi1 M a r t i n K. Clements:

Roy I , . (Biddings . 2f>, of
5591 Scotch Road. Vassar.
was placed on two years'
probation for larceny in a
building.

He was also sentenced to
lid days in the county jail ,
wi th credit given for one day
served, f ined $100, assessed
$150 court costs and ordered
to pay $105 res t i tu t ion.

ile pleaded guilty April 21
ID hav ing taken money on or
about Feb. 23 from Vassar
High School.

Michael Morgan, 18, of
5546 Swaffer Road, Vassar,
was also placed on two
years' probation for larceny
in a bui lding.

He was sentenced to 54
days in the county ja i l , with
credit given for 54 days
served. He was f ined $100,
assessed $150 court costs
and ordered to pay restitu-
tion of $5.05. He was also
ordered to attend an alcohol
abuse program.

Man ticketed
in accident
Sunday night

Randell L. Hiatt, 30, of
4876 Milligan Road, Cass
City, was ticketed by sher-
i f f ' s deputies on a charge of
violation of the basic speed
law (speed too fast) after an
accident Sunday.

Officers reported he was
northbound on Cedar Run
Road at 11 p.m. when he
failed to negotiate a right-
hand curve.

The car went off the left
side of the road, hit soft
ground and rolled over onto
its lop.

The accident happened at
11 p.m. in Elmwood town-

ship.
At 7:40 a.m. Friday, ac-

cording to deputies, Arnold
H. Sticken, 56, of 7689 Can-
boro Road, Owendale, was
westbound on Bay City-
Forestville Road, east of
Richie Road, when his ve-
hicle struck a deer.

Diann Freeland, 33, of
Caro, was westbound on
Deckerville Road, east of
Dodge Road, at 9:40 p.m.
deputies said.

He pleaded guilty to the
charge April 21, of having
taken two six-packs of beer
from Van's Market in Vas-
sar Feb. 29.

Elmer R. Castle, 19, of
4181 East Street, Akron,
stood mute to a charge of
larceny in a building, of
having stolen cash and
checks April 23 from
Churchill's Bar in that com-
m u n i t y .

A pretrial hearing was
scheduled June 2. Bond was
continued.

DISTRICT COURT

Gary L. Zellar, 25, of Caro,
was arraigned Monday be-
fore District Judge Richard
F, Kern on a charge of
possession of a controlled
substance.

The judge ordered him
released on S5.ooo personal
recognizance bond and
scheduled a pretrial hearing
May 27, prel iminary exami-
na t ion June 6.

Zellar was arrested by
C'aro police on a warrant
Saturday, charging him with
possession of phenylcyclo-
lu-xyl ethylamine <P 'CE>.

Cellar's pickup was
stopped by Cass City police
early April 19 on M-81 in
Ellington township, while
they were returning from
assisting another police
agency and spotted his ve-
hicle being driven erratical-
ly .

The substance he is
charged with possessing was
found in a small plastic
container they found on the
road behind his stopped
truck. Zellar was released at
that time, pending identi-
fication of the substance by
the state police laboratory.

Also Monday, Scott R.
Ackerman, 23, of 4677 Ken-
nebec Drive, Cass City, was
sentenced to five days in the
county jail for indecent ex-
posure.

He pleaded guilty to the
charge May 6, the incident
having occurred April 3 in
Cass City.

Three days of the sentence
were served starting Mon-
day, the final two starting
May 26.

CAROPRIVE-IN
Phone: 673-2722

Guest Nights
Mon.& Tues.

2 for $2.50

WEDNESDAY thru SATURDAY MAY 21 - 24

WEDNESDAY NIGHT ONLY

ALL ADM. $1.
FONDA LEMMON PACINO

BEST
ACTOR

BEST
ACTOR

ALPACINOi

AND
JUSTICE

FOR
ALL

SUNDAY-MONDAY-TUESDAY MAY 25-26-27

FastS
Economical

thats
gas grilling.

A Warm Morning Gas Grill is ready to
barbecue when you are. Your local
office of Southeastern Michigan Gas
Company has several models to
choose from for your outdoor cooking
needs.

VISA, Master Charge
or use our convenient payment plan

Hours 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. (Monday thru Friday)

Southeastern Michigan Gas Company
Sandusky: 648-2333

Check your telephone directory for a toll free number for your area.
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Eastern Star plans more card parties
CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, MAY 22,1980

Echo Chapter, Order of
the Eastern Star, held its
May 14 meeting with 45
members present.

A report was given on the
card party. There were 14

tables. The hope is to have
more card parties in the fall.

Members will be going to
the Trinity United Methodist
church May 25 at 11 a.m. as
a group.

Want Help Finding What You |

Want? Try The Want-Ads Today! j

Herman Umpfenbach an-
nounced the Cass City Coun-
cil of the Masonic lodge will
hold a family night May 27.

After the meeting, Jello
and sandwiches were served
in the dining room by Elmer
and Janet Francis, Harold
and Helen McGrath, Leo and
Dolly Tracey, Clayton and
Luella Root, Helen Agar,
Lois Binder and Effie Stev-
ens.

Gagetown Area News Harold Koch

Phone 665-2536

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Koch
and Janet, Mr. and Mrs.
Franklin Koch and Karen
and Rick and Deb Seibel
were in the Mikado Pine

River area picking mush-
rooms Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Francis
Hunter of Grosse Pointe
Woods spent the week end

with Mr. and Mrs. William
C. Hunter.

Mrs. Lucille LaFave, Mrs.
Jeanine Hobart and Mrs.
Elaine Seibel attended the

Best Wishes
Blount Agriculture

Robin Sullivan, vaieaictoiian
Well Done

Gagetown Oil & Gas

Peter KlemKowsky

Success
George's Bar

KirkCarolan
Success

Gagetown Oil & Gas

DebGellel
Good Luck
Kelly's Market

Richard Powell

Well Done
Evans Products Co.

Ed Grates

Best Wishes
Farmers & Merchants

Bank

Jell Mallock

Good Luck
Farmers & Merchants

Bank

lammy Kain

Well Done
Farmers & Merchants

Bank

Sandra Karg

Sesf Wishes
Farmers & Merchants

Bank

Jean Kubiak

Best Wishes
Wickes Agriculture

Owendale

Kevin McPhail

Congratulations
Evans Products

Tom Menzel

Well Done
Sohigro Service

Center

Tracy Mitchell
Success

Evans Products

i »

V-
Sue Murdwbki

Good Luck
Evans Products

Joe Wooa

Best Wishes
LaFave Steel

Dan VVaracK

Congratulations
Gagetown Oil &Gas

Todd Nowaczyk
Success

Sohigro Service
Center

Lori Mandich

Well Done
Wickes Agriculture

Owendale

Becky Parker

Best Wishes
Wickes Agriculture

Owendale

Carol Parker

Good Luck
Petrolane Gas Service

Alan Haag

Congratulations
Petrolane Gas Service

John Rellord

Well Done
Farm Bureau

Jay Rlchez

Success
Farm Bureau

Kathy Rocheleau

Best Wishes
Nicky's Beagio

Kris Rocheleau

Good Luck
Blount Agriculture

Chris Russell
Congratulations
George's Bar

JohnCrandall

Well Done
Cass City Chronicle

Gerald Adams
Success

Cass City Chronicle

Linda Zimmer

Best Wishes
Farm Bureau

Donna Salcido
Best Wishes

Kelly's Market

Brad Erickson

Congratulations
Nicky's Beagio

Dawn Wissner

Well Done
Nicky's Beagio

Rosemarie Salcido
Success

Ruthie's Hair Hut

Delberl Vargo

Well Done
Cass City Chronicle

Carol Goslin

Congratulations
Nicky's Elbow Room

Brian Volz
Best Wishes

Ruthie's Hair Hut

Scott Wissner
Well Done

Kelly's Market

Jennifer Errer

Success
LaFave Steel

Paula Good
Good Luck

LaFave Steel

Laura Wald
Congratulations

Petrolane Gas Service
i\y o i — i u v y v v i I W W I M

The Chronicle regrets that the photos of the following students were unavailable
Doug A. BenchQck Mane A. G. Levino Gerald K. Nickolas Jellrey B.Maxson George W. Norcross SteveJ. Paruch

WernarSchuIz

Good Luck
Farmer & Merchants

Bank

BACCALAUREATE SERVICE
Sunday, May 18,1980

Processional Owendale-Gagetown Band
Laura Witczak, Director

Invocation Mary Kay Burrows
Class ot 1980

Responsive Reading Class ot 1980
and Audience

Scripture Richard Powell
Class oil 980

Apostles' Creed Leader: Richard Powell
Senior Class Song "You've Got A Friend"

Class of 1980
Baccalaureate Deacon Lambert Kuhr

St. Agatha Catholic Church
Benediction Thomas E. Menzel

Class of 1980
Recessional Owendale-Gagetown Band

Laura Witczak, Director

GRADUATION EXERCISES
Thursday, May 22,1980

Processional

Invocation

Guest Speaker —

Student Speakers.

Awarding of Diplomas.

Benediction.
Recessional

. Owendale-Gagetown Band
Laura Witczak, Director

Robin Sullivan
Class on 980

Dr. Alexander Nelson
University ol Michigan

Robin Sullivan
Valedictorian

Mary Kay Burrows
Salutatorian

. Mr. Ronald Good, President
Board ol Education

Mr. Patrick Goslin, Trustee
Board ol Education

Mr. Ronald Erickson
Superintendent

Thomas Menzel
, Owendale-Gagetown Band

Laura Witczak, Director

Miles Thorp

Congratulations
Sohigro Service

Center

mother and daughter ban-
quet at Moravian church in
Unionville last week as
guests of Mrs. Frances
Schilling.

Mr. and Mrs. Elger Gen-
erous received a phone call
Sunday from Mr. and Mrs.
Joseph Jankech of Arizona.
They/are former Gagetown
area residents. They re-
ported it was 90 degrees
there Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Franklin
Koch and Karen and Mr. and
Mrs. Harold Koch and Janet
helped Carl Weber Jr. and
Mike Trinklein celebrate
their 50th birthdays at a
party given in their honor at
the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Mike Trinklein in Franken-
muth Sunday afternoon.

Cathy Hobart recently re-
turned from a 4'/-.-month
stay in Ireland and has gone
back to Aquinas College in
Grand Rapids, where she
will be employed for the
summer.

4-H cavies
workshop
Thursday
A special cavies workshop

has been scheduled this
Thursday at 6:30 p.m. in the
Wilber Memorial 4-H Build-
ing, Caro fairgrounds.

All 4-H leaders, members
and parents interested in
small pets projects like
cavies are encouraged to
attend.

The meeting is sponsored
by the 4-H Small Animal
Developmental Committee.

Simmons
rites held
Monday
James T. Simmons, 77, of

Cass City died Friday at
Hills and Dales General
Hospital after a long illness.

He was born Jan. 28, 1903,
in Evergreen township, San-
ilac county, the son of John
and Velma (Brown) Sim-
mons.

Simmons married Edna
Ball Spiers Jan. 12, 1928, in
Gagetown. Following their
marriage, they made their
home on a farm near Snov-
er, coming to Cass City in
1975. Mr. and Mrs. Simmons
celebrated their 50th wed-
ding anniversary in Jan-
uary, 1978.

He was a member of the
Shabbona Reorganized
Church of the Latter Day
Saints since childhood.

Simmons is survived by
his wife; two daughters,
Mrs. Clayton (Bet ty) Baer
of Snover and Mrs. Robert
(Maxine) LaJoie of Caro;
one stepdaughter, Mrs.
Frank (Winnifred) Wilson of
Yale; two sons, Orvil Sim-
mons of Bay City and Glen
Simmons of Rose City; three
sisters, Mrs. Edith Parrott
and Mrs. Jessie Cameron,
both of Deckerville, and
Mrs. Elizabeth McNeil of
Cass City; two brothers,
John Simmons of Owosso
and Charles Simmons of
Deckerville; 11 grandchil-
dren, and six great-grand-
children. One son, Alfred,
preceded him in death.

Funeral services were
conducted Monday after-
noon at Little's Funeral
Home, Cass City, with Rev.
Harry Capps of the First
Presbyterian church of Cass
City and Rev. Allan Lewis of
Snover officiating.

Burial was in Elkland
cemetery.

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Ann Hobar^
to read
own poetry

Kalamazoo College senior
Ann Hobart will give .
reading of her own works ot i
poetry this Thursday in the
Olmsted Room of Mandelle
Hall on the college campus.
The presentation is free arid
open to the public.

She is the daughter of Mr. I
and Mrs. Ben Hobart of i
Hobart Road, Gagetown. '

Her poetry was written as i
her senior individualized
project. The title and thenV
of her collection of 40 poems
is "Something to Support the
National Faith ifrSimplic-1
ity." She will read from
about a dozen of the most
recent poems.

Miss Hobart, who majors
in English, also has written
for the "Cauldron," the col-
lege's poetry magazine.

For the next school year,
from mid-October to June
she has received a Frencf'
government assistantship to
teach English in that
country to school children

Eventually, Miss Hobart
plans to pursue a master's
degree and a career in
teaching. She was selected
to the Phi Beta Kappa
honorary society this year.
She also served as a senior
fellow in the English depart-
ment.

For her career develop-
ment quarter, she was a
teaching assistant at a home
for crippled children in
Pittsburgh. She participated
in Kalamazoo College's for-
eign study program in Stras-
bourg, France.

Kim Hool on
dean's list at
Alma College

Kim Hool, an Alma Col-
lege sophomore from Cass
City, is among students
named to the college's
dean's list for outstanding
academic performance dur-
ing the winter term ending^
April 19.

Students who achieve a 3 5
or better grade point aver-
age during a term, while
carrying a minimum of 13
credits fat least eight of
which are evaluative
grades), are named to the
dean's list.

Kim, a 1978 graduate of
Assumption High School, is
the daughter of Mr. and Mn>
Jack Hool, Windsor, On- -_
tario. She lives at 4656
Street, Cass City.

I

Ernest A. Teichman Jr.
6529 Main St.

Cass City, Mich.
Phone 872-3388

"State Farm has
LIFE insurance,)

too! Call me
for details."

S t At I F A R M

I N i U B A N C I

Like a good neighbor,
State Farm is there.
Stale Fami Ule Insuidncc Company

Home Odice: Bloommglon, Illinois

PHOTO

FREE 5x7 PRINT
WITH EVERY DEVELOPED ROLL OF 4X PRINTS
WE WILL INCLUDE A COUPON GOOD FOR ONE

FREE
5x7 ENLARGEMENT

(With prints developed)

TAKE YOUR FILM TO:

Old Wood
Drug

On The Corner
Gorwirttond Photography

b your 0««t Buy
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CITY IGA FOODLINER
Fast Photo Finishing Service
for Your Shopping Convenience

STORE HOURS: DAILY TO 6:00

THURSDAY AND FRIDAY TO 9:00.
Food Stamps Gladly Accepted

CLOSED MEMORIAL DAY
Beer& Wine to go

We now have Bag Ice

NOTE. Not responsible for errors made in
printing. QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED.

Ad Good Thru Sat, May 24, 1980.

WHAT'S SO SPECIAL AT IGA?

•PLAIN »CHIVE

BRAND

Cream Cheese

Limit one coupon pei
ftftaen dollar (915.00)
eluding Beer, Wine,
coupon items. Expire

family- Coupon and
purchase required, ei

.£?yT£o" "N" Umit2 *3°Z-Pk9-

Look to New Deli Items — Home-l\Charco
made Food, Just Right For
Parties, Weddings & Picnics.
Potato Salad, German Potato

for Your salad, Macaroni Salad, Baked!
"" Beans and Cole Slaw.

••«•••••••
SAVE BONUS COUPON

Needs!
I Limit one coupon per family. Coupon anrj
I filtoon dollnr ($15.001 purchnsn roquirud, n»
| eluding Beer. Winrs, Cignrones or other

coupon itonu E .pirns M,-iv 71 1980 MR

2
Kingsford
Charcoal

IBBBBBUB
BONUS COUPON

WEST VIRGINIA

Sliced
Bacon

I imit 1 »9fl IKLlmKI <cu '"•

•••••••••••••••••

• Limit one coupon per family Coupon nnd
fifteen dollnr ($15.001 purchase required, ax

B eluding Boor, Wine. Cigarettes or other
•coupon ilorm. Expires Mny 24, 1980 N R Limit 2 »1 Ib. Pkg.

FAME

Skinless
Wieners

lib. Pkg.

A complete plant care dept. by Hyponex.
Now in stock 3 brands of garden seeds,
yellow & white & jumbo onion sets. Seed
potatoes - Sebago, Cobblers, Pontiac Red,
Russet, Burbank. Peat moss, top soil, cow
manure, beauty rock brick bits. A nice
selection of shrubs; vegetables & bedding
plants in stock this week.

Chiquita No. 1

BANANAS

IGATABURlU -BONfUSS

Chuck Steak ih
FARMER PEET

Ring Bologna ib
IGA TABURlTt -r-nfSH

Spare Ribs ID
THORN APPLE VALLEY
• BtEF -SMOKCD "POIISM

Sausage ib
$ 9 9
1

IGA TADLERlTE

Fresh Ground
Hamburger

Ib.

Mixed
Pork Chops

$119

IGA TAiuERitc

Whole or
Split Fryers

MICHIGAN

White All Purpose
Potatoes

15» bag

$-|99

FLORIDA

Red Ripe
Watermelon

Ib.

Cal. Iceberg

Lettuce

head

\
'it-~-

•REG.-RIPPLED

FAME
AL LAYER VARIETIES

Pillsburv Plus
Potato Chips Cake Mix

13-14 oz. Bag 18V. 02. Box

MILK IS A NATURAL'

FAME
2% Milk

Gill Ju(j

Mich. Salads 16 oz.

Macaroni
Potato

Cole Slaw

69
MARDI GRASMARDB GRAS

Towels Napkins
140 CL Pky.1 Roll Pkg.

69<
FAME 9 in.

White
Paper Plates Sweet Relish

100 ct Pkg

99

VLASIC BONUS PACK -HAMBURGER

Dill Chips or

22 o*. Jar

IGA

Hamburger or
Hot Dog Buns'

2
act.
Pack

I f HI O A t M l AI h IIAISIN •!'( CAN SANIlH S
IIICH N (.HII'S •COCOANU? CHOI CMH1!.

FAME FROZEN WHIPPED

Topping s oz BO«I 59

YOUR CHOICE. . .

Parkay Twin Pops or
Margarine Fudgee Bars

iiiTpk,,. 12ctpkg

58* 88

Keehler Cookies n n/ 89*

Bakery
Specials!

•11021 -12620 'SAVEUPT060C

Kodak
Color Film

Ench

$1991

• (4-. .U -^
^-"—^

VINYI - ;MHV-SAVl 50C $O69

Garden Hose MI. O
ANCHOR HOCKING 3lfy'\
Iced Tea Glasses i6m / I
IOAM-SAVI .]I)C $499

$O59
BBQGrilli ,, £.
I IISIIIO WMll -:>AVI IDC $'159

Decanter <;.,i

.£>
-̂

•REG. •MINT 25C OFF LABEL -SAVE3W

^ Crest
f Toothpaste

Ice Chest to en

CLIP & SAVE COUPON

REYNOLDS

Giant
Foil

$O592
Limit 1 -200 ft Box

SAVE

CLIP & SAVE COUPON

, NESTEA

Instant
100% Tea

$199
1

Limit 1 *3 oz. Jar

SAVE (3QC

CLIP Et SAVE COUPON

ALL FLAVORS

Kool-Aid
Handycan

$1591
Limit 1 -Mokes 10 Qts.

SAVE 68

CLIP & SAVE COUPON

•REG. -ONION -HICKORY -HOT N SPICY

Open Pit
BBQ Sauce

OPEN PIT
WICIIMI.OJIW

CLIP & SAVE COUPON

FAME

Trash Can
Liners

$1981
SAVE(24$

Limit 1 «20ct. Box

SAVE^cc^55'

CLIP & SAVE COUPON

FOLGER'S

Instant
Coffee

$4594
Limit 1 »10oi. Jar

—T—^ V^ • / 1J" \*«T^ J \̂ «r^pF t " — >C^ ^/ I inn! ii 'IHIIIIHI imr Ininilv Cniiiinii "v— ' Limil olincou|»llp«r Inmlly. Coupon
Ijmil on. coupon p«ft«mil» C«j|><>n ' limn nim i imtxm pm fniiuly Ci>ii|i»ii ^-^.^-^ Liniil IHIH IMHI|)IIM |)Kr Inmily Ciiu|inn ^ -^ lirnil Him r.iHi|Min |i«r Inoiily Coupon "--_ i i •., ;„ , niriî JiZTn.,,, m,,| ,nven dollar l» 7.001 fiurchM* r»qulr»
Kid »«>n dolbi H7 001 purcham r«|Ulr«<l. incliiitiny Bnnr. nml »«»nn iliillnr l> / 001 |iuii:hnu> rni|uirnil. nii:liiiluiu Hnur, nml HIIUIIII iliillnr l»7 001 |nin:hni« rni|iiirnil. nil lnilini| Hiinr, mill invan ilollni l»7 001 pnirirliiuii riii|iii">H. ii«i:liniinn iiintr i^^ Ciuiiriillni or othiir i;iiu|'ion it«nii 'Coii|wn ii«pirn« Wina. Ciu»ranai ur olhar coupon ilarni
•*^rA«, Ci^arftlak or othar coupon uarrm CrH'(K>n nujHrin Win«. Ci^iinilliis nr nlhiti i:ou|iiin ihiuifi COIIIHMI o«|nriiN Winr CiipiinnHH nr oltmr i:ini|iim ituniH Coupon ii«|iini!i Wlnii, Cmnr«nn» or othitr coupon itumt .ou|ion imp i . « • « . . «non Kin c *iirrJnu Mnu ^4 1Q80
jAurdav, May 24, 1980. N R S.-.timicy, M«y 24, 1980. N R Sntiinliiy. May 24, 1980. RJO Snturdoy. Mny 24, 1980. R7 SflUirrinyJJ^Z4J980^ ̂  ^^ Jjj, SMurdajM«ay ̂ '^^ —

. ..eluding BMT, i
,. Coupon «ptn.̂  I

'N-R |
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The Ellington Township Zoning

Board

will meet June 3 at 7:30 p.m.

at the Township Hall at the corner
of M-81 and Dutcher Road.

As this is a public meeting, any person
having an interest in the township relative to
any matter which should properly come
before the Zoning Board is invited to attend
this meeting.

Clayton Turner
Clerk

(others Get Quick Results With The (

I Chronicle's Classified Ads— |
j You Will Too! I

Holbrook Area News Mrs. Thelma Jackson
Phone 658-2347

EXTENSION CLUB

The Greenleaf Extension
Group entertained the Dres-
den Dolls Extension Ex-
change Group of Sterling
Heights Thursday when they
met at the home of Mrs.
Herman Umpfenbach for
brunch. The group toured
the Walbro factory in Cass
City before going to the
Gagetown Country Club for
lunch. In the afternoon they
toured the Miller egg factory
near Owendale.

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Ross
and Leslie, of Henrietta,

1 SUMMER MONTH
FREE

With 3-Month
Membership

STUDENT RATES
$55.00 For Entire Summer

SUMMER'S
ON US!

June-July-August

JUST SIGN UP FOR A
6-MONTH PERSONALIZED

MEMBERSHIP
AND WE'LL GIVE YOU
3 SUMMER MONTHS

FREE

We Have Many Plans From Which To Choose —
ONE'S JUST RIGHT FOR YOU!

NEW SUMMER HOURS
8:30 A.M. -12 Noon

| 4:00 P.M.-8:00 P.M.

HURRY!
OFFER GOOD

MAY 22 -29

NEW YOU HEALTH SPA
PLAZA WEST Phone 872-4050 CASS CITY

spent Monday and Tuesday,
and Dave Cammin of Sagi-
naw, spent Thursday at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Jim
Hewitt and Lori and Shirley
Ross.

Rita Tyrrell spent Sunday
through Tuesday with Mr.
and Mrs. Milo Herman at
Montrose.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Dreger
and family, of Utica, spent
Friday through Sunday with
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morell
and family and Mrs. Bob
Dreger. They visited Mr.
and Mrs. Don Jackson and
family and Mrs. George
Jackson Saturday.

Mrs. Ernest Hamilton of
Royal Oak spent Saturday
and Sunday with Ira Robin-
son and was a guest Sunday
night and Monday of Sara
Campbell and Harry Ed-
wards,

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold La-
peer were guests for Sunday
dinner with Mr. and Mrs.
Cliff Jackson.

Karri Dillon and Carlie
Gibbard were Saturday
guests of Mrs. Tom Gibbard.

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley
Glaza and Mr. and Mrs.
Reynold Tschirhart spent
Friday evening in Port Aus-
tin.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Fues-
ter and Mr. and Mrs. Jerry
Decker were guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Gaylord Lapeer
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Stephen
Knowles of Union Lake
spent the week end with Mr.
and Mrs. Jim Hewitt and
Lori and Shirley Ross.

Rita Tyrrell spent Satur-
day and Sunday with Judy
Tyrrell at East Lansing.
Sunday afternoon Judy and
Rita attended the Spring
Roundup Banquet sponsored
by the Michigan State Block
and Bridle Club.

Curtis Cleland, Mrs. Jim
Doerr, Wendy and Stanley
attended the Fiddlers Jam-
boree at Port Hope Saturday
afternoon.

Chad and Jamie Dreger,
of Utica, were guests of
Melissa, Jason and J immy
Jackson Friday.

Lyle Richardson, of Jack-
son, VVis . , was a recent guest
of Mr. and Mrs. Bob Jackson

and family
Calif.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shag-
ena visited Leslie Hewitt at
Hills and Dales Hospital in
Cass City.

Rev. Robert VonOeyen of
Ubly visited Sara Campbell
and Harry Edwards
Wednesday.

Mrs. Mike Schenk and
sons of Ubly were lunch
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Schenk Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Cass Ku-
backi were Thursday eve-
ning guests of Mrs. Dave
Sweeney.

Mr. and Mrs. Red Janow-
iak and Mr. and Mrs. Rey-
nold Tschirhart were Sun-
day evening guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Harry Weinard.

Mr. arid Mrs. Joe Dybilas
attended the 25th wedding
anniversary of Mr. and Mrs.
Tony Kearn at their home in
Reese Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. Curtis Cleland vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Jim
Hewitt Saturday morning.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tyr-
rell, Brenda and Carey at-
tended a graduation party
for Scott Cook at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Cook
Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. David Main of Mount
Clemens and Mrs. Henry
Sofka attended a pink and
blue shower for Janet Glaza
Wil l iams at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Jerry Glaza in
Troy Sunday afternoon. It
was given by Diann Glaza,
Joan Glaza Smith and Mrs.
Jerry Glaza.

Mrs. Kenneth Campbell of
St. Helen spent Monday and
Tuesday with Mrs. Don
Becker in Caro. Tuesday
they visited Sara Campbell
and Harry Edwards.

K f C H K K CLUB

Five tables of cards were
played when the euchre club
met Saturday evening at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Cl i f f
Jackson. High prizes were
won by Mrs. Lcn Beulla ,
Mrs. Gaylord Lapeer and
Sylvester Bukowski . Low
prizes were won by Mrs. Syl-
vester Bukowski and Lee
Heiulrick. Gaylord Lapeer
won the t r ave l i ng pri/e. A

at Anaheim, potluck lunch was served.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shag-
ena were Thursday evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Calvin Hunt.

Mr. and Mrs. Ben
Meschke of Port Hope were
Friday guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Jack Walker.

Mr. and Mrs. Simon Pol-
lum and Leona, and Mrs.
Harry Weinard were Thurs-
day evening guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Reynold Tschir-
hart.

HOME MAKERS

Mrs. Lyle Clarke, Mrs.
Lynn Spencer, Mrs. Curtis
Cleland, Mrs. Gaylord La-
peer, Mrs. Jim Doerr, Mrs.
Arnold Lapeer, Mrs. Frank
Laming, Mrs. Ray Rienelt,
Clara Bond, Mrs. Herman
Umpfenbach, Mrs. Leander
Rivard, and daughter Paula,
Ethel Ross, Mrs. Hiram
Keyser, Mrs. Lee Hendrick,
Mrs. Ralph Hoxie all at-
tended Home Makers Night
at Sandusky school Tuesday
evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Stephen
Knowles of Union Lake,
Mrs. Kenneth Campbell of
St. Helen, Mrs. Don Becker
of Caro, Carol Ross of Bad
Axe, Mr. and Mrs. Gary
Ross of Henrietta, Shirley
Ross, Mr. and Mrs. Jim
Hewitt and Lori visited Les-
lie Hewitt at Hills and Dales
Hospital in Cass City.

Rita Tyrrell visited
friends at Onaway Friday
and Saturday.

Jeff Doerr spent Saturday
with Mrs. Curtis Cleland.

Mrs. Dennis Morell of
Minden was a Friday eve-
ning guest of Mr. and Mrs.
Don Jackson and family and
Mrs. George Jackson.

Mrs. Ernest Hamilton of
Royal Oak and Ira Robinson
were Sunday dinner guests
of Sara Campbell and Harry
Edwards.

Mrs. Ronnie Gracey vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Glen
Shagena.

Mr. and Mrs. Ewald Bey-
ers of Pigeon were Tuesday

25-ln. Floral Spray
Roses, carnations or dah-
lias, with greens and wide
ribbon. $599

15-ln.
Floral Wreath v

Memorial wreath wi th
daisies, greens and wide
bow.

American Flag
6x9-inch colorfast flag in
16-inch wooden staff .

20-ln. Cemetery Base
Cemetery vase' w i t h
ground spike and floral
arrangement with greens.

S299
ea.

29-ln. Floral Spray
Headstone spray with

^h, metal saddle. With wide
'^~ ribbon, artificial flowers

and greens.

SC99
W ea

27-ln. Memorial Spray
Spray of greens, plus ros-
es, carnations or dahlias.

SC99

Discover
5 ea.

Where everything you buy is guaranteed.

BEN FRANKLIN
We bring variety to lift

Cass City

afternoon and supper guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jack-
son.

Jeny Murow and Don Har-
rington of Bad Axe, Jack
Ross and Al Hammerle of
Ubly were Saturday guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schenk
and Randy.

Mr. and Mrs. Mason Ber-
ridge and family of Romeo
were Sunday dinner guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Burton
Berridge.

Delpha Duvall of Pontiac
spent .a few days with Mr.
and Mrs. Delbert Gracey.

The annual St. Columb-
kille Catholic church bake
sale and spring raffle was
held Sunday afternoon at St.
Andrew's Hall in Sheridan.
Mrs. Bruno Longuski won
the quilt.

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Wie-
tek of Detroit were guests
Sunday overnight and Mon-
day of Mrs. Louis Naples.

Mrs, Jack Krug and Mrs.
Dave Sweeney attended a
bridal shower for Lois
Maurer at the Ubly Fox
Hunters Hall in Ubly Sunday
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Nadi-
ger of Pontiac spent Sunday
night till Tuesday with Mrs.
Emma Decker. Clara Bond
spent Sunday with Mrs.
Decker.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernie
Owensby of Mount Clemens
and Mr. and Mrs. Chuck
Schuck of Detroit were Sun-
day guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Jack Walker.

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold La-
peer spent a few days with
Howard Hardy and daughter
Marion at Hardwood Lake.

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Gibbard
and daughter Tory Amanda
Mae, Mr. and Mrs. Dale
Laming and Becky, Mr. and
Mrs. Evans Gibbard and
family and friend Greg,
Mrs. Carl Gibbard and
Kathy and Karen were Sun-
day guests of Mrs. Tom
Gibbard.

Mr. and Mrs. Reynold
Tschirhart visited Harry
Weinard at Huron Memorial
Hospital in Bad Axe Wednes-
day. Mr. Weinard came
home Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord
Lapeer were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Steve
Timmons and daughters in
Owendale. They also visited
Mrs. Manly Fay Sr.

BRIDAL SHOWER

A group of relatives and
friends attended a bridal
shower Sunday afternoon for
Miss Lois Maurer, daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. Mike Maur-
er of Ubly, at the Ubly Fox
Hunters Hall. Games were
played and prizes given.
Mrs. Betty Susalla won the
door prize.

The shower cake was
made and decorated by Mrs.
Chris Tyll. A buffet dinner
was served.

Miss Maurer will become
the bride of Marvin Hill of
Ruth Sept. 6 at St. John's
Catholic church in Ubly.

John Naples of East De-
troit spent Tuesday through
Sunday with Mrs. Louis
Naples.

Mr. and Mrs. Martin
Decker of Detroit visited
Mr. and Mrs. Leverett
Barnes, Mrs. Emma Deck-
er and Mr. and Mrs. Cliff
Jackson, Sunday.

Mrs. Dave Sweeney was a
Tuesday guest and Mr. and
Mrs. John Walker, John Jr.,
Janice and Kim, of Ruth,
were Saturday guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Jack Walker.

Mrs. George Barber,
Lloyd, Sue and friend Tim of
Royal Oak and Mr. and Mrs.
Keith Welby and family of
Lake Orion were recent
guests of Mrs. Tom Gibbard.

Mrs. Wilfred Wills and

Clayton Campbell spent a
few days in Tennessee.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Doen
were Saturday evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ed'
Francis in Croswell.

Lynn Spencer attended the
Masonic Grand Council atl
Gaylord Friday and Satur
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tyrrelll
attended the wedding of!
Linda Armstrong and John
Ruthko at St. John's Cat!
olic church in Ubly at 2 p.m.
Saturday. A reception fqN
lowed at" the * IJbTy Foxl
Hunters Club Hall. Mr. and
Mrs. Jack Tyrrell are John
Ruthko's godparents.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Cle-
land visited Linda Elliott of
Bad Axe and Leslie Hewitt
at Hills and Dales Hospital
in Cass City Friday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Sofka1

spent the week end with Mi
and Mrs. David Main m i
Mount Clemens.

Mrs. Raymond Wallace
was a Thursday afternoon
guest of Mrs. Alex Cleland. f

Mrs. Paul Streussnig and
Jody, Mrs. Bob Swackham-
er of Bad Axe and Sara i
Campbell attended the 1
mother and daughter ban-
quet at the First Presbyter-
ian church in Bad Axi
Thursday evening.

Mrs. Howard Britt visited i
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schenk
and Randy Friday after-
noon.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Deck-
er were Wednesday supper
and evening guests of Mr
and Mrs. Cliff Jackson.

Murill Shagena and Ray
Armstead of Cass City were i
Saturday morning visitors
at the Glen Shagena homer

Mrs. Elmer Brahmer was
a Tuesday evening guest of I
Mr. and Mrs. Reynold 1
Tschirhart.

Jeny Murow of Bad Axe
spent Sunday at the Earl
Schenk home.

Square dance
on Saturday

The Town and Country]
Square Dance Club invitesl
all square dancers to ai
dance from 8-11 p.m. Satur-i
day at Elkton Elementary)
School.

Caller will be Chuck Beck-
er. Refreshments w i l l ; be I
served.

Our Buyer's
Choice Plan suits
your insurance

budget.

m
With Michigan Mutual's
"Buyer's Choice Plan"
you have several pay-
ment options. Pick the
schedule that's conve-
nient to you, with only a
small service charge per
payment.

It's the better way to
pay for car and home in-
surance. Call us for full
details.

Edward H. Doerr

Doerr Agency
6265 Main St.

Cass City
Phone 872-3615 J

NOTICE
OF CHANGE IN RATES

TRASH COLLECTION
FEE WILL BE RAISED

FROM $10 to $12

STARTING WITH THE
JUNE 30 billing

(April-May-June Quarter)

For The

VILLAGE of GAGETOWN

r

•

I
Elery Sontag

Village Clerk p~
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New books at
the library

' WALKING THROUGH THE FIRE and SIGNS OF
SPRING, by Laurel Lee (non-fiction). Laurel Lee kept a

journal during the nine months she was undergoing
intensive treatment for Hodgkin's disease. Published as
"Walking through the fire", it moved almost everyone who
read it-pure, naive, lyrical, and life-affirming expressions
of a young woman with three little children who was
walking hand-in-hand with God and death. "Signs of
spring" brings us up to date, again by means of Laurel's
journal: Divorce from a husband who wouldn't bear the
burden, months of welfare-level poorness, the news that her
hospital journal would be published, a rise in fortunes, the
love of two men whose gallantry fell short of marrying into
such heavy burdens, the recurrence of the cancer, and always,
always care of the children.

THE UPAS TREE, by Eva Hanagan CfictionXWith a deft
touch, Hanagan has created an effective novel about a
woman, Ishbel, coming into her own after years of catering
to family demands. Subtle satire lightens the account of
Ishbel's travails as her mother's maid servant, while a
slightly different, wry tone enters as Ishbel makes her first
discoveries of freedom later in the novel. The novelist feints
with clever intimations of potentially dire events and
relieves the readers fears only in the heart-warming last
scene.

THE DREAM MAKER: WILLIAM C. DURANT,
FOUNDER OF GENERAL MOTORS, by Bernard
Weisberger (non-fiction). The story of how Durant formed
in the first decades of this century what is now the largest
U.S. auto manufacturer is interestingly told. In describing
Durant's early career as a carriage maker, Weisberger
points out how the large-scale production methods and
acquisition of companies making parts predated the tactics
later used to bring success to General Motors. The author is
equally explicit about Durant's necessary resignation from
GM and the rise and fall of a second venture in auto
manufacturing.

Suzanne Little on dean's list

Kathy Dillard
gets degree at
Harding Univ.

Kathy Diane Dillard,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Lyle Clarke, 3475 Cemetery
Road, Cass City, was among
380 seniors at Harding Uni-
versity, Searcy, Ark., to
receive degrees in spring
commencement ceremonies
May 11.
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AROUND THE FARM

Common bean
mosaic virus

By William Bortel

Suzanne Little has been
named to the dean's list for
the winter semester at West-
ern Michigan University.

She is the daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Harold Little, 5178
Kelly Road, Cass City.

To be eligible, a student

needs a minimum 3.5 grade
point average out of a pos-
sible 4.0.

Wise is the man who
knows enough to let well
enough alone.

Kathy Dillard

She majored in home eco-
nomics textile merchan-
dising.

Her husband, Mark, re-
ceived a degree in Bible.

The couple will be living in
Pontiac, where Dillard is
employed at a General
Motors truck plant. He had
been on leave to get his
degree.

Mrs. Dillard wi l l be seek-
ing employment, preferably
in textile merchandising, ac-
cording to her mother.
Kathy is a 1976 graduate of
Cass "City High School.

Having rented our farm, we will sell the fol lowing personal property at public auction
located 4 miles East of Cass City lo M-53, 5 miles South. 1 v? miles East on Shabbona
Road or Vz mile West of Shabbona on

SATURDAY, MAY 24
at 10:00 A.M.

IHC #300 TRACTOR
fast hitch, wide front, duals

FARMALL A TRACTOR
with 2 row cultivator and bean

-• ' puller
„*•

Triple K 12 ft. field cul t ivator •
3 point

- Triple K land leveler
4 row 3 point cult ivator
IHC 3-14 fast hitch plow
Fast hitch rear blade
12 ft. double disc - 12 ft. weeder
12 ft. harrow - 9 ft. cul i tpacker

^ 4 section harrow
- 8 ft. field cultivator

7 ft. double disc
2 heavy duty wagons with grain

boxes
Comfort sprayer with 110 gallon

plastic tank- pull type
16 ft. wood-type elevator
Wagon with gravity box
Avery pick up beaner with PTO

drive and straw chopper
J Innes 4 row bean windrower
: AC #60 combine

5" - 20' grain auger with motor
4"-20'grain auger
IHC 16 hoe grain drill
IHC 4 row planter-plastic buckets
7 ft. John Deere mower
Heat hauser for #300
Chicken feeders

\ J D 2 row horse cultivator
3 Bidwell beaners for parts
2 AC combines for parts

- Platform scales
•'"IHC 42" combine for parts
'Chain binders

. Several logging chains
- 55 gallon drums - Pipe wrenches
'Prill press stand
Quantity of steel fence posts
.Pipe rack & pipe - Fuel barrel
Post driver - 5' roll of wire-new
"Aluminum scoop shovels
Air compressor - 1 hp. motor
•XP 1000 Homelite chain saw
.Saw mill circular saw grinder
Water tank • Wood spl i t ter
'2 wheel barrows
Large exhaust fan
Black & Decker 1/2" drill
61/2" Craftsman saw • 1T chain fall

-Quantity of steel roofing

5 screw jacks - V belts
Large quanti ty of old iron
Quant i t y of mixed lumber
Quan t i t y of walnut lumber
Forks - Shovels
Jewelry Wagons

ANTIQUES-
Dinner bell - 7 pc. castor set
7 pc. castor set
Pitcher, bowl, & chamber pot set
Commode
Solid oak dresser with high mirror
2 trunks
% bed - Lanterns
Kitchen cabinet - Rocking chair
Cabinet radio - Picture frames
School water crock - Small crock
Large baking crock
4 sausage grinders
Blue telephone glass
Cast iron fry pans
English stone covered vegetable

dish
Glass cracker jar - Ink well
Oil lamp with brass bottom
Copper boiler
20 gallon copper kettle
Small kitchen range
Wash board - Griddle - Dishes
Shaving mug - Depression glass
Straight razor - Bob sleigh
Pitcher pump - Walking plow
Cow bells - 2 wood wagon wheels
Neck yokes - Single trees
Wood pulleys - Buck saws
Forge- Horse tongues
5 gallon crock jug
Lightening rods - Weather vane
Milk cans .
2 water tank pumps for steam

engine
Many others

HOUSEHOLD-
Bedroom suite • Maple bed
Rocking chair - Coffee table
Small stand • 2 footstools
Night stand-Books
Steel book shelf - Christmas tree
Oil stove - Several lamps
Pressure cooker - Kettles - Pans
Set of Melmac dishes - Toaster
Sheets & bed spreads
Electric fry pan
Electric fans - Room air cooler
Many others

Hozen & Gladys Kritzman,
CLERK: Hillaker Auction Service
TERMS: Cash. Everything settled for day of sale. Not responsible

for accidents.

AUCTIONEERS: Lorn Hillaker Lunch Available
Clark Hillaker
Phone 517-872-3019 Cass City

One of the most exciting
events to happen to the
Michigan dry bean industry
in the last 10 years is the
signing of a contract with
Mexico.

The contract will be a boon
to the bean industry, but as
with all good things, it is not
without potential pitfalls.

The contract calls for
colored beans, primarily
pinto and black turtle soup
types. This fact will require
a major shift in production
for many growers, who have
been up to now comfortable
with producing white navy
bean varieties.

As we approach the 1980
season, one of our major
concerns is sufficient good
quality seed of the pinto and
black bean varieties to plant
the acres necessary to fill
the contract obligations.

There are several seed-
borne diseases which can
cause substantial crop
losses. Common mosaic
virus, halo, common, and
fuscous bacterial blights,
and anthracnose can all ride
into the bean field on seed.

In this article we will con-
centrate on common mosaic
virus, leaving the other
diseases for future articles.

Common bean mosaic
causes puckering of leaflets,
chlorotic mo t t l i ng and leaf -
let elongation. Pod. loaf and
petiole distortion. and
dwarf ing of a few leaves on
the whole plant can occur.
At times premature ' death
occurs. Infected plants
usually have great ly re-
duced pod set i ind seed
produc t ion .

Once introduced to the
f ie ld , mosaic can lie spread
from p l a n t l < > p l a n t b y
con tac t , t i l l age e q u i p m e n t ,
and aphids. The p l a n t s
which a re in le t - led du r ing
Ib i s secondary spread usua l -
l\ produce a near normal
y ie ld , however , al least f i l l
percent ol the seed produced
may car ry I he v i rus lo a
subsequent crop should the
seed be used for p l a n t i n g
stock

The typ ica l mosaic' .symp-
toms ment ioned above are
found in va r i e t i e s l i ke S;ini-
lac, C h a r l c v o i x . Man i lou ,
C a l i f o r n i a l igh! and dark red

Sanilac to
appeal on
Bond Drain

The Sanilac County Board
of Commissioners May 14
approved the action of its
cha i rman , Stuart Parsell,
in i n i t i a t i n g a Circui t Court
appeal ol the cost apportion-
ment for the Bond Drain
project.

The board is appealing
county Drain Commissioner
Stuart Armstead's assess-
ment of 26.5 percent of the
$63,000 cost to the counly-at-
large, a decision that was
upheld by a board of review
April 29.'

The county's hired witness
had testified before the re-
view board that he thought
the county-at-large share
should only be 11.27 percent.

Armstead said Monday he
had been official ly notified
of the appeal being filed, but
had yet to be notified of a
court date.

Work on the drain clean-
ing project in Evergreen and
Greenleaf townships, now
underway, will continue
while the appeal is under-
way.

Fluoride
program
announced

The summer topical fluor-
ide program in Sanilac
county during the summer
months will be at the follow-
ing locations:

Deckerville Community
School, June 9-18; Croswell,
June 19-July 3; Marlette,
July 7-15, and Sandusky,
July 16-30.

According to the county
Health Department, ap-
proximately 500 children
have enrolled in the pro-
gram.

Parents of enrolled chil-
dren will receive appoint-
ment cards about two weeks
prior to their children's ap-
pointment.

Sites in Croswell, Marlette
and Sandusky will be an-
nounced later.

The person with no pur-
pose in life can never show
progress.

kidney, and Michigan Im-
proved Cranberry beans.
Wyoming 166R and 111 Pinto
beans may also develop
common mosaic as de-
scribed.

Most other bean varieties
grown are resistant to the
common mosaic virus. Un-
fortunately in some varie-
ties, the resistance to mo-
saic is expressed in the form
of "black root." The resis-
tance is actually expressed
as immuni ty or "hypersensi-
t i v i t y , " thus , when the plant
is inoculated with the virus,
it reacts in the form of a root
and stem discoloration,
rapid wi l t , and death.

The idea here is that the
plant dies rather than sur-
viving to serve as an infec-
tion center for neighboring
plants. A few plants die but
the majority survive, the-
oretically.

If ( v i r u l i f e r o n s ) aphid
vectors are moving into
bean fields in great num-
bers, plant losses can be
substant ia l due to this hyp-
ersensitive form of resist-
ance. The hypersensitive
type of resistance is present
in the varieties Seafarer,
Gra l io t , Tuscola, and some
Black Turtle Soup varieties.
Other cu l t iva r s may also
have the black root hyper-
sensitive react ion; however,
posit ive t e s t i ng has not been
done.

As Michigan moves to-
wards f u l f i l l i n g i ts contract
ob l iga t ions , bean growers
should reali/.e t h a t c o n t i n u a -
t i o n of t h e contract i s a l least
p a r t i a l l y dependent on the
del ivery of a q u a l i t y prod-
u c t . A t t e n t i o n to seed
sources and q u a l i t y uiis- i
ease-tree i seed for p l a n t i n g
is t h e f i r s t step to mee t ing
our end ol the bargain

KODAK
COLORBUR3T25G
Instant Camera

Built-in electronic flash.-
Automatic, motorized print ejection
Simple nim-and-shool operation

List Price $76.50

Our Discount Price 69.88

Factory Rebate -10.00
YOUR PRICE AFTER REBATE

TAKE A

$10
REBATE

another
Wilh this rt'bnte oiler. n>ct?ivi>
valuable Cash-Back Cci1ilirj.il
worth SlOon KODAK Inst.inl
Color Film PR10 p.icks

Stop in for complete rebate and
certificate offer details. But hurry!
Offer ends July 15,1980.

YOUR FRIENDLY DISCOUNT STORE

Others Get Quick Results With The
Chronicle's Classified Ads— You Will Too!

7nw!/c

STEP LADDERS
5-FOOt, features pail shelf, rag rail, and tool holder,
Pinch-proof spreaders. Braced top and bottom, slip-
resistant steps, red vinyl shoes. 07/365 $29.99

6-Foot Ladder (not shown)oy/aee $32.99
5-Way Ladder, use as stepladder, extension,
staircase or as two separate ladders. Variable height.
6 - f t . as stepladder, 10-f t . as extension. Converts in
seconds without tools. Saves space. 07/386 $69.99

_ Arryl i f .
t'\ House Pill

I Mifi'

ACRYLIC LATEX
HOUSE PAINT

SAVE $5.00

Now
Just $10.97
Unique la tex oil-emulsion fo r -
mulc'i. Protects like an oil paint.
High hiding. Res is ts weather ,
stains. 35 Jamestown colors. HPX

One Stroke
Refinishing

Kit

$4.99
"Graining" particles suspended within the paint are
released with each brush stroke. No special technique
needed. Refinish anything from furniture to kitchen
cabinets or outdoor shutters and trim. Complete with
paint, brush and touch-up sandpaper. Choice of colors.
07/366/7/8/9/70/1/3/4/5/6

Now
Just

TRU-TEX LATEX
TEXTURE PAINT

SAVE $3.00

$6.97
Create dramat ic t ex tu res on
wal ls; ceil ings. Hide hair l ine
cracks; tape joints. Latex easy-to-
use. See it! (TP)

LATEX
FLAT ENAMEL

Th« Beautiful Brute"

SAVE $5.00

$10.97Now
Only

44 Colors, white '
E-2 KARE® ;
LATEX FLAT
INTERIOR PAINT;
Most stains, grease and*
grime just wash away.*
Soft look Is ideal for all*
walls, woodwork. EZ-

MANY OTHER PAINTS and PAINT SUNDRIESON SALES
ReferToYour1980 Spring Paint Week Circular

Albee
Cass City

SALE ENDS MAY 31,1980 jj

Home Center
Phone 872-2270
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FOOJi 1K.YTER
IN CASS CITY

OPEN

THURS
FRIDAY TO 9 P

SATURDAY

SPECIALS GOOD THRU:
r - , , ,, , _ . . __,
Erlas Homemade Sliced

COOKED SALAMI

SATURDAY, MAY 24, 1980
, Erla's Homemade

Tender Aged

BLADE

HOMEMADE SAUSAGE'
AND

SMOKED MEATS
(Wholesale & Retail)

Erla's
Homemade

Smoked

Polish or Roasted

SAUSAGE
S-J59

Ring Bologna
Skinless Franks
Large Bologna sheep Casing $ 4 4 9

Franks I

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Erla's Homemade * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

Franks
Erla's Homemade OLD FASHION

SMOKED
HAMS

Whole or
Shank Half

Fresh Whole or Rib Half

PORK Slicea

LOINS f™

Smith's Fully Boneless
Skinless & Defatted

SMOKED HAMS
$129

™ Ih

Whole
or

Fresh
Pan Ready Gr. A

/WHOLE
FRYERS

Hickory Smoked Sliced Rindless

LAYER
BACON

Ib.

Erla's Homemade
Hickory Smoked Whole

SLAB BACON.;..

CUT UporSPLIT

56*

BAKERY
SPECIALS

%!

Erla's Homemade

Fresh Liver Rings ..
American Leader

Pork & Beans
Del Monte

Fruit Cocktail

V >-

Oven Fresh
Golden Loaf

Bread 20 oz.
Trueworth • Garden

Oven Glo
Hot Dog • Hamburg

Buns

Sweet Peas 16 oz.
Cans

<:

8 pack

DEL MONTE Oven Glo

Can

Fried Cakes 12 pack

KRAFT

TOMATO

CATSUP

Natural Sun • Frozen

Lemonade

MIRACLE

HEINZ

6oz.
Cans

*v

Barbecue
Sauce

Vlasic • 5 kinds

Relish
2/89<

Miracle
Whip

10 02.
Jars

32 oz.
Jar

w/Onions PRINCE ELBOW

Macaroni
AMERICAN LEADER-CRUSHED

PINEAPPLE
BARBECUE

SAUCE

2lb. Pkg.

26 oz.!
Btl.

SWANSON'S
CHUNK WHITE

Chicken
15oz.
Can 39C

Diet or Regular

Pepsi
Mt. Dew 8-1/z liter

bils.

PARAMOUNT

POTATO

lEIbows.

Trueworth

ASPARAGUS
Dan-Dee • 3 kinds

JELLIES S l b J a r

Sunshine • Swiss Grahams
or Swiss Short Bread

COOKIES 12'/2oz. Pkg.

General Mills Cereal

GOLDEN GRAHAMS

5oz.
Can

n
KINGSFORD

Match Light
Charcoal GARDEN

8lb. Bag
mm mm

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS

Regular $1.99 60's S HI 4 9

Bufferin I
Reg. Unscented & Powder Deodorant W ^1 J £1

Right Guard I
Metamucil $O99
PowderReg. 14 oz. $4.99

Match

Size 56 New Crop

CALIF. ORANGES
00

U.S. No. 1 CA

DELICIOUS APPLES
3 99*

I Size 24 California

LETTUCE,
U.S. No. 1 Cooking

ONIONS .
U.S. No. 1 Long Green

CUKES...

Mb. Bag

'for
00

Gentle Pels

LIQUID
SOAP

59*

SOFTEX

BATHROOM

TISSUE
r 790Btl.

FRESH START

Bag DETERGENT, 0 ! B
$ I69
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ONLY AT IRLA'SFOOD CENTER

TRUEWORTH
Sweetened or Unsweetened

ORANGE
JUICE
46 oz.
Can

Kraft American
or Pimento-Singles

CHEESE
SLICES '£
HUNT'S

JUICE
46oz
Can

Banquet Frozen
Assorted Kinds

ifi BANQUET
Frozen Pot Pies

Fried
Chicken

$399

Robin Hood

Flour S17|

"60oz. Pkg.
17 pieces

NESTEA
INSTANT

WinSchuler i4oz. ctn.

Bar Scheeze
Kraft-Chunk Aged 1

P
2°2- £ VHKQ. jjg g

Swiss Cheese' I

BrtlAMT (Neste?
oo°/o!

Jar

KRAFT
JET-PUFFED
OR HEARTH

Marshmallows

2lOoz7 T

""f /.

McDoiidlu b
2'-.-o Low f-dl r

MILK / < ] : ;
Mi-Uuiiak) L - A l l Havufb

Fruit Drinks Pun
kMcDciiald's

Twin Pops
McDonald's-AII Flavors

Ice Cream

ife
$-149

' • 'I'1 ' P
Oln ™

BULK

Potato or Macaroni

SALADS
1 Ib.
Ctn.

American Beauty

Mr. Turkey
Dark Meat

TURKEY
ROAST

2lb.
Loaf

Can

Pork & Beans

S-W..5

Down Memory Lane
FROM THE FILES OF THE CHRONICLE

FIVE YEARS AGO

James Maharg, son of
Kenneth Maharg of Cass
City, graduated from
Aquinas College with a de-
gree in fine arts. He re-
ceived the highest honor of
Aquinas by being listed on
the Dean's List.

Carolyn Smith, daughter
........ of.. Mr. and Mrs. Richard

Smith, has been named
1 "secretary of the year" by

members of the Vocational
Office Block at Cass City
High School.

Gross receipts from the
sale of 1000 Poppies by the
American Legion Auxiliary
totaled $379. Top salesper-
son was Mrs. Lillian Ken-
dall.

By a 6-4 vote, the com-
bined Tuscola and Huron
Intermediate School Dis-
tricts Boards of Education
rejected the request of 36
property owners to have
their property transferred
from the Owendale-Gage-
town to the Cass City School
District.

TEN YEARS AGO

Marilee Turner, daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred
Turner of Decker, and Lynn
Haire, daughter of Mr. and
Mrs. John Haire, were
among 45 Michigan State
University students tapped
into Tower Guard, one of the
university's distinguished
women's honoraries.

Cass City clinched at least
a share of the Thumb B

Caro offers
summer school
program

The Community Services
Department of Caro Com-
muni ty Schools wil l offer a
summer school program. It
wil l be open to all high
school students that have
permission of I heir p r inc i -
pal.

English and U.S. History
wi l l be offered. English wi l l
meet Mondays and Wednes-
days beginn ing Wednesday,
.June 11 . U.S. History w i l l
moot Tuesdays and Thurs-
days beginning Tuesday,
.June id.

M o t h subjects w i l l be
t a u g h t at the Caro Drop In
Center in downtown Caro
I r o n ) (>-!) p .m.

R e g i s t r a t i o n began Mon-
day and concludes June (i.
Cost lor r;idi class is $:id and
mus t be paid at the t i m e of
r e g i s t r a t i o n .

S t u d e n t s must have ' w r i t -
t en permission f rom t h e i r
h i g h school p r i nc ipa l and
I rom t h e i r parents i f they
are under I K years of age.

Reg i s t r a t ion w i l l be at the
C o m m u n i t y Services Of f i ce
located in Caro High School.
O i l ice hours are Monday
th rough Thursday from » : : > ( )
a . m. - I d p . m . and h ' r idays
I rom !i:3n a . m . 4 : : i ( i p. in
C a l l ( i 7 : i - : i l ( i ( i . extension :M1
lor more i n f o r m a t i o n

Classes w i l l he held only i l
a s u l ' l i c i e n t m i n i m u m enro l l -
i nen l is m e t . I I classes are

Conference baseball crown
with a 2-0 victory over Caro.

Jame Kot, Cass City
Schools instrumental music
instructor, was one of the
featured performers at a
jazz concert at Flint's Whit-
ing Auditorium.

Nellie Sinclair, retiring
Owen-Gage teacher, will be
honored at an open house
Sunday, She.taught for 33
years, the final 21 of them in
the Owendale and later the
Owen-Gage schools.

TWENTY-FIVE
AGO

YEARS

Ices be

Downing in
college
'Who's Who'

Gregory J. Downing, son
of Jack and Harriet Down-
ing, Gage-town, is among 48
students at Ferris State
College nominated to the
biographical publ icat ion
"Who's Who in American
Colleges and Universit ies,
19711-80."

Students are selected to
appear in the publication on
the hasis of scholarship and
par t ic ipa t ion in campus ex-
t racurr icular activities.

Downing, a 1975 graduate
of Owendale-Gagetown High
School, graduated from the
pharmacy program at Fer-
ris this year. While at Fer-
ris, he was awarded the
Wil l iam C. Sunkcs Memorial
Award, presented annually
to the most outstanding
graduating pharmacy
senior. He was a member of
the Student American Phar-
maceutical Association and
Rho Chi Society, profession-
al honor society.

THE GRIND

Man struggles to get him-
self fixed for life, and by that
time finds he has just about
worried himself to death.

About 180 band members
and their parents attended
the Band Booster Club co-
operative dinner at Cass
City High School.

For the first time in many
years, Cass City will field an
independent baseball team.

The members of the Tus-
cola County Extension Ad-
visory Board and agricul-
tural committee of the

Criminal
complaints
total 5 77

The Tuscola County Sher-
iff 's Department received a
total of 577 complaints in
April , compared to 512 the
month before.

The greatest number, 168,
involved traffic complaints
(accidents, reckless driving,

etc . ) , followed by larcenies,
65, vandalism, 61. and burg-
laries, 43.

Deputies made 58 arrests
during the month , of which
26 involved t r a f f i c viola-
tions, six for l iquor viola-
tions, five for burglaries,
and three for vandalism.

There were 21 appearance
tickets issued, 12 involving
transporting or possession of
open intoxicants in a motor
vehicle and nine for pur-
chase, possession or trans-
porting liquor or alcoholic-
beverages by minors.

Deputies issued 267 t r a f f i c
tickets, 101 of which were for
speeding and 40 for parking
violat ions.

They drove 45,126 miles
during the month , their
patrol cars having con-
sumed 3,881 gallons of gaso-
l ine (11 .63 miles per gal lon) .

The county jai l received
170 inmates in April, of
whom 12 were female, and
released 1(17.

Cass Ci ty police made
seven arrests during the
mon th , two each for t r a f f i c
v io la t ions , vandal ism and
liquor law violat ions, one for
burglary .

Kingston police arrested
one person for obstruction of
jus t ice .

State police from the Caro
post arrested 20 persons,
inc lud ing seven for t r a f f i c -
related offenses, three for
l iquor viola t ions and two
each for violat ion of con-
trol led substance law and
obst ruct ion of justice.

The number of complaints
received from and accidents
in area townships and v i l -
lages respectively were:
Cass City , 34 complaints,
accidents not listed; Elkland
township, 23 and 4; Colum-
bia, 9 and 1; El l ington, 12
and 1; Elmwood, 13 and 0;
Kingston township , 13 and 1;
Kingston village, 2 and 1,
and Novesta. 24 and 4.

Board of Supervisors met
and Don Kebler was pre-
sented to them. He was
recommended as assistant
county agricultural agent
and they in turn hired him.

Cass City received $5,376
as its share of first quarter
receipts from the state
Motor Vehicle Highway
Fund.

THIRTY-rEIVE .YEARS-
AGO

The heating and plumbing
business of E.A. Wanner
was sold to Avon Boag of
Argyle township and Elmore
Caister of Evergreen town-
ship.

The Gavel Club pledged
$300 towards the air strip
project for Cass City.

First Lt. John A. Reagh,
combat pilot, recently re-
turned from overseas, has
been assigned to Turner
Field, Twin Engine Pilot
School, at Albany, Ga.

Mrs. Raymond Green, in-
structor and counselor in
educational reconditioning
at Percy Jones Hospital,
Battle Creek, was a guest at
the home of her parents, Mr.
and Mrs. J.A. Sandham.

Citizens hear :
county official

The Owen-Gage Senior
Citizens met last Thursday
at the Municipal Building at
Owendale. ;.'

Blessing was given by
Mrs. Peter Severn. ',•

Forty-four members aj-
tended the dinner. •;.'

Guest speaker was Fran-
ces L. Holdwick, Huron
county register of deeds.
Donna Reed was her guest.

Other guests were Mrs.
Cecil Loomis and Mrs. How-
ard Irrer.

Two new members joined,
Mrs. Grace Roberts and
MfsTTbm Q u i r i r i . ~

Door prizes were won by
Andy Szidik and Mrs. Rob-
erts.

Euchre prize winners
were men's high, Leslie
Munroe; low, Tony Enderle;
ladies'high, Mrs. Irma Mar-
tin; low, Mary Enderle;
traveling prize, Stella Pi-
sarek.

Next meeting will be at the
Elmwood-Gagetown Fire
Hall Thursday, June 5,
where blood pressure read-
ings will be taken.

Formal Wear

Chapped
Men's Wearand
Formal Wear Rental!
Phone 872-3431

Professional and Business

DIRECTORY
DR. W.S. SELBY

Optometrist
Hours: B-f i txcepl Thursday

H-1^ noon on Salutary
4624HMISI .
'\C'0:.S I'orn

Hi l l - , ;HuJ I),Hi;:, Hospil.il
Phone 872-3404

Allen Witherspoon
N'".vl-ni)l,indL:li-

NfcLLH.JWl' l f-u'UI

Nl.L f.qijily f unil
V.iiue Line fund
H-cyston1-1 f-uncjr.
Phone 872-2321

46l5Oak CassCily

K.I. MacRae, D.O.
Osteopathic Physician

and Surgeon
Corner Church and Oak Streets

Oltice 872-2880 Res 872-3365

Sang H, Park, M,P,
Obstetrics & Gynecology

4672 Hill Street
Phone 872-2800

Olfictj Hours by Appointment

DR. E.PAUL LOCKWOOD
Chiropractic Physician

OMice Hours: Mon , TUPS . Wed . Fn
9-12 noon and ! 30-5 00 p m

Saturdiiy 9- iL ;a m
Closed All Day Thursday

Phone 872-2765 Cass City
tor ^ppoiniment

Harold T.Donahue
M.D.

Physician & Surgeon
CLINIC

4674 Hill Street, Cass City
OMu:eB/2-2:i2j Res 872-2311

Harris-Hampshire
Agency, Inc.

Complete Insurance Services
6815 E. Cass City Road

Cass City, Michigan

Phono 872-2688

James Ballard, M. D.
Off ice at 4530 Weaver Street |

Saib A. Isterabadl, M.D.. FRCS
4674 Hill Street

Csss City.Michigan 48726

Surgeon, General & Thoracic
Outpatient Clinic

Hills & Dales Hospital

Each Wednesday
8a.m.-1 p.m.

Hours

DO YOU HAVE A
DRINKING PROBLEM?

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS
andAL-ANON

E v e r y Friday Evening - 8:00 p.m.
Good Shepherd Lutheran Church

Cass City

Edward Scollon,
D.V.M.

Veterinarian
Call for Appointment

for Small Animals
Phone 872-2935

4849 N. Seeger Si., Cass City

Or. J. Geissinger

CHIROPRACTOR

Mon., Tues., Thurs., Fri.
9-12 a.m. and 2-6 p.m.

Sat., 9-12 a.m.
21 N. Aimer, Caro, Ml.
Across from IGA Store
Phone Caro 673-4464

Richard A. Hall, D.O.

Osteopathic Physician

6545 Church Street

Cass City, Michigan
Gllico 872 .4 /25 Hornu 8/2-4 762

Hoon K. Jeung, M.D.
General Surgery

9a.m. - 5p.m. Daily
Saturday-9 to 12 noon

Off ice Hours by Appointment
Phone 872-4611

4672 Hill SI.
Cass City, Mich. 48726

Home 872-3138

Harry Crandell, Jr.

D.V.M.

Office 4438 South Seeger St.
Phone 872-2255

Don't be
penny wise
and pound
foolish.

"Cheap" prices for chemicals doesn't automatically spell satisfaction, and
they are not always a bargain.

When we quote you a price, we back it up with professional advice:
• correct chemical for your needs
• latest recommendations for problem weeds
• correct application rate
• update on new product registrations, tank mixes and correct usage

See Wickes Agriculture for a safe and sound chemical program in 1980 . . . .
part of our professional agronomic services to help you get a head start on this
year's complete crop program.

WICKES
AGRICULTURE

6210 Main Cass City 872-2171
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DIAMONDS

Caro's Leading Jeweler
' Phone 673-2444

Memorial Day M^^P^p^ ;̂%S§
service Sunday Your Neighbor Says
near Owendale "

Gas tax increase

is unnecessary

CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, MAY 22,1980

Memorial Day services at
Grant township cemetery
near Owendale will be Sun-
day at 1:30 p.m.

Speaker will be Rev.
David Porterfield, pastor of
the Gagetown Church of the
Nazarene. Local churches
and organizations will also
participate.

Shabbona Area News
Marie Meredith Phone 672-9489

INTEREST RATES DROP
SO HAVE PRICES FOR

FARM BUREAU BUILDINGS

- SAVE
3 4 x 4 0 x 1 0

Building
12x10 Slider Door
3/4x6/8 Walk Door

2 f t . Fiberglass
Under Eaves

LI MIT-ONE
PER TWP.

S4980 Total
Erected

Price

LOOKING FOR SOMETHING DIFFERENT?
ASK ABOUT OUR HIP ROOF BUILDINGS:

• Overhead
Storage

• Feed Storage
Over Horses

• Storage Over
Garage

We Offer Complete
Building Services

ANTON PETERS
517-872-4405 or

GLEN ERSKINE
753-3457 Saginaw

SALE PRICES ON ALL SIZE BUILDINGS

The effects of smaller cars
and motorists driving less
are being felt.

If, however, the result will
be an increase in the gaso-
line tax, Christine Joles is
opposed. The price of gaso-
line, she said, "is high
enough now."

Except for a small per-
centage for public transpor-
tation and railroads, reve-
nue from the state gasoline
tax (11 cents per gallon),
diesel fuel tax and license
plate fees are all spent for
road construction and
maintenance.

While those costs are go-
ing up 10-20 percent a year,
the Michigan Department of
Transportation reported last
week, fuel tax and license
plate fee revenue declined
4.5 percent for the first three
months of this year, com-
pared to the same period
last year.

The situation has led to a
call by highway interests for
an eventual increase in the
fuel tax, perhaps by setting
it as a percentage of the
price per-gallon instead of
the present flat rate. That
way, highway revenue will
increase as the price of
gasoline increases.

But Mrs. Joles doesn't feel
an increase in the gasoline
tax is necessary. "I do think
a lot of the money is squand-
ered.

"These roads are terrible,
especially in Tuscola
county," she added.

Because she feels the
price of gasoline is already
high enough, she was happy

when a federal judge last
week enjoined President
Carter from putting into
effect an oil import fee,
which would have increased
gasoline prices 10 cents per
gallon. "I don't know if it
was a bad idea," she com-
mented. "I'm just glad it
didn't pass."

She and her husband, Rob-
ert, purchased a smaller car
because of its better mile-
age. She also tries to com-
bine errands when she
comes into town, to reduce
the number of trips she has
to make.

A homemaker in a very
literal sense, she and her
husband have been building
their own home on McAlpine
Road, Gagetown, for the
past three years. They hope
to move in in July.

Her husband is employed
at the Caro Regional Center.
They have a son, Jason, 4.

Marie Meredith spent May
13-16 as a patient in the
Huron Memorial Hospital,
Bad Axe.

The United Methodist
Bible School will be held
June 9-13. It will start at 7:15
for the entire family.

May 23 members of the
United Methodist church
will go bowling.

Friday evening the Meth-
odists honored graduates at
a family night. Mr. and Mrs.

Gary Bader sponsored the
program.

Mr. and Mrs. Wally Mc-
Lean, of Ubly, were callers
Sunday afternoon of Mr. and
Mrs. Alex Wheeler and fam-
ily.

School reunions will take
place June 7.

RLDS WOMEN
The RLDS Women's De-

partment met Thursday at

Big Brothers/Big Sisters

the home of Mrs. Curtis
Cleland.

Maude Holcomb had the
worship and Mrs. Don Smith
the lesson. Mrs. Dean Smith
was in charge of the meet-
ing. The group will put on
the May birthday party at
Provincial House.

Mrs. Frank Pelton, Karen
King and family attended
the graduation service Sun-
day evening in Deckerville.

CASS CITY, MICHIG/

Singles club
celebrating
10th birthda

*̂
The YMCA Thumb Single

Club of Sandusky will coj
duct its 10th anniversaJT
dance and party Saturday i
Sandusky High School froi]
8:30 p.m.-12:30 a.m. - I

Music will be provided b|
Deny Ewald and the Musil
Makers. I

It will be guest night anl
all adults are welcome. Rd"
freshments will be served.

One way to avoid excit
ment is to live within you'rj
income.

A lot of special attention is
needed from a man for this
little eight-year-old boy. He
comes from a large family
in Unionville, and enjoys
building things, playing foot-
ball and basketball.

Hobart on dean's list
Cathy J. Hobart of Gage-

town has been named to the
1979-80 clean's list at Aquinas
College. Grand Rapids.

She is a junior .
To be named to the list , a

student needed a m i n i m u m
grade point average of 3.5.

PICK YOUR TIRE &

STEEl BELTED
GLASS BELTED

POWER STREAK
78

Goodyear's best-selling diagonal ply
tire. It olfers honest performance,
honest value. Road-gripping tread
design, rugged polyester cord body.

$2719
A78-13 whitewal l

plus$1.55 FETandold t i re

Whilewall
Size

H7h 13

C78 4

lift 4

Hh 4

u It; 4

O7H 'j

H7H \\,

OUR
PRICE

1(J 22

33 2lj

3') 27

3h 34

3'J .12

4 1 1 7

43 39

41) 1)4

Liberal

Plu
FETa
OldT

1 70

1 <J3

1 82

2 23

,' :i«

2 41)

2 ()!)

2 %

Bui

TIEMPO
RADIAL

Goodyear's best selling radial t i re. . .
the one you've seen advertised on
TV. It's the rain tire, sun tire, traction
tire - the one tire that does it all.
'Tiempo.' Only from Goodyear.

S/IC3245
P15580R13 whitewall

plus$1.59 FETandold tire

Budget 1

Whilewall
Size

HIH:>7'>HI3

P11J')7!)HI4

M20!)7'jH14

P21')7'jHI4

?22r)7!)HI4

64 15

6(iB3

6820

71 24

G7.52

7 6 2 7

)J22i)7()HI!) 7 2 7 0

OUR
PRICE

Plus
FETand
Old Tire

202

233

248

2 b B

281

257

2 7!)

rerms...Low Month

CUSHION BELT
POLYGLAS

A versatile performer with emphasis
on value. Two tread-firming fiber-
glass belts, two polyester cord body
plies. Hundreds of carefully angled
biting edges in the tread for sure
traction and handling.

$3807
B78-13 whitewall

plus $1.85 FETandold tire

Whilewall
Size

U7H 14

b78-14

F78 14

U7B 14

H/8 14

Ci /B- lb

H 78-1 f)

L/8-1')

OUR
PRICE

4220

4382

•If) 73

4 / (j.'i

MM

4B 73

1)2 M

Plus
FETand
Old Tire

2 Ob

2 2 1

2.'I/

2!)4

2 79

21)2

2B4

l 3 13

y Payments
Complete Headquarters For Farm, Truck, And Auto Tires

FARM TIRE CENTER
6168 West Main Street

Cass City

GOOD'/YEAR

This nine-year-old from
Kingston is anxious to meet
a man who enjoys games,
and outdoor activities. Why

Laurie greets
Reagan at
airport
Michigan Farm Bureau

Vice-president Jack Laurie
of Dodge Road, Cass City,
was in the reception line
May 13 at Tri-City Airport of
those who officially greeted
Republican presidential
candidate Ronald Reagan
and wife Nancy when they
stepped off the plane.

At a fund raising break-
fast the following morning,
Reagan endorsed Norman
Hughes, Republican candi-
date for the 8th Congression-
al seat now held by Demo-
crat Bob Traxler.

More than $18,000 for
Hughes was raised at the
breakfast.

Veterans'
benefits
announced

The Veterans Administra-
tion spent $576.57 million in
Michigan in fiscal year 1979.

In Tuscola county, VA
expenditures totaled $1.86
mil l ion; Sanilac, $1.18 mil-
l ion, and Huron. $1.29 mi l -
l ion .

Of those amounts, com-
pensation and pensions ac-
counted for $1.38 mi l l i on in
Tuscola; $872,459 in Sanilac
and $953,962 in Huron. The
total for Michigan was
$315.79 mi l l i on .

Expenditures for educa-
t ional benefits to Vietnam
era veterans and other t ra in-
ing programs were $336,685
in Tuscola $212,721 in Sani-
lac and $232,593 in Huron.
Statewide, the amount
totaled sl ightly under $77
mil l ion .

In Michigan, the VA spent
$32.65 mi l l ion on insurance
and indemnities, of which
$142,771 was spent in Tus-
cola county. The figure was
$90,204 in Sanilac and $98,631
in Huron.

Dale Smith
promoted
by Army

Dale R. Smith, son of Mr.
and Mrs. Wilford Smith, 5820
Severance Road, Deford, re-
cently was promoted to
Army specialist four while
serving as a multichannel
communications equipment
operator with the 2nd Arm-
ored Division in Garlstedt,
Germany.

The appointing orders for
this promotion stated
". . .The Secretary of the
Army has placed special
trust and confidence in this
soldier's patriotism, valor,
fidelity and abilities."

The promotion was based
upon these qualities and the
demonstrated potential for
increased responsibilities.

Smith, who entered the
Army in July. 1978, is a 1978
graduate of Cass City High
School

not give him a try?

A very active nine-year-
old is waiting in the Caro
area. He enjoys doing most
anything. He definitely
needs the one-to-one atten-
tion of a man. He is a nice
boy and lots of fun to be
around.

; HUE PHOTO

| BUY BACK"
9 Guawitfee.

This eight-year-old in
Kingston is anxious to meet
a man to talk with. He
enjoys sports, cartoons, and
any activities outdoors. A
very nice boy to spend time
with.

Big Brothers-Big Sisters
in Tuscola county is located
at 129 E. Burnside Street,
Caro, telephone 673-6996; in
Sanilac county at 26 Lexing-
ton Street, P.O. Box 1,
Sandusky, telephone 648-
4433.

Li or prints you don't like no
If matter what the reason.

Take up to a month to decide, dont
forget your original envelope or store
receipt.
Guarantee applies only to original rdls
processed and printed by Hite Photo.

WE USE KODAK PAPER FOR A GOOD LOOK!

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
MIKE WEAVER, Owner Ph. .8723613

Eim-rfreiicy Ph. 872-3283
Your Family Discount Drug Store

AUTO PARTS STORES

SPRING CAR CARE SALE
WAGNER

BHAXF WOnucI1-,

BRAKE SHOES
AND
DISC BRAKE
PADS
For most American
cars and light trucks
iSoine applications slightly higher)

BRAKE SHOES

799
JF • SET

EXCHANGE

BRAKE PADS

CUMOUT
Add to the fuel
Cleans carburetor
and fuel system
while you drive
160Z Size *7502

139

GUNK
Quickly removes
grease and dirt
spray it on -
hose it off
16 oz aerosol

119

The better you take
care of your car. the
longer it will take
care of you Pick up
the things you'll need
at a savings right
now at your
CARQUEST Auto Parts
Store Regular care
always costs less
than repairs

Johnny Rutherford
Two time Indy 500 Winner

BLUE POLY
ONE STEP SEALANT
The One-Step Poly Sealant for the
do-it-yourselfer Cleans shines and
seals in one easy application
Contains an advanced formula that
actually bonds to the metallic
surface of your car

TURTLEWAX
CAR WASH
Rich, mild deep-cleaning
suds that float away dirt
and grime
Large 18 oz size

CARQUEST
MOTOR OIL
10W40 ALL SEASON
OR HD 30 WT.
Meets or exceeds all
manufacturers new car
warranty requirements.

#EB-1

995
Protects for
24 months or
your money back!

99C
#T-75

YOUR CHOICE

79C
LIMIT ONE CASE
PER CUSTOMER

DUPLICOLOR
AUTOSPRAYPAINT
Durable high gloss, fast drying
acrylic lacquer Duplicates
vehicle's original color
colors to match most
American cars and trucks 130Z can

can
WE KNOW WHAT YOU MEAN WHEN YOU'RE TALKING PARTS. I"

me 75 CARQUEST Auto P.irts stores in Michigan .ire pnrt ol trie 1400 stores nationwide I1"™

Cass City Auto Supply
6585 Main Street

Cass City, Michigan
Phone 872-2178

[!••» cood ar nil participating CARQUEST Auto Parts stores thru May 25,1980.

LAWRENCE INSURANCE AGENCY, INC
124 N STATE ST.

CARO
PH. 673-4141

LIFE HOME CAR - BUSINESS BONDS - FARM 6265 MAIN ST.
CASS CITY
PH. 872-4343
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Citizens of Tomorrow Debut of new carburetor
highlights Althaver world tour

Suzanne, 11, and
Krista, 7, children
of Mr. and Mrs.
Tim Grassmann,
5139 Penny Road,
Cass City.

Austin, 2, son of
Mr. and Mrs.
James Brinkman,
4mBayCity-For-
estvi l le Road,
Gagetown.

Bobby, 6, and
Tonya, 9, children
of Mr. and Mrs.
Harry McKellar,
7559 Bach Road,
Gagetown.

Lambert E. Althaver,
president of Walbro Corp.,
recently returned to corpor-
ate headquarters at Cass
City after a tour which took
him to Walbro subsidiaries
around the world.

Beginning at the multi-
national's Walbro GmbH in
Stuttgart, West Germany,
the tour included Walbro de
Mexico in Nogales, Sonora,
Mexico, then Walbro Far
East Headquarters in Kawa-
saki City, Japan.

Walbro Far East includes
a manufacturing and as-
sembly plant in Miyagi Pre-
fecture, Japan. The tour also
included Walbro Singapore,
where the Walbro line of
diaphragm carburetors for
small gasoline engines is
produced for use on chain
saws, brush cutters, and
weed trimmers.

One of the highlights of
Mr. Althaver's trip was a
press conference held in
Kawasaki City, with a group
of Japanese f inanc ia l , in-

dustrial and trade news-
paper editors and publish-
ers. The news conference,
hosted by Hirohito Kobay-
ashi, president, and Tatsuya
Mizutani, chief engineer of
Walbro Far East, was held
to announce final develop-
ment and initial production
of a new Walbro "WZ"
Model carburetor. The new
carburetor was developed
specifically for the brush
cutter industry, and will be
manufactured and sold by
Walbro Far East.

The trio also gave the
press a general description
of the structure and business
of Walbro Corporation, in-
cluding details concerning
its subsidiaries in Japan,
Singapore, Mexico and West
Germany.

Althaver pointed out the
origin of the new carburetor
provides an excellent illus-
tration of the many benefits
of Walbro's multi-national
sharing of resources and
disciplines in fuel systems

Kimberly, 11, and Kimberly, 11, and
Katherine, 5, chil- John, 10, children
dren of Mr. and of Mr. and Mrs.
Mrs. Don Wild- John Ols/ak, 5584
man, (>S77 Herron W a l s h Road ,
Drive, Cass City. Gagetown.

Doug, 6, and
Amy Jo, 4, children
of Mr. and Mrs.
D o u g l a s G r a y ,
4924 Quinn Street,
Gagetown.

112 to receive

diplomas at

Ubly Sunday

Brad, 9, Mcllis- Rebecca, 8, and
sa, (i, and Jodi, 4, Gary, 4, children
children ot Air. and of Mr. and Mrs.
Mrs. James Cope- Norman Kminons,
l and , 7X00 Bach (iS(»S Reagh Street,
Road, Gugetoyvn. Gagetown.

Bil l , 11, and
Vieki, (J, children
of Mr. and Mrs.
Kit Kicker , 4937
C e n t e r S t r e e t ,
Gagetown.

There w i l l be 112 grad-
uates receiving their di-
plomas Sunday at I 'b ly High
School.

Combined baccalaureate
and commencement cere-
monies begin at - p .m. in the
g y m n a s i u m .

The l i s t of g radua tes is as
follows:

Dessalee Hensinger .
C y n t h i a A n n Hischer. K a t h -
er ine Mane Block. Holier!
.lames Block. Donald Dennis
Booms, Michae l Paul Brio-
l a t , Sherry A n n Br io la t .
Cheryl Kay Conley. Joseph
A. Cook. Scoit Curtis Cook.
Maureen Crowell . Robert D.
Dreger. Mar lenc Mary
Dropiewski . Diana Lynn
Hckenswiller. Bryce Ed-
ward Kmmendorfe r . Koy
Thomas E m m i n g . Sherri
A n n K r t m a n .

Su/anne Marie Kiset te .
Linda ( J a y Fisher . M i c h e l l e
1. Fl igger . Kenne th K r v i n
Fran!/ . Sharon Mane Fran-
y.el. Kenneth David ( J l a / a .

Mark Steven Glaza, Mary
Beth Gl in ieck i , Laura M.
Gornowic/.. Diane Lynn Gos-
d/ inski , Terrence Joseph
Goscl / inski , Ann Hena
Gril 'ka, Mae Catherine
G r i f k a . David Ar thu r

Bet ty M. H a l i f a x ,
Robin Hanselman.
W. lleilig, Margo
Heleski. Richard
l le lesk i , Lori M.

(iuigar,
Laurey
Thomas
Louise
( la ra rd
l l o l d w i f k

THE FSUST BAPTIST CHURCH
Corner oi Houghton and West

Weekly Though!

Services • . ' . > :

Messages A I/ i"

KM

Rev. T. W.Teal l . Pastor

Mary L. Hanby, Church Worker

872-3155
872-2888

Guideline for

seeking benefits

uninsured
farm «

workers:

I 'eople ncai ' inn ii:"> who are
not a l ready receiving Social
Secu r i t y h c i u - t i t s should con-
tac t the Saginaw Social Se-
c u r i t y o f f i c e two to three
i n o n l h s before t h e i r b i r t h -
day , according to Susan
Ludwin. f ield representa-
t i v e .

These people should do so
in order to be sure t h a t they
have l u l l Medicare protec-
I ion t h e m o n t h they reach (if).
This is t r u e , she said, even if
t h e y have no ret i rement

Library

FINANCIAL FARM DISASTER COULD RESULT
Agricultural employers must provide the same work-

er's disability compensation coverage for their employ-
ees as do non-agricultural employers. It's the law.

Farm Bureau Mutual can help. Our agricultural
worker's disability compensation insurance programs
are proven to work right for all types of Michigan
farmers.

If you employ any agricultural labor, remember the
law. Your Farm Bureau Insurance agent can help.

Farm Bureau Mutual is one of the few insurers
offering reduced rates and minimum premiums for
agricultural employees.

Bruce King & Paul Leonard
6148 E. Cass City Road, Cass City, Ml 48726

Office Phone: 517-872-4720

FARM BUREAU ;*•
INSURANCE fl

GROUP, f 1

board

meets
Library Board members

Mrs. K .L MacRae, Esther
McCullough, Barbara Tuck-
ey and l ib ra r ian Barbara
l iu tchinson were present
Tuesday morning for the
board's monthly meeting at
the Rawson Memorial
Library . Absent were May-
nard McConkey, Lou La-
Ponsie and Mrs. Lucy
Auten .

The l ibrar ian reported
2,100 persons have been
issued l ibrary cards to date.
Circulat ion is at. the usual
rate for this time of the year.

Some landscaping around
the new part of the library is
planned and Mrs. Tuckey
will provide petunias for
planting. The historical so-
ciety will construct cup-
boards to store material for
that organization.

The summer reading pro-
gram "Mission 80" is
planned.

Looking forward, there
are plans for a craft show
and perhaps a flower display
in August

plans
I 'eople not a l r e a d \

m o n t h l y b e n e f i t s h a v e a
l imi ted l i m e load to br MIIV
t h e i r f u l l Medicare p ro tec -
t i o n begins a t i in .

I I t hey d o n ' t act w i t h i n t h e
i t -month period before the
m o n t h t h e y reach ( i f i , i h e i r
Medica re med ica l i n s u r a n c e
pro tec t ion can be delayed
from l - i i months. Medical
in su rance may be delayed
for a year or more if a
person f a i l s to act w i t h i n the
It months a f te r his or her until
b i r t h d a y m o n t h , a n d t h e
m o n t h l y p r e m i u m may be
increased.

People should have cer-
t a i n evidence a v a i l a b l e
when they contact the o f f i ce ,
i n c l u d i n g Social Security
card or a record of the
number; proof of age,
preferably a b i r th or bap-
tism record made shortly
after bir th, and W-2 forms
(wage and tax statement) or
self-employment tax returns
for the previous two years.

Ludwig said that people
who don't have this informa-
tion should not delay con-
tacting Social Security. The
people at the Saginaw office
can suggest other evidence
which can be used.

The Saginaw Social Secur-
ity office is at E. Genesee
and N. Warren Streets in
downtown Saginaw, tele-
phone 771-1010.

David l lunsanger . Leona
Mar ie Kanaby. Kevin James
K a u f m a n . Carl Steven Kel-
ler, Patricia Ann Kiehl,
.lames Kenne th King , Earl
Thomas Klee, Karen Marie
K u h a c k i . Lori Lee Kubacki .
Mark .Joseph Kubacki.
Miclu ' l r Marie Kuback i .
Lisa Jean K u t l e r . Denise
M a r i e Lemke. Darren
Michael Lubeski. Edward
Alec McDonald . J u l i e Kay
M c D o n a l d . Joseph Angus
M c E a c h i n . Ann Margaret
Maurcr

Patsy Kay Maurcr . (!reg-
nry M a r v i n Messing. . J e f f r e y
Benedict Messing. Karen
M a r i e Messing. Pau l ine
Mary Messing. T i m o t h y
Joseph Messing. Therese
Maureen Miscism. Jacque••
f ine Jean Mush ie r , Mar jor ie
K a > Murdock . Thomas Pal-
r i ck Navarre . Colleen Mary
Nowak. I Hume Andrew
< 1 Parka Dean James Osen-
i n s k i . Deborah Jean Osen-
l o s k i . T i m o t h y Michae l
( t M ' i i t o s k i . Colleen Ann
P i T i i s k i . David A l v i n
Pe rusk i , ( ia r re l John
Pcniski . K i r t Douglas Per-
u s k i . Ella Mac Peter

M a l e M a r k Peters , Ken-
n e t h John P i c h l a . Ar lcne
M a n P i o n k . A n n M a r i e
Pol lmn. Joseph S Pus/.,
D u n i r E l a i n e Puva l awsk i ,
l . e i s ; i Mane H e m e l l . Laur ie

l . v i i n e Robei ' l s . Tanya L in
R o K l o n . ( l e r a l d Michael
R u i l y . ( i a r y Joseph Rumpl / . ,
Douglas Kev in Sadro, Mel-
v i n James Sadro. M a r i l y n
Kay Sagcman, Richard
Henry Sehwart/. . Gerald
W i l l i a m Sin i lhers, David
James Slacer, Anthony Ray-
mond Stout , Frederick
James Sweeney.

Jean Marie Terbrack,
Evgenia S. Theodosiadou,
Benjamin E. Thompson,
Karl Lee Trepkowski, Col-
leen Kay Tschirhart, Daniel
Joseph Vogel, Timothy John
Voorheis, Kimberly Sue
Walsh, Nancy Joanne
Walsh, Belinda Lee War-
chuck, Mark Anthony
Wasierski, Linda K. Weber,
Dean William Weltin, Gor-
don Phillip Weltin, Dennis
Daniel Wolschlager, Mark
Anthony Wolschlager,
Roger Kenneth Wrubel, Wil-
liam John Wruble.

To work for you
The Chronicle PHONE 872-2010

technology, since the new East. Thus, a product con- ary to meet a local need now
product was designed and ceived and produced by promises to become a global
developed by Walbro Far Walbro's overseas subsidi- best-seller.

WORLD TOUR « Hirohito Kobayashi, president of
Walbro Far East, demonstrates the use of EDM machining
to produce dies used for the manufacture of Walbro's new
WZ brush cutter engine carburetor to Walbro President
Lambert E. Althaver during the latter's world tour of the
corporation's subsidiaries.
********************************^***£

TaMMST**
*
*

**********
Now Through May 31

ROTISSIRH

With Purchase Of
AMBERLIGHT

REGENCY or CLASSIC

A
$37.00 Value

AMBERLIGHT

REGENCY
S269Without

Cylinder
00

Reg. Price S397.00

Dual stainless steel burners with 5-year
limited warranty. Dual modulating heat
controls (High, Medium, Low). 40,000
BTUH total input (20,000 BTUH per
control). Porcelamized cast iron channel
grids. Raised cooking rack. 482 square
inches ol cooking su r face . Flava-
Briquettes. Extra deep. . .17'/2 inches.
Also available for Natural Gas.

*12.00 FACTORY J
REBATE I

With Purchase Of Regency Gas Grill
Of fer Expires May 31,1980Jf ,

* *
4*********************

Model PC-40-3TB

AMBERLIGHT

CLASSIC
Without
Cylinder

$22900
Reg. Price $331.00

Dual stainless steel burners with 5-year limited
warranty. Dual modulating heat controls (High,
Medium, Low). 30,000 BTUH total input (15,000 BTUH
per control). Porcelainized cast iron channel grids.
Raised cooking rack. 362 square inches of cooking
surface. Flava-Briquettes. Extra deep • 163/4 inches.

)|***********************
<t0 AA WCTORY >
*O.UU REBATE ;:

_ With Purchase of Classic Gas Grill j.
T Offer Expires May 31,1980 j.

************************

Model PC-30-3TB

^FUELGAS
FUELGAS i

'CO. of CASS CITY
OPEN DAILY 8-5, SATURDAY 8-Noon

4 Miles East of Cass City at Corner of M-53 &M'81

Phone 872-2161 " —
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3 losses cloud

O-G baseball

title hopes

TyiMui o ••• tmt

' O-G cops 5th straight
league softball title

, Owen-Gage clinched at
least a second place share in
the North Central D League
baseball standings at home
Thursday when it split with
Kingston.

The Bulldogs won the
opener, 3-2, but lost the
nightcap, 4-2.

Coach Phil Gray's squad
finished the league season
with a 9-5 mark. The other
teams don't finish unti l this
week, with a first place
finish still possible, depend-
ing on how Carsonville-Port
Sanilac does in its final four
games.

Pete Klemkowsky struck
out seven, walked two and
surrendered four hits to win
the opener. The senior ace
has a 7-2 win-loss mark so
far this season.

Losing pitcher Brian Eld-
ridge gave up six hits,
walked three and struck out
two.

Vince Salcido hit two
. singles and Jim Glidden had

a double for the Bulldogs.
Jason Koehler of the Cardi-
nals hit a double.

Todd Remsig lessened the
Bulldog's chances for a first
place finish in striking out
six and giving up f ive hits in

Richards paces
qualifiers —

AMD

Catalogs loaned

overnight.

FREE

SUBSCRIPTION

with each order.

The Chronicle
PHONE 872-2010

the 4-2 nightcap. He walked
four.

Losing pitcher Jim Ruhr
threw the first three innings,
to be relieved by Klemkow-
sky for the final two. They
combined for four hits, eight
walks and eight strikeouts.

Kirk Carolan, Klemkow-
sky, Glidden, Salcido and
Kuhr each hit a single for
Owen-Gage.

Wade Campbell collected
two singles for Kingston.

The Bulldogs played a
non-conference game at
home against Lakers Tues-
day. Their pre-district game
is Friday at Carsonville.

The Owen-Gage baseball
team ended its regular sea-
son Tuesday by dropping
both ends of a double header
at home against non-league
Lakers, 7-2 and ll-l .

The Bulldogs f inish the
regular season at 10-10 over-
all and play in the pre-dis-
tricls Friday at Carsonville-
Port Sanilac.

Tod Dubey was the win-
ning pitcher in the opener,
giving up three hi ts , three
walks and striking out three.

Losing pitcher Pete Klem-
kowsky surrendered f ive
hits, walked nine and struck
out nine. He also hit a triple
for his team.

Rob Herzog connected for
a double and a single for
Lakers.

Troy Gunden was the win-
ning hurler in the second
game, str iking out seven,
walking four and giving up
three hits.

He hit a double and a
single for his team. Don
Bergman and Todd Weisen-
baugh each hit two singles.

Losing pitcher Alan Haag
was relieved by Kirk Caro-
lan. They gave up nine hits ,
four walks and struck out
five.

Haag hit two singles.

The Owen-Gage softball
team won its fifth straight
North Central D League title
last week, ending its 14-0
season with two wins Thurs-
day at Kingston.

The Bulldogs won the first
game, 17-14, and the second,
14-3.

In her five years at the
helm, Judy Campbell's soft-
ball teams have lost only two
league games, both last
year, the only year they had
to share the title with anoth-
er team.

Winning pitcher in the
opener was Dana Laurie,
who pitched the first 3 2-3
innings, and gave up 14 runs,
six hits, nine walks and
struck out two.

She was relieved by Tarn-

Girls finish sixth

my Kain, who gave UD
only one hit in her 2 1-3
innings.

Top hitters in the Bulldog
onslaught were Becky How-
ard with two home runs and
a single; Carol Goslin, two
singles and two doubles;
Julie Andrakowicz, three
singles, and Heidi Rockefel-
ler, two singles and a triple.

Marie Lalko took the
Cardinal loss, giving up 17
runs, 16 hits, four walks and
striking out three.

She and Sally Engler each
hit two singles. Liz Pierce
connected for a double.

Howard started the second
game for Owen-Gage and
gave up three runs, one hit
and five walks, striking out
one, before being pulled by

coach Campbell after two-
thirds of an inning.

Kain went the rest of the
distance to get the win,
giving up only one walk in
her 5 1-3 innings on the
mound.

Losing pitcher was again
Lalko. who struck out one,
walked four and gave up
nine hits and 14 runs.

Howard hit another home
run, plus a double. Robin
Sullivan and Dana Laurie
each hit a single and a
double.

Pierce had Kingston's lone
h i t , a double.

The Bulldogs played a
non-league game Tuesday at
home against Lakers. Fri-
day, they play in the pro-dis-
t r ic ts at Port Hope.

Cass City qualified for
State competition in four
events among the boys and
two events among the girls
in regional competition held
Friday at Marlette.

The boys' contingent will
be headed by Steve Richards
who qualified with a record
in the mile, third in 880 and
in the mile relay where Cass
City finished third1. Other
boys on the mile relay team
are Ray Kloc, Bob Sawdon
and Tim Sontag. Brian de-
Beaubien was th i rd in the
discus.

In addition to the quali-
fiers, others who won med-
als were Joe Decker, fourth
in the pole v a u l t ; Todd Com-
ment, sixth in high jump;
Mark Mozden, sixth in the
two mile, and the 880 relay
team of Sontag, Steve Da-

dacki, Max Morrish and
Sawdon, sixth.

The state qualifiers
among the girls were fresh-
man Michelle Fahrner, with
:63 in the 440 for a first
place, and senior Teresa
Hewitt, with a second in the
110-yard hurdles with a time
of :16.29.

Others to win medals but
failing to qualify for the
State were: Hewitt, sixth in
the 220-yard hurdles; Kristy
Deering, fourth in the 'two
mile; the mile relay team of
Jane Hobart, Shelley Rabi-
deau, Deanna Pomeroy and
Fahrner, which finished
fourth, and the 880 relay
team of Fahrner, Hewitt,
Hobart and Janie Wright
which finished sixth.

Deering's time of 12.49.9
set a new Cass City school
record.

at Huron
meet, too

Bulldog boys roll to

North Central track title
The Owen-Gage boys took

home the championship
trophy Wednesday of last
week from the North Central
D League meet at Kingston.

The Bulldogs, coached by
Arnie Besonen, won six
events, including all three
relays.

The Akron-Fairgrove girls
won the i r division of the
meet , w i th the Bulldogs
coming in sixth of eight
teams.

The meet began Tuesday

but rain forced it being
continued the following day.

BOYS' KVKNTS

Point totals were Owen-
Gage, 109; North Huron, 95;
Kingston, 85; Akron-Fair-
grove, 71; Peck, (>9; Carson-
ville-Port Sanilac, 39; Case-
ville. 27, and Port Hope. 1.

First place and top Owen-
Gage f in isher in each event
were:

Long j u m p - 1) Jeff

ROLLING HILLS
GOLF COURSE

PRESENTS

ii

'!
GRAND
SLAM"

A NEW LOUNGE

NOW SERVING SANDWICHES
BEER AND WINE

WATCH FOR OUR

GRAND OPENING
COMING SOON

HAPPY HOUR - Mon.-Fri. 5-7 p.m.

- HOURS -
Monday-Thursday 8 a.m. -11 p.m.
Friday and Saturday 8a.m. - 12p.m.
Sunday 12a.m. -12p.m.

6586 W.MILLIGAN
(At The Golf Course)

PHONE 872-3569

Jokn & Maharg

Hallock, O-G, 19'7".
High j u m p - l ) Seddon, P.

5'10"; 4) Jim Glidden, O-G.
Shot put - 1 ) VanConant ,

P, 4<i '7 ' : : 1 ' ; 2) Pete Klem-
kowsky. O-G.

Discus - 1 1 VanConan t , P,
120'3"; (i) Klemkowsky.

Pole v a u l t - 1 ) J im Pat-
naude, O-G, i;i'.

120 high hurdles - 1 1
Peter. K , l l i . l i ; 4 i Scott
Gaeth . O-G.

100-yard dash - D Hal -
lock. O-G. 10.(i.

Mi le - 1 i Detmers. A-K.
4 : 5 1 .

880 relay - 1 1 Owen-Gage,
1:38.1.

•140 yard run - 1 ) Karrcr,
A-F, 54. ( i ; f i ) Vargo. O-G.

440 relay - 1 ) Owen-Gage.
1*7 T
t I . I .

330-yard low hurdles - 1 >
Novack. C. 41 . ( i : H i Brad
Kriekson, O-G.

880 yard run - 1 1 Tennan t .
C, 2:13.f i ; 4 i Chris Hu i / a r ,
O-G.

220-yard run - 1 ) Karver .
A-F, n o t i m e a v a i l a b l e ; 2 >
Hallock. O-G.

Two mi le - 1 ) Isek-r. Ml,
no t ime ava i l ab le .

Mile relay - l i Owen-
Gage. 3:43.2.

G I K l . S ' KVKNTS

Point totals were Akron-
Fairgrove, l f > < i ; Kingston,
115; Peck. (15; North Huron,
5 1 ' L - ; C-PS, 4!)',; Owen-
Gage, 18; Caseville, 4; Port
Hope, 1.

Events in which the Bul l -
clog girls placed were:

Long j u m p -- 1 ) Stone,
A-F, 13'IF,"; 5) Jennifer
Errer, O-G.

High j u m p - n Linda
Draggoo, C-PS, 4'10"; 4)
Jul ie Andrakowic/., O-G.

Shot put - 11 Naert, A-F,
30.3; 3) Andrakowic/, O-G.

110 low hurdles - n
Pringle, P, 15.9; 3) Mary
Kay Burrows, O-G.

880 relay -- 1 ) A-F, 1.-59.fi;
(i) O-G.

R K G I O N A L S

Owen-Gage qual i f ied en-
trants in five events in the
Class D regionals Saturday
at Caro High School. The
Bulldogs of Arnie Besonen
placed fourth in the team
standings.

The qualifiers will now be
participating in the state
Class D track meet May 31
at Grand Blanc.

The top three in each
event qualified.

Jim Patnaude took first
place in the pole vault at
12'4'-" and Jeff Hallock won
the long jump with a dis-
tance of 20'2".

Jim Glidden took second
in the 100-yard dash with a
time of 11.3. Hallock, whose
specialty is the dashes,
didn't run in those events
due to illness.

Two Bulldog relay teams
will be going to the state
competition. The 880-yard
team of Jeff and Lennie
Hallock, Brad Erickson and
Jim Glidden took second
with a time of 1:36.

The mile relay team of
Dave Ondrajka, Erickson
and.Jim and Dan Glidden
came in third in a time of
3:42.9.

Scott Gaeth captured f i f th

in the 120-yard high hurdles
at l(>.9'.i and Pete Klemkow-
sky's toss of 44 ' (> ' - . :" in the
shot put was good for s ixth.

Fowler won the event wi th
1034 points , followed by
Detroit Country Day, 79;
Mich igan Lutheran Semi-
nary , 49, and Owen-Gage. 45.

Top performer for the
Bulldog girls was Mary Kay
Burrows with a f i f t h in the
110-vard low hurdles.

Another in a long str ing of
track laurels was bestowed
on Steve Richards , Cass C i ty
High School's premier dis-
tance runner. Monday at the
Huron meet of champions.

Richards was named the
ou t s tand ing male a t h l e t e of
the meet as he set two meet
records on his way to a pair
of i n d i v i d u a l event wins.

Richards was f i r s t in the
880-yard run when he set a
new meet record of 2:0(1.5 to
crack Tom Sheckl's of Bad
Axe ,mark of 2 : i i l . O .

Richards ' mi le l ime of
4:31 .31 cracked the mark of
Doug Iseler of Nor th Huron
( 4 : 3 3 . 5 ) .

In a d d i t i o n to the records
Richards ran the 1 anchor on
the w inn ing mile relay team.
C'ass C i t y was in t h i r d place
about 20 yards behind am)
Richa rds made up t h e d i f -

Hawks top Lakers twice

ference to post the win in
3:3(i . l .

Other runners on the win-
ning team were Ray Kloc,
Bob Sawdon and Tim Son-
tag.

Other medal winners at
the meet included: Brian
dcBeaubien. second, discus,
125-9; Todd Comment, sec-
ond high j ump , 5-11; Joe
Decker, second, pole vault,
12-0; Scott Hobart, second,
330 low hurdles, :41.54; Bob
YnnCamp, second, 880,
2:0;i.(i(i; Steve Hollis, sec-
ond, 120 high hurdles, :16.8;
Ray Kloc. second, 440, :53;
HBO're lay team, third, with
Tim Sontag. Steve Dadacki,
Max Morrish and Sawdon.

In the girls ' competition
Teresa Hewitt finished sec-
ond in the 110-yard low
hurd les and the Cass City 880
relay team f in ished fourth.

A

Cass Ci ty won two of throe
baseball games played dur-
ing the week but would
probably have cheerfully
traded t h e two wins for the
one garni- t h a t was los t .

That ' s because (he Hawks
lost the q u a l i f y i n g round
Kami1 against Mar le t t e , 2-0.
last Thursday and defeated
tin 1 Lakers twice las t
Wednesday in Thumb B
Conference competi t ion.

The wins d i d n ' t mean
a n y t h i n g as far as Cass
Ci ty ' s t i t l e chances were1

concerned but did cap a
regular season t h a t was
much be t te r t h a n average.

Aga ins t M a r l e t t e the
Hawks received good p i t c h -
ing from Ken M a r t i n who
allowed just two h i t s out the 1

Haiders were able to t u r n
bo th .safet ies i n t o runs .

The Hawks picked up t w o
hits in the third but a double
p lay ru ined Cass C i t y ' s
chances. Steve I l e r ron
walked two and s t r u c k out
f i v e in b is s h u t o u t s t i n t on
t in- m o u n d .

Cass Ci ty used a s e v e n - h i t
a t t a c k t h a t produced f i v e
runs as the Hawks rolled
past the Lakers in the f i r s t
game. f > - : i .

I t was a sloppy name as
the Lakers were charged
w i t h seven errors and the
Ibwks w i t h f i v e . K a n i e v
Stoulenburg got c r ed i t lor
the win as he p i t c h e d a f o u r -
h i t t e r and s t r u c k out i n .
Mike Stec lashed ou t t h r e e
h i t s and M a r t i n added a pa i r

Set 3-day Osei
The second annual round

robin softball tournament,
sponsored by the Oscntoski
fast pitch team, will begin
Friday and wind up with
playoffs Sunday afternoon.

Teams wi l l be divided into
two divisions and will com-
pete at the Cass City Recre-
ation Park.

The tournament begins
Friday at 7:30 p.m. wi th four
games to be played. It will
continue Saturday, s tar t ing
at 10 a.m. and continue all
day, wi th the last game
start ing at 9 p.m.

Sunday w i l l see one regu-
lar game begin A 11 a .m. .
followed by the tou rnamen t
p layof f s at 1 p.m.

The Div i s ion A champions
wi l l take on the Divis ion B
runner-up and the Divis ion B
winners w i l l play the D i v i -
sion A runner-up. A consola-
tion game svill be played at 3
p.m. for the losers. The
championship game wi l l be-
gin at 4:30 p.m.

Teams to be competing in
the Division A race are: Tr i -
County Sports, Reese; Ray-
mond's Sports Center, Sagi-

Sometimcs it's difficult to accept the fact
that certain events are actually hap-
pening to you ... Like the time the wind
blew the tree across the roof, or you
backed into your neighbors car. Not all
of them were disasters.. . just unexpected
and expensive. That last part is where we
can help. For insurance of any kind, give
us a call!

HARRIS-
HAMPSHIRE

AGENCY, INC.
6d15E. Cass City Road

Phone 872-2688

-\

ette
year

to lead t h e Hawk a t t acK.
in l i i t - n ightcap Cass City

used a pair of errors and two
hi t s in the third inning to
score two runs and it was
enough for the win as Todd
Comment pitched a strong
game in a rare mound start.

Comment pitched the first
5 2-3 innings before being
rel ieved wi th the tying run '
on base by Stoutenburg.who
made his f ina l appearance
for Cass Ci ty a memorable
one by s t r iking out the
Lakers ' Farver and ending
the game.

Stec. who proved to be
Cass Ci ty ' s most productive
h i t t e r continued his heavy
st icking with two singles in
three tr ies.

tourney
naw, winner ot last year s
tournament; Eddie's Party
Shop, F l i n t ; Cozy Corner
Saloon, Flint, and Pee Wee's
Barbecue. Flint.

The Division B contest will
have: Severance Tool, Sagi-
naw; The Station, Cass City;
Munger Merchants, Mun :
gcr; Bay City Towing, Bay
C i t y , and The Misty, Flint.

In case of rain, the tourna-
ment schedule will be ad-
justed by officials with the
possibi l i ty of f inishing Mon-
dav.
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Richards boy athlete of meet

Undefeated Caro runs
away with league honors

STEVE RICHARDS
State qualifier and Thumb B
League athlete of meet.

RAY KLOC
State qualifier, mile relay.

TERESA HEWITT
State qualifier, hurdles.

MICHELLE FAHRNER
State qualifier, 440.

BOB SAWDON
State qualifier, mile relay.

TIM SONTAG
State qualifier, mile relay.

BRIAN deBEAUBIEN
State qua l i f i e r , discus.

KRISTY DEERING
Sets school record.

Cass City wins qualifier

Crucial games ahead in
race for softball titles

The crucial game of the
season for the Cass City
High School softball team is
at hand.

Consider this. The Hawks
meet Brown City at Brown
City in thi? state tournament
Friday at 4 p.m. They
qualif ied by whipping Mar-
lette, 9-5', Friday.

Wednesday the Hawks
were to have played at North
Branch in games that wil l
probably decide liie Thumb
B Association t i t l e . The

Broncos are 11-1 in the
conference and Cass City is
9-1.

A loss to the Lakers in the
opening game of a double
header Thursday, G-4,
makes the road to the t i t le a
bit rocky. Before the upset
Cass City was coasting along
without defeat and probably
would have needed only a
split to win the t i t le . Now a
double win is a must if the
girls are to claim an undis-
puted championship.

ALBEE'S

Bargain
of the Month

RUGER
Model 10/22

Semi-Automatic
LONG RIFLE

The Lakers not only beat
the Hawks in the first game
but they also bested Cass
City's ace pitcher, Shirley
Fleming, while doing it.

The Lakers rapped Flem-
ing for 10 hits while the best
tha t the Hawks could do was
six hits off the slants of
Janet Gleason, spread out
among six different players.

Cass City scored a run in
the th i rd and twice more in
the fourth to t ra i l at the end
of three. 4-3. but the Lakers
added insurance runs in the
four th and f i f t h to claim the
win .

Threatened with a loss of
the league for the first t ime
this year Cass City bounced
back in the nightcap to win
13-6.

Padgett Randall , who
hasn't seen much mound
duty this season pitched the
win. Her job was made easy
as the Hawks batted around
in the f irs t i nn ing and scored
seven t imes as Dubs had
trouble get t ing anyone out.

She settled down after the
opening i n n i n g and the
Lakers closed the gap to 7-4
before Cans City exploded
again in the f i f t h . This t ime
the rally netted six runs to
lurn the game into a run-
away.

The Hawks were led by
Nancv Tont i . Randall and

Fleming with two hits each
in four tries.

TOURNAMENT

Cass City won the qua l i fy -
ing rounds of the state
tournament by whipping
Mar le t t ea t Cass City Recre-
a t ional Park. l)-5. It was the
th i rd t ime this year that the
Hawks topped the Raiders.

It was a close ball game
for the f irs t four innings. The
Raiders moved in front in
the second with a pair of
markers. Cass City bounced
back into the lead with a
four-run splurge in the third.
Marlette countered with a
pair of markers in the fourth
to tie the game. Cass City
countered with a run in the
bottom of the inning to take
the lead for good, 5-4.

Cass City added a pair of
insurance markers in the
f i f t h and sixth while a single
counter by Marlette in the
last inning only made the
f ina l score a l i t t le closer.

Vickie Pobanz and Libby
Hartel with two hits were the
heavy stickers for Cass City
while Jackie Vatter and
Nancy Long each collected
two hits for the losers.

Fleming was the winning
pitcher, s t r ik ing out two and
allowing eight hits .

Cass City boys placed
third in the Thumb B Confer-
ence League meet and tied
for second place with Vassar
in the race for the Thumb B
Championship. Cass City's
girls finished third in the
league meet and fourth in
the final standings.

Caro, which raced through
undefeated in regular sea-
son competition, also domi-
nated the conference meet
last Wednesday at Caro with
159 points. Marlette scored
77 and the Hawks 56.

Marlette and Vassar tied
for top honors among the
girls as the Vulcans won the
league meet and finished
behind Marlette in the reg-
ular season competition.
Vassar won the league meet
with 109 points; Marlette
posted 70'/2 and Cass City
scored 53.

While Caro dominated the
boys' team competition,
Cass City had the outstand-
ing individual performer.
Steve Richards was named
boys' athlete of the meet.
The selection was not un-
expected as the premier
Hawk distance runner was
the co-athlete of the meet as
a junior.

Richards won the 880-yard
run, finished second in the
mile and ran a leg on the
winning mile relay team.

Winning the mile relay for
the Hawks besides Richards
were Ray KIoc, Bob Sawdon
and Tim Sontag.

Cass City's other first
place finish among the boys
was in the 880-yard relay.
Running were Max Morrish,
Steve Dadacki, Sawdon and
Sontag.

Two new track records

were set. Zambron of San-
dusky threw the discus
161'6", a distance that would
give him a State record if he
duplicates the feat in the
State meet May 31.

Bill Rorhosier ran the mile
in 4:29 to break Richards'
record established last year.

Among the girls, a first
place was won by Teresa
Hewitt in the 110-low
hurdles. Points were also
earned by the 880-yard relay
team of Michelle Fahrner,
Hewitt, Jane Hobart and
Janie Wright.

In addition the 440-relay
team of Tammi Rabideau,
Hewitt, Hobart and Wright
and the mile relay squad of
Hobart, Shelley Rabideau,
Deanna Pomeroy and Fahr-
ner finished third.

The winners among the
boys, with the times or
distances, together with
Cass City point producers
are:

Discus (new record) -
(1) Zambron, Sandusky,
161'6"; (3) deBeaubien, CC,
133'3".

High Jump - ( 1 ) Gil lman,
Vassar, 6'2"; (6) Comment,
CC, 5'9".

120 high hurdles - (1)
Lake, N. Branch, 15:55; (6)
Hollis, CC.

100-yard dash - (1) Harp-
er, Vassar. 10:54;

Mile run (new record) -
Romosier, Marlette, 4:29;
(2) Richards, CC, 4:30.23.

Shot put - (1) Zambron,
Sandusky, 53'10".

880 yard relay - Max
Morrish, Steve Dadacki,
Sawdon, Sontag, CC, 1.36.9.

Long jump - ( 1 > Weidman,
Lakers, 19'7V.

440-yard d a s h - H u f f , Caro,

51.28; (4) Sawdon, CC, 53.03.
440-yard relay - Caro,

46.40; (5) Cass City, 47.32.
330 low hurdles - Hartman,

Caro, 40.2; (6) Hobart, CC,
41.88.

880 yard run - Richards,
CC, 2:00.7.

Pole vault - (1) Frank,
Caro, 12'9"; (5) Decker, CC,
11'4".

220 yard dash - (1) Huff,
Caro, 23.55.

2-mile run - ( 1 ) Pattullo,
Caro, 9:51.43; (6) Mozden,
CC, 10:30.40.

Mile relay - Cass City,
3:36.72.

The winners among the
girls, with the times or
distances, together with the
Cass City point producers,
are:

Shot put - Sturgis, Bad
Axe, 33'9",

Long jump - Holzworth,
Caro, IS'?1;.".

110 low hurdles - Hewitt,
CC, 16.5.

100-yard dash - Clark,
Marlette, 11:95.

Mile run - Conklin, San-
dusky, 5:42.4; (6) Deering,
CC, 6:01.50.

Discus - Kelledes, Mar-
lette, 108'2".

880-yard relay - Vassar,
1:49.9; (3) Cass City, 1:54.23.

440 yard dash - Haffner ,
Vassar, 1:01.9; (3) Fahrner,
CC, 1:03.08; ( 4 ) Rabideau.
CC. 1:06.13.

440 relay - Vassar, 52.87:
(3) Cass City, 54.75.

220low hurdles - Wisncski.

Bad Axe, 31.08; (3) Hewitt,
CC, 32.69.

880 yard run - Palmer,
Vassar, 2:31.95; (4) Rabi-
deau, CC, 2:38.44.

220-yard dash - Clark,
Marlette, 26.94.

2-mile run - Rogers, N
Branch, 12:23.58; (4) Deer-
ing, CC, 13:04.03.

High jump - Wisneski, Bad
Axe, 5'2".

Mile relay - Vassar,
4:18.52; (3) Cass City,
4:28.27.

FINAL STANDINGS (boys)
Thumb B Association

Dual League Over

Caro
Cass City
Marlette
Vassar
Bad Axe
Lakers *
N. Branch *
Sandusky

14
12
10
8
1
4
4
0

14
10
12
7
7
4
2
0

all
28
22
22
15
8
8
6
0

* One dual meet left.

FINALS'!'
'I'll u in b

ANDINGS (girls)
B Association

Dual League Over

Marlette
Vassar
Caro
Cass City
Sanduskv
Bad Axe'
N. Branch *
Lakers *

all
14 12 26
12 14 26
10 10 20
6 8 14
(1 4 12
0 6 6
2 2 4
0 0 0

* One dual meet left.

O-G wins 6 events
at Huron Invitational

Chip
Shots

FLIGHT 1
Dick Wallace
Dave Lovejoy
BillKritzman
Clint House
Elwyn Helwig
Carl Palmer
DaleMcIntosh
Mike Murphy
Maynard Helwig
Bil l Hepshinska
Newell Harris
Jim Fox
KenEisinger
Rod Wright
Jim Peyerk
Roland Pakonen
Gene Kloc
Don Grouse

9
9
9
9
9
7
7
6
6

Gary Hornbacher
George Heins
George Mika
Ken Maharg
Larrv Davis

Owen-Gage captured six
f i r s t places Monday to f i n i sh
in fou r th place overall in the
eighth annua l i n v i t a t i o n a l
track meet at Bad Axe. It
was the top Class D school.

Jim Patnaude set a meet
record when he won f i rs t
place in the pole vau l t w i th a
vault of 13'3".

Other f i rs t place finishes
by the Bulldogs were:

Discus. Pete Klemkow-
sky, 125'l t l"; long jump. Jeff
Hal lock, 2071..";' 100-yard
dash. Jim Glidclen, 10.64
i w i t h Hal lock second at
10 .65) ; HHO relay wi th a t ime
of 1:34.34, and 4411-yard

dash, Glidden, 52.92.
Other placings by the

Owen-Gage boys were: shot
put, Klemkowsky, 3rd,
4 4 ' 4 > - j " ; 120 high ' hurdles,'
Scott Gaeth, 3rd; 17.19; 410-'
yard rek>y. 5 th , 47.08; 3JO-
yard low hurdles, Biad.
krickson. 5th, 42.02; 220-
yard dash, Jeff Hallock, 2nd,J
23.75; Lenny Hallock, 6th,
24.71, and one-mile relay,
2nd. 3:3I>. 19. ' -

The only Bulldog girl t o "
place was Jul ie Andrakow-•
in, who took four th in t h e "
shot put at 29'5'.," and f i f t h
in the high jump at 4'6". ;

\=
r

10-shot Rotary
Magazine

Tell winners in
bowling tourney

Reg.

Now Thru
JUNE

Only

,95

-Quantities Limited-

Check our complete

line of 8KB, Remington,

I thaca, Brown ing ,
Savage, Weatherby, FIE
and Mossberg guns.

Marge Tyll , of Ubly,
walked away with $30 and a
trophy for a high handicap
score of 1,933 in all events of
the Bad Axe Women's Bowl-
ing Association tournament
which took place earlier this
spring in Cass City.

She also had the high
actual score of 1,735 in all
events.

Anna Lamming of Bad
Axe took first place in the
singles competition with a
series score of 686. She won
$45 and a trophy.

In the doubles competi-
tion, Mary Lou Fluegge and
Delores Yahn of Pigeon,
split an $80 first prize with a
1,276 series.

The Citizen's Federal
Team from Bad Axe took
first place in the team event.

its

FLIGHT 2
Jude Patnaude
Ernie Teichman
DonOuvry
Mike Brown
Russ Richards
John Maharg
Steve Fobear
Bill Ewald
George Bushong
Alva Allen
Clyde Wells
DaveRomig
Phil Robinson
John Ha ire
Chuck Guinther
Clark Erla
Don Erla
Jerry Houghton

Pepsi
CRICKET, BIC, SCRIPTO

Lighters

MEMORIAL DAY

SPECIALS
$Reg.

2.09
8-'/2 liter

Plus Deposit

FLIGHT;!
Ken Zdrojewski
NatTuttle

The team won $190 for
series score of 3,035.

Naomi Neibel of Pigeon
won three trophies for: high
actual game, 278, high
actual series, 627, and high
handicap game, 301. Ms.
Yahn led the tournament in
the high handicap series
category with a score of 705.

Foster's Bar of Minden
City was awarded $10 for its
high handicap game of 1065.

Three bowlers received
awards for scoring 100
points above their averages.
They were: Ms. Yahn, 257,
Ms. Neibel, 278, and Beverly
Brown of Bad Axe, with 254. p.. , u , .

The association's annual D'<* Hampshire
spring meeting will be Fri-
day at the Farm Bureau
Building in Bad Axe. It will
begin at 7:30 p.m.

RUFFLES 7oz.

CHIPS
<u

Sun tan Blanket

CHIP SPECIAL
OF

THE WEEK!

TANS YOU
6.98 Value

EXTRA FAST

Dave Hoard
Bob Stickle
Ron Ouvry
Aime Ouvry
Earl Harris

New All Natural

Beyer's Yogurt

Reg.
59$ 'For

Full Pint

Fruit Drinks

00
29<c ea. "For

No Uy-Away On Item Of The Month

ALBEE >^ HOME CENTEI
Cass City Phone 872-22701 The Cass City Chronicle

Clark Boylan
Ron Geiger

FLIGHT 4
Herman Umpfenbach
LyleTrueinner
Hugh Lautner
Mike Shaft
BertAIthaver
Anton Peters
Tom Proctor
George Clara
Dana Truemner
Don Schelke
Fritz Olson
Ken Jensen

IWE HAVE A FULL LINE OF
LOTIONS. HAWAIIAN TROPIC,

SUNTAN OILS &
SEA & SKI, ETC.

REMEMBER FILM AND CAMERAS FOR YOUR FUN

Old Wood Will Be Open 9 a.m. >to 1 p.m. Memorial Day

Old Wood Dru
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Please Your Grad and
Please Your Budget

WITH COACH LIGHT'S EVERYDAY LOW DISCOUNT PRICES

GREAT SOUND! GREAT VALUE!

New® SANYO Portable
Cassette Tape Recorder.

M1540A

SO/195
• ••A An outstanding value
*P '• from the world's largest

tape recorder manufacturer.
Precision performance-engineered tape transport
mechanism is designed to withstand all the rugged
use you give it.

• Condenser mike built-in • Auto-stop at tape end •
Rugged Sanyo tape transport system • Battery or AC
operation • AC adaptor included • Earphone and exter-
nal mike jacks • Famous Sanyo reliability

Exclusive New Styles...
ALL NEW

Touch of Class
Collection

by
distinctly jewelry

SANYO AM/FM
Compact Size
Portable Radio

$16.

Kodak Camera
59 6=3 ^\-^ Outfit

Kodak
Ektral K0| KodicolorU

Reg.
25.95

$2295

KODAK EKTRA 1
C<imeM Out f i t

Graduation
Cards
Special occasions call for
thoughtful Hallmark
cards. Shop from our
wide assortment.

KODAK!

84.95

KODAK EKTRAMAX
Camera Outfit

• Built-in electronic
flash

• Stop-action
capability

• Fast 400-speed
film included

New SANYO AM/FM portable RP511B

solid state radio keeps you
informed. Top features in a rugged,
high powered portable radio with detachable AC
line cord. Higher power amplifier and telescopic
FM antenna gives you news and entertainment
loud and clear.

• Solid State • Rotary gyro tuning dial • Full range
unicone speaker • Built-in AM antenna, telescoping FM
antenna « Earphone jack • Carrying strap.

SANYO
100% Solid State Electronic
AM/FML.E.D. Digital Clock
Radio Buxtons for Guy and Gal Grads

$70 95
A beautiful way
to get full fidelity
sound and accurate time.

39.
• Large ( 6") Diijit.il T ime Display • Li(]htud Slido Ruin
Tuning Dull • Top Mounted function Controls •
Snoo/o Al.'irm with 5 Nino Miniilf.1 W;ikc Up Cycle's •
Power Interruption Indicator • H;indsomo Simulated
Woodgrain Cabinet • ^4 Hour Memory for Day to Day
WakoUp without Resetting • I'M arid Auto (Alarm On)
Indicators • Real Time Alarm Time Pushbutton Switch-
ing • Sleep Off 'Snoo/e Pushbutton Switching • Sloop
Off/Snooze Pushbutton Switching • Separate' Hour/
Minute Time Soiling Controls • Wako to Music • Ear-
phone or Pillow Speaker Jack lor Private; Listening •
Built-in AM-FM Antonnas • 60 Minute Sleop Timer

VISA

..."Your Wind Song
stays on his mind."

by

PR1NCI- MATCHAHELLI

All The

Famous Brands

In Our

Cosmetic
Department

Jovan Sex Appeal'"
Aftershave/Cologne

100's In Stock

Timex
Watches

Cheerful exchange if their
choice is not your choice.

•*^

"Sun" Pool
Chemicals In Stock

Coach Light
Pharmacy

Cass City

] Bike, hike
events held
Saturday

Money is being collected
from people who made
pledges in two area fund-
raisings Saturday.

A total of $2,400 was
pledged to the Big Brothers-
Big Sisters "bike and hike"
in Caro, according to Connie
Garnet, the organization's
director.

Envelopes were distri-
buted to those who made
pledges to the 56 partici-
pants in the event. They now
have three weeks to send in
their money, she said.

No estimate was immed-
iately available on the
amount raised in a bike-a-
thon for St. Jude's Hospital
in Memphis. The event was
held in the Cass City area.

In addition to money
pledged to BB-BS, $200 was
also received from a number
of business organizations.
The donations were used to
finance the event, Mrs.
Garnet said, adding she
expects more donations to
be coming in.

She said the fund-raiser
was a success, considering
there were a number of
other events going on that
may have hampered partici-
pation.

Bikers rode for 10 miles in
Caro while those walking
hiked six miles.

The St. Jude's bike-a-thon,
which started at the Cass
City Recreation Park, drew
14 participants. The farthest
any of them rode was 36
miles.

Nina Davis, coordinator of
the event, said she should
know by the end of the week
the amount collected in
pledges by the participants.

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

HEALTH TIPS

Parents can help

babies learn to see

Homemade toys and child-
hood games used for genera-
tions are still on top in
helping babies learn to see,
says the president of the
Michigan Optometric As-
sociation.

According to Dr. Owen R.
Dueweke, infants are born
with the mechanism for
seeing but they have to learn
to use their eyes by develop-
ing many different vision
skills. The first year is a
period of active vision de-
velopment and, Dr. Duew-
eke says, parents' help is
needed.

He offered these tips for
parents:

-Talk to your baby from
different places in the room
so he or she will have a
familiar moving target to
watch and follow.

-Play patty cake to help
your baby learn the many
directions of movement
which hands and eyes can
take.

-Give your baby time to
play on the floor and find
opportunities for him or her
to watch older children play.

--Hang a colorful home-
made mobile (plastic meas-
uring spoons are good to
use) outside a small infant's
crib at eye level.

-Change your baby's posi-
tion in the crib or move the
crib in the room so the baby
has different views and gets
to use both eyes.

-Keep a dim light on in the
baby's room at night so he or
she will have something to
look at upon awakening.

-Provide your older infant
with large, smooth, clean
objects (pots, pans, etc.) to
pick up and handle.

-Encourage your baby to
crawl before walking, be-
cause crawling helps a child
learn to use the two eyes
together as a team.

Dr. Dueweke said infants
should be beginning to use
their two eyes together by
about age two months. Oc-
casionally, a baby may
"turn off" one eye at some
strange angle for brief
periods, while it concen-
trates on using and develop-
ing the other eye.

But if an infant two
months of age or older does
not show signs of using the
two eyes together or the eyes
appear to be continually
crossed, parents should ar-
range for a thorough vision
examination.

Doctors of optometry have
special procedures to exam-
ine an infant's eyes and can.
also advise parents on the
many things they can do to
help their baby learn to see.

Coming: Auctions

April top DHIA herds
No. %Cow
of Days
Cows in milk

1. Victor 111 34
2. KeinathBros. 105
3. Leon & Terry Keinath 148
4. Ronald Opperman 95
5. Lloyd Walz 55
6. Hampshire Farms 51
7. Donald DeLong 154
8. LoomisBros. 70
9. Martin Damm 45

10. Gerald Koeltzow 30

82
82
87
85
91
94
90
93
87
90

Test

4.52
4.76
4.68
4.31
4.10
4.65
4.21
4.22
4.03
3.80

Lbs.
Milk

55.9
50.2
46.8
50.4
52.7
45.1
45.8
45.7
45.2
47.4

TOP OWNER-SAMPLER HERDS

1. Judith McClure 31 84 4.11 47.1
2. Warren Schmandt 30 93 3.54 53.7
3. Donald Currey 48 90 4.17 41.9
4. E & K Reinert Farm 98 88 3.77 44.9
5. Glenn Minard 24 96 3.75 42.2

Daily
B'fat

2.53
2.39
2.19
2.17
2.16
2.10
1.93
1.93
1.82
1.80

L94
1.90
1.75
1.69
1.58

Saturday, May 24 - Hazen
and Gladys Kritzman will
sell farm machinery, an-
tiques and household goods,
at the place located four
miles east of Cass City, to
M-53, five miles south and
IVfe miles east on Shabbona
Road. Lorn Hillaker, auc-i
tioneer.

Saturday, May 31 - James
and Peter Wolf will sell farm
machinery at the place lo-
cated six miles north of
Deckerville, two miles east,
a half-mile north and '/« of a
mile east on Snay Rd. Osen-
toski Auction Service, auc-
tioneers.

Extension club

presents awards
Jean Clarke, Cass City,

and Eileen Riess, Snover,
were recipients of the silver
salute awards at the May 13
awards night of the Sanilac
County Extension Home-
makers.

More than 130 persons
attended the program at
Sandusky High School.

The silver salute awards
are given to active commun-
ity women who are involved
in the growth of their com-
munity.

Mrs. Clarke, a member of
the Greenleaf Extension
Homemakers Club, and
Mrs. Riess, a member of the
Snover club, will now be
entered in state competition
during College Week 1980 at
Michigan State University.

Sebewaing
bank low

Cultural art award win-
ners May 13 were Grace
Klaus, creative painting and
ceramics; Lulu Reinelt,
Betty Hooper and Mabel
Cole; stitchery; Marion
Spencer, creative writing;
Nancy Hoxie, natural 'ma-
terials; Jean Stoick, metal;
Marion Umpfenbach, weav-
ing, and Mabel Cole, other.

The winners' exhibits will
be on display and vying for
state honors during College
Week.

Club of the vear was the
Lakeview club of the Deck-
erville area. The Greenleaf
and North Speaker groups
won the club banner awards
for having the highest per-
centage of members attend-
ing the awards program.

School Menu
MAY 27-30

TUESDAY

Fishwich
Tartar Sauce

Chips
Cheese Cube

Buttered Corn
White Milk

Cookie

WEDNESDAY

Spaghetti & Meat
Bread-Butter

Pineapple Tidbits
White Milk

Cookie

THURSDAY

Mashed Potatoes
Hamburg Gravy
Buttered Beans
Bread-Butter

White Milk
Pudding

FRIDAY

Barbecue on Bun
Chips

Buttered Peas
White Milk

Cookie

Menu subject to change.

NEW START

Put all your failures in the
past tense — that way you
won't stumble over them as
you head for success.

bidder

Notice of Change
of

Low bidder on bonds for
two Huron county drainage
projects was Farmers and
Merchants State Bank of
Sebewaing, with a bid of 7M>
percent, according to Nor-
man H. Schroeder, bank
president.

Three other banks bid.
The drainage projects are

for the Frederick and
Branches Drain No. 1 and 2,
and the Morgan and
Branches Drain, located in
Bloomfield and Sigel town-
ships, in east-central Huron
county.

The projects, to be con-
structed by Stuart Nicol and
Sons, Inc. of Cass City, and
Michigan Culvert Company
of Mason, will amount to
$134,104.

The bonds wiH he paid off,
one-third each year, on April
15 of 1981,1982 and 1983. The
bonds and pledges of credit
were approved by the Huron
County Board of Commis-
sioners.

Regular Meeting
of the

Cass City
Village Council

Meeting will beheld

Tuesday, May 27
7:00 p.m.

instead of
/

Monday, May 26

Memorial Day
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GAGETOWN SCHOOL -- Iva Peterson of Cass City was 10 or 11 years old
when this photo was taken in front of the old Gagetown school. It was taken 52 or
53 years ago, the original photograph being 25 inches wide, and shows all the
students, in kindergarten through 12th grade. The present Gagetown Elemen-

Neola Webb likes to
read to those who can't

tary School stands on the site of the building shown here. Mrs. Peterson then
Iva Deneen, is in the front row, 10th from the right. The four teachers at the
school are the women at the right in the back row, the tallest one being Miss
Koepfgen, who was also the school superintendent.

Neola Webb likes to read
•nd on Wednesday after-
ioons, she does her reading
lit loud to residents at
provincial House.

The Cass City resident has
been a volunteer there for
several years.

The reading group is fairly
new. She sits down with
approximately 10 residents
and reads them articles
from the Chronicle, short
stories and poetry.

According to Provincial
"ouse Activities Director

Mary Vatter, Mrs. Webb is
one of 28 individual volun-
teers.

Others volunteer their
time through membership in
church groups and commun-
ity groups, scouting organi-
zations, senior citizen
groups and fraternal organi-
zations which help at the
facility.

"We really appreciate
everything our volunteers do
for our residents all year
long," she commented.
"They give so much."

"I like to read," Mrs.

Webb said, "and there are
some here who can't see to
read themselves.

"So, I read items from the
local paper and anything
else I think they will be
interested in. And some-
times, things come up in a
story that they remember or
know about, and we usually
end up talking too."

Mrs. Webb initially be-
came involved at Provincial
House after she and her
husband, John, moved from
their farm at Rescue fn

City five years ago. A friend
suggested that she become a
volunteer, and she decided
to take her up on it.

"I had been kind of want-
ing to do that kind of thing
but had just never done
anything about it," Mrs.
Webb recalled. "So we came
up one day and I started
helping with Bingo and some
visiting.

"I like the people very
much," she says. "I like
doing something that puts a
bright spot in their day."

THE CASS CITY MILLING CO. building was located on Main Street for many
years. Jack Esau, owner of this photo, guesses it was taken around 1900. The
building is on the site now occupied by B & W Auto Sales. The mill produced
pastry flour and feed. The barrel on the forward tip of the root was used to douse
frequent tires started by sparks coming from the chimney.

READING the Cass City Chronicle to Provincial House
residents Sylvia LaCourse (left) and Alta Sharp is volunteer
Neola Webb. (Provincial House photo).

Maintaining power lawn edge trimmers
Mainta in ing a lawn can be

fun—if you remove the
drudgery involved. Like edg-

~ing and tr imming.
' The Outdoor Power

Equipment Institute sug-
gests these tips on how to

use edger trimmers safely
and eff ic ient ly:

1. Read the owner's man-
ua l careful ly . Acquaint
yourself with all controls,
a t t a c h m e n t s a n d s a f e t y
features.

2. Keep children and pets
out of the way.

3. W e a r rough- so led ,
heavy-duty shoes or boots
and tailored pants. Skirts or
billowy slacks can get
caught in moving parts.

by

Vitamins at Coach
Light Cost Less

You Buy The Discount Way

'1. Protect your eyes
wearing safety goggles.

5. Let the engine cool for
10 minutes before r e f i l l i n g
the t ank .

6. Stop the engine when
leaving the equ ipmen t to
make repairs or r e fue l .

FOURTEEN YEARS LATER, the building, at right, had
a new root and a new paint job. Maple Street now runs be-
tween it and the building in the center, now the site of
Clare's Sunoco. Roy Taylor owned the business, renamed
Elkland Roller Mills, from the mid-1920s to about 1950,
when the large building was torn down. The photo, from
1914, is owned by Mrs. Stanley Fessler of Caro.

postponed \
to Tliursda

*̂̂  !"
The Cass City High School?

senior swing-out, scheduled;!;
to take place after bacca-'"
laureate services Sunday?
hut postponed because of?
ra in , wi l l take place starting!
at 9:45 a.m. Thursday at th
Intermediate School.

Phone lines
trigger alarm
but no fire

Repair of the telephone t
l ine at Croft-Clara Lumber \
Wednesday morning set off |
the fire alarm, which auto- {
mat ica l ly triggers the fire *,
hal l siren. It happened at |
H : H O a.m. t

Natural
9

Vitamin A
2.88 Value

Natural Unprocessed

Bran $00 mg 300

Vitamin
B-12

250 MCG

100 Tabs 4.63 Value

Gelatin
/"fine 3'89 Value

vOpSSugarless wo caps

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
. M I K K ' - . V t : K . K R . Owner Pli, 872-;{6i:i

Your Family Discount Drug Store

ON THE MARKET

THAT SHOPS

CHRONICLE LINERS
EVERY WEEK

As Little
As A Week
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Letters
to the Editor

USE LOW COST CHRONICLE CLASSIFIED ADS

You picked the
wrong week end
Hi John,

Regarding your Rabbit
Tracks of May 8, I am
sending you this article on
the outlook on tourism in
Cadillac in Northern Mich-
igan.

The week end you were
north was between seasons.
This is the week end that the

Sugar
candidates
needed

Women interested in be-
coming 1980 Michigan Sugar
queen must apply by June 7,
according to contest rules.

Entry forms are available
by writing to: Mrs. Thomas
John Jr. 553 N. Center
Street, Sebewaing. Mich.
48759. Or by calling (517)
883-3697.

Applicants must be be-
tween the ages of 18 and 22
and must be a resident of an
agricultural community
where sugar beets are
grown.

The queen will reign for
one year, appearing at
functions representing the
Michigan sugar industry.

READ THE
Chronicle

Mfofft

Mas
THEY CAN

morel mushrooms peak and
the Mitchell State Park was
practically full by Friday
noon and there are no vacan-
cies in the motels.

The majority of the calls
that we get at the Chamber
of Commerce are from tour-
ists in Indiana and Ohio
regarding motels and
events.

Come on up and play
McGuire's Golf Course
sometime. Their third nine
will be opening soon.

Sincerely,

Judy Woody

Nothing
taken in
break-in
Gagetown police officer

James Compo investigated a
break-in and a broken win-
dow in that community May
12.

The break-in, he said, was
at the depot building behind
Farm Bureau Services on
Gage Street. The lock and
hasp had been pried o f f , but
all that was inside were
chemicals and nothing was
taken.

The glass in the front door
of the office of Dr. Thelma
June MacRae on State
Street was broken but entry
wasn't gained.

Steven Ham met of 4180
Sherman Street reported to
Cass City police Friday t h a t
his son's bicycle was miss-
ing.

His son, Steven, parked il
between Ale Street and the
baseball f ield at 6 p.m. and
when he returned at 8:30, it
was gone.

Police found it at 5:30 a .m.
Saturday next to the woods
by the ska t ing rink area.

Dear publisher,
Thank you for your article

on the Gideon Bibles but,
please make a name correc-
tion. The spectator who
stood up was Dan Widdis.

Also, would you please
make it clear that although
he did drop out of Cass City
High School, he went on to
night school to graduate the
same time as his class, with
a "B" average.

Thank you,
Mrs. Dan Widdis

Fred HalSock
dies at 93 in
Lake Orion

Fred B. Hallock, 93, died
Tuesday at his home in Lake
Orion.

He was born May 26, 1886,
in Grant township, Huron
county, the son of Runyon
and Isabel (O'Neal) Hal-
lock.

He married Minnie Wei-
land in Bad Axe Nov. 18,
1905. They were farmers and
moved to Lake Orion about
1938.

Survivors are two sons,
Rex Hallock of Baltimore,
Md., and Wyland Hallock of
Petoskey; five daughters,
Mrs. Arda Bovee of Adrian,
Mrs. Erma Ludwig and Mrs.
Jean Hall , both of Oxford,
Mrs. Lois Sweetser of Taze-
well, Va., and Mrs. Doris
Montgomery of Lansing; 30
grandchildren; 49 great-
grandchildren, and five
great-great-grandchildren.

Funeral services will be
Thursday at 2 p.m. at the
Bossardet Funeral Home,
Oxford. Rev. James Wells of
the First Baptist church of
Lake Orion will officiate.

Burial wi l l be in Oxford
cemetery.

The fami ly requests me-
morials be sent to First
Baptist church of Lake
Orion . There w i l l be no
v i s i t a t ion .

Transit (nonbusiness) rates.
15 words or less, $1.00 each
insertion; additional words 5
cents each. Three weeks for
the price of two - cash rate.
Save money by enclosing
cash with mail orders, Rates
for display want ad on appli-
cation.

[ Automotive^

The house in which Noah
Webster wro te h is d i c t i o n -
ary was d i sman t l ed and
moved from New Haven.
Conn. , t o ( i r e e n f i e l d V i l l a g e .
Dearborn, where il was
rebu i l t and comple ted in
193(1-37.

Find The Service Or Product /7~|

you Need In This \\ {**\ '(( ri
Wr^B mmv v v hv 1

_SERVICE DIREC
Auto Bump and Point

WOODRUFF'S
COLLISION

6248 VV Pint-St
Cabs Ci ty • Phone b/2 -4t&
•Bumping • Painhng ,iru]

Frame Ht-piHf
Complete Auio Gillie

i.i.i'.i' !••>•'! .V ,r, ; ,,,' / ,•• •

Auto Dealers

Ford. . . Better Ideas
For The American Road

^-ir— FORD, INC.

6392 Mam St. 872-2300

PEOPLE READ
Litt le Ads

You're Reading One
Now!

Call 8 72-20 10

Auto Service

Clare's Sunoco Service
• funtiUps • Minor HL'paifb

• Un<Jf;rujiitiM<j • Cjff^'.t; & Oil

Call 872-2470

1 & S Standard Service
Phone 872-2342

Certif ied Mechanics
Complete Car
Care Service

WRECKER SERVICE

Village Service Center
TUBS • V-Bolls • Bananas

TuneUps • Brakes • Mulllurs

free
In-Town Pickup ,& Delivery

Phone 872-3850

Tires, Batteries
and Accessories

gfa FRANK'S
*4r UNION 76 SERVICE

45J6 Leach Phone 872-2S06

-i

]

Auto-Farm- Commercial

Rebuilding Service

Faust
Rebuilding Service

• Ant.-mjli,i',

I. 'I, "''(I A f.' ' , , '.!

,,,l.,l l.i, n A I.: 1 i V

I,',.M M.IIII L,iv, L i ] , ,;/. . ; ; , j , ,

~ - - - - ..-.

Bakery

Sommer's
Bakery & Restaurant

• Home of Irish Bread

' Daily lunch Special

Mon.-Thurs.-7 a.m. -5. 30 pm
Fn.-7 a. in. -8 p.m.
Sat. -7 a.m. -5 p.m.

Cass City 872-3577

Building Materials

Croft-Clara Lumber, Inc.
CassCi ty 872-2141

Andersen Windows
Better Locks

Prelinished Paneling
Mon.-Fri.-8a.m.-5:30p.m.

Sat. -8 a.m. -5 p.m.

Chain Saws

McCulloch Chainsaw
Sales & Service

Rabideau Motors
Farm Division

k-.̂ «-.-ri j— w—

Dining

CHARMONT

Friday Buffet !i\i m -\(i\> '«
Mori.-Thurs. '.> i MI 11 1' MI

Fri .-Sal. f jp in I0|jm
Sun. 12 noon I) |) MI

PinaS. Short Orders

till 1 a.m.
Cii;.!, City

Ptione II/2-12GO

I

i

i

Wood Burning Equipment!

i
LI BlLLLL'l
TORY_I
lJ!!f!llL?!?!̂ !LJ!!̂ !C

QUALITY ELECTRIC
•Electr ic Motor Repair

•New & Used Motor Sales
' , 1 1 1 , 1 1 1 . F'l l. lV .'. 1 I'll.r.l-

6S<!4 Main 872-4700

j^ HoiTstyiing j

HAIR BENDERS
Specialiiing in

Cutting • Sty/ing • Perms
i,,.-, -. r i . ,,., 1 : . i.|. in

M ,, : , , , l i , , • : l - l , , , , . , . , . , . - ' . . . l ' ,

Hillside Beauty Salon

Tues. Through Sat.
/ / » ; . i l l ' ; • , t i n - I I I . , ' ' ' I n :

I 1 : i l l ' . .,. i t l . i l II. i l l 1 i l l

.^^^^^^^^ -̂~^~ -̂̂ ~~ -̂̂ -̂ -J

j Oil und Gas I

Haley Oil Co.
'l(> Wnijt i l '.A . 1 ik lor,

* r t,* * • t-i • / A - .- • i 'f • ' '•' — • '" '

[J f ; lwi : ly Kif H r d t K 1 , F r i f i i i f t I rn lus l l y

<, Call
sflKSwl Enterprise 6458
'̂•^ or 375-4200

Rust Proofing

Tuff-Kote Dinol

Aulomotivu Husl Proof ing
SyslernG W^XJIKJ

Gr.ivol Guards Running Boiirdb
McH.k Kulo Slono Chip Proleclion

Phone 269-9585

847 S. Van Dyke Bad Axe

This space could
be yours lor

as little as $1.25
per week.

Dan's Auto & Fireplace Shop
I'comploie Linu ul M«l!m,,..;,los ' '"'"I* *"'"" B""""" "Home of th,

' An rujhl Slcjvus

H Acccssorias /(" '""''.'',,"' ''''""' riroploc*

Deford ' *' '"'"' 872-3190

FOR SALE - '72 Chevy 350,
$500 or best offer. Call
872-3492. ^^3

FOR SALE - 1968 Triumph
convertible, excellent
mechanical condition, new
paint job. See Bud Schnee-
berger at Schneeberger's
Furniture, Cass City.

1-5-22-tf

FOR SALE -1977 Chevy van
- new engine, carpeted, AM-
FM cassette. Excellent con-
dition. Best offer. Call
872-3379 after 5:00 p.m.

1-5-22-3

FOR SALE - 1956 Olds
Holiday 88, excellent condi-
tion. Motor just over-
hauled. From Arizona.
Phone 313-672-9396. 1-5-15-3

FOR SALE - 1974 Gremlin,
good condition. Low mile-
age. Call 872-2954. 1-5-8-3

FOR SALE - 1975 Chevrolet
Custom Deluxe, V-8 pickup.
$2000 or best offer. Phone
872-2291 between 4-9 p.m.

1-5-8-3

FOR SALE - 1957 Chevy 4
door. Runs. Could be a sharp
car with some work. Asking
$900 or see it and make an
offer. Phone 872-3561 after 9
p.m. to 11 p.m. 1-5-8-3

FOR SALE - 1968 Ford
Thunderbird, good condi-
t ion . Call 872-4077. 1-5-15-3

[ Automotive]
FOR SALE - 1975 FlOO Ford
pickup, custom cab, 300 6
cylinder 3 speed. Power
steering - brakes. Phone
872-4632. 1-5-22.3

FOR SALE -1979 Pinto Run-
about, AM-FM stereo,
undercoated, other options.
Excellent condition. Must
sell. Phone 269-9961 or
269-9640. 1-5-22-3

FOR SALE -1975 Monza V-8,
good gas mileage. Call after
5:00 p.m. - 872-2677.

l-5-15-3n

[ General ^~]
[ Merchandise I

FOR SALE - '79 Yamaha
XS-400 road bike, black.
Excellent condition. 4000
miles, $1,200. Call after 5 -
872-3856. 2-5-8-3

FOR SALE - Whirlpool
washer and GE dryer, needs
some repair. $75 or best
offer. Call after 4:00 p.m.
872-4003. 2-5-22-1

SEWING AND alterations.
Recycle or update old cloth-
ing. K. Vargo, phone
872-3646. 2-5-22-3

BOAT FOR SALE - moving -
must sacrifice. 28 ft. Rich-
ards cabin cruiser, steel
hull . Excellent condition.
Call 872-4270. 2-5-22-3

FOR SALE - 1978 Honda
750K black with windjam-
mer fair ing. Excellent con-
dition. $2000.00. Call
872-3366. 2-5-15-3

FOR SALE - Assorted sixes
of Andersen window
screens. Used only 6 months.
Very reasonable! Call 872-
3965 af ter 5 p.m. 2 - f > - l - l n

GeneraF)
[Merchandise!

BULK PROPANE systems
for grain driers or home
heating. Fuelgas Company

General ]
Merchandise

General
[Merchandise.

FOR SALE - AKC registered
blond cocker spaniel. Good
with children. One year old.

of Cass City. Phone 872-2161. • Call 872-2633 or 872-3872.
2-11-14-tf

HONEY FOR SALE
Millard Ball, 3640 Cemetery
Road, 1=1 '•
light.

•i miles south of stop
2-10-1 l-ln

KITCHEN-AID dishwasher
closeout. All floor stock dish-
washers on sale. Cash and
carry only. Example front
load white regular $359.95 -
now $288.88. Richard's Fur-
niture, TV, Appliance, Cass
City, phone 872-2930.

2-5-22-1

BLACK DIRT - good for
lawns, garden, shrubbery.
Arlan Brown, Ubly. Phone
658-8452. 2-4-24-tf

FOR SALE - 10 hp Case
garden tractor with 42-inch
mower, good working condi-
tion. Phone 872-2215.

2-5-15-2

FOR SALE - Honda 70
motorcycle. Phone 872-2795.

2-5-8-3

DON'T MISS our great lay-
a-way blanket sale. Pay a
l i t t le each week and have
your blankets all paid for by
cold weather t ime. Feder-
ated Store, Cass City.

"2-5-22-2

GAS WATER HEATERS -
30-gallon size, glass lined
wi th P and T valve, only $149
at Fuelgas Co., Inc. 4 miles
east of Cass City. Phone
872-2161. 2-3-9-tf

1969 DODGE CORONET -
runs, $100 or make offer.
Maple kitchen table with
pads, leaves and four match-
ing chairs. Oak three door
icebox. Oak high-back bed.
Deckerville 313-376-8024.

2-5-15-3

FOR SALE - 1977 RM 125

Suzuki, new sprockets and
chain, engine recently re-
built, excellent condition
Call 872-3190 or 872-2246.

2-5-15-2

DOUGHBOY above ground
pools and filters: Sun chemi-
cals on sale at Leisure
Living, 350 Divided Hwy.
M-15, Bay City, 517-892-7212.
Hours Tuesday-Thursday,
9-5:30; Friday 9-7; Satur-
day, 9-2. Closed Sunday and
Monday. 2-5-1-6

HAY FOR SALE - 1st and
2nd alfalfa. 2Vi north and 3/i
east of Cass City. 2-5-8-3

FOR SALE - Mobile home
apartment 8'x30', $1500.
Save wedding ring sets,
Diamond Simulations
H.G.E., $39.95. Wanted- tent
trailer. Phone 313-672-9256.

2-5-8-3

WINTER HEATING woes!
Dan can solve your problem!
See our fine selection o|
wood burning stoves and acl

2-5-15-3 cessories. Dan's Automotiv<[
and Fireplace Shop, Deford)
Phone 872-3190. 2-10-25-tl

FOR SALE - 1975 XL 350
Honda, on and off-roadl
motorcycle, just like nev
Best offer or $650. Phon
872-3509 after 4 p.m.

2-3-22-31

FOR RENT-new -electric
or manual typewriters by I
the week or month. Also!
leave your typewriters and!
other office equipment at I
our store for repair. Used!
typewriters for sale. [
McConkey Jewelry. 2-4-6-tf|

(RealEstateT
I For Sale 1
HOUSE FOR SALE - brickl
farm house, USA school!
district, insulated and car-f
peted, land contract. Calll
674-2688. 3-5-22-3J

HOUSE FOR SALE - 1 acre|
on M-53. 2 bedroom, 2 stor
Call 872-3530. 3-5-22

FOR SALE - dirt track car,
needs work. $50. Call
872-4076. 2-5-22-3

FOR SALE - Sperti Mark 4
heat and sun lamp, $40.
Three wooden bar stools
colonial style, wooden table
and four captain chairs $150,
two gray-blue accent chairs,
like new, $75 each. Fuzzy
navy blue love-seat $40. Call
872-2436 after 6:30 p.m.

2-5-22-1

1978 COUGAR. Very clean,
AM-FM stereo, a i r , rear
window defogger. 35,000
miles. Asking $3,000. Phone
872-272.r). 1-5-22-3

1978 750 TRIUMPH Bonne-
vil le . Excellent condi t ion,
low mileage. S I . K O O or best
o f f e r . Phone 872-4777.

2-5-15-3

FOR SALE - 1973 Chevy
Impala 2 door 350-2 barrel,
v i n y l roof, t i n t e d glass. A1W-
F.M 8-track stereo and new
speakers. $8011. Also 1972
Chevy Impala 4 door 350-2
barrel. S40II. Call 673-7134.

1-5-8-3

FOR SALE - 195(i Chevy
pickup, S U M ) . Plioiie K72-4274.

l -5 -15- : (

Crisis center

mcctm" srt~
There w i l l be a m e e t i n g

lor members ol the Tuscola
Coun ty A s s a u l t Cr i s i s Center
Thursday. May 29.

The m e e t i n g w i l l beheld in
the basement of the Tuscola
C o u n t y S h e r i f f ' s Depa r t -
ment and w i l l begin at 7:3(1
p.m.

TIP TO MOTORISTS

A l i t t l e common sense on
t h a t vaca t ion t r i p may save
a l i f e and it may be your
own.

FOR SALE - 1976 Starcraf t
fold-down camper. Sleeps (i.
Canopy and add-a-room. K\-
cellent condi t ion . Phone
872-296'.). 2-5-22-1

FOR SALE - 1973450 Honda
road bike, 38(10 miles. Good
c o n d i t i o n . Phone 872-2969.

FOR SALE - 1974 Sheridan
mobile home in Cass City,
14x65. Take over payments.
Phone Mayville 843-6247.

2-5-22-3

FOR SALE - new Go-Cart,
634cc motor. Call mornings
658-8477. 2-5-22-3

BEAUTIFUL matching set
of a n t i q u e Victor ian furni-
ture, love seat, 2 side chairs -
one w i t h arms, all in very
good cond i t i on . Call after 6
872-4070. 2-5-8-3

Coal and Wood
Heaters and
Fireplaces

All sizes and styles

HOT WATER HEATERS
-ELECTRIC AND GAS.

Financing available -
Instant credit

Schneeberger's, Inc.
Phone 872-2696

Main St., Cass City
2-8-30-tf

FOR SALE -
second c u t t i n g
and clean
658 8409.

very good
a l f a l f a hay

straw. Phone
2-5-H-3

FOR SAI.K - I'.tVii T r iumph
Honnev i l l e . excellent condi-
t i o n . THUD miles. S l t i i H ) . Phone
evenings H72-4H32. 2-fi-! l- : i

F ( )K SALE - '78 Tr iumph
and '7HPenton 175. Call days
1(72-210!) - n ights (ifiK-H-WO. ask
for Ron. 2-5-H-:i

Wool) STOVKS and sup-
plies . Hi) u n i t s on d i sp l ay .
Best price. Best service.
Leisure L iv ing , ;(f>() divided
h ighway M - l f > , Bay C i t y ,
fi 17-HD2-7212 Tuesday-Thurs-
day !)-5::!(), Friday 9-7, Satur-
day !)-2. Closed Sunday and
Monday. 2-ii-2K-tf

OUR STEREO department
is h u l g i n u ! All components,
speakers, turn-tables, car
stereos have been reduced
for great savings. Richard's
F u r n i t u r e . TV. Appliance,
Cass C i t y , phone 872-2930.

2-5-22-1

FOR SALE - Girl's 20-inch
bicycle, banana seat and
basket to match. Very good
condition. Phone 872-2954.

2-5-8-3

18'x 36'

Business building
for sale

in Deford.
C03

Don Smith
Real Estate

Caro
Phone 673-8153

3-5-15-31

FOR SALE - one story onel
bedroom home, good neigh-l
borhood and pleasant loca-|
tion. Phone 872-3271.

3-5-8-31

For Sale - 3 adjoining lots for|
1 building site in beautiM
Broken Rocks subdivision
Port Austin, Mich. Excel-l
lent swimming cove and!
sandy beach. Tennis courts!
and other recreational facil-l
ities available to home own-l
ers. Excellent terms avaiJ-j
able. 12L|

Don Smith
Rea! Estate

Phone 673-8153
Caro, Mich.

3-5-22-21

11)72 750 HONDA. Loaded.
Best o f fe r . Call af ter six
K72-475C.. 2-5-22-3

FOR SALE - 180 ft. lineal
2x4" welded wire 5 ft . high,
•Slio. Phone (i7:i-37()3.

2-5-22-3

CAS R A N G E S - Magic Chef,
neu , 20 inches and .'(() inches.
Any color, f rom $239.
Kuelgas Co., four miles east
ol Cass Ci ty . Phone «72-21(il.

2-1-11-tf

SPECIAL OF THE WEEK
1976

CHEVROLET
IMPALA

CUSTOM COUPE
Auto., vinyl top, P.S.,
P.B., rust proofed,
white walls, one owner.
Low mileage, Sharp!

S2695
Plus tax & plates

1979 Chevrolet
1/2 Ton Pickup

6 cylinder, standard trans-
mission, radio, real clean.

1979 Chevy Caprice
Station Wagon

Wood grain, full power, air
cond., and stereo radio, lot
of other extras.

1979Chevette
4 door, custom two-tone,
auto., good gas mileage,
one-owner.

1977 Chevy
Shorty Pickup

Roll bars, sun roof, 4 speed
trans., P.S., P.B., extra
shart

P
GMQUAUTY

SERVICE/MOTS

1977 Chevy Impala
4 door auto, trans., power
steering, vinyl roof, cruise
control, sharp.

1979 Ford 150
Super cab pickup, V-8,
auto., P.S., P.B., two-tone,
dual tanks, camper cover,
full bench rear seat.

1979 Chevrolet Luv
Economy engine, 4 speed
transmission, sport stripes,
12,000 miles, check this one.

I GENERAL MOTORS BUTTS DIVISION

1977 Chev. Impala
2 door, auto, trans., P.B.,
P.S., vinyl roof, 39,000
miles, sharp.

OUVRY

Transportation Special
1973 Dodge Polaris

2 door, P.S., P.B., vinyl roof,
$495.00

1976 Comoro
Rally sport, small V-8,
auto., P.S., P.B., rally wheels.

1977 Pontiac
Trans AM

Red, auto, trans., P.S., P.B.,
extra clean car, and a good
buy.

1978 Pontiac
Trans AM

T-roof, auto, trans., power,
stereo, air cond., lots of
extras.

•1 THAT GREAT
| G.M. FEELING WITH

GENUINE G.M.
PARTS

REAL ESTATE

CAPE C'OI)

One of the better locations in town. Hardwood floors, 4
bedrooms, full basement and attached garage. Nice spot
lor the kids. Immediate occupancy. See anytime.

NEW ON THE MARKET

D e l i g h t f u l , desirable mobile home anchored down on a nice
.") acre setting. Well kept, very neat and includes storage
shed. Don't rniss out. Paved road, too.

EVEKGKEEN TOWNSHIP

Nearly 3 acres, all remodeled and carpeted, Andersen
windows, large 2 car garage, new furnace. Land contract
terms or possible 0 down for qualified buyer. Call for more
informat ion . Cass City district.

KU ACRES

55 acres wooded, good hunting and building site. Paved
road not far from Cass City. Terms.

EASY OWN

Land contract terms on this 3 bedroom brick with full base-
ment, garage, enclosed porch. Why rent?

EXECUTIVE (|

Perfect setting amid lots of trees on nearly 6 acres. Over
2000 square feet of exclusive living. Four large bedrooms,
21- baths, family room and all the trimmings. On paved
highway. Many other features. Seeing is believing.

GAGETOWN

Cute bungalow at a price and terms you can easily afford.
3 bedrooms, basement, garage, gas heat.

FARMS

We have them, all sizes and locations. Call us for more''
information.

NEEDED

Moderate priced home in and near Cass City. If you're
thinking of selling yours, give us a call. We have buyers
waiting.

LARGE ROOMS

And a large yard with 4 acres, tool shed, barn and a m|lh
house. Home has 4 bedrooms, hardwood floors, big kitchen'
and lots of cupboards. Gas heat and wood burning furnace,
Cass City schools.

OSENTOSKI
REALTY

CHEVROLET-OLDS, INC. 6501 Main St., Cass City
Cass City Phone 872-4301

Phone 872-4377

3-5-22-1
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General

[Merchandise.
I General
(Merchandise

ReaJ Estate
For Rent [ Notices 1 [ Notices"! [_ Services 1 ( Services

J GAS GRILLS and carts -
- 'Special at $99.00. Fuelgas

• .' Company of Cass City, M-53
•&M-81. Phone 872-2161.

2-5-25-tf

FOR SALE - Sierra coal and
wood burning stove, fire
brick lined, takes 33-inch

• log, $500. 1974 125 Yamaha
Enduro, $375. Also hog
waterer and feeder with

, 'electric heating element,
$150. Call 872-5196 before

- lO.-OOa.m.or after 8.'30 p.m.
-- 2-5-22-3

FOR SALE - 8 track stereo,
•$65.00; 1955 and 1953 Ford 1
ton pickup, $100.00 each;
add-on wood furnace,
$425.00. Phone 872-3766.

2-5-22-3

HAY STACKS for sale - $25
ton. Phone 872-2473.

• 2-5-8-3

FOR SALE - four office
chairs, will sell individually,
jig saw, floor scrubber and
polisher, one, half horse
power heavy duty electric
motor with about 100 feet
heavy cord. Call. 872-2155 day
or 872-3519 evenings.

2-5-22-1

FOR SALE - snowmobile
trailer. Bill Ewald, phone
872-2954. 2-5-22-3

FOR SALE - macrame
hanging lamps, tables, plant
holders, mirrors and owls.
Call 872-3894 between 10:00-
4:30 p.m. 2-5-8-3

FOR RENT - 70 acres of
good farm land. Rent all or
any part. Call 872-2254 after
4P-m- 4-5-22-3

Notices

Real Estate )
For Rent J

Real Estate
For Sale
Handyman's

Special

House is located by Cass
City. Go east on Hwy. M-81 to
M-53. Turn north on M-53 and
go approximately 2V2 miles
to a gravel cross road (by
stone house). Turn east and
go Vfe mile to house on right.
Interim financing is avail-
able. Do a little and save a
lot. Low down payment and
low interest rate makes
you an owner instead of a
renter. Excellent opportun-
ity. Nice 3 bedroom house.
We can furnish materials
to complete. Immediate pos-
session. See it and then con-
tact Properties Department,
toll free at 1-800-328-4462.
4500 Lyndale Avenue North,
Minneapolis, Minn. 65412, or
call collect to Robert Gomez
at 517-792-1040.

3-5-22-2

FOR RENT - 2 bedroom
apartment, partly fur-
nished, air conditioning,
carpeting, attractive. No
children, no pets. Hillside
Apartments. Call 872-3755.

4-5-8-3

HOUSE FOR RENT in
Gagetown-Unionville area.
Call 665-2444 after 6:00 p.m.

4-5-22-3

FOR RENT - upper large
two bedroom apartment.
Prefer one or two working
people. Call 872-2291 be-
tween 4-8 p.m. 4-5-1-tf

PARKING FACILITIES for
rent - See Bud Schneeberger
at Schneeberger Furniture
Store, Main St., Cass City.

4-3-6-tf

FOR RENT - A-frame cot-
tage, 'i> mile from beach at
Higgins Lake. Reserve now
for your summer vacation.
Phone 872-2256 or 872-4530
after 8 p.m. 4-5-22-3

APARTMENT LIVING -
private room for female -
share kitchen, living room,
etc. Call 872-4212 before 4
p.m. Monday thru Friday.

4-1-3-tf

Free Estimates
on roofing, siding, insulation,
aluminum doors and windows
and aluminum or Fiber
Glass awnings.

Elkton Roofing
& Siding Co.

Phone 269-7469
5-7-21-tf

DEALERSHIPS available
with Oil Master of Michigan
Electro Refining System.
High profit potential, strong
demand. For details call R.
Becker, 517-872-4002.

5-5-15-4

Napkins
• Wedding
• Anniversary
• Open House

Beverage and Luncheon
, Sizes

Choice of colors and designs
with names and dates

Cass City
Chronicle
Phone 872-2010

5-4-17-tf

WANT TO RENT - house
with garage in Cass City
area by June 1. Call Mar-
lette 635-2938 or Bad Axe
269-9408. 5-5-8-3

Save Gas
Buy a Bicycle
from Albee's

See our full line of

Huffy Bicycles
Now open Thursday & Kriciay

evening till 9p.m.

REAL ESTATE
REMODELED

3 bedroom, 2 story home with new insulation. Natural gas
heat keeps utility bills low. Built-in dishwasher and garbage
disposal. Also 2 story barn with workshop and garage door.
Nice city lot. Asking $28,900. C-29-TO

COMPLETELY CARPETED

^Throughout this 2 bedroom home, newly remodelled kitchen
^and bath, also I0'x20' outbuilding on nice corner lot Asking

$29,900. C-89-TO

MINI-FARM

Approximately 20 surveyed acres with new 30'.\40' pole barn
and 20'x30' tool shed. Also 2 story home is remodelled and
features 3 bedrooms, large country kitchen, aluminum
siding, Andersen windows. Completely carpeted, gas
furnace and more. Low 50's, ' C-273-HF

FARM

Approximately 118 acres with new 40'x80' pole building,
older barn, 24'x30' garage and 2 story, 5 bedroom
remodelled .brick home. Will consider selling on land
contract terms. Asking $122,250. C-57-F

Albee
Home Center

Cass City
5-3-13-tf

CALLIGRAPHY - Hand let-
tering - done to order: place
cards, posters, certificates,
invitat ions, etc. K. Vargo.
Call 872-3646, 5-5-22-3

DON'T MISS our great lav-
a-way blanket sale. Pay a
little each week and have
your blankets all paid for by
cold weather time. Feder-
ated Store, Cass City.

D-3

Holding l i i M l a l i u i i s

Inc.
630N. State, Caro, phone 673-6106
8498 State Rd., Millington, phone 871-4567
Vassar Office, 100 W. Huron, phone 823-8461
255 N. Center Rd., Saginaw, phone 790-3806

EQUAL HOUSING

OPPORTUNITY

Commercial Residential Farm

REALTOR*

Open Daily 9 • 7, Sal. 9 • 4, Olher Times
By Appointment 3-5-22-1

Anniversary invitations
LT>th, "><lth and others

Raised lettering, exquisite
papers \

Check our catalogs out over-
night.

The Cass City
Chronicle
Phone 872-2010

5-4-17-tf

FEED ONE adult for $7.00
weekly. Includes 1 pound
meat daily, choice of 8 fresh
vegetables and grains. Free
details write: O.K., 830 N.
M-18 "0", Gladwin, Mi.
48624. ;V8.;j

NOTICE
WANTED!!!! Listings on all types of real estate
in Tuscola, Huron and Sanilac Counties.

We sell, buy, rent, lease or trade!!!!

We have been serving the 3 counties for over 27
years in real estate needs.

See, Call or Write to:

B. A. Calka
Real Estate

B.A. Calka, Realtor
6306 W. Main St., Cass City, Michigan 48726

Telephone: 872-3355 or 872-3230

We sell FARMS & HOMES

OPPORTWY for 6% commission [7EALTOP1

DOUBLE D Fishwish - 2511
N. Van Dyke, next to Mid
Thumb Suzuki Sales. All
tropical fish and supplies.
Phone 872-3272. Don and
Debbie Jo Hass. 5-5-8-4

CAKES FOR all occasions.
Phone 313-672-9136 or 313-
672-9757. 5-5-15-3

CUSTOM pipe cutting to
your specification. Complete
line of galvanized and cop-
per pipe supplies. Bigelow
Sentry Hardware; Phone
872-2245. 5-5-15-tf

WATER KING water soften-
ers on sale at Fuelgas
Company. Free home water
analysis. 4 east of Cass City
on M-53. Phone 872-2161.

5-5-1-tf

Lin's Hair House
6644 Houghton St.

Cass City

Featuring
Linda Sokol
Judiilaas

Men's & Women's Hair Care

Phone 872-2269
5-5-1-tf

LOST - old Border Collie,
female, black and white.
Strayed from Deford area.
Theron Roach, phone
872-4588 or 872-3147.

5-5-22-3

NOW SELLING Mary Kay
cosmetics in my home.
Carolyn Gohsman, 6170
Cedar Drive, Cass City,
Mich. Phone 872-2597, 9:00
a.m.-9:00 p.m. Appointment
for free facial. 5-5-22-4

Russ Healy's

Livestock

Trucking

Cass City

Phone 872-4571

WANTED - 1-2 bedroom
apartment partially fur-
nished. Retired lady seeking
quiet environment. Phone
872-2361. 5.5-8-3

or
872-2243

5-5-22-3

REDUCE SAFE and fast
with GoBese Tablets and
E-Vap "water pills." Old
Wood Drug, Cass City.

5-5-8-6

NoTice

We are now writing
contracts for this
year's pickle crop.
Fur more information contact:

Jim Kilbourn at Deford
872-3323 or

Bloch and Guggenheimer,
314 S. Hanselman, Bad Axe,
269-1)1!)!.

5-5-15-3

ALPINE HOLIDAY Sept.
I8-2H, $894. Oberammergau
Passion Play extra option
$175. Price: Detroit, all
transportation, 1st class
hotels. Two meals daily. For
free brochure write Chris
Press, 7369 Berne Rd.,
Pigeon, MI. 48755. Call 517-
453-2202. Limited seating left
on tours to Germany, Aus-
tria, Switzerland July 20 -
Aug. 3 and Aug. 3-17, $1244.
Try a Chriscross. 5-5-8-4

WE'VE MOVED!

Buds & Blossoms
Flower Shop's

New Location

6491 Main Street

(right next to Gambles)
5-3-20-11

SPRING IS fix up time. See
Bigelow Hardware for win-
dow and screen repair.

5-5-22-1

BIKE DOC - I remembered
the important question I
wanted to ask you - Isn't
May 22nd your birthday?
Happy Birthday, Lamb
Chop. 5-5-22-1

Bingo
Every Sunday
Everybody welcome

Early Birds •«::«) p.m.
Regular bingo - 7 r.'to p.m.

St. Pancratius
Church

5-7-5-tf

WE'VE MOVED!

Buds & Blossoms
Flower Shop's

New Location

6491 Main Street
(right next to Gambles)

5-3-20-11

[Household Sales]
MOVING SALE - refriger-
ator, 2 20-inch bikes, riding
mower, sewing machine,
draperies. Call 872-2394.

14-5-15-2

BASEMENT SALE - Thurs-
day and Friday, 9 till 5. 4202
5. Seeger St. 14-5-22-1

2-FAMILY Garage Sale -
baby swing, rocker, car
seat, play pen, dresses and
slack sets, like new, sizes 5
and 6x, shoes, men's clothes,
dehumidifier. May 22, 23, 24,
from 10 till 6. 2 west of
Deford, 1 north and Vi west
on Shabbona Rd. 14-5-22-1

LARGE GARAGE SALE -
miscellaneous items, furni-
ture, 23 channel CB, tape
player, clothing, much
more. Everything must be
sold. Saturday, May 24, 4595
Oak St., Cass City.

14-5-22-1

LARGE GARAGE SALE -
children's (some chubby),
ladies, men's (tails and
large) clothing; household
and decorative items,
dishes, electric organ, toys,
games and much more.
Thursday, Friday, Satur-
day, May 22-23-24, 8 till 5.
Located 2'/2 miles east of
stoplight, ''4 mile south on
Krapf Rd. Joanne O'Dell.

14-5-22-1

GROUP GARAGE SALE -
Thursday, Friday, Satur-
day, May 22-23-24, from 9 till
6. Good baby's, men's and
women's clothes, 2 record
cabinets, 2 wood plant
stands, rocker, bar stools,
wood burning stove, girl's
10-speed bike, Many house-
hold and miscellaneous
items, craft and decorative
items. 6 south, 3 east and ' j
south of Cass City. Ron
Rutkoski. 14-5-22-1

GARAGE SALE - Thursday,
Friday and Saturday, 6704
Main St., Cass City.

14-5-22-1

GARAGE SALE - May 22
and 23,10:00 a.m.-5:00 p.m.,
6350 Pine Street. Antique
dresser, five old shaving
mugs, old razors, ruby red
berry set, 12 ruby red water
glasses, old gold eye glasses,
all kinds of glass ware, some
>ilver pieces, paper back
books, pine hutch and lots of
other miscellaneous items.

14-5-22-1

PICTURES, fan, small table
saw, pump, light fixtures,
end table, chair, fiber glass
door canopy, 10-speed bike,
carnp stove, clock, miscel-
laneous. May 23 and 24. 6178
Shabbona Road, five miles
south, three fourth mile west
of Cass City. 14-5-22-1

YARD SALE - 6910 Ritter
Road, Cass City. May 23-24,
from 9 till 5. Antique
straight-back chairs, dress
form, vacuum cleaner, 2
youth beds, bathroom sink
and vanity, kitchenware, old
dishes, humidifier, 12x60
mobile home. 3 miles north
of M-81 on M-53, then % mile
west on Ritter Road.

14-5-22-1

YARD SALE - Saturday,
May 24,8a.m. till ? Antiques
and collectibles. No clothes.
Glassware, furniture,
trunks, quilts, lamps, bask-
ets and much more. 8980
Point Charity Drive at Ann
St., southwest of Caseville
on Sand Point. 14-5-22-1

EVERYTHING SALE - new
Avon and new ceramics.
Miscellaneous items, Seven
days a week, 10:00 a.m. on.
6606 Gage Street, Gagetown.
Phone 665-2421. 14-5-15-3

Services
SHARPENING SERVICE -
all types of saws, mower
blades, knives, etc. Machine
precision • fast service and
low rates. Ed Spencer, 2
south, I'/) west of Cass City
on West Kelly Rd. Phone
872-4512 after 3:30.

8-5-1-4

Terrasi & Son
Electrical Co.

•Newinstallations and
repairs

• Electrical heating and
cooling service

• Homes - Farms - Business
Licensed electrical

contractor
CALL ANYTIME

658-2291
Cass City Road, Snover

--:._ """ 8-i-i8-tf"
EXPERT WHEEL aligtT
ment. Call for appointment.
Kingston Tire Center, Kings-
ton. Phone 683-2826. 8-8-10-tf

PAGAN'S THUMB Carpet
Cleaning - Dry foam or
steam. Also upholstery and
wall cleaning. Free Esti-
mates. Call toll free 1-800-
322-0206 or 517-761-7503. We
welcome BankAmericard -
Master Charee. 8-3-20-tf

Brooks'
Landscaping

6389 7th Street
Cass City

Full line of trees,
& shrubbery

Call collect 872-2932

Evenings or week-end
appointments

8-3-20-12

B AND B Refrigeration -
Repair all makes of wash-
ers, driers, refrigerators,
freezers and ranges. Call
Caro 673-6125. 8-5-1-tf

AUCTIONEER
EXPERIENCED

Complete Auctioneering
Service Handled Anywhere.
We Make All Arrangements.
Our Experience Is Your

Assurance.

Ira, David &
Martin Osentoski

Phone
Cass City 872-2352 Collect

PIANO TUNING and re-
pairing on all makes of
pianos. 20 years'experience.
Member of the Piano Tech-
nicians Guild. Duane Johns-
ton, Bad Axe, Mich. 48413.
Phone 269-7364. 8-2-1-tf

Custom
Butchering

Meat cut, wrapped and frozen

Gainor's
Meat Packing

Bad Axe, Phone 269-8161

1 mile north, 1 mile west of
Bad Axe.

8-11-25-tf

INTERIOR AND Exterior
painting - Install windows,
drywall, panelling, ceiling
tile, etc. Theron Esckilsen,
4314 Maple St., Cass City.
Phone 872-2302. 8-7-19-tf

Martin Electric
Residential and Commercial

Wiring

State Licensed

Free Estimates

Phone 872-4114

4180 Kurds Corner Road
8-10-tf

AUCTIONEERING - See
Lorn "Slim" Hillaker. Top
dollar for your property.
Phone 872-3019, Cass City.

8-10-3-tf

Custom Slaughtering - Curing
Smoking and Processing

Beef - Pork - Veal - Lamb

For Sale - Beef and Pork,
Whole or half. Wrapped in the

new clear shrink film
Erla'sPackingCo.

Cass City, Michigan
DickErla

Phone 872-2191
8-11-2-tf

EXPERT BRAKE service
from $29.95. Call for appoint-
ment. Kingston Tire Center,
Kingston. Phone 683-2826.

8-8-10-tf

Aluminum Siding
Eave Troughs, Storm
Windows and Doors

Installed by
Licensed Contractor

Workmanship Guaranteed

Please call evenings

Call 872-3320
RayArmstead

8-4-10-tf

FLEENOR APPLIANCE
Service - 4260 Woodland
Ave., Cass City. Phone 872-
3697. 8-4-17-tf

Chuck Gage
Welding Shop

We now have heli-arc welding

Specializing in stainless
steel, blacksmithing, fabrica-
ting and radiator repair.

Also portable welding

7062E. DeckervilleRd.
Deford, Michigan

Phone 872-2552
8-5-15-tf

ELMER H. FRANCIS, li-
censed builder. New homes
or remodeling. Roofing, sid-
ing, barns, pole buildings
Phone 872-2921. 8-11-7-tf

Services ]
CHAPPEL'S Repair Service
- odd jobs. No job too small.
Phone 375-2510. 8-5-1-tf

Wanted to Buy J

Farm
Equipment

FOR SALE - International
No. 93 self-propelled com-
bine, Innes No. 570 wind-
rower, D15 Allis Chalmers
tractor with duals, plow and
cultivator, Super C with
plow, cultivator and bean
puller, '73 Dodge Polara -
needs motor, 4 bags cleaned
June clover seed, old planter
and grain drill and antique
Lionel electric train and
other miscellaneous items.
Call Pete Kritzman 872-3108.

9-5-22-1

FOR SALE - Hay wagon
with rack, $200 Call 872-
2507. 9-5-15-3

FOR SALE - John Deere 3
point 3 bottom 14-inch plow,
$300; International 449A 4
row corn and bean planter,
$450; 1958 John Deere 45
self-propelled combine,
$1250; John Deere 6 row corn
head for 105 combine, $850.
Located near Argyle Road
and M-53. Phone 1-313-363-
2804 or 872-2882. 9-5-15-3

FOR SALE - NH hay baler
model 68, in perfect working
order. ($600.00). 1>2 east, '-
north of Gagetown. Phone
665-2480. 9-5-22-1

FOR SALE - 300 gallon gas
tank with nozzle, on stand
and Super C International
tractor wilh 2 cultivators,
good shape. Phone 883-3979.

9-5-22-3

FOR SALE - Holstein heif-
er, just freshened, 2 row
cultivator with hydraulic
cylinders, fits H or M; Oliver
3 bottom 14-inch trailer plow
on rubber. Also, electric
cream separator. Call 872-
2512. 9-4-10-tf

[Work Wanted)
TYPING AND bookkeeping
is what I do.-Maybe I can
be of help to you. Call
872-3733. 12-5-22-3

WILL DO housecleaning,
also babysitting. Tarn, call
872-4625. 12-5-22-3

CMU graduate with two-
year certificate, looking for
secretarial employment.
Typing 75 wpm - short hand
110 wpm. Some medical and
legal typing, other qualifica-
tions, experienced. Call
375-4088. 12-5-22-5

WILL DO BABY SITTING in
my home on Kelly Road, just
south of Cass City. Call
872-3887 anytime. 12-5-22-3

WANTED - spring house
cleaning. Call Ubly 658-2250
or 658-8958. 12-5-22-3

BABY SITTING in Owen-
dale area. First or second
shift. References. Call 678-
4449. 12-5-22-3

WILL DO LAWN mowing,
roto tilling and yard work.
Call 872-3191. 12-5-8-3

WILL DO BABY SITTING in
my home: Deford area.

WANTED - Ford 302 engine.
.Call 872-2254 after 4 p.m.

6-5-22-3

WILL BUY - silver coins
silver dollars and old pocket
watches. Phone _ 872^2635

~after5p.m. 6-9-7-tfn

[To Give Away ]
TWO BORDER Collie pups,
six months old to give away
to a good home. Fred Maf-
thews, phone 872-3879.

7-5-22-1

Livestock ]
FOR SALE - double regis-
tered Palomino quarter-
horse mare, 12 years old
Gentle and well trained
Phone 872-2256 after 9 p m

10-5-22-3

FOR SALE - pair of black
matched ponies. Two miles
east of Cass City, v4 mile
south on Crawford Road
Phone 872-3221. 10-5-22-3

REGISTERED Arabian
gelding, chestnut with black
mane, tail and legs. Sharp
looking and good disposition.
Call after 6 - 872-4070.

10-5-8-3

[Help Wanted)
WANTED - baby sitter in my
home in town, to start in
July for newborn and 5-yeai -
old. 4 days a week. Refer-
ences. Phone 872-3294.

11-5-15-4

STOP WASTING your
energy. Put your free time
to good use. Sell Avon pai t-
time or full time and eain
good money. Call 872-2525 :or
write Virginia Seroka, 2841
N. Van Dyke, Decker.

11-5-8-3

Card of Thanks]
WE WISH TO express our
heartfelt thanks to relatives,
friends and neighbors for the
flowers, cards and kind-
nesses during our recent
bereavement. Special
thanks to Pastor Taylor, the
singers, Mr. Little and the
ladies of the Cass Cfiy
Missionary church. MrJ
Vernon Rosenberger and
family. 13-5-2J-1

Phone 872-3904. 12-5-8-3

I WOULD LIKE to thank Di
Donahue and his entire s t a f f
at Hills and Dales General
Hospital for the wonderful
care I received during rny
recent stay in the hospital. I
want to thank Rev. Kelley
and Rev. Gelatt for visits
and prayers and all who
visited me and for gifts,
flowers and cards. May God
richly bless you all. Ethel
Buehrly. 13-5-22-1

WE WISH TO express sin-
cere thanks to our many
friends who helped us
through our time of bereave-
ment. We are gratefully
appreciative of the gifts of
cards, flowers, memorials
and food. Thanks, also, to
Vern Lockard for his com-
forting message, the organ-
ist, soloist and the ladies of
the Novesta Church of Christ
for their services. The fam-
ily and relatives of Keith
Horner. 13-5-22-1

WE WOULD LIKE to thank
our relatives, friends ami
neighbors for the flowers,
food and memorials during
the loss of our father, grand-
father and great-grandfath-
er, Rev. Kelley and Rev,
Dickins for their comforting
words. Thanks to the ladies
of the Salem United Meth-
odist church for the nice
lunch, also the Little Funer-
al Home for their services.
Mr. and Mrs. Harley Dean,
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Dean and
family. 13-5-22-1

ATTENTION

EMPLOYERS

Hiring new help? Why not try local
residents of Huron, Sanilac or Tuscola,
counties? ON-THE-JOB training can;
be of monetary assistance to you by;
providing up to fifty (50) percent of a;
new employee's hourly wage or sal-j
ary. If you are willing to employ eli-;
gible unemployed workers, this pro-*
gram may help you to turn someone
into a skilled asset to your company.
For further information call (517)
872-4546 at the Thumb Area Consortium
in Cass City.

12-5-8-8"
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Why do teachers
leave Cass City?

COOKS' TOUR - Preschoolers through third graders learned some fundamentals of cooking in an afternoon
community education class taught by Kate Jackson, home economics teacher at Cass City High School. Some
of her high school students assisted. Last of the four sessions for the 12 girls and five boys was last Thursday.
In addition to preparing meals, at left, they also learned what comes after -- washing dishes.

Owen-Gage appeal Garage sales
Continuied from page one

rule.
It may, however, agree

with the appeals court that
Owen-Gage legally waived
its right to argue the arbi-
trary and capricious provi-
sion as it failed to present
that argument in a circuit
court brief.

The assistant attorney
general declined to specu-
late on whether the Goslin
territory is now in the Owen-
Gage or Cass City district.

Erickson said the Su-
preme Court's decision to

hear the case gives his
district reason to file an
addendum to its appeal now
before the state appeals
court involving December,
1978 and 1979 taxes from
Goslin.

In October of last year,
Tuscola Circuit Judge Mar-
tin E. Clements ruled the
taxes for both those years,
which total more than
$170,000at Owen-Gage's mil-
lage rate, should go to Cass
City.

Owen-Gage appealed,
with its motion being lodged
in the state appeals court

since then.
The district contends that

since the issue of the prop-
erty transfer is still in
litigation, Goslin still is part
of Owen-Gage and it, not
Cass City, should get the
taxes. "Things have to be on
hold while appeals are being
made," Erickson said.
"That has been our conten-
tion all along."

The Chronicle was unable
to contact Robert Kleeb,
Howell attorney represent-
ing the Goslin property own-
ers who sought the transfer
to Cass City.

~ *- -r -ft i

HAVE A THRIFTY YEAR WITH
these

Special

o O
LOW

ON
QUALITY Whirlpool

WHIRLPOOL
fftBYEB

Model LFE3000

$18995

WHIRLPOOL
WACMFB

Model LHB3000

$26995

WHIRLPOOL
Model REM7200
• 35-minute, dual-speed MEALTIMER* clock
•COOK POWER variable power control
• Black-glass, see-through door
• Large, 1.14 cu. ft. oven capacity
• Sealed-in glass shelf

_ _ • Oven light
95* End-of-cooking signal

• Oven light 'Tmk.
• Micro Menus* cookbook
• Free cooking school available

INSTANT CREDIT

Whirlpool
Regrigerator

EET121DT

Whirlpool
SDU4001

Dishwasher

are success
Continued from page: one

made for future sales was
that the Chamber make
more maps available, per-
haps distributing them at
each sale location.

A number of people re-
quested the maps to guide
them to other sales but she
had none to give them.

Some of the items for sale
in garages around the city
included old clothes, house-
hold items, and assorted
knick-knacks, according to
those participants con-
tacted.

Rev. Eldred Kelley, 4-154
Ale Street, said he and his
wife also had a number of
antiques for sale, including a
trunk and a variety of old
picture frames.

At least one person was
unhappy with the way the
sale was operated, however.

Beryl Bliss, 6785 Main
Street, said she thought
there were too many garage
sales Roinf; on at once but
declined to comment fur-
ther.

Most said they felt the
variety of sales and the
accompanying advertising
helped their business. The
average reported was
$200-300 in sales.

Jean Murphy, 6555 Church
Street, said she had a sale
two years ago but only made
about half the profits of last
week. She attributed the
success to the publicity the
event received.

Most of her items were
sold, except for one boxful,
Murphy added.

Many of the entrepreneurs
combined forces with neigh-
bors and friends in group
garage sales.

Murphy and five others
shared their location, she
said, adding prices and prof-
its were kept separate.

Most said they would like
to see the idea of the
community-wide sale con-
tinued: however, many
added they would not par-
ticipate every year.

"We obviously couldn't
have one every year," Rev.
Kelley said. "We wouldn't
have enough to sell."

Michigan Mirror

Oil drilling

bill 'reckless'
Uv Uarn-n M. Hoyt

.Mich. Press Association

The leader of the environ-
menta l groups tha t brought
a lawsui t to stop oil and gas
d r i l l i n g in the Pigeon River
Country State Forest has
declared a bill promoted as
a vehicle to allow dril l ing
while protecting the most
sensitive lands is an out-
rageous and reckless piece
of legislation.

Ken Sikkema, executive
director of the Michigan
Environmental Protection
Council, charged the bill (SB
1119) "constitutes the most
far-reaching special interest
attack on Michigan's en-
vironmental laws in years."

He said in fact , passage of
the bill would have precisely
the opposite effect of pro-
tecting the lands of excep-
tional environmental values.

Sikkema asserted the bill
would exempt oil and gas
drilling on state lands of
exceptional environmental
value from the state En-
vironmental Protection Act
(under which the Pigeon
River suit was brought) and
other environmental laws
and would open the way for
off-shore drilling of the
Great Lakes.

Although co-sponsored by
29 of the 38 members of the
Senate, including all five
members of the Commerce
Committee where the bill
was referred, Sikkema said
he believes when the Senate
understands the full impact
of the legislation, it will not
"sail right through, despite
appearances that it is
greased."

The bill would require the
director of the Department
of Natural Resources to
evaluate all state land
leased since 1968 for oil and
gas exploration (which in-
cludes Pigeon River),

THE DIRECTOR ALSO
would be required to pre-
pare a plan for development
of areas having exceptional
environmental values and
include all terms or condi-
tions stipulated to or agreed

to by leaseholders and the
director of the Natural Re-
sources Commission.

Currently, the leasehold-
ers have agreed to confine
dr i l l ing to the southern third
of the forest and to specified
sites, but the state Supreme
Court disallowed drilling
permits at the 10 sites
approved by Department of
Natural Resources Director
Howard Tanner.

The bill also requires com-
mission approval of drilling
plans unless the plan results
in unnecessary waste and if
the state supervisor of wells
has certified that the plan
wil l not have a significant
adverse impact on the en-
vironment.

Further, the bill states
that compliance with those
procedures presumes com-
pliance with environmental
standards and requires any
court challenge to be
brought in Ingham County
Circuit Court.

THE ENVIRONMENTAL
Protection Act (EPA) al-
lows any citizen to bring a
lawsuit on an allegation that
the environment would be
harmed by planned or exist-
ing activity and places the
burden of proof that the
environment would not be
harmed on the person en-
gaging in the activity.

Dennis Tierney of the
DNR's Bureau of Resources
said provisions of the bill do
appear to attempt to bypass
the EPA, but added he is not
sure the bill really accomp-
lishes that end. He said he
believes citizens could still
rely on the EPA to bring
lawsuits.

Sikkema said the bill could
not be amended to meet his
group's objections, but sug-
gested a substitute could be
drafted that would require
the state department to de-
velop a planning process to
set priorities for drilling on
state lands and to maximize
the public return on oil and
gas drilled from beneath
those lands.

He said that was the
ultimate purpose of bringing
the Pigeon River lawsuit.

Continued from page .one

stay. Cass City doesn't have
the shopping, movies and
other cultural attractions
that a larger city or college
town has, a six-year teacher
pointed out. "For someone
coming from Detroit, I'm
sure it's a shock."

Some female teachers

Bush is
winner over
Reagan

Continued, from page one

Of the 22,313 registered
voters, 4,226 cast ballots, a
turnout of 18.9 percent.

In Greenleaf township,
Reagan received 32 votes to
18 for Bush and one uncom-
mitted.

In Evergreen, Reagan
won 47 votes, Bush, 34,
uncommitted, 3, and Fer-
nandez, one. Carter and
LaRouche each got one.

Austin township voters re-
jected a four-year 2.5-mill
renewal for roads, 67-50,
which had been in effect for
at least 10 years.

Township Clerk John
Osentoski said he "can't
understand why it was
turned down," adding that it
will be up to the township
board to decide if it wants to
schedule another vote. It
could do so as part of the
Aug. 5 primary or Nov. 4
general election.

The 2.5 .rills would have
raised about $16,000 a year
for roads.

HURON COUNTY

George Bush received
1,443 votes to 1,122 for Ron-
ald Reagan.

Others listed on the Re-
publican side of the ballot
were Anderson, 223, Fer-
nandez, 26, Stassen, 13, and
uncommitted, 40.

Brown received 107 Dem-
ocratic votes, LaRouche, 46,
and uncommitted, 67.

A total of 3.087 ballots
were cast, which is 15.6
percent of the 19,697 regis-
tered voters in the county.

fresh out of college, she
added, come here with boy-
friends elsewhere and some-
times engaged. After a year
or two here, they leave to get
married.

College campuses have
other attractions. For teach-
ers working on advanced
degrees, it is a long com-
mute from Cass City after
school to attend a class, so
many leave for a job closer
to a college campus.

Some leave to go back to
college full-time. The teach-
er mentioned at the begin-
ning of this section, for
instance, may accept a
graduate fellowship at a
university.

The female teachers con-
tacted felt young male
teachers have an advantage
in a small town. There isn't a
stigma attached to a male
being out alone, males can
ask females out, plus many
are coaches and thus get
more involved outside of
school with other teacher-
coaches and members of the
community.

A male coach, who has
been here less than two
years, said he has met some
people through coaching,
but after practice, he usual-
ly goes one way and the
other coaches go another.

As for living in a small
town, he comes from anoth-
er small community, so Cass
City is not a change. But for
someone coming from the
Detroit area, "that's quite a
difference from around
here."

INVOLUNTARY LEAVING

Although most teachers
leave of their own accord, a
few don't.

The Chronicle talked to
two teachers, both in their
first year here, who were
either asked to resign or to
whom it was suggested they
do so.

One had extensive
substituting experience else-
where last year. For the
other, it was his first teach-
ing job. Both are now seek-
ing teaching jobs elsewhere
for the 1980-81 school year.

It was discipline that
caused problems for the two,
though with one. he said the
out-of-the-ordinary prob-

lems were confined to a
study hall with more than 80
students.

Both felt their principals
could have taken some
measures to ease their diffi-
culties, but were not sharply
critical.

"I can see their point of
view as far as asking me not
to come back," said one.

CONCLUSION

Other than the two who
were asked to leave, none of
the teachers contacted were
dissatisfied with the school
system, other than a few
minor complaints.

"I think we have a nice
school system," said one,(
adding that based on con-
versations at conventions
with other teachers in her
field, from other school dis-
tricts, "I'm a lot better off."

Kingston

graduatioi

Sunday
Commencement exercises

for graduates of Kingston
High School's 1980 class will
take place Sunday in the
high school gymnasium. The
combined baccalaureap
and commencement cere's
mony will begin at 2 p.m.

There are 56 students in
this year's graduating class.

Valedictory and saluta-
tory addresses will be read
by Elisabeth Britton and
Shelly Stoll respectively.

A musical selection, "We
May Never Pass This Way
Again," will be sung by
graduates Sue Smith and
Jim Ahearn. Marie Lalko'
will accompany them.

An opening prayer by Rev.
Larry E. Schwark of the
Dayton Center church will
follow the processional
played by the Kingston High
School Band under the direc-
tion of Wayne Smith.

Rev. Gilson Miller, of the
Kingston United Methodist
church will give an address.

300 LONG GUN 300
JfcUCTI

ANTIQUE and MODERN

Sunday, May 25
LUNCH 10:30 A.M. LUNCH

Located at the Colony House in Sanilac County, Mich-
igan, 4 miles East of Cass City, 4 miles North on Van
Dyke (M-53) or 13 miles South of Bad Axe or 90 miles
North of Detroit.
This private collection of 300 long guns is one of the1

largest in the thumb of Michigan with approximately
one-third being Winchesters. Inspection will start at
8:30 A.M. day of sale. Catalog will be available at the
door or on request to auctioneer prior to sale.

TERMS- A five dollar buyer's number fee will be
charged at the door to be applied on purchase. All
purchases will be paid for by cash or checK with
proper ID day of sale. Nothing removed from premises
until paid for.

AUCTIONEER - LORN HILLAKER
Phone

517-872-3019
4059 DOERR ROAD

CASS CITY, MICH. 48726
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cuss OF 'so
CLASS OFFICERS

President jane Hobart

Vice-President Steven Richards
Secretary Teresa Hewitt
Treasurer Vickie Pobanz

Class Sponsors Mr. David Hoard

Miss Christine Psujek
Assistant Sponsors Mrs. Laure Mieskowski

Mr. Russell Biefer
Mr. Dale Mclntosh

CLASS MOTTO:

"The important thing in this world is not so much where we
stand, but where we are going."

The 94th class at Cass City High School

Baccalaureate Service

Sunday, May 18, 1980, 2:00 p.m.

Processional Senior High School Band
"Pomp & Circumstance"by Elgar Tom Clair. Director

Invocation Reverend Harry Capps
Cass City Presbyterian Church

Musical Selection Senior High School Choir
' 'Old Irish Blessing' by Denes Agay James Hobbs. Director

Scripture Reading Elder Dean Smith
Reorganized Church of Jesus Christ

of Latter Day Saints, Decker

Musical Selection Senior High School Band
"Glorious Things of Thee Are Spoken" by Ployhar Tom Clair, Director

Prayer for the Graduates Pastor John Lange
Novesta Baptist Church

Address Reverend James VanDellen
Good Shepherd Lutheran Church

Benediction Reverend Harry Capps
Cass City Presbyterian Church

Recessional Senior High School Band
"Recessional" by Elgar Tom Clair, Director

Graduation Exercises

Thursday, May 22, 1980, 8:00 p.m.

Processional Senior High School Band
' 'Pomp & Circumstance'' by Elgar Tom Clair, Director

Invocation Reverend P. T. Wachterhauser
Trinity United Methodist Church, Cass City

Welcome Donald G. Grouse
Superintendent of Schools

Student Speakers Jane Hobart
Class of 1980

Daniel LaPonsie
Class of 1980

Musical Selection Senior High School Band
Tom Clair, Director

Presentation of Honors and Awards C. J. Cleland
Wayne Dillon

Senior High School Counselors

Presentation of Graduates Russell L. Richards
Senior High School Principal

Awarding of Diplomas Donald G. Grouse
Superintendent of Schools

Benediction Reverend P. T. Wachterhauser
Trinity United Methodist Church, Cass City

Recessional Senior High School Band
1 'Recessional'' by Elgar Tom Clair, Director



Terry Lynn Agar • Lester Jay Auten III

Connie E. Clark • Robert Glenn Clarke

Anne Jean Esau v Lori Beth Ewald

John James Gallagher Virginia Marie Gibas

Sherry Ann Bader

Gail Diane Compo

Timothy T. Fahrner

Patricia May Gilliam

I ft'.

Andrea Kelly Barnes

Walter J.Connolly

Randal Jay Ferris

Sandra Ruth Guc

v - valedictorian s - saiutatorian " • honor student (3.000 or better grade point average)

Barbara Jean Broecker Debra Lee Brown

£1PM
Steven Arthur Corcoran Laura Lee Enos

Susan Elaine Finkbemer Larry Jonathan Fisher

Mark Ferrell Guinther Trent C. Guinther

Lisa Kaye Brown

Renee Mane Erla

Gregory Scott Frank

Gail Elizabeth Gutierrez

Lori A. Zrehm

Adam Zimba

• :er,.sd Mjy in

The Chronicle regrets that the photos of
the following students were unavailable

Deborah Susan Barker
Thomas Leo Coleman
Dean Allen Dillon
Valerie Ann Gibas
Pamela Ann Goodman

.Jack E. Groombridge
Kelly Ann Hall
Angeleatte Marie Harmon

Evelyn S. Langenburg
Michael Paul Martin
Robert Vincent Piaskowski
Lena M. Remsing
Lynn Marie Schember-Smith
Franklin D. Venema
James William Wright

'80 CLASS OFFICERS

Jane Hobart
President

Steven Richards
Vice-President

Teresa Hewitt
Secretary

Vickie Pobanz
Treasurer

GO forward from this beginning... A task complete — Congratulations class of '80
Center

Bartnik's Sales & Service

B&W Used Cars

Big D Drive-In Restaurant

Bigelow Sentry Hardware Cass City Sports, Inc.

Cass City Auto Supply

Cass City Chronicle

Cass City Steel Supply,
Inc.

Cass City Oil &Gas

Cass City IGA Foodliner Cass City State Bank

Schneeberger'sTV,
Furniture & Appliances

Sommer's Bakery &
Restaurant

Trend Vendors, Inc.

Thumb National Bank
and Trust Co.

The Trade Winds

Village Service Center

Wickes Agriculture

Winter's Truck Sales

Buds & Blossoms Flower Shop Cass City Floral Coach Light Pharmacy State Farm Insurance Veronica's Restaurant Old Wood Drug
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• Karen Lynn Speirs

Caroline Christina Swart

Debbie Ann Spencer Michael DeWayne Stec Peggy Sue Stevens Karen Marie Stine * Earney Eldon Stoutenburg John Edward Suiter

Anthony Edward Sweeney Linda K. Taylor
v Lori Ann Teichman Michael Frederick Thorp Todd Gurdon Toner • Nancy L. Tonti

Yvonne Jo Harm

' Julie Anne He!A

Elizabeth Helen Hariel Lauri Anne Hartsel Jane Marie Hartwick

Donald E- Hendnckll Susan Kay Hendrick ' Teresa Annette Hewitt

Teruyo Hayashi

Rickey Dean Hoag

Melanie L. Hayes

Rusty Alan Hoag

Louise Ann Healy

" Jane Susan Hobart

David Riley Vargo Kathleen Susan Vargo Michael Peter Vatter Todd Michael Vatter Kevin Robert Wagg Kimberly Sheila Waldorf Bob Dale Warju Rebecca Ann HoDan Linda Lea Hoidburg Daniel A Hunt Edward David Izydorek Timothy Frederick Johnson Wendy Ann Kelley Donald G.King

Karen Elizabeth Wallace

,,.,x
Carmen Louise Warmbier v Linda Marie Whittaker Walter Evan Widdis

v - valedictorian s - salutatorian • - honor student (3.000 or better grade point average)

Robert Thomas Wilson Tina Ann Wright Bonnie Lynn Wutzke

A good start today — a good finish tomorrow
New You Health Spa

Osentoski Realty
& Auctioneering

Ouvry Chevrolet-Olds.,
Inc.

The Pinrvey State Bank

Pizza Villa

Quaker Maid Dairy

Rabideau Motors, Inc.
Farm Division

Richard's TV-Appliance-
Furniture

Rolling Hills Airport

Rolling Hills Golf Course

Ron's Automotive

Ryland & Guc Plumbing

Denise Sandra Kntzman Doreen Ann Krol Scott Alan Krueger Ruth KayKulmski Clayette Ann Lane

v - valedictorian s - salutatorian * - honor student (3.000 or better grade point average)

Best wishes to the class of '80
B.A. CalkaReal Estate

Chuck Gage Welding
Shop

The Charmont

Clare's Sunoco Service

The Clothes Closet

Colony House

Copeland & Gornowicz Ins.
Agency

Eicher's Cleaners

Enos Farm Supply

Erla's Food Center

Dan's Auto & Fireplace Shop Evans Products Co.
Deford

Croft-Clara Lumber Co., Inc. Deford Country Grocery I Faust Rebuilding Service



Susan Marie Langenburg • Daniel R. LaPonsie • Sandy Lee Little LuEllen Kay Lowe Sharon M. Lowe

Tamara Kaye McKee

x. - }
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Martina Jo McKenney Scott G. McLachlan Donald J. MacKowiak Tammy A. Manion

Douglas Robert McArthur

David C. Martin

Brenda Leigh McClorey

s Kenneth J. Martin. Jr.

Connie Kay Nicol

Julie Lyn Palmateer

James Arthur Nicol

v Melanie Eleanor Particka

Robert S. O'Dell Denise Marie Okerstrom Anna Marie Osentoski Deborah Ann Page

Suzanne Lynn PasansKi
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Joann Maris Peters " Vickie Ann Pobanz Robin Marie Quinn

Daniel Eugene Palazzola

" Tammi Lynn Rabtdeau

Jay Frederick Matt Kimberly Ann Meredith ' Tracy Lynn Vandiver-Middaugh Patricia Sue Miller Brent M.Mitchell Deborah Leigh Mitchell William Harry Mitchell DuaneP. Reed Julie Rene' Richards Steven Paul Richards " Tammie Lynne Root • Kathy Ann Rosenberger * Darwin Duane Rushlo Tammy Lynn Schember

Max B. Morrish Karen L. Musial Michael E. Neiman Kathleen Marguerite Newell Bunny Sue Newsome Terry James Nicholas Karen Kaye Schmidt Judith Adele Sieradzki Brian Simpson Brian Smerdon Cynthia Dee Smith Matthew Brian Smith John Robert Sommer

v • valedictorian s - salutatorian • - honor student (3.000 or better grade point average) v - valedictorian s • salutatorian • -honor student (3.000 or better grade point average)

Well done grads — keep up the good work
Fort's Store

Elmer Francis, Builder

Frank's Service Station

Gamble Store

G/F Archery

Geiger-Hunt Ford, Inc.

Gene's M-81 Motel

The Hair Benders

Harris-Hampshire Agency,
Inc.

Ed Hahn Real Estate &
Pine Cone Shop

Goodyear Farm Tire Center Helen's Beauty Shop

Success and best wishes to all of you
Herron Builders

Hillside Beauty Shop

Hobart's Family Shoes

Kritzmans', Inc.

Konrad's Bakery &
Restaurant

L & S Standard & Sports
Center

Kappen Sawmill, Deford Larry's Power Wash

Little's Funeral Home

Martin Electric

Mary's Beauty Salon

Mutual Savings and Loan
Assoc.


	CCC 1980
	01-03-1980
	01-10-1980
	01-17-1980
	01-24-1980
	01-31-1980
	02-07-1980
	02-14-1980
	02-21-1980
	02-28-1980
	03-06-1980
	03-13-1980
	03-20-1980
	03-27-1980
	04-03-1980
	04-10-1980
	04-17-1980
	04-24-1980
	05-01-1980
	05-08-1980
	05-15-1980
	05-22-1980
	05-29-1980
	06-05-1980
	06-12-1980
	06-19-1980
	06-26-1980
	07-03-1980
	07-10-1980
	07-17-1980
	07-24-1980
	07-31-1980
	08-07-1980
	08-14-1980
	08-21-1980
	08-28-1980
	09-04-1980
	09-11-1980
	09-18-1980
	09-25-1980
	10-02-1980
	10-09-1980
	10-16-1980
	10-23-1980
	10-30-1980
	11-06-1980
	11-13-1980
	11-20-1980
	11-27-1980
	12-04-1980
	12-11-1980
	12-18-1980
	12-24-1980
	12-31-1980


