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7per cent increase

Council votek V

HOUSE FIRE - Raymond M. Quinn died Monday as a result of injuries sustained in
this Sunday morning house fire on Richie Road, near Gagetown. Gagetown firemen
battled the blaze for almost five hours. Quinn was a visitor in the home.

Dies in Saginaw hospital

Christinas morning fire
claims Gagetown man

A 73-year-old Gagetown
man died Monday at St.
Mary's Hospital in Saginaw,
the victim of a Christmas
morning fire that destroyed a
home on Richie Road, east of
Gagetown.

The victim, Raymond M.
Quinn, who lived at 4773 South
Street, was a visitor in the
home, which belonged to Wil-
liam Russell.

Also living in the home,
according to Gagetown Fire
Chief Chuck Wright, were
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Rolston,
who cared for Russell, who
is crippled, and their daugh-
ter. All were home when the
fire started about 9a.m.

The occupants told Wright
that Quinn apparently threw
an inflammable liquid into a
woodburning stove in the rear
of the home to get a fire
burning. Gasoline for a chain-
saw was stored nearby.

The fire in the stove flared
back, burning Quinn and
starting the house on fire.

The home had no phone so
the Rolstons telephoned the
fire department from a neigh-
bor's and enlisted their help
to remove Russell from the
house.

Firemen arrived a few
minutes later, but due to very
strong winds fanning the
flames were unable to save
the wood frame structure.
They were able to prevent an
oil storage tank alongside the
house from exploding.

The Gagetown firemen
were on the scene from about
9a.m. to 1:45 p.m.

Elkland township firemen
brought a water tanker to the
scene to aid in fighting the
flames.

The only thing saved from
inside the home was an elec-
tric arc welder.

Quinn was taken to Hills
and Dales General Hospital,
then transferred
immediately to the burn unit
at St. Mary's.

Reportedly, Russell and the
Rolstons are temporarily
living with Rolston's brother
intheUblyarea.

There was no insurance on
the house, which appeared to
be rather old. The loss esti-
mate was $5,000.

The Russell home was on

Richie Road, .3 mile south of
Bay City-Forestville Road, a
mile east of Gagetown.

Quinn, a lifelong resident of
the area, was born in
Gagetown Nov. 2, 1904, the
son of Joseph and Coltilda
Quinn.

He served in the Army in
World War II.

He is survived by one
sister, Mrs. Norman (Helen)
Carpenter of Sterling Heights;
one nephew, Lawrence Quinn
of Detroit, and one niece,
Mrs. Janet Murphy of West
Bloomfield. One brother,
Bernard, preceded him in
death.

A prayer service for the
victim was to be conducted
Wednesday at Little's
Funeral Home, Cass City.

Funeral mass will be held
this Thursday at 11 a.m. from
St. Agatha's Catholic Church
in Gagetown with Father
Norman Van Poppelen of-
ficiating. Burial will be in St.
Agatha's cemetery.

Elkland township firemen
were called to the Enoch
Osentoski Jr. home at 8:15
Monday morning when an
overheated pipe from a wood
stove started a wall burning.

The home is on McMillan
Road, about a half-mile north
of Bay City-Forostville Roa/d,"
eastofM-53.

Fire Chief Jim Jezewski
said the pipe from the stove,
used for supplemental

h e a t i n g , a p p a r e n t l y
overheated and started a fire
burning within the west wall
of the house, both down-
stairs and upstairs.

Firemen gained access to
the flames by pulling away
some siding and cutting a
hole through .the outside and
enlarging a 'nole burned by
the fire inside. They fought
the fire for about 45 minutes.

J e z e w s k i es t imated
damage at $2,000.

Pickup misplaced
A Cass City man last week

lost his pickup truck - but not
to thieves, as he had thought.

The man reported to village
police Wednesday morning,
Dec. 21, that his pickup was
stolen from his home some-
time after midnight while he
was at the Charmont.

Police Chief Gene Wilson

recalled seeing a pickup at
the Charmont, so went back
there and checked. It was the
one reported stolen.

The chief theorized the man
drove it to the bowling lanes
and was too intoxicated to
drive it home, so got a ride
with someone else, and forgot
where he had left it.

Cass City employees got a-
New Year's present from the
village council Tuesday night,
a 7 per cent pay increase.

Council members also
voted themselves a raise, the
first since 1963, but it won't
make them rich.

The council voted 3-1 to
abandon an alley running
south from Pine Street, but a
two-thirds majority of all
council members was needed,
so for now, the alley stays
open.

The 7 per cent pay raise
affects 15 of 16 village em-
ployees.

In addition to the pay
increase, cumulative sick
leave was increased from 90
days to 120, and employees
will get all of Good Friday off
instead of a half-day.

Up till now, employees got
one week of vacation after six
months employment, two
weeks after one year, and
three weeks after 10 years. A
change is that after five
years, employees will get an
additional vacation day each
year up to the maximum after
10 years of three weeks.

The total package approved
by the council, pay and fringe
benefits, equals a 9 per cent
increase that will cost the
village an additional $17,994
in 1978.

According to Councilman
Richard Hampshire, chair-
man of the personnel com-
mittee, that compares to a 6
per cent wage increase, over-
all 8.75 per cent increase,
and total cost of $14,051 in
1977.

:.• The'One exception to the 7
per cent increase, bookkeeper
Joyce LaRoche, will get a 13.3
per cent increase but at
$8,840, will still be the lowest
paid village employee.

The highest paid is Supt.
Lou LaPonsie, $20,020.

Police Chief Gene Wilson
and wastewater plant super-
intendent Nelson Willy get
$17,083 with the increase.

The four village employees
paid with federal Compre-
hensive Employment and
Training Act funds will re-
ceive $10,700, of which $10,000
is in CETA funds and the
remainder from the village.

Over Thumb area

Lowered flight paths
will mean bigger boom

I will be at
the Pinney State Bank Fri-
day, Dec. 30, to collect taxes.
Elkland township treasurer.

12-29-1

The booms will be "boom-
ier" and the noise noisier if
the Air Force is allowed to
expand and lower its military
operations area (MOA) over
the upper Thumb area.

The present MOA has a
minimum "floor" of 13,000
and roughly covers.all of the
Thumb east of a line from
Sebewaing to Deford and
north of Deckerville Road
east from Deford.

The Air Force wants to
lower the floor to 4,000 feet
and expand the area to east of
a line from south of Sebe-
waing to south of Sandusky
and north of M-90.

The expanded area, as is
the present one, will primar-
ily be used by Air National
Guard and Air Force Reserve
units on training missions
operating out of Selfridge Air
National Guard Field at
Mount Clemens.

Following a public hearing
in Bad Axe in November, the
Federal Aviation Administra-
tion (FAA) approved the
lower flight levels. Interven-
tion by U.S. Rep. Bob Traxler
led to a recent reversal and a
second hearing has now been
scheduled Wednesday, Jan. 4.
It will start at 6:30 p.m. in
the Bad Axe Intermediate
School.

The MOA is used by three
types of aircraft, although
one, C-130 transport planes,
do not need to operate within
the area. The others are F-100
fighter planes and F-106 inter-
ceptor jets. The Air Force

• contends that pilots of the
' latter plane need to operate at
altitudes as low as 4,000 feet
in order to receive adequate
training.

According to William Gil-
martin, legislative assistant
to Rep. Traxler, more study

of two factors ' is needed
before the lower MOA should
be approved.

One is that whether low-fly-
ing jets will interfere with or
infringe upon air space used
by civilian aircraft.

The Huron Aviation Club,
headed by retired Air Force
Lt. Col. David W. Shoup of
Caseville, is attempting to
reach a compromise by hav-
ing the minimum MOA flight
level set at 6,000.

With private aircraft
normally trying to fly above
2,500 feet, Shoup recently
explained, that only gives
civilian pilots 1,500 feet of
space to work in if the MOA is
lowered to 4,000 feet.

The other area of concern is
the environmental impact of
the lower operating levels,
that is, will the added noise
from lower flying military
planes disturb residents on

the ground and possibly dam-
age buildings.

Shoup said the Air Force
has said it will not fly at
supersonic speeds when fly-
ing low, so structural damage
to homes and buildings from
sonic booms is not expected to
be a problem.

"However," he continued,
"the Air Force is talking
about utilizing 50 per cent of
the daylight hours for train-
ing missions from Tuesday
through Saturday, and oc-
casionally on Sunday, so it
will be noisy."

FAA officials have stressed
that they are concerned with
the air safety factor, not with
noise.

Gilmartin said an Environ-
mental Protection Agency
representative is expected to
be at the Jan. 4 hearing so
that the noise factor will be
discussed, in addition to air
safety.

COUNCIL PAY

The council doubled the pay
for the village president,
council members, and clerk
(for attending meetings).

Council members, who
were getting $10 per meeting
for a maximum of 15 meet-
ings per year, will get $20.
The village president got a
raise from $15 per meeting to
$30. The clerk got the same
increase as councilmen.

Pay for the village treas-
urer was raised from $450
annually to $700.

Voting for the increase
were trustees Gary Jones,
D.E. Ravvson, Richard Hamp-
shire, and James Ware. Bill
Bliss Jr. and Nat Tuttle were
absent.

ABANDONMENT

Tabled from the November
meeting was a decision on
abandonment of the north-
south portion of the L-shaped
alley in the block surrounded
by Pine, West, Houghton, and
Brooker Streets.

At the direction of the
council at the last meeting,
village workmen since then
surveyed the alley.

They found, village Presi-
dent Lambert Althaver re-
ported, that the house of Wil-
liam McKinley, one who peti-
tioned for the abandonment,
protrudes 10 feet into the
alley; his garage, 17 Vz feet.

The fence of Ronald Weip-
pert, not a petitioner, is five
feet into the alley.

That left the council with
two choices, Althaver ex-
plained, either remove the
encroachments or make them
legal by abandoning the alley.
He recommended abandon-
ment because no one would be
deprived of access to his
property by closing off the
alley. The abandonment will
make the east-west portion of
the alley a dead end.

Trustees voted 3-1 for the
abandonment - Dr. Rawson
voted no - but on the advice of
city attorney Clinton House,
decided a two-thirds vote of
all members, that is, four
votes, was needed for pass-
age.

Forrest T. Walpole, attorn-
ey for those opposing the
abandonment, objected when
the council voted to continue
the matter until its Jan. 31
meeting, when presumably
all council members would be
present.

Attorney House said it was
up to the council to decide,
"but if you want no objec-
tions, have McKinley file a
new petition." Trustees took
his advice, so bringing up the
matter again will require
filing a new petition.

SUBDIVISION

The council approved the
preliminary plat for North-
wood Estates and Northwood
Village, which allows devel-
oper Tom Herron to sell more
than four lots. Fifty-four lots
are in the first stage of
development. Some minor
changes, as recommended in
the village planning commis-
sion, were accepted by the
council.

At hospital

Accepted was a petition for
annexation of a parcel
479-by-66 feet in the subdivi-
sion to the village. The parcel
contains the continuation of
Hospital Drive into the sub-
division and presently runs
contiguous to but outside of
the village limits.

Annexation is necessary in
order for the developer to
eventually turn the street and
utilities running under it over
to the village.

The annexation must now
be approved by the county
board of commissioners.

OTHER ITEMS

LaPonsie reported that
flooding of the skating rink in
the village park may begin
this week.

A request by Frederick B.
Auten of the Cass City State
Bank for paving of the alley
between West and Downing
Streets behind the bank's new
building was referred to the
streets committee.

Shower of gifts
awaits 1st baby
Cass City merchants and

the Chronicle will shower the
first born baby at Hills and
Dales General Hospital with
gifts to gladden both the new
arrival and the parents,

It makes losing the tax
deduction in 1977 much easier
to bear.

From Kritzman's will come
a $10 gift certificate and from
Sommers' Bakery the parents
will be gifted with a congratu-
lations cake. Coach Light
Pharmacy hopes that no med-
ication is needed but if it is
there is $10.00 waiting to-
wards the purchase of a
prescription for either the
baby or the parents.

Old Wood Drug is giving a
$5 gift certificate and Erla's

Food Center has $10 worth of
merchandise waiting to be
picked up.

The Pinney State Bank
wants the youngster to get
started right and the parents
can come in and pick_ up a
$25 bond for the newborn.

IGA Foodliner will give $10
worth of baby food or mer-
chandise while Konrad's
Bakery has $5 worth of baked
goods for the family. Albee
True Value Hardware has $5
in merchandise to give in
honor of the event and the
Pied Piper has $10 worth of
merchandise waiting for the
new arrival.

Finally there is $5 in mer-
chandise being given at the
Gamble Store.

OPERATIONS AREA - The inner designated area is the
present Air Force military operations area, which has a
minimum "floor" of 13,000 feet. The proposed increased
area, marked by the heavy dotted line, would have a minimum
floor of 4,000 feet.

BEST WISHES
From

Staff and
Correspondents

AT THE CHRONICLE
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Cass City Social and Personal Items
Mrs. Reva Little Phone 872-3698

Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Keys

Christina Spencer and Ron-
ald Keys were united in
marriage Saturday, Nov. 19,
at the Kingston Methodist
church, Kingston.

The Rev. Joel Hurley per-
formed the double-ring cere-
mony for the daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Harold Spencer of

CARD'S LEADING JEWELER
Phone 673-2444

Kingston and the son of Mr.
and Mrs. Leland S. Keys of
Marlette.

The bride wore a long gown
of lace over satin.

Matron of honor was Karen
Freeman, sister of the bride.
She wore a yellow long gown.
Bridesmaid was Betty Skin-
ner, friend of the bride. She
wore a blue long gown.

Best man was Harold
Spencer III, brother of the
bride, and Al Fahs, friend of
the groom, was groomsman.
Ushers were Garry Spencer,
brother of the bride, and
Larry Keys, brother of the
groom.

A reception was held at
Caro Gun Club for 400 guests.

The couple are l iving at
Marlette.

The Want Ads are newsy too.

Servirvg^the Needs of Agriculture

HAPPY
NEW YEAR

From All Of Us
At

WICKES AGRICULTURE
We will be closed Dec. 30-31, Jan. 1-2

I
9
m
§

I

Mrs. Arthur Little was in
Center Line from Friday until
Monday to spend Christmas
with Mr. and Mrs. Don Rob-
erts and daughters, Brenda
and Diane, and sons, Craig
and Kevin.

Mr. and Mrs. Cas Stuba and
daughters, Shelley and
Christine, of Detroit and Mrs.
Norman Fisher of Royal Oak
spent Christmas Eve and
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
Philip Doerr. Other- guests
Monday and Tuesday were
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Doerr of
Kalamazoo. Mr. and Mrs.
Gary Barnes joined them for
a Christmas dinner Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Willard Dobbs
had their family with them
for Christmas dinner Mon-
day, Rev. and Mrs. William
Dobbs and children, David,
Dennis, Daniel and DeAnn, of
Mendon and Mr. and Mrs.
Tim Barnes and son Joshua of
Kawkawlin.

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Ko-
zan had with them Christmas
Eve, Theodore Ashmore of
Battle Creek, Gary Piesko of
Frankenmuth, Cheryl Kozan,
who is home from CMU, Mt.
Pleasant, Mr. and Mrs.
Randy Kozan and Mr. and
Mrs. Gary Czekai and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Morgan,
Miss Ellen Morgan and Miss
Maxine Loney were Christ-
mas Day guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Tom Morgan at Mar-
lette.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Craig
and Barbara had as Christ-
mas Eve guests, Mr. and Mrs.
Ron Decker of Big Rapids,
Carlton Craig of Highland,
Mr. and Mrs. Al Tropf, Mrs.
Paul Craig, Mrs. Hazel
Barnes and Mr. and Mrs.
Harold Craig.

Fifty-five attended the
Fraser Presbyterian church
Ladies' Aid dinner Dec. 21.
Aid members exchanged
gifts.

School secretaries enjoyed
a Christmas party during
their noon hour at school Dec.
21.

Christmas Day guests' of
Mr. and Mrs. Clayton Root
were Mr. and Mrs. George
McKee and family of Lapeer
and Mr. and Mrs. Frank
Nemeth of Deford. Joining
them for supper were Mr. and
Mrs. Roger Root and chil-
dren.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard
Woodard, Mr. and Mrs. Keith
Little and family and Mr. and
Mrs. David Little were part of
a family gathering Monday at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Bill
Bright at Lapeer.

A Happy Holiday Season
To Each Of You

o

o

o

o

o

And Special Thanks
For Making Coach Light

Your Discount Drug Center

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
M l k K \ V K \ Y K K . (Kvm-r IM.. 872-3613

KiiH'rjrmry Hi. 872-3283
Your Family Discount Dru<r Store

Donald E. Lorentzen and
daughters, Amy and Nancy,
of St. Charles, 111., spent from
Wednesday until Friday with
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Lorent-
zen. An early Christmas din-
ner was held Wednesday eve-
ning and other guests in-
cluded Anne Marie Lorentzen
of Saginaw and Rick Lorent-
zen of Clio.

Christmas dinner guests
Sunday at the Donald Lorent-
zen home-were Mr.- and-Mrs.
William Smith of Marlette,
Mr. and Mrs. George Jetta,
Anne Marie Lorentzen and
Rick Lorentzen.

Mrs. Leota Anthes spent
Christmas at Grand Ledge
with her daughter and family,
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Steig-
man and two children.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Craig
had with them for Christmas
Day, Mr. and Mrs. Ron
Decker of Big Rapids, Carlton
Craig of Highland, Mrs. Al
Tropf, Mrs. Hazel Barnes and
Mrs. Paul Craig.

Mr. and Mrs. Ferris Ware
and family entertained the
Ware families Christmas
Eve. Guests were Mr. and
Mrs. Gordon Ware of Clarks-
ton, Mr. and Mrs. David Ware
and children, Mr. and Mrs.
James Ware and family, Mr.
and Mrs. Leo Ware, Mr. and
Mrs. Kenneth Nye and family
and Mr. and Mrs. Mike
Gilliam.

Mrs. Ella Cumper and
Katherine Martin spent sev-
eral days over Christmas
with Mrs. Hannah Pierson of
Coleman.

Cindy Marshall of Mt. Vern-
on, Ohio, spent from Saturday
through Monday with her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Russell
Schneeberger.

Stanley Martinek of N.
Hurds Corner Road, was dis-
charged from the Osteopathic
Hospital in Saginaw and has
been able to return to his
employment with the Road
Commission.

Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Tracy
entertained two groups at
Christmas family gatherings
over the week end. Saturday
afternoon guests were Mr.
and Mrs. Ron Fox and family
of Lapeer, Mrs. Arvil Shields
of Marlette, the Tim Tracys
of Vassar and Beth and Ann
Tracy. Sunday guests were
Theo Hendrick, Mr. and Mrs.
Douglas O'Dell and Mr. and
Mrs. Timothy Tracy and chil-
dren.

Mrs. Ben Kirton had her
family with her Sunday, Dec.
18, for an early Christmas
dinner. Guests were Mr. and
Mrs. William Jones and
daughter Cheryl of Livonia
and Mr. and Mrs. Ben Jones
and children, Benji and Dan-
ielle.

The Warren Kelleys had
their family with them Mon-
day for Christmas dinner.
Guests were Mr. and Mrs.
Gary Kelley and two girls of
Otisville, Mr. and Mrs. David
Opal and two daughters and
Rev. and Mrs. Eldred Kelley
and two sons.

Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Tracy
had as guests Thursday eve-
ning, Mrs. Arvil Shields of
Marlette, Mrs. Tim Tracy
and two daughters of Vassar
and Beth and Ann Tracy. The
birthday of Mrs. Shields was
celebrated.

Eric Esau of Amherst,
Mass., and Miss Mary Beth
Esau of Ann Arbor came Dec.
21 to spend Christmas with
their parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Jack Esau, and Anne. Other
Christmas Day guests in the
Esau home were Mr. and
Mrs. Louis Striffler of De-
troit, Horace Croft of Ubly,
Mrs. Gertrude Falkenhagen,
Leonard Striffler, Mrs.
Esther Benkelman, Miss
Muriel Addison, Mrs. Fern
Maier, Miss Laura Maier and
Miss Katherine Crane.

Mr. and Mrs. James Mac-
Tavish returned home Mon-
day evening after spending a
few days with their daughter
and her family, Mr. and Mrs.
James Sting of Columbus,
Ind.

The Novesta Church of
Christ announces an all-state
Youth rally to be held Dec. 27,
28, 29 at the Elizabeth Lake
Church of Christ, Pontiac,
and a youth rally Dec. 30 at

Mrs. Hollis Seeley and
daughter Janis had as Christ-
mas Eve guests, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Seeley and four chil-
dren of Ubly, Mr. and Mrs.
Stanley Kirn and daughters,
Melinda and Kathy, and
Sherry 1 Seeley.

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Kirn
and daughters, Melinda and
Kathy, had as guests from
Saturday until Monday, his
mother, Mrs. Esther Kirn, of

the Great Lakes-Bible college — Chelsea -and his~sister,Miss-
at Lansing.

Pastor and Mrs. Harold
Prong and daughter Gaylene,
along with the pastor's father,
Gay Prong, and their son and
family, Mr. and Mrs. Roger
Prong and two sons of Waus-
eon, Ohio, had an early family
Christmas dinner Friday eve-
ning with Mr. and Mrs. Jeff
Prong at Lincoln Park. The
Roger Prongs leave Dec. 29
from Metropolitan Airport,
Detroit, for Chile where they
expect to be engaged in
missionary work for the next
three years.

Christmas Day guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Maynard Hel-
wig were: Mr. and Mrs.
Russell Parrish, Kimberly
and Kevin of Deford, Mrs.
Viola Little and granddaugh-
ter, Donna Little, Mr. and
Mrs. Dale Parrish, Jerold
Little and daughters, Carol,
Karen and Gail, Mr. and Mrs.
David Ware, Lisa and Mike
and Joe Howard, Mr. and
Mrs. Ronald Parrish, Mich-
elle and Richard and Mr. and
Mrs. Dale Mclntosh, Shannon
and Bryce.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Little
and family had as Christmas
guests Monday, Bob Atkin of
Mt. Morris, Mrs. Frances
Justin and Mark Atkin.

Mr. and Mrs. David Little
spent Christmas Day with her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Gene
Stauffer at Vicksburg.

Mr. and Mrs. Carmack
Smith were at Fenton from
Saturday until Monday to
spend Christmas with their
daughter and family, the Lyle
Wheelers.

Mrs. Ella Cumper spent
Tuesday at Marlette with
Edna Harris.

Christmas Day guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Holm
were Mr. and Mrs. Lyle
Zapfe, Mr. and Mrs. Roger
Root and children and Mrs.
Thelma Graham.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Zapfe
and daughters, Tammie and
Angela,, of Mayville, visited
his grandparents, Mr. and
Mrs. Lyle Zapfe, Tuesday
evening, Dec. 20.

Mrs. C.M. Wallace received
word last week of the death of
her sister-in-law, Mrs. James
Hurley of Alamosa, Colo.
Mrs. Hurley was the former
Hester McKim of Cass City.

Mrs. Ernest Croft spent
Christmas at Chesaning with
her daughter, Mrs. E.G. Bell,
and son Bob.

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Peasley
had an early Christmas din-
ner for their family Thursday
evening when Mr. and Mrs.
Ivan Paladi and children, Mr.
and Mrs. Ray Peasley and
children, Mr. and Mrs. Char-
les Peasley and children and
Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Zapfe were
guests.

Jim Wallace and son Ben-
nie of Midland, Cammie Wal-
lace of Bay City and Mr. and
Mrs. Duncan Wallace and son
of Sanford spent Christmas
with Mrs. C.M. Wallace.

Mrs. Lester Jersey of
Boyne City is spending the
holidays with her daughter
and son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs.
Charles Auten. Also home
with her parents for Christ-
mas was Miss Barbara Auten
of Kalamazoo, who came
Friday.

Mrs. Mary Kirton and Mrs.
Hazel Whitfield were Christ-
mas guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Fred Emigh and their daugh-
ter, Mrs. Lois Whitaker.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Mer-
chant were Christmas Day
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Grant
Merchant and children,
Aimee, Michael and Richard,
at Owendale. Joining them
for supper were Mr. and Mrs.
Larry Merchant and sons,
Mark and Kirt.

For Past Results
Try Chronicle

WANT ADS

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Grub-
er had with them for Christ-
mas, their daughter and fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. David
Graves and daughters, Jen-
nifer and Heather, of Isle of
Palms, S.C., and Mr. and
Mrs. Joe Merchant.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bolz of
Willis came Dec, IQ^and have
been visiting the Ivan Tracys.
Tuesday evening, the birth-
day of Mrs. Bolz was cele-
brated when supper guests in
the Tracy home were Mr. and
Mrs. Don Whittenburg of
Caro and Theo Hendrick.
Joining them in the evening
for cake and ice cream were
Mr. and Mrs. George Fisher
Sr., Sandra and Shelley
Frank, Mr. and Mrs. Douglas
O'Dell and Mr. and Mrs.
Duane O'Dell.

Marjorie Kirn of Flint.

Mr. and Mrs. M.B. Auten
had with them over the
Christmas week end, John
Starmann of Colon and Miss
Barbara Starmann of Ann
Arbor. Mr. and Mrs. Tom
Craig and Barbara joined
them Christmas Day.

Carl Lounsbury of Tulsa,
Okla., came Dec. 24 and is
spending two weeks with his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Leslie
Lounsbury. Also with the
Lounsburys for his Christmas
vacation is their grandson,
Donald Smith of Sault Ste.
Marie.

Christmas guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Tom Lounsbury and
baby Jacob Dec. 24 were Carl
Lounsbury of Tulsa, Okla.,
Mr. and Mrs. James Schad of
Clio, Mr. and Mrs. James
Schad Jr. and son Peter of
Flint, Mrs. Rosemary Boglar-
sky of Algonac and Mr. and
Mrs. Leslie Lounsbury.

Miss Mary Hanby of Union
Grove, Wis., came Dec. 17 to
visit her grandmother, Mrs.
Edith Ward, and other rela-
tives until Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew
Barnes Jr. and Andrea had
their family with them for
Christmas Day including Mr.
and Mrs. Mike Piereson and
sons, Brad and Scott, of
Ypsilanti, Mr. and Mrs. Dav-
id Barnes and children,
Bryan and Kimberly, of Bay
City, Mr. and Mrs. Tim
Barnes and Joshua of Kaw-
kawlin and Mr. and Mrs.
Gary Barnes.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Hendrick
had as Christmas guests, Mr.
and wfrs. Ray Hendrick and
daughter Luree of State Col-
lege,. Penn., Mr. and Mrs.
Randy Hendrick and son
Ryan of Waynesboro, Penn.,
Mr. and Mrs. Ron Hendrick
and Jennie of Columbus,
Ohio, Mr. and Mrs. Arlen
Hendrick and Lisa of Peck
and Mr. and Mrs. Dick Hend-
rick, Scott and Sue! Floyd
Wedge of Fife Lake was an
afternoon visitor.

Mr. and Mrs. Arlington
Gray of Decker and Mr. and
Mrs. Donald Schneider and
family spent the Christmas
holiday week end at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. Roger La-
Mothe and Joseph of Jackson.
Other guests were Mr. and
Mrs. Joseph LaMothe and
grandson of Sault Ste. Marie
and Miss Stella Smith of Jack-
son.

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Hend-
rick and son Ryan and Mr.
and Mrs. Raymond Hendrick
and daughter LuRee, all of
Pennsylvania, were Christ-
mas dinner guests Christmas
Eve at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Lee Smith. Other guests
were Mr. and Mrs. Fred
Smith, David and Kelly, of
Lapeer, Mr. and Mrs. Don
Smith and family and Mrs.
Doris Evens, of Cass City.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Ware
of Clarkston, Mrs. Martha
Clement, who lives in the
Tuscola County Medical Care
Facility, and Mr. and Mrs.
Stanley McArthur were
Christmas Day guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Leo Ware.

Hills and Dales
General Hospital
PATIENTS LISTED TUES-
DAY, DEC. 27, WERE:

James Pethers, Brian
Haley, Roberta Ryland, Mrs.
Ernest Schwaderer, William
Donnelly, Harvey McMullen,
Wilbur Morrison, Mrs.
Theresa Windy and Mrs.
Frank Demaray of Cass City;

Norman Smith of San-
dusky ;

Darlene Lamke of Ubly;
Deborah Botka and Mrs.

Lawrence O'Connell of Owen-
dale;

Mrs. Clarence Liversedge
of Caseville;

Alfred Lindeman of Sebe-
waing;

Mrs. Romaine VanHoost of
Unionville;

Mrs. Wilfred Smith of De-
ford;

Mrs. Harold Phelps of Snov-
er;

William Emery and Phillis
Crowe of Decker.

Mr. and Mrs. Otulakowski

Deborah Lynn Walter and
Eugene Michael Otulakowski
were united in marriage Sat-
urday, Nov. 19, at Salem
United Methodist church,
Cass City.

The Rev. Eldred Kelley
performed the double-ring
ceremony for the daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey J.
Walter and the son of Mr. and
Mrs. Eugene V. Otulakowski,
all of Cass City.

Mrs. Sue Opal was soloist
and sang, "The Wedding
Song", "Evergreen" and "In
This Quiet House." Rev. Kel-
ley sang "The Lord's Pray-
er". They were accompanied
on the organ by Mrs. Betty
Kirn.

Given in marriage by her
father, the bride wore a gown
of white dacron sheer over
taffeta wi th galoon Chan-
t i l ly lace in a pinafore fashion
bodice front and back. The
high Victorian neckline, long
sleeves and ruffle which ac-
cented the front and extended
to the back in apron fashion
were of Chantilly lace. A
large ruffle hem compli-
mented the long train. Her
long cathedral veil was edged
in matching Chantil ly lace
which hung from an open cap
headpiece. She carried a cas-
cade bouquet of white pom-
pon chrysanthemums with
two orchids in the center.

Miniature bride was Angela
Otulakowski, sister of the
groom. She wore an exact
copy of the bride's dress and
carried a miniature cascade
of flowers.

Maid of honor was Carol
Uppucue, a friend of the
bride. Bridesmaids were
Michele Male and Diane
Teichman, friends of the
bride, and Annie Lynn Cy-

bert, cousin of the bride.
Dianna Hutchinson, a friend
of the bride, was junior
bridesmaid.

Nicol Gubanche, niece of
the groom, was the flower
girl.

Rick Tuckey, friend of the
groom, was the best man.
Greg Bell, friend of the
groom, Steve Walter, brother
of the bride and Leon Lesz-
czynski, cousin of the groom,
were the groomsmen. Billy
Otulakowski, brother of the
groom, was the junior
groomsman.

Douglas Zugelmann, neph-
ew of the groom, was the ring
bearer.

Following the ceremony a
reception was held at the
Knights of Columbus Hall ,
Caro, for 400 guests.

The wedding tr ip was to
Niagara Falls and Toronto.

The couple will live at
Route 2,North Wheeler Road,
Snover.

Marriage Licenses
Gerald C. Allen, 25, Kings-

ton, and Dawn F. Waldorf, 34,
Kingston. •

Don L. Anger Jr., 21, Kings-
ton, and Deborah G. Town-
send, 19, Kingston.

Wayne D. Smcaton, 22,
Byron, and Laura L. Ewing,
21, Vassar.

Clare L. Kreger, 27, May-
vil le , and Carol Sue Dorian,
24, M i l l i n g l o n .

Ronald L. Trisch, 20, Caro,
and Deborah S. Koepf, 21,
Caro.

Life would be simple if
people were wil l ing to be
themselves.

Jhwl/oM

MONTH
QUANTITIES LIMITED

MARK V SCALE
Large foot area covered in washable vinyl. Matching
handle. Measurement in standard pounds or metric kilo-
grams. Capacity 270 lbs./120 kilograms in one pound/'/z
kilogram graduations. Choice of colors: white, gold,
chocolate brown.

No Lay-Aways On Item Of The Month

ALBEE (&^ HARDWARE
Cass City X^L"°*'"C sro«^X Phone 872-2270
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"If It Fitz..."
Spending "holiday money"

By Jim Fitzgerald

Notes for reading on a
loafing day after Christmas...

. . . For about 30 years, Roy
Bash has been playing Santa
Claus at the annual Christ-
mas party given for needy
kids at Most Holy Trinity
church. For the last five
years, the same little girl has
asked for the same thing. She
hasn't received it yet.

"But she still believes in
Santa Claus, and she must be
13 years old," reported Bash,
a retired newspaper photog-
rapher who now has his
offices in the Detroit Press
Club. He puts on the -Santa
suit every year to save the
church the cost of a pillow.

Maybe the little girl has
nothing else in which to

CASS CITY CfltfONlCLE
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AT CASS CITY, MICHIGAN
6552 Main Street

John Halra, publisher
National Advertising Representative,

Michigan Weekly Newspapers, Inc., 257
Michigan Avanue, East Lansing, Mich-
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Second class postage paid at Cass
City, Michigan 48726.
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Tuscola, Huron and Sanilac Counties,
$6.00 a year or 2 years lor $10.50. 3 years
for $15.00. .$3.50 lor six months and 3
months for $2.25.
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Payable in advance.

For Information regarding newspaper
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believe.
"I want my father home for

Christmas," she told Santa
again this year, and she
added that he is in Marquette,
in prison, for murder.

What did your kids get for
Christmas?

. . . My wife instructed me
to tell the world that she did
all of her Christmas shopping
in downtown Detroit, mostly
in Hudson's, and it was a
grand experience.

"I found everything I
wanted, the clerks were all
nice, and I appreciated being
able to spend holiday money
at Hudson's," she said,

"Is holiday money different
than the ordinary money you
usually spend?" I asked with
hope in my heart. "Do you get
it somewhere else except
from our checking account?"

"It's a Hudson service,"
Pat explained. "When you
spend holiday money there,
you don't get billed until
February."

That gives me all of Jan-
uary to pray that February
never comes.

. . . On one of those snowy
afternoons, Jim Morrison was
driving north on Telegraph,
trying to reach his home in
Rochester. The clogged traf-
fic finally stopped dead, and
not a wheel turned for 90

minutes.
"But southbound traffic

was thin and moving swiftly,
and I thought you'd like to
know what happened," Mor-
rison told me. "One of the
cars moving easily toward
Detroit slowed down and a
man stuck his head out the
window and hollered at all the
stuck suburbanites:

" 'Move back to the
cityeeeeee.' "

Amen. Nothing makes me
feel more smug than to walk
home from work in a snow-
storm, always moving stead-
ily forward, feeling; Tike Sgt.
Preston of the Mounties,
while the cars are not moving
at all.

"I like to stop for a couple of
drinks along the way," I
explained to my wife. "It is
fun to come out of the saloon
and see that the Chevrolets
and Cadillacs haven't moved
10 feet since I went in."

"Why don't you stop and get
a haircut?" she said.

She just doesn't understand
about adventure — and what
a man needs in his belly if he
must battle a blizzard, bent
low against the wind, to make
his way home to his marooned
wife.

On, you huskies.

LIBRARY ADDITION - Looking at some books on the
table inside the new addition at Rawson Memorial Library
Saturday was Jane Kenward of N. Dodge Road, Deford.

New addition opens
at Cass City library

Sound the trumpets!
Here comes another
New Year. We hope it
proves to be the best
one ever for you!

Clare and Jeannie

and all the staff

Pizza and Short Orders
7 Days A Week

Take Out — 872-4200

Serving Your Favorite Mixed Drinks

CHARMONT LANES
West Village Limits, Cass City

. . . Miss Joan Clifford of
Detroit is indignant that the
Top of the Flame restaurant,
on top of the Consolidated Gas
building, may close because
of poor business. She phoned
to ask me to do something
about it.

Miss Clifford said she eats
out almost every evening
because "I'm not a very good
cook." The Top of the Flame
is her favorite. "The food is
always delicious, the people
are nice and the view is
marvelous."

The Flame has been losing
business to the Summit, the
new revolving restaurant on
top of the Renaissance Cen-
ter. Miss Clifford has tried the
Summit and insists that the
food and the view ("too
high") aren't worth the has-
sle of getting there. The usual
wait for the elevator is a
bummer.

Miss Clifford may qualify
as an expert. She has been
eating in Detroit restaurants,
mostly in the downtown area,
for 22 years. So I don't
hesitate to furnish a platform
for her praise of the Top of the
Flame.

Besides, she sounded pretty
feisty, the type of person I like
to have on my side. I asked if
she would tell me her age.

"No," she said, "because I
don't look as old as I am."

I could tell that over the
phone.

The new addition at the
Rawson Memorial Library
opened Friday.

That isn't all that's new.
For the first time in its
history, the library will issue
library cards to persons tak-
ing out books.

And for persons who took
out books but didn't return
them when they were sup-
posed to, or still have them
past the return date, the
library in January will let
persons pay their fines at
half-price.

Construction of the 1,500-
square foot addition began
last June. It would have been
completed six weeks ago, had
it not been for a delay in
receipt of the carpeting. The
carpeting arrived last week
and the new room opened
Friday. There will be an
official opening in January.

At present, according to
librarian Barbara Hutchin-
son, the new room will be
used primarily as a study
area. When there are enough
books to warrant it, there is
plenty of space to install book
shelves.

Cost of the addition was
approximately $33,000, paid
for primarily by donations
contained in the wills of the
late Julia Murray and Dorus
Benkelman. There was also
some money left over from
the previous building fund.

Since the library opened in
1970, books have been
checked out by recording the
person's name on the book
card.

"Because we are getting as
large as we are," Mrs. Hutch-
inson explained, "our present
circulation system has be-
come inefficient."
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Date change
Starting in January, the

Gagetown Village Council
will begin meeting on the first
Thursday of each month at 7
p.m. instead of the first
Monday.

COMING! WORLD'S BIGGEST TRAVELING INDOOR CIRCUS

ELF KHURAFEH TEMPLE'S
34th ANNUAL

SAGINAW CIVIC CENTER
5 BIG DAYS 5

January 13-17,1978
TEN

Performances

ALL
NEW

PRODUCTION

Gigantic
Friday, Monday, Tuesday

4:00 and 8:15 P.M.
Saturday 2:15 and 7:30 P.M.
Sunday, 1:15 and 5:15 P.M.

Produced by L. N. FLECKLES

SAGINAW AREA'S
BIGGEST - BRIGHTEST — GRANDEST

MOST ELEGANT CIRCUS EVER
AS ALWAYS

GENERAL ADMISSION: ADULTS $3.00 Children and Students 14 and Under $1.50
RESERVED SEATS Adults and Children $4.00 & $4.50

TICKETS NOW ON SALE SAGINAW CIVIC CENTER BEGINNING DECEMBER 27th

RESERVE SOI COUPON - - - —-

Prices
$4.00
$4.50'

How Many Children [ How Many Adults | Which Day Mat. or Evening Total Cost

For Reserved Seafs Phone
Saginaw Civic Center

Box Office — 754-8431

Effective December 27, 1977

Address Mail Orders For Tickets To: Please Send Self-Addressed, Stamped Envelope Wilh Your Order
SHRINE CIRCUS OFFICE — P.O. BOX 3261 — SAGINAW, MICHIGAN 48605

FOR INFORMATION CALL 755-4881

Name -

Address

City _..

Upstairs at the Chronicle
office is a machine that has a
typewriter like keyboard,
stands about four feet high
and three feet wide and is a
real Dr. Jekyll and Mr. Hyde.

In its Dr. Jekyll phase it
spits out picture perfect type
in a variety of styles in more
than a dozen sizes.

When it becomes Mr. Hyde
it turns out ulcers in operat-
ors, compositors and publish-
ers. Especially publishers.

Right now it is Mr. Hyde. In
spades.

It all started innocently
enough. Just like the good

- Doctor Jekyll when he swal-
lowed that first draught. It
wasn't good, but it wasn't all
that bad either.

Our Mr. Hyde garbled a
little type once in a while but
corrected itself and went
winging on the way it has
since it arrived a year and a
half ago.

About a month ago it was
decided that the pampered
pet upstairs should undergo a
little preventive therapy.
Why wait for a serious mal-
function.

That little dandy needs a
special doctor and he com-
mands special prices. Or at
least the company he works
for does.

The charge is $36 per hour
portal to portal from wher-
ever these electronic "service
engineers" come from. Serv-
ice engineer is what the com-
pany calls them. How could
you call them computer
repairmen at those rates?
Anyway, it takes them from
two to four hours to get here
and whatever time it takes to
come it's assumed that it
takes that long to get back. To
make a long story short (but
not so sweet) it costs about
$125 to get them to the office
to start work.

The trouble is that little
blue monster upstairs is full
of tricks. When the visiting
expert is working it's on its
best behavior. Spitting out
lines like you wouldn't be-
lieve.

That lasts until the expert
has packed his fancy gauges
and put away his tools and
departed for the next sick
machine.

When it's time for it to go '
back to work, it almost im-
mediately enters its Mr. Hyde
stage again . . . only worse
than before. •

The machine's dual career
started in November and
continues and continues. In-
cluding the call last Friday,
there have been nine different
service engineers here put-
ting in new parts like they are
going out of style.

I shouldn't make this ap-
pear worse than it really is.
I'm sure that the company
will make some allowance for
repairmen who didn't repair
when they send the bi l l .

The machine that preceded
the monster gave us very
few problems in nearly 10
years. At times like these it's
tempting to take it out of moth
balls.

It was a very simple ma-
chine. In comparison it was
also a very slow production
machine.

So like it or not, there is no
way we can do without the
blue monster.

Like the rest of society we
are chained to the computer.
That's not so bad. What is (as
you can see) is that we are
chained to the computer re-
pairman, too.

9430OOO0CXSOOOB0

For that reason, from now
on, when a person checks out
a library book, he or she will
be issued a library card, to be
shown in the future when
borrowing books. The cards
will be free.

Children can get their own
cards or use that of their
parents.

In an effort to cut down on
the number of outstanding
overdue book fines, and get
back overdue books, fines can
be paid in January at "half
price."

Mrs. Hutchinson hasn't
totaled the amount of fines
due to the library, but the
number of cards -- one fine
per card -- is a couple of
inches thick. That's for books
that were returned late, pre-
sumably into the outside book
drop, without the borrower
paying the fine.

The overdue book card file
is another couple of inches
thick.

The fines range from a
comparatively few cents to
$5-6, according to the librar-
ian. Fines are 2 cents per day
for most items; 5 cents a day
for 7-day books.

The library has one new
piece of equipment, a study
carrel for patrons listening to
the record player or cassette
player.

Phone worker

takes course
Verna May MacRae of Cass

City, business accounts rep-
resentative for General Tele-
phone in Davison, recently
completed an eight-day
course at the company's
training center in Muskegon.

The course is designed to
provide business account rep-
resentatives with the basic
knowledge required to effi-
ciently handle business con-
tacts. Included was training
in handling and interpreting
office records, alphabetical
and classified directory list-
ings, and billing.

Mrs. MacRae and her hus-
band Calvin live on N. Seeger
St.

She has been with the
company for 17 years.

ay good lucfe, happiness and
prosperity come to your house to
stay every moment of the New YearJ

i

VILLAGE SERVICE CENTER!
Bob - Jerry - Shirley - Gary - Bill

Phil - Durrell
Cass City
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Rabbit Tracks

By John Haire

(And anyone else he can

get to help)
:::::::::::̂ ^̂

No matter what the season Mrs. Martha Harbec reports
that someone is using a holiday wreath that formerly was
placed on parents' grave in Elkland Township Cemetery.
Also taken from one of the graves was a pine tree, suitable
as a Christmas tree.

And a merry Christmas to you, too, Scrooge.

**********

It brightens the season to see the Rev. and Mrs. Melvin
R. Vender out and about together.

Mel doesn't,hear so well and a cane is used but that's
nothing considering their ages. He retired as full time
minister of First Presbyterian Church in 1958.

**********

Idle note: The next time this country's most well-known
razor blade company comes out with a new "advancement"
in blade technology I'm going to stock up. It seems to me
that when a new campaign starts these blades last and last
and last. Lots of good shaves.

Then after the introductory period they only seem good
for two or three shaves before becoming too dull to use.

**********

New Year's resolutions: (Sure to be broken). To write this
trivia on the week end instead of busy Monday or Tuesday.
To lose weight and keep it off. To spend more time fishing.
To not get excited at basketball games. Ditto, track meets.

To learn to eat spinach, broccoli, squash. (I almost said par-
snips, but one can aim only so high).

To play more golf. To play better golf. To walk more for
exercise. To not complain when it's hot. To not complain
when it's cold. To read more good books. To not complain about
TV commercials or programs. To enjoy each day for what
that day brings. To be thankful for health and peace that
now reigns.

**********

Phil Keating starts off the new year with an offer that I
couldn't refuse. In this week's paper comes the Chronicle's
annual First Baby Contest.

Sponsors pay $7.50 for the advertising and offer a prize
for the first arrival. The Pinney State Bank is offering a $25
savings bond.

It was part of a deal. If we don't charge the bank for the
ad, says Phil, we'll boost the amount from $5 to $25.

**********

Another reminder to all advertisers and contributors.
Monday is another holiday and the same early deadlines
are in effect for another week. Thanks for your cooperation.

Professional and Business

DR. W. S. SELBY
OPTOMETRIST

Hours: 8-5 except Thursday
8-12 noon on Saturday

4624 Hill St.
Across from Hills and Dales

Hospital

Phone 872-3404

Alien Witherspoon
New England Life
NEL Growth Fund
NEL Equity Fund

Value Line Fund-Keystone
Funds

Phone 872-2321
4615 Oak St. Cass City

Or. E. Paul Lockwpod
Chiropractic Physician

Office Hours:
Won., Tues., Wed., Fri.

9-12 noon and 1:30-5:00 p.m.
Saturday 9-12 a.m.

Closed All Day Thursday
Phone 872-2765 Cass City

For Appointment

Harold T. Donahue,
M.D.

Physician & Surgeon
CLINIC

4674 Hill St., Cass City

Office 872-2323 • Res. 872-2311

K. I. MacRAE, D. 0.

Osteopathic Physician
and Surgeon

Corner Church and Oak Streets
Office 872-2880 • Res. 872-3365

DO YOU HAVE A
DRINKING PROBLEM?

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS
and AL-ANON

Every Friday Evening - 8:00 p.m.
Good Shepherd Lutheran
Church, Cass City

Efren M. Dizon, M.D,
PerlaA. Espino, M.D.

Diplomates of the American
Board of Pediatrics

(Practice limited to Infants
and Children)

4674 Hill St.
Cass City, Mich. 48726

(Across from Hills & Dales
Hospital)

Phone 517-872-4384

Hoon K. Jeung, M.D.
General Surgery

9a.m.-5p.m. daily
Saturday-9 to 12 noon

Office Hours by Appointment
Phone 872*1611

4672 Hill St.
Cass City, Mich. 48726

Home 872-3138

Harris-Hampshire
Agency, Inc.

Complete Insurance Services

6815 E. Cass City Road
Cass City, Michigan

Phone 872-2688

RICHARD A. HALL, D.O.

Osteopathic Physician

4672 Hill Street
Cass City, Michigan

Office 872-4725 - Home 872-4762

Edward Scollon,
D.V.M.

Veterinarian
Call For Appointment

For Small Animals
Phone 872-2935

4849 N. Seeger St., Cass City

James Ballard, M.D.
Office at 4530 Weaver Street

Hours: 10:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon
2:00 p.m. to 4:30 p.m.

Daily except Thursday after-
noon

Harry CrandeJJ, Jr.
D.V.M.

Office 4438 South Seeger St.
Phone 872-2255

Saib A. Isterabadi, M.D.
4674 Hill Street

Cass City, Michigan 48726

General Surgeon
Thoracic and

Cardiovascular Surgeon

Office Hours: Thursday after-
noon 1 -5 p.m.

Phone 872-2323

Dr. J.H. Geissinger
Chiropractor

Won., Tues., Thurs,, Fri.
9-12 noon and 2-6 p.m.

Sat. 9-12 noon

21 N. Aimer, Caro', Michigan

Across from IGA Store
Phone Caro 673-4464
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KRITZMANS' ANNUAL

FAMILY

COAT &
JACKET

NOTICE
All

Christinas
Gift

Exchanges

Should be

completed

on or

before

Jan. 11978
Thank You

• MEN'S

•WOMEN'S

•BOYS'
•GIRLS

• INFANTS
SNOWSUITS

Women's and Girls'

SNOW
BOOTS

OneGroup

Men's Leather

BOOTS
&

SHOES
Leather

Fleece Lined

Women's Winter

DRESS
One Large Group
With Big, Big, Big

PRICE
REDUCTIONS

Hurry For Best Selection

Boys' Long Sleeve

DRESS
SHIRTS

Fancy

and Plain

Knit Shi

One Large Group

25" OFF
master charge

THE INTERBANK CARD
KRITZMANS; INC.

PHONE 872-3470

HEALTH TIPS

Frostbite always
a winter hazard

By Frank Chappell, American Medical Association

Cold weather is back again
and with it come the health
hazards that accompany sub-
freezing temperatures. An
ever present winter danger in
most of the United States is
frostbite.

Frostbite is, naturally,
more of a problem in the
northern states, but even in
most of the south there are
occasional periods of weather
cold enough -to- nip—unpro-
tected noses and cheeks.

The American Medical As-
sociation points out that frost-
bite can be very painful , can
result in amputations, and
can leave the vict im hyper-
sensitive to cold for the rest of
his or her l i fe .

In some ways the damage
of frostbite is similar to a
burn. Injuries to both deep
and shallow tissue are com-
parable. First degree frost-
bite, like sunburn, is an injury
to surface skin. It is l ikely to
attack ears, toes, fingers,
cheeks or nose. Second de-
gree frostbite produces blis-
ters as in second degree
burns. In third degree frost-
bite the damage is deep and
much of the frozen part may
be lost.

Prevention is the best pro-
tection. This means being
properly dressed in warm
clothing, waterproof shoes,
and heavy, dry socks, with
good covering for head and
ears. Keep clothing dry from
both outside moisture and
perspiration, and avoid tight
clothing or garters that may
restrict circulat ion.

Motorists traveling across
country in subfreezing weath-
er are advised to have heavy
clothing and shoes in the car,
in the event of a breakdown
and a necessary hike for help.
If your auto is stalled in snow
or ice some distance from
help, it may be safer to stay
in the car than to walk a long
distance in extreme cold in
light clothing.

The first signs of frostbite
are "pins and needles" prick-
ly feeling, and then numb-
ness. The affected part will
turn white or grey and later
red. Groups such as the
military often use the buddy,
system 'outdoors in severe
weather. Each ''"' buddy
watches the other's face for

Snover Lions
celebrate 20th
anniversary

Charter night for the 20th
anniversary of the Snover
Lions Club was held Wednes-
day, Dec. 14, with a turkey
dinner served by the Snover
Rebekah Lodge ladies at the
Snover IOOF Hall.

Twenty-four attended, con-
sisting of Lions members and
their wives and guests, Mr.
and Mrs. Wayne Ziegelmann
of Snover, and Mr. and Mrs.
Emerson Vatter, Sandusky.

Emerson Vatter, represent-
ing the sponsoring club, the
Sandusky Lions, spoke of the
20th anniversary and the 20-
year veterans, Winston Dor-
man and D.B. Duckwitz. He
showed slides of the Vatter
family's flower garden and
pictures of the Snover Old
Timers.

signs of frostbite.
First aid possibilities are

limited. Thawing of the tissue
as soon as possible is the first
consideration. This can best
be accomplished by getting
indoors into a warm room.
Treat the frozen part gently
and do not rub or massage it.
The old technique of rubbing
snow or ice water on the
frozen spot does more harm

" t h a n good by~delaying~thaw-~
ing.

Medical treatment is
needed promptly. Control of
the severe pain is required,
and antibiotics and antitet-
anus injections may be
needed if the skin is broken.
Often the frozen skin will
eventually crumble and fall
off.

Singles club
plans January
dances

The Tip of the Thumb
Singles Club held its monthly
business meeting at the home
of Agnes Schultz Dec. 19. Six
members were present.

The music for the dance
Jan. 7 will be furnished by
Pat's band. The Harmony
Knights wi l l provide the
music for the Guest Night
dance Jan. 21 where married
couples are invited to come as
guests of their single friends.
The dances are open to all
single, widowed and divorced
persons 25 years and older.
They are held at the First
United Methodist church gym
in Bad Axe, starting at 8:30
p.m.

Leonard Goretski and Ann
Forsyth were appointed to
make plans for the first
annual election of officers.

The date and place for the
January business meeting
will be announced at a later
date.

Wisdom is uncommon be-
cause it involves some com-
mon sense.

WE'VE LOWERED
THE COST OF
CARPET CLEANING

m&B Hsw* n

CARPET CLEANING
SYSTEM AT NEW

LOWER
RATES

Do-H-yoursell
and get professional
results

S39 9 -4 Hours

GAMBLE STORE
CassCity

the
New Year bring
abiding Peace and
harmony. It is with
sincere thanks we exten
our best wishes to everyone.

MUTUAL
SAVINGS

CassCity
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The weather
High

Wednesday 29
Thursday 34
Friday 42
Saturday ....38
Sunday 22 ,
Monday 22

Precip.
. . . .26
. . . .02

0
0

... .07
0

Tuesday 26 . . . . -2 trace

(Recorded at Cass City wastewater treatment plant)

Low.
. .14 .
..18 .
..16
..12
. . -4 .
.4

CASS CASS
CITY

Thursday thru New Year's Eve
— Dec. 29 -30 -31
EXCLUSIVE THUMB PREMIERE
Thursday - All Seats $1.00 - 8:00 Only

Fri.-Sat. Evening - 7:30 & 9:30

JAN-MICHAEL VINCEN

CHRISTMAS CONCERT - The Cass City High School con-
cert band performed its annual Christmas concert last
Thursday night in the high school gym, under the baton of
George Bushong. The concert band's performance was pre-
ceded by that of the seventh and eighth grade bands.

Arrest Gustincic after

fraud of banks unveiled

MIHCHIWFOXIWSWS MHWffllAUEY

New Year's Day and Monday
Jan. 1-2

EXCLUSIVE THUMB PREMIERE
Alan Arkin and Rob Reiner

The Fikus Family:
They're Not Roasted.

They're Not Salted.
They're just

Plain Nuts.

Coming Thursday Jan. 5
Sissy Spacek (Star of "Carrie")

The Want Ads Are Newsy Too!

A scheme to defraud banks
in seven counties, including
the Pinney State Bank in Cass
City, ended with the arrest of
two men in Caro last week.

The scheme consisted of
opening a small savings ac-
count at a bank. About a week
later, the subject who opened
the account returns to deposit
a forged cashier's check,
usually for about $18,000.

The following day, before
the check is verified, the
subject returns and with-
draws about $4,000, leaving
the majority of funds to avoid
suspicion.

Charged in Tuscola county
with uttering and publishing a
forged instrument is John C.
Gustincic, 31, of Croswell. He
was arraigned Friday before
District Judge Richard F.
Kern, who set bond at $32,000.
A pre-preliminary examina-
tion was held this Tuesday,
with the preliminary exam
scheduled Jan. 6. As of Tues-
day, he was still in the county
jail.

Arrested along with Gustin-
cic was Roger F. Glenn, 36, of
Jeddo, who was charged with
conspiracy to utter and pub-
lish a forged instrument.
Bond for him was set Friday
at $30,000, which he posted
later that day. The prelimi-
nary examination was sched-
uled Jan. 13.

Following his arrest, Glenn
was turned over to authorities
in Lapeer county, where he
was arraigned in district
court on two counts of utter-
ing and publishing, each
count involving a different
bank there. Bond was set at
$5,000 on each count, which he
posted. The preliminary ex-

NEW YEAR'S EVE

GALA AFFAIR

SHERWOOD ON THE HILL
GAGETOWN

SATURDAY. DEC. 31
9 P-m-

35 Couple Includes
Buffet Dinner and Dancing

All Cocktails and Beer, Party Favors

Champagne Toast at Midnight

Continental Breakfast

CALL 665-9971
FOR TICKETS and INFORMATION

animation was scheduled
Feb. 2.

The charges in Lapeer were
in connection with the de-
frauding of two banks there
the previous week of about
$8-10,000.

After his court appearance
there, Glenn was returned to
Caro for arraignment.

Warrants were issued Tues-
day afternoon by the Huron
county prosecutor's office
charging Gustincic with one
count each of forgery and
uttering and publishing.

Glenn was charged with
those counts plus a third of
conspiracy to utter and pub-
lish.

All of the charges were in
connection with the deposit of
the forged cashier's check at
the First National Bank in
Bad Axe.

As Glenn is free on bond,
Prosecutor Peter B. Capling
said, he will have to be
arrested by police.

In Sanilac county, Assistant
Prosecutor Philip E. Loma-
son said his office has not
been contacted yet by any
police agency about possibly
issuing any warrants in the
case.

An alert assistant vice-
president at the First Nation-
al Bank of Bad Axe, Vera
Cook, was suspicious of a
cashier's check deposited by
one of the two men and that
led to their downfall.

She checked with the sup-
posed issuing bank in Elk-
hart, Ind., was told it was a
forgery, and then notified the
state police post in Bad Axe.

Detectives from the Caro,
Lapeer, and Bay City state
police posts, plus state troop-
ers, Huron sheriff's deputies,
and police in Bad Axe, Ubly,
and Caro were then brought
into the case. Since the arrest
of the two men, the Federal
Bureau of Investigation has
also been brought in.

In addition to the Bad Axe
bank, investigators found ac-
counts had been opened, and
at some, cashiers' checks
deposited, at the following
banks:

State Savings Bank of
Caro; Pinney State Bank;
Thumb National Bank and
Trust, Pigeon; State Bank of
Port Hope; Huron County
Bank, Harbor Beach; Com-
munity Bank branch, Ubly;
Exchange State Bank, Car-
sonville branch; Wolverine
State Bank, Sandusky, and
Sanilac County Bank, Decker-
ville.

In banks where it was
immediately determined
cashier's checks were depos-
ited, the total amounts depos-
ited in each bank (original
deposit plus cashier's check)
ranged from $17,778 to
$19,318.

Detective Sgt. Milton Wol-
ner of the Caro post was
notified by Lt. Leo T. Sieting,
the Bad Axe post command-
er, about the possible fraud
late Tuesday afternoon. The
banks were closed by then, so
Wolner telephoned local bank
presidents at home.

Wednesday morning, a
State Savings Bank official in
Caro checked new savings
deposits and found one of the
forged checks. When he was
on the phone with the Caro
state police post, one of the
suspects came into the bank
and attempted to make a
withdrawal.

Nearby Caro village police
moved in and made the
arrest. Arrested was Gustin-
cic, who was using the alias of
Donald W. Sparr of Saginaw
when apprehended.

Glenn, thought to be the
mastermind of the scheme,
was arrested nearby, sitting
in a parked station wagon
belonging to Gustincic.

Also Wednesday morning,
officers staked out some
banks in Huron and Sanilac
counties.

An official at the Pinney
State Bank said the two men
were arrested before one of
them tried to withdraw any
money from the account
opened at the bank.

According to state police,
Glenn is similar in appear-
ance to a man who committed
similar fraud at banks in
Detroit, Chesaning, and Flint.

E m
STRAND - CARO

Phone: 673-3033

Don't Forget.... Two Will Be Admitted For $2.00
On Monday Night!! Come and Save
to***************************************

Friday thru Thursday Dec. 30-Jan. 5
Continuous New Year's Day from 4:30

mm
Sometimes when you reach for a dream

you have to leave something behind.

A Columbia Pictures Release o C

Ubly area
woman dies
in crash

A 69-year-old Ubly area
woman was killed
Wednesday, Dec. 21, .in a
collision 6Vfe miles northeast
of Ubly.

Dead is Agnes F. Palach, a
passenger in a car driven by
her husband, Xavier, 73. He
was reported in fair condition
Tuesday at Huron Memorial
Hospital in Bad Axe.

Bad Axe state police re-
ported the Palach auto was
northbound on MacDonald
Road, where it collided with
the pickup truck of James
E. McGee, 33, of Bad Axe,
who was westbound on Purdy
Rd. Troopers said the pickup
struck the passenger side door
of the car.

Services for Mrs. Palach
were held Saturday morning
from St. Mary's Catholic
Church in Parisville, Father
Stanley Surman of-
ficiating. Burial was in the
church cemetery.

Mrs. Palach was the 13th
traffic fatality in Huron
County this year.

OTHER ACCIDENTS

Maureen E. Cosway, 29, of
Wilcox Road, Deford, struck
a deer at 6:40 a.m. Friday
while eastbound on Sevens
Road, west of Phillips Road,
according to sheriff's
deputies.

At 11:15 a.m. on the 20th,
John R. Slater, 36, of Davison,
was eastbound on M-81, east
of Kurds Corner Road. He
told deputies an oncoming
vehicle crossed the center-
line. He swerved toward the
middle of the road and when
he turned back into his lane,
he lost control. The car went
off the south side of the road
and struck a sign.

Wednesday, Dec. 21, ac-
cording to deputies, Roger D.
•Dibble, 23, of Caro, struck a
deer while westbound on Bev-
ens Road, east of English
Road.

Thursday, Dec. 22, accord-
ing to Cass City police, a car
driven by Susan Asher, 17, of
6681 Third Street, backed into
the car of Barbara Hendrick,
40, of 5054 Green Road, who
was northbound in a lane at
the Cass City High School
parking lot. The accident
occurred at 3:30 p.m.

Sunday, village police re-
ported, Susan K. Happen of
4297 Ale Street backed out of
her driveway into a car
parked hy the curb opposite
the driveway.

Thursday, Dec. 22, accord-
ing to Cass City police, Rich-
ard L. Vaughan, 24, of Caro,
struck a deer while north-
bound on Cemetery Road,
north of Kelly Road.

PEDALING AROUND

Teaching

birth control
By Mike Eliasohn

As described in these pages
last week, as soon as the state
prepares the official guide-
lines, teaching about birth
control will be legal in Mich-
igan schools,

As also reported, area
school superintendents don't
intend to propose that such a
subject be taught unless par-
ents first ask for it.

I-hope someone in each
school district will have the
courage to propose that the
topic be taught. That will at
least let the debate get
started, as opposed to no
debate at all.

I further hope that when the
debate is over, the decision
will be that teenagers should
have access to birth control
information if they and their
parents so desire.

A careful examination of
the new law shows that it is
not as "bad" as some might
think.

The important thing to re-
member is that courses in-
cluding the subject of birth
control, if offered by a dis-
trict, cannot be compulsory.
Parents or students can re-
quest that they (the students)
be exempted.

Another thing to remember
is that such a course isn't
going to be just about birth
control.

The law pertaining to the
teaching of birth control al-
lows it as a subject in courses
of "sex education, including
family planning, human sex-
uality, and the emotional,
physical, psychological, hy-
genic, economic and social
aspects of family life." Also
allowable is the teaching of
reproductive health ("the re-
productive system and its
physiological, psychological,
and endocrinological func-
tions") and "the recognition,
prevention, and treatment of
venereal disease."

Conceivably, birth control
and the other topics could be
included in a course which
might be called "family life"
or "preparation for mar-
riage."

In such courses in some
schools, boys and girls pair
off at the beginning of the
semester and get "married".
(Not for real, of course)
As "married" couples, they
study such topics as prepar-
ing for the wedding, family
insurance , buying a house,

living on a budget, having and
raising children, divorce and
death. In other words, a
course that teaches that mar-
riage (and these days, also
living together without bene-
fit of matrimony) isn't all
"love and kisses."

Teaching about birth con-
trol and reproductive health
would fit naturally in such a
course. Hopefully, iLwill show,
that the responsibility of not
having babies, if that is the
intent of the couple involved,
lies partially with the male
partner, not just with the
female.

Such a course certainly
isn't going to put a stop to
teenage pregnancy. Presum-
ably the course would be
taught in high school. As

-reported last week, girls as
young as 14 have been en-
rolled in the Tuscola Inter-
mediate School District alter-
native school program for
pregnant students. Such a
course would have come too
late for them.

Secondly, if a teenage
couple is going to engage in
sex, if they want to use con-
traceptives, they have to be
able to get them, which may
not be easy.

Thirdly, even if they know
about birth control and can
get the contraceptives, the
couple may not want to use
them.

Planned Parenthood esti-
mates that nationally, 34.9
per cent of all girls ages 15-19
had had sexual intercourse,
with the average age for the
first such experience 16 years
and 2 months. (There are no
equivalent figures for boys.)

The figures may or may not
be correct. The point is that
many teenagers are going to
engage in sexual conduct no
matter what their parents'
moral beliefs.

And if teenagers are going
to do so, I feel using birth
control is a preferable alter-
native to girls having babies
who are not ready for mother-
hood.

FORMAL WEAR

Chopper's
Men's Wear and

Formal Wear Rental

Phone 872-3431

Curiosity is like fire—it can
be either helpful or harmful.

THE LARGEST DISPLAY OF FIREPLACES,
COAL and WOOD HEATERS IN NORTHEASTERN

MICHIGAN IS AT

LEISURE LIVING
350 Divided Highway M-15, 2 miles S. of Center (M-25)
Bay City, Closed Sunday and Monday • (517) 892-7212

OFF
Now Thru

December 31

ON ALL

CHRISTMAS DECORATIONS

price

25% OFF
on all

TOYS
in stock

Sale ends
December 31

ro

ALBEE
Cass City

HARDWARE
Phone 872-2270
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/e're so lucky to have you as our friends! We

resolve to serve you better than ever in the coming

New Year. Hope it's happy!

Rolling Hills Golf Course
and Airport

Grant and Mary Hutchinson
Cass City

Marie Gremel gets
Holstein dairy award
Marie Gremel was the re-

cipient of the Holstein Associ-
ation award for being the
outstanding girl involved in
the dairy industry at the Dec.
14 Huron County All-Dairy
Organization banquet.

The daughter of Mr. and
Mrs. Harold Gremel Jr. of

Owen-Gage
names student
of the month

Sherrie Hoffman has been
named~Novemberstudent of
the month at Owen-Gage High
School by the student of the
month committee.

She has a 3.243 grade point
average, is editor of the Bull-
dog Star, and past editor of
the yearbook.

She is interested in X-ray
technology and plans to at-
tend Ferris State College in
Big Rapids.

Miss Hoffman is a senior
taking five classes in trigo-
nometry, office help, typing I,
government, and accounting.
She was in the junior and
senior plays and two all-
school plays, and is vice-pres-
ident of the National Honor
Society.

Sebewaing, she is a senior at
Owen-Gage High School.

About 200 persons attended
the annual event, held in the
Farm Bureau Building at Bad
Axe.

Mrs. Mary Jean Voelker
accepted a special $50 award
in memory of her late hus-
band from the Michigan Ani-
mal Breeders Cooperative.

The money will be placed in
the Kenneth Voelker Scholar-
ship Fund, to be presented to
a dairy student at Michigan
State University.

Voelker, a well-known
dairyman, was killed in a
traff ic accident in Ohio in

.June. „...- _
Dairy Herd Improvement

Association Awards were pre-
sented for the 36 top herds in
milking production in 1977.

Among those receiving pro-
duction awards based on
DHIA records were Henry
Osentoski, Ubly, 18,254
pounds; Dblan and Larry
Sweeney, Ubly, 17,892; Leon-
ard Briolat, Ubly, 17,461, and
Gerald Elenbaum, Owendale
16,757.

Among those receiving
DHIA awards based on owner
sampler records were Roger
Fritz, Owendale, 16,257
pounds, and Howard Tough,
Ublv, 16,151.

Shabbona Area News
Marie Meredith

Phone 672-9489

Provincial House held its
Christmas party Wednesday
afternoon, Dec. 21. The Dor-
man Sisters sang as part of
the program. They also
helped serve along with Mrs.
Don Smith and Mrs. Ryerson
Puterbaugh.

PIONEER GROUP

The Pioneer Group held a
chicken dinner Thursday,
Dec. 22, at the RLDS church
annex. Mrs. Fred Emigh
conducted a short business
meeting. Roll call was an-

• swered"with 30 present, A
short program was held.

The next meeting will be
Jan. 26 at the RLDS annex.

Mr. and Mrs. Vincent Vat-
ters and daughter of Cadillac
visited his mother, Mrs. John
Vatters, Tuesday afternoon at
the home of Mrs. Nelin Rich-
ardson.

EXTENSION

The Shabbona Extension
Group held its Christmas
party at the home of Mrs. Jim
Mclntosh Monday evening,
Dec. 19.

CLEARANCE EVENT
AT WOOD'SIT'S BEEN A GOOD YEAR. WE

HAVE HAD LOTS OF SALES AND
A GOOD HOLIDAY SEASON
BUT WE HAVE SOME THINGS
LEFT FROM SPECIAL SALES,
PURCHASES AND ITEMS WE
THOUGHT YOU'D LIKE, BUT

SEASONAL CAo/
CLEARANCE ITEMS 50% OFF
• Gift Wrap • Ribbons and Tags

• Boxed Cards • Candles - Rings - Bases
• Tinsel and Garland • Decorations

• Strings Lights 20-35 and 50's
• Outdoor Replacement Bulbs

CHRISTMAS CANDY . A o/

SPECIALTY ITEMS JV /O

FRUIT CAKES, PEANUT BRITTLE
AND RIBBON CANDY

OFF

of<

SALE! ODDS ond ENDS
• Toffee Tins
• Hand Woven Baskets
• Snack Caddy
• Fruit Juicer
• Utility Trays
• Coaster Sets
• Garage Sale Kits
• Dozens of Kitchen Aids
• Seal-A-Meal Refills
• Folding Luggage Carts
• Plant Hangers & Pots

• Heavy Duty Aluminum
Pans 6 Styles

• Wine Racks
• Many More Things-1 &2 of a kind

ALL PRICED 50% OFF TO
CLEAR-WELL BELOW COST

50
o/.
/w

OFF

COSMETIC - A

GIFT SETS ?U
For Men and Women

• Jean Nate • Golden Soverign

• Roman Brio • Black Tie

• Skin Bracer • Old Spice

• Warm Woods and Teak

• Canoe
• Ondine

• Chem'ere

• Much More

HEALTH
EXERCISERS
50% OFF

Jump Ropes

Stretchers
For Trimming

Exercisers

°isneV

WATCHES 30 %
OFF

LARGE SELECTIONMEMO BOARDS 3S.yles 25 % off

PICTURES AND FRAMES JEWELRY
ONE-HALF PRICE

PANTY HOSE - NYLONS - KNEE-HI's

BIG
SELECTION

GLOVES - HATS
AND PURSES
SELECTION CAMERAS . A o/

PROJECTORS, ETC. TO 3U /O OFF

1/2 PRICE
- ,
71

Kim Christmas
Centerpieces

All Season
Centerpieces

CftO/
3 " /

O/
/O

OCCT\Jt*

Digital Alarms

$-|288
Reg.
17.95

MUCH MORE ON

YEAR-END
CLEARANCE

SHORTODAY FOR

GREAT SAVINGS

OLD WOOD DRUG
HAS MORE OF WHAT YOU'RE LOOKING FOR

On The Corner Cass City

TOYS
Large Selection
One-Half Price

SAVE

50°/cO

The welcome was extended
by Miss Marie Meredith, vice-
chairman. The flag pledge
was repeated in unison, led by
Mrs. William Jones. The Wo-
men's Creed was also re-
peated in unison. Roll call
was answered by a poem.

There were 14 members
and three visitors present.
The secretary's and treasur-
er's reports were given by
Mrs. Bob Burns. Plans were
made to take cookies to the
Christmas party at Provin-
cial House, Cass City.

Secret friends were re-
vealed and -a—new—name--
drawn for another year. Rec-
reation was in charge of Mrs.
Jones and Mrs. Clair Aus-
lander.

Lunch was served by the
hostess.

The next meeting will be
Jan. 23 with Mrs. Arlie Gray.
The lesson on Heart will be
presented by Mrs. Bob Burns
and Mrs. Mclntosh.

DELAYED NEWS

Mr. and Mrs. John Fleming
and daughters were Saturday
guests of the former's sister,
Mrs. John Pickett and family
of Waterford.

UNITED METHODIST
WOMEN

The Shabbona United Meth-
odist Women held their
Christmas party Wednesday
evening, Dec. 14, with Mrs.
Arlie Gray.

Mrs. Bob Bader, chairman
greeted the 24 members and
one visitor. A date to remem-
ber is Iva Mae Hildinger's
birthday, Jan. 1.

Mrs. Jim Mclntosh gave a
missionary report on the life
of Dr. Donald Mclntyre. Mrs.
John Tatgenhorst read a
Christmas article, Mrs. Mary
Vatter'spoem, "I Love You."
Mrs. Gray read the Christ-
mas story from the Bible.

Mrs. Paul Rockwell and
Mrs. Russell Smith presented
the lesson, "His Name Shall
be Called Wonderful." Secret
Sisters were revealed and
new names drawn for another
year. The group will donate
their Christmas card money
to the Mathewson family, who
lost their home by fire. The
roll call was answered by the
most unusual Christmas gift
you ever received.

The Jan. 11 meeting will be
with Mrs. Russell Smith. The
lesson will be by Mrs. Bob
Bader.

Mrs. Carl Gibbard Sr. and
son, Carl Jr., were Monday
afternoon callers of Mr. and
Mrs. Andy Hoagg.

WOMEN'S DEPARTMENT

The RLDS Women's De-
partment met Thursday eve-
ning, Dec. 15, with Mrs.
Ryerson Puterbaugh.

Greetings were extended by
Mrs. Don Smith, women's
leader. The worship service
was in charge of Mrs. Smith.
Invocation was offered by
Mrs. Howard Gregg. Read-
ings by Mrs. Bruce Kritzman
and Mrs. Dean Smith. A short
play by Mrs. Jim Doerr and
Mrs. Kritzman.

A short business meeting
was held. The group voted to

November
milk output
increases
November milk production

in the state of 388 million
pounds was up four per cent
from a year earlier, accord-
ing to the Michigan Crop
Reporting Service.

The 404,000 cows, the same
as a year earlier, gave an
average of 960 pounds, an
increase of 40 pounds from
November, 1976, and up 95
pounds from two years ago.

National milk production of
almost 9.5 billion pounds in
November was 2.9 per cent
higher than a year earlier and
7.5 per cent more than two
years ago.

Production per cow aver-
aged 866 pounds, 30 pounds
more than a year earlier and
69 pounds more than two
years ago. The nation's dairy
herd numbered 10.966 million
head, down 73,000 from a year
earlier.

The production level for the
first 11 months of 1977 was
113.39 billion pounds, 2.5 per
cent ahead of those months in
1976 and 7.0 per cent ahead of
the same period in 1975.

The milk-feed price ration
decreased from 1.84 in Octob-
er to 1.76 in November. Milk
prices either remained the
same or rose slightly, but the
ration values in all regions of
the country rose, thus ac-
counting for the ratio de-
crease.

donate $25 to Woodland. Some
plans were made for the next
meeting.

Exchange of gifts was held.
Lunch was served by the
hostess, assisted by her
daughter, Lana, and Mrs.
Doerr.

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Smith
and girls, Mr. and Mrs. Don
Smith and family, Mr. and
Mrs. Randy Smith and Mon-
ica, Mr. and Mrs. Harvey
Ross and family, Mr. and
.MrSi. Rodney_Smjth. and _Mr.
and Mrs. Raymond Buerkle
Jr. attended the Smith Christ-
mas dinner Sunday at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Larry
Smith and family.

Mrs. Forest Pardy and
Mrs. Horatio Pardy were
Saturday afternoon callers of
Mrs. William Snell and Miss
Bertha Snell.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Deer-
ing and family of Deford, Mr.
and Mrs. Gordon Watson and
sons of Mayville, Mr. and
Mrs. Tom Chard of Decker,
Mr. and Mrs. Troy Rhine-
hardt of Pontiac, Mr. and
Mrs. Ron Behr and family of
Marlette, Mr. and Mrs. Rob-
ert Behr and family of Sagi-
naw, Mr. and Mrs. Dale
Mitchell and boys of Carleton,
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Palmer and
Paul of Sandusky, Mr. and
Mrs. Louis Behr of Argyle,
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Leslie and
family attended the Behr
Christmas dinner at the Civic
Center in Sandusky Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Dor-
man were Friday afternoon
callers of Mrs. Maude Hough-
ton.

Cheryl Karr

Campus Life

candidate
Cheryl Karr, a senior at

Cass City High School, is
among the candidates from
Sanilac and Tuscola counties
who will be competing for the
Miss Campus Life Sweetheart
title.

She is the daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. James Karr.

The annual contest spon-
sored ,by the Campus Life
division of Delta-Thumb
Youth for Christ will be Feb.
11 at 8 p.m. at Vassar High
School.

Campus Life also an-
nounced its Florida Break-
Away trip during spring va-
cation.

Sanilac and Lapeer county
students can go March 18-25;
Tuscola, Saginaw, Bay, and
Midland county students,
March 25-April 1.

The trip will include visits
to Disney World and Daytona
Beach.

More information can be
obtained from the Campus
Life office in Marlette.

Mr. and Mrs. Andy Hoagg
visited Mrs. Eva Ashcroft of
Deford Thursday afternoon.

Mrs. Wilfred Waun was a
Sunday evening caller of Mrs.
William Snell and Miss
Bertha Snell and Mr. and
Mrs. Ryerson Puterbaugh,
Lana and Dalton were Satur-
day evening callers of Mr.
and Mrs. Victor Hyatt.

Mr. and Mrs. Harley Dor-
man of Caro were Friday
supper guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Voyle Dorman.

Mr. and Mrs. Andy Hoagg
visited the former's sister,
Mrs. Rugus Walker-,-at-Mas--
lette hospital Thursday after-
noon. Mrs. Walker fell and
broke her hip.

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Kirk-
bright, Mr. and Mrs. John
Franzel and Brian, Mrs. Don
Krause and daughters, Sally
and Anna, and Mrs. George
Krause were Saturday eve-
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Paul Mezo of Sandusky in
honor of Sally's birthday.

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Dor-
man were Sunday supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Curtis
Cleland.

Pat Goslin
on dean's list
Patricia Goslin, a freshman

at Lake Superior State Col-
lege in Sault Ste. Marie, has
been named to the dean's list
for the fall semester.

A 3.5 grade point average or
above is required to be named
to the list.

A June, 1977 graduate of
Cass City High School, she is
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Keith Goslin of 3351 Bay City-
Forestville Road, Gagetown.

Area CPAs
to meet

Area bankers will be guests
of members at a meeting of
the eastern chapter of the
Michigan Association of Cert-
ified Public Accountants
Tuesday, Jan. 3, at Zehnder's
Restaurant in Frankenmuth.

Featured speaker Profes-
sor Ross Wilhelm of the
University of Michigan will
discuss "The Economic Fore-
cast".

The program will be mod-
erated by chapter Chairman
Edward J. Moore, CPA, of
Bad Axe.

A LITTLE !
CHRONICLE {

WANT AD !

Results

HARDWARE STORED

TOOL
of the Month

10-PIECE
SCREWDRIVER SET

Master
MECHANIC

now
just:

Quantities Limited
From Master Mechanic—10 reasons never to have a screw
loose. 10 screwdrivers feature tempered, high carbon steel
and shock resistant jumbo-sized handles that are comfort-
able to grip. Set includes 7 regular tips and 3 phillips tips.
TT10

No Lay-Aways On Item Of The Month

CaaaCltv Phone 872-2270

A
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CASS CITY IGA FOODLINER
/

! STORE HOURS: OPEN THURSDAY AND
FRIDAY NIGHT TILL 9:00. DAILY TILL 6.

~ ~ ~ C H E C K THIS DEPARTMENT

We Have A Complete Plant Care Dept., Potting Soil, Leaf Shine, Plant
Food, Jobe's Plant Food Spikes. Air Fern Cacti, Venus Fly Traps,
Clear Glass Rooters, Assorted Kinds At A Very Low Price. Moon
Cactus, Dwarf Rose Bushes, Ivy Wishing Well in the Plant Dept.
Also Assorted Redwood Bird Feeders. A New Shipment Of Assorted
Fresh Foliage Plants In Assorted Size Pots. Every Week.

Now For Your Convenience

Photo Finishing Service

We Welcome Food Coupons and

Social Services Orders

AD FOR WEEK ENDING SAT., DEC. 31, 1977
BEER & WINE TO GO

NOTE: Not responsible for errors made in
printing. QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED.

!QA • TABLERITE BESF
FULL CUT

ROUND
STEAK

$'
Ib.

OUR FINEST . . .
IGA • TABLERITE

CHICKEN
LEGS

BACKS ATTACHED

A DELICIOUS WAY TO
START YOUR DAY . . .

WEST VIRGINIA

SLICED
BACON

Ib. Pkg.

$3--

IGA • TABLERITE

GROUND
BEEF

MADE FROM CHUCK

FLORIDA • WHITE

GRAPE-
FRUIT

5-lb. Bag

VINE-RIPENED
TOMATOES

WIN SCHULER'S'Oniqn.GwUc'Bscon

BAR —-
SUNSHINE
CHEEZ-ITS
CRACKERS
1-lb. Box

-a

OVEN FRESH • BLACK BAVARIAN
RYE __..

YOUR CHOICE

FAME
FRUIT SALE

•Y.C. Poachm
W* ft Slical 29-0

• Bart. Pesr I .
Halves 29-oz.

•Wholo
Tomatoes 28-oz. Can

ALL FLAVORS

HI-C
DRINKS

46-oz. Can

OVEN FRESH CRACKED WHEAT tt
HONEY GLO
BREAD
1-b.Lmrf.........

OFF LABEL

ALKA
SELTZER ,
SAVE 13'-25<t. Btl

SAVE 20'
ANACIN
TABLETS
100-cl. Bll
5oz.«9-oz..12-oz.
ANCHOR HOCKING
GLASSES Save
YOURCHOICEI 16'

OVEN FRESH • SESAME
HAMBURG
BUNS
t-ctPkg. ...............

FAME

TOMATO
JUICE

48-01. Can

$ 4 9

^

PENN DUTCH

MUSHROOMS |
4-oz. Can

KEEBLER; • ASST.

SNACK
CRACKERS
8-9 oz. Pkgs..

FLORIDA • PINK
GRAPE-
FRUIT
B-lb. Bag

""-"ste.

SALUTO • FROZEN

PARTY
PIZZA

14-Inch Size
33-oz. Pkg.

FAME • PEELED ft DEVEINED

FROZEN
SHRIMP

12-oz. Pkg.

$O89

FAME • FROZEN

ORANGE
JUICE

100% PURE FLORIDA!
16<». CAN ^gfe.-.

.0I/A"1

KRAFT'INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

CHEESE
SLICES

IGA • COLBY ^

CHUNK
CHEESE

HALFMOON LONGHORN
10-oz. Pkg.

4 SOUP
DISHES

THIS WEEK S

rEATUHED ITEM

'2.00 off
WITH COUPON

^OOWAHT

STOCK!

VALUABLE COUPON WORTH '2.00
TOWAID THE FURCKAIE OF THIS Wtflft fEATUMO ITEI

SET OF 4 SOUP DISHES'

OutHtg Diuo
Coupon Sit

niP'ice •• 111 99

Youf Puce (wilh coupon) S9.99

In tht ptllttn of yofr cho/e*
Coupon Good Thru

12/31/77

NR

Limit One Coupon Per Family
. Coupon Expire* Dec. 31, 1977

With thi* Coupon ft $15 Purchase
Excluding Beer, Wine or Cigarettes

IS®

NR

Limit One Coupon Per Family
Coupon Expires Dec. 31, 1977

With this Coupon tt $15 Purchase
Excluding Beer, Wine or Cigarettes

pkfl-

Limit One Coupon Per Family
Coupon Expires Dec. 31, 1977

With this Coupon ft $7.00 Purchase
NR, Excluding Beer, Wine or Cigarettes

COUP0"

1\
Iff

^ Limit One Coupon Per .Family
Coupon Expires Dec. 31. 19/'

With this Coupon ft $7.00 Purchase
NR Excluding Beer, Wine or Cigarettes

Limit One Coupon Per Family
Coupon Expires Dec. 31, 1977

With this Coupon ft $7.00 Purchase
NR Excluding Beer, Wine or Cigarettes
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Your Neighbor says

Building a house

made '77 beautiful

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Cass City Bowling Leagues

This past year was a
"beautiful year," according
to Sandra Walter. "We really
went through a learning
process."

The learning process she
and her husband Haryey went
through was building a new
home on Huron Line Road,
Cass City. "We never did
anything like that before,"
Mrs. Walter explained.

They had some help from
friends and had to hire some
skilled tradesmen to do some
tasks, such as a plumber, but
most of the work they did
themselves.

Harvey Walter works as a
food establishment and build-
ing inspector for the Thumb
District Health Department.
Mrs. Walter is a medical
assistant for Dr. Ivan Mac-
Rae, D.O.
- Work started on the house
in early August and the
Walters moved in Dec. 17. It
isn't finished yet, so Mrs.
Walter has one New Year's
resolution -- "finishing the
house and enjoying it."

The Walters owned a house
on Koepfgen Road until they
sold it, then rented a house for
five months while they were
building their new one.

They missed one goal in
-building their new dwelling,
having it ready to live in
before their daughter, Deb-
bie, was married in Novem-
ber. They have one son,
Steve, a high school junior.

CITY LEAGUE
Dec. 2G, 1977

Dale's Eaves Troughing 23
Woods Hay & Straw 22
Cass City Lanes . 18"••
Evans Products 17
Mac & Leo Service 15'^
Klein's Fertilizer 13
Whittaker's Sawmill 11 'i
Cass City Cycle Sales 7'••

High Team Series: Dale's
Eaves Troughing 2644,

-Klein's Fertilizer 24l2r
High Team Games: Dale's

Eaves Troughing 905-886,
Klein's Fertilizer 873.

High Individual Series: Ted
Furness 656, L. Tracy 534, R.
Clarkson 513, T. Yost 512, V.
Gallaway 507.

High Individual Games:
Ted Furness 258-210-188, G.
King 221, V. Gallaway 194, R.
Clarkson 191, L. Tracy 189-
177, T. Yost 182-175, K. Burza
181, G. Gallaway 181, L.
Taylor 181, 0. Pierce 180,
Harold Whittaker 176.

172, C. Croft 171, J. Brown
170, C. Mellendorf 170.

High Women's Series: C.
Davidson 461, P. Schwartz
448, M. Schwartz 438, S.
Nicholas 404, S. Wentworth
403.

High Women's Games: M.
Schwartz 184-151, C. Davidson
175-159, P. Schwartz 163, S.
Wentworth 156.

Splits Converted: 3-10 W.
Czekai, 5-6 C. Croft , 3-9-10 R.
Levine, 4-7-8 V. Gal laway,
4-7-10 G. Frederick. -

200 Games: J. Warrack 213,
K. Gremel 208-205, J. Guinth-
er 200, D. Englehart 212, C.
Kolb 211, E. Helwig 209, F.
Nowak 222, D. Miller 214, E.
Halev 206, T. Gruber 204.

CHARMONT
LADIES' LEAGUE

GUYS & GALS
End of First Ha l f

Dec. 20, 1!)77

Brand X 45
Udder Guys 41 '-
Pin Rollers 40
Kens & Kerbs 36'-
Kingston Klowns 35
Full Moons 31
T-B's 30
Lucky Strikes 211
D&DConstruct ion 27
Century 21 26
Kingston CB'ers 24
Muldoos 22

Gagetown Oil and Gas
Farm Bureau
Veronica's
BigD
Johnson Plumberettes
B e r W a G a N a
Woods Research
IGA Foodliner
Brinkman Bins
Cabelettes
Live Wires
Erla's

13 M;
13
12
12
11
11
10
10
9 M.
8
6 "2
3'A

WoodsTeam High Series:
Research 2120.

Team High Game: Ber Wa
Ga Na 739.

High Series: P. Schwartz
559, E. Remain 482, M.
Schember 477, R. Leyva 464,
C. Mellendorf 450, N. Davis
452, M. Guild 466.

High Games: P. Schwartz
214, R. Fader 156, C. Spencer
156, D. Parrish 160, M. Lagos
156, B. Lefler 158, G. Sutler
162, N. Anderson 155, B. Abke
183, R. Leyva 166, M. Smith-
ers 168, E. Romain 178, P.
Johnson 163, C. Mellendorf
162, P. Mclntosh 169, Carol
Rutkoski 155, S. Asher 156, M.
Schember 170, J. Winchester
159, N. Davis 186, R. Batts 156,
M. Guild 187, R. Speirs 150.

KINGS & QUEENS
Dec. 22, 1!)77

May you have a New Year filled
with dreams come true: success
and happiness unlimited! And
may we continue to share in the
progress of our fine community.'

KRITZMANS', INC,
Cass City

Nic-Cums
M-D's
Gutter Dusters
Pro Bowlers^
Bar-Gals
Forty-Niners
Rebels
Pin Busters

18 "A
18
15
15
14'/2
13
10
8

High Team Series: • Nic-
Cums 1783, Forty-Niners 1772,
Pin Busters 1738.

High Team Games: Pin
Busters 619, Forty Niners 612,
Nic-Cums 602-600.

High Men's Series: D. Cum-
mins 521, C. Croft 485, C.
Mellendorf 471, J. Brown 465,
W. Czekai 455.

High Men's Games: D.
Cummins 193-175, W. Czekai

Celebrate the joys of liv-

ing by welcoming the New

Year with loved ones.

Eria Food Center & Eria Packing Company
AND ALL THE EMPLOYEES

CASS CITY

High Team Series: Kens
and Kerbs 1900, Udder Guys
1836, Brand X 1801.

High Team Games: Kens &
Kerbs 687-662, Udder Guys
669-607, Brand X 637.

High Men's Series: G.
Kerbyson 521, J. Wolak 512,
R. Colling 503, R. Bouck 499,
B. Inbody 49B.

High Men's Games: G.
Kerbyson 214, J. Wolak 190,
R. Bouck 185.

High Women's Series: S.
Reynolds 575, N. Maharg 476,
M.'Schwartz 442, V. Bil icki
440, M. Leiterman 435, M.
Rabideau 419, A. Geister 417,
M. Inbody 416, V. Wolak 4 1 1 ,
C. Krueger 409, L. Leilerman
407.

High Women's Games: S.
Reynolds 206-202-l(i7, M. In-
body 178, N. Maharg 174-173,
M. Leiterman 167, L. Leiter-
man 163, C. Krueger 160, V.
Bilicki 155, V. Wolak 153, M.
Schwartz 150.

Splits Converted: 2-7 I.
Beyer, 4-5 S. Reynolds, 5-6 C.
Krueger (2 ) , E. Bil icki , 4-5-7
J. Wolak, 3-10 V. Bouck, M.
Schwartz, V. Bi l i ck i , 6-7-10 M.
Schwartz.

Tl'SCOLA
G E T T O G K T H E R S " B "

Dec. l!l, 1!)77

Fagans No. 2 14
Kingston Stale Bank 13
Farm Bureau - 11
C.C. Crop Service 11

1 Rogers Hay 9
B loun tAgr i . 8
Kingston Krome 7
Cole Carbide 5
Col wood No. l 5
Thunder Road Speedway 5
Ami's Texaco 4
Col wood No. 2 4

High Game: N. Benitez 213.
High Series: N. Benitez 560.
High Team Series: Kings-

Ion State Bank 2778.
High Team Game: Thunder

Road 1018.
500 Scries: N. Ben'itez 560,

H . S h a w 502, B. Chard 504, G.
Geister 504, B. Billow 503.

200 Games: N. Benitez 213,
K. Nusome 200.

MKIU'IIANETTK LEAGUE
Dec. 22, l!)77

Gambles 12
Anrod Screen Cyl. 11
Walbro ' 10
Tuckey Block ' 10
Cole Carbide 10
Cass City Boron 9
Wilson Ins. 9
Kr i tz tnan ' s 8
The Wearhouse 7
Albee Hardware 6
Bliss Milk Hauling 4
Herron Builders 0

TUSCOLA
GETTOGETHERS"A"

Dec. l i ) , 1!)77

WIDL Radio 14
Spring Crest Draperies 13
Ouvry Chevy-Olds 10
Halls Trim Shop 10
Pabst 8
Harris-Hampshire Ins. 8
New Grecnleaf Garage 7
Croft-Clara Lumber 7
Sommers' Bakery 7
Hillaker 'sAuct. Serv. 5
J&C Service 4
Bartnik's Sales & Parts 3

F. Nowak 222.
K. Gremel 597.
Series: Spring

High Game
High Series
High Team

Crest 2876.
High Team Game: Spring

Crest 1044.
500 Series :T.Wissner 530, J.

Warrack 559, K. Gremel 597,
B. Warrack 502, M. Helwig
518, D. Wallace 549, J. Guinth-
er 568, M. Wasserman 527, D.
Englehart 560, C. Kolb 537, A.
Ouvry 515, L. Summers 500,
E. Helwig 513, B. Smith 502,
D. Shannon 504, B. Kupiec
513, B. Biebel 504, B. Wildman
522, N. Biebel 524, T. Becker
518, N. Willy 508, J. Mclntosh
518, R. Geiger 514, D. Miller
520, R. Schember 510, E.
Haley 566, T. Gruber 502, B.
Bartle 500.

High Team Series: Walbro
2188, Wilson 2176, Bliss 2149,
Kr i tzman ' s 2126, Anrod 2102,
C.C. Boron 2084, Herron's
2021, Gambles 2011.

High Team Games: Walbro
820-706, Wilson 811-710, Kritz-
man's 780, Bliss 760-723, C.C.
Boron 732-701, Anrod 723-712,
Gambles 710, Herron's 701.

High Individual Series: J.
Morell 507, M. Guild 499,
Phyllis Mclntosh 494, N. Wal-
lace 485, Nancy Helwig 473, N.
Maharg (sub) 460, B. Deering
454, P. Johnson 454.

High Individual Games: J.
Morell 201-171, Nancy Helwig
191-154, D. Tuckey 191, M.
Gui ld 188-159-152, N. Wallace
185-179, N. Maharg (sub)
182-169, B. Deering 179, Phyl-
lis Mclntosh 178-164-152, P.
Johnson 177, D. Dunn 168, B.
Schott 168, F. Lovejoy 163, B.
Irrer 162, D. Golding 161, H.
Sontag 161, J. Hunt 160, J.
Smithson 159, L. Bryant 155,
G. Carolan 155, M. Isard
155-151, J. LaRoche 155, G.
Root 155-152, L. Selby 155, N.
Bauer 154, Pat Mclntosh 153,
T. Weaver 153, M. Downing
152, K. Tuckey 150.

MERCHANTS"A"LEAGUE
Dec. 21, 1077

Cass City Oil & Gas 13
Croft-Clara Lumber 13
Charlie's Market 12
Fuelgas 12
New England Life 11
Kingston State Bank 10
Kritzman's 9
Charmont 9
Erla's Food Center 9
Ouvry Chevy-Olds 8
Blount Agriculture 7
Warren Electric 7

500 Series: L. Wenzloff'ssp,
J. Gallagher 561, H. Wolak
554, M. Helwig 546, B. Pudel-
ko 543, J. Steadman 540, Dick

Time to Welcome
' the New Year

I icking off the good things we wish for all our
devoted patrons, as we welcome

Mac & Leo Service
TOTAL PRODUCTS

Gas-Oil Cass City

Root 536, C. Vandiver 535, N.
Willy 535, L. Davis 533, G.
Whittaker 531, B. Wischmey-
er 528, J. Kelly 526, G. Lapp
521, E. Helwig 520, L. Sum-
mers 520, Don Root 519, C.
Kolb 517, D. Vatter 517, A.
Witherspoon 517, W. Harmon
514, A. Asher 511. L. Taylor
511, P. Robinson 508, J. Storm
507, A. McLachlan 505, A.
Ouvry 503, E. Lewicki 502.

200Games: L. Wenzloff 246,
C. Vandiver 236, E. Lewicki
227rF. Knoblet 2207A'. Wither-"
spoon 219, B. Pudelko 216, J.
Gallagher 201.

MERCHANTS"B"LEAGUE
Dec. 21, 1977

Colony House 15
Gagetown Oil & Gas 15
Clare's Sunoco Service 13
Tuckey Concrete " 12
Rabideau Motor Sales 11
Village Service Center 11
Charmont 10
Croft-Clara Lumber 8
Herron Builders 7
Copeland Builders 7

• American Bankers Life 7
Walbro 4

500Series: G. Diebel 556, A.
McLachlan 554, F. Schott 549,
D. Englehart 532, B. Dunn
526, V. Ricker 526, R. Osen-
toski 524, J. Smithson 521, C.
Comment 516, J. Sontag 513,
P. Nielsen 503, G. Deering
502.

200 Games: V. Ricker 207,
F. Schott 206, L. Summers
201.

Buehrly 152.
Splits Converted: C. Fur-

ness 5-6-10, 5-8-10.

TUESDAY
AFTERNOON LADIES

Dec. 20, 1977

Lucky Strikes
Chappel's Men's Shop
Charlie's Angels
TheBankettes
Out of Towners

TheCarber-Raiders
Bowling Bags
Wonder Women
Day-Dreamers
Decker Devils
Sunshine

36
35'2
34
33' 2
33
3iia
31
30
28
26
22' 2
19

High Series : J. Lockyer 517.
High Game: N. Wallace

194. •
High Team Series: Lucky

Strikes 2260.
High Team Game: Lucky

Strikes 803.
Splits Converted: M. Dick-

inson 5-7-9, P. Teichman 5-10,
R. Marr 5-7, L. Wenzlaff 5-7,
N. Ruggles 4-10, R. Peter
4-5-7, G. Prieskorn 5-7.

THURSDAY MORNING
COFFEE LEAGUE

Dec. 22,1!)77

LADIES CITY LEAGUE
2nd Quarter - Position Night

Dec. 20, 1!)77

Friendly Rivals 43
Crestwood Lounge 35
Gutter Dusters 35
Pin Pickers 27
Pin Passers 24 '<•>
Hot Shots 23'i;
Colonial Inn 23
FTroop 13

High Series: M. Truemner
434.

High Game .-V.Shemko 176.
High Team Series: Hot

Shots 1628.
High Team Game: Hot

Shots 598.
Splits Converted: S. Joos

4-5, B. Creason 3-10, V. Kil-
bourn 3-10, K. McCullough 5-7.

Conservation
programset
for farmers

The 1978 Agricultural Con-
servation Program (ACB),
recently announced by the
U.S. Department of Agricul-
ture, provides $190 million
nationwide for cost-sharing
with eligible producers for
soil and water conservation
practices, according to Vern-
on L. Kretzschmer, chairman
of the Michigan Agricultural
Stabilization and Conserva-
tion Committee. Michigan
has been allocated $4,364,000.

This money will be used in
cost-sharing with eligible
farmers on different types of
practices to solve conserva-
tion and environmental prob-
lems. County ASC commit-
tees wil l develop a priority
system for the identification
of conservation problems and
determine ACP practices to
solve these problems.

Details are available from
county Agricultural Stabiliza-
tion and Conservation Service
offices.

Advertise it in The Chronicle.

Francis Builders 22
Chappel 's Men's Shop 22
Argyle Rec 20 M;
Copeland & Gornowicz 16
Clare's Sunoco 15
Ground Level Shoppe 12
AAA 11
Chuck Gage Welding 9M>

High Team Series: Francis
Builders 2150, Chappel's
Men's Shop 2007, Copeland &
Gornowicz 1946.

High Team Games: Fran-
cis Builders 766-724, Chap-
pel's Men's Shop 695. • ;""

'High Individual Series': 3.
Deering 483, M. Home 462, I.
Schweikart 460, C. Davidson
451, J. Lapp (sub) 450, V.
Knowlton 450,

High Individual Games: I.
Schweikart 190, C. Davidson
173-157, C. Furness 171, J.
Lapp (sub) 169-161, J. Deer-
ing 168-160-155, D. Grifka 166,
A. Pierce (sub) 160, V. Knowl-
ton 162-155, M. Home 160-159,
J. Hines 159, D. Tracy 153, E.

SELF EMPLOYED?
Why Not Set Aside A Portion of

Your Earnings in a Tax
Deductible Pension Plan?

Not only are the contributions deduc-
tibJe. But the interest accumulates tax

For a tailored program to your specific
needs pieasecaii

HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE
INSURANCE AGENCY, INC.
Cass City Phone 872-2688

REASONS
GREETINGS

FROM

Thumb Co-qpTennirial; 375-2289
ElktanCo-qp... 875-888L.9
SebewaineGo-qp..,...,.. 883'3030f
RuthElevator....!. ........,..........864-339ll
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Holbrook Area News Mrs. Thelma Jackson

Phone 658-2347

Honor young sugar beet growers

Mrs. Curtis Cleland was a
recent guest of Mr. and Mrs.
Steve Hosner, Cindy and Rick
at Lansing.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Blem
and Becky Goodall of Gage-
town, Mr. and Mrs. Steve
Timmons and daughters,
Randy Lapeer of Houghton,
and Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord
Lapeer were Thursday sup-
per guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Lynwood Lapeer, Sheree and
Shelly in honor of Randy

JLaEeer_'s_bjrth_day,

mas Concert at the high
school Monday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Al Hammerle
were Tuesday evening guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schenk
and Randy.

Mr. and Mrs. John Michal-
ski and family of Deford, Mr.
and Mrs. Dave Michalski and
family and Mr. and Mrs.
Kevin Robinson and Tracy
were Christmas night guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Ray Michal-
ski.

Lori Hewitt was a Wednes-
Melvin Peter was a Thurs-

day forenoon guest of Mrs.
George Jackson.

Mrs. Jim Doerr and Mrs.
Curtis Cleland attended the
Cass City High School choir
and vocal ensemble Christ-

Teacher
receives
master's
Douglas L. Hall of N. Van

Dyke Road, Decker, grad-
uated with a master of arts
degree in administration Sat-
urday, Dec. 17, from Central
Michigan University, Mt.
Pleasant.

Douglas Hall

He received his BS degree
from Bethel College, Mish-
awaka, Ind., in 1967.

He taught in the Marlette
School system for nine years
and is now teaching his
second year in the Cass City

„ School system at Evergreen
Elementary.

His parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Lloyd Hall of Yale, and his
wife Judy (Tuckey) Hall at-
tended the commencement.

EDWARD DOERR

We tailor
insurance
for almost
everything
you own.

Whether it's your car,
business, home—or life
protection for you or
any member of your
family—we offer
Michigan Mutual
insurance plans
tailored to your exact
requirements. Call
now.

Doerr Agency

Phone 872-3615

Cass City

day overnight giiest of Gloria
Gusa at Minden City.

Mr. apd Mrs. Lynn Spencer
attended the Christmas party
at Provincial House Wednes-
day afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Cleland
and Doris Kinney were Tues-
day dinner guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Don Near at Ubly
Heights.

Randy Lapeer of Houghton
is spending the Christmas
holidays with Mr. and Mrs.
Lynwood Lapeer and daugh-
ters.

Mrs. George Jackson spent
Sunday and Monday with Mr.
and Mrs. George Jackson Jr.
and family at Oxford.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schenk
and Mrs. David Hacker spent
Wednesday in Port Huron.

Ron Roby of Johannesburg
was a Saturday guest of Mr.
and Mrs. Jack Tyrrell and
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Michal-
ski and Mr. and Mrs. Dave
Michalski and family were

E. Knowlton
dies after

long illness
Mrs. Elizabeth Knowlton of

Cass City died Wednesday,
Dec. 21, at Hills and Dales
General Hospital after a long
illness.

She was born Jan. 26, 1922,
in Preston, England, the
daughter of Walter and Ann
Hodge Turner. She came to
the United States at three
years of age.

Miss Turner married Wil-
liam B. Knowlton Sept. 27,
1.939, in,Fer.ndale, They made
their home in Ferndale and
Parrnihgtori before coming to
Cass City in 1955.

Mrs. Knowlton had been
employed by Hills and Dales
General Hospital.

She is survived by two
daughters, Mrs. Charlotte
Kitchin of Cass City and Mrs.
Ruth Hnatiuk of Caro; four
sons, William J. Knowlton of
Cass City, John Knowlton and
Robert Knowlton, both of
Caro, and James Knowlton of
Deford; two brothers, Walter
Turner of Caro and Richard
Turner of Cass City, and 13
grandchildren. One grandson,
one stepbrother, and one step-
sister preceded her in death.

Funeral services for Mrs.
Knowlton were conducted
Saturday afternoon from
Little's Funeral Home with
Rev. Eldred Kelley, pastor of
the Salem United Methodist
church of Cass City, officiat-
ing.

Burial was in Elkland
cemetery.

Corn results
available

Results of the 1977 corn
trials in Huron county are
now available at the county
extension office in Bad Axe.

A total of 113 seed varieties
for grain and 54 varieties for
silage were planted on the Bill
McCrea and Sons Farm near
Bad Axe for the trials.

Sunday dinner guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Kevin Robinson and
Tracey.

Shirley and Carol Ross and
Lori Hewitt visited Welling-
ton Tanner at Peck Friday.

Mrs. Curtis Cleland and
Mrs. Jim Doerr visited Mrs.
Bob Spencer at Provincial
House Monday.

Dan Peter of Clarkston was
a Tuesday forenoon guest of
Mrs. Georgia Jackson.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond
O'Henlev and Rila tvrrell

NOTICE OF
FINAL DAY FOR

FILING PETITIONS
VILLAGE OF CASS CITY

DEC. 30 AT CLERK'S OFFICE

• 3 Trustees
4-Year Terms

• Clerk, Treasurer,
President, Assessor
For 2-Year Terms

LYNDA MclNTOSH

"attended the wedding'of'Anit'a
Shagena and Mike Artman at
St. Mary's Catholic church at
Port Huron Friday evening. A
reception followed at the Elks
Country Club.

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard
Shagena of Sebewaing were
Tuesday evening guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shagena.

Mr. and Mrs. Cl i f f Robinson
were Thursday dinner guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Kevin Robin-
son and Tracy. Evening
guests were Mr. and Mrs.
Ray Michalski .

Debbie Timmons was a
Thursday overnight guest of
Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord La-
peer.

Glen Shagena visited Leslie
Hewitt Wednesday evening.

Sheila Dalton left Friday to
spend four days with her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Arlan
Dalton. at Richland Center,
Wis.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Cleland
and Mrs. Jim Doerr visited
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Simmons at
Cass City Monday.

Harry Edwards entered
Huron Memorial Hospital,
Bad Axe, Monday.

Mrs. Laverne Grifka and
Mrs. Frank Laming were
Wednesday afternoon guests

" o f Mrs. Gaylorci"Lapeer.
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Schenk

of Ubly were Thursday eve-
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Earl Schenk and Randy in
honor of Mrs. Earl Schenk's
bir thday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Doerr
and fami ly attended the Cass
City High School band concert
at the high school Thursday
evening.

Carol Ross of McPherson,
Kan., visited Sue Corliss at
Caro Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson
were Friday guests of Mrs.
Emma Decker in Cass City.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernie Cam-
eron spent a couple days with
Mr. and Mrs. John Campion
and family at Walled Lake.

The 4-H and Future Farm-
ers of America sugar beet
project members in Tuscola
county were honored at the
recent annual Sugar Beet
Banquet. The banquet is
sponsored yearly by the Caro
Sugar Beet Growers Associ-
ation and the Caro plant of the
Michigan Sugar Company.

The 4-H factory premier
growers awards were pre-
sented to the following 4-H
members: Julie Koeppen-

New agent
for erosion
law picked

The Sanilac County Board
of Commissioners voted
Wednesday, Dec. 21, to ap-
point the county Department
of Construction and Land Use
as the new enforcing agent for
soil erosion and sedimenta-
tion control as of Jan. 1.

The board had voted at its
Dec. 14 meeting to end the
county Road Commission's
role as enforcing agent.

The board also voted to
accept the offer of the county
planning commission to have
its committee assist in revis-
ing the county soil erosion
handbook.

doerfer, Robert Schluckbier,
John Mossner, Pam Bierlein,
Bethany Schluckbier, and
Brian Mossner of the Tuscola
Beetniks 4-H Club; Jane Rod-
ammer and Janine Roth of
the Pioneer 4-H Club; Rich-
ard Goodchild, Martha Good-
child, and Paula Montei of the
Progressive 4-H Club, and
Kip Parsell of the Toppers 4-H
Club.

The FFA factory premier
growers awards were pre-
sented to the following FFA
members: Paul Hawken and
Dennis Ackerman of Reese
FFA and Dennis Schmidt of
Millington FFA.

The 4-H and FFA members
selected" for the" educationar
trip were: Julie Koeppen-
doerfer, John Mossner, Mar-
tha Goodchild, Bethany
Schluckbier, and Dennis
Schmidt. The Prestige Grow-
ers who went on a trip before
were Robert Schluckbier and
Jane Rodammer.

The program, presented to
members, parents, and lead-
ers was given by Joe Mcln-
tyre of the Frutehey Bean
Company.

SLOW PROCESS

Change is not a necessity
for progress—old setups are
often more successful than
new ones.

Hoping your

friendship will
remain one of the

many pleasures of

the New Year.
Our thanks. , m

age town Elevator,
Inc.

Blount Agriculture Inc.
Gagetown, Michigan

The Want Ads Are Newsy Too!

LAST 3 DAYS
DON'T LOSE OUT

Dear Friends and Customers:

We must reduce our inventory before JANUARY 1st TfTHIS TAX SALE"

means greater savings to you than any sale you've ever seen before. You can't afford to miss

tbis opportunity to have first choice of the many Bargains we are making available!

TV "APPLIANCES F I H M T I K K

Phone:872-2696 Cass City

NOGIMMfCfCS-
: 'JUST- LOW ; ' ' i : - i i s

• ...... "—

CREDIT

BANKAMERICARD master charge
THE INTERBANK CARD

FURNITURE CARPETING * APPLIANCES
BASSETT '

.DINIA'UE
CHICAGO TABLE
FOX

LA-Z-BOY
LANE
N O R W A L K

PONTIAC
S E K T A
S E A L Y

MA GEE
. W O R L D

M O H A W K
T R E N D

R . C ' . A .
ZENITH

G.E..
WHIRLPOOL

TV A P P I I A N C K S ITKMTUU

m
Phone: 872-2696

OPEN ALL DAY - 8 a.m. to 9 p.m.

December 27-28-29-30-31

SERVICE WITH

EVERY PURCHASE



PAGE TEN CASS CITY CHRONICLE - THURSDAY, DECEMBER 29, 1977

All programs now consolidated
CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Social Services settling in new home
, At the Tuscola County De-
partment of Social Services,
employees are tripping over
boxes.

But that's better than trip-
ping over each other. And for
the benefits of both employ-
ees and clients, everything is
now under one roof.

The move into the new DSS
building began Dec. 1, with
the last of the staff moving in
Dec. 17. As of Friday, there
were lots of boxes still un-
packed and* some interior
work, such as installation of
door handles and partitions,
yet to be done.
"• The new building is located
on M-81, about two miles west
of the center of Caro. It is
being leased by the state from
the builder, Edward Liebler
of Caro.

The building was needed for
two reasons, according to
department Director Onalee
Detwiler.

Most important, it consoli-
dates all department func-
tions under one roof. For the
last two years, the assistance
payments section shared a
building with the Thumb Dis-
trict Health Department fur-
ther to the west on M-81. The
services section was located
in a building at the Caro
Regional Center.

That created communica-
tion problems for the staff
and for many clients, it meant
first they had to go to one
building, then to the other.

Secondly, the new building
has 13,000 square feet of
space, as compared to 8,000
previously split among the
two buildings. That means
more room to move around in
and more privacy for staff
and clients.

ASSISTANCE

As indicated, the DSS has
two main functions - assist-
ance payments or welfare,
and services.

SIMULATED

ENGRAVED

BUSINESS CARDS

'1 AVAILABLE 1-COLOR

OR 2-COLOR

The Cass City
Chronicle

The number of persons
receiving assistance, Mrs.
Detwiler said, probably
reached its peak in October,
1975, during the last reces-
sion, and has been gradually
declining since then.

Perhaps the best-known
welfare program is Aid to
Dependent Children, which
has three categories: Regular
ADC, for one-parent families;
ADC for families with an
incapacitated parent, and
ADC-U, where the father- is
unemployed. In the latter two
categories, both parents can
be in the home.

In August, the latest month
for which statistics are avail-
able, there were 828 families
(with a total of 2,810 mem-
bers) receiving some form of
ADC. That compares to 803
families one year earlier and
778 two years before.

The average payment per
family in August was $256.88.

Food stamps is another
well-known program. The
DSS only handles applications
plus emergency stamp pur-
chases; the stamps are norm-
ally purchased at post offices.

The total number of persons
eligible to buy food stamps in
August wasn't available.
However, in addition to those
receiving public assistance
all of whom are eligible to buy
food stamps, 153 persons not
eligible for public assistance
applied in August to buy
them. (Some people may earn
too much to qualify for public
assistance but still qualify for
food stamps.)

In July, 1976, 234 persons
not receiving public assist-
ance received food stamps.
(The August, 1976 statistics
were still "buried" in one of
Mrs. Detwiler's boxes.)

Medicaid pays for medical
care for the indigent. In
August, that applied to 821 per-
sons in the county, of whom
215 were 65 and over (some
persons who qualify for Medi-
care -- medical care for the
elderly - also qualify for
Medicaid), 328 disabled, and
68 in families with dependent
children, and 210 in the cate-
gory of "other children under
age 21." Most patients at the
Caro Regional Center receive
Medicaid, thus the high num-
ber of recipients in this
county.

In July, 1976, a total of 599
persons were receiving Medi-
caid.

The final welfare category
is general assistance, "for
those who fall through the
cracks," Mrs. Detwiler ex-
plained. It provides assist-
ance for persons not eligible
for other programs. Often,

Where tour Farm Comes First BUSINESSMEN
HOME OWNERS

BLir63U FARMERS
FARM BUREAU SERVICES. INC

Planning a New Building, Store,
Office, Warehouse, Garage?

Farm Bureau Buildings Are-
• Professionally Engiheered
• Designed to Fit Your Needs
• Carry a Long Term Warranty
•Erected or Material Only

"Ask the Farm Bureau People7'
Call 872-4409 or 753-3457 Now

Anton Peters Glen Erskine
582^Cass City Road
Cass City, M148726

4330 Seaway Drive
Carrollton, Ml 48724

New Year?
" Ttl oy, health, contentment"
. . . our toast to you and your

loved ones in the bright New Year.

THE TRADE WINDS
Cass City - Pigeon • Frankenmuth

those who qualify are single,
unmarried persons between
the ages of 21 and 62.

The total number receiving
general assistance in August
was 88, compared to 77 in
July, 1976. The average pay-
ment this August was $99.20.

General assistance is the
only category where the
county directly contributes. It
was once entirely a county-
financed program, but the
state is gradually assuming
the entire financial burden.

Another assistance pro-
gram, handled entirely by the
Social Security Administra-
tion, not by the DSS, is supple-
mental security income, for
the blind, disabled, and to
elderly persons unable to get
by solely on Social Security. A
total of 1,051 persons were
receiving SSI in the county in
August, compared to 773 in
July, 1976.

There are two basic checks
against welfare fraud, ac-
cording to Mrs. Detwiler.

First, information reported
by applicants, such as last
employer, schools attended,
children in home, marriage
and-or divorce, is checked.
Each six months thereafter,
there is a reverification -
assuming the person is still
receiving assistance, of
course.

Secondly, there is one em-
ployee whose sole job is to
investigate welfare com-
plaints. Another employee
tracks down divorced or sep-
arated fathers who are not
making their child support
payments.

SERVICES

The other DSS section pro-
vides various services, not
just for persons receiving
public assistance.

Various child and family
services include handling
adoptions, foster home licens-
ing and placements, working
with neglected and abused
children, plus potential delin-
quents, and counseling and
money management for fam-
ilies.

Adult protective services is
a new function, dealing with
helping individuals unable to
take care of themselves, such
as the elderly, emotionally ill,
and mentally retarded.

A volunteer coordinator
sets up volunteer programs.
One DSS volunteer was in
charge of the department's
distribution of Christmas
baskets to needy families this
year.

A homemaker works with
neglected and abused fami-
lies.

Jobs are not neglected. All
employable persons must
register with the Michigan
Employment Security Com-
mission before receiving any
welfare benefits.

A new two-week program in
conjunction with the Caro
Community Schools prepares
welfare recipients and others
to apply for jobs. Those
enrolled learn such things as
how to fill out job applica-
tions, conduct, what to wear
when applying, and, accord-
ing to Mrs. Detwiler, "a
picture of what the labor
market is and how to take
advantage of it."

The federal Work Incentive
Program (WIN) is housed in
the DSS building. One of its
functions is to determine
whether sanctions should be
imposed if a person receiving
public assistance turns down
a job. (There can be legiti-

mate reasons for doing so,
such as lack of a car.)

Sanctions can include elimi-
nating a person's welfare
benefits, though not those
going to children of the recipi-
ent.

The Tuscola county DSS

has 52 civil service employ-
ees, including its director,
plus 10 paid with funds from
various federal employment
program funds.

When Mrs. Detwiler started
with the department 10 years
ago, there were only about 20.

She worked her way through
the ranks and was appointed
director in 1973. Appointment
of county DSS directors is
made jointly by the state DSS
and each county's Social
Services Board.

The various social service

programs aren't always per-
fect, Mrs. Detwiler admits.

"I think we all agree the
whole welfare system needs
attention nationwide," she
commented, "but until then,
we have to make a go of it
with what we've got."

NEW BUILDING -- The new building housing the Tuscola county Department of
Social Services is on M-81, about two miles west of the center of Caro. Landscaping
will be done later.

LOTS OF BOXES » These still-unpacked boxes in the
clerical section in the new Department of Social Services
building contain various forms. Eventually they will be put,
in a storage room.

IRA
Individual Retirement Accounts

• Tax Deductible Contributions up
to 15% of pay, max. $1,500

• Tax Free Accumulation Until
Retirement

• Various Funding Vehicles, Mutual
Funds and Annuities

PLEASE CONTACT THE:

HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE
INSURANCE AGENCY, INC.

Cass City- Phone 872-2688

SOCIAL SERVICES Director Onalee
A. Detwiler (left) discusses matters with
assistance payments worker Kathy Holik.
Still unpacked boxes in Mrs. Detwiler's
office are in the foreground.

The King Wood Stove

Automatic
Wood

Circulators
BRICK LINED

END LOADERS

With the use of an Automatic
Thermostat, up to 12 hours of
constant, even heat Is assured
with one load of Fuel! Wood
or Coal Burning.

Reg. $389.95

SALE $319 95 lodel
aeoo-s

BANKAMERICARD
welcome here
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CROFT-CLARA LUMBER, INC.
Dalevollmar
Orvi lie Mai lory
Russell Hillaker
Larry Summers

Wm. Repshinska
Elwyn Helwig'
ElmerSchuIz
Claude Spelman

John Shagena
Dale Mclntosh
Clifford Croft
JoAnn Berry

Robert Kozan
Carolyn Berry
Dennis Sweet
Eugene Kaake
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IErla's Homemade

Sliced

COOKED SALAMI
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Erla's

Smoked

SLAB BACON
(by the chunki

Tender Aged Beef

Blade Cut

POT ROASTS

Erla's Home Made

RING BOLOGNA
or

LARGE BOLOGNA

0 / U U / O
~*r

Erla s Ho mem;

PICKLED BOLOGNA

Erla's Homemade

SUMMER SAUSAGE

$129
Erla' Homemade

Fresh

LIVER RINGS

KISZK A STICKS

lb.

/ Fresh

Whole

Produce
Size 24 Calif.

LETTUCE
U.S. No. 1 Mich.

POTATOES
U.S. No. 1 Cooking

ONIONS
Florida

TANGERINES
U.S. No. 1

BANANAS

head 39
90A V l

dozen

Ibs.
00 \\

fc- Cream of
Mushroom

Campbells

Chicken Noodle or

Cream of Mushroom

SOUP

Grade A
'y^7

16 Or tt Fresh Pan Ready
Rib Half

PORK
LOINS

b
$r

•Sliced Free /)HartSweet peas 17°Z- °r
Our Favorite

tut Green Beans
Vlasic No Garlic or

Kosher Spears

Erla's Mild Sen

LESS
sation

FRANKS
• • • • i* mm

FRYERS

CUT UP
FRYERS

lb.

Ib.

10 lb.

Box

or
Jb.

1
79

00
O B .

10V20Z.
cans

Made RiteReg.-Ripple

Potato Chips
McDonald 2%

Low Fat Milk
No Return Btls.

Seven-Up &
Bordens American Singles

Cheese Slices
Parkay

Spread

6oz. can

39

2lb. tub

Star Kist

Tuna
Hunts

Manwich
Kraf t 3 Kinds

Chip Dip .
Gentle Pels Liquid

Dish Soap
Vets Nuggets

FOOd 25lb. bag

27 oz. can

Garlic • Onion o n7 .
Jalipmo OOZ. cin

22 oz. bll.

a

Del Monte Breakfast

PRUNES 32 oz. pkg.

Del Monte

TOMATO JUICE ««.«,„'
Penn Dutch Pieces & Stems A Act
MUSHROOMS 4ozcans 2/89*

Romeo Fancy

MARASCHINO

CHERRIES 10ozjar

*/i

mtwnof

î̂ P;̂ ^ '̂;̂ '':'*!

Prince

Elbow
Macaroni ̂ .,59*

Chun King Frozen
Chicken- Meal/Shrimp'Shnmp

Egg Rolls e o z P 59'

>

.^

Specials Good Thru: Sat., Dec. 31,1977

LAKE TO LAKE
GRADE"AA"

CHEDDAR OR
COLBY LONGHORN

CHEESE
9oz.

pkg.

BCM
t MERCHANDliING

2 ROLL
NORTHERN

BRAWNY
TOWELS

OR
DELTA

CORONET

BATHROOM
TISSUE

4 ROLL

BMCRY

120Z.K.

Food Center
IN CASS CITY

OPEN MONDAY THURSDAY TO 6 P.M

FRIDAY TO 9 P.M.

SATURDAY 8:00 A.M. TO 6 P.M.

BEER WINE
'MEMBER T.W. FOOD STORE

PHONE 872-2191

Oven Fresh

Cocktail Rye Bread
Oven Fresh

Light Rye Bread 16.oz.if.
Dark Rye Bread 200211
Oven Fresh

Golden Wheat & Golden White Bread
Oven Fresh

Cinnamon Rolls i2oz P kg

20 oz. If.

Health & Beauty Aids

Alka Seltzer
Wilkinson II

Twin Blade Cartridge
Ultra Ban II
Anti-Perspirant

Fried Chicken
Bright n' Early Frozen

Orange Juice i2oz
Nutwood Farm Frozen

Donuts :
Red

Hawaiian
Punch
Realemon

Lemon Juice
Squeeze Bottle

TOTINO'S FROZEN

PIZZA
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It was a fairly good year

1977 — a year of peaks and valleys
NEW YEAR'S EVE

SMORGASBORD
Starting At 5 p.m.

* DANCING
* FAVORS

WILDWOOD FARMS
Van Dyke Road, Cass City

PHONE 872-2720

Another year is softly fad-
ing away and like most years
it was one with its share of
peaks and valleys.

There were good things
reported in the pages of the
Chronicle, some not so good,
and some downright discour-
aging.

On balance it appears to
have been a fairly good year
for folks in the Cass City area
and the Thumb.

On the bright-side area
communities could look back
on a better than average year
for retail sales.

Cass City made some major
advances with a shopping
mall, new bank, larger furni-
ture store, remodeled hotel

and enlargements or im-
provements at two farm serv-
ice elevators.

Employment remained at a
high level as Anrod, Walbro,
Cole Carbide and General
Cable hummed with activity.

Counterbalancing these
signs of economic well-being
was a gloomy farm picture.
In addition to low crop prices,
first drought, then excessive
rain cut yields. So much so

.that the area was granted
disaster area status so farm-
ers could borrow money at
reasonable rates to keep go-
ing.

In the spring, most of the
community receive^ a l if t by
the school's basketball team

Dinsmore exam
set for Jan. 6

Myadec Capsules
had no equal-until
they made
tablet.

100 Plus 30 Free

$8.89
value $7.19

Myadec
- iabs

Tablet or
Capsule

JMyadec^
PARKE-DAVIS
High polinci
llamln lormuu with ml

4nf\T\r**i tottoiitenpu-.130 Day ,;*K£v
Vitamin ;.<»»***

The Parke-Davis
Myadec Capsule con-
tains a high-potency
vitamin formula with
minerals—9 important
vitamins and 6 minerals,
to be exact. And now
this same high-potency
vitamin product is also available in an easy-to-take
tablet. If you're active and on the go, stop in today
and buy a supply of Myadec Tabs.

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY

Supply PARKE-DAVIS

Ph. «72-/5(>]:iWKAVKR. <)wner

Your Family 'Discoun tRrnp Store;

Donald S. Dinsmore,
charged with two counts of
murder in the shooting deaths
of his former in-laws, faces
preliminary examination
Jan. 6 to determine if there is
enough evidence to bind him
over to circuit court for trial.

District Judge Richard F.
Kern scheduled the examina-
tion date Friday after receiv-
ing a report from the Center
for Forensic Psychiatry at
Ypsilanti State Hospital,
where Dinsmore was exam-
ined. The report said Dins-
more was found mentally
competent to stand trial.

Following the hearing Fri-
day, Dinsmore was remanded
to the county jail .

He is charged in connection
with the Sept. 23 shooting
deaths of Henry N. Beamish,
64, and his wife, Marie, 62, in
their Waterman Road home
near Vassar.

Dinsmore, their former
son-in-law, was arrested two
days later. Age 41, he lived on
W. Cass City Road near
Akron.

He married the Beamishes'
daughter in 1967. They were
divorced in July of this year.
She now lives in Florida with
their two children.

In circuit court Friday be-
fore Judge Norman A. Bagu-
ley:

Randy E. Dibble, 26, of 421
E. Frank Street, Caro, was
sentenced to 32 months to four
years in the State Prison of
Southern Michigan at Jack-
son for delivery of marijuana.

He was found guilty of the
charge by a jury Nov. 22, the
offense having taken place in
Caro Aug. 18.

Gerald A. Volz, 23, of Rt. 3
Loomis Road, Unionville, was
sentenced for violation of
probation, to which he
pleaded guilty Dec. 12.

He was sentenced to 90 days
in the county jail, credited
with 69 days served, proba-
tion was continued, and he
was assessed $200 additional
court costs.

He was placed on three
years' probation May 3, 1976,
after having pleaded guilty to
attempted malicious destruc-
tion of property over $100.

The probation violation
stemmed from his having
pleaded guilty to charges of
reckless driving and destruc-
tion of jail property under
$100. in Huron county i n .
October.

that won a conference title
and went to the regionals
before bowing out.

It was great because Cass
City had not won in the
previous 18 years.

Cass Cityans and Elmwood
township-Gagetown residents
got some of their federal tax
dollars back in the form of
public works funds.

The village received $338,-
880, which it is using to pave

^portions of ...Ale, Huron,
Maple, and Sherman Streets.
The Cass City schools got
$120,120, being used to finance
construction of the Campbell
Elementary School addition,
instead of the millage ap-
proved by voters in June.

Gagetown and Elmwood
township received $150,000,
being used to build a new vil-
lage-township hall and fire
station.

Federal money had an im-
pact for other items as well.
After waiting several months,
the village finally received
$128,850 as Uncle Sam's 75 per
cent share to pay the cost for
planning the expansion and
improvement of the waste-
water treatment plant. At
year's end, village officials
were waiting to find out if
they would receive the ap-
proximately $2.6 million be-
ing sought in federal funds to
finance the major share of the
actual construction cost.

The village this year also
received $45,000 from the
federal Farmers Home Ad-
ministration for installation
of water and sewer lines in
the industrial park.

Gagetown and Owendale
both applied for federal funds
to finance planning of sewage
collection and treatment fa-
cilities in those communities.

Users of the Grand Trunk
Western rail line from Imlay
City to Caseville received
good news in July when the
Interstate Commerce Com-
mission administrative law
judge denied the railroad's
petition to abandon the line.

The tracks run through
Kingston, Deford, Cass City,
Gagetown, and Owendale.
The decision didn't mean that
the railroad would improve
its tracks, much of which are
in .poor condition, and the
president of the Michigan

Thumb Producers Railroad,
which wanted to take over the
line, said he was planning an
appeal.

The Owendale-Gagetown
School District continued its
numerous battles during the
year.

One victory for supporters
of the district came in June
when the Michigan Supreme
Court denied an application
for rehearing of a suit to block
the sale of $1.675 million in
borfds for the new High school

Auto theft
charges
dropped

Charges have been dropped
against Mehrl and Gloria
Stull, who were arrested Dec.
1 when Tuscola county depu-
ties found them in possession
of a stolen pickup truck.

Mehrl Stull III was charged
with concealment of stolen
property over $100 in connec-
tion with the theft of the
pickup, taken from a Lovetts-
ville, Va., couple Nov. 29.

In addition, he and his wife
were both charged with pos-
session of stolen property
over $100 in connection with
the Oct. 12 theft of a car
belonging to Larry Lier of
Caro.

Addresses for the couple
include Frederick, Md.; Ar-
cola, Va., and Harper's Fer-
ry, W. Va.

The charges against Stull,
according to the prosecutor's
office, were dropped after he
waived extradition to Virgin-
ia, where he is charged with
the theft of the pickup.

Charges against Mrs. Stull
were dropped, the prosecut-
or's office noted, because
"further investigation re-
vealed that the defendant's
guilt cannot be shown beyond
a reasonable doubt."

The Stalls, both 19, were
arrested Dec. 1 in a Fremont
township gravel pit, where
the pickup truck they were
driving became stuck.

The Lier auto was recov-
ered in Frederick, Md., two
days after it was taken in
Caro. '

building and gymnasium,
plus remodeling of the pres-
ent gym into a cafeteria. The
bonds were sold and demoli-
tion of the old Owendale High
School to clear way for the
new structure began in Oc-
tober.

A major setback for the
district came when the state
appeals court, later upheld by
the supreme court, upheld the
transfer of the Goslin parcel
to the Cass City School Dis-
trict. At year's end, the Owen-
Gage board was still waiting
for a Supreme Court decision
on whether i t will grant the
board's request for a rehear-
ing. Ult imate settlement of
the case will be precedent
setting for other transfer
cases.

Owen-Gage ran out of mon-
ey to pay its employees after
Oct. 14, but in December was
informed it will begin receiv-
ing categorical state aid
again and was waiting to
receive a $150,000 loan ap-
proved by the legislature.

School Menu

JAN. 3-6

TUESDAY

Hot Dog & Bun
Potato Chips
Apple Sauce
White Milk

Cookie

WEDNESDAY

Escalloped Potatoes & Ham
Bread-Butter

Buttered Beans
White Milk

Cookie

THURSDAY

Mashed Potatoes—
Beef in Gravy
'Bread-Butter

Fruit Cup
Celery Sticks
White Milk

Cookie

FRIDAY

Fishwich
Tartare Sauce
Buttered Corn

White Milk
Cookie

Menu subject to change.

Si.• ilver hells cliim<-, filliiifj; th<' air with heurl
wishes, for a year of unlimited happiness, lor all

our devoted friends.

BARTMK'S SERVICE
Corner M-53 and M-81
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1978's

What lucky little guy or gal will be the baby who lands here FIRST in the
New Year of 1978? Just look at the bountiful harvest of gifts this newcomer
will reap if his particular stork arrives in our community soonest after the
stroke of midnight, Dec.31-Jan.1.

$10.00 Gift
Certificate

FROM

KRFIZMANS', INC.
CASS CITY

For The Proud PARENTS A

Congratulations
Cake
FROM

SOMMERS' BAKERY
CASS CITY

$10.00 Toward

Any Prescription
FROM

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
CASS CITY

CONTEST RULES
These Cass City merchants welcome Cass
City area's first baby of 1978 with this list
of wonderful gifts.

Parents need not register or buy anything
to become eligible to win all these
valuable prizes. All that is necessary is
that they be area residents and have their
baby in Hills and Dales General Hospital.
Hospital will be contacted to determine
the winner.

$5.00 Gin
Certificate

FROM

OLD WOOD
DRUG

CASS CITY

$10.00 Worth

Of Baby Merchandise
FROM '

ERLA'S FOOD CENTER
CASS CITY

$25.00

Savings Bond
FROM

THE PINNEY STATE BANK
"A Full Service Bank" CASS CITY

$10.00 WORTH

Baby Food
OR

Merchandise
FROM

IGA FOODLINER
CASS CITY

$5 Baked
Goods

FROM

KONRAD'S BAKERY
CASS CITY

$5.00 In
Merchandise

FROM

Albee Hardware
CASS CITY

$10.00Worth
Of Merchandise

FROM

THE PIED PD7ER
CASS CITY

$5.00 In

Merchandise
FROM

GAMBLE STORE
CASS CITY

***************************^



CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Gif f ord OES
group meets
Twenty-five attended the

Dec. 20 meeting of Gifford
Chapter OES at Gagetown.
Guests were Mr. and Mrs.
Richard Wichterman of Bay
Chapter, Bay City. Joyce
Wichterman is a member of
the Grand Chapter youth
committee.

Fourteen officers answered
roll call. Following a routine
business meeting, there was
the singing of Christmas
carols, a gift exchange and a
lunch served.
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Raffle nets organization over $2,000

Down Memory Lane
FROM THE FILES OF THE CHRONICLE

Tuscola County Big Broth-
ers-Big Sisters made more
than $2,000 from their recent-
ly completed raffle, accord-
ing to organization Director
Evelyn Gilbert.

Ticket sales totaled $2,817,
from which the organization
had to pay for the prizes,
donated at cost by Larry's TV
of Caro.

First prize, a color televi-

sion, was won by Ron Bege-
man of Caro; second place,
40-channel citizens band
radio, C. Richerson of Caro;
third place, AM-FM table
radio, D. Bernier of Saginaw.

More money is needed to
keep the organization in op-
eration, Mrs. Gilbert said,
and some fund raising proj-
ects are being developed in
conjunction with the Jaycees.

FIVE YEARS AGO

The boys at Teen Ranch
in Kingston enjoy the new
pool table purchased with

AROUND THE FARM

SBA loan

program
By William Bortel

You will find the Small
Business Administration pro-
gram summarized below. Its
office is in the basement of
the Civil Defense Center in
Caro, behind the courthouse,
telephone 673-8493.

Eligible Areas: Arenac,
Bay, Huron, Lapeer, Sagi-
naw, Sanilac and Tuscola
counties.

Types of Loans: Physical
disaster - to restore the
victim's home or business
property, real or personal, as
nearly as possible to pre-
disaster conditions. No up-
grading of land is permitted.
Loans to cover crop losses are
available under this program.

Economic Injury - to pro-
vide for a continued cash flow
to the victim so that the
quality of life is maintained
without interruption. Expan-
sion of farm or business
operations is not permitted
with the proceeds of the loan.

lENTRINSEthnG
the professional
do-it-yourself
carpet cleaning
system _..J&/

RINSENVAC
cleans the way
professionals do
at a traction
of the cost

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City Phone 872-2270

Loan limits: Physical dis-
aster - Amount of damages up
to $500,000, except in cases
where undue hardship occurs.
Economic injury - Actual
amount of losses up to $500,-
000, except in cases of undue
hardship.

Interest rates: Physical
disaster - 3 per cent on the
first $250,000, 6-Vn per cent on
amounts in excess of $250,000.
Economic injury - 3 per cent
on the first $25,000, (>•"•* per
cent on amounts in excess of
$25,000. Terms: Usually 10 to
12 years, but can be for as
long as 30 years.

Credit tests: Physical dis-
aster - No credit test is used,
but applicant has to demon-
strate a reasonable abi l i ty to
repay the loan within the
given time. Econornic injury -
Uses a credit test of prior
denial like the test used by the
Farmers Home Administra-
tion.

Computation of eligible
losses: Acres planted x estab-
lished normal yield x per-
centage of loss x market price
- recovery (if known) : eli-
gible loss.

Normal yield: The yield as
determined by the Agri-
cultural Stabil ization and
Conservation Service (ASCS)
for program crops, and the
Statistical Reporting Service
(SRS) for non-program crops.

Coordinating Agencies:
SBA is directed by a joint
memorandum of understand-
ing to coordinate all of its
emergency loan act ivi t ies
with those of the. Farmers
Home Administrat ion.

Multiple applications:
Farmers may not apply for
SBA and Farmers Homo
loans at the same time under
the disaster program. If a
farmer is denied a loan by one
agency, he may then apply to
the other for the needed loan.

Use of proceeds: Up to 50
per cent of the loan may be
used to pay outstanding obli-
gations, including other
loans. Not less than 50 per
cent must be used for the
planting of a new crop.

some $1,500 raised in Cass
City in behalf of the project.
In addition, the boys were
entertained at a pre-Christ-
mas party. The party was held
at the ranch and hosted by
the James Bauers, who have
sponsored the event annually
for several years.

Former resident Charles
Severance, 65, now of Akron,
has written a book entitled
"Tales of the Thumb." The
short stories are set in the
early rural days of the farm-
ing communities of the
Thumb.

The Pinney State Bank
donated $1,000 as a gift to the
park expansion program.
President Frederick Pinney
stated that the gift was the
bank's acknowledgment and
approval of the park
development undertaken by
the council.

Dale Doyen, a junior at
Cass City High School, said
that he has been learning and
practicing the art of
preserving animals in life-
like poses for about three
years. He is a professional
taxidermist. Among many of
his stuffed animals he has a
peacock, iguana and a 42-inch
pike.

TEN YEARS AGO

The flu bug that has closed
several area schools has been
felt at Cass City High School,
but the school will not be
closing.

Joe Frederick helped police
apprehend two and possibly
three young men who
smashed up his laundromat
and are suspected of rifling
two other laundromats in
Caro.

Cass City Village Council
granted village employees a
10 per cent across the board
increase.

Christmas for 29 area
families was made a little
brighter by the distribution of
yule baskets by the Elkland
and Novesta Township
Community Chest.

Cass City Village Council
accepted with regret the
resignation of Glenn "Scotty"
McCullough.

David MacRae and Les
Searls wil l be among 63
students from Oakland
University, Rochester, who

will spend the winter
semester studying in
England.

TWENTY-FIVE YEARS
AGO

Mr. and Mrs. John Hayes,
lifelong residents of Ellington
Township, will be honored
guests at an open house in the

Official Proceedings Of The

TUSCOLA COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

NOVEMBER 22,1977
Meeting of the Tuscola County Board of Commissioners was

called to order by the Chairman, Maynard McConkey.
Roll Call: All present except Nagy and Russell.
Prayer by Chairman McConkey. /
Pledge to the Flag.

77-M-339
home.of Mr> and..M!?- ?-c- Robert Wellington presented local bridge progress report
Hendrick.

For the fourth straight
year, impartial judges from
outside Cass City have named
the Christmas display of
Lloyd Vyse as best in the
village.

Thomas Quinn Jr. is hauling
milk to Bad Axe for Clifton
Endersbe because Endersbe
has been laid up with a
smashed foot.

Laura Bigelow is the new
bookkeeper at Bulen Motors.

Pupils at McHugh school,
taught by Mrs. Keith
Murphy, presented their
annual Christmas program at
Shabbona Community hall.

Jack W. Stahlbaum arrived
from California to spend a 17-
day holiday furlough with his
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Stahlbaum Sr.

THIRTY-FIVE YEARS
AGO

During "Women at War
Week", a woman was
appointed from each
fraternal, social and religious
order in Cass City to organize
stamp and bond buying.

A "share the ride"
program of inter-city trans-
portation is functioning
through the courtesy of
Wood's Drug Store in Cass
City where drivers and
would-be passengers register
their travel intentions.

Local teaches received $50
checks and part-time
employees received $25
checks as Christmas bonuses
from district funds.

Lieut. Shafer of the
Aircraft Warning Dept.
visited Cass City and stated
Cass City's plane spotting
tower was as well equipped
as any he had inspected.

Rev.Lee N. Page
commenced his pastorate at
the First Presbyterian
Church in Cass City.

through Novembers, 1977 and a proposed local bridge construction"
for 1978-1979.

Motion by Wenta, supported by Kennedy we transfer $43,809.23
from Bridge Millage Fund to Road Commission. Motion carried.

Minutes of November 8, 1977 were reviewed.
Motion by Rayl, supported by Collon the minutes be approved

as printed. Motion carried.
77-M-340

Motion by Collon, supported by Wenta, Commissioners Ken-
nedy, Rayl and McConkey be authorized to attend a Three County
meeting at Wildwood Farms on December 5, 1977 at 11:00 a.m.
Motion carried.
77-M-341

A resolution was received from the City of Vassar in regard to a
District Court to be held in Vassar on a part-time basis.

Motion by Kennedy, supported by Rayl the letter be received
and placed on file and the subject of the letter be referred to the
County Affairs Committee for further study and recommendation.
Motion carried.
77-M-342

Motion by Collon, supported by Wenta the meeting dates of the
Board of Commissioners for December be 6 and 20 and a public
hearing for the budget on Revenue Sharing Funds be held
December 20, 1977 at 2:00 p.m. Motion carried.

Recess for lunch.
AFTERNOON SESSION — NOVEMBER 22,1977

Roll Call: All members present except Russell.
77-M-343

Roland Price, District Court Probation Officer appeared
before the Board with a request for part-time help to work during
the regular vacation time of his secretary December 16-30,1977.

Motion by Nagy, supported by Collon, the request be approved.
Motion carried.
77-M-344

Motion by Nagy, supported by Wenta the monthly statement of
the Treasurer's office be received and placed on file. Motion
carried.
77-M-345

Motion by Wenta, supported by Rayl the following rates be
established for Vanderbilt Park: $3.00 annual vehicle pass, $1.00
per day — electricity.

Motion carried.
77-M-346 —-• - -

Motion by Kennedy, supported by Nagy the 1977 revised
Allocation Report of the Equalization Department be officially
approved.

Roll Call Vote: Kennedy, yes; McConkey, yes; Rayl, yes;
Russell, absent; Collon, yes; Wenta, yes; Nagy, yes. 6 yes, 1 ab-
sent. Motion carried.

ALLOCATION REPORT
77M-347

Frank Lenard presented the Tri-County Consortium Title II
and VI Fiscal Report for Tuscola County. Title II and VI 1977-1978
proposed plans for a review for later action within the next month
by the Board.

Motion by Nagy, supported by Wenta the reports be received
and placed on file. Motion carried.
77-M-348

Commissioner Nagy presented the name of Stanley Baldwin in
nomination for the Area Agency on Aging.

Motion by Kennedy, supported by Nagy the nominations be
closed and a unanimous ballot be cast for Stanley Baldwin. Motion
carried.
77-M-349

Motion by Nagy, supported by Kennedy the Sheriff be allowed
to hire 3 Matrons from CETA funds at a salary of $3.5081 per hour.
Motion carried.
77-M-350

Motion by Kennedy, supported by Wenta $6,000.00 be trans-
ferred from the General Fund to the Mental Health Fund being the
budgeted 4th quarter allocation for 1977. Motion carried.

Minutes were read and approved.
Motion by Wenta, supported by Rayl we adjourn to December

6, 1977 at 9:30 a.m. Motion carried.
Elsie Hicks, Clerk Maynard McConkey, Chairman

Big Brothers/Big Sisters

TUSCOLA INTERMEDIATE SCHOOL DISTRICT
TOWNSHIP

AKRON
ALMER
ARBELA
COLUMBIA
DAYTON
DENMARK
ELKLAND
ELLINGTON
ELMWOOD
FAIRGROVE
FREMONT
GILFORD
INDIANFIELDS
JUNIATA
KINGSTON
KOYLTON
ELLINGTON
NOVESTA
TUSCOLA
VASSAR
WATERTOWN
WELLS
WISNER '
VASSAR CITY

TOTALS

VALUATION

25,362,800
18,016,400
15,384,320
18,375,784
10,839,900
29,074,300
22,836,000
8,270,360
7,599,700

18,622,000
13,694,211
16,604,207
31,967,630
11,168,045
8,854,587
5,420,300

18,300,625
8,574,100

12,576,040
11,976,143
8,639,200
7,196,300
9,128,993

15,736,096

354,218,041

SANILAC INTERMEDIATE
TOWNSHIP

OPERATING
.15

3,804.43
2,702.46
2,307.65
2 756.38
1 ,625.99
4,361.15
3425.40
1 240.55
1,139.96
2,793.30
2,054.13
2,490.63
4,795.14
1,675.20
1,328.19

813.05
2,745.09
1,286.12
1,886.41
1,796.42
1,295.88
1,079.45
1,369.34
2,360.42

SPECIALED
1.60

40,580.48
28,826.24
24,614.91
29,401.25
17,343.84
46,518.88
36,537.60
13,232.58
12,159.52
29 795.20
21,910.74
26,566.73
51,148.21
17,868.87
14,167.34
8,672.48

29,281.00
13,718.56
20,121.66
19,161.83
13,822.72
11,514.08
14,606.38
25,177.75

53,132.74 566,748.85

SCHOOL DISTRICT
VALUATION OPERATING SPECIAL

25 ED
.90

HURON INTERMEDIATE SCHOOL
BLDG' DEBT

.17
4,311.67
3,062.78
2,615.34
3,104.89
1,842.78
4,942.63
3.882.12
1,405.97

772.94
3,165.74
2,328.02
2,822.72
5,434.50
1,898.57
1 505.28

921.45
3,111.11
1,457.59
2,137.93
2,035.95
1 ,468.66
1,223.37
1,551.92
2,675.14

59,679.07

VALUATION

289,100

1,133,900

6,046,900

7,469,900

OPERATING
.10

28.91

113.39

604.69

746.99

SAGINAW INTERMEDIATE SCHOOL
CAREER VALUATION OPERAT

ED
2.00

ING
.15

SPEC
ED

2.00

DISTRICT
SPECIAL ED

.75

216.83

850.43

4,535.18

5,602.44

DISTRICT
BLDG

.25

TREASURED MOMENTS
OF THE

HOLIDAY SEASON

TOO
IMPORTANT
TO TRUST

TO ANYTHING
BUT THE BEST

110 BONUS PHOTO'"

41/4 "x 51/4 "Overall

BRING YOUR FILM
TO COACH LIGHT

Here's an eight-year-old
who is in need of special
a t ten t ion from a man. He
likes al l sports, is artistic, and
is very active. He lives in the
Unionvi l le area.

A shy l i t t l e seven-year-old
from Fairgrove needs a Big
Brother to relate to. He likes
the outdoors and loves ani-
mals. This chi ld is very like-
able and eager to please.

Arc you a sports-minded
man? Here's a twelve year
old boy who loves all types of
sports. He is a bit shy, but a
very nice boy, l iving in Caro.

A curly-headed, blue-eyed
fellow, 12-year-old, desper-
ately needs a Big Brother.
From Caro, this guy is a real
hustler and charmer. He
would be happiest with an
active man.

Also in Caro is a blue-eyed,
dark haired young man of
twelve who is extremely ac-

tive with a vivacious person-
al i ty. Again, he needs to be
with a man who is a doer.
There would never be a dull
moment with this fellow.

Big Brothers-Big Sisters in
Tuscola county is located at
230 N. State Street, Caro,
telephone 673-6996; in Huron
county at 121 N. Heisterman
Street, Bad Axe, telephone
209-7264; in Sanilac county at
P.O. Box 1, Sandusky, tele-
phone 648-4433.

Coming1 Auction

Saturday, Jan. 7 - John
Gyomory will hold a Holstein
dairy auction at the place
located 10 miles south of Cass
City or three miles north and
one mile east of Kingston,
corner of Bevens and Ceme-
tery Rd. Boyd Tail, auction-
eer.

The Want Ads are newsy too.

WHERE
QUALITY

IS

GUARANTEED

1J26 BONUS PHOTO*
3'/2" x 6" Overall

If You Are Not Satisfied It
Costs You Nothing!!
Bonus Photos Always
Quality At Discount Prices

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
MIKE WEAVER, Owner Phone 872-3613

Emergency Phone 872-3283
Your Family Discount Drug Store

PEACEFUL
NEW YEAR

OUVRY CHEV.-OLDS, INC.
And All Employees

CM* City Phone 872-430.1

AKRON
ALMER
ARBELA
COLUMBIA
DAYTON
DENMARK
ELKLAND
MILLINGTON
ELMWOOD
FAIRGROVE
FREMONT
GILFORD
INDIANFIELDS
JUNIATA
KINGSTON
KOYLTON
MILLINGTON
NOVESTA
TUSCOLA
VASSAR
WATERTOWN
WELLS
WISNER
VASSAR CITY
TOTALS

TOWNSHIP

AKRON
ALMER
ARBELA
COLUMBIA
DAYTON
DENMARK
ELKLAND
ELLINGTON
ELMWOOD
FAIRGROVE
FREMONT
GILFORD
INDIANFIELDS
JUNIATA
KINGSTON
KOYLTON
MILLINGTON
NOVESTA
TUSCOLA
VASSAR
WATERTOWN
WELLS
WISNER
VASSAR CITY
TOTALS

TOWNSHIP

279,623 41.94

235,600 35.34

559.25

471.20

69.90

58.90

97,900
3,003,100

24.48
750.78

88.11
2,702.79

195.80
6,006.20

3,101,000 775.26 2,790.90 6,202.00

5,543,585 831.54

6,058,808 908.82

11,087.17

12,117,62

1,385.90

1,514.70

TUSCOLA COUNTY ALLOCATION REPORT - 1977
VALUATION

25,362,800
18,016,400
15,663,943
18,664,884
10,839,900
29,309,900
23,969,900
8,270,360

13,646,600
18,622,000
13,694,211
16,604,207
31,967,630
11,168,045
8,952,487
8,423,400

18,300,625
8,574,100

18,119,625
11,976,143
8,639,200
7,196,300
9,128,993

15,736,096
370,847,749

COUNTY
ALLOCATED

4.20

106,523.76
75,668.88
65,788.56
78,392,51
45,527.58

123,101.58
100,673.58
34,735.51
57,315.72
78 212.40
57,515.69
69,737.66

134,264.04
46 905.79
37,600.45
35,378.28
76,862.63
36,011.22
76,102.43
50,299.80
36,284.64
30,224.46
38,341.77
66,091.60

1,557,560.54

COUNTY
SPECIAL
BRIDGES

1.00

25,362.80
18,016.40
15,663.94
18,664.88
10,839.90
29,309.90
23,969.90
8,270.36

13,646.60
18,622.00
13,694.21
16,604.20
31,967.63
11,168.05
8,952.48
8,423.40

18,300.62
8,574.10

18,119.62
11,976.15
8,639.20
7,196.30
9,128.99

15,736.10
370,847.73

TOWNSHIP
ALLOCATED

1.65

41,848.61
29,727.06
25,845.51
30,797.05
17,885.84
48,361.33
39,550.34
13,646.09
22,516.89
30,726.30
22,595.45
27,396.94
52,746.59
18,427.27
14,771.60
13,898.62
30,196.03
14,147.27
29,897.38
19,760.64
14,254.68
11,873.90
15,062.84

TOWNSHIPS?
VOTED FIRE
FIRE-
AMBULANCE

6,340.71

9,332.44"

4,713.24

8,270.36

TOWNSHIPS?
VOTED
LIBRARY

5,586.60

9,150.31

7,169.50
11,976.15

55,943.35

18',300.62

TOWNSHIPS?
VOTED
ROAD

25,362.80
18,016.40
15,663.94

24,811.08

31,657.40

16,604.20

11,168.05

585,934.23 56,952.71 79,830.57 143,283.87

VALUATION

AKRON
ALMER
ARBELA
COLUMBIA
DAYTON
DENMARK
ELKLAND
ELLINGTON
ELMWOOD
FAIRCPOVE
FREMONT
GILFORD
INDIANFIELDS
JUNIATA
KINGSTON
KOYLTON
MILLINGTON
NOVESTA
TUSCOLA
VASSAR
WATERTOWN
WELLS '
WISNER
VASSAR CITY
TOTALS

25,362,800
18,016,400
15,663,943
18,664,884
10,839,900
29,309,900
23,969,900
8,270,360

13,646,600
18,622,000
13,694,211
16,604,207
31,967,630
11,168,045
8,952,487
8,423,400

18,300,625
8,574.100

18,119,625
11,976,143
8,639,200
7,196,300
9,128.993

15,736,096
370.847.749

OPERATING
ALLOCATED

228,265.20
162,147.60
140,989.46
168,056.23
97,559.10

263,800.88
216,012.58
74,433.25

124,331.13
167,598.00
123,247.90
149,437.86
287,708.67
100,512.40
80,572.38
75,810.60

164,705.63
77,166.90

163,353.81
107,785.29
77,752.80
64,766.70
82.160.94

141,624.86
3,339,800.17

SCHOOL TAXES
SPEC VOTED SPEC VOTED
OPERATING

422,411.63
288,254.34
219,321.61
274,931.57
153,828.70
437,898.32
287,906.48
•121..910.91
176,625.99
348,485.20
205,423.54
283.013.24
495,469.53
162,800.72
114,903.82
120,063.05
256,208.75
102,031.79
243,784.82
156,878.99
126,398.40
102,308.49
154,268.05
204,569.24

5,459,697.18

DEBT

92,786.50
10,695.40
13,654.47
90,860.47
39,967.42

117,696.14
19,946.98
4,658.48

17,103.44
19,158.61
54,020.54
49,442.14
16,182.08
12,664.81
25,394.42
27,512.51
15,006.51 '
6,859.28

36,799.47
16,638.61
24,141.39
11,940.25
30,582.59
22,602.62

776.215.13

SPEC VOTED
BLDG OR
SITE

DRAIN
SPREAD

5,452.07
6,589.71

391.47 16,420.00
11,127.20

7.75
329.84 7,019.43

4,826.90
11,607.16
20,. 110.86

6,306.36

14,64859
9,500.00
4,593.25

400.00

7,761.02 16,843.04

8.482.33

11.217.30
1,323.62

147,993.64

TOTAL

1,003,050.66
643,707.27
543,947.95
717,670.61
386,428.90

1,088,618.76
732,868.80
311,442.04
442.359.22
755,911.61
502,790.22
650,422.68

1,135,659.74
399,738.72
309,004.35
305,546.46
624,268.30
261,252.83
637.281.70
398,309.83
304,058.37
242,127.00
358,290.12
482,061.35

13,236,817.49

DRAIN
FROM

GENERAL
FUND

'4,312.70
3,315.58
8.210.00
5,521.52

20.93
4,267.71

2,758.44
5,904.38

10,797.43

3,716.01
9.36

7,685.38
4,750.00
2,275.58

200.00

8,42058

6,886.69
1,987.08

81,039.61
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Issue by issue here are highlights
that helped make the news in 1977

JANUARY

Jan. 6 - Cass City village
employees win 1977 wage and
fringe benefit increase total-
ing 8.64 per cent from village
council; Julie Ann, daughter
of Mr. and Mrs. Rodney
Devore, first baby of 1977
born at Hills and Dales Gen-
eral Hospital; smoke alarm
saves the mobile home of
Donna DeLong, Kelly Rd.

Jan. Hi -- Four of six
dissident property owners
who lost an earlier attempt to
stop the sale of Owen-Gage
School District bonds file
claim of appeal with Michi-
gan Court of Appeal; fire
believed started by over-
heated oil heater destroys
Harry Pyonk home on Cum-
ber Road, seven miles south-
west of Ubly; Maynard Mc-

Conkey, Cass City, elected
chairman of Tuscola County
Board of Commissioners.

Jan. 20 -- Cass City Village
Council to apply for $350,000
grant through Farmers Home
Administration to develop in-
dustrial park property owned
by Cass City Development
Corp.; Cass City Board of
Education okays first step in
drive for new county voca-
tional education center;
American Civil Liberties
Union and Mrs. Joyce Lane
win 3-month battle to have
guidelines changed for dis-
ciplining of students with
unexcused absences; one of
coldest winters in Michigan
history continues to hold
Thumb in its icy grip as
below-zero temperatures
drain fuel supplies and
force at least one major

Hillside Beauty Salon
Sandy Scott - Bonnie Gaszczynski

Sally Masten - Kathy Root
Cass City

utility to cut back its power
supply.

Jan. 27 -- Defiant Tuscola
County Board of Commission-
ers declares war against
state's property tax system
as it votes to reject 1976
residential property study as
presented by equalization de-
partment; state comes under
fire from Michigan Thumb
Producers Railroad Corp. for
not backing a move to pur-
chase 100 grain hopper cars
which could have been used
by the railroad; 350 street
signs gift from Uncle Sam to
Cass City; Thumb National
Bank and Trust Co. of Pigeon
announces application for
branch office in Cass City has
been denied.

FEBRUARY

Feb. :t - Railroad future in
Cass City appears cloudy as
Interstate Commerce Com-
mission opens hearings on
rail abandonment; additions
to the Hills and Dales General
Hospital made possible by
recently completed major
portion of the fund raising
drive, a total of $476,240, will
be completed in about two
years; fire levels mobile
home of Robin and Shirley
LaFond of Kingston.

Feb. 10 - Cass City grows
by 14 acres as county board of
commissioners approves an-
nexation of property at the
west village l imits; railroad
abandonment hearing ends,
decision in case must be
rendered within 120 days;
Sanilac county one of 11
Michigan counties declared
disaster areas as result of the
late January blizzard.

Feb. 17 -- Cass City School
Board decides school will
probably be able to operate in
1977-78 at no increase in
millage rate for district tax-
payers; governor asks presi-
dent Carter to declare Tus-
cola and 30 other Michigan
counties federal disaster area
in the wake of winter snow-
storms that blocked roads,
closed schools and factories,
and did property damage;

Find The Service Or Product
Need In This

LJSERYICE DIRECTOR
Auto Service Caterers Dining (com.)

Clare's Sunoco Service
• Tune Ups • Minor Repairs

• Tires • Batteries
• Undercoating • Grease & Oil

Call 872-2470

Winters'

COLONY HOUSE
8430 N. Van Dyke, Cass City

Specializing In
Weddings • Banquets

Phone 872-3300 or 872-3103

L & S Standard Service
Phone 872-2342

Certified Mechanics

Complete Car Care
Service

WRECKER SERVICE

Cleaners

Village Service Center
Tires • V-Belts • Batteries

{Tune Ups • Brakes • Mufflers

Free
In-Town Pickup & Delivery

Phone 872-3850

EICHER'S CLEANERS
• Alterations
• Draperies
• Wedding Gowns
• CoatRelining

6471 Main, Cass City
Phone 872-3264

Wildwood Farms
Restaurant • Lounge • Motel

Open 7 Days A Week
Dancing • Saturdays 10 p.m.
6320 Van Dyke, Cass City

Phone 872-2720

Farm Equipment

Hedley Equipment Co., Inc.
IH Farm Equipment
Ski-Doo Snowmobiles
Stihl & McCulloch Chain Saws

Ports and Service
1800 W. CaroRoad, Caro

Phone 673-4164

Grocery

Christian Book Store

Bakery

Sommer's
Bakery & Restaurant

• Home of Irish Bread
• Daily Lunch Special

Mon.-Thurs. -7 a.m. • 6 p.m.
Fri.-7a.m.-8p.m.

Sat. -7a.m. -5p.m.
Cass City 872-3577

Bowling

NEW LOCATION
THE WORD

Bibles • Books • Gifts
Records • Tapes

Mon.-Frl. • 10 a.m. • 9 p.m.
Sat. 10a.m.-5:30p.m.

6451 Main Street
Cass City

M & R Grocery
Beer & Wine

Groceries & Meat

Man.-Sat. • 7a.m.-11 p.m.
Sun.- 9a .m. -11 p.m.

4119 S. Seeger St., Cass City
Phone 872-3313

Dining

Cass City Lanes
4533 Weaver 872-2844

Open Bowling
Wed. 6:30 p.m. Fri. 6:30 p.m.

Sat. 1 p.m.-?
Sun. 1 p.m.-6p.m.-8:15-?

65$ Per Game

CHARMONT
Friday Buffet5 p.m.-10 p.m.
Mon.-Thurs. • 10:30 a.m.-9 p.m.

Fri.-Sat. 10:30 a.m.-10 p.m.
Sun. -12 noon -8 p.m.

Pizza & Short Orders
till 1 a.m.

Cass City 872-4200

Hair Styling

HAIR BENDERS
Specializing In

Cutting • Styling • Perms
Tues.& Fn.-8a.rn. -6p.m.

Wed. & Thurs. • 8 a.m. • 8:30 p.m.
Sal.-7 a.m.-3p.m.

6350Garfield Phone 872-3145

Oil and Gas

Building Materials

Croft-Clara Lumber, Inc.
Cass City 872-2141

Andersen Windows
Dexter locks
Prefini$he<t Paneling

Mon.-Frl. • 8 a.m. • 5:30 p.m.
Sat.-8a.m.-5 p.m.

Pizza Villa
Spaghetti-Lasagna

Pizza, Salads, Sandwiches
Mpn.-Thurs. 8a.m.-10p.m.

Fri. 8a.m.-3a.m.
Sat. 4 p.m.-3 a.m.

Sunday 12 p.m.-12 a.m.
For Take Out Orders

Call 872-4440

Mac & Leo Service

Total Gas and Oil Products
For Home and Farm Delivery

Call

872-3122
6314 Main ' Cass City

This space could
be yours for

as little as $16.29
for 13 weeks

fire does $8,000 damage to the
mobile home of Ray Smutek
of Huntsville Trailer Park.

Feb. 2-1 - Water lines still
freezing in Cass City. Supt.
Lou LaPonsie states so far
this year, 33 frozen water
lines have been thawed by
village workmen; Bill Juhasz
becomes Cass City's first
Eagle Scout in five years;
Elkland township wrestles
with ambulance service
future.

MARCH

March :i -- "We're number
one!," cry students and fans
following 65-64 victory over
Frankenmuth, giving Cass
City first conference basket-
ball crown in nearly 20 years;
apparent friction between
Elkland Township Fire De-
partment and Cass City Pub-
lic Schools results in sus-
pension of unscheduled fire
drills conducted by the de-
par tment ; Patricia Goslin
and Ann Whittaker co-vale-
dictorians of class of 1977
with perfect 4.0 grade point
average, Cathy Hobart salut-
atorian with 3.946 grade point
average; no water and sewer
line construction in Cass
City's industr ial park un t i l at
least September, village off i -
cials told.

March 10 - Area hospital
room rates still soaring, sur-
vey shows; Tuscola County
Board of Commissioners
agrees to meet with super-
visors of five southern town-
ships to set up solid waste
disposal p lan t ; new officers
for the 1977-78 Cass City
Chamber of Commerce are
president, Dick Albee; vice-
president Phil Keating; sec-
retary, Jim Kctchum, and
treasurer, Gloria Ouvry.

March 17 - Owen-Gage
School Board gears for anoth-
er legal f igh t af ter i l learns
Grant township officials are
holding a portion of district's
debt retirement monies in
escrow; vandals open 18 fire
hydrants throughout the vil-
lage; Thumb District Health
Department reports among
Tuscola students, 15 per cent
lack required shots.

March 2-1 - Tax hassle
between Grant township and
Owen-Gage School District
apparently settled when
township board rescinds ear-
lier resolution to withhold
part of the district's debt
retirement millage; Tuscola
County Board of Commis-
sioners okays CETA corpora-
tion plan; Michigan Thumb
Producers Railroad Corp.
poised to begin operating
track owned by Chessie sys-
tem from Port Austin to Cros-
well, but future of its plan to
take over part of the Grand
Trunk line serving Cass City
still in doubt.

March ;!l - Owen-Gage
School Board moves to drop
further legal action against
Grant township for withhold-
ing district property taxes;
six week-end grass fires
plague Elkland township fire-
men.

APRIL

April 7 -- Elkland electors
vote to give Cultural Center to
the village; fire destroys
home of Mrs. Mary Vatter on
Decker Road in Shabbona;
explosion blows apart home
of Clare Roller on Bruce
Street in Deford.

April 14 - Cass City School
Board stalls teacher bargain-
ing plans; Owen-Gage dissi-
dents who try to stop the
scheduled sale of school
bonds will be sued; voter
approval for small addition,
at estimated cost of $117,000
to Campbell Elementary
School sought by the Cass
City School Board.

April 21 -- Damage esti-
mated at $10,000 in fire that
heavily damages house
owned by P. Newingham on
Third Street in Cass City;
Cass City police continue
investigation of theft of $150 in
drugs, taken in break-in from
Coach Light Pharmacy.

April 28 -- Objections by
Wesley's milk plant officials
to costs connected with Cass
City's proposed $3.5 million
wastewaler treatment plant
could stall project in its
tracks; Mrs. Helen Baker
receives Chamber of Com-
merce citizen of the year
award, Cathy Hobart named
Junior citizen of the year;
Cass City Village Council un-
decided on fate of the Cultural
Center.

MAY

May 5 - New three-year
contract between Walbro
Corp. and United Auto Work-

ers Local 213 rat if ied; Tus-
cola County Sheriff's detec-
tives continuing investigation
into breaking and entering at
Cass City NFO grain termi-
nal ; Ken. E. Jensen new
administrator at Hills and
Dales General Hospital.

May 12 - Cass City High
School band uniforms get
okay from the school board;
Elkland Township Supervisor
Edwin Karr expected to re-
sign post, following appoint-
ment as appraiser by Tuscola
County Board of Commis-*
sioners; damage estimated at
$60,000 when fire guts Scott
Kelley home.

May 1!) - Village Supt. Lou
LaPonsie expects to receive
letter of intent from Wesley's
Quaker Maid, officials pledg-
ing firm will go along with
federal Environmental Pro-
tection Agency rules govern-
ing the proposed Cass City's
wastewater treatment plant;
drought puts crimp in county
farm picture; fire destroys
mobile home of Larry Levine
near Gagetown; spectacular
grass fire destroys 300 pine
trees on land owned by John
Karpovich in Novesta town-
ship.

May 2(i - Council okays
request by Thomas Herron to
develop another 40 acres at
north village l imits; fire does
estimated $10,000 damage to
the Richard Wright home;
water tower repairs will be-

X A
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You Always
Feel

WELCOME
At Coach Light

(Tell Us If We Are Wrong)

Nine Years Ago We Made
A Firm Commitment To
Offer The Finest Service
In The Area. You Jelt- Us
We have Succeeded By
Steadily Making Our Store
Your Shopping Head-
quarters. Thank You Very
Much.

Service At Coach Light Means:
• 10% Discount For Senior Citizens

• Discount Patent Medicine Prices

• Remodeled and Enlarged Store

• Friendly Service Always

• Name Brands You Can Trust

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
MIKE WEAVER, Owner Ph. 872-3613

Emergency Ph)872-3283
Your Family Discount Drug Store

CLASSIFIEDS
Transit (nonbusiness) rates.
20 words or less, $1.00 each
insertion; additional words 4
cents each. Three weeks for
the price of two - cash rate.
Save money by enclosing
cash with mail orders. Rates
for display want ad on appli-
cation.

General
[Merchandise]

gin May 25; Jack LeRoy
Zellar of Caro reported in
serious condition after car-
bicycle accident.

JUNE

June 2 -- Red tape stalls
sewage treatment plant as
funding is lost this year; Cass
City Development Corp. to
receive $45,000 from FHA for
development of industrial
park property in the south-
west corner of village; con-
struction slated to begin on
1,500 square-foot addition to
Rawson Memorial Library;
there are 2,436 residents in
Cass City.

June 9 -- Groundbreaking
for new Plaza West, 4,000
square-foot shopping mall, to
be held within a week; Cass
City police will up its force
this summer; four candidates
seeking two seats on the Cass
City School Board. They are
Ellen Thresa Burnette, Dean
Hoag, Thomas Herron and
Albert W. Curtis.

June 16 -- Cass City village
to spend federal windfall of
$459,000 on school and streets;
Owen-Gage set to sell school
bonds June 29; Hills and
Dales General Hospital f in-
ishes fiscal year in the black;
Cass City School Board ap-
proves 8 per cent pay hike for
non-union staff .

June 21! - Landfills in
Gagetown, Elmwood and
Columbia, along with four
others in northern Tuscola
county facing a July 1 shut-
down; 200 attend 100th anni-
versary of First Presbyterian
church of Cass City; Tuscola
county's wheat crop will prob-
ably be about 25 per cent less
than normal.

June 30 - Tuscola county to
get $200,000 for construction
of a new animal shelter;
Tuscola County Road Com-
mission lays off 30 employees
for indefinite period; Cass
City Village Council changes
mind on industrial park in-
stallations and decides to take
bids.

JULY

July 7 - Owen-Gage sells
high school bonds, ground-
breaking slated July 23; Tus-
cola County Road Commis-
sion employees voting on new
contract; dairyman Ken
Voelker was killed in a head-
on crash in Ohio.

July 14 - Rail line through
Cass City staying open; par-
ents fight to expand local
school band program; former
Cass City resident Jack R.
Zellar dies after having been
hospitalized since May 21,
when he was struck by a car
while riding his bicycle;
Mark Emmons, charged with
two counts of first degree
murder, arraigned before
District Judge Richard F.
Kern.

July 21 -- Dwindling mem-
bership poses threat to Amer-
ican Legion Tri-County Post
507; Thumb Intelligence Unit,
an undercover drug investi-
gation unit, may be abolished
because three Thumb count-
ies that partially fund it may
decide they can't afford it;
temperature of 108 degrees
reported at the Cass City
wastewater treatment plant.

July 28 - Cass City State
Bank set to build new build-
ing; sewage plant planning
funds delayed because of
changes in the federal En-
vironmental Protection
Agency regulations regarding
installation of sewer lines;
Tuscola County Board of
Commissioners takes steps to
replace the Thumb Intelli-
gence Unit with a county-lev-
el un i t .

AUGUST

Aug. t -- Cass City police
arrest three men charged in
connection with the opening
of 18 fire hydrants; Cass
Cityans getting richer, fig-
ures show an increase of 38
per cent from the per capita
income in 1969; Owen-Gage
voters okay 6.25 mill renewal
request; Elmwood township
to use Cass City landfill.

Aug. 11 -- Owen-Gage
School Board approves rent-
ing of St. Agatha's School in
Gagetown for 1977-78 school
year; Cass City School Board
refuses to buckle under pres.-
sure applied by parents hop-
ing for the addition of assist-
ant band director to school
staff, members vote unani-
mously not to raise their
salaries.

Aug. 18 -- More court battles
loom as Owen-Gage dissi-
dents win appeal decision-
Cass City Historical Society
holds organizational meeting
and names Jack Esau as
president; shooting fracas
forces former Gagetown vil-
lage police officer, Claude
Harry King, to quit.

Please turn to page 16.

BULK PROPANE systems
for grain driers or home
heating. Fuelgas Company of
Cass City. Phone 872-2161.

2-11-14-tf

[ Automotive] Winter Clearance
FOR SALE - 1974 Chevy
Impala Custom. Less than
15,000 miles. 4 miles east of
Cass City, first house south on
M-53, across from Fuelgas.

1-12-15-3

FOR SALE - 1976 Monza
Towne Coupe, 14,000 miles.
Excellent condition. Phone
872-3786. 1-12-22-2

Investigate

Kingston

break-in
More than $1,000 in mer-

chandise was stolen from a
Kingston area home Dec. 20,
one of several recent break-
ins in that area.

Eugene Sutphen of 5158 S.
Cemetery Road, Kingston,
reported to sheriff's deputies
that his home was entered
between 6:45 and 10 p.m.
Officers found footprints in
the snow all around the house,
indicating the intruders first
walked around it to make
sure no one was home.

The burglars kicked in a
door to the garage, then
kicked in a door from the
garage into the home to gain
entry.

The most expensive item
stolen was a Barwick grand-
father clock, with Sutphen's
name inscribed inside the
door, worth $500.

Also taken were two chain-
saws, valued at a total of
$230; a $50 jewelry box con-
taining $150 in women's jew-
elry; a $10 jewelry box with
$150 in men's jewelry; two
men's Longines watches, one
with Sutphen's name en-
graved on it, total of $250, and
several miscellaneous items,
total of $89.

Ladies' winter coats and
jackets 25% off

Children's winter coats
and jackets 25% off

Ladies' pant suits and
jackets 25% off

Snowmobile suits, men's,
women's, boys' and
children's 25%.off-

Men's and boys' winter
jackets 25% off

Federated Store
Cass City

2-12-29-1

FOR SALE -1973 Ski Doo 294
Silver Bullet snowmobile. Ex-
cellent condition. Call 872-
3187. 2-12-15-3

HOMELITE
CHAIN SAWS

Complete Selection
at

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City
2j_-25-tf

VIVA GAS Grills, with
wheels, from $119.95. Fuelgas
Co. of Cass City, corner M-53
and M-81. Phone 872-2161.

2-4-14-tf

3 horses

die in

accident
Two horses were killed and

a third put to sleep after being
struck by a car Dec. 20. The
horses were owned by the
Michigan Teen Ranch near
Kingston.

Sheriff's deputies reported
that Charles 0. McLaughlin,
22, of Rossman Road, Kings-
ton, was northbound on
Kingston Road at 7 a.m., just
north of Lanway Road, when
he crested a hi l l and struck
the three animals, which
were in the road.

The impact threw one of the
horses into a southbound car
driven by Kenneth W. Rey-
nolds, 24, of Marlette.

Two of the animals were
killed instant ly; a veterinar-
ian was summoned to put the
third to sleep.

Advertise it in The Chronicle.

ORDINANCE NO. 90

AN ORDINANCE RELA-
TIVE TO THE ESTABLISH-
MENT OF COMPENSA-
TION FOR THE VILLAGE
PRESIDENT AND FOR
THE MEMBERS OF THE
VILLAGE COUNCIL.

The Village of Cass City
ordains:

Section 1. The President of
the Village of Cass City shall
be paid the sum of Thirty
dollars for each council meet-
ing attended, but not to
exceed the sum of Four
Hundred Fifty in any one
year.

Section 2. The members of
the Village Council of the
Village of Cass City shall each
be paid the sum of Twenty
dollars for each council meet-
ing attended, but not to
exceed the sum of Three
Hundred in any one year.

Section 3. The Clerk of the
Village of Cass City shall be
paid the sum of Twenty
dollars for each council meet-
ing attended, but not to
exceed the sum of Three
Hundred dollars in any one
year.

Section 4. The Treasurer of
the Village of Cass City shall
be paid the sum of Seven
Hundred dollars per year.

Passed, adopted and ap-
proved at the regular meeting
of the Common Council of the
Village of Cass City on the
27th day of December, 1977.

Lambert Althaver, President

Lynda Mclntosh, Clerk

CASH FOR
LAND CONTBACTS

Any type of real estate
throughout Michigan
.No commissions or costs
First National Accept.,
Call Free 1-800-292-1550

We're Dealing at B & W !
2 Locations To Serve You

Caro Lot - 842 State St. Cass City Lot - 6617 Main St.
If76 PINTO, 4-ipaed, iharp $2795
1975 MUSTANG 2+2,4 -cy l . , stick ihift $2695
1975 CHEVROLET CAPRICE loaded, AIR $3595
1975 VEGA HATCHBACK 4-ipod .. $1795
1974 PONTIAC GRAND PRIX loaded, AIR $3895
1974 MUSTANG II 2-dr., H.T., 4-cyl., auto., 20,000 mllei .. $2295
1974 CAMIRO 6-cyl,, itick $2795
1971 PLYMOUTH Sporti Fury wagon $1295
1973 BEL AIRE SEDAN 4-door, V-J, auto., PS/PB $1495
1973 PONTIAC CATAUNA 2-dr., H.T., V-8auto.,PS/PB .... $17»5
1972 IMPALA 2-dr., H.T., S auto., PS/PB. AIR $1795
1971 PONTIAC 4-door icdon $ 895
1971 PONTIAC Ventura $1395

PICK-UP
1975 FORD 'A-TON I avto., PS/PB Ranger, XLT $2395
1976 FORD Vj-TON ., $3895

Open Monday thru Thursday 9 to 5
Friday 9 to 7 Saturday 9 to 12

Or Anytime by Appointment

B& W
AUfO SA1ES

6617 Main, Cass City Phone 872-4620
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Merchandise
General

Merchandise
General

Merchandise
( Notices ] [ Notices ) [ Notices ]

FOR RENT - Electric adding
machine by day or week. Oi
rent a new Smith-Corona
portable typewriter. Also new
and used typewriters for sale,
all makes. Leave your type-
writers and other office equip-
ment at our store for repair.
McConkey Jewelry and Gift
Shop. 2-10-6-tf

GAS SPACE HEATERS - new
and used, from $75. Controls
included. Fuelgas Company,
toe., .corner M-81 and M-53,,
Cass City. Phone 872-2161.

2-2-3-tf

USED

CHAIN SAWS

at

Gamble Store

Cass City
2-12-15-tf

WEDDING INVITATIONS
and announcements. A com-
plete line of printing, raised
printing or engraving. Dozens
to choose from. Cass City
Chronicle, Cass City.

2-1-12-tf

SALE - Glass lined water
heaters, gas. From 30 gallon
to 75 gallon. Fuelgas Co. of
Cass City. Phone 872-2161.

2-9-23-tf

TWO COON HOUNDS - one
registered female treeing
walker 3 years old, one male
blue tick 4 years old - deer
broke. Excellent tree dogs.
Fence, carrying box. One-
year-old wheat light with
charger, reasonable. Call
after 5. Phone 635-7346.

2-12-22-3

FOR SALE - 1 model No. 51
Ithaca trap grade, used 5
months. After 6.'00p.m. phone
658-8477. 2-12-15-3

FOR SALE - 5 Border Collie
puppies, female. First come,
first served. $10. Phone 872-
3371. 2-12-22-4

FOR SALE - two pike fishing
spears, handmade, and two
perch spears. Reasonably
priced. Phone 872-2947.

2-12-22-2

APARTMENT gas range -
Magic Chef. $189.95 and trade.
Fuelgas Co., Cass City, phone
872-2161. Corner M-53 and
M-81. 2-7-1-tf

FOR SALE - eggs - small, 40
cents. Medium, 55 cents.
Large, 60cents. 4 miles south,
W> west on Severance Rd.
Ron Patera. 2-12-29-3

Winter Clearance
Ladies' winter coats and
jackets 25% off

Children's winter coats
and jackets, 25% off

Ladies' pant suits and
-jackets "25%"6ff

Snowmobile suits, men's,
women's, boys' and
children's 25% off

Men's and boys' winter
jackets 25% off

Federated Store
Cass City

2-12-29-1

SNOW TIRE SALE - For all
your tire and alignment
needs, call Kingston Tire
Center at GR3-27(i2. 2-10-27-tf

FOR SALE - 1970 Evinrude
snowmobile and gas. Phone
872-4228. 2-12-1-6

PAPER NAPKINS imprinted
with names and dates for
weddings, receptions, show-
ers, anniversaries and other
occasions. The Cass City
Chronicle. 2-1-12-tf

AVON OPENS Doors. You'll
be amazed how friendly
people can be when you're
selling America's most pop-
ular cosmetics. To find out
how you can become an Avon
Representative, call 872-2525
or write Virginia Seroka, 2841
N. Van Dyke, Decker, Mi.

5-12-8-4

Free Estimates

on roofing, siding, insulation,,
aluminum doors and windows
and aluminum or Fiber Glass
awnings

Elkton Roofing
& Siding Co.

Phone 269-7469 6

5-7-21-tf

TOP DOLLAR paid on good
quality red fox and muskrats.
Ross Fur Market, Caseville.
Phone 856-2324. 5-12-15-5

WANT TO RENT - 1 or 2
bedroom house or apartment
by Jan. 5. Reply to PO box 10,
Pigeon, Mi. 48755. 5-12-15-3

GAME PARTY - Every Sun-
day night at St. Pancratius
hall, Cass City, 7:30 p.m.

5-2-20-tf

I WILL BE teaching organ
and piano lessons. Contact
Bonnie Lockwood, P.O. 25,
Cass City or call 872-4737 af-
ter 4. 5-12-15-3

WANTED - barn beams - slab
lumber - power and hand
tools. All donations,tax de:.
ductible. Caro Area Services
For the Handicapped. Phone
517-673-7721. 5-3-10-tf

HAPPY BIRTHDAY Elmer -
A little bird told us your
birthday is due. Like to have
been there to sing Happy
Birthday to you. From
Thelma and Cliff Jackson.

5-12-29-ln

LOST - boy's red and white
knit hat and girl's tan shoe for
right foot.coming home from
school. Call 872-4676. 5-12-15-3

W A N T E D - o l d pocke t
watches,-rings, chains. Call
872-2635 after 5 p.m.

5-2-20-tfn

Real Estate
For Sale

Services ]

GAME PARTY - Every Sun-
day night at St. Pancratius
hall, Cass City, 7:30p.m.

5-2-20-tf

FOR SALE BY B.A. CALKA REAL ESTATE

AMONG THE PINES & WHITE BIRCH!!!
10 ACRES: 3 bedroom home with BRICK FIREPLACE and
HEATILATOR; laundry room off kitchen; 12x30' living room;
kitchen and dining area 25' in length; sliding doors to
sunroom; barbecue patio; large car-port; lots of dwarf fruit
trees, raspberries, currants, rhubarb; strawberries, shrubs,
flowers - LOTS OF PINE AND WHITE BIRCH - many other
features - Offered to you for $37,500.00 terms. Your inspection
invi ted! ! ! !

NEED MORE ROOM? SAFE FOR CHILDREN!!!

IMMEDIATE POSSESSION!!! Very neat 8 room home - l'/2
bathrooms; 22x28' FAMILY ROOM with Franklin Stove - large
dining room; breakfast nook - plus basement; attached garage
-plus many other features; MOVE RIGHT IN!!! Your inspec-
tion invited!!! FINANCING AVAILABLE only 10 per cent
down.

READY TO MOVE INTO!!!!!
MOBILE HOME in very good condition - well cared for -
natural gas forced hot air furnace; heavy duty air conditioner;
electric range and refrigerator; two davenports; 3 end tables;
2 beds; etc., 16' canopy - self-supporting TV antenna, etc.
EXTRA LARGE LOT 120' x 2101 - $13,500.00. IMMEDIATE
POSSESSION!!!!

IN CASS CITY: Frame 5 room home - 2 bedrooms; natural
gas heat - basement; garage - near schools, playground and
shopping - all this for $18,200.00.

SPECIAL!!!!!

Two income brick building - separate entrances - natural
gas fired steam heat - wall to wall carpeting - basement;
reduced to $10,500.00 for QUICK SALE.

A-lCONDITION!!!!
COUNTRY HOME: RANCH TYPE with 3 bedrooms; wall to
wall carpeting; IV;. BATHROOMS; family room; 24 x 40'
garage and workshop; aluminum siding; 14x14' PATIO for
outdoor cooking; formal dining room; 2 ut i l i ty buildings; home
is 4 years old - comes with Harvest gold refrigerator and
range; also, curtains and drapes remain. ALL THIS ON extra
large lot 198 x 198' - blacktop road — $37,500.00 terms.

YOUR INSPECTION INVITED!!!!
COUNTRY HOME: BRICK FIREPLACE with heatilator; 4
large bedrooms; lots of closet and storage space; over 1500
square feet of living space; plus BASEMENT; gas heating
system with forced hot water with 3 zones; built in 1973; two
car garage attached; 2 BATHROOMS; formal dining room;
newly landscaped —- l'/2 ACRES — Offered to you for
$44,900.00. terms. Your inspection invited!!!!!!

IN CASS CITY: Two story frame home with new aluminum
siding; black shutters; natural gas heating system about 3
years old; wall to wall carpeting; REMODELED recently;
family room with electric fireplace; 3 bedrooms with lots of
closets and storage space; !'/:> bathrooms; attic insulated;
many other features - $27,500.00 terms.

COUNTRY HOME: West of Cass City you will find this 7
ROOM BRICK HOME; oil fired steam boiler new in 1967; 3
bedrooms plus sunroom with sliding aluminum windows;
formal dining room; with attractive wainscoting; modern
kitchen with natural finish cabinets; built-in oven and built-in
range; dinette area panelled; beautiful natural wood trim;
medium size barn has concrete floor; all this is situated on one
acre of well kept grounds with large shade trees; attic is
insulated!!! Your inspection invited!!!!! Offered to you for
$32,000.00 on terms. OPTIONAL — 44x12' machinery storage
building available for $9,000.00. IF purchased with above
property.

EVERYTHING GOES!!!!!
CHILDREN'S AND LADIES' Clothing Store - 22x126' with
living quarters upstairs; building is in sound condition;
COMES WITH $25,000.00 in clothing, plus all show cases;
racks, fixtures, chests, fluorescent lighting fixtures; full
basement; 3 large bedrooms; dining room; plus room for
additional rooms; garage; YOUR INSPECTION INVITED!!!

ALL THE ROOM YOU NEED FOR YOUR FAMILY!!!
In Cass City: Practically all remodeled recently: all new
kitchen- all new bathroom: 14x27' livine- room with recessed
lights; wall to wall carpeting; all NEW 26x30' gfarage 2 1/2 car
with 9x26' workshop; anchor fencing cost over $1100.00 -
10x16'. PATIO, natural gas furnace; laundry room off kitchen;

. 4 large bedrooms with lots of closets and storage space;
over $1800.00 spent on kitchen cabinets; YOUR INSPECTION
INVITED!!!! Offered to you for $33,500.00 terms.

IMMEDIATE POSSESSION!!!
NEW SUBDIVISION: Brick & Aluminum siding; approximately
1500 square feet of living space; plus full basement; kitchen
cabinets alone cost over $1500.00; plus BRICK FIREPLACE
with heatilator; all lo^ge rooms; FAMILY ROOM; Andersen
windows; 22x24' garage; 1 1/2 bathrooms; many other built-
ins - MOVE RIGHT IN - 10% down. '

FOR RENT: Modern BUSINESS BUILDING -- suitable for
various offices or retail business - next to Gamble Store in Cass
City - available January 1, 1978.

SPECIAL !!!!

COUNTRY HOME: Close in to Cass City — 8 room home with
4 bedrooms, BRICK FIREPLACE WITH heatilator,
recreation room in basement, built-in range and oven,
attic and walls insulated, 26' x 28' garage, nicely land-
scaped, PLUS 30' x 40' block building suitable for cabinet
shop, workshop, hobby shop, dog kennels, etc. - situated
on a 166' x 222' lot - all this for $38,500.00 terms.

INVESTMENT!!! 20 ACRES in Evergreen township - all
tillable - choice building sites; $15,000.00.

COUNTRY LIVING !!!!
NEAR CARO: Ranch type home with 5 rooms; large attached
breezeway and 2 car garage; basement; new gas furnace;
aluminum siding; built-in gun case; Franklin fireplace; plus
20 x 20' l'/2 car garage for workshop; beautiful setting among
many Blue Spruce, Scotch Pines, White Pines, etc. Just off
M-81 highway - near Caro — ALL THIS FOR $39,500.00 terms.

NEED MORE INCOME OR A JOB!!! GAS STATION enjoying
a good gross business -18,000 gallons storage capacity -comes
completely equipped, plus inventory - one man operation!!!!
$34,500.00 terms.

IN CASS CITY: LARGE 5 bedroom home with extensive
remodeling completed; aluminum siding; shutters; wall to
wall carpeting; formal dining room; natural gas forced hot
water heating system; family size kitchen with Birch
cabinets; attached large 2 car garage; l'/2 LOTS - l'/2
BATHROOMS; Office, Den and Laundry Room off kitchen;
many other features!!!! Offered to you for $45,000.00 terms.

IDEAL FOR THE SEMI-RETIRED!!!
BUSINESS BUILDING AND LIVING QUARTERS: Presently
operated as small electrical repair shop; 3 large bedrooms;
closets; new kitchen cabinets; wall to wall carpeting in extra
large living room; bedroom and hallway; very good buy at
$21,500. Sellers will hold land contract with responsible family.

LOOKING FOR WORK? BUSINESS PROPERTY & HOME
CASS CITY AREA: Highway location 1 '/2 Acres -1 story frame
home with 5 rooms; natural gas furnace; very neat in and out -
nicely landscaped; 24x28' garage; PLUS 38 x 42' building
suitable for repairs; body shop; gas station; etc. comes with 2
H.P. air compressor and two post Globe Hoist; TO SETTLE
ESTATE; $42,000.00. Your inspection invited!!!

COMPLETELY EQUIPPED AND FURNISHED!!!

70 ACRES - Grade A Dairy Farm - comes with 46 head of cattle -
all corn and hay; all equipment - 4 tractors, etc. $125,000.00
terms.

BRAND NEW FURNACE
BRICK HOME IN CASS CITY - 2 BEDROOMS, dining
room, large living room, large bathroom and laundry room,
newly decorated, ONE STORY - wall to wall carpeting,
22' x 24' garage - many other features - offered to you for
$26,500.00. Immediate Possession.

PARTY STORE - living quarters, 3 bedrooms, PLUS:
remodeled store, grossed over $263,000.00 in 1976 - Beer and
Wine and Light Groceries, etc.

3 ACRES OF WOODS!!!
FARMETTE-10 ACRES - TRI-LEVEL HOME built in 1971-
FAMILY ROOM with Angel Stone FIREPLACE with
heatilator, 2 BATHROOMS, 8 rooms, 3 bedrooms, phone and
TV jacks in bedrooms and garage, wall to wall carpeting,
built-in gun cabinet, 2 sets of sliding glass doors leading to
patios, laundry room, stone front and aluminum siding,
shutters, 2 car garage attached and insulated, 7-8 fruit trees,
12' x 18' utility building, many other features, $55,000.00.
Terms Available.

ATTENTION RETIREES!!!
40 acres close into Cass City - 4 room frame home with
insul-siding, oil heating, drilled well with own water system,
basement, granary, garage, barn foundation, 34 acres tillable,
WIDOW CANNOT HANDLE, $35,000.00

80 ACRES - 35 acres tillable - balance in second growth - no
buildings, $48,000.00 terms.

BUILDING SITES-5 ACRE PARCEL to center of Cass River
—high and dry, 1 mile south and ivfe miles west of Cass City.

LISTINGS WANTED: On all types of REAL ESTATE —
FARMS, HOMES, COUNTRY HOMES, RETIREMENT,
BUSINESSES, LOTS, ETC.

SEE, CALL OR WRITE TO: B.A. CALKA, REALTOR

6306 W. Main St.,Cass City, 'Michigan 48726
Telephone: 872-3355

"LISTINGS WANTED ON ALL TYPES OF PROPERTY
^ . - ' ."

SERVING THIS, COMMUNITY FOR OVER 24 YEARS

Real Estate For Sale J
REAL ESTATE

TAKE A LOOK
At this beauty, a 3 bedroom home with 2 baths, formal dining,
extra large living room with fireplace, open stairway, first
floor laundry room, full basement (partially finished), the
furnace is approximately 1 year old, home has lots of storage.
Located on a corner lot with lots of shade trees. Just 1 block off
M-81. Asking only $22,900. 77-399-TO

M. Dale Brown - Phone 872-3158

5694 Cass City Road - Cass City

Representing

(McLeod Realty, Inc.
630 N. State

Caro-
Ph. 673-6106

ITiValley

IUIIAI HUUSINC,

OPPORTUNITY

DEFORD AREA
Buy part - 2 bedroom home all remodeled in the last year,
including new roof and siding. All carpeted, on one acre for
$26,900 or buy all 7 acres with a pond and a good barn. Just 2
blocks from town for $45,000.00.

ACREAGE
11.2 acres of sheer beauty. White Creek runs in the back of your
property - perfect for building. 5!/i miles from town. Land
contract available.

3-5 ACRE LOTS
Gravel base under nice top soil, has been surveyed and cleared
- perfect spot to build, wooded in back of lots. Contract terms
available.

HIDE-AWAY
Cabin in the woods for a week-end retreat or stay the year
around. 10 acres of wooded serenity, under 14,000, land con-
tract available.

JUST THE SPOT
to build your dream house. 1% acres just 4 miles from town.

JUST ACROSS
from the river - this beautiful 3 bedroom ranch, (has all the ex-
tras) 2Vfe car garage with automatic door opener. All on 6%
acres with a iand contract.

40 ACRES
to play on, build on or roam on, beautiful spot to do whatever
you want. Land contract available.

TOTALLY REMODELED 3
bedroom home with fireplace.
Includes barn, corn crib and
silo. On 1.7 acres. Only
$29,000.00. CT-33. The Hamil-
ton Co. Realty, 872-4321,
Glenda Nelson, 872-4516;'
Marvin Hobart, 673-3275.

3-12-29-1

FOR SALE - In Florida, 2'/2
acre wooded lot with a new
double .wide 24x60. 3 bed-
rooms, 2 baths, completely
furnished. $25,000.00. Call
872-4134. 3-12-22-3

TWO STORY 4 bedroom fam-
ily home - Aluminum siding,
shutters. Full basement, ga-
rage, trees. Low $20's. CC-17.
The Hamilton Co. Realty,
872-4321; Glenda 872-4516;
Marvin, 673-3275. 3-12-29-1

• BUYING OR SELLING?

LISTINGS NEEDED

R. KIM ANTHONY

Business Residence
872-2720 658-8634

Osentoski Realty
3-12-22-4

FOUR YEARS OLD - 3 bed-
room, aluminum siding. Lot
size 120 x 180, Owendale.
Reasonably priced. OT-20.
The Hamilton Co. Realty,
872-4321, Glenda Nelson, 872-
4516; Marvin Hobart, 673-
3275. 3-12-29-1

Real Estate
For Rent

8498 State Rd.
Millington -

Ph. 871-4567
Board OI Real Eslale
Ana Listing Exchange
Commercial Residential Farm ,

Open Daily 9 • 7, Sal. 9 • 4, Other Times By Appointment

3-12-22-3

CLOSE TO THE ACTION
3 bedroom home on a large corner lot. New roof and paint
this year. No work to do on the inside. Three blocks from
work and five blocks from town. $26,900.00. Contract terms
available.

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY
50 x 75 all steel building, all insulated. 3 phase electric, 2
over-head doors; 1 door 42' wide (electric) LP gas heat,
private office, priced to sell. No reasonable offer refused.

STARTER HOME
2 bedroom, 12 x 60 trailer with 10 x 15 utility room on 1 acre of
land, priced under $9,000.00

NESTLED IN THE PINES
3 bedroom home, full basement, with 28x40 barn, 2 car garage,
on 18 acres. Just across the street from the river - for under
$24,000.00

4,000 FEET OF FRONTAGE
Over 60 acres on a main road with a good barn and other
outbuilding, 2 bedroom home in need of repairs and it's all
yours for $38,000.00, land contract available.

FOR RENT - apartment type
living for girls. 1 block south
of light. New washer and
dryer. Furnished. Rent in-
cludes all utilities. Phone
872-3570. 4-9-8-tf

Huntsville Mobile

Home Park

Lots Available

Phone 872-2495

4-6-9-tf

FOR RENT - Commercial
building in Cass City. Com-,
pletely remodeled inside and
out - new hot water heater,
new gas furnace, new carpet-
ing, new light fixtures - good
for office space. Stop at
Schneeberger's Furniture,
Cass City. 4-9-15-tf

Services J

Cass City
5301 Van Dyke
Phone 872-2352

Caro office
528 N. State
Phone 673-7777. - -f

" REALTOR Call Mary LaPeer-872-2545
Kim Anthony-872-2720
Jim Lenhard-872-2720
Joy Anthony-872-2720

REALTOR

3-10-6-tf

SNOW PLOWING - Call 872-
3915. 8-12-8-tfn

NORM COATES TV service,
6750 Elmwood Rd., Cass City.
Phone 872-3139. If no answer,
call 872-3435. 8-10-16-tf

CUSTOM
BUTCHERING

Meat cut, wrapped and frozen

Gainor's
Meat Packing

Bad Axe, Phone 269-8161

1 mile north, 1 mile west of
Bad Axe.

8-11-25-tf
B AND B Refrigeration - Re-
pair all makes of washers,
driers, refrigerators, freezers
and ranges. Call Caro 673-6125.

_ 8-5-1-tf

AUCTIONEERING - See
Lorn "Slim" Hillaker. Top
dollar for your property.
Phone 872-3019 Cass City.
_ 8-10-3-tf

ELMER H. FRANCIS, li-
censed builder. New homes or
remodeling. Roofing, siding,
barns, pole buildings. Phone
872-2921. 8-11-7-tf

Chuck Gage Welding
Shop

We now have heli-arc welding

Specializing in stainless
steel, blacksmithing, fabrica-
ting and radiator repair.

Also portable welding

7062E.DeckervilleRd.
Deford, Michigan

Phone 872-2552
8-5-15-tf

SEWING MACHINE and vac-
uum cleaner sales and serv-
ice. Parts in stock for all
makes. Service Department
and store hours, 8 to 5. Tom
Lowery, 319 Bacon St., Bad
Axe. Phone 269-9101.

8-1-8-tf

I WILL BE teaching organ,
and piano lessons. Contact"
Bonnie Lockwood, P.O. 25,
Cass City or call 872-4737
after 4. 8-12-15-3

AUCTIONEER
EXPERIENCED

Compete Auctioneering Ser-
vice Handled Anywhere.
We Make All Arrangements
Our Experience Is Your
Assurance.

Ira, David & ~
Martin Osentoski

Phone
Cass City 872-2352 Collect

INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR
Painting - Theron Esckilsen,
4314 Maple St. Phone 872-2302.

8-11-17-8

Custom Slaughtering - Curing
Smoking and Processing

Beef- Pork - Veal - Lamb

For Sale-Beef and Pork,
whole or half. Wrapped in the

new clear shrink film

Erla's Packing Co.
Cass City, Michigan

DickErla
Phone 872-2191

8-11-2-tf

CHAPPEL'S Plumbing &
Heating Service. Also storm
door and window repair. No
job too small. Phone 375-2510.

8-7-22-tf

Get the best

Insulation

Call Joe
Mellendorf

375-2727
State Licensed

8-1-20-tf

TRI-COUNTY Dead St&ck
Removal. Free service on
cows and steers over 500 Ibs.
Phone 517/375-4088. 8-8-1-tf

FAGAN'S THUMB Carpet
Cleaning - Dry foam or steam,
Also upholstery and wall
cleaning. Free Estimates.
Call toll free 1-800-322-0206
or 517/761-7503. We welcome
BankAmericard - Master
Charge. 8-3-20-tf

FOR "a job well done feel-
ing" clean carpets with Blue
Lustre. Rent electric sham-
pooer $1. Ben Franklin Store,
Cass City. 8-6-11-tf

Martin Electric
Residential and Commercial

Wiring

State Licensed

Free Estimates

Phone 872-4114

4180 Kurds Corner Road
8-10-1-tf

CUSTOM BUTCHERING -
Monday and by 10 a.m. Tues-
day. By appointment only.
Cutting and wrapping for
deep freeze. iVfe miles south.
Carl Reed, Cass City. Phone
872-2085 8-10-27-tf'

Wanted to Buy 1
WANTED TO BUY - baled
straw. Fred Matthews, phone
872-3879. 6-12-15-3

Farm
Equipment

FOR SALE -1969 Case tractor
with Construction King front
loader. Call 872-3904 or after 6
p.m. 872-2967. 9-10-27-tf

Help Wanted)
WANTED - baby sitter for
first shift, starting in Jan-
uary. Phone 872-4172.

11-12-15-3

JOB FOR LADY - to live in
and companion for elderly
lady - 3 or 4 days a week. Call
872-3393. 11-12-15-3

HELP WANTED - second
shift. Must be 18 with high
school diploma. Apply M&R
Grocery, Cass City. 11-12-29-1

.Work Wanted)
WILL DO babysitting in my
home. Have references. Live
in town. Call 872-3918.

12-12-15-3

WANTED - Organ and piano
students, adult and children.
Contact Bonnie Lockwood,
P.O. 25, Cass City or call 872-
4737 after 4. 12-12-15-3
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Hawks roll by Vassar

in pre-holiday tilt
Cass City rolled to its sixth

victory in seven starts
Wednesday night with an
easy 88-59 decision over visit-
ing Vassar Vulcans.

It was a make-up game of a
previously .scheduled contest
cancelled by the weather.

The Hawks moved out in
front in the opening minutes
and were never threatened.

The Vulcans used a team
substitution method as five
players played a few minutes
and five others came in for
several minutes.

If the strategy was to wear
out the opposition it failed to
work.

Actually the Vulcans stayed
the closest to the Hawks in the
first period.

NOTICE
We will be closed for the holidays after

Friday, Dec. 23, until Tuesday, Jan. 3,1978.

Our winter loading hours will be 8 a.m. to 4
p.m. Monday-Friday. Loading will be discon-
tinued on Saturdays until further notice.

Thank You for your past patronage. Merry
Christmas and A Happy New Year.

Wallace Stone Plant
Bay Port, Mich.

CASS CITY

VILLAGE OFFICES
WILL BE

CLOSED
FRIDAY, DEC. 30 AND

MONDAY, JAN. 2

FOR THE HOLIDAYS

Behind balanced scoring by
Clarke Haire, Jeff Hartel and
Mike Richards, Cass City
moved out in front by 12
points midway through the
opening stanza. Vassar came
charging back to close the
gap to 17-12 at the end of the
first period but that was as
close as they were to get.

The Hawks moved out from
that time on to widen the
margin during the remainder
of the game.

In the third period Jesse
Groth registered the best
eight minutes of his career as
lie poured in 11 points to show
the way.

Coach Ron Nurnberger was
able to experiment with vari-
ous combinations and de-
fenses. In the last quarter for
three or four minutes he
shifted to a zone defense
rarely seen played by the
Hawks.

Cass City had four players
in double figures. Haire led
with 19. Jeff Hartel posted 17;
Groth, 15, and Paul Battel, 10.
Reflecting the platooning sys-
tem used by the Vulcans only
Pat. Doran with 10 points was
in double figures, but 11
players shared in the visitors'
scoring.

Paced by Battel with 12, the
Hawks outrebounded Vassar,
34-18.

Cass City showed improve-
ment from the charity lane,
hitting 69 per cent on 18 of 26.

JUNIOR VARSITY
Cass City's JV's continued

to roll in the preliminary with
a 72-43 decision over the
Vulcans. The JV squad now
has a 6-1 record, identical to
the varsity's!

Cass City FG FT PTS
Haire 7 5-5 ~ 19™
Hartel 7 3-3 17
Richards, Mike 4 1-1 9
Trischler 1 2-3 4
Richards, Scott 2 - 4
Severance 0 2-2 2
Groth 6 3-5 15
Fahrner 2 0-1 4
Battel 4 2-2 10

35 18-26 88

Vassar
Gohsman 3 2 - 2 8
Laux 4 1-2 9
Hall 4 1-4 9
Doran 5 - 10
Hess 3 1-2 7
Heffelfinger 1 - 2
Wade 1 2 - 2 4
Gilchrist 1 - 2
Koch 1 - 2

• Laurion 2 0-1 4
Tetreau 1 - 2

26 7-13 59

THUMB B CONFERENCE
League Over

all

Lakers
Cass City
Frankenmuth
Bad Axe
Caro
Vassar
Marlette
Sandusky

W
3
3
3
2
2
1
1
0

L
0
1
1
2
2
3
3
3

W
5
6
5
3
2
2
4
1

L
0
1
1
4
3
4
3
4

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Bulldogs
perfect
in loop

Owen-Gage ran its North
Central D League mark to 5-0
last week with a 72-56 win
Tuesday night at Port Austin.

After a Christmas .break,
coach Phil Gray's Bulldogs
resumed competition this
Wednesday in the non-league
holiday tournament at Kinde
North Huron, playing Akron-
Fairgrove opening night.

The game at Port Austin
didn't start out a runaway as
the final score would indicate.
The two teams played nip-
and-tuck the first half, with
the visitors only leading by
one point, 31-30, at half time.

Any hopes the home team
might have had for a victory,
however, fell apart in the
third quarter, when it was
outscored 24-M).

Top scorers for the Bull-
dogs were Mark McDonald,
16; Roger Ziehm, 14; Gary
Goslin, 14; Dave Fritz, 10, and
Dick Glidden, 10.

In double figures for Port
Austin were Eugene Breuss,
19; Brian Korn, 16, and Larry
Reinke, 10.

The Bulldogs pulled down
58 rebounds to 52 for Port
Aust in. McDonald and Parker
both had 11 for the victors;
Reinke had 14 for the losers.

The Bulldog reserves won,
05-27. Both they and the
varsity squad were 5-1 for the
season after their respective
wins.

Score by quarters:

O-G
PA

10 21 24 17 72
9 21 10 16 56

PAUL BATTEL goes up for an easy basket against
outmanned Vassar in the last game before the holidays.
Defending is Patrick Doran. Clare Trischler watches at left.
Other Vassar players are Mark Laux and Timothy Hall.

1977 — an eventful year
Pistol league

starts Jan. 4
The Gateway Sportsman's will be open to members and

Club winter pistol league will non-members on a first-come
meet at the clubhouse, 2V-> basis with a limit of 10 three-
miles west of Unionville on man teams.
M-25, Wednesday, Jan. 4. Interested shooters may

Purpose of the meeting will register by contacting Ron
be to register, form teams, Bernia, Akron, phone 691-5736
and discuss rules. The league or W. W. Partlo - 691-5223.
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WE WISH

for each and every one of you a New Year that
brings the special happiness and satisfaction
which follows the attainment of your personal
goals.

And for the community of Cass City, our wish
is for continued progress in 1978. Our
community's history has been too consistent
to doubt that this wish will be fulfilled. The path
is straight ahead, leading to new achievements
every year.

"Happy New Year"

The Pinney State Bank

Continued from page 14.
Aug. 25 - Groundbreaking

ceremonies held for erection
of a shelter over the Indian
carvings (petroglyphs) in
Sanilac county; Owen-Gage
voters to go to polls to decide
whether property should be
transferred from the district.

SEPTEMBER

Sept. l -- Market prices too
low, outlook is gloomy for
area farmers; Cass City gets
sewage planning and street
improvement funds; Cass
City and Owen-Gage teachers
without contracts; damage
estimated at $20,000 in fire
that destroys barn and con-
tents belonging to Bruce Sher-
man.

Sept. 8 - Rioting rocks the
Owendale Speedway track
with police officers being
called from numerous Thumb
communities; additional cir-
cuit judges proposed for
Thumb area; Tuscola County
Road Commission planning to
spend $1.44 million during
next two years for replace-
ment of 12 bridges; damage
estimated at $20,500 due to a
fire at home of Mr. and Mrs.
Gary Diebel.

Sept. 15 - Tuscola County
Board of Commissioners give
tentative go-ahead to addition
of a third circuit judge for
Tuscola and Lapeer counties;
new subdivision gets first
okay from Cass City Village
Council giving developer Tom
Herron go-ahead to construct
sanitary sewer line and a
pumping station; Cass City
High School will be site of the
National Farmers Organiza-
tion annual state convention;
Owen-Gage School District
facing budget crunch due, to
refusal of state Department
of Education to release cate-
gorical state aid owed to the
district.

Sept. 22 - Smaller post
offices in area face uncertain
future because Postal Service
considers them uneconomi-
cal; severe rain storm in the
south end of Tuscola county
causes heavy crop loss; hunt-
ers see problems with state's
new "written permission"

trespass law; Community
Chest goal is $14,000.

Sept. 2!) - Cass City Village
Council decides not to take
over Cultural Center; Donald
Dinsmore, charged with two
open counts of murder in
slaying of Vassar couple,
was arraigned before District
Judge Richard F. Kern;
Owen-Gage board to seek
rehearing on Supreme. Court
upholding of transfer of Gos-
lin parcel to Cass City dis-
trict.

OCTOBER

Oct. (i - Gagetown, Owen-
dale village councils okay
applying for federal funds to
plan sewage treatment sys-
tems for their communities;
burglars chop hole through
roof of Cass City IGA, escape
with $498; Ubly only area
school to gain in enrollment;
Gagetown finished last fiscal
year in black; Elmwood
township board accepts bid
for demolition of townshjp
hall.

Oct. 13 -- Rain drowning dry
bean crop; Owen-Gage em-
ployees face payless paydays
before month is over; Elkland
township board okays contin-
ued cost sharing for mainte-
nance of Cultural Center;
pickup truck stolen from
Mary Voelker of Owendale
found in Oregon with man
charged in theft ; Deb Lenda
Owen-Gage homecoming
queen.

Oct. 20 -- Disaster aid
requests for farmers in Tus-
cola, Sanilac, and Huron
counties on desk of Gov.
Milliken; six vehicles stolen
in county in one week; pro-
posed 1978 valuation figures
in Huron county show aver-
age increase of 34 per cent;
demolition of old Owendale
High School starts; proposed
new county budget $3.2 mil-
lion; Melissa Smith Cass City
High School homecoming
queen.

Oct. 27 - Cass City School
Board approves $2.3 million
budget for 1977-78; bids for
street repaying project ex-
ceed estimates by 40 per cent;

Alice
Bev

Bill
Bob

Don
Fred

Glennola
Harold

Liz
Jo Lucille Phil
Karen Marge Sandy

NOTICE
MOST CASS CITY

BUSINESSES WILL BE

CLOSED
JAN. 2

CHRISTMAS EXCHANGES GLADLY
MADE UNTIL JAN. 7,1978

THANK YOU.

RETAIL DIVISION
CASS CITY CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

Owen-Gage voters vote
against transfer of property
from district; Tuscola, Sani-
lac, and Huron counties may
get more than $1 million for
youth jobs; proposal an-
nounced for $2.8 million
county vocational education
center.

NOVEMBER

Nov. 3 - Cass City Village
Council accepts bid for street
rebuilding project, paid for
with $338,000 in federal public
works funds; farmers will be
encouraged to voluntarily
control pollution from their
farms; Gov. Milliken seeks
farm disaster aid for Tuscola,
Huron, Sanilac, and Saginaw
counties.

Nov. 10 - Gagetown village
council and Elmwood town-
ship award bid for construc-
tion of new township-village
hall, paid for mainly .with
federal funds; Marsha Gos-
lin, 11, of rural Gagetown
killed in automobile crash;
Reva Little honored by Cass
City Business and .Profes-
sional Women's Club as
"woman of the year"; Tus-
cola county board okays $3.2
million budget for 1978; Cass
City finishes varsity football
season with 5-4 mark, Owen-
Gage, 6-3.

Nov. 17 -- U.S. Department
of Agriculture approves farm
disaster loans for farmers in
Tuscola, Sanilac, Huron, and
Saginaw counties; Farmers
and Merchants State Bank
ends free loans to Owen-Gage
employees; fewer hunters ap-
parently successful on open-
ing day of deer season;
heating fuel supplies appear
adequate for winter; Owen-
Gage girls' basketball squad
wins North Central D League
crown with undefeated sea-
son.

Nov. 24 - State mediator
called in for intermediate
school district contract talks
with non-professional em-
ployees; governor signs bill
authorizing state loan to
Owen-Gage school district;
Cass City High School band
debuts new uniforms; Cass
City Board of Education en-
dorses county vocational edu-
cation center.

DECEMBER
Dec. 1 - Proposed 1978 Cass

City village budget is $380,-

000; third circuit judge for
Tuscola and Lapeer counties
to be recommended to legisla-
ture; Tuscola farmers and
farm-related businesses in
Tuscola, Huron, Sanilac and
Lapeer counties eligible for
Small Business Administra-
tion disaster loans.

Dec. 8 -- Farmland tax
valuation in Tuscola county to
go up average of 10-12 per
cent (later reported to be 15
per cent); Hills and Dales
General Hospital receives
final approval needed from
state for new emergency and
outpatient services building
and renovations in present
building; Tuscola County In-
termediate School District
declared eligible for possible
receipt of $1.25 million from
state to build county voca-
tional education center.

Dec. 15 -- Sunday night fire
leaves Lamton Road family
of six homeless, Dec. 1 fire
leaves Kingston area family
of five homeless; Owen-Gage
district to get categorical
state aid again, still waiting
for $150,000 loan; Sanilac
county valuations to increase
overall 13.5 per cent; Gage-
town Woman's Study Club 50
years old.

Dec. 22 -- Tuscola County
Board of Commissioners
seeks freeze on county tax
valuations for 1978; Owendale
apparently only village to
have ballot contest in March
13 elections; Huron and Tus-
cola intermediate school
boards deny requested trans-
fer of property from Owen-
Gage to Cass City district.

People who can no longer
grapple with a situation are
on the verge of losing their
grip.

AND

Catalogs loaned
overnight.

FREE SUBSCRIPTION

with each order.

The Chronicle
PHONE 872-2010

THE REGULAR

NOVESTA TOWNSHIP
BOARD MEETING

Will Be Held

MONDAY, JAN. 9
INSTEAD OF JAN. 2

At

TOWN HALL
7p.m. •
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