
Commissioners OK elected officials $2,000 pay hikes
Elected Tuscola county of-

ficials were granted $2,000
pay increases by the Board of
Commissioners at the board's
regular meeting Wednesday,
Feb. 13, at the courthouse.

Those receiving increases
included Sheriff Hugh Marr,
Clerk Elsie Hicks, Treasurer
Arthur Willits, Register of
Deeds John Marshall and
Drain Commissioner Leslie
Lounsbury.

Second District Commis-
sioner Maynard McConkey
said the new salary levels are
still low in comparison with
neighboring counties but
added that an accurate pic-
ture cannot be drawn by
malcing-straight-compari =
sons.

All officers, except Marr,
will now receive $12,000 per
year.

In a related item, the board
also approved a working
agreement with the sheriff's
office employees which close-
ly matched that of courthouse
employees, with the excep-
tion that life insurance is also
offered.

In other business, the board
awarded a $10,546.00 bid on
draperies, carpeting and car-
pentry work in the circuit
court room and judges
chambers to Clement and
Kirk Inc. of Lapeer.

The firm's bid came well
under several other area bids
for -which carpeting -and
drapes alone would total over

$12,000. The firm is a reput-
able one, McConkey said, and
has done' work for other
government bui ldings in
neighboring counties,

Scott Engineering of Al-
pena, architects in charge of
the remodeling, will closely
supervise the work, he added.
The firm is the same archi-
tects which designed the new
County Road Commission
building.

McConkey said the Lapeer
firm has indicated it wil l
sublet some of the work to
Caro area people.

SOU, S U K V K Y

- -In other-business, •the-ljeard-
approved spending $3,417.00

for 300 copies of the updated
county soil survey which is in
the final stages of completion.

McConkey said field work
has been completed and the
findings are being correlated
with the 1926 soil survey and
with data gathered by the
county Soil Conservation
Service over the past 25
years.

This will involve new desig-
, nations for some soils and

rec lass i f ica t ion of some
lands.

The survey will be of use to
farmers, real estate firms
and the County Equalization
Department in determining

-valucs-and-tases-; —
Half the cost of the updating

is being borne by Michigan
State University's Coopera-
tive Extension Service. Indi-
vidual copies of the survey
update will be sold, Mc-
Conkey saidaPrices for indi-
vidual copies have not yet
been set.

The board also received an
official request from Gage-
town for contracted police
protection. While costs are
not yet set, the service, to be
provided by the Tuscola
County Sheriff's Department,
will give the village some 25
hours of protection per week,
during hours yet to be estab-
lished.

—MeConkey- said-the-request~ -
was referred to the public

safety committee, which will
base the cost of protection on
a 40-hour basis and then
reduce it to the 25-hour figure.

He indicated an answer
should be forthcoming within
a week to 10 days.

No gasoline bids for the
Sheriff's Department were
received, but the department
will still continue to receive
fuel through Neeb Corp. of
Bad Axe.

McConkey said the firm has
indicated it will meet the
needs of the depar tment
unless something unforeseen
happens.

A spokesman for Neeb said
-Friday—-it—will—supply the-
department with 100 per cent

of its needs. The department
is a priority user and, accord-
ing to government fuel allo-
cation guidelines, this need
must be met first.

The department will be
charged regular tankwagon
prices, which vary from day
to day, the spokesman said.
He declined to give figures
being .charged the depart-
ment, but McConkey indi-
cated the price averaged
slightly above 30 cents per
gallon. Price could not be
guaranteed, he added.

Commissioners also ap-
proved the hiring of attorney
Gary Crews as assistant to

-prosecutor-George Holmes on—
a part-time basis at $6,000 per

year.
Attorney Leo Maki will

continue to work from the
prosecutor's office.

Reports were also received
from the Department of Cor-
rections approving proced-
ures in the Tuscola County
Jail and from Dog Warden
Mike Franco.

McConkey said the dog
situation continues to be a
problem county-wide, adding
that the problem is one the
county will have to learn to
live with. He said a ban on dog
ownership or restrictions on
the number of dogs owned by
one-person -would-probably—
not work.
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Flu bug cuts

Cass Gty school

attendance
Authorities at Cass City

Schools are casting a fearful
eye at the flu bug that has
closed several area schools
and appears to be headed
toward Cass City.

Tuesday, a combination of
icy roads and the flu cut
heavily into attendance at all
schools.

Hardest hi t was Uetord
school. Seventy of a total
enrollment of 166 were miss-
ing from classes. Authorities
there placed nearly all of the
blame on illness.

Since Kingston was hard hit
prior to the outbreak at
Deford, school heads are
fearful that the entire district
will be hit before the week is
over.

Mrs. Bernard Freiburger,
principal at Campbell Ele-
mentary, urged parents to
leave children at home at the
first sign of illness to avoid
spreading the disease.

She said that several stu-
dents at her school came to
school and were sick.

Contrasting with the Deford
school situation is the outlook
at Evergreen. No flu here,

Concluded on page 5.

CHARLES SOPER, 46, Kingston, remains in fair con-
dition in Hills and Dales'General Hospital after his car
went out of control and struck a tree late Monday after-
noon on Cemetery Road south of DeLong Road.

Plan 40 more beds

Huron hospital addition won't

close down Hills and Dales
Plans for the construction

of a 40-bed addition to Huron
Memorial Hospital in Bad
Axe will not spell the end to
Hills and Dales General Hos-
pital, according to the presi-
dent of the Hills and Dales
Board of Directors.

"There's no reason why it
should be," attorney Clinton
House said Friday. "We hate
a good hospital here and we
have the potential to keep
pace."

: House said, however, if
moves are not made to add
more doctors to the Cass City
facil i ty, it would put a strain
on the hospital. But, he said, if
Huron Memorial does not
have the physicians to staff
the addition, then their prob-
lem becomes greater.

"I personally feel Huron is
grossly overbuilt," he said.
"But, I must say if I were in
their position, I would ap-
proach it the same way.
They're doing an excellent
job getting doctors and that's
the key."

House's comments came in
reply to a statement from Dr.
Robert Oakes of Harbor
Beach Thursday, Feb. 14, who
said construction of the new
wing at Huron would be a
death-knell to Scheurer Hos-
pital in Pigeon, Harbor Beach
Hospital and Hills and Dales
General Hospital.

House said he felt the
addition would not hurt Hills
and Dales or drive it out of
business, providing it re-
mains strong medically and
works to get more doctors.

"There is plenty of room for
new doctors in Cass City," he
said. Even now, a substantial
number of people are finding
medical care outside Cass
City. It is the general prac-
titioner who makes greatest
use of the hospital and if we
eventually lose our older
doctors without replacing
them, patients are just nat-
urally going to leave."

House said an all-put drive
in the .community-including

the medical community-is
needed to increase the num-
ber of physicians in Cass City.

"Our people must realize
th'at this is a major need and
support it," he said. "In Bad
Axe, they are trying to build
and they're getting all the
doctors to work together to
pull it off . That's what we
need here."

House said small hospitals
such as Hills and Dales have a
place in the medical com-
muni ty , but that it is getting
harder to meet stricter stand-
ards. He said in 10 years
requirements have changed
drastically, making i t d i f f i -
cult for the hospital to com-
pete with larger facilities or
to even keep pace.

He said the outlook for
acquiring new physicians for
Cass City is presently good,
citing the fact that the new
four-doctor clinic is nearly
complete, a long wi th the
acquisition of Drs. Yongkyun
Kim and J.Y. Lee in the past
year.

But, he added, the com-
munity is still not fully behind
the drive.

"We seem reluctant to face
the fact of life that doctors are
a merchantable commodity
and that-they're going to go
where they can get the best
offer," he'explained. "You
don't improve a hospital by
merely adding beds. It takes
bodies to staff those beds.
This is the need."

. House said Cass City is in
an advantageous position
geographically, in that it can
draw people on four sides,
while Bad Axe, in effect, has
water on three sides.

Similarly, hospitals in Har-
bor Beach and Pigeon would
face these kinds of geograph-
ical problems.

"It is up to us to provide the
service here," he said. "Some
people don't think it's right to
give new doctors coming here
a break' on location and
expenses. But, again, doctors
will go where they can do the

best f inanc ia l ly ."
Hills and Dales can accom-

modate 62 patients. Last week
there were 38 patients listed,
up from a low of 15 before
Christmas.

Huron Memorial Hospital
current ly has 67 beds avail-
able.

In i ts a n n o u n c e m e n t
Wednesday, Feb. 13, hospital
co-administrator Roger Bon-
nema said the hospital plans
to move forward immediately
with bids and the letting of
contracts.

Critics of the plan in nearby
communities said this would
upset a survey present ly
being conducted by the East
Central Michigan Compre-
hensive Heal th P l ann ing
Council. The planning council
must certify the need for
additional hospital beds be-
fore construction can begin,
according to Michael L.
Jones, assistant director and
health facilities planner for
the council.

Bonncma said, however,
tha t the hospital is not
restricted by the council,
since its plans were already
complete before l i m i t i n g
legislation was passed.

Bonnema said published
reports to the effect that
Huron's addition would drive
other hospitals out of business
were "grossly wrong" and
said this was not the purpose
of the expansion program.

Bonnema said pat ient
origin has shown an increase
of 50 per cent both from east
and west of Bad Axe with
some increase from the south.

Jones said Friday he has
verbal assurances frorn Bon-
nema that Huron will wait
from four to six weeks after
bids are opened before begin-
ning actual construction. This
will give ECMCHPC time to
complete its study of county
hospital needs, he said.

"Right now, we have indi-
cations that Huron county
hospitals are over-bedded,"
Jones,said. "As far as what

w i l l happen if a 40-bed
addition is bui l t at Huron, no
one really knows. We do know
that if they do go ahead with
it, they must come up with
1400 more admissions each
year to keep it going."

Jones said if the hospital
went ahead without waiting
for the study to be completed,
one of two things would
happen. One, it would draw
patients away from smaller
hospitals and force them out
of business or two, and more
likely, a lack of patients at
Huron would put it in f inan-
cial trouble and force it to
close down.

"Our position is that the
situat ion could end up being
worse if they went ahead
now," he said. "Population
projections show Huron
county losing population in-
stead of gaining.

Jones said Hills and Dales
Genera] Hospital draws very
l i t t l e from Huron county
presently, with the exception
of the Sebewaing area, where
two doctors use the Cass City
facility instead of. Scheurer
Hospital in Pigeon.

Jones said he is hopeful
Huron Memorial will wait on
i ts bu i ld ing program, al-
though the commission has no
authority to make them wait.
Huron was entered into the
program after it had begun
plans for expansion.

Jones said eventual ly ,
comprehensive studies will be
made of Tuscola and Sanilac
county hospital needs. The
results will be merged into a
Thumb-wide planning council
to aid hospitals in meeting
their needs.

He said hospitals such as
Harbor Beach won't neces-
sarily be shut down by
Huron's expansion, but it is
too soon to tell.

"It's going to take time and
we're going to need a great
deal of community input in
order to arrive at any conclu-
sions," he said.

Kingston man 'fair' after
car strikes tree Monday

A Kingston man was listed
in fair condition late Tuesday
afternoon following surgery
for injuries sustained in a
one-car accident late Monday
afternoon on Cemetery Road
just south of DeLong Road.

Charles F. Soper, 46, of 3370
River St., Kingston, sustained
multiple injuries at 5:41 p.m.
when the car he was driving
south on Cemetery Road went
out of control and struck a
tree.

Tuscola county sher i f f ' s
deputies who invest igated
said Soper attempted to pass
another vehicle when he lost
control of the car. It left the
roadway on the west side and
struck _ a tree stump. It then
traveled another 115 feet
before striking the tree.

Soper was alone in the
vehicle at the time of the
mishap. He was taken to Hills
and Dales General Hospital
where surgery was per-
formed Tuesday.

Officers noted that the road
surface was slippery at the
time of the crash and no
citation was issued.

Cass City Police assisted in
the investigation.

FATALITY

Tuscola county recorded its
third traffic fatal i ty of 1974
late Sunday afternoon when a
28-year-old Flint man died in
a two-car crash on Bray Road
at Arbela Road, about nine
miles southwest of Millington.

The victim was Ralph Eck-
er. Two passengers in his
auto, David Ecker, 24, and
Elmer Gould, also 24, both of
F l in t , sustained cuts and
bruises.

The Ecker car collided with
a car driven by Clifford
Bentley, 20, of Clio. James
Warren, 16, a passenger in the
Bentley auto, escaped with
cuts and bruises.

All were taken to St.
Joseph's Hospital in Flint.

State Police from the Caro
Post who investigated said
the Ecker vehicle was travel-
ing west on Arbela Road and
ran 'a stop sign at the
intersection of Bray Road.

The vehicle s truck the
Bentley auto, southbound on
Bray Road.

Both cars went off the.>
roadway into a field. Wit-
nesses said they saw the
Ecker vehicle headed west at
about 50 miles an hour when it
ran the slop sign.

The accident took place at
5:50 p.m.

OWENDALE MAN
INJURED

An Owendale man was
hospitalized Friday afternoon
after the car he was driving
ran off M-25 and hurdled Mud
Creek, northeast of Bay Port,
crashing head-on into the
north bank of the frozen
creek.

Ennis Alton Haley, 19, was
taken to Saginaw St. Mary's
Hospital in critical condition
wi;th head injuries.

Haley was traveling alone
when his northbound car ran
off the west side of M-25,
traveled for several feet
along the shdulder, then
crossed an access road that
leads to a boat launching area
at the mouth of Mud Creek
before it became airborne
and crashed into the opposite
bank.

Huron county sheriff's dep-
uties said Haley may have
fallen asleep at the wheel.

The accident occurred at
12:30 p.m.

OTHER ACCIDENTvS

Several other minor acci-
dents were reported to area

police, and sheriff 's deputies.
Thursday, Feb. 14, a car-

driven by Wayne David Dil-
lon, 29, of 186(i Hoppe Rcl.,
Unionville, backed out of a
parking stall and into another
vehicle in the Cass City High
School parking lot.

Cass City Police said Dillon
failed to see the parked car
which was situated in front of
the school in a no-parking
area. No ticket was issued.
The mishap took place at 4:25
p.m.

Friday, Nancy Peruski of
Bad Axe reported to Cass City
Police that someone had
struck her car while it was
parked in the General Cable
parking lot.

She told police when she
came out to leave work, she

found the left f ront fender of
her car had been h i t . Police
said a suspect was not found.
The mishap was reported at
12:10 a.m.

Also Friday, a car driven
by Edward Jay Vanhorn, 23,
oi' Silvernail Road, Deford,
struck and killed a deer while
traveling west on Bcvens
Road near Plain Road.

State Police from the Caro
Post said the deer came from
the south side of the -road
into the path of the car, was
struck and then ran back
toward the south.

Vanhorn was not injured in
the mishap which took place
at 7:50 a.m.

Monday, a- car driven by
Arthur Zimmerman Sr., 30, of
6483 Merchant Rcl., struck

and k i l l e d a deer w h i l e
traveling west on Bevens
Road a half mile east of
English Road.

Zimmerman was not in-
jured in the mishap which
occurred at 11:35 a.m.

Tuesday, a car .dr iven by
Janis Kay Benjamin of Hunt
Road, Mayvillc, went out of
control and struck a guard
rai l on Cemetery Road just
south of DeLong Road.

Cass City Pol ice 'who in-
vestigated said Mrs. Benja-
min was traveling north on
Cemetery Road when she lost
control of her car on the icy
road and struck the guard
rail .

She was not injured in the
accident which took place at
7:05 a.m.

Lamotte twp. hears plea
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The chief of Lamotte town-
ship's new fire department
submitted his budget before
the township board Tuesday
nigh t tha t called for an
expenditure of over $6,000 for
expenses and new equipment.
Generally, the board's reac-
tion was cool.

Art West submitted the
budget calling for $2,926 in
depa r tmen t expenses plus
$3,691 in new equipment in-
cluding boots, coats and hel-
mets. In addition, West re-
quested a sinking fund of
$3,400 be set up to meet the
cost of major new equipment
such as fire trucks.

West proposed financing
the department by the insti-
tution of a one-mill township
tax, if necessary, which he
felt would raise sufficient
funds.

Township Supervisor Cecil
Hayward informed West and
some 20 persons who gath-
ered for the meeting at the
fire hall that there is not
money available for such a
large outlay and that revenue
sharing funds, used largely in
the construction of the build-
ing, would not be available for
some time.

He proposed that township
residents be taxed when the
need for a fire truck arose
rather than establishing a
sinking fund, citing inf la t ion
at 10 to 12 per cent.

West argued that the fund

was necessary as a ready
reserve in case of emergency.

West con tended to (he
board that instead of spend-
ing funds in the bui ld ing to
complete a small kitchen
area, this money should be
used to purchase b a d l y
needed fire f ight ing equip-
ment. In the budget, he called
for purchasing 14 pair of
boots, ci t ing that he, himself ,
has no boots when he must
f ight a fire.

"I'd say 95 per cent of all
the people I've talked wi th in
this township don't want more
money spent on this build-
ing," West told the board.
"They want the f i r e depart-
ment bu i l t up."

Hayward replied t ha t be-
fore the genera]'room in the
fire hall could be put to use, a
kitchen area wi th a three-stall
sink must be ins ta l led , ac-
cording to state heal th regu-
lations.

A number of voters in the
crowd contended that the
board could rent the bui ld ing
as is, without any further
expenditure on k i tchen faci l i -
ties ' i f it would provide 20
tables and 200 chairs. Mem-
bers of the fire department
auxi l ia ry said tha t the bu i ld -
ing then could be rented for
wedding receptions or re-
unions when there would not
be a need for a ki tchen. Such
rents could then be used in the

fire department.
Hayward replied that the

kitchen was a necessity by
law before the bui ld ing could '
be rented.

"We're fortunate to have a
bui ld ing here at a l l ," Hay-
ward said. "I think it should
be completed so it could be
used."

Treasurer Jack Gi l l i g con-
tended that money for tlie
department is non-existent in
the township treasury, con-
tending the treasury is behind
last year already.

Clerk Wayne Adams agreed
tha t the funds do not exist for
this kind of an outlay and
added that the bu i ld ing of the
department takes t ime.

Adams accused West of
constantly coming before the
board, a s k i n g for more
money.

West replied that the board
appointed him chief and could
remove him if it wanted.

"You put me in charge of
protecting the people of the
township and I'm trying to do
that the best way I know
how," West said. "If you don't
l ike my work, then you can
remove me."

The board decided to study
the budget and bring it up at
the next meeting.

After the meeting, West
said he felt he was still at odds
with the board and that
nothing was settled.

SOME 20 persons gathered to hear Lamotte Township
Fire Chief Art West submit a $6,000 budget to'the town-
ship board "Tuesday night at the'fire hall. West emphasized
the need for more firefightin'g equipment.
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Fourteen junior-hi youth
from Salem and Trinity
United Methodist churches
met at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Dale Buehrly Sunday
from 5:30 to 8:30 p.m. The
juniors divided into teams
and baked pizzas, Mr. and
Mrs. Harvey Walter were
also present and with Mr. and
Mrs. Buehrly judged the
pizzas. First place award
went to JulAnn Auten's team
and second place to Kurt
Proctor's team. Larry
Buehrly was in charge of
games and the group worked
on a play-they are preparing
to present in the churches in
April.

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Lee-
son returned to their home at
Wild Fowl Bay Friday from
Detroit where they had spent
nearly a month at the home of
Mr. and Mrs, Daniel Sullivan.
They went to awai t the
arrival of the new Sullivan
baby, Jennifer Lynn, who was
born Feb. 2. Edward Mark
went Monday to spend a few
days with his daughter and
son- in- law, Mr. and Mrs.
Leeson.

Special services are
planned for Sunday, March 10,
in the Novesta Church of
Christ when missionaries to
Spain will have charge of both
morning and evening serv-
ices.

Mr. and Mrs. William Mar-
tus Sr. had as week-end
guests, Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Martus and children of Flint.

Thirty-two relatives from
Detroit, Grand Blanc, Gage-
town and Cass City attended a
party at the Andrew Kozan
home "Feb. 9;~wiren"~tl1ey'"
celebrated the 21st birthday
of Randy Kozan.

The second birthday of
Julie Czekai was celebrated
Saturday evening at the An-
drew Kozan home. Joining the
Andrew Kozan family, in-
cluding Miss Cheryl Kozan, a
student at Mt. Pleasant, and
Randy, Robert and Frances
at home, were Bill Ashmore
of Gagetown, Miss Elaine
Kloc and Mr. and Mrs. Gary
Czckai and Julie and their
five sons, Ronnie, Teny,
Brian, Koith and Tnmmv '

Mr. and Mrs. Keith D. Faber

A double-ring ceremony
u n i t i n g Miss Nancy Ann
Younglove of Ubly and Keith
D. Faber of Sebewaing was
performed by Fr. Robert J.
Duggan at St. Ignatius Cath-
olic Church, Freiburg, Satur-
day, Jan. 12.

Music for the ceremony
was provided by Sally Stacer.

Parents of the couple are
Mrs. Marie Younglove of
Ubly and Mr. and Mrs.
Leonard Faber of Sebewaing.

The bride, given in mar-
riage by her godfather, John
Stanley of Hazel Park, wore
an A-line Venice lace Bogice-
trimmed gown with a Queen
Anne ruffled neckline trim-
med in blue, with long French
sleeves and ruffled bottom.
Her veil was floor-length,
trimmed in blue. She carried
white roses and blue carna-
tions with blue velvet stream-
ers.

Mrs. Jean Marie Spaulding
of Saginaw, cousin of the
bride, served as matron of
honor. She was attired in a
red velvet floor-length gown
with stand-up collar, Juliet
sleeves, high waist and a
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& AUTO INSURANCE
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three layer skirt. She carried
a white muff with red roses
and one red carnation.

Darlene Czap of Sebewaing,
sister of the groom, Vickey
Franzel of Ubly, cousin of the
bride, and Patty Oscntoski of
U b l y , Mary C ie s l i n sk i of
Ubly, Judy Eisengruber of
Sebewaing, Barbara Czcwski,
and Brenda Richardson, both
of Ubly, served as brides-
maids. Their gowns matched
that of the matron of honor,
but in a rainbow of colors.
They also carr ied w h i t e
muffs , with yellow roses and
a yellow carnation. They
wore white velvet ribbons in
their hair.

Ted Faber of Owendalc,
brother of the groom, was
best man. Groomsmen were
Al Kundinger of Sebewaing,
Al Prich of Gagetown, Earl
Frebig of Sebewaing, Tim
Irion of Sebewaing, Frank
Franzel of Pontiac, cousin of
the bride, Mike Dranschille of
Owendale and Pal Nitz of
Sebewaing.

Larry Peters of Ubly, cous-
in of the bride, and Terry
Faber of Sebewaing, brother
of the groom, were ushers.

Flower girls were Tammy
Younglove of Ubly, sister of
the bride, and De Ann Par-
ticka of Warren, cousin of the
bride. They wore gowns of red
velvet similar to the brides-
maids', made by Judy Par-
ticka of Warren, cousin of the
bride. They,carried baskets of
mixed flowers.

Ring bearer was Brian
Jaskowski of Madison Hts.,
cousin of the bride.

Mrs. Younglove wore a
floor-length cream colored
gown with a purple jacket.
She wore a corsage of pink
tinted carnations. Mrs. Fabert
was attired in a red floor-'
length gown with silver trim.
She wore a. corsage of red
tinted carnations.

A reception for 400 guests
was held at the Unionville hall
immediately following the
wedding.

The bride is a graduate of
Ubly 'High School, and is
employed, at Walbro Corp.,
Cass City.'The groom is a
graduate of Sebewaing High
School and is employed at
Evans Products, Gagetown.

The couple is living at 4394
Maple St., Cass City.. .

The young people will have
charge of the evening service
in the Novesta Church of
Christ, Sunday evening, Feb.
2-1. A program is being
planned.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Auten
spent Sunday with their
daughter , Miss Barbara
Auten in Alma.

Mr. and Mrs. James Gross,
Mrs. Ernest Croft, Mrs. Mar-
ian Callan of Saginaw and
Mrs. E.G. Bell and son Bob of
Che^aning enjoyed dinner-to* ~
gether in Saginaw Sunday
and following dinner spent a
few hours in the Callan home,

Mr. and Mrs. Dave Lovejoy
and daughter Amy spent the
week end in Ann Arbor wi th
his parents, Mr. and Mrs.
C.W. Lovejoy.

Eric Esau, who has been
employed as a secretary for
the University of Michigan
school of library science, has
accepted a position as refer-
ence l ibrar ian in the Univer-
s i ty of Massachuse t t s at
A m h e r s t , Mass, and w i l l
begin his work there in
March.

Ron Crandell, a student at
the University of Michigan,
Ann Arbor, spent from Thurs-
day until Sunday at his home
here and showed his antiques
at Fashion Square Mal l ,
Saginaw.

Mrs. Ray Silvernail re-
turned home Saturday from
Marysville where she had
spent the week with her
brother and his wife, Mr. and
Mrs. Richard Ostrander.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth
Brown, who were called home
by the death of his father, left
Monday to return to their
home in Iowa. More with her
mother, Mrs. Cecil Brown,
until Friday arc Mrs. Roger
McDonald and daughters of
Naperville, 111.

Mr. and .Mrs. Don Anker
and son George of Bay City
were visitors Saturday at the
home of his parents, Mr. and
Mrs. William Anker.

Mr. and Mrs. George Fish-
er Sr. were Sunday dinner
guests in the Leslie Hartwick
home when the 1,'Jth birthday
of Norcen Henclrick was
celebrated. Other afternoon
guests were Mr. and Mrs.
George Fisher Jr. and fami ly ,
Mr. and Mrs. Art Fisher and
fami ly , Mr. and Mrs. Charles
Hartwick and family and Mr.
and Mrs. John Shagena and
daughter. Icecream and cake
were served in recognition of
the birthdays of Mrs. Charles
Hartwick and Noreen Hencl-
rick.

Twenty a t tended the
monthly business and social
meeting of the Progressive
Class of Salem UM church,
held Thursday evening at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Harvey
Walter. Various class proj-
ects were discussed and the
class again wil l" f inance the
sending of one youth to camp
in the summer. Refreshments
included home-made ice
cream.

Miss Cheryl Karr was given
a surprise birthday party
Saturday evening by a group
of girls. The party for Cheryl,
who was 15, was held at the
home of Miss Shirley Mart in.

Mrs. John Sting and daugh-
ter Jennifer of La peer spent
the week end wi th Mrs,
Sting's parents, Mr. and Mrs.
Lyle Lounsbury.

Gregory Frank and Beth
Tracy were Friday overnight
guests in the Glenn McClorey

Jioine. - —-

Sgt. and Mrs. Roger Reid of
Oscoda came Saturday eve-
ning and spent unt i l Tuesday
with their parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Donald Reid and Mr.
and Mrs. Lee Hartel.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Wil-
helmi of Plymouth spent from
Wednesday u n t i l Sunday with
his mother, Mrs. Lilah Wi l -
he lmi ,

Mrs. Alex Greenleaf, Mrs.
Gerald W h i t t a k e r , Mrs.
George Jetta, Mrs. Charles
Holm and Mrs. Thelma
Graham attended a special
OES meeting at Sebewaing,
Tuesday evening, Feb. 12,
which was highlighted by a
ceremony marking the con-
solidation of Caseville and .
Sebewaing Eastern Star
chapters.

Mrs. Clayton Turner of
Lapeer was here Thursday
and took her mother-in-law,
Mrs-Graee-Turnery to Union - -
ville where they visited the
latter's sister, Mrs. Frances
Schilling.

Friends celebrated the
b i r thday of Mrs. Harvey
Walter Feb. 8, with dinner at
the Franklin Inn. Present
besides Mr. and Mrs. Walter
were Mr. and Mrs. Dean
Hutchinson, Mr. and Mrs.
Gerald Auten and Mr. and
Mrs. Dale Buehrly.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert L. Hennessey

Good Shepherd Lutheran
Church, Cass City , was the
setting for the 5 p.m. wedding
ceremony of Mary El len
Peterson and Robert L. Hen-
nessey, Saturday, Dec. 22.
Rev. James Vanbellen offici-
al ed.

The bride is the daughter of
Mrs. John W. Peterson of
Cass City and the late Mr.
Peterson. The groom is the
son of Mr. and Mrs. Daniel
Hennessey of Cass City.

The bride was given away
by her uncle, Russ Dcneen of
Cass City, and wore a sat in
gown with million leg sleeves,
Empire waist , pearl t r im and
a high neckline.

Maid of Honor was Jane
Peterson, sister of the bride,
and b r i d e s m a i d was Sue
Hennessey, sister of the

groom. They wore pink velvet
gowns w i t h m u t t o n leg
sleeves, Empire waists, high
necklines and lace and ma-
roon ribbon trim. They each
carried a single red rose.

Groomsmen were Jude
Patnaude and Rob Alexand-
er, friends of (he groom, from
Cass City.

The church was decorated
w i t h two baskets of white
mums and pink carnations at
the a l t a r .

The bride's mother wore a
f l o o r - l e n g t h l i gh t b lue ,
double-knit gown with a blue
tinted carnation corsage.

The groom's mother wore a
matching ensemble.

A reception was held im-.
mediately following the cere-
mony at the Caro Gun Club.

The couple is residing -at
5047 Cemetery Rd., Cass City.

Mrs. Gerald Houghton
entertained Saturday evening
to ,celebrate her husband's
birthday. Guests were Mr.
and Mrs. James Neal of Bay
City, Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Fischer and Mr. and Mrs.
Stanley Morell. Euchre was
played.

Mr. and Mrs. Rick Lorent-
zen of West Haven, Conn,
came Friday and will be
guests of his parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Don Lorent/en until
Thursday. Anne Marie Lor-

-en-t-zen—ef -Saginaw came""
Saturday and stayed unt i l
Monday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Engle-
hart visited their daughter
and family, the William Den-
bys at Marysville, Sunday
and visited Mrs. Englehart's
fa ther , Maynard DeLong, at
Port Huron.

Good Shepherd Lutheran
Church will hold midweek
Lenten services each Wednes-
day, beginning Feb. 27, at
7:30 p.m.

Miss Sally Kolb spent the
week end with Miss Jeanne
Alexander at Alma, where
Jeanne attends college.

Mrs. Alice Neilz of Har-
rison and her sister, Mrs.
Lilah Wilhelmi, spent Tues-
day and Wednesday, Feb.
12-13, with their sister, Mrs.
Bernice Sweet at Carsonville.

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Nich-
olas and daughters of Bay
City were Sunday evening
callers at the Garrison Stinc
home.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Van-
Allen and family of Lapeer
were Sunday guests of his
mother, Mrs. Will iam Van-
Allen.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Zapfe, daughter Ki t ty and son
Roger of Clio were Sunday
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Lyle
Zapfe.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Holm
spent Saturday and Sunday at
L inco ln Park wi th t h e i r
daughter, Miss Karen Holm.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Buehrly
and children had as Friday
supper guests, Mrs. Buehrly's
sister and fami ly , Mr. and
Mrs. Senopole and son Chris
of Decker.

Nine attended the monthly
meeting of the Elmwood
Missionary Circle held Fri-
day at the home of Mrs.
Vincent Wald and Miss Mary
Wald. Potluck dinner was
enjoyed at noon. The March
meeting is scheduled to be
held at the home of the
group's newest member, Mrs.
Richard Erla.

Born to Rev. and Mrs.
James Van Dellen Monday, in
Saginaw General Hospital, a
son, Michael David. The baby
weighed six pounds and 12
ounces.

DKAI) KM I)

Even an astronaut must feel
that space is limited when he
tries to park his automobile.

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas E. Ruhl

A Christmas wedding was
solemnized when Jeannettc
Ann Garland of Batt le Creek
and Douglas Eric Ruhl of
Frankenmuth were uni ted in
marriage in a double ring
ceremony by the Rev. James
O'Meara'inSt. Philip Catholic
Church in Battle Creek Sat-
urday, Dec. 22, at one p.m.

Miss Garland is the daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Samuel H.
Garland of Battle Creek and
Mr. and Mrs. William Ruhl of
Cass City arc parents of the
groom.

The bride chose her sisters
as her attendants. Mrs. Har-
old Grimes of Battle Creek

. served as her matron of honor
wi th Cindy and Ellen Garland
as bridesmaids. Jennifer and
Sammy Dougherty of Battle
Creek, niece and nephew of
the bride, were flower girl
and ring bearer.

For his best man the groom
chose his brother, William A.
R u h l , of Spring Lake. Dale
Allen, a cousin, of Kingston
and Charles Lyon of Frank-
enmuth were ushers.

Following the cemnony a
dinner and reception was held I
at St. Phi l ip Social Hal l for 1501

.guests.
After a wedding t r ip m i

Northern Michigan the couple)
is making their home mi
Frankenmuth. Mr. and Mrs.
Ruhl are on the teaching s t a f f I
of F rankenmuth Public!
Schools.

The rehearsal dinner wasi
hosted by Mr. and Mrs i
William Ruhl for their soni
and his fiancee, famil ies of l
the couple and members ofl
the wedding party. The din,-|
nor was held in the Silvori
Helmet, Holiday Inn at Bat t lc l
Creek Friday evening, Dec i
21.

WEDDING
RECEPTIONS

"Reserve Yoyr Day"
AT. THE

SHERWOOD FOREST
COUNTRY CLUB

GAGETOWN
Phone.665-9972 • ' • *

MOOD FARMS
4 miles east, 1/4 south

of Cass City

RESTAURANT - LOUNGE
OPEN TUESDAY THROUGH SATURDAY

11 a.m. to 2 a.m.
SUNDAY 11:00 a.m. till 8:00 p.m.

Private Banquet Rooms
RESERVATIONS CALL 872-2720

Dancing Every
Saturday Night 9:30

DISCOUNT

Tomorrm'i Homu TOMV

If yon would like to avoid the rush- we invite you to

call 673-4138 or 673-4139 for appointments.

OUR OPEN HOUSE IS COMING SOON

BOB BISHOP, CONTRACTOR 1548 E. Caro Rd.
Ph. 6734138 or 673413!
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Marriage Licenses
James Kenneth LaPratt,

28, of Caro and Sharon Lee
Karr, 21, of Caro.

Steven Howard Little,' 19, of
Caro and Catherine Ann
Oleniacz, 18, of Caro.

George Wallace Sangster,
30, of Decker and Charlotte
Joan Watson, 30, of Cass City.

William Lloyd Loomis, 37,
of La peer and Madeline Carol
VanWormer, 31, of Milling-
ton.

Charles Frederick Tasch-
ner, 61, of Owenclale and Eva
Meininger, 62, of Gagetown.

Bruce Scott Hutchinspn, 20,
)f Caro and Kathy Ann
Reddington, 17, of Caro.

Arthur Lee Sleight, 20, of
Pontiac and Deborah Sue
Koepf, 18, of Caro.

— Nelson Oscar Botx.man, 21,
of Unionville and Kathy Sue
Kastraba, 18, of Caro.

Floyd Leroy Rexin, 22, of
Silverwood and Sue Lynn
TerBush, 25, of Mayvillo.'

James Vincent Sattelberg,
19, of Unionville and DeAnn
Jean Herman, 19, of Union-
ville.
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"IfltFitz..."
Stuck at the top

BY JIM FITZGERALD

A few years ago mere was
some talk about opening, a
saloon in the building that
formerly housed the Ballen-
tine Dry Goods Co. I immedi-
ately protested, c l a iming
such an action would be
similar to hiring a harlot to
dust the church.

The saloon was never buil t
and I like to think my
righteous indignation helped
prevent the sacrilege. It is
sad enough that there is no
longer a Ballentine Dry
Geods Co. But -it -would - be
pure tragedy if its hallowed
walls should be scarred by
boozy graffiti and Pabst Blue
Ribbon signs/

Ballentine's stood on a
prominent corner in down-
town Port Huron for hundreds
of years, or so it seemed, and
never changed. All around i t ,

the world turned to leather
and k n o t t y pine, wi th a
chargcplate in every fist and
a check-out counter blocking
every exit. But, until tne
1950's, Ballentine's remained
a hushed oasis where elderly
women sat down to try on
gloves, and you could hear the
soft f i nge r ing of fabrics
mixed with the slight slap of
turning pages in huge pattern
books.

And a few times each day
you could also hear the
ex'aspenfted -"whispers -of"
clerks telling each other the
dumb elevator was stuck
again.

I operated tha t r icke ty
elevator in 19-1,'i, when I was
17. There were 3 floors plus a
basement used only for stor-
age. The elevator traveled
through a cage and was

KEEPS NUTS FRESH & SANITARY

"Old Fashion"
Nut Dispenser

Press the lever and it dispenses the
correct portion ol nutb for you Clear
window lets you see contents Easy to till .
and keep clean Choice ol colors

2.00
VALUE

ADORABLE CERAMIC CREATIONS

Animal Salt and
Pepper Sets

Select f'om 3 cufe .ind color Hi I sots to adorn
your Mble setttnp Squir re l with Atom Bear
wild Honeycomb frof ; with Mushroom

Handy Way To Store and Use Thread

Fold-Away Thread
Spool Caddy

Conveniently holdi !8 spools ot thread at
youi linnet lips Folds M.i! tor storage,
spools can'i (all out Opens ,il a twist ot
Ihfc dnfler Choice ol col" '

Scented Candle
in Porcelain Dish

Gleaming white porrelnin wilh colorful floral design
on cover with gold leaf trim Choice ot three lovely
designs

2.49
VALUE

Mww 99<t

Large Porcelain
Bath Soap Dish

Beautiful Mor?l design set rnlo gleaming white
porcelain with gold leal rim Choice ot design in

rose yplio* r blue

2.49
VALUE 99<t

USTERINE
MftuttfW .

THE TASTE YOU HATE

' TWICE A DAY.

LISTERINE
ANTISEPTIC

14-oz. btl.

Reg. $1.39

LOVELV WALNUT FINISHED WOOD

Recipe Stand
with Index Cards
Keep your recipes as near to you as your
fingertips, 10 categories to die recipes
under (or (ast reference

2.00
VALUE

FRAGRANT, SOFT LIGHT ACCENT!

Floral Design
Scented Candles

Choice of fragrances such as: Lilac,
Oriental, Gardenia and Honeysuckle tn
lovely accent colors.

1.49
VALUE 77C

NEW DE-LIGHT-FUL DESIGN!

"Happy Face"
Egg Candle

Loveable egg shaped candle on it's own
gold-toned metal base Choice ol 4 happy
laces and colors.

1.95
VALUE 77C

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
MIM; \\IV\VKK. Ph. 872-3613

Ph. K72-32K3

therefore exposed to public
view at all times, on all floors.
I controlled it by pushing a
lever to the left for down, to
the right for up, and center
for stop. I was a chronic
daydreamer and sometimes
stopped the elevator when it
made no sense at all. Thus
waiting people on the 2nd
floor got long looks at the
passengers' legs while 3rd
floor waiters counted dan-
druff:

It was not easy to manipu-
late the lever so that the car

stopped flush with the floor. I
never told passengers to
"Watch your step, please." I
always told them to either
step up or jump down. Once I
advised a departing woman to
step up and she asked me for
a boost. "Maybe you could
cup your hands together and
give me a foothold," she
suggested.

But the u l t ima te calamity
was when I overshot the 3rd
floor and got the elevator-
stuck to the top of the cage. I
did this 4 or 5 times a day,
thus making me the world
champion marooner of pas-
sengers.

Passengers often accused
me of deserting the ship. You
see, to get the elevator
unstuck I had to squeeze
through the elevator door,
jump' down to the 3rd floor,
and then run down 3 flights of
stairs to the basement where
the elevator power plant was
located.

This trip took me from 1 to 3
minutes, depending upon how
crowded the stairs were with
people afra id of the elevator.
At each landing there would
be several clerks wishing me
Godspeed. My clear duty was
to free the marooned pas-
sengers before their cries for
help could be heard above the
fingering of fabric.

Propped against the ele-
vator motor were 2 sawed-off
broom handles, ever ready. I
would push these 'handles i
against 2 watchamacal l i ts ,
there w o u l d be several
sparks , and the e leva tor
would tremble loose and sag
slowly downward.

This was a real experience
for the s u d d e n l y u n s t u c k
passengers. For !i floors I had
remote control of their fate
and they didn ' t know what the
hell was going on. You should
have seen, their fr ightened
expressions when they f i n a l l y
descended into the murky
basement where I reboarclecl
to once again take physical
control of the ship.

If I ever saw a rescued
passenger a 2nd t ime it was
on the s tairwav.

Mr.
rural
their
sary

Mr. and Mrs. Peter Kino

and_MrsiPeler.KjQc_flL.i.'SQUthlield._aud-&Irs.. Honr-y

Rabbit tracks
By John Haire

(And anyone else he can

get to help)

One of the few spectators without a kid on the squad of the
Cass City eighth grade basketball team, that is playing a
tournament,at Sandusky Monday was Vern Palmer.

Or, it might be more accurate to say that he has about 25 kids
playing. Vern. is a former teacher at Cass City who left the
ranks for private industry.

He also was coach of the eighth graders when they were in
the sixth grade and won a tournament for him. •'

Cass City celebrated
55th wedding anniver-
Feb. l. They were

married in Chicago in St.
John's Cantinus Church and
came to this area in 1922,
where they have lived since
that lime.

The couple h a v e , f o u r
daughters, Chesterine, Ele-
nora ;uul Frances, all of

(Josephine) Wolak of King-
ston; three sons, Walter of
Romeo, Richard of Southfield
and Eugene of Cass City; four
grandchildren and one great-
grandchild.

A family gathering wi th
their children, relatives and
friends celebrated the occa-
sion at their home south of
Cass Citv.

Hills and Dales General Hospital
IlIIM'lIS:

Feb. 12 lo Mr. and Mrs.
Gale Fr j fk of Caro, a boy,
Phi l ip Jason.

Feb. 15 to Mr. and Mrs.
Henry Bohm of Caro, a boy,
Darrin Henry.

Feb. 17 to Mr. and- Mrs.
Gordon Hi l ts of Mayville, a
girl.

I 'ATIKNTS
DAY, FKH.

I.ISTKI) AION-
I X , WKKK:

Lyle Bicldle, Connie How-
ard, Clarence Decker, Mrs.

Jan Koepfgen

to take part

in MSlJ rodeo
Cowgirls' barrel racing and

goat tying are the events Jan
Koepfgen of Cass City will be
par t ic ipat ing in at the f i f t h
Annua l Intercollegiate Rodeo
at Michigan State University.

The 30 students in MSU's
Rodeo Club sponsor the event
each winter in the Livestock
Pavilion on campus.

Miss Koepfgen, the daugh-
ter of Mrs. Don Koepfgen of
5206 Koepfgen Rd., is an MSU
senior majoring in animal
husbandry and a 1970 gradute
of Cass City High School.

She is assistant chairman of
the rodeo and a member of
(lie Department of Animal
Husbandry Curriculum Com-
mit lco .

E
FROM THE

ditor's Corner
It's enough to oiovv your

mind.
I keep th inking what I

would have done if it were I
in s t ead of Rando lph A.
Hearst.

If it had been my daughter
kidnapped. My daughter in
the hands of the polit ical
radicals of the Symbionbse
Liberation Army.

I th ink about it and I come
to one sure conclusion. I'm
sure that I couldn't handle it
as well as Hearst.

There he stands in front of
the mikes and you know what
must be inside. The heart
wrenching agony. The nerve
sapping uncer ta inty . The
endless torture of hoping for
the best while fearing the'
worst.

You know that he must be
feeling exactly l ike his wife
who broke down in one of the
newscasts.

Yet this man keeps calm.
He appears to be casting
aside every personal feeling,
every outward show of emo-
tion. Concentrating with
every power at his command
on bringing his daughter back ••
home safely.

It's easy to say, "what else
would he do. . . .or anyone do
in a situation like this?"

For one thing the normal •
reaction would be to plead for
mercy for his daughter. To
point out that she is not
responsible has done
nothinp tn deserve to be
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kidnapped.
Thoughts l ike this would

have to race through every
parent's mind. How could you
help it?

That approach gets you
nothing and Hearst has been
able to avoid it. At who knows
what cost?

Instead he is going ahead
with plans to do what he can
to meet the demands of the
terrorists. . . .negotiating in
good fa i th and, as this is
w r i t t e n , apparen t ly w i th
some hopes of success.

But more than what he is
doing is the way that he is
doing it. The composure, in

/public anyway, of this man is
astonishing, it's almost as if
he were an interested by-
stander.

; His high esteem rose an-
other notch here when h e '
berated an official for a
remark about the case that
was slightly critical of his
daughter's kidnappers.

Instead his line is that the
persons who have his daugh-
ter arc honorable people with
a cause who arc bargaining in
good fa i th .

If any approach can keep
his daughter alive certainly
this must be the one.

There's no guarantee of
course. With persons irrat-
ional enough to try and
advance the cause of justice
w i t h an action l ike this .
anything is possible.

Even the moat radical of
groups prior to the SLA never
attempted this and most of
the persons they are suppos-
edly trying to help are turning
away from the SLA.

• The sympathy of the nation
is with the Hearsts and if he
succeeds in bringing .his
daughter home safely the
respect of the nation should
belong to him too.

And ,if he fails, it's the
thought here that there would
have been no way to succeed.

From the view halfway
across the country Randolph •
A. Hearst comes across as a
true giant of a man.

Irma Hicks, Linda Isbisler,
Mrs. Edward Magier, Mrs.
Charles O'Dcll, Mrs. Floy
Strange, Mrs. Robert Well's
and Mrs. Basil Wot ton of Cass
City;

Henry Hock of Owendalc;
Joseph Young of Reese;
Wil l iam Hoeksema of I in-

lay Ci ty;
John Kenney of Otisvi l le ;
Scott Sy, Larry Gugal, Alan

Sakon, Sharon Ross, Chris-
tine Ewald and Donald Sakon
of Unionvi l le ;

Gene Dandron, Mrs. Don-
ald Haley, Paul Wolak of
Kingston;

Mrs. Ray Periso, Robert
Miners, Alec Mcstcr and Mrs.
Fred Hull of Deford;

Thomas Gibhard , Mrs.
Ilenc Dora of Ubly;

Mrs. Herman Law, Craig
Wurm of Sebewaing;

Mrs. Theresa Kurtansky of
Caro;

Mrs. Elsie Harrington of
Akron;

Virgil Burress of Gage-
town ;

Avalos Apolonio Jr. of1

Pigeon;
Keith Kieltyka of Decker.

It 's l ike we guessed in this tr ivia last week, noining s oeeu
settled in the Owen-Gage school district . Supt. Glenn Sanford
wants that to be abundant ly clear.

He's getting flack from both factions in the distr ict . . . .the
ones who want to go it alone and those who want to split the
dis t r ic t . Please, he pleads, tell them again that nothing's been
decided and won't be for awhile yet .

Band Director George Bushong and the weather just don't
get along. You'll recall his cancellations of var iousband shows
last year because of the weather.

Well, another show was held Saturday and, no, George and
his kids weren't weathered out. So what's the beef?

It's simply that early this week a combinat ion of flu and icy
roads kept 'so many kids out of school thai he couldn't round
them up for pictures.

Results in the Solo and Ensemble Festival held at Caro
Saturday were good, struts George. Four firsts, 9 seconds and
one third in 15 events are worth pictures for the winners, he
added.

Considering his bad luck in oilier years we agreed to wait a
week to get the photos. Look for th'em in next week's paper

The business scene is looking up in Gagetown. In recent
years several businesses died and were nol replaced. But in
the last month a new concern and an enlarged old concern
opened its doors.

The new business is the upholstery and drapery shop of the
L. Spencer family. The new (old) store is Bill's Foodland,
owned and operated by Bi l l Downing.

Everything about the food store is new and modern from.the
carpet to the fixtures. .

It's a store needed in Gagetown and from the comments I
hear, one that the residents arc happy lo have theie. In
addition to all this, Gagolown Elevator will start construction
of a new GO by 60-foot storage silo in Apri l .

+ + + + + + 4- +

It's nice to be needed and respected. Sometimes we can even
be helpful.

Thursday afternoon a lady called the Chronicle and asked
how togct the carbon out of an oil space heater. Another day a
reader asked our high school trainee how to spell luminous.

It wasn't hard to shed a l i l l l e light (pun intended) about
luminous, but we were out in the cold when it came to talking
about space heaters. (Pun intended.) •

GROSS MEAT MAM

MEALMEAT MAKES
THE

SPECIALS GOOD THROUGH MONDAY, FEB. 25th

KoegeJ's MADE UP TO MICHIGANS HIGH SAUSAGE
STANDARDS "OF COURSE" ^

VIENNA FRANKS *
WITH SKINS - YOU KNOW THEY ARE GOOD

25

5 Lb. Box
95

SAVE 20$ LB.

HOMEMADE

[POLISH SAUSAGE or
SMOKED SAUSAGE

SAVE 19$ LB,

LEAN MEATY

BEEF SHORT
RIBS 590Ib.

FARMER-PEETS
OLD FASHIONED

SMOKED
PICNICS

A Double Repeat From Last Week
BIL MAR BONELESS

Lb.
TURKEY ROAST

EACH

FARMER PEETS -
SAVE 40$ LB. . :

OLD FASHIONED STICK

GERMAN BOLOGNA
BY THE
PIECE Ib.$2.89

TRWlElTTAlKlT
HOME MADE SAUSAGE -

HOME DRESSED INSPECTED MEATS
FRESH DRESSED CHICKENS -. MEATS FOR FREEZERS

- .FREE PARKING IN REAR - LARGE CITY LOT AT v

BACK DOOR — USE OUR NEW CUSTOMER ENTRANCE
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BEINH FRAIM KLJIM

BONUSBUY!BONU&BARGA/NSf

PEATPOTS
2'/4 and 3-in. sizes.
8 10 12 in package.
Slarl new plants,
seeds early.

OUR LOW PRICE

-, Luncheon size.
. Choice of deep-tone

. ^^fcjtf^y \̂. *•** 4 : "1 ••

•••••' > ••„"' /••'•'" '

All Add Up Jo BONUS SA VINGS!

ill
Big 26x45-ln. Size!

Decorator AREA RUGS
100% nylons and nylon
polyester blends in solids,
stripes and geometries to
brighten any room. Waffle
rubber backs.

% Creative! Mai* Fan! to Something Different!

CREATIVE NEEDLECRAFTS
STITCHERY PICTURE KITS'

Include Stomped Fabric, Sufficient Yarn, Needle, Simple Instructions (Frames Not Included}

Men'*,
UNDERWEAR
• Unconditionally Guaranteed!
Our best quality briefs and T-shirts of no-iron
Dacron® polyester and cotton. Soft, comfort-
able, long wearing.

Reg.Pkg.of3fora.43 R»g. Pl<g. of 3 for Mi
BOYS'XS, 5. M, I MEN'S S, M, L, XL

• Bag-up Household Cleanup Problems!

•TRASH BAGS! UNERS
• CHOICE OF
5 16-o.t. siz»-45 per box
• 40-qt. sizg-15 per box
I 20-gal. jiie-IOperbox

133-gal. iize~8 per box

Sturdy! Leakproof plastic)
• Sanitary) Four convenienl

sizes...in handy dispenser
box. Ties included.

Reg. 79c Each

"*l
SPONGE MOP

With EXTRA REFILL
Cellulose sponge mop
with easy-squeeze
metal wringer. Wood
handle.

ALL FOR ONLY

SxMn. PICTURE KITS
Stamped fabric, yarn to em-
broider the design, needle,
instructions. Choice of several.

HANDKERCHIEFS
Full size 17-in. square,
super absorbent all
cotton. Hemstitched.

«l.

Cross Stilcheryl Needlepoint!

2 SIZES PICTURE KITS
•5x7-in..8x10-in.
Choose from many attractive
designs, Canvas or oyster
white jute fabrics, Complete
with yarns, needle, easy-to
follow instructions.

Stitchery Kirs! Samplers/

5x7-IN PAIRS, llxVMN.,
1&16-IN. SIZES
Create a whole wall grouping at savings,
Our kits have it all in neat packages, just
add interest and complete. Choose
different sizes for variety.

Choice of Many
Styles, Designs!

ONE LOW PRICE

CUTTING BOARD
Marked in 1-in. squares for
easy, accurate, fabric and
pa t te rn culling. Folds to
12 x 40-in. Wilh bound edges.

144
Deluxe Picture Kits!

9x12-IN NEEDLEPOINT
1&16-IN. Cross Stifchery

Make an heirloom at our low sale price.
Choose from a variety of designs. All fit
standard frames. Fun for old hands...
easy to follow instructions for beginners.

Love, Floral,
More Subjects!

OUR LOW PRICE

PKG OF SI
FOAM CUPS

i 6%-oz. capacity. For
Vhot or cold drinks
llnsulated.

Re g. S7c Pkg,

UTTIE
6010EN BOOKS
Entertaining, informa-

i live, amusing. Many
[ titles. 8x6 '/• -in.

raj. 3Sc Esch

Holds 30 Patterns

Pattern FILE BOX
Get your patterns organized in
our sturdy file box. 4 movable
dividers, hinges, loc!;, handle.
Plastic.

SEERSUCKER PRINTS

^ BOXOF4JO
SIIKPINS

Strong, rust
resistant

•

MAJESTY
MrtTYPINS
50 in assorted

sizes.

SEAM
RIPPER

t .Cuts threads neatly.

^

I

I

6" SEWING
GAUGE

Set gauge,
measure precisely.

i

n
For School! Home! Office!

STATIONERY Specials
Tablets, envelopes,
pens, cello tapes, cray- • I
olas, art paper...many
more at our low, low sale |
price. Shop now and c

save.

For Sleep! Play!

INFANTS
COVERALLS
Safe, non flamable coveralls
of brushed acetate and poly
ester, Appliqued. Snap or
zip front. Machine washable,
Small or large.

-̂*-.
CHOICE

OFSTYLES

Pin/ess! TAPE TABS!

30 Tinkles Daytime
Disposable Diapers

Reg.
$1.67

NOWQNLY*

Buy monvsavers
Pinless. flushnble
plnaiod for ex t ra goo I
tape tabs, absorbei
cloth diapers. Slop ir

savings1

inerliner,

Light and bright for Spring!
50%-cotton/50% polyester;
keeps its crispness through
all weather. Machine wash-
able. 45-in. width.

KIDDIES PRINTS
Polyester/cotton prints for
little swingers. Save on juv-
enile patterns, make sewing
for the sandbox set fun.
No ironing! 44/45-in.

.at Savings.1

YD.

BEST BUYS FOR WKPHNTS

JUST

ARRIVED

WOVEN

COTTON
DENIM WEIGHT

;• MACHINE WASH

PLAIDS & PRINTS

f \

Satiny* to Make iour Ute...Batyt Easier!

/•' RABY

t IRON-ON
PATCHES

For perma-press
fabrics.

PERFUMED
STATIONERY

10 decorated, 6 plain ^
sheets, 10 envelopes, v
Choice of designs.

Reg. 69cl
NOW ONLY

I

Toddler.
Sizes 2 to 4

SHORTALl
A SHIRT

SETS
ONELOWPRICE

12 MENDING
PATCHES

Iron on perma-press.
2x3 in .

Pick fruit and vegetables
from our Avril rayon/cotton
blend. A colorful crop for
dressing or decorating.
Machine wash, no iron.
44/45-in.

100% COTTON
&

COTTON BLENDS
SINGLE KNITS

MACHINE WASH

1*$1.79 Yd.

POLYESTER

1/4, 3/8, 1/2,
\ 3/4. 1-in. widths:. - .
'' 1 t o 3Vds. •

•* only ai BEN FRANKLIN

HOMECREST
PAPER TOWELS

'120 sheet rolls. White, colors.
Rtg.3ScRoll

Rom
WITH THIS COUPON

^ffiSg Good only it BEN FRANKLIN ̂ -̂%-

FISHER'S DRV
ROASTED PEANUTS

8-Oz.sizel
OUR LOW PRICE

Kmozz^ ««
t»-Vy WITH THIS COUPON

\ 5tti Avenue
SUPER STRETCH

PAN1Y HOSE
• One sire fits all!
Super stretch for bet-
ter fit, smoother
looks. One size fits 5'
to 5' 6". 100 to 150
Ibs. Choice of fashion
shades.

Reg. S7c Pr.

fOUR LOW PRICE

r\t\

Infant GIFT SETS
Buy now, keep on hand for those very
special events. Gift boxed; 2-piece
jama, 1-piece sleeper, sleeper with bib.
All flame-safe in solids, prints or plaids..
Come in today.

Shortalls with matching polos, both stretch
nylon make washday easy, wearday (un. Solid

. color shortalls. burton shoulders. Striped pull-
overs with ribbed neck, sleeves. Come in a
bevy of coordinating colors.

Yd.

For Blouses! Dresses! Lingerie!

DACRON BATISTE
• New Spring Prints, Colors!
• AII Machine Washable!

Soft, sheer easy-care Dacron polyester
Batiste in a lovely selection of colorful prints
and colors...so very right for today's femi-
nine fashions. Lightweight. 45-in. wiidths.

OUKlOWPKKf

your Choice
Gift boxed

"Carved" Style

FRAMED
MIRRORS

MULTI-GRIP
BATH MATS

14x22'/I-in. i rubber
rnat, 100 suction cup
sure -g r ip back .
Choice of colors.

OUR LOW PRICE
Rectangular and oval

(Jshapes; 2-in. walnut &
gold color frames. Over-
all size: 18x24-in.

13

10.

^ a

Dependable TImokaepersI

6E AlARM CLOCKS
Choose popular Snopz-
Alarm® or luminous dial.
Compact size. Easy read dial,
sweep second hand. Antique
white.

Self Adhesive

DECORATING PIASTIC
4Easy to apply...goes on

everything • instantly!
Washable, waterproof.
Choice of many patterns
and colors. 18-in. wide.

E5EIM A FRAIM KLI IM
Cass City Wher£ everything you buy is guaranteed

BANKAMERICARD
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Down Memory Lane
FROM THE FILES OF THE CHRONICLE

FIVE YEARS AGO

Taxes in Tuscola county
will jump 10 per cent next
year, the Tuscola County
Board of Supervisors learned
Tuesday afternoon as they
studied the 1968 equalization
analysis from the State Tax
Commission.

An announcement from an
assistant game biologist,
Robert Strong of Lansing,

-that™the "antlerless" deer
season might be opened
brought a storm of protest
from a District Sportsman
club meeting in Cass City.

Twenty-five years of serv-
ice to the community will be
commemorated Saturday by
the Cass City Gavel Club at a
special anniversary dance
and celebration at the Cass
City In te rmedia te School
gym.

Speaialist Four Grant L.
Merchant was injured while
serving with the 35th infantry

in Vietnam recently and will
be hospitalized in Japan for a
month following an operation.

A meeting of persons op-
posed to the division of
Owendale-Gagetown School is
scheduled Thursday night at
the town hall in Gagetown.

TEN YEAKS AGO

Ousted Probate Judge Hen-
derson Graham was put back
on the county payroll late last
week after Bay City Circuit
Court Judge Richard Smith
declared that stopping his
salary did not come under the
jurisdiction of the local cir-
cuit court.

T he resignation of Arthur
Craig, 75, as supervisor of
Evergreen township has re-
sulted in a whole shuffling of
offices on the township board.

More teachers, more time
and more materials were the
chief factors among needs of
six Cass City Public School

teachers who appeared on a
panel at a School-Community
Association meeting Tuesday
night at Campbell Elemen-
tary School.

Whether or not Cass City
Public Schools teachers will
seek another pay raise for the
coming year will be learned
Thursday n igh t , Feb. 20,
when teacher contracts are
discussed at a special Board
of Education meeting.

KETCHUM'S KNAPSACK

Opportunity

didn't knock

By Jim Ketchum

NOW!

MOVIES
WITHOUT MOVIE IIGHTS

XL33

Give the
newest movie cameras.

The new KODAK XL33 Movie Camera or
the KODAK XL55 Movie Camera with zoom lens.
They take natural looking movies
in the light you live in ... using new KODAK
EKTACHROME 160 Movie Film.

OLD WOOD DRUG
Is Dealing.

Trade-in or Discount.

Movies are easier than ever. Even new
\

Sound Movies are available at Wood's.

T\VK.\TY-KIVK
Y K A H S A C O

Robert Keppcn, whose term
as village trustee expires this
spring, was nominated presi-
dent at the village caucus
Tuesday evening at the
council rooms. Twenty-two
were present to cast ballots.

The class of 1930 of the Cass
City High School is making
advance preparations for a
reunion Saturday evening,
April 2, in the local school
auditor ium.

Attention is called of all
parents l iving in Greenleaf,
Evergreen, Aust in , Argyle,
Lamotte and Moore town-
ships in Sanilac county that

.an immunizat ion clinic is
scheduled for next week.

Rev. Roy Stniffler, a 1910
graduate of Cass City High
School, has resigned as min-
ister of the Congregational
church in Geneva, Ohio, to
take a pastorate in New
Baltimore, Mich.

THIRTY-FIVK YKAKS AGO

Mrs. Will iam A. Secger, 42,
was killed about 10:00 p.m.
Friday when the automobile
driven by her husband
crashed into a 'freight train
standing at the West Garfield
Avenue crossing near 'the
Grand Trunk Depot in Cass
City. She was dead on arrival
at Pleasant Home Hospital.
. Cass City officials were
nominated to succeed them-
selves in office at the village
caucus held at the council
rooms Friday evening.

Officials of Gagetown Pub-
lic Schools spent Wednesday
and Thursday of last week in
Lansing confer r ing w i t h
members of the department
of public instruction regard-
ing,broadening the Gagetown
High School curr iculum.

The knock Alexander Solx.-
henitsyn heard at his apart-
ment door in Moscow one
cold, dark winter day last
week wasn't opportunity. It
was the Soviet Secret Police,
come to revoke his literary
license-permanently.

Solzhenitsyn, as you know,
is the Nobel Prize winning
dissident author who has been
at tempting to tell it like it is in
the Soviet Union-particularly
how it is in the prisons and
slave labor camps which s t i l l
do a landoffice business in the
midst of the worker's para-
dise.

Before the next 48 hours
were done, Solzheni t syn
wound up in West Germany,
deported by the Russians for
conduct unbecoming a Soviet
citizcn-namely complaining
about how things are and
calling for reform.

It could have been much
worse. The Soviets have
obviously picked up a couple
of pointers on how to dispose
of the opposi t ion w i t h o u t '
pickaxes such as were used
on Leon Trotsky or (he salt
mines of picturesque Siberia.

They chose the easiest way
out that would still allow the
egg to be wiped o f f ' their
collective faces before it had
a chance.to dry. Better they
should be wiping egg from
their faces than blood from
their hands.

Anyway, Sol/henitsyn got
the boot for wri t ing his lalesl
book "The Gulag Archipe-
lago", a chronicle of l ife in the
slave labor camps. Only one
of his books, "One Day in the
Life of Ivan Denizovich" was
ever published in the USSR,
that during the Khrushchev
era of de-Stalini/.ation.

Now Nik i t a has bit the dust
and S t a l i n is m a k i n g a
comeback in the h i s to ry
books. This means criticism
about his years, such as
Solzhen i l syn ' s has to be •
silenced.

What better way, ra t ion-
alized the communists, than
to simply throw him out? No
blood is let, no one from the
west comes poking around
asking a lot of foolish ques-
tions and the Soviet T l n i n n ' s

MID -WINTER SALE
Starts February 14

Thru 23rd

WINDOWS &
GLASS

SLIDING DOORS
2 o»iv Anderson Narrowline
P.S. Picture Window Units

w/insulated glass Reg S3,5 6G

9' • 6" wide x _ , ,--- «-
5 > . 6" High Sale '200.00 ea

I0"1* Anderson Wood Casement
w/insulaled glass e..l» J1 0/1 fin ...
W2N4 • 4' 4" Wide J3l6 IJU.UU 63.
x 4' • 7" High Rog. S15G.96

1 °"'v Anderson Wood Casement
w/insulatod glass W2N3 •

4' • 4" Wide 3' - 7" High Sale '99.00
Rog. SI30.58 '

2o" ' v8 f t . x ' 6 f t . 8 " Alum Mil
Gliding Patio Doors.

Insulated • tempered w/scr. Rog. S179.00

Sale '159.00

Storm & Screen Combinations
2o^D.H Mil 2 4 « 4 6 % Rq. SIMS Sale '8.00 ea.
2</D.H Mil 24 ' i2'/. R.g. SH.95 Sale '8.00 ea.

| 3:/D.H Mil V'/n* «•»• siwsSale '8.00 ea.
1/D.H Mil «», sbi. R.g. siwSale '8.00 ea.

11/Slider «« « «x «•!• «»-»s Sale '12.00 ea.

PANELING
4 x 8

Gold Surfer Reg. $6.25 ea. Sale !5.60
4 x 8

Green Surfer Reg. $5.45 ea.Saie '4.95
4 x 8 •

Blue Surfer Reg- $5-45 ea-Sa|e '4-95

Rushmore Cypress^-; Sale '5.95
*" tpo.oy ea..

Highland Hickory Reg- Sale'6.50
4 x 8

8.50 ea.

Irish Mist Reg. $8.50 ea. Sa|e '6.50

DaYk Conqueror . 3
R

4
6
9
g;a Sale '2.99

4 x 8 .

Honey Birch Re&. $7.00 ea. sale '5.40
4 x 7

Dark Conqueror $f^'ea Sale '2.65

Vinyl Shield
in- i •-•Winter Elm

- $3-25 ea. Sale '2.75

PLYWOOD
&

BOARDS
Sheathing^

1 x 4 thru
i x 12 Reg. Sale '270.00 Ml
S299.00 M

Sheathing*4
1 x 4 thru

Re-I S242.oo M Sale !223.50 M

- "s'heathing#5
1 x 4 thru
1 * 10 Sale '175.00 M
Reg. S189.50 M

Sheathing
'A x 4 x 8 °

cox piy sale M.99 ea.
Reg. S5.83 ea.

Sanded One -Side
1p4 x «xoo8 P'v Sale '4-99 ea. |Reg. S5.99 ea. '

Underlayment

Reg. S8.05 ea.

Economy Spr.
2 x 4 x a Sale .99 ea.

0. POIVER TOOLS
1 - 10" Rockwell/Delta JOOQ QP
Tabte Saw. TA H.P. OO*7i*/«
Contractors Model w/extensions, enclosed
stand, and rollaway wheels Reg. S419.95

UNFINISHED FURNITURE
1 Only-Storage Bench .

#9000 Reg. S15.95 Sale 11.95

CEILING TILE
12 x 12 Plain

White Tile

Reg. .15

ft

IrVilmot Home
t

Center 1 Mile West Of Kingston On M-46

. Ph. 683-2690
cn;

image in the rest of the world
gets only slightly tarnished.

There's only one flaw in this
b e a u t i f u l , Marx i an p lan ,
however. This isn't going to
shut Solzhenitsyn up. Printing
presses exist in West Ger-
many, as well as in every
other corner of the western
world and just as sure as

_ snow Jails in Moscow-, he. -will-
keep wri t ing.

Moreover, what he writes
wil l find its way through the
cracks in the Iron Curtain
back to the homel'olks. Cur-
rently, Voice of America and
Radio Free Europe are
broadcas t ing the book in
serialized segments in Rus-
sian.

And, in spite of jamming,
the message is g e t t i n g
through, for a "closed" so-
ciety is never really closed
completely. If it were, Solx-
henitsyns wouldn ' t exist, nor
would their need.

• The author's wife, Natalya',
stayed behind. Soviet au thor-
ities said she would be free
to join her exiled husband
whenever she wanted. And,
eventual ly, she'll probably
pack her bags, grab the k'ids
and make the dash to the
west.

Soviets wi l l probably let her
go, making sure the last
vestiges of the author's pres-
ence are erased.

But there will always he a
si/able minori ty of Russians
who wi l l know who Alexander
Solxhenitsyn is and who will
read what he has to say. And
there will be others like him
who wil l a t tempt, at whatever
cost, to tell it l ike it is.

There wil l then be other
knocks at other doors on cold, -
gray afternoons. It won't he
opportunity knocking then,
ei ther .

Flu bug hits
Continued from page one

say authorities. The 38 absent
out of 171 Tuesday were
at t r ibuted to icy roads.

In Campbell elementary,
133 of 543 fai led to report and
186 students missed classes in
(he Intermediate School. .
higher than average but not
a larming absenteeism.

In the High School an
estimated 100 students were
not in class.

Cass City Village
Council Meeting
The regular meeting of the

Cass City Village Council was
held on January 29, 1974. All
Trustees were present.

A motion was made by
Trustee Rawson and sup-
ported by Trustee Tuttle that
Tom Schaible's bid of $200.00
for the former Pobanz home
be rejected. Motion carried.
Any further decision was
tabled unt i l the next meeting.

The minutes of the regular
December meeting and a
special January meeting
were read and approved.

The f inancia l report for the
month of December was
presented.

A motion was made by
Trustee Jones and supported
by Trustee Tuttle that the
Council gratefully acknow-
ledge the Chamber of Com-
merce's donation of approxi-
mately $700.00 to purchase
playground equipment for the
Village park. Motion carried.

A motion was made by
Trustee Jones and supported
by Trustee Tuttle that the
employment of Mrs. Debbie
LeValley as Bookkeeper be
confirmed. Motion carried.

It was reported by Village
Superintendent Lou LaPonsie
that there will be no cost to
the Village for, the State's
project of w i d e n i n g M-81
because we are not adding to
the drainage load on the
storm sewer system.

A motion was made by
Trustee Bliss and supported
by Trustee Hampshire that
authorization be given to seek
bids for a new tractor and
flail mower. Written sealed
bids will b'e opened February
26, 1974, at 7:00 p.m. Motion
carried.

A motion was made . by
Trustee Jones and supported
by Trustee Bliss that Council
hold a public hearing on the
proposed budget for 1974 on
February 26, 1974, at 8:00
p.m. Motion carried.

A motion was made, by
Trustee Rawson and sup-
ported by Trustee Bliss that
the bills as examined be
approved for payment. Mo-
tion carried.

There being no fur ther
business a motion was made
by Trustee Bliss and sup-
ported by Trustee Jones that
the meeting be adjourned.
Motion carried.

1 Karen Osentoski
Deputy Village Clerk

"THE ALL NEW"

BILL'S FOODLAND
IN GAGETOWN

.STORE HOURS: DAILY 8 a.m. - 8 p.m.
SUNDAY 9 a.m.'- 2 p.m.

OPEN
FOR

BUSINESS

NOW!

EVERYTHING NEW,
SHINY, UP TO THE

MINUTE. READY
FOR YOUR

SHOPPING PLEASURE
All new Merchandise. C'mon in and get

acquainted. We'll be looking for you.
Bill Downing

NEW OWNER - OPERATOR

SPECIALS GOOD THRU:
SAT., FEB. 23, 1974

CAMPBELL'S

CHICKEN NOODLE SOUP 6/M00
Banquet Frozen

FRIED CHICKEN
$149

PKG.

STOKELY

CATSUP.

BANANAS. _____»,_! 2$
LEAN BOSTON BUTT

PORK STEAK
FARMER PEET'S*

SMOKY LINKS

BACON
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CASS CITY GUN CLUB
4 sputn, 1 east, 1/4 north of Cass City

Pancake Breakfast
EVERY SUNDAY

At 7:30 a.m.

Holbrook Area News Mrs, Thelma Jackson

Phone OL 8-3092

-Advertise It InrThe Chronicle.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack I 'us/y-
kowski ;ui(l family of Saginaw
spent the week I'lul wi l l ) .Mr.
and Mrs. Joe- Dyhilas and
f a m i l y .

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Spencer
at tended the Fa in i ly Put luck
dinner .Sunday af ternoon at
t h e Frascr P r e s b y t e r i a n
Church. Guest speaker Ann
Hoss of Had Axe gave a t a l k
on Aging.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Goro-
nowicx and Mr. and Mrs. .Jack
Pelton were snnwmoh i l i ng at
(JiiLnvuy. - — --.

Mr. and Mrs. John Naples
and .lack of Fast De t ro i t

Old-timers used to rely on this mill. This mill used
to depend on the right wind.

Despite man's most valiant efforts the wheel was
frequently at a standstill. What then? Waiting, wait-
ing, waiting! What patience they must have learned—
only faith sustained them. The wind would blow again.

The patient life also requires a foundation of faith.
It can come early or late, slowly or fast.

• If you lack the necessary faith to fulfill your life's
needs, turn to the Church. The wind will blow again.

Wednesday
Matthew
5:3-12

Thursday
Romans
12:M-21

Friday
Romans
1.1:15-19

Saturday
II Timothy
2:19-22

Scriptures selected by ihe American Bible Society
Copyright 1971 K u i s t e r Adve r lmny Si-rvite, Inc., Slrashurg, Virg in ia

Message Sponsored by
These Progressive Firms
CROFT-CLARA LUMBER, INC.

'hone 872-2141 Cass C i l v , M i d i .

VERONICA'S RESTAURANT

Phone 872-2550

"Good HOUR' Cooked Food"

MAC& LEO SERVICE

TOTAL PRODUCTS

Cass C i l v , Mich . 3lionc872-:il22

ANDERSON'S THUMB APPLIANCE
(>422 West M a i n Street, Cass C i t y . Mich .

Phone 872-3505

HOTPOINT—KELVINATOR-GIBSON-
MAYTAG-NORGE

VILLAGE SERVICE CENTER

TIRES-BATTERIES-V-BELTS-TUNE-
'UPS-MUFFLERS-BRAKE SERVICE

Cass Ci tv , Midi. Phone 872-3850

CASSCITY.FLORAL

FLOWERS & GIFTS

Phono 872-3075 Cass Ci lv , Mich.

MUTUAL SAVINGS & LOAN

Your Investments Are Our Mutual Concern

Open Saturday morning

Cass Citv • Phone 872-2105

GAMBLE STORE

CassCitv'. Michigan Phone 872-35.15

IGAFOODLINER

TA'BLERITE MEATS

I i l 2 l Cass C i l v Road. Cass C i l v Phone 872-21545

KLEIN FERTILIZERS, INC.

Cass C i l v , Mich

Paint

CASS CITY AUTO SUPPLY

Machine Shop Service

'PHONE 872-2626

FUELGAS CO. OF CASS CITY
B U L K - - P R O P A N E SYSTEMS-FURNACES
- - R A N G E S - WATER SOFTENERS &
OTHER A P P L I A N C E S

J u n c t i o n M - 8 I . & M - 5 H

Open Id t i l l 10 7days a week

QUAKER MAID DAIRY

Groceries — Ice Cream

Fake Outs - Par ly Supplies Phone 872-1)1%

WESTERN AUTO ASSOCIATE
STORE

f M f i " M a i n . S t .

Cass C i tv , Midi. Phone 872-2040

KRITZMAN'S CLOTHING

.0447 Main

Cass Ci lv , Mich. Phone 872-3470

OUVRY CHEVROLET-OLDS, INC.
Cass City, Michigan '

(Ouraim is to please)

872-2750 872-3830

J & C T O T A L
TIRES—WHEEL A L I G N M E N T

MECHANIC ON DUTY
WRECKER SERVICE

Cass City, Mich. ' .Phone 872-29B7

spent the week end with Mr.
and Mrs. Louis Naples.

Amy Ilerp of Ubly was a
Tuesday overnight guest of
K a t h y Dybilas.

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Robinson
. and Becky and Mrs. Kevin

Robinson at tended the Bad
Axe Methodist Church calen-
dar parly Monday evening-

Mr, and Mrs. Jack Pelton
had dinner Sunday at Wild-
wood Farms in honor of their
351 h wedding anniversary.

Mrs . L y n n Spencer a l -
. Umdi:d ^leadership Michigan

Association Extension Home-
makers meeting at Grand
Rapids Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Beck-
er and f ami ly were Sunday
af te rnoon guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Jim Hewi t t and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Duane Nicol
and ' M u r i e l of Wi l l iamston
and Angela Part lo of Akron
were Saturday dinner guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Leland Nicol.

ISAM) FESTIVAL

Jim Tyrrel l , Becky Robin-
son and R u t h Hewitt at tended
the Solo and Band Festival at
Caro Saturday. Jim Tyrrell
and Debbie Roberts got a first .
on a due t . Sadie Fisher, Dave
Cranston, and Debbie Rob-
erts gol a second on a quartet.

Becky Robinson and Randy
Maurer gol a ' f i r s t on a duet.

Becky got a second on a
solo.

R u t h Hewi t t , Karen Ben-
singer and Margie Engel got
a second on a t r io .

Ruth Hewit t played piano
for Margie Engel who got a
second on a solo.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Tracy
were T h u r s d a y e v e n i n g
guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Gaylord Lapeer.

Mrs. Mike Stein and daugh-
ter were Wednesday evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Curtis
Cleland.

Mrs . . J im H e w i t t spent
Wednesday w i t h Mrs. Frank
Yietter at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Wi l l i am Rees at
F i l i o n . Evening guests were
Jim H e w i t t , Ru th and Lori.

Monica Babbs spent the-
week end wi th Sara Campbell
and Harry Edwards whi le
Mr. and Mrs. Monty Babbs
spent the week end in Bay
Ci ty .

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Silver
and T i f f a n y of Bay Ci ty and
Reva Silver were Saturday
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Gerald Wil ls and sons.

Mrs. Jerry Decker spent
Tuesday morning with Mrs.
Gaylord Lapeer.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Emigh
we're S a t u r d a y a f t e r n o o n
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Leland
N i c o l . Other recent guests
were Mr. and Mrs. Mill 'ord
.Robinson.

Y A R N ri.ru

The Yarn Club met Tues-
day at the home of Mrs. Jim
Doerr for a pot luck dinner in
honor of Mrs. Curt is Cleland's
.b i r thday .

Mrs. Emma Decker and
Mr. and Mrs. C l i f f Jackson
were Friday evening guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Ward Benkol-
man in honor of Mr.'Benkel-
man's b i r t h d a y .

Mr. and Mrs. Duane Chippi
of Cass Cilv were Sunday
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Frank Laming.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim McCart-
"ney of A lma , Mr. and Mrs.
Eugene Cleland and f a m i l y of
Bad Axe, Mrs. Jim Doerr and
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Cleland
ami family, were Tuesday
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Curtis Cleland.

Mr . and Mrs. Gerald Batie
at (ended a p o l i t i c a l r a l l y
Friday evening in the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Erla of
Cass Ci ty , to advance the
candidacy of J. Robert Trax-
ler. Democrat ic nominee for
the of f ice of U.S. congress-
man of the 8 th d i s t r i c t .
Representat ive Don Riegle
was also present.
. A. J. Batie was a Monday

evening dinner guest of Mr.
and Mrs. Gerald Ba t i e of
Gagetown.

Tuesday evening, A. J.
Balie was the guest of Mr.
and Mrs. Bud Hul l of Gage-
lown where movies were
shown of the Bat ie ' - l l i l l wed-
ding . •

Wendy and Belli Doerr
a t tended the Jr. High Rl.DS
Sunday'school class parly at
Shabbona Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Leland Nicol
and Mr. and Mrs. Tom Nicol
spent Friday in Owosso and
also vis i ted Mr. and Mrs.
Duane Nicol at Wi l l i ams ton .

Mr . and Mrs. Bernard
Shagena of Unionvi l le were
Saturday afternoon guests of
Mr. and'Mrs. M u r i l l Shagena
and. Mary.
. Mrs. Bob Damm, Tammy
and Christie of Pigeoir, Mrs.
.Ray Griggs, Mrs. Delmar
Bowron and Ira Robinson of.
Bad Axe, Mrs. Jerry Decker,

Mrs. Ben Ki r ton , Mrs.
Charles Bond. Mrs. Lynn
Hurford and Mr. and Mrs.
Cl i f f Jackson were visitors
last week at the home of Mrs.
Emma Decker in Cass City.

Mr. and Mrs. Leland Nicol
were Sunday afternoon guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Fred Jans.

Larry M o r e l l and J im
Osentoski spent the week end
at S a u l t Ste . Mar ie and
a t t e n d e d t h e s n o w m o b i l e
races.

Glen Shagena visi ted Leslie
Hewitt-Sunday- evening. — - •

Mrs. George Barber and
Rose of Royal Oak and Keith
Welby of Lake Orion spent the
week end with Mrs. Tom
Gibbard and also visited Tom
Gibbard at Hills and Dales
Hospital in Cass Ci ty . Connie
and Jeri Lynn Starr were
Sunday dinner guests.

Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord La-
peer were Saturday supper
and evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Steve Timmons and
Debbie.

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson
were. Wednesday even ing
guests of Mr. and Mrs.. Glen
Shagena.

Mr. and Mrs. David Hacker
and f a m i l y were Saturday
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Earl Schenk and Randy.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Gibbard
and Kathy and Mr. and Mrs.
Eyans Gibbard visited Tom
Gibbard at Hil ls and Dales
Hospital in Cass City Sunday.

Phil Kolar and son Joe of
Romeo were Saturday guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Jack Pelton.

F A R M IHIRKAU

The Shabbona Farm
Bureau group met Thursday
evening at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Cur t i s C le land .
Curtis Cleland led the discus-
sion on Law Enforcement.
Cass City Police Chief Gene
Wilson was a guest speaker.
The next meeting wi l l be
March 14 at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Virgil Lowe. A
potluck lunch was served.

Ruth Hewitt was a Friday
overnight guest of Karen
Bensinger.

Mrs. Gaylord Lapeer vis-
ited Mrs. Manly Fay Sr. at
Hills and Dales Hospital in'
Cass City Tuesday afternoon.

. Twenty members and sev-
eral parents and leaders of
the Holbrook Helpers 4-II
sewing group met Saturday at
the Eraser church.

Mrs. Charles Bond, Mrs.
Emma Decker and Mr. and
Mrs. Cliff Jackson visited
Jerry Decker at Hills and
Dales Hospital in Cass City
Friday.

Murill Shagena was a Sun-

day guest of Mr. and Mrs.
Glen Shagena.

Rick Ferino of Midland and
Debbie Chippi were Saturday
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Frank Laming.

R o b i n Be lan and M i k e
Schenk of Uhly were Sunday
dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Earl Schenk and Randy.

( i R K K M . K A F i : \TK\SKI\

The Greenleaf Extension
group met Thursday al'ter-

--no»n--at- the- 'home of Mrs.
Curtis Cleland. The lesson on
food addi t ives was given by
Mrs. Jim Doerr and Mrs. Don
Tracy. Officers for the com-
ing year are cha i rman. Mrs.
Lynn Spencer; v i c e - c h a i r -
man, Mrs. Hiram Keyser;
•secretary and treasurer. Mrs.
Jim Dolecki; council mem- -
her, Mrs. Cur t i s Cleland;
alternate council member,
Mrs. Don Tracy; chairman of
Plan of Work is Mrs. Jim
Doerr. The next meeting w i l l
be held at the home of Mrs.
Jim Doerr March 14, w i t h a
potluck dinner at noon.

Mrs. Henry Jackson vis i ted
Rose Strauss Friday.

The Ubly Band Boosters
held a bake sale at the Thumb
Electr ic Bui ld ing in Ubly

. Saturday wi th proceeds going
to the Ubly band.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Me-
Knight of Bad Axe were
Thursday evening guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewi t t and
f a m i l y .

Mrs. Gary Partlo and An-
gela were Tuesday guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Leland Nicol
and Mr. and Mrs. S tuar t
Nicol .

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Mc-
Cartney of Alma spent last
week wi th Mr. and Mrs. Jerry
Cleland and fami ly .

Mr. and Mrs. C l i f f Jackson
were Thursday supper guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Leonard
Slirrett in Bad Axe.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Gos-
clinski and f ami ly were Sun-
clay guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Cl i f f Robinson and Becky.

Mrs. Frank Laming at-
tended a pink and blue shower
for Mrs. Phi l ip Rockwell at
the home of Mrs. Harold
McAlpinc Sunday afternoon.
A lunch was served.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin John-
son of Bad Axe were Friday
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Earl Schenk and Randy.

Mr. and Mrs.' Eugene Cle-
land and fami ly of Bad Axe
and Mr. and Mrs. Curtis
Cleland attended the Bad Axe
Methodist church calendar j
party Monday evening.

Rev. Dan Schinabarger of
Bad Axe was a Friday guest
of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewi t t

, and f a m i l y .
Mrs. Art Marshall, Mrs.

Ernest Campbell and Dawn,
Mrs. Melvin Peter, Mrs. Don
Near, Doris and Bessie Kin-
ney. Murneta Stanbaugh and
Sara Campbell attended a
quilt ing bee last week at the
home of Mr. and Mrs. Gary
Stanbaugh and family.

Raymond Wallace and Mr.
and Mrs. Gaylord Lapeer
visited Jerry Decker at Hi l l s
and Dales Hospital in Cass
City Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Doerr,
Tina and Jamie were Friday

"evening giiesTs~oT~Mr,"ami
Mrs. Jim Hewitt and f ami ly .

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tyrrell
a t tended the funeral of an
uncle, Harry Cooper at the
Cole Funeral 'Home a t 11
o'clock in Montrose Thurs-
day. Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Tyrrell la ter vis i ted Mr. and •
Mrs. Nelson Cooper and Mr.
and Mrs. Mike Herman. Mr.
and Mrs. Herman had re-
tu rned home from Mara thon .
Florida where they ha.d spent
li weeks.

Mrs. Ray Armslead i
Davisburg spent 3 days la-
week with Mr. and Mi
Muril l Shagena.

The Smalt Engines Hoi
brook Helpers .4-H group mi
Tiii-Mlay after school at tl
home of Mrs. Jim Doeil
under the leadership of Mr;
Stuart Nicol.

A.J. Batie was a Fndal
evening visitor at the Clj^l
Jackson home.

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Mi
Phinhind Mr. and Mrs. Wil l '
Brown of Cass City wei
Saturday evening guests i,
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shagen;i

.lack Ross oi: Ubly and Eai
Schenk went to the movii
" V a n i s h i n g W i l d e r n e s s :
Wednesday evening in Bal
Axe.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Lan,
ing were Snndav evenmi
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Do)
Tracy and Judy.

Tom Gibbard entered Hi l l )
and Dales Hospi ta l in Cas
City Fridav.

VISIT OUR EXPANDED
JEWELRY DEPARTMEN.
A Wide Selection

Earrings

.25 to $12.00

Sterling Silver Rings

$2.00 to $5.00
Your Favorite

Costume Jewelry

.00 and up
IT'S COACH LIGHT FOR-

VARIETY - SELECTION - LOW PRICE,

We Accept All PRE-PAID

PRESCRIPTION PLANS BANKAlVIERICAR

HOW

IS FREE CHECKING?
At our bank, it means

* No service charge of any kind
* No age requirements

* No minimum balance

* No limits on checks or deposits

* No charge for statements

* No gimmicks

FREE all the way. You check out exactly what you check in.
• ' .

Check FREE with us and BANK YOUR SAVINGS!
* * • Your Local Full Service Bank

*

*
*

O IV1 fvi LJ "V '

* •.».•* .

(FREE PARKING IN THE REAR)

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

• BAD AXE
Downtown
Northgate

• CASEVILLE

• ELKTON

i.KINDE,

I MINDEN CITY
• UBLY
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FRESH

PORK HOCKS
FRESH SLICED

PORKLIVER^

INGTONS BIRTHDAY
LB.

t
tB.

BOSTON BUTT

PORK STEAKS
FRESH SLICED

SIDE PORK

79*
59
97
891C

LB.

.<ff

^
FRANC O-AMERICAN

SPAGHETTI-0'S
15-oz. cans

MAXWELL HOUSE
ALL GRINDS

FRESH PORK

NECK BONES.
EELA'S HICKORY SMOKED SLICED

RINDLESS BACON
SKWLESS POLISH

LINK SAUSAGE.
ERLA'S HOM3MADE BULK

PORK SAUSAGE
FRESH GROUND

HAMBURGER.
ERLA'S HICKORY SMOKED

PICNICS
'FRESH WHOLE OR RIB HALF

PORK LOINS--
ERLA'S MILD SENSATION

SKINLESS FRANKS
RING BOLOGNA

LARGE BOLOGNA
Size 24 California
Lettuce

U.S. No. 1 Mich.
Potatoes
Cello
Radishes
U.S. No. 1
Bananas

ft
M;

COFFEE

HICKORY SMOKED

HAMS

Fresh Pan Ready

WHOLE CUT-UP

SANI SEAL

CHOCOLATE
MCDONALD CARNIVAL
ICE CREAM BARS i?jjt. Pkg.

».„ M-ODE RITE (Reg. 79£)
§ POTATO CHIPS L3:°z- Pks-

P1LLSBURY COUNTRY STYLE OR tf) /O f"k

BISCUITS ̂ ™ ™LJl Ji°_zj. Pfe O / O 9 <t
VELVET BRAND ft ~i OO
PEANUT BUTTER __2:Lbi'_8_°z__^r. ^ '
TIP TOP FLORIDA

CITRUS BLEND
FAYGO ASSORTED 12-oz
PQP

HAWAIIAN
FRUIT PUNCH 46-pz._c_an

VALLEY RICH

FRUIT COCKTAIL or
I tAunto Halves or sliced 3 lb.

cans

OVEtf FRESH , ** 1 1/2-lb. A f\ .

BIG 30 BREAD 2 ^ 89<
OVEN FRESH Sugar & Plain - ^^

FRIED CAKES^ 69
OVEN FRESH ^

JELLY ROLL___1_2.°_^__49

COLEMAN PRINT

KRAFT REG. or Pimonto g_02

CHEEZWHIZ

69<

lb. pkg.

VICKS NYQUIL
TASTE O'-SEA FROZEN RAW

PERCH FILLETS __
CREAMETTES • '

ELBOW MACARONI _j_-
PENNSYLVANIA DUTCH WHOLE

MUSHROOMS
PAPERMATE

BALL POINT PENS
SUNSHINE

HI HO CRACKERS—-^^
NO DEPOSIT - NO RETURN

-
QQ , ...f

MAALOX LIQUID
OXRAY FROZEN HASH BROWN--.

79C POTATOES __2_4:«._.59C
T ' NIBLETS WHOLE KERNEL . /nft

•« 690 CORN v:c_pf-ca_n, 4/890
M ,*>* ^1 VET'S CANNED

3/J1.00 DOG FOOD-
n A KAL KAN 14 :

630 CAT FOOD
1A. NEW; PURINA

490 CHOICE MORSELS
PALMOLIVE LIQUID FORDi'SHES

QUANTITY
RIGHTS
RESERVED

SPECIALS GOOD

THRU SATURDAY

FEB. 23, 1974

Ib^cans

KAL KAN 14 FLAVORS
6-oz. cans

NEW! PURINA (FOR CATS)

NO DEPOSIT - NO RETURN ^ jfrj AA . FOR.DISHES JAjL

COCA CflLA----------s-8-s? J1.09 DETERfiENT-2i-° -̂490
.AJAX ALL PURPOSE

CLEANER
28-oz. Btl.

(SPECIAL LABEL)49<
BLEACH

GAL.

Food Center
IN CASS CITY

OPEN MONDAY THURSDAY TO 6 P.M.

FRIDAY TO 9 P.M.

SATURDAY 8:00 A.M. TO 6 P.M.

WINEBEER
MEMBER

Special Label

ROMAN
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DENIM
JEANS

_QNLY.—

• WITH FLARE
CUFF

• ASS'T. COLORS
• SIZES 10-18

Sizes 12-20, 38-44

50% POLYESTER

FINAL WINTER CLEARANCE

CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 21, 1974 CASS CITY. MICHIGAN

Men's—Ladies'—Children's

WINTER CO ATS
and JACKETS

NOW

ALL SALES FINAL, NO RETURNS
NO REFUNDS

DRESS

SHOES

ONE LOT - LADIES

$1
ONE GROUP

LADIES' DRESSES
AND PANT SETS

Price
ONE GROUP

CHILDRENS
COATS

'/J OFF
The price of children's

scat's will be much higher]
next fall. Buy now and
save.

CHILDREN'S

TIGHTS

PRICE
2

BROKEN SIZES
1 - 1 4

INFANTS'

CORDUROY
PANTS

Sizes 3-4 only

$1.00
Men's

Turtle Neck

SHIRTS
REG. i
$10.00 VALUE

WITH
ZIPPER

LONG SLEEVES

LADIES

HEAVY WOOL

SWEATERS

prs. 147
MEN'S

THERMAL SOX 2
Heavy duty - Keeps feet dry and warm

ONLY

VALUES TO $20.
EXTRA
SIZES

Beat the lower temperature,
with a warm wool sweater.

MEN'S

SWEAT SHIRTS
$2.99 each 50% Acrylic 2-$5

Men's

KNIT DRESS
SHIRTS

$4..99 EACH (v • fi

REG.
$7.98
SIZES 30-42

SHORT SLEEVES
SIZE: MED, ONL

MEN'S

DRESS
PANTS

]/2 Price

Sparling calls for Congressional
appointments, UN review in area stop
o t .-,*:„-,,-. u — «..„„ * *i • i - i*iiiStating he supports the idea

of a Constitutional amend-
ment to allow the appoint-
ment of Congressmen to
vacant seats and favors a
"long, hard look at our role in
the United Nations", Con-
gressional hopeful James M.
Sparling Jr. began a cam-
paign swing through the
Eighth Congressional District
Thursday.

Sparling was in Cass City
on a trip designed to meet
with media representatives

~" "an"d"sara~h"e"'15el ie'v'esf luThas
the inside t r ack on the
nomination to f i l l the seat
vacated by the resignation of
Rep. James Harvey.

Harvey was sworn in as a
federal judge Feb. 1.

"I defini tely feel I have an
advantage over the other
candidates in the race lie-
cause I know the distr ict ," he
said, cit ing his ties wi th the
Saginaw News as well' as his
years as Harvey's admini-
strative assistant.

"I can come into Cass Ci ty
and I know people," he said.
"I've worked in the area and
I've b u i l t bridges over the
years in the district."

'Sparling said the fact tha t
he was in the district 17(i clays
last year is an 'example tha t
he is in touch wi th the mood of
voters. He added tha t he
conducted office hours for
Harvey dur ing tha t t ime and .
plans to cont inue the practice
if elected.

Spa r l i ng sa id c o n t i n u i n g
contact with voters would he
a major goal for him as a
congressman. He said he
discounts the theory t h a t
representatives should rely
solely on their own judge-
ments.

"I want to come back to the
district svi th the major issues
before congress and hold a
series of public meetings on

Services held

for

C.U. Brown
Funeral services were held

Friday at the First Baptist
Church for Cecil U. Brown,
80, who died Feb.' 11, in
Waterman General Hospi ta l ,
Eustis, Fla. He had been
hospitalized 10 days.

Friday

CECIL BROWN

Mr. Brown was born in
Cumber , S a n i l a c c o u n t y ,
March 24,'1893, son of the la te
Thomas and Selina Pollard
Brown.

He married Mary Bur l ,
June 12, 1920, in Detroi t where
they made their home u n t i l
192.'!, when they came to Cass
City, where lie made his home
•un t i l h is death.

He served in the Navy in
World War I. He was a
member of the First Baptist
Church of Cass C i t y , serving
as a deacon and treasurer. He
was also a member of the
Board of Education for 12
years and served as Village
Superintendent for 25 years.
In 1958, he retired from De-
troit Edison Co. after 10 •
years, and worked for the
village of Marlcttc u n t i l 19(ifi.

He is survived by his wife,
Mary;*one son, Kenneth of
Marion, Iowa; four daugh-
ters, Mrs. John ( R u t h Jean)
Quinn of Plymouth, Mich. ,
Mrs. W i l l i a m ' ( E l a i n e ) Bell of
Traverse City, Mrs. Roger
(Mary K a y ) McDonald of
Naperville, 111., and • Mrs.
James (Sharon) Evans of
Iquitos, Peru; one brother,
Leslie of Marce l lu s ; two
sisters, Mrs. Olive B. Clarke
of Sunnyvale, Calif., and Miss
Edna Brown of San Jose,
Calif., and 12 grandchildren.
Five brothers and two sisters
preceded him in death.

Rev. Frank B. Smith, as-
sociate pastor of Calvary
Baptist Church of Plymouth, .
officiated.

Interment was in Elkland
ccmctcrv.

KSSKNTIAI.8

If fashion was based on
comrriori sense, there'd be no
gripe about the high cost of
living. \ .

'•• \' '.- . '• ''

them," he said. "I want to
make voters aware of the
effects legislation will have
on them before it is enacted
into law. So many times
people don't realize how a law
will affect them until it's long
passed. I want as'much input
as possible from the voters."

PLATFORM

Sparling admitted he has
not developed a platfprm per
se. adding he has no specific,_
legislative proposals in mind.

He did say he favors some
sort of U.S. Constitutional
amendment which would al-
low the governor to appoint
an interim representative the

, same way he now appoints
U.S. Senators'to f i l l unexpired
terms.

"I'm deeply concerned that
right now the Eighth Con-
gressional District is without
a voice in the House of
Representatives," he said. "I
would like to see some kind of
amendment which wo,uld not
allow that to happen. As it
stands, the voters will be
without a representative for
over eight weeks."

Sparl ing said such an
amendment might include a
clause which would stipulate
that the governor would have
to appoint a replacement
from the same political party
as the outgoing representa-
tive.

This , .he acknowledged ,
would give c o n s t i t u t i o n a l
sanction to political parties,
something which does not
exist in the document.

"It would insure cont inui ty
in the district," he said,
"because it would recognize
how constituents voted in the
last election."

Sparling also said he favors
a "long, hard look" at the
American role in the United
Nations.

"We pay over half the
operating costs of the UN," he
said, "and it seems t ime to
study it closely. I think we
should either build up the UN
and bring it up to date or we
should get rid of it."

He cited the fact that the
charter was written in 1945
and said it needs revision to
make it stronger. Sparling
acknowledged the organiza-
tion's work in the fields of
health and 'educat ion, but
wondered if the U.S. is getting
its money's worth.

"I want to give it a real shot
in the arm," he said. "Just
paying the lion's share of the
costs isn't the way to do it.

When the UN was organized,
it had 46 nations. Now it has
upwards of 140. And they all
have the same voice in the
General Assembly. Yet we
pay most of the costs."

RESIGNATION

in government, relying, on
principles.

"The integrity and credibi-
lity of politicians at the
federal and state level needs
revival," he said. "Voter
confidence must be restored
in elected officials."

Sparling said he does not
foresee great problems in the
d is t r i c t because he is a
Republican at' a time when

He said
popularity

the president's
will probably not

Sparling denied any wrong
doing surrounding the timing
of Rep. Harvey's resignation
and his formal candidacy for pVe7iden7'Nixon's popularity
the vacant seat. Opponents js at an all-time low.

-ihave-cbapged-that—Harvey—'TWs^STrtfepubTlcarrais^
resigned only after a strong t rjc t," he said emphatically,
political base for Sparling had -How big the margin will be
been established. is 'a question,', but it will

"Where was it to my definitely send a Republican
advantage?" Sparling said. to Congress."
"There was none. In fact , I
probably lost any political
advantage the way things
turned out."

Sparling said between the
t ime Harvey's n o m i n a t i o n
was announced in August and
his conf i rmat ion, opponents
really had the advantage
because they had time to
build organizations and raise
funds.

He cited the fact that during
the long i nves t i ga t i on of
Harvey for the federal judge- ,
ship, he was t ied clown
supplying committees wi th
information on the congress-
man and could not have done
any campaigning.

have too great an effect in the
district because it is an
off-year election and also a
special election.

Sparling, 45, has served as
Harvey's assistant since 1961
and is a former reporter for
the Saginaw News. He also
edite-d a monthly publication
of the Packard Motor Car Co.
and served two years in the
Navy.

He is married and has three
children.

FORMAL WEAR JZ?<

RYAN'S
Men's Wear and
Formal Wear Rental
Phone 872-3431

YOU
COME FIRST

WITH US
T U K N K I ) OFF

Sparling said one of the
major problems confronting
his campaign is voter apathy.
Many persons are turned off
by politics and politicians, he
said. He added that there
must be a political force in the
nation to restore confidence

You buy only the h igh-
est q u a l i t y drugs at
Coach l igh t .

Y o u ' l l f i n d p rompt ,
f r i e n d l y , professional
service.

Talk over your drug
problems. You' l l f ind a
pharmac i s t a lways
ava i lab le and in-
formed on drug in-
c o m p a t i b i l i t i e s .

Y o u ' l l f i n d the lowest
possible prices for
drugs. You can buy
w i t h conf idence .

e Accept All PRE-PALD
PRESCRIPTION PLANS

(FREE PARKING IN THE REAR)

MIKE WEAVER

Pharmacist

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
M I K i : WKAVKK. -.Owi'in- I'll. »?2stt>i:t

KimTjrain Ph. K72-:{2«:{
JAMES SPARLING

Support The Hawks!

CASS CITY vs. (IBLY
Tuesday, Feb. 26

; NOVEMBER 30 - CASS CITY 62 SANDUSKY 68

[DECEMBER 4 - CASS CITY 77 KINDE 26
DECEMBER 7 - CASS CITY 70 LAKERS 74
DECEMBER 11 - CASS CITY 92 —UBLY 32
DECEMBER 14 - CASS CITY 72 CARD 65
DECEMBER 21 - CASS CHT 65 FRANKENMUTH 66;

JANUARY 4 - CASS CITY 70 ... MARLETTE '371
JANUARY 8 - CASS CITY 71 VASSAR 57 j
JANUARY 11 - CASS CITY 68 .....BAD AXE 56J
JANUARY 18 - CASS CITY 64 SANDUSKY 54]
JANUARY 22 - CASS CITY 58 HARBOR BEACH 48 J
JANUARY 25 - CASS CITY 71 — . LAKERS 61J
FEBRUARY 1 CASS CITY 43 CARD 58J
FEBRUARY ' 8 CASS CITY 73 FRANKENMUTH 98J
FEBRUARY 9 CASS CITY 78 DECKERVILLE 68j
FEBRUARY 15 CASS CITY 76 -—MARLETTE 56'
FEBRUARY 19 CASS CITY 53 HARBOR BEACH 71 <
FEBRUARY 22 -.VASSAR =•-— THERE !
FEBRUARY 26 - UBLY HERE !

<
MARCH 1 - BAD AXE — THERE !

Sponsored on behalf of the team by these merchants
ANDERSON'S THUMB APPLIANCE

Cass City Phone 872-3505

KLEIN FERTILIZERS INC.
Phone-872-2120 Cass City, Mich.

WALBRO CORPORATION
6242 Garfield Phone 872-2131

ERLA'SFOOD CENTER
Phone 872-2191

AUTENMOTORS
Phone 872-2300

GENERAL CABLE
Cass City •

MAC & LEO SERVICE
6314 Main Phone 872-3122

CROFT-CLARA LBR., INC.
6141 Main , Phone 872-2141

SCHNEEBERGER TV,
FURNITURE - APPLIANCE

Phone 872-2696 Cass City, Mich.

KRITZMAN'S CLOTHING
6447 Main Phone 872-3470

LONDON FARM DAIRY
6646 Chutch Phone 872-3523';

VILLAGE SERVICE CENTER
Phone 872-3850 Cass City, Mich.
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For the Ri

CASS CITY
IGA FOOD LINER

STORE HOURS: OPEN THURSDAY &

FRIDAY NIGHTS TILL 9:00.

PRICES GOOD NOW thru FEB. 23,1974
NOTE: Not responsible for er rors mcde in
Printing. QUANTITY RIGHTS R E S E R V E D

Allies .(W tIGA
Tablerite

WHOLE FRYERS

HYGRADE

Pure Pork

LINK
SAUSAGE

$

Ib. 1.29
TABLERITE

Cut-Up Fryers ,b 55*
3 LEGGED OR

Db'l Breasted Fryers .b 55*

TOPAZ
STONEWARE

THIS WEEK'S SPECIAL

SAUCE
WITH $3.00 PURCHASE

^B ^0^ .̂

&Ail
• *E"*r

TABLERITE

Split Broilers

PEPPERIDGE FARM DRESSING

Stuffed Roasters
TABLERITE

Country Cut Fryers

TABLERITE • WITH BACKS

Fryer Legs

TABLERITE.WITH BACKS

Fryer Breasts

PRINGLES.3PACK

POTATO
net. 13Vi-oz.

Pkg.

Ib.

ALL FLAVORS

Hi-C
DRINKS

FAME • ASST. • SLICED

Lunch Meats
/TABLE KING

Sliced Bacon

89*
09

WASHINGTON»RED«GOLDEN DELICIOUS

Apples 3-lb. Bag

RED .RIPE

Watermelon »>

CANNED
HAMS 3-|b-CAN

FAME

CANNED
HAMS s-1"-0™

"CtfOK'S DELIGHT

CANNED
HAMS 8"lb Can

TURKEY
DRUMSTICKS

.(.

DELICIOUS &

NUTRITIOUS

\ BRUSSEL

I* \ ' o ' ^ 1°-°z'\ Sprouts cup
:|/ TROPICAL IQSize

• Pineapples

99

99

99

SMUCKERS • 5 VARIETIES net. 12-oz. JAR

DESSERT J
TOPPINGS

net.8-oz. Jar
CATALINA

3/$|
DRESSINGS / JL

TABLE TREAT

CRUSHED

SLICED.TIDBITS

20-oz. Cans

PINEAPPLE

TABLE TREAT

WHITE
BREAD

LOAVES

V/4-lb. LOAF

46-oz. CANS
FAME • 2 PLY DEL MONTE

BATH
TISSUE

ASST. COLORS

4-Roll Pkg.

\ TOMftTO I

iCATSUP

TOMATO

CATSUP

26-02. Btl.

COLGATE • WITH FREE TOOTHBRUSH

Toothpaste net. 7-oz.Tube /9

99*

35*

DRISTAN • SAVE 20c

Nasal Mist 15cc. Btl.

Coronet Jumbo Studio

Print Towels

KEEBLER • C.C. BIGGS-PECAN SANDIES

Cookies net. 10-oz. Pkg.

OVEN FRESH

Fried Cakes 12PAK
Chocolate
Nestle's Quik 2 l b

69*
97*

Table Treat Solid

MARGARINE

- 42*
Sunny Delight

Citrus Blend
1/2 gal. 59*

OVEN FRESH • ANGEL FOOD

Cake Rings net. 12-OZ.Pkg.

OVEN FRESH • CINNAMON

Fresh Rolls net. 14-oz. Pkg.

FAME CALIFORNIA DARK RED

Kidney Beans net^n°
z'

FAME SOFT MOIST BEEF CHUNKS

Dog Food epAKCtn.

CHOC.,STRAWBERRY,CHOC. MINT

Brach Floats wb.Pkg. 87*
TABLE TREAT IN LIGHT SYRUP

PEARS 29-oz. Can

CORN MUFFIN

Jiffy Mix net.SVi-oz. Box

3 VARIETIES

47*

IGA.HAMBURG &

Hot Dog Buns 12PACK 49^
OVEN FRESH

Lunch Box Pies 5"" 6/JJ9<

DL-rt *

'****:*''''
MAXWELL HOUSE«INSTANT

Coffee 6-oz. Jar

Save 33( 89*
Limit One Coupon Per Family

Coupon Expires Feb. 23, 1974
With Coupon & $7.00 Purchase

OsSUNSHINE.HYDROX

.Cookies

f Limit One Coupon Per'Family
Coupon Expires Feb. 23, 1974

With Coupon & $7.00 Purchase

_ _, . net.'7-8-oz.
ibA Dinners - B O X
PINK LIQUID

Gard Detergent at.

DAIRY FRESH

HALF&
HALF

Qt. Ctn. SMUCKER'S • FROZEN 37-oz. Pkg.

CHERRY

PIES

SPIC & SPAN

Cleaner
SWIFT'S

Prem

,54-oz. Box

net. 12-oz. Can

-"•-̂  • ' - • ' • ' • , • • • . ' ,
A \FAST ACTING ^ pkg

[% Anacin 7*71
r+~ ,ef&tJSave 18* * •
^$£r^ NV
^^l^m • Limit One Coupon Per Family
J^^y Coupon Expires Feb. 23, 1974

' MENDELSON FARM

LARGE

EGGS

21/2 - Doz. Ctn. ORE.IDA
24-oz. Pkg.

CRINKLE CUT
POTATOES

FAME KIBBLED

Dog Food 25-lb. Bag

LIPTON BLACK

Tea Bags 100-ct. BOX
KARO GREEN

. t

Pancake Syrup ie-oz.

BAGGIES #1409

Trash Bags
Save 3O*

10-ot. Pkg.

39*
Limit One Coupon Per Family
Coupon Expires Feb. 23, 1974
With Coupon & $7.00 Purchase
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Your neighbor says

We've slowed
down

CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY. FEBRUARY 21. 1974

Cass Gity Bowling Leagues
SUNDAY NIGHT JUNIORS

Are motorists driving any
slower today than they were
before the onset of the energy
crisis? The State Highway
Commission thinks so. It said
last week that in January, the
average freeway speed was

The Kellys moved to Cass
City recently from Midland.
They have a d a u g h t e r ,
Michelle, age 2.

_
with (itt.fi miles per "hour in
January of 1973.

Mrs. Tom Kelly of Hunts-
ville Trailer Park, thinks so,
too.

"We've notieed as we've
traveled that t raf f ic isn't
moving as fast," she says.
"My husband drives to work
in Bay City and he says traffic-
is moving slower."

The Kellys have also slowed
down to 50-55 miles per hour
from (iO-65. Mrs. Kelly said
they've noticed tha t the gas-
oline gauge needle doesn't
drop as fast as it once did,
either.

AROUND THE FARM

Apply by March 15

for additional (iiel
By William Bortel

If you plan to use more fuel
' for farm production this year

than in 1972, you must order it
through your local distributor
by March 15.

A l t h o u g h f a r m e r s are
guaranteed 100 per cent of
their fuel requirements based
on 1972 use, any a d d i t i o n a l
fuel must be ordered with a

Henry Block
has 17 reasons

why you should
come to us for

income tax
help.

iTReason l.'"W.eUare Income
Hax specialists.'We ask the
Flight questions. We dig for
every honest deduction. We
want to leave no stone un-
turned to make sure you
pay the smallest legiti-
mate tax.

T H E I N C O M E T A X P E O P L E

6440 Main St.
Cass City

Open 9-6
Mon.-Sat.
872-4490

special form.
Called FE-017, the form wil l

be available at local Agri-
c u l t u r a l S t a b i l i z a t i o n and
Conservation Service (ASCS)
offices by. Feb. 15.

Use your own records or
records at your dis t r ibutor to
detail the amount of various
fuels you used in 1972 and
1973. Then estimate your
additional needs for the com-
ing year.

To calculate fuel require-
ments for various crops and
acreages, wr i te for a free'
single copy of "Agricultural
E n g i n e e r i n g I n f o r m a t i o n
Series No. 285," Plan Service,
226 Ag Engineering Bklg.,
•MSU, East Lans ing , Mi.
48824:

You must just i fy your needs
for additional fuel by l ist ing
a d d i t i o n a l added acreage,
new equipment' and changes
in operations.

Take your fuel request to
your local dis t r ibutor . He wi l l
then submit the request to his
supplier.

If your d i s t r i b u t o r dis-
agrees wi th your estimated
needs, consu l t your local
ASCS office. When necessary,
the ASCS wil l act as an
auditor to verify your needs.

All agribusincssmen wi th
fuel questions can call (he
Fuel Crisis Center in Lan-
sing: 517-373-8250.

We Accept All PRE-PAED
PRESCRIPTION PLANS BANKAMERICARD

(FREE PARKING IN. THE REAR)'

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
AILM: \ V I : V M . K ,

Scrubs
Turkeys
Pin Eater«
Rookies
Hopefuls
Luckless Trio
Thunderballs
Rednecks

25
22
19
17
17
11'
10
9

High Team Series: Hope-
fuls 1213, Scrubs 1149.

High Team Games: Hope-
-fuls-431-nB; Turkeys 429.

High Indiv idual Series: E.
Schwartz 469, L. Papp 435.

High Individual Games: E.
Schwartz 16(1-152-151, L. Papp
155, S. Mellendorf 155.

Spl i t s Conver ted : E.
Schwartz 3-10, ,J. Groth 3-10,
B. Van Allen 5-7, M. Frederick
2-7-8.

K I N G S & Q U K K N S
FKH. 12, 1!I7I

Doerr V, Munch
Brewers
D.T.'s
Schwartz Clan
Hobedo's
Loser's Inc.
VIP's
Good Guvs

19
Hi
12
11
11
11
11
5

Actual Size 4"x5

FROM YOUR
110 KODACOLOR
FILMS

High Team Series: Doerr's
Bunch 1851, Brewers 1772,
D-T's 1741.

High Team Games: Brew-
ers 644, Doerr's Bunch 631-
620-600, D-T's 629.

High Men's Series: D.
Doerr 588, C. Timmons 496.

High Men's Games: D.
Doerr 214-190-184, C. Tim-
mons 198.

High Women's Series: C.
Davidson 519, L. Teller 476, F.
Witherspoon 443, M. Schwartz
439, M. Downing 406.

High Women's Games: C.
Davidson 188-167-164, L. Tel-
ler 179-163, M. Schwartz 163-
161, F. Witherspoon 154.

Splits Converted: 2-7-10 F.
Schwartz, 3-9-10 C. Timmons,
3-10 L. Randa l l , L. Teller.

CITY LKAGUIC

Miracle Groc. - Dan's
Sunoco 16

Evans Products 13
Ouvry Chev-Olds 12
L & S S p o r t Center 12
Bartnik Sales & Service 11
New Greenlcaf Garage 8
Cass City Lanes 4
Sommers Bakery 4

High Series: H. Copcland
597, C. Vandiver 596, D. Allen
580, N. Wi l ly 554, C. Kolb 552,
A.D. Freder ick 526, J.
Guinther 523, D. Ouvry 520,
M . Z a w i l i n s k i S l G , L .Ko ' lbSlO,
G. Thompson 509, G. King 509,
R. Ouvry 507, B. Bartle 507.

200 Games: C. Vandiver
244, H, Copoland 216.

L A D I K S n T Y L K A G U K

Pat's Beauty Salon' 17'••
WKYO 16
Sandy's "Beauties" .15
Johnson Plumberettcs 14
Gambles 13
Woods Research Co. 10
General Cable 5U
Deering Packing 5

High Team Series: WKYO
2125, Sandy 's "Beauties"
2109, Gambles 2096.

High Team Games: Pat's
Beauty Salon 756, Sanely's
"Beauties" 748, WKYO 748.

High Indiv idual Series: S.
Cummins 545, J. Steadman
503, M. Guild 478, L. Selby 478,
J. La Roche ( sub) 475, J.
Deering 474, G. Root 463, R.
Baits 462, P. Johnson 460, M.
La Peer 455.

High Indiv idual Games: S.
C u m m i n s 193-192-160, J .
Deering 193, A. McComb 193,
L. Selby 184-169, D. Jones 181,
J. Steadman 181-166-156, P.

jonnson 179, P. Mclntosh
(sub) 178, M. Guild 173-157, G.
Root 172-150, M. LaPeer 168-
156, E. Keagh 150, M. Spencer
152. K. Woods 151. I. Schwarl/
150, R. Ba t t s 175-159, J.
La Roche (sub) 174-160, B.
Abke 173.

splits Converted: S. Cum-
mins 5-6-10, P. Harbec 3-7, P.
Johnson; J. LnRoche ( s u b ) ,
C. Mellendorf, I. Schwartz
3-10, .M. LaPeer 5-7, B.
Massingale 5-6, H. Peters

-2-4-9-10.-5-0, -4-5,--G. Root,-S.
Scott 2-7, M. Spencer 3-10, 5-6.

THURSDAY N H J I I T T R I O

Van Dale
Smith
Essenmacher
DravesDist.
Nemeth
Francis Builders
Carpenter
Cottick Radiator

21
19
18
16
14
11
8
5

High Team Series: Smi th
1478, Nemeth 1459.

High Team Games: Smith
535, Essenmacher 528.

High I n d i v i d u a l Series:
Dale Smith 548, Lowell Smith
548, J. Gallagher 514, B.
Andrus 515.

High I n d i v i d u a l Games:
Dale Smith 214-183, L. Smith
192-182, B. Andrus 192, G.
Gwisdalla 187-175, J. .Gal-
lagher 186-180, G. Deering
183, A. McLachlan 182, Leo
Essenmacher 178, D. Doerr
175.

SUNDAY NIGHT i\HXI-:i)
Feb. 17, lilVI

•Knd of Third Quarter

Channelmasters
Dead Beats
Yellowjackets
Gut te r Dusters
Pintippers
Mix Ups
BigJ 's
D.J.'s

14 ' i
14
14

High Women's Games: ,1.
Lapp 166, J. Deering 165, N.
Anderson 158.

High Women's Series: J.
Deering 478, J. Lapp 471,
M.Frederick 440.

High Men's Games: G.
Lapp 2'4, L. Tracy 189, D.
Curtis 179.

High Men's Series: G. Lapp
580. A.D. Frederick 516, T.
Fin-ness 510.

High Team Game: Chan-
nelmasters 658.

High Team Series: Mix Ups
1877.

Spl i ts Converted: T. Fur-
ness 3-10, 5-7, 5-7, R. Deering
3-10, E. Francis 3-10, A.D.
Frederick 6-7-10, C. Crawford
5-7, L. Tracy 3-10.

MERCHANTS"A" LKAGUF,
Finn 1 Standings-3rd Hound

Fcl). I l l , M I 7 I

Croft-Clara Lumber 21
Kritzmans 19
Bigelow Nuts & Bolts 18
Fuelgas 17
J.P. Burroughs 16
New England Life 13
Village Service Center 13
Erla Food Center I I

600 Series: E. Schulz 611.
500 Series: D. Wallace 580,

R. Ouvry 549, J. Root 530, E.
Helwig 523, A. Witherspoon
522, B. Thompson 520, B.
Musall 519, B. Kr i tzman 517,
D. Vatter517, C. Guinther 516,
G. Lapp 503.

200 Games: E. Schulz 224-
200, J .Smithson221, R. Ouvry
214, B. Musall 211,0. Wallace
203.

Team High Series to Date -
J.P. Burroughs 2902.

Individual High Series to
Date - Keith Pobanz - 626.

Team High Game to Date -
J.P. Burroughs - 1060.

Individual High Game to
Date - Bob Copeland - 250.

STOP RUST CANCER!

Guarantee For Your Car

to
H
O

^
§
CO
H
O

(Regardless of Make)

If you appfy Sym-Tech

RUST PROOFER NOW!
Protect your car against the elements

invest pennies to save $ $ $
(Call For More Information)

OUVRY CHEV.-
OLDS INC.

M

CASS CITY
PHONE 872-2750
or 872-3830"

K^M

STOP RUST GANGER!

Individual High Average -
Dick Wallace 175.

Note: High Average but
does not have 2/3 season -
Elmer Schulz - 178.

Winner Hound No. l - J.P.
Burroughs.

Winner Round No. 2 -
Croft-Clara.

Winner First Half - Croft-.
Clara.

M E R C H A N T S "B" I.K.Uil'E
iMtwl KlHiulings - ;!r<l-H<HHHl -

Feb. i:i, 11171

Tuckey Block 22
Clare's Sunoco Service 20
Croft-C' lara Lumber 18
RabideauiMotor Sales 16
Winter's Truck Sales 15
Veronica's Restaurant 14
Schneeberger TV 13
Wesley Quaker Maid 10

500 Series: J. G u i n t h e r 558,

Schwartz (sub) 457, P. John-
son 453, Phyllis Mclntosh 453,
N. Helwig 452.

High Individual Games: M.
Zdrojewski 182, M. Guild
175-162, P. Johnson 171-153, E.
Buehrly 169-161-150, I.
Schweikart 168-155, N. Wal-
lace 168-156, Phyllis Mclntosh
166-157, M. Schwartz (sub)
160-150, M. Kerbyson 165, J.
Morell ( sub) 164-163, M. Ro-
mig (sub) 162, N. Helwig 158,

LaRoche58-152,J ._ _
soil" 158, R. Mellendorri57,]R.
W h i t t a k e r 157, D. Wisch-
meyer 155, P. Erla 150, T.
Weaver 150.

Splits Converted: K. Anson
3-10, E. Buehrly 3-10, N.
Helwig 4-5-7, 5-7, L. Herron
3-10, B. Ingles 2-7, A. Law! on
4-5, P. Little 3-10, 5-6, R.
Mellendorf 5-10, J. Smithson
2-7, 4-5, .D. Wischmeyer 2-7,
M. Zdrojewski 3-10.

MONDAY N I G H T T K I O
Feb. IK. 1!I7I

Reefers 18
Blank Electronics 17
Bar Hoppers 13
Gadabouts 12
Newcomers 10
Dreamers 10
Ten Pins 9
Warren Electric 7

High Team Series: Gad-
_ahnuts-1245,-Reefcni-U93

High Team Games: Gad-
abouts 448, Reefers 438.

High Individual Series: M.
Grady 452, A. Barren 441, M.
Powell -417.

High Individual Games: L.
Teller 154, M. Grady 190, M.
Powell 151-164. L. Holcomb
153, A. Barren 177, N. Hart-
wick 157, N. Anderson 156.

Splits Converted: A. Barren
5-6.

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Echo Chapter

OES holds

Feb. 13 meeting
Thirty-two attended a reg- J

ular monthly meeting of Echo
Chapter OES held Feb. 13. i
Seventeen officers answered I
roll call.

The ways and means com- i
mittee reported net proceeds I
from a dinner served Feb. 4 i
amounted to $382.97.

Mrs. Donna Holm, Sunshine <J
Committee reported four
cards sent during the month. L_

Dec. 12 Mrs. Alex Green- i
leaf, worthy matron and Mrs. i
Gerald Whittaker and Mrs. i
George Jetya took treats to
members of the Girl Scout I
troop whose leader is Mrs.
Dailey Parrish. Echo chapter
is the troop sponsor.

Kei th McConkey and a
committee of men served f
lunch at the close of the i
meeting.

B. Bar t le V.
J. Peyerk 518, E. Schulz 517,
J. Curtis 509.

High (James: B. Barllc 231,
V. Palmer 215, N .Gremel 206,
,1. G u i n t h e r 203-202, C. Mel-
lendorf 197. J. Curt is 196, B.
Silvenuii l 190.

Team High Series to Dale -
Winter 's Truck Sales - 2880.

I n d i v i d u a l High Series to
Date - Frank Schott - 607.

Team High Game to Date -
Schneeberger TV, Winter's
Truck Sales - 1042.

I n d i v i d u a l High Game to
Date - Frank Schotl 234.

I n d i v i d u a l High Average to
Dale - Elmer Schulz 172.

Winner Round No, 1 -
Rabideau Motor Sales.

Winner Round No. 2 -
Croft-Clara.

Winner 1st H a l f - Rabideau
Motor Siilcs.

I M E K U I A N E T T E L E A G U E
Fell. I I, 11171

FINAL WINTER

Clearance

Cole Carbide
Clare's Sunoco
K r i t z m a n s
Albee Hardware
Cass Ci ty Lanes
Richard 's TV
Walbro
Herron Builders

19
19
14
14

II
10

High Team Series: Kr i tz -
mans 2170, C.C. Lanes 2169,
Walbro 2142.

High Team Games: Kri tz-
mans 790-706, C.C. Lanes
755-749, Walbro 734-720, Rich-
ard's 706.

High I n d i v i d u a l Series: E.
Buehrly 480, M. Gui ld 479, N.
Wallace 473, I. Schweikart
463, J. Morell ( sub) 460, M.

THE CLtifHES CLOSET
ACROSS FROM BEN FRANKLIN STORE

f THE PLACE

TO SAVE

IS

MUTUAL
SAYINGS

PASSBOOK SAVINGS
Compounded Daily, Earnings Paid Quarterly.
Annual Yield 5.39%. No Minimum Balance.
Withdraw Anytime. Add Anytime. All Funds
in by the 10th of the Month Earn from the
1st of that Month.

(Effective October 1,1973)

CERTI-BOOK SAVINGS
Earnings Paid and Compounded Quarterly.
Annual Yield 5.88%. Minimum Balance
$1000.00 with Additions or Withdrawals in
Multiples of $100.00 or More. Withdrawals
Anytime or on 90 Days Written Notice.
Earnings Then Paid to Date of Withdrawal.

OPEN
9:00 A. M. - 3:00 P. M. MON.-THTTRS.

9:00 A. M. - 5:00 P. M. FRI. -— 9:00 A. M. - NOON SAT.

MUTUAL SAVINGS
I N S U R E D ; 6459, Main St. Cass City, Mich

Phone .872-2105 ' :
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WAREHOUSE SALE
SAVE 10% to 40% And More!

See It To Believe It!

3
DAYS
ONLY!

Keep/ your oven daf/y-fre/h
and al way/ pre/entably clean,

Want to clean your oven? Cook something on
a Hardwick gas range with EVERKLEEN® oven!
Scouring, scraping and scrubbing is a thing
of the past. EVERKLEEN® resists grease and

baked-on foods and continu-
ally cleans itself automatically

while you cook at normal
temperatures. Stains and
oven soil s imply fade
away. Costs nothing extra
to operate and is com-
pletely service free! EVER-
KLEEN®... the oven that
cleans itself automatically!

INSTANT

CREDIT
No Parent Till Mir. 1974

YOUR
OLD

RANGE

SAVE! GREAT TRADE-IN OPPORTUNITY!

HARDWICK

FREE STANDING

GAS RANGES

Your C h a n c e To
Trade-In That Old
Range At A Prof it I

NEW, AUTOMATIC CONVENIENCE

You won't believe what a breeze it is to prepare

the family meals . . . day In, day out . . . on a
new modern Hardwick range. Quick, clean, cool top

COLORS: White, Copportorw, flf (he range cooking _ _ even-heat oven for per-

Avocado or Gold Tone. („( baking . . . and easiest cleaning ever.

WHIRLPOOL DRYERS.. .ONLY78WHEN YOU BUY A WASHER!
Whirlpool GOOD

WASHER

138

BETTER
WASHER

178

BEST
WASHER

'198

FULL FACTORY SERVICE & WARRANTY
Get quality Whirlpool Automatic Washer at
low Schneeberger's prices! See our complete
line of fine Whirlpool products!

Whirlpool 3-cycle automatic washer with
famous Magic-Mjx Filter is now priced at
$178! Don't miss this special value at
Schneeberger's this week!

COMPARE OUR
PRICES ANYWHERE!

SEE HOW YOU SAVE!

OPEN ALL
DAY SATURDAY

FRIDAY to 9 p.m.

Whirlpool 2-speed, 3-cycle, 3-tempera-
ture automatic washer with Magic Mix
Filter is now priced as low as $198, with
full factory service and warranty!

WE BUY BY THE CARLOAD
THE WAREHOUSE WAY

^WIDEST SELECTION
IN THE THUMB"

OPEN EVERY
SATURDAY AFTERNOON

FREE PARKING - \
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DeMolay to

hold open house
Tuscola Chapter, Order of

DeMolay and their sponsor-
ing body, Mt. Moriah Lodge
No.'226,' F&AM, will host an
open house Feb. 25 at the
Masonic Temple in Caro at
7::i() p.m.

The open house is being
held to explain the purpose of
DeMolay and its principles.
The program wi l l be directed
at young men between the
ages of 13 and 21.

The film, "What Came You
Here To Uo?", will be pre-
sented, followed by a question
and answer period.

CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 21, 1974

Shabbona Area News
Marie Meredith

Phone 672-9489

.MKTIWmST U'OMK.V

The Shabbona United Meth-
odist Women met Wednesday
evening, Feb. 13, with Mrs.
Robert Wheeler. There were
18 present.

The meeting was called to
order by Mrs. Robert Bader,
president. The devotional was
in charge of Mrs. Arl ington
Gray. The 12th Chapter of
Luke was read in unison.
Headings. "My Creed" by

WE DON'T PUT VOV /NTHf
flT-

I '" BORQK STREET

Mrs. nobert Burns and
"What Is the Church?" by
Mrs. Russell S m i t h , were
presented.

The usual order of business
was conducted and cards
were signed for those who are
i l l . The lesson, Whatever
Happened to the Old-Fash-
ioned Sabbath?, was taught
by Mrs. Russell Smi th .

Lunch was served by the
hostess.

The next meeting will be
March 13 wi th Mrs. Clair
Auslander and the lesson is by

Gray, ........ , ..........

The RLDS Women's De-
partment will meet Thurs-
day, Feb. 21, for a 12 o'clock
noon lunch with Mrs. Maude
Holcomb. Roll call is your
fondest memory of grand-
mother .

The Bunco Group wil l meet
Sa tu rday evening, Feb. 23, at
the Communi ty Hal l w i th Mr.
and Mrs. John Agar , hosts.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hubhard
of Oscoda came Friday n igh t
and spent the week end
vis i t ing her sister and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Merril l
Kreger and f a m i l y .

Mr. and Mrs. John Dunlap
Sr. were Thursday supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Don
Smi th and f a m i l y . They came
to celebrate their grandson
Randy's 18th b i r thday.

Mr. and Mrs. Andy Hoagg
and Mr. and Mrs. Robert

Wheeler and Jeff were Sun-
day dinner guests of the
lat ter 's daughter and hus-
band. Mr. and Mrs. Mike
Monaco of Port Huron.

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Dor-
man were Saturday afternoon
callers of the former's a u n t .
Mrs. Maude Houghton of
Snover. They were also sup-
per guests of .Mr. and Mrs.
Merle Dorman and grand-
daughter Rena.

I M O N K F . i : GROU'

The Pioneer Group wi l l
moot at the "Decked Masonic
Hall Feb. 28 for an oyster
dinner at 12:30.

Kmerson Vatters of Sand-
usky wi l l show pictures.

Bring something to go with
oysters for dinner and also
table service.

Thursday afternoon, Mrs.
Bruce Kritx.man entertained
seven ladies, q u i l t i n g in her
home.

KXTK.VSWN

The Shabbona Extension
Group wi l l meet Monday
evening, Feb. 2">, at 8 p.m.
The meeting w i l l be held at
the Community Hall with
Mrs. Robert Burns and Mrs.
Bruce K r i t / m a n , co-host-
esses.

Each one is requested to
bring mater ia l to make an
Easter rabbit.

What will five cents buy?

6
6
6
u
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u
6

a whole lota hot water!
A LEAKY HOT WATER FAUCET, DRIPPING DAY AND NIGHT, CAN
WASTE HUNDREDS OF GALLONS OF HEATED WATER EACH YEAR.
ACTUAL STUDIES SHOW THAT A LEAK OF ONE DROP PER SECOND
ADDS UP TO ABOUT 650 GALLONS PER YEAR.

A FIVE-CENT WASHER PLUS A LITTLE EFFORT CAN CURE MOST
FAUCET DRIPS... AND STOP ONE OF LIFE'S LITTLE ANNOYANCES.

ALSO... AND MOST IMPORTANT... FROM TIME TO TIME DRAIN OFF
A PAIL OR TWO OF WATER FROM THE BOTTOM OF THE WATER
HEATER. THIS WILL REMOVE THE POSSIBLE COLLECTION OF SLUDGE
AND HELP KEEP THE BURNER FROM OPERATING EXCESSIVELY.

YOU CAN CORRECT THE WASTE OF HEAT AND WATER PLUS SAVE
GAS AND MONEY TOO.

MICHIGAN GAS COMPANY

Mr. and Mrs. James Hop-
kins and daughter Ju la ine of
Saginaw visited (heir parents,
Mr. and Mrs. Virg i l Van-
Norman, Friday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Mi l l igan
and daughter Sanely of He-
mans were Saturday evening
callers of Mr. and Mrs. Dale
Leslie and f a m i l y .

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold J.
Kreuger and Diane of Sagi-
naw .came Friday night and
spent the week end wi th her
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Merrill
Kreger, and f a m i l y .

Thursday evening, Mr. and
Mrs. Don Smi th entertained
11 of their son Randy's friends
in honor of his b i r thday.
Bir thday cake and ice cream
were served.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Arbit-
ter and Mr. and Mrs. Virgi l
V a n N o r m a n visi ted Mrs.
Thelma Ward at Flint and
Mr. and Mrs. Merle Wauri at
Birch Run Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Jones of
Mt. Clemens and Mrs. Pat
Kreuger, Lisa and Frankie
wore Sa tu rday a f t e r n o o n
callers of Mr. and Mrs.
Merr i l l Kreger and fami ly .

Mr. and Mrs. Ha r ley Dor-
man and f a m i l y , and Steve
Purely and Linda Geiger of'
Caro were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Voyle
Dorman. Afternoon callers
were Mrs. Floyd Mclntosh
and f a m i l y , Mr. and Mrs.
Dean Smi th and girls and Mr.
and Mrs. Robert Sawclon and
f a m i l y .

Mr. and Mrs. George Mc-
Kee and f a m i l y of Lapeer
were Sunday afternoon call-
ers of Mr. and Mrs. Laurence
Hyat t and f a m i l y .

Mr. and Mrs. Mi l ton Phi l-
lips of St. Clair Shores were
Thursday callers of the i r

-parents , Mr. and Mrs. Earl

Springstead.
Saturday evening dinner

gues t s of Mr. and Mrs.
Mer r i l l Kreger and fami ly
were: Mr. and Mrs. Thomas
Hagen of Sandusky. Miss
Jeimnie Kreger of Caro. Mrs.
Diane Elsholx and Scotty. Mr.
and Mrs. Dale Mann and
Patty. Ernie Gerstenberger.
the B i l l I luggards and Arnold
J. Kreuger.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Brock
and girls of Brown City were
Sunday af ternoon callers of
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Leslie and
family; - ~"

Mrs. George Regnerus and
f a m i l y of Mt. Clemens and
Danny Bera were Sunday
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Springstead.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Messing
and daughters, Laurie and
Kel ly , were Sunday afternoon
callers of Mr. and Mrs.
Men- i l l Kreger and f a m i l y .

St. Michael's

Ladies Guild

plan events
The monthly meeting of St.

Michael Ladies Guild was
held Feb. 13at 7:30p.m. in the
rectory basement . Rev.
Father" Richard A. Kubiak
opened the meet ing wi th
prayer.

A bake sale was discussed
and planned for Feb. 23 and 24
after Mass. A group garage
sale will be held after Easter.
Members arc asked for good
used items that arc no longer
needed for this event. Details
wil l be announced later.

Refreshments were served
by Margie Veldman, Rose
Simon and Rose Ann Wolf-
rum .

Genevcve Wood and Nursie
Kloc purchased the door
prize, which was won by
Clara Lasko. They were also
in charge of the entertain-
ment for the evening.

Any lady who would like to
a t t end the meet ings and
needs a ride is asked to call
one of the officers to arrange
transportation.

The meeting was closed
prayer for the canoni-
for ' Mother Elizabeth

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

BETTER HEALTH

Modern medicine'

emotional strain

BY DR. WALTER C. ALVAREZ and DRMA/li i ,AM j. WELCH

Almost all of us. when we
are sick, or th ink we are.
suffer from more than just
our physical ailments. And
•sometimes modern medical
cures become so threatening
that they arouse that suffer-
ing and can d r ive q u i t e
normal people up the wall and
even out of their minds.

Doctors are aware, or ought
t'0"~b"enhat"sonietmTesT "for
some patients just screwing
up enough courage to go and
be examined can constitute
emotional distress of major
proportions.

This is especially so in

with a
zation
Seton.

School Menu
FKH. W-.UXHri l I

M O N D A Y

Hot Dog & Bun
Pot a to Chips
Peach Slices

Milk
Cookie

Tl'KSDAY

Chicken Noodle Soup
Turkey Sandwich

Pickles
Milk
Cake

Asii\vi-:n\Ksi).\v

Tuna Noodle Casserole
Buttered Beans

Bread-butter
Milk

Coconut Bar

THURSDAY

Mashed Potatoes
Hamburg Gravy

Buttered Peas
Bread-butter

M i l k
Cookie

F R I D A Y

Barbecue on Bun
Potato Chips

Buttered Corn
Milk

Cookie

Menu subject to change.

AGENT'S CORNER

Suit up for snowmobiling
Allene Mills - Extension Agent

Snowmobiling can be a lot
of fun.

It can also be miserably
uncomfortable -- even dang-
erous.

What makes the differ-
ence?

Often a major factor is the
clothing you wear.

To really enjoy snowmo-
biling, you must be warm and
dry, free to move around
easily and able to see well.
The proper clothing will pro-
vide comfort, freedom to
move and good visibility, and
it will not be a safety hazard.

TRY OUR "DO IT YOURSELF" KIT • AND SAVE!
Buy

PENNZOIL
PZ-2

OIL FILTER for

And
PENNZOIL

Qts. for

05
20

AND JUST FOR

MUST BE CASH & CARRY

25
Cass Gly BORON

Everything you

need for an oil change]

At The Red Light

The most popular type of
clothing for snowmobiling -
and for a wide range of other
winter activities - is the
snowmobile suit. A good suit
is wind resistant and water
repellent. It provides plenty
of warmth with minimum
weight.

• The best way to be ^ure you
get a suit that will perform
well is to buy it from a

• knowledgeable and reputable
dealer. He wi l l show you
one-piece and two-piece suits
in a wide range of colors.
Two-piece suits should have a
longer jacket and a raised
waist l ine on the pants to keep
snow out. Some will have a
bib-type pant or a jumpsuit
instead of pants.

A suit that matches your
machine might be stylish, but
if the color is very light, you
can expect it to show gas and
oil spots very easily. If you
insist on a light-colored sui t ,
look for one with an oil and
water-resistant f in i sh - it wil l
help keep s t a in ing to a
m i n i m u m .

The inner lining of the suit
may be nylon, flannel or a pile
fabric. Any of them will keep
you warm, but the nylon is
easier to slide on and off.

Women's Study

Club holds

meeting Feb. 12
The Women's Study Club

met with lone Perry Feb. 12.
Es ther M c C u l l o u g h , presi-
dent, presided. She showed
two plates which the club will
sell.

Helen Baker -gave the re-
port of (he nominating com-
mit tee . All offices are fi l led
except president, which the
club will a t tempt to f i l l by the
next meeting.

The club wi l l hold a bake-
less sale in the near future
and will donate $20 toward
landscaping for the library.

A discussion followed" a
presentation on "Laws for
Women" given by Helen
Baker.

'"'H' next meelini ' will be
> ' ; ! .>•;: 'Hicks

hospitals, where we manage
to contrive unfamil iar and
thus t h r e a t e n i n g env i ron -
ments, such as the operating
theaters, post-operative re-
covery rooms, intensive care
units and the like, where the
encounter can be psycholog-
ically overwhelming.

Even the simple mat ter of
.̂ !°od Jett]!!fi_j'oi'Jaboj:atnrx
tests, or being hooked up to
electrical recording ma-
chines , or plugged in.to
breathing devices, can un-
loosen a rush of inner fears
and panic that often distress
and can in fact temporari ly
unhinge patients who were
previously apparently qu i t e
normal.

Some years ago. a t h o u g h t -
ful psychiatrist talked with
some 30 patients who w i t h i n
the previous 24 hours had had
laboratory studies made upon
them. Some were in a poorly
concealed state of anx ie ty .
Most of them were fr ight-
ened, Some were seriously
depressed.

He found t ha t the ma in
causes of such distress in-
cluded an absence of in-
formation on what was to
occur or, worse, mis informa-
t ion ; the strangeness-of the
laboratory technic ians ; fear
of w h a t the tests m i g h t
reveal.

Sadly, he concluded t h a i
most of the distress -- t ak ing
into account, of course, t h a i
the patients' basic person-
al i ty structure played some
part - could have been
avoided if the doctor involved
had taken more t ime and had
shown more insight in pre-
paring the patients for tests
they were to undergo.

The emotional reactions of
patients who arc anestheti/ed
for surgery have also been
studied in the post-operative
recovery room and again, 1H
to 24 hours later. Anxie ty and
irritability suggestive of a
serious e m o t i o n a l d i s t u r b -
ance were not seen in those
who had general anesthesia
un t i l 24 hours af ter (he
operation.

Those who were awake
during surgery, hav ing had
only spinal anesthesia ,
showed such symptoms when
first seen in the recovery
room.

The same reactions were
found with patients treated

n-
on

for serious 'disease in
tensive care units and
medical wards.

In another study, nearly a
third of some 400 consecutive
patients admit ted to a cor-
onary care u n i t required
psychiatric supervision be-
cause of the severity of their
anxie ty or depression, or

-lMKiause--th«p—behavior—be-
came so inappropriate tha t
their sani ty was in question

Their t rea tment consisted
sometimes of the administra-
t ion of qu i e t i ng medications,
and sometimes, painstaking
detailed explanat ions of their
illness helped to quiet them

1 Others had to he moved to a
less stressful environment

An a l m o s t u n i v e r s a l l y
stressful encounter is that ol
open-heart surgery, evoking
not only anxiety in the patieni
bill in the professional s ta l f
around them as well.

Among t w e l v e "normal"
subjects undergoing such
surgery , one p s y c h i a t r i s t
found only four who had not
developed overt psychoses in
the course of their hospital
slay. Five of the others
became for a lime quite out ol
the i r minds w i t h delusions
and hallucinations. Three suf -
fered temporar i ly profound
confusion and for a time loss
of memory.

Happily lhe.se episodes are,
for the most p a r t , shor t - l ived,
but Uni t does no I make them
any more acceptable. And the
single most i m p o r t a n t factor
in t ry ing to prevent them, or
in m a k i n g them more bear-
able, is an unders tanding,
devoted and on-lhe-job phy-
s ic ian .

DIAMONDS

CARD'S LEADING JEWELER
PH. 673-2444

AUCTION
SALE

SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 23
AT 1 P.M.

Located 9 miles West and P/o miles North of Caro or 2 miles
West and V* rnile South of Fairgrove at 1882 N. Vassar Road

TRUCKS
1966 Ford '600' truck, N cab,

15 ft, steel reinforced box,
20T twin Edinbourough
grain tight beet box, 9.20
rubber, nice shape

1961 Ford '600' truck, 14 ft.
steel reinforced grain tight
beet box, pull type Edin-
bourough hoist, A-l con-
dition

TRACiORS & PLOWS
1969 International Farmall
756'diesel tractor, w-model
310 Germal diesel engine,
cab, PS, PB, flo front,
16.9x38 rubber, like new

International '550' semi-
plow, 5-14 bottom, on land
hitch

Int. duals w/wheels, 16.9x38
rubber

International Farmall H
tractor, narrow front

COMBINE & CORN HEAD
1962 John Deere '55' Hi-Lo
self-propelled combine, cab,
bean equipped, w/lnnes
pickup, 12 ft. header

John Deere '334N' corn head
for above combine

John Deere '210' corn head

MACHINERY
International 6 row corn
planter

John Deere FBB 15 hole
grain drill

International vibra shank
field cultivator, 16V? ft.

MidWest 16 ft. levelers
Int. '46' transport disc
Inf. '463' rear mount
cultivator

Int. 6 row bean puller
Int. 4 row cultivator for wide
row corn

Int. 5 section spike tooth
harrow

John Deere 16 ft. spring tooth
harrow

Int. cultipacker, 12 ft. w/
wings

Int. semi-mounted mower, 7
f t .

MidWest plow harrow
McCurdy gravity box on

Knowles 12T running gear
w/flo rubber

Century crop sprayer trailer,
450 gal. Poly tank

Fertilizer spreader, trailer,
tandem, PTO

Machinery carrier', 16 ft.
Brady stalk chopper, 5 ft.
Axle w/aircraft wheels and
rubber

Set of gauge wheels
Misc. items of value
Small jewelry 'wagon

TERMS; Contact bank clerk prior to
arrangements.

sale date for credit

THE FAIRGROVE
BANK, Clerk.

BRANCH OF THE STATE SAVINGS

WILLIAM HUNTER,
Owner

BOYD TAIT, AUCTIONEER,
Phone Caro 673-3525 for auction dales.
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Heart attack victims live in mainstream of activity
By Jim Ketduim

A patient in the hospital has
just been told he has .suffered
a heart attack. The reassur-
ances from the doctor which
quickly follow do not pene-
trate the mind as those two
svords "heart attack" reverb-
erate, over and over.

Heart at tack. The nation's
leading killer, it took (575,000
lives and directly touched the
lives of nearly four million
more in 1971. Yet, the patient
wonders, how can the doctor
sit there and tell me I ' l l be
fine?

Many patients approach the
aftermath of a heart 'attack

™wT(ITTTie Idea dial"lliey" are
condemned to a l i fe in a wheel
chair or in bed, a f inancia l
burden on their families and a
useless part of society.

According to many who
have been there, th i s is not
necessarily so. Though some
persons are severely re-
stricted, the major i ty are
capable of nearly f u l l recov-
eries and can lead equally
normal lives.

The w a t c h w o r d in t h a t
recovery which rings , over
and over is care. Patience,
slowing down a l i t t l e and a
desire to re turn to an act ive
l i fe all go hand in hand toward
a recovery.

Mrs. Itoyce Russell of
Green Road, Gagelown, is
l iving proof t h a t i t works.

Mrs. Russell, at the time,
mother of three, was a
walking dynamo. She recalls
that before her heart prob-
lems, everything had to be
done immediately.

"1 think what led to my
problems was that I was
simply doing too much," she
recalled as she relaxed in a
living room chair in the
comfortable, well-kept family
farmhouse.

"I was helping my husband
in the barn with chores,
keeping house, raising my
children and attending to all
their functions in school and
church. I just got completely
tired out. - -

"I'm not a hustler by nature
and I th ink I pushed myself
too far."

The pushing ended in 1%!)
when an ominous shortness of
breath took hold of her. Three
times she wrote it off to an
upset stomach or some un-
known malady. The four th
t ime was too much.

Taken to Hil ls and Dales
General Hospital , her prob-
lem was diagnosed as a heart
a t tack . Fortunately, no dam-
age had been done and, a f t e r
a 21-day slay, she went home.

"I don't seem to remember .
being fear fu l , " she reflected.
"Although there was one t ime
while I was there I remember
someone came in and told me
if I followed the doctor's

orders completely, I'd be fine.
If I didn't , I'd die.

"I remember I had a bad
dream about it that night and
even now, I ' l l wake up
thinking about it. I wonder

«,sometimes if I'm doing ex-
actly what . I should. It still
haunts me."

Once back home, she began
a regimen of walking a mile
each day, while slowly taking
on more and more to do.

MOW I . IFK

She said her heart a t tack
helped open a new life for
her-a more relaxed life wi th
things taken in stride. No
longer must" every -task" bc-
accomplished in one day.

Today, at age 47, she finds
she accomplishes just as
much and enjoys it more.
After conquering the. emo-
tional stress of adjustment ,
she finds the most important
lesson she learned is to pace
herself and not get tired.

This new philosophy has
extended to every facet of her
l i fe . Three years ago, she
gave b i r th to a daughter,
Lisa. She said she bore up
well under the added s t ra in of
a baby, better, perhaps than
wi th the other three children.

"I wasn' t cautioned against
having more children," she
said. "I was under a doctor's
care and I d idn ' t let myself
get t ired. Everything's been

MRS. ROYCE RUSSELL and daughter, Lisa, 3.
not an end, but a beginning.

Lions Auxiliar

holds auction
The Lions A u x i l i a r y enter-

tained guests at t h e i r mon t l i l y
meet ing Monday , Feb. 1 1 . A
dessert was served.

About 42 a t tended a "Silent
Auct ion" which net ted the
club $l(i().00. The i tems not
selected in the Silent Auct ion
were auc t ioned off by Donna
Wischmeyor.

The next regular m o n t h l y
•meeting wi l l be held Marcji 11
at Veronica's Res t au ran t .

Victor Shagena dies Monday
Victor .). Shagena, 73, re-

tired carpenter, died Monday
af t e r suf fer ing a heart a t tack
at the Argyle township home
of his nephew, Francis Shag-
ena.

Horn Aug. 2, 1900, in Argyle
township, he lived in the
Ponl iac and Cass Ci ty areas
u n t i l 1907. He then moved
back ' to Argyle township.

Me is survived by two
daughters , Mrs. George A.
Lapp of Cass Cily and Mrs.
Robert I hind of Warren; eight

grandchi ldren , and two sis-

ters, Mrs. Elsie Roeback of
Argyle and Mrs. Maxell Krilz-
man of Snover.

Funeral services wi l l be
!()::«) a.m. Thursday at the
Z i n g e r Fune ra l Home in
Ubly. Rev. Stanley Kilar will
o f f i c i a t e . Bur ia l w i l l be in St .
Igna t iu s cemetery, Freiburg.

Rosary w i l l be recited at
the funeral home by Fr. Kilar
at I! p .m. Wednesday.

There's not much hope for
the fellow who f i l l s up on dope.

Y. KIM, M.D.
IS PLEASED TO

ANNOUNCE THE MOVING

OF HIS OFFICE
TO THE NEW

HILLS and DALES
MEDICAL CENTER

Dale St.

Hospital
W Medical

Center

Chur,ch St.

4672 HILL ST.

CASS CITY

-(OFFICE LOCATED IN'THE SOUTH-
WEST CORNER OF BUILDING.)

Thank you for your cooperation.

fine."
Today, she takes a blood-

thinning drug and watches
her diet. But for the most
part , lite still holds as much
as it ever did.

"I th ink maybe it holds
even more," she smiled. "My
days are planned and I allow
myself the rest I need. I really
feel fine."

She and her husband were
.married 27 years ago by Rev.
Melvin It. Vender in Cass
City. Now retired at 83, Rev.
Vender has had his own
experience with the trauma of
a heart attack and what it
takes to recover.

It happened in 1959 in
-Marietta, Ohio, where he-and
his wife had moved following
his leaving the First Presby-
terian Church of Cass City.

Rev. Vender had decided to
work p a r t - t i m e w i t h t he
Marie t ta church in Chr is t ian
education, along with calling
on pa r i sh ione r s u n t i l he
reached the mandatory re-
t i rement age of 70.

"Marietta is an extremely
h i l l y place," he recalled as he
sat at the ki tchen table of
their small , neat home on
Church Street.-"Most of tin-
houses are buil t in to the side
of the hi l l s and you have to
climb steps to get to the main
floors."

One day, after leaving the
home of a parishioner, the
pastor got in to his car and
prepared to drive away.

"All of a sudden I became
very short of breath," he
remembered, demonstrating
the panting that overtook
him. "I began to break out
into a sweat and had chi l ls .
Then I started to feel the pain
in my chest and I thought, is
this how it's going to end? I
never once thought about a
heart a t t ack . "

As he sat there, struggling
to breathe, a fr iend came by
and noticed him s i t t ing in the
car. Me stopped, jumped*into
the vehicle and drove Rev.
Vender borne where a doctor
was summoned. By then the
pain had subsided and the
doctor decided not to hos-
pitali/.e h im.

RKS'C AM) R K C O V H K Y

"The doctor told me to
remain very, very quiet ," he
recalled. "Me told me if I did,
I'd be a l l right." •

Recovery came, although
he retired from the ministry,
at 01!.

Today, Rev. Vender slates
emphat ical ly that he feels
f ine . He dai ly walks down-
town and has had no lasting il l
effects.

"After the a t tack , my doc-
tor told me that if I took care
of myself , I migh t have
another 15 or 20 years," he
said. "This is the isth year."
he smiled, crossing his f ing-
ers. "And I feel fine."

Of those who suffer heart
attacks, HO-K5 per cent of them
return to their same jobs and
lead normal lives. Although
the problems faced are very
real, they should be dealt wi th
as rea l is t ica l ly as possible,
according to Al ton L. Blakes-
lec, science writer for the
Associated Press.

In the publ ica t ion "Mow to
Live With Heart .Trouble",
Blakeslee s ta tes t h a t the
record of people with heart
disease justif ies hope and
confidence. He cmphasix.es
optimism in the recovery of a
coronary pa t ien t .

Tuscola County 'Equaliza-
tion Director Mac B. O'Dell

NEWS FROM

District Court
Donald James Howard of

Cass City in the village of
Cass City was ticketed for
excessive noise ( m u f f l e r s ) .
He paid f ine and costs of $15.

Lament Carlton Whitlock of
Gagetown was ticketed in
Ind ian f i c lds township for op-
crating a vehicle with vision
obstructed. He paid f ine and
costs of $20.

• Ronald Leonard McLaren
of Decker in the village of
Fairgrove was ticketed for
speeding (radar). He paid
fine and costs of $50.

Richard Roy McKenney of
Deford in Novcsta township
was ticketed for driving wi th
an expired operators license.
He paid fine and costs of $25.

Gerald Ellis Limberger of
Deford in Elkland township
was ticketed for excessive
night time speed, 75 mph in an
allowed 55 mile zone. He paid
fine and costs of $50.

Harry James Sherman of
Deford in the village of Cass
City was ticketed for exces-
sive noise (mufflers). He paid,
fine and costs of $15.

'Arthur Jay Pratt of Deford
in the village of Fairgrove
was ticketed for disregarding;
a posted stop sign. He paid
fine-.and costs of $15. •,«•.

embodies optimism in dealing
with heart attacks. Stricken
in .1959 with a coronary
thrombosis , O'Dell found
optimism a key element in his
recovery.

Looking forward to a return
to a productive life helps
make it so.

"You find you can lead a
useful , modified life," he said
as he sat behind his desk in
the basement of the court-
house in Caro.

After being stricken. O'Dell
found his construction job too
much of a strain and dr i f t ed
through a series of jobs before
going to work for the Equal i -
zation Department.

"There-were-plenty-of -tips
and downs along the way." he
remembered.

O'Dell agrees that the 'big-
gest problem faced by some-
one who has suffered a heart
a t t ack is the men ta l adjus t -
ment.

"You have to realize from
that point on, you are l im-
ited," he said. "I t ' s d i f f i c u l t
to realize all of a sudden tha t
you have a handicap. But you
f ind t h a t you can' t ignore i i , I I
won't let you forget ."

O'Dell said another need
the pa t i en t has is encourage-
ment , but not to the poin t t ha t
he is not allowed to lend any
semblance of a normal l i fe .

"The f ami ly and friends of

a heart attack victim have to
adjust as well as the patient,"
he emphasized.

Planning , he agrees, is
important. "IlVe make plans
audi t gets to a point that I'm
just too tired, we don't go.
You can tell right away when
you've used up your energy."
. O'Dell finds he must work
at not getting upt ight , saying
tension is probably the great-
est single cause of heart
problems. He added that a
heart a t t ack pat ient has an
advantage in that he can
legi t imate ly avoid the useless
frenzy in life the rest of us
must face.

Is O'Dell afraid of dying'.'
---\u."-..ha- said. ML., tlunk-

about it once in awhile, but
I'm not really afraid. A bear!
attack prepares you in that
you've faced the reali ty of
death squarely. It leaves you
either fearful or composed. It
takes a great deal of f a i t h and
adjus tment ."

He added that the heart
a t t a c k v i c t i m probably has a
belter chance of l i v i n g longer
t h a n the average person
because he has had to slow
down and face real i ty .

'.'And you gel to l ive a good,
fu l l life," O'Dell said. "That's
part of the problem wi th
people these days. . . . they
take themselves too serious-

MAC O'DELL concentrate on
the essential and forget the frenzy.

REV. MELVIN VENDER. . . "I
thought, is this how it's going to end?"

• Adjustable for children or adults
• Folds to fit closets, car trunks, elevators!

Fully equipped
• Great for camping, vacationing, apartment living!

COMPLIMENTS OF OUR STORE AND REXALL , . . MAKERS OF
SUPER PLENAMINS, AMERICA'S LARGEST SELLING MULTI-VITAMIN
MULTI- MINERAL PRODUCT!

tome in and see it! Get full details!

OLD WOOD
Cass DRUG "On The

Corner"

COUPLED WITH OUR

1st ANNUAL

PANCAKE DAY
At Your

GOOD/YCAR FARM TIRE
CENTER

SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 23, '74
10:30 A.M. to 3:00 P.M.

ftsil
PANCAKES and

SAUSAGE
Served from 10:30 a.m.

to 3p.m.

• COMPLETE LINE OF AUTOMOTIVE,
FARM AND TRUCK TIRES.

• WE STOCK FARM DUALS.

• 3 RADIO .EQUIPPED1 SERVICE TRUCKS
FOR SERVICE TO FARMERS &
TRUCKERS.

• RETAIL AND.WHOLESALE.

•BRING THE ENTIRE FAMILY-

GOODYEAR FARM TIRE CENTER
6168 West Main Cass City
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"Largest Stock

In The Thumb"

TREMENDOUS
CHOICE

Choose your oj/vn

Kind of comfort!
®

FINE UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE
sofa-sleepers by

FLExSTEEC

SAVE PURCHASE

$50$100
Entire Stock And More
Living Room Sofas
And Love Seats —,

Sale Priced From

Reg. $440

Bedroom And

Dining Room Furniture

ALL FEB. SALE PRICED

RECLINA-ROCKER

by LA-Z-BOY®

Reduced '20 to '50 AUTHORIZED LA-Z-BOr DEALER

Save 25% on Lamps, Pictures and Accessories

BABY FURNITURE
SALE

Child Line Gibs

Several
Quality
Mattresses
To Select

From
BY

Kantwet

Baby Mattress Price

With Purchase Of Any Baby Crib At Regular Price
Large Selection of Baby Cribs

CARPET
Complete!

Installed
Bigelow's ANGELIQUE

A Tamed Down Nylon Shag

All Displayed Carpet We Show
Has Feb. Sale Price

66
Installed

All Desks Less 25%
Bigelow's
MADCAP

Samsonite Furniture Sale
SAVE ON MONARCH FOLDING TABLE

FOLDING CHAIR

5 Piece
Set

$48
SAVE

Regular $CQ50[59

SPECIAL
PURCHASE

Regular M9'5

Now In The Carton *1588

WALNUT OR
MAPLE FINISH

ADJUSTABLE
SHELVES

SLIDING
\ GLASS DOORS

Long Pile
Nylon Shag

Lee's
OPENING NITE

Heat Set Top
Grade Nylon
Civilized Shag

CARO130 W. Burnside St. GUNSELL'S
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Name area students to CMU honors list
CASS CITY CHRONICL^-THUHSDAY. FEBRUARY 21. 1974

AARP elects officers for 1974
PAGE FIFTEEN

Fourteen ('ass City ari-u
tudents luive been named to

the academic honors list at
Central Michigan University
for the fall semester of !H7:i.
In addition, ei^ht area stu-
dents have been honored by
CMU for achieving straight
"A" averages for the semes-
ter.

To be eligible for the
academic honors l ist, a stu-
dent must have a cumulative
grade average of "B" or
better for his or her entire
college career.

Deford
Deford Good Neighbors

Club will meet Feb. •>-> at «:()((
p.m. at the home of Arlene
Lowe. The group will make a
pin cushion for ils project.
Persons with any questions
may call Arlene or Judv.

The straight "A" list is
based upon fall semester
grades whithout regard to
cumulative averages.

Those named to the aca-
demic honors list are: Mar-
garet A. Mattel, senior; Mary
Beth Ksau, sophomore; Sally
A. (ieiger, senior; Kli/abeth
A. Ilillaker, junior; Jel'fery

Coming: Auctions

Saturday, Feb. 2:1 - William
Hunter will hold a farm
machinery sale at the place,
located nine miles west and 1-
:;i miles north of C.'aro at 1HH2
N. Vassar Rd. Boycl Tail -
auctioneer.

Saturday, March 2 - Edward
Drews will have a farm
machinery sale at the place
located nine miles east and
three quarters of a mile north
of Bad Axe on Johnson Rd. Ira
and David Osentoski, auction-
eers.

Hunt Hoagg. sophomore; Sac
C. Kulinski; freshman : .('urlis
F. Strickland, freshman, and
Kathleen .M. Urban, junior,
all of Cass City.

Katharine ,). l.orenc/.
freshman, and l.ouami Park-
er, senior, ol ( i age town;
Betty L. .Mclntosh. sopho-
more, and Linda K. Peterson,
senior, of Snover: Nancy
Jean Walkowski, senior, of
Decker and Penny P. Har-
rison, senior, of L'nioin'ille
were also named to Ihe list.

Those recognized for
achieving all "A's" during
the fa l l soiiMister were: Belly
J. Ballngh. senior. Sally
(ieiger. senior, and JelTery
Hoajliî .. soplidiuuj-i'.. _ all... ol. -
Cass City; Louann Parker,
senior, of (iagelown; Shirley
Sue Stevens, junior, of Owen-
dale; Car! F. .Munlock. se-
nior, and Hariette Osenloski.
senior, both of I'My, and
Penny P. Harrison of Union-
ville.'

The Cass City AAKP met
Feb. M at the Klkland Town-
ship Fire Hall for its monthly
meeting.

Rev. ^Melvin R.' Vender
gave a memorial service for
Cecil Broun, who was one ol
Ihe cjiarler memliers of the
chapter.

A potluck dinner followed.

with :il pi-esenl. The meeting
was presided over by Norcne
Partridge, president. The fol-
lowing off icers were elected:
president. Marie Roch: vice-
president. Norene.Partridge;
srrrt'lan . Corinne Creuger:
treasurer. Alma Seegei'.

Klecled to the board of
directors were Mars Mcln-

70 attend Sweetheart banquet
Seventy persons at tended

Ihe annual "Sweetheart"
banquet held Saturday eve-
ning at the Novesta Church of
Christ.

Fojlowing the meal a pro-
gram was presented with
retired Judge1 David V'okes of
Detroit as the speaker. The
program began with group
singing with Mrs. Arthur
Pratt as pianist. Mrs. Thelma
Pratt gave a reading and

vocal numbers were pre-
sented by Pastor and Mrs..
Harold Prong as a duet and a
mixed quartet composed of
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Mc-

. Cu'imall- and—Mi!r-am!—Mrs:
Harold L i t t le , The bene-
diction was given by Arthur
Prat t .

Mrs. David Ware. Mrs.
Harold Little. Mrs. Kenneth
Nye and Mrs. Jack llartwick
were in charge.of arrange-
ments.

lyre. Catherine Mcdillvray.
Virginia Chishohn and Glenn
McClorey.

The group decided to collect
nylons and cards with pic-
tures which will be sen! to the
Tuscola County Medical Care
Facility in Caro for patients
to work with. These will be
collected at the March meet-
ing.

Also, each member is to
choose someone who lives
alone or an older person to
call each day and keep in
touch with them. Those par-
ticipating are asked to report
to Mrs. Koch or Mrs. Part-
ridge the name of the person
chosen.

Installation of officers will
be conducted by slate AARP
officials at the next meeting.

Plan every move—keep
your thinking ahead of your
work.

NOW OPEN
in Gagetown

L SPENCER FAM|LY
UPHOLSTERY AND
DRAPERY SHOP

• Choose From Wide Sample
Selection - 3 to 5 day Delivery;

• Free Estimates - Free Pick
Up and Delivery

Pl1^^^65-2625ti^A >

The Want Ads Are Newsy Too!

FEBRUARY GET GENUINE HOOVER W
BAGS & ACCESSORIES HERE

CARO
Largest Stock In The Thumb

HOOVER
presents a completely
new canister cleaner

FACTORY AUTHORIZED

HOOVER SERVICE

with all these
attachments
at no
extra cost

Telescoping
Extension Wand

Large
Throw-Away

Bag

Combination Rug
And Flooi Nozzlt

MODEL
843

Exclusive
Double-Stretch Hose

Dusting Brush

Crevice
Tool

Upholstery
Brush

Tool
Storage Rack

complete for

FLOATS ON AIR • NO WHEELS - NO RUNNERS

...and it picksup
the scrub-water!
• Power scrubs, damp mops,

waxes, polishes, buffs!
• Shampoos carpets to like

new brightness!
• Separate dispenser & pick-up

tanks!
• Wide-angle headlight!
• High power reversible motor!
• Complete with all accessories!

$69.95

CONVERTIBLE
Other
Hoover

Specials

Not Listed

In This Ad.

SALE PRICED

Cleaning
Tools
MODEL 707

With
Cleaner

Regular
$16.95

Special Sale Savings On Other

Hoover Cleaners

• "It beats, as it
.sweeps, as it cleans".
• Extra large throw-
away bag—holds more
dirt—change less
•ften!
• Vinyl outer jacket-
never a dusty odor.
Wipe clean with a
damp cloth.
• Instant rug adjust-
ment...low pile to
deep shag.
• Two speed motor—
50% more suction
with cleaning tools, ;
automatically!
• Rolls on wheels.
• Wide angle head-
light.

"MODEL 707

PUT NEW LIFE IN YOUR
HOOVER CLEANER

WITH OUR 8 POINT FACTORY SERVICE
1. Check Electrical System 5. Check Bag
2. Check Motor & Bearings 6. Check Filter System
3. Check All Movable Parts. 7. Check & Clean Agitator
4. Check Belt & Brushes 8. Clean & Lubricate

$C995PLUS PARTS
Reg. $8.95

CLINIC
SERVICE

CLINIC

Factory Special Disposable Bags 3 pkg. for $2.00.
FREE ESTIMATES ON MAJOR REPAIRS -ALL WORK DONE BY FACTORY EXPERTS

BRING YOUR HOOVER VACUUM CLEANER

O ftaiio 9 AM T0 5:3°PM

ZQufS THURSDAY & FRIDAY
nnlu FEB. & FEB.
umy 21 22

DAYS
ONLl

HANDIVAC
SPECIAL!
Use it like an
Upright...

Use it like a
Canister!,

$

Convenient switch

Powerful motor...
plenty of suction

Converts in seconds
for attachments

Combination
nozzle for rugs
and hard surface floors

*2695

Complete
with

attachments

NEW HOOVER
HUMIDIFIER

Automatic Comfort
with Scientific

Humidity Control!
20% SAVINGS

On All

HOOVER HUMIDIFIERS
Season Clearance Prices

Gunsell's Have Serviced And

Sold Hoovers Since 1919 Guns ell's 130 W. BURNSIDE ST.

CARO, MICH.
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Local FFA chapter looks toward farming challenges
By Jim Ketchum

"We're trying to keep their
interest up and help these
kids to develop themselves."

That's how Lyle Clarke,
vocational agr icul ture in-
structor at Cass City High
School, describes his goals as
advisor to the school's Future
Farmers of America chapter.
Clarke admits it isn't always
easy, but he thinks the results
are worth it.

He has served as FFA
advisor for 20 years at Cass
City High School and in that
time, has seen a great deal of

-change.in both the types of.
students who join FFA and in,
farming itself.

The local chapter boasts 35
members, all from farming
backgrounds. It also boasts a
girl-freshman Lisa Zimba--
as a member. And, while
Clarke admits he has fewer
FFA members today than in
years past, he sees a positive
future for the organization.

FFA is not a class, he
explained. It is a voluntary
part of the vocational agri-
culture program. FFA mem--

DO YOU HAVE A DRINKING
PROBLEM? ALCOHOLICS
ANONYMOUS & AL-ANON
Every Friday evening, 7:30
p.m. to 8:30 p.m.

Good Shepherd Lutheran
Church, Cass City.

bers have to take vo ag when
they join.

Dues are three dollars a
year, which include functions
at the state and national
levels. Meetings are gen-
erally held once a month the
year round, including sum-
mer. Special meetings are
also held as the need arises.

FFA members participate
in a wide range of activities
and compete at county fairs
and exhibitions showing and
judging nearly every facet of
farm life.

Among other things, mem-
bers learn, through partici-
pation, how to conduct and
take part in a public meeting,
to speak in public, to buy and
sell cooperatively, to assume
civic responsibility and to
finance themselves..

National headquarters of
FFA are located in the
Department of Health, Edu-
cation and Wel fa re and
national conventions are held
annually .in Kansas City.

In Cass City, members
have their own projects in
crops and livestock. Clarke
said emphasis is placed on
record keeping to a great
extent.

Members annual ly display
their efforts at the Tuscola
County Fair and the livestock
show and sale held each July
at the Cass City Livestock
Exchange.

Members can also partici-

PROFESSIONAL & BUSINESS

DIRECTORY
DR.W. S.SELBY

Optometrist

Hours 8-5:00except Thursday
Evenings by appointment

4624 Hil l St.
Across from Hills and Dales

Hospital
Phone 872-3404

ALLEN WITHERSPOON
New England Li te
NEL Growth Fund
NEL Equity Fund

Value Line Fund-Keystone
Funds

Phone 872-2321
4015 Oak St., Cass City

YONGKYUN KIM, M.D.
Obstetrician—Gynecologist

4672 Hi l l St. Cass City
across from Hills & Dales
General Hospital.

Office hours - 1-5 p.m.
Monday thru Friday except
closed Wednesdays.

9-12 Saturday
Morning hours by appoint-

ment, ' office 872-2900, resi-
dence 872-3172.

JAMES BALLARD, M.D.
Office at 4530 Weaver St.

Hours: 10:00a.m, to 12:00-
2:00p.m. to4.'30 .

Daily except Thursday after-
noon.

Harry Crandell, Jr.
D.V.M.

Office 4438 SoutnSecger St.

Phone 872-2255

DR. J.H.GEISSINGER
CHIROPRACTOR

MON.,TUES.,THURS.,
FRI., 9-12 and 2-5

SAT.,9-12 EVE., MON: 5-7
THURS.I5-6

'Phone 673-4464

21 N. Aimer St.
Next to Aimer St.

Village Parking Lot

Dr. E. Paul Lockwood
Chiropractic Physician

Off ice Hours:
Mon.,Tues., Wed., Fri.

9-12a .m.andl :30-5:OOp.m.

Saturday 9-12 a.m.

Evenings-Tues. 7-9 p.m.

Closed All Day Thursday
PH. 872-2765 Cass

For Appointment

Harold T. Donahue, M.D.

Physician & Surgeon
CLINIC

4G74 Hi l l St., Cass City

Office 872-2323 - Res. 872-2311

HARRIS—HAMPSHIRE

Insurance Agency

Complete Insurance Services

6815 E. Cass City Rcl.
Cass City, Michigan

Phone 872-2688

J .Y . LEE, M.D..
Internal Medicine

Chest Diseases — Heart
& Lungs

4672 Hill Street
Cass City

9-5 Mon.-Fr i .
9-12 Sat.

Phone:872-4500

K.I. MacRAE, D.O.

Osteopathic Physician

and Surgeon

Corner Church and Oak Sts.
Office 872-2880 - Res. 872-3365

DR. EDWARD SCOLLON
VETERINARIAN

Call For'Appointment
For Small Animals

872-2935

849 N. Seeger St., Cass City

pate in a contest held yearly
by Michigan Bean Co. in
which they raise crops and
keep records from planting to

'harvest. Prizes are awarded
on the basis of both produc-
tion and records.

Clarke explained that Cass
City's FFA has sold Florida
citrus the last few years. The
organization plans to sell
some 400 crates of oranges,
tangerines and grapefruit this
year.

With all these activities,
FFA still finds time to study
the basics of farming from
planting to livestock raising
to figuring monthly budgets.
Clarke emphasized this as a
major area of importance.

"I think markets are prob-
ably one of the most im-
portant things these kids will
have to deal with when they
get into the world of farm-
ing," he said. "This is one of
the reasons we're involved ;il
the livestock exchange. We
want to do more than just turn
these kids loose out there. We
want them to understand how
cattle are graded and judged
and why they don't always get
the price they th ink they
should."

Clarke said about half tho
FFA members presently en-
rolled wi l l stay in fa rming .
Some may not enter it im-
mediately af ter high school,
he said, but eventual ly, they
do return to some aspect of
agriculture.

1NTKHKST STRONG

Clarke said interest among
parents in, FFA has always
been good, pr imar i ly because
a major part of Tuscola
coun ty ' s economy is t i ed
d i rec t ly w i t h f a r m i n g . A
decline of members in FFA
doesn't neccssarilv indica te

GAGETOWN
Mrs. Elery Sontag

Phone 665-9956

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Com-
ment and her mother, Mrs.
Pearl Bliss, spent the week
end w i t h the C o m m e n t s '
daughter and f a m i l y , Mr. and
Mrs. John Arvoy and f a m i l y
at Owosso.

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Com-
ment spent from Thursday
u n t i l Sunday w i t h their son,
Michael in Pi t tsburgh, Pa.
They 'went by plane from
Tri-Cily airport .

Mr. and Mrs. dames Com-
ment and daughter Kimber ly
of Unionvi l le were Sunday
visi tors of his aun ts . Misses
Mary and Nel l ie O'llourke.

Clare Comment,accompan-
ied by his grandfather , Ar thur
Freeman,left last Monday to
spend two weeks with rela-
tives in Florida. Mr. and Mrs.
Frank" Freeman 'also accom-
panied tlie'm there.

M r . a n d Mrs. W i l l i a m
Hunter were Sunday dinner
guests of her sister and
husband, Mr. and Mrs. .Ber-
nard Kennedy, at Port Aus t in .

Mrs. Elmer Shope entered
H i l l s and Dales Hosp i t a l
Monday for t r ea tmen t . Deb-
bie, Jean and John Shope are
staying wi th their grandpar-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Elery
Sontag, dur ing (heir mother's
absence.

W O K K Y FKEK
Fortunate is the person who

can eliminate the word re-
venge from his vocabulary.

SECONDARY

There are many people who
resolve to be happy and take a
chance on being good.

100%
POLYESTER

zing fofSpring

NEW!!
DOTTIES

COORDINATES

11 COLORS TO CHOOSE FROM

REG. $b'.9H

'ONLY

FAMILY
.98™

FABRIC SHOP
6229 W MAIN ST., CASS CITY PHONE 872-2660

an unhealthy situation, he
explained.
' "Farms today are bigger

and owned by a smaller
number of persons than they
were years ago," he said.
"Thus, we don't have as
many kids out for FFA as we
used to have."

He said he foresees a
renewed interest in farming
among farm students, due in
part to the dramatic rise in
farm prices over the last
year. But h,e added, money
hasn't been the big object,
even in the past.

Members have joined be-
cause of their natural interest
in farming which has been
maintained at a fairly con-
stant level for'years..

Clarke said FFA members
tend to spread themselves
pretty evenly between in-
terests in cash crops as
opposed to dairying. Hogs and
beef cattle are also showing a
strong upsurge in interest and
study.

I ' H O H I . K I M S

FFA is not immune to
problems, the primary one
being mainta in ing interest in
the organization among the
members as a whole.

"It's harder to get things
going any more, "-Clarke said.
"Today the kids have morp
outside interests going and
they have less t ime for
something like FFA."

Meeting content has also
had to change to meet new
needs.

"Years ago, a movie was a
big event at a meeting," he
said. "That \wls before tele-
vision. Now a movie is just
another thing and it really
doesn't hold their interest."

Strength of FFA organiza-
tions will vary depending on
the state and its attachment
to f a r m i n g , he said. In
Michigan, FFA has about
12,000 members in 225
schools.-

FFA developed from an
organization founded in Vir-
ginia in [he rnjd-1920's and as
a na t iona l organizat ion
marks its 46th anniversary
this year.

It was chartered by Con-
gress in 1950.

Clarke said a former FFA
member is probably better-
prepared to meet the complex
problems of manag ing a
modern farm than someone
who has not been exposed to
it. Its emphasis on markets,
pricing and quality of prod-
ucts all aid in making farm-
ing decisions.

Clarke said it also helps a
young farmer recognize when
markets shif t and why.

"We really can't train for
the future," he said. "We
can't even really train for
next year or the year after
that. But we do attempt to
explain why change occurs
and how to recognize it."

PREPARING FOR this year's cattle judging contest are
three members of Cass City Future Farmers of America
Jesse Zimba, Lisa Zimba and Randy Smith, vice-presi-
dent of the chapter.

mm

FEBRUARY
16-23

or tomorrow's agriculture . . . today's Future
Farmers of America have already started to meet
the challenges of the environment. . . are already
preparing themselves for useful, and satisfying,
careers in the nation's largest industry.

F.F.A. offers its young members the opportunity
.to develop their special vocational skills with
varied training programs and community projects.
We congratulate F.F.A. on its 40th anniversary,
its members for learning, earning and growing.

Croft-Clara Lumber Inc. -

Erla's Food Center •
& Packing Inc. -cecity

Michigan Bean Co. - cass city

Carocay J.P. Burroughs Laethem Equip. Co. -

Agriculture Inc. - cagetown Rabideau Motors - cass city
o • .

t

Hedley Equip. Co. - can, Leonard Damm

Deering Packing -snverwood & Son
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BEAT INFLATION BY SHOPPING AT KRITZMANS'

FLORAL SHEET SALE
• NO-IRON MUSLIN 50% POLYESTER, 50% COTTON

72" X104" ——
;*̂  TWIN FITTED E-

81" X104"
DOUBLE BED FITTED-

90"X 115" QUEEN
QUEEN
42"X36"
FLORAL CASES Pr.

>$27

$3
>$4
>$2

37

99

27

SINGLE KNIT MATERIAL
New Ass't Spring Patterns 60-inches

Wide - 50% Polyester and 50% Cotton

SALE!!!!!

MEN'S RUBBER

HIP BOOTS
AND

CHEST WADERS
-I I _•!-.

Limited Supply * i T *

tfL. " i *
BECAUSE OF THE HIGH IMPORT
TAXES THIS MAY BE THE LAST
TIME THAT THESE BOOTS CAN
BE OFFERED AT THESE LOW
PRICES.

HURRY AND SAVE

RUBBER HIP
BOOTS SIZES

7 to 11

RUBBER CHEST
WADERS

SIZES 6 to 12

MEN'S
LONG SLEEVE

SWEAT
SHIRTS

• First Quality

• 50% Polyester
50%'Cotton

• Sizes Small, Med.,
Large, X-Large

• By Famous Maker

• Reg. $3.69

2 for

or $2.67 each

CLOSE-OUT VALUE
MEN'S 8-INCH WORK SHOES

ELK TANNED LEATHER UPPER WITH
RUBBER HEEL AND LONG WEARING
CORK SOLE

Sizes 7 - 1 3 $ Q SS
(no size 8) ' ̂

LIMITED SUPPLY EE WIDTH ONLY

YD.

SEERSUCKER PLAID MATERIAL
By Dan River. 50% Polyester, 50% Cotton.

No-Iron. One Group of Ass't Plaids. 45"

and 44" Widths.

Reg. $2.39 $177
I YD.

CLOSE-OUT
GENUINE

SUPP-HOSE STOCKING
By "KAYSER-ROTH" .

SUPP-HOSE SUPREME SHEER

• SUPP-HOSE REGULAR

Reg. $4.95

Value $799
L pr>

HURRY! WHILE THEY LAST

WOMEN'S AND GIRL'S

VINYL SNOW BOOTS
WITH WARM LINING. CLOSE-OUT
OF WINTER STOCK. MOSTLY SMALL
SIZES.

OFF

WOMEN'S PANTY HOSE
• FIRST QUALITY

•ASSORTED SHADES

REG. 99<fr per. pair

KRITZMANS CASS
CITY

With the purchase of one yard or
more of material from our ma-
terial department. Limit - 2 pat-
terns per customer.

SALE ENDS SAT.
FEB. 23, 1974

BANKAMERICARD

master charge
THE INTERBANK CARD
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Police probe two gasoline thefts
Two gasoline thefts are

being investigated by Cass
City Police and Tuscola
county sheriff's deputies.

Tuesday, Cass City Police
reported gasoline was stolen
from a car belonging to
Andrew Parker of Lamton
Road, Decker, while it was
parked at Auten Motor Sales.
The theft occurred sometime
between Saturday night and
Tuesday morning, according
to Chief Gene Wilson.

Wilson reported several
other vehicles parked in the
vic in i ty had also been tamp-
ered with .and

caps were missing, lie said it
was not known if any gasoline
had been stolen from these
vehicles.

Friday, Glen Van Wagoner
of White Creek Road, Kings-
ton , reported to Tuscola
count) sheriff's deputies tha t
gasoline had been stolen from
two tractors and a' storage
tank at his residence.

He told deputies he went to
check the tractors and no-
ticed the gas caps missing. A
f u r t h e r check d e t e r m i n e d
that the tanks were empty.
The storage tank was also

OLD WOOD DRUG
Has a complete photo department.

Cameras made for you.

Priced Right Too!

Pick the new K O D A K
POCket INSTAMATIC ' 20
Camera, the little camera

'that goes in your pocket
or purse for great pictures
wherever they happen.

Pick the easy- to -use
KODAK INSTAMATIC X-15
Camera and save all your
summer fun in beautiful
snapshots and slides. .

Come, take your pick from these and other
popular KODAK INSTAMATIC" Cameras

A total of 200 gallons of
gasoline was stolen valued at
$100. The t h e f t occurred
sometime between Jan. 29

tand Feb. 14.
Both cases remain open.
Cass City Police also re-

Croft named

VP of assn.
C l i f f C r o f t , president of

C r o f t - C l a r a L u m b e r , w a s
elected vice-president of the

" M i c h i g a n Re ta i l Lumber
Dealers Association at its
a n n u a l convent ion held re-
cen t ly a t ( I r a n i ! Kapids.

Over 2,0110 lumber dealers
at tended the a n n u a l conven-
t i o n . Kar l Vogelheim, Rogers
C i t y , is the new p res iden t .

Garrett to<
speak at

Trinity
A min i s t e r p a r t i c i p a t i n g in

a program lo reach Thumb-
area vacat ioners w i l l be the
gues t speaker a t T r i n i t y
U n i t e d M e t h o d i s t C h u r c h
Sunday, Feb. 2-1.

Rev. Robert (Jam-It, a
member of the Detroit Con-
ference Coord ina t ing Corn-
mi (lee on Leisure Resort
M i n i s t r y , serves on an ecu-
menical m i n i s t r y serving the.
Sagihaw Bay Shore urea from
Bay Port lo Harbor Beach.

He serves as pastor of the
Grindstone C i ty , Port A u s t i n
and Pinnebog United Meth-
odist Churches.

l i e w i l l speak, on "A New
Look at Leisure."

ported the larceny of a tape
player and four speakers

.from a car belonging to Henry
Ciesielski of River Road.
Police said the the f t occurred
while the car was parked in
back of a service s tat ion '
w i t h i n the last lit) days.

The the f t • was reported
Saturday.

CATTI.I-: A T T A C K K D

James Fader of -liiiili Green
Rd. repor ted to Tuscola

deputies tha t sometime a l te r
' noon Sunday, one of his cows
was attacked by do^s whi le
tiie cow was in the barn.

He told deputies a s imi l a r

incident took place Jan. 2;i.
Also at tha t t ime, a 350-11).
heifer had been killed by dogs
in the barn. He said he has no
idea where, the dogs came
from or who might own them.

The clous atUiched the cow
in its f ront legs, i n f l i c t i n g
serious wounds.

Wednesday, Feb. l.'i. Wal ter
Arn of East Bevens Road.
Delord. reported, to Tuscola
deputies t h a t l l u > f ron t license
plate f rom bis car had been
stolen whi le the vehicle was
parked in the garage at .his
home.

He said the t h e f t occurred
'sometime between FelV R and
Feb. 12.

CCDC moves on
site development

Cass C i t y D e v e l o p m e n t
Corporation w i l l move ahead
w i t h plans to develop l and
south of the Arnica p l a n t as a
s i te for f u r t h e r i n d u s - l r i a l
growth at a cost of a p p r o x i -
.malely $ l f> ,0 ( lO .

The dec i s ion was a n -
nounced d u r i n g a meet ing of
CCDC at the M u n i c i p a l B u i l d -
ing Tuesday n i g h t .

Accord ing , to S e c r e t a r y
Michael Weaver, the s i t e w i l l
be brought up to road level
and water and sewev w i l l also
be made a v a i l a b l e . This l a l t e r
cost goes beyond the S l f i . O I H )
f igure .

Weaver said six to n i n e
months ago. two f i r m s were
interes ted in the s i t e ' but the
corporat ion was not ready lo
deal on i t . Since then bo th
f i r m s have backed o u t .

"Once t h i s work is done,

w e ' l l be ready to work w i t h
any f i r m i m m e d i a t e l y t h a i i s
in te res ted in b u i l d i n g ou t
t he re , " W e a v e r sa id . He
enipliasi / .ed t h a i t h e s i t e w i l l
t ake a lot of work before i t
w i l l be ready. No dale for
comple t ion was set.

Weaver said the corpora-
l i o n is also pleased w i t h t h e
.complet ion of Dr. Paul Chap-
pel's c l i n i c wh ich did not exist
a year ago. Weaver said Dr.
C h a p p e l has developed a
s t r u n g , successful den t i s t ' s
prac t ice in ('ass C i t y .

At . the mee t ing . C l i f f o r d
( V o l t and Herbert Ludlnw
were re-elected to three-year
terms on the board. Crof t
c u r r e n t l y serves as president ,
w h i l e Ludlow is a member of
the board.

The corpora t ion present ly
has Kili v o t i n g shares of stock.

'Or FIBERGLAS

INSULATION

TROUBLE LIGHTS

CHLORIDE

DOOR MIRRORS

95 ALL ITEMS
CASH & CARRY

PRICES GOOD UNTIL MARCH 2,1974

CROFT-CLARA LUMBER, INC.
CASS CITY PHONE 872-2141

Arraign Fairgrove
man Tuesday

WANT ADS

A Fairgrove man was' ar-
raigned in Tuscola County
Circuit Court Tuesday and
charged with the u n l a w f u l
d i s t r i bu t ion of mar i juana at
A k r o n - F a i r g r o v e H i g h
School.

John Fierrof .was arraigned
before Judge James P.
Church i l l . He stood mute and
a plea of innocent was entered
in his behalf . Pre-trial exam-
inat ion was set for March 4
and bai l was cont inued.

The offense occurred Jan.
- If:" " • •

In other court action Tues-
day. I he court look under
advisement a mot ion f i l ed by
M i l t o n Shields asking for a
new t r i a l . Shields was con-
victed as a c r i m i n a l psycho-
pa th and is presently serving
a sentence in Jackson Prison.

Judge C h u r c h i l l a lso
granted a mot ion for dismis-
sal of charges against La-
mont U 'h i l lock . Cam. W h i t -
lock had been charged w i t h
larceny of a service s t a t i o n in
Cam.

A jury t r i a l of one day was

Lorie Spear

in review
Lorie Spear, a Mich igan

Stale Univers i ty I reshman
and 1972 graduate of Cass
City High School, explores
her personal concept of cul-
ture as she reviews the MSU
fine a r t s en ter ta inment pro-
gram as part of her h u m a n i -
ties class.

, T h i r t y - f i v e MSU s tuden ts
a t t e n d a m u l t i t u d e of c u l t u r a l
events i n c l u d i n g the Leeltire-
Conccrt Series. Kresgc Ar t
Cenler Gallery e x h i b i t s and
var ious programs offered by
the Depar tment of Music .
Then they w r i t e a paper
e v a l u a t i n g I lie even t .

Bishop Pipes Jr., professor
in the Depar tment of Hu-
m a n i t i e s , i n t r o d u c e d the '
H u m a n i t i e s Per forming A r t s
class in l!)72 to encourage
s tuden t s to m a k e use of (he
numerous c u l t u r a l ' and edu-
c a t i o n a l f a c i l i t i e s a v a i l a b l e
on t h e MSU campus.

D u r i n g t h e t e r m , each
s t u d e n t a t t ends at least eight
c u l t u r a l ac t iv i t i es . They also
meet w i t h the i r instructor lo
assess (he i r personal con-
cepts of cul ture and how they
are expanding through the
added contac t made possible
th rough the' course.

Miss Spear is the daughter
of Mrs. Mary Spear of HI. No.
1. P h i l l i p s Road, Del'ord. She
is ma jo r ing in psychology.

Name Delores

Sherrard queen

Saturday
Reversing the trend of (he

past two years, Delores Sher-
rard captured the crown as
Swee thea r t Queen a t the
Campus L i f e Swee thea r t
Pageant held Saturday n ight
al Vassar High School.

Miss Sherrard, a senior at
Cass Ci ty High School, look
the crown in compet i t ion w i t h
representatives from seven
other schools. First runner-up
was Renee Mowry of Akron-
Fa irgrove High School and
Kerry Wells of Vassar High
School was second runner-up.

DELORES SHERRARD

She indicated she wi l l ac-
cept a free hike tr ip through
Europe th is summer as a
member of Campus Life's
European b ike . t r ip . She wi l l
spend mos t , of J u l y and
A u g u s t l o u r i n g m u c h of
France.

For her ta len t entry, Miss
Sherrard played the trumpet
and sang a solo. She also
collected between $800 and
$900 ' in pennies through a
collection dr ive al a number
of Cass City stores.

Funds raised by contes-
t a n t s will go toward paying
for the pageant and toward
f inanc ing the Campus Life
Clubs.

For the past two years,
Cass City 's representat ive
finished in the first runner-up
slot. , •

« • ' , '• • "

V;^;X^;i-^%'

set in (he case of Lionel 1).
Daly, who faces a th i rd
charge of driving while under
the influence of liquor. The
tr ial wi l l beheld April 10. The
offense took place Nov. 10.

Pre-tr ial examina t ion for
James Gray, Gagelown. was
continued two weeks. Gray is
charged wi th arson in a f i re
which burned his home in
Cass Ci tv last summer.

INCOME TAX Service - Clara 1
Gaffney, 6567 Elizabeth. I
Phone 872-2875 evenings and i
week ends. 2-7-10

FOR SALE - Homelite chainl
saw in good condition. $50.
872-3718. 2-21-31

CUSTOM - BUTCHERING - I
Monday and by noon Tues-
day. By appointment only.
Cutting and wrapping for deep
freeze. 1 1/2 mile's south.
Carl Reed, Cass City. Phone
872-2085. 10-27-tf

2-e-OA-SS:
CITY?

F R I - S A T • SON. FEB. 22-23-24
THUMB AREA PREMIERE!

Fri.-Sat. EVE. 7:30 & 9:30
SUNDAY 5:00 - 7:00 - 9:00 .

Color by Deluxe"

**ALSO**

WALT DISNEY FEATURETTE

"BEAVER VALLEY

STARTING WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY
20th for a LIMITED ENGAGEMENT!
Please Note: The STRAND THEATRE
in Caro has been leased to Warner
Bros, for this engagement and they
set the admission prices.

2 Showings each night at 7:00 & 9:00
Continuous Sat. & Sun. from 2:00

ADULTS..$2.50 CHILDREN..$1.00

Robert
Redford
a/Jeremiah

Johnson

Panavision" • Technicolor

The man
who became a

legend.

The film 'destined
to be a
classic!

s&IPG]
Warner Bros.

A Warner Communications Company o

NO PASSES CAN BE ACCEPTED'
FOR THIS ENGAGEMENT .

TYLER LODGE

CARD
PARTY

• AT

MASONIC HALL
Maple & Garfield Sts. - Cass City

Saturday,
Feb. 23

' ,' ' 8 p.m.

' Admission - $1.00 - Refreshments

Sponsored In Community Interest By

THE CASS CITY STATE BANK



CASS CITY, MICHIGAN CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 21, 1974 PAGE NINETEEN

TURN DISCARDS INTO CASH • USE PROFITABLE, LOW COST CHRONICLE LINERS
Transit (nonbuslness) rate:

20 words or less, $1.00 each
Insertion; additional words 4
cents each. Three weeks for
the price of two - cash rate.
Save money by enclosing cash
with- mail orders. Rates for
display want ad on application.

FOR SALE -June clover seed. .
Call OL 8-4457 Ubly.

2-21-ln

KOSTANKO'S Auto Service -
All gas and diesel engines,
automatic transmissions,
re-builds, tune-ups, welding
and fabricating. Our policy is
customer satisfaction. Phone

— 8 7 2 ^ 2 2 1 0 . " 1 0 - 4 - t f

I AM a candidate for the of-
fice of Village Clerk for
Village of Gagetown for gen-
eral election March 11 at
Village Hall. I will also be
a write-in candidate for of-
fice of village treasurer of
Gagetown. Your support will
be greatly appreciated.
Madeline Sontag. 2-21-ln

FOR RENT - apartment type
living for girls, 1 block south
of light. New washer and dry-•
er. Rent starting at $75 month
includes all utilities. Phone
872-3570. 2-7-tf

ALL HARDWOOD firewood,
full cord and a half, $21.00.
Delivery charge $5.00. 2
miles east and 3/4 north of
Shabbona. Phone 313-672-
9589. Free delivery 3 miles
either side of Germania Rd.,
from Bay City Forestville
Rd. to Deckerville Rd.

2-21-1

FOR SALE - Corn picker,
one row, $150.00. Frank
Nagy, 1 3/4 west of M-81
on Akron Rd. 2-14-3

WANTED - Part-time cleri-
cal help in Cass City church
office. Adult must be ex-
perienced in typing stencils
and mimeographing. Call
872-2945. 2-21-4

No more slippery walks

use
Supermelt

Harmless to grass-shrubs-
concrete. Melts 30 times fast-
er than rock salt. Goes 6
times further.

Albee True Value
Hardware
Cass City

12-13-tf

EUCHRE card party - Satur-
day, March 2, at 8 o'clock.
Prizes, lunch served. $1.00
donation. Sponsored by Gif-
ford Chapter OES, Gagetown.

2-21-1

FOR RENT - Bissell and Blue
Lustre rug shampooers. Al-
bee True Value Hardware.
Phone 872-2270. 7-13-tf

HAPPY BIRTHDAY Karen
Fischer. Love ya like a
sister. 2-21-1

FOR RENT - furnished farm
house, wall to wall carpet-
ing. Excellent condition, See
Bud Schneeberger atSchnee-
berger's TV, Furniture,
Main St., Cass City. Also,
house for rent, furnished, in
Cass City, gas heat, wall to
wall carpeting. See Bud
Schneeberger. 2-14-tf

KAWASAKI 1972, 350-S2
motorcycle, low mileage,
absolutely like new, never
raced or run in dirt, super
gas mileage, only $650.00.
Lee Armbruster Sales,
Unionville 674-2311. 2-21-1

SEPTIC TANK CLEANING -
For fast, guaranteed work.
call Dale Rabideau, Cass
City 872-3581 or 872-3000.

3-24-tf

WANTED - land to rent, north-
east of Cass City. Call 872-
2254. 2-7-3

ANTIQUES, Book, Miscellan-
eous Sale - Brass beds, old
books (over 2,000), old news-
papers, postcards, miscel-
laneous items. Sale starts
Wednesday, Feb. 20, at 9:30
a.m. through Saturday, Feb.
23, 3:30 p.m. 6124 Cass City
Road, across from IGA Store
In Cass City. 2-21-1

FOR SALE - 1969 Chevelle
SS. Phone 872-4528. 2-14-3

EARS PIERCED FREE - fast
and easy aroid Wood "Drug.""
Purchase 14 carat gold posts
from our big selection. New
spring jewelry arriving
dally. 2-21-1

FOR "a Job well done feeling"
clean carpets with Blue Lus-
tre. Rent electric shampooer
$1. Ben Franklin Store, Cass
City. 6-11-tf

WILL BABY SIT in my home
days, preschoolers, excel-
lent care, trained first aider.
Companion for my pre-
schooler. Dodge Rd, Phone
872-3898. 2-21-3

USED FARM
EQUIPMENT

A wide selection of good
used equipment is available
now. The current supply situ-
ation makes these items bet-
ter than ever buys. Act now
while stocks are complete.

TRACTORS
JOHN DEERE B. Good ma-

chine.
CASE 1030 Diesel. Cab, 3-
point hitch.

IHC 300 diesel. With loader.
MASSEY-FERGUSON 50 Gas.
OLIVER 88. Gas.
OLIVER 1600. With heat hous-
er, duals

IHC M with wide front
IHC 350 diesel

SKID STEER
LOADERS

CASE 1530 with just 150 hours
MELROE BOBCAT model 600
(2) CASE 1537
CASE 580 with loader. Diesel

BARGAIN BUYS
CASE blower 54
NEW HOLLAND blower. Mod-
el 23

OLIVER 4-row cultivator
JOHN DEERE 4-16 semi-

mounted plow
(2) CASE 5-16 semi-mounted
plows

CASE 5-16 "2000 series"
semi-mounted plows

NEW HOLLAND 717 with 2-
row corn head

NEW HOLLAND 460 haybine
NEW HOLLAND 516 spreader,

good shape
NEW HOLLAND 510 spreader
(2) used 3-bottom Oliver trail-
er plows

A SELECTION OF
GOOD USED
FIELD CULTI-
VATORS AND
USED HAY CON-
DITIONERS

FOR SALE - in Cass City,
near schools and stores. 4
bedroom home, 2 baths,
kitchen, dining room, living
room, basement, natural gas
fired hot water heat, corner
location, garage too. $1000
down and $155. month with
good credit rating. Immedi-

• ate possession. Call John
McCormick, Cass City,
Mich., 872-2715. ' 1-3-tf

AUCTIONEER
EXPERIENCED

Complete Auctioneering Ser-
vice Handled Anywhere.

WerhTaklf A'llAr range ments
My Experience Is Your

Assurance

IRA AND DAVID
O3ENTOSKI

PHONE:
Cass City 872-2352 collect

FOR SALE - fireplace wood.
Phone 872-2621. 2-14-3

GRIM'S DRIVE-IN - Featur-
ing Moore's Ice Cream and
Monsterburgers. M-81 and
M-53. Monday - Thursday,
11:30-10. Friday - Saturday,
11:30-11. 6-7-tf

WATER SOFTENERS - Rent
or buy with first 6 months'
rental applying to purchase.
5-cycle valve. Rental models
as low as $189.95, Special
offer - free gift with water
demonstration in your home.
No obligation. Crystalsoft
Division, Fuelgas Co. M-53
and M-81. 4-29-tf

Great Decorating Ideas
Start Here.

Color coordinate your home
with the latest in carpeting
from Magee and Morcrest.

Add the crowning touch with
today's easy-do wallcovering
and paint.

Visit our decorating depart-
ment soon.

Free estimates and prompt
service.

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City
1-10-tf

REDUCE EXCESS fluids with
Fluidex $1.89 — Lose weight
with Dex-A-Diet capsules
$1.98 at Old Wood Drug.

1-10-12

.PAPER NAPKINS imprinted
with names and dates for
weddings, receptions, show-
ers, anniversaries and other
occasions. The Cass City
Chronicle. 1-12-tf

EVERGREEN Township Board
meeting will be held Thurs-
day, Feb. 21, 8:00 p.m. at
Otis Dorland's home. 2-21-1

RAWLEIGH PRODUCTS in-
terested in sales or prod-
ucts. Richard Abke, RFD
No. 2, Unionville, Mi. 674-
2489. 2-7-3

We Have Freezers
Gibson and Hotpoint

15 and 20 cu. ft. chest; 10,
13, 16 No Frost; 19, 21 cu.
ft. uprights.

Sales with service.

Anderson Thumb
Appliance

Cass City - Main St.
2-21-tf

FOR SALE - Sunset 200-gal-
lon bulk tank. Phone Ubly
658-4771. Call after 8 p.m.

2-21-1

WEDDING INVITATIONS and
announcements. A complete
line of printing, raised print-
ing or engraving. Dozens to
choose from. Cass City
Chronicle, Cass City.

1-12-tf

Now

Homelite
Chain Saws

at

Albee True Value
Sales & Service

HOUSE FOR SALE - 1-story,
10-room home on 50x132-
foot lot. Carpeted, stove and
refrigerator. Metal clothes
closets. New wiring, plumb-
Ing, storm windows and oil
furnace. Also two utility
buildings. Located at 119
Butler, Caro, 2-7-3

Custom Butchering

Meat cut, wrapped and frozen

Gainer's

MeairPacking

FOR RENT - Electric adding
machine by day or week. Or
rent a new Smith-Corona
portable typewriter. Also
new and used typewriters for
sale, all makes. Leave your
typewriters and other office
equipment at our store for
repair. McConkey Jewelry
and Gift Shop. 10-6-tf

FOR SALE - 72Ski Doo Olym-
pic 300 with cover, excellent
condition. $425. Call 872-
2993. 2-21-3

Wallpaper and
Paint

FOR SALE - 13 wood storm
windows and screens. One
wood storm door and screen.
John A. Kelly, 4282 Maple,
Cass City, after 5 p.m.

2-14-3

MARTIN ELECTRIC

Residential and Commercial
Wiring

State Licensed

Free Estimates

WANTED - baby sitter in my
home. Phone 872-4528.

2-14-3

FOR RENT - second floor
one bedroom ' apartment,
kitchen and livingroomcom-
bined. Furnished and utili-
ties paid. Working single girl
or girls only. Phone 673-
4006. 2-21-tf

GROSS

MEAT MARKET
FOR PERSONAL SERVICE

And the Best in Meats

Our Own Make of Fine
Sausages and Smoked Meats

Freezer Meats Always
Available

9-23-tf

INCOME TAX SERVICE - ap-
pointment only. Phone 665-
2520 - Richard J. Patnaude,
5 1/2 miles west of Gage-
town, 1/2 mile north on North
Colwood Road. 1-10-8

FOR SALE - 1969 19 horse-
power and 1970 28 horse-
power Viking snowmobile.
Phone 872-3071. 2-21-1

Cass City

FOR QUICK efficient proces-
sing of your income tax re-
turns, see John McCormick,
next to Gamble Store in Cass
City. Phone 872-2715.

1-3-13

AUCTIONEERING - See Lorn
"Slim" Hillaker. Top dollar
for your property. Phone
872-3019, Cass City. 10-3-tf

REGULAR MEETING of Hills
and Dales Hospital Auxiliary
will be held Feb. 25 at 1:30
p.m. in the hospital meet-
ing room. All members and
friends are urged to attend.

2-21-1

STRETCH LITE Boots, all
sizes. $2.99. Save over 50%.
Old Wood Drug. 2-21-1

Antiques, Book,
Miscellaneous Sale
Brass beds, old books (over
2,000), old newspapers, post-
cards, miscellaneous items.

Sale starts Wednesday, Feb.
20, at 9:30 a.m. through Sat-
urday, Feb. 23, 3:30 p.m.

6124 Cass City Road
IGA

Starting Feb. 23

"Country Four"

9:30 p. m.

Wildwood Farms
Cass City

2-14-2

across from
Cass city.

Wallpaper and
Paint

Just received a whole new
line of wall paper.

Fast Service

Gambles
Cass City

2-7-tf

Rabideau Motors
Cass City Phone 872-2616

FOR SALE - Lady's spring
coat, brand new, size 201/2;
handmade afghans in beauti-
ful colors; countertop range
and wall oven - only used a
short time; used typewriter
and a few odds and ends.
Can be seen at Elery Son-
tags, 6574 Gage St. or call
665-9956. l-17-6n

HAPPY BIRTHDAY Bryan on
your 16th birthday. 2-21-1

FOR SALE - 1974 1/2 ton
Chevy pickup, power steer-
ing, disc brakes, automatic
and extras, 7,300 miles -
$3,000. Phone 872-4557.

2-7-3

BEAN GROWERS Notice - you
must bring in your bean
knives now, to insure being
serviced, for hammering or
rebuilding your worn-out
knives better than new. Guar-
anteed satisfaction. Ubly
Welding and Machine Shop,
Ubly, Mich. 1-3-12

FOR SALE - 1972 292cc 3
cylinder Ski Doo Blizzard
snow machine, like new, less
than 2 hours use. Phone Dick
Erla 872-2191. 2-14-tf

FOR SALE - 3 axle Low Boy
trailer. Frank Nagy. 1 3/4
west of M-81 on Akron Rd.

2-14-3

Used Equipment
Mid-Winter Specials

John Deere 3010 Gas
John Deere 3010 Diesel
John Deere 4020 Diesel
John Deere 24 1/2 Field Cultivator
John Dee,re F130 - 3-16' Plow
John Deere F145 - 4-14' Plow
John Deere 336 Baler w/Ejector
John Deere 483'Hay Conditioner
John Deere RWA 10 wheel Mounted Disk
John Deere 16 ft.-Harrow.

LAETHEM EQUIPMENT COMPANY
337 Montague Phone 673-3939

Caro 2-21-1

REAL ESTATE
A cut stone home with 5 bedrooms in very good condition,
also trailer home rented out for extra income, good barn
or workshop along with, over 1 1/4 acres of land, business
location. Down payment of $4,000. and owner will carry
contract at 7%. Don't miss this buy.

160 acre dairy or beef farm, 2 silos, tool sheds, land ready
for spring, 65 acres plowed, hay fields, 18 acres of wheat,
large barn with loafing sheds In very good condition. ALONG
with this is a 3 bedroom ranch home with fireplace, garage,
all in excellent condition. If you are looking for an invest-
ment or a farmer's farm, then you must see this.

Trailer home on large lot 165 feet by 660 feet located In
Greenleaf township. Price reduced down to $10,000. for
a quick cash sale1. •

EDWARD J. HAHN, BROKER
located at 6240 W. Main Street, Cass City, Mi.

Gertrude A. Gray, Saleslady. Phone 872-2155 or 872-3519
evenings. 2-21-1

WANTED
. ALL TYPES OF REAL ESTATE

HOMES, FARMS, RECREATIONAL LAND, HIDE-AWAYS,
VACANT LAND, COTTAGES, BUSINESSES, LOTS, etc. LIST
your property TODAY!!! Perhaps the prospective buyer's
name for your place is already on our list. If so, we'll be
happy to get in touch with him if you list with B. A. CALKA
REAL ESTATE today. No charge for listing. Let us explain
our advertising program to you.

B. A. CALKA REAL ESTATE
B. A. Calka, Realtor

6306 W,. Main St., Cass City, Michigan 48726
Telephone: Area Code 517 872-3355 or call:.

Fred A. McEachern, Associate Shirley A. Kappen, Salesman
872-3355 872-3355

Call: William C. Hunter
4693 S. State St., Gagetown, Michigan 48735

Telephone: 665-2261
SERVING THIS COMMUNITY FO3 OVER 20 YEARS IN REAL
ESTATE. 2_ 7_ 3

AUCTIONEERING - Farm and
general. Harold Copeland,
phone 872-2592. 5-18-tf

ARE YOU satisfied with your
present family income? Let
your ability supplement your
income. Husband and wife
work together. Send name,
address and phone number.
Box 120, Pigeon, Mich.
48755. 2-21-2

FOR SALE - Rupp400cc snow-
mobile and double trailer.
Low mileage. Make an offer.
Phone 872-2161. After 6 call
872-3096. 2-14-tf

ROOMS FOR RENT.- Girls
only. Cooking in rooms, $10
a week and up. References
required. 872-2406. 4391 S.
Seeger. 5-3-tf

BIBLE BOOK Store will be
closed for vacation'Feb.
20-28. Vera Bearss. 2-14-2

WANTED -' Used cars and
metal. Pay top dollar. Chuck
Hartmon's Used Auto Parts,
1 3/4 miles south of M-81
on M-53. Call 872-4519.

2-21-3

FOR SALE - Bred Gilts -
7 Yorks and 1 York boar.
Frank Nagy, 1 3/4 west of
M-81 on Akron Rd. 2-14-3

FOR QUICK efficient proces-
sing of your income tax re-
turns, see John McCormick,
next to Gamble Store in Cass
City. Phone 872-2715.1-3-13

FOR SALE - 1969 Chrysler
Imperial Le Baron, in ex-
cellent condition, outstand-
ing on gasoline mileage. Dick
Erla, phone 872-2191.

2-14-tf

WILL DO sewing and alter-
ations for the whole family.
Phone 872-4157. 2-21-3

FOR SALE - '68 Ski Doo, 20
hp engine - brand new - and
new tracks. Call Ubly 658-
4949 after 5. 2-21-3

Bad Axe. Phone 269-8161

1 mile north, 1 mile west of
Bad Axe. 11-25-tf

FOR RENT - apartment type
2-7-tf living for girls, Iblocksouth

of light, New washer and dry-
er. Rent starting at $75 month
includes all utilities. Phone
872-3570. 2-7-tf

FIRE ALARMS installed in
mobile homes, conventional
homes and shops. Call 517-
635-2411 or 517-635-6001.

2-21-2

We have
lime available
at all times.

Klein's
Fertilizers

Phone 872-2120
8-30-tf

GEORGE GOULD Tax and
bookkeeping service. Open
under the name of Sarah
Jane Smith, 624 S. Hooper
St., Caro. Phone 673-2656.

1-10-8

1971 PLYMOUTH Satellite,
radial tires, good condition,
low mileage, 16 mpg. Phone
673-4138. 2-14-2

Hap's Open Spaces
announces

Dealership for

Stihl Chain Saws
A make for every use.

Hdp & Bonnie
Campbell

Just received a whole new
line of wall paper.

Fast Service

Gambles
Cass City

2-7-tf

FOR RENT - 20 acres of farm
land. 2 1/2 south of Cass
City. Phone 872- 2781.

2-14-3

DOES YOUR PIANO need
tuning? Call Duane Johnston,
409 Cleveland St., Bad Axe,
269-7364. Thirteen years'
experience on all makes of
pianos, registered crafts man
member of the Piano Tech-
nician's Guild. 7-30-tf

FOR SALE - 1968 Mustang
fastback. 289,4-speed trans-
mission. Positive traction.
Engine just rebuilt. $495.
Phone 872-2306. 2-21-3

4180 Hurds Corner Road
10-1-tf

WOULD LIKE babysitting in
our home. Any age, any time.
Meals, clothing and bath when
necessary. References.
Guaranteed satisfaction.
Phone 872-4286. 2-14-3

FOR SALE - Homelite chain
saws; Johnson outboard mo-
tors, boats and accessories.
Boyd Shaver's Garage, Caro,
across from Caro Drive-In.
Phone OSborn 3-3039.

1-23-tf

LOST - size 38 Golden Alli-
gator black topcoat. Taken
by mistake New Year's Eve
at. White Creek Club. Will
exchange for your size 36.
Phone 872-4283. 2-21-3

Store in
2-21-1

"MCCORMICK REALTY INC.*

Needs listings immediately, for our spring catalog sales!!!
We have buyers for land from 2 acres to 3 or 4 thousand
acres of good farm land.

Either cash or. on land contract!!! Also wanted any type
of property for sale. Worried about income tax problems
if you sell? I am qualified to advise you of your obligations!!!

Call 517-872-2715

JOHN V. McCORMICK, BROKER

6491 Main Street
Cass City, Michigan 48726

. ,' - • • 1-31-5

Rt. 4 Jacob Rd., Caro
Phone 673-4055

9-29-tf

FOR SALE - 1968 Ford XL,
302 v-8, power steering,
automatic air conditioner.
Over 21 miles per gallon.
51,000 actual miles. Real
nice car. No rust - uses
no oil. Call 872-3385. Bruce
Holcomb, 4413 West St.

2-21-1

ATTENTION FARMERS - We
.now have free dead stock re-
moval in your area. Tri-
County Dead Stock Removal.
Phone 517-375-4088. 12-6-tf

HELP WANTED - trainee
needed for part time work,
evenings and week ends in
the cardio-pulmonary de-
partment. Previous medical
experience helpful, but not
essential. Contact Mr. Mark
LeBlanc at Hills and Dales
General Hospital, phone 872-
2121. 2-21-1

FOR SALE - 1968 Dodge Cor-
onet 6 cylinder, automatic,
new rubber. Keith Russell,
1 west and 1 1/4 north of
Cass City. 2-14-3

BOOMS RED & White Top
Silos: Now in our 46th year
serving the more aggressive
and cost conscious farmers.
Silos for every purpose. Get
all the facts before you buy.
Find out what a really heavy
plaster coat is. Is it applied
with a cement gun, like we
do? We install the founda-
tion. Our trucks are self
unloading with hydraulic
booms. Silo-Matic and Van-
Dale Equipment. Earlyordej-
discounts in effect. Booms
Silo Co., Inc., Harbor Beach,
Mich. 48441. Phone 517-479-
6654. 1-24-tf

Looking for no-wax vinyl
floor covering?

Come see our

fine selection of beautiful
vinyl floors from Congoleum.

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City
Phone 872-2270

1-10-tf

SPECIAL - 10% discount Jan.
15 thru Feb. 28. Carpets
gleam when cleaned by
steam. Free estimates. Call
Thumb Carpet Cleaners.
823-8821, Vassar, Mi.

1-10-8

FOR SALE - Case 310 crawl-
er tractor with bucket and
weights. Frank Nagy, 1 3/4
west of M-81 on Akron Rd.

2-14-3

DEERING PACKING
Fresh counter meats

Open 7 days - weekdays
till 5. Open Friday till 9.
Sundays 1-5 p.m.

Halves and quarters for
sale. We wrap and freeze.

For trucking, phone 761-
7073.

5 miles south and 2 1/2 west
of Kingston on E. Mayville
Rd. 3-5-tf

FOR SALE - Two 14x7slotted
chrome wheels. Deep set.
Will fit Mo-Par, Ford or
Chrysler. Good shape. $40
or best offer. Phone 872-
2306. 2-21-3

FOR SALE - fireplace wood
- Ash. Will deliver. Dan
Toner, phone 872-2506.

2-14-3

NOTICE
Re-Roof Awnings
Re-Side Insulate

Aluminum Windows and Doors
Call or Write

Bill Sprague, owner
of Elkton Roofing and Siding

Company
Elkton 375-4215

Bad Axe CO 9-7469
Bad Axe CO 9-7158
Terms to 5 years

3-17-tf

LOST -. Miniature Schnauzer
grey and white. Reward. Call
872-3682. Herb Bills.

2-21-3

NOVESTA

TOWNSHIP

RESIDENTS

M! rch 2, 1974, is the last
day I will collect 1973 taxes.

Ruth Spencer
Treasurer

2-14-3

FOR SALE - 3 bedroom, 2
bath ranch home. Full base-
ment, 24x24 garage, natural
gas heating, By owner, 673-
4138. 2-14-2

FOR RENT - large home. 3
miles northeast of Akron.
Phone Caro 673-6803 after
4 p.m. 2-21-1

FOR SALE - 1973 Chevy Monte
Carlo, power steering, power
brakes, power windows, air
conditioning, 350 cu. in. Low
mileage. Phone 872-4240
after 6 p.m. Ken Hayes.

2-7-3

Custom Slaughtering - curing
smoking and processing.

Beef - Pork - Veal - Lamb

For Sale - Beef and Pork,
whole or half. Wrapped in the
new clear shrink film.

Erla's Packing Co.
Cass City, Mich.

Dick Erla
Phone 872-2191

11-2-tf

REAL ESTATE
YOUR LOOKING DAYS ARE OVER: corner 40 acres with
mobile home - 2 bedroom - living room, 13'x7' expansion
plus 10'xl6' addition - includes refrigerator^ range, exhaust
fan and hood - 24'x40' barn - approximately 24 acres
tillable - mobile home cost approximately $10,000.00 -
owner wants $23,500.00. B2-F-407

CALLING ALL HOME SEEKERS in the $21,000.00 Bracket:
here's a'little gem you might have missed- 3 bedroom ranch
- kitchen has dining .area - living room - bath - attached
2 car garage - water softener - approximately 3/4 of an
acre - all this home needs is redecorating. M5-TO-005

S. ELKTON ROAD: Room to ronm - approximately 2-acres
plus 3 bedroom farm home - 2 car garage - chicken coop
- $2,500.00 down. H3-HF-505 ' '

We have several 5 to 10 acre parcels that are beautiful
building sites!!!

J. McLEOD REALTY

630 N. State Street, Caro
REP. IN CASS CITY AREA, DALE BROWN 872-3158

Day or Night 673-6106 or 673-6107 2-14-2

DAY WAITRESS - Apply in
person, Wildwood Farms,
M-53, Cass City. 2-14-2

CARPENTER contractor with
builder's license. Anything
in construction and home re-
modeling, Chester Kulinski,
phone 872-2512. Satisfaction
is my business. 11-30-tf

HAY AND STRAW for sale.
3 miles west of Argyle. Phone
658-5109. 2-7-tf

BIRCH AND hardwood fire-
place wood for sale. Roger
Root, phone 872-3718 after
6:00 p.m. 12-20-tf

FEEDER PIGS for sale -
Phone 872-3238. 2-21-1

FOR SALE - Single snow-
mobile trailer with tilt bed,
$60.00. If Interested, call
872-4111. 2-14-3

I WISH to thank Dr. Donahue,
nurses, cooks and visitors
and all who sent cards and
gifts. Alta Fay. 2-21-1

A SPECIAL thanks to all our
friends and neighbors for
the kindness shown at the
time of the loss of our loved
one. Bob and Donna Wisch-
meyer and family. 2-21-1

I WISH to thank all that visited
me and sent cards while I
was in the hospital. Also Rev.
Wood for his visits and
prayer. Mrs. Cecil Loomis.

2-21-1

THANK YOU for donations for
Sweetheart Campaign and to
all those-that put the pennies
in the donation cans. Mac
and Leo Service, Cass City
Florist," General Cable
Corp., Walbro Corp., L&S
Standard, Auten Motors,
Ouvry Chev-Olds, Thumb
Appliance Center, Erla's
Food Center, Old Wood Drug
Store, Sommers Bakery,
'Rabideau Motors, Krttz-
man's, Gulf, Schneeberger's
Furniture, Ryan's- Men's
Wear, . calka 'Realty, Albee •
Hardware, Cass City Auto
Supply, Damm Farm Imple-
ment, McConkey's Jewelry,
Ed Doerr Insurance. 2-21-1
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JERRY TONER missed this difficult
lay-up from behind the board but the
two points weren't needed as Cass
City easily defeated the Red Raiders
last Friday. Watching the play are Paul
Chapin and Bob Lambert.

Whirlpool Sales
2 Year Guarantee on Parts &

Labor on New Purchases

WE SERVICE ALL BRANDS
LANGMAID SERVICE

CENTER INC.
State St. Kingston 517-683-2247

WHY HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE?
Most folks say because of skilled professional service
for every client and on any claim. Always!

YOU R/independent
Insurance i/AGENT

Newell Harris Richard Hampshire

HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE INS. AGENCY
6815 E. Cass City Road

Uninspired Hawks bow to
aroused Harbor Beach five

The Cass City Red Hawks
move back into Thumb B
Conference competition Fri-
day at Vassar and must be
hoping that the Vulcans prove
to be more hospitable than the
Pirates of Harbor Beach were
Tuesday.

The Pirates soundly de-
feated the Hawks, 71-51), to
make it a game each for the

•—-two-clubs- this yearr - - "
The Pirates dominated the

game because they domi-
nated the backboards. Paced
by Ron Wruble, an agile (>' .3"
center, Harbor Beach just
about e l imina ted second shots
for Cass City and picked up
many points on second effort
shots on offense.

Cass City was playing wi th-
out Sophomore Guard Chuck
Bliss, but it 's doub t fu l if his
presence would have changed
the eventual outcome.

Cass City fell behind in the
first quarter and it was a l l
downhil l from t h a t point on.

At the h a l f , Harbor Beach
had forged i n t o a :i7-2l!
advantage.

By the end of three quar t -
ers, the Beachers had
stretched it to 15 points and
about the only question that
remained was how much the
f i n a l margin was going to be.

Cass City was gu i l ty of
numerous turnovers and in
general played uninspi red
basketball .

The Hawks were led by
Scott Hartel who netted 14.
The only other Hawks in
double figures were Dave
Hi l l ake r , 12, and Nick Gihas,
10.

Wruble net ted 21 and Terry
Woycehoski added Hi for
Harbor Beach.

Time is growing short for
Cass Ci ty prior to tournament
t ime. After Vassar this Fri-
day the Hawks play Ubly at
home and then conclude the
r e g u l a r season March 1
aga ins t Bad Axe.

Coaches needed

That gives the team just
three games to get ready for
the district in Cass City.
Judging by the results of
games during the season,
Harbor Beach wi l l reign as
slight favorites.

Despite recent reverses,
the Hawks are not far behind
and both Deckerville and
Sanclusky have shown flashes
of brilliance .-{(-promises to be
a wide open tourney.

JVS W I N I5U;

While the vars i ty gave the
home 'fans l i t t l e to cheer
about, the Junior Varsity
sparkled. It was no contest as
Cass Ci ty pounded out a (>4-4:)
decision in the prel iminary.

MAIU.KTTI-: (1AMK

Cass City got back on the
victory trai l last Friday wi th
a win as expected over

Thumb B Conference ta i l
enders Marlet te . The score
was 7li-5(i.

Most fans agreed that the
Hawks have played better
games than they did against
the Raiders but there were
bright spots for Cass City
rooters.

One was tha t the Hawk
guards found the open man
wTth~~"~colTsTst eiVcy * agai ivsI
Marlette. Passes by Chuck
Bliss and Jerry Toner helped
Scott Hartel , 22 points, and
Nick Gihas, 20 points, to big
scoring nights .

But the Hawks were s t i l l
gu i l ty of numerous turnovers.
Cass City was charged wi th 1!)
w h i l e M a r l e t t e w a s l i t t l e
better, commit t ing IB.

Actua l ly , most of the sta-
tistics of the'game were close.
Cass City shot :)(i per cent and
Marlette 27 per cent. Re-
bounds were 50 lo 49 in favor
of the Hawks and Cass Ci tv

shot G8 per. cent from the
charity stripe as compared to
50 per cent by Marlette.

The statistics were closer
than the game. Cass City
moved off in to a 14-7 first
quarter lead and was never
seriously t h r e a t e n e d a f t e r
tha t . Coach Fred Hurlburt
turned to his bench l iberally
throughout the second and

•-fourth-quarters atid~seveif6f
the 10 men on the team
figured in the scoring.

After the relatively low
scoring first period,' both
teams started to f ind the
scoring range. At the hal f , the
Hawks were in front 35-27.

The Hawks were led by
Hartel, the team's most con-
s i s t en t p layer in recent
games. Besides his' game-
l ead ing 22 p o i n t s , H a r t e l
picked off 20 rebounds.

Pete Diegel led Marlet te
wi th lii points, the only Raider
to break in to double figures.

for Girl's

Little League
Want to he a Girl 's L i t t l e

League coach? This summer
is your oppor tun i ty , accord-
ing lo organizer Ra l ly Mfi-
rm rg.

Ms. Maharg said Monday
the league w i l l consist of
about 100 gir ls ages 10-13 and
will use the old l i t t l e league
diamond a t the m u n i c i p a l
park. Communi ty Chest and
Rotary w i l l make donat ions to
gel the league rol l ing, she
said.

S ix coaches a re s t i l l
needed, she said, adding t h a t
anyone interested should con-
tact her at 375-4225 in FJkton
or call Cass City In te rmed ia te
School.

LOOKING OVER the totals of sales for Girl Scout Cookies
in Cass City are the top three cookie sellers Carol Dil-
lon (left), Teresa Sheldon and Tammie McKee, along with
chairperson Elaine Proctor.

Tammie led the way with 185 boxes sold, followed by
Carol with 152 boxes and Teresa with 143 boxes.

Bad Axe post commander retires Friday
Lt. Richard J. LaCasse, 52,

commander of the Bad Axe
State Police Post since 19(59, is
r e t i r i ng Friday.

LaCasse retires from his
s i x t h a s s i g n m e n t , h a v i n g
served previously at Erie,
Marque t te , Bay Ci ty , Cadil lac
and Flat Hock.

He became sergeant and
post commander at Bad Axe
in 19(59 where his rank was
promoted to l ieutenant in
1971.

LaCasse was born in F l in t
where he graduated from
high school. He served twice

in the Marine Corps, f i rs t for
4H months w i t h :i() of them
overseas dur ing World War II
and again for four months on
recall in 1950-51. Me enlisted
in the Stale Police in 1948.

He and his wife, Imogene,
have a son and three daugh-
ters..

Mean Mary Jean, Superstar of your Chrysler-Plymouth Dealer Team, says:

In the past
three years,
over 250,000
people have
come over
from other
makes of cars
to Satellite.

74 Plymouth
Satellite Custom
4-DoorSedan

Why are so many people making the
switch to Plymouth Satellite?

Hey, it could be because of the
Satellite's shape. Or its mid-size car
handling. Or the fact that it carries up to
six people. Or its electronic ignition that
virtually eliminates ignition tune-ups.
One thing's for sure, this year we want to
win>you over.to Plymouth Satellite.
Know what I mean?

JUNIOR VARSITY

The Hawk Junior Varsity
rolled to v ic tory in the
preliminary ,vvitli an easy
04-49 decision!

The line score:

Cass City 14 21 20 21
Marlette 7 20 14 15

-eass-City-—-Hartel; 22r
Bliss, 3, Gibas, 20, Toner, 12,
Hillaker, 8, Helwig, 2. Eber-
line, 4.

Marlette —Pete Diegel, 18,
Chapin, 2, El l io t t , 2, Camberl,
7. Marsh, 7, Glady, 9, E l l io t t ,
4.

T I I U A I B B C O N F K R K N n - :
(Monday . F e b . - I )

1.

Caro
Frankenmuth
Laker
Cass City
Sandusky
Vassar
Marlette
Bad Axe

i*:igii(> Overall
W 1.

11 1
10 2

7 4
7 5
5 7
4 8
2 9
1 11

\V 1.
14 2
14 2
9 5

11 5
7 9
8 10
5 14
3 14

Freshmen win

final 3 games
The Freshman basketball

team ended its season w i t h a
flourish by winn ing the last
three games played.

The latest victory was over
the Bad Axe Hatchets Mon-
day when the team walked off
with a 60-37 decision.

Selected as most va luable
player was Rick Selby and as
mosl, improved player was
Bill Shagenc. Mike Lowe led
the team in scoring wi th a 14.H
average.

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

Volleyballers
win one, lose

2 last week
The Cass City Girl's Volley-

ball team racked up • one
varsity win and two losses in
competi t ion-against Caro,
Marlette and Vassar last
week.

Wednesday, Feb. 13, the
varsity lost to Caro 15-7 and
15-5. Sean Ouvry scored five
points in the first game while
Karen M a r t i n made four
points in the second game.

The JV's took two 15-6 wins
over Caro's JV's, with Beth
Eria -scoring—a—totar-of-H
points in both games. Chris
Stace made six points and
Ela ine S tou tenburg added
live more to the total for the
two contests.

Thursday, Feb. 14, Vassar
took the measure of the
varsity in three games. Vas-
sar took the opening game
15-7, but Cass City came back
to even the match by a 15-2
ta l ly in the second contest.

Vassar won the third game
and the match 15-10. Cass City
showed some sparkling indi-
vidual performances, with
Karen M a r t i n scoring nine
points and Nancy Koepfgcn
and Karen O'Dell each adding
eight points.

Cass City 's luck changed
Monday aga in s t M a r l e l t e
when the girls took their
match in three games. The
varsity won the first game i
15-12. then dropped the second I
to Marle t te , 15-8.

But then the girls charged [
back to take the match 15-7

Among the top scorers of !
the night were Deb Selby wi th I
10 points and Sean Ouvry with I
nine for the evening, followed I
by Karen Mart in wi th eight I
Nancy Koepfgen and Elvia i
Po/.xi each scored four points I

The JV's whipped Mar- i
letle's JV's 15-0 and 15-1 w i t h
Beth Eria scoring all of Cass L
City 's points.

The team was scheduled to
meet Frankenmuth Wednes- (

day, Feb. 20, and wind up its
season against Vassar next
Monday.

OLD WOOD DRUG

PRICES MAKE

BEAUTIFUL MUSIC

8-TRACK TAPES

New Releases
Reg. $3.99 and up

100's to choose from.

Latest records arrive at Old Wood

Drug each Week - All discount priced.\

OLD WOOD DRUG
On the Corner Cass City

»««*»««a««»a«*̂ ^

We Can't Put Our Money On

Sale, But We'll Pay You

PAA

CHRYSLER

Plymoutfi 74 Plymouth Satellite AUTHORIZED DEALER CHRYSLER
MOTORS CORPORATION

RABIDEAU MOTORS, 6513 Main St., Cass City

FOR A 4-YEAR CERTIFICATE OF DEPOSIT
$1000 Min. Deposit'- Maximum Is Up.To You.

5 % PASS BOOK SAVING
5'j%CERTIFICATE — Maturing Quarterly To 1 Year

$5011 Mill . Deposit
G % CERTIFICATE — 1-2U Years — $500 Minimum

Deposit
fi'2 % CERTIFICATE — 2'a--l Years — $500 Minimum

Deposit

We invite you to bring this add and
your Passbook and Certificates in
and let us compare our Savings
with yours.

A Substantial Interest Penalty Will Be Imposed For
Withdrawals Of All Or Part Of Deposit Before Matur-
ity.

B> PEOPLES STATE BANK
THCSANK OF FRIIHDLYSCfiVICt

CARO

,r..4
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