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E From the

ditor's Corner
The Pontiac State Hospital is

conducting a campaign for do-
nations for television sets for
patients. At the -present time
there are 38 wards without sets.

The use of television for
therapy purposes surprised ui
when we read of its benefits'. We
are going to print part of its
uses as outlined by hospita]
authorities.

For the mentally ill individual,
television is of major import-
ance. For the psychotic patient,
language can be and frequently
is difficult, for some speech is
even impossible.

On the twenty-eight wardi
with television, the patient;
themselves adequately expresi
what television means. The
patients say "not only does it
help us pass the time and keep
up with what is going on in the
world, but it gives us something
to talk about."

Authorities say that at time
the programs bring about active
participation on the part of the
patients and it is not unusual to
see patients singing and dancing
when musical programs are on
the air. Ward personnel tell of
incidents where patients who
normally just sit around and
stare into space become active
and hum or dance 'right along
with the programs.

Television is valuable on all
of the wards. Patients on very
disturbed wards are extremely
attentive, enjoy it thoroughly
and even though they are at
times destructive, they never
bother the television sets.

Since television can reach the
patients either through auditory
or visual mechanisms, it is far-
reaching in its effects.

Hospital personnel directly
responsible for the patients'
care feel that 90 per cent of the
patients derive benefits from
television.

The attitude of all authorities
is reflected by a psychiatric aide,
a veteran of 23 years at the hos-
pital, who asserted, "television
is the greatest thing that has
happened to patients in the 23
years I have worked here."

The goal of the hospital is a
TV set in every ward.

Highlights Club
Meeting Jan. 14

Mrs. Earl Douglas entertained
members and guests of the
Junior Woman's Club of Cass
City at the regular January
meeting of the club held at the

/ home *of Mrs. Richard Darmody,
Thursday, Jan. 14. Mrs. Ray-
mond Whalin was co-hostess.

Mrs. Douglas told details of
her recent visit to the United
Nations while in New York and
explained how many of the
rooms were decorated by various
countries represented in the in-
ternational organization.

She showed pictures of council
rooms where committees meet
and explained the interpretation
system of the organization that
translates /a speech into six
languages -so that interested per-
sons can tune in on earphones
and understand any address
given.

Mrs. Robert Hartwick, vice-
president, presided at the meet-
ing. A "Frocks for Frauleins"
box was "well filled by donations
from members of material and
sewing notions. The box will be
used to help the German Youth
Association.

Members are stressing Ameri-
canism this month. The club
voted to send a donation to the
Restoration Fund for Independ-
ence Hall and join the Michigan

. Concluded on page ter>-

Many Chancery Cases

Court Calendar Lists
Three Criminal Cases

Three criminal cases are listed
among the 53 cases on the circuit
court calendar for the February
term of court at Caro.

The court calendar reveals
that more chancery cases are on
the docket than any other type.
Eighteen cases are scheduled to
be tried in chancery.

Other cases in February in-
clude: eight civil jury cases; 12
civil non-jury cases and 12 cases
in which no progress has been
made for more than one year.

Criminal Cases.
The People vs. Gerald John-

son, statutory rape and indecent
liberties.

The People vs. Christopher
Schumacher, assault with intent
to do great bodily harm less than
that of the crime of murder.

The People vs. Clarence Kam-
penski, also known as Larry
Craig and Zella Kampenski, also
known as Zella Hanes, extortion
and conspiracy to commit extor-
tion.

Civil Cases — Jury,
Tony Asperger and Norma

Asperger vs. Louis Ackerman
and Milton Schian, Freeland
Sugden, Conrad Mueller and
Rusch Construction Company,
damages. . ,

Magdalena Kleitch, Exec, of
the estate of Anthony Kleitch,
Sr., deceased vs. Marjorie G.
Rice a]kja Marjorie Rice Sher-
wood, tresnass on the case.

Walter C. Paugels and Bea-
trice K. Pauerels vs. Noah Hall
and Eda Hall, jointly and indi-
vidually, assumosit with a count
in trespass on the case.

Detroit Automobile Inter- Ins.,
Exchange, a Mich. Insurance
Association, Subrogee of Tilt
Sales. Inc., a Mich.. Corp., and
Tile Sales, Inc., a Michigan Cor-
poration vs. George Severn,
damages.

Odd Larsen vs. Robert Fues-
ter. trespass on the case."

Dona J. Poineau vs. Eva F.
Chamberlain, trespass on the
case.
• Gertrude Toronsro vs. Eva F.
Chamberlain, trespass on the
case.

.Alfred Henry Poineau vs. Eva
F. Chamberlain? trespass on the
case. x

Area Men Promoted
In Thumb CAP I/

Enlargement of the staff and
several promotions were an-
nounced this week by Maj. Carl
R. Nye, commanding officer of
the Thumb Group, Civil Air Pa-
trol.

Among the changes were the
appointment of Shirley Nye of
Cass City as director of person-
nel and the addition of Rev.
Robert McLean, D. D., of Bad
Axe as chaplain.

Other promotions included:
Second Lieut. Warren Wood,
commanding the Cass City
Scraadron, to first lieutenant and
WilfoM Jolly of Cass City
Squadron to warrant officer.

Civil Cases—Non-Jury.
Manufacturers Casualty Insur-

ance Co., Subrogee of William
L. Cotie and William L. Cotie
vs. Paul McAllister, trespass on
the case.

William McComb vs. LeRoy
TerBush, appeal from Justice
Court.

Public Loan Corporation, a
Foreign Corporation vs. George
Patterson, assumpsit.

Fern Pike, Michigan Mutual
Liability Co., a Mich. Ins. Corp
Subrogee of Ellis VanConnett
and Jennie VanConnett, Ind
and as co-partners dibia Van-
Connett Nash Sales, & Ellis Van-
Connett and Jennie VanConnett,
Ind., and as co-partners d|b|a
VanConnett, Nash Sales vs.
Charles Gibbs, trespass.

A. Koegel & • Company,
Mich., Corp., for the use and
benefit of the Michigan Mutual
Liability Co., a Mich., Corp. vs.
William J,. Strand & Mary . M.
Strand, jointly and Ind., and Wil-
liam J. Strand and Mary M
Strand, dlb'a Strand Body and
Paint Shop, trespass on the case

Kenneth Baur and Francis
Cottrell, co-partners, djbla under

j the name and style of Baur and
! Cottrell vs. Alex Woloshen, dam
- ages.

Auto-Owners Insurance Co., a
Domestic Ins., Co. and subrogee
of Arnold McDougrall and Ches-
ley McDougall and Arnold Mc-
Dousrall and Chesley McDougall
vs. Earl Dibble. Junior, tresnass.

Louis Sabo, Jr. vs. The Core
mercial Benefit Insurance Co., a
Foreign Corporation, damages

Ann Ingram, guardian of
Charles E. Ingram, minor vs.
Frank Rubisch, trespass.

Wilburn H. Ingram vs. Frank
Rubisch, trespass on the case.

Herbert Schleier and Alfred
Fischaber, Company Partners
doing business under the name
and style of Millington Feed and
Coal Company vs. J. Lee Boothe
assumpsit.

R. J. Gilmore, an infant by
Elmer Gilmore, his next friend
and Elmer Gilmore, individually
vs. Moore Telephone System, a
Miqhigan Corporation, and Nor-
man Alderfer, trespass on the
case.

Chancery Cases.
Carl A. Williams, adm. of the

estate of George Fqskett, de-
ceased vs. Basil E. Foskett, Al-
mon G. Foskett, Cecil C. Foskett,
Darrell D. Foskett, Harry Junior
Foskett and Nadene Norien Fos-
kett Carter, to set aside deed.

Joseph Yurich and Justine
Yurich, husband and wife vs.
Steve Mahac and Mary Mahac,
husband and wife, Anna French,
Mary Cardoni and Pauline Butz,
partition.

Margaret I. Walker vs. Harold
E. Walker, divorce.

Lillian I. Gassman vs. Earl L.
Gassman, divorce.

Emry Muska vs. Margaret
Muska, divorce.

Florence Brown vs. Bird
Brown, divorce.

Martha M. Russell vs. Ar-
Concluded on page ten.

Prep for Marlette Tonight

Hawks Post Victory
Over Hatchets, 62-46

Vance to Head
New Edison Sales
District in County

Local Markets
Buying price:

Soybeans - 2.86
Beans 7.80
Light red kidney beans 8.25
Dark red kidney beans 9.00
Cranberries 9.50
Yellow eye beans 6.50
Corn , ....--- 1.37

Grain
Wheat, No. 2, mixed, bu 1.97
Oats, new, bu. 85
Barley, cwt „ 2.25
Rye 89
Buckwheat, cwt 2.25

Livestock
Cows, pound 09 .12
Cattle, pound 12 .19
Calves, pound 20 .32
Hogs, pound 27

Produce
Eggs, large white, doz 42
Eggs, brown, doz .40
Butterfat 65

Cass City set the stage for a
howdown battle for first place

in the Thumb "B" Conference
Friday, Jan. 15, when they de-
feated Bad Axe at the Cass City
gym, 62-46.

The Hawks will go into the
crucial game tonight trailing un-
defeated Marlette by one game.
The Hawks were defeated earlier
in the season by Sandusky while
Marlette has rolled over every
opponent.

Against Bad Axe, the Hawks
won easily although, they suf-
fered a bad third quarter slump
for the second time this year.

Against the Hatchets, the
Hawks' first half cushion and
last period drive carried them
through to victory. Earlier this
year the slump after the inter-
mission cost them a chance for
victory from Mt. Pleasant.

Cass City outscored Bad Axe
in the first quarter, 17-12. Clare
Comment, Don Simmons and
Jack Clara carried the scoring
load for the Hawks in the period.
Comment hit three of his four
field goals in the opening1 stanza
and Clara added two more while
Simmons coverted four out of
four gift heaves.

The second period was the
biggest of the evening for Cass
City.

Paced by Russ Foy, who hit a
remarkable percentage in the
quarter, and racked up five field
goals, the Hawks counted for 21
points while Bad Axe stalled at

10. At the intermission, , Cass
City was on the long end of a 38-
22 count.

It looked as if the only thing
remaining to be decided at half
time was the size of the score,
but the Hatchets came roaring
back and moved to within five
points of Cass City in a startling
drive.

But with the pressure on, the
Hawks bounded back and moved
back into a comfortable lead by
the end of the drive. Foy, who
had trouble connecting on four
shots in the victory over Caro,
found the free-throw range in
the final period and converted
seven of eight tries to hold his
team to victory.

Foy led both teams in scoring
with 20 points. Bill Tuckey, who
in preceding games had been
held to a high of eight points,
netted 14 against Bad Axe.

In addition, the played his
usual good game, rebounding the
offensive and defensive back-
boards for the Hawks.

Gale Erbe took scoring honors
for Bad Axe with 19 points. He
scored nine times from the field
and added a free throw.

The Cass City second team
kept rolling along with a victory
over the Hatchet seconds. The
reserves have a 5-2 won-loss rec-
ord, identical to the record of the
varsity squad.

They posted an easy 51-30 vic-
tory over Bad Axe. Jim Ellis led
the scorers with 15 points.

Detroit Edison announced this
week that the company's Port
Huron sales district is to be
divided Feb. 1 into five sales
districts.

The division is to be made
along county lines in the Thumb
area. The five counties which are
to be sales" districts are Huron,
Sanilac, Lapeer, St. Clair and
Tuscola.

Heading the Tuscola District
will be Mahlon W. Vance, long-
time head of the Edison office
in Caro.

Vance, a native of Jasper,
Indiana, attended Indiana State

Mahlon W. Vance.
Normal College and joined De-
troit Edison in 1924. For 24
years he worked out of the com-
pany's general offices, serving
first as appliance coordinator,
field agent and then as manager
of a Detroit customer office.

Vance is a member of the
Caro Rotary Club and the Tus-
cola County Conservation Club.

Managers of districts in other
counties are: Charles R. Kervin,
with Edison since 1936, Huron
County; Harold R. Rogers, with,
Edison since 1921, Lapeer Coun-
ty; Ralph W. Bricker, with Edi-
son since 1945, St. Clair County,
and Gerald B. VanNorman, with
Edison since 1922, Sanilac Coun-
ty.

Officers Named at
First Baptist Church

The congregation of the First
Baptist Church elected church
and Sunday School officers at a
meeting Wednesday evening of
last week as follows: church
treasurer, C. U. Brown; clerk,
Mrs. Vera Bearss; deaconess for
three years, Mrs. Ida McAlpine;
deacons for three years, Clarence
Ewald and Gail Parrott; trustee
for three years, Max Esckilsen;
church pianist, Miss Emmaline
Bullis; music committee director,
Mrs. Robert Weckle; church hos-
tess, Mrs. Otto Goertsen; head
usher, Stanley McArthur, and
chairman of the flower commit-
tee, Mrs. C. U. Brown.

Sunday School officers elected
were: Sunday School supt.,
Frank McVety: assistant sut>t..
Clarence Ewald; secretary, Mrs.
Walter Finkbeiner; Sunday
School pianist, Mrs. Gail Par-
rott; assistant pianist, Mrs.
Veron Gingrich; primary supt.,
Mrs. Vera Bearss; assistant pri-
mary supt., Mrs. Weckle. and
cradle roll supt., Mrs. Walter
Finkbeiner.

The following financial report
was given: total receipts for the
year, $16,341.00: received for
missions, $2.449.74; general re-
ceipts, $6,907.66: various church
treasurers, $1.243.85, and build-
ing fund, $5,044.14.

Honor 4-H Leaders
At Caro Banquet

George C. MacQueen, county
4-H club agent, reports that 129
leaders and friends of 4-H at-
tended the annual leaders'
recognition banquet last
Wednesday evening at the
Sacred Heart School, Caro. Af-
ter a fine meal, served by the
ladies of the League of Catholic
Women, several special awards
were given. Nevels Pearson, as-
sistant state 4-H club leader,

Concluded on page ten.

Monday Meeting
The regular meeting of the

Home and School Council will
be held Monday evening at 8
o'clock in the library rooms of
the school.

Persons present will gather
in small groups to discuss the
new addition to the school
that has been proposed by
the school board.

Before the discussion, the
children in Mrs. Iva Profit's
room will present a health
exercise.

Refreshments will be in
charge of Mrs. Maud Sim-
mons of Gagetown.

Slate Band Concert
At High School

The annual winter band con-
cert will be held Thursday, Jan.
28, at Cass City High School, ac-
cording to an announcement by
Ralph Powell, band director.

The concert was originally
scheduled to be held Dec. 22 but
was postponed. The 61-piece
Cass City School Band has ar-
ranged an outstanding program
of secular and sacred music for
the evening.

Admission to the event is free
and authorities are expecting a
large crowd to see the annual
show.

Carpenter Shoots
Arctic Owl in Silo

Clare Carpenter, four miles
north and one-half west of Cass
City, is displaying an Arctic
owl that he shot with a .22 cali-
ber rifle in his silo Tuesday.

The bird had a 58%-inch wing-
spread and needle-sharp claws
one-half inch long.

Mr. Carpenter said that each
time he stuck his head in the
silo, the bird would rise to the
attack. It was on the fly in the
silo when he dropped it with, the
rifle.

The bird, snow white vith
grey flecks, flew into the silo
through the open top but could
not fly out again.

Mr. Carpenter said that he
was going to have the bird
mounted.

Cass City Banks
Elect Officers at
Meetings Tuesday

The Cass City State Bank and
the Pinney State Bank elected
officers for 1954 at elections held
Tuesday at the banks.

Officers for the Cass City
Bank are: M. B. Auten, presi-
dent; Frederick Auten, vice-
president; C. M. Wallace, vice-
president and cashier, and
assistant cashiers, Miss Irene
Stafford and Miss Gertrude
Gray.

Directors of the Cass City
State Bank are: M. B. Auten,
Frederick Auten, John A. Sand-
ham, Curtis R. Hunt, Mr. Wal-
lace and B. F. Benkelman.

Officers for the Pinney State
Bank are: Frederick H. Pinney,
president; Dorus Benkelman,
vice-president, and Robert Keat-
ing, cashier.

Directors of the bank are:
Mrs. Elizabeth Pinney, Mr. Pin-
ney, Mr. Benkelman, H. M. Bu-
len, William J. Profit and Mr.
Keating.

Despite Increased Operating Costs

County Deficit Lower
In '54. Budget Show

Tuscola County supervisors set J office after they were okayed by ]
the 1954 budget for the cototy
before adjourning their January
session early this week and the
expenditures of the county will
increase from $376,717.24, spent
in 1953, to $381,470 in 1954, ac-
cording to the budget figures.

Some of the increased cost
will come from a general raise in
salary for county employees.

John Humm, friend of the
court, will receive $3,600 this
year, a boost of $250 over his
1953 salary.

A flat raise of $200 was
granted to other employees in'
the courthouse. The raise does
not affect heads of the various
departments.

The raise will pay the follow-
ing amounts yearly to em-
ployees: office deputies, $2,700;
office clerks, $2,000; janitor,
$2,700, and caretaker, $2,200.

Besides raising the wages of
the employees, the
supervisors set a pattern
wages for new employees.

Persons who accept employ-.

the county school board.
Little Change.

There will be little change in
the assessment for farmers in
the county. Farm elevators'
worth has been increased from
$175 to $300 and horses will not
be assessed in the future.

X-Ray Unit.
According to a report read to

the supervisors, the cost of the
mobile X-ray unit to the partici-
pating counties in 1953 was $10,-
973.12.

Probate Office.
Judge Almon C. Pierce re-

ported that the total cost of
running his office for 1953 was
$12,298.87. The report showed
that $12,826.57 was spent and
$527.70 collected back for post-
age charged against clients.

In the state portion of his of-
fice, expenditures amounted to
$11,069.42, of which $5,288.94

board of was refunded from parents.
for Supervisors voted at • this

meeting to hold their next meet-
ing on the second Monday in

ment by the county will start at February. This will be the start
$200 less than the top figures Of a new procedure for the
listed above and will be granted
increases every six months until
the maximum figures are
reached.

Although the county will
spend more money in 1954, in-
creased revenue will lower the
county deficit by the end of 1954,
according to the budget.

Starting the year, the county
was in the red to the tune of

a
board. In previous years mem-
bers met for regular meetings
only four times a year.

Farm Bureau
Membership Drive
Ends for Year

February Term

Select
Court
Jurors

$74,564.59. Budget figures have
increased $17,361.29, but revenue
is expected to jump $41,426.69.
The estimated deficit at the end I ment drive Tuesday, the club had

Five men from the Cass Cltf
area are among the 30 jurors
selected for the February terns
of circuit court at Caro.

The five men are: James
Woodward, Cass City; Leslie
Beach, Gagetown; Frank Shoberfc
and. Walter Hunter, both of
Kingston, and Arthur Scbott,
Deford.

The remaining jurors on the
list are: Walter Furman, Vassar;
Ernest Robinson, Sr., Fostoria;
Howard Berry, Caro; Clarence
Morgan and Wayne Harrington^
both of Akron; Ann Miklovie^
Caro; Ollie Dennis, Vassar; Don-
ald Graf, Unionville; Elray Gil-
more, Silverwood, and Phillip
Bauer, Reese.

A. M. Thane, Caro; Clifford
Ackenback, Akron; Florence Me-
Intyre, Mayville; Percy Elliso®P
Reese; Allison Stone, Howard
Sackrider and Claud Cole, all of
Caro; Oscar Petzold, MillingtoH;
George Grainger, Bernie Barkle^

™ T n/r I "~ -,. , * \ and Lemuel Lee, all of Vassar.;
Clark Montague, director for, Chester Kinney, Millingbm;

George Hergenreder, Caro, ausi
Neita Black and Bertram Partly
both'of Akron, complete the Hsfc,

the Farm Bureau in Tuscola
County, announced today that at
the end of the official enroll-

of 1954 is expected to be $50,-
499.19.

The increase
come from an
mill rate from

in revenue will
increase ,in the
seven to seven

and one-half mills and a general
increase in valuation of proper-
ty.

Legal Opinion.
Bates Wills appeared before

the supervisors and presented a
legal opinion to the board that
bills of the county superintend-
ent of schools' office was not
subject to audit by the supervi-
sors.

In view of this
board instructed the county clerk
to pay all bills presented by that

not only reached its goal for the
year, but had passed the figure
set for 1955 as well.

Farm Bureau membership for
'54 was set at 1,738 members.
Enrollment has already passed
this figure and the 1955 goal of
1,871 members has been reached.

Although the official drive has j
been completed, Montague said
that the organization would con-
tinue to write,, memberships
through August.

During1 the remaining months,
enough families are expected to
sign to swell the county mem-

opinion, the | bership total to over 2,000 fami-

all enrollments

Sweeney Holstein
Tops DHIA Report

Leading the parade of 198
cows producing 50 pounds of fat
or more during December are a
registered and grade Holstein,
tieing for first place, producing
93 pounds of fat and owned by
Dolan Sweeney of Ubly and Paul
and Orrin Titsworth of Milling-
ton, respectively, according to
Alfred P. Ballweg, Tuscola
County agricultural agent. In
third place is a registered Hol-
stein producing 89 pounds fat
owned by Harry Russell, Gage-
town. H. T. Donahue, Cass City,
is the owner of a registered Hol-
stein producing 86 pounds fat
and in fourth place. In fifth
place is again a registered Hol-
stein producing 85 pounds fat,
owned by Walter Moderow,
Reese. Tieing for sixth place and
producing 83 pounds fat are a
registered Jersey, grade Hol-
stein and registered Holstein,
owned by Homer Daubenmeyer,
Marlette, Ernest Nuerminger,
Saginaw, and Lavern Engelhard,
Unionville. Other Dairy Herd Im-
provement Association members
with cows in the top ten are
Harold Blaylock, Vassar, a reg-
istered Ayrshire with 82 pounds
fat; Norman and Wallace Koep-
pendoerfer, Vassar, a grade Hol-
stein with, 79 pounds fat; Ross
and Clair Russell, Caro, a regis-
tered Holstein with 79 pounds
fat, and Tuscola County Farm,
Caro, a grade Holstein with 78
pounds fat.

In the class with herds of 30
pounds fat or more during De-
cember are the following top ten
in this class: Alan Kirk, Fair-
grove, a three-cow herd with, an
average butterfat production of

Concluded on page ten.

Frutchey Bean Company
will be open Thursday after-
noons and closed Saturday after-
noons.—Adv. 1-22-4

Elect Officers at
Lutheran Church

All officers of The Good Shep-
herd Lutheran ' Church in Cass
City were re-elected to their re-
spective offices at a voters'
meeting held Friday evening,
Jan. 15, at the church.

Fred Iseler will again serve as
president of the church. Other
officers elected included: Otto
Neu, elder; Peter Zell, trustee;
Wesley Frederick, secretary;
John Haire, treasurer, and Glen
Ulrey, bulletin manager.

The officers will be installed
Sunday, Jan. 24, at the regular
church service.

It was announced that the
church building debt has been
reduced to $1,800.

Two members of the church,
Mr. Iseler and Louis Bartz, pur-
chased an electric organ for the
church. They will be partly re-
paid for their expenditure by do-
nations from other church mem-
bers.

ilies.
Last year

totaled 1,857.
Montague said that the swell-

ing membership reflected the
work the organization is doing
representing the farmers' inter-
est in legislation and other vital
problems where .united action is
desired.

Rotarians Hear
Randall in Caro

An estimated 25 Rotarians
from Cass City were guests of
the Caro Rotary Club Monday
evening in a joint meeting of
the Cass City, Caro and Sebe-
waing Rotary Clubs, held to
hear Larry Randall, former
superintendent of Cass City
Schools.

Mr. Randall told members of! lect were explained.

WSC Names
Officers at Regular
Meeting Tuesday

Mrs. Herbert Ludiw was re--
elected president for her secoair
year when the Woman's Study/"
Club met with Mrs. Harold Per-
ry Tuesday afternoon. Other of-
ficers chosen were: First vice-
president, Miss Hollis
ney; second vice-president,
Adolph Woelfle; recording
tary, Mrs. Roy Taylor; corress--
ponding secretary, Miss Manef
Addison; treasurer, Mrs. C". IL-
Graham; publicity chairman^
Mrs. H. F. Lenzner; state con-
vention delegate, Miss MeBar-
ney, alternate, Mrs. Edw. Fafe^;
district convention delegate--,,
Miss Addison, alternate, Mxsu.
Otto Goertsen; county delegate,
Mrs. Grant Patterson, alternate;.,
Mrs. Perry. The tellers were
Mrs. Floyd Reid, Mrs. M. C. 3fo-
Lellan and Mrs. Robert Gross,,

The opening number of a pro-
gram on "Religion" was a play-
let entitled, "The Collect
Speaks," presented by Mrs;.
Goertsen, Mrs. A. J. Knapp an<f
Mrs. Lenzner, in which the aims
and objectives of the club col—

his experiences as a former dis-
trict governor of Rotary and
some of his personal history
since leaving the Thumb area.

The meeting held in Caro took
the place of the regular Rotary
meeting in the village that would
have been held Tuesday, Jan. 12.

Hays Presents History
Of Dairy Research

"Believe it or not," said J. G.
Hays, Michigan State College
dairyman, "the cow is the hard-
est working animal on the farm."

With this introduction, the
dairy expert explained the re-
search done at. the college to im-
prove production of the nation's
dairy cattle to members of the
Cass City Community Club Tues-
day evening at the school.

Hays, an accomplished public
speaker, kept the audience on the
edge of its seat with his in-
formed speech and semi-ribald
humor.

He took members back to the
early days of cattle research
and explained the work that
went into the discovery of iodine
and cobalt as part of feed for
dairy cattle.

Following his explanation of
these two vital elements in feed,
he told members of work done in
vitamins for cattle.

He concluded that most of the
necessary vitamins come to cat-
tle naturally and did not need to
be added to feed.

Work done at MSC in artificial
insemination was carefully ex-
plained by Hays. He traced the
process from its infancy through
the present.

He said that from one-quarter
to one-half of all cattle in Mich-
igan are now bred artificially.

To further research in cattle,
MSC has cut a hole in the side
of cows and inserted a plastic
disk with, a removable mouth-
piece.

He showed pictures of one of
the test cows and said that the
process was invaluable for re-
search and did not hurt the ani-
mal.

The cows with the opening al-
lows researchers to take samples
of juices in the cows' digestive
tracts and permits the observa-
tion of the animals' digestive
system in action.

Because of these observations,
Hays said, he was able to make
his opening statement that the
cow was the hardest working
animal on the farm.

In her talk on religion,
Goertsen stressed the superiority
of Christianity over other reli-
gions such as Mohammedanism,
Confucianism, etc. In speaking-
of great preachers of the pasts,
she related the story of the hum-
ble beginning of the ministry of
Charles Spurgeon of London asffi
his ultimate success. Mrs. Goert-
sen closed her inspiring address'
by disclosing to her audience
"What My Religion Means to*
Me."

"Is the Bible, the Best Seller^
Real?" was the title of a paper
read by Mrs. Lenzner. Adrian
Fuller, the Detroit Free Press
religious writer, was the author-
ity for -most of the statements
given.

The program was appropri-
ately opened with a prayer by
Mrs. A. Kihnaird and closed "by
singing a verse of "Blest B'e the
Tie That Binds."

During the business session m
contribution was voted for the
nurses' fund and the ways anai
means committee was instructed!
to devise a plan to raise funds
for '^Girls' Town."

The next meeting of the C!B&
will be held Tuesday, Feb. 2, a£
the home of Mrs. Robert Gross*'
when Miss McBurney will give sa
book review. Members wHS
please take notice that the' Fetfe,
2 and Feb. 16 programs' Bare
been interchanged.

P. F. A. Fish Supper
Feb. 4 at Hrgh School, beginning-
at 5:30 till all are served. Adults
$1.25; children 75c.—Adv. 2t,

Parsch's Store
will be open Thursday afternoons*
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News from Deford Area
Novesta 4-H Club—

The third meeting of the No-
vesta 4-H Club winter project
was held recently at the Elmer
Pfaff home. Thirty-four mem-
bers, four leaders and six visi-
tors were present.

Mr. McQueen, the county
agent, was a guest at the meet-
ing. He told of the different
projects being worked and gave
assistance on some.

Cake and cocoa were served at
the close of the meeting and
February 4 is the date of the
next meeting at the home of
Catherine Sefton.

Renae, little daughter of Mr.
and Mrs. Edwin Rayl, and
granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs.
Earl Rayl, Sr., celebrated her
fourth birthday Saturday after-
noon with a birthday party. Ten

SECOND ANNUAL
BIBLE INSTITUTE

of Cass City
Accredited by EVANGELICAL TEACHER TRAIN-

ING ASS'N., Chicago, Illinois
—Twelve Week Semester—

each Tuesday from 8 to 10 p. ml.
First Class Jan. 26 8 to 10 p. m.

Two Subjects
"Bible and Missions" "Bible and Evangelism"

TEACHING ONLY
Orthodox, Fundamental Truths of God's Word in con-
trast to the liberalism of today.
ALL INVITED NO CHARGE

YOU'RE INVITED TO ATTEND

GOSPEL SERVICES
FEATURING

SPECIAL MUSIC
TESTIMONIES

BIBLE PREACHING

AT THE

GRACE COMMUNITY CHURCH
Corner M-53 and M-81

THURSDAY
At 8 p. in.
January 21

CHARLES

SUNDAY
At 10:45 a. m.

January 24

McHATTON
Gospel Echoes Radio Speaker will be bringing

the messages

little children were present for
the occasion. Miss Carolynn Ray]
and Mrs. Burton Allen assisted.
The group sang "Happy Birth-
day" while Renae opened her
gifts. Ice cream, a birthday cake
and kool aid were served. Among
the guests were both grand-
mothers, Mrs. John Horst of
Akron and Mrs. Earl Rayl, Sr.

Mrs. Ella Childs, Mr. and Mrs
Byron Childs and sons of Union-
ville, Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Ray
and girls of Cass City, Mr. and
Mrs. Walter Rayl and girls of
Marlette, Miss Donna Norrington
and Elmer Rayl of Akron, Mis;
Carolynn Rayl of Royal Oak anc
Mr. and Mrs. Duane Rich of
Sandusky were all callers at the
Earl Rayl, Sr., home during the
past week.

Mr. and Mrs. Norris Boyne of
Center Line visited Mr. and Mrs
Arleon Retherford and family
on Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Clark Montague
and Mr. and Mrs.s Horace Murry
and Geraldine of Caro called on
Mr. and Mrs. George Roblin on
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Moore of
Royal Oak spent Sunday eve-
ning and Monday with the lat-
ter's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Louis
Sherwood.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Petersen
and family of Marlette and Miss
Marjorie Schiebel were Sundav
visitors at the Kenneth Churchill
home.

Mr. and Mrs. William Toner
and daughter, Iverna, of Cass
City and Mr. and Mrs. Arthur
Adrian and daughter, Johanna,
of Davison were Sunday visitors
at the Clark Zinnecker home.

Mr. and Mrs. Francis VanHorn
and Miss Joan Green of Kings-
ton and Mr. and Mrs. Eugene
Chapin and family of Cass City
were Sunday evening luncheon
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Harold
Chapin and family.

Mrs. Tony Probe and three
daughters and Miss Margaret
Kilbourn of Detroit visited their
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Raymond
Kilboum on Sunday.

James Jacoby of Pontiac spent
the week end with Mr. and Mrs.
George Jacoby and sons.

Mr. and Mrs. John McCon-
nachie of Deckerville called on
Mr. and Mrs. William Hicks
Friday afternoon.

Dennie Vader of Romulus was
a visitor at the Gail . Parrott
home from Tuesday until Satur-
day.

HOLBROOK
Sixteen little friends helped

Dennis and Dean Rienstra cele-
brate their ninth birthday Jan.
15. Games were played and
lunch was served with each
twin having a birthday cake.
The boys received many nice
gifts.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Jackson
attended a birthday dinner, at
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Forest
Smith near Shabbona on Sunda
held in honor of Mrs. Smith
brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs
Edgar Jackson of Ubly.

Mrs. Ella Becker of Bad Ax
visited her mother, Mrs. Gordo
Jackson, on Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Jackso
were guests on Sunday at th
Lee Hendrick home near Wick
ware.

Miss Betsey Thorpe of Sag
naw was a guest on Sunday a
the Loren Trathen home.

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold LaPee
visited Tuesday at the Cliffor
Jackson home.

Mrs. Gordon Jackson visite
Monday afternoon at the Merl
Winters home at Old Greenleaf.

Mrs. Loren Trathen visite
her niece, Mrs. Myrtle Rabideaij
who is convalescing at the horn
of Mr. and Mrs. Rodney Karr
on Monday.

PEICE TOO HIGH
The main reason so few of u

attain the pinnacle of success i
because the cost is greater tha
we are willing to pay.

MAKING ENDS MEET
January's biggest problem

that of making the ends of a lit
tie income and a big expens
meet.

DIRECTORY

JAMES BALLARD, M. D.
Office at Cass City Hospital

Phone 221R3 Hours, 9-5, 7-9

DENTISTRY
E. C.FRITZ

Office over Mac & Scotty Drug
Store. We solict your patronage
when in need of work.

The death rate today is any-
thing above 85 miles an hour.

NOW! STANDARD OIL'S NEW HOME
HEATING DISCOVERY

STANDARD

II

NEW STANDARD
FURNACE OIL

FKEYENTS CLOGGING OF OIL BURNER PARTS
STOPS GUM, SEDIMENT, RUST IN TANKS

'KEEPS OIL BURNERS RUNNING LIKE NEW

WHAT IS STA-CLEAN
STA-CLEAN IS A NEW, PATENTED ADDITIVE AVAILABLE ONLY
IN STANDARD FUEL OIL. IT IS A DETERGENT, A RUST-PREVENT-
ING AGENT BLENDED AT THE REFINERY. IT CLEANS AND
PROTECTS AS IT FLOWS THROUGH EVERY VITAL PART FROM
TANK TO CHAMBER.

H. T. Donahue, A. B., M. D
Physician and Surgeon

X-Ray Eyes Examined
Phones:

Office, 96 — Res. 69

K. I. MacRae, D. O.
Osteopathic Physician and

Surgeon
Half block east of Chronicle

Office, 226R2 Res. 226R3

B. H. S.TARMANN,sM. D.
Physician and Surgeon

HoursT—Daily, 9 to 5. Wednes-
day and Saturday evenings, 7:30-
9:30. Other times by appointment

Phones:
Office 189R2 Home 189R3

DR. D. E. RAWSON
DR. G. C. CARRICK

DENTISTS
Office in Sheridan Building

No other oil gives such assurance of constant, no stop heat. New Standard Fur-
nace Oil with STA-CLEAN does more than any other oil to eliminate major
causes of burner failure. Cleans and protects as it flows through every vital part
from tank to fire chamber!

You Expect
More From

AndAnfl

R. D. Keating
DISTRIBUTOR

Standard Oil Products
Phone 248 Cass City

WATSON
STANDARD SERVICE

GAS AND OIL
Oak & Main Sts. Cass City

F. L. MORRIS, M. D.
Office 4415 South Seeger St.

Office hours, 1-4 and 7-9 p. m.
Phone 221R2

Harry Crandell, Jr., D. V. M.
Office 4438 South Seeger St.

Phone 27

PHOTOGRAPHER
Call 245 Cass City
FRITZ NEITZEL, P. A. of A.
Baby Portrait - Commercial

WEDDINGS, STUDIO
AND CANDID

Cass City
Specializing- in the care of

the chronically ill.
Under the supervision of
Helen S. Stevens, R. N.

DR. B. V. CLARK
CHIROPRACTOR

Mon. - Pri. 9-12, 1-5, 6-15-9
Tues.- Wed. - Sat. 9-12, 1-5

Closed Thursdays
House calls made

Phone 370
233 S. .State St. Caro

N. C. MANKE
Steam Baths and Swedish

Massage
Special Foot Treatments

Mrs, Manke in Attendance
Church & Oak Streets, Cass City

Phone 29R2

Expert Watch Repairing
PROMPT SERVICE

REASONABLE CHARGES
Satisfaction Guaranteed

No job too big - No job too small
Daniel's Jewelers Changed to

WM. MANASSE'S
JEWELRY

180 N. State St. Caro, Mich.

First Presbyterian Church—
Melvin R. Vender, minister. Sun-
day, January 24:

11:00 a. m., Divine worship.
Special music to be arranged.
Question period instead of a, ser-
mon.

10:15 a. an., The Church Sun-
day School. Classes from Primary
through adults! Provisions for
small children.

11:00 a. m., Nursery class and
Kindergarten.

11:00 a. m., Period II, Worship
for primary; followed by stories,
dramatics, etc. at 11:30 a. m.

Westminster Youth Fellowship,
Jr. Hi and Senior groups at 7:30.

Jan. 19, Flint Presbytery, First
Presbyterian Church, Flint.

Jan. 21 at 8:00 p. m. Leader-
ship Training School.

Jan. 28-29, Christian Education
Institute in Flint.

Feb. 8-9, Leaders' conference in
East Lansing.

Young adult conference in East
Lansing Feb. 19-21.

St. Pancratius Catholic Church:
Rev. John J. Bozek, pastor.

Masses at 7:30 a. m. and 10:00
a. m. Sunday.

On Holydays of Obligation at
6:00 a. m. and 9:00 a. m.

Novena Services Monday 8:30
p. an. Confessions after Novena
and on Saturday 3:30 to 4:30 p.
m. and 8:00 and 9:00 p. m.

United Missionary Churches:
Lewis L. Surbrook, minister.
Phone 99F13.

Mizpah:
10:30 a. m. Sunday School.
11:30 a. m. Morning Worship.
Monday evening, Jan. 25, Re-

vival services begin with Rev.
Thompson, evangelist. Services
every evening except Saturday at
8 o'clock.

Riverside:
10 a.- m. Morning worship.
11* a. m., Sunday School.
8 p. m., Evangelistic service.

New Greenleaf United Mission-
ary Church—

Sunday School, 10:00.
Morning worship, 11:00.
Evangelistic service, 8:00 p. m.
Midweek prayer service

Wednesday at 8:00 p. m.
Rev. Eva L. Surbrook, pastor. *

Cass City Church of The Naza-
rene, 6538 Third Street, Phone
124R4. Sunday, January 24:

10:00 a. m. Bible School, Lila
Tracy, superintendent; Stanton
March, assistant.

11:00 a. m. Worship Service,
Sermon Subject: "When Profit is
Loss."

7:15 p. m., NYPS. Where youth
fellowships and worships.

8:00 p. m. Gospel Service, Ser-
Subject: "Thorough-going

Disciples."
Wednesday, January 27: 8:00

p. m. Prayer and Praise Service.
Earl M. Crane, pastor.

Deford Methodist Church —
Sunday services:

Church, 10 a. m. Rev. Edith
Smith. Sunday School, 11 a. m.
Main floor, Edwin Rayl, 'Supt.

Youth meeting Sunday eve-
nings.

Prayer and Bible study,
Wednesday, 8 p. m., in the church.

Family fellowship, fourth Fri-
day night of each month.

W. S. C. S., second Tuesday of
each month.

Primary department, Elna Kel-
ey, Supt. * ;

First Baptist Church-—Rev. R.
G. Weckle, pastor.

Revival meeting tonight at 8
p. m. with closing day on Sunday,
Jan. 24, with Evangelist Mark
Mitchell of Canton, Ohio, (see
display ad.)

Bible school -hour at 10 a. m.
Adult Bible class lesson is "God
Knows All." When was the last
time you took your Bible and
came to Bible School? We invite
you to get the Bible school habit.

Worship hour at 11 a. m. Spe-
cial anthem by choir. .Sermon by
Evangelist Mark Mitchell.

Special'"Question and Answer"
time for all interested on the
Bible and relative subjects at 3
p. m. Open to all.

Junior Youthtime, "Ambassa-
dors," at 7:30 p. m.

Evangelistic Hour at 8 p. m.
Closing message of the Revival
Crusade with Dr. Mitchell speak-
ing.

Monday evening at 8 p. m.
Senior Youthtimers will have
their "Ice and Snow" party. Bus
will leave church at 7:45 p. m.
Election of officers for the year.
All high schoolers invited.

Tuesday morning at 11 a. m.,
radio broadcast over WMPC, La-
peer.

The Second Annual Bible Insti-
tute of Cass City will begin at 8
p. m

Ellington Church of the Naza-
rene—Sunday School, 10 a. m.

Morning worship, 11:00.
Young people's service, 7:15

p. m.
Evangelistic service, 8:00 p. m.
Prayer meeting, 8:00 p. m.,

Wednesday.
Rev. T. C. Riddle, pastor. - *

Family Bible Hour—At the
Hillside School, one-half mile
west, one-half mile north of Elm-
wood Store. Hurd Corners Road.

Every Sunday afternoon at
3:30 a fundamental message from
the Bible. *

Lamotte United Missionary
Church, 8 miles north of Marlette.

Morning worship, 10:00. Sun-
day School, 11:00. Sunday eve-
ning, 8:00. You are cordially in-
vited to attend.

Rev. B. H. .Surbrook, pastor. *

Salem Evangelical United
Brethren Church, corner of Ale
and Pine Streets, Cass City. S.
R. Wurtz, minister.

Bible School 10:00 a. m.
Divine Worship 11:00 a. m.
There will be no evening ser-

vice. Everyone is invited to at-
tend the Caro church where the
pastor is assisting in evangelis-
tic meetings. The service at the
Caro church will begin at 7:30
p. m.

Monday night the Youth Fel-
lowship will meet with Connie
Bartle. The prayer group are
invited to attend the Wednesday
evening service at Caro. Those
desiring a ride, see the pastor,
Dale Buehrly or Jacob Hiller.

Thursday: 7:00 p. m. prompt,
orchestra practice. 7:45 p. m.,
choir practice. 8:00 p. m. The
school of Leadership Training at
the Presbyterian Church. 1

Saturday^ at 2:00 p. m. sharp>

Sunday, January 24— Jeho-
vah's Witnesses—Kingdom Hall,
1% miles northeast and & mile
east of Caro, Mich. Public lec-
ture: 3:00 p. m. "Who Gave Us
The Bible?" Watchtower study
at 4:15 p. m. Subject: "Ever-
lasting Praise Due the New
World's .Sovereign." Ps. 145:2,
CB. Meetings: Tuesday and
Friday at 8:00 p. m.

Cass City Methodist Church—
Floyd Wilfred Porter, pastor.

10 a. m. Church School op-
portunities for all the family.

11 a. m., Worship with sermon
by the pastor "Une-xpected
Faith."

7 p. m. Intermediate and 7:30
p. m. Senior Youth Fellowships
Monday, 4 p. m. Junior Choir.

Monday, 7:30 p. m. Methodist
Men entertain Northern Sub-
district Men at monthly dinner
meeting. Dr. Hugh Townley of
Saginaw will show pictures and
speak on "The Holy Land,
Yesterday and Today."

Tuesday, 8:15 p. m. Commis-
sion on Education and Workers1'
Conference.

Wednesday, 7:30 p. m., Chan-
cel choir.

Thursday, 8 p. m. at Presby-
terian Church: Cass City School
of Christian Living, three
courses.

The Lutheran Church of The
Good Shepherd—

Friday. Jan. 22: „ Women's
Missionary League at the church
at 2:00.

Sunday, Jan. 24: Divine Wor-
ship with celebration of The
Lord's Supper at 9:00. Sunday
.School classes at 10:00.

Tuesday, Jan. 26: Choir at
7:30. Adult classes at 8:30.

_. in the basement auditorium j Junior Choir Practice. It is im-
with two classes. One subject is' portant that everyone be out to
"Evangelism Thru God's Word;"
other subject is "Bible and Mis-
sions." This is a - twelve-week
semester. Credited by the Evan-
gelical Teacher Training Ass'n. of
Chicago, Illinois. All interested
in the orthodox fundamental
teachings of God's Word in con-
trast to the liberalism of the
modern day are welcome.

Wednesday at 8 p. m., prayer
meeting and Bible study.

Church board meeting at 9
p. m.

Gagetown Church of the Naza-
rene—F. Holbrook, pastor.

Sunday School 10:00 a. m.
Lawrence Summers, superin-
tendent. Morning worship, 11:00.
N. Y. P. S. 7:15. Evangelistic ser-
vice, 8:00 p. m. Midweek service,
Wednesday at 8 p. m. Welcome to
all our services. *

St. Miehael Church, Wilmot—-
| Rev. Sig^nund J» Haremski, pas-

St. Joseph Church, Mayville— (tor.
Rev. Sigmund J. Haremski, pas-1 Masses: Sunday and Holydays,

7:30 and 11:30. Weekdays, 8 a. m.
Confessions Friday evening af-

ter services. Saturday 3-4, 8-9.
Evening services Friday at 8. *

practice Saturday.

Cass City Assembly of God—
Sunday School at 10 a. m. >
Morning worship at 11:00.
Evening evangelistic at 8:00.
Prayer meeting Thursday, 8:00

p. m.
All welcome.
Rev. Earl Olsen, pastor. *

Novesta Church of Christ-
Howard Woodard. minister.
Keith Little, Bible School supt.

Bible School 10 a. m.
Communion and Message 11

a. m. 0
Evening worship at 8.
Prayer meeting and Bible

study Thursday 8 p. m.
You are cordially invited to

attend these services.

Advertise it in Chronicle.

or.
Masses Sunday and Holydays,

5:30.
Confessions Sunday at 9:-9:-30.*

Dynamic Bible

Preaching
Closing Jan. 24 Only Jesus Saves Tonight 8 p. m.

First Baptist Church Cass City

New cab comfort.

JOHN W. BAYLEY AGENCY
Bookkeeping Income Tax

Insurance
Office Hours: 9-5 except
Thursday and Saturday

Telephone 289

DR. M. E. PENCE
Optometrist

2nd Floor of State Savings Bank
Caro, Mich. Phone 193

Office Hours—Every Day
Except Thursdays and Sundays

9:00 a, m. to 12 p. m. and
1:30 p..am. to 5:00 p. m.

a ComPfefeV new/ The new Comfortmaster cab is only one of the
many great new advances offered by the most powerful, fines,t
performing, best-looking Advance-Design trucks ever built!

The new '54 Chevrolet truck Comfortmaster
cab offers increased visibility with new one-
piece curved windshield. Instruments are
easier to read and controls are easier to reach.

And the new Ride Control Seat* provides
extra comfort for drivers.
t Here are more new features you'll like—
NEW ENGINE POWER AND ECONOMY. Bigger
"Thriftmaster 235." Rugged "Loadmaster
235." All-new "Jobmaster 261" engine.*
NEW AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION.* Hydra-

FOR'54

Matic is available on l/2-,%- and 1-ton models.
NEW, BIGGER LOAD SPACE. Roomier pickup
and stake bodies.
NEW CHASSIS RUGGEDNESS. Heavier axle shafts
on 2-ton models. Newly designed clutches and
more rigid frames on all models.
NEW ADVANCE-DESIGN STYLING. New front-
end is more massive in appearance.
^Optional at extra cost. Ride Control Seat is avail-
able on all cab models, "Jobmaster 261" engine on
2-ton models. a

OnAyM/

ADVANCE-DESIGN TRUCKS

Phone 185R2 BULEN MOTORS Cass City
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News from Gagetown Area
Karrs' Wedding Anniversary—

Forty-seven friends and rela-
tives of Mr. and Mrs. Mose Karr
met at the Winton Club House
Saturday evening for a surprise
party in honor of the Karrs' 47th
wedding anniversary.

For entertainment the group
played cards and a potluck sup-
per, including a wedding cake,
was served.

A purse of money was pre-
sented to the honored guests.

Guests were present from
Pontiac, Milford, Ann Arbor,
Deford, Cass City, Snover and

Gagetown.
The affair was planned * by

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Salgat,
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Clague and
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Karr.

Grant Farm Bureau—
The Grant Farm Bureau group

met at the Williamson School
Wednesday evening, January 13,
for their regular monthly meet-
ing.

Michael Pisarek conducted the
business meeting with twenty-
nine families answering roll call.
Charles Taschner made a report

WE INVITE YOU TO

COMPAR E
PRICE and QUALITY

OUR

I MONUMENTS - - MARKERS
m Our quality markers and monuments cost many dollars less
« than others of similar quality. That's why we ask you to com-
:<fl pare prices and quality. Why not look over our stock today?

Main St.—Next to Ideal Plumbing
Office Two Doors West of Ford Garage

on the membership drive and
fourteen new families have been
added to the roster. The discus-
sion on "Taxing State Owned
Lands" was led by Michael Penn.

Following the recreation
period a cooperative lunch was
served by the committee, Mr.
and Mrs. Richard Schuette and
Mrs. William Ashmore, Jr.

Allis-Chalmers 11-B Disc Harrows

Available in 5%, 7 or 8-ft. cutting widths. Hydraulic ram or irip-repe angling
of gangs. Various combinations and sizes of smooth and notched blades,,

When you pull an Allis-Chalmers 11-B Double-Action
Disc Harrow across your field, you get down to pay dirt
on every round ... fast!

It has the weight needed for quick penetration, and
this Weight is evenly distributed. Every keen-edged
blade does its full share of the work. Altogether, they do
a masterly job of chopping stubble, roots and surface
trash... mixing and pulverizing the soil.

The 11-B is a flexible harrow, with every adjustment
necessary for the kind of seedbed you want. Front and
rear gangs have independent action, assuring coverage
in rough or uneven conditions.

ENJOY
the National Farm
and Home Hour —
£4BC—Every Saturday

(fllUS-CHfllMERS )
V " SALCS AND SERVICE J[

E.JOHNSON

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Freeman,
Mrs. M. P. Freeman and Miss
Cathryn Freeman left Monday
for Florida where they expect to
spend the next six weeks or two
months.

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Roche-
leau moved from the Lenhard
house on W. State St. to their
recently purchased farm one
mile south of town.

Mr. and Mrs. William C. Hunt-
er and family and Mrs. C. P.
Hunter were Sunday" dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Vincent
Weiler in Saginaw.

Mr. and Mrs. George Gartner
and Miss Theresa Burkman of
Detroit and Mr. and Mrs. Char-
les Proulx and family of Meta-
mora were week-end guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Proulx.

Week-end guests of Mrs. Wil-
liam Comment were her daugh-
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs.
Angus McEachin of North
Branch.

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Carpen-
ter of Detroit spent the week
end with her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Joseph Quinn.

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Laurie
spent Sunday with her sister,
Mrs. Archie Mclntyre.

Friday evening, Jan. 22, at
o'clock, the dancing class taught
by Miss Jane Marcell of Fair-
grove will present its final revue
of the year in the public school
gymnasium.

Mrs. Frank Lenhard was
pleasantly surprised on her
birthday Saturday evening a
her home here when Mr. an(
Mrs. Robert Cartwright anc
family of Unionville, Mr. ant
Mrs. Carl Lenhard and family of
Ithaca, Miss Florence Lehman
Mr. and Mrs. William Lenhard
and family and Mr. and Mrs.
Lyman Hull and family helped
her celebrate. Games were
played and potluck lunch was
served.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Hill
and daughters of Mason were
week-end guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Hugh Corner.

Rev. M. M. Sprouse of Detroit
is a house guest of Rev. and Mrs.
Franklin K. Holbrook this week
during revival meetings at the
Church of the Nazarene.

Fred Heroerick went to Clear-
water, Florida, last week to visit
his son and family, Dr. and Mrs.
Frederick Hemerick, for a few
weeks.

Gagetown Woman's Study
Club met Monday evening at the
home of Mrs. Leslie Munro. The
meeting was called to order by
the president. Mrs. Sherwood
Rice, Jr. Roll call was responded
to by "My girlhood ambition."
Mrs. Frank Weatherhead gave a
paper on "Family Security" and
Mrs. Floyd Werdeman on "Vo-
cational Guidance." Michigan
State Federation of Woman's
Club is offering1 an art talent
contest for a high school senior
from this area. Refreshments
were served by the hostess. Mrs.
William Anker entertained the
members at the previous meet-
ing at which Mrs. Stanley
Muntz spoke on nutrition.

Miss Veronica Mullin spent
the week end in Detroit with
Mr. and Mrs. Martin O'Conner.

BOWLING NEWS
Merchanette's League.

Team Pts.
Rabideaus , 35%

ass City Oil & Gas 35
Pinney State. Bank 34
Brinker Lumber 30%
?orts 30
Shaws 15

Team high three games: Rabi^-
deaus 2346, Forts 2291, Pinneys
2224.

Team high single game: Forts
821, Rabideaus 817-783.

Individual high three games:
Patterson 534, B. Dewey 509,

L. Profit (sub.) 500.
Individual high single game:

D. Vargo 189, C. Patterson 187,
C. Wright 187.

High averages: B. Dewey 153,
C. Patterson 152, V. Strickland
149, D. Klinkman 148, D. Vargo
142, M. Guilds 141, S. Nye 140.

Betty Ryland converted the
6-10-7 split.

Ladies' City League.
Team Pts.
Profit 47
I. Hildinger 40
Bartle 39
Townsend 38%
Carmer 38
B. Hildinger 38
Dewey 37
Freiburger 34%
McComb 34
D. Hildinger 32
Karr 32
Schwaderer 22

Team high three games: Prof-
it 1944, Freiburger 1921, Karr
1897.

Team high single game: Prof-
it 714-697, Townsend 698, Karr
678.

Individual high three games:
B. Carmer 483, B, O'Connor 480,
B. Dewey 470, L. Profit 463.

Individual high single game:
B. Carmer 188, L. Profit 172-170;

B. Dewey 171, M. Schott 171, 3
Freiburger 176.

Five high averages: B. Dewey
150, G. Bartle 149, B.- O'Connor
147, P. Johnson 143, A. McComb
140.

Be'ginners' Group.
Individual high three games:

J. Golding 329, V. MacRae 317,
B. Myas 293, F. Hutchinson 293.

Individual high single game:
J. Golding 118, L. Leitch 117, J.
May 109, V. MacRae 109.

Men's City League.
Standings January 11.

Team Pts.
Asher , 23
Gremel 21
Zmierski 20
Reid 18%
Kritzman 17%
Wooley 17%
Bartz 15
Landon 13
Lapp 13
Wallace 13
Huff 12
Dillman 9%

Team high three games: Asher
2473, Gremel 2403, Kritzman
2338.

Team high single game:
Gremel 889, Asher 852, Kritzman
844.

Individual high three games:
Kettlewell 573, Zmierski 565,
Bigham 560.

Individual high single game:
Douglas 206, Kettlewell, Zmier-
ski 205, Wooley 204.

Those who have a fine com-
mand of language say nothing.

ONE LACKING
Some people possess many

good qualities, but lack the one
necessary to make use of them.

SHORT-LIVED
Public acclaim is short-lived—

it will ride you on its shoulder to-
day and on a rail tomorrow.

YOU CAN RELY ON THESE

FAMOUS BRAND NAMES
You buy with confidence when you purchase appliances from the
famous brands at Cass City Oil and Gas Co.

DUO THERM OIL
BURNERS

DUO THERM HOT
WATER

HEATERS

THOR

RCA - CROSLEY - ADMIRAL - MANY

OTHER FAMOUS BRANDS

TELEVISION - RADIOS
REFRIGERATORS

HOME FREEZERS
ELECTRIC
DRYERS

TRAFFIC
APPLIANCES

RANGES

DISH WASHERS

REFRIGERATOR — RADIO — TV

REPAIR SERVICE
Gulf Gas — Fuel Oil — Tires and Batteries

Cass City
Phone 25 Stanley Asher, Mgr. Cass City
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Put a Chronicle Want Ad to Work for You!
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Fine-car Styling An outstanding example of fine-car beauty in the low-price field . .»
the new Crestline Fordor is the fashion car for the American Road

DEFORD «<)%^ 144 F2
It's nice to be important—also

important to be nice.

America's Fastest Growing Life Insurance Co. offers a

New Kind of Life Insurance for
Children . . . Benefits Increase
5 Times in Value at Age 21 With

No Added Cost!
Have you a child or grandchild be-

tween the ages of 1 and 15 ? If so, our new
President Juvenile Estate Builder policy
will assure him $5000 of life insurance at
age 21 for every $1000 you buy him now! . .
with no increase in cost and with no fur-*
ther proof of insurability.

You see, this savings-type life insur-
ance immediately jumps to 5 times its
original value when the youngster reaches
21, yet the annual premium does not
change throughout the life of the policy.

This plan completely solves the 3 ma-
jor problems of life; EDUCATION,
BUILDING AN ESTATE and RETIRE-
MENT in the simplest, most economical
and most profitable way of anything on
the market today.

This is the ideal way to guarantee
your child or grandchild a substantial
amount of life insurance protection as he
takes on grown-up responsibilities, with
important cash values available for earlier
education or later emergencies. Liberal
guaranteed value coupons, bearing

compound interest, add materially to these
values.

Your youngster is now at the life in-
surance bargain counter. The sooner you
buy, the lower the rate. The sooner you
buy, the less chance of his developing a
health impairment that will later make him
uninsurable.

For complete details just fill out and
return the coupon. No obligation, of
course.

I SOBEL INSURANCE AGENCY
f 2295 Waverly, Detroit 6, Michigan

New Astra-Dial Instrument Panel is a safety dividend with speed-
ometer placed high on the panel for easier reading. Warning lights tell
when generator is discharging or oil pressure falls too low.

Style-Setting Interiors in Ford give you beauty from the inside^out!
Colorful new upholstery fabrics and smart trim are another '54 Ford
dividend . . . help make Ford the style leader of the industry. ̂

NameI

I
1 Address

I Phone No. .
I
1 Child's age

tiatfs
our showrooms I

The '54 Ford gives you extra Dividends in style, in

performance, in ride, with fine-car features you would

normally expect to find only in highest-priced cars.

The new Y-bSock V-8
with the new extra-deep crankcase, has
130-h.p. for a dividend of 18% more power.
And you can enjoy V-8 advantages on less
gas! Free-turning overhead valves and
shorter piston
engine life!

stroke help give longer

The new I-biock Six
has 115-h.p. for a dividend of 14% more
poicer. Like the V-8, it has Ford's High-
Turbulence Combustion Chamber for
more complete and economical combus-
tion of fuel. It's the latest word on high-
compression, low-friction Six design.

-Joint Front Suspension

It allows greater up and down wheel
travel for a smoother ride . . . helps keep
wheels in true alignment for consist-
ently easy handling. Wheels move on
ball joints, whether up or down . . .
right or left.

Plus 5* optional power cissisfs
that make driving easier, more pleasant! You can have Power-Lift Windows
. . . 4-Way Power Front Seat . . . Swift Sure Power Brain's . . . Master-Guide
power steering . . , and Fordomatic Drive. The)'re all available in Ford!

Come in for a Test Drive
F.D.A.F.

AUTEN MOTOR SALES
CASS CITY PHONE 111



PAGE FOUR. CASS CITY CHRONICLE— FRIDAY, JANUARY 22, 1954. CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

ass City Area Social and Personal Items
Miss Betty McMiller of Ponti-

•ac spent the week end at her
feame here.

Dean Murphy has accepted a
€eaeMng position in the Kinde

.and teaches history and

Miss Helen Dalton, who was
injured in an auto accident Jan.
Ss is improvmgvin.Marlette Com-
sramlty Hospital. • '

'Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Benkel-
asaai had as overnight guests
Monday night, Mr. and Mrs. Ed
iSfmington of Detroit.

Mr. and Mrs., Joseph.-Crawford
saffii nephew, Larry Connell, left
IPaesday for Florida : where they
«xpeet to stay until spring.

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph, Gast of
Hint spent the week end with
Jfe and Mrs. 'Ray.;. -Kleenor and
sons and Mrs. Lydia White.

Mrs. Roy McMiller spent last
•w^ek with her daughters, Mrs..
.James Turner at Gibraltar and

Betty McMiller at Pontiac.
The Nellie M. Young, past

•matrons' club -of Echo Chapter
•€>ES, will meet Wednesday eve-

Jan. 27, with Mrs. L. I.

Mr. and Mrs. A. H. Kinnaird,
Ife and Mrs. Earl Douglas, Mrs.
!L A. Fritz and Mrs. John Sand-
Tssm. attended the funeral of

Charles Bayless in Detroit

Mrs. Wilma Fry and Mrs.
Edward Golding, Sr., were in

Monday evening to attend
•a, dinner in Hotel Montague and
meeting of directors, of the coun-
% United Health and Welfare

Many of his friends are ask-
•'img Jim Mark for tips on the
latest fashions in men's clothes.
Mr. Mark, together with Alden

was in Detroit Sunday to
•attend the annual style show

men's clothiers in Michigan.
Bavid, son of Mr. and Mrs.

•<as£ Mr. and Mrs. James Chami-
•$»ion, and Kathy> daughter of
Jfc and Mrs. James Mark,
-smderwent tonsil operations in
IPIeasant Home Hospital this

About 35 rural letter carriers
and their wives from Sanilac
and Tuscola counties were pres-
<sat Wednesday evening of last
week for a meeting of that or-
ganization held at the school-

here. Robert Profit, the
presided over the

meeting. Klaus Schulze, German
exchange student, spoke to the
group and a film on safety was

Duane Kettlewell returned to
Detroit Tuesday where he is en-
rolled in television school.

Mr.s and Mrs. Chas. Holm and
daughters visited the Oliver
Holms near Twining Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs, Be.n Kirton spent
the week end with their daugh-
ter and husband, Mr. and Mrs.
Wm. Jones, and other relatives
in Detroit. * ! ' • '

Mrs. Ethel Dickinson was in
'Saginaw Friday and tiie Misses
Judith Dickinson and Lois Little
returned home with her to spend
the, week end here.

Mrs. Hugo Lindholm and son,
Jack, of Detroit spent the week
end as guests of her sister and
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Ray Sil-
vernail, near Argyle.

John Schweitzer, 72, of Pigeon,
grandfather of Mrs. Duane Ket-
'tlewjell and Miss Shirley Lein-
weber,' died suddenly Friday eve-
ning. Funeral. services were held
Monday at Linkville.

Mrs. Alex Greenleaf .1'eturned
home Tuesday from Roseville,
where she was called Jan. 10 by

John Mark, who has been very
ill in the Clair Tuckey home
since Jan. 10, has been improv-
ing.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Hamilton
and daughter of Auburn Hts.
visited his aunt, Mrs. Margaret
Hamilton, Sunday.

Rev. and Mrs, M. R. Vender at-,
-tended the 16th Ministers* Con-
ference in Ann Arbor from Jan.
18 to'Jan. 20..'Mr, E. G. Golding,
Sr., is attending as commissioner.

S. F. C. J. D. Tuckey is cur-

Mr, and Mrs. Kenneth Swee
and son, Jimmie, of Lapeer spen
from Friday until Saturday eve
ning with Mrs. George Seeger.

Mr. and Mrs. J. F. Klein and
family of Port Huron spent Sun
day with Mr. and Mrs. Ber
Schwegler and Mrs. Mary Klein

Mrs. George Seeger returned
home Tuesday of last week after
spending a few days with Mr. and
Mrs. Gerald Seeger and daughter
in Detroit.

Mr. and Mrs. John Guinther
rently stationed at Fort Leonard^ an<! daughter, Norma, and 'Mr
Wood, Mo., and is looking for-1 *nd ̂ rs' 'Clement Tyo visited Mr

i , -, • T -i . •-, f ... ' (TUintnfir's sisfev MT»C T\/Tow^,Vward to being discharged from
the army in February.

Mr. and Mrs. T. C. Hendrick

Guinther's sister, Mrs. Mamie
Dyers in Flint, Thursday.

Mr, and Mrs. Harry Falken-
and Miss Marie Barnes spent the I ha^en and Leonard Striffler left
week end in the Detroit area. Sunday for a stay in Florida
Miss Barnes with her brother, Fred Ritchie accompanied their

- - - " • — on the trip. Mrs. Ritchie has been
in California and is expected to

Donald Duvall, at Wyandotte
and the Hendricks in the Sher-
well Kelly home in Romulus. '} J°in her husband in Florida.

Miss Eunice Tuckey, who
teaches in Bridgeport and lives1

in Saginaw, spent the week end
at her parental home here. Sun-
day Mr. and Mrs. Luke Tuckey

the death of her father. Her!and three sons and Eunice were

Miss Minnie Helwig, who has
been with her sister, Mrs
George Bartle, in the home of
the latter's- daughter, Mrs. Carl
Ritter near Bad Axe, returned to
the Bartle home over the week

mother, Mrs. John Gledhill, re-
turned to. Cass. City with her.

Mr. and Mrs. Erwin Binder
were visitors at the Basil Quick
home, .north of Caro, Friday eve-
ning, -following the dinner for
employees and their families at
Caro State. Hospital which they
attended.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Harris, ac-
companied by his brother, Roy,
of Coldwater, left Friday on a
trip to California and expect to
be away a month to six weeks.
They will visit the Ivan Hamil-
tdhs in Phoenix, Ariz., on 'the
trip.

Mrs. Samuel Wurtz, who suf-
fered a broken hip in August,
went Wednesday from the home
of her son, Rev. S. R. Wurtz, to
her apartment in the E. W.
Kercher home. Her daughter,
Mrs. D. G. Finkbtiner of Sebe-:
waing, came Wednesday to
spend a week with her mother.

Roy McMiller left Jan. 10 for
Granite City, 111., where he is
chief engineer of the Nestle's
Nescafe Plant. As soon. as suit-
able housing can be found, Mrs.
McMiller will join him there.
Mr. McMiller was a Nestle em-
ployee in Greenville, Ohio, for
ten years before the McMillers
came to Cass City eight years
ago. They have two daughters,
Jane (Mrs. James Turner), who
is living currently at Gibraltar,
Mich., and Betty McMiller in
Pontiac.

Mr. Melvin L. Hall was a call-
er at the home of Merle Corn-

dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. j end- Mrs- Bartle is improving
Carl Mantey near Fairgrove. | steadily.

Rev. and Mrs. Howard Wood-
ard and daughter, Mary Helen,

stock in Dearborn last Wednes- I who were in Lapeer Sunday af-
" ternoon for the broadcast of the
Church of Christ, called on the
Woodards' daughter and family,
Mr. and Mrs. James Lonsberry
and children near Attica.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Little took
tl/eir son, Pvt. Roger Little, to
Willow Run Friday where he took
a plane at 7:30, Saturday for
Camp Chaffee, Ark. Pvt. Roger is
taking advanced infantry train-
ing and was home on a 10-day
furlough from Fort Knox, Ky.

Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Bryce of
Flint brought her father, Robert
Mark, to Cass City Friday eve-
ning where he remained to spend
a few days as the guest of his
niece and husband> Mr. and Mrs.
Ben Schwegler. Mr. Mark came
because of the critical condition
of his brother, John Mark.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Little at-
tended the irieeting in Lapeer

day. Mr. Hall and Mr. Comstock
spent two years together in the
service. While there, two other
buddies from Detroit, who served
with them in Europe, called to
see them.

Thirty-five were present Fri-
day evening when Mr. and Mrs.
Mack Little entertained the No-
vesta Farmers' Club. For the
program, C. P. Kline of Caro
showed pictures on "Tuber-
culosis" and Mary Helen Wood-
ard and Hazel Little sang. The
February meeting will be in the
Claud Peasley home.

Twelve members of the Junior
Youth Fellowship of the Evan-
gelical Church and their leaders,
Mrs. Arnold Copeland and Mrs.
Lawrence Bartle, met Monday
evening with Newell Harris.
There was the usual business
meeting, games and refresh-
ments. Plans were made for an
ice skating party in February. | District American Legion Posts

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Green- and Auxiliaries. In the Auxiliary
leaf, Mr. and Mrs. Edward Green- meeting, 60 were present from 20
leaf, Mr. and Mrs. Don Seeger,
Mrs. John West, Mrs. Chas. Mer-
chant, Mrs. George Seeger, Mrs.
Laurence Copland and Mrs. Les-
ter Evens attended the funeral
of John Gledhill, father of Mrs.
Alex Greenleaf, in Roseville,
Thursday.

easy steps
to getting the c;

come in and compare the features. The new fuii-time
pow@l* st®@rin§5 that gives you easier parking

and driving. The sensational Hy«Drive no-shift driving.

Plus many features not found in other low-price cars—or even amonn

some of the high-price cars!
Hy-Drive and Power Steering each available at low extra cost

WOMAN'S WORLD

OST AVERAGE homes have a
number of plastic items in

them, and though they shed. dirt
rather freely, there will come a
'time when they, too, will need
laundering care of some kind.

Plastic shower - curtains and
drapes, as well as other plastic
drapes which you may have about
the home can usually be washed
off with just a cloth. Use warm
water, from 110 to 120°' and a
mild detergent suds.

Follow this with a clear warm
water rinse and wipe dry with a
cloth.

Water-Spotted Plastic
White spots on plastic curtains

and drapes are usually caused
by soap curd and hard water. In
this case, the plastics should be

Marriage Licenses Guest Evangelist

There are no more ice cube
trays to fill or empty when you
have an LP-gas refrigerator
with an ice maker that freezes
and stores these "ice circles"
automatically. Water is piped
to the refrigerator to make the
ice circles, and they are dried
before being dropped into a
large storage basket, automa-
tically, of course, so they don't
stick together.

units in the Seventh District. The
organization voted $25.00 to help
furnish the new annex to the
Veterans' Hospital at Battle
Creek. The next district meeting
will be March 14 at Imlay City.

Mrs. Chas. Bayless died Sun-
day in Detroit and funeral ser-
vices and burial took place
Wednesday in Detroit. Mrs.
Bayless, wife of a former pas-
tor of the Methodist Church
here, made many friends here
both, within and outside the,
church. She is survived by her
husband, pastor of the Campbell!
Ave. Methodist Church in De-l ¥ T your artistic talents are vege-
troit, and two sons, Charles andltable Plates- You can blend fla-

washed in a washing machine with
a non-precipitating water softener.

Water for this should be not
warmer than if you were washing
off the plastics with a cloth. To
your tub, add % to 1 cup of the
softener. Allow the curtains to
soak until the spots dissolve, or,
at least, soften. Brush off with
:loth or a very soft brush.

Plastic materials should not be
:pun dry or wrung in the usual
!ashion. Shake them out as much

as possible on taking from the tub,
then hang on a line to drip dry.

Pressing plastics is much open
to question. If you want to press,
set the iron at the lowest possible
emperature.

Vegetable Plates
an Catch the Eye

WHAT A wonderful outlet for
•

Warren, and three grandchil-
dren.

A birthday party was held re-
cently in the Herbert Bartle
home, honoring- Mrs. Harlem
Nichol, Eoy Wagg1, Sr., and Roy
Wagg, Jr., who have birthdays

vors, colors and textures as hap-
pily as an artistic and serve your
family a good bit of nutrition, too!

Here's a combination with which
you can start: delicate golden
corn pudding baked in crisp, sweet
green peppers,, sauteed eggplant
slices with creamy - rich mush-

take a new Plymouth for a trial drive

give it a real workout on the road.

then tell US which of Plymouth's beautiful new models you prefer

and how you'd like to pay. Our deal will be easy on your pocketbookl

Plymouth's solid value is an established
fact! For example, there are more
Flymouths used as taxicabs than all other
standard-built cars combined.

Plymouth

headquarters for value

PDC

Robideau Motor Sales

January. Those present were:!room sauce and buttered carrots
Mr. and Mrs. Harlem Nichol and) to complete the treat:
Alan, Mrs. Frank Nichol, Mr.
and Mrs. Wayne Nichol and
Kathy, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Wagg
and Roy, Jr., Mrs. Bob Alexan-
der and Robbie. An oyster dinner
was served along with sand-
wiches, hamburgers, pickles,
cake, tea and coffee.

Mrs. B. H. Starmann reviewed
"Within These Borders" by John
S. Scotford for the program
Monday evening when the Pres-
byterian Guild met with Mrs.
Frederick Pinney. Miss Agnes
Milligan conducted devotions.
New officers assumed their seeds and membranes from pep-
duties, including the new presi-
dent, Mrs. Frederick Auten. As-
sistant hostesses were Mrs.
Leonard Smith, Mrs. Richard
Darmody and Mrs. Harry Little.
Thirty-four attended the meet-
ing. The February meeting will
be held with Mrs. B. H. Star-
mann. The retiring president,
Mrs. Lewis Bishop, and the. new
president, Mrs. Frederick Auten,
poured when refreshments were
servd.

PHONE 267 CASS CITY

PLEASANT HOME HOSPITAL
Bom Jan. 18, to Mr. and Mrs.

Morris Meredith of Snover, a
daughter. Other patients in the
•hospital Wednesday forenoon in-
cluded: Mrs. Harold Benkelrnan.
Kathy Mark, Mrs. Arthur Kuhl.
Linda Fuester of Cass City; Mrs,
Ralph Metiva of Fairgrove; Mrs.
Mabel Davis and Mrs. Harold
Phelps of Sandusky; Mrs. John
Kritzman and Mrs. Milton Han-
sing of Tyre; LeRoy Blasius and
Mrs. Claire Berry of Caro; Mrs.
Wm. D'Arcy of Kingston, and
Lucille Jops of Vassar.

Recently discharged were:
Mrs. Carlos Vader of Romulus;
Mrs. Robert Mitchell of Garden
City; Theron Bush of Unionville,;!
Mrs. Geraldine Smith and Mrs.
Wm. Elsholz of Sandusky; Mrs.
Earl Hurd, Mrs. Walter Lubac-
zewski and baby of Gagetown;
Gary McMann of Marlette; Mrs.
Curtis Hunt, Becky Champion,
David Barnes, Constant Adam-
czyk of Cass City; Fred Warren
df Kingston; Roy Romaine of
Saro, and Mrs. Joseph Pastor
id F'rank Martin of Vassar.

Corn Pudding Peppers
(Serves 4)

4 medium green peppers
1 egg
1 cup evaporated milk
1 cup canned, whole kernel

corn, drained
2 tablespoons minced onion
2 tablespoons minced green

pepper
1 teaspoon salt

Few grains black pepper
Select uniform peppers. Wash

thoroughly and cut off tops. Dis-
card stems and mince remaining
top slices for pudding. Remove

per cups. Beat egg with fork, add
milk, corn, onion, minced pepper,
salt and pepper. Blend thoroughly
and pour into pepper cups. Place
in a small, deep baking dish with

cup boiling water at the bottom.
Cover and bake in a moderate
(350°F.) oven until pudding is set,
about 35 minutes.

Eggplant Saute,
Mushroom Sauce

(Serves 4)
1 small eggplant
1 pint mushrooms
3 tablespoons butter
2 tablespoons flour

y->. teaspoon salt
1 cup boiling water
1 cup evaporated milk
4 slices toast

Peel eggplant, cut in thick slices.
Place in pan of cold water to
cover, to which 1 tablespoon of
salt is added. Let soak for one
hour. Drain eggplant, then coat
slices with flour and brown slowly
on each side in hot fat. While
eggplant is browning, wash, slice
and cook mushrooms, sliced, in
butter for about 10 minutes. Sprin-
kle mushrooms with flour and salt;
stir to blend. Add boiling water
md cook until thickened. Add milk
md cook until thickened. Place
slices of eggplant on toast and
cover with sauce.

FAMILY ON DECLINE
Some folks who trace their an-

cestry back usually find that the
family has been descending for
years.

The secret of success remains
a secret to many people.

A marriage application was
received this week at the Tus-
cola County Clerk's office in
Caro for Richard Jay Fisher, 20
of Vassar and Janet Ethel
Thompson, 16, of Vassar. .

Marriage licenses Were
granted to the following:

Lyle J. Burns, 19, of Milling-
ton and Beulah Grace Hunt 18
of Millington. '

Emil J. Richter, 32, of King-
ston and Velma Aileen Hackel,
28, of Kingston.

Donald Edward Kaatz, 18, of
Sebewaing and Jeanne Mae
Field, 18, of Deford.

Clarence Edward Milliken, 23,
of Vassar and Jane Mary
Hauger, 19, of Vassar.

CASS CITY HOSPITAL
Born Jan. 15, to Mr. and Mrs

Henry Sherman of Kingston, a
daughter, .Shirley Ann. Mother
and baby and the following other
patients were recently dis-
charged: Mrs. Melvin Whittaker
and baby, Hugh Connolly, Mrs
Frank Nagy, Mrs. Dean Rabi-
deau of Cass City; Mrs. Orville
Brown of Sebewaing; Mrs.
Catherine Landing of Deford,
and Mrs. Frances Walker of
Ubly.

Patients in the hospital
Wednesday forenoon included:
Harry Wise, Otto Prieskorn,
Mrs. Bertha Kilbourn and Stan-
ley Anker of Cass City; Wm.
Braddock of Midland; Mrs. Lois
Howard and Francis Hernandez
of Owendale; John Cleland of
Tyre; Mrs. Jennie Brown of
Ubly, and Baby girl Zyrowski of
Kingston.

RESCUE
Milton Mellendorf of Royal

Oak spent Friday with relatives
around Rescue.

Mrs. Elwood Creguer and
children, Christine, Norreen and
Lee, from east of Filion spent
Wednesday visiting at the
homes of her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Thomas Quinn, ,Sr., brother
and wife, Mr. and Mrs. Thomas
Quinn, Jr., and sister and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Norris E.
Mellendorf.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Caryl of
St. Clair visited at the home of
her mother, Mrs. Charles Cum-
mings, and brother, Earl, and
other relatives from Thursday
until Sunday.

James Sting, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Ottomar Sting of Grant,
has volunteered for service in
the array and will leave on Mon-
day, January 25, with seven
other young men from Bad Axe
who have been inducted in the
armed services.

Richard ' McDonald, who is
employed in Pontiac, spent the
week end at his farm home in
Grant.

Remember church services at
the Grant Methodist Church
every Sunday. Sunday School at
10:30 with, Martin Moore as
superintendent and preaching
service at 11:30 with Rev. Em-
mett Cones conducting the ser-
vices. Youth Fellowship each
Sunday evening at 8 o'clock;
choir practice every other Mon-
day «evening under the supervi-
sion of Mrs. Clare Profit. The
Woman's Society of Christian
Service met last Thursday,
January 14.

Remember church services at
the Canboro Latter Day Saint
Church every Sunday. Sunday
School at 10 o'clock with Clay-
ton Gemmell as the superintend-
ent. Preaching services at 11
o'clock and 8 o'clock with, Elder
John Abbe conducting the ser-
vices. Midweek prayer meeting
on Wednesday evening at .eight
o'clock.

Gary and Glen Mellendorf,
twin sons of Mrs. Stanley B.
Mellendorf, are recovering
nicely from recently having their
tonsils removed.
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C. L. Thompson.
Guest evangelist at a series of

meetings at the Mizpah United
Missionary Church on M-53 will
be Rev. C. L. Thompson of Hazel
Green, Ky.

The meetings are scheduled to
start Monday, Jan. 25. .

Rev. Thompson, a former coal
mine operator, will present illus-
trations from his varied experi-
ences.

Winter 4-H Clubs

Several winter 4-H clubs in
Tuscola County are conducting
their community or. school pro-
grams, notes George C. Mac-
Queen, county 4-H club agent.
The following clubs have sub-
mitted their enrollments and
several others are organized and
have enrollments due in the 4-H
office: Reese Busy Fingers;
North Grove Cloth anjl Wood;
Akron Community; Box Alder,
Caro; Columbia Corners, Union-
ville; Connor Junior Farmers,
Caro; Gilford Community 4-H;
Dayton Clover, Mayville; Dia-
mond Willing Workers, Milling-
ton; Gagetown School; Happy-
Go-Lucky, Caro; Jolly 4-H'ers,
Millington; Kingston 4-H Work-
ers; Lewis 4-H Club, Caro;
Mitchell Porkers, Akron; Mitch-
ell School, Reese; Needle and
Nail, Caro; North Vassar; No-
vesta Community; Progressive
Four, Vassar; Reese Four-Leaf
Clover;- Richville Community;
St. Agatha's, Gagetown; Van
Petten, Reese; Watertown-Dun-
can; West Elkland; West May-
ville; Wisner; Wonder Workers,
Unionville; Taggett's- Corners;
Ellington .School; Graham and
Kingston Saw and Solder.

During the last week 4-H trac-
tor clubs were organized at Vas-
sar, Reese, Caro and Cass City,
with Unionville slated to or-
ganize soon. Clayton Uhl at Mil-
lington is working on such a club
for Millington and Mayville
boys. Other 4-H clubs are or-
ganized at Fairgrove school,
Thane school, in Unionville, Ak-
ron-Santee, and Hinkley school
district. These clubs will proceed
until March 15. Then they will
be instructed on spring achieve-
ment activities.

Georg-e Gruba Dies
After Long- Illness

Mr. George Gruba died at
Pleasant Home Hospital Sunday
night, January 17, where he
had been a patient one day. He
had been in ill health the past
year and a half.

Mr. Gruba was bom in Po-
land, April 23, 189S, the son of
the late Mr. and Mrs. Andrew
Gruba.

He came to Detroit from Po-
land in 1928. He .was united in
marriage to Miss Blanche Pluta
in Tourist Falls, Massachusetts,
in June of 1937. They came to
this vicinity and settled on a farm
in Novesta Township three and a
half years ago where he has lived
until his death.

He leaves his wife; two
daughters, Miss Stella Gruba and
Miss Josephine Gruba of Poland;
two sons, Mr. Joseph Gruba and
Mr. Stanley Gruba, of Poland, by
a previous marriage; one sister,
Mrs. Josephine Resinick of Brods-
ville, Oklahoma, two stepdaugh-
ters, Mrs. Paul Soika and Mrs.
Raymond Sevryn, and one step-
son, Mr. Wallace Pluta, all of De-
troit.

He was taken from Little's
Funeral Homej Cass City, -.to the
Risko Funeral Home in Detroit
on Monday, where funeral ser-
vices will be held today (Friday)
in the Polish, National Church and
burial will be in Woodmere
Cemetery.

WHY WORRY?
Some of the people who pro-

fess no religion at all worry a
lot about the brand others have
adopted.

SHORT-LIVED
If all the New Year's resolu-

tions were laid end to end they
wouldn't reach to the first of
February.

IMPROVES JUDGMENT
Statistics show that fewer

college girls marry—proof that
higher education improves their
judgment.

ORDER FOR PUBLICATION.
Annual Account.

State of Michigan, The Probate Court
for the County of Tuscola.

In the Matter of the Estate of Robert
A. McNamee, Deceased.

At a session of said Court, held on
January 5th, 1954.

Present, Honorable Almon C. Pierce,
Judge of Probate.

Notice is Hereby Given, That the peti-
tion of Robert L. McNamee, the Trustee
of said estate, praying that his annual
account be allowed will be heard at the
Probate Court on February 5th, 1954, at
ten a. m.

It is Ordered, That notice thereof be
given by publication of a copy hereof for
three weeks consecutively previous to
said day of hearing, in the Cass City
Chronicle, and that the petitioner cause
a copy of this notice to be served upon
each known party in interest at his last
known address by registered mail, return
receipt demanded, at least fourteen (14)
days prior to such heari-ng, or by per-
sonal service at least five (5) days prior
to such hearing.

ALMON C. PIERCE,
Judge of Probate.

A true copy:
Beatrice P. Berry, Register of Probate.

1-15-3

TWE WAPPVMEATER

Sinclair Petroleum Products

ANNUAL

CONCERT
Presented By

Cass City High School Band

JANUARY 28th
8:00 P. M.

ADMISSION FREE
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Farm. Population ,
Decline Challenge

So 4-H Clubbers :

Told at Chicago
Members, of 4-H Clubs from all

over the nation .gathered in 'Chi-
cago recently for the 32nd National
4-H Club..-Congress. The meeting
was a'time of tribute to the 16 mil-
lion other farm boys and girls v/ho
have participated in the 4-H Club
program since it began 40 years
ago. It" was also the moment of
.recognition for state.and district
winners in 4-H. programs through-
out the nation.

Secretary of Agriculture Ezra
Taft Benson was among those who
outlined the great challenges
facing rural youth and the 4-H Club
organization, which • draws more
than two million young Americans
into its membership each year.

Mr. Benson told the 4-H Congress
that the farmer to today, and of

Big cake, 4-H Club members
and ten fingers mark 10th Anni-
versary of soil-saving club proj-
ect. About H.% million acres of
farm soil were saved by 4-H
Club members in last decade
through good conservation
practices.

tomorrow, faces a rapidly expand-
ing domestic demand for food and
fiber, a demand ^hat will be me
only if our agricultural program
.k-ieps step with our growing nation-
al population.

This is an important point, since
our national population has growr
from 132 million in 1946 to 160 mil
lion today, with the possibility o:
200 million or more by 1975.

In contrast, the number of per
sons actually engaged in farming
is steadily declining. In a shor
time, fewer farmers will be called
upon to fulfill the agricultura
needs of nearly twice as many
people as there were in the nation
in 1900, when we were much more
an agricultural nation than we are
today.

Tomorrow's farmer, 4-H Club
bers were told, will have to obtair
greatly expanded production from
approximately the same number
of acres now in use.

Care of Galvanized
Roofs Will Pay Well

Galvanized roofs will look better,
last longer, if they are painted and
kept weather-tight.

If your metal roof is in need of
repair, or will need repairs soon,
make some fair weather plans now
to recondition correctly and you'll
save money in the long run.

Galvanized surfaces, of course,
should not be painted until they
have weathered several months to
one year. Metallic zinc is the best
of various paints used to check
rust and two coats will renew the
zinc coating carried by ordinary
galvanized sheets. A single coat
over rust will last several years.

In reconditioning an old roof, re-
nail the sheets with 1% to 2-inch
screw type nails, spaced about
eight inches apart on the side laps
and five inches apart on the ends.
Before painting, remove loose rust
with a stiff broom or wire brush, if
rust coat is heavy. Surfaces to be
painted should also be free of dust,
dirt, grease and oil. Turpentine or
mineral spirits are both excellent
for removing grease or oil.

Spray painting will save both
time and labor.

Benson Explains
Farm Program

By Ezra Taft Benson
Secretary of Agriculture

The farm prog-ram submitted
o Congress this week by Presi-
ent- Eisenhower requires only a
flinimum amount of new legisla-
ion and is designed to maintain
gricultural income at high
svels.
This plan, product of the most

omprehensive study , of the
American farm problem in all
listory, embodies, these major
ecommendations:

1. That the bipartisan' Farm
Acts of 194-8 and 1949 become ef-
ective-as now scheduled with
he 1955 crops.

2. That not to exceed $2.5 bil-
ion worth of surpluses acquired
37 the Government under the
aresent program be withdrawn
Tom the market and placed in a
special reserve stockpile.

3. That Commodity Credit
Corporation's borrowing author-
ty be increased by $1.75 billion—

from $6.75 billion to $8.5 billion-
o permit continuation of price
support operations on basic com-

modities at 90 per cent of parity
through 1954, as existing legisla-
;ion requires. •-

In urging that flexible price
supports become operative on
3asic commodities in 1955, the
President emphasized the neecl
for balancing production of vari-
ous crops with changing demands
Price supports, ranging between
75 and 90 per cent of parity
would vary from year to year in
accordance with the actions ^ of
farmers themselves in' gearing
production to annual require-
ments.

Although this program was en-
acted by. overwhelming majorities
of both parties in Congress, itr
effective date was postponed b}
continuation of .mandatory^price
supports on basic commodities a
90 per cent of parity througr
1954. In developing the'new farrr
program, it was recognized tha
it would have little change of
success if it had to carry th
initial handicap of a $6 billior
stockpile accumulated undei
prior operations. The depressing
effect of these surpluses upor
free market prices has been ir
evidence for two years.

The parity ratio—the yardstod?
which measures the relationship
between prices received by th
farmer and those which he pay;
for goods and services—ha<
tumbled from 113 at the peak o
the Korean War in 1951 to 94
when the new administration took
office in January of 1953. Today
it is 91, although it has averaged
about 93 during the year.

To facilitate the transition to
the new program and, at the
same time, strengthen agricul-
tural commodity prices in the
market place, the President has
recommended that up to $2.5 bil-
lion worth of Government-owned
surplus farm goods be placed in
a special reserve to be used for
war emergencies, famine relief,
foreign aid, school lunch pro-
grams, charitable undertakings
and disposal through newly de-
veloped commercial channels.

Sizeable quantities of wheat,
cotton, vegetable oils and, possi-
bly, dairy products would be
"frozen" under this plan and thus
reduce the annual carry-over for
at least the first year to near
normal. These items could at no
time be disposed of in such a
manner as to interfere with regu-

WANT AD RATES
Want ad of 20 words or less, 40 cents

ach insertion; additional •words, 2 cents
:ach. Orders by mail should be accom-
>anied by cash or postage stamps. Rates
or display want ad on application.

' AM NOW doing general sewing
and altering. Would appreciate
your patronage. Mrs. Lee Har-
tel, 6353 Garfield, Cass City.
1-15-2

FOR SALE—80 acre farm with
buildings, mostly pasture with
creek running through, $500
down, balance easy terms. Also
1940 Chevrolet, panel. Wayne
Spencer, 3 east, 1% south of
Cass City. ' 1-15-2*

KEYS! Any kind at Bulen
Motors, Cass City, Mich. 1-8-tf

FOR RENT—Single sleeping
room. Mrs. Severn, 4391 S.
Seeger, C'ass City. Phone 12.
1-8-tf

FOUND—Black cocker pup, 6-8
weeks old, corner Houghton and
Oak Street. Inquire Dr. Cran-
delFs office, Cass City. 1-22-1

RITE-WAY • BROILER MASH.
An economical mash highly for-
tified and formulated to produce
fast gain and fast feathering to
bring birds to market in'the
least possible time. Extra forti-
fied with Vitamelk; a multiple
fortifier for better poultry nu-
trition. Available at your Wal-
lace & Morley Elevators.
1-15-6

PHOTO FINISHING—Fast ser-
vice, hi-gloss finish. Service,
quality and fair price. Enlarge-
ments made from your nega-
tives. Pictures copied if no nega-
tive. Neitzel Studio, Cass City.
10-20-tf

RITE-WAY 34% POULTRY con-
centrate. By using our 34% Poul-
try Concentrate mixed with home
grown grains, poultry raisers
will obtain excellent results with
their laying flocks. Contains all
necessary Amino Acids, Vita-
mins, Antibiotics ,and Trace
Minerals. Extra fortified wfth
Vitamelk; a multiple Vitamin
Fortifier. Available at your
Wallace & Morley Elevators.
1-15-6

DOWNS CHICKS hatching week-
ly. U. S. Certified White Leg-
horns, U. S. Approved New
Hampshires, Barred Rocks and
White Rocks for egg production.
Broiler strains of New Hamp-
shires, White Rocks and White
Americans. All chicks U. S. Pul-
lorum clean. Phone your orders

We Sell and Service
Titan Chain Saws

ASK FOR DEMONSTRATION.

LUMBER AND TIMBER CUT
TO YOUR SPECIFICATIONS.

Standing Timber and Logs
Bought. We Pay More.

B. & L. Lumber Co.
Robinson & Hadley Roads

Cass City, Michigan
Phone Cass City 217F2

9-4-tf

CUSTOM BUTCHERING—Mon-
days, Tuesdays and Wednesdays.
No appointment necessary. Cut
and wrap meat for deep
freezers. Smoking and curing
meat. Hillaker-Laber, 1% miles
south of Cass City. Phone
109F12. 10-16-tf

to Mrs. Fred Emigh,
154F21.

Cass City
1-15-8

NOW IS THE TIME to think
about your next fall's flock of
pullets. Try the Neuhauser
Hatcheries. All pullets guaran-
teed to lay, dead or alive. See
Francis Sowden for your order.
Cass City, R 1. 1-22-2*

FOR SALE—3 registered Angus
cows with calves by side; 12
head Angus feeder cattle. 1
south, 4x/4 east of Argyle. El-
mer Phillips. 1-22-2*

SEPTIC TANKS and cesspools
cleaned. Also ready built ce-
ment septic tanks or can pour
them at your home. Phone Caro
92913. Lloyd Trisch, 5 miles
northeast of Caro on Colwood
Road. 9-18-tf

Marvel Mystery Oil

Protect the vital heat zone of
car, truck or tractor motor at the
critical warm-up period with

MARVEL MYSTERY OIL,

the perfect fuel additive.
MARVEL MYSTERY OIL is
high film strength oil and flows
freely at 70 degrees. Easier start-
ing, save repair bills. MARVEL
MYSTERY OIL keeps new
motors new longer, used motori
in use longer.

Cass City Auto Parts
1-15-2

EGG PROTECTORS

There is little danger of damage
to eggs in incubator trays when the
trays are filled, but if eggs arf
removed for any reason, perhaps
after fertility tests, vacant space?
might cause eggs to roll and break
Wads of paper are often used tc
keep eggs close together, but the
w o o d e n follower blocks showr
above are much neater and may be
used indefinitely. Blocks have
finger holes as shown and smal
nails in each corner which engagt
the wire bottoms of the tray.

If you can't be great you can
be reliable—which is greater.

lar domestic
operations.

The existing

and foreign trade

authority for
support and purchase programs
on such commodities as oats, bar-
ley, grain sorghums, soybeans,
flax, meats, poultry and
dairy products and fresh

eggs,
fruits

and vegetables would be virtually
unchanged under the proposed
plan Potatoes would become
eligible for aid on the same basis
as other vegetable crops.

Price supports on five of the
basic commiodities — wheat, corn,
cotton, peanuts and rice— would
range between 75 and 90 per cent
of parity, depending on tbe sup-
ply from year to year. It was
recommended by the President
that the modernized parity for-
mula, now scheduled to become
effective January 1, 1956, be ap-
plied to four of these crops at
that time. It is already effective
on rice, tobacco and non-basic
commodities.

This modernized parity is based
upon the price relationships of
the various commodities to one
another over the past 10 years
It brings the old 1909-14 formula
up to date.

The President further recom-
mended that legislative action be
taken to prevent a decline of
more than five per cent in any
one year, as a result of the
transition from the old to the
modernized parity on various
commiodities.

For tobacco, the present pro-
gram would be continued with
.price supports -at 90 per cent of
parity when marketing quotas are
in effect.

Continuation of the sugar
program in its present form is
recommended.

DEAD STOCK—Prompt removal.
Call Darling and Company Col-
lect 207, Cass City. 1-23-tf

WANTED—Painting and deco-
rating by experienced man. Call
or write 6693 Deckerville Rd.,
Decker, Michigan. Henry Hoff-
man. 1-22-4*

Honey and tung nuts would be
dropped from the^ list of com-
modities on which price supports
are mandatory. Future supports
would be at the discretion of the
Secretary of Agriculture, as is
now the case with most other
non-basic commodities.

A completely new program is
proposed for wool. Direct pay-
ments would be made to pro-
ducers to make up the difference
between the average price of
wool during the marketing sea-
son and 90 per cent of parity.

The special problems of the
operators of millions of small
farms, most of which receive lit-
tle or no direct benefits from
price support programs, are to be
made the subject of a broad
study recommended in the Presi-
dent's message.

At the same time, plans are
outlined for high level trade
missions and for a world confer-
ence on international trade
problems with a view of expand-
ing our exchange of agricultural
goods with other nations.

Lutheran Ladies'
Aid Names Mrs.
Miller President

Mrs. Clarence Miller was
named president of the Lutheran
Ladies' Aid Society at the Janu-
ary election. The Society met
last Friday afternoon at the
home of Mrs. Alvin Avery. Mrs.
Louis Bartz was co-hostess.

Other officers elected were:
vice-president, Mrs. Otto Neu;
secretary, Mrs. Olin Bouck, and
treasurer, Mrs. John Haire.

During the business meeting,
Mrs. Francis Butler was ac-
cepted as a new member.

The February meeting will be
at the home of Mrs. Olin Bouck,
with Mrs. Harold Deering as-
sisting.

REAL ESTATE

MODERN HOME in the country
4 rooms and bath; auto, ho
water heater; lots of cupboarc
space; double sink; tiled floor
2-car garage; home 5 years old
one acre land; full price $5500
TERMS.

CEMENT BLOCK building 40 ft
x 55 ft.; good heating plant
could be used for storage, bodj
re building or garage.

SIX-ROOM HOME; well located
built-in cupboards; hot wate
heater; large lot; could be made
into income property withou
too much effort. Price $4300
TERMS.

40 ACRES—5 room home; own
water system; large poultrj
house; only 1% off M-53. Thi
won't last long for $4500.

40 ACRES on M-53; 4 roon
home; hot water heater; owr
water system; oil furnace; nea
store; full price $5500.

40 ACRES—Good grade
gravel, samples taken.

80 ACRES—Large home; owr
water system; milk house; tw
barns; productive land. Price
to sell.

5 ACRES near Kingston; 5 roon
home; own water system; hi
roof bam. Price $3100. TERMS

200 ACRES on black top; 7 roon
modern home; 40 x 60 barn; 1
stanchions, room for more
shipping grade A milk; larg
poultry house; circular drive
sacrificing at $18,000. TERMS.

160 ACRES—Dairy farm; 5 roor
home; 40 ft. x 70 ft. barn; 3
stanchions; drinking cups;
silos; stream; timber; 2 mile
from village. Price $20,000
TERMS.

WE HAVE A LARGE selectio
of farms, homes; businesses.

B. A. Calka
United Farm Agency

Phone 126R4 6487 Main St.

1-15-1

APARTMENT FOR RENT. In-
quire Albee Hdwe. and Furni-
ture. Phone '266, Cass City.
1-22-tf

OR SALE— Taupe Frieze
davenport and chair, like new.
Three suits of men's underwear,
25% wool, worn very little.
4305 Doerr Rd. 1-22-1*

TOR SALE—1953 Royal Coach
trailer, 29 ft. Inquire Larry Mc-
Clorey, 6432 Garfield St., Cass
City. 1-15-2*

*V ANTED— Scrap metal, bat-
teries, junk cars. Pickup on
quantities. Call 173. Southside
Auto Parts, Cass City. 11-30-tf

RITE-WAY POULTRY develop-
er. An 18% Poultry Mash de-
signed to feed after the birds
have been taken off starter
mash. Extra fortified with Vita-
melk to build strong, healthy,
fully developed pullets. Contains
all known Vitamins, Minerals
and Antibiotics needed to de-
velop growing pullet flocks into-
good layers. Available at your
Wallace & Morley Elevators.
1-15-6

FOR SALE—First and second
cutting alfalfa hay; also wheat
straw. Inquire Mike Skoropada,
2 miles southwest of Elmwood
.Store on M-81. 1-22-2*

FOR SALE—Registered Polled
Hereford bull, 15 months old,
good one. John Innes, Snover,
Mich. 1-22-1*

Arnold Copeland
Farm and General

Auctioneering
Take advantage of our complete

auction service.

You can place the entire adminis-
tration of your auction in our
hands and we will make all ar-
rangements.

Phone 235R3 6293 W. Main St
Cass City

10-20-tf

ANDRUS CHICKS may now b(
ordered through me. For infor
mation and placing of order;
come to my home or send card
Authorized representative ot
Andrus Hatchery, Reese, Mich
Clifton Ferguson, Decker. 1-8-tf

FOR SALE—650 x 16 tire. Also,
750 x 16 tire, both like new.
Sell reasonable. Elton Willis, 1
west, first place south of Cass
City. . 1-22-1*

FOR SALE—New and used Mc-
Cullough chain saws. Gordon
Ferguson, Argyle. Phone Snover
3309. 1-22-3*

FOR SALE—3 pc. blue living
room suite, modern, very clean.
Mrs. Allen McDonald, 4270 S.
Seeger St., Cass City. 1-22-2*

BALED ALFALFA and clover
hay for sale. Frank Nagy, 3
miles west, 3% south and 1%
west of Cass City. 1-22-2*

FOR SALE—60 acre farm, lo-
cated in section 8, Brookfield
Twp., Huron Co., '2% miles west
of Owendale on black top road.
Must be sold to settle estate.
For further details, contact Ar-
thur Priebe, adm. Wm. Huffman
Estate, Pigeon, Mich. Phone
56R3. 1-8-3

FOR SALE—Refrigerator with
5-year-old motor. Baptist par-
sonage. 1 mile west of M-53,
first house south of Deckerville
Rd. 1-22-1*

RITE-WAY 20% EGG MASH. A
20% protein Egg Mash contain-
ing all necessary Amino Acids,
Vitamins, Trace Minerals and
Antibiotics required for a laying
flock to maintain a high level
of egg production. Extra forti-
fied with .. Vitamelk for better
poultry nutrition. Available at
your Wallace & Morley Eleva-
tors. 1-15-6

FOR RENT—240 acre dairy
farm with good milk base on
50-50 basis. Machinery and
cows furnished or partly fur-
nished. Write Box W. S., c/o
Chronicle Office, C'ass City.
1-22-2*

FOR SALE—Six Holsteir
heifers, 18 months old, ready for
service. Vincent Fritz, 2% east
of Owendale. 1-22-3*

Barn Test An

Aerovent

30 Days Free Trial

No Obligation

Pay Nothing Down

This Is A Trial Offer

Your chance to find out what
good ventilation can do for you.

In your barn, hog or poultry
house.

Stop in, pick up the system
yourself or send us the size of
your barn and number of ani-
mals, and we'll bring it out.

Satchell Sales and
Service

REAL ESTATE
HOME FOR SALE—Living room,
dinette, kitchen, two bedrooms
and full bath. Good location
Priced to sell with $500.00 down.

120 ACRES good land on hard top
road, good brick house, two car
garage, large barn. To settle es-
tate, this is priced to sell at $14,-
000.

WELDING SHOP, excellent loca-
tion in good town. Will be for
self in one year.

WANTED—80 acres more or les
with modern buildings. Cash
waiting.

WANTED—4 or 5 room house
with bath in $5,000 bracket.

180 ACRES highly productive
land, good seven-room house
with bath, barn has stanchions
and water cups for 23 cows. 50
acres wheat, 80 acres fall plow-
ed. Can be bought on easy terms

80 ACRES GOOD land, all level
good house and barn. Easy
terms.

ALMOST NEW six rooms and
bath, full basement, garage with
breezeway. Just a beautifu
home and the price is right.

NEW FOUR rooms and bath, 1
car garage, small barn, chicken
coop, on four acres close to
town. $4,500 full price.

100 ACRES, home has six room;
and bath, good barn, milk house
silo, price reduced to $7,500.

120 ACRES, idea-l dairy farm
modern home, good barn wit]
milking parlor for quick sale
$3,000 to handle.

James Colbert
BROKER

Cass City, Mich,
5-15-tf

Phone 9086

1-22-2

Caro

AT ORCHARD HILLS—Crisp
juicy apples for eating and cook-
ing. Also fresh sweet cider. R.
L. Hill, 7 miles southwest of
Caro on M-81. We close at 6:30
p. m. 10-30-tf.

IF YOU desire a word of encour-
agement and prayer, call Cass
City 203 and say "I need encour-
agement." 3-20-tf

SELF-SUSTAINING
Save your pennies and nickels

all your life and the dollars you
leave will take care of them-
selves.

ABILITY COUNTS
Happiness doesn't come from

having everything given to you—
but in the ability to get it.

Advertise it in the Chronicle.

FOR SALE—Buzz saw and frame
to fit any tractor. 3 west, %
south of Argyle. Victor Hyatt.
1-15-2*

FOR SALE—Pair of nurses white
shoes, size 6. Will do baby
sitting. Call 206R3, 6656 Third
St. 1-22-1

CUSTOM CHAIN SAW work,
$4.00 per hr. Stanley Morell,
Cass City, Mich. Phone 65F11.
1-22-1*

FOR SALE—12 ton of loose
Timothy hay in mow. 1 west,
2% south of Deford. James Mc-
Neil. 1-22-1*

Marlette Roofing
and Sheet Metal Co.

ROOFS APPLIED OR
REPAIRED

Ruberoid Tite-On Shingles, Built-
up roofs. Insulated Brick or As-
bestos siding. Metal decks and
eavestroughs.

Terms if desired.
Free estimates. Drop us a card or

call Marlette 139,

Max S. Patrick, Prop.
Marlette, Michigan

5-26-tf

FOR SALE— Leghorn hens,
alive $1.25; dressed 35c lb.;
oven dressed 40c. Will deliver.
1 west, 3 north of Cass City.
Harriet McDonald. 1-22-1*

SADDLERY—Wholesale and re-
tail. We guarantee to sell cheap-
er. We buy, sell, repair and
trade used saddles. The Shoe
Hospital, Cass City, Mich.
5-28-tf

WANTED—Farmers, before you
sell your hogs, see Dick Erl
Cass City Locker Packing Planl
We pay top market prices and
pick them up ourselves. Call
Cass City 280. 1-15-tf

FOR RENT — Two bedroom
apartment, nice kitchen, tiled
bath, living room, two bedrooms,
automatic oil furnace. Call
151R2 or see James Colbert.
1-15-tf

RITE-WAY CHICK STARTER.
A 20% protein mash containing
all necessary Vitamins and Min-
erals to promote fast starts for
chicks during first 8 weeks.
Extra fortified with Vitamelk to
assure extra growth and faster
start to produce a chicken of
good breeding and laying quali-
ties. Available at your Wallace

FOR RENT—House with 4 rooms
and bath. 2 south, 1 west, %
south of Cass City. Write 4963
Junction, Detroit, Mich. 1-22-2*

LOST—2 black white faced
heifers, 2 years old. Last seen in,
Ralph Loney's pasture. Milton
Fox, Snover, Mich: f 1-22-1*

FOR SALE — Three cows, 3.
years old, calf by side; also out-
side stairway. 1 % miles north
of Cass City. Henry Turner.
1-22-2*

& Morley Elevators. 1-15-6

FOR SALE—Several good used
inside and outside doors.. Sev-
eral good two-lite windows.
Two large front windows with
16-inch top. Secondhand Store,
Cass City. Phone 11R2. 1-22-1*

POULTRY WANTED — Drop
postal card to Stephen Dodge,
Cass City. Will call for any
amount at any time. Phone 259
or 146F15. 8-15-tf

FOUR LOTS FOR SALE—Two
lots of red raspberries and six
maple trees. Mrs. Clarence
Quick, 6432 Seventh St., Cass
City. Phone 123R2. 1-15-2*

REAL ESTATE

Home Bargain *

Home Bargain

7 room home with l1/^ bath-
rooms; good location; could
be converted into two apart-
ments; furnace; auto. elec. ,
hot water heater; storm-
windows and screens; two
separate entrances; garage.
Full price $6500. Down pay-
ment of $2500. Balance like
rent.

SEE, CALL OR WRITE

B. A. Calka
United. Farm Agency

Cass City,'Mich.

1-22-1

FOR SALE — 2-wheel utility
trailer in good condition. Good
tires and detachable rack.
Reasonable. R. L. Profit, 4135
S. Seeger. " 1-22-tf

SADDLERY—Wholesale and re-
tail. We guarantee to sell cheap-
er. We buy, sell, repair and
trade used saddles. The Shoe
Hospital, Cass City, Mich.
5-28-tf

NEEDED

JOURNEYMEN

Millwright, machine
repairmen and

toolmakers

APPLY

Pontiac Motors
Division

Employment Office
GLENWOOD AVE.

Pontiac, Mich.

12-4-tf

WANTED—Washing or ironing
or both in my home at 6656
Third St. Please help me with
your work. Telephone 206R3.
1-22-1

FOR SALE—Slab wood, $3.00 a
cord; block wood, $3.50 a cord.
Ronald VanAllen, phone 112F24.
1-8-tf.

FOR SALE
New and Used Farm

Machinery
1949 JOHN DEERE "A" with
power troll.

1950 JOHN DEERE "A."
OLIVER 66 and cultivator.
USED JOHN DEERE "AR,"
good rubber.

Cliff Ryan
John Deere Sales and Service

Cass City
6-24-tf

ENLIST NOW in the great army
of workers who have no com-
plaints to make about their
work shoes. They wear Wolver-
ine Shell Horsehides—enjoy
moccasin comfort while they
work—enjoy real work shoe
economy, too, because Wolver-
ines are so tough—gives lots
more wear for every dime of
cost. Try 'em1 on at Hulien's,
the Home of Fine Shoes and
Clothing, Cass City. 1-22-1

ARE YOU HAVING poultry di-
sease troubles? Ask your Wal-
lace & Morley Elevator manager
to have our Poultry Disease
Consultant check your flock.
Trained and experienced in cur-
ing poultry diseases. An extra
free service provided by your
Wallace & Morley Elevators.
1-15-6

POULTRY WANTED — Call
Louis Molnar, Deford, Mich,
Phone Cass City 144F21. Get
our price before you sell your
flock. 7-24-tf

HAY FOR SALE—Timothy and
alfalfa mixed, first cutting,
good color, 45c per bale. 3%
north of Shabbona. Wilford
Caister. 1-22-2*

RITE-WAY MEDICATED chick
starter. A 20% protein mash
containing all necessary
mins and Minerals to
fast starts for chicks.

Vita-
promote
Plus the

proper level of medication as a
preventative against Coccidio-
sis. Extra fortified with Vita-
melk to assure extra growth and
faster starts for chicks during
first 8 weeks. Available at your
Wallace & Morley Elevators.
1-15-6

ATLAS FIELD tested baler
twine. Fully guaranteed, $9.00
per bale. Emory Lounsbury,
phone 98F14, Cass City. 1-22-tf

APPLES — Mclntosh, Northern
Spy, Double Red Delicious,
Jonathan and Wagener. Fresh
sweet cider. Wellemeyer Or-
chards, 2% north of Vassar.
12-4-tf

GET YOUR HURON County
Hatchery chicks at Elkland
Roller Mills. U. S. Approved,
U. S. Pullorum Passed. 1-22-tf

WE WILL MAKE your old fur-
niture new again. Bring back
its former charm, its old com-
fort. It. will be completely re-
built by skilled workmen. For
the latest and finest in up-
holstering fabrics, see Hutchin-
son's Upholstering Shop, Cass
City. Phone 333. 12-18-tf

For Sale At

Dealer Cost

Ford overhead valve 6-cylinder
industrial engine. Also 6-cylinder
conversion kit for model BN
Ford tractor. Save $500 by mak-
ing your own conversion.

Call 14R2

Larry Roberts
1-22-2*

CUSTOM .SLAUGHTERING! We
do custom slaughtering Monday,
Tuesday, Wednesday. No ap-
pointment necessary. We also
cut and wrap meat for deep
freeze. Gross and Maier. Phone

_b' 6-20-tf

TIRES—Tractors, truck, cars and
farm< equipment, new and used.
All sizes. The H. 0. Paul Co
6-30-tf

WANTED—Full time girl for
general housework and to act
as hostess. Phone 224, Cass
City. ..

CAMERAS ABE our business
Stop in and" let's get acquainted'.
You name the camera and we'll
get it. Argus, Ansco, Baldix,
Kodak, Liecas, etc. Neitzel
Studio and Camera Shop, Cass
City.

FOR RENT — Two"
basement house. Call
Cass City.

9-4-tf
•— "•• «

bedroom
102F12,
1-22-1*

FOR SALE—Norge refrigerator.
No reasonable offer refttsed.
May be seen at McConkey
Jewelry and Gift Shop, Cass
City. 1-15-2

INSURANCE
OF ALL KINDS

HOME
FARM

AUTOMOBILE
FIRE

LIABILITY
LIFE

Arnold Copeland
P6h-15!tf5RB 6293 W' Main St'

FOR SALE-80 acre farm, 6%
east of Sebewaing, Section 8,
Brookfield Twp. 2 new silos
70x80 barn, 25 new stanchions.
Equipped for sending inspected
milk, 2000-gal. gas tanks and
pumps. Modern house and good
outbuildings. Running water in
all buildings. One of the most
modern homes in Huron County.
Terms will be given. Inquire
Arnold Copeland, telephone
235R3, Cass City 1-22-1*

THANKS FOR ALL Christmas
gifts and candy. Your Saginaw
News boy, Bob McComb. 1-22-1

I WISH TO thank the Fire De-
partment and the people who
were so kind at the time of my
accident. Keith Lowe; 1-22-1*

WE WISH TO thank the Kings-
ton Fire Department, neighbors
and all who were so kind to us
in many ways when we lost our
barn by fire. May God richly
bless you all. Mr. and Mrs. Leigh
Wilson. 1-22-1*

I WISH TO thank my friends in
Cass City who so kindly re-
membered me during my stay in
the hospital, also Dr. Donahue,
Mrs. Freeman and her staff for
their splendid care. Theron
Bush. 1-22-1*

I DO TRUCKING to Marlette
Mondays and Caro on Tuesdays.
Roy Newsome, 1% east of De-
ford, phone 320F22. 1-15-3*

WE EXTEND our deep appreci-
ation to everyone who in any
way expressed their sympathy
during our recent bereavement
in the loss of our husband and
father. Mrs. Fred Milligan and
family. 1-22-1*
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Extension Heads to
Study Insurance

Leaders of home demonstra-
tion '.groups in Tuscola County
•will meet to study insurance
inext Thursday and Friday, Jan-

27 and 28. The meetings
be held at 10:00 o'clock at $*°** present,,, _ _,. Shoemaker.
courthouse in Caro. Miss

JLfteille Ketchum, extension spe-|
"Sialist in home management,
'Michigan State College, will
'talk- with the group about the

e of Jdifferent kinds of

ia 'families* security programs.
'3*he discussion will

ground insurance related to the
fiome and the family ear. Topics

•the total insurance program, the!
?amount of fire
<<earry on the home, other kinds;
«&t protection for the home,

OFFICIAL PROCEEDINGS

Tuscola County Board of Supervisors
OCTOBER SESSION 1953

Regular October .session of the Tus-
:ola County Board of Supervisors be-
gun and held in the. Count House,
October lath, 1953.

Meeting called ito order by Chair-
man, Grower Laurie, with all Super-

exeept Supervisor

Regular order of business taken up.
Clerk read oomuinication from the

East Michigan Tourist Association,
requesting an appropriation of $250.00
for the ensuing year. Also requesting
the Board to appoint a representative
from the Board to represent Tuscola
county on their advisory council. Mo-1

tion made by Supervisor Baguley,
arid liability insurance supported by Supervisor Graham, .that

'this request be (referred to the Com-
mittee on Ways and Means for their

Center! reoom-mendaitlon. Motion carried.
Motion made> by Supervisor Muel-

ler,
ben , .........
Director be made a special order for

supported toy Supervisor VanPet-
ithat the election of a Walfare

<to fe© included will be planning]Thursday"^or«tMK>nT ^Motion carried.
Motion made by Supervisor Muel-

ler, supported by Supervisor Hicks,
tolthat we adjourn until 1:30. Motion

carried. '
AFTERNOON

a
near owner's liability for injury
resulting from an accident with]
Ms car, and the kind of protec-
tion that liability insurance pro-
•"vides for the car owner. Also to
€se 'discussed is comprehensive
personal liability insurance. This
Hcind of insurance provides
•valuable protection for the home
*<®wner. It is not so well-known as

other kinds of insurance.

••*

You'll be
'way ahead

SESSION
Meeting called to order by Chair-

man Laurie, with quorum present.
Supervisor Mueller, Chairman of

he Committee on Drains and Drain-
age, presented the following report:

Mr. Chairman, Hon. Board of Su-
pervisors, Gentlemen:

Your Committee to whom was re-
ferred the matter of overdrafts on
.•naetive drains and overdraft of Re-
volving Drain Fund, beg leave to re-
port and recommend the following:

Your committee having had this
matter under careful study and con-
sideration, (recommend that the over-
draft of the following named inactive
drains, and preiminary expense of
drains petitioned for but not yet es-
tablished, or turned down by the
Board of Determination and charged
to the Revolving Drain Fund, be paid
out of the .General Fund of the Coun-
ty:
Carson $ 319.43
Bad Shiawassee 7.4
Cass River 759.43
Flint River Cut Off 392.5

to leave your
cor at home

Flint River Trunk
Lynch

11.10
653.56

Your committee
mends ithat the sum of
from the General Fund to B. S. Brew-

& Sons, Owosso, Michigan, for en
gineering ordered by the Drainage
Board to "be done on White Creek No
2 Drain, which was .subsequentlj
found to be illegal.

Your committe also recomemnds i
any time any of the above name
drains become active, the Countj
Drain Commissioner shall assess sai"
drain or drains for the amount of the
overdraft paid out of (the Genera
Fund. All funds so assessed shall b
transferred to the General Fund o
the county.

On April 1, 1953, the Revolving
Fund was overdrawn $15,821.61 an"
on September 30, 1953, it was over-
drawn $20,982.51. Therefore, youi
Committee recomends that the sun
of $5,000 he transferred from the Gen
eral Fund to the Revolving Draii
Fund control.

All- of which is respectfully sub
mitted.

CONRAD MUELLER
EVARD RAWSON
EARL LINDSAY

Moved by Supervisor Dehmel, sup
panted by Supervisor Harmon, tha
the report be acteipted and the Recom
mendations carried out. Motion car
ried.

County Treasurer, Arthur Willits
appeared before the B'oard in regar<
to the Township Treasurer's Bond
Motion made by Supervisor Lindsay
supported by Supervisor Jones, tha
the treasurer be authorized to pur
chase a Blanket Bond for the sever:
Township' Treasurers ias in the pre-
vious year. Motion carried.

Supervisor James Kirk, Chairma:
of the Committee on County Tax, pr<
sented the following Report:

Mr. Chairman: Hon. Board of Su
pe'rvisors,

Your Committee on Taxation beg;
leave to submit the following report

Valuation County Ta
Afcron ^ 4 2,399,500 $17,996.2

a Greyhound
enjoy warm coaches, fre-

< «quent schedules, dependable
'service. You'll save money at
Greyhound's low fares. And—
you'll travel relaxed as you
avoid all winter weather worries!
look at these low fares

JPASS CITY TO:
One Round

.^Destination Way Trip
Detroit ................ 3.10 5.60

1.50 2.70
Oty .............. 1.90 3.45

-Cleveland ... ........... 6.95 12.55
Toledo .......... ,„ ..... 4.45 8.05
Mackinaw City .„ 7.35 13.25

(U. S. Tax Extra)
'Similar tow fares to anywhere In America!

MAC & SCOTTY DRUG STORE
City Phone 38R2

Aimer
Arbela . ..
Columbia .
Dayton . .
Denmark .
Elkland . .
Ellington .
Elmwood .
Fairgrove .
Fremont .
Gilford . .
Indianfields
Juniata . .
Kingston .
Koylton .
Millington .
Novesta . .
Tuscola . .
Vassai1 Twp
Water-town
Wells .
Wisner . ..
Vassar City

TOTAL

1,869,760
1,061,800
2,262,800
1,186,300
3,044,800
3,860,860

818,415
1,584,200
2,315,250
1,548,250
1,784,400

.6,441,043
1,227,600
1,225,840
1,018,650
2,102,250
1,099,800
1,978,850

628,550
1,154,279

786,120
916,950

3,420,149

14,023.2
7,963.5

16,971.0
8,897.2

22,836.0
28,956.4
6,138.1

11,881.5
17,364.3
11,611.87
13,383.00
48,307.82
9,207.00
9,193.80
7,639.87

Your Committee on Ways and
/leans .reported as followsaooc... _ . .
,leans recommend that an approprra-
km of $250.00 be made to Eastern
Michigan Tourist ssociation for year
954 a.nd that the Chairman of this
oard appoint a committee of three

o attend the annual meeting at Bay
ity, Thursday, October 15.

LESTER JONES
NICHOLAS VANPETTEN
HENDERSON GRAHAM

Motion made by Supervisor Mueller,
up ported by Supervisor Mclnityre,
hat the .report be accepted and adop-
"^ Yea and Nay vote taken of

there were (Yes-23) (Nay-4)
absent-1). Motion declared carried
y Chairman Laurie.
Moved by Supervisor Slafter, sup-:

orted by Supervisor Hicks that Su-
'ervisor .VanPetten be the Director to
epresent Tuscola County advisory
xmncil of the .East Michigan Tourist
Association. Motion carried. And,
upervisor Chairman Laurie appoint-
d Supervisor Mclnityre, Slafter, and
ames Kirk as a committee* to attend
ihe East Michigan Tourist Associa-
lon ait Bay City, October 15.

Moved by Supervisor VanPetten,
supported by Supervisor Kirk that we
Adjourn until 9:30 tomorrow. Motion'
carried. i

Signed:
FRED MATHEWS, County Clerk
GROVER LAURJE, Chairman

OCTOBER 13, 1953
Regular October Session of the Tus-

K»la County Board of Supervisors

leyr ifctat the report be accepted; amd
adopted.. Motion carried.

County Drain Commissioner Free-
land Sugden appeared before the
Board and .presented the annual re-
port as follows:

To- the Board of Supervisors- of thejLamphere
County of Tus-colar Gentlemen:

In- compliance with the pro\
of Sec. XI of Cap.. II of Act No. 316,
of the Public Acts of 1923-, I have the
honor to subm'it
as County Drain

my annual report
Commissioner. of

said County -of Tuscola covering; the
period from the 1st day of October A.
D. 1952, to the 1st day of October A,
D. 1953.

I. The following named drains
were left unfinished at the date of
my last report, (or were found unfin-j
ished when I entered upon the duties
the duties of my office.)

Cass River (Inter Oowcityy,, tetog.
considered in Sagtauaw Federal
ect; Flint River (Inter Coumty),. be-
ing considered -in* Saginaw Fedieral
project; Roussch (Inter County), In-
junction; Che-boyganning Creek (Inter
County), awaiting new petition; Mar-
ry, held up because of CheboyganniBg
Creek; Scott & Scott extension, under
construction;. Presten, completed:
Strevel, conaipteted; State & Colling,
under construettioini, Cuifets,. completed;
LaFave, conipleted;: Road District Ne.
11, under construction; VanGeiisen,
compleited; Battel, ready tor sate, (In-

:TISerry . .195.S
'an Geisen 195S
'ogt . .19.53
STe-rschky.. . 1953;

ter ' County) ^
struetion;.

r» * ^
r>£ bif"to order b

,« . ,
Al'1?03- Meeting under consitruction; Yax, completed

' "-Chairman Laurie!
called the roll with all isuper-isors responding

hoemaker.
Minutes of yesterday's session read

y Clerk and approved as read. Reg-
ilar order of business dispensed with
iind Chairman Laurie called upon Mr.
Lee A. Horton, representing' the iAd-
dressograph Sales Agency, who dis-
cussed the advantages to be gained
by the county in the purchase of an
addressograph.
. Motion made

tnei, supported

Tatntuadige,
Creek,.

under eon>
. _ OiKord, in-

junction; Butternut Creek, held up
for new petition; Columbian, under
construction; Sucker Creek, complet
ed; Bau«r Lwois, completed; Curry
completed; Constant DuRussell, (In
ter County) ready for sale; SquaM
Creek, Denmark, held up on account

Squaw Creek,. Gilford; Lamphere

Albertson, about ready for sale; Car-
son, completed as roadside ditch; El-

except Supervisorjlis, under construction; Gager, held
up; Krapf, to !be sold 10-9-53; Ains-
:worth, abo-ut ready for sale; Vogt, un
dar construction; Colling Road Br. o:
Kemp Drain, petition out; French
Road Br. of Kemp Drain, to be sold
•10-9-53; M-15, completed; Borody
chuck, under construction; Tattleville
awaiting report; Hoats, awaiting re
port; "Werschky, completed; Rether-
ford, completed; Allen, completed
Bader, completed; Caufield, complet
ed; Northwestern Gilford, completed
Terry, completed; Sumae, completed
King Extension, completed; Belgian

by Supervisor Deih-i
by Supervisor Gra-

ham, ithat this matter of the address-
ograph be turned over to the Commit-
tee on Building's and Grounds for fur-
ther study. Motion carried.

Regular order of business taken up.
Question -of auditing bills was
Bought up for discussion. Motion

made by Supervisor Dehmel, support-
„/, ^r O,, ------ J— -- -by Supervisor Jones, that
Ihairman appoint a committee of

three supervisors to act as an audit-
ing committee, fior this board, and no
bills -to be ipaid by the county with-
out the approval of said Committee.
Motion carried.

Moved by Kirk, supported by Tits-
worth, -that we adjourn until 1:30.
Motion carried.

AFTERNOON SESSION

under construction.
The followingIII. named drain

Meeting caled to order by Chairman
Laurie with quorum pre'sent.

Supervisor Henderson, Chairman of
the Committee on Health presented
the following anticipated budget
the Adult Mental Health Clinic
Saginaw, Michigan, as -follows:

Anticipated Income .for 1954

have been begun by" .me, during th<
year, and are- only partly completed
to-wit: Huron, (Inter County) Await
ing Engineer's report; Fessler, await
ing engineer's report; Stock, Boar<
of Determination 9-25-53, will then b
ready for R/~W's; Lockwood, awal
ing report; Irion, awaiting report
Hum'es, awaiting report; Haines
Brs., awaiting report; Hunter & Brs
awaiting report; Moore, awaiting
port; Enos, awaiting report; Go
ka, 40 per cent to be cleaned
out same time as Lockwood
Freeman, drainage board meeting,
24-53, (Inter County); Cox, board o
determination, 9-21-53; Boulton, boari
of determination 9-23-53; Black, boar
of determination 9-30-53; Trombka

of I new to be given to engineer for r«
of

Saginaw County
Bay County . . .
Midland County
Tuscola County
Fees ..........

$ 4,000.00 Name of Drain
3,000.00
1,500.00
1,500.00

600.00

$10,600.00TOTAL
BUDGET FOR 1954

January 1, 1954 - December 31, 1954
Annual Monthly

.$ 1,200.00 $100.00
. 5,740.00 478.33

60.00 * 5.00

1 Rent
2 Prof. 'Sal
3 Social Security
4 Telephone

Telegrams .
5 Insurance . ..
6 Office Supp. .
7 Postage .' ....
8 Contingency .
9 Conf. and Educ.

10 Subs. & Pub
11 Pro. Dues ..
1.2 Audit . ......
13 Medical and Psy-

cho 1. supp
14 New Equipt. ..
15 Rep & Replace.

580.00
500.00
400.0Q
150.00
300.00
350.00
250.00
150.00
150.00

250.00
120.00
120.00

48.33
41.
33.33
12.50
25.00
29.17
20.83
12.50
12.50

20.83
10.00
10.00

TOTAL
And also

$10,320.00
recommended an appro-

priation of $1,500.00 ito the clinic for
the year 1954. Motion made by Su-
pervisor Dehmel, supported by Super-
visor VanPetten, that the report be
accepted and adopted and the appro-
priation made is reoommendred. Yea
and Nay vote -taken O'f which there
were (Yes - 20) (Nay-0) (absent-5).
Motion declared carried by Chairman
Laurie.

Supervisor "Wilson, Chairman of the
Committeie on Buildings and Grounds

port 'Crawford, (Inter County) drain
age board meeting, 10-14-53.

Inactive Revolving Drain Funds

*—Year shows last

Balanc
Overdrafi

activity.

759.

392.5

Bad Shiawasses: Part of
Saginaw Valley Flood Con-
trol. Recommend transfer
from General Fund to -take
care of overdraft. 1938* $ 7.

Cass River: Part of Saginaw
Valley Flood Control. Rec-
ommend transfer from Gen-
eral fund to take care of
overdraft. 1944*

Flint River Cut Off: Part of
Saginaw Valley Flood Con-
trol. Recommend transfer
from General Fund ito itake
care of overdraft 1946*

Flint River Trunk: Pant of
Saginaw Valley Flood Con-
trol. Recommend transfer
from General Fund to 'take
care of overdraft. 1947*

Lynch: Inter county with La-
peer county. Stopped by in-
junction on Flint River,
pant of Saginaw Valley
Flood Control. Recommend
transfer from General Fund
-to rtake care of overdraft.

Pike: Branch of Allen Drain.
Recommend no action. 1943*

Shileds: Recommend no act-,
ion. Lack signer for legal
petit ion, estate involved

Soper: Branch of Allen
Drain. Recommend no act-
tion. 1948*

15.

204.501
204.50

iunter & Branches
iu-ron, .
rian . .
Crapf . .
./ockwood

Jauer Louis- ..
/[-15
doore .
'reston,
load Diat. No.
louseh .,
eott & Scott Ext.
quaw Or.,. Gilford,
•state & Colling 19-53,
treve-1 . 1953
ucker Creek . . — .. .1953,
tock 1953,

, 1963:

Yax .1953

12:.5>0
8.50

23.50
557.60

23.75
1,140.00

834.90
415,37
410.10

16.00
500.80
291.75
76-7.40

1,,245,75
780.02

9,404.78
469'.75

1,196.81
156.05

1,683.55
81.75

60S.21
2,480.73

2..00
419.65

Active Revolving FUmd-
Overdraft

Inactive Revolving Fundi
Overdo-aft

Less Control 20..000..00

Bal. O.D. of about 9-15-53 $20-,861.93
Note: Balances are of about Sept.

15, 1953. No running account was- con.-
-sidered while collecting information.

Because a sizeable overdraft has- re-
mained after tax credits for the past
six years (March 31, 1953, Overdraft
$15,821,61, September 30, 1953, over-
draft $20,982.51), I recommend ithe
control of the Revolving Fund be in-
creased by $5,000 making a total of
$25,00-0 available.

The Carson Drain has been con-
structed as a roadside ditch and no
further work will be done at this time.
I, therefore, ineco-monend a transfer
from the General Fund for $319.43 to
the Carson Revolving Drain Fund.

Because engineering was done on
White Creek No. 2 Drain on a peti-
tion that the. Drainage Board had no
jurisdiction, to act on, I recommend
the engineering cost of $605.68 ito E. S.
Brewer & Sons, be paid from the Gen-
eral Fund.

I respectfully submit all the above
for yowr ©ansside-ration.

Name of Drain Orders
ADAMS „

0-1-5-2 Balance 'overdrawn , $
.0-3.1-52. Receipt
2-23-52 Harold Volweiler excavating A5502 1,667.38
2-2S-52 Harold Vollweiler excavating A550S 1,667.38
-19-53 E. S. Brewer survey R2366 58.87
;,-25*-53 Tiransfer 1300
1-25^52 Transfer 1300
5-5-53 Transfer 1316
-3-53, Transfer 1335
:-7-53 Transfer 1346
>-3:-53 Transfer 1354

Credit Balance

$ 310.28
11.25

1,864,99
582.50
47.08

202.35
26.55
42.66

0-1-5-3 Balance Overdrawn

.0-1-52 Balance on h-and

.-6-53 E. S. Brewer, survey

AINSWORTH

R2353 577.2U

926.53

371.94

0-1-53 Balance overdrawn
ALBERTSON

0-1-52 Balance overdrawn
1-19-53 E. S. Brewer, survey R2409

10-1-53 Balance overdrawn ..

996.30

10-1-52 Balance overdrawn
S-25-53 Transfer 1300
-6-53 Transfer 1335

354.66
178.03

9-18-53
10-1-53

10-1-53 Balance overdrawn
ALDER CREEK TILE

10-1-50 Balance on hand
6-11-53 Frank Lester, fixing tile A5629
9-18-53 Ted Gilmore, fixing tile A5781
9-19-53 H. Legg, fixing tile , A5782
9-18-53 Kingston Fire Dept. fixing tileW A5783
9-18-53 Knight Drain Tile A5784

Transfer 1357
Balance on hand

ALLEN
10-1-52 Balance overdrawn
10-14-52 A. M. Hunter, survey R2301
11-3-52 J. Schmeltz, staking R2307
11-5-52 W. A. Forbes Co., stakes R2312
11-14-53 A. M. Hunter, eng R2321
11-15-52 Receipt 901
12-1-52 John Ruppal, share of drains 44 ft.

of 4 in. pipe R2326
12-1-52 L. Petiprin, staking R2327
12-1-52 W. A. Forbes Co., stakes R2329
12-2-52 Ben Czelda, tax ref A5436

Ben Czelda, tax ,ref A5437
Ben Czelda, tax ref A5438
L. Easlick, excavat A5453 22,326.61
L. Easlick, excavat A5454 4,997.40
L. Easlick, excavat A5455 4,997.40
L. Easlick, excavat A5456 4,997.40

12-2-52
12-2-52
12-2-52
12-2.-52
12-4-52
12-4-52

9.00
24.00

2.50
20.00
12.00

35.00
11.00
20.00
24.50

22.00
3.00

10.00
3.33
3.33
3.33

205.26

31.39

1,027.69

583.19

50.50

209.36

185.00

499.50

12-4-52 A. T. Barries Co., remove
12-4-52 A. T. Barnes Co., remov.
12-4-52 A. T. Barnes Co., remov.
12-5-52 Armco, pipe
12-5-52 Armco, pipe
12-5-52 J. Schmeltz, stak. .
12-5-52 Armco, pipe .., .
12-5-52 Armco, p_i-pe
12-5-52 Armco, pipe
12-5-52 Armco, pipe
12-17-52 Armco, pipe
12-17-52 Armco, pipe
12-17-52 Armco,, pipe
12-22-52 Receipt 1051
12-22-52 Receipt 1952
1-2-53 J. Schmeltz, stak. ..
1-2-53 L. Petiprin, stak. ...
1-2-53 W. A. Forbes, stakes
1-19-53 E. S. Brewer, survey
2-2-53 J. Schmeltz, stak.
1-6-53 J. Spencer, ref. tax
1-6-53 J. Spencer, ref. tax
1-6-53 J. Spencer, ref. tax
1-31-53 L. Easlick, excav.

L. Easlick, excav.
L. Easlick, excav.
L. Baslick, excav. .
L. Easlick, excav.
L. Easlick, excav.

1-31-53
1-31-53
1-31-53
1-31-53
1-31-53
"1-31-53

foot
foot

in pier
in pier
in pier

A5457
A5458
A5459
A5472
A5473
R2236
A5474
A5475
A5476
A5477
A5493 6,800.00
A5494 7,200.00
A5495 7,599.99

UNIQUE
THE MICHIGAN; TOUMST eotwcii,fm>NDED fH
1945,15 WE CNOf<DKaNfZATfON OF ITS K1H0»J
THE U.S. IT IS GZWOSSJ OF PRIVATE INOUSTftf
MEMBEfiS AND'fiEPRESEWSTlVES OF MlCHIGANS
FOUfi,NON-WOFl.p£G»ALT(XJRlST ASSOCIA-
TIONS. AH. SERVE WTO3OT EXPENSE ALLOWANCE

STATE AND ASSOCIATION: FUN0S INTO A UNIFIED
TOURIST PROMOTION PTOBW.

CJIYOPtRKS:
N0.>0mff, CM WISE NATION Hfl$«S W«Nf TREES
A$-DEH5Qm:.iis FOREST POPULATION INCLUDES
650;CX»mKS WHOSE VALUE IS ESTIMATED AT
*60,<X»;OCKtaNUALtY. THE CITY SPENDS ABOUT
*500,000' TQ! K£S? WEM- IK HEAtaiGftOttMS

•fatffBr
C^geic" HOW WTflE CREEK WAS NftMED:

6»E CftEfK WAS INCORPORATED M tS3*,KJTWA?
IWHBJi m 1825 Kf, A Vffl SMALL BATJlg B6IWSES TV0
MEMBSHSOFaSUftVEYING WRJY AND'W> (SDiaHS.THE
ffiWm &BENTH? KINGOUSTCD RW1WSKAB

SRM8LE FOft THE "miW CITWHAME

HICHWW SflreiY RBSTr
ALWAYS A LEADER, if* MQCEM.Hf8iaay
CONSTRUCTION: AND; SAFEW,.MI(»I;

UNE ON A HeHWAy,.!N:l«t,TaSLOl«
DOWN AND GUIDE" WARC ON W ,.
04NGEROU5 CURVr.MABQUETTEeQUNTft
ROAD COMMISS/ONEB 0ROOT> A WHITE
UNE PAINTED ON "DEAD' WH'S OWE*
BETWEEN MARQUEITE AMD NEWUNEE.

FEATURE S£A/ES

R2340
R2341
R2342
R2365
R2368
A5507
A5508
A5509

11.00
3.00
7.00

879.57
20.00
14.69
14.69
14.69

A5527 5,000.00
A5528 5,000.00
A5529 1,000.00

A5530 1,000.00
A5531 1,000.00
A5532 1,000.00

8,248.50
14,841.38
4,714.13
8,657.09
5,895.90
6,877.13

25,651.12

$45,736,416 $343,023.12
All of which is respectively submit-

dertake the financing of the address-
ograph machine;

We there-forte do

!ted.

G REYH D UNO

JAMES C. KIRK, Chairman
FRANK BAKER

Motion made by Supervisor Hender-
son, supported by Supervisor Gra-
ham, that the report toe accepted and
adopted and turned over to the Com-
mittee on Ways and Means. Yea and
No vote -taken of which there were
(Yes-23) (No-0) (absent-1). Motion
declared carried by Chairman Laurie.

Supervisor Janes, Chairman of the
Committee on Ways and Means, re-
ported as follows:

Mr. Chairman, H-on. Board of Su-
pervisors, Gentlemen:

presented the following' report:
Your committe on buildings and

grounds to whom was referred the
matter of -the purchase of an address-
ograph make the following recommen-
dations:

That,- whereas it is generally tmder-

realized in tn-e- purchase of an adress-
ograph, will accrue (to the individual
townships, and whereas, it is also
generally
ships are

understood that the town-
at this time unable to tin-

that at this time the Board of Super-
visors purchase the said odressograph
when this county at the present
time operating under a deficit in the

To.tal of Inactive Revolving
Drain Fund. $

Note: These balances are of 'about
September 15, 1953. No running ac-
count was considered while collect-
ing information.

Active Revolving Drain Funds
Name of Drain

Ainsworth
Albertson
Allen
Battel
Birch Run Outlet
Borodychuk .
Butternut Creek
Colling Rd Bd. of

Last
Activity

1953
1953
1953
1953
1953
1953
1952

Balance
O. D.

$ 608.70
1,027.80

3.50
307.88

71.61

Carson

Columbian

1953
1952

Cheboyganning Creek 1953
Oheboygann. Cr. Dam 1950

19 3
1953
1953
1953
1953

the county permits its purchase English Line 1952
until such time as this Board of French Road Branch of

gienera! fund; furher this committee!Constant DuRussell
recomends that the matter of the I Curry
purchase of the addressograph be Cutts
tabled until such time as the finances Ellisof " - - -

Supervisors shall wish to
the matter.

LAWRENCE WILSON
FRED HUSTON
JAMES C. KIRK

Motion made by Supervisor Hender-1

son, supported by Supervisor Bagu-

reconsider| Kemp
'Gager
Hainies & Branches
Hume-s

1953
..1953
..1953
..1953

5,686.99

249.75
319.43

2,347.44
11.65

2,179.46
574.16
199.76
308.21

43.5

321.69
563.98
30.95

THIS TAG
ON A USED CAR

TELLS YOU-
yon con buy with

NEW-GAR
CONFIDENCE!

6 ways better
• Thoroughly inspected

Reconditioned for Safeff
• Reconditioned for

Performance
• Reconditioned for

Honestly Described

OWENDALE

.. L. Baslick, excav : A5533 1,000.00
2-5-53 Akron Twp. Treas., Frank Storm tax,

lots give-n to Vil A5537
2-5-53 Akron Twp. Treas., Frank Storm

tax, lots given to Vil A5538
2-5-53 Afcron Twp. Treas., Frank Storm

tax, lots given to Vil A5539
2-4-53 W. A. Forbes, stak R2369
3-17-53 Rd. Comm., labor & pipe R2384
3-25-53 Transfer 1300
3-25-53 Transfer 1300
5-2-53 Ward Clark, stakes R2403
5-1-53 J. Schmeltz, stak R2396
4-22-53 Armco, pipe A5572
4-22-53 Armco, pipe A5573.
4-22-53 Armco-, pipe A5574
4-22-53 Armco Pipe A5575
4-22-53 Armco Pipe A5576
4-22-53 Armco Pipe A5577
4-22-53 Armco Pipe A5578 5,004.00
4-22-53 Armoo Pine A5579 5,004.00
5-5-53 Transfer 1316

Transfer 1335

A57

7-21-53 N. Weitzel, Riprap A5714 1,000.00
7-28-53 L. Mayerhafer, bridges A5723 5,004.00
7-28-53 L, Mayerhafer, bridges A5724 1,356.66
7-28-53 L: Mayerhafer, bridges A5725 1,356.67
7-28-53 L. Mayerhafer, bridges A5726 1,356.67
7-6-53 Transfer 1335
8-13-53 Jensen, pipe A5742
8-17-53 Tus. Co. Rd., pipe *"<ifi
-S-17-53 Transfer 1346- - -
9-14-53 L, Easlick, excav A5772 14,000.00
9-3-53 Transfer 1354

10-1-53 Balance Overdrawn

10-1-52 Balance on Hand ..
APPLEGATE

1300

10-1-53 Balance on Hand .

10-1-52 Balance overdrawn
3-25-53 Transfer 1300
6-3-53 Transfer 1335

10-1-53 Balance overdrawn

42.00

ARMBRUSTER

505.40
45.12

590-.19

39.67

Phone 185R2 BULEN MOTORS

The Ladies' Department class
meeting was held Thursday af-
ternoon with 16 members pres-
ent. There was roll call and
recreation activities. Their lead-
er and teacher was Alma Severn

! and the hostess was Mildred Gim-!
mell. A lunch was served and the
next meeting will be at the home1

of Mrs. Edith Andrews.
The Adult class meeting was

held at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Pete Severn Friday evening. Al-
ma Davis was teacher and de-
votions were given by Alma
Severn. Thirty members were
present. Lunch was served and

j recreation was in charge of FJpra
Kivell. The closing prayer was" by
Frank Sheufelt and the next
meeting will be at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Morley.

Mrs. Ida Eicker is home again
after spending two weeks in the
Scheurer Hospital in Pigeon be-
cause of injuries received in a

(recent accident.
Mrs. Lizzie Andrews was a din-

ner guest of Mr. and Mrs. Alma
Davis Sunday at Ubly.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Lewis and
daughter, Pamela, of Pontiac and
Mrs. Pearl Rivert of Sebewaing
were Sunday guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Dave O'Connell.

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford O'Con-
nell and children and Mrs. Lizzie
O'Connell were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Weir
and children of Berkley.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie Hopkins
of Pontiac were dinner guests ol
Mr. and Mrs. Dave O'Connel
Sunday and are spending the rest
of the week in Bay Port.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Sheufelt
were Sunday dinner guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Walker of
Ubly.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle McAlpine
Concluded on page ten,

IT'S A FACT
Facts are such annoying things

that many folks refuse to have
anything to do with them.

LOSES ITS VALUE
The value of enthusiasm is lost

whenever it reaches the point of
developing into recklessness.

CLIFF RYAN
1 o'clock, Cass Theatre

Want Ads Pay

The Thrifty Way!
'B^ .<K&' ^ir

Remember — Besides our weekly bargains you receive a free dollar other fine gift
with each $25 in accumulated purchases at our store.

Lean Meaty

PORK CHOPS "• 69c
Shoulderouuuiuer ^̂ H Î ^B

Pork Steak " 57C
Choice Cut

SWISS STEAK Ib. 55c
Ib. ZlC

Snow White Home Rendered

LARD 35c
KoegePs Grade A
Sliced Bologna Ib.

SUGAR 10 S, 89C
Beechnut

Coffee
l-Ib.
can

All Flavors

JELL-0 pkgs

Pascal

CELERY stalk 19c
Water Maid A Ib.
Fancy Rice ........................ . cello 29C

CASS
Fhone280

& SUPER MARKET
Cass City
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Annual Tax Sale
ANNUAL TAX SALE

STATE OP MICHIGAN

In the Circuit Court for the County
of Tuscola in Chancery

In the Matter of the Petition of
John B. Martin, Auditor Gen-
eral of the State of Michigan,
for and in behalf of said State, i
for the sale of certain lands \
for taxes assessed thereon. I

No. 4627
On'reading and filing the petition ^of

the Auditor General of the State of
Michigan praying for a decree in favor
of the State of Michigan, against each
parcel of land therein described, for the
amounts therein specified, claimed to be
diae for taxes, interest and charges on
each such parcel of land, and that such
lands be sold for the amounts so
claimed by the State of Michigan.

.It is ordered that said petition will be
brought on for hearing and decree at the
February term of this Court, to be held
at Caro in the County of Tuscola State
of Michigan, on the 8th day.of February
A. D, 1954, at the opening of the Court
on that day, and that all persons inter-
ested in such lands ©r any part there-
of, desiring to contest the lien claimed
thereon by the State of Michigan, for
such taxes, interest and charges, or any
part thereof, shall appear in said Court,
and file with the clerk thereof their ob-
jections thereto on or before the first
day of the term of this Court above men-
tioned, and that in default thereof the
same will be taken as confessed and a
decree will be taken and entered as
prayed for in said petition. And it is
further ordered that in pursuance of said
decree the lands described in said petition
for which a decree of sale shall be made,
•will be sold for the several taxes, inter-
est ' and charges thereon as determined
by such decree, on the first Tuesday in
May thereafter, beginning at 10 o'clock
a. m. on said day, or on the day or days
subsequent thereto as may be necessary
to complete the sale of said lands and of
each and every parcel thereof, at the
office of the County Treasurer, or at
such convenient place as shall be selected
by him at the county seat of the County
of Tuscola State of Michigan; and that
the sale then and there made will be a
public sale, and each parcel described in
the decree shall be separately exposed for
sale for the total taxes, interest and
charges, and the sale shall be made to
the person paying the full amount
charged against such parcel, and accept-
ing a conveyance of the smallest undi-
vided fee simple interest therein ; or, if
no person will pay the taxes and
charges and take a conveyance of less
than the entire thereof, then the whole
parcel shall be offered and sold. If any
parcel of land cannot be sold for taxes,
interest and charges, such parcel shall
be passed over for the time being, and
shall, on the succeeding day, or before
the close of the sale, fee reoffered, and
if, on such second offer, or during such
sale, the same cannot be sold for the
amount aforesaid, the County Treasurer
shall bid off the same in the name of the
State.

Witness the Hon. Timothy C. Quinn,
Circuit Judge, and the seal of said Cir-
cuit Court of Tuscola County this 10th
day of December A. D. W53.

TIMOTHY C. QUINN,
Circuit Judge.

Countersigned,
Fred Mathews, Clerk.

STATE OF MICHIGAN
In the Circuit Court for the County

of Tuscola in Chancery

In the Matter of the Petition of
John B. Martin, Auditor .Gen-
eral of the State of Michigan^
for and in behalf of said State
for the sale of certain lands for
taxes assessed thereon.

SCHEDULE "A"
TAXES FOR 1951 AND

PRIOR YEARS
Years for Total of Taxes

rtM Which Interest and
•§ S * Delinquent Charges Due

Description g uFrom To in Said Years
or Parcel GO a"*! Inclusive Dollars Cents

Town No. 14 North, Range No. 9 East
COLUMBIA TOWNSHIP

Com. 26 rds E of NW cor. of Sec. 28 th
S 12 rds th E 8 rds th N 12 rds th W
8 rds to pi. of beg.

28 1951 2.76
Town No. 11 North, Range No. 10 East

DAYTON TOWNSHIP
Cat Lake Sub. No. 1

Lot'51

Lot 57

Lot 71

Lot 89

Lot 90

Lot 159

Lot 225

Lot 226

1951

1951

7 1951
Shay Lake Sub.

13

13

13

13

13

1951

1951

1951

1951

1.52

1.52

1.34

1.44

1.44

2.34

2.34

To the Circuit Court for the County of
Tuscola, in Chancery:

John B. Martin, Auditor General of
the State of 'Michigan, respectfully shows
unto the Court :

1. That he is the Auditor General of
the State of Michigan and makes and
files this petition under, by virtue of and
pursuant to the provisions of Act No.
206 of the Public Acts of 1893, as
amended, and Act No. 126 of the Public
Acts of 1933, as amended ;

2. That Schedule A annexed hereto is
the tax record required by the act first
above mentioned and contains the des-
cription of all lands in the aforesaid
county upon which taxes, which were -as-
sessed for the years mentioned therein,
have remained unpaid for more than one
year after they were returned as de-
linquent, the description of all lands in
said county heretofore bid off in the
name of the State and thus held and up-
on winch taxes -which were assessed sub-
sequent to the tax for which such lands
were sold to the State have remained un-
paid for more than one year after they
•were returned as delinquent, and the
description of all lands in said county
which are delinquent for any installment
of taxes under the provisions of the act
last above mentioned ;

3. That extended separately in said
schedule against each description of said
lands therein contained are (a) the total
amount of delinquent taxes upon said
description for the non-payment of which
the same may lawfully be sold at the
next annual tax sale, (b) interest com-
puted thereon as provided by law to the
first day of May, next ensuing, (e) a
collection fee of four per cent and (d)
§1.00 for expenses, all in accordance with
the provisions of the act first above
mentioned ;

4. That all of the aforesaid taxes, in-
terest and charges are valid, .^delinquent
and unpaid, and have remained de-
linquent and unpaid for sufficient time
to authorize and require, as provided fey
the foregoing acts, the sale of the afore-
said parcels of land against which they
were assessed and are extended in said
schedule at the next "annual tax sale for
the non-payment thereof, and that the
said taxes, interest, collection fee and ex-
penses so extended in said schedule
against each parcel of land therein des-
cribed constitute a valid lien upon each
of the said several parcels of land
described in said schedule as therein and
against which extended in favor of the
people of the State of Michigan, the pay-
ment of which lien this court may enr
force as a preferred or first claim upon
such lands by the sale thereof.

Wherefore your petitioner prays:
a. That within the time provided by

law this court may determine and decree
that the aforesaid taxes, interest, col-
lection fee and charges are valid and
constitute a valid lien upon eaeh of the

% said Several parcels of land described in
said schedule as therein extended ;

b. That within the time provided by
law this court make a final decree in
favor of the State of Michigan against
each parcel of said lands for the payment
of the several amounts of taxes, interest,
collection fee and expenses, as computed
and extended in said schedule against
the several parcels of land therein con-
tained ;

c. That said decree provide that in de-
fault of the payment so ordered of the
said_ several sums computed and extended
against said lands in said schedule, the
said several parcels of land, or such in-
terest therein as may be necessary to
satisfy the amount decreed against the
same, shall severally be sold as the law
provides ;

d. That your petitioner may have such
other and further relief in the premises
as to this court may seem just and
equitable.

And your petitioner will ever pray, etc.
Dated: Pecember 1, 1953.

JOHN B. MARTIN,
Auditor General of the State of Michigan,

for and in behalf of said State.

1951 2.34
Town No. 11 North, Range No. 10 East

DAYTON TOWNSHIP
N % of N % of SE %

28 40 1951 68.52
A lot com. 48 rds E of S % stake Sec.

35 th E 10 rds th N to P. M. R. R. |
W'ly along said R. R. about 10 rds to
a pt. due N of beg. th S to beg.

35 1951 5.70
Town No. 13 North, Range No. 10 East

ELLINGTON TOWNSHIP
E % of SE %

7 80 1951 24.64
NE % of NE %

10 40 1951 10.64
SW 4 of NW %

14 40 1951 10.27
NE % of SE %

14 40 1951 163.S5
NE % of NE %

25 40 1951 15.82
SE % of NE %

25 40 1951 9.34
E % of SE %

25 80 1951 17.68
NW % of SE %

31 40 1951 112.15
E % of E % of SE %

35 ,40 1951 10.27
Town No. 14 North, Range No. 10 East

ELMWOOD TOWNSHIP
NE % of SW %

22 40 1951 48.88
N 40 A of W % of NW frl %

31 40 1951 45.85
Town No. 11 North, Range No. 9 East

" FREMONT TOWNSHIP
E % of SE % of NW %

14 20 1951 3.58
Beg. 25 rds & 7 Iks S of % stake of E

line of See. 27. S 16 rds W 10 rds N
16 rds E to beg.

27 1 1951 3.45
All that part of SE % of NW % S of

State Rd.
29 18 1951 4.79

SE % of SW % -
29 40 1951 14.79

S % of SE % .
30 80 - 1951 19.98

SE % of SW %
30 40 1951 13.35

Town No. 12 North, Range No. 9 East
INDIANFIELDS TOWNSHIP

Com. at a pt. 488.4 ft. E of the % stake
of Sec. 2 th NE to a pt. 1129 ft. which
pt. is cen. of Sucker Or. Rd. th at rt.
angles'to said Rd. SE'ly along the line
of land formerly sold to other parties
250 ft. th NE'ly 75 ft. th NW'ly to a
pt. in said Rd. 64 ft. NE'ly from the
pt. of beg. th SW'ly to pt. of beg.

2 1951 • 20.76
Com. at NW cor. of SW % of SE'% of

Sec. 2 run E 40 rds S 8 rds W 40 rds
N 8 rds to beg. Part of SE %

2 1951 23.59
N 5 A of S % of SW % of NE %

11 5 1951 16.12
Com. at a pt. 78 rds E of where N & S

% line inters. State Rd. run S 16 rds
E 10 rds N 16 rds th W 10 rds to beg.

20 1951, 10.46
Town No. 12 North, Range No. 8 East

JUNIATA TOWNSHIP
S % of NW %

2 80 1951 433.32
S % of NW %

9 80 1951 127.28
VILLAGE ©F WATROUSVILLE

Com. at SW cor. Sec. 10 th N 8 rds E 6
rds th S 8 rds th W 6 rds to pi. of

SCHEDULE "A"
TAXES FOR 1951 AND

PRIOR YEARS
Years for Total of Taxes

g,M Which Interest and
•£ 3 $ Delinquent Charges Due

Description g ^ gFrom To in Said Years
or Parcel co «<! Inclusive Dollars Cents
Town No. 12 North, Range No. 9 Eas

VILLAGE OF CARO
Original Plat

Metes & Bounds
Com. 134 ft. from cen. of NYCRR tracks

on NE side of Bush St. run SE 53 ft.
7 in. along Bush St. NE 80 ft. to land
formerly owned by Ross, along land of
Ross 73 ft. 4 in. th SW 132 ft. to beg.
Also com. at a pt. 20 rds W & 28.5
rds N of E % stake of Sec. 3 th S
8.95 rds E 4 rds N 8.95 rds W 4 rds
to pt. of beg. Part of SE % of NE %

1951 40.53
Metes & Bounds

Com. at a pt. in cen. of State St. at SE
cor. of land formerly owned by Good-
child ran SW along ST. St. 10 rds th
NW at rt. angles to St. St. 20 rds NE
10 rds SE 20 rds to beg. Part of NE %
of NE % ex. pc. of land in NE cor.
66 ft. 8 in. on St. St. by 14 rds deep
sold Clark & ex. land sold to Imerson
& Cookingham

1951 9'5.67
Montague's & Wilmot's Add.

Lot 1-5, Blk 2
2 1951 45.74

W. E. Sherman's Add.
Lot 4, Blk. 5

5 1951 54.66
M. J. Smith's Add.

Lot 6, Blk. 2
2 1951 40.53

Town No. 13 North, Range No. 8 East
FAIRGROVE VILLAGE

Metes & Bounds
Com. 104 rds 9 ft. W of SE cor. Sec. 17

th N 152 ft. to RR SW along RR to S
line See. 17, E 9 rds 4 ft. to beg.

17 1951 30.83
Town No. 11 North, Range No. 9 East

MAYVILLE VILLAGE
• Beechwood Annex.

Lot. 8-9, Blk 1
1 1951 5.10
L. Fox's 2nd Add.

W % of lot 3, Blk 9
9 1951 9.15
Lynhurst Annex.

Lots 6-7-10, Blk D
D 1951 23.80
Win. Turner's Add.

Lot 5, Blk. 1
1 1951 23.80

Wm. Turner's 2nd Add.
Lots 1-2-3-4 Blk 7

7 1951 117.06
Lot 1, Blk 8

8 1951 23.73
Woodside Annex.

Lot 10, Blk 2
2 1951 30.31

Town No. 10 North, Range No. 8 East
MILLINGTON VILLAGE

Original Plat
N % of Lot 5, Blk 13

13 1951 51.02
Metes & Bounds

Lot. com. SW cor. Blk 14 th N 10 rds W
4 rds S 10 rds E 4 rds to beg.

1 1951 52.87
Town No. 12 North, Range No. 7 East

REESE VILLAGE
Original Plat

Lots 12-13, Blk 15
15 1951 44.05

Town No. 11 North, Range No. 8 East
CITY OF VASSAR

Original Plat
Lots 21-22 Blk 2 ex. N 16 ft. of lot 22

Down Memory Lane
FROM THE FILES OF THE CHRONICLE

Lot 12, Blk 3
3

Lot 18, Blk 3
3

1951

1951

1951
Metes & Bounds

1864.39

706.45

23.14

Five Years Ago.
On Jan. 12, Mr. and Mrs. A. A.

Brian were married 62 years. No
celebration is planned because of
illness in the family.

Mr. J. E. Liddicoat has been
selected by the Tuscola County
Board of Education to serve as
county superintendent of schools
to succeed Ben H. McComb who
resigned.

Cass City's death rate in 1948
was lower than in 1947. Fifty-
four deaths were registered in
1948 while in 1947, there were 72.

All rural teachers must regis-
ter at the county school superin-
tendent's office before they will
be eligible to teach for the year
1949-50.

Ten Years Ago.
Recreational facilities for

youth here were praised by Har-
old Oatley in a talk at the Ro-
tary Club luncheon Tuesday.

Cass City won over Bad Axe
Friday night with a 43-31 score.

Mrs. Andrew Schmidt, 65, died
in her home here Sunday morning
after a long illness.

Mrs, Rosa Scriver, 85, died
Friday night in the home of Mrs.
Jennie Martin where she had
been cared for.

Second Lt. John Arnold Reagh,
son of Mr. and Mrs. Ira Reagh,,
received his silver wings on Jan.
7 at Blytheville, Ark.

10 1951 2.42
Lot 7-8 Blk 9

16 1951 10.23
Lot 9 Blk 7 • '

16 1951 3.31
Town No. 12 North, Range No. 11 East

KINGSTON TOWNSHIP
SE % of SE % ex. about 7 A off N

side & also ex. com. at pt. on N line of
Snover Rd. 167.88 ft. W of E line of
Sec. 17 th N'ly 200 ft. th W par. to
een. line of Snover Rd. 400 ft. th
B'ly 200 ft. to N line of Snover Rd. th
B'ly 400 ft. along N'iy line of Snover
Rd. to beg.

17 1951 2-6.70
NE % of SE %

' 24 40 1951 10.20
E % of NE 14

27 80 1951 48.93
Town No. 11 North, Range No. 11 East

KOYLTON TOWNSHIP
N % of NW %

1 80 1951 65.47
SE % of NE % :

8 40 1951. 20.43,
NE % of SE %

8 40 1951 20.43
SE % of NE %

20 40 1951 17.00
S % of S % of SE %

20 40 1951 17.00
S % of SW % less 1 sq. A in NW cor.

28 79 1951 ' 45.77
SE % of NE %

29 40 1951 23.85
Town No. 10 North,' Range No. 8 East

MILLINGTON TOWNSHIP
NE % of NE' % & E % of SE % of

NE %
14 60 1951 60.28

W % of SE % ex. 8 A sold off NE %
34 72 1951 23.23

Town No. 11 North, Range No. 7 East
TUSCOLA TOWNSHIP

Village of Tuscola
S % of SE % also lots 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9,

10, 11, 12 Blk 16
28 73.47 1951 72.63

Town No. 11 North, Range No. 8 East
VASSAR TOWNSHIP

E % of SE %
2 80 1951 22.31

Town No. 10 North, Range No. 9 East
WATERTOWN TOWNSHIP

N % of SW %
12 80 1951 68.62

A par of land beg. at SW cor. of SE %
of SE % th N 13 rds E 8 rds S 13 rds
W 8 rds to pi. of beg.

24 65/100 1951 7.49
S % of NE % frl.

31 79 4/100 1951 21.38
Village of Fostoria

Blk. 7 & 8
26 1951

Lots 4 & 5 Blk 19
25 1951 10.27

Lot 8 Blk 20
25 1951 23.23

Town No. 12 North, Range No. 10 East
WELLS TOWNSHIP

SW % of SE %
4 40 1951 17.62

NW % of NE %
9 40 1951 13.01

NE

That part of E % of E % of Sec. S of
Cass R. & N of Rd. ex. com. at pt.
betw. Sec.'s 7 & 8, 25 Iks. N of NW
cor. of SW % Sec. 8 th W 11.71 ch. to
St.1 Rd. to Sec. line th N 14.98 ch. to
beg. 71 A Sec. 7-11-8

1951 111.63
Merritt's Add.

NE % of lots 1-2, Blk 4
4 1951 23.14

Ebenezer Morse's Add.
Lots 2-14 E % of lot 13 ex.. beg. NE cor.

lot 2 th S along E line lot 2 for 129
58/100 ft. to Huron Ave. W along Ave.
56.85 ft. th N 125.15 ft. to S line of lot
3, 48 ft. from beg. th E to beg. Blk 4

1951 89.51
North's Add.

Lot 5, Blk C
C 1951 . 4.68

Lots 2-3-4-5 ex. SE cor. of lot 5 also 10
A E & joining Blk 10 Blk 10 S. of Cass
River

10 1951
W % of lots 11-12, Blk, ll

11 1951
Lot 7, Blk. 12

'12 1951
Lot 11, Blk 15

15 1951
N 66 ft. of lot 7, Blk. 20

20 1951

Twenty-five Years Ago.
Twelve teams will contest for

honors in the series of volleyball
games the next three months.

Mrs. Bay Crane will have an
auction sale of horses and farm
tools one block north of the Ford
Garage in Cass City Saturday.

The personal property of the
Thomas Whitfield Estate will be
sold at auction Wednesday, Jan.
23.

The following officers were in-
stalled for Venus Rebekah Lodge
of Cass City Friday evening: Mrs.
John C'ole, Miss Katherine Crane,
Mrs. C. W. Heller, Mrs. Geo.
West, Mrs. B. F. Benkelman,
Mrs. William Schwaderer, Mrs.
John Caldwell, Mrs. John Bohn-

23.14

26.82

23.14

17.88

Loose conduct gets many
pie in a tight spot.

peo-

sack, Mrs. Chas. Kosanke, Mrs.
Andrew Barnes, Mrs. Margaret
Levagood, Mrs. Bertha Brown,
Mrs. Delia Lauderbach, Mrs. John
Lorentzen and Mrs. Robert
Warner.

Thirty-five Years Ago.
At the annual meeting of the

Tuscola, Huron and ,Sanilac Dis-
trict Fair Monday afternoon, an
entire new set of fair officers
were chosen: Hugh Cooper, pres-
ident; C. R. Townsend, vice-presi-
dent; M. B. Amten, secretary, and
G. A. Tindale, treasurer. In se-
lecting directors, Chas. Ewing,
John Sugden and Lester Bailey
were chosen for three-year terms
and Harry T. Crandell for one
year.

I. B. Auten, proprietor of the
Cass City Bank, reports that 1918
has been a very prosperous year
in this community. They have the
least past due notes of any time
in his 35 years experience as a
banker.

Edward Hopkins of Ellington
was fatally injured Thursday
when he jumped off a load of hay
onto a fork handle which pene-
trated his body seven or eight
inches inflicting severe injuries
to the intestinal parts.

TOO MUCH TALKING
Psychiatrists say talking will

cure a lot of troubles—the trouble
is, it was talking that started
most of our troubles in the
place.

first

Dairy Management
Tour Scheduled in
Tuscola County

Dairy farmers in Tuscola
County will not want to miss the
dairy management tour sched-
uled for Tuesday, January 26,
'announced Quentin R. Ostrander,
assistant county agricultural
agent.

The purpose of this tour, Os-
trander stated, will be to discuss
dairy barn arrangements, barn
and milk house sanitation, gener-
al management problems and
labor saving devices.

The tour will include four

stops plus a noon lunch . pro-
gram. There will be two pen
barns with self feeders and walk-
in milking parlors and two
stanchion barns, Pstrander said.

Three dairy bam specialists,
Don Murray, dairy specialist
from Michigan State College,
Art Bell, agricultural engineer-
ing specialist from Michigan
State College, and a milk in-
spector from the Detroit board
of health, will be present to
discuss problems with, the farm-
ers attending the tour.

The tour schedule is as fol-
lows: 10:00 a. m.—Tom Laurie
farm, located 4 miles west and
IV2 miles.north of Cass City, oh
Cedar Run Road; 11:00 a, m.—

Jim Tuckey farm, located 2 miles
west and 1 mile south of Cass
City, on Elmwood Road; 12:00
noon—lunch at Home Restaurant
in Cass City; 1:30 p. m.—Lewis
Wenzloff farm, located 1 mile
west and l1^ miles north of
Kingston; 2:45 p. m.—Leroy
Ross farm, located 4 miles east
and 2% miles south of Kingston.

The County Extension Office
urges all dairy farmers to at-
tend this tour.

TRAGIC END
There is -no tragedy like a mis-

spent life being1 caught by old
age without funds to pay for its
uselessness.

HERE ARE 3 IMPORTANT REASONS
TOR SlIWCINfro^

JOHN DEERE EQUIPMENT

1. It's the oft-season. You can spare your
eejuipment more readily.

2. Our sHop can schedule the work at
your convenience.

3. You'll save that last-minute rush . . .
prevent "down-time" later on.

Remember, too . . . only our shop offers
skilled mechanics, trained in John Deere
servicing methods; precision tools for John
Deere work; and genuine John Deere parts
that fit right . , . last longer. It's the best
possible service for your equipment.

Act now. Let's make a service date for your
John Deere equipment soon»

MAICO
H E A R I N G AIDS

IMcCONKEY
*w

Jewelry & Gift Shop
Cass CityPhone 278R2

Cass City. CLIFF RYAN Phone 20

Hirtie' of Quality &rvef
Genuine JOHN DEERE PARTS

New ...Ultra-New for'54!

ORDER FOR PUBLICATION.
General.

State of Michigan, The Probate Court
for the County of Tuscola.

In the Matter of the Estate of Wil-
liam 0. Rawson, Deceased.

At a session of said Court, held on
January llth, 1954.

Present, Honorable Almon C. Pierce,
Judge of Probate.

Notice is Hereby Given, That the
petition of Audley Rawson praying that
said Court adjudicate and determine who
were at the time of his death the legal
heirs of said deceased will be heard at
the Probate Court on February 3rd,
1954, at ten a. m.

It is Ordered, that notice thereof be
given by publication of a copy hereof
for three weeks consecutively previous
to said day of hearing, in the Cass City
Chronicle, and that the petitioner cause

turn receipt demanded, at least fourteen
(14) days prior to such hearing, or by
personal service at least five (5) days
prior to such hearing ^ ̂ ^ -

Judge of Probate.
A true copy . , „ , ,

Beatrice P. Berry, Register of Probate.
1-15-3

NOW ON

GALA DISPLAY

AT YOUR

ANNOUNCING the breath-taking new Oldsmobile
Super "88" for 1954! The Oldsmobile so ultra-new in

design ... so original in style throughout ...
there's never been a car like it before! Just wait till you

see its completely new Body by Fisher—that new
lower, longer, lovelier silhouette! The daring new
slant of its panoramic windshield! The dramatic new
flair in its sweep-cut doors and fenders! And just
wait till you drive the new 185-horsepower World's
Record "Rocket" Engine with 8.25 to 1 compression
ratio—the engine that outperforms, out-economizes

even the power-famous '53 "Rocket". For a completely
new view on modern automobiles, see the thrilling
new Super "88" ... on display now! And watch
for Oldsmobile's new "Dream Car", the Classic

Ninety-Eight» . . coming to your dealer's soon!

SW

W

1,4 of NW
9 40

% of NE %
10 40

'2 of NW %
24 80

of S % of NW

1951

1951

26
N % of SW

26
SW

40

1951
r i/
1951

1951

SCHEDULE "A"

TAXES FOR 1951 AND
PRIOR YEARS,'

Years for Total of Taxes
£j& Which Interest and
52 3 2 Delinquent Charges Dae

Description g fa t> From To in Said Years
or Parcel to o<! Inclusive Dollars Cents
Town No. 15 North, Range No. 8 East

AKRON TOWNSHIP
S 60 A of E y2 of SE%

13 60 1951 42.03
SW % of NW i

24 40 1951 29.39
Com. at the NW cor. of NW % of NE %

running th S 36 1/3 rds E 7 rds N 36
1/3 rds W 7 rds to beg.
i 25 1949 12.25
'\ of E % of SE %

27 20 1951 10.14
•!i No. 10 North, Range No. 7 East

ARBELA TOWNSHD7

80
of SW %

26 40 1951
NE M of SE %

27 40 1951
SE % of SE %

27 40 1951
SW % of NE %

32 40 1951
SE % of NE %

32 40 1951
Town No. 14 North, Range No. 7

WISNER TOWNSHIP
i Oakhurst Park

Lot 108
2 5/100 1951

31.47

13.92

31.47

18.54

39.79

19.47

23.16

21.32

26.85

15.65
East

It Pays
TO LOOK

Your Best

2.45

' Eve-ryone knows that a smart
\\ appearance is the one asset

> that is invaluable in the home
or in business, that's why more I
and more people bring their j 1

clothes to us.

CHECK THESE f
ADVANTAGES

EXPERIENCED WORKMEN |

QUICK SERVICE

PICK-UP & DELIVERY

I

of NW %
13 80 1951

J of S % of NW %,
16 50 1951

91.10

29.18

Town No. 14 North, Range No. 7 East
WISNER TOWNSHIP

SW % of NE % „ OJ
22 40 1951 29.84

Com 4 rds E of SW cor. Sec. 32 th N 20
rds E 40 rds N 20 rds E 12 rds S 40
rds W 52 rds to beg.

82 8 1951 16.91
Mankes* Sub. Original Plat

Lots 22-23 Blk 2
29 1951 2.12

Town No. 14 North, Range No. 8 East
AKRON VILLAGE

Original Plat
Lot 11, Blfc 4

4 1951 11.81
Town No. 12 North, Range No. 9 East

VILLAGE OF CARO
Original Plat

Lot 5, Blk 17
17 1951 117.M

When your clothes go to;;
Eichers you know they come ' ;
back cleaned carefully and cor-
rectly.

OUR EXPERT CLEANING ;
IS GUARANTEED

Pickup and Delivery
Phones

Pigeon 183 Cass City 233

Car illustrated: 1954 Super "88" Holiday CoupG. White Sidewatt Tiros,
optional at extra cost. A General Motors Value.

World's Record "Rocket"

OL.DSIN/IO •I mmm
S E E Y O U R N E A R E S T O L D S M O B I L E D E A L E R

Phone 185R2 BULEN MOTORS Cass City
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Caro, Michigan
"Always Two Action

Features"
Fri., Sat., Sun. Jan. 22-23-24

Bargain Matinee Sat. at
2:30 p.m.

Co-Feature

Plus Color Cartoon

Sharpened political axes were
hacking away, even before Gov.
Williams completed his address
to the 67th session of Michigan's
legislature.

Some people considered the
speech itself a rather keen wea-
pon. The governor dealt, he said,
with only the most ' pressing
problems including "prosperity"
in 1954 for Michigan citizens.
Other needs, among them edu-
cation, would be called to the
lawmakers' attention in subse-
quent addresses.

* * *
Immediate objections were

voiced by Republicans to the
governor implying credit for the
balanced budget. They recalled
that he permitted the business
receipts tax, . which brought "in
the required revenue to attain fi-
nancial balance, to become law.

But he did so without signing
the bill and with plain spoken
misgivings.

* * *

Major fields and proposals in
the governor's address:

Agriculture: A $500,000 mar-
keting program; better promo-
tion of Michigan products.

Industry: Increase unemploy-
ment insurance to 50% of pre-
vailing average wage ($82.30 at
current figures), plus $2 x>er
week for each child; lengthen
payment period from 20 to 26

COMING NEXT WEEK!
Thumb's Premiere!

SUN., MON., TUBS. . JAN. 31-FEB. 2
; Continuous Sunday from 3:00 p. m.

NIALL
ADMISSION PRICES

Sunday Matinee Until 6:00 p. m.
ADULTS 90c CHILDREN 50c

• All Evenings
ADULTS $1.20 CHILDREN 50c

Coupons which entitle ADULT Patrons to 25%-discount
may be obtained from the local ministers.

Please Note: Regular courtesy tickets cannot be accepted
for this engagement.

tax diversion amendment and
will be allocated as increase aid
to local school districts.

% ^ %

"Other major factors responsi-
ble for increased appropriation
recommendations include: higher
college enrollments, additional
beds in mental hospitals, ines-
capable improvements in our
correctional system and addi-
tional efforts in respect to tuber-
culosis," said Governor Wil-
liams.

"Four functions account for
™lt T „ 7 , $25.1 millions or 93% of the iri-weeks. Increase workmen's com- . ,, „ i T j ^,. , .,., . crease in the General budget:

disability msur- Education 69%. 'Mental Hygienepensation and
ance payments. Set minimum
wage at $1 per hour.

Small Business: Legislation to
permit the formation of a pri-
vately financed company to sup-
ply venture capital
small enterprises.

Tourist. Industry:

and, aid to

Set- aside

10%; Corrections
Health 6%."

8%; Public

Tradition and color have
developed as part of convening
ceremonies for Michigan's legis-
lature.

from mineral,'oil and) First session is usually brief,
gravel deposits on state Innd to
help snpport parks. Improve-
mp-nt of conservation m-oorams.

St. Lawrence Waterway:
Con,-

Old battles can be renewed
over the governor's remarks
about the highway program. He
charged, as he did months ago,
that the highway commission

informal. A little like opening
day of school after summer va-
cation. Legal requirements of
the legislature's start are con-
formed to, organization gets
underway. Its "house" in order,
the 'governor is "called in" for
his address. This speech bears
the same relationship to state
government as the United States
President's "State of the Na-
tion" address does to federal
government.

.6REENLEAF
James Walker is still confined

to his bed with a bad cold al-
though somewhat improved in
health.

Wm. MacGillvray of Detroit
spent the week end with his
cousin, Angus Campbell.

Praser Church Choir met for
practice Friday evening with
Mr. and Mrs. George Fisher.

Week-end guests at the home

of Mr. and Mrs. Rayford Thorpe
were their daughters, Miss Hila
Wills of Detroit and Miss Betsy
Thorpe of Saginaw.

Mrs. Robert Hoadley made a
business trip to Saginaw Satur-
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Maurice Taylor
and daughters, Lynne and Linda,
and Myron Fisher returned Sat-
urday from a month's trip to
California.

past?
LWAVSASttT

SHOW"

has not made use of all federal
money it had available.

On that occasion Highway
Commissioner Ziegler produced
letters from Washington and .v, , \ ,-. , ,bers of the Supreme Court in
numerous auditors to show that X . . .»,....._, _..,__.. _..j _«...:
Michigan had allocated all such
funds. '

Zieerler was more than mildly

Special chairs are crowded in-
to the House of Representative
chamber so that Senators, mem-

irritated with the governor's
remarks. Labeling the charge
"political chicanery," Ziegler
indicated that Williams knew
he was misrepresenting the
facts.

One million dollars a day is
reouired to operate the state of
Michigan dnrins- t^e coming
year, according to the budget
message of ^ov. Williams.

Study of this •nronosal is the
key nroblem of lawmakers dur-

their official
high officials can be present to
hear the governor spe'ak his
opinions on what laws and ap-

ing the which opened
Jan. 13. Each amount outlined by
the crovernor is $365.541,568.

"No deficit financing1 is
needed." nredicts the governor,
arise." This is one point agreed
•n-Don bv leaders of both, parties.

propriations should be made.
In following sessions, the leg-

islature is expected to consider
| subjects set forth in the gover-
nor's message and propose mea-
sures to deal with the problems
he outlined.

^ * *
Before .the session begins cer-

tain key dates are agreed upon.
These include the closing date,
final date for submitting bills
and a day by which committees
but recommend action on all bills
under its jurisdiction or permit
them to "die."

* # *
Closing date of this session is

set for April 9.
Legislators have until Feb. 10

to introduce bills. After that
It is extremely unlikely that the date whatever business is sub-
anpropriation measures passed mitted will go through the legis-
bv legislators will show red ink.
Neither side would relish the
blame for planning a deficit.

Last vear's bude-et message
proposed expenditures of

lative machinery.
There was talk at one time

that this would be a short ses-
sion. But now predictions are
that 1,000 bills will be submitted.
This is more than can be proper-

401,700. Tbe legislature worked | iy considered in the time allotted.
this sum down to $338.593.602 The more important ones will be
before granting approval. The
new proposal is eight r>er cent
hierheiv (About $27 million more* this year,
than was recmpsted in the previ-
ous message.)

About 40% of this increase is I
required by law under the sales

acted upon; many must drop
from sight, not to become issues

PROBLEM SOLVED
This whole problem of what is

wrong- with youth could be solved
if parents analyzed
well.

themselves

Marlette Phone 3531
"Always A Hit Show"

Fri.? Sat. Jan. 22-23
Two Action Features!

and
Gene Hits the Danger Trail!
Gene Autry and Champion

"LAST OF THE PONY RIDERS"

with Smiley Burnette
Added Color Cartoon "The Wee

Men"

^r" v£ 11 MM$

SLEEPING IS A DREAM "
WHEN I'M YOUR SANDMAN

They're feather light—and one to a bed's
ail that's needed!

It's old fashioned to smother under a muscle-
numbing pile of bedding.

Be feather warm—automatically!
Dial the warmth you want, and there it stays
regardless of room or outside temperatures.

Saturday Midnite Show Jan. 23
Sun., Mon. . Jan. 24-25

Double Feature ,
Continuous Sunday from 3\p. m.

f?*:;tf;t*m^vtM(f7f2!tL

3lPflf*5af»iff̂ nM-Sy

2nd Feature

Also Walt Disney Color Cairtoon
Please Note: "Thunder Over The
Plains" will not be shown at the
Saturday Midnite Show.

Tues., Wed., Thurs. Jan. 26-27-28

SEE YOUR DEALER or Detroit Edison (Extra World News - Color Car-
* toon -* Special "Nostradamus

And The Queenf

THE SHOW PLACE OF THE THUMB!

FRI., SAT. JAN. 22-23
Two B-ig Hits!

Plus

A Hit Attraction
SATURDAY MIDNIGHT SHOW AND

SUN., MON., JAN. 24-25

Continuous Sunday from 3:00. p. m.

.. as Exciting as the
Furious Mutiny
it Caused!

ROBERT STEWART METRO-GOIOWYN-MAYER PICTURE

BETTAST.JQHN-KEENANWYNN
* JAMES WHITMORE- KURT

**. * » HARRY BROWN • D^ » RICHARD THORPE • p^ * PANDRO S.
tata«u» st« h K* «£S vniuttB

Also Pete Smith Special - World News - Bugs Bunny
Color Cartoon

TUBS., WED., THURS.
Midweek Special!

JAN. 26-27-28

Extra Comedy - Color Cartoon - News
em mm m «§

COMING NEXT WEEK!
JAN. 31-FEB. 1-2

•fc^v?i*nta«if>,*-ili' <iia

SUN., MON., TUES.

LOUIS de ROCHEMONT presents

11 PASSION
AND POWER.. . IT COULD
HARDLY BE SURPASSED!
This 'Martin Luther* is a titan...«. brilliant
... forceful..« commands attention!'*

Jfc —B6«fey Crowtter, N. Y. Wraw

CARO PHONE 377
THE SHOW PLACE OF THE THUMB!

NOW INSTALLED!

Our New ASTROLITE MAGNIGLOW

CINEMASCOPE Screen

The first and (MLY installation of a CINEMA-
SCOPE Screen in the THUMB, at the present time!
Come and be THRILLED by this great, new way of
presenting.motion pictures!

Our first presentation on this panoramic screen wil
be "ALL THE BROTHERS WERE VALIANT" on
Sunday, January 24.

Cass City'
A WEEK OF HITS!

FRI., SAT. • ' ' JAN. 22-23
First Showing This Territory!

Two Superb Features!

<*i IT GiTS IN YOUR \|i .
"""•'"" BLOOD AND

STAYS

HOWARD DUFF
HHENE STANLEY-DAVE VSLLOCK

MINOR WATSON

Color Cartoon

SATURDAY MIDNIGHT SHOW

"SNOW BOG"

SUN., MON. % JAN. 24-25
Thum'b's Premier!

Continuous Sunday from 3:00 p. m.

FOR THE LOVE {

OF A BEAUTIFUL j
WOMAN! l

World News and Color Cartoon

TUBS., WED.5 THURS. JAN. 26-2?
First Thumb Showing-!

FRANKIE IA1NE SING
mmm® ms
BLOWING WILD'
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Bakery Special
Guaranteed" Freshly Baked

MULLER'S Family Size!

Jelly Roll Cake
Reg. price 33c NOW ONLY

The Loaf For The "Two-Taste"
Family

MULLER'S Fresh!

Half & Half Bread
Half a loaf white, half a loaf dart

IGA yellow cling
peaches and IGA
fruit cocktail high-
light the Fiesta of
California canned
fruits. Try them in
these tempting com-
binations, and learn
why the IGA
'means top quality at
everyday low prices.

SUNSHINE KRISPY

CRACKERS

NORTHERN

^^>
DEL MONTE

Crushed NO. 2

CANS

remember IGA TABLE-RITE MEATS are always tender

TABLE-RITE QUALITY, TENDER, JUICY

Peter Pan Peanut Butter.... 12-oz. jar 39e
Watermaid Rice l-lb. pkg-, 15c
IGA Sliced Pineapple .... 2%-size can 37c
Velvet Pastry Flour 5-lb. bag 51c
Cousins Dog Meal 5-lb. bag 53c
Northern Paper Towels 2 pkgs. 37c

Tomato 46-OZ.
CANS

BLADE CUT CALIFORNIA SUNKIST
IGA TABLE-RITE Beef helps stretch

your meat dollars, delieiously, because

they're not only priced as low as market

cost permit, but selected for the tender-

ness, juiciness and fine flavor as our own

IGA beef buyers select only the very

tops of corn-fed, fully matured beef

cattle.

Boneless

Fresh Creamery

l-lb. 716

220 size
doz. 43?

WAXED

Rut Ib.

NEW

Veal Ib.

SNOW CROP FRESH FROZEN FOODS

Snow Crop Peas ~~ 2 10-oz. pkg. 37c

Snow Crop Com W. K 2 8-oz. pkg. 39c

FINEST FOOD FROZEN

Ib.

CRISP CELLO
Farmer Peets

Skinless Franks" 37c People with cash register tape for dolls turn in to
Foodtown.

Carrots pkgs.

I FOODTOWN
I IGA SUPER MARKET

DUPUI
IGA SUPER MARKET

THESE PRICES GOOD AT BOTH IGA MARKETS IN CASS CITY
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JUNIOR WOMAN'S CLUB

Continued from page one.
Juniors in an attempt to reach
$100 from this state.

The General Federation of
Women's Clubs is sponsoring an
essay contest on Americanism
for school students and the con-
test will be offered to Cass City
students through the English
Department.

Many guests were present and
the club expressed the hope that
all would become regular mem-
bers of the organization.

CEMETERY
MEMORIALS
Largest and'Finest Stock Eyer

in This Territory at Caro,
Michigan

Charles F. Mudge
Local Representative

Phone 99F14

Cumings
Memorials
PHONE 458

CARO, MICHIGAN

Meets Thursday

Twenty-one members of the
Elkland Farm Bureau met
Thursday evening at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. John Marshall.

The business meeting was con-
ducted by Chairman Edward
Golding. A gift of money and a
quantity of canned fruit was pre-
sented to Mr. and Mrs. Chris
Krug, members of the group,
who recently suffered the loss
of their home by fire.

The discussion topic, "Public
Owned Lands, and Local Taxa-
tion," was led by Mrs. Clare Car-
penter. Pictures of interesting
scenes and wild life of Michigan
were shown by Mr. Harold Tubbs
of the Michigan Conservation
Department.

A potluck lunch was served
and the February meeting will
be at the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Clinton Law.

WHEN IT FREEZES ~
AND WHEN WINTER

SNORTS AMD

We Deliver
100-lb. tanks

BOAG^CHURCHILL

HONOR 4-H LEADERS

PLUMBING *MMT/NG
YPHJLGAS*

Continued from page one.
presented awards of the gold
clover to Mrs. Lucile Hickey
Akron, for 10 years leadership
in the Graham 4-H Club, and
Loren Brady, Unionville, for the
same number of years leading
the Unionville Livestock Club.
Awards of the silver clover were
presented by Alfred Ballweg,
county agent, to Fred Starkey,
Caro; Mrs. Louis Trisch, Caro;
Mrs. Albert Vollmar, Caro; Mrs.
Preston Karr, Cass City; Win-
ford Groner, Marlette; Mr. and
Mrs. Clarence McMullen, May-
ville, and Mrs. Alex Liberacki,
Unionville. This award denotes
five years leadership.

Wes Raven, Detroit Edison
Company, Caro, and Quentin Os-
trander, assistant county agri-
cultural agent, presented the
third and fourth and first and
second year pins, respectively.
Special recognition was given to
Al Thorn, Vassar, Standard Oil
station agent, for his work with
the 4-H tractor clubs; Dave El-
dredge, Mayville High School
band director, for organizing a
4-H club band, and Wes Raven
for the close cooperation con-
tributed by the Detroit Edison
Company. Mr. Raven in turn sur-
prised the group by presenting
two framed photos, 24 in. x 18
in., of the Wilber Memorial 4-H
Club Building to Bruce Ruggles,

t president of the 4-H club coun-
| cil, and Alfred Ballweg.

Jerry Davis, international
farm youth exchange delegate
to Germany this past summer,
climaxed the program by his
fine illustrated talk on living,
working and playing experiences
with German farm families.

A competent worker cannot be
held down—or an incompetent
worker held up.

»*«HHHHĤ «H">»Ĥ <HHH»MHH«̂ ^

JYour CURTISS Repi tentative"
4 !

Linebreed Don't Outcross
NO MEMBERSHIP FEES

Call

WAYNE J. EVANS
Caro Phone 62841

^
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53 pounds. In second place is the
32-cow herd of registered and
grade Holsteins, owned by Roy
Brown, Fostoria, averaging 44.2
pounds fat; in third place is the
registered Ayrshire herd of 17
cows owned by Harold Blaylock,
Vassar, and averaging 43.5
pounds fat; in fourth place is
the 16-cow herd of grade Hoi-
steins owned by Ernest Nuerm-
inger, Saginaw, with 42.1 pounds
fat; in fifth place is the 9-cow
herd of registered Holsteins
with 41.4 pounds fat owned by
Glyde Rohlfs of Akron. Other
herds placing in top ten are Do-
Ian Sweeney, Ubly, 21-cows,
registered Holsteins with 39.5
pounds fat; Ellwood Eastman,
Cass City, 20 cows, registered
Guernseys with 38.8 pounds fat;
Ben Loeffler, Reese, 13 cows,
registered Holsteins with 38.6
pounds fat; Earl Langley, Fos-
toria, 12 cows with 38.6 pounds
fat, and George Foster, Fostoria,
47-cow herd of registered Hol-
steins with 38.3 pounds fat.

In the 305-day records _ class
for individual cows, we find a
grade Holstein cow, age 6, with
16,896 -pounds milk and 699
pounds fat to lead the parade of
41 cows in this class, said Ball-
weg. In second place is a regis-
tered Holstein, age 6, with 19,740
pounds milk and 656 pounds fat,
owned by Elmer Kern of Reese.
A registered Hoi stein, age 7,
owned by Rufus Wark, Akron,
with, 17.866 pounds milk and 649
pounds fat, stands third in this
class. Dolan Sweeney of Ublv is
the owner of a registered Hol-
stein, age 3, with 15,790 pounds
milk and 591 pounds fat to
take fourth place. A grade Hol-
stein, age 4, with 21,548 pounds
milk and 558 pounds fat to take
fifth place is owned by Floyd
Churchill of Caro. Other dairy
members with cows placing m
the top ten in this class are:
Clayton Rohlfs, Fairgrove, regis-
tered Holstein, age 3, with 14,-
936 pounds milk and 548 pounds
fat- Roy Jackson and Son, grade
Guernsey, age 10, 12,104 pounds
milk and 536 pounds fat; Rufus
Wark, Akron, registered Hol-
stein, age 4, 14,254 pounds milk
and 525 pounds fat; Mrs. Gladys
Fort, Cass City, registered Jer-
sey, age 6, 11,520 pounds milk
and 516 pounds fat, and Ross and
Clair Russell, Caro, a regis-
tered Holstein. age 5, with 16,-
220 pounds milk and 515 pounds
fat. . pro

A total of 1,482 cows in _ 73
herds were under dairy herd im-
provement association test dur-
ing December, concluded Ball-
weg.

Realty Transfers
Realty transfers in the Cass

City area as recorded at the
Register of Deed's office in
Caro this week included:

Delbert E. Rawson, Cass City,
to Charles Auten and wife of
Cass Citv. lot 3, block 17, Seeg-
er's addition to the village of
Cass City.

Jacob Patera, Novesta Town-
ship, to the Township of Noves-
ta, a piece of land in the NE%
of section 16, west 44 rods,,
north 8 rods, east 44 rods, south
8 rods; also another piece of
land in the NE1^ of section 16.
running north 298 feet, west 90
feet, south 298 feet and east 90
feet. All property in Novesta
Township.

JANUARY

TIME TO CHECK YOUR LINEN SHELVES. STOCK

UP NOW AT OUR WHITE SALE SAVINGS.

"Pacific" Contour

White Sheets

$U9twins

Snowy-white muslins woven for heavy
duty. Snug mitered corners keep sheet
wrinkle free, speeds bedmaking.

Full size $2.29

,81 x 99

Sleepwell Sheets

$1.77
Long wearing type 128 staple cotton
sheets. Seconds of a famous maker of
quality sheets.

Top Quality "Pepperell"

Bedding Needs
81 x 99 sheets „ $2.29
81 x 108 sheets $2.49
42 x 36 Cases 59c

Fine muslin, beautifully finished in a
smooth texture.

Pillow Tubing

. 67eyd-
Long wearing type 140 tubing.

Foam Rubber Pillows

$4.88 ea

Scientifically correct for most restful
slumber. Full size.

CASS CITY, MICH.
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thur Clara & Edna Clara, in-
junction.

Lyle James Thurston ^
Frank B. Tinglan, exec., of the
estate of Rose L. Thurston, de-
ceased, Charles Thurston, Grace
Wells, Howard Thurston and
Leon W. Nicholson, to establish
the ownership of stock certifi
cate.

Gouglass G. MacGregor, a;
administrator of the estate of
Florence Thoresen, deceased and
DeForest H. Haskell vs. Albin
J. Stevens, as administrator of
the estate of Oscar Thoresen,
deceased, William Henry Cas
well, as Royal Norwegian Vice
Consul, Julie Thoresen and the
unknown heirs, devisees, legatee
and assigns of the said Oscar
Thoresen, deceased.

Alma M. Trudgeon vs. Byron
F. Trudgeon, divorce.

Mary R. Taylor vs. Howard
Taylor, divorce.

In the Matter of the Petition
of the Auditor General of the
State of Michigan. For and in
behalf of said state, for the sale
of certain lands for the taxes as
sessed thereon (for the year of
1951 and previous years), May
Tax Sale.

Mildred Hutchinson vs. Har
vey L. Hutchinson, divorce.

Vance Porter vs. Lorraine
Porter, divorce.

Janet I. Karr vs. Ervin J
Karr, divorce.

James E. Sweeney vs. Edna S
Sweeney* divqrce.

Verna Jean Ward vs. Robert
Harry Ward, divorce.

Lillian Popp vs. John Popp,
divorce.
Causes in which no progress has

been made for more than
one year.

The Village of Cass City, a
Michigan Municipal Corp. for
the use and benefit of the Auto
Owners Insurance Company vs.
Leslie Rossman, trespass on the
case.

The Auto-Owners Insurance
Company, a Domestic Corpora-
tion vs. Roy Copeland, trespass
on the case. .

Azra Webb, dlbja Thumb
Radio Company vs. Michigan
Bottle Gas Company,^ Michigan
Corporation, assumpsit.

Detroit Automobile Inter., In-
surance Exc., a corporation vs.
Donald Eugene Hoover, trespass
on the case.

Fritz Mantey vs. William Mo-
line.

Wolverine Insurance Com-
pany, a Michigan Corporation
Subrogee of Wavne J. Evans vs.
George Churchill, trespass on
the case.

Ward Clark vs. Delos Green,
replevin.

Citizens Mutual Auto Insur-
ance Company, a Michigan In-
surance Association, Subrogee
of Vere Warren and Vere War-
ren vs. Stanley Wysocki, tres-
pass on the case.

Arthur A. Conger vs. Ina Jane
Conger Hopf, damages.

Lynn Boyce & Marguerite
Boyce, his wife vs. The Village
of Mayville, a Michigan Munici-
pal Corporation, damages.

Albert Pearsall & Edith M.
Pearsall, husband and wife vs.
John J. Giza & Angeline Giza,
husband and wife, specific per-
formance.

Joy E. Kay vs. Armin L. Kay,
uniform reciprocal support act.

Members Place in
Chicago Show

Recent information was re-
ceived by George C. MacQueen,
county 4-H club agent, concern-
ing participation of Tuscola
County 4-H bean club members
in the recent international hay
and grain show in Chicago.

In the navy pea bean class of
the field bean section, Bill Pike,
Fairgrove, was second; Leland
Irish, Caro, fourth; Betty Lou
King, Caro, fifth, and Carl Voll-
mar, Caro, sixth. The last three
are members of the Lewis 4-H
Club. A reported total time of
60 hours was applied to peck
sample preparation by Leland
Irish,.

Marlette Livestock
Sales Co.

Market Report Monday,
January 18, 1954

Best butcher
cattle 19.00-22.00

Medium 17.00-19.00
Commercial 15.00-17.00
Utility 10.00-14.00
Best butcher

bulls 15.00-16.50
Medium 10.00-15.00
Commercial 8.00-10.00
Stock bulls ... 36.00-95.00
Best butcher

cows 11.00-13.50
Medium 9.00-11.00
Cutters and

Canners 7.00-9.00
Top veal 33.00-36.50
Fair to good 24.00-32.00
Seconds 18.00-24.00
Common 10.00-17.00
Deacons 1.00-21.00
Top lambs 21.75-
Ewes 5.00-7.50
Top hogs 26.00-27,50
Roughs 17.00-21.00

OWENDALE
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were callers at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Ray Webster Friday
evening.

Mrs. Evelyn Kuhl and Mrs.
Amie Bailey of Ubly were guests
Monday of Mr. and Mrs. Frank
Sheufelt.

Mr. and Mrs.'Frank Sheufelt
and Mrs. May Sheufelt were
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Pete
Severn Tuesday night and also
called on Mr. and Mrs. Israel
Good.

Mr. and Mrs. ,SiIas Parker and
son, Kenneth., were Sunday din-
ner guests. of Mr. and Mrs.
Israel Good. Afternoon callers
were Mr. and Mrs. Ervin An-
drews and children, Larry and
Lesley, Mrs. May Sheufelt and
Mrs. Iva Arnott.

Wesley Parker of Frostproof,
Florida, spent two days at the
home of his parents, Mi-, and Mrs.
Silas Parker, and son, Kenneth.

Mrs. May Sheufelt had as
guests Saturday for dinner Mr.
and Mrs. Ervin Andrews and
children, Larry and Lesley, Mrs.
Iva Arnott, Mr. Les Sheufelt of
Detroit and Mr. and Mrs. Frank
Sheufelt.

Mr. and Mrs. Ervin Andrews
and children had as guests Sun-
day for dinner Mr. Les Sheufelt,
Mrs. May Sheufelt and Mrs. Iva
Arnott.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Sheufelt
had as guests Saturday for sup-
per Mrs. May Sheufelt, Mrs. Iva
Arnott, Mr. Les Sheufelt and
Mr. John Abbe and children,
Dennis and David.

Mr. and Mrs. Max Webster of
Detroit were Sunday guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Webster and
called at the home Saturday eve-
ning of Mr. and Mrs. Edgar
Cummins of Cass City.

Born to Mr. and Mrs. Ellis
Gardner at the Scheurer Hospi-
tal, Pigeon, an eight and one-half
pound girl Saturday. She will
answer to the name of Carrol
Lyn.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Webster
were in Saginaw Thursday to
visA their daughter, Arvilla, and
brought her son, Paul, with them
to spend two weeks.

Elder Archie Harder and wife
of Bay Port were guests Sunday
of the RLDS Church.' Elder
Harder was the speaker at the
11 o'clock hour.

' Mr. and Mrs. James Gimmell
were guests Sunday of Mrs. Cora
Tracey of Caro.

Mrs. Robert Brookins and
children, Cheryl and Debbie, of
Saginaw are guests of their
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Levi
Heberaly, this week.

Hurt Clara Dies
Sunday Near Lapeer

Mr. Burt Clara died suddenly
at his home in Arcadia Township,
near Lapeer, Sunday, January 17.

Funeral services were held at
2:00 p. m., Wednesday, in the
Gagetown Methodist Church with
Rev. Geo. Burlew officiating.

Mr. Clara was born in Elkland
Township, April 13, 1892, the
son of the late Mr. and Mrs.
George Clara.

On October 2, 1912, he married
Miss Grace Krug. Following their
marriage, they made their home
on a farm near Gagetown.

For the past seven and one-half
years, Mr. Clara has been super-
intendent of the Verner Farms
near Lapeer.

He was a member of the Acme
Lodge No. 446 F. & A. M. of
GSgetown.

Surviving are his wife; four
daughters, Miss Berneice Clara
and Mrs. Tom (Mildred) Down-
ing, both of Gagetown, Mrs.
Walter (Marion) Woidan of Lum
and Mrs. Henry (Lorene) Austin

of Bad Axe; one son, Mr. Geo.
Clara of Cass City; four sisters,
Mrs. Harvey Krug, Atlanta,
Geoi-gia, Mrs. Earl Russell, Gage-
town, Mrs. George Urlich of
Toledd, Ohio, and Miss Maybelle
Clara of Birmingham; two broth-
ers, Mr. Ralph Clara of Pontiac
and Mr. Arthur Clara of Gage-
town, and thirteen grandchildren.

Committal services were under
the auspices of Acme Lodge No.
446 F. & A. M. of Gagetown and
burial was in Elkland Cemetery.

Little's Funeral Home was in
charge.

Saginaw Pastor at
Methodist Church

At the monthly meeting of
Methodist Men, Monday, Jaiiu-
aiy 25, Dr. Hugh Townley, pas-
tor of Ames Methodist Church
in Saginaw, will show pictures
taken on his recent two months'
trip around the 'world.

He will have time for just a
part of the series at this meet-
ing, so will concentrate on "The
Holy Land, Yesterday and To-

day."
Cass City Methodist Men will"

entertain the men of the North-
ern Sub-district at this meeting
for which dinner is scheduled at
7:30 p. m.

New Gnemasoope
Screen at Strand

Authorities at the Strand
Theatre in Caro announced today
that a new cinemascope screen
would be installed this week.

The giant astrolite magniglow
silver screen is the same type
that was recently installed in
Radio City Music Hall in New
York. The screen has a surface
of pure silver and is installed
with a slight curve, according to
H. H. Weeks, Strand Theatre
manager.

More uniform light distribu-
tion and more brilliant, true»to-
life color rendition are some of
the advantages of this screen,
Weeks said.

First picture to be seen on the
new screen will be "All the
Brothers Were Valiant."

Advertise it in the Chronicle.

CASS CITY
HIGH SCHOOL

CASS CITY
vs.

SAGINAW
S. S. PETER &• RAUL

JANUARY 26
STARTING AT 7 P. M. ?

ADMISSION
Adults 50c Students 25c

<&
MEMO TO'ADVERTISERS

to the
Our local stores are the display rooms and ware-
houses for the world's finest products. Efficient
banking, insurance, real estate and other business
services are also available to the people in our
community. The readers of this newspaper find
our advertising columns a dependable guide to
the point of sale—a useful source for up-to-date
news and information about these goods and
services.

In order that advertising expenditures may be
made with us on the basis of known values, as
required for any sound business investment, this
newspaper is a member of the Audit Bureau
of Circulations.

Every advertiser should know about A.B.C.
The Bureau is a cooperative, non-profit asso-
ciation Df 3,450 publishers, advertisers and ad-
vertising agencies. Working together, these buy-
ers and sellers of advertising establish standards

for paid circulation, rules and methods for audit-
ing and reporting the circulations of newspapers
and periodicals.

At regular intervals one of the Bureau's large
staff of experienced circulation auditors visits us
to make a thorough audit of our circulation
records. The FACTS established by his audit are'
published by the Bureau in A.B.C, reports which
are available to you, our advertisers. These re-
ports tell you how much circulation we have,
where it goes, how it is sold and other FACTS
essential to^the profitable use of newspaper adver-
tising. Ask us for a copy of our A.B.C. report.

t E O

THE CASS CITY CHRONICLE


	CCC
	01-08-1954
	01-15-1954
	01-22-1954
	01-29-1954
	02-05-1954
	02-12-1954
	02-19-1954
	02-26-1954
	03-05-1954
	03-12-1954
	03-19-1954
	03-26-1954
	04-02-1954
	04-09-1954
	04-16-1954
	04-23-1954
	04-30-1954
	05-07-1954
	05-14-1954
	05-21-1954
	05-28-1954
	06-04-1954
	06-11-1954
	06-18-1954
	06-25-1954
	07-02-1954
	07-09-1954
	07-16-1954
	07-23-1954
	07-30-1954
	08-06-1954
	08-13-1954
	08-20-1954
	08-27-1954
	09-03-1954
	09-10-1954
	09-17-1954
	09-24-1954
	10-01-1954
	10-08-1954
	10-15-1954
	10-22-1954
	10-29-1954
	11-05-1954
	11-12-1954
	11-19-1954
	11-26-1954
	12-03-1954
	12-10-1954
	12-17-1954
	12-24-1954
	12-31-1954


