
General Cable, Walbro head top village taxpayers
Cass City's top ten indus-

trial and commercial taxpay-
ers contributed nearly 34 per
cent of the total real and
personal property taxes col-
lected by the village in 1975,
according to tax roll figures.

The figures also show that
the village's top two taxpay-
ers contributed over $33,000
toward r u n n i n g munic ipa l
government last year.

Records show the top tax-
payer . was General Cable
Corporation which paid
$17,281.39. The total included
$7,221.50 in real property
levies and $10,059.89 in per-
sonal property taxes.
-GeneralCable, the village's

largest employer, paid slight-
ly over $1,500" more in prop-
erty taxes than did Walbro
Corp., which chipped in with

$15,741.56. Walbro's personal
property tax bill stood at
$13,217.97, over $3,000 more
than General Cable's.

At the same time, Walbro's
real property tax bill stood at
$2,523.59.

The two businesses led the
list of top ten commercial and
industrial taxpayers by a
wide margin in 1975.

Next closest on the list was
Provincial House, Inc., which
paid a total tax bill of
$5,904.56, including $5,252 in
real property levies. This was
the second full year that
Provincial House's 117-bed
nursing home was on village
tax rolls. It began operations
in October of 1973.

Fourth highest taxpayer in
Cass City last year was De-
troit Edison Co., which paid

$2,870.88, with over 99 per
cent of that total in personal
property tax on power lines,
poles and transformers.

Following Edison was
Smith Builders, owners of
Hillside Colonial Apartments,
with a tax bill of $2,035.15, all
in real property. The firm
operates four apar tment
buildings in the village, and
began construction in 1972.

Cass City's sixth largest
taxpayer was Anrod Screen
Cylinder Co., with an outlay
of $2,034.96, i n c l u d i n g a
$1,358.96 personal property
tax bill.

Anrod has operated in Cass
City since 1954 and at its
present Garfield Street loca-
tion since 1960.

The seventh largest prop-

erty tax bill mailed in 1975
went to Wickes Agriculture,
Inc., which operates Cass
City's grain elevator. Wickes'
total levy was $1,578.23, with
$970.31 in real property tax
and $607.92 in personal levies.

Wickes is placing the finish-
ing touches on two new grain
silos that will add 250,000
bushels of storage space to
the present 150,000 bushel
capacity.

Cass City's number eight
taxpayer was Southeastern
Michigan Gas Co., with a
personal property tax bill of
$1,572.32. It paid no real prop-
erty tax.

Southeastern has operated
in Cass City since 1964.

Ninth on the list was Bauer
Candy Company which paid a
total tax bill of $1,385.22. The

levy included $925.67 in per-
sonal property taxes and
$459.55 in real property taxes.

Bauer Candy has operated
in Cass City since 1948, mov-
ing to its present 14,000
square-foot building on Doerr
Road in 1972.

Cass City's 10th largest tax-
payer was Marshall Distr i-
buting Co., which paid a
$1,259.17 tax bill. The levy
included $1,022.83 in persona'l
property taxes and $236.34 in
real property levies.

Marshall's operates a large
wholesale and retail outlet
dealing largely in snowmobile
parts and accessories.

The total bill levied against
the village's top 10 taxpayers
hit $51,662.44. Overall village
tax collections were budgeted
at $153,000 for the year 1975.

Another large contributor
to Cass City's tax base last
year was IBM Corporation
which paid $1,003.79 in per-
sonal property taxes. These
were applied against ma-
chines the firm owns and
leases to businesses within
the village l imi ts , Treasurer
Mrs. Celia House explained.

CHANGKS

The tax picture could be
altered in 1976 since the
state's new single business
tax has become law. Under
the new statute, personal
property taxes are largely
eliminated.

At a recent council meet-
ing, Village President Lam-
bert Althaver explained that
villages should receive some

additional state shared reve-
nues to offset this loss, but
just how much is still an open
question.

A move is currently under-
way in the Michigan Legis-

lature to revise the contro-
versial law before 1976 tax
collections begin to ease what
some legislators see as a
heavy burden on the small
businessman.

CASS CITY'S TOP TEN TAXPAYERS IN 1975

1. General Cable Corp.
2. Walbro Corp.
3. Provincial House
4. Detroit Edison
5. Smith Builders
6. Anrod Screen Cyl.
7. Wickes
8. S.E.Mich. Gas
9. Bauer Candy Co.

10. Marshall Dist.

Note: These figures are VILLAGE taxes only and do not
include tax payments made to Elkland township.
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A TUSCOLA County Sheriff's deputy investigates the scene of a snowmobile accident that
took the life of Harold Isard, 35, Cass City, late Saturday night on Milligan Road, north of Cass
City. Isard's snowmobile struck a stranded car around 10:50 p.m. (Neitzel Photo).

retirement for her

Work keeps Anne Mitchell

happy, youthful at 75
If you're going lo operate a

= les taurant , you've got to like
• people. And you've got to be

a m b i t i o u s . Anne M i t c h e l l
1 qual i f ies on all counts.

The energetic owner of
Ciossroacls Restaurant, lo-

" cated nine miles northeast of
Cass City, has operated the

= cozy ea t ing e s t a b l i s h m e n t
since 1961. Before that , she

• operated a successful res-
taurant in Dearborn for 11
years.

In all that lime, she's never
: lost her interest in people or
• in serving food they like. And

she has no plans to change
things now.

1 "You know, this country
and I arc going to celebrate
miles tone b i r t hdays this
year," the vivacious Miss
Mitchell said as she settled
into a booth, sipping a steam-
ing cup of coffee. "I'll be 76
this year."

She doesn't look it-or act it.
That's because she's stayed
active, she says. It's her
secret for happiness,

i "Older people need to be
' active," Miss Mitchell says.

"I've been pressured to re-
tire, but I'm not ready. I'm
too young to retire."

For Miss Mitchell, the in-
side of a restaurant has been
home since 1949. That was the
year she and a friend decided
to go into business for them-
selves as restaurant propri-
etors.

"Neither one of us had had
any prior experience in res-
taurant work," she recalled.
"Since I had cooked for
thrashers back home on the
farm, I was elected as cook."

It wasn't long, however,
before Miss Mitchell was on
her own. Her partner died of a
heart attack after the first
year of their partnership. For
the next 10 years, she was on
her own.

She ran the business suc-
cessfully unti l 1960 when the
building was sold and she had
to leave.

At that point , Miss Mitchel l
said, she was ready to return
"home".

"I was born and raised on a
farm just outside Shabhona,"
she said, "and I went to
Detroit in 1923-mostly to see
what the big city was like and
also because I wanted'a job."

More want out

From then unti l 1949, she
worked at a variety of jobs.
She was employed by Michi-
gan Bell Telephone Co., and
department stores in Detroit.

"Those were in Depression
times and let me tell you
things were rough," she re-
called. "I stayed in the city
unt i l my mother died and then
I came back home and stayed
w i t h my f a t h e r u n t i l he
passed away. That's when I

returned to Dearborn and
went into the restaurant busi-
ness."

CROSSROADS

Her return to the Thumb
and purchase of Crossroads
didn't get off to a rousing
start. She recalled the recep-
tion she got when one person
learned she had purchased

Concluded on page 2.

Owen-Gage faces more

property transfers
The Owen-Gage School Dis-

trict has been hit. with yet
another property transfer re-
quest amounting to nearly
nine per cent of the district.

Petitions were filed last
week with the Huron Inter-
mediate Board of Education
requesting the transfer to the
Unionvil le-Sebewaing dis-
trict.

Filed under the auspices of
Orville Gremel of Riskey
Road, Sebewaing, the prop-
erty lies in Brookfield town-
ship north of Bach Road and
also includes one parcel in
Sebewaing township.

While final State Equalized
Valuation figures are not yet
available, according to Inter-
mediate Supt. James Mc-
Bride, estimated value is in
excess of-$l million.

The transfer would involve

about 20 students, McBride
said.

McBride explained a form-
al hearing on the petitions will
probably be conducted in late
February before a combined
Huron-Tuscola Intermediate
Board. He said a combined
board would be necessary
since property in the Huron
district is seeking transfer to
the Tuscola district.

"Right now, it's too soon to
provide much concrete in-
formation," McBride said.

The superintendent also
confirmed that a single parcel
in the northwest corner of
Brookfield township is seek-
ing transfer from Owen-Gage
to the Laker School District.
Four students are involved.

Another single parcel is
seeking transfer back to the
Laker district. Originally in-

cluded in the Ellenbaum
transfer of last year, it re-
quested and was granted
transfer back to Owen-Gage
last October.

Since then, the owner has
reportedly decided to seek re-
instatement at Lakers.

A hearing on this parcel will
be conducted at the State
Board of Education when it
rules on an appeal by Owen-
Gage protesting the Ellen-
baum transfer.

In the meantime, a large
portion of the district in the
southwest corner is still
awaiting a decision by the
State Board to transfer to the
Cass City School District.

A decision on this request is
expected at either the March
or April session, informed
sources have said.

Strikes parked car

Harold Isard killed

in snowmobile crash
A 35-year-old Cass City man

was killed late Saturday night
when the snowmobile he was
riding slammed into a parked
car on Milligan Road, a mile
northeast of Cass City.

Harold Isard was pro-
nounced dead on arrival at
Hills and Dales General Hos-
pital.

According to the Tuscola
County Sheriff's officers' re-
port, Isard was riding his
snowmobile east on Milligan
Road at 10:50 p.m. when he
hit the auto which had be-
come stuck. The car's owner,
Wayne Ensign of Dorrance
Road, Kingston, had left the
vehicle to get help.

^Deputies said the car was
partly on the roadway.

A witness to the tragic
accident told officers Isard
and a group of friends had
gotten together to go snow-
mobiling and were returning
from Gagetown.

JackStahlbaum, Cass City,
a member of the party, said
he was following Isard about
30 yards behind at about 50-55
miles an hour. Stahlbaum told
off icers Isard apparent ly
didn't see the parked vehicle
on the edge of the roadway
until it was too late.

Isard reportedly tried to
swerve but caught a corner of
the car.

Ensign told police his car
slid into the ditch along Milli-
gan Road about 9:30 that
evening and he had gone to
get help to pull the car out. He
had stopped in Wilmot for a
short time and when he re-
turned, he discovered the car

missing and called Sheriff 's
deputies.

Deputies noted it was im-
possible to determine exactly
where the snowmobile struck
the car because it had been
removed to a nearby home
before officers arrived at the
scene.

bro Corp. in 1965 in the
personnel department and be-
came manufacturing man-
ager in 1972.

He was a member of the
T r i n i t y United Methodist
church of Cass City.

He is survived by his wid-
ow ; one son, Matthew and one
daughter, Andrea, both of
Cass City; his mother, Mrs.
Dorothy Isard of Omaha,
Neb.; one brother, DeLoss of
Cheboygan; two sisters, Mrs.
Shirley Harding of Omaha,
and Mrs. Michael (Kath-
erine) Tracy of Carp Lake,

and his stepmother, Mrs.
Elizabeth Isard of Mackinaw
City.

The funeral was held Tues-
day from Tr in i ty United
Methodist church with Rev.
E.D.K. Isaacs, pastor, offici-
ating.

A service was scheduled
Thursday at the Nordman
Funeral Home in Cheboygan
with Rev. Dorothy Kling of
the First Congregational
church of Cheboygan, offici-
ating.

Burial will be in Lakeview
cemetery, Mackinaw City.

Valuations to rise

in area townships

HAROLD ISARD

Isard was born Jan. 3, 1941,
in Omaha, Neb., son of Mrs.
Dorothy Wielandt Isard and
the late Harold Isard;

He came to Cheboygan in
1955 from Nebraska. He mar-
ried Margo Schmalzried in
Levering, Mich., Sept. 17,
1963. The couple moved to
Cass City from Mi. Pleasant
in 1965.

He was employed-by Wal-

Elkland township residen-
tial property owners can look
forward to increased valua-
tions following a decision by
township Supervisor Edwin
Karr to spread an average
18 M; per cent increase.

Karr said Tuesday he de-
cided to spread the increase
as recommended by the
County Equalization Depart-
ment because it will cost
township taxpayers less in the
long run.

"If we had gone to a factor,
we would have received no
credit for it (in increased
valuations) and we'd remain
at our same level," Karr said.
"Then we would probably

MISS ANNE MITCHELL, 75, has been in front of a grill and oven
in a restaurant for over a qu^rteif-century and has no early plans to
retire. Miss Mitchell has owned Crossroads Restaurant since 1961.

have had to take another
increase next year on residen-
tial property."

The increase wi l l add
$1,434,072 to the value of the
township, boosting the total to
$9,192,772. The added value
will be spread on residential
property on ly , Ka'rr ex-
plained, since commercial
property is studied each year
and small adjustments made.
He said this is done because of
a lack of large commercial
sales on which to base a
study.

He said the added vafue is
based on sales for the previ-
ous three years, adding that
the increases apply only to
existing property and do not
inc lude property recently
added to the rolls.

"If we had taken a 10 per
cent factor from the county, it
would have gone on all prop-
erty including agricultural,"
Karr said. "Then next year,
the ag property would have
gotten it again and we would
still be at the same value
level."

Karr blamed the increases
on cont inued double-digit
inflation.

"If you get the inflation
controlled, then maybe some
of these values will stabilize a
little," he said.

"Actually, this isn't all
b'ad," he said. "If you own a
home, it shows someone is in-
terested in buying it and that
it's a good investment'."

Novesta Township Super-
visor Gail Parrott said he
plans to spread an average 14
per cent increase on residen-
tial property. The increase
translates into an additional
$224,760 bringing the total
township value to $5,951,360,
excluding new property,

"Basically, I felt it was a
legality (to raise) more than
anything else," Parrott said.
"I felt we should go along
with the law because if we
didn't, we'd get hit with a
factor."

Elmwood Township Super-
visor Roy Messer said
Wednesday morning he plans
to spread an average 18 per
cent increase on residential
property. The increase will
add another $250,000 to the
value of the township, Messer
said. ..* , „ . ' ' • • ,

"I felt this is whatV had to
do," Messer said^ ''I was
afraid of what might happen
if we didn't. As far as I could
see, it's the law and we had to
go along with it."
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A VISITATION of the O.E.S. Grand Family was held at Echo
Chapter No. 337 Wednesday, Jan. 14, in Cass City. Shown are (from
the left) Worthy Matron Theda Seeger, Worthy Grand Matron
Mrs. Beatrice Dole and Worthy Patron of Echo Chapter and Tyler
Lodge Ed Golding Sr. (Neitzel Photo).

Anne Mitchell thrives on work
Continued from page one

the establishment.
"I remember they told me

well, you know that place has
changed hands so often, I
doubt whether or not you'll
last out there. We probably
won't see you around too
long."

The business is now com-
pleting its 15th year under
Miss Mitchel l ' s ownership
and has been a success.

"I always thought my res-
taurant kitchen should be just
the way it would be at home,"
she said. "To me, home-
cooked food means more than
fancy equipment."

She's using equipment pur-
chased originally in 1950.
Maintaining the ovens, grills
and everything else in a res-
taurant is a full-time job, she
says.

"I haven't met a restaurant
owner yet who hasn't felt as
though he was tied to his
place with a ball and chain,"
she says. "But I love it. This
place is like home to a lot of
people. Sometimes someone
who's all alone will come in
every day. I try to visit with
them and they stay as long as
they like. I enjoy that."

She says people haven't
changed too much in over 25
years as a restaurant owner.
Their appetites haven't eith-
er, she added. They still like
the basics-roasts, ham and
chicken.

She doesn't put much stock
in new-fangled quick-cooking
techniques employed at
nationwide fast-food chains.
"Oh, I suppose it's all right if
you're in a hurry," she said.
"But somehow I think you
lose some of the flavor of the
food."

Miss Mitchell still oversees
operations at her restaurant,
even though time and health
problems have forced her to
cut back from her normal
14-hour-a-day schedule she
once maintained. She has
only one full-t ime and one
part-time employee to help
her operate the business.

So far, though, it's worked
out well. "I work as much as I
can within limits," she said.
"There's always something to
do around here, you know."

Miss Mitchell firmly be-
lieves older persons need to
remain active. "This res-
taurant is what's kept me
going," she said. "It certainly
beats sitting in my house and
feeling sorry for myself."

Don't look for Anne Mitch-
ell to sit around feeling sorry
for herself-ever. She'll be too
busy for that.

imruiunm IIUIIUL.
ELECTRICAL PERMITS

51. It shall be unlawful in the state for any person to proceed with any electrical work
which falls within the scope of the act without applying to the board for a permit within
24 hours of the time the work was started. A permit to do the work shall be issued if the
application is properly submitted with the necessary inspection fees.

Electrical permits must be obtained by an Electrical
Contractor, or a homeowner installing his own electrical.

Electrical Permits must be obtained from the Tuscola
Department of Public Works, Building Codes Division, in the
basement of the Court House, beginning February 2, 1976.

BUILDING PERMIT REMINDER:

The law requires that all buildings constructed, new, additions,
alterations, removal or change of use of any structure, except
ordinary repairs such as painting, siding, roofing, interior
paneling and such that does not change the size or structural
components of a building.

To obtain a building permit you must present a zoning permit
from your Township or Village, a sewage permit from the
Thumb District Health Department, and plans and specifica-
tions.

Telephone 517-673-6124

Tuscola County Department of Public Works
Building Codes Division (Basement of the Court House)

Cass City Social and Personal Items Mrs. Reva Little

Phone 872-3698

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Fink-
beiner returned home Thurs-
day from a three weeks' trip
to Florida. They were accom-
panied by their grandson,
Douglas Holland of Sebe-
waing. Their trip included a
day at Disney World. Also,
they met in Florida, Mrs.
Finkbeiner's sister and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Sow-
den of Clarkston. En route
home, they spent two days in
Dayton, Ohio, with Mr. and
Mrs. Ed Seabrook.

Mr. and Mrs. Garrison
Stine, sons Scott and Randy
and Mr. and Mrs. Roger
Nicholas and daughters of
Kawkawlin went to Tri-City
airport Friday night to meet
the Stines' daughter, Mrs.
Kenneth Marker, and 13-
month-old daughter Stacie as
they arrived home from Italy.
They had been there 11
months where Kenneth Mark-
er is serving with the Air
Force. He will arrive in Feb-
ruary and after a few days
here, will go to Wurtsmith
AFB at Oscoda. Mrs. Marker
and Stacie are staying with
the Peter Markers at Col-
wood.

William Finkbeiner, sons
Matthew and Bill and Ms.
Marsha Finkle and daughter
Heather of Pontiac were Sun-
day dinner guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Lloyd Finkbeiner.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Cut-
ler of Saginaw were visitors
Saturday at the Lyle Louns-
bury home and spent most of
the day with Mrs. Cutler's
mother, Mrs. Eliza Morse at
Provincial House.

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Nich-
olas and daughters of Kaw-
kawlin were Sunday guests at
the Garrison Stine home.

Mrs. Charles Peasley re-
turned to her home Tuesday,
Jan. 13, from Hills and Dales
General Hospital. Friday
they brought home from Sag-
inaw General Hospital, their
infant daughter, Shawna, who
had been a patient there.

Dr. and Mrs. E.C. Fritz had
as week-end guests, his sister
and husband, Mr. and Mrs.
Edgar Smith of Troy.

Mr. and Mrs. C.R. Hunt left '
Friday to visit the Gerald
Forthuns in Ann Arbor and
from there went to Bonita
Springs, Fla., for the rest of
the winter.

Local women who went to
Saginaw Tuesday, Jan. 13, to
attend one of the Town Hall
series were Mrs. E.C. Fritz,
Mrs. Cliff Ryan, Mrs. Robert
Oilman, Mrs. Gilbert Albee,
Mrs. H.T. Donahue, Miss Ver-
nita Knight, Mrs. D.E. Raw-
son and Mrs. Nathaniel Tut-
tle. The entertainer .was Bill
Schustik, a folk singer.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Coleman
of Janesville, Wisconsin, vis-
ited their aunt, Mrs. Orilla
McKee, Saturday and Sun-
day.

BPW meets

Jan. 7
The monthly meeting of the

Business and Professional
Women's Club was held Jan. 7
at Veronica's Restaurant.

During the business meet-
ing, members voted a $50.00
contribution to the Cancer
Fund. New members wel-
comed were Mrs. Alice Mc-
Comb, Miss Beverly Hurley
and Mrs. Marilyn Alexander.
The club has now equalized
its membership for the year,
plus one.

Guest speaker for the meet-
ing was Jacob Mortensen,
exchange student from Den-
mark.

Miss Donna DeLong will fly
this week end to Bradenton,
Fla., where her grandmother,
Mrs. Howard Loomis is the
guest of Mr. and Mrs! Clare
Hanes. Miss DeLong and Mrs.
Loomis will return to Cass
City the first week in Feb-
ruary.

The Youth Fellowship and
the Faithful Followers of
Salem UM church met Sun-
day at 5:30 p.m. at the church
for a surprise birthday party
for Deb Walter, who was
marking her 18th birthday.
Each person attending con-
tributed a penny per pound of
his or her weight which went
to Miss Walter for her Camp-
us Sweetheart campaign
fund. Ice cream and cake
were served.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Hutch-
inson, Jane, Greg, Jill and
Joan were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Stan
Guinther, Sandy and Mark.
Rod Hutchinson was an after-
noon caller.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest
Beardsley had as guests for
several days this week,
cousins of Mrs. Beardsley,
Rev. and Mrs. Percy Rainey
of Markdale, Ont.

Shegitz-Wolak

vows spoken

Dec. 13

Miss Elaine M. Wolak and
Steve G. Shegitz were mar-
ried Dec. 13, in a double-ring
ceremony held at St. Rene
Catholic church in Sterling
Heights.

The bride is the daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Wolak of
Kingston. The bridegroom is
the son of Mr. and Mrs.
Joseph Shegitz of Camden,
Mich.

Maid of honor was Alice
Wolak, sister of the bride.

Ed Barant, friend of the
groom, was best man. Ray
Wolak, brother of the bride,
served as usher.

A reception following the
ceremony was held at St.
Dennis School in Sterling
Heights.

Following a trip to the west
coast, the couple will make
their home in Sterling
Heights.

Hills and Dales
General Hospital
BIRTHS:

Jan. 12, to Mr. and Mrs.
Gary Becker of Fairgrove, a
boy, Mark Frederick.

Jan. 15, to Mr. and Mrs.
James Sting of Sebewaing, a
girl, Jam! Sue.

Jan. 16, to Mr. and Mrs.
Steve Fosdick of Owendale, a
boy, Travis Wade.

PATIENTS LISTED MON-
DAY, JAN. 19, WERE:

Luis Arroyo, Paul Hill, Mrs.
David Ashmore, Mrs. Vir-
ginia Chisholm, Delbert
Gracey, Mrs. Frances Justin
and Mrs. Laura Smith of Cass
City;

Nancy Hartsell and Mrs.
Theron Hopper of Deford;

Lawrence Steely of Decker;
Lisa Gaeth of Unionville;
James Thorp, Ryan Pom-

eroy and Mrs. Minnie Boug-
han of Caro;

Henry Austin of Bad Axe;
Mrs. Alma Davis and Mrs.

Lyman Hull of Gagetown;
Fred Strassburg of Kings-

ton ;
Mrs. Michael Retzler and

David Peters II of Owendale.

Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Ko-
zan were in Detroit from
Saturday until Monday.

Mrs. Mike Murphy of Gage-
town was guest of honor
Sunday afternoon at a pink
and blue shower in the lounge
of Trinity UM church. Host-
esses were Kris O'Dell, Kath-
leen Toner and Mrs. Scott
Hartel. Some 40 relatives and
friends attended. Out-of-town
guests were Mrs. Irvin Kritz-
man of Millersburg, Ind., and
Miss Lillian Dunlap of Caro.

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Murphy
and sons Scott and Patrick
celebrated Patr ick 's 5th
birthday, which was Jan. 20,
Saturday evening when they
attended the Shrine Circus in
Saginaw.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Kritz-
man will leave by plane Jan.
23 to spend three weeks with
relatives in California and
Phoenix, Ariz. Mr. and Mrs.
Mike Murphy of Gagetown
will live in their home while
they are absent.

Mr. and Mrs. Dave Loomis
and family had as Sunday
afternoon and evening guests,
Mrs. Loomis' parents, Mr.
and Mrs. Raymond Partlo of
Akron and her aunt and uncle,
Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Neu of
Unionville.

Mr. and Mrs. Irvin Kritz-
man and daughter Gretchen
of Millersburg, Ind., were
Saturday night guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Bruce Kritzman.

ENGAGED

MARCY DIANNE MILLER

Mr. and Mrs. Delmar J.
Miller of Owendale announce
the engagement of their
daughter, Marcy Dianne, to
Richard Brinkman, son of
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Brink-
man of Cass City.

The bride-elect is a 1975
graduate of Cass City High
School and is a nursing stu-
dent at Lake Superior State
College, Sault Ste. Marie.

The prospective bride-
groom is a 1975 graduate of
Owen-Gage High School and
is also attending Lake Su-
perior State College..

Wedding plans are indefi-
nite.

Anne Marie Lorentzen of
Saginaw spent the week-end
with her parents, Mr. and
Mrs. Don Lorentzen.

Tim Finkbeiner and Kurt
Spellman of Cincinnati, Ohio,
left Tuesday after spending a
week with Mr. and Mrs.
George Fisher Sr. Other Sun-
day guests at the Fisher home
were Alice and Cathy Fink-
beiner of Deford and Mr. and
Mrs. Don Finkbeiner and
family.

Mrs. Ella Cumper has re-
turned home after spending a
month with her stepdaughter,
Mrs. Wayne Welch, and fam-
ily at Fairfax, Va.

Marriage Licenses
John Richard Andersen, 26,

Caro, and Mary Catherine
Gingrich, 20, Caro.

Robert Michael Murphy, 33,
Troy, and Kathleen Elaine
Weber, 26, Richville.

Charles Anthony Schlaud,
26, Kingston, and Sandra
Jean Weber, 19, Millington.

Ronald Dean Snyder Jr., 18,
Millington, and Jean Marie
Elore, 18, Millington.

Joseph Sam Milazzo, 36,
Mayville, and Dawn Denise
Torrez, 21, Mayville.

Tim Lee Hutchinson, 20,
Caro, and Terrie Ann Leach,
20, Caro.

Gerald Lee Dziesinski, 23,
Ossineke, and Maureen
Esther Weber, 17, Millington.

Dean Jack Buchinger, 19,
Reese, and Sheryl TJrma
Gage, 18, Vassar.

David Lynn Harris 28, La-
peer, and Kathleen Nora
Blasius, 27, Caro.

About 45 were present Mon-
day evening at the Novesta
Church of Christ for a meet-
ing of the Eastern District

'Christian Men's Fellowship
The next meeting will be at
the Pine Run church.

Deacons of the Novesta
Church of Christ will meet
Sunday, Jan. 25, at 2 p.m. at
the church. Also scheduled
for Feb. 14, at 7:30 a.m. is a
prayer breakfast for women

Mr. and Mrs. William Mar-..
tus Sr. spent Sunday with
their daughter and family,
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Zielke
and children at Battle Creek.

Mrs. James Mclntosh and
Mrs. Theda Seeger were
week-end guests of Mrs.
Seeger's niece and husband,
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Heintz at
Berkley. Sunday, they at-
tended the Greenfield Presby-
terian church where Mrs.
Heintz was installed during
the service as an Elder.
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FREE! PRIVATE
BANQUET ROOM

For Parties of All Kinds

j9\U &k BIRTHDAY

OFFICE

REHEARSAL

BUSINESS

j SALAD BAR WITH YOUR ~!
! DINNER j
I Nightly 4:30-9:30 Sunday 11-7 )

FRIDAY SEAFOOD BUFFET
All you can eat-Fresh Lake Perch,
Shrimp, Clams, Chicken.

Includes Salad Bar
SATURDAY-MUSIC BY "THREE R's"

WILDWOOD FARM RESTAURANT
1/4 mile south of M-81 on M-53 Phone 872-2720

Want Help Finding What You Want?
Try The Want-Ads Today!

PEERING PACKING
5 miles south of Kingston and 3 1/2 west on E. Mayville Road

* FRESH COUNTER MEATS
* FULL LINE OF GROCERIES & VEGETABLES

PORK-BEEF
BY

HALVES or QUARTERS

CUSTOM
SLAUGHTERING
TUESDAYS-FRIDAYS

OPEN 7 M°n' thrU Thurs' and Saturday 8 a.m.
to 6 p.m. Friday - 8 a.m. to 8 p.m.

DAYS WEEK Sundays - 10 a.m. to 5 p.m.

PHONE 761-7073

THERE IS STILL TIME TO OPEN A 1976

CHRISTMAS CLUB ACCOUNT
You will be glad you did when next December comes.

THE PINNEY STATE BANK
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• "If It F i tz . . . "
Is the left turn right

BY JIM FITZGERALD

The idea was to get to know
my 2 teenage kids again. I
•night learn to like them
""gain, the way I did when
hey were tiny and I could 1

-uddle them in my arms and
•asily lock them in a cup-
>oard.

So we drove to Florida for a
ioliday vacation. Ma, Pa,
'7-year-old Ed and 19-year-
>ld Christy, packed with all
>ur earthly tape decks and
•lectric curlers into our (!-
'ear-old gas-gulping Oklsmo-

bile. 3,029 miles round-trip
with stops at several motels
to watch the toilets overflow.

God help us all .
It was our f i rs t f ami ly

vacation in at least 5 years.
We took the kids everywhere
with us when they were l i t t le
because t ha t ' s " wha t Al l
American families always did
on Saturday Evening Post
covers. We went the complete
oute Together, Waltons on

wheels, visit ing the Mayflow-
er, Parrot Jungle and 1,456
lopping seals.

Then, one day in St. Louis,
vhile my neck was still sore
rom looking up at McDon-
ild's biggest arch, the kids
•new up.

They announced they were
bored sick with Ma and Pa
and the amusement-park l ife.
They didn' t want to follow the
pioneer trail , marked only by
billboards, to the village of

j FORMAL WEAR

RYAN'S
I Men's Wear and
Formal Wear Rental
Phone 872-3431

the Neon Indian. They wanted
. to go home and see their

friends.
It was an Emancipation

Proclamation and from that
day on, my wife and I trav-
eled free. The children stayed
home with the peanut butter.
It was marvelous to check
into a Holiday Inn and be
reminded why the word
"motel" is a double entendre
when Johnny Carson says it.

But, just like in a Chester
Morris movie, the calendar
pages flipped. Came Christ-
mas 1975 and an invitation to
rev i s i t our f avo r i t e spot ,
beaut i fu l Marco Island on the
west coast of Florida. Sud-
denly my wife decided her 2
youngest had to see the island
before they were too old for
me to pay for i t . And the lousy
kids agreed to go, not because
they really wanted to, but
because they like to hear me
sob hysterically.

So I got to know my kids
again. I learned important
things:

Ed is no problem traveling
if you don't mind nudging
and pushing and otherwise
guiding him between bed and
board. He can't respond to
spoken directions because 2
earphones have become per-
manently attached to his
head. He carries a tape play-
er everywhere, with spare
batteries in every pocket and
extra Frank Zappa tapes in
his mouth. (If you don't know
who Frank Zappa is, say
thank you to God.)

Christy always agrees with
her mother. This meant I had
no chance of winning the
domestic disputes which in-
evitably occur along the free-

way.
When I am the pilot, my

wife is navigator, in charge of
reading all maps and signs. I
require explicit instructions
and constant reassurance.
When the proper procedure
toward Florida is to turn left
at the next exit , I want to he-
given tha t information sev-
eral times as I approach the
turn. When, for the 15th t ime,
I ask, "Is this where I turn
left?" I do not appreciate
such answers as "Right, un-
less you want to go into the
ocean."

Such sarcasm is dangerous.
Obviously, when the navi-
gator is asked if a left turn is
the right turn, she should not
answer "right," she should
say "correct." When the navi-
gator consistently refuses to
obey these most rudimentary
rules of safety, the pilot is
certainly justified in scream-
ing and pounding the steering
wheel and threatening to kill.

But my wife doesn't see it
that way and ne i the r , I
learned during this rebirth of
blessed fatherhood, does our
darling daughter. It was 2
against 1 all the way, with no
help from my son because the
angriest pilot in the world
can ' t holler louder than
Frank Zappa.

I didn't win one argument
in 3,000 miles. Onward and
Upward, except when you
turn left, right?
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Low bid nearly loses

Commissioners
okay police car bids

DOWN AND OUT

A slip of the foot may break
a bone or two, but a slip of the
tongue could break someone
else up permanently.

The Tuscola County Board
of Commissioners cont inued
their long January session
th is week as they accepted
bids on f ive new cars for the
S h e r i f f ' s d e p a r t m e n t a n d
heard a var ie ty of committee
reports.

The board agreed to pur-
chase two mid-size cars from
Bell-Greig Motors of Caro at a
cost of $4,700 each and three
full-size Fords from Burton-
Moore of Caro.

The board nearly awarded
the full-size car bid to Wilsie-
Simpson which had offered to
supply three Oldsmobiles at
$5,175 each. It backed down,
however and awarded the
purchase to Burton-Moore,
which was low bidder at
$5,072 each.

The purchasing committee
had pushed for the Oldsmo-
biles on recommendation of
Sheriff Hugh Marr. The de-
partment had reportedly been
dissatisfied with Ford pur-
chases in the past and leaned
toward the General Motors
product.

Cminr. Kenneth Kennedy,
Mill ington, said he personally
felt the Oldsmobiles were a
better buy for the county but
added that Burton-Moore had
submitted the lowest bid and
that it would be hard to
explain why a low bid was not
accepted.

The board recessed, then
returned and decided to buy
the Fords.

The board also heard a
protest from Glenn Tryon,
representing Help Line, who

said il would he d i f f i c u l t to
f i n d a new headquarters for
the t e l e p h o n e p rob l em-an -
swering service once it was
forced out of a county-owned
house behind the j a i l in Caro.

Help Line has a Feb. 1
d e a d l i n e f o r f i n d i n g n e w
quarters.

Commissioners assured
Tryon tha t it would help the
agency f i n d a new home.
Cinmr. Maynard .McConkcy,
Cass C i ty , said i t ' s possible
tha t Help Line may wind up in
the bui ld ing occupied by the
A I c o h o 1 i s m I n f o r in a t i o n
Center and Mcdicaid Screen-
ing on Lincoln Street.

No decision was made.
Cminr. J. Benson Collon

reported t h a t 3(5 ambulance
attendants are current ly en-
rolled in a pilot program for
the t ra in ing of Emergency
M e d i c a l Techn i c i ans . The
program, funded under a
$204,000 grant from the De-
partment of Health, Educa-

t ion and Welfare, is being
conducted in the county Civil
Defense Center in Caro and
operates every Monday n igh t .

The course is expected to
run for the next four months.

Collon said this is the first
project of its kind in the stato.
At tendan t s from Cass City,
Caro, Vassar, Mayvil le and
Unionv i l l e are part ic ipat ing,
Collon said.

The program is operated
under auspices of the East
Central Michigan Compre-
hensive H e a l t h P l a n n i n g
Council .

McConkey reported that a
grievance filed by Sheriff 's
deputies over a pay dispute
has been resolved. The case
centered on extra hours
logged by two deputies who
were required to appear in a
court case in Lapeer county.

He did not offer specific
details, pending formal ac-
ceptance by the deputies.

Nard trial resumes

Tuesday in Caro

When It's A
Day To Remember

Remember Wood saves you

more on photo supplies. .

OLD WOOD

FREE!

. .. remember it with dependable Kodak film.
And a KODAK INSTAMATIC® Camera is the best
way to snap those special moments meant to
be saved. Happy faces make pretty pictures
. . . and pictures on Kodak film do make a
difference.

Kodak Makes Your Pictures Count.

Kodak makes your pictures count

FREE!
EXTRA PRINTS - FULL SIZE
CHOOSE THE BEST ONES AND GET
EXTRAS FREE!

FREE - ALBUM PAGES

OLD WOOD DRUG
PHONE 872-2075 "On The Corner" CASS CITY

The trial of 18-year-old Ken-
neth Nard of Fl in t , charged in
connection with the murders
of two Lapeer county youths
last May, resumed Tuesday
in Tuscola County Circuit
Court before Judge Norman
Baguley.

Last week, Lapeer County
Prosecutor Edward Meth be-
gan laying the foundation for
the prosecution's case. Wit-
nesses included the caretaker
of a park near Tody Lake,

scene of the murders, who
tes t i f i ed regarding move-
ments in and around the lake
the day the slayings took
place.

Court sources said as many
as 35 prosecution witnesses
may be called to testify be-
fore the prosecution rests its
case.

The case is being tried
before a 14-person jury, in-
cluding two alternates. Jury
selection was completed late
Tuesday, Jan. 13.

Police probe bomb threat hoax
A bomb threat that proved

to be a hoax was investigated
by Cass City Police Saturday
night.

Police said the telephoned
threat was received around
0:30 p.m. at the Quaker Maid
Party Store on Main Street by

Lynda Guinther. The caller
said a bomb was set to
explode at 7:30 p.m.

Police searched the build-
ing and found no bomb.

Police Chief Gene Wilson
said juveniles are suspected.
No arrests have been made.

E
FROM THE

ditor's Corner
The political bandwagon

cause these days is universal
health care under govern-
ment supervision.

Most politicians are like
Sen. Edward Kennedy, who is
a co-sponsor of a bill in the
hopper providing for health
care from cradle to grave.

Universal health care has
public a p p r o v a l . . . . why not?
It promises a benefit with the
cost more or less hidden to the
average wage earner.

Given the government ' s
record, you'll have to believe
that it will cost more for the
wage earner than a privately
funded program.

Social Security is broke.
Our postal system is an inef-
f icient , high cost operation.
The government has yet to
prove that it can run anything
as well as the private sector,

WEEK
AUCTION SALE

DRESSES & PANT SUITS
cmii^LNs COATS & JACKETS

WINTER

MEN'S AND f 4"t ATC A lA^lf ETC
BOYS' WINTER VWM I 9 01 «J«VIVfcl^

Sorry-'

NO LAYAWAYS

Prices Reduced 10% Each Week
.•OpVl SHOP EARLY FOR BEST

HUIXIV * ' SELECTION—DON'T WAIT
YOUR SIZE MAY BE SOLD THIS WEEK!

NO EXCHANGES - HOLDS OR

REFUNDS ON SALE ITEMS

LADIES'& CHILDREN'S

SNOW BOOTS
MEN'S & BOYS'

FLANNEL SHIRTS

MEN'S, BOYS', CHILDREN'S

SNOWMOBILE BOOTS
MEN'S & BOYS'

INSULATED BOOTS

HERE'S
HOW IT
WORKS

1 $ 6.98

8.98

^^ 10.98

f 12.98

j 16.98,

1 24.98

ITEM NOW ONLY

ITEM NOW ONLY

ITEM NOW ONLY

ITEM NOW ONLY

ITEM NOW ONLY

ITEM NOW ONLY

$ 4.11

5.30

6.47

7.66

10.03

14.75

But let's don the rose col-
ored glasses for a moment.
Assume (if you can) that the
government will run the pro-
gram with a cost efficiency as
good as there is. That every
dollar workers devote to
health care for all will return
a dollar in genuine health
care.

Now that's a mind boggling
assumption, isn't it?

Anyway, now the govern-
ment is running the health
care show with optimum ef-
ficiency, and the real problem
may still be unsolved.

Good health care when
needed.

If you judge by the results
in Europe, universal health
care may not be the panacea
that backers like Kennedy
say when they pontificate,
"health care for all the people
is a right, not a privilege."

Germany has free health
care and side-by-side with the
free care is a paid system.
Germans have the right to the
free care . . . . but if they want
prompt medical attention and
extra attention they pay for it.
The fact that many do indi-
cates to me that universal
health care may lack some-
thing over there,

In England there is an
acute shortage of doctors and
long waiting lines, a TV doc-
umentary revealed.

There is a shortage of phy-
sicians a l ready in this
country with our semi-paid
hospital plans for the indigent
and the retired. You don't
need to be a genius to forecast
what will happen with a ful ly
nationalized plan.

The government should
step into the health picture,
alright. There is a crying
need.

The need is to open up
medical schools. Break the
tight monopoly that skyrock-
ets health care because any
doctor today can "write his
own ticket" when he receives
his MU.

Spend a few millions (few in
comparison to the cost of
nationalized health) to open
up twice as many schools as
we have now. Get more doc-
tors in the field.

That way the price will
come down for all of us and all
of us will have a better

.oppor tuni ty . to receive
prompt, competent health
care.;1
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Rabbit tracks
By John Haire

(And anyone else he can

get to help)

The usual limited number of official transportation maps
published by the Michigan Highway Department are now
available on a first come, first served basis.

For as many years as I can remember the maps have been
distributed yearly, but evidently that's changed now.

The map's cover lists the years 1976 and 1977 and it appears
that publication is going on a bi-annual basis.

All those pheasants you see on the side of the road these days
are looking for grit, the DNR tells me. ( I suppose most of you
knew that already).

Anyway, the game experts in the department say that most
of the birds will winter through the current cold spell.

What could kill off the birds would be a thaw and then a long
freeze where a crust of ice would keep the birds from getting to
weed seeds that form 90 per cent of their winter diet.

Let's hope that doesn't happen just when more pheasants are
showing up than most of us have seen in the last 10 years.

I'm guessing that it's 15 years now since Donald "Stub"
Stamats was varsity basketball coach at Caro. But the genial,
well-known, well-liked Stamats has retained his avid interest in
high school sports.

He was an interested observer in Saturday's game between
Frankenmuth and Cass City and you'll find him popping up all
over the Thumb at important high school athletic contests.

I awarded myself a hero's medal for listening to President
Ford Monday night rather than to "All in the Family" which
was listed opposite the speech on another network.

After I heard the speech I mentally added an oak leaf cluster
to my hero award.

A businessman dropped in from Caro to subscribe to the
paper and remarked that the topless dancers at Gagetown was
the talk of the town there.

I could have told him that the story didn't exactly go
unnoticed in Cass City or in the metro area either. The story
was picked up by the Bay City daily and given front page
publicity.

The Want Ads Are Newsy Too!

PROFESSIONAL & BUSINESS

DIRECTORY
DR. W. S.SELBY

Optometrist
Hours 8-5.-noexcept Thursday
Saturdays 8:00a.m.-l:00p.m

4C24 Hil l St.

Across from Hills and Dales
Hospital

Phone 872-3404

ALLEN WITHERSPOON
New England Life
NEL Growth Fund
NEL Equity Fund

Value Line Fund-Keystone
Funds

Phone 872-2321
4615 Oak St. Cass City

YONGKYUN KIM, M.D.
Board Certified in Obstetrics
and Gynecology
Obstetrician 4-Gynecologist
Laparascopic sterilizations

4672 Hill St., Cass City
Office hours Monday through
Friday 9-5, except Wednes-
day. Sat. 9-12.

Office 872-2960, Residence
872-3172.

K.I. MacRAE, D.O.

Osteopathic Physician

and Surgeon

Corner Church and Oak Sts.
Office 872-2880 - Res. 872-3365

DO YOU HAVE A
DRINKING PROBLEM?

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS
& AL-ANON

Every Friday evening, 8:00
p.m. Good Shepherd Luther-
an Church, Cass City.

EFRENM.DIZON.M.D.
PERLAA. ESPINO.M.D.
Diplomates of the American

Board of Pediatrics
(Practice limited to Infants
and Children)

at 4672 Hill St.
Cass City, Mich. 48726

(Across from Hills & Dales
Hospital)

Phone 517-872-4384

JAMES BALLARD, M.D.
Off ice at 4530 Weaver St.

Hours: 10:00a.m. to 12:00
2:00p.m.to4:30

Daily except Thursday after-'
noon.

MAC'S COUNTRY
BEAUTY & BOUTIQUE
5 miles east of M-53 on

Argyle Rd.
Open every day, except

Monday.
Call for evening appoint-

ments, Ubly 658-5109.
Operators: Barb MacAl-

pine, Vera Ferguson and
Renee King.

Dr. E. Paul Lockwood
Chiropractic Physician

Off ice Hours:
Mon.,Tues.,Wed.,Fri.

9-12 a.m. and 1:30-5:00 p.m.

Saturday 9-12 a.m.
Evenings - Tues. 7-9 p.m.
Closed All Day Thursday
Phone 872-2765 Cass City

For Appointment

Harold T. Donahue, M.D.

Physician & Surgeon
CLINIC

4674 Hill St., Cass City

O f f i c e K72-2:i:>:i-Res. !!72*2:il1

HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE

Insurance Agency

Complolc Insurance Services

6 H 1 5 K . Cass City Rd.
Cass C i l y . Mich igan

Phone 872-2M8

J. Y. LEE, M.D..
Internal Medicine

Chest Diseases — Heart
& Lungs

•W72 H i l l SI reel
Cass Ci ty

OFFICE HOURS 9 till 5
except Wednesday

and Saturday 9 till 12
Phone:872-4500

C & S Electronics

Color and Black-White TV
Service — Hi -Fi, Stereo,

Car Radios
Bring it in and save

Located on Germania Rd.

Phone 658-5971

Harry Crandell, Jr.
D.V.M. .

Office 4438 South Seeger St.

Phone 872-2255

DR. J.H.GEISSINGER
CHIROPRACTOR

MON,TUE.,THURS:,FRI.
9-12a.m.and2-6p.m.

SAT. 9-12 a.m.

21 N. Aimer, Caro, MI.

Across from IGA store
Phone '. .Caro 673-4464

DR. EDWARD SCOLLON
VETERINARIAN

Call For Appointment
For Small Animals

872-2935

4849 N. Seeger'.SI „ Cass City
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Holbrook Area News
Mrs. Thelma Jackson

Phone OL 8-3092

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Spencer
and Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Cle-
land and family were Friday
dinner and evening guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Ernie Cameron.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt,
Ruth and Lori visited Mrs.
Frank Yietter at the home of
Mr. and Mrs. William Rees at

Filion in honor of Mrs. Yiet-
ter's birthday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Doerr
and family spent Monday
evening at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Joe Doerr and fam-
ily at Argyle to visit Dale
Doerr who came home from
Port Huron Hospital, Satur-
day.

At Your Service
872-2075

Tom Proctor

your

pharmacist

OLD WOOD DRUG
"GUARDIANS OF YOUR HEALTH"

CASS CITY

FARM BUREAU

The Young Ideas Farm
Bureau group met Thursday
evening at the home of Mr.
and Mrs. Joe VanErp. Joe
Sweeney led the discussion on
Township Government. After
the meet ing, cards were
played and Mrs. Joe Wolsch-
lager and Vern Krug won high
prizes. Mrs. Joe Sweeney and
James A. Sweeney won low
prizes. The next meeting will
be held at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Joe Sweeney. The host-
ess served a lunch.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Van-
Allen of Caro and Mr. and
Mrs. Cliff Jackson were after-
noon and supper guests of
Clara and Alma Vogel at
Caro.

Doug Labeski was a Thurs-
day guest of Randy Schenk.

Melissa Jackson was a
Thursday overnight guest of
Mr. and Mrs. George Jack-
son.

4-H MEETING

The Holbrook Helpers 4-H
crocheting group met at the
home of Mrs. Jim Doerr
Tuesday and Wednesday
afternoons.

WATCH THIS CAR!
The
the

car to watch is the one behind
car in front of yours! And this

same car is the one that ought to
be completely insured with our Agency.
We pride ourselves on low rates and
fast claim service!

HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE
INS. AGENCY

6815 E. Cass City Road
Cass City

Phone 872-2688

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Cleland
and family visited Mr. and
Mrs. Curtis Cleland Friday.

Ruth Hewitt was a Tuesday
and Wednesday overnight
guest of Becky Robinson.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence
Wolschlager of Bad Axe and
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Grifka
were Monday evening guests
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Dybilas
and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Felmlee,
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Felmlee
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Bill
Bierman and family and sev-
eral neighbors from Bay City,
along with Susan Sofka of
Swartz Creek and Mr. and
Mrs. Henry Sofka attended a
surprise birthday party for
Marty Felmlee at their home
in Bay City, Saturday eve-
ning.

Mrs. Norman Marr and
family of Sandusky arrived
Thursday to get Vera Fahs of
Sandusky, who had spent a
week with Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Schenk and Randy.

Mrs. Henry Jackson spent
Friday with Rose Strauss.

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Spencer
attended the Fraser Presby-
terian church annual congre-
gational meeting Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. George Jack-
son Jr. and family of Oxford
were Saturday dinner guests
of Mr. and Mrs. George Jack-
son.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Cleland
were Thursday guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Jim Doerr and
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Harlan Dick-
inson and family, Mr. and
Mrs. Philip Robinson and
family of Cass City and Mr.
and Mrs. Howard Wills and
Terry were Sunday guests of

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Robinson
and Becky and Sophia Dom-
ingo.

Marty Felmlee and Jen-
nifer of Bay City were Thurs-
day guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Henry Sofka.

Rev. and Mrs. Harry
Capps, Stacy and Jeremy,
Mr. and Mrs. Lynwood La-
peer and family and Mr. and
Mrs. Steve Timmons and
Debbie were Sunday dinner
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Gay-
lord Lapeer in honor of Steve
Timmons' and Gaylord La-
peer's birthdays.

Jack Ross of Ubly was a
Thursday guest of Mr. and
Mrs. Earl Schenk.

Murill Shagena was a Mon-
day overnight guest of Mr.
and Mrs. Bernard Shagena
and Sherry.

Sara Campbell received
word of the birth of an eight-
pound, four-ounce, great-
granddaughter, born Wednes-
day at Port Huron General
Hospital to Mr. and Mrs. Lee
Marion of Marlette. Grand-
parents are Mr. and Mrs.
John Dubey of Bay Port.

Rev. Robert vonOeyen of
Ubly and Lynn Spencer were
Saturday visitors at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. Henry Jack-
son and Edith.

Phil Berridge of Big Rapids
spent the week end with Mr.
and Mrs. Burton Berridge
and sons.

EUCHRE PARTY

The Happy Dozen Euchre
Club met Saturday evening at
the home of Mr. and Mrs.
Tony Cieslinski. High prizes
were won by Mr. and Mrs.
Bryce Hagen. Low prizes
were won by Mrs. Gerald
Wills and Harold Ballagh. A
potluck lunch was served.

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard
Shagena of Unionville and
Glen Shagena were Saturday
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Murill

4 BIG SALE DAYS
THURS. thru SUN.

NO LIMIT WHILE SUPPLY LASTS

TRY M & R FOR FRESH PROD UCE CV

CRISP FIRM HEAD

I Lettuce —
RIPE YELLOW

Reg

<
113 SIZE

RED

Bananas.. Reg. 24? Grapes

Idaho Bakers-----?!9 10LBS 1.59
KOEGEL'S LARGE

BOLOGNA
•Reg.

Ib.

KOEGEL'S RING

BOLOGNA
Reg.

lib.

Sunflower qtrs. Reg. 49$

Margarine 3 lbs

Dairy Fresh qtrs. Reg. 49$

Margarine ^L 390

London's 12-oz. ctn.

Cottage Chee8e-R-e^-66-^490

BRING COUPON TO OUR STORE

FREE 100
HOLDEN RED STAMPS

With each $10 or more purchase
at M & R GROCERY

DUTCH LOAF
KOEGEL'S -
Reg. $1.49

POTATO
CHIPS

Ib.

AUNT JANE'S 32-oz. mm*

SWEET
RELISH
Reg, $1.09

FRITO-LAYS

POTATO
CHIPS

Reg. 79$

9-oz.
bag 69ct

33IKPSI

""•VALUABLE COUPON"""!

DOUBLE HOLDEN!

COKE
Reg. $1.90

OR

16-oz.

No-Return

Btls.

PEPSI
Reg. $2.00

RED STAMPS
WITH ALL PURCHASES
Thursday and Friday

with coupon

I
I
I
I
I
I REGULAR
J 55$ EACH

28-OZ. NO RETURN BOTTLES

7-UP or VERNOR'S
1253

BIGC

Hamburg or RMNC

V« Sin49£ ea. Q P^gs. jf |

SCHAFER'S

Reg.
2/89$

BIG C BREAD nnC100
J|"FOR

SCHAFER'S SOFT-N-GOOD

BREAD
1 1/2-lb. King— i n i JL/4-J.w. J

GROCERY
49C Reg.

63$

4119 S. SEEGER

CASS CITY

Shagena.
Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson

were Sunday supper and eve-
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Leonard Stirrett in Bad Axe.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Jackson,
Melissa and Jason were Sat-
urday afternoon guests of Mr.
and Mrs. Doug Morell and
were supper and evening
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Floyd
Morell and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Spencer
attended the Huron, Sanilac,
Tuscola Rural Letter Car-
riers meeting Saturday eve-
ning at Wildwood Farms
where the group met for
dinner. Plans were made for
the convention to be held June
20. 21 and 22 in Bad Axe.

Sheila Dalton and Shirley
Ross were Thursday over-
night guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Jim Hewitt and family.

Wendy and Jamie Doerr
were Tuesday afternoon vis-
itors at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Keith Brown and family.

Karen Bensinger was a
Friday overnight guest of
Becky Robinson and Sophia
Domingo.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shagena
were Monday supper and
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Cliff Jackson.

Mrs. Anna Sofka of Ubly
and Henry Sofka were Tues-
day callers in Harbor Beach.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Buchan-
an of Caro and Mr. and Mrs.

, Calvin MacRae of Cass City
were Sunday supper guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Don Becker.

Melissa Jackson spent from
Monday till Thursday with
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morell
and family.

The Holbrook Helpers sew-
ing, knitting and crocheting
4-H meeting was cancelled
Saturday due to snow-blocked
roads. Meetings are planned
for every Saturday from 10
a.m. to 3 p.m. at Fraser
church.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Doerr
visited Mr. and Mrs. Jim
Dolecki, Wednesday morn-
ing.

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Robin-
son, Becky, Mr. and Mrs.
Kevin Robinson and Sophia
Domingo attended the anni-
versary dinner and party for
Mr. and Mrs. John Pfaff in
Bad Axe, Saturday evening.

Steve Dybilas of Port Huron
spent the week end with Mr.
and Mrs. Joe Dybilas, Paul
and Kathy.

Carol Cornett of Bad Axe
and Steve Sofka attended the
Burrough Elevator's banquet
at Colony House Saturday
evening. Cocktail hour was at
5:30 p.m. and dinner at 6:30
p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson
were Saturday supper guests
of Mrs. Emma Decker and
evening guests of Mr. and
Mrs. Glen Shagena.

Twenty-five snowmobilers
met at the home of Mr. and
Mrs. Steve Timmons for hot
dogs after spending the eve-
ning snowmobiling.

Vera Fahs of Sandusky and
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schenk
were Monday lunch guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Britt.

Mrs. Baker,

87, dies

Jan.15

Mrs. Julia Elizabeth Baker,
87, of Deford died Thursday,
Jan. 15, at the Sanilac County
Medical Care Facility.

She was born June 2, 1888,
in Sokolovac, Yugoslavia ,
daughter of the late John and
Elizabeth King.

She married Michael Baker
Sr., Aug. 7, 1907, in Yugo-
slavia. The couple came to
the United States in 1910, to
Michigan in 1919 from West
Virginia and settled in Deford
in 1942. Her husband died
Aug. 1, 1971.

Mrs. Baker was a member
of the Cass City Assembly of
God for 50 years and also the
Hungarian Club.

She is survived by two sons,
Joseph Baker of Deford and
Michael Baker of Mt. Morris;
five daughters, Mrs. Otis
(Julia) Otto and Mrs. Walter
(Mary) Stewart, both of San-
dusky, Mrs. Howard (Anna)
Luana of Deford, Miss Rose
Baker of Ferndale and Mrs.
George (Kathryn) Nowokow-
ski of Detroit; 10 grandchil-
dren and 15 great-grandchil-
dren, and one sister, Mrs.
Louis Parrish of Caro. Three
sons preceded her in .death.

Funeral services were con-
ducted Saturday from Little's
Funeral Home with Rev.
Chester Swoffer of Decker-
ville officiating.

Burial was in Novesta
cemetery.

Your neighbor says

Students

should work
Just how beneficial is it for

a high school student to hold
down a part-time job? Should
students try to work and
study at the same time?

Edward Profit of rural Cass
City thinks it a good idea.

"It isn't the money that's
really impor tan t , " Profi t
says. "The money is really
secondary. I think the exper-
ience is what's most im-
portant. With a job, they get
used to meeting people and
learn how to get along with
them."

Profit says the decision on
whether or not a student
should work probably de-
pends on his work load and
other outside activities. But in
most cases, he feels a part-
time job is useful.

"It can't help but do some
good," he says. "There's a lot
of difference between study-

ing from books and the real!
world."

Profit was born and raised I
in the Cass City area. He is
married and the father of two [
children.

Learn more

about slow

cookers

FRANKLIN

Did you receive a slow
cooker as a gif t or have you
purchased a slow cooker or do
you plan to purchase one? If
so, make plans to attend the
Fami ly L iv ing Educa t ion
Class "Selection and Use of
Slow Cookers" Monday. Jan.
26, at 1:30 p.m. at the Civil
Defense Center in Caro.

Marlene Wilson will discuss
slow cooker models and fea-
tures that are available to the
consumer. Aliene Mills, Ex-
tension Home Economist, will
discuss safe uses and sug-
gested methods for food prep-
aration in the slow cooker.
Participants will have time to
share their experiences in
using their slow cookers and
recipes that they enjoy.

This class is open to all
interested persons.
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\57hen Ben was
postmaster general,
he gave his entire
salary to the re-
lief of the
Continental
soldiersj __

Ben said:
TONGUE
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KEOGH
Mutual Savings can help you
take advantage of the Keogh Plan:
set aside $7,500 tax free.

IRA
If your company has no pension
plan you can set aside up to
$1,500 per year tax-free.
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12 PH. 872-2105

Serving Mid-Michigan with seventeen offices: Cast City, Sebewaing,
Pigeon, Bay City, Saginaw, Midland, Mount Pleasant, Auburn, Ewex-
ville, Gladwin, Standish, West Branch, Big Rapids, Reed dry, and
St. Louis.
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KETCHUM'S KNAPSACK

No School

By Jim Ketchum

Driver hospitalized in

Huron snowmobile crash
Maybe it's the little boy in

me; I'm not sure. But every
time it snows, I mean really
snows, I begin listening for
school closing announce-
ments.

Maybe it's just a carryover
of old habits. It began well
over 20 years ago when heavy
snow automatically meant
listening to see whether or not
I got a reprieve from hi t t ing
the books.

There was always some-
thing special and exciting
about having school called
off. It's always that way for
students like me who could
find more interesting things
to do than long division, log-
ar i thms or learn ing how
much coffee Brazil grew each
year.

The most exciting part was
when it started snowing heav-
ily in the late afternoon or
early evening. I drove my
parents nuts running outside
with a yardstick every hour
or so, checking the snow
depth and boldly announcing
that they just had to cancel
school. There was no way
those busses could slog their
way through those drifts.

As night wore on, it became
harder to sleep with anticipa-
tion that school would be
called off in the morning.

Things reached a fever
pitch around dawn, especially
if the snow had kept up all
night, as I waited for the radio
announcer to read those two
lovely words, "no school".

More times than not, it
didn't happen. The worst
thing would be when the snow
stopped during the night and
the snow plows began clear-
ing roads. Didn't those idiots
realize I needed a break?

But when it did happen-ah,

that was great. What was best
was if the snow day was a
Friday. That meant a long
week end and all the goofing
off that went with it.

Once I got into college, all
that changed. Classes weren't
stopped by snow. More
classes were cancelled due to
professorial hangovers than
from inclement weather.

Only twice during my four
years at Michigan State Uni-
versity did they shut every-
thing down and tell everybody
to go home due to snow. That
was only because 17 or 18
inches of the stuff fell in 24
hours.

Still, my old habit of listen-
ing to the school closings
persists. There's no real rea-
son for it. I still have to trudge
off to work. I did get to stay
home du r ing last A p r i l ' s
mammoth dumping, but I
used my home telephone to
keep the paper's news wheels
grinding.

It's one of those facts of life
everybody learns-the world
doesn't close down when it
snows.

I guess one of the reasons I
still listen for school closings
is partly sour grapes. It gives
me a chance to gripe about
how soft education has be-
come. I get to say that they
never closed down classes as
much when I went to school.

"They ran schools back
then, not country clubs," I
mutter scholarly to my wife
who only shrugs and goes
about her business.

Maybe part of it is jealousy.
Those darn kids have it so
easy. Then I remember I had
my turn at being a kid.

Now it's their turn.
Was that a snowflake I just

saw? Maybe they won't have
school tomorrow.

Snow and ice on area roads
combined to help produce a
rash of traffic accidents that
included a potentially serious
snowmobile accident Satur-
day night in Huron county.

An 18-year-old Cass City
man escaped serious injury
Saturday night when the cat-
he was attempting to start
was struck head-on by a
snowmobile on Nugent Road,
two miles south of Bad Axe.

Dallas Englehart of rural
Cass City was not injured, but
the crash sent the operator of
the snowmobi le , Thomas
Wolschlager, 30, Bad Axe, to
Huron Memor ia l Hosp i t a l
with multiple injuries.

Eng leha r t told H u r o n
County Sheriff's deputies he
was headed south on Nugent
Road when his car stalled. He
said he shut off the headlights
and was attempting to restart
the vehicle at the t ime of the
crash.

Officers said Wolschlager
was headed north, apparently
operating with no headlights
on his machine. Police said
another snow machine with
lights was traveling along-
side Wolschlager.

Two passengers in Engle-
hart's car, Larry Sutler, 18,
Cass City, and Dawn Bouv-
erette, 1C, of Bad Axe, were
uninjured.

No.c i ta t ions were issued.
The accident took place at
9:13 p.m.

No injuries were reported
in a single-car accident Sun-
day afternoon on Cass City
Road, three miles east of Cass
City in Sanilac county.

Caro State Police ident i f ied
the driver of the car as
Donald Wilson, 22, of Cass
City Road. They said Wilson
was eastbound on M-81 when
he lost control of the car and
ran off the north side of the

road. The car landed on its
side.

Wilson was not injured. He
was cited for t ravel ing too
fast for conditions. The acci-
dent took place at 5:00 p.m.

CASS CITY ACCIDENTS

Two drivers were uninjured
when their cars collided on
South Secger Street just north
of the south village l imi t s
early Saturday morning.

Cass Ci ty Police said a
s o u t h b o u n d p i c k u p t ruck
driven by Richard Leroy
Honclr ick. ' - l l , of B711 Hough-
ton St., struck the rear of a
southbound car driven by
Clarke Haire, IB, of -4172 S.
Secger St.

Police said Haire was at-
tempting to back up and turn
into a driveway he had slid
past on the slippery road
surface. They said'Hcndrick
could not slop in time to avoid
a collision.

A passenger in the Hend-
rick vehicle, Douglas Gaffney
of (>f)(i7 Elizabeth St. , was not
injured.

Police noted the street sur-
face was extremely icy. The
accident took place at 12:58
a.m.

Neither driver was t i ck -
eted.

Vehicles driven by Edward
Keith Mitchel l , 32, of 4140 S.
Elkton Rd., Gagetown, and
Barbara Elaine Haag, 26, of
Elkton, collided Friday morn-
ing at the intersection of
Houghton and West Streets.

Cass City Police said the
Mitchel l vehicle was headed
west on Houghton Street and
had stopped for the intersec-
tion as the southbound Haag
auto at tempted a left turn
onto Houghton.

Police said Ms. Haag cut
the corner to avoid piled snow
and s t ruck the Mi tche l l ve-
hicle. No t icke t was issued
and neither dr iver was in-
j u r e d . The acc iden t took
place at 9:55 a.m.

In another Friday property
damage accident, cars driven
by James Edward W i l l i s , 27,
of B719 E. Main St., and
Wi l l i am Bliss Jr., 31, of 0772
Pino St., collided near the
i n t e r s e c t i o n of M a i n and
Weaver Streets.

Cass City Police said the
Will is vehicle was eastbound
as the Bliss auto came from a
driveway and attempted to
make a lef t turn onto Weaver.
Police said Wi l l i s could not
stop in t ime to avoid str iking
me liiiss auto in the rear.

Bliss was shaken up in the
12:05 p.m. mishap. Will is was
not injured. No ticket was
issued.

A property damage acci-
dent near the intersection of
Sherman and Pine Streets
Thursday morning left two
drivers unhur t . Police said a
car driven by Russell Lee
Bradley, 61, of 4207 Sherman
St., was headed north on
Sherman when a parked ve-
hicle driven by Stanley Paul
Kirn of 4317 Maple St.,'pulled
onto the street in front of
Bradley.

No ticket was issued. The
accident took place at 9:15
a.m.

OTI1EK ACCIDENTS

A snowbank was blamed for
a two-vehicle accident on
Kelly Rd. about 3 miles south
of Cass Ci ty , Monday af te r -
noon. An eastbound car driv-
en by Lee Aust in Soldan, 25, of
Kelly Road, Cass City, struck
a snowbank in an a t t empt to
allow a westbound car driven
by Thomas E. Dewey, 26, of
6258Schwegler Rd,, Cass City,
to pass, Caro State Police
reported.

.The snow apparently threw
the rear of the Soldan vehicle
in to the side of Dewey's auto,
police said.

The drivers, along with a
passenger in the Soldan auto,
James Sat te lberg , 22, of
Fourth St., Cass City, were
uninjured. The accident took
place at 2:10 p.m.

A Cass City driver escaped
injury Thursday when the
vehicle he was driving struck
a car on Treasurer Road, two
miles east of Mayvi l le .

Sheriff 's deputies said Rob-
ert Wayne Rochcleau, 33, of S.
Elkton Rd., was headed south
and tried to go around a
stalled auto in the center of
the road. In at tempting to
pass, officers said, the rear
wheels of a trailer Rochcleau
was pull ing struck the car.

No ticket was issued. The
accident took place at 11:30
a.m.

AXETHEATRE
WED.-TUES. JAN. 21-27

ONE WEEK
Dr. Syn. 7:00-9:43

Treasure island 8:17

DOUBLE DISNEY
ADVENTURE!

ROBEF1T LOUIS STEVENSON'S

1975 forest fires

worst in 7 years

TECHNICOLOR® <:&

. [G

STRAND-CARO
Phone: 673-3033

M i c h i g a n weathered i t s
worst forest fire season in
seven years during 1975, when
nearly 17,000 acres burned in
855 fires.

"Three bad weeks in May in
which 302 fires burned 14,199
acres were the most miser-
able for firefighters," says
Robert J. Compeau, chief of
the Department of Natural
Resources forest fire division.
"Those fires occurred during
the worst period for fire con-
ditions in 25 years, after an
extended dry season, low
humidity and winds."

Generally, the state has the
greatest fear of forest fires in

EVERY MONDAY NIGHT
TWO WILL BE ADMITTED"
FOR $2.00. SAVE MONEY!

March, before the spring
green-up, Compeau says.
"But vegetat ion r ema ined
very dry until May (last year)
when a potentially explosive
situation literally burst."

Last year's total compares
to 1,035 fires that destroyed
6,107 acres of forested lands
in Michigan during 1974.

The state's worst fire sea-
son on record was in 1871,
when about two mil l ion acres
burned and 200 persons lost
their lives.

A CASS CITY driver, Donald Wilson, escaped injury Sunday
afternoon when his car slid out of control and rolled on its side on
M-81 three miles east of Cass City. The accident was one of many
area mishaps caused by snow and ice-covered roads. (Neitzel
Photo).

FRIDAY thru THURSDAY JAN. 23-29
PREMIERE SHOWING! HERE IS THE
ONE YOU HAVE BEEN WAITING FOR!
THE VIOLENCE and SUSPENSE WILL
LEAVE YOU HANGING ON THE EDGE
OF YOUR SEAT! RATED "R".
CONTINUOUS SUNDAY from 4:30

RUNS YOU OVER WITH ACTION,
VIOLENCE, SUSPENSE AND THRILLS.

"CRACKLES WITH SUSPENSE!"
—Hank Grant, CBS Radio

DINO DE LAURENTIIS PRESENTS

ROBERT REDFORD
FAYEDUNAWAY

.CLIFF ROBERTSON
MAXVONSYDOW
IN A STANLEY SCHNEIDER PRODUCTION

A SYDNEY POLLACK FILM

Diabetics warned: keep
extra insulin supply handy

Michigan winters with the proper foods, medication or
constant threat of immobili /- syr inges when a n a t u r a l
ing snowstorms necessitate disaster strikes is courting
planning ahead for emerg- trouble, whether at home or
encies. t ravel ing .

A diabetic caught w i t h o u t Mrs. Evelyn Billings, Di-

JOHN HOUSEMAN/MUllCBYDAVnD GRUSIN/USEOON THE NOVIL

in DAr»« THE KMDOH BY JAMES GRADY'scnlENpuYBT LORENZO SEMPLE, JR. AND DAVID
RAYFIEL WOOUCEOOY STANLEY SCHNEIDERoc«CTEO»»SYDNEY POLLACK/PANAVISION*/

TECHNICOLOR* " PARAMOUNT RELEASE r- 1

COMING YOUR WAY...NEXT AT THE
STRAND...STARTS ON FRIDAY, JAN.
30 for ONE FULL WEEK!!

COMING SOON;..THE FAIREST OF ALL

Snon)t0Hff2
*MHIH4 by BUCK* VI1TA OimiBUTION CO, l«. «Wl» Onntj ffoduelioni TECH NICOLOR4

CASS CASS
CITY

IFRI.-SAT.-SUN. JAN. 23-24-25
THE 1976 COMEDY SURPRISE!

"A funny movie
about the

early days (of Hollywood)...
a real pleasure and a pleaser."

-Gene Shalit, NBC-TV Today Show

MGH's COMEDY SURPRISE. A B1LL/ZIEFF PRODUCTION

JEFF BRIDGES ANDY GRIFFITH

COMING NEXT WEEK:
GENE HACKMAN in

"NIGHT MOVE"
BURT REYNOLDS in

"DELIVERANCE"

rector of Nursing at the
Thumb District Health De-
p a r t m e n t , says .diabetics
planning a trip to Europe
usually remember to take
extra precautions. But she
says they forget how easily a
simple trip from Caro to
Detroit can become hazard-
ous - by car breakdown, mas-
sive traff ic jams or an im-
mobil iz ing snowstorm.

Mrs. Billings recommends
people with diabetes who are
planning to take a trip, par-
ticularly during the unpre-
dictable winter season, take
the following precautions:
• Carry insulin, syringes,

needles and oral medication
on your person. Don't take a
chance with lost or damaged
baggage.
• Take enough extra med-

ication and syringes to last
two or three days in an
emergency. Carry a ful l bot-
tle of insulin and disposable
syringes in pocket or purse.
Know the strength, type and
dosage of the medication you
take.
• Take extra supplies of

urine testing equipment. This
becomes very important dur-
ing an emergency.
• If you haven't memorized
your diet plan, take a copy
with you.
• Carry emergency rations

such as canned frui t , juice,
crackers, peanut butter ,
canned meat or fish, jars of
cheddar-type cheese or other
food that will travel well
without refrigeration. Miss-
ing meals is very dangerous
for a diabetic. If the trip goes
as planned, you have wasted
nothing but a little space.
• Carry some ,type of

diabetes ident i f ica t ion for
protection in an emergency
situation. An arm bracelet or
pendant that can't get lost is
best.

• Carry the name and ad-
dress of your physician.
• Tell people you are trav-

eling with that you have
diabetes so they wil l be aware
of your needs.

Mrs. Billings also warns
diabetics not to assume that
emergency shelters will be
able to provide their special
needs. Priority at a shelter
must go to people who have
been physically injured.

"In short," Mrs. Billings
says, "the diabetic should not
count on outside help. He
must be prepared ahead of
t ime for an emergency, even
in his own home."

Not only can a snowstorm
strand motorists, but it can
keep many people, particu-
larly the elderly, confined to
their homes for several days.

Mrs . B i l l i n g s suggests
diabetics keep a home pantry
stocked with a week's supply
of canned meats, canned
frui ts , f ru i t juices and any
other special diet needs. Also
keep suppl ies of needles,
syringes, testing equipment
and medication. The equip-
ment should be kept in origi-
nal wrappers with seals in-
tact.

Because you could be al-
most anywhere when a nat-
ural disaster strikes, Mrs.
Billings suggests storing a
supply of insulin where you
work and at the homes of
peonle vou most frequently
visit.

"Diabetes doesn't stop you
from doing anything, even
traveling," says Mrs. Bil-
lings. "It just requires a little
more planning."

A pamphlet, "Have Dia-
betes Will Travel," is avail-
able by writing to the Mich-
igan Diabetes Association, or
calling the Thumb District
Health Department at Caro.
Phone 673-4178.

GROSS
MEAT MARKET

PHONE 872-3466
Specials Good thru Sat., Jan. 24th

Weekend Specials
FRESH LEAN

Hans Own Homemade

RING
BOLOGNA

LB.

LARGE
BOLOGNA

79'LB.

TURKEY

DRUMSTICKS

LB.

ttttr

BRISKET LB.

CITY CHICKEN

LB.

We Have Our Seasonal

FRESH OYSTERS & FRESH FISH
Coming in Thursday Morning

We accept food stamps

FRESH DRESSED CHICKENS

Meats Cut, Wrapped and
Quick Frozen FOR YOUR

FREEZER

REMEMBER
HANS MAKES A

COMPLETE SELECTION OF

HOMEMADE

SAUSAGES
COME IN AND SAMPLE

THEM

GROSS
MEAT MARKET

FREE PARKING IN REAR OF STORE
USE OUR SIDE ENTRANCE .
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AARP meets Jan. 8
CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, JANUARY 22, 1976

Cass City AARP met Thurs-
day, Jan. 8, at the Elkland
Township Fire Hall with 43

SIMULATED

ENGRAVED

BUSINESS CARDS

Available 1-Color

or 2-Color

The Chronicle

members present.
Avis Youngs, Thelma Pratt

and Helen Little were elected
to the nominating committee.
Election of officers will be
held at the February meeting.

Ellen Toner gave a slide
presentation on the activities
at Darbee School.

The next meeting will be
held Thursday, Feb. 12, at the
fire hall beginning with din-
ner at 12:30 p.m. Mr. and
Mrs. Ernest Beardsley, Helen
Little and Christine Tyler will
be in charge of arrange-
ments.

Cass City Bowling Leagues

MERCHANETTELEAGUE
Jan. 15, l!)7(i

If you're sure the other
fellow is right it is a good plan
to follow in his footsteps.

Cass City Lanes
Herron Builders
Cole Carbide
Richard's TV
Walbro
Kritzman's
Albee Hardware
Clare's Sunoco

4
4
4
3
1
0
0
0

BAY CITY MT. PLEASANT
CARD REESE
CASS CITY SAGINAW
FRANKENMUTH SEBEWAING

"MIDLAND UBLY
VASSAR

A Total Automotive Parts-center"
• Competitive prices
• Total parts center for domestic & foreign cars.
• Trained parts technicians will take time

to solve your total auto needs
• Complete motor rebuilding, cylinder reboring, valve

grinding, crankshafts turned, brake drums turned.
• We machine any parts for auto - trucks and

farm equipment.

6585 E. Main, Cass City

High Team Series: C C
Lanes 2245, Richard's 2108
Herron's 2081, Walbro 2076. '

High Team Games: C C
Lanes 764-760-721, Richard's
738-712, Walbro 709, Herron's
703.

High Individual Series: I.
Schweikart 581, N. Wallace
476, G. Kelley 472, J. Smithson
463, J. Morel! 458,

High Individual Games: I
Schweikar t 203-189-189, G
Kelley 173-155, C. Krueger
165, N. Wallace 165-159-152 M
Zdrojewski 161, J. Smithson
163-156, J. Morell 159-151, D.

Wischmeyer 158, C. Lang-
maid 157, Pat Mclntosh 156,
P. Allen 155, L. Herron 155, M.
Kerbyson 153, H. Schuch-
mann 153, N. Bauer 151, M.
Guild 150.

Splits Converted: B. Deer-
ing 4-5, J. Freiburger 3-10, M.
Guild 3-10, G. Kelley 3-10,
6-7-10, V. Kilbourn 2-7, 3-10,
5-6, Pat Mclntosh 5-7, Phyllis
Mclntosh 5-6, J. Morell 5-7, F.
Ridenour 5-6, J. Smithson 5-7,
N. Wallace 3-10, 4-5, T. Weav-
er 3-10.

SUNDAY NIGHT JUNIORS

The Feds
Bros.
Team No. 3
Strikes
C.C. Biggs
Comeback Kids
Rookies
Team No. 4

16
13
8
8
7
7
4
1

VITAMIN SALE!
SUPER B

COMPLEX

TABS

BANKAMERICARD
welcome"here

Exclusive Authorized Thumb
Distributor For Hollister

Ostomy Appliances. ^
$2.57

Reg. $3.69

Money Orders
Any Denomination

We Accept All PRE-PAID
PRESCRIPTION PLANS

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
MIKE WEAVER, Owner Ph, 872-3613

Emmienrv Ph. 872-3283

VITAMIN
C

250 MG.

$10.18
VALUE

btls.
of 100

Myadec" Capsules
had no equal—
until they made
a tablet.

Vitamin C
100 TABS

$1.29
Value

High-potency vitamin
formula with minerals REVLON

$8.89
Value

COLOGNES - LIPSTICK
MOON DROPS
NAIL ENAMELOont

Get Run
Oown-.Take
VITAMINS

MAKEUP

VITAMIN E
Water Soluble

100 VIT.
Reg. $5.30

INFANTS'
DROPS

PARKING

Reg. $6.09 Reg. $3.41

KIDS NEED
Reg. $4.09

High Team Series: The
Feds 1224, C.C.' Biggs 1136,
Bros. 1120.

High Team Games: The
Feds 431-413, Strikes 428.

High Individual Series: E.
Schwartz 448, T. Vandiver
439. R. Selby 423, C. Kelley
418, S. Reed 403, J. Fortson
402.

High Individual Games: E.
Schwartz 169, C. Kelley 167, S.
Reed 166, R. Selby 161, T.
Vandiver 152-152, J. Fortson
152, D. Childs 5-7, C. Kelley
2-10.

SUNDAY NIGHT MIXED

Turkeys
Four Tops
Mixups
Apple Jacks
Low Rollers
Miss Fits
B-Ups
Late Comers

11
11
10
9
9
6
4
4

High Team Series: Turkeys
1931, Mixups 1887, Apple
Jacks 1850.

High Team Games: Mixups
676, Turkeys 670, Apple Jacks
647.

High Women's Series: M.
LaPeer (sub) 467, J. Lapp 465,
M. Frederick 460.

Men's High Series: M.
Frederick 619, L. Tracy 530,
R. Deering 511.

Women's High Games: M.:
LaPeer (sub) 178, J.'Lapp 176,
J. Deering 169.

Men's High Games: M.
Frederick 220, M. Frederick
203, R. Deering 197.

Splits Converted: C. Fur-
ness, R. Schweikar t , W.
Bauer 3-10, J. Schwartz 5-6, E.
Francis 4-5, G. Lapp 3-10, 2-7,
M. LaPeer (sub) 3-5-10, D.
Curtis 3-10, 5-7, D. Randall
4-9-10, 2-7, 4-7-9.

MONDAY NIGHT CITY
Jan. M), l!)7fi

Evans 14
Bartnik's 10
Ouvry's 9
New Greenleaf 8
L&S 7
Sommers' 6
Cass City 5
Halls 5

200 Games: E. Helwig 212,
F. Knoblet 209, R. Ouvry 205,
S. Eyer 200.

500 Series: R. Ouvry 588, E.
Helwig 557, C. Vandiver 548,
R. Schweikart 522, J. Burle-
son 515, F. Knoblet 504.

MERCHANTS"A"LEAGUE
Jan. 14,1!)7<>

Miracle-Allen 24
Erla's Food Center 22
Fuelgas 14
Croft-Clara Lumber 13
New England Life 12
Cass City Oil & Gas 11
Kritzman's 9
J.P. Burroughs 7

500Series: L. Taylor 559, E.
Schulz 557, M. Zawilinski 552,
D. Allen 550, J. Smithson 547,

Echo Chapter

grants life

membership
T w e n t y - t h r e e members

were present Jan. 14 for the 4
p.m. opening of Echo Chapter
OES, which was called off at 5
p.m. and reconvened at 8 p.m.

The charter was draped in
memory of Vera AuBuchon.

In the business meeting,
one l ife-membership was
granted and application for
another was received. Invi-
tations were read to a meet-
ing Feb. 16 at Bad Axe and to
a meeting Feb. 17 in Caro.
Members voted a 100 per cent
contribution of 13 cents per
member to the Grand Chap-
ter relief fund.

A six o'clock potluck supper
wil l precede the regular
meeting Feb. 11, and pictures
of the International Temple in
Washington, D.C., will be
shown. Sandusky Chapter will
be invited to attend.

Announcement was made
of the Feb. 21 dinner and
dance at Colony House when
there will be a joint celebra-
tion of the bicentennial and
the sesquicentennial of Free
Masonry. The affair will be
open to the public.

Letter

Miracles clarify

their stand
January 16,1976

Dear Mr. Haire,
Mic and I are quite pleased

with the article Mr. Ketchum
did on us. But I would like to
clarify a few of the state-
ments in the article as we feel
it may have raised questions
in the minds of those who
have read it.

One statement that ap-
peared in the article is this,
"True, it isn't always se-
cure," the 24-year-old Mir-
acle said, "But neither is the
Christian life."

A few people that we've
talked to have questioned that
statement. We would like to
let them know that that isn't
exactly what we mean.

Even though we do get low
in the pocketbook sometimes,
we are secure in knowing that
God knows our needs and will
supply the needed finances.
When we were down to $3, we
had just paid that month's
bills and we had food to eat.
By the next week when money
for groceries was needed, it
was there for us. God not only
supplies our needs, but he is
always on time. It hasn't been
easy to learn the lesson of
"finances by faith", but I can
.honestly say that now when
we're "down to nothing" we
can have faith that our bills
will be paid on time the next
week. Philippians 4:19 says;
"But my God shall supply all
your needs according to his
riches in glory by Christ
Jesus". Many people believe
that. We have had unlimited

opportunities to put our faith
into practice.

One more thing we would
like to clarify is that we know
that Teen Missions is where
God wants us. In the article it
said, "I guess it's what God
has in mind for us." For us
and the rest of the Teen
Missions staff, there's no
"guess" about it. If we
weren't sure that God wants
our services there, we may
have wanted to quit long ago.
God has led us there and
we've never doubted that. It's
good to know when things get
rough "faithful is he that
calleth you, who also will do
it." I Thessalonians 5:24.
There is a plaque that one of
the Teen Missions staffers
has that says the same thing.
"The will of God will never
take you, where the grace of
God cannot keep you."

That lets us know that no
matter where God may lead
us, He will give us the
strength, patience, wisdom or
whatever to cope with the
situation. It's the challenge
that promotes Christian
growth, and .believe me, it's
exciting. We're thankful for
the hard times as well as the
mountain-top experiences.

Thanks for helping us tell
people what we're doing. If
anyone has a question about
Teen Missions, the address is
P,0. Box 1056, Merritt Island,
Florida 32952.

Sincerely, ,
Mic & Evelyn Miracle

C. Guinther 541, B. Musall
540, D. Erla 539, A. Ouvry 538,
B. Copeland 530, C. Kolb 529,
K. Miracle 519, J. Li t t le 515,
G. Lapp 514, N. Gremel 512,
Dick Root 511, B. Selby 509, D.
Iseler 507, A.D. Frederick 506.

200 Games: L. Taylor 225,
B. Thompson 214, N. Gremel
210, D. Allen 201, C. Vandiver
200, M. Zawilinski 200.

MERCHANTS"B"LEAGUE
Jan. 14, Iflifi

Winter's Truck Sales 20
Village Service Center 20
Deford Roofing 17
Walbro 14
Croft-Clara Lumber 14
Clare's Sunoco Service 13
Schneeberger TV 8
Rabideau Motor Sales 6

600 Series: A. McLachlan
606.

500Series: J. Romig 553, J.
Gallagher 551, S. Curtis 542,
G. Wichert 533, G. Deering
531, D. Englehart 527, E.
Schulz 512, B. Bartle 511, J.
Guinther 508, J. Burleson 505.

High Games: A. McLach-
lan 255-190, J. Gallagher 209-
190, G. Wichert 205, J. Romig
203, D. Englehart 202, G.
Deering 200, B. Bartle 191, S.
Curtis 190, E. Schulz 190.

MONDAY NIGHT TRIO
Jan. 19, 1!>7<>

High Team Series: Pickle
Pickers 1265, Dreamers, 1213.

High Team Games: Pickle
Pickers 449, Jokers 430.

High Individual Series: B.
Massingale 491, L. Yost 449,
P. Schwartz 437, L. Holcomb
428, S. Reynolds 423, M.
Grady 40C, B. Creason 406, N.
Anderson 403.

High Individual Games: P.
Schwartz 188-154, B. Mas-
singale 183-162, L. Yost 163-
157, L. Holcomb 161, N. An-
derson 156, B; Creason 155, S.
Reynolds 150.

Splits Converted: M. Grady
3-10, S. Russell 9-10, 3-10, 2-7,
S. Reynolds 4-5.

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

4-H council

elected
The 4-H adult leaders and

4-H members have selected
their new representatives for
the Tuscola County 4-H Coun-
cil. The adult representatives
were elected for a three-year
term and the teen members
for a one-year term, reports
Bernie Jardot, 4-H Youth
Agent.

The new adult representa-
tives elected were Mrs. Ruth
Rubisch , Vassar; Monte
Montei, Unionville; Jack Gal-
lagher, Cass City, and Mrs
Ford Boyne, Marlette.

The new teen members are
Mary Or tner , U n i o n v i l l e ,
Tina Valentine, Fostoria;
Judy Fletcher, Mi l l ing ton ,
and Karen Wagg, Cass City.

CASS CITY GUN CLUB
4 south, 1 east, 1/4 north of Cass City

WINT~ER~TRAPlEA~GUE
TO START

2nd WEDNESDAY IN FEBRUARY
Interested parties call

872-2266 or 872-3478

Jokers
Pickle Pickers
Dreamers
Pluggers
Hopefulls
Ups & Downs
Russells

13
12
9
9
7
7
7

Want Help Finding What You Want?

Try The Want-Ads Today!

Copynghl 1976 Kfislo

Inc SlrasDu'g. Vugini

Our family Bible i?> a venerable volume, ll has

been passed from generation lo getiLTalion. going lo

the oldest each lime, and now, as long as I live, il shall
be mine.

1 have always been fascinated by this wedding
picture of my Grandmother and Grandfather Harris,

which has always been located al the page which
records their marriage. I recall when this peppery,
little gray-haired lady showed me the picture for the

first lime. Her fingers were old and wrinkled —
trembling as she turned to it.

Notice that a church appears not once, but twice,

in the drawings. 1 have always thought this symbolic
because the Church was such an important factor in
Grandmother's life. Her l-'anh upheld her Ihrough

many dark limes, and what was important was (hat
she communicated it lo all of us. Another priceless

inheritance from my Grandmother — her Bible iind

her Faith.

Wednesday
[ixndus
12:1-1-1

Thur sday
I'sulim
5 1 : 1 - 1 7

l-riday
Psalms
1.10:1-S

Suui rduy
Isa iah

4 0 : 1 - 1 !

FIRST AUTOMOTIVE, INC.

Machine Shop Service Paint

Phone 872-2178

Open I (I I ill l() 7 days a week

QUAKER MAID DAIRY
Groceries — Ice Cream

';ikc Ouls - Parly Supplies Plftne H72-Bl!)fi

VERONICA'S RESTAURANT
Cass City's headquarters for fine, home
cooked meals, lunches.

Phone 872-2550

KLEIN FERTILIZERS, INC.

Clayton Klein
Photic 872-2120 Cass City, Mich.

FUELGAS CO. OF CASS CITY
Bulk—Propane Ranges
Water Softeners & Other Appliances-

Sheet Metal
Junel ion M-H1 & M-5H Phone 872-2161

CROFT-CLARA LUMBER. INC.
. complete Building Supplies

Andersen Window?
Phone H72-214I Cass Cily. Mich.

KRITZMAN'S CLOTHING

6447 Main

Cass City. Mich. Phone 872-3470

GAMBLE STORE

Cass City, Mich. Phone 872-3515

MESSAGE SPONSORED BY
THESE

PROGRESSIVE. FIRMS
THUMB APPLIANCE, INC.

"Appliance Center of the Thumb"

Phone 872-3505 Roland Bedell

MAC& LEO SERVICE

TOTAL PRODUCTS
Jhwie 872-3122 Cass City, Mich.

VILLAGF SERVICE CENTER
TIKES—HATTKRIES- -V-BELTS—TUNE-

UPS—MUFf- 'LERS—BRAKE SERVICE

CassC ' i lv . M i c h . Phone 872-3850

BARTNIK SALES & SERVICE
Mobil Service

Used car &. tractor parts
M-81 & M-53 Phone 872-3541

IGAFOODLINER

TABLERITE MEATS

.121 Cass Citv Road. Cass Cilv Phone 872-2645

OUVRY CHEVROLET-OLDS, INC.
Cass City ..Michigan

New ana Used Cars & Trucks
872-2750' 872-3830,

CASS CITY FLORAL! -
. • I '

FLOWERS & GIFTS • •
Phone 872-3675 Cass City, Mich.
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Knows
WhatYouLike.

PRICES GOOD
NOW thru SAT,, JAN. 24,1976

JJNOTE: Not respons ib le for errors mode In
JPrinting. QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED.

STORE HOURS: OPEN THURSDAY &

FRIDAY NIGHTS TILL 9:00.

DAILY TILL 6:00.

STOCK-UP
& SAVE

ON AMERICA'S
BEST-KNOWN FOODS

THIS WEEK FROM MR. IGA!

CAMPBELL'S

VEGETABLE

SOUP
net 10 ] 2-01. Con

PILLSBURY 7

CAKE »•"••'«
18-oz.

MIXES B.,

KRAFT
Orange
Drink... MIIACjiE WHIP

O

HI-C
FRUIT
DRINKS

FLAVORS

46-ox. Can

UPTO$1000 A REAL FAVORITE!

LOG CABIN
SYRUP

FUN SIZE

CANDIES
• MILKY WAY .SNICKERS

•3 MUSKETEERS .PLAIN M&M's

o

WITH

COUPON

WITH

COUPON

10* OFF Label ^ T E | M>ERATURES Q

CHEER $
DETERGENT

49-oz. Box

o

o
NESTLES

Quik

CHOCOLATE
QUIK

$-139

Sunshine Reg. or UnsoBted ®

KRISPY O
CRACKERS •

2 - l b . WITH

COUPON O

DEL MONTE DEL MONTE

ODDS CHART „ of Janua^ 12. 1976
><<", I'xxi'.ii" 'i April 12. 1976

VEGETABLE
rnizi
VALlir

11.00000

imoo
2000

boo

2.00

1.00

IOL-J

NO OF
PRI2SS

25

Tin

700

2.MO

5.500

10.000

•8.575

[il.'iyl'tl "1 Ih-'

ODDS FOf

ONE STOKE V

2S4.0M to

Kite a

10.14310

1.550 in

1.291 la

178 lo

MI 10

limilly 111 1361

SII

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

panic

ODDS FOB
11 STORE VISITS

ZI.B46 la

i.seon
7BOIO

27310

9910

Hlo

1110

piitm<] IGA ar

1

1

1

1

1

1

1

(1 a If

ODDS IOR
26 STORE VIS

10.921 10

TUn

390io

I17lo

»lo

7u

In

taleii Food Si

TS

3res

•BEANS 16 & 17 OX. Cans O

O o • o o

OVEN FRESH

.i ol i tie SMIL- of Michigan.

1-lb. Loaf

SMOKE SAUSAGE
FARMER PEET'S

WHOLE OR END CUT

SLAB
or

OVEN FRESH NUTTY

DCNUT STICKS iz-ct. Pkg.

Deluxe Grahams or Fudge Strips

COOKIES
12'/s-oz. Pkg.

& BEAUTY AIDS

CREST* Reg. or Mint

TOOTHPASTE "«£*-

FOR COUGH RELIEF

KIYCJUIIL net 6-02. Bt.

PENN CHAMP w/Flints

FLUID 2
net 4-oz. Cans

SMOKE KIELBASA

fi49
BACON B

IGA-TABLERITE

M I X E D
PORK CHOPS

IGA-TABLERITE

FRYER
LEGS

IGA-TABLERITE BEEF

CUBE
STEAKS

WITH

BACKS
LB.

LB

MCDONALD Brand

ICE
CREAM

Ctn

DOWNYFLAKE FROZEN

HOME-MADE SIZE

WAFFLES
net 12-oz. Pkg.

BANQUET _4_ VAR|ET|ES

MAN-PIEASER

DINNERS
17-1902. Pkgs.

OVIN FRESH HOT DOG or

HAMBURG BUNS

PRODUCE VALUES
ALL PURPOSE U.S. No. 1 JQ .|b Bgg

MICHIGAN £.£ 1

POTATOES ^1

3 LBS.

CALIFORNIA NAVEL

ORANGES
SEEDLESS!

GROWN BYSUNKIST!

Doz

FAME 2%

LOW FAT

MILK Ctn.

KRAFT COLBY or CHEDDAR

CHEESE
KRAFT'QUARTERS'

PARKAY
MARGARINE

Mb. Pkg.

TABLETS

ANACIN
FUN SIZE

CANDY BARS
-4-. VARIETIES

^Ib WITH COUPON

Bag

LOG CABIN

SYRUP QUIK
WITH COUPON

100-ct. Pkg. ^ ̂  I Q

Limit One Coupon per Family
Coupon Expires Jon. 24, 1976
With Coupon 8, $7.00 Purchase

Limit One Coupon per Family
Coupon Expires Jan. 24, 1976
With Coupon & $7.00 Purchase

Limit One Coupon per Family
Coupon Expires Jan. 24, 1976

With Coupon & $7.00 Purchase
Limit One Coupon per Family
Coupon ExDires Jan. 24, 1976
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Designate centennial farm
A farm owned by Raymond

and Velma Starr of Route No.
2, Snover, has been desig-
nated as a Centennial Farm
by the Division of Michigan
History.

The farm, located in Austin
township, Sanilac county, has
been in the possession of the
family since 1868. It was
originally purchased in 1868
by Duncan McDougall.

Secretary of State Richard
H. Austin, whose Department

administers the Centennial
Farm program, said the pro-
gram was inaugurated in
1948. Since then, more than
3000 Michigan farms have
been certified as Centennial
Farms.

Certificates are provided
by the Division of Michigan
History. Large metal mark-
ers are provided by the De-
troit Edison and Consumers
Power Companies.

Down Memory Lane
FROM THE FILES OF THE CHRONICLE

Lounsbury
CASS CITY, MICHIGAN,

ins

FIVK YEARS AGO

Three major economic
moves took place in Tuscola
county this week with the

NO IRON

WHITE SHEETS & CASES
.79

$3.69
Pillow Cases
$1.99

SIZE 66 x 104 or
TWIN FITTED---

SIZE 81 x 104 or
FULL FITTED --

PRINTED or STRIPED SHEETS
NO IRON, 50% POLYESTER, 50% COTTON

$2.97TWIN FITTED or
66 x 104

FULL FITTED or
80 x 104

PILLOW
CASES

BLANKET
100%

ACRYLIC

ONLY

Full bed size, 72 x 90.
Warmth without weight.
Plain colors

ELECTRIC
BLANKETS

Double bed, single control.
Guaranteed for 1 year.

100%
Polyester filled -

Quilted - Fitted Style

MATTRESS
PADS

Twin Bed Double Bed

MuIti-Color

RUG

CANNON ROYAL FAMILY
IRREGULARS

Bath Towel

Hand Towel

Wash Cloth 570

CANNON TOWELS
PLAIN COLORS

Bath Towel 770

Hand Towel 570

Wash Cloths 270

TPERRTYED DISH TOWELS 77 <
Heavy weight in a wide assortment of prints.

FEDERATED
Coss City

Sheriff's Department organ-
izing a lodge in the Fraternal
Order of Police . . . The
County Commissioners and
Sher i f f ' s -Deput ies settling
their contract dispute . . . and
Eaton, Yale and Towne, one
of the county's largest indus-
tries settling their differences
with the allied indus t r ia l
workers.

Mr. and Mrs. Pat Martin
have sold Martin's Restau-
rant to' Mrs. Veronica Gasz-
czynski of Cass City.

Reports received last week
by the Tuscola County Board
of Commissioners included
those of Clerk Elsie -Hicks of
Deford and William Profit,
register of deeds, of Cass
City.

Anne W. Bulen, daughter of
Mr. and Mrs. Horace Bulen of
Cass City; and Su Ann Com-
ment, daughter of Mr. and
Mrs. Douglas Comment of
Gagetown, have been honored
as DAR Good Citizens of the
year.

Dave and James Milligan of
Cass City have been named to
receive a special award for
their excellence in corn grow-
ing.

TRN YEARS AGO

Unless spending soars in
1966, Tuscola county will end
the year with an estimated
surplus of $32,546, County
Clerk Archie Hicks reported
after the Board of Super-
visors set the county budget
Friday, Jan. 14, during their
week-long January session.

Jerome Root Sr. was hon-
ored at a retirement party
given by Cass City Schools as
he ended a 25-year career as a
custodian Jan. 12.

Harold Deering of Deford
was elected a trustee and as
alternate on the meat bar-
gaining committee of the Nat-
ional Farmers Organization
at the farm union's monthly
session Jan. 13, in Caro.

After clawing their way to
three straight victories, the
Cass City Red Hawks let up
for a moment and were de-
feated by Sandusky 70-66 Fri-
day night at Cass City.

Three Cass City residents
have been named to jury duty
for February -In Tuscola
county. They are Myrtle Lud-
low, Victor Guernsey and
Herman Charter.

TWENTY-FIVE YEARS
AGO

Rep. A l l i s o n Green of
Kingston has been named
chairman of the Michigan
Veteran Facil i ty and a mem-
ber of the committee on ed-
uca t ion , and revision and
amendment of the state Con-
s t i t u t i o n in the Michigan Ix'tf
i s la ture .

Stuart A t w e l l o l t h e Fru tch-
ey Bean Co., Cass Ci ty , has
just returned I'rorr a t r i p to
Decalur, Ind. , \ \nere he at-
tended the M e M i l l c n Feed
M i l l s Kcodman's Conference.

A l b h i J. Stevens. Cuss C i t y
a t t o r n e y , was appointed In
(Jov. ( I . Memu'ii W i l l i a m s as
pub l i c a d m i n i s t r a t o r of Tus-
colii county .

The hoard of educat ion iu
session Monday n i ^ h t . lend

ered Willis Campbell a two-
year contract as superintend-
ent of schools. He is complet-
ing his eighth year in tha t
position.

Audley H. Kinnaird, man-
ager of the ST&H Oil Co's
station in Cass City, was
elected a member of the
board of directors of that
company at the annual meet-
ing of stockholders Tuesday.

THIKTY-nVK YEARS
AGO

Wil l i am T. Noble, a former
Cass City resident, has been
awarded first prize in a nat-
ional photographic contest
sponsored by a nationally
circulated publishers' maga-
zine, The National Publisher.
Noble is now employed as
staff photographer and city
editor at the Lapeer County
Press.

Of the 40 automobile oper-
ators who applied to Deputy
Sheriff Vernon Everett for
drivers' licenses here Friday
was Chris Schwaderer, who
passed the 87th milestone on
life's journey Nov. 17 last. Mr.
Schwaderer is one of the
oldest among Tuscola
county's automobile drivers.

A railway passenger coach
left the Michigan Central
Station at Caro Tuesday for
the first time in the last seven
years when 23 young men
entrained for the Detroit in-
duction center to be enlisted
under the selective service
law. One of the interested
spectators was Orlando Lc-
Valley, 92, one of Tuscola
county's last surviving Civil
War veterans.

John Hewit t , who had the
misfortune to cut his foot on ;i
piece of glass as he jumped
over a fence several weeks
ago, is still confined to his
home.

"Gone With the Wind" w i l l
be shown at the Cass Theatre
soon, an advertisement an-
nounced this week.

training

Cancer

Society meets

Jan. 12
A joint meeting for the

Tuscola County Unit, Ameri-
can Cancer Executive Board,
and the 1976 crusade planning
committee was held Monday
evening, Jan. 12, at the home
of Mr. and Mrs. Don Ko-
chalka. Mrs. Earlene Cassidy
presided at the planning com-
mittee meeting.

Activities were planned for
the coming crusade, which
will again be held in the
month of April, with the Cru-
sade Kickol'f meeting March
22.

The crusade goal of $29,000
was accepted by the board.

Mrs. Ruth Hoffman an-
nounced the State Kickoff
meeting will be held March
27, in Lansing. The next meet-
ing is planned for Feb. 9.

REGULAR MEETING OF THE
CASS CITY VILLAGE COUNCIL

The regular meeting of the
Cass City Village Council was
held on December 30, 1975, at
the Municipal Building. All
Trustees were present except
Trustee Hampshire.

The minutes of the regular
November meeting were read
and approved.

A motion was made by
Trustee Tuttle and supported
by Trustee Bliss that annex-
ation of the following de-
scribed property be ap-
proved :

Commencing at the northeast
corner of Section 28, T14N-
R11E, Elkland Township,
Tuscola County, Michigan;
thence S 0 25' 10" E along the
east line of said Section 28
1,417.56 feet, to the point of
beginning; thence N 89' 53'
06" W 222.75 feet; thence N.0 r

25'10" W 115.50 feet; thence S
89° 53' 06" E 222.75 feet;
thence S 0' 25' 10" E 115.50
feet, to the point of beginning.
Subject to right-of-ways and
easements of record. Being a
part of Northeast '4 , Section
28, T14N-R11E, and contain-
ing .59 acres of land.

Motion carried.
A motion was made -by

Trustee Bliss and supported
by Trustee Jones that the
extension of water and sewer
on North Seeger to the Wil-
liam Malone property subject
to written request be ap-
proved. Motion carried.

A motion was made by
Trustee Bliss and supported
by Trustee Tuttle that a bid
not be made by the Village pn

the Gladys Lenzner property
located on the corner of Oak
and Pine Streets for the pur-
pose of a parking lot. Motion
carried, 3 yeas, 2 nays.

The financial statement for
the month of November was
reviewed.

A motion was made by
Trustee Bliss and supported
by Trustee Jones to authorize
the necessary transfers in the
1975 budget. Motion carried.

A motion was made by
Trustee Tuttle and supported
by Trustee Jones that the 1976
proposed wage and fringe
benefits be approved as pre-
sented. Motion carried.

A letter was read from
Pinney State Bank transmit-
ting a gift of $1,000.00. to the
Pool Fund. It was gratefully
acknowledged.

The 1976 proposed budget
was presented. Further dis-
cussion will be held at the
next meeting.

A motion was made by
Trustee Bliss and supported
by Trustee Rawson that the
bills as examined be ap-
proved for payment. Motion
carried.

Superintendent's report
was reviewed.

A motion was made by
Trustee Jones and supported
by Trustee Ware to authorize
the purchase of a peg board
'system for bookkeeping.
Motion carried. '

There being no further busi-
ness a motion was made by
Trustee Bliss and supported
by Trustee Ware that, the
meeting be adjourned. Motion
carried.

CARLLOUNSBURY

Lounsbury served in the
U.S. Air Force, returning to
civilian life in February, 1969.

He is presently maintaining
a full time job while attending
30 hours of classes and doing
15 hours of homework each
week.

21 from area

named to CMU

honors list
Twenty-one area students

from the Cass City area have
been named to the academic
honors list at Central Mich-
igan University for the fall
semester of 1975.

The list includes Mari But-
ler, freshman; Mary Beth
Esau, senior; David D. Hil-
laker, freshman; Gerald Lee
Morrish, senior; William Oui-
mette, senior; Kristine Rid-
enour, freshman, and Curtis
F. Strickland, junior; all of
Cass City.

Also named were Kathy Jo
Burrows, freshman of Gage-
town; James Glassford,
Joseph C. Gottler II and
Susan Wolak, all sophomores
from Kingston.

Other honor students were
Randall L. Howard, senior;
Larry D. Jamieson, senior;
Kathy Joan LaFave, senior,
and Cynthia Weatherhead,
junior, all of Owendale.

Also named were Nancy M.
Geboski, senior; Ellen K.
Hagen, junior; Carl F. Rein-
elt Jr., junior; Dougald B.
Leitch, junior, and Marilyn J.
Sweeney, senior, all of Ubly,
and Betty L. Mclntosh, se-
nior, of Snover.

To be eligible for the aca-
demic honors list, a student
must have a cumulative
grade average of "B" or
better for his or her entire
college career.

CARD'S LEADING JEWELER
PH. 673-2444

IGagetown News
Mrs. Harold Koch 665-2536

Larry and Sandra Ziehm,
students at Northern Michi-
gan University at Marquette,
returned to their studies Sun-

Carl Lounsbury, a 1963
graduate of Cass City High
School, has begun training as
an avia t ion maintenance
technician at Spartan School
of Aeronautics in Tulsa, Okla.

School Menu
JAN. 26-au

MONDAY

Fishwich
Tartar Sauce
Potato Chips

Buttered Beans
White Milk

TUESDAY

Vegetable Soup
Meat Sandwich

Peach Slices
Crackers

Milk
Cookie

WEDNESDAY

Barbecue on Bun
Potato Sticks
Apple Sauce
White Milk

Cookie

THURSDAY

Spaghetti & Meat
Bread-butter
Lettuce Salad
Cheese Slices

White Milk

FRIDAY

Hot Dog & Bun
Buttered Corn
Potato Chips

Milk
Banana Cake

Menu subject to change.

day after spending the holi-
days with their parents.

Mrs. Dorothy Hopkins of
Flint spent the week with hei
mother, Mrs. Viola Hutchm-l
son.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Weber I
and family visited Mr. and I
Mrs. Harold Koch and family
Sunday afternoon.

Sunday dinner guests ol
Mrs. Frances She l l ing of
Unionville were Mrs. Lucille
LaFave, Mrs. Gerry Carlon
and Mrs. Aura Beaudon.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Miklovich
called on the Harold-Kochs -
Sunday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Po
banz of Sebewaing vveie
guests of the Franklin Kochs
Sunday.

Counting time is unimport-
ant—see to it that time
counts.

Although not required to do
so by code, the sun has
already adopted a shorter
working day.

Having Trouble
Paying Bills?

If you are having
trouble paying that
policy once a year,
we may be able to
help!

Try our "10 Pay
Plan" for Home,
Auto or Business
Insurance.

Mich. Mutual
Ins. Co.

Doerr Agency
Phone 872-3615

Cass City

HIGHEST QUALITY
PROFESSIONAL

SERVICE

ALWAYS

AT

COACH LIGHT

PHARMACY

Exclusive Authorized
Dealer in the Thumb
for Hollister Ostomy

Appliances.

STEVE EYER. Pharmacist

BANKAMERICARD
welcome here

FREE
PARKING IN REAR.

WE ACCEPT ALL PRE-PAY PRESCRIPTION PLANS.

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY
MTKK WKAVKR. OWIKT Ph. 872-3613 ,

KIIHTLTIK-V 'I'h. «72-3283

WEEKLY SPECIAL
15-15-15 WHILE SUPPLY LASTS

PER TON
CASH PRICE

Phone 872-2120 or Stop In and have a
cup of Coffee with Us.,

KLEIN'S
KLEIN'S SERVICE CENTER j
Cass City, Michigan
Phone 517-872-2120
Gary C. Diebel, Manager



CASS CITY, MICHIGAN

WSC meets

Jan. 13
The Womanfe Study Club

met Jan. 13 at the home of
Mrs. E.L. Schwaderer. Mrs.
Edward Baker presented the
bicentennial program.

The next meeting will be
Feb. 10 at the home of Mrs.
Ernest Croft.

CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, JANUARY 22, 1976 PAGE NINE

BETTER HEALTH

Crib deaths

BY DR. WILLIAM J. WELCH

BE INDEPENDENT

Multiply everything that
you expect your friends to do
for you by two and then hustle
and do them yourself.

CONTINUING

The recent t rag ic and
wholly unanticipated death of
the six-week-old grandson of
Gov. Hugh Carey of New
York has focused public at-
tention on the enigma of crib
death, which each year kills
an estimated 10,000 babies in
their first year of l ife.

The catastrophe of unex-

Special Gospel Meetings
AT

Hillside Gospel Hall
4235 Kurds Corner Road Cass City

Nightly Except Sat.
including Sunday at 7:30 p.m.

- SPEAKERS -
|Mr. Norman Crawford Mr. William Metcalf

From Jackson, Mich. From Corruna, Ontario

Preaching the same old fashioned Gospel as preached
by John Wesley, D. L, Moody and other men of God.

ALL ARE WELCOME
"Christ Jesus came into the World to save sinners"
I Tim. 1:15

plained crib death, the lead-
ing cause of death among
infants between the ages of
one week and one year in the
United States, is especially
agonizing because it strikes
without warning. Its victims
are rarely recognized to be ill
and, on the contrary, are
considered by parents and
doctors to be- robust and
heal thy.

Most victims are in their
f i rs t few months of l i f e and,
contrary to a widely held
popular belief, do not suffo-
cate in the i r bed clothes.

Death usual ly appears to
have come peacefully wi th no
evidence of s t rugg le as
though the child had simply
stopped breathing in a quiet
sleep.

Painstaking post mortem
examinations commonly re-
veal no apparent cause of
dea th , a l t hough over the
years many theories as to the
cause of death have been
explored, only to be found
wanting.

It has been suggested that
an enlarged Ihymus gland
under the breast bone could
choke off the windpipe. Oth-
ers have incriminated aller-
gic shock, perhaps due to an
unsuspected allergy to m i l k .
And, of course, overwhelming
infec t ion by bacteria or a
virus has been suspected but

CASS CITY RED HAWK

FRIDAY, JAN. 23
CASS CITY RED HAWKS

VASSAR
JUNIOR VARSITY 7 p.m.

VARSITY FOLLOWS

TUESDAY, JAN. 27
CASS CITY RED HAWKS

vs.
UBLY BEARCATS

JUNIOR VARSITY 6:30 p.m.

VARSITY FOLLOWS

CASS CITY HIGH SCHOOL
SPONSORED IN PUBLIC INTEREST

BY THESE HAWK BOOSTERS
WICKES AGRICULTURE

Phone 872-2171

MAC & LEO SERVICE

Phone 872-3122

VILLAGE SERVICE CENTER

Phone 872-3850

OUVRY CHEV-OLDS., INC.
Phone 872-2750

CROFT-CLARA LUMBER, INC.
Phone 872-2141

GENERAL CABLE CORPORATION
Phone 872-2111

ERLA'S FOOD CENTER
Phone 872-2191

WALBRO CORPORATION
Phone 872-2131

EGGS BY JNR
Phone 872-4041

KLEIN FERTILIZERS, INC.

Phone 872-2120

KRITZMANS', INC.
Phone 872-3470

FRED'S SERVICE GARAGE
Phone 872-2235

5589 E. Cass City Rd. Cass City

AUTEN MOTORS
Phone 872-2300

BIG D RESTAURANT

Phone 872-4515 Cass City

not proved.
There are also studies tha t

propose an en/ynu1 dH'ick'ncy
which could provoke a sharp
decline in blood sugar leading
to coma and death.

The quiet and a p p a r e n t l y
abrupt modeol 'dea lh , w i t h o u t
signs of struggle, has led
other investigators to suspect
a • udden tr iggering of a l e tha l
i r r e g u l a r i t y of the heart as
the cause of crib death.

It is suggested t h a i a mech-
anism no t u n l i k e v e n t r i c u l a r
f i b r i l l a t i o n , which has in-
creasingly been rei'ogni/ed as
the cause of f a i n t i n g spells
and sudden death in a d u l t s ,
may also be at work in the
unexpected deaths of i n f an t s .

Vent r icu lar f i b r i l l a t i o n is a
rapid chaotic quivering of the
pumping muscles of the lower
heart chamber, which re-
places the normal rhythmic
contraction necessary to pro-
pel blood into the c i rcula t ion ,
and especially to the brain.

In t e r f e r ence w i t h the
normal pumping of blood to
the brain provokes immedi-
a te unconsciousness a n d ,
when the brain is deprived of
blood for three or four min-
utes, death ensues. If wi th in
these few crit ical minutes an
electrical shock administered
over the chest wall is success-
ful in convert ing the heart
rhythm to normal, the pump-
ing action is resumed. Fresh
blood flushes into the brain
and consciousness is re-
stored.

It is in order to detect and
immediately treat such l i fe-
threatening irregulari t ies of
the heart, which arc common
in heart attacks, that is the
primary reason for hospital
monitoring of the electrical
impulses generated by the
heart (electrocardiogram) in
intensive-care sections of
most hospitals and in mobile
coronary-care units.

No such facil i t ies would
seem possible or arc envis-
aged for the victims of crib
deaths. Current studies sug-
gest, however, that poor brain
control of in fan t i le sleeping
mechanisms may allow a
prolonged pause in breathing
that could set off a l i fe- threat -
ening heart rhythm.

Other work suggests that
the root of the problem may
reside in an inherited f law in
the e lect r ical conduc t ion
mechan ism of the h e a r t ,
which has been found to run in
some famil ies of children sub-
ject to crib death.

Much more work is needed
to bring light on this perplex-
ing and mysterious killer, but
one thing is clear. There is no
need for young parents to
blame themselves for some
imagined neglect, as they so
of ten do, when t ragedy
strikes. The fact is that no one
yet knows how to ant icipate
crib death in the susceptible,
and no one yet knows how to
prevent it.

For informat ion about the
causes and t r e a t m e n t of
schizophrenia, address a long
envelope to yourself, put 13
cents postage on it and en-
close it with 25 cents in an
envelope addressed to Dr.
William J. Welch, Box 4994,
Dept. CCC, DCS Moines, Iowa
50306, Ask for the booklet,
"New Hope for Schizophren-
ics."

C U K K K N T ISSUE-]

For our sports-minded fans
basketball has now succeeded
football as the most import-
ant thing in the world.

TEAMWORK

Sacrifices by all of us are a
necessity if we are to foil our
worst enemy — inflation —
from bleeding our economy.

Shabbona Area News
Marie Meredith

Phone 672-9489

Rev . and Mrs. Haro ld
Smith were Thursday supper
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ralph
Smith.

Monday evening, Mr. and
Mrs. Ryerson P u t e r b a u g h
and family entertained in
honor of Dalton Puterbaugh's
b i r thday . Guests were Mr.
and Mrs. Dale Leslie, Bob,
Merrilec. Al and Ann, Mr. and
Mrs. Bob Hacker, Mr. and
Mrs. C l in ton Hacker, Dick,
Jane and Al, and Mr. and
Mrs. Alex Gherniawski.

Mr. and Mrs. E lwin Rich-
ardson and Brenda were Sun-

Tuscola

SCD sets

annual meet
Detroit Tiger pitcher Vern

Ruble wil l speak at the Tus-
cola Soil Conservation Dis-
trict annual meeting Jan. 28.

The dinner meeting will be
held at 7:00 p.m. in the Caro
High School cafeteria.

Ruhle graduated from Cole-
man High School in 1909 and
from Olivet College in 1975.
He signed June 7, 1972 and
spent 2'i! years in the minor
leagues. He was Tiger Rookie
of the Year in 1975.

The directors will hold a
short business meeting and
the election of two directors.
Terms for Leon Keinath and
Charles Wells are expiring. A
nominat ing committee nomi-
nated the following people:
Area No. 1: Leon Keinath,
Wilforcl Leix, Willard Petzold,
and Erwin Reinert. Area No.
2: Curtis Fackler, Robert
Humpert , Ruben Keinath and
Charles Wells. One director
wi l l be elected for a three
year term in each area.

Tickets may be purchased
from the following directors:
Leon K e i n a t h , M i l l i n g t o n ;
Don Loomis, Cass C i t y ;
Bruce Ruggles, Kingston-
Charles Wells, Vassal- and
John Findlay of Reese. They
may also be purchased from
ijie district aide at the TSCD
office at '852 S. Hooper St.,
Caro. Seedling trees will be
given as door prizes.

Meetings set

for pork

producers
Pork producers in the

Thumb area are invited to
attend an educational meet-
ing at one of three locations
Jan. 28 and 29. David Ellis,
DVM of the MSU College of
Veterinary Medicine, wil l dis-
cuss "the management of
confined housing systems to
control disease problems".
Dr. Maynard Hogberg, Ex-
tension Swine Specialist at
MSU, will discuss "manage-
ment of the breeding herd"
Glen Maust, Pork Producer
at Bay Port, will review
activities of local, state, and
national pork promotion pro-
grams.

The first of these three
meetings will be at 1:30 p.m.
Wednesday, Jan. 28, in the
4-H Building on the Fair-
grounds at Caro. The next
meeting will be at 7:30 p.m.
Wednesday, Jan. 28, in the
Marlette High School Vo-Ag
Room, Then, Thursday, Jan.
29, a third meeting will be in
the Log Cabin Inn in Sebe-
waing at 9:45 a.m.

These meetings are open to
anyone interested in pork
production regardless of
race, color, or national origin.

day dinner guests of Mrs.
Nelin Richardson.

Mrs. Manuel Sanchez of
Berkley is spending this week
w i t h Mr. and Mrs. Earl
Springstead.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Smith
were Saturday dinner guests
of Rev. and Mrs. Harold
Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Dor-
man were Monday evening
supper guests of Mr. and Mrs.
Harley Dorman and family of
Caro. -

Mr. and Mrs. John Dunlap
Sr. were Sunday afternoon
callers of Mr. and Mrs. Don
Smith and f a m i l y .

Bt'NTO

The Bunco Group will meet
Saturday evening, Jan. 24, at
the Community Hall. Mr. and
Mrs. Bill Wheeler will be
hosts.

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Cherni-
awsk i and Mrs. Ryerson
Puterbaugh were Sunday
afternoon callers of Mr. and
Mrs. Robert Sprague and
family at Bay Port.

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Dor-
man were Wednesday callers
of Mr. and Mrs. Gene Groom-
bridge of Cass City.

The Pioneer group wi l l
meet at the RLDS church
annex Thursday, Jan. 22. A

70 greet

OES Grand

Family
More than 70 persons at-

tended the dinner and pro-
gram at the Masonic Temple
Wednesday evening, Jan. 14,
when Echo Chapter OES
hosted the Grand Family.
Seven Grand Officers and five
committee women came from
Mackinaw City, Mason, Lan-
sing, Dimondale, Flint, the
Detroit area, Bad Axe and
Caro. This was the first visi-
tation of the Grand Family of
the current Grand Chapter
year.

Guests were registered by
Mrs. Avis Youngs and Mrs.
Harold Murphy, after which a
six o'clock dinner was served
in the dining room where
table decorations were in
keeping with the bicentennial
year. Several men from Tyler
Lodge F&AM helped with the
serving.

At eight o'clock, Echo
Chapter reopened with the
introduction of Mrs. Beatrice
Dole of L ivon ia , Wor thy
Grand Matron, and other
members of the Grand Fam-
ily, by Mrs. Theda Seeger,
Worthy Matron of Echo Chap-
ter.

Mrs. Seeger presented Mrs.
Dole with honorary member-
ships from Echo Chapter for
herself and for Clarence
Johnson, Worthy Grand
Patron, who was unable to
attend. Also presented to Mrs.
Dole was a check for $18.85
from Echo Chapter for the
relief fund. Thirty small pil-
lows made by members of
Marlette Chapter and Echo
Chapter were given to Mrs.
Dole and will be taken to the
Masonic Home at Alma for
use of the elderly who make
their home there.

At the close of the meeting,
entertainment consisted of a
skit and vocal music by the
Dorman Sisters. Par t ic i -
pating in the skit, which was a
farce on the early history of
America, were Keith Mur-
phy, Jim Karr, Lester Evans,
Robert Hunter and Arlington
Hoffman. They were assisted
by Harold Prong as narrator
and by Keith McConkey. •

Following the formal clos-
ing , r e f reshments were
served in the dining room by
Mrs. Charles Holm and her
committee.

cooperative dinner will be
served at 12:30 p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Smith

were Sunday dinner guests of
Mr. and Mrs. Vern Geister
and f ami ly at Marlette.

Official Proceedings Of The

TUSCOLA COUNTY
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

DECEMBER 23,1975
Meeting of the Tuscola County Board of Commissioners

was calledf'obrder by the Chairman, Charles F. Woodcock.
Roll Call: All members present.
The Director of Thumb Intelligence Group appeared before

the Board and reported on work being done.
Minutes of December 9, 1975 were presented and approved.

75-M-234
Robert Wellington of the Tuscola County Road Commission

appeared before the Board and presented a Resolution for
approval by the Board.

Motion by Nagy, supported by Collon, the propo.ed
Resolution be referred to the Finance Committee for further
study and recommendation later today. Motion carried.
75-M-235

Sheriff Hugh Marr appeared before the Board with a
request for car bids for 1976.

Motion by Collon, supported by Kennedy, the proposed bids
be presented to the Sheriff Committee for study and recom-
mendation. Motion carried.
75-M-236

Sheriff Marr presented a report from the Department of
Treasury on Accounting for Jail Inmates Funds.

Motion by Nagy, supported by Kennedy, the report be
received and placed on file. Motion carried.
75-M-237

Bates Wills, Probate Judge, appeared before the Board and
discussion was had on a vacancy in the Juvenile Department.

Motion by Wenta, supported by Collon, the matter be
referred to the Personnel Committee for further study and
recommendation. Motion carried.

Recess for lunch.
AFTERNOON SESSION—DECEMBER 23, 1975

All members present.
Michael Gage, Emergency Medical Hospital Coordinator

with East Central Michigan Comprehensive Health Council,
appeared before the Board and discussion was had on E.M.T.
Training and proposed Federal Grants for Radio Systems for
hospitals and ambulances in Tuscola County.
75-M-238

John Briggsof Human Development Commission appeared
before the Board and discussion was had on "Meals on Wheels"
with a request for $1,615.00 for the year 1976 for the program.

Motion by Nagy, supported by Wenta, the matter be
referred to the Finance Committee for study and recom-
mendation. Motion carried.
75-M-239

Motion by Dehmel, supported by Nagy, the Resolution
presented by the Road Commission for permission to borrow
funds to be paid from State collected taxes be approved. Roll
Call Vote: Dehmel, yes; McConkey, yes; Collon, yes; Wenta,
yes; Nagy, yes; Kennedy, yes; Woodcock, yes. 7 yes, 0 no.
Motion carried.
75-M-240

Motion by Wenta, supported by Nagy, the Sheriff be
allowed to advertise for car bids. Bids to be opened January 13,
1976 at 2:00 P.M. Motion carried.
75-M-241

Motion by Commissioner Kennedy, supported by Dehmel,
the following transfers be made:

$104,259.00 from Revenue Sharing to General Fund Public
Safety

44,365.00 from Public Improvement to Contingent Fund
1,000.00 from Contagious to Contingent Fund

To Transfer from the Contingency Account to the various
departments in the amount of $154,155.00:
Board of Commissioners $10,640.00
Circuit Court 47,250.00
District Court 17,610.00
Magistrate 690.00
Probate Court 4,861.00
Juvenile Division 3,981.00
Adult Probation 714.00
District Court Probation 1,029.00
County Clerk 3,130.00
Courthouse and Grounds 20,018.00
Equalization 1,810.00
Planning Commission 445.00
County Treasurer 2,156.00
Animal Shelter 2,618.00
Civil Defense 2,334.00
Ambulance Emergency 21.00
Drivers License Bureau 6,518.00
Marine Safety = 872.00
Veterans Burial 1,518.00
Veterans Counseling 3,691.00
Drain at- large 1.00
Insuranceand Bonds 10,591.00
Social Security Co. Share 3,576.00
Friend of the Court 2&.00
Drain Commission 460.00
Cooperative Extension 1,353.00
Prosecuting Attorney 6,048.00

$154,155.00
To amend Prosecuting Attorney Budget from $43,569.00 to

$53,569.00 and to amend Cooperative Extension Budget from
$27,586.00 fo $51,616.00. Roll Call Vofe: Kennedy, yes; Wood-
cock, yes; Dehmel, yes; McConkey, yes; Collon, yes; Wenta,
yes; Nagy, yes. 7 yes, 0 no. Motion carried.
75-M-242

Motion by Kennedy, supported by McConkey, the report of
the Equalization Dept. be received and placed on file and the
Equalization Director be instructed to refrain from sending the
report to the State Tax Commission. Motion carried.
75-M-243

A request was received from the Register of Deeds to af-
fend a convention in Kalamazoo.

Motion by Kennedy, supported by Wenta, he be allowed to
attend with necessary expenses to be paid. Motion carried.
75-M-244

Motion by Commissioner McConkey, supported by Nagy,
the salary of Jackie Larson as Confidential Secretary fo the
Board of Commissioners be set at $9500.00 refroacfive to Oc-
tober 1,1975. Roll Call Vofe: McConkey, yes; Collon, abstain;
Wenta, yes; Nagy, yes; Kennedy, yes; Woodcock, yes; Deh-
mel, yes. 6 yes, 1 abstain. Motion carried.

Minutes were read and approved.
Chairman Woodcock thanked the Board for their

cooperation for the year.
Motion by Nagy, supported by Wenta, we adjourn until

January 13, 1976 at 9:30 a.m. Motion carried.
Elsie Hicks, Clerk Charles F. Woodcock, Chairman

ALL FURNITURE, STEREOS, TV's, APPLIANCES, COCKTAIL & END TABLES, PICTURES, LAMPS and CHAIRS

SALE PRICED thru JANUARY

ICHARD'S TV -APPLIANCE -FURNITURE 'OWNER: RICHARD JONES

INTERIOR DESIGN: GERRY JONES

(Moving to Former Western Auto Store

Main St., Cass City - February)

MAIN ST.;, CASS CITY PHONE 872-2930 HOURS: WEEKDAYS 9-5:30 - Fri. 9-9 -, Sat. 9-5
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Commissioners hear dept. heads

County growth rate continues
decline, statistics reveal

The Tuscola County Board
of Commissioners began re-
ceiving annual reports from
various county departments
last week during its week-
long organizational session.
More reports were due this
week.

Among those presented
were Register of Deeds,
Treasurer and Magistrate.

REGISTER OF DEEDS

Tuscola county's rate of
growth showed signs of con-
tinued decline in 1975, accord-
ing to statistics presented by
Register of Deeds John Mar-
shall.

Marshall's annual report
shows a total of 2,245 deeds
registered in 1975, a drop of 73
from 1974 and 364 fewer than
were registered in 1973. Prior
to that year, Marshall said,
the number had shown slow
but generally steady growth.

READ THE
Chronicle

THEY CAN

The number of land con-
tracts recorded also dropped,
Marshall reported. A total of
128 were registered, down 43
from 1974 and a drop of six
from the previous year.

The number of new mort-
gages rose slightly, however,
finishing the year at 1,197, an
increase of 55 over 1974. The
total was still down 333 from
1973.

A total of 11,515 instruments
were registered in 1975, an
increase of less than 400 from
1974 but still below the 12,583
registered in 1973.

Marshall reported total re-
ceipts of the Register of
Deeds office in 1975 were
$61,452.30, an increase of $121
from 1974. In 1973, receipts
totaled $68,565.55.

Expenses for the year were
reported as $36,376.68, with a
net profit of $25,075.62.

TREASURER'S REPORT

Total county income from
all depar tments exceeded
estimates by over $77,000,
according to the report of
Treasurer Arthur Willits.

Willits reported the county
received a total of $1,780,-
363.11 from all departments,
$77,540.11 more than antici-
pated

The largest surplus over
estimate came in the Treas-
urer's office itself, which re-
ceived a total of $1,516,583.78.
The total is $36,247.78 over

estimated income at the be-
ginning of the year.

A healthy income picture
was also reported by Tuscola
County District Court, which
received $110,270.76, more
than $20,000 over estimates.

Other departments ending
the year on the plus side of
income estimates were the
Friend of the Court, Probate
Court , Probat ion Depar t -
ment, Dog Warden and the
County Clerk's office.

Departments which failed
to meet anticipated income
inc luded the Register of
Deeds o f f i c e which fe l l

$4,997.70 short of its goal, and
the S h e r i f f ' s depar tment
which missed its anticipated
income of $21,572.00 by only
$182.64.

Will i ts also reported that
$767,707.10 in delinquent tax
receipts were written in 1975.

MAGISTRATE

County Magis t ra te John
Bowles reported his office
took in $118,581 in fines in
1975, down $9,000 from a year
ago.

He also reported that Cass
City received $1,913 in fines
returned to municipalities, a
$500 increase from last year.
Gagetown received $1,187 up
a whopping $565 from a year
ago.

Caro topped the list with
$2,494, over twice the amount
it received last year and
Vassar received $1,259, about
half its 1974 total.

Bowles explained that from
each fine received by his
office, $4 goes to the state. If
the violation involves a vil-
lage ordinance, the remaind-
er is split two-thirds to the
county and one-third to the
village.

If the violation is a state
matter, the split is 50-50 be-
tween state and county.

Fines returned to villages
can be used for any purpose
designated by that village.

Bowles reported his office's
busiest month was October,
when over $14,000 in fines was
collected. He said October is
traditionally hectic due to an
increase in the number of
hunt ing violation citations is-
sued by the Department of
Natural Resources.

Classes called off Monday

Drifting snow blocks
roads, shuts schools

The Largest Display of Fireplaces, Wood & Coal Stoves
and Accessories is at:

Leisure Living
on Divided Highway M-15, Just South of Bay City. Free
Heat Machines, Chimney Heat Savers, Grates, Grills,
Glass Doors, Tools, Free Standing & custom Screens,
Fireproof Glue on Brick & Stone and Bicentennial Flags.

Weekdays 9 to 5:30, Friday night to 7, Saturday 9 to 2,
Closed Sundays and Mondays. Phone (517)-892-7212.

Drif t ing snow that choked
area sideroads provided Cass
City School District students
with another half-day's vaca-
tion Monday following last
week's holiday that saw stu-
dents go an entire week with-
out cracking the books.

School officials cancelled
classes at 12:30 p.m. At least
four busses were reportedly
stuck on snow-clogged county
roads Monday morning.

Unionville-Sebewaing Area
schools were also reported
closed Monday afternoon due
to poor road conditions.

It's the longest continuous
string of no-school days in
recent memory and while it
may be fun for the students, it
created headaches for school

a d m i n i s t r a t o r s who were
looking at f inal exam sched-
ules wari ly .

Supt. Donald Grouse said
the amount of lost time will
not have to be made up in
June. He said according to
state law, the snow is consid-
ered an "act of God" and as
such need not be made up.

"If a boiler broke down,
though, and we had to close
for three or four days, then
we'd have to have at least 180
days of education," he added.

Grouse explained the cri-
teria for closing school are
based primarily on road con-
ditions. He said bus super-
visor Ross Miller is consulted,
along with drivers from out-
lying points of the district.

From these reports, a de-
cision is made.

The super in tenden t said
much of last week's problems
were related to blowing and
drif t ing snow, especially on
east-west roads. He said some
county roads had a track only
the width of a snowplow Mon-
day and that these were fill-
ing fast.

Crouse said no school aid
has been lost as a result of the
school closings.

High School Principal Russ
Richards said Monday se-
mester exams were stil l
scheduled for Thursday and
Friday of this week. He said
teachers told him work could
still be completed in time.

Bill the account of SCHNEEBERGER'S

TIME FACTOR REQUESTED

(Regular Postal gram

Same Day

nt Is requested that clients check on
jf the above, for proper dispatch rat
•V of the Postalgram. . s-

POST1NG DATA

HOfH RECORPED

A STRANDED motorist gets an assist from a County Road
Commission snow-plow on Hurley Road, two miles north of Cass
City, Monday afternoon. Drifting snow that clogged sideroads
forced Cass City schools to close Monday afternoon, giving
students another half-day's vacation to go along with an entire
week away from classes last week.

SHARPENING UP their pinball games are Cindy Walters (left)
and Dorothy Schwartz. This favorite pastime for many is no longer
illegal, thanks to a recently-passed bill in the Michigan
Legislature.

WAREHOUSE CLEARANCE
$225,000 STOCK MUST GO IN 36 SELLING HOURS

Sale Starts Jan. 22 8:00 a.m. 3 Days Only

OUR WAREHOUSE IS JAMMED WITH MERCHANDISE 1976 MODELS ARE ON THEIR

WAY WE MUST MAKE ROOM! WE NEED THE MONEY! FURNITURE • CARPEt

BEDDING REFRIGERATORS

DISHWASHERS TELEVISIONS

RANGES -

STEREOS

WASHERS • DRYERS FREEZERS

OUR COMPLETE STOCK MUST BE

SOLD AT REDUCED PRICES. S-A-V-E $40 - $50 - $60 - EVEN $100 ON MANY ITEMS

• • ' . - . . ... BE HERE EARLY THURSDAY MORNING FOR THE B I G B I G B A R G A I N S ! ! ..

-THE SALE YOU HAVE BEEN WAITING FOR -

USE OUR EASY PAYMENT PLAN FIRST INSTALLMENT FEB. 1976

TV • APPLIANCES FIRIWURE

Phone: 872-2696 Cass City

GOOD

SERVICE

our most

IMPORTANT

PRODUCT

Tilt! Pinball declared
legal by legislature
You may not have'realized

it, but all you pinball fanatics
were breaking the law. But
thanks to an act of the Mich-
igan legislature, you're no
longer candidates for a jail
cell.

Shortly before adjourning
for their Christmas recess,
lawmakers amended the
state's criminal code, making
pinbal l completely legal.
Actually it wasn't the pinball
players that were breaking
the law as much as it was
taverns and restaurant oper-
ators with the machines in
their establishments.

The old law ruled out profi ts
made from "a gaming room
or a gaming table or any
game of skill or chance, or
partly of skill and partly of
chance, used for gaming."

In short, it meant pinball
machines that offered free
games for high scores were in
violation. Proprietors could
have gone to jail for up to two
years and been fined $1,000.

The new law exempts "a
mechanical amusement de-
vice which through the appli-
cation of an element of skill"
provides free games.

The change came in a bill
introduced by Sen. Harry De-
Maso (R-Battle Creek). But it
wasn't that simple,

A dispute arose between
two Democratic representa-
tives-Paul Rosenbaum of
Battle Creek and John
Markes of Livonia. 'The bill
limits free-play games to 15 at
any one time. Markes offered
an amendment to eliminate
the limit.

The House okayed the
amendment and sent it to the
Senate. Then it called the bill
back and rcmstituted the lim-
it, conforming to senate
action. Rosenbaum had urged
the amendment be restored.

The limit had been insti-

tuted to help eliminate the
possibility of actual gamb-
ling, DeMaso said.

The old law had been large-
ly ignored in the wake of pin-
ball-mania sweeping the na-
tion. In 1945, the Michigan
Supreme Court ruled pin ball
machines offering free games
were actually gambling de-
vices under the c r imina l
code.

Two things have changed
since that time. Pinball ma-
chines 'have almost univer-
sally added "flippers" by
which the player can control
the path of the ball to some
extent,

And, in 1962, federal law
provided that machines with
flippers were not gambling
devices.

WITH
EVERY ROLL OF
KODACOLOB
FILM...
PROCESSED
& PRINTED
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ERLA'S HICKORY SMOKED

PICNICS

...ni

Tender Aget

ERLA'S HICKORY SMOKED WHOLE OR SHANK HALF

HAMS
$1.

HICKORY SMOKED SKINLESS

BONELESS HAMS

'1.45*
Beef

STEAKS
RIB STEAKS
ROUND STEAKS

ERLA'S HOMEMADE FRESH

LIVER RINGS

LB.

FRESH FROZEN

TURKEY DRUMSTICKS

Sf h™ 7" C
LB.

ERLA'S HOMEMADE BULK

PORK SAUSAGE
•y,

FRESH GROUND

HAMBURGER

SIRLOIN STEAKS

T-BONE STEAKS-

PORTERHOUSE STEAKS 1.15

98< LB.

VLASIC

SAUERKRAUT.

FRESH PORK

SPARE RIBS

$1.19
qt jar

COLES FROZEN

GARLIC BREAD -

.490
690

CAMPBELL'S CHICKEN NOODLE OR VEGETABLE

V 2r/ 3fr I

ERLA'S MILD SENSATION

SKINLESS FRANKS

RING BOLOGNA

LARGE BOLOGNA

ii
FRESH SLICEDFRESH SLICtlJ fl*f i

BEEF LfVER 4/0
ERLA'S HOMEMADE

PICKLED BOLOGNA
LB.

KEEBLER ZESTA SALTINESIVtLXLiJDIjJCjri £jHiOJ..rt. u-n.-1-i JL l-LI-UiO 1 j— f̂l̂  JL

CR ACKERS-4 9<
KEYKO QRTD.

MARGARINE
MCDONALD CARNIVAL

1-lb. pkg.

GLADE Asst'd. Solid Scents

AIR FRESHENERi-_* 390

lit

BARS 12 pk.

MCDONALD QUALITY
CHEK'D.

SKIM MILK

SWIFTNING

SHORTENING 5119
3-lb.
can

''

Oven Fresh

Golden Loaf
1 l/4-lb.

loaf

Oven Fresh

1-lb.
loaf

Oven Glo Sugar & Plain

12 49 <

46-oz. can

LIBBY'S

TOMATO
JUICE-
TIP TOP FLORIDA

CITRUS

KIX BREAKFAST

9-oz

Specials Good Thru: Monday.
Jan- 26, 1

CEREAL
FLAVOR KIST

COOKIES

jp7^~<»*^^'fu^>^'^^t^^><^j<w'^^"'^rjo''mTf'-''"TTri^^

^X Banquet Frozen

rnirnFRIED

98C LB.

PRODUCE
Size 88 Sunkist

ORANGES. doz.

U.S. Nq. 1 Michigan

POTATOES...
New

CABBAGE _______ Lb:_15<t
U.S. No. 1 Mclntosh
or Delicious

APPLES 4 bag 69<t

Cello

RADISHES pkg.

MADE RITE
Reg or Ripple W_Q

CHIPS bag 77<
TOTINOS FROZEN 4 Kinds

15-oz. pkg.

NO RETURN

16-oz. btls.
IQQu<9

Oatmeal-Iced Oatmeal-Fig Bars

^ MEIICIWNOISING

rla's
Food Center

IN CASS CITY
OPEN MONDAY THURSDAY TO 6 P.M

FRIDAY TO 9 P.M.

SATURDAY 8:00 A.M. TO 6 P.M.

BEER WINE
MEMBER T.W. FOOD STORE

PHONE 872-2191

GENTLE FELS LIQUID

DISH SOAP
NORTHERN BATHROOM

TISSUE 4rol lpak

BANQUET FROZEN

HEALTH & BEAUTY ITEMS
Pacquin

Hand Cream x-dry !_7_0_zlla_r_o9c|5

Hai Karate after shave t^._bti, $ 1.49
Protein 21 X-Hold

Hair Spray '-l?~2-'-?--
Visine ^ -. ^.^.
Eye Drops fl^i.I- $1.U"
Swan 5 gr' each 9«^n ^ wii • • m i l ^^0 Ct. Dtl.Aspirin Tablets.

FRUIT

9-OZ.
PKGS.

APPLE PUCH CHERRY
Vaseline Jel

Alka Seltzer Plug-
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Joslyn seeks impartial role as county prosecutor

TUSCOLA COUNTY Prosecutor Patrick Joslyn began his new
job Jan. 1 after serving as an assistant prosecutor in Clinton
county. Joslyn still faces many of the problems that led his
predecessor George Holmes to resign.

By Jim Ketchum

Patrick Joslyn could have
gone into any number of
professions during his life.
He's taken a crack at every-
thing from teaching to bar
tending to meat cutt ing.

Yet, either because of or in
spite of everything, the 34-
year-old St. Johns native
eventually found his way into
the practice of law. Today
he's Tuscola county's new
prosecuting attorney.

"I've probably had more
opportunities to do anything
than a lot of people," Joslyn
said as he took a break from
his hectic svork schedule,
leaned back in his chair and
crushed out a cigarette in an
ash tray.

"I had to work my way
through college and in the
process, 1 worked on a farm,
washed cars at a Buick deal-
ership, cut meat, unloaded
trucks and even tended bar
for awhile," Joslyn said.

It all led to a career as an
attorney, thanks in large part
to the G.I. Bill, passed by Con-
gress in 1967. Joslyn, a social
science major at Michigan
State University, had planned
to be a teacher.

"I was doing student teach-
ing at Lansing Everett High
School," Jos lyn reca l led ,
"and 1 became frustrated
w i t h what I saw. Students
would ask me why they
should gel an education and I
would say to better them-
selves.

"Yet I could see that there
were societal problems evi-
dent that wouldn't allow that
to happen. And I felt I could
do more to help meet those
problems as a lawyer than as
a teacher."

Armed with this determina-
tion, along with G.I. Bill funds
("we counted on that to pay
the rent"), he graduated from
the Detroit College of Law in

June, 1972 and was admitted
to the bar.

He served as an assistant
prosecutor in his native Clint-
on county the past four years
before taking over for former
Prosecutor George Holmes
this year.

Joslyn says he likes the idea
of coming to Tuscola county
because of the similarities to
his home turf .

"Both counties are primar-
i ly f a r m l a n d , " he sa id ,
"they're wi th in driving dis-
tance of the megalopolis and
the populations are about the
same."

The Thumb was not entirely
new c o u n t r y for Joslyn,
whose wife has f a m i l y ties in
the region. Her grandfather
owned and operated a store in
Deckerville 20 years ago.

"I've driven through Tus-
cola county for at least the
past 13 years," he said. "So
even though I'm not well-
acquainted with the people
yet, I feel I have some know-
ledge of the area."

POLICIES

The new prosecutor hasn't
committed himself yet to a
set of policies he wants to
implement. He says he wants
to take time to fami l ia r ize
himself with the job, the
people and the problems fac-
ing the office of prosecuting
attorney.

"One thing I would like to
do is develop a good working
relationship with the Board of
Commissioners ," he said.
"There's no point in carrying
on a running feud with them. I
plan to attend as many com-
mission meetings as possible
so that I have an idea of what
some of the problems are that
they face."

Regard ing the f u n d i n g
crisis t h a t p rec ip i t a ted
Holmes' resignation as prose-
cutor, Joslyn isn't ready to go

•pexalf GREAT SKLKCTIONS

Live Plants FROM
POTS - PLANTERS

All kinds in stock

Time*
Watches

Kodak
Cameras

Electric
Appliances

All
ON SALE

SUPER
PLENAMINSASPIRIN WITH PURCHASE

PEPSI or COKE
16-oz. NO RETURNS

39
NIACIH

TABLETS,
Hi Pi

(MCtmMIC ACID)

MONEY ORDERS 15«

Fine Copies
254 ea.

EXTRAS .
ea.

OLD WOOD DRUGS
THE CORNER STORE WITH A WHOLE LOT MORE

CASS CITY

FRANKOMA

POTTERY
SHIPMENT ARRIVED

LOTS OF

MUGS AND SETS

SEE IT ALL TODAY

on the record with specific
proposals. He does see a trend
toward an expanding prose-
cutor's role in all Michigan
counties, due in part to larger
police forces.

"It's a problem that's been
faced by metropolitan areas
for many years that's just
now beginning to be felt in
places such as Tuscola
county." Joslyn said.

From a professional stand-
point, Joslyn believes a prose-
cuting attorney must remain
as impart ia l as possible as he
conducts his office.

"I'm a Republican," he
says, "but I feel that when it
comes to an office such as this
one. you have to be as non-

partisan as possible. If it ever
boiled down to a choice of
whether or not to prosecute
someone because he svas a
Democrat or a Republican, I
wouldn't want any part.of it.
Something like that really
makes me mad."

Joslyn says the low esteem
in which lawyers are held by
much of the public shouldn't
be taken as a blanket state-
ment that all lawyers are
corrupt.

"There has always been
that sort of stigma to a
certain degree," Joslyn says.
"But you'll find undesirable
persons in any profession and
I'm convinced that society
eventually weeds them out.

Personally, I'll stand on my
own record as a lawyer and a
public official."

Regarding his own future,
Joslyn says he plans to re-
main on the Tuscola county
scene for some time to come.

"I definitely plan to stay
around,"hesays. "Rightnow
I can't foresee any reason
why I shouldn't. Of course, I
do have to run for election and
it's up to the people to decide
whether they want me to
continue. It's their choice."

He said he is still looking for
permanent living quarters for
himself and his family includ-
ing his wife, the former- Jud—
ith Clark and their five chil-
dren ranging in age from
eight years to nine weeks.

Cass City crime rate

rises, Wilson reports
Crime in Cass City, includ-

ing larcenies , burglar ies ,
vandalism and drug com-
plaints, all rose in 1975, ac-
cording to Police Chief Gene
Wilson's annual report re-
leased this week.

The report shows the total
number of crimes in 1975
stood at 305, up 68 from the
previous year and a gain of
122 from 1973 figures. Vanda-
lism showed the sharpest rise
with 121 complaints, 32 more
than were reported in 1974.

Total larcenies stood at 136,
an increase of 11, while 30
burglar ies were reported,
seven more than last year.
Assaults stood at 19, a jump of
10.

A sharp rise in drug com-
plaints was also noted. Wilson
said his department handled
25 drug cases, 16 more than in
1974 and 23 more than just two
years ago.

Wilson's department spent
a busy year on the enforce-
ment front as well. Cass City
police wrote a total of 462
traffic tickets in 1975, 126

License

plate study

fins

Numbers, letters and bor-
der stripes on your license
plates already are shiny--
after many legislative hassles
about reflectorizing.

Now the fight appears to
begin anew, as a special
legislative committee gears
up to study whether Michi-
gan's license plates should be
ful ly reflectorized.

An earlier study reportedly
found no significant advan-
tage to adding the material to
reflect light. And Secretary
of State Richard H. Austin
opposes re f l ec to r i z ing f u r -
ther.

Critics also point out that
completely reflectorizing li-
cense plates could n'early
double the current 70 cents
per pair of plates manufac-
turing cost.

But Rep. Thomas Ander-
son, D-Southgate, is sponsor-
ing a bill to require fu l l
reflectorizing. He says the
current plates are ineffect ive
in bad weather and provide
inadequate i l lumination.

The special study commit-
tee will "sort out the data
available," says Democratic
Sen. Jerome Hart of Saginaw,
who sponsored the measure
creating the committee.

THINGS
WE PRINT

BUSINESS CARDS
ACCOUNTING

FORMS
PROGRAMS
STATEMENTS
ENVELOPES
TICKETS
MENUS
LETTERHEADS
VOUCHERS
BROCHURES
BOOKLETS

The Chronicle
PHONE 872-2010

more than in 1974 and 2(i()
more than were issued in
1973.

Total arrests and appear-
ance tickets issued nearly
tripled from 1974, Wilson re-
ported. Officers issued 143
appearance tickets in 1975,
compared with only 50 last
year and just 30 in 1972 and
1973.

Wilson said the large in-
crease was due pr imari ly to
better enforcement. He said
having four men on duty the
entire year helped boost de-
partment effectiveness. In
1974, the department was
short one man for about three
months before officer Robert
Smith was hired.

Greater enforcement was
also reflected in the increased
number of verbal warnings
issued to motorists. A total of
791 motorists received verbal
warnings in 1975, a jump of
205 from the previous year.

Wilson reported the depart-
ment also handled increased
numbers of disorderly com-
p l a i n t s , runaways , a n i m a l
complaints and prowler com-
plaints.

While the trend was toward
more police a c t i v i t y , de-
creases were reported in a
few categories. The total
number of village t ra f f ic ac-
cidents in 1975 stood at 90, a
decrease of 10 from 1974.
Minor accidents dropped by
22 and t ra f f ic complaints
were down by six from 1974.

Cass City Police officers
also palrolled 77,968 miles in
1975, a drop of 4,748 miles
from last year. The drop
came after Wilson ordered
patrols confined to the vil lage
limits as much as possible.

In prior years, the depart-
ment responded to calls as far
away as Deford and would be
pressed into service when
Tuscola County Sheriff 's de-
parlmenl patrol uni t s were
not immediately avai lable .

The cutback was ordered to
help cut department operat-
ing costs.

As a result , department
officers worked 417 overt ime
hours in 1975, 74 fewer than
the previous year.

Wilson reported total calls
and services handled by Cass
City Police in 1075 stood at
4,475, an increase of 413 from
1974 and a j ump of 1)02 from
1973.

The pol ice c h i e f sa id
$12,303.00 in stolen property
was reported in 1975, about
hal f of 1974's t o t a l .

In other services, the de-
par tmenl handled 24 regis-
t ra t ion requests in 1975, an
increase of 11 from last year.
It conducted 50 l iquor inspec-
tions and 10 vehicle inspec-
tions.

Elect bank

officers

Tuesday
Officers for Pinney Slal'1

Bank and Cass Ci ly Stau-
Bank were named in separate
board meetings held Tuesday
night.

Pinney Sta te Bank direc-
tors include I'Yederick Pin-
ney, Dr. Lewis Pinney, Dr.
Dc lbe r t Rawson , R i c h a r d
Donahue, Thomas Jackson
and Robert Kea t ing .

O f f i c e r s a rc p r e s i d e n t ,
Frederick P inney ; vice-pres-
ident , Robert K e a t i n g ; cash-
ier, Bill Huh I. and assistant
cash ie rs , Beve r ly H u r l e y ,
Alice Me Comb and Phil Keat-
ing.

Renamed officers of Cass
City State Bank wen; M.B.
A u t e n , c h a i r m a n o f the
board; Fred Auten, presi-
dent ; Art Randa l l , vice'pres-
ident , and Larry Dickinson
and Sherry! Secley, assistant
cashiers.

AIME SAYS, WE'RE

VERY EASY TO DO
BUSINESS WITH

$3488l!)75 Chevrolet '/•> ton pickup and camper box,
standard transmission. Extra clean, 1 year-
warranty. Only

1!)74 Pontiac Lenians sport coupe, V8 automatic
transmission and air conditioning, power, bucket
seats. 1 year warranty. Only

l!)74 Gremlin coupe. Economy engine, standard
transmission, radio, good gas mileage. 1 year
warranty. Only

l!)74 Chevrolet Vz ton pickup, 6 cylinder, standard
transmission. Excellent condition. 1 year war-
ranty. Only

l!)73 Chevrolet :!.i ton pickup V8, 4 speed. Like
new. 1 year warranty

11)72 Chevrolet Impala custom coupe V8, auto-
matic transmission, power, special custom
paint. Only

l!)72 Ford LTD 4 door, power, air conditioning,
stereo, vinyl top. Extra sharp. Only

l!)71 Chevrolet Impala station wagon V8, auto-
matic transmission, power. Extra clean. 1 year
warranty. Only

1971 Olds Cutlass V8, automatic transmission,
power. Good transportation

l!)70 Ford Maverick, standard transmission,
radio. Good transportation car. Only

3188
2188

2688

1788
1588
1288

OUVRY CHEV.-OLDS, INC
V Phone.872-2750 or 872-3830

• • ' • ' . ' ' • • . Cass'-City ' . ' • ' • ' /
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TURN DISCARDS INTO CASH • USE PROFITADLE, LOW COST CHRONICLE LINERS
Transit (nonbuslness)rate:

'0 words or less, $1.00 each
insertion; additional words 4
2ents each. Three weeks for
Ihe price of two - cash rate.
iave money by enclosing cash
with mall orders. Rates for
display want ad on application.

AUCTIONEERING - See Lorn
"Slim" Hillaker. Top dollar
for your property. Phone
812-3019 Cass City. 10-3-tf

CUSTOM
BUTCHERING

Meat cut, wrapped and frozen

Gainor's
Meat Packing

Bad Axe. Phone 269-8161

FOUR PUPPIES to give away,
mother is collie. Also girls'
winter coats - sizes 10, 12,
14. Call after 4 p.m. 872-
3812. 1-22-1

Homelite
Chain Saws

Complete stock
available

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City
10-16-tf

1 mile north,
Bad Axe.

mile west of
11-25-tf

\PARTMENT FOR RENT -
Call 872-2266 after 5.

1-22-3

FOR SALE - Homelite chain
saws; Johnson outboard mo-
tors, boats and accessories.
Boyd Shaver's Garage, Caro.
Across from Caro Drive-In.
Phone OSborn 3-3039.

1-23-tf

Lost
Golden Retriever

Light brown color, white col-
lar, female.

Answers to Sugarfoot. 4 1/2
months old.

Reward
Phone 872-2266

after 5
1-22-1

GAME PARTY - Every Sun-
day night, at St. Pancratius
hall, Cass City, 8:00 p.m.

2-20-tf

NEW MAGIC CHEF gas
ranges, 30-Inch size. Any
color. Special $199.95. Fuel-
gas Co., Cass City, phone
872-2161. Corner M-81 and
M-53. 5-15-tf

FOR SALE - 23" color Zenith
console TV, new picture tube,
3-year warranty on picture
tube, $295 plus tax. 23" color
Zenith TV console $275 plus
tax. 23" color console RCA
TV $185 plus tax. 21" color
TV console Zenith $185 plus
tax. 21" black and white
Philco console TV, $55 plus
tax. 22" black and white Ad-
miral console, $75 plus tax.
All are used color TV's, have
been fully Inspected and
carry 90-day warranty. We
pay 100% of our labor and
50% on parts. Thumb Ap-
pliance, Inc. 6422 W. Main
St., Cass City. 1-22-1

DOES YOUR PIANO need
tuning? Call Duane Johnston,
409 Cleveland St., Bad Axe,
269-7364. Thirteen years'
experience on all makes of
pianos, registered craftsman
member of the Piano Tech-
nician's Guild. 7-30-tf

FOR SALE - 1974 Ski Doo
340; 1973 Yamaha 292. Phone
872-3732. 1-22-3

FOR SALE - 1971 Ski Doo
Nordic, 30 hp, wide track,
$350.00. Call 872-3755 after
6:00 weekdays or anytime
week ends. 1-15-3

FOR RENT - 5 room upstairs
apartment. Heat furnished.
Phone 872-4415. 12-11-tf

WANTED - old pocket
watches, rings, chains. Call
872-2635 after 5 p.m.

;2-20-tfn

GAME PARTY - Every Sun-
day night, at St. Pancratius
hall, Cass City, 8:00 p.m.

2-20-tf

McCulloch

Chain Saws
Parts-service

A complete selection of sizes
on display.

Select the saw that fits
your needs.

Rabideau Motors
Farm Division

Phone 872-2616
8-28-tf

FOR RENT - Electric adding
machine by day or week. Or
rent a new Smith-Corona
portable typewriter. Also
new and used typewriters for
sale, all makes. Leave your
typewriters and other office
equipment at our store for
repair. McConkey Jewelry
and Gift Shop. 10-6-tf

AUCTIONEERING - Farm and
general. Harold Copeland,
phone 872-2592. 5-18-tf

EAR CORN For Sale - by the
ton. Phone 673-7179.

1-22-3

2ND FLOOR apartment, 3
rooms and bath, furnished
and all utilities paid. Work-
ing girls only. Phone 673-
4006. 5-29-tf

SEPTIC TANK CLEANING -
For fast, guaranteed work
call Dale Rabideau, Cass
City 872-3581 or 872-3000.

3-24-tf

CUSTOM BUTCHERING -
Monday and by 10 a.m. Tues-
day. By appointment only.
Cutting and wrapping for deep
freeze. 1 1/2 miles south.
Carl Reed, Cass City. Phone
872-2085. 10-27-tf

Custom Slaughtering - curing
smoking and processing.

Beef - Pork - Veal - Lamb

For Sale - Beef and Pork,
whole or half. Wrapped in the
new clear shrink f i lm.

Erla's Packing Co.
Cass City, Mich.

Dick Erla
Phone 872-2191

11-2-tf

ARVIN

Electric

Space Heaters
Check our complete selection

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City
1-15-tf

Bible Discovery

and Research

every Wednesday evening,
7:30 to 8:30.

At Trinity United Methodist
church, Cass City.

You are invited.
11-13-tf

Cass City an

iuy
_ An 18-year-old Cass City

man entered a guilty plea to
attempted larceny when he
appeared for arraignment

- Monday in Tuscola County
Circuit Court before presiding

~ Judge Martin Clements.
Leonard Rudolph Raus will

: be sentenced Feb. 2. His bond
~ was reduced to $1,000 and he
. was remanded to the Tuscola

County Jail.
A motion to drop a breaking

and entering charge was
taken under advisement.

- Raus is charged in con-
nection with the Dec. 18 theft
of tools from a garage owned

. by Robert Vargo of rural Cass
City.

: A Mayville man will be
sentenced March 1 after
pleading guilty to one of eight
perjury counts lodged against
him. Lionel Dennis Daly, 27,
was placed on $5,000 bond
while he awaits sentence.

Daly was charged in con-
nection with testimony he
gave in a Tuscola County
District Court trial last Nov.
20.

Richard Earl Shaw, 32,
Caro, was arraigned on two
separate counts of attempting
to defraud. He entered pleas
of guilty which were accepted
by the court. Sentencing was
set for March 1 and a pre-
sentence investigation was
ordered.

Both incidents took place in
Caro last July 26.

Will iam Paul Schrader,
Caro, was arraigned on a
charge of larceny at the
Gamble Store in Caro. He
stood mute and a plea of
innocent was entered in his
behalf.

Pre-trial examination was
set for Feb. 2, and bond was
continued.

The alleged offense took

place Dec. 3.
Donald Gene Searles, 21,

Clifford, was sentenced on a
larceny charge to two years'
probation and fines and costs
totaling $200, along with $50
restitution.

In addition, Searles was
sentenced to serve 59 days in
the county jail with credit for
59 days already served.

A breaking and entering
count was dismissed. Searles
was arrested Nov. 4.

George B. Rivar, Silver-
wood, entered a guilty plea to
a probation violation. Sent-
encing was set for Feb. 2.

Rivar was remanded to the
county jail without bond.

Fire damages

Ubly home

FOR SALE - three bedroom
modern ranch home on two
acres, many extras, $43,000.
- Three bedroom home,
partly remodeled, $7,500.
Richard Peter in Kingston,
683-2711. 1-15-4

FOR RENT - apartment type
living for girls, 1 block south
of light. New washer and dry-
er. Furnished. Rent includes
all utilities. Phone872-3570.

12-11-tf

Albee True Value
Hardware

Item of the Month
7-pc. Bake 'n Serve Ensemble

Ideal for microwaves.

This month only:
Reg. $15.95 value Now $7.95

WANT TO DO baby sitting.
Have own transportation.
Phone 872-2287, 1-8-3

ELMER H. FRANCIS, licensed
builder. New homes or re-
modeling. Roofing, siding,
barns, pole buildings. Phone
872-2921. 11-7-tf

WILL DO baby sitting in my
home, day shift or after-
noons. Phone 872-3705.

1-22-3

Dairymen and
Builders

Use Sanitile High Gloss for
Interior coloring and water-
proofing of new concrete
walls, such as hospitals,
schools, dairy and commer-
cial buildings. Choose your
color and stop worrying about
the peeling and mold which
comes from ordinary concrete
paint.

O'Dell Steel Bldgs.
Cass City 872-2349. 8-29-tf

FOR SALE - 1971 Yamaha
GP 396 snowmobile. Rich
Patera, phone 872-2469, call
after 5. 1-22-3

FAGAN'S THUMB Carpet
Cleaning - Dry foam or
steam. Also upholstery and
wall cleaning. Free Esti-
mates. Clifford 761-7503.

3-20-tf

FOR SALE - 1973 Snowmo-
bile. As good as new. Phone
872-4111. 1-22-3

NORM COATES TV service.
6750 Elmwood Rd., Cass
City. Phone 872-3139. If no
answer, call 872-3435.

10-16-tf

FURNISHED Apartment for
rent - all new carpeting;
lights and water furnished.
See Bud Schneeberger at
Schneeberger's Furniture
store, Main St., Cass City.

11-13-tf

FOR SALE - 10-foot camper.
Self-contained, Call after 4
p.m. Phone 872-2748.

1-8-3

WANTED - housework by day
or hour. Phone 872-3914 or
872-3491. Connie McAlpine.

1-15-3

Chuck Gage Welding
Shop

We now have heli-arc welding.
Specializing in stainless

steel, blacksmithing, fabri- ••
eating and radiator repair.

Also portable welding.

7062 E. Deckerville Rd.
Deford, Mi.

Phone 872-2552
5-15-tf

A $50 REBATE given to you
on any new couch $199 and
up. Beautiful herculons, vel-
vets and colonials, modern,
etc. Limited time on this
sale. "Bargain Center",
M-81 to Colwood Rd,, 1/2
mile down Tomlinson Rd,
Phone Caro 673-2480.

1-15-2

PIANO AND GUITAR lessons
- your home or mine. Phone
673-6055. 1-8-3

FOR SALE - purebred male
red dachshund, 7 weeks, $50.
Phone 673-6521. 1-8-3

Moto-Ski and Viking
Snowmobiles

For Rent

1 and 2 bedroom apartments.

Kitchen appliances,
ing'and drapes.

carpet-

Convenient location in Cass
City.

Smith Builders
Phone 673-6708

1-8-tf

FOR SALE - Dual purpose
Shorthorns, Polled, horned
bulls and females to serv-
ice age. Henry Motz andSon,
1 north, 1 1/2 east of Elk-
ton. 1-22-3

PAPER NAPKINS imprinted
with names and dates for
weddings, receptions, show-
ers, anniversaries and other
occasions. The Cass City
Chronicle. 1-12-tf

MACRAME

Make your own plant hangers.

Complete line of yarn, beads
and other accessories. Avail-
able at

Albee True Value
Hardware

Cass City
1-15-tf

DON'T MISS our Dutch Auc-
tion Sale of winter merchan-
dise. Prices reduced 10%
each week. Shop early for
best selection. Federated
Store, Cass City. 12-31-4

B AND B Refrigeration - Re-
pair all makes of washers,
driers, refrigerators, freez-
ers and ranges. Call Caro
673-6125. 5-1-tf

FOR SALE - Large bales of
clean straw. Phone 673-7179.

1-22-3

SEWING MACHINE and vac-
uum cleaner sales and serv-
ice. Parts in stock for all
makes. Service Department
and store hours, 8 to 5.
Tom Lowery, 319 Bacon St.,
Bad Axe. Phone 269-9101.

1-8-tf

MISSING - playful 6-month-
old beagle dog with brown
collar. Reward. Phone 872-
2068. 1-15-3

No lay-aways on this item.
1-15-3

BULK PROPANE systems for
grain driers or home heat-
ing. Fuelgas Company of
Cass City. 11-14-tf

BEE LINE Clothing - open
house Wednesday and Thurs-
day, 10:30 a.m. to 9 p.m.
Come and see the new line
for this season. Take a cat-
alog home. Also on sale,
last season sample clothes
at half price. Hostesses;
Olive Hutchinson and Evelyn
Haley, 6623 Huron St. Phone
872-3244. 1-22-1

Mol-Mix

liquid supplements

A fire of undetermined or-
igin did approximately $4,000
damage to the Ray Osantow-
ski home, located on Bingham
Street in Ubly, Sunday mor-
ning.

Fire Chief Earl Longuski
said the blaze was confined to
a mattress in one of the
bedrooms in the three-year-
old home. Smoke and water
damage was extensive, he
said.

Osantowski was reportedly
home alone at the time of the
fire.

Ubly firemen, responded to
the alarm at 11:30 a.m. and
were at the scene about one
hour. No one was injured.

RUBBER STAMPS

Use. rubber stamps to clearly mark papers, documents,
packages and many items. Stamped impressions have an
official look, get attention and save time. You can buy
made-to-order rubber stamps in any size with any wording
or any special marks or trademarks. Rubber stamps pay
for themselves many times over.

THE CASS CITY CHRONICLE

PHONE 872-2010

32 supplement
MMS 100 silage additive

Available all times.

Leslie Profit
6382 Cemetery Rd., Cass City

Phone 872-2309
9-25-tf

WANTED - baby sitting job.
Doerr Rd. Phone 872-3511.

1-22-3

FOR SALE - Seasoned fire-
place wood. Soft wood - $15';
hard wood - $20, and birch
- $25. Ask about free de-
livery. Roger Root. Phone
872-3718. 11-20-tf

HAY FOR SALE - No rain,
large bales. Phone 673-7179.

1-22-3

NOTICE
Re-Roof Awnings
Re-Side Insulate

Aluminum Windows and Doors
Call or Write

Bill Sprague, owner
of Elkton Roofing and Siding

Company

Elkton 375-4215
Bad Axe CO 9-7469
Bad Axe CO 9-7158
Terms to 5 years

3-17-tf

PANCAKE SUPPER Jan. 23
at Salem United Methodist
church, 5:00 - 7:30. Free-
will offering. Jan. 30 - Car-
nival at Cultural Center,
4:30 - 7:00. All proceeds
for Cass City Sweetheart
candidate. 1-15-2

FOR SALE BY
B. A. CALKA REAL ESTATE

SPECIAL!!! Just Listed!! RANCH TYPE with 2 large bed-
rooms down and 1 dormitory style upstairs in knotty pine;
large living room with gold wall to wall carpeting; PLUS
17x28' FAMILY ROOM with wall to wall carpeting; PLUS
LARGE FIREPLACE with barn beam used for mantel -
FAMILY SIZE KITCHEN 22' in length with 35 feet of Oak
cabinets; built-in desk; sliding glass doors lead to land-
scaped yard; basement; garage attached; 1 1/2 BATH-
ROOMS; cluster of Birch trees and large Weeping Willow
- extra LARGE LOT 99x132' - sidewalks and blacktop
street; MANY OTHER FEATURES - Your inspection In-
vited!!! $36,000.00 Immediate Occupancy - situated
on Seed St., Cass City, Michigan. OUT OF STATE OWN-
ERS - want immediate sale.

5 ACRES: Ranch type home with 3 bedrooms; new wall to
wall carpeting; basement; furnace; situated'on a knoll -
very neat - PLUS 30x40' Moriarlty building 3 years old
- concrete floor; ideal workshop; garage - wooded back-
ground near State Hospital --- $29,900.00 terms.

2 ACRES: near Cass City - 5 room home frame - painted
white - 2 extra large bedrooms; basement; remodeled;
plus 36x50' barn newly painted - owner purchased home
in Cass City offered to you for $24,500.00 terms.

10 ACRES: CLOSE IN TO CASS CITY — comes with
20x28' plus 4' porch - COTTAGE, a hideaway for YOU!!!
$14,300.00 terms.

JUST OUTSIDE VILLAGE LIMITS: One story frame home
- attractive setting; 3 bedrooms; wall to wall carpeting;
FIREPLACE; natur'1 gas forced hot water heating system;
2 car garage; plus utility building and rabbit pens; large
lot 126x275' circular drive, etc. All this for $26,500.00
terms.

JUST OUTSIDE VILLAGE LIMITS OF CASS CITY: 5 room
home only 5 years old; wall to wall carpeting; natural gas
forced hot air heating system; utility building-blacktop street;
large lot 104x275' - HAS TO BE SEEN TO BE AP-
PRECIATED!!!! $24,000.00.

DOERR ROAD 3 ACRES more or less - VACANT-
LOTS OF GOOD GRAVEL ~ $10,000. Excellent building
site.

MOTEL: 16 Units - all MODERN - in very good condition;
highway location; plus living quarters; comes completely
furnished; EXTRA LARGE LOT 300x297'; county seat town
in THUMB OF MICHIGAN - OWNERS MOVING TO ARIZONA
- HEALTH. Offered to you for $110,000.00 terms. Sellers
will hold land contract with responsible family.

• CHOICE BUILDING SITE: Near Cass City --- high and dry
- about 1 1/2 ACRES - $3,200.00 terms.

SHABBONA: 1 1/2 story frame home - painted white - 4
bedrooms; new well - some remodeling completed - LOT
78x120' near Cass River and across road from elementary
school. Asking $11,500.00 — SELLERS WANT QUICK
ACTION ON SALE OF HOME!!!!

80 ACRES: near Cass City — 60 acres tillable - pro-
ductive soil - 8 room BRICK HOME - basement; BARN
IN POOR CONDITION; TO SETTLE ESTATE — $55,000.00
terms.

FOR THESE AND OTHER BARGAINS IN REAL ESTATE,
see, call or write to:

B. A. CALKA, Realtor
6306 W. Main St., Cass City, Mich.

Telephone: 872-3355

SERVING THIS COMMUNITY 23 YEARS IN REAL ESTATE
NEEDS. • 1-15-2

WEDDING INVITATIONS and
announcements. A complete
line of printing, raised print-
ing or engraving. Dozens to
choose from. Cass City
Chronicle, Cass City.

1-12-tf

3 only Franklin Stoves
complete with Screen - Grate
& Boot.
Less Stove Pipe $298.00

Zonolite Attic Fill
Cash & Carry. 3 cubic ft.
Bag $2.68
Delivered $2.76

40 x so Wall Mirrors
Reg. $26.95 Sale $22 48

Arvin Heaters SH 25
Reg. $18.95 Sale $15.08

Batteries - pack of two
Reg. $1.70 Sale $ .88

D-Batteries -packof
two. Alkaline Energy cell.
Reg. $2.00 Sale $1.20

16 x 24"
Bulletin Boards

Reg. $5.29 Sale $3.98

Room Humidifiers
Low as $39.95

Two only - 36" Avocado
Range Hoods

Reg. $59.00 Sale$47.88

Bird Vinyl Siding
Per sq. without

Backer

TRIUMPH
NORTON
PENTON
MOTO GUZZI
HUSQVARNA

HUSQVARNA
Chain Saws

Thumb Cycle Sales
6509 Main Phone 872-3750

5-2-tf

FOR SALE - 2 - 6.50x13
tires and 2 - 6.50x13 snow
tires. Phone 872-2463.

1-22-3

APARTMENT range Magic
Chef - new with automatic
matchless oven. $179.00.
Fuelgas Co., Cass City,
corner M-81 & M -53, phone
872-2161. 3-20-tf

FOR SALE - 1967 Volkswagen
with sun roof. Best offer.
Also, 1975 250 Enduro Yam-
aha, brand new, must sell.
Call anytime - 872-4205 or
872-2120. 1-8-3

CASS CITY STUDIO
features

Passport pictures

Complete wedding service
Reproductions of old pictures

Kodak film
and fast film service

6473 Main St.

Phone 872-2885
Tuesday thru Friday - noon
till 5:30 - Saturday 10-5.

12-18-tf

FOR SALE - Hay, first and
second cutting: 85? for first,
$1.00 for second. Frank
Spencer. Phone 872-2306.

1-22-3

ROOFER NEEDED - with ex-
perience in metal and asphalt
roofing for barns and houses
In upper Thumb area. Write
to Roofer, Box 119, c/o The
Advertiser, Caro, Mi. 48723.
Give name, address, phone
number, experience and ref-
erences. 1-22-1

AUCTIONEER
EXPERIENCED

Complete Auctioneering Ser-
vice Handled Anywhere.

We make All Arrangements
My Experience Is Your

Assurance

IRA AND DAVID
OSENTOSKI

PHONE:
Cass City 872-2352 collect

WANTED - Salesperson to
work in rural Cass City area
for an established company.
Knowledge of frame con-
struction desirable but not
necessary. Write to Box 265,
Carrollton, Mich. 48724.

1-22-3

FOR "a job well done feeling"
clean carpets with Blue Lus-
tre. Rent electric shampooer
$1. Ben Franklin Store, Cass
City. 6-11-tf

ICE SKATES
All Sizes

Men's-Women's-
Children's

Albee True Value
Hardware
Cass City

12-31-tf

FOR SALE - all sizes snow-
mobile trailers. Phone 872-
2855. 1-8-3

GLASS LINED water heaters,
gas: 30-gal. size $109.95;
40-gal. size $119.95; 50-gal.
size $149.95; 75-gal. size
$279.95. Fuelgas Co., Cass
City. Phone 872-2161.

1-8-tf

AUCTIONEER

Gary Jackson
Auction Co.

Deal direct - I'll furnish you
with auctioneers, ringmen,
clerks, cashiers, trucking,
tents and buyers.

Phone 872-2495
7-3-tf

FOR SALE - In Cass City
area: split stone house. 4
bedrooms, 2 car garage, in
country. Plenty of trees and
nice garden spot, hot water
heat. 400'x400' lot. Terms
are available to qualified
buyer at 8 1/2%. Contact
B. I. Wilson Real Estate
in Caro or phone 673-3593.

1-22-1

FOR QUICK Efficient proces-
sing of your Income .Tax
Returns, see - John Mc-
Cormick, next to the Gamble
Store in Cass City, phone
517-872-2715. 12-24-14

MARTIN ELECTRIC ==

CROFT-CLARA
LUMBER, INC.

Cass City

MISSING - 50-cup percolator,
belonging to Deford Craft
Club at Deford Town Hall.
Please call 872-3853 or 872-
2447. 1-8-3

TRI-COUNTY Dead Stock Re-
moval. 517-375-4088.

8-1-tf

HALF-PRICE
during

JANUARY
A half-price fee is in effect
through January on overdue
books returned. Uncollected
fines for books already re-
turned may also be paid up
for half price.

Rawson Memorial
Library

Cass City 1-15-3

FOR SALE - Six Brown Swiss
vaccinated yearling heifers.
Top MABA breeding. Phone
872-2237. 1-22-3

SWIVEL ROCKER - good con-
dition. Cost $139.00 - sell
for $25.00. Color - green.
4572 Hill, Apt. 1 South. Phone
872-2207. 1-22-1

SIEGLER mobile home central
air conditioners and fur-
naces. Compare our free
estimates. Fuelgas Co., Inc.,
Cass City. Phone 872-2161.

6-26-tf

Listings
Wanted

Need 2 & 3 bedroom homes
In Cass City.

Edward J. Hahn
Real Estate

6240 W. Main St.
Phone 872-2155 or
evenings 872-3519
Edward J. Hahn, Broker

1-15-2

RON'S REPAIRS - Appliance
- refrigeration and electri-
cal. Licensed electrician.
Call after 4 p.m. 872-3839.

8-7-tf

SALE - Fall-winter samples
of Queensway-to- Fashion
clothes: 60 per cent off. To
have a party, call Marsha
Franks 665-2288. 1-15-2

Residential and Commercial
Wiring

State Licensed

Free Estimates

PHONE 872-4114
4180 Kurds Corner Road

10-1-tf

I WOULD LIKE to thank Dr.
Donahue and Hills and Dales
Hospital staff for excellent
care while I was a patient.
Arthur Hartwick. 1-22-1

MANY, MANY thanks to .rela-
tives, friends and neighbors
for their help and kindness
shown me while I'm conva-
lescing in my home with a
brpken ankle. Food, gifts and
cards all greatly appreci-
ated. Marie Cybulski.

1-22-1

WE ARE sincerely grateful
to relatives, friends and
neighbors for their many kind
acts of sympathy during the
loss of our husband and fath-
er. Thank you for the me-
morials, flowers, cards and

food brought in and to the
ladies of the church and the
neighbors who served the
lunch. A special thank you
to Jim Kilbourn, Whitie Hop-
per, David Gabler, Mona
Phillips, Leola and Arleon
Retherford and to Rev. Joel
Hurley for his prayers and
comforting words and to the
Little Funeral Home who
were so kind. Your kindness
will always be remembered.
The family of Kenneth
Churchill. 1-22-1

REAL ESTATE
Gagetown: approximately 2 acres - has septic tank, city
water - zoned commercial. D-A-140

Hobby Farm: 4 bedroom home - den - built-in desk and
china cabinet - 2 1/2 baths - full basement - approximately
2 acres. B-CY-423

Akron: Bay City-Forestville - Extra nice 12' x 60' 1967
Hartford - 2 bedroom - large 30' x 40' cement block garage
with furnace - lot 102' x 171''. H5-TL-602

Gagetown: 5 bedroom home - some paneling - basement -
natural gas heat - good condition- 132' x 165' lot. M5-TO-008

Cass City: 5 apartments - good income property - basement
- garage. M2-TO-088

Caseville: 2 bedroom - 1 car garage - storage shed - lot
100' x 120' - near channel and public beach. M3-TO-082

CONTACT:

630 N. State Street
Caro, Mi. 48723

PHONE: 1-517-67376106 Day or Night
" ' ' ' . ' 1-15-2
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Third quarter letdown fatal

as Hawks lose 2 loop tilts
If the Cass City Red Hawks

could figure out a way to wipe
out the third quarter of bask-
etball games they would be
heading into their next two
home games with Vassar
(Friday) and Ubly (Tuesday)
with a glittering Thumb B
Conference record.

But they can't and for the
second time in three games the
team dissipated a substantial
half t ime lead to lose.

The score was 68-6<> as the
Marlette Red Raiders won in
the f inal seconds of play.

The Hawks started slowly
as Marlelte ran off the first
eight points.

But a basket by Clarke
Haire started the Cass City
attack going and the Hawks
quickly closed the gap and
went ahead.

In the second period the
Hawks played some of their
best b a s k e t b a l l in recent
games to burn the meshes for
28 points with Haire, Ken
Lowe and Hick Tuckey pi tch-
ing in most of the baskets.

But in the third period fans

might have thought that they
were at the Caro game again.

The Raiders came out
strong and Cass City was
unable to hit the hoop. The
11-point lead melted like snow
in a spring thaw and before
Cass City was able to right
i t se l f , Mar le t te had tied the
game. At the end of three
periods the score was 54-aIl.

From then on it was a
see-saw game with neither
team able to post an advan-
tage.

With 1:34 left in the game
the host team had moved in
f ront by four points. But the
Hawks weren't through yet. A
steal and a quick basket
brought the margin to two
points.

Wi th 38 seconds left the
Hawks again gained posses-
sion. Haire dribbled to the
side and sunk an eight-footer
and the game was tied.

W i t h four seconds left Paul
Diegel let fly from 20 feet and
swished the meshes. A Cass
City countering basket came
a moment af te r the f i n a l
bu/./.er and that was the end
for Cass City.

The Hawks were led by
Haire with 25 points . Rick
Tuckey added 15 and Ken
Lowe netted 14.

Sophomore Paul B a t t e l
showed improvement under
the boards when he came off
the bench in relief of Chuck
Hendrick.

JV'S LOSE

The Cass City junior varsity
lost its second game of the
season and second in a row,
38-34.

The young Hawks trailed as
much as 11 points in the third
quarter and rallied to within a
single basket before losing.

berger's charges is f inding a
way to keep the opposition
from burning the nets.

The Hawks d idn ' t come up
w i t h t h e s o l u t i o n a g a i n s t
Frankenmuth as the Eagles
gunned their way to a 79-68
decision.

It 's hard ,to win basketbal l
games when the opponent
scores 75 points or more and
in the last two games the
Hawks have yielded 79 and 89
points .

The Hawks did manage to
stay in the game for three
quarters w i t h the visi tors . In
the f i rs t ha l f i t was the
shooting of Ken Lowe tha t
kept the Hawks w i t h i n range.

He scored 17 of his 19 points
in the f i r s t ha l f and as usual
was a demon on the boards
for Cass Ci ty .

At the end of the f i r s t
quar ter the Hawks t ra i led by
a lone p o i n t , 22-21. By the
intermiss ion the Eagles had
moved in front 44-3(1.

Cass City used more /.one
defense in the game than it
had previously when faster
players were available. The
Eagles always seem to have a
player that burns the nets
from the corner to beat a zone
and the visitors had another
one Saturday. He was Frank
List svho popped in 23 points
many coining on the bomb

from the corner.
The Hasvks refused to fold

and did a l i t t l e bombing of its
own against the Eagle /.one.
Rick Tuckey hit on short
jumpers from around the key
and Dave Romig hit on fast
breaks to help Cass City post
an 18-10 th i rd quarter margin
and move w i t h i n five points .

The margin stayed about
l ike tha t t i l l about three min-
utes l e f t when Frankenmuth
spurted to a 10-12 point mar-
gin and then coasted in for the
v ic to ry .

The game was won by
Frankenmuth at the free
throw l ine . Cass City scored
32 f ield goals and Franken-
m u t h counted 31. However,
the Eagles converted 17 of 24
from the l ine wh i l e the Hasvks
made only four of a meager 10
tries.

Ivcading scorers for Cass
City were Tuckey. 22, Ixnve,
19, and Romig 13'. Paul Bern-
tha i led the v is i tors w i t h 2(i
poin ts whi le List added 23.

JV'S LOSK

The Cass City Junior Var-
sity lost its f i rs t game of the
year as the Frankenmuth
JV's led all the way to post an
easy 50-34 decision.
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Cass City
Haire
Jeff Harlel
Dave Romig
Ken Losve
Bat te l
Tuckey
Hendrick

Ft;
11
i
i
3
1
6
1

FT
3-6
0-0
4-4
8-8
0-0
3-4
0-0

PTS
25
2
6

14
2

15
9

Frankenmuth
Marlette
Vassal-
Bad Axe
Caro
Sanduskv
Cass City
Lakers

U'
4
4
4
4
3
3
3
1

L
2
3
3
3
3
3
4
5

Cass City
Haire
Romig
Tuckey
Hendrick
Losve , Ken
Battel
Losve, Mike
Hartcl

K(i
4
6

10
0
9
2
1
0

32

FT
0-0
1-3
2-4
0-0
1-2
0-0
0-1
0-0

4-10

P'I'S
8

13
22
0

19
4
2
0

68

Frunkcnnni th
List
Bernthal
Webb
Eisches
vonBehren
Duff
Keller

10
9
1
3
5
1
2

3-4
8-9
0-1
0-0
3-5
0-0
3-5

23
26
2
6

13
2
7

CLARKE HAIRE beats Steve Coulter on a drive for two points
Tuesday night against Marlette, but the Raiders rallied for a 68-66
win.

Deer hunting is safer
today, DNR claims

Thirteen persons died in
h u n t i n g a c c i d e n t s d u r i n g
1975, and (here were 24 re-
ported gun-related accidents

31 17-24 79

24 18-22 66

Mark-tie
Morgan
Coulter
Sul l ivan
McSkulin
Ell iot t
Metzcr
Diegel

2
1
4
6
5
4
4

2-2
0-0
0-0
5-6
1-5
5-6
3-3

6
2

8
17
11
13
11

26 16-22 08

THERE ARE FALL AWAY jump shots and
fall away jump shots but this one by Mike
Lowe, number 23, is the ultimate. Lowe fell on
his back after putting the shot up, but it went
in for two points for Cass City against
Frankenmuth.

F K A N K K N M U T H OAMK

Cass City's new line-up
proved that it can score in its
first game Saturday. Now the
challenge to Coach Ron Nurn-

7th grade

tourney to test

unbeaten Hawks

Weather info

signs coming

SPECIAL NOTIC
WATER AND SEWER

BILLINGS CAN ONLY

BE PAID AT

MUNICIPAL BUILDING

EFFECTIVE FEB. 1
OPEN 8 aon. to 4:30 p.m. DAILY-

NO SAT. OFFICE HOURS

Bills can be mailed to Village

VILLAGE OF CASS CITY

A glimpse into the future of
Cass Ci ty High School's
basketball program is in store
for local fans who attend the
Seventh Grade tournament
that starts Thursday at Cass
City High School.

Perhaps the most interest-
ing match-up for local fans
will come on the opening
night of the tourney at 7 p.m.
when Cass City meets Frank-
enmuth .

Cass City's seventh grade
has never been defeated and
the word is that Frankenmuth
is loaded with ta lent . The
little Hawks have rolled over
all opposition and their vic-
tory string includes a champ-

ionship in the sixth grace
level last year at Deckerville
. . .the first Cass City tearn to
turn the trick since 1972.

The t o u r n a m e n t ac t ion
starts at 5 p.m. when Marlette
faces the Lakers. At 6 p.m.
Mayville and Vassar square
off , followed by Cass City-
Frankenmuth. The last game
of the evening starts at 8 p.m.
when Reese meets Caro.

The winners will play the
winners and the losers play
the losers in the second round
slated for Saturday night .

The finals are carded Mon-
day when a t o u r n a m e n t
champion, runner-up and
consolation champion will all
receive trophies.

Swirling snow nearly blinds
you as you drive along an
interstate highway in un-
f a m i l i a r t e r r i t o r y . I f y o u
knew condit ions up ahead a
bit , you'd be able to decide
whether to give it up right
now and f ind a place to spend
the night--or go on to better
conditions.

The Department of State
Highways is trying to help
you m a k e t h a t dec i s ion ,
through a new pilot project
i n v o l v i n g "Weather I n f o "
signs.

The signs tell motorists
where to tune their car radios
to f ind the latest in weather
and road informat ion . Sixteen
signs are up now, along 1-196
and 1-94 in western Michigan
and along 1-75 between Birch
Run south of Saginaw and the
Mackinac Bridge.

"Maximum use wil l prob-
ably be in the win te r , " says a
department spokesman. "But
the signs can also help in the
warmer weather, when the
radio stations can warn of
approaching tornados or a
truck turned over across the
highway."

Indicat ions are that if the
pilot project is successful,
signs wi l l go up on other inter-
state highway legs through-
out the state.

dur ing Michigan 's recent f i re-
arm deer season.

Too many , of course, espec-
ially when you consider that
carelessness and lack of
judgment by some cont inue to
cause over one-half of all
reported firearm accidents.

But Dr. David Jenkins,
head of the Department of
N a t u r a l Resources W i l d l i f e
Divis ion, says the accident
rate per 100,000 deer hunters
has been steadily decreasing
for over 30 years.

f -I- I I I I-

"Accidents number ing be-
tween GO and 80 a year were
common 20 years ago when
roughly '100,000 deer hunters
were af ie ld ," Jenkins notes.
And, he says, "the worse
season on record was back in
1952 when nearly half as
many hunters as we had in
1975 (700,000) were involved
in nearly three times as many
accidents as we had this
year."

.Jenkins says deer h u n l e i s
can be proud of revei sing
those negat ive t o t a l s .

"Most hunters act respons-
ibly in the f i e l d , and they have
made deer h u n t i n g one of the
safer pastimes when com-
pared to insurance company
accident figures for othei
sports," he says.

What about the deer?
The DNR reports some 87,-

100 were taken dur ing the 1975
firearm season, according lo
preliminary figures.

Those figures, culled f i o m
tra f f i c counts taken along
major north and southbound
highways during the two-
week season in late Novem-
ber, w i l l be updated and
f ina l i zed through a poslcaid
survey of licensed deer h u n t -
ers.

Occasionally even1 the wise
old owl hoots at the wrong
time.

FREE AND REDUCED
STUDENT LUNCH POLICY

The Cass City Board of Education has adopted the follosving
family size and income criteria for determining el igibi l i ty for
Free Meals and Free Milk or Reduced-Price Meals I'oi
children unable to pay the ful l price of meals and milk served
under the National School Lunch, School Breakfast , Special
Milk Program, and U. S. D. A. Donated Foods Program.

Total A B
Family Scale For Free Scale For
Sj/e Meals And Reduced-Price

Free Milk Meals
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12

$ 3,230
4,240
5,250
6,260
7,190
8,110
8,950
9,790

10,550
11,310
12,060
12,810

Each Additional
Family Member: $750.

$ 3,231 - r,,040
4,241 - fi,(;2()
5,251 - 8,200
6,261 - 9,770
7.191 - 11,210
8,111 - 12,650
8,951 - 13,970
9,791 - 15,280

10,551 - l(i,460
11,311 - 17,640
12,061 - 18,820
12,811 - 20,000

Each Addi t ional
Family Member: $1,180

CASS CITY High School's Girls' Volleyball team was scheduled
to open its season Wednesday night against Vassar at home. Shown
are (front row, from the left) Chris Krueger, Deb McFarland,
Nora Langmaid, Luann Gallaway and Coleen Leslie.

Middle Row: Melanie Kelley, Beth Erla, Ann Ballagh, Judy
Luana, Chris Strace and Laura Bauer.

Back row: Assistant Coach Kally Maharg, Linda Sheldon,
Dianna Smith, Maxine Smith, Vicki Vandiver and Coach Brenda
Breidinger.

Children from families whose income is at or below the
levels shown are eligible for free meals and milk or
reduced-price meals. In addition, families not meeting these
criteria but with other unusual expenses due to unusually high
medical expenses, shelter costs in excess of 30 per cent of
income, special education expenses due to mental or physical
condition of a child, and disaster or casualty losses may apply.

Application forms are being sent to all homes with a letter to
parents. Additional copies are available at the principal's
office in each school. The information provided on the
application is confidential and will be used only for the purpose
of determining eligibility. Applications may be submitted at
any time during the year.

In certain cases, foster children are also eligible for these
benefits. If a family has foster children living with them and
wishes to apply for such meals and milk for them, it should
contact the school.

Children of unemployed parents may qualify for free or
reduced-price meals and-or free milk if total family income
including welfare payments, unemployment compensation
and sub-pay benefits fall within the prescribed family income
guidelines.

In the operation of child feeding programs, no child will be
discriminated against because of race, sex, color, or national
origin.

Under the provisions of the policy the school principals will
review applications and determine eligibility. If a parent is
dissatisfied with the ruling of the official, he may make a
request either orally or in writing to Donald Grouse,
Superintendent of the Cass City Public Schools, for a hearing to
appeal the decision.
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