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Townships ’ 
fire fees 
increased 

Area townships served by 
the Elkland Township Fire 
Dcpartmcnt will pay a little 
more for the service begin- 
ning this year. 

The Elkland Township 
Board last week approved 
incrcasing stand-by fees by 
$25, boosting thc fees from 
$275 to $300 per township 
section. 

Thc hike affects 3 town- 
ships in Tuscola County - 
Ellington ( 1  3.5 sections) 
Kingston ( 5  sections), and all 
of Novesta Township (36 
sections). In Sanilac County, 
the local department covers 
portions of Evergreen Town- 
ship ( 1 8  sections) and 
GreenlcafTownship (25 sec- 
tions), and i i i  Huron County, 
thc department covers 13.5 
scctions o f  Grant Township. 
’The increase translates into 

an additional $2,775 i n  
stand-by fee revenue. 

Township Clerk Norma 
Wallace indicated an in- 
crease was needed to keep up 
with rising insurancc ex- 
penses. The dcpartment also 
purchased a new fire truck 
last ycar, she noted. 

Township officials previ- 
ously raised stand-by fees in 
1993, from $225 to $275 per 
section. Before that, an in-  
crease was iipprovcd in 1988. 

In  othcr business during the 
March 10 rnorittily meeting, 
the board: 

*Appointed township fire 
departnicnt officers as rcc- 
oriimcnded by Fire Chief 
Ron Pawloski. 

The officers are: Don Root, 
assislant chief; Jack 
Hartwick, first captain; Mick 
Kirn,  sccond captain; Mike 
Stcc, first lieutenant, and 
Ross McCallum, second 
lieutenant. 

.Voted to spend $450 to 
continue participation in an 
annual mower trade-in pro- 
gram through Lacthem’s in 
Caro. 
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IMPROVING SERVICES and “getting back to the commu- 
nity” are among the goals of the new leadership team at 
Hills and Dales General Hospital, (from left) Dee McKrow, 
Kathy Rowe and Jean Anthony. 

Trio to lead 
resurgent Hills 
and Dales Hospital 

It isn’t official yet, hut in- 
terim administration appoint- 
n’c n’ :>t Hills  and D?!es 
General Hospital are ex- 
pected to be made perma- 
nent, with a third veteran 
hospital employee joining 
the leadership team. 
The posts of chief executive 

officer and chief financial 
officer have been offered to 
Dee McKrow and Kathy 
Rowe, respectively. In addi- 
tion, Jean Anthony has been 
named chief operational of- 
ficer. 
McKrow said she and Rowe 

haven’t been officially 
named to their posts because 

However. shc added, “I think 
it’s a formality at this point.” 

McKrcw began hcr hcalth 
career as a radiology tech- 
nologist at North Oakland 
Medical Center in 1979. She 
joined Macomb Hospital 
Center i n  1989, serving 
through July 1995. She has 
scrved in an executive posi- 
tion at Hills and Dales Hos- 
pital since August 1995. 
Rowe, a certificd public ac- 

countant, worked for certi- 
tied public accountant firms 
at Breckenridge and BadAxe 
from 1981 to 1984. She was 
named business office super- 
visor in  1984, and promoted 

employment contracts to chief financial officer in 
haven’t been finalized yet. 1987. She joined Hills and 

Elkland township okays 
$6,250 machine to switch 
to high-tech voting 
Elkland Township is joining 

21 host of other Thumb mu- 
nicipalities that have made 
the switch to high-tech vot- 
ing equipment. 

The township board last 
week voted to participate in 
an  effort to incorporate the 
new optical scan voting ma- 
chines throughout Tuscola 
County, township Clerk 
Norma Wallace said. 
The cost of an optical scan 

niachine will depend on the 
number of townships that 
decide to go with the new 
cqui pmcn t . 
“The machine, if we bought 

i t  outright, is $6,250,” 
Wallace said. However, she 
added, if  scveral townships 
buy the machines, the bulk 
rate could hc as low as about 
$5,800. 
“We’re hoping that inore of 

them (townships) will go 
with i t ,  but we’re definitely 
going with the new voting 
system .” 

Wallace indicated she has 
becn impressed with demon- 
strations she has seen of the 
optical scan machines. 

The new equipment will 
climinatc the need for an ab- 
sentee voter ballot precinct, 
as well as a 4-member absen- 
tee voter ballot board, be- 
cause all ballots are counted 
on one machinc, she said. 

“And i t  cuts down on time 
- as soon as the polls close, 

you push a button and the 
totals are there,” she added. 
Aside from speed, the opti- 

cal scan technology trans- 
lates into big savings, shorter 
lines at voting polls, and a 
smaller margin of error, ac- 
cording to Tuscola County 
Clerk Margie White, who 
would like to see the county 
adopt a uniform voting sys- 
tem. 
Currently, only 2 townships 
- Akron and Vassar - uti- 
lize the optical scan ma- 
chines, she said. Three mu- 
nicipalities use punch cards 
and the rest use voting ma- 
chines. 

White said a survey of bal- 
lot costs in the last general 
election revealed some inter- 
esting figures. 
The municipalities that use 

punch cards - Arbela, 
Ellington and the city of 
Vassar - had a combined 
2,998 voters and spent 
$6,200 to print ballots, or 
about $2.07 per voter. The 
townships that use machines 
had a combined 18,000 vot- 
ers and spent a little over 
$19,OOO, or $1.07 per voter. 
The cost for Akron and 
Vassar townships, which had 
1,973 voters, totaled $1,300, 
or 69 cents per voter. 

White indicated she hopes 
a majority of townships will 
make the switch to optical 
scan machines, and that the 

county will also participate 
by purchasing software that 
would allow the county clerk 
to set up ballots for the mu- 
nicipali ties. 

To-date, 6 townships - 
Arbela, Elkland, Fremont, 
Indianfields, Koylton and 
Tuscola townships - have 
responded favorably to a sur- 
vey asking if they would con- 
sider using the optical scan 
system. Only NovestaTown- 
ship has responded unfavor- 
ably, White said. 

The switch to an optical 
scan machine comes at a 
good time for ElklandTown- 
ship, according to Wallace. 
She explained that a steady 

increase in registered voters 
in the township’s Precinct 2 
was going to force the town- 
ship to purchase a third, stan- 
dard voting machine for that 
precinct. However, with the 
optical scan machine, no ad- 
ditional machines will be 
needed because the new 
equipment can handle nearly 
4,000 voters. Currently, the 
township has just over 2,500 
registered voters. 
Purchase of an optical scan 

machine has been budgeted 
for this ycar, although i t  
won’t be used for several 
months unless a special elec- 
tion is scheduled. The next 
regular election will be the 
August I998 primary. 

Dales General Hospital in 
July 1995. 

Anihuny is rhc veteran of 
the group, having served the 
local hospital for 22 years. 
She started as an LPN and 
later earned her RN certifi- 
cation, working in areas such 
as quality improvement, risk 
management and medical 
staff services. Shc has held 
supervisory positions for the 
past 8 years. 

McKrow and Rowe were 
appointed last Octobcr to re- 
place outgoing hospital 
president Deborah Sopo. 

NEW APPROACH 

The executives, along with 
Anthony, have brought with 
them a different management 
style designed to cut red tape 
and encourage employees to 
take an active role in decision 
making. 

Among the changes has 
been elimination of the 
hospital’s senior team, which 
was composed of directors 
representing various depart- 
rnnntc 

One of 4 killed 

Erla family member 
bank shooting victim 

The violent, senseless for his actlons. ing on it. Our whole family ful.” 
Although Pijanowski was a 

nephew to Erla, she pointed 
out they were close in age 
and enjoyed more of a 
bcotherlsister relationship 

deaths of 4 people at a “Wereally arefocusingon is, 
Comerica Bank branch in 
northeast Detroit last week 
hit home, tragically, for a 
Cass Citv area familv. 

forgiveness,” she added. 
“We’reworkingonthis, and 
it’s very hard, butwe’rePraY- 

“YOU can’t go through 
something like this - as, 
awful as it is - and be hate- 

I , 
The 7-minute rampage by 

gunman Allen Lane Griffin 
Jr. March 1 1  ended in the 
shooting deaths of 4 people, 
including Griffin, who was 
killed by police. Two bank 
employees lost their lives, as 
did a 77-year-old man taken 
hostage outside the bank, 
Two others were injured by 
shots fired by Griffin. 

One of the victims, bank 
branch Manager Stanley R. 
Pijanowski, 52, of 
Bloomfield Hills, was the 
grandson of the late John and 
Genevieve Erla. 
He was a nephew to several 

other Cass City area resi- 
dents; Dick and Chris Erla, 
Don and Mary Lou Erla, Dan 
and Marlene Erla, Arnold 
and Sharon Erla, Chuck and 
Agnes Erla, Clark and Pat 
Erla, Gerty Erla and Marilyn 
Erla. 

“We are having a rough 
time with this, I think be- 

growing up. 
“We’re such a large family, 

we were raised together,” she 
recalled. “We were together 
for many years, either at our 
home or at their home, so 
he’s really more like a 
brother. 

“There are a lot of good 
memories,” she said, adding 
Pijahowski was a good busi- 
ness man, but will be remem- 
bered more for his willing- 
ness to do for others, and his 
attention to helping out fam- 
ily members. “He was really 
a good person.” 
According to published re- 

ports, Pijanowski and James 
Isom, a 25-year-old customer 
representative from Warren, 
were shot to death inside the 
bank. Another victim, 
Stanley Hays, 77, of Detroit, 
was shot after Griffin took 
him hostage. 
,Griffh was killed by a bar- 

rage of shots from officers as 
cause of the way i t  hap- 
pened,” Marilyn Erla con- 

hetried to flee. 
CASS CITY area family members are Surviving shotgun wounds 

tion, also at St. John Hospi- 
tal. 

Rep. Green opposes police 
check for seatbelt use 

The debate over whether 
I a w en force m e n t officers 
should be,able to stop and 
ticket motorists for not wear- 
ing seatbelts is on again, with 
the introduction of a bill by 
state Rep. Frank Fitzgerald. 
Fitzgerald, R-Grand Ledge, 

says he expects bipartisan 
support for the standard 
safety belt enforcement leg- 
islation, introduced in Febru- 
ary. 

ment community. 
“1 don’t think it will (pass) 

this time, either,*’ state Rep. 
Mike Green, R-Mayville, 
commented last week. “This 
is like a rights bill - it’s like, 
how can you force me to do 
something I don’t want to 
do?” 
A lot of people in the com- 

munity don’t want to be told 
what to do, said Green, who 
represents Huron and 

to decide not to wear a seat 
belt, “and I probably would 
have to agree with them. It’s 
more control by the state.” 

Green recalled the legisla- 
tion considered last year sat 
on the House floor for 
months before he and others 
voted the bill out of commit- 
tee and on the floor for a de- 
bate. But the debate never 
materialized and the legisla- 
tion was returned to commit- 

CAMPAIGN 
UNDERWAY 

The Michigan Safety Belt 
Coalition, which has 
launched a campaign in sup- 
port of the bill, disagrees, cit- 
ing support from several 
other state organizations 
ranging from the Michigan 
Chamber of Commerce to 
the Michigan State Medical 
Societv. 

Often, the arrangement re- 
sulted in long waits for ac- 
tion, even for minor requests. 
For example, she said, it took 
4 months to replace a broken 
chair in the emergency de- 
part men t . 

Now, McKrow continued, 
department heads have be- 
come “managers”, and 
they’ve been given much 
more leeway in running their 
departments. 

“The whole idea is to em- 
power the employees to 
make their own decisions, to 
do what they have to get 
done on a timely basis,” she 
said. “We’re trying to do 
business in a more business 
atmosphere, responding 
quickly and efficiently.” 

Department heads still fol- 
low a chain of command, but 
it’s the employees who make 
the new system work, 
McKrow said. 

Along with giving manag- 
ers more freedom in making 
decisions, the hospital’s lead- 
ership team has made it  a 
point to let employees know 
their doors are always open. 
And that they understand that 

Please turn to back page. 

EARNING A TOP division one rating at the district Class C band competition was the Cass City 
Symphony Band. The competition was held at Laker High March 15 with 9 bands participating. 
Cass City was one of 2 bands to get division one ratings in each category. One judge called it the 
best performance of the day. Top ratings have been scarce for Cass City. The last division one 
ratings were earned in 1993 and 1983. Band director Jason Smigell said that the rating was due 
to the great group of kids in the band. The band earned the right to compete in the state compe- 
tition April 25 or 26, but because of scheduling difficulties, it is not certain that the band will be 
able to attend. 
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Cas City Cooperative Preschool 

OPEN 

When: Thurs., April 24, 1997 at 7-8 p.m. 
Where: Good Shepherd Lutheran Church, 

Cass City (not affiliated) 
For: 3 - 5 year olds 

Parents and Preschoolers Welcome! 
For more information call 872-4246, ask for Shelly, 

Cantata set at r 
b 

Potter House 
Jan Moore's Community 

Choir will be at Potter House 
church, on Sixth Street, Cass 
City, Palm Sunday, March 
23, at 11 a.m. 

They will be performing 
their cantata, "Behold the 
Risen Savior." 

Everyone is invited to at- 
tend this service and also the 
Easter breakfast, March 30, 
at 9 a.m., and the Easter ser- 
vice that will follow at 1 1  
a.m. 

Marriage 
1 icenses 

Tedd Daniel Burton, 
Davison, and Teena Marie 
Eden bec k, Mill ingt on 

Randy John Katzinger and 
Pamela Jean McRace, both 
of Unionville. 

James Lawrence 
McClenathen, Blissfield, and 
Patricia Jo Wright, Caro. 

Steven James Bohn and 
Kari Lyne Thoraton, both of 
Unionville. 

Thomas Michael 
Kelsheimer and Jennifer 
Lynn Smith, Otter Lake. 
Jeffrey Thomas Huizar and 

Michelle Leigh Gillman, 
both of Vassar. 

Hills & Dales General Hospital , 

present: 

FIRSTAID I 

AND 
ADULT, CHILD & INFANT CPR 

When: Saturday, March 22, Sam-lpm 
Where: 
Cost: 
Instructor: Ray Plain 

Hills & Dales General Hospital - Meeting Room 
. S20.00 (includes take home text) 

RSVP: Dawn Maust, BSWEducation Coordinator 
517-872-2121 Ext 342 

You are encouraged to wear comfortable clothing. 

PUBLIC HEARING 
PROPOSED ZONING ORDINANCE REVISIONS 

ELKLAND TOWNSHIP 
he Township of Elkland Planning Commission will hold a public hearing on pro- 
iosed revisions to its current zoning ordinance and changes to its zoning ordinance 
nap. The changes are on file at the Township of Elkland Town Hall at 6691 Church 
Street, Cass City, MI 48726. 

Minor revisions are proposed for the text of the zoning ordinance. The changes in the 
toning ordinance are to, (1) remove inconsistent language for limitations on use or 
wreational mobile homes; (2) update controls on regulation of dish antennas; (3) add 
sign setback distances to sign controls; and (4) revise the uses in the B-1 Business 
District as allowed by right and by special land use permit. 

Changes in the zoning ordinance map are limited to the B-1 Business District and M-1 
Manufacturing District. The changes are, (1) immediately north of the village of Cass 
City replace the current A-1 Agricultural District with a B-1 Business District 350' 
wide along the east side of Cemetery Road to 500' north of Milligan Road and for 500' 
East of Cemetery Road on the north side of Milligan Road with 500' north of Milligan 
Road on the east side of Cemetery Road;(2) east of thevillage of Cass City, replace the 
FC-1 Forestry Conservation District with B-1 Business Zoning from the eastern termi- 
nus of B-1300' both north and south of M-81 to one-half mile east of Schwegler Road, 
and replace the current FC-1 Forestry Conservation District with M-1 Manufacturing 
District 500' north and south of M-81 from Greenland Road to 1,980 feet west; and (3) 
west of the village, replace the current A-1 Agricultural District with B-1 Business 
District 500' north of M-81 from Koepfgen Road westerly to 660' west of Spence Road 
and on the south side of M-81, replace A-1 Agricultural District with B-1 Business 
District 500' in width to the south from Koepfgen Road'west to 1,320 feet west of 
Koepfgen Road. 

Maps and detailed texts of these changes will be presented at the public hearing, which 
will be held as follows: 

Here are some helpful tips 
collected from a variety of 
sources. 

>For feeding the birds, use 
an empty 3-pound coffee 
can. Cut a small triangle in 
the plastic lid to pour from, 
Filling the feeder will be 
much quicker i n  chilly 
weather. 
>If you buy a lot of gifts and 

your memory just isn't what 
it  used to be, keep a notebook 
with everybody's name in it. 
Whenever you buy a gift, 
write i t  down next to the 
person's name. If you think 
of something the person 
might like, make a note of it. 
Then check i t  off when you 
get it .  
If you shop well in advance, 

better jot down where you're 
keeping the gifts, too. 
>When you don't have time 

to make meatballs, make 
meat squares. Spread the 
meat rnixturc in a jelly roll 
pan and bake. Then cut i t  
into srnall squares. You can 
also cook the meat loaf mix 
in a frying pan and stir i t  into 
spaghctti sauce. 
>Coat thc measuring spoon 

with nonstick cooking spray 
before mcasuring honcy, 
syrup o r  molasscs. I t  will 
slide right out wi thout  a 
goocy IllCSS. 
>To prcvcnt t'ruit pies t'rom 

hyhbling ovcr. cut sniall 
vent3 i n  thc top crust and 
stick ii piccc o f  macaroni 
upright in  cach vent. Thc 
J U I C C  will boil up insidc the 
macaroni and n o t  all over the 
ovcn. 

>When y o u  buy bacon, re- 
move enough sirips f o r  
hakcd beans. Cut them up 
and I'reeze them in  plastic 
hags. They'll be all ready 
when you need them. 
'>Save your  orange peels in 

a plastic hag in the freezer. 
Whcn ;i recipe calls for 
grated orange peel, grate i t  
frozen. 
>To keep bed linen sets to- 

gether, fold both sheets and 
one pillowcase and store 
them inside the other pillow- 
case. 

>A coat of spray starch on 
sneakers wil l  keep them 
clean longer. 

>Canvas shoes can be 
cleaned with foam uphol- 
stery cleaner and scrubbed 
with a brush. 

>Candle wax will pop out 
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of candle holders easily if 
you freeze them. 

>Rubbing your hands on a 
cut raw potato after peeling 
onions will remove the odor. 
Rubbing them on your stain- 
less steel sink works, too. 

For those of us who are ea- 
ger to get outdoors and do 
spring-type work: 
>An easy way to start a ge- 

ranium cutting is by boring 
a hole in a potato, placing the 
cut end of the stem in the 
potato and planting it. 

>When getting ready to 
plant your garden, put a 
small child in a wagon and 
pull him up and down the 
garden spot to mark straight 
rows. 

>To prevent blisters and 
"get a grip" on gardening, 
put rubber crutch tips around 
the handles of your tools. 

>Use a child's rake to re- 
move dead leaves from your 
flower beds. There will be 
less damage to the plants. 

>You can make a kneeling 
pad for the garden by filling 
an old hot water bottle with 
sand or styrofoam pellets. 

>If  your  garden space is 
limited, sprinkle radish seeds 
around your  cabbage plants 
and onion bulbs around to- 
mato plants. By the time the 
cahhagc and tnmatocs spread 
out,  the radishes and onions 
will he used up. 

A couple more signs o f  
spring: Thc tlies coming to 
lite and toilet papcr strcatii- 
crs in thc trecs. 

Crumb1 it begins 
army truining 

Army Pvt. Adrian J .  
Cramblit has arrived at Fort 
Sill, Lawton, Okla., to begin 
One Station Unit Training. 
The training includes 
completion of basic military 
training and advanced indi- 
vidual training. 

Basic trainees receive in- 
struction in drill and cercmo- 
nies, weapons, map reading, 
tactics, military courtesy, 
military justice, first aid, and 
Army history and traditions. 

Afterward, soldiers com- 
plete the field artillery can- 
non crew member advanced 
individual training caurse. 

Cramblit is the son of 
Martha J .  Cramblit and 
grandson of Barbara T. Th- 
ompson of Snover. 

Sr. Citizens' Menu 
Senior citizens are asked to 
make reservations on the day 
of the meal between 8 a.m, 
and 9 a . m .  by calling 
Berenice Sowden, 872-2397. 

MARCH 24-25-28 

Monday - Chicken Ala 
King, herb stuffing, carrot 
curldgreen peppers, roll, 
fruit gelatin. 

Tuesday - Crispy fish, 
cream style potatoes, Brus- 
sels sprouts, variety bread, 
cherry pie. 
Friday - Closed - Good Fri- 

printing, tiephone 872-2010. * day. 

~ 

WEDNESDAY 81 THURSDAY 7:30 
Wed. Double Punch On Movie Goer Card 

Thurs. "Bargain Nite" Save $$$$ 
Divorced Son Moves Back Home-- 

DEBBIE REYNOLDS is " MOTH E R '' 
STARTS FRIDAY (5 FUNNY NIGHTS) 

All Evenings (Except Sat.) 7:30 
Saturday 7:30 & 9:20 

NO Mon. & Tues. This Picture 
-I-- - 

AREA CUB Scouts recently gathered at the Cass City VFW 
Hall for their annual Blue and Gold Banquet. 

Cub Scouts receive awards at 
annual Blue and Gold Banquet 

Cub Scout Pack 3594 re- 
cently celebrated the 87th 
birthday of the Boy Scouts 
and the 67th birthday of the 
Cub Scouts with the annual 
Blue and Gold Banquet. 

Special guests of the Cub 
Scouts were melnbers of the 
Cass City Gavel Club, which 
has supported Pack 3594 for 
some 49 ycars. 

Den one opened the meet- 
ing with the tlag ceremony, 
and Deb Ross welcomed ev- 
etyone to the banquet. After 
the invocation, each den 
sharcd a meal with their par- 
cnts and guests. 

Cubmaster Mick Lester 
presenled m a n y  awards 
throughout the evening, with 
each den providing entertain- 
tnent, cheers and skits. The 
awards presented represent 
rhc hard work put forth by 
thc den leaders, scouts and 
the1 r parent 5 .  

The following scouts were 
presented the Wolf Badge: 
Ryan Ross, Brad Hartel, Eric 
Rornain. Kyle Swanson, An- 
t h o n y  Langlois. Thomas 
Mittlestat, Kurt Hanby and 
Cameron Lautner. In  addi- 
t i o n ,  Ryan Ross and Kurt 
Hanby each received one 
gold and 2 silver Arrow 
Points for their achieve- 
ments. 

The following scouts were 

presented the Webelos 
Badge: Jay Lester, Joshua 
Nolan, Michael Zmierski, 
Ryan Hartwick, Kenny 
Spencer, John Guc, and Den- 
nisThomas. In addition, each 
of the above noted scouts re- 
ceived the Scientist pin. 
Joshua Nolan received the 
Communicator and Artist 
pin, and Dennis Thomas re- 
ceived the Artist and Com- 
muni ty  pin. 

The following Panther 
Scouts receivcd the follow- 
ing awards: Eric Hanby, 
Craftsman and Naturalist 
pins; Hank Metzger, Artist 
and Craftsman; Dusty 

Mallory, Aquanaut, Crafts- 
man, and Traveler, and Rob- 
ert Damoth, Fitness. 

After the awards, gifts were 
presented to Lester and Ross 
for their outstanding contrl- 
butions to the pack. 
Announcements were ma& 

of the upcoming scouting 
evcnts. The Pinewood Derby 
is scheduled for March 22 
starting at 9 a.m.  i n  the 
Middle School Cafeteria. Ah 
afternoon of skating is 
planned for the scouts and 
their families at the Sandusky 
Roller Rink March 15 frorr 
1 to 3 p.m. 

Adoption forum scheduled , 

for  area adoptive families . 

. Tuscola County Strong 
Families/Safe Children will 
be holding an adoption open 
forum for families who have 
adopted children in Tuscola 
County. The purpose of this 
forum is to help identify ser- 
vice needs of adoptive fami- 
lies and to discuss the possi- 
bilities for an adoption men- 
tor, who will serve as a liai- 
son among adpptive families 
and human service agencies 
in the county. The event will 
take place March 24 at 7 p.m. 
at the Tuscola Technology 

For more information, cod- 
tact Ryan Spaulding at 672- 
3067. 

Rutkoski is i 
Ferris grad I 

Jennifer A. Rutkoski cjf 
Decker is one of 5 18 students 
to complete the requirements 
for certificates, associate'!, 
bachelor's, and master's de- 
grees at Ferris State Univer- 
sity during fall semester. She 
received a BS degree in has- 

* .  1.. 

Center in Caro, room 302. P1talltY managemen[. 

Check out our loan rates 
before you make that 

major purchase. 

You'll Like  Our Quick Approval, 
Great' Rates, Flexible Terms, and 

Unsurpassable Service! 

Going on now! 
Spring Loan Special 

Stop in or call for details. I :  

Tuesday, March 25, 1997 at 8:OO p.m. 
Elkland Township Hall 
6691 Church Street 
Cass City, MI 48726 

Comments, suggestions and possible revisions will be accepted at the public hearin€ 
and in  written material submitted to township offces before or at the public hearing. 

Roger Root, Chairman 
Elkland Township Planning Commission 

Thumb National 
h m k  & u r n  
Member FDIC 

E-Mall us at: thumb@avd.net or visit our web site at: w.avci.net/-thumb 11 

mailto:thumb@avd.net
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Starkey The back forty 
by Roger Pond 

Q 1997 Roqer Pond 
attends 

by John Haire 
;+::::::::: .... x.:.. .. :.>:.:*:.:.:. ......... .............. .............. ........ 
.C..... .... ... ..,:.:‘ ........ conference I get a kick out of those tab- 

loid newspapers at the gro- 
cery checkout. The ones that 
declare, “Man Raised By 
Monkeys - - Buys World’s 
Largest Banana Farm!” 

I wish I could write head- 
lines like those. Training like 
that might get me a job with 
CBS. 

Tabloid headlines make 
perfect sense when com- 
pared to the hubbub about 
the Scottish scientist and his 
sheep cloning experiments. I 
will admit that story is get- 
ting pretty old, but everyone 
else is reporting it. I should 
gct another whack at i t ,  too. 

It’s obvious the major me- 
dia has missed the most star- 
tling thing about the scien- 
tist who fabricated a sheep. 
This man not only cloned a 
sheep from an adult cell, he 
kept the whole thing secret 
for 7 months! 

Readers rnay recall the 
news reports last summer 
when Scottish scientists dis- 
covered how to make identi- 
cal sheep using cells from a 
9-day-old shecp embryo. 
They let the cells divide and 
implanted thousands of iden- 
tical cells into eggs collected 
from ewes. 

I wrotc about that expcri- 
ment and urgcd them t o  quit 
while they were ahead. “Next 
thing you know thcy’ll be 
cloning a bbnch of sheep- 
herders,” I suggested. 
Now we’re told Scottish sci- 

entist Ian Wilmut has cloned 
a single sheep from a mam- 
niary cell of an adult sheep. 
That’s not the same proccss 
we read about in July, but we 
can assume those experi- 
ments are related. 

Thc f u n n y  thing about 
Wi 1111 ut ‘5 accam pl i s hmen t is 
thc media didn’t report i t  
until his cloned sheep was 7 
months old. I f  this is the sci- 
entific breakthrough the me- 
dia says i t  is, why did i t  take 
thcm 7 months to find out 
about i t? !  

‘I‘hcrc was no great mystery 
in that lambing barn last July. 
Thc clone is a white-faoc 
Iamb, implanted and carried 
to term in a black-face ewe. 

Wilmut has good fences. 
The neighbor’s ram had 
nothing to do with it. 

The black-face ewe has an 
cartag. The scientists remem- 
bered which sheep they put 
the embryo into. 
You can bet the research sta- 

tion was sending out news 
releases like crazy. “Scientist 
clones sheep!” “New Sheep 
Made From Old Sheep!” 
“Mad Scientist Creates 
Sheep From Spare Parts!” 
Even the tabloids wouldn’t 

bite on it. Now, 7 months 
later, the networks are report- 
ing this story like it’s late- 
breaking news. They should 

We’re lucky this was a ewe 
lamb. Had it  been a wether, 
those Scotsmen would prob- 
ably have slaughtered i t  and 
eaten it by now! 

My wife and 1 were talking 
about this strange event last 
evening. I asked her, “Why 
do you suppose i t  took the 
mcdia 7 months to get that 
story on the air?” 

“I don’t know,” she said. 
“Maybe they had to wait un- 
til the O.J. Simpson trial was 
over.” 
There you have it. From the 

mouths of babes. 
This just proves what many 

folks have known for a long 
time: “If a guy really wants 
to know what’s going on, he 
might as well iust ask his 

Richard Starkey, of 
Fairgrove, recently repre- 
sented Tuscola County Farm 
Bureau at Michigan Farm 
Bureau’s Council of Presi- 
dents’ Conference, held Feb. 
18 and 19 in Lansing. The 
meeting was held for county 
leaders to learn about issues 
affecting the agricultural in- 
dustry and ways to 
strengthen their county Farm 
Bureau organizations. 
A tour of the new Michigan 

State University Livestock 
Pavilion was a highlight of 
the 2-day event. Dean 
Kleckner, an Iowa farmer 
and American Farm Bureau 
Federation president, in- 
spired participants and chal- 
lenged them to continue to 
take active roles in their or- 
ganization. Dan Wyant, di- 
rector of the Michigan De- 
partment ofAgriculture, also 
addrcsscd the county leaders. 

Four county Farm Bureau 
leaders were featured during 
the conference to share thcir 
successful county Farm Bu- 
rcau activities. Tim Hood, 
Van Burcn County Farm Bu- 
reau president, cxplained 
how a volunteer membership 
drive recruited new fjrmers 
into his group. 

Monroe County Farm Bu- 
reau Prcsident Gary Charter 
illustratcd his county’s con- 
ccrn ovcr a truck regulation 
issuc and thc steps they took 
to rcsolvc i t .  Hillsdale 
County’s Dave Godl‘rcy 
highlighted a successful Ag 
Ac c i dc n t Re sc UL‘ Prog riim . 
Sue Huehl from Washtenaw 
County discuss4 thc nccd to 
cducatc the general public 
about agriculture and how 
they did i t  through Project 
Rural Education Day. 

The Tannery is a restaurant-bar on Lake Street in down- 
lown Boyne City. Its food is good, not gourmet, but good. 
The prices are about average for the area and there are daily 
specials. Rate it above average for the genre. 
But if you go on Friday or Saturday and like soup, be pre- 

pared for a pleasant surprise. Those are the days when sea- 
;food chowder is offered. It’s really outstanding, as good as 
:fiat offered in better restaurants for about half the price. 
w 
0 ********** 
0 

, I  This winter weather must have all the businesses involved 
in winter sports smiling all the way to the bank. The snow- 
mobiles were bounding around all over the place in northern 
Michigan. 

At Boyne Mountain the skiers were out in force and Sun- 
day was about as good a ski day as there is and it comes at a 
time when the season normally is winding down for the year. 

AMERICAN FARM BUREAU Fed- 
eration President Dean Kleckner (left) 
with Richard Starkey, who represented 
Wscola County at the 1997 Michigan 
Farm Bureau Council of Presidents’ 
Conference. be ashamed of themselves. wik.” *********** 

Pair face felonies For A Special Easter, 
Come To Our Place! 

EASTER SUNDAY BUFFET 
11:30 a.m. - 2:30 p.m. 

Featuring Dijon Crusted Roast Beef, along with 
Ham,Turkey & Dressing, Redfish, Kielbasa and 
Sauerkraut, Candied Sweet Potatoes, Real Mashed 

Scott Ackerman got a free listing of his bike business on 
the internet. One response was from Japan. 
> A bike owner there had his bike stolen and one of thc tubes 
running from the seat had been sawed in 2. 

What the owner wanted to know was if and how the bike 
might be repaired. Ackerman said that it probably could be 
done if someone wanted to tackle the job, but after i t  was 
done it wouldn’t look like much. 

Two people were recently Bond in the case was set at 
arraigned on separate felony $1 ,OOO. A preliminary ex- 
charges in Tuscola County amination was scheduled for 
District Court. March 25 at 10 a.m. 

Justin A. Guilds, 18, Caro, 
was charged with fourth de- 
gree criminal sexual conduct 
involving thc use of force or 
coercion, and malicious de- 
struction of property valued 
at $IO() o r  less March 7 in 
Indian fie Ids Township. 

Adam J. Kuzma, 17, Caro. 
was arraigned on a chargc of 
delivery of a counterfeit sub- 
stance Oct. 17 i n  Vassar 
Township . 
Bond was set at $5,000. Hc 

faces a preliminary exam 
March 25 at 10 a.m. 

The Weather 
Potatoes and Gravy, Chateau 
Fries, Special Salad Bar, $995 
Soup and Dessert 

High Low Precip. 
Tuesday ................................. 40 ............ 22 .............. 0 
Wednesday ............................ 39 ............ 23 .............. 0 
Thursday ............................... 32 ............ 24 .......... .32“ 
Friday .................................... 33 ............ 15 .......... .25” 
Saturday ................................ 24 .............. 8 .............. 0 
Sunday .................................. 36 ............ 30 .............. 0 
Monday .................................. 5 1 ............ 29 .............. 0 

(Recorded at Cass City wastewater treatment plant .) 

“Children’s prices available 
Reservations 0 n I y 

665-9971 or 665-2594 
. 

T h e  f$ 
r-. * 

L 

Good Friday, All You Can Eat, 
FISH FRY, includes Deep Fried 
Fish, Soup and Salad Bar, Home 

Starting Sunday, April 6 
SUNDAY BRUNCH 

H a i r e  

Net 
‘I’herc‘s nothing like 21 sinall 

town t o  strip aw;ly thc vcnecr 
and clown to the fiber of 
thc wood * 

It’s possible to coast along 
i n  the population centers 
where peoplc circulate to- 
gcthcr but find i t  virtually 
iriipossiblc to get down to 
hcdrock. 

For us who iipprcciate the 
sinall town lifc. one of its 
strengths is that you get to 
know everybody and every- 
body knows you. 

That probably is an irrita- 
tion to the smoothy who 
rnakcs that grcat first impres- 
sion and blends casily into 
any new group. But  i f  that 
first imprcssion isn’t real, 

where his worth was noted 
and recognized. Cass City 
was fortunate to be able to be 
helped by his talents and his 
willingness to share them 
when asked. 

He Wil l  be missed. 

10:30 a.m. - 2:OO p.m. $550  
Boys make 
mess, clean 
up mess 

Township Of Evergreen 

Notice of Budget 
Public Hearing 

A night of mischief ended 
with apologies and some 
cleaning for 3 local boys ovcr 
the weekend. 
According to Cass City po- 

lice, the boys, all juvcnilcs, 
confessed t o  “dcc ora t i n g ” 
several homes and a car with 
a combination of chocolate 
syrup, mustard and or “silly 
s tr i ng .” 

Police received cornplaints 
Saturday frun Audrey 
Katzenberger, 4344 Oak St., 
Jenevieve Freiburger, 6592 
Third St . ,  and Stanley 
McArthur, 6606Third St., all 
involving homes being splat- 
tered, A fourth resident, 
Misty Coryell, 4355 Oak St., 
reported chocolate syrup was 
poured onto her auto. 

Officer Jim Jiroux traced 
footsteps from the Coryell 
residence to the home of one 
of the juveniles, who along 
with 2 other boys confessed. 
Reports state the officer then 
accompanied the boys to 
cach residence, where they 
apologized and made ar- 
rangements to clean up. 

The Evergreen Township Board will hold a pub- 
ic hearing on the proposed township budget for 
‘Iscal year 1997- 1998 at the Evergreen Township 
Hall on Saturday, March 29 at 1 :oO p.m. The prop- 
zrty tax millage rate proposed to be levied to 
support the proposed budget will be a subject 
Df this hearing. A copy of the budget is available 
For public inspection at this time and location. 
The notice is posted in compliance with PA267 of 1976 as 

amended (Open Meetings Act), MCLA 41.72a (2)(3) and the 
Americans With Disabilities Act (ADA). 
The Evergreen Township board will provide necessary rea- 

sonable auxiliary aids and services, such as signers for the 
hearing impaired and audio tapes of printed materials being 
considered at the meeting, to individuals with disabilities at 
the meeting upon 7 days notice to the Evergreen Township 
board. 
Individuals with disabilities requiring auxiliary aids or ser- 

vices should contact the Evergreen Township board by writ- 
ing or calling the following: 

Arthur Severance, Clerk 
633 I Severance Rd. 
Decker, MI 48426 
( 5  17) 872-3530 

ovcr thc course of  time in  
intirnatc small towns the 
truth will out. The real per- 
son emerges. 

That’s a real plus for guys 
like J.  D. Tuckey. I had only 
been around for 6 months or 
s o  the first time that our paths 
crossed. 

I t  was an cxperience, and if 
those i n i t  i al tn ee t i n gs had 
been the end of  it, my esti- 
mation of h i m  would be 
ground zero. 
He didn’t come on as a car- 

i n g , c o nee r n ed - a bo u t -you 
person. He was blunt, out- 
spoken and there never was 
a doubt of where he stood. 

I t  took awhile before I 
learned what the rest of the 
town kncw. He was elected 
to the Cass City School 
Board in a hotly contested 
election. Won casily because 
in a small town people get to 

I’d guess that the number of 
know you . 

ALL WOMEN’S FRAGRANCE GIFT SETS REDUCED 

GOOD 
FRIDAY pcoile who came to J.D, for 

help through the years could 
nurnber in the hundreds. He 
bailed us out at the Chroniclc 
and editorTom Montgomery 
is t‘ond of telling how much 
of a genius hc was in analyz- 
ing and repairing his some- 
titncs balky outboard motor. 
His gcnius with motors was 

recognized at Walbro Corpo- 
ration, whcrc hc was a senior 
project enginccr on a staff 
loaded with college-trained 
people. 

It was fortunate that he 
spent his life in Cass City, 

March 28th at 
Marshmallov 

Egg 
Crate Happy 
9 02. Easter 

Box 
11 3/4 02. 

“Easter Candv for Kids of All Aqes” 

First Baptist Church 
6420 kghton street 

C a s  Clty, Michigan 
L 

1:OO - 2:OO p.m. 

“7hree Wews Of The Goss” 
Speakers: William Paton - Bad Axe 

Mark Nieman - Marlette 
Elvin Harden - C a s  City 

b, 

1 

ll 7:OO p.m. Ernest A. Teichman, Jr. 
6240 W. Main 

Cass City, Mich. 
Phone 872-3388 h a m a  by 

Mike b e  - Sandusky 
“Peter And The Goss” l i k e  a good neighbor, 

Srare Farm is rhen.m 
State Farm Insurance Companies 
Home Onices Bloom~ngton. lllinol 
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Come See Us 
We write for 5 

companies specializing in 

High Risk Drivers 
Driving Without 

Insurance 
.Too Many Points 
@Young Drivers 

@co-In60dy Insurunce 
I 6263 Church St. 

Cass City, MI 48726 
Phone 51 7-872-51 14 

800-835-9870 

Since 1988 I 

CASS u r y ,  MICHIGAN 

- - -. 

Down Memory Lane 
From the files of the Chronicle 

5 YEARS AGO 10 YEARS AGO Cooking contest this spring 
in Jackson, Miss. 

This year's Red Hawk team 
became the third team from 
Cass City to win the district 
championship at Mayville. 
Members of the team are: 
Mark h e r ,  Brad Gray, Ron 
Bouck, Maurice Evans, John 
Gibson, Kevin Mika, Greg 
LeValley, Ben Schott, AI 
Prosowski, Todd Bliss, Kent 
Winter and Paul Ulfig. Jeff 
Hartel is the coach and David 
McPhaiI is mascot. 

The Cass City School 
Board voted unanimously to 
offer teachers with 10 or 
more years service in the dis- 
trict a bonus of $16,000 if 
they retire, at its regular 
meeting Monday night. 
Winners of the Mid Thumb 

Association doubles bowling 
tournament, held recently at 
the Charmont, were Cass 
City residents Randy 
Kabideau and Rick Kerkau. 
The duo rolled a handi- 
capped 3-game series of 
1537. Kerkau also won the 
singles event with a handi- 
capped total of 870, which 
included a perfect 300 game. 
At its meeting Monday, the 

school board selected Dick 
Wallace, a former board 
member and volunteer 
helper at track, football and 
other Cass City sporting 
events, as its Friend ofYouth. 
Wallace will be honored at 
the annual Meet of Champi- 
ons at Caro May 26. 

Part-time Owendale Police 
Officer Mike Stec, 24, a Cass 
City resident, delivered a 
baby en route to the hospital 
Friday night. He stopped a 
Pigeon couple travelling 
west on Sebewaing Road just 
outside of Owendale, who 
had their 4-way flashers on, 
to see if he could be of help. 
Stec took the mother-to-be in 
his patrol car, with the father 
following in his car. Before 
they made it to the hospital 
the baby decided to be born. 
Cass City Ambulance atten- 
dants arrived shortly thereaf- 
ter and transferred mother 
and baby to the hospital. It 
was the first baby Stec had 
delivered. 

Deborah E. Blue, daughter 
of Kenneth and Dorothy 
Blue, has been named vale- 
dictorian for the class of 
1987. Mark A. Kappen is the 
salutatorian. He is the son of 
Gerald and Catherine 
Kappen. 

Off-road racing enthusiast 
Joe Howard, Cass City, will 
be Michigan's only represen- 
tative in the "suspended od- 
yssey" class of Mickey 
Thompson's Off-Road 
Championship Grand Prix, 
set for Saturday at the 
Pont iac S ilverdome . 

Homemaker and part-tirne 
pre-school teacher Jane 
Faust of Owendale has been 
selected to represent Michi- 
gan in the National Chicken 

The Elmwood-Gagetown Fire Department will be accept- 
ing sealed bids for ( 1) 1977 Chevrolet van. Arrangements to 
sce this van can be made by contacting Paul Lopez at 665- 
2606 or Herschel Adams at 665-2670 between 3;oO p.m- and 
8:OO p.m. 

Bids must be submitted to the  ELMWOOD TWP. 
GAGETOWN FIRE DEPARTMENT, PO. Box 5 5 ,  Gagetown, 
MI 48735 no later than April 4, 1997. 
We reserve the right to reject any or all bids, 

ELMWOOD ToWNSHlP 
GAGETOWN FIRE DEPARTMENT 

Paul Lopez, Fire Chief 5-3- 19-2 

25 YEARS AGO 

Voters over w he 1 m i n g 1 y 
disapproved of beer in  the 
park in  an advisory vote 
Monday by a vote of 273 to 
83. 
One of the biggest cows t o  

pass through the auctioneer's 
hands at the Michigan Live- 
stock Exchange east of Cass 
City was sold Tuesday, for 
$500.A Holstein cow weigh- 
ing in at 2,000 pounds was 
sold for 25 cents a pound. 
The average weight is 1,000 
to 1,500 pounds. The beast 
was owned by Carl Wolf of 
Palms, who said he had a 
larger cow at home. 

Paul Prangley, Nancy 
Kerbyson, B.J. Haire, Ron 
Crandell, Mary Beth Esau, 
Kathy Kerbyson and AI 
Romig attended the Sth Di- 
mension at the Saginaw 
Civic Center Sunday. 

Rev. Eldred KeIlcy o f  
Saginaw, who is a patient in  
the U of M Hospital in  Ann 
Arbor, is reported as im- 
proved by his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. Warren Kelley. He 
was removed from the inten- 
sive care unit Saturday but i r  
is expected that he will have 
to remain in the hospital for 
another 6 weeks. 
The boards o f  education of' 

the Owen-Gage arid 
U n i on v i 1 I e - S e hew a i n g 
school districts were directcd 
by the citizens conimittee t o  
devisc a specific proposal for 
construction of a building i f '  
a merger of the district is au- 
thorized. The stated reason 
for the merger is to hopcfully 
build one high school facil- 
ity. 

35 YEARS AGO 

Bill Wood, Cass City chief' 
of police for the past 4 years, 
has tendered his resignation 
and is scheduled to begin as 
chief of the Holly policc 
force Wednesday, March 28. 
Mrs. Edward (Mae) Fischer 

will he the first lady niem- 
ber ever to occupy ;I scat o n  
the Gagetown Board of' 
Trustees. 

Western Auto Associate 
Store, owned and operated 
for the past 16 years by R.M. 
Hunter, Cass City, has hecn 
sold to Charlcs H. Turncr, 
former Chrysler Corporation 
official . 
Anne Marie Lorentzcn has 

returned after a 2-year tour 
of duty with the Nursc Corps 
at Walker AFB, Roswcll, 
New Mexico. The daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Lorentzen, Cass City, is 
scheduled to resume her du- 
ties as a nurse at VA Hospi- 
tal, Saginaw, April 2. 
Cass City's Larry Robinson 

placed on the Thumb B all- 
conference cage squad, an- 
nounced last week by league 
coaches. He was also named 
to the all-star squad in foot- 
ball. 

PUBLIC HEARING 
BASIC PLAN ELEMENTS 

ELKLAND TOWNSHIP 

The Township of Elkland Planning Commission will hold a public hearing on its basic 
and land use plan map. The changes are on file at the Township of Elkland Town Hall 
at 6691 Church Street, Cass City, MI 48726. 

The basic plan envisions primarily maintaining the rural character of Elkland TOWIF 
;hip. Accordingly, agricultural plans dominate the northwester0 two-thirds of the town- 
;hip and floodplain conservation dominates the southeastern area. Cass City is not 
danned or zoned by the township, although Cass City remains the residential, COIII- 
mercial, industrial, economic, recreational and local governmental center of the gen- 
:ral community, 

Elkland Township land use plans includes, extension or Village residential arcas west 
and south of the Village, business development north of the Village of Cass City along 
Cemetery Road to north of Milligan Road, extending business areas east of the Village 
along M-81 to one-half mile east of Schwegler Road, providing for business areas west 
of the Village to Crane Road, providing a business area south of Cass City and permit- 
ting industrial areas south of the village on Cemetery Road and east of the village at 
Greenland Road and M-81 State Highway. 

Maps and detailed texts of these changes will be presented at the public hearing, which 
will be held as follows: 

Tuesday, March 25, 1997 at 7:30 p.m. 
Elkland Township Hall 
6691 Church Street 
Cass City, MI 48726 

Comments, suggestions and possible revisions will he accepted at the public hearing 
and 111 written material submitted to township oflices before or at the public hearing. 

Day care focus of 
April 5 conference 
Are y o u  a day care provider 

or do you want to start a day 
care business'? Then you 
rnay want to attend the "Bct- 
ter Kid Carc Conference" to 
be held Saturday, April 5, at 
Cass City High School. 

The prograrii starts at 8:OO 

available from the MSU-Ex- 
tension offices in Tuscola, 
Huron and Sanilac counties. 
The cost of the workshop is 
$ IO, which includes refresh- 
ments, lunch and printed 
material. The deadline for 
registration is March 15. 

in  the morning with registra- 
tion and browsing exhibits. 
The day will include classes 
and hands on workshops, 
drawings and prizes, refresh- Foundation. 
inents, lunch and profes- 

This conference is made 
possible by a grant from the 
T h u m b  Partnership for 
Health and the Kellogg 

---- 

NEED A NEW CAR OR TRUCK? 

qgb-fj7 &b+it 
"OVER 200 NEW & USED CARS 

AND TRUCKS AVAILABLE" 
I 

"Every Make and Model" 
For Your Best Buv 

Ron Ouvry 
Home 872-2495 1 Business 269-9781 

Y 

CALL M E  TODAY! 

Satisfaction 
After The 

Sale 
Guaranteed! 

inany Repistration more. 
forms are milk.  more than 6,600 quarts of With Ideas For Feature Stories 

Celebrate an Easter 
Parade of Photo 

Savings! 
Brighten Your Easter Festivities With the Easter Family Portrait 

Package, at the AGFA Same Day Photo Lab at Book Mart 
Books Cards Photo and Gifts. Savings Too Good To Keep 

Under Our Bonnet! 
9- ;. ,A? e; e '@ - @ &*&@I @ &*@ @ @ @  4 %-@ @ %:*@ Q p@j 4 t 4  @ 

4\\P Clip & Save Coupon! * 
w b!i\j' .* 

Four 8x10 Ivory Colored Muttes 
Twenty Four Wallet Sized Prints i i j  

ii- 

(Ti . L J  Four 5x7 Enlargements @ 

Twelve Easter Greeting Cards @) 

a33 

m *  

All for the Low, Low Price of just. .. $9.99 ab 

Use the Negative of Your Choice, or Make a Negative of Your ,! 1 

Favorite Easter Photo for Just 99 cents! 

Don't Let The Parade Pass You By! 

M o p  at Home... 
Mart! 

----I--- 

AGFA Nothing Escapes AGFA Film! 
-----I-- i r  valuable coupon 1 r valuable coupon 1 -------- r-------- valuable coupon i r  valuable coupon 

I 199 cent Photo Processing! I I  I 
I I Free Photo Processing! I I I I Wallet Sued Photo Prints 

with each purchased roll of AGFA HDC 
I make a new negative of your favorite I I I I  

36 exposure film! I I with each purchased disposable I Easter photo memory.. I I Just10 Cents Each! 1 I I 
I m .  

I 
I 

_- - - - -_ I -  1 
valuable coupon I I  valuable coupon t 

Free! I 

Jelly Belly Gourmet Style Jelly Beans I Assortments, All Sires I I All Sizes Cadbury CrmePggr I I 1 or. Sample Size Bag 

I I Health Mart Vitamin C 

I 500 mg 100 Count I I  I I offer expires 04/30/97 I I offer expires 04/30/97 1 I offer expires 04/30/97 J 1 offer ex~ires04/30/97 J I -- -- J L -- - - - - - - 

camera, applies to all makes and 
models ... I t  

I I no commercial accounts! I I  
single prints only Just 99 cents! your choice of negative I i 

offer expires 04/30/97 J offer expires 04/30/97 1 I - 
I ' no commercial accounts I 

I 
L--------,l L--.------ J L  

I 
I 
I 

offer expires 04/30/97 
I I  

offer expires 04/j0/97 

i r  ----I--- i r  ------I- 

voluable coupon i r  --I----- r valuable coupon 

I I  I I  
I I 10 Percent Off! I I IO Percent off! 

I I  I I  
I I  

I I  Free! 

I I With Your Next Purchase.. 1 
Russell Stover Boxed Chocolate 

With Purchase of any Hdth Mart 
Brand item 

I C - - - -  

thrcc t'xtra shots w i th  12 cxp and 
74 cxp Comt on Agfarolor HDC filni 
arid 0 1 1 1  s r o r e  procesring to  
t l r i v o  dr i  cdsy bargain 

. _ " ~ -  - - . 

enter to win! 
Win our Book Mart 
and Health Mart 
Parade of Values 

i 
I Name: ._.. .__ __ . _ _  _ 

Telephone: _I . __ _ _  . -- - Easter Basket! 

Address: -_ . . __ __ . _ _  

City & Zip: -"- Need Not Be present to Win! 

Drawing Held on Good Friday.. 
No Purchase Necessary.. 

' 
I Shop at Home, Shop at Book 1 1  / I  1 ,  Mart & Health Mart! HAPPY EASTER! 

- I  1 

I 
I 
' 1  

"OLD WOOD DRUG" A G F A e  FILM 
MOTHIMC ESCAPES ACFA FILM STORE I IOURS: 

Mor) Itbru Fri 9 a m - 6 p rn. 
Sat 9 a m  - 4 p m  

Sun 12 30 p m - 4 p.m. 
OPEN EVERY OTHER SUNDAY 

BOOKMART 
Books, Cards, Photo & Gifts 

6498 Meln St. 
NEW SHERIDAN 

HEALTH MART PHARMACY 
Jonathan Shores, R. PH. CASS CITY, MI 48726 (517) 872.2075 Roger Root, Chairnlan 

El kl and Township Planning Conmission 
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Area internet At Owen-Gage 

Student helping student access comtng 
to Cass Citv key to reading program 

J 
era1 internet service provid- 
ers. 
During last week’s session, 

the board received some 
good news and bad news, 
according to Prieskorn. 

The bad news, she ex- 
plained, is that GTE officials 
misquoted themselves when 
they said the company could 
provide local internet access 
if there were a minimum 125 
subscribers. As it turns out, 
GTE would need at least 
1,200 customers. 

Prieskorn noted prelimi- 
nary discussions with other 
firms haven’t panned out; 
Local Internet Services, Inc., 
Ludington, hasn’t submitted 
a specific contract, she said, 
and Century Telephone in 
Caro has no plans to come to 
Cass City. 

However, representatives 
from Agri-Valley Services, 
Inc., Pigeon, indicated their 
firm is going to be expand- 
ing to Cass City. “It looks 
like it’s going to happen.” 

Prieskorn said a survey of 
internet use and interest, con- 
ducted by the EDC in recent 
weeks, has netted 53 re- 
sponses so far. “We thought 
that was a pretty good re- 
sponse,” she added. 

The EDC began exploring 
the possibility of local 
internet access because it  
represents another service 
the community could offer to 
prospective businesses and 
individuals looking to relo- 
cate in the village. 

The goal, Prieskorn con- 
cluded, was to encourage a 
company to take the next 
step. “I think we served our 
purpose as far as getting the 
ball rolling:’ 

Educators in  the Owen- 
Gage School District are try- 
ing a different approach to 
encourage students to pick 
up a book for the sake of 
reading. 
In an effort to nurture a love 

of reading among younger 
students, the district has 
launched a modest program 
in which juniorlsenior high 
students are matched with 
elementary pupils. The pairs 
meet 3 times a week to share 
books, games and other ac- 
tivities. 

The “Reading Buddies” 
program is only about 3 
weeks old, and the effort in- 
volves only a half-dozen jun- 
ior/senior high students so 
far. 

But the smiles of the 
younger students, and their 
anticipation of meeting their 
“reading buddy’’ is encour- 
aging, according to Diane 
Warack, aTitle I teacher who 
has spearheaded the project. 

“We’ve seen changes al- 
ready,” she said of the 
younger pupils, who look 
forward to Mondays, 
Wednesdays and Fridays, 
when they meet with their 
“buddies” for an hour to 
share not only a book, but 
ideas and thoughts. 
“I think what we had looked 

at is (how) many of our stu- 
dents who don’t like to read, 

who don’t enjoy reading, and 
we wanted to find a way to 
get these kids to like read- 
ing,” she said. 

“You can get a better re- 
sponse and a much happier 
rcader when you work one- 
on-one. 

“One of our ultimate goals 
is that through their enjoy- 
ment of reading, they will 
pick up more books. . .be- 
cause they want to read,” 
Warac k added. 

She pointed out the pro- 
gram was started on a small 
scale to see how the students 
would react. In the future, 
she hopes to expand the 
project to include others in 
the community. “I have 
many volunteer parents who 
are anxious to get started 
also.” 

If the interest matches that 
seen at thejunior/senior high 
school, Warack should have 
no problcm finding enough 
“reading buddies.” 

“We had a ton of interest in 
it,” Counselor Joel Brandel 
commented, referring to the 
number of students who in-  
dicated they wanted to par- 
ticipate. “We had almost 30 
kids sign up.” 
Unfortunately, many of the 

students’ schedules made it 
impossible for them to vol- 
unteer during their lunch 

hours, he noted. 
For the 6 students who are 

participating, the experience 
has been an enjoyable one. 

“It’s been fun,” said senior 
Amanda Salcido. 

“We just wanted to help. 
We know that we can help 
them (younger students) and 
make it more fun for them,” 
she added. “We don’t make 
all the rules; they help us.” 

Shannon McClorey, an- 
other senior, echoed 
Salcido’s comments. 

“I just wanted to help the 
kids learn to read, to get bet- 
ter at it,” she said. “You don’t 
just have to read. We play 
games and all sorts of differ- 
ent activities. 

“I didn’t know what to ex- 
pect. I thought they would 
be more shy and reserved, 
but they’re not,” McClorey 
added. “They’ve been a lot 
of fun.” 

Aside from McClorey and 
Salcido, 4 other students par- 
ticipate regularly in the pro- 
gram - Rob Coryell, Anna 
Smith, Heather Sprague and 
Ann Warack. 

Elementary Principal Bill 
Britt said he hasn’t heard 
many comments from teach- 
ers yet about the program 
because it’s still so new. 
However, he added, “The 
kids seem to be pretty thrilled 
about it.” 

Efforts by thc Cass City 
Economic Devclopment 
Corporation to bring local 
internet access to Cass City 
may pay off, board members 
learned last week. 

“I think we’re a lot more 
optimistic that it’s going to 
happen,” EDC Board Presi- 
dent Geraldine Prieskorn 
cominented following the 
hoard’s March 1 1  meeting. 

The issue was discussed at 
the local EDC board’s Feb- 
ruary meeting, when about 
2S gathered to explore 
intcrnct services and hard- 
ware capabilities available 
now and planned i n  the fu- 
ture. 
Among those in attendance 

were representatives of sev- 

OWEN-GAGE students are helping their younger counter- 
parts improve their reading skills through a new “Reading 
Buddies” program. Above, (left to right) senior Amanda 
Salcido reads to fourth grader Amanda Byrd, while senior 
Shannon McClorey shares a book with fourth grader Jenny 
Czewski. 

Wedding 
Announcements 

Circuit court proceedings 
The following people ap- 

peared Friday in  Tuscola 
County Circuit Court on 
criminal charges: 

*Alan J. Dandron, 40, 
Gagetown, pleaded no con- 
test to attempted assault with 
intent to do great bodily 

harm July 1 1, 1994, in Co- 
lumbia Township, and being 
habitual offender, second of- 
fense. 

A pre-sentence investiga- 
tion was ordered, bond was 
continued and the defendant 
was remanded to the custody 
of the sheriff’s department. 
Sentencing is to be sched- 
uled. 

.Keith E. Cronewald, 20, 
Caro, pleaded innocent to 
charges of carjacking, armed 
robbery and carrying a con- 
cealed weapon Sept. 8 in 
Wells Township, and second 
degree home invasion, con- 
spiracy to commit home in- 
vasion, larceny in a building 
and receiving and concealing 
stolen property over $100 
May 27 in Wells Township. 
A pretrial hearing is to be 

scheduled in the case. 
*Steven P. Napora 111, 18, 

Saginaw, was sentenced to 
240 days in the county jail 
for probation violation - 
failure to report to his super- 
vising probation agent. 
*Ryan N. Sholes, 20, Caro, 

was sentenced to 36 months 
to 5 years in prison for his 
pleas of no contest to unlaw- 
fu l  use of a motor vehicle 
Nov. 27, 1993, inVassar, pro- 
bation violation, operating a 
motor vehicle while under 
the influence of liquor and 
unlawfully driving away an 
automobile Oct. 7 in  
Indianfields Township. 
Sholes, who was remanded 

to the custody of the sheriff’s 
department, was ordered to 
pay a $200 fine, $235 foren- 
sic fee and $989.88 in resti- 
tution. He was granted per- 
mission to enroll in a residen- 
tial treatment program. 

OJoey E. Staten, 29, 
Fairgrove, was sentenced to 
2 years and 6 months to 4 

years in prison for his plea 
of guilty to probation viola- 
tion. 

.Jason A. Sanback, 19, 
Caro, was sentenced to 36 
months probation for his plea 
of guilty to larceny in a build- 
ing Nov. 28 in Ellington 
Township. 

Sanback was ordered to 
undergo substance abuse 
counseling, and pay $400 in 
court costs and fines, $407 in  
restitution and a $60 victim 
crime fee. He is to remain 
on bond until arrangement 
can be made for him to par- 
ticipate in a “boot camp” pro- 
gram. 

.Arden L. Huffman, 38, 
North Branch, was sentenced 
to 24 months probation and 
90 days in the county jail (45 
days deferred to the end of 
probation), with work re- 
lease, for his plea of guilty 
to possession of a dangerous 
weapon Dec. 19 in Cas City. 
Huffman, who was ordered 

to undergo substance abuse 
counseling and therapy, was 
ordered to pay $1,000 in 
costs and fines plus a $60 
victim crime fee. 

Catalogs loaned 
overnight . 

Free Subscription 
with each order Monuments ordered 

by April 25 will be 
set by Memorial Day TEC to Cass City 

, Chronicle 
Phone 872-201 0 sponsor 4 

students 
The selection of a memorial is a most important decision 
. .because it is a permanent tribute of love and rc ;pect. 

We offer sincere counsel, years of experience and the finest 

HE FUNERAL memorials produced anywhere. 
RANCE PLAN - I  

MONiMENTc 
?d %!- Represented by: 

For the 16th consecutive 
year, Thumb Electric Coop- 
erative will be sponsoring 4 
area high school students, 
whose parents receive elec- 
trical service from the coop- 
erative, to share in an educa- 
tional, social and leadership 
experience by participating 
in Michigan Electric Teen 
Days ’97 at the 4-H Kettunen 
Center, Tustin, April 23, 24 
and 25. 

WHOLE Debra L. Kranz, Director Kingston 
51 7-663-221 0 HOUSE 

FULL OF 

WINDOWS $1 
Four students will be se- 

lected by Thumb Electric 
Cooperative to attend the 
16th annual event. 3 DAYS 

ONLY 
Thurs., Fri. & Sat. 

’ -+- At. Schneeberger’s In Cass City! 

In addition to educating 
youth about electric coopera- 
tive issues, Teen Days ’97 
will provide social activities. 

As in the past, on& of the 
participants in Teen Days ’97 
will be selected to attend 
Rural Youth Toyr in Wash- 
ington, D.C., June 14-20. 

Interested teens may con- 
tact TEC for applications or 
for further information by 
calling 1-5 17-658-857 1 or 1 - 
800-327-0166. Deadline for 

try is March 22. 5 
7 One UT uur MOSI ropuiar 

Styles, This Reclina-RockeP 
Chair Comes In A Variety Of 

Fabrics 8 Colors. 
Light Oan - 

Residents of the Month 
rn 

Witti wirirlow purchase lor sub-structure 95 
Table Model 

Model VG2032 

The Zollner’s are 
our own married couple here 
at Tendercare. They both are 
a pleasure to have in the facil- 
ity. John & Virginia share a 
room and have their own TV 
and refrigerator. 

We are proud to 
have them as part of our 
Tendercare family. 

WINDOWS Free Garden Window 
Free ScreendLocks 
Free Double Strength Class $ O0 Free Thermo Glass 

SERVBCE AFTER 
Emalovee of the Month FOR YOUR ENTIRE HOME 

m 
ro. 

As 
AS $1,799’ Morris Powell has 

been employed at Tendercare 
since November of 1973 - over 
23 years1 Morris first worked 
as a nurse aide; went into 
nursing school and returned as 
an LPN! Recently Morns has 
taken on the responsibility of 
the Rehab Nurse and assist- 
ing with new employees. 

Morris is a team 
player and a peacemaker. He 

is well liked by the residents and his co-workers. 
The Rehab staff appreciate his assistance - they 
say “he always makes time for us, no matter how 
busy he is.” 

Thank you Morris for a job well done. We 
are pleased you are a part of our Tendercare fam- 
Ilyl 

LOW d 
AS 

Add Insulation And Beauty 

Cover SoffiVFacia With A 
To Your Home 

Vinyl Wrap And Never Paint 
Again 
Cover Exterior Window 
TrimlNew Caulk 
New Gutters/Downspouts 
In Choice of Color 
New Shutters With Every 
Siding Order (Limit 2 Pair) 

*Based cn 24’x36’ ranch at 12% 
Interest, 84 mo. financing 

13” Diagonal 
Remote Control 

PORTABLE 15 Cu. Ft. 

COLOR CHEST FREEZER 
ROPER WASHER & 

DRVER PAIR 
Tv 

Model VG2032A Save $60 
FREE DELIVERY - SO DAYS SAME AS CASH 

It All Starts With Low Prices!! SUPERSTORE!! 

Tendercare Cass City 
4782 Hospitd Drive 

(517) an-2174 
Cas City, MI 48726 

1 -800-288=4385 
STATE LICENSE #2101109016 



Letters to the editor 
On assessments, bond issues 

Obituaries 

I '  I 
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Ublv names top 1997 graduates Cass City 
Bowling dent of the Month for May 

1996. She represented 
Sanilac County i n  the 
“Young People’s Citizenship 
Seminar” the summer of her 
Junior year, and won first 
place in the interior design 
cohipetition at Delta College 
Skill Day in her Sophomore 
year. 

Halifax has also been in- 
volved in many extracurricu- 
lar activities. She has been a 
member of the National 
Honor Society for 2 years 
and a member of Quiz Bowl 
for 4 years, She has been an 
elementary student aide, a 
high school office aide, a 
member of the prom com- 

mittee and an honor guard at 
Graduation. 

She has been a member of 
Ubly High School’s volley- 
ball team for 4 years and a 
member of the cheerleading 
squad for one year, lettering 
in both sports. She was also 
a member of the marching 
band’s color guard for one 
year. 

Halifax is a member of 
Minden City United Meth- 
odist Church, where she has 
taughtvacation Bible School 
for 3 years, is a substitute 
Sunday School teacher, and 
was a member of the youth 
group, holding the office of 
treasurer. 

Currently employed at 
Stafono’s restaurant, She 
plans to attend Michigan 
State University or Western 
Michigan University after 
graduation. 

Heilig, during her 4 years 
at Ubly High School, has 
earned academic achieve- 
ment awards in algebra, bi- 
ology I and 11, English 9, 
short stories and writing, 
American literature, Spanish 
I and TI, health, American 
history and band, including 
the first chair and director’s 
awards. She is also a mem- 
ber of the National Honor 
Society. 
Heilig has becn an elemen- 

tary student aide for 3 years. 
She was a member of the 
volleyball team for 4 years 
and has earned her sports let- 
ter. She is also a member of 
the high school band, play- 
ing the French horn. This 
past summer, Melissa was a 
member of the Michigan 
High School Football 
Coaches Associat ion All Star 
Band. 
Heilig was a member of the 

prom committee, and an 
honor guard at Graduation. 
She currently holds the po- 
sition of co-edi tor of the high 
school yearbook and has 
been the drum major of the 
band for 2 years. 

She is a member of S t .  
Ignatius Catholic Church of 
Freiburg, and is currently 
employed at Farmer Jack in 
Bad Axe. 
After graduation, she plans 

to attend Central Michigan 
University. 

Also graduating with high 
honors are: Rachel Herp, 
Sandra Rutkowski, Angela 
Puvalowski, Kathryn Elliott, 
Meeghan Lautner, Elizabeth 
Bragg, Robert Mitchell and 
Laura Osentoski. 
Graduating with honors are 

Paula Morell, Stephen 
Oberski, Christina Sadro, 
Jamie Bock, KristinaWyrick 
and Chrissy Bezemek. 

Ubly Community School 
officials have announced the 
honor students of  the class of 
1997. 

Valedictorian is Carol 
Halifax, daughter of Dale 
and Nancy Halifax of 
Mindcn City. She is complet- 
ing her high school career 
with a grade point average of  
3.98. 

Salutatorian is Melissa 
Heilig, daughter of Gerald 
and Mary Beth Heilig of 
Ubly. She will graduate with 
a grade point average of 3.96. 

SUNDAY NO ROLLERS 
March 9 

Milletics 612 (236). J .  Krol 610 (223). 
D. Kirkbride 604 (2SS), D. Steele 587 
17741. R .  Withersnoon 576 (233) ,  v. 

D & J’s Sisch 570, B Poirykus 569 (232), J 
The S.H L 15 Langenhurg 566. W Gulnther 564, B 
Half N Half Rutkoski 559 (2 IS), T Summers 554, D 
Schott’s Accounting 13 Wallace 553, B Anthes 552, M Jackson 
C B’s I 552. G Robrnson 22.5. C Anthes 220, 
Ublv Buds & Blossoms 

17 

13 

I 1 M Baucrschnildt 2 19, J Storm 21 3 
We’ll Get Back To You 
CWD’s THURSDAY NITE TRIO 

March 13 
10 
6 

Men’s High Series & Game: E. Brown 
584 & 210. 
Women’s High Series: D. Williams 490, 

R. Copeland 469. 
Women’s High Game: D. Williams 186. 
High Team Series: The S.H.1,. 1927. 
High Team Game: Ubly Buds & Blos- 

E I 

~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ d e r s  
Electric 

~ o ~ ~ ~ r e ~ ) d ~  Gas 
IGA soms 669. 

22 
19 
18 
I8 
16 
16 
14 
13 

Mycogen Plant Sciences I 3  
I 1  MERCHANETT’E LEAGUE Hyatt  Farms 

High Team Series & Game: General March 13 

FormYou 3 
Thumb Auto Wash 
J.B.’s Crew 
Detroit Edison 
All Season Rental 
Heartland Home Care 
Car0 Chiropractic 
Rolling Hills 
Nel’s Kitchen 
Northwood Golf 

18 
16 
13 
13 
12 
12 
I 1  
IO 
8 
7 

Cabk 1924 (693) 
High Senes &Games Doug O’kll69.5 

(237-290). Duane O’Dell674 (232-217- 
225). L) Doerr 656 (257-225). Dennis 
Hyatt 673 (232-222), G Pringle 605 
(255) .  K Pichla 596 (228), 11 Miller 583 
(221), D Dickrnson 581, R Pringle 578, 
E Champagne 577 (21 1), R Biebe1221, 
J Smrthson 224. E Schmaltz 21 1 ,  D 
Heleski 2 IO 

CHARMONT LADIES No Minim urn 

senlor cttizens. 

6121 Cass City Road, Cass City, Michigan 48726 Phone: 872-2645 
purchase required 
on sale /terns for Store Hours: Monday-Saturday: 7:OO am - 9:OO pm Sunday: 8:OO am - 5:OO pm 

Beer Wine Pkg. Liquor Lottery Tickets Food Stamps Bakery Deli WIC Coupons Accepted 

500 Series: J ,  Morell 594, D. Potrykus 
530, L. &la 5 IO.  

200Games: J .  Morell 215, D. Williams 
205. 

High Actual Team Series:  Car0  
Chiropractic 1886. 

High Actual Team Game: Car0 
Chiropractic and Heartland Home Care 
655. 

Team # 7 
J.B.’s Crew 
Pizzavilla 
Cable-et tes 
Cass City l i r e  
Live Wires 
Wild John’s 
Cass City IGA 
Dee’s M.P. Rockets 
Dott Manufacturing 

17 
16 
15 

I 1  112 
I I  
I I  
I I  
I O  
I O  

I 112 

Carol Halifax 
MERCHANTS 

March 12 Here is how to enter; Just fill out this entry an 
box at the store. 2 winners will be drawn ea 

No purchase required. Must be 1 

pb A/ 1 

c‘ at 7.. 
Tk OrtlY 
2 y o ~ r  city 2- - CPSSA, 

Ne’”’ 4 a m a m a e a a o e m a  
a 
0 EASTER DINNER DRAWING 

High7tam Series and Game: Live Wires 
3098 ( I  117). 

High Series: R .  Peyerk 537. B .  Wilrson 
520, S. Hutchinson 5 13, E. Komain 5 IO. 
B. Batkie 493,J. Kaye 496, T. Skripy 477. 
C. Slaughter 497, M. Moore 483, L. 
Kilbourn 480. V. Patera 492, B .  Kilbourn 
489. 

High Games: L. Kilbourn 251, U. 
Peyerk 21 I .  S. Hutchinson 21 I .  C. 
Slaughter 21 3. K. Uaniels 202, N. Davis 
181, B. Watson 190, D. Kelly 174. J .  Kaye 
185, L. Ondrajka 189, V. Paterii 195, M. 
Moore 183, M. Horne 177, E. Romain 
182, M. Mathewson 179, K. Copeland 
181. M. Truemner 170. V. Humes 173. 

Charmont 
Milletics Surveying 
Cole Carbide 
Soundz by Greg 
Brentwood 
Charmont Motel 
New England Life 
Homesteaders 
Pro Temp 
Cass City Sports 
Independent Bank 
Wickes 

12 
I I  
IO 
I O  
IO 
9 
9 
8 
5 
5 
5 
2 

0 

Name 

: Address 
a AII dinners given away 

Friday, March 28. 
Your Easter Dinner will consist of: 

High Series & Games: J. Smithson 726 
(258-236-232). T. Pettengill 723 (248- 
247-228), S. Hammett 700 (267-257). I, 
Tomazewski 697 (256-235). D. Orton 656 

h t z  635 (234-21 8), R. Byrnes 628 (235), 
P. McIntosh 624 (225). D. Shannon 6 16 
(224-215).  M. Gettel 613 (239).  J .  

(244-212), D. O’Dell636 (231-725), M 

Wedding 
Announcements 

THURSDAY MORNING 
COFFEE LFAGUE 

March 13 1 Dozen Fresh Baked Dinner Rolls : 
1 Can Fame Pineapple Slices 

9 1 Freshly 8aked Pumpkin Pie 0 

1 Fame Ebnetess Ham, 
average weight 8-1 0 fbs. 
1 - 5 Ib. Bag of Potatoes 
1 Bag Fame Frozen Vegetables o m m a o a o m m + 0 ~ ~ 0 ~ ~ + + m  

Unpredictablcs 11 
Golden Oldies 27 I12 
k e ’ s  M P Rockets 24 
STAH 27 
KHEW 22 112 
Alley Cats 16 

551 (201) 

Rockets 1797 (617) 

High Series & G a m  D Mathewson 

High Team Series & Ganw Dee’s M P 

FRIDAY NIGHT 
MIXED DOUHLES 

March 14 

Melissa Heilig 

During her 4 years at Ubly 
High School, Halifax has 
earned achievcrnent awards 
in  chemistry, algebra I,  11, 
and 111, Spanish I, 11, and 111, 
English 9, American litera- 
ture, biology, advanced hiol- 
ogy, gcneral business and 
health. She was named Stu- Gators 61 

7- 10‘s 59 
Easy 7 54 
Misfits 54 
“Cut Throat” 48 
Grumblers 46 
U.S. 42 
Split Happens 39 
9-N-A Wiggle 39 
Jegsters 38 

34 The Fami I y 
Rare Form 32 
Men’s High Series & Game: J.  Navmo 

577 (257), T. Potrykus 559 (222). I .  Ridge 
557 (205), B. Potrykus 544, R. Priiigle 
233. 

Women‘s High Series & Games B. 
Watson 521, M. Smith 500 (190). L .  
Dibble 500. 

High Team Series: 7-10’s 1984. 
High learn Game: Gators 706. 

Good Catalogs loaned 
overnight , source 

Dairy products are a good 
source of calcium, which can 
help prevent osteoporosis. ‘1’0 
get thc S a m  arnount of  c d -  
cium that y o u  get in  2 8 -  
ounce glasscs o f  milk,  you’d 
have to eat 20 cggs, 30 slices 
o f  whitc bread o r  2 1/2 cups 
of greens. 

Free Subscription 
with each order 

Cass City 
Chronicle 

Phone 872-201 0 

$100 Toys-R-Us Gift 
certificate in the 
r------------ Kid Approved 

5weepsta kes I 
I 
I 

I 
Name: ~ -~ I 

sure you have qualicprotection. - 
Call your Farm Bureau Insurance agent for a 

home coverage update. 
~ R E ~ U  Making your future Hk iNSURANCE more predictable 

Rich Ypma LUTCF 
6703 Main 

Cass City, MI 48726 
Phone. 872-4326 

v u  WUCW vylwl. ,MY WI IAY t i l l  l a w  e y l w u  0 1 ~ 9 ~ ~  

n Earn vow 
College Degree 
in Cass City Pizza 

7.6 to 8.1 02. Pkg. 

Take all of your classes right here in Cass City! 
Call us tomorrow for information a b u t  our  
Degree programs in Accounting, Management, 
Computer Information Systems, Administrative 
Assistant, or Word Prcxlessing Specialist. Or ask 
about our Bachelor prc-grams in Management, 
Accounting, or Business Leadership. 

6667 Man Street, Cuss City, MI 48726 n n 
For a career. For a future. For a life. 

& A n  Equal Oppcnunity Afltrmalive Aclim InsttIutW 
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Bad Axe places Kingston behind 41-36. 

The Cards battled back in 
the final period and sent the 3 on star squad game into overtime on a 
bucket by Kaniszewski with 

Thumb league 
all-conference 
teams named 

Kingston bows 
in overtime loss 
North Central Thumb 

League champion Kingston 
battled Fowler for 4 quarters 
and 2 overtime periods Fri- 
day before bowing 75-73 in 
a classic Class D Regional 
final battle at Bad Axe. 

Coach Mike Rea’s Cardi- 
nals enter the record books 
with a lofty 22-3 mark. 
Fowler advances into 
Tuesday’s Class D 
quarterfinals at Oxford with 
a 20-5 record against Detroit 
East Catholic, who stands at 

The Cardinals took a 14- 10 
advantage into the second 
period against Fowler when 
Chris Michalski and Tim 
Lyons hit back-to-back shots 
from behind the arc to close 
the opening frame. 

Lyons opened the period 
before the intermission with 
another trey and, following 
a basket from senior John 
McLaughlin on an offensive 
rebound, Kingston possessed 
its biggest lead of the night 
at 19-11, 

Fowler narrowed the mar- 
gin behind the inside play of 
Dan Spitzely and Curt 
Hungerford, who sand- 

23-2. 

wiched a pair of hoops 
around an 8-foot jumper by 
Kingston’s Leon 
Kaniszewski. Dan Rayl 
ended the scoring for 
Kingston in the half with a 
basket in the paint, which 
helped establish a 26-23 ad- 

Kaniszewski sent the game 
into a second overtime when 
he nailed a 3-point shot at the 
buzzer to knot the game at 
66-all. 

McLaughlin and 
Kaniszewski led Kingston, 
splitting 36 tallies. 

Coaches of the Thumb Na- 
tional announced their selec- 
tion of the league’s all-con- 
ference basketball team, 
which was dominated by 
USA and Lakers, with 2 se- 
lections each. Cass City 
placed 2 on the second team. 

Honored were 2 Cass City 
seniors, Chad Diegel and 
Scott Wallace. Wallace was 
Cass City’s leading scorer 
from his guard position. 
Diegel was runner-up and 
was a leading rebounder. 

The Lakers placed seniors 
Pete Beachy andTim Russell 
on the first team. League 
champion USA placed 
Shaun Gainforth and Eric 
Kelly on the first team, and 
David Perales of Marlette 
won the final first team posi- 
tion. 
Besides its first team mem- 

bers, USA placed JimAndrol 
on the second team and Dan 
Sweetman on the honorable 
mention list. 

Marlette placed Tom 
Kolenda on the second team 
and Nathan Sowa and Rob 
Schmitt on the honorable 
mention list. 

All Saints was represented 
by Pat Rybak on the second 
team and with Craig Francis 
and Rafael Guzman, who re- 
ceived honorable mention. 

Bad Axe failed to place a 
player on the teams. 

vantage at the intermission. 
Fowler took its first lead of 

the second half on Jon 
Nobach’s triple near the 6- 
minute mark at 29-28. Lyons 
regained the lead for 
Kingston on a 6-foot jump 
shot on their next possession. 
The one-point margin would 
be Kingston’s last lead of the 
night. 

The Eagles went on a 9-0 
run and held their biggest 
advantage, 38-30, after a 
Ryan O’Rourke put back at 
the 2-minute mark of the 
third period. 

Carey Bastian closed the 
gap to 38-34 for Kingston 
with a pair of field goals but 
Nick Thelen’s triple regained 
a 7-point margin for the 
Eagles. After a Kingston 
turnover, the Eagles looked 
to run out the clock and take 
a possible 9-point lead into 
the final period. McLaughlin 
thwarted that plan when he 
stole an errant pass, drove the 
length of the floor, and 
scored to end the frame with 

SCD 1 

EYE CARE 
& EYEWEAR 

sponsors 
contest 

FOR EVERYONE Continued from page 9. 
pings, pictures from maga- 
zines or your own art work. 
3. Entries will be judged on 

the conservation message, 
visual effectiveness, original- 
ity and universal appeal. 

4. The 1997 theme is 
“B ac ky ard Stewards hip .” 
Correct theme must be on the 
front of the poster and_ theme 
must be spelled correctly and 
appear exactly as stated. The 
theme emphasizes what each 
of us can do in our own back- 
yard, schoolyard or neigh- 
borhood to practice and pro- 
mote positive stewardship. 

For further information 
contact the Tuscola SCD of- 
fice, 1075 Cleaver Rd., Caro, 
or phone 5 17-673-8 174. 

THUMB AMERICAN 

Professional eye 
exams 
Prescriptions filled 
Large selection of 
frames 

b All types of contact 
No-line bifocals 

b Classes repaired 
b Blue Cross & VSP 

DAVID C. 
BATZER II, 0.L 

Professional Eye Care 
Ead Axe Cass City 

participant 

269.7263 872-3404 

In the Thumb American, 
the first team selections 
were: Chris Schmitt, Reese; 
David Wood, Cros-Lex; Ja- 
son Newton and Tony 
Reiner, Sandusky, and Joe 
Rutkowski, Ubly. 

The second team: Cory 
Haubonstricker and Ben 
Hillborg, Reese; Rico 
Ballentine, Deckerville; Tim 
Callender, Harbor Beach, 
Mike Pearson and John Wil- 
liams, Cros-Lex, Erik 
Krueger, Harbor Beach, and 
Ryan Buhl, Mayville. 

Receiving honorable men- 
tion were Neil Russell and 
Cory Sc humac her, 
Deckerville; Paul Sheldon, 
Cros-Lex; Tony Reinke, 
Sandusky, and John Zang- 
Bodis, Kyle O’Neil and 
DaryI Ford, Harbor Beach. 

KINGSTON’S CHRIS MICHALSKI drives the lane against 
Fowler during Friday’s regional final in Bad Axe. 

i 
1 

North Central Thumb 
League volleyball champion 
Owen-Gage dominated the 
league’s 1997 all-conference 
team with 4 first team selec- 
tions. 

Seniors Kate Powers and 
Amanda Salcido joined 
Kingston’s Meredith Roland 
and Port Hope’s Jessica 
Miller as unanimous choices 
on the fantasy team. 

Besides Powers and 
Salcido, Bulldog teammates 
Jennifer Winchester and Beth 
Nickerson were included on 
this year’s dream team. 
Winchester’s and Powers’ 
selections mark the third 
consecutive time the pair 
have earned league first team 
honors. Powers has been a 
unanimous choice for the 
past 2 years. Salcido was a 
member of the 1996 elite 
squad. 

Owen-Gage juniors Tonya 
Smith and MelissaVargo re- 
ceived second team distinc- 
tion for the Bulldogs. 

The NCTL complete all- 
conference listing: 

FIRST TEAM 
*Meredith Roland, 

Kingston; Devin Kelly, 
Kingston; *Kate Powers, 
Owen-Gage; *Amanda 
Salcido, Owen-Gage; Jen 
Winchester, Owen-Gage; 
Beth Nickerson, Owen- 
Gage; *Jessica Miller, Port 
Hope, and Rebecca 
Ma karew i c z, Peck. 

SECOND TEAM 

3 seconds remaining in regu- HONORABLE 

Looking for a CHURCH? 
We welcome you through our door. 

You’ll like what you find and be NOTICE welcomed back for more. Myers, Kingston;‘ Nicole 
Heilig, North Huron; Nicole 
Lewandowski, North Huron; 
Jessica Seoa, North Huron; 
Tracy Ernst, Peck; Shasta 
Johnston, Peck; Lindsey 
McTaggart, Port Hope. 
* Unanimous choices 

Heinlein and Ashlie Chapel 
received honorable mention. Earning honorable mention 

arc Carissa Rockwell and 
Jenny Harmon, Marlette; 
Heather MacDonald and 
Sara Fredrick, All Saints, and 
Abbie Krause, Bad Axe. 

AMERICAN LEAGUE 

Calvary Bible 
Fellowship 

The Village of Cass City will be receiving 
-sealed bids until 4:OO p.m. March 24, 1997, 

at the Municipal Building, 
6506 Main Street, P.O. Box 123, 

Cass City, MI 48726-01 23. 
For one (1) new 

1997 FORD TRUCK. 

Bad Axe’s first team play- 
ers are Kelly Jaworski, 
Julienne Ferris and Aleatha 
Johnson. Lakers are repre- 
sented by Casey McLellan MAIN STREET, CASS CITY. ... ACROSS 

FROM THE CASS THEATRE 
PARKING AND ENTRANCE LOCATED 

BEHIND THE CHURCH 
SUNDAY SCHOOL 9:45 a.m. 
MORNING WORSHIP 
EVENING SERVICE 6:OO p.m. 

1 1 :00 a m .  

McL,aUghlin among The American League’s 
first team: Shannon Sutton 

Specifications are as follows: 

F700 Conventional-Gas 

Ford Gas 7 . 0 L  H.O. 236 HP 3600 RPM 
Allison AT-545 4 Speecl Automatic 
21,000 LB Rockwell RS-21-145 Steel 
Axle Ratio 6.14 
9,000 LB Front Axle 
23,000 LB w/4,500 LB Aux low deflection 
Hydraulic brakes front disc 
Hydraulic brakes mar HD 
35 gal. RH steel step tank 
Single horiz muffler and pipe LH side 
Ban I 71 AMP 535 CCA Motorcraft GRP 64 
King pin bushings - Bronz 
Differential (S) main, non locking 
Drag link & tie rods Greaseable 
Magnetic traps, rear axle drain & fill 
Single power steering ross TAS-55 
Shock Absorbers, front DBL ACT telescopic 
Wheel seals FRT 
Wheel Seal Rear, C.R. Scotseal 
Hyd Booster 
Parking Brake Spring-set rear axle 
Tubeless radial tires 
Goodyear unisteel 1 lR22.5 
Disc Type 10 hole painted wheel 
Standard interior trim 
Stationary grille painted 
Clam type frt hood 
Horns dual electric 
Mirrors dual western delbar steel 
Running boards 
Tinted glass all around 
Two speed wipers electric 
Dash mounted cigar lighter 
Cowl vent left hand, ventilation 
Heater fresh air w/dl weather ventilation 
Electronic AM/FM stereo radio 
Steering wheel 18” Dia. 
Sun visor RH & LH 
Lap & Shoulder seat belts 
Bench seat full width HD black vinyl 
Ammeter 
Oil press gauge elec 
Coolant temp gauge elec 
Fuel gauge elec 
Parking brake control dash mounted 
Elec speedometer 
Elec tachometer 
Turn signal switch steering col mounted 
Fuse circuit protectors 
Emerg flashers 
Halogen head lights 
5 cap marker lights 
Tail lights 
Turn signal & side marker combo lights 
95 AMP Ah internally reg 
Donaldson single stage air cleaner 
Non clutch type cooling fan 
One quart full flow oil filter 
Elec fuel pump 
Electromechanical governor 
PTO crankshaft driven 
12 volt starter 
Throttle hand control vernier t y p  
Ext trans oil filter 
Trans oil cooler 
Full width frt bumper 
Front tow hooks 

WB-177 CA-108 OAL-283 
W c 

and Lindsay Reif, Reese, and 
McLaughlin, Kingston; ‘ l lm Rachel D~ Vusse, Har- 
Lyons, Kingston; Jeff bor Beach. 

For the second straight year, 
Kingston’s John McLaughlin 
was named a unanimous 
choice to the ,North Central 
Thumb League all-confer- 
ence team. 
Besides McLaughlin, North 

Huron’s Jeff Gottschalk re- 
turns to highlight the 9- 
school association’s best as 
voted on by league coaches. 

The undefeated champion 
Cardinals also placed Tim 
Lyons among the league’s 
elite. Teammate Chris 
Michalski earned second 
team consideration. 

Two Owen-Gage sopho- 
mores, Justin Anthes and 
Joel Bolzman, received hon- 
orable mention accolades. 

The complete NCTL bas- 
ketball all-conference selec- 
tions include: 

FIRST TEAM 
Josh Burkey, Akron- 

Fai rgrove ; *John 

PRAYER MTG. WED. 7:OO p.m. 

Gottschalk, North Huron; 
Mike Steinhoff, Peck, and 
Jason Leonard, Peck. Joe’s Back In Town 

SECOND TEAM MAIN STREET AUTO CARE 
Josh McCoy, Akron- 

Fairgrove; Dan Vogcl, 
Carsonville-Port Sanilac; 
Chris Peeling, Carsonville- 
Port Sanilac; Josh Sherman, 
Carsonville-Port Sanilac; 
Chris Michalski, Kingston; 
Eric Lasceski, North Huron; 
Mike Webb, Peck, and Erik 
Pye, Port Hope. 

New Owner 
and Operator 
Joe Janssen Wash & wax 

Shampoo 
Total Recondition - inside, outside 
Scotchguard Engine Detail Michelle Monchilov, Ak- 

ron-Fairgrove; Carrie Diehl, 
Caseville; Meghan Roland, 
Kingston; Dana Zyrowski, 
Kingston; Kim Yaroch, 
North Huron; Tonya Smith, 
Owen-Gage; Melissa Vargo, 
Owen-Gage, and Shane 
Johnston, Peck. 

HONORABLE 
MENTION 

CARS - TRUCKS - MOTOR HOMES - TRAVEL TRAILERS 
- MOTORCYCLES WILL CLEAN ANYTHING! 

Call for appointment 
Ride ih style for just %goo 

Get your motorcycle looking its best for the Summer of 1997 
Located next to J.C. Service 

Hours: 8 a.m. - 4 p.m. 
6354 Main St.. Cass Citv 872-4350 

Jon Rosenberg, 
Carsonville-Port Sanilac; 
Aaron Britt, Caseville; Matt 
Bednorek, Caseville; Dan 
Rayl, Kingston; Leon 
Kaniszewski, Kingston; 
Floyd Rice, North Huron; 
Justin Anthes, Owen-Gage; 
Joel Bolzman, Owen-Gage; 
Tom Affer, Peck, and Tony 
Emerick, Port Hope. 
* Unanimous choice 

You’re 
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covered. 
hght? on Neutrogena 

Daily Moisture Supply 
or Neutrogenam 

Foot Cream 00000 I I 
00000 0 (0000)0 00000 0000 McVey Agency lnc. 

4546 Leach St. 
Cass City, Mich, 
(51 7 )  872-4860 

For a free protection review- 
Being in good hands is the only place to be: The Village Council has the right to accept or reject 

any or all bids. 
Joyce A. LaRoche 

Village Clerk 
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Great careers end 
for 0 - G  spikers 

points were recorded by 
Smith (8) and Nickerson (4). 
Melissa Vargo was credited 
with 6 kills and 5 digs for 
Owcn-Gage. 

Although Owen-Gage’s 
graduation losses will be 
hefty, Campbell will return 
several key players for the 
1998 season. Leading the list 
will be Vargo, who will be 
expected to play a big lead- 
ership role in her third and 
final season under Campbell. 
Add to the list of returnees 

Smith and Amy Joles. Smith 

All good things must end. 
But this ending came too 

soon - last Tuesday, in the 
state Class D quarterfinals - 
for Coach Judy Campbell’s 
Owen-Gage volleyball team. 
The Dawgs’ (36-6-3) hopes 

n of returning to the state final 
*rounds ceased when Center 
Line St. Clement defeated 

*the North Central Thumb 
*League champions 15-2 and 
: 15- 13 at Almont. 

For the veteran mentor of 
‘22 years, the loss was one of 
her most sorrowful. 

“This sadness is not about 
winning and losing, This is 
about teaching, coaching and 
being a surrogate mother and 
friend for the past 7 years to 
the girls,” said Campbell. 
. The season-ending defeat 
marks the conclusion of 3 
outstanding volleyball ca- 
reers at Owen-Gage. Playing 
“in their final game in a Bull- 
dog uniform were seniors 
‘Kate Powers, Jennifer Win- 
chester and Amanda Salcido. 
The trio have played under 
Campbell since their fresh- 
man year, each earning first 
team all-conference acco- 
lades for the past 2 seasons. 
Also gone for next year are 

senior starter Beth Nickerson 

mutual enjoyment and giving 
each so much has come to an 
end as they continue on with 
their lives. I guess that’s what 
a lot of my secret to coach- 
ing is - the love we share and 
working hard to please each 
other. It certainly leaves a 
raw hurt when it’s over arid 
the kids grow up and leave 
the nest.” 
At Almont, Owen-Gage de- 

livered the type of perfor- 
mance Bulldog backers have 
become accustomed to - 
never say die. 

139” W.B., V-8 Magnum 

automatic transmission, 
air, tilt, cruise, power 
windows, power locks, 
AWFM cassette, H.D. 
service group, trailer 
tow, sliding rear Wwow, 

aluminum wheels and 
-1 ml -1 premium interior, 

volleyball letters. i n  the second game,” said inclu-ding Nicole Warack, 
Campbell. Melissa Albrecht and Cassie 

Trailing 13-5, Owen-Gage Virgo. 
ran off 8 straight points with 

\ 3.9 V-6 engine, 
4 speed automatic 
transmission, air 
conditioning, power 
windows, power locks 
tilt wheel, cruise 
control, A M M  

junior Tonya- Smith at the 
service l ine .  But St.  
Clement’s big h i t t e r  
Catherine Schwarts con- Grant helps provide home 
nected o n  2 winners to end 
the match. 

All-Stater Powers led 
Owen-Gage i n  the f r o n t  
court with 1 1  kil ls  and 5 
blocks. Salcido added 5 kills 

delivered meal program cassette, sliding rear 
window, SLT plus -[r/jm package, remote entr 

%329** $259** $206** more! 
66 Months 24 Months 36 fdof~ths and much, much and teammates Shannon 

McClorey and Lisa Warack. 
Campbell added, “Hours of 

and 10 digs, and Winchester 
recorded 3 kills, 4 digs, and 
7 assists. Owen-Gage’s only  

The Human Development 
Commission’s (HDC) 
Home-Delivered Meal Pro- 
gram has received a grant 
from the Reynolds/NAMP 
Winter Meals Program to 
help bring nutritious food 
and a touch of human con- 
tact to those homebound se- 
niors who are unable to cook 
for themsclvcs. 

The Richmond, Va.,-based 
Reynolds Metal Company, 
producer of Reynolds Alumi- 
n u m  Foil, donated $ IS0,OOO 
to the National Association 
of  Meal Programs, helping to 
make possible the HDC grant 
and others across the coun- 
try. 

The company donated 5 
cents each time a Reynolds 
product was purchased in 
food stores across the coun- 
try. The grants will be used 
to help provide hot, cold, fro- 
zen, or shelf-stable meals 
delivered to area seniors by 
HDC volunteer drivers. 

“These extra dollars will 

help us meet the nutritional 
needs of the seniors in the 
Thumb,” said Tom 
Ve ne z i ano, n u tr i t i o n direct or 
at HDC. “Reynolds and 
NAMP have really put to- 
gether something special. We 
are grateful for their efforts 
on our behalf.’’ 

The Human Development 
Commission Home-Deliv- 
cred Meal Program provided 
184,000 meals to nearly 
1,200 area seniors in pro- 
gram year 1995- 1996. 

Recipients must be 60 years 
of  age (or the spouse of 
someone who is), 
homebound, and unable to 
cook for themselves or attend 
an HDC Senior Dining Cen- 
ter. A donation of $1.75 for 
hot or frozen meals, and 75 
cents for cold meals is asked 
of each recipient. 

HDC’s Senior Nutrition 
Program, which also i n -  
cludes 19 Senior Dining 
Centers in the Thumb area, 

along with other senior food 
programs, can always use 
donations and more volun- 
leers. If you would like to 
learn more about how you 

can help, please call 1-800- 
843-6394 or the local num- 
ber for the Human Develop- 
ment Commission office in 
your area. 

Urge entry in 
soil district 
poster contest 
The Tuscola Soil Conserva- 

tion District (TSCD) is spon- 
soring a youth soil and wa- 
ter conservation poster con- 
test and urges all students in  
grades one through 6 to en- 
ter. 
Students are eligible as fol- 

lows: Division I - 1st grade; 
Division I1 - 2nd and 3rd 
grade, and Division 111 - 4th, 
5th and 6th grade. 
Posters will be judged at the 

local level and 3 posters will 

be selected in each division. 
There will be a first, second 
and third place winner. All 
participants will  receive a 
certificate. 

72 Months 36 Months 24 Months much, much more! 1 $379**I I $M** 1 1  $269** I 
The winners will receive an 

award at the Tuscola SCD 
annual meeting in January, 
b’irst-place winners will be 
entered in state competition 
in December and first-place 
winners at the state level will 
be sent to the national com- 
petition. 

automatic transmission, 
driver side sliding door, 

-7 Rules are as follows: 
I .  The posters must be 

turned in  to thcTSCD office, 
1075 Cleaver Road, Caro, 
Mich., by April 28. The 
name, home address, divi- 
sion, school, teacher’s name 
and TSCD must he attached 
or printed on the back of each 
poster. 

2 .  Posters should be no 
larger than 24“x36”. Choice 
of materials is optional, but 
poster board, railroad board 
or a sturdy material is pre- 
ferred. You may use clip- 

Please turn to page 8. 

-b . F-,l power mirrors,\ ma 

Keep household products and merjicines out of sight and 
out of reach from curious hands. A locked cabinet or 
closet is your safest option. 
Remember, children act fast. Never leave a cleaning 
product or medication in sight, even to answer the 
doorbell or phone. 
Close all backaging tightly before storing. Insist on 
childproof packaging whenever possible. 
Store cleaning products and medicines in a separate 
place, away from food. Keep all products in their original 
containers. 
Children learn by imitation. Avoid taking medications in 
front of them or drinking from the btt le .  

NEVER refer to medicine as “candy”. It’s easy to see how 
this deceptive play could lead to disaster. 
Don’t overlook your garage, attic and other storage areas 
for potentially hazardous situations. 
Being prepared can save a life. Keep the telephone 
number of your doctor, hospital or local poison control 
center in a handy place. Learn what to do in case 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 
lip5 
fhe 

;ses 5. 

6. 

7. 

0. 

3 speed automatic 
transmission, power 
steering, power brake, 
air conditioning, cloth 
bucket seats,rear foldi 

Stma11 B u s i r l e s s  
Owners: 

I bench, floor mounted 
console w/arm rest, ’-1 7, AWFM stereo, rear 

$209** $1 55** $1 12** much more. 
66 Mmths 36 Months 24 Months defroster, and much, 

A TIPP for your 
employees , These imporfant salefy 

are brought lo you by 
concerned local busines 
leatured on this page. 

~~ ~ 

Service Houm 

Showroom HOnm 

M-F 8:OOarn - 6:OOprn 
Sat 9:OOam - 2:OOpm 

M, Th 8:30am - 8:OOpm 

Sat 9:OOam - 2:OOpm 
Tu, W, F 8:30am - 6:OOpm 

Time Insurance 
Praesidiurn Plans 

CticJosiiig tlir right healrhcarr 
protcrtian for- you and your 
trrrplnycrs is ctiallrii~tig, ‘I‘irnc 
Iiisurilncr Company has 
rewntly ititroducrd it5 
I’racsidiiinr Plans dcsigicd for 
small groups of 3-50. I .ike the 
I’rarsidiuin name. wliirh i s  i tw 
Iatin word rncanitig to pmirct 
o r  p a r d ,  ‘T’imr’s Pmrsidium 
Hans prmidr extcnsivr 
inrdical co\.eraqc Tor your 
\.aluablc rrriployrr<. 

‘l’iinr I i a ~  Iwcii  p c w i c t i i q  quality 
scnicr and products siilcc IRYZ. 
\\.hrn you sclrct a ‘ h n c  hcalth 
product you hmre thr ad\-antagc 
01‘ wcr 100 yrars of sourid 
fi~cal maiispcrtiriit. 

( b i t a c t  y i i r  local T i r r i c  
Insiirancr I t*prrwiit;+tivr. ; i l r i l  

I ) A W  thr 7’IPP nn 10 yoiir 
cmployecs. 

For more lnlormatlon contact: 

II of accidental or 
suspected poisoning. 

I M.M.R. 
Cass City 

support all the public 
emergency services that 
assist with keeping Cass 
City a safe community. 

In the event of an emergency Plus tax, title, plates and destination. Rebate included wherl 
ipplicable. **$I ,000.00 down plus tax, title, plates and destine 
ion. 60, 66 or 72 months. Rebate included where applicable 
subject to specific lender qualifications and approval. “Leas 
iayment based on 12, 18, 24, 27, 30, 36,39,42 or 48 month 
as shown) closed end lease, subject to specific lender qualifica 
ions and approval. Customer responsible for 1st payment, sa 
:ujity deposit (monthly payment rounded up to next $50) $C 
S O O ,  $1,000, $1,500, $2,000, down as shown, new plate, desti 
ration, (aquisition fee & 6% sales fax where applicable due a 
felivery) 6% use tax added to monthly payment rebate hcludec 
To get total of lease multiply payment by term. Customer ha 
Iption to purchase at lease end at price determined at leas 
nception. Mileage not to exceed 12,000 miles per year. .15 pe 
nile charge for excess miles. Leasee responsible for excessiv 
Year and tear. Picture may not represent actual vehicle bein1 
;old. This ad is your coupon: Please present for discounts th& 
ire shown above. Sale limited to availability during program pc 
iod. 

Dial 911 11 
r 

S.H. Raythatha, 

Or. Ray 

Total Family Care 

4672 Hill St., Cass City 

NOYUN, M.D. 

6232 Hospital Or. 

NOYUN, M.D. 

6232 Hospital Or. 
Cass City 

(5 17) 872-4733 

Local Rrgirtrrcd Rtpnmtalioc 

P.O. Box 38 
Cass City, MI 48726-iX13.8 

(517) 872-2688 

Newel1 E. Harris II In case of II FRO‘.! T I W  P l l A R M A C l S T  \VI10 KNOWS, 
A N D  KNOWS you. 

6498 Main 
Cass City, Mich. 
51 7-872-2075 

Accidental Poisoning 
Call 

1 -800-POISON 1 

Stop in and pick up 
1 1  your hee infomation 

Cass City 

(5 17) 872-4733 
Reglslered represenlathre 

I1 -- -- I for your home JI IL---- -_ .. . .. I Phone 872-5010 - I I Emergency 1-800-POISON 1 11 
A 
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PANCAKE & 
SAUSAGE 
SUPPER 

Friday, March 21 
5-7 p.m. 

Novesta Church of Christ 
Free Will Offering 

Bible Bowl Team 
~ Sponsored by 

t 

PAGE TEN 

Furniture Repair 
Woodworking 

Fireplace Mantels 
0 Reproduction Design 

CALL 872-2010 TO PLACE AN ACTION AD 

sales. In-home service. 
Credit cards accepted, Call 

anytime- 
673-4850 Or 800-745-485 1 

8-9-25-tf 
send $10.00 for a booklet 

& tape to: 

Magnetic Health & 
Wellness 

C/O PO. Box 37 
Attica, MI 48412-0037 

I n , z l l s s  2-3-19-2 

tion 11:oo a.m.-April6. Can 
sign now at St. John's Horse 
Auction. 5 17-838-2300. 

2-3- 19-2 

FOR SALE - 40 4" Vibra 
Shank teeth $ 5 0 3  O n e  
3 0 . 5 ~ 3 2  tire and tube, 2 

High School parents. Don't SALT FREE iron condition- 

ycarbook now while supplies 32,000 grain, $700. In-home 
service on all brands. Credit last. Senior parents: i t  still is 
cards accepted. Call Paul's not too late to rccogniLc your 

senior with a special senior ad. Pump Repair, 673-4850 or 

forget to Order your 1996-97 and water softeners, 

l a t e r  than March 21 ' 800-745-485 1 for free analy- 
5-3- 19- I 8-9-25-tf sis. 

*EXTERIORS 
*WOOD GRAINING 

*TEXTURING 

(517) 872-3840 
- 8- 1 1 -27-tf 

John's Small 
Engine Repair 
ALL MAKES & MODELS 

6426 Cass City Rd. 
Cass City, Mich. 

Across from stockyard 
Cranks haft straightening 

available 
Reasonable Rates 

Mom-Fri. 4 - 9 p.m. 
Sat. 9 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

872-3866 8-6-22-tf 

REPAIRING KIRBY Vacu- 
ums - since 1977. Repair any 

Ross Kraft 
Cass City,Mich. 

Pump Sales 
& Service 

.. 
All Brands 

7 17 1 Severance Rd. 
Cass Citv 

961 N. VanOyke Rd., Bid Axe 
Phone 269-9955 1 WINDOW CLEANING 1 

I. 

Cass City Wrecker 
Se r v i ce/ Au t o E I ec t r i c 

Blaine deBeaubien, Prop. 

Specializing in auto 8 truck electrical wiring 
Certified Mechanic 

Tran s 1 t (no n bu s i ness ) rates . 
A0 words or  Icss, $ I  .75 each 
Avertion; additional wards 8 Merchandise 

Notices Services Services Notices General 
Merchandise ) 

.cents each. Three wceks for 
the price of 2-cash rate. Save 
tnoney by enclosing cash wi4h 
mail orders. Rates for display 
want ad on application. 

Hunter Safety KAPPEN TREE 
SERVICE 

Let YOUR tree problem 
be OURS! 

We're insured for your 
protection 

TREES BRUSH 
LIMBS STUMPS 

Call Anytime 
1-800-322-5684 
1-5 17-673-53 13 

8 - 3 - 2 7-t 

Ken Martin 
Electric, Lnc. FISH FOR SALE - Used washer 

and dryer parts for Whirl- 
pool, Kenmore and GE. Mo- 
tors, pumps, timers, trans- 
missions, and many other 
parts. Dan Gyomory, 6772 
Pine End, Cass City,MI 
48726. 5 17-872-201 3. 

2-3-5-3 

FIREWOOD - Ash - Maple, 
seasoned. $40 a face cord. 
872-35 15. 2-3- 19-tf 

SEVERAL NEWER prom 
dresses for sale. Colors and 
sizes vary, reasonable prices. 
Call after 5 p.m., 872-5532 
or 872-2327. 2-3- 12-3 

Cass City Gun Club 
March 20,21 & 22,1997 

Regi$ration: March 20 

Class: 7 - 930 p.m. 
March 21 Class: 

7-10 p.m. 
March 22 Class: 

8 a.m.-1 p.m. 
Cost $5.00 

Must be 12 yrs. old on or 
before March 1 ,  1998. 
Need Social Security 

Number at registration. 
For more information 

call 872-5495 

6 - 7 p.m. 

5-3-5-3 

SUPPER Homes - Farms 
Commercial 

Industrial 
New and rewire 

STATE LICENSED 
Phone 872-4114 

4 180 Hurds Corner Road 
8-8- 1 0-tf 

FOR SALE - Storage barns, 
all sizes, horse barns, dog 
houses, craft items. Will de- 
liver, Call 872-2608. 3rd 
house on Hurds Corner Rd., 
north of M-81. Harold 
Deer ing . 2-2-1 2-tf 

c Automotive > Cass City Gun Club 
March 28 

3:30 - 8:OO p.m. 
Adults $6.00 

Children $3.00 
5-3-19-1 

6 HP ROTO-HOE rear-tine 
tiller with shredder attach- 
ment, well maintained. $300. 

2-3- 12-3 665-2350. 

,FOR SALE - 1982 Mercury 
Station wagon, 302 motor, 
130,000 miles, new tires, de- 
pendable. Asking $1,200. 
Must sell. Call before 3 pm., 
872-3201. 1-3-5-3 

FOR SALE - Scamper tent 
pop-up camper, electric re- 
frigerator, furnace and pres- 
sure water system, tandem 
axle. Excellent condition. 
5 17-872-3692. 2-3- 19- 1 

~~ 

PICTURE WINDOW loo", 
used, $100. Ends open. 872- 
2822. 2-3- 12-2 

AMANA MICROWAVE 
(cookbook included), $100 
and wooden port-a-crib with 
pad and 1 sheet, $30. Call 
before 3 p.m., 872-3201. 

2-3-5-3 

WIVE FOR SALE - 1990 Olds Cut- 
'[ass Ciera SL, V-6, power 
steering, power brakes, 4- 
door, 1 19,000 miles. Asking 
$3,000. 872-261 1 ,  call 
iriorn ings. 1-3- 19-3 

ANTENNA 
INSTALLATION 

SERVICE 
Also Radios, VCRs, 
CBs, Marine Radios, 

Stereos, TVs 
PHONE 872-2696 

Schneeberger 's 
Appliances-TV-Furniture 

*. 

FOR SALE - Refrigerator, 
runs good. Coppertone color, 
asking $50 or best. 
Woodstove, good for garage, 
$35 or best. Cross-country 
skis like new, $35 or best. 
Call any time to leave mes- 
sage, 872-2380. 2-3- 19-3 

Stainmastet 

*Rood removal ' 
Don Dohn 
4394 Maple #3 

Cass City 

POR SALE - 199 I Plymouth 
:Voyager SE, white, loaded, 
45,000 miles. 658-8244. 

1-3- 12-3 

LAMINATE those important 
papers. On the spot service. 
Cass City Chronicle, 6550 
Main. ( 5  17) 872-20 IO. 

5- 12-4-tfn 

No More Difficulty 
S wall0 wing Pills!!! 

No More Painful Shots!!! 

Send $7.00 For More 
Information To: 

VITAM I N S TO DAY 
PO. BOX 37 

ATTICA, MI 4841 2-0037 
(W)23155 

New Image 

Come see our  profes- 
sionals at your local 
Caro office and let us 
help you with your 
Real Estate needs. 
S 17-672-6090. 

3-2-2641 

1995 MERCURY Sable with 
extras. Excellent condition. 
Phone 872-3 101. 1-3- 12-3 

HAY AND STRAW Auction 
at St. John's Horse Auction 
first and third Saturday of 
every month at 1:00 p.m. 

24 Hour 
WRECKER 
SERVICE 

872-2251 day 
872-5606 night 

872-347 1 8-7- 1 0 4  

PAUL'S PUMP REPAIR - 

Spaghetti Dinner & Auction 
April 11 - 5-8:30 p.m. 

Detroit Edison Building 
Doerr Road, Cass City 

1 

498 1 FORD Station Wagon, 
$400. Headboard, shelves 
and mirror for king size wa- 
fer hcd, $ IO. Four tape deck 
stands, $6 each. 872-9964. 

1-3- 12-3 

FOR SALE - 1993 Ford 
Ranger XLT with fiberglass 
Cover. Excellent condition, 
very clean, great gas mile- 
age. Asking $7,995. Garry 
Edzik, 872-4059. 1-3- 12-3 

FOR SALE - 1987 
Oldsmohile Regency 98, 
loaded. 872-3543. 1-3- 12-3 

5 17-838-2300. 2-3-i9-3 

ST. JOHN'S Horse. Auction 
- big tack auction April 4 at 

FOR SALE - 3 bedroom 
house with 2 baths, finished 
basement, fireplace, 2 car at- 
tached garage in Caw City. 
Call 872-3095. 3-3-5-3 

Musical Entertainment every 15 minutes 
Auction - Silent Auction - Drawings 
1997 Dominican Republic MissionsTrip 

Sponsored by: 
Cass City Evangelical Free Church 

For more information contact: 
Deb Otulakowski at 872-5600 

rickets may be purchased in advance 
or at the door. 

ATTENTION CASS CITI 

_ -  - 

< ForRent 1 
4556 Green Rd., Cass City I LEEMORCAN 

872-3976 
SMALL HOUSE for rent - 
Retirees only. Refrigerator, 
stove, newly remodeled. Call 
872-33 15, ask for Opal. 

4-3- 19-tf 
I CASS CITY, MICWGAN 

*INTERIORS 
8-4-13-tfl I You call, we haul 

CASS CITY WRECKER/ 
AUTO ELECTRIC 

AAA Affiliated 
5-8-3 1 - tf FOR E N T -  Cass City Mini 

Storage. Call 872-3917. 
4-3- 13-tf 

houser $25 to fit Int. H, 275 
gallon overheat fuel tank 
with hose and filter $50.5 17- 
872-4895. 2-3- 19- I 

~~ 

1988 THUNDERBIRD - 
looks good, runs good, 
68,000 miles. Asking $4,700 
or best offer. 872-4306 day 
time. 1-3- 19-3 

FOR SALE - Storage trail- 
ers and storage sheds. Call 
872-4540. 2-3- 12-3 

EARN HUNDREDS OF $$$$ 
Usin Far Infrared Tech. 

& dagnetic Health & 
Wellness Products 

Send $10.00 for a booklet & 
tape to: 

Magnetic Health & 
Wellness 

C/O P.O. Box 37 
Attica, MI 4841 2-0037 

2-3- 19-2 U)' 3 I 5 5  

SMALL ONE-bedroom 
apartment for rent. $250 per 
month, plus deposit. Call 
Michele, 872-3434,9-5 p.m. 

4-3- 12-3 

~~ -. 

HUGE SAVINGS on se- 
lected models of Arch Type 
Steel buildings. 25x26, 
30x42, 50x200. Great for 
storage, shops, garages. Easy 
financing available, Call im- 
mediately 1-800-222-6335. 

9 2-3-19-2 

BINGO - Every Sunday at 
St.  Pancratius Hal l ,  S. 
Swger. Cass City. Doors 
open S:O0 p.m.,  games start 
ai S : 3 O .  "No smoking" ef- 
fective May 5. Phone 872- 
54 IO.  Knights of Columbus 
Council No. 8892. 

5-4-24-tf 

Smith 
Refrigeration 

and 
Appliance Repair 

Thomas Roofing 
Serving the area 

for 26 years 
LICENSED 
INSURED 
BONDED 
872-2970 

Cass City 

FOR RENT - furnished one- 
bedroom apartment . All utili- 
ties included. 872-2267. 

4-3- 12-3 
3 0 x 5 0  POLE BARN, 2 pens 
inside. To be moved. 872- 
2063. 2-3-5-3 

~~ 

LARGE. SUNNY one-bed- 
loom apartment. Available in 
E & T building in Marlette. 
Features Berber carpeting, 
ceiling fans, I 1/2 baths, and 
an  open floor plan. Laundry 
tacilitics and courtyard avail- 
able. $500 pcr month, utili- 
ties not included. 1-8 10-549- 
7205. 4-2- 1 9- t f 

All makes and models 

Call 872-3092 
8-3- 15-tf 

' M a k e  i t  a perfect  < Wanted to Buy ] 
FRIDAY FISH FRY 

Irlr*lrrtki~s SUlld BNI. 
$5.95 4-9 p.111. 

FOR SALE - Minolta X-370 
35mm camera with 50 and 
28mm lenses, automatic film 
advance unit, 3 flash unit# 
and bag, $100 or best offer. 
Call 872-5308. 2-3-5-3 

b - 0  I A / P  
WANTED -Aurora H.O. slot 8-3-25-tf cars and tracks, (517) 872- 
379 1 .  6-3-5-3 

Ronold E. Palmer 
Builder 

New buildings, old 
buildings, roojirzg, 
siding, pole barns 

NO JOB TOO BIG OR 
TOO SMALL 

2805 Crawford Rd. 
Cass City, Mich. 48726 

(5 1 7) 872-4780 
8-9-30-tf 

- 
L, i nv i t a t i on !  0 

' Call 872-3579 TUESDAY SI'ECIAI, 
4 - closing 

Liver & Onions 
All Y O U  CUI eat - $4.50 

( ToGive Away ) 
Robert Bliss FOR SALE - 6 days/5 nights 

FloriddCaribbean cruise for 
2. Paid $400, will sell for 
$200. 872-2633. 2-3- 12-3 

FREE - 3 male puppies, 7 
wceks old. Can be outside or 
in.  First shots and worming. 
872-3461, leave message. 

7-3- 12-3 

8 
0 Builder WEARE NOW taking appli- 

cations for 1 and 2 bedroom 
apartments at Northwood 
Heights in Cass City. Rent i!: 
based on income. For rental 
information call (517) 872- 
2369. Equal Housing Oppor- 
tunity. 4- 1-8-tf 

Sclcct yc N I  rs from 
Kcgcncy's finc Licensed & Insured 

Replacement Windows 
Vinyl Siding 

New Construction & 
Remodeling 

Homes & Businesses 
8-5-3 1 -tf 

a)llcction of 
\\id d i ng 

Invitations 

COCKATIELS FOR SALE. 
Call 872-4458. 2-3- 12-3 Winter Hours 

Mon.-T'hurs. 1 1-8 p.m 
Fri. & Sat. 11-9 p.m. 

Sunday 9-3 p.m. 

FREE PUPPIES - Call 872- 
4441. 7-3- 19-1 

BEEF FOR SALE 
GRAINFED I Services 

SUGAR CREEK Apart- 
ments - one, 2 and 3-bed- 
room plans with washer/ 
dryer connections. 726- I I66 
sq, ft., starting at $459. 208 
Romain Rd.,  Caro, MI 

4- 1 -8-tf 
48723. 5 17-673-05 15. 

By Quarter, Half or Whole I * *  Certified Master Mechanic 
Computer Alignments 

Computer Balance 
& Rotation 

Front End parts 
Shocks & Struts 

Brakes 
Tun e - ups 

Free Estimates 
All your tire needs from 

wheelbarrows 
to tractors 

See us today 

3oofing Downspout 
siding 

Siding 
872-5082 

* Licensed 62 Insured 
* Guarantecd Work mans hip 
* Frtx Written Estimates 
* Over 20 yrs. Expericnce 
* Call J i m  today 
I l'hank You! 8-3- 19-tf 

ELECTRIC MOTOR and 
power tool repair, 8 a.m.to 
5 p.m. weekdays, 8 a.m. to 
noon Saturdays. John Blair, 
1/8 mile west of M-53 on 
Sebewaing Road. Phone 
269-7909. 8- 12- 13-tf 

Delivered 
to any 

laughterhouse 

--. --- 
Sdkouet te  ditnouscne Sehdlcu, 

Whatever the Occmion.., 
Leave the Driving To Us! 

Weddings Proms 
Concerts Sporting Events 
Airport Runs A Night Out 

WALLY LAMING, OWNER 
4276 Ale St,, Cass City 

5 17-872-1 290 
8-10-23-tl 

4 p  Cass City Chroniclc 
RON PATERA 

872-4076 
WANTED - farmland to rent 
for the 1997 season. Call 

I 872-2010 

5 17-672-6220 or 5 17-883- 
9529. 4-3-5-3 

Action Guide Find the Service or Product 
You Need in This. . . . Notices Interior & Exterior 

Painting EE. Franzel 
Well Drilling 

2" to St wells 
drilled & repaired 

REWARD!! Have you seen 
me? German Shepherd/ 
Wolf, black w/golden brown 
legs, wearing a red collar, 
energetic and friendly. Prob- 
ably hungry. Name is 
Pupper. Lost by Englehart, 
Kelly and Cemetery Rd., 2- 
3 miles south of Cass City. 
Please call 872-4381, ext. 
1432#. 5-3- 19-3 

SERVICE DIRECTORY Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 

5- 12- 1 8-tl 

APPLIANCE 

FULL LINE OF MAGIC CHEF 
KITCHEN AND LAUNDRV Systems &Waxing 

Gravel Guards 
Running Boards 

CALL US TODAY Phone 269-9585 
Rock Ute Stone Chip Protection 

027 Van Dyke, Bad Axe 

WHAT WE SELL 

Fuelgas 
Division of Thermoaas 

BINGO - Every Wednesday 
night. Open 6:W-early bird 
630 - regular bingo 7:OO. 
Post 3644 VFW, Weaver St. 

5-2-26- t f 

shampoo, etc.? Will ship 
Parcel Post. Call 269-7562 
or 479-6543 evenings. Kirby 
of Bad Axe, 1051 East Hu- 
ron, across from the Franklin 
Inn. 8-3- 12- 16 

LUNCH 
SPECIALS 

Tu e s d a y 

Spaghetti 
All You Can Eat  

Ray Armstead and Co. 
Complete Tax and 

Accounting Services 
Mon.-Fri. 8:30 a.m. - 530 p.m. 

Sat. 9:00 a.m. - 1:00 p.m. 
Eve n i n g a p p o i n t m e n t s ava i I ab I e 

6545 Church St., Cass City, Michigan 
Ph: 51 7-872-4532 Fax: 51 7-872-51 40 

VFW HALL available for 
rental occasions. Call Jim 
Ceranski at 872-435 I .  

5-2-2 1 -tf 
RED HAWK Tree Service - 
Trimming and removal of all 
trees. Quality workmanship, 
reasonable rates, free esti- 
mates. Call John, ( 5  8-3- 17) 12-52 872- 
9804. 

1 I 

I DAN'S POWER & STOVE I SUPREME 
WINDOW CLEANING 

Friday 
All Yuu Can Eat 

Fish SOMMERS RESTAURANT 
is now serving Broasted 
Chicken again. You don't 
have to lift a finger (except 
to dial 872-3577).,.Quick as 
a wink, all the luscious 
Broasted Chicken your fam- 
ily can eat will be ready for 
you. 5-3- 12-3 

. ( 1  AUTOSERVICE 1 1  Fireplaces, Stoves, Chimneys 
Chimney Sweeping & Repairs 

Gas, Wood Fireplaces, 
Stoves & Fireplace Inserts 

Sales & Service 
6509 Main, Cass City 

Phone 872-3190 

Storms - Screens - Windows 
Janitorial Service Floors 
Eaves & Gutters Cleaned 
Hi-Riser Service & Rental 

Estimates on Commercial, 
Residential & Industrial Work 

Complete Insurance Coverage 
Security Services Available 

Sunday 
All Yoir Can Eat  

Broasted Chicken 
ACE QLASS 

of CASS CITY 
Auto Glass 

Commercial Glass 
Replacement Windows 

New Windows 
WE INSTALL 

Glass & Vinyl Florida 
Rooms 

Vinyl Siding 
51 7-872-2822 

Phone 872-2251 
6597 Main, Cass City FLOWERS - BREAKFAST SPECIAL 

$1,99 
ALL DAY LONG 

HOURS: 
Mon.-Thur. 7 a.m.-7 p.m. 

Fri. 7 a .rn .4  p.m. 
Sat. 7 a.m.-7 p.m. 
Sun. 9 a.m.-4 p.m. 

1 120 Gratiot, Saginaw 
Call 790-7609 

~ 

NOTICE - Dwaine's Barber 
Shop will be closed from the 
21st of March until the 28th 
of March. New starting hours 
for the summer starting on 
the 28th will be 7:30. 

5-3- 12-2 

To Place An Ad 
Tire repair in The 

Action Guide - Alignments Mufflers Sandy Tierney, Owner 

Phone 872-5303 
6476 Main St., Cass City, MI 48726 

Brakes *Oil Changes 
Cerhlied Mechanic 
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CALL 872-2010 .TO PUCE AN ACTION AD:\ 
*"**LAND CONTRACTS***** 
If you're receiving payments 
on a Land Contract, GETA 
BETTER CASH PRICE IN 
ONE DAY. Argo Realty (810) 
569-1 367-2746. 200, Toll-Free 1-800- 

( Help Wanted ) < Help Wanted 3 HAIR SALON - Hiring a NAIL 
TECHNICIAN and HAIR 
STYLIST for full service Aveda 
Salon at Grand Hotel on 
Mackinac Island. Must be 
licensed. Employment mid- 
May until late October. 
Housing available. Mail your 
inquirylresume to: Grand 
Hotel, Attn: Human Re- 
sources, 21 77 Commons 
Parkway, Okemos, MI 48864 
or fax: (517) 349-5504. EOE, 
MIF. 

Services Services Services Services 
RESIDENTIAL TECHNI- 
CIANS - Full time and part 
time - - provides daily living 
assistance and residential 
programming for 4 to 6 de- 
vel opme n t al l y d i s abled 
adults. These positions will 
be located at Pineland, which 
is a residential facility oper- 
ated directly by Tuscola 
County Community Mental 
HealthAuthority. Deadline is 
March 26, 1997. Submit let- 
ter application, resume to: 
Daniel Bristol, Director, Di- 
vision of Services for the 
Developmentally Disabled, 
P.O. Box 239, Caro, MI 
48723. E.O.E. 11-3-19-1 

Reasonable Auto WANTED - Baby-sitter in 
my home in Deford. Call 
872-5525. 1 1-3- 19-3 

f Work Wanted > 
~- 

MIKA'S CUSTOM 
MOLDINGS 
Hardwood Molding 

Furniture Repair 
Woodworking 

Reproduction Design 
Fireplace Mantels 

Repair Rates Francis Builders 
New Homes or 

Remodeling , Roofing, 
Siding, Barns, Pole 

Buildings 
Licensed and Insured 
Phone 872-2921 

or 872-4696 
8-2-26-tf 

Satellite Repair 
& Thing 
All makes 

arid models 
Call 

872-4469 
8-2- 1 2 4  

Guar an teed Satisfaction 
Complete Auto Service 

CALL 
(517) 872-4528 

Lone Automotive 
7716 Deckerville Rd. 

Deford, MI 48729 
8-3-5-' 

CAN'T AFFORD THEHOME 
YOU NEED? Get MORE 
home for your money with min- 
imal downpayment. Complete 
financing if available. De- 
Geor e Home Alliance, 1-800- 
343- 9 884. 

WILL DO educational day- 
care starting June 9. All ages 
welcome. Experienced with 
special needs. 872- 1834, ask 
for Dawn. 12-3- 19-3 

4556 Green Rd., Cass City 
872-3976 

8-4-1 3-t 

~ 

WORK WANTED - Certi- 
fied teacher will tutor all sub- 
jects in evenings. 872- 1834, 
ask for Dawn. 12-3-19-3 

DIABETIC? Insulin depen- 
dent? Save money on sup- 
plies. We bill insurances for 
you. Call! Medical Equipment 
Centers, Inc., a Michigan- 
based company. Toll-free 1- 
888-732-1 227. 

AFFORDABLE LIFE INSUR- 
ANCE. Protect Your Family's 
Future! Call Now for a FREE 
rate quote. Spica Capital 
Group Inc. 1-888-331 -8700 
ext. 710. 

Simpson Excavating 
Dozer landscaping - All 
types of backhoe work 

House demolition & removal 
Footings - Waterlines .. 

Complete septic systems 
Sand - Gravel - Topsoil 

Variety of t i l l  - 
Any size fill job 
FrccEstimates 
872-4502 

8- 1-23-11 

NEED YOUR house 
cleaned'? Call Nancy 872- 
3754. 12-3-5-3 Real Estate For Sale I L O T T E R Y  W I N N E R S !  

Annuity Holders! Don't wait 
years for payments. Instant 
lump cash available in all 
states! Many transactions 
structured tax free! Can 
Pros erity Partners, 1-800- 
435b48  ext. 506. 

ATTENT ION BUS1 N ESSES: 
Internet Advertising Reaches 
Millions. Call for Free INFO. 1- 
800-844-9639 ext. 0937. 

C.E.N,A.'s NEEDED. Good 
benefits and comparable 
wages. Please apply at 
Tendercare, 4782 Hospital 
Drive, Cass City, MI 48726. 
5 17-872-2 174. E.O.E. 

11-3-19-1 

WORK WANTED - Mother 
of one will baby-sit in my 
loving, non-smoking home. 
Call 872-3657. 12-3- 12-3 WEIGHTLIFTING EQUIP- 

MENT FACTORY DIRECT. 
Huge savings on Home Gyms, 
Smith Workout Centers, Leg 
Presses, much more. Gym 
quality. US. made. Free color 
brochure. Performance Fit- 
ness 1-800-299-8650. 

~ 

WILL DO Baby-sitting in 
my home. Have lots of ex- 
perience and references. 
Call 872-4659, 
DF790054909. 12-3- 12-3 

COMPLETE DOG kennel- 
ing, starting at $6 a day. Call 
658-2332. 8-9-4- tf 

HOTTESTBIZ INUSA - CD 
Rom software manufacturer 
seeks distributor! Family, chil- 
dren's educational and busi- 
ness lines. $100K potential. 
No selling! Terrific fund-raiser! 
Investment required! 1-800- 

COASTAL NORTH CAROLI- 

201 -5889. 

NA. Free list of waterfront bar- 
gains. Acrea e and homesites 
as low as $17,900. Coastal 
Marketing & Development, 
New Bern, NC. 1-800-566- 
LAND. 

RN AND LPN positions 
available. Good benefits and 
competitive wages. Apply at 
Tendercare. 4782 Hospital 
Drive, Cass City, MI 48726. 

11-3-19-1 
5 17-872-2 174. E.O.E. 

WILL HOUSE clean. Flex- 
ible hours, reliable, good 
worker. Call 872-4374. 

12-2-26-9 

(Card of Thanks 3 

GRAND HOTEL, MACKINAC 
ISLAND. Seasonal positions 
available. Employment from 
mid-May through late October. 
Housing available. Hiring bar- 
tenders, wait staff, wine stew- 
ards, cooks, kitchen steward, 
front office staff, seamstress, 
housekeepers, housekeeping 
supervisors, nail technicians, 
hair stylists, grounds/ arden- 

guards, recreation attendants, 
bicycle mechanic, bell staff 
and many more, Mail your 
inquirylresume to: Grand 
hotel, Attn: Human Re- 
sources, 21 77 Commons 
Parkway, Okemos, MI 48864 
or fax: (517) 349-5504. EOE, 
M/F, 

ers, golf course sta !f , life- 

GIVE US A CALL! 
WANTED - mature, respon- 
sible sitter for 2 boys, after 
school plus summer vaca- 
tion. Mondays thru Fridays. 
Must have reliable refer- 
ences. Please call (5 17) 872- 
3503 after 6 p.m. I 1-3- 19-3 

I WOULD LIKE to thank all 
those who remembered me 
on my lOlst birthday. I ap- 
preciated every card and gift. 
Vern McConnell. 13-3- 19- 1 

Gas & Oil Furnaces 
All Gas Appliances 

HEATING 

COOLING 
SPECIALIST 

Paul L. 
Brown 

and 

Owner 
State Licensed 

24 Hour Emergency 
Service 

CALL 51 7-072-2734 
8-3-30-tl 

2ND CHANCE MORTGAGEl 
NO APPLICATION FEES, 
Poor Credit, Bankrupt, Fore- 
closure, ok! Pay off Taxes, 
Land Contracts, Credit Cards, 
Medical Bills, or do Home 
Improvements - FAST APP- 
ROVALS - TAMERMORT- 
GAGE CO. -1-800-285-5284. 

WANTED - Summer help, 
cook, etc. D & J Dairy, Cass 
City. Call 872-3107. leave 
name and phonc number. 

I 1-3- 19-4 

3 Bedroom Home - Very neat neutral color This b V d Y  Ranch *S Rmdy to Move In - Large 
family room, patio doors leading to multi-level deck, 

kitchen and bath* New garage. large landscaped backyard. New carpet, E R  , L.R. 
CCT- 156 and hall. Huge master bedroom, newer oak cabinets 

kitchen. All newer Andersen windows, privacy fence 
I 112 car garage. Finished basement, full bath down 7 plus I bedroom and rec room or family room. Plus 
much more. A must see. CCT- 155 

All Updated -Windows, doors, kitchen car- 
pet, wiring, furnace, heater - water, central 

garage, new. UB-044 Full basement. Oak trim. Natural gas.. $67,500. 

~ 

BABY-SITTER needed. 
Odd overnight hours, 5-6 
days a week. Call Sue after 
5:30, 872-3273. 11-3-19-3 

AN INVESTMENT CO. pays 
top dollar for LAND CON- 

TURED SETTLEMENTS 81 
ANNUITIES. Sell Direct. 1- 
800-6.71-1717 8am-9pm 7 
days. 

TRACTS, MTGS., STRUC- 

OTR - One year + experience, 
up to 30 cents per mile, week- 
ly pay, insurance furnished, 
401 k. Assigned tractors. CDL 
" A  wlHAZMAT required. Call 
Landair Transport, Inc., 1-800- 
788-7357. 

HOMEOWNERS LOANS! 
"Borrow up to 25% more than 
your home is worth!" 
Consolidate bills! Home 
Improvements! No Application 
Fee! Apply By Phone. SAM- 

1668. 
BOY FINANCIAL: 1-800-691- 

Full Timepart Time 
Flexible Schedule 

Easy Work, 
No Experience 

Earn $300-$600 weekly, 
at home, guaranteed. 

Call M-F 8- IO Central time 

ext. 1127H9 
I(S04) 64 1-7778, 

11-3-5-L 

( Help Wanted ) 
TAN AT HOME. Wolff Sun 
Beds. Buy local factory direct 
and save. Lamps-Lotions- 
Accessories. Financing avail- 
able. Free color catalog. Call 
today for FREE shipping. 1- 
800-325-4294. 

STEEL BUILDINGS: Sale: 
30x40~10, $4,361 ; 40~60x14, 
$7,992; 50x75~14, $11,627; 
50x1 00x1 6, $1 551 5; 60x 
100x1 6, $17,615; Mini-storage 
buildings, 30x100, 20 units, 
$9,692. Free brochures. 
Sentinel Buildings, 1-800-327- 
0790, Extension 79. 

IF INTERESTED in full- 
time, 9-5, child care position 
for 2 children, please submit 
a hand-written resume with 
references to P.O. Box 135, 
Cass City, MI 48726. 

I 1-3- 19-4 

CASH NOW!.! We purchase 
mortgages, annuities, and 
business notes. Since 1984 
highest prices paid. Free esti- 
mates, prompt professional 
senrice. Colonial Financial 1- 
800-969-1 200 ext. 57. DRIVER EXPERIENCED/ 

INEXPERIENCED. $2,COq 
si n-on bonus, $.22 to 
$.!l/rnile to start a id  full bend 
efits after 30 days. Call Gainey 
Transportation Services: 1- 
800-326-8889. 

HOMES NEEDED! DO YOU HAVE DIABETES? 
Get your supplies at no cost to 
you? Call Rainbow Foundation 
Toll-free 24 hours 1-888429- 
1025. (Medicare & private 
insurance accepted.) 

FOR SALE 
If you're thinking of selling - now is the time to put your home on the market. 

Call Kellv & Co. For A Free Market Analysis 
Very neat one story home with new carpeting. Newly deco- 
rated - glassed in porches - basement - extra large garage - 
corner lot. $55,000.00. 

1 lot for sale in Hills & Dales Subdivision, 112Ix175' - 
excellent location. 
RANCHTYPE HOME with 3 bedrooms - natural gas heat 
- central air; wall to wall carpeting; Laundry on 1st floor; 
new thermo-pane windows, garage attached. Very neat in 
and out. Priced to sell. $75,000.00 Bank Terms 
CONDO - Best Buy!!! 
1200 square feet - full basement - Open and airy living 
room with stone fireplace; bay windows; cathedral ceiling 
- 2-4 piece bathrooms; laundry room off kitchen - 2 pan- 
tries; built ins - high efficiency natural gas heating system; 
water softener - large bedrooms; many other features; priced 
to sell immediately for $89,500. Please call for an ap- 
pointment by calling B.A. CALKA, REALTOR, 872-3355 
or 872-3230. 
PLUMBING & HEATING BUSINESS - comes with real 
estate, fixtures, and all stock. Due to illness, forced to sell 
at $22,500. 

Call 

DRIVERS - SOLOKEAMSl 
O W N E R  O P E R A T O R S ,  
TEAMS - $loOK+, $2K sign- 
on! Trainers $70K+! Top 
Owner Operator program. 
Conven tionalslcoast- to-coast! 
Bonuses, benefits. Covenant 
Transport (experienced) 1 - 
graduates) 1-800-338-6428, 
xt. SB-28. Weekend re- 

crui ters. 

800-441-4394, Ext. SB-28, 

L 

EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR 
Newspaper Association. 
As our current CEO app 
roaches retirement, the 
Michigan Press Association 
seeks a newspaper profes- 
sional to serve as executive 
director, providing leader- 
ship for 51 dailies and 238 
weeklies and 70 associate 
members. The Executive 
Director serves under a 
board of 15 directors and 
has a staff of 8. Respon- 
sibilities include central 
office management, finan- 
cial operations, legislative 
work, convention, contests, 
publications and advertising 
sales. Newspaper experi- 
ence preferred, trade asso- 
ciation experience is help- 
ful. Send letter of applica- 
tion, resume and salary his- 

.tory to: Michigan Press 
Association Search Comm- 
ittee, David Jackson, chair- 
man, P.O. Box 160, Mason, 
MI 48854 by APRIL I O ,  
1997. All applicants will be 
sent a questionnaire to be 
returned by April 22, 1997. 

FRONT SALE. Beautifully 
wooded, dock approved parcel 
wllong frontage on spectacular 
50,000 acre recreation lake in 
So. Carolina - next to 18 hole 
cham pions hip golf course. 
Fish, boat, golf year round in 
our fantastic climate! Paved 
roads, ulg utils, much more! 
Financing available. Call 1 - 

SO. CAROLlNA WATER- 

800-704-3154. TLE 

Owner Wants This sold - Open to an offer. Very nice 4 
bedroom, 2 1/2 baths, den, family room, gas log fireplace. 
Large backyard. 3 car garage. Call today. TCC 1167 

Ideal Home for the Couple Starting Out - Very nice 3 bedroom home set on 
a corner lot. Newly decorated throughout, open kitchen and living rmm Full 
basement, newer shingles, easy to heat. I car garage. Take a look. TCC1201 LUMP SUM CASH NOW! We 

buy your insurance settlement, 
annuity, mortgage notes or lot- 
tery winnings payments for 
CASH! Quick closing. 1-800- 
338-5815 ext. 200. 

WOLFF TANNING BEDS. Tan 
at home! Buy direct and SAVE. 
CommerciaVHome units from 
$199. Low Monthly Payments! 
Call today for FREE Color 
Catalog 1-800-842-1 31 0. 
$$CASH$$ Immediate $$ for 
structured settlements and 
deferred insurance claims. 
J.G. Wentworth 1-800-386- 
3582. 

B.A. Calka, Realtor 
6306 W. Main St., Cass City, Michigan 48726 

,- . . . . . I . 

Fantastic Year 'Round Home on Sanford Lake - 3,000 
sq. feet of living space. Sun room, wrapping deck, huge 
family room, fireplace. wet bar, vaulted ceiling, 3 bedrooms, 
2 baths. 2 car garage. Much, much more. Cy2029 

Southeast of Cass City Very nice ranch h o w  on just over an acre. 3 bedrooms. large 
living room, breezeway entry. I In car garage plus a pole barn $52..500. Cy2022 
The Ideal Ranch - Only I mile from town on I acre. 3 bedrooms, I 112 baths, 1st floor 
laundry, gas log fireplace. Full high basement. 2 car garage. Call today. Cy20 19 
Sct in Bad Axe on a h r g e  Lot -This ranch features 3 bedrooms. I In baths, natural gas 
heat and central air. New roof in 1996. 2 car garage. TOS I2 
Price Reducd ~ Owner wants an offer. 2 story home set on a I34'x 192' coner lot. 3 
bedrooms, main floor laundry, natural gas heat. $22.900. M5 I3 
R.i  Reduced - Very lovely ranch home in a super location. h g e  kitchen. 2 bedrooms. 
gas log fireplace, hardwood floors, knotty pine breezeway. Very nice fenced in yard. Call 
today. TCC I I99 
Town Living with a Country View - Look out o v u  the golf course and counyside from 
the deck in the summer or the sun room in the wtnter. 3 bedroom ranch home with full 
finished walk-out lower lever. Not a drive by home. TCC I I90 
North Branch Area - Beautiful new Cape Cod on 3 IR acres. Over 2,000 sq feet with a 
full basement. 3 bedrooms. 2 112 baths, country porch plus a large deck 2 car garage and 
a 1 4 x 2 0  storage s h e d  Cy2033 
Set on Paved Road Between Cas City & Caro - Very nice wooded setting. this ranch 
features 3 bedrooms, 2 baths. huge living room with sliding doors to a patio area I car 
garage plus a 24'x30 pole barn with cement floor and clecuic. Cy2034 
Super LocPtion - Block building on a corner lot. Zoned General Business. Ideal location 
for your business. COM974 
Zoned Omcc Serviccs - Very nice brick and block building set on a 1.72'~ 1.72' lor. Building 
in good shape. COM95 I 
160 Acre Farm - Very nice 2 bedroom ranch home built in 199 I .  Full f in ished basement. 
32'xBo'garage. I7 acres of woods and the rest is  tillable - til&. F7 14 
BeautifuUy Remodeled 2 Story Home - 3 tdrooms. 2 baths, formal dining, family rooin 
Sewing & Laundry room. back entry off kitchen. 30x30 garage with everything, great 
location. $74.900 Cy 202 I 
New on the Market - Very nice I 112 story home set on a comer lot. 3 bedrooms. I 112 
baths. enclosed porch, deck. fenced yard. full basement. I In car garage. TCC I203 
This is Not a Drive-by - Very nice ranch horn with large living room. 2 large bxlrooms, 
nice deck. 2 car garage. Very neat and clean home. Take a look f47.5W. Cy2032 

Telephone (517) 872-3355 7-7-1 9-1 
Just Broke In - Over 3,000 sq. ft. of living space plus mud room, 
over-sized garage and carport. This home was custom built in 
1995. Central air, underground sprinkler system, 3 large bedrooms, 
master suite with spa tub, walk-in closets, 2 112 bathrooms, coun- 
try kitchen with built-in snack bar and desk, formal dining room. 
Heated sunroom plus lots more. Call for more details. 
The Ideal Home - Located only I mile from town on 1 acre. Beautiful ranch home with 3 
Mooms, I In baths, I st f loor laundry, gas log fireplace. sliding doors to a cement patio. 
Full high basement, 2 car plus attached garage. Blacktopcircledrive. Cy 2019 
English M o r  with Possible Income - 4 bedroom brick home with fireplace. hardwood 
floors. Full high basement, enclosed porch, plus a one bedroom home to be rented for 
income. TCC I192 
Owner Has Relocated so this home is available to move right in. All set up in Huntsville 
Park. 1993 14x70 with 3 Mmxns, open kitokn and living room. Storage sM. MH67I 
New on the Market - Beautiful view i u ~ I  lots of wildlife come with this 4 bedroom. brick 
home set on a lake with IO acres. Sun room, full basement, garage and pole barn. F7 I5 

EACH WITH ITS OWN SPECIAL FEATURES. IDEAL FOR THE RETIRED 
COUPLETHAT'S ON THE GO. CALL US AND LET US TELL YOU ABOUT THE 
ONES THAT ARE AVAILABLE 
New on the Market - Just south of Cass City. 2OxWcement black building. Ideal work- 
shop, garage orjust extra storage space. $14.900. COM989 
Nice Ranch Home set oursick the village limits. 3 bedtooms, basement, gas heat. I IL? car 
garage plus a 3Ox36'pole bam. Call today $84,900. TCC I 195 
Beautiful Home Set on 1 3/4 Acres - Over 3,oOO square feet with large master suite. 2 
fireplaces. family room, den, music room. 2 112 baths. 2 car garage, blacktop driveway. 
TCCI 1x5 
Owners Relocating - Only I 112 miles from town on blacktop road. Very nice 2 story 
home with lots of newer items Set on 4 acres and comes with a26'x.72' garage. 2-story 
workshop garage and a barn Take a look. Cy2008 
New on the Market - Lovely ranch home on a 314 acre lot in town 3 bedrooms. 2 baths, 
full basement. 2 car gwage. Beautiful yard with trees and shrubs. TCC I200 
Price Reduced - Move in day of closing. 2 story home set in town on a comer lot. 3.4 
bedrooms. large kitckn, nice entry rwm between kitchen anrl attached 2 car garage. Owners 
need to settle estate. TCC I 194 
New on the Market + Very unique 3 story brick home loaded with oak woodwork and 
hardwood floors. 5-7 bedruoms, 2 ID baths, formal dining, library, sun porch, deck. Much, 
much mow TCC I202 

-BEAUTIFUL 2 BEDROOM CONDOS, 

Call Cass City 51 7-872-2248 
or Car0 51 7-673-2555 
Kelly W. Smith, Broker 

Farm Commercial Residential 
Listinas Wanted 

I c + c  - 

New Image 

owned and operated 
I Each ofJice independently 

NEED MONEY? Homeown- 
ers, We have the right loan for 
you!! Speedy service Quick 
closings. Slow credit OK. Take 
cash out for ANY worthwhile 
purpose. Call Mortgage 
America today! 1-800-334- 
7038. 

Y 

1023 East Caro Road 
Caro, MI 48723 

Office: 517-672-6090 
Jane Wilkinson Elizabeth Howard 

517-872-4560 - 517-868-9863 BUILDERS L I C E N S E  
COURSE. Money back guar- 
anteed you will pass the 
Michigan builders license 
exam. $95 inctudes complete 
course materials. Prepare now 
for next exam. Information: 1- 
800-541-1 030. 

- . .  fi m Rig0 Vega - 51 7-874-5987 
MAIN ST. - 3 bedroom bungalow, with full basement. 
Light & airy living room with bow window and shiny 
hardwood floors. Home warranty included. $54,900. 
Call Liz 517-872-4560 
HOBBY FARM - 15 acres, out-buildings, plus a 4 bed- 
room ranch with over 2,000 sq. ft. living space. All this 
for $312,000. Call Liz 517-872-4560 
IF GOLF IS YOUR BAG - live minutes away from 2 golf 
courses. For $92,900 you can own this 2 bedroom, 2 1 /2  
bath condo on the hill with walk-out basement. Call Liz 

SEVENTH ST. - Vacant 6 full lots and 2 partial lots in 
Cass City. Nice location. Offer $15,000. Call Rigo Vega 

C A R 0  SCHOOLS - nice 1 acre country location with 2 
sheds, 3 bedrooms, newer wiring, roof, furnace, ac, win- 
dows, siding and insulation. All this for $55,000. Call 
lane-517-868-9863 

517-872-4560 

517-874-5987 

DIABETICS. Save Money On 
Supplies. Medicare pa s if you 
use insulin, we bill r or ou. 
Mention 271012. 1-800-i33- 
2001 * 

DOCTOR BUYS LAND CPN- 
TRACTS and loans money on 
real estate. Fast closing. 
Immediate cash. Deal directly 
with Doctor Daniels & Son, 1- 

61 66. 
800-837-6166, 1 4 1  0-335- 

SOUTHERN COLORADO. 
Ride off into the sunset! 70 AC 
- $39,900. Beautifully rolling 
landscape wlsbectacular 
views of the Rockies. Loaded 
wltrophy deer, elk, turkey. Just 
minutes to lakes & Nat'l 
Forest. Year-round access, 
tellelec. Excellent financin . 
Call Hatchet Ranch now, (71 E ) 
564-6367. 

PLACE YOUR STATEWIDE 
ADHERE! $239 buys a 25- 
word classified ad offering 
over 1.4 million circulation. 
Contact this newspaper for 
details.. 
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Anderson, Tuckey, 
Bernhardt, Doran & Co., P.C. 

Certified Public Accountants 
Gary Anderson, CPA (Caro) 

Robert Tuckey, CPA (Cass City) 
Jerry Bernhardt, CPA (Caro) 
Thomas Doran, CPA (Caro) 

Valerie Jamieson, CPA (Cass City) 
715 E. Frank St., Caro, MI 

Phone 673-3137 
6261 Church St., Cass City, MI 

i Phone 872-3730 

Established I924 ’ 

Parcel 2-A: Part of the Northwest 114 of 
Section 9, Town I O  Nonh, Range 8 East. 
described as beginning N.O1 degrees 
10’00” w. 1000.20 f e t  along the West 

4452 Doerr Rd 
(across from She//  as Station) 

Phone 872-4241 

ALL PETS 
VETERINARY CLINIC 

P.C. 
~ Susan Hoppe D.V.M. 

4438 S. Seeger St. 
Phone 872-2255 

I 

Seatbelt enforcement debated (again) 
Deadline for submitting items in the calendar is the Fri- 

day noon before publication. 
a ticket solely for  failing to 
wear ‘seatbelts. 

Waymire said other slates 
that have passed standard 
enforccment legislation have 
seen safety belt usc increasc 
by 10 to 15 percent. 

“Thc law IS very screwy on 
this -- they mandate thou- 
sands of dollars of safe’ 
equipment in vehicles, anu 
yet they don’t mandate use 
of i t .  
“We talkcd about that (stan- 

dard enforcement legisla- 
tion) at our last police chiefs 
meeting,” he said,  “and 
there’s no change at all in  our 
support for that. 
“The only problem is, we’re 

not getting any support from 
our local represcntative.” 
Lautner indicated he’s con- 

vinced lcgislators who don’t 
support standard enforce- 
ment are hearing only from 
constituents who don’t want 
t o  be forced t o  wear 
scathelts, not from those who 
are alive because they took 
the time to buckle up. 
Yes, some people have died 

in crashcs despite the use o. 
a seatbelt, Lautner acknowl- 
edged. Still, he said, there’s 
no doubt many more lives are 
saved. “I personally have 
never unbuckled a dead bodv 

save I 00 lives, prevent3,OW 
serious injuries and cut auto 
crash costs by $170 million 
annual I y. 

“Each year, the 70 percent 
of us who do wear safety 
belts are paying that $170 
million i n  higher police, 
medical, rehabilitation, legal 
and insurance costs and lost 
productivity for the 30 per- 
cent of Michigan drivers and 

wear seat belts,” he said. 
“Michigan’s safety belt law 

is the only traffic law on the 
books that does not allow 
standard enforcement. Law 
enforcement officials can is- 
sue a citation to someone 
solely for not turning on 
headlights at dusk; they can 
cite a driver whose only of- 
fense is a burned out tail 
light. But they cannot issue 

Wednesday, March 19 
The Lower Thumb Chapter of the American Diabetes 

Association meet at 7 p.m. in the Marlette Community 
Hospital Auxiliary Room. A video will be shown. 

EVERYONE PAYS 
Friday, March 21 “In response to those who 

contend safety belt use 
should bc an individual de- 
cision, the coalition is sug- 
gesting that we look at who 
is paying for the individual’s 
decision if a crash happens,” 
Waymire continued. “All of 
us bear the burden of a hun- 
dred thousand dollar insur- 
ance claim, not only the 
driver who was tossed from 
a car unnecessarily.” 
The idea that seatbelt use is 

an individual right is a joke, 
commented First Lt. Doug 
Lautner, commander of the 
Michigan State Poliw Post in  
Caro. “It’s against the law; 
you just can’t enforce i t  like 

Alcoholics Anonymous and Al-Anon, Good Shepherd 
Lutheran Church, 8 p.m. 

NOTICE Sunday, March 23 Trio leading resurgent 
Jan Moore’s Community Choir sings at Potter House 

Church on 6th Street, Cass City, I I a.m. 
Tuscola County Humanc Society bake sale, noon to 5:OO 

p.m. in Wal-Mart’s foyer. There will also he a raffle for a 
free stuffed buni:y. 

Cass City hospital 
ANNUAL MEETING 

FOR 

Tuscola County 
Elkland Township 

ing cessation, and for the first 
time in several years, CPR 
training . 

Another focus is on the 
business community, which 
can access a myriad of ser- 
vices, including physicals, 
testing for department of 
transportation requirements 
for truck drivers, on-site 
wellness classes, and reha- 
bil i tat ion. 

Within 6 months, renova- 
tions will begin at the hospi- 
tal to upgrade cardiovascular 
services , which w i I1 el i mi - 
nate the need to transfer 
some heart patients to 
Saginaw or Bay City, 
McKrow said. 
Also planned, she added, is 

a cardiac rehabilitation pro- 
gram at MARC in Caro. The 
program, being established 
in conjunction with the Heart 
Group, Saginaw, and 
Saginaw Gcneral Hospital, 
will mean shorter trips for 
area heart patients. 

Monday, March 24 mistakes occasionally hap- 
pen. 
She acknowledged it’s been 

a challenge for employees to 
adjust to the new approach, 
“but we’ll get it done. It’s 
really turning around 
quickly.” 

“There’s a whole l o t  more 
cnthusiasm for cooperative- 
ness among departments,” 
Anthony agreed. “It’s a 
change for everyone that 
may be a little intimidating 
at first, but everyone seems 
to be doing well with it.” 

Hills and Dales Hospital Auxiliary meeting at Charmont, 

Cass City Women’s Club at Charmont, 6 p.m, 
Cass City School Board meeting, high school, 7:30 p.m. 
Cass City Village Council meeting, 7 p.m., Municipal 

12 noon. 

Building. 

At 
Elkland Township Fire Hall 

MON., MARCH 31 Tuesday, March 25 - J  

out of a car.” every othcr law. 
7 p.m. Annual spring musical at Deford Elementary School, 

“Stone Soup.” Perforniances at 12: I5 p.m. and 7 p.m. Professional and Business I 
D I R E CTO RY Wednesday, March 26 NORMA WALLACE 

Township Clerk Duplicate bridgc resumes, 7 p.m. at Channont. Everyone 
welcome. Last week’s winncrs: John Haire and Bill Dupuis. 

GOOD NEWS 

NOTICE NOTICE McKrow said patient sur- 
veys have been encouraging, 
with positive comments far 
out w e i g h i n g n eg a t i ve on e s . 
“Our admissions arc up, our 
out-patient volurne is up, our 
clinics are growing,” she 
added. 

Rowc said the Michigan 
At hlc t ic and Re hah i I i ta t  i o n  
Center (MARC) rccently had 
its best month ever. with 
therapy offered at the Caro 
facility growing rapidly. In 
addition, she added, Thumb 
Area Home Care, another 
branch of thc Hills and Dalcs 
Health Carc Corporation, 
just experienccd its best 
month in 3 years. 
As for the future, McKrow 

said. “We want to make sure 
we get back to the conimu- 
ni ty.” 

Towards that end, the hos- 
pital is offering classes i n  
first-aid certification, smok- 

DOUGLAS 
PANKRATZ, M.D, 

Board Certified 
Orthopaedic 

Surgery 
“Specializing in 

Joint Replacement, 
Arthr*oscopic 

Surgtvy & 
. Fracture Care 

ANNUAL MEETING 
FOR 

Sanilac County 
Evergreen Township 

ANNUAL MEETING 
FOR 

Tuscola County 
Novesta Township Area residents will have an 

opportunity to offer their in-  
put regarding hospital ser- 
vices in May, when officials 
hope to organize a town hall 
nice ti ng . At 

Township Hall 
~ 

DOYOU HAVE A 
D R I N KING PROBLEM? 

ALCOHOLICS 
ANONYMOUS 

MEETINGS 
AND AL-ANON 

Every Friday Evening - 8 00 p.m 

At 
Township Hall Leading SAT., MARCH 22 4672 Hill Street 

Cass City, MI 48726 
HOURS BY 

APPOINTMENT 

SAT., MARCH 29 producer 
1 p.m. The United States leads the 

world in per capita produc- 
tion of ice cream and related 
products, followed by New 
Zealand, Australia, Sweden 
and Canada. About 10 per- 
cent of all the milk produced 
in the U.S. is made into ice 
cream. 

1 p.m. 
KATHY NEW ELL 

Township Clerk 
872-4651 

I Good Shepherd Lutheran Church 
Cass Citv ARTHURSEVERANCE 

Township Clerk (517) 872-4320 
or 

(517) 269-9551 

I Legal Notices I Physician & Surgeon 
Office Hours: 

Mon.-Fri. - 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Thurs. - Closed 

Sat. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
6232 Hospital Drive 

Cass City 
Off ice 872-4733 
Res. 872-4257 

itiyut(iric B ngerit f o t .  

Tenn B Universal Life 
*Auto . Home 

Business Health 
FINANCIAI, PHOTISC‘TION 

1s OUR BUSINESS 
“We w i l t  io he your c i p v i t ”  

Agents 
Mark Wiese .Jim Ceranski 

68 IS E Cass City Kd 
Caw City, MI 48726 

517-872-4351 
- - - - I _ - - _  

Mortgage Foreclosure Sale Mortgage Foreclosure Sale 

THIS FIRM IS A DEBT COLLECTOR 
ATTEMP’CINGTO COLLECTA DEBT. 
ANY INFORMATION WE OBTAIN 
WILL BE USED FORTHAT PURPOSE. 

THIS FIRM IS A DEBT COLLECTOR 
AT~F,MP’I’ING*I‘C~ COLLECTA DEBT 
ANY INFORMATION WE OBTAIN 
WILL, BE USED FORTHAT PURPOSE 

MORTGAGE SALE - Default has been MORTGAGE SALE - Default has been 
made i n  the conditions of a mortgage 
made by Michael C. MURPHY. a single 
man to FIRST CHICAGO NBD MORT- 
GAGE COMPANY (f/Wa NBD Mort- 
gage Company, a Delaware Corporation). 
Mortgagee, dated October 27th, I993 and 
recorded on October 28th, I993 in Liber 
649, on Page 032, Tuscola County 
Records, Michigan. on which mortgage 
there is claimed to  be due at the date 
hereof the sum of One Hundred Two 
Thousand Three Hundred Twenty-Two 
and 46/100 dollars ($102,322.46), includ- 
ing interest at 7.12% pcr annum. 

Under the power of sale contained in  
said mortgage and the statute in  such caw 
nude and provided, notice is hereby given 
that said mortgage will be foreclosed by 
a sale ofthe mortgaged premises, or some 
part otthem, at public vendue. at the front 
entrance to the Courthouse in theVillage 
of Caro. Tuscola County, Michigan, at 
10:W o’clock a.m. on April 2Sth, 1997. 

Said premises are situated in TOWN- 
S H I P  O F  MILLINGTON. Tuscola 
County, Michigan, and are dcscribed as: 

made by Marcia I,. Martin, an unmarried 
woman (original mortgagors) to UNION 

DIANAPOLIS, Mortgagee, dated March 
5 .  1996 and recorded on March 5 ,  1996 - - - - - - - .- 
in Liber 686. on page 1167, Tuscola 

FEDERAL SAVINGS BANK O F  IN- 

PHY SIC1 ANS SOMMUNITY RURAL 
HEALTH CENTER 

HEALTH CARE 
$50 fee 

Including physician’s fee 
and clinic room 

No appointment necessary 
Open 6 a.m. - 10 p.m. 
HILLS & DALES 

GENERAL HOSPITAL 
872-21 21 

Physician on site 24 hr./day 
for emergency care. 

FOR NON-EMERGENCY HOON K. 
JEUNG, M.D. 

Surgeon 
Specialist in Stomach 
and Bowel Problems 

9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Daily 
Saturday - 9 to 12 noon’ 

Closed Thursday 
6230 Hospital Drive 
Cass City, MI 48726 
Phone 872-461 1 

872-3490 

County Records, Michigan, on which 
mortgage there is claimed to be due at 
the date hereof the sum of Forty One thou- 
sand Three Hundred Forty Eight and 74/ 
100 dollars ($41 -348 74), including inter- 
est at 6.500% per annum Adjustable Rate 
Mortgage. Interest rate may change on 
07/01 of each year. 

Under the power of sale contained in 
said mortgage and the statute in such case 
made and provided, notice is hereby given 
that said mortgage will be foreclosed by 
a sale of the mortgaged premises, or some 
pa~t  of them, at public vendue, at the front 
entrance to the Courthouse in thevillage 
of Caro, Tuscola Caunty, Michigan at 
10.00 AM o’clock, on April 1 I ,  1997. I FAMILYRURAL I ~~~ ~~ 

Chiroma ctor 

Said premises are situated in Township 
of MILLINGTON, Tuscola County, 
Michigan, and arc described as: 

HEALTH CARE 
“We’re here for your 
health care needs“ 

Richard A, Hall, D,O. 
J o b  Zawacki PA-C 

4674 Hill St., Cass City 
Phone 872-4725 

Office Hours: 
Mon.-Fri. 9 a.m.-5 p.m. 

Sat. 9 a.m. + 12 p.m. 
---31--- 

PARCEL C- I Commencing at the East 
114 corner of Section 34, Town 10 North, 
Range 8 East, Running thence North 89 
degrees S 2  minutes 35 seconds West, 
1174.44 feet along the East-West 114 line; 
thence South 18 degrees I 1  minutes SO 
seconds East. 700.28 feet; thence South 
89 degrees 55 minutes 32 seconds East, 
963.07 feet; thence North 0 degrees 37 
minutes 54 seconds West, 664.02 feet 
along the East Section line to the point of 
beginning. Being part of the Southwest 
1/4 of Section 34, Town I O  North, Range 
8 East, EXCEPTING the North 332.01 
feet thereof. 

I 

Section line from the West 1/4 corner of 
Section 9; thence continuing N. 01 de- 
grees 10’00” w, 150.00 feet along said 
West Section line; thence N. 88 degrees 
50’00“ E, 424.30 feet; thence S. 01 de- 
grees 10’00” E. 150.00 feet; thence s. 88 
degrees 50’00” W, 424.30 feet to the point 
of beginning 

S.H. Raythatha, M.D. 

Dr. Ray 
Total Family Care 

The redemption period shall be 6 
month(s) from the date of such sale. un- 

PARCEL C-2 Commencing at the East 
1/4 corner of Section 34, Town I O  North. 
Range 8 East, thence North 89 degrees 
52 minutes 35 secoiidsWest, 1469.36 feet 
along the East-West 1/4 line to the point 
of beginning. Running thence North 89 
degrees 52 minutes 35 seconds West, 
112.64 feet along t k  East-West 114 line; 
thence South 0 degrees 55 minutes 20 
seconds East, 665.43 feet; thence South 
89 degrees 55 minutes 32 seconds East, 
320.70 feet: thence North 18 degrees I 1 
minutes SO seconds West, 700.55 feet to 
the point of beginning. EXCEPTING the 
North 332.71 feer thereof. Being pari of 
the Southeast I/4 of Section 34. Town 10 
North. Range 8 East. 

. .  

Cass City I less determined abandoned in accordance 
with 1948CL 6003241a, in which case I NORTHEASTERN 

FOOT CLINIC 
Dr. Judi Ecker 

Dr.Thomas Bobrowsk 
“YOUR FAMILY FOOT 

CARE CENTER” 
4672 Hill St., Cass City 

072-4327 or 
3532 Center, Essexville 

the redemption period shall be 30 days 
from the date of such sale. Phone 872-501 0 

Office Hours: Mon.-Fri. 8-5 Dated: February 26, 1997 

UNION FEDERAL SAVINGS BANK 
OF INDIANAPOLIS 

Brian C. 
deBeaubien, M.D. 

COMPREHENSIVE 
ORTH 0 PA ED IC 

CARE 
Total Joint Replacement 
Arthroscopic Surgery 
Sports Medicine 
Adult & Pediatric 
Endoscopic Carpal 
Tunnel Release 
Arthritis Care 

Most insurances accepted 

4672 Hill St., Cass City 

1080 S. Van Dyke, Bad Axe 
(5 1 7) 872-4320 

(5 1 7) 269-3002 

FOR lNFOKMATION. PLEASE CALL 
(8 10) 642-4202 
Trott & Trott, P.C. 
Attorneys for UNION FEDERAL SAV- 
INGS BANK OF INDIANAPOLIS, 
30 150 Telegraph 
Suite 100 
Bingham Farms. Mirhigan 48025 
File W702 1067 

2-26-5 

895-8594 I 

Edward Scollon, D.V.M. 
Veterinarian 
Farm and 

Pet Animals 
Phone 872-2935 

4849 N. Seeger St., Cass Cil 

l h e  redemption period shall he 12 
rnonth(s) from the date of such sale 

Dated, March I2th, 1997 
FIRST CHICAGO NBD MORTGAGE 
COMPANY 

FOR INFORMATION, PLEASE CALL 

Trott & Trott. P C  
Attorneys for FIKS‘I’ CHICAGO NBD 
MORTGAGE COMPANY 
30 I 50 Telegraph 
suite loo 
Bingham l-krns. Michigan 48025 

(8 I O )  642-4202 

F l l C  ti 97021453 
3- 12-5 

-’ c - 7 ,  G?& SPECIAL HOURS: [a pJ g’xzameluicaq Mon., 9:30 a.m.-5 Tues.. p.rn.: Wed. 

6 MONTHS 
M A T T R E S S  & FURNITURE CO. 9:30 a.m.4  p.m.: SAME’AS CASH 

51 7-673-8088 

Thurs. & Fri. 

’ Sat, 9:30 a.m.-6 p.m. 
362 N. State St. (M-81), Caro - Next To The Courthouse 



You Den't Have toSo ot 0' Gold on Home R e d r s !  a 

I 

Asbland-Dav is 

Vinyl Sidi S 1'13 C I A 1, 1" JIW 11 A S 13 Rl;inil Blind s 
U rl 

9 9 9  32"~ 29" , 
38"x 

24"x 69" 
30"x 69" 
3 6 3  69" 

29"x 64" 
3IYx 64" 
32"w 64" 

42" x 69" 

48" x 69" 

- Peach - 

Several Colors 
to Chouse From 

$G# 99 60"x69" 

99 66" Y 49" 

Why Pay up tc $7700.00? 

SELF SERVE LUMBER'S PRICES: 

80 54" ~ 6 9 "  $6 99 42" w69" $8.99 
$evdan/ colors to 8boass f tom 

* This is only a smal/ sample of sizes & colors shown, 
Many other sizes & colors in stock at our warehouse. 

bP€Cl!AL PURCHASE 

Whirlpool Tubs 
1 

* I  i 

3 -Picture -Franr-es - ' 

8 x  10 
(43795-43796) 

Harvest 11 
Oak 

Styles 8t Colors vary 
Der Self Serve Lumber location 

$/49 
(43710) 

(43699) 

Prices from 

8 x  70 Sizes 5 x 7 and 
Several Colors !o choose from 



V a n i t y  
Valox Polym 

(41 254-41 265) ’ , 
Why Pay? 

25” x 19” 24” Steel Towel Bar 
31 ’’ x 19” $5+% 

37” x 19” $6945 $3gq5 
49” x 19” $89795 sq4ss 

(Not Exactly as Shown) 

Why Pay $7.95? 

95 
(4331 2) h 

(Bulbs Not Included) 

24”Oak’ .- 

T-eZ 

r 

SOLID OAK’ 
Toilet Paper Holder 

Why Pay 
$6.29? 

I SAVE Why Pay? @e P@ 
on FAUCETS 

#86142 Lavatory Single 
Control with Pop-up (41751) $45;95 

#86180 Kitchen Single 
Control less spray (41752) 

#86181 Kitchen Single 
Control with Spray (41753) $55;95 

_.. - --- . --_ 

SUPER SAVINGS 
on foflat Seats 

#20 Premium Why Pa 
Almond or Rase $18.99? WhyPay? Our Price 

16” Safety Grab Bar m e m e . . m e  

24”Safety Grab Bar ... n e . . .  

32” Safety Grab Bar . . . . . e . .  

48” Safety Grab Bar a . m . . . m .  a447 ...... . . 22.95 

Safety Bath Seat . .....*. W ... ..... 19.95 

16.49 

Safety Tub Rail e m e m m e e m  WQ7 m e e m m m . m  24.95 

Stowaway Bath Seat 
‘4. 

8- A% d6 Why Pay $89.95? 

Mirror Medicine 
Cabinet 

1 6”x 36” 
Why Pay 

Filter m I 

why Pay 
$14.95? 

044% % 

(43506) 

7 Postformed “Time For A New 
L 1 Counter TOPS Counter In The 

Kitchen? EDusrrpEs 
Check Out Our Large Selection!!! 

Hat Panel, Raised Panel, Arch Top, Stmight Top 

Manv SfVkS & SSzes (Selection varies 

rl ‘ 1  * 

Y, 

Dryer 
Vent 

Closure 
BEL 
HEAKrLm 

L- 

Fbatlrq aut00 In rrp 

homwmercqs  Save on heating 
BWhdovmpodlocl & cooling bills 

Easy to install 
p i I h . r e w * W r n I l r  

Keep out weor v m (  prmw 
cold. Mal. rodsna. *IC 

rodents & bugs 
hwn W n w  a y I r  

i V 

Nice selection of o 
4 5 ;tops at ON 

W E  Y 
kitchen cabinets at Wholesale 

I Your Choice of White or several other colors. 

Why Pay $788.00. I 
Uichwood Lite & Rkhwood Lite Caihedr.1- 

in Stock Beautiful Cabinets!!! I Mounting Rim Sold Separatly 



JOINT COMPOUNDS mer 
Redi-Mix Joint Cement 
1 Gallon (01 172). . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

Redi-Mix Joint Co 
3-1 /2 Gallon (27144). . 

Redi-Mix Joint Ce 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

3 1174) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

250 ft. Wallboard Tape (04273)... ... 

Interior 
Why Pay $70.59 to $76.88? 

1 /2 OFF Competitors’ Prices 

6/2 Pint 
(42280-42343) 

SAVE BIG!!! 
Hurry whIIe supplies last! 

llwllDIl 

Why Pay $3*99? 

7 Protect Valuable Woolens Contech 
PL PRO 2000 

- .- Adhesive Sealant 
Brown or Redwood 

2’ Why Pay$3.79? & 
z!l 

from Moth Damage. 
Install a Cedar Closet! 

-‘j (37584,37585) 
&. _- 

48” ULTRA LEVEL 
-(Not Exactly as Shown) 

whypay 1/2 off 
$4gm ’’? SU6GSTED RETAIL!!! 

- - - - J  - - # ‘ 
Suggested Retail 

Your Choice: 5 yellow or Orange 
(35521,35522) 

Why Pay $29.95 or More 

(3361 5) 
gJpER spre 

Avallable at: Atwater St., Grafiot Rd., !Ill\\ I ’ One inch (1”) Doors 
Davison Rd., Wheeler St., Cam & Birch Run locations. 

A 

Whv Pay $18.95? 

(41 788) 

whypay O@ $ Hall/Closet Lever 

Polished Brass 
Sty‘e: Kim $12.95? ... (32043,33909) 

Bed/Bath Lever why pay dfi $ 
Style: Corsair $13m95? 
Polished Brass 

* These are just a few of the different styte /mksets from Weiser we have to offer. 
Hurry in - check out our nice selection of locksets at Everyday Low Prices. 

LE 

’754) Intenor Doors 
Your Choice: emium Woodcore Traditional 

1-1 14’’ Why Pay $195.00 

White 

CHAMSERDOOR c u t l t  w x m  INOUSTR~~ \ IM: Storm Door 

36”x 80” or more? 

24 ”, 28 ”, 30”, 32 ” or 36” m 
Your Choicer 1-3/8” Thick 

24” 10-Lite 
30”, 32’: 36” Why Pay $1 ”1.95? 

I (39525,34792-95) 

Security Door 
The 
Homestead 
I%h4we4 
Interchangeable 
window & screen 
Washable 

lomestead 
3ii&B%l 

Interchangeable 

Washable 
Beautiful 
woodgrain finish 

9 Key lock dead bolt 
hardware for 
added security 
W-4 polypropylene 

window & screen 

Beautiful woodgrain finish . Key lock dead bolt hardware for 
added security 
W-4 polypropylene construction 
for strength and durability 
Features double closures 

1-112” thick 
32” or 36” $ 9 9 9: 

Brown 
or Almond 

construction for strength and durability 
Features double closures 

1-1/2“ thlck 32”or 36” 
Brown or Almond 

(38454-39461) 



f 
i 

1009 E. Huron Ave. 1576 E. Caro Rd. 2825 Davison Rd. 215 S. Pine River 

Mon. - Fri. 7:30-7:30 Mon. - Fri. 7:30-730 Mon. - Fri. 8:30-8:30 Mon. - Fri. 7:30-7:30 Mon. - Fri. 7:30-7:30 Mon. - Fri. 8:OO-8:00 Sat. 7:30-6:30 Sat. 8:30-7:30 Sat. 7:30-6:30 Sat. 7:30-6:30 Sat. 8:OO-7:00 Sun. 
Sat. 7:30-6:30 Sun. 1O:OO-500 Sun. 1O:OO-5:00 Sun. 1O:OO-5:00 ’ Sun. 1O:OO-5:OO Sun. 1O:OO-500 10:00-5:00 

m) White Aluminum Baked enamel finish 

5” K type gutter $ 
IO’ section ( 0 1 8 ~ )  

2”x 3” White Downspout $ 
10’ section (01887) 

= All Necessary Accessories in Stock - 
$ 

KEEP CHILDREN AND 
DEBRIS OUT OF YOUR WINDOW WELLS 

The tough, all-seasons 
WINDOW WELL COVER 

Standard Hardboard 
118’’ 2’x 4’ Plain 

(02 1 68) 

118” 4’x 4’ Plain 
(021 69) 

I 

MAIN BREAKER a: ..& --* 

LOAD CENTERS 
1 inchformat 
1 Phase-3Wire 

24’’ x 70” .............. “/035 Ib 

15 pcs / pkg. 

mq?. &t. 
(Brown. Red, Green) 

- -  

Bay City 686-591 1 Cass City 87241 30 St. Louis 681 -3398 Saginaw 792-4201 

207 E. Vermont St. 
Mon. - Fri. 8:OO-8:OO 
Sat. 7:30-6:30 Sat. 7:30-6:30 
Sun. 1O:OO-5:00 Sun. 1O:OO-5:00 

Birch Run 624-4822 Flint 787-4289 
1 191 0 Maple Rd. 
Mon. - Fri. 8:OO-8:00 
Sat. 8:OO-7:00 Sat. 7:OO-500 
Sun. 1O:OO-5:OO Sun. 1O:OO-500 

6667 N. State Rd. 141 4 Weiss St. 

Sat. 7:30-6:30 Sat. 7:30-6:30 
Sun. 1O:OO-500 Sun. 1O:OO-500 

Saginaw 790-1 575 Saginaw 754-7466 
151 7 S. Wheeler St. 1400 Atwater St. 
Mon. - Fri. 8:OO-8:00 Mon. - Fri. 7:OO-5:OO 
Sat. 8 : O W : O O  Sat. 7:OO-500 
Sun. 10:00%:00 Sun. 10:00-5:00 

Mon. - Fri. 7:30-7:30 Mon. - Fri. 7:30-7:30 6957 E. Cass City Rd. 
Mon. - Fri. 7:30-7:30 

G-5496 N. Saginaw 
Mon. - Fri. 7:OO-5:OO 

1 Sorry, No Rainchecks We reserve the right to limit quantitles to everyone 

Page4 97-1 1 

Brass Thted 
Victorian Vent j 

I 4” x i o ”  or 4” x 12” I 
Why Pay $70.99? i 
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