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BLIND SINCE BIRTH, Nathan Sweet has not let that hold 
him back from being a musician or participating in many other 
activities such as canoeing, fishing and bowling. 

County seeks 3 millages, surcharge 

Voters to decide nomination 
for ‘3 cornrnisioner posts 

City veterinarian-is complet- 
ing his first 2-year term in District One Commissioner 
oftice. James D. Schafer, Republi- 

lenged in the primary, 

For Cass City’s Nathan Sweet 
blind i s  merely a nuisance 

by Rebecca Messer 
Staff Writer 

He sings and plays guitar 
trom his hcart and with pas- 
sion; knows the latest hits 
and loves the applause when 
the song is over, not unlike 
any other musician. 

There is, however, one 
small difference between 
him and fellow musicians. 

He is blind. 
Nathan Sweet, blind since 

birth, can not see the music 
r instrument he is playing. 
At age 4, Sweet’s mom, 

Kathy, observed him taking 
an interest in music. Notic- 
ing that her son was walking 
around the house singing, 
Kathy, who wanted to en- 
courage his interest, bought 
him a few instruments. 
Fourteen years later, Sweet 

is proficient on drums, key- 
mard and electric and acous- 
tic guitar. 

LESSONS 

Sweet, who has lived in 
Cass City most of his life, 

learns all 01 iiis music hy ear 
and touch. When the teen 
first started playing guitar, he 
took a year of lessons to learn 
the chords. Since Sweet 
could not learn chords by 
looking at a music book or 
his instrument, he had to 
memorize everything as he 
was being taught. 

When he hears a song he 
wants to learn, Sweet said he 
breaks the song into 3 areas, 
words, drum beat and 
chords. He added it usually 
takes him a couple of days 
to learn a new song, once he 
sets his mind to it. 

“I usually pick the beat up 
pretty quick. The hardcst 
part sometimes are the words 
and chords, learning the 
chord changes.” 

In  addition to singing and 
playing guitar on his own, 
Sweet sings i n  h i s  high 
school choir and has per- 
formed with the Saginaw 
Orchestra during their 
Christmas program. 

He also wants to start his 
own country band. “I have 
played with friends’ bands 

arid they like to play that 
White Zombie, heavy metal 
stuff. I’ll play that for a while 
but I prefer sticking to my 
country.” 

The Marlette High School 
junior has practically con- 
verted his small bedroom 
into a recording studio. He 
has electric and acoustic gui- 
tars, a keyboard, speakers, 
amplifiers, a mixing board, 
a digital delay processor and, 
of course, a microphone. 

Some of the 18-year-old’s 
favorite musicians are Stone 
Temple Pilots, Pearl Jam, 
Garth Brooks, Elvis, Snoop 
Doggy Dog, Tracey 
Lawrence and Shania 
Tbaine. “I like all kinds, re- 
ally. I like switching around 
to diffcrent kinds, but I 
mostly stick to country.” 

Calling his blindness a 
“nuisance” rather than a dis- 
ability, Sweet refuses to let 
i t  hold him back. “Thcre are 
no obstacles because I alii 
blind .” 
Even walking up and down 

the stairs at school doesn’t 

Stanley May 

bother him. “People ask ‘Is 
i t  scary?’ I say, no not re- 
ally.” 

SCHOOL 

Being blind has not stopped 
Sweet from attending regu- 
lar public schools either, in- 
stead of schools for the blind. 
“I wanted him to be around 
sighted people, not blind 
people all his life, because it 
is a sighted world,” Kathy 
said. 
At school Sweet does have 

special instruments such as a 
trrailler and abacus to enable 
him to learn, but he receives 
no special privileges. “If he’s 
late to class he gets a tardy 
just like anyone else. He 
doesn’t get treated any dif- 
ferently,” Kathy said. 

“All the kids at school are 
just like my family. They 
help me out a lot,” he said. 

Unlike the rest of his class- 
mates, Sweet spends 2 hours 
of his school day working 
with a braille and mobility 

teacher. Wiih his mobility 
teacher he works on learning 
how to walk with a cane and 
different techniques to open 
doors. 
When it conies time to take 

notes in class Sweet uses one 
of 2 methods. He will either 
type what the teacher is say- 
ing on his brailler or use a 
pocket size tape recorder and 
listen to the lecture again 
later. 

Sweet uses an ancient Chi- 
nese method of counting for 
math problems. He carries 
an abacus. He also uses the 
same textbooks as his class- 
mates, only his are a little 
different. They are on tape. 

According to Swect, having 
books on tape does not make 
them any more exciting. 
“They’re boring. It’s the 
same boring voice saying 
‘page 49.” 

The self-described class 
clown said he would like to 
go to college one day and 
then pursue music. “I want 
to be famous and go to Nash- 
ville and be a county singer.” 

Ellington townships. There 
are no Democratic candi- 
dates. 

In District 4 (Indianfields 

and Wells townships), in- 
cumbent Republican Susan 
A. Osborne will square off 

Please turn to page 11. 

Dennis Henry Owil A. Beecher 

Edward C. Scollon Sarah M. Pistro Ginny McLaren 

L ate zn separate 
county car crashes 
A Tuscola County man has 

been,charged in the death of 
a Vassar teen who died after 
being struck by a car while 
walking in Vassar Township 
early Saturday morning. 

The accident was one of 2 
fatalities reported in  the 
county over the weekend. 

The victim was identified as 
Mitchell W. Kilbourn, 15, of 
Vassar. 

Tuscola County Sheriff’s 
deputies reported Kilbourn 
was walking on Vassar Road 
north of Miller Road at about 
1 :30 a,m. when he was struck 
by a northbound car driven 
by Alan D, Worth, 32, also 

personnel to St.  Mary’s 
Medical Center, Saginaw, 
where he died of his injuries. 

Worth was transported to 
the Tuscola County jail. He 
was later arraigned on a 
charge of operating a motor 
vehicle while under the influ- 
ence of liquor - causing 
death. 

Bond in the case was set at 
$20,000. Worth faces a pre- 
liminary examination Aug. 5 
at 9:30 a.m. i n  Tuscola 
County District Court. 

If convicted, he faces a 
maximum penalty of 15 
years in prison and/or a fine 
of $2,500 to $10,000. 

2-CAR CRASH 

A Bay Port woman was 
killed in a 2-vehicle accident 
on Gilford Road near Ringle 
Road in southern Fairgrove 
Township Saturday. 

Troopers at the Michigan 
State Police post in Car0 re- 
ported the victim, Mae E. 
Stalter, 53, Bay Port, was 
southbound on Ringle Road 
at 10: 15 a.m. when she en- 
tered the Gilford Road inter- 
section and was struck 
broadside by an eastbound 
vehicle driven by David D. 
Green, 42, of Essexville. 

Green was transported to 
Bay Medical Center for treat- 

oi Vassar. Deputies are continuing ment of his injuries. 

by Vassar A r a  Ambulana accident. 
The victim was transported their investigation into the The cause of the accident 

remains under investigation, 

II Confusion reigned, says Cass 
Cityan on duty at Olympics 

Joe Meyer puts in 2 con- It was always pretty busy,” were,” he said. “Most of the blast. 
secutive weeks of training said the area resident, who people that came through “It wasn’t like a political 
each year as a National also spcnt a couple of days were on their way to the near- thing where they tried to kill 
Guardsman, but this year’s at the swimming venue est bus station. There were a athletes. This was an attack 
session will always stick out (GeorgiaTech) and 2 days at lot of people who were shook on civilians for the sole Pur- 
in his mind. the Wolf Creek shooting up and crying.” pose of killing civilians. 

Sunday hunting 
in Huron County? 

Huron County voters will 
decide next week whether to 
allow Sunday hunting in 
their county. 
The question will appear on 

the Tuesday, Aug. 6, primary 
election ballot, and will read: 
“Shall Act No. 396 of the lo- 
cal acts of 1994 which would 
result in the repeal of Act. 
No. 3 of the local acts of 
1937, which is an act passed 
in 1937 that prohibits hunt- 
ing with firearms, dogs, or 
otherwise in Huron County 
on Sunday, be adopted‘?” 
Huron County Clerk Helen 

Lemanski said commission- 
ers decided to place the mea- 
sure on the ballot in accor- 
dance with a state bill passed 
nearly 2 years ago. 

The bill, introduced by 
State Rep. Kim Rhead, 
Sandusky, gave county com- 
missioners 2 years to place a 
Sunday hunting question be- 
fore voters. 

With the primary election 
less than a week away, 
Lernanski said she’s heard 
very little discussion about 
the proposal. “We haven’t 

had anyone campaigning for 
or against it,” she added. 

Rhead said Huron County 
is among about 11 Michigan 
counties, including Tuscola, 
Sanilac and Lapeer, that still 
prohibit Sunday hunting in 
one form or another. 

Rhead said he introduced 
the bill because repealing the 
county laws requires an act 
of the state Legislature. 

He said Sanilac County is 
also considering placing a 
question before voters in the 
near future, but with lan- 
guage that would confine 
hunters to pursuing game on 
Sundays only on their own 
property. 
To do that, Rhead said, an- 

other bill may have to be in- 
troduced because the exist- 
ing bill expires this year. * 

Sanilac County voters have 
twice turned down Sunday 
hunting proposals in recent 
memory, with the most re- 
cent vote, 5 or 6 years ago, 
defeating a measure that 
would have allowed bow 
hunting on Sundays. 
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Meg’s Peg 

4 Ne ig h e bo rs 

by Melva E. Guinther 

Cuss City Marriage 
1 icenses Social Items 

Call your local news 
to the Chronicle office 

872-2010 

will present - - ~~ 

Timothy Law re n ce 
Guinther and Denise Anne 
Posluszny, both of Cass City. 

Kurtis John Kendziorski, 
Clio, and Julie Anne Paladi, 
De ford. 

Chad Nelson Zimmeman 
and Mary Ann Carpenter, 
both of Gagetown. 

Rodney Scott Blake and 
Tracie Lynn Niesen, both of 
Millington. 
Johnny Roger Bailey Jr. and 

Ronette Marie Germain, 
both of Vassar. 
Ronald Charles Hubbard Jr. 

and Rhonda Lee Adams, 
both of Vassar. 

Raymond Lee Louks, 
Brooksville, and Marilyn 
Jane Humphrey s, 
Millington. 
Victor Christian Molina and 

Michelle Lynn Bennett, both 
of Vassar. 

Ernest Lyle Reinhardt and 
Lisa Ann Martin, both of 
Caro. 

Craig Allen Esckelson and 
Jennifer Lee Barker, both of 
Vassar. 
Courtney Dale Bauer, Birch 

Run, and Cheryl Kathryn 
Hutchenson, Vassar. 

Raymond Michael Nowak, 
Crawford, and Lucy Ann 
Zeitler, Caro. 

Jeffery Lynn Spencer and 
Christine Louise Hughes, 
both of Cass City. 

Daniel Stephen Hunt and 
Renee’ Celeste Jobin, both of 
Millington. 

* * *  
To perceive things in 

the germ is intelligence. 
-Lao-tse 

WINNIE 
THE POOH” Ian Stirton of Washington, 

D.C., and his sister, Mary 
Giroux of Treherne, 
Manitoba, visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Gaylord LaPeer re- 
cently. 

Neighbors just aren’t what 
they used to be. 
Not that we have any com- 

plaints. Our neighbors, the 
ones we know, are fine folks. 
We get along very well. 

But people as a whole just 
aren’t “neighborly” like they 
used to be, are they? 

It’s been said that a neigh- 
bor is someone who knows 
you better than you know 
yourself. I’m not sure that 
applies these days. A lot of 
us don’t even know our 
neighbors’ names. 
Part of thc reason, I’m con- 

vinced, is the demise of the 
front porch. Porches have 
pretty much given way to 
backyard patios and decks. 
There was something about 

a neighbor sitting on his front 
porch that just seemed to say, 
“Stop by, sit a spell, and 
chat.” 

Even the kids don’t stay 
home like they used to. They 
have the park, swimming 
pool and sports activities i n  
the summer and school the 
rest of the year. 
And people move around a 

lot more than they once did. 
It used to be commonplace 
for a person to be born, live 
and die in the same place. 
Now they change jobs and 
residences so often that it’s 
sometimes hard to keep up 
with who’s living next door. 
Possibly the idea of a neigh- 

bor knowing more ahout you 
than you do was conceived 
in the days of party telephone 
lines. 

?Remember party lines 
when the whole neighbor- 
hood was connected, with 
different rings? 
Your ring might have been 

2 long and 3 short, while oth- 
ers’ were one long, 2 short, 
etc. 

The phone rang in every 
house. Everybody knew ev- 
erybody else’s ring, and there 
was nothing but honor to pre- 
vent somebody from listen- 
ing in on a neighbor’s con- 
versation. You could almost 
depend on it  i f  the phone 
rang late at night. 
That wasn’t all bad, because 

a late night call usually sig- 
naled an emergency of some 
sort, and the neighbors could 
be counted on to help out if 
needed. 
It was bad news, though, if 

you had a neighbor who 
hogged the line, because you 
couldn’t use the phone till he 
or she got off. 

In which case, it may well 
be that private lines, like 
good fences, make good 
ncighbors. 

August 1, 3, 5, 9 
“LITTLE 

Aaron Volz of Cass City re- 
cently participated in Michi- 
gay Tech n ol o g i c a 1 
University’s 20th annual 
summer youth program. He 
was among approximately 
1 ,OOO junior and senior high 
school students attending 
this summer’s sessions. Each 
student has the opportunity 
to participate in one of 56 
week-long explorations. Pro- 
gram design focuses on ca- 
reer exploration and devel- 
opment of new skills through 
laboratory, classroom and 
field experiences. Volz is the 
son of Charles and Linda 
Volz. He is a freshman at 
Cass City High School. 

WOMEN” 
August 2, 4, 8, 10 

All Performances will be at 8 p.m. at the 
Port Austin Community Playhouse, 35 Railroad 

St. Call 51 7-738-521 7 for information. 

Edward and Tisa Szczepanski 

Pair united 
Tisa Darr of Cass City and She is the daughter of Lois 

Edward Szczepanski of Darr of  Shabbona and 
Minden City were married Charles Darr of Saginaw, and 
April 13 at Living Word Wor- the granddaughter of Walter 
ship Center in Cass City by Goodall and Glenn Darr. 

Mandy ~ i ~ ~ ~ l ~  of cass fi Patios and decks have more 
of an aura of privacy. You City hasbeen named to the 

dean’s list of GMI Engineer- 
ing and Management Insti- 
tute of Flint. GMI is a coop- 
erative institute and Nizzola 
co-ops for Delphi Chassie 
Systems in Milford. She is 
studying to receive a degree 
in mechanical engineering. 

kind of feel like you  need an 
invitation. 

It’s also true that people 
don’t need their neighbors 
like they once did. 
When I was a kid living in 

the country, you didn’t make 
a trip into town on a whim. 
You bought groceries once a 
week and made them last. If 
you did run out of something 
before Saturday, your neigh- 
bor could usually help you 
out. 
These days most folks that 

live in the country are in town 
every day, and there’s always 
a storc open. So why would 
you bother your neighbor? 
Another factor in the loss of 

neighborliness is that people 
are simply too busy. When 
both parents work, they have 
household and family obliga- 
tions to take care of when 
they get home. 

- I  

the-Rev. Scott Tysick. 

riage by Robert Noble., 

Mother of the groom is 

and father is Thomas 
The bride was given in mar- I,inda Mullins of Florida, 

Szczepanski of Minden City. 
The bride wore a white, 

full-length gown with a 
banded collar, fitted long 
point sleeves and a full- 
length chapel train. 

Maid of honor was Debbie 
Kockn. Bridesmaids were 
Beth Loss and Dawn 
Schmaltz, cousin of the 
bride. They wore floor- 
length peach dresses with 
white lace. 
Best man was Mark Walker 

and groomsmen were Cliff 
Harris and Brian Lipskey. 
Ushers were Wally Northon, 
uncle of the bride, and Jason 

26 attend annual 
Gruber reunion 
The 4th annual reunion of 

the Joseph and Susie Gruber 
family was held at the home 
of Ben Gruber, Saturday, 
July 20, with 26 members 
attending. A potluck meal 
was served. 

Games were played, visit- 
ing and looking at pictures 
were enjoyed. 

Members came from Port 
Huron, Capac, Oxford, 
Almont, Gagetown and Cass 
Pi*.. 

At the Calvary Bible Fel- 
lowship July 14, after the 
evening service, a surprise 
lunch was served in honor of 
Larry ,Finkbeher, who will 
be gone to Alaska for 3 
months on a fishing, hunting 
and photography trip. 

July 28, 53 were in atten- 
dance at church, where a fel- 
lowship dinner was served 
after the morning service. 

I 
I 

- _  - -  

HEAD START 
FREE PRE-SCHOOL ROUNDUP 

HEAD START is a free child development pre-school program 
funded by the Federal Government for children age 3 to 5 
years old who meet eligibility requirements. 

1 DATE: Thursday, August 1 , 1996 
LOCATION: Cass City Head Start Center 

TIME: 10 a.m. - 4 p.m. 

4869 N. Seeger St. (across from the High School) 
BRING THE FOLLOWING ITEMS: ~ 

L I L Y .  

The next reunion will be 
held the 3rd Sunday of July 
at the home of Roy Thomas 
Bliss of Oxford, grandson of 
the late Joseph and Susie 
Gruber. lando and Bradenton. 

Lips key. 
A reception was held at 

Franklin Inn in Bad Axe. 
The couple honeymooned 

for 5 days in Florida at Or- 

Susan and Carl James an- 
nounce the birth of their son, 
Cody Carl James, He was 
born July 21 at 3:OO a.m. at 
Saginaw General. He 
weighed 5 pounds, 8 ounces 
and was 17 3/4 inches long. 

WCTU holds 
Annual reunion 
held July I3 

Last 3 months Proof of Income 
& 1995 W2 or 1040 Forms 
Medicaid Card (If applies) 
Food Stamp Number (If applies) 
Child‘s Immunization Records 
Parents’ Social Security Numbers 

Dentist & Physician Names, 
Addresses & Phone Numbers 
Child’s Birth Certificate 
Verification of Residency (Driver 
license or any document with 
address) 

For more information please contact Karen Goodro (51 7) 672-6030 

picnic at park 

NOTICE Cass River Woman’s Chris- 
tian Temperance Union held 
a picnic at the park Friday, 
Ju ly  26. Mrs. Doris Hurd 
gave the table grace before 
the potluck meal was served. 

The meeting opened with 
singing “America” and the 
pledges to the flags. There 
were several requests for 
prayers and prayer was of- 
fered for each request. Little 
AliciaAnne Willis and Emily 
Rose Willis were made 
W.R.R. in a ceremony when 
they wore white ribbons 
around their wrists. Their 
mother pledged to teach 
them the true values of never 
participating in use of to- 
bacco, alcohol and other 
drugs. The group pledged to 
remember them in prayer. 
Mrs. Evelyn Hardwick gave 

a devotional lesson on chil- 
dren from the Bible. Alicia 
Willis recited Bible verses 
she had memorized during 
Bible school. 

Sarah Deittmer of 
Crawfordville, Ind., who is 
visiting her aunt, Mrs. 
Hardwick, sang a solo, “I 
Came to Love You Early.” 

The service was dismissed 

The annual Lowe/ 
McAllister family reunion 
was held Saturday, July 13, 
at the Cass City Park with 82 
attending. 
A potluck meal was served 

at noon. 
Games were played with 

Wenola (Helwig) Lowe win- 
ning the penny in  the cup 
game. Karen (Hillaker) 
Ouvry and Julie (Helwig) 
Powers entertained the chil- 
dren and the younger adults. 

Georgcne Lowe Brown 
shared many old pictures of 
family members, as well as 
the original wedding invi ta- 
tion of Norma and Jim from 
1926. 
Seventy-two descendants of 

James and Norma 
(McAllister) Lowe, plus 2 
sisters, one brother, their 
families, and 2 guests came 
from Indian River,Ypsilanti, 
Sandusky, Croswell, Snover, 
Deford, Caro, Ubly, Mason, 
Port Sanilac, Pigeon and the 
Cass City area. 

Coming the farthest were 
Bruce McAllister and his 
wife, Lois, of Indian River. 
Next year’s reunion will be 

held at the same place on the 

Dr. Kenneth and Michelle 
(Jones) Tiseo of Car0 an- 
nounce the birth of their 
daughter, Blair Elise, Satur- 
day, July 27, at Bay Medical. 
She weighed 8 pounds, 5 
ounces, and joins a big sis- 
ter, Katie, 23 months, at 
home. 
Grandparents are Gary and 

Doris Jones of Cass City and 
William and Beverly Tiseo of 
Mecosta. Mr. and Mrs. 
Albert Jones of Decker are 
great-grandparents. 

OF 
I I 

SPECIAL MEETING 
The Village of Cass City Planning Commis- 
sion will hold a Special Meeting, Thursday, 
August 1, 1996 at 7:OO pm. at the Municipal 
Building, 6506 Main Street, Cass City, Michi- 
gan to review a preliminary plat of Northwood 
Village & Estates NO. 3. 
Those persons wishing to comment may ap- 
pear at the hearing, or if unable to attend, may 
make written comments directed to the office 
of the Village Clerk, 6506 Main Street, P.O. 
Box 123, Cass City, MI 48726-0123. 

Joyce A. LaRoche 
Village Clerk 

Some People Will Go 
to Incredible Lengths 
for Prescription Savings! W e  don’t clown 3rd Saturday of July. with prayer. 

CASS 
Surround Sound Stereo 

around. 
NOW THRU THURSDAY 8:OO 

If uou are travelling out of town for effordable pesoription d o e s ,  
we have g d  news for you. Call us and ask about the “oood As Oold” 
pesoription drug pridng program. 

Wed. Double Punch On Movie Goer Card 
Thursday “Bargain Nite” Save $$$$ 

HE’S TRYING TO SAVE THE LAST DRAGON 
Dennis Quaid & Sean Connery 

‘I DRAG ON H EART” 
0 5.72 /oApy The “Oood As QoM‘ p p m  offers uou some of the lowest 

prescription drug prices in the Thumb1 

STARTS FRIDAY (ONE FUNNY WEEK) 
All Evenings (Except Sat.) 8:OO 

Saturday 7:30 & 9:30 
Qenim aged si* p r s  ot d e r  autometicelly qual@ for “Oood A8 

Qold“ pricing, a8 w d  as a ten percent dismunt on all Heah  Mart brand 
products. However, uou need not be a senior to qualii fbr these 
pmwiption drug savings. Ask us if ”oood A8 Qokl” pridng wuld work for 
you1 Qave =me m o n q ,  and avoid the long drive out of town1 

$1,000 minimum balance required. Penalty for early 
withdrawal. Annual percentage yield effective July 
23, 1996 and subject to change thereafter. ”HILARIOUS 

GREAT I m  I*- MfWf CWANNLL FUN!## “Good As Gold” ... Only At Health Mart! €-Mail us at: thumbdavci.net 

EDDIE MURPHY 
THE 

Shop At Home ... Shop At Health Marf 

!NUTTY Thumb National 
l%#3&Um 

MEMBER 
FDIC ’OLD WOOD DRUQ’ 

STORE HOURS: 
Mon. lhru Fri 9 a.m - 6 p m. 

Sei Q a.m. - 4 p.m. 
Sun. 1290 p.m. - 4 p rn. 

A W A e  FILM 
WOTHulo ESCAPES AGFA FILM 

BOOKMART 
Books, Cards, Phbto & GlRs 

6498 Maln St. 
Jonrthrn Shotas, R. PH. CASS CITY, MI 48726 (517) 872-2075 OPEN EVERY OTHER SUNDAY 

NEW SHERIDAN 
HEALTH MART PHARMACY 

SOON: “INDEPENDENCE DAY” 

http://thumbdavci.net
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Disaster declared; flood 
aid headed for Thumb 0 1 9 w ~ f b K I  

The back forty 
by Roger Pond 

Rabbit Tkacks 

I’ve never been much of a 
shopper. If I had a choice 
between going shopping and 
having a tooth pulled, I 
would probably go shopping, 
but I still wouldn’t like it. 

Looking for a new car is 
about the worst kind of shop- 
ping in my opinion. The high 
price tag for cars is part of 
the problem, but the tradi- 
tional dickering about price 
is a hassle, too. 

I’ve always hated those 
deals where the salesman 
won’t tell you the price of a 
car. You have to make him an 
offer; then he checks with the 
boss, and they both have a 
big laugh before he returns 
to tell you how much every- 
one enjoyed your little joke. 
Many car dealers are begin- 

ning to realize customers 
don’t like all of this hokus 
pokus about prices. The last 
time we bought a car the 
salesman said, “Our 
dealership thinks buying a 
car should be just like buy- 
ing a pair of shoes. We tell 
you what the price is and if 
you like the product, and the 
color, you can decide if this 
is what you want.” 

“That’s certainly good to 
hear,’’ I told him. “That’s the 
way I like to do business.” 

So the salesman told me 
how much they needed for 
the car, and I offered him 
$1,000 less. (Maybe I was 
just testing him, I don’t 
know.) 
We bought the car, anyway, 

and it happens to be Honda. 
I know folks will object to 
buying foreign cars and all 
of that, but I have a couple 
of nephews working at the 
Honda plant in  Ohio, and 
they’re pretty decent kids. 

Several years ‘ago I was 
talking with a woman who 
bought a new Buick to help 
support the American car 
makers. She later noticed the 
interior of her Buick is ex- 
actly like the inside of a 
Toy o t a. 

If you watch cars going 
down the road, you’ll notice 
the outsides are the same, 
too. Some coincidence, huh? 

The biggest surprises for 
me are the safety gadgets in 
cars these days. There’s a bell 
to remind that the door is 
open, a beeper to make you 
fasten the seatbelt, and a 
buzzer to inform that your 
leg is caught in the steering 
wheel. 

The worst thing in our car 
is the automatic seatbelt. One 
end of the belt runs on a little 
track above the door frame. 
When you turn the key on, 
the seatbelt zips up the track 

you open the door, the belt 
zips back and lets you out. 

If you are backing the car 
and open the door to stick 
your head out, the seatbelt 
grabs you by the neck and 
throws you in the ditch. This 
teaches one to use the mir- 
rors. 
It seems we have come full- 

circle when i t  comes to ve- 
hicle safety. The philosophy 
behind these new gadgets is 
just like the old buggy horses 
my dad used to drive. 
The old horses had the same 

code of safety. If you did 
something foolish, they 

Governor John Engler an- 
nounced last week that the 
state has received a federal 
disaster declaration under the 
Robert T. Stafford Disaster 
Relief and Emergency Assis- 
tance Act for several Michi- 
gan counties that experi- 
enced severe storms and 
flooding in June. 

received from President Bill 
Clinton July 23. 
July 3, Engler faxed a letter 

to the White House request- 
ing a disaster declaration for 
the Saginaw Valley and 
Thumb regions of 
Michigan ’ s Lower Pen i n - 
sula. After touring the re- 
gions June 22, Engler pro- 
claimed a state of disaster in 
Lapecr, Saginaw, Tuscola, St. 
Clair and Sanilac counties. 
June 26, the Governor in- 
cluded Bay County and the 
City of Midland in Midland 
County in the disaster proc- 
lamation. 
. Representatives from the 
Federal Emergency Manage- 
ment Agency (FEMA) arid 

the Emergency Management 
Division of the Michigan 
State Police will coordinate 
assistance distribution. 

Acting public information 
officer at the Emergency 
Management Division of the 
State Police, Mark Wesley, 
said at this point it is not 
known how much money 
Tuscola County will get. 

Wesley said the amount of 
money Tuscola County will 
receive will be determined by 
what repair projects and sup- 
plies it is trying to recover. 
He explained each of the 6 
counties and the city of Mid- 
land declared a disaster area 
will have to apply for specific 
areas they want repaired. 

Once the applications are 
received, a survey team will 
visit Tuscola County to 
vcrify the application re- 
quests. A monetary amount 
will be decided once the re- 
quests are verified. “This is 
quite a lengthy process,” 
Wesley said. 

The disaster fund program 
is a match program, Wesley 
said, meaning the federal 
government will provide 75 
percent of the funds neces- 
sary for repairs and the re- 
maining 25 percent will be 
divided equally between the 
state and local government. 
For more information, con- 

tact Mark Wesley in  the 
Emergency Management 
Division of the State Police 
at (517) 334-5123. 

: The Ron Geigers recently returned from nearly a month 
bruising New England and attending a banquet in Washing- 
ton, D.C., a testimonial dinner given in honor of his brother, 
Keith, retiring president of the National Education Associa- 
&ion. 
7.  At the banquet he and the rest of the Geiger family had a 
rare experience. They shook hands with President Clinton, 
who spoke at the dinner. 
I Also attending from Cass City was Bob Gengler, Geiger 
Paid. 

The measure authorizes 
federal funding for repair and 
replacement of public facili- 
ties and for hazard mitigation 
measures. 
“This is heartening news for 

many Michigan communi- 
ties,” Engler said. 
The governor was informed 

of the declaration in a letter 

********** 

: From time to time we receive tips from readers about res- 
raurants that have impressed them. One came from Jim 
.*]askey, ramrod at K C Insurance Co. in Cass City. 
:He’s enthusiastic about the food at the Pasta House in Kinde. 
I t ’s  a small restaurant with about a dozen tables. Not fancy, 
bt nice and clean. 
;The place was humming on the Thursday I was there, with 
@ts of takeout action. 
:,The special listed on the board was chicken breast, filled 
iyith clams and shrimp with an alfredo-like sauce. I ordered 

.That was a mistake. Most times when you enter a restau- 
jant with pasta in the title, it’s best to order pasta. 
:No one else ate chicken while I was there, but the pasta 

boked good. My chicken cost $9.99, plus beverage. The 
e t a  dishes were either $6.99 or $7.99. 
,:The special I rate about a 5 on the 1-10 scale, but the 
iptaurant’s rating would certainly have been higher if I or- 
*red any of the pasta. 

it. 

********** 

.#Speaking of restaurants, let me tell you about the year’s 
k s t  deal. It was at the restaurant at Bay Valley Golf Course. 
-wur of us attended the delicious $12.95 Sunday brunch, ve were seated and water brought to our table. 

waiter appeared, so we served ourselves. At the cashier’s 
tksk, wc: said we had no bill, no waiter. 
.The clerk scurried out in the room where we were seated, 

@me back and ducked into the manager’s office. 
::Returned, she s:tid that there would be no charge for the 4 
meals. 
*:Give i t  a IO. 

:: 
t 4  
1 ‘  ********** 
*‘ 

!t’s panic time when spot news pictures turn out lousy, but 
hometimes a little imagination and a lot of talent can save 
+he day. 
:The top photo below shows how the picture of the Sweeney 
$rand champion steer came out. The bottom photo shows 
Qhat we printed last week. 
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and holds youin.Then, when made you pay for it.  

E h W ~ ~ E  OF THE hl0N”I-l RESIDENT OF THE MONTH 
Marion Adams Dorothy Booth 

n r‘armers can 
secure loans 

Governor John Engler an- 
nounced Monday that the 
U.S. Department ofAgricul- 
ture has started a low-intcr- 
est loan program for farmers 
in 15 Michigan counties af- 
fected by severe storms and 
flooding earlier this year. 
Farmers who qualify will be 
eligible for low-interest loans 
of 3.75 percent from the 
USDA. 

laration under the Robert T. 
Stafford Disaster Relief and 
Emergency Assistance Act. 
Federal Emergency Manage- 
ment Agency officials 
opened a disaster relief office 
in  Bay City July 29, and will 
hold public briefing sessions 
during the week. Friday, 
dam age ass e s s men t t e am s 
will begin to determine eli- 
gibility and damage 
arnoun t s. 

During the month of July we Our July Resident of the 
salute Marion Adams as Em- 
ployee of the Month. Marion Month ‘s Booth. 
has worked at Tendercare Cass Dorothy has been a resi- 
City since August 27, 1975, dent at Tendercare Cass 

City since May 1 ,  1985! over twenty years! Marion 
works on our afternoon shift. 
Her co-workers affectionately She is the President of our 
call her “MA“, she is’always Resident Council. Der- 

o t h y  enjoys playing willing to help her co-workers 
and enjoys taking new employ- 
ees under her wing. Marion is bingo, Bible study, cook- 
very dedicated, and always ing and arts and crafts. 
You don’t see her in the hall- 
way often, because she is al- found where the action is! 
ways doing what she can for We love your friendly 
her residents. We are proud to smile ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ h ~ ,  keep up 
have Marion a part of our the good work. 
Tendercare Family! 

goes beyond what is expected. ~~~~~h~ can always be 
The 6 principal approved 

counties are Bay, Saginaw, 
Sanilac, Tuscola, Lapeer and 
St. Clair. In addition-, eligible 
farmers in the following 9 
contiguous counties may ap- 
ply: Arenac, Huron, Gratiot, 
Oakland, Midland, Gladwin, 
Cenesee, Macomb and 
Shiawassce. Tendercare Cass City 

4782 Hospital Drive 
Cass City, MI 48726 
(5  17) 872-2 174 

“This loan program is wel- 
come news for the many 
farmers whose livelihood 
was devastated earlier this 
year,” said Engler. “With this 
assistance, family farmeis 
will he able to put the p*t 
behind them and look for- 
ward to a brighter future.” 
The governor added he ex- 

pccts other Michigan coun- 
ties to bc approved for the 
loan program as well. 

The low-interest loan pro- 
gram is designed for family 
farmers in  the above counties 
who have suffered physical 
or production loss. Farmers 
have until March 24, 1997, 
to apply for loans. Applica- 
tions should be made at the 
county farrn service agency 
office. Loan approvals are 
contingent upon the avail- 
ability of funds. 

L 

I A little of this arid that from have it‘? 
the cortih of Muin ati&Oak 
on a cloudy Friday, hoping 
it will turn to rain. (Whut a 
difference h month niakcs.) 

Heard around the coffee 
table was the result (strictly 
unofficial) of the recent fund 
raiser i n  behalf of USA 
Schools. 

It was reported by one of 
the boosters attending the S -  
hour afternoon affair, that 
every one of 1,000 tickets at 
$ I 0 0  each was sold. The tick- 
ets werc for 2 meals each and 
an entry in a prize drawing. 

In  addition, there were 50- 
50 drawings every hour and 
each earned the sponsors 
four-figure profits. Add to 
that $2 (real cash) gambling 
and it’s easy to see that thc 
event ratcs to hc at the top of  
any fund-raiser programs. 

It is the third year for the 
benefit and the first that all 
tickets printed were sold. 

If that were all there is, let 
them have their casinos. 

The crucial question is if 
Detroit has casinos, how long 
would i t  be before they 
spread across the state to 
Pontiac, Flint, Saginaw, Bay 
City? When promoters see 
the zillions of bucks the In- 
dians rake in at Mt. Pleasant 
and other areas, there’s no 
doubt given an opportunity, 
the dice will roll. 
It’s not too far fetched, if  the 

gambling starts to stretch 
out-state, to see it  roll into the 
Thumb. A casino at the cor- 
ner of M-8 I and M-S3.? 

Looking at the big picture, 
i t  looks like gambling will 
engulf us regardless of what 
we do. Now gambling for 
real money, not prizes, al- 
though with stringent restric- 
tions, is legal for civic 
groups. We are used to the 
lottery and off track horse 
betting. Remember a couple 
of decades or so ago when 
bingo for any reason was 
u n 1 aw f u 1 ? 

If statc-wide casino gam- 
bling does become legal, a 
good bet (pardon the pun) 
would be that this area would 
be one of the last to succumb. 
Thank goodness. 

I V l l l  IUUI I V I 1  y 

servina as vice 7 =I John Merriman Chairman of Board of I= 
Commissioners Last week, Engler an- 

nounced that Michigan re- 
ceived a federal disaster dec- DE DlCATE D 
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iave never missed regular or special mee ‘ting 

VOTE AUG. 6 Pa P .  

:’*The solution? The Chronicle’s Joann Asher drew the miss- It bugs me a little to get a 
medical bill trom a doctor I 
have never seen or who has 
ncvcr wen me for a service 
listed o n  my bill that I can’t 
decipher. You too‘? 

$g portion of the steer and the ribbon. 

The Weather 
Tuesday ................................. 80 ............ 60 .............. 0 

............................ 80 ............ 60 .............. 0 
Thursday ............................... 80 ............ 58 .............. 0 
Friday .................................... 76 ............ 54 ........... IO”  
Saturday ................................ 77 ............ 57 .............. 0 
Sunday .................................. 78 ..... ;...... 56 .......... .05“ 
Monday ................................. 77 ............ 62 ........ I .09“ 

Paid for by Committee to Re-elect Merriman 
for County Commissioner District 1 

I 1 
****** 

Loolcslikenobo$y 
else mmes close to 

0UrcDmm. 

It has always been the con- 
tention here that gambling is 
bad business for communi- 
ties. It seems probable now 
that another decision about 
gambling will be needed and 
a yes or no vote is not as clear 
cut as i t  once was. 

What’s planned is a state- 
wide referendum that will 
allow gambling in Detroit 
despite Gov. John Engler’s 
refusal to permit it .  

, What keeps nagging at me 
is that we are being asked 
state-wide to decide an issue 
for Detroit. After all, Detroit 
voters have indicated that 
they want casino gambling. 

If they want it,  who are we 
decide that they won’ 

With these great rates and convenient terms, we 
don’t think you’ll hnd an easier way to get a great 
return on your investment. For details, d Mutual 
Savings Bank. There’s a branch close to you. 

6241 Main !h$872-2105 

$500 midmum Mat rquirtd m open CD or tR4 Ptnllty m y  bt knpostd br  tvly withdrawal. 
hnurl pcrccnugt ylcld (MY) i s  c l c h  Junc 27,19%. P-al rubjcct to chmgc. FDIC Inrumd. 

THAr‘S STATE FARM 
INSURANCE. 

COME, CHECK OUT OUR 
NEW MERCHANDISE 

SURGEON GENERAL WARNING Srndrhg Cwrm$ Lung Cancer, 
Haart Dirmra. Emphysema And M a y  CanP(iab Prctrruncv 

Llko m good nelghbor, 
State F0rm Is them.@ 
Stale Farm Insurance Companies 
Home Onices Bloominglon Illinois 
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Barcia honored for ' 

DownMemorvLane defense of Medicare 
From the files of the Chronicle w 

U.S. Congressman Jim 
Barcia (D. Bay City) was re- 
cently honored by the Se- 
niors Coalition with The Se- 
niors Coalition Meritorious 
Service Award for his com- 
mitment and vote record in 
preserving Medicare. 

"This is a true honor," 
Barcia said. "I believe very 
strongly that we must protect 
Medicare, which so many 
seniors depend upon for their 
health care needs. Without 
this vital program, many se- 
niors would not be able to 
afford standard physical care 
or would forgo their medical 
needs for fear of compiling 

with his votes in the 104th 
Congress." I 

The Seniors Coalition is d 
non-profit public advocacy' 
organization with 2 million 
members and supporters. It 
believes in responsible gov- 
ernment financial manage- 
ment to preserve our 
economy for future genera- 
tions, and accepts no govern- 
ment grants. 

Barcia previously received 
a Defender of Social Secu- 
rity Award from the Seniors, 
Coalition for his pledge not 
to cut, raise taxes on, or 
means test Social Security. 

5 YEARS AGO The police are cracking 
down on weekend cruisers in 
reaction to Saturday's early- 
morning fight i n  the 
Charmont parking lot. Pa- 
trols also will be stepped up 
through other popular park- 
ing lots for cruisers, includ- 
ing Jordan College, Chemi- 
cal Bank Service Center, 
People's Choice $hell Mar- 
ket, Cass City Hardware and 
Thumb National Bank. 

The Cass City Village 
Council was asked to con- 
sider expanding bus service 
to Cass City by the Car0 
Transit Authority at its regu- 
lar meeting Monday evening, 

The council will study the 
proposal and try to get a 
reading of the sentiment of 
the community before mak- 
ing any decisions. 

the car they were ridin'g in 
was broadsided Thursday 
morning on Colling Road. 

The death of Pamela K. 
Spurling, 25, of Cass City, is 
being investigated by the 
State Police post in  Caro. 
They are not releasing any 
information at this time. 

Rev. Larry Van Slambrook, 
depicting a pioneer circuit 
rider, made a stop i n  
Shabbona Wednesday 
evening. He traveled 75 
miles on horseback from 
Brown City to Sebewaing to 
raise money for Bay Shore 
Camp. 
Richard Carroll, a teacher at 

Cass City High School, has 
retired after 31 years at the 
school. The school board and 
teachers threw a farewell 
party on the last day of 
school last month at the high 
school cafeteria. 

After 30 years the Misses 
Gertrude and Nina McWebb 
have returned to their birth- 
place at 4645 Oak Street af- 
ter teaching and doing puh- 
lic work in Ohio. 
A bumper wheat harvest is 

in  sight for area farmers, pro- 
viding that the weather co- 
operates in the next I O  days. 

Jack Alexander, 18, suf- 
fered slight burns on his face, 
arms and shoulders when he 
was sprayed by hot oil from 
an overheated electric trans- 
former on a utility pole Sat- 
urday evening. He was 4 

treated at Hills and Dales 
General Hospital and rc- 
leased Sunday. 

Mrs. Alfred J. Knapp, 86, 
Mrs. Elizabeth Pinney, Mrs. 
Margaret Haire arid Mrs. 
Maude Schenck have high 
hopes that theTigers will win 
the pennant this year. The 
ladies follow the Detroit Ti- 

'I'he "Routid Barn" on 
firthie Road, a mile north of 
!.;:yetown, is i n  very real 
clmger o f  demolition. 

J L i  lcti iiie resident Dale 
Parrish has  retired after 
working l o r  the Tuscola 
( ' ( )II 11 t y Road C omm i ssi o n 
1 o r  40 years. 

Ai1 8-year-old Car0 youth 
roniained in  critical condi- 
l i o r i  'I'uesday morning at St. 
hl ary's Medical Center, 
Siigitiaw. Charles liisch had 
;I 11 v a r  - d r o w n i n g acc id en t 
n d i i l c .  swimming i n  the Vil- 
I age of' Chro pool July 17. 

10 YEARS AGO 

An estimated 200 persons 
attended the dedication of the 
new barrier-free ramp at St. 
Agatha's Church, Gagetown, 
Sunday. Bishop Kenneth A. 
Untener from the Saginaw 
diocese was the dedication 
speaker. 

Joseph Griesmayer Jr,, 68, 
and his wife Wanda, 68, of 
Unionville were killed when 

25 YEARS AGO 

Plans for selling beer at the 
park were temporarily 
shelved Tuesday night after 
an orderly meeting in which 
representatives of the pro and 
anti-beer forces crowded the 
council chambers at the regu- 
lar meeting of the Cass City 
Village Council. 

Harvey Kritzman was con- 
firmed owner of the road to 
his home Wednesday morn- 
ing in a Tuscola County Cir- 
cuit Court hearing. The road 
has been in  dispute by the 
Wrangler's Club. 

The Harvey McCreedy 

a huge debt from hospital Local students and doctor visits." 
Stan Parris, The Seniors 

Coalition Chairman of Con- On dean's list 
gressional Affairs, said "The 
qualification for the award 
was a strong voting record in 
support of senior issues, Rep- 
resentative Barcia has dem- 
onstrated his dedication to 
America's older population 
over the course of this term. 
He has allied himself with 
senior citizens by supporting 
The Seniors Coalition 1995 
Pledge To Save Medicare 
and backed that pledge up 

Seven area residents are 
among the students named to 
the dean's list at Detroit Col- 
lege of Business for the, 
spring 1996 term. 

They are Kristin Gamet, 
Christine Rasmussen, Marie 
Stanczak, Janice Tuckey and 
Lori Warmbier, all of Cass 
City; Rosalie Bitterling of 
Ubly; and Rita Easlick o f .  
Kingston. , 

, NOTICE OF ELECTION 
GENERAL PRIMARY 

family of 10, of 2680 
Dickerson Rd., a mile east of 
Colwood, was left homeless 
after fire swept through their 
home late Monday after- 
noon. Mrs. McCreedy was in 
Hills and Dales Hospital, 
where she was recovering 
from surgery at the time of 
the fire. 

Frank Lester, Cass City's 

gers basehall club with zeal. 

An old clothes ham- 

~~~,~~~ ~ ~ ~ a i ~ $ o ~ ~  
blankets and pillows. 

' lo  ~ l i r  qunlificd electors of Sanilac County: 

~ O I ' l ~ ~ E  IS  HEREBY GIVEN. that the General Primary Election will be held in the County of Sanilac, State of Michigan on: 

TUESDAY, AUGUST 6,1996 
'oi- the purpose of nominating candidates for the Republican and Democratic parties for the offices of United States, Senator, Representative in 
.'ong!ress - 5th District, State Representative - 83rd District; County: Prosecuting Attorney, Sheriff, County Clerk, County Treasurer, Register of 
.)ccds. I h i n  Coininissioner, County Road Cornmissioner, County Surveyor, County Cornmissioner; Townships: Supervisor, Clerk, Treasurer, 
['ruhtcus, Constable; and for the purpose of electing Precinct Delegates. 

Hills and Dales General Hospital will be offering 
free DementiaTraining Seminars which will be pre- 
sented by theThumb Area Dementia Coalition. The 
first seminar will be offered August 8th from 3:OO- 
4:30 p.m. Topics that will be discussed are: over- 
view of dementia (a deterioration of the mind from 
stroke, illness, etc.), nutrition, eating, and oral health 
assessment of related health care issues. The 
second seminar will be held September 1 Oth, 3:OO- 
4:30 p.m. Topics to be discussed at this meeting 
will be: hospitalization concerns, mobility, safety, 
and continence. 
The seminars will be held at the Hills and Dales 

General Hospital meeting room and are open to 
the public. This program will be most helpful for 
anyone who takes care of the older adult including 
family, AFC homes, LTC facilities and hospitals. 
Anyone interested in attending these seminars or 
if you have any questions, please contact Dawn 
Maust, BSN, Education Coordinator, Hills and 
Dales, 51 7-872-21 21, Ext. 342. The seminars are 
being sponsored by a grant from the Kellogg Foun- 
dation. 

oldest resident, will celebrate 
his 104th birthday, Sunday, 
Aug. 1. Lester, who lives 
with his children, feels pretty 
good and attributes his long 
life to a strong and healthy 
constitution. 

Kelly Blades, 2, and Julie 
Blades, 4, won in the 6 and 
under age group in the rec- 
reational program's fishing 
contest recently. Kelly won 
a flashlight for catching the 
first fish and Julie received a 
reel for the biggest fish 
caught. 

Powerful Choices 
I Iic following proposals will also he on the ballot: Fortis ewnpenles are slrong 

providers 01 flnanclel securlly, 
ollerlrig powerful choke8 lor your 
llnanclal needs. SANILAC COUNTY MILLAGE PROPOSITION 

I REQUEST Fro RECAPTURE THE FULL MILLAGE RATE OF FIVE ( 5 )  MILLS DUE TO REQUIRED MILLAGE ROLLBACK REDUC- 
I IONS SINCE 1074 

Time Insurance: lndvldual 
Medlcal Including Shod Term 
Medical, Small Group Benelils, 
Fortis Long Term Care. 

Forllr Beneflts: Qroup Beneflls. 

Forils Financial Group: Mulual 
Funds; Flxed and Varlable 
Annuitlea; Llle Insurance, Variable 
Universal Life Insurance. 

<HALL THE 1074 VOI'EL) FIXED FIVE (5) MILLTAX LIMITATION FOR THE COUNTY OF SANILAC, AS REDUCED BY THE REQUIRED 
LIILLAGE ROLLBACK WHICH LAST RESULTED IN A LEVY OF 4.3395 MILLS ($434 PER $1,000 OF TAXABLE VALUE) WITHIN SAID 
'OUNTY, HE INCKEASED FOR GENERAL OPERATING PURPOSES TO FIVE ( 5 )  MILLS ($5.00 PER $ I  ,000 OFTAXABLEVALUE, REAL 

< l V I ?  rl'lilS WOULD RESULT IN A N  ADDITIONAL .6603 INCREASE ($0.66 PER $1,000 OFTAXABLE VALUE) WITHIN SAID COUNTY; 
A ' I I I C ' I I  I,EVY WILL KAISE IN THE FIRST YEAR OF THE LEVY A N  ESTIMATED $516.622.91. 

Z N I )  TANG1HI.E PERSONAL PROPERTY), WITHIN SAID COUNTY FOR THE PERIOD OF SIX (6)YEARS 1996 THROUGH 2001 IWLU- 

SANILAC COUNTY LIBRARY MILLAGE For more Informellon contact: 

4 RENEWAL OF THE EXPIRED LIBRARY MILLAGE WILL PROVIDE FUNDS FOR THE BENEFIT OF ALL PUBLIC LIBRARIES SERV- 
Y G  SANILAC COUNTY CITIZENS. 

Local Registered Reprcun tn tiue 

Newel1 E. Harris 
P.O. Box 38 

Cas City, MI 487264038 
(517) 872-2668 

35 YEARS AGO 
Shnll the IS mill tax limitation on the general ad valorem taxes within Sanilac County imposed under Article lX, Section 6, of the Michigan 

:'onslitution be illcreased for said county by 2/10 of 1 inill (20 cents per $1.000 of taxable value) for four (4) years, 1996 through 1999 inclusive, 
o pi.ovidc funds for  the hcnefit of all public libraries serving Sanilac County Citizens; which increase shall raise in the first year of the levy an 

" * > I  I I I I ; I ~ C ~  $ I5O,O()O.O0? 

The Cass City School 
Board recently approved 14 
measures designed to cut 
school operating costs and 
bring expenditures in line 
with revenue, The move was 
made necessary after school 
electors voted not to approve 
a special 3-mill tax for oper- 
ating at a recent special elec- 
tion. 

a, 

Registered representative 
SANILAC COUNTY SENIOR CITIZENS MILLAGE 

4 RENEWAL OF THE EXPIRE13 SENIOR CITIZENS MILLAGE TO PROVIDE FUNDS FOR USE BY THE SANILAC COUNTY COUNCIL 
:.IN AGING, -1.0 MAINTAIN AND EXPANI) SERVICES TO OLDER CITIZENS IN SANILAC COUNTY WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE 
?ANII.AC COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

Cass City (5i7) 872-2/2/ Shall thc IS rn i l l  tax limitation on the general ad valorem taxes within Sanilac County imposed under Article IX, Section 6, of the Michigan 
l'onstitution he increased for said county by 2/10 of I mill (20 cents per $1,000 of taxable value) for four (4) years, 1996 through 1999 inclusive, 
:o provide for use by the Sanilac County Council on Aging, to maintain and expand services to older citizens in Sanilac County with the approval 
. ) I  the Sanilac County Board of Commissioners; which increase shall raise in the first year of the levy an estimated $150,OOO.00? * * a EVERGREEN TOWNSHIP 

TAX LIMITATION PROPOSITION 
TOWNSHIP ROAD MII,I,AGG db D e  First Aid * * * + Shall the IS inill tax limitation on general ad valorem taxes within Evergreen Township imposed under Article IX, Sec. 6 of the Michigan 

I'onclitulion be increased for said township by one ( I )  mill ($1.00 per $I,O00 of taxable valuation) over four (4) years beginning with the 1996 tax 
Icvy year and running through the 1999 tax levy year (inclusive) for the specific purpose of road repair, construction, improvement and maintenance 
i i i  Ilie uiiincorpor;itcd are&$ of Evergreen Township; and shall the township levy such increase in millage for such purpose during such period, which 
incicw will raise i n  the first year of such levy an estimated revenue of Fourteen Thousand, Three Hundred and Sixteen Dollars ($14,316,000)? 

- * * * * * * * * * 
GREENLEAF TOWNSHIP 

TAX LIMITATION PROPOSITION 
RIENEWAI, OF FIRE PROTECTION MILLAGE 

Shall the IS rnill tax limitation on general ad valorem taxes within Grwnleaf Township imposed under Article IX, Sec. 6 of the Michigan 
C'unstitution be increased for said township by one ( I )  mill ($1.00 per $I,OOO of taxable valuation) over four (4) years beginning with the 1997 tax 
Icvy year and running through the 2000 tax levy year (inclusive) for the specific purpose of fire protection in the unincorporated areas of Greenleaf 
'l'oiiiiship; and shall the township levy such increase in millage for such purpose during such period, which increase will raise in the first year of 
such levy :in estirnated revenue of Thirteen Thousand Nine Hundred and Twelve Dollars ($ I3,912.00)? 

* 
AdhesiveTape 

GREENLEAF TOWNSHIP 
TOWNSHIP PROPOSITION 

f * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Confirming grant of franchise to THE DETROIT EDISON COMPANY, for the purpose of the erection, construction, and maintenance of towers, 
polrc, ni:uns, wires, pipes, conduits. apparatus, etc,, requisite for the transmission. transforming and distribution of electricity for public and 
private use 

* * * * * * 
f * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

STERILE 

I ,  CAROL, A DALE. COUNTY TREASURER OF THE COUNTY OF SANILAC, MICHIGAN, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT AS OF JUNE 24, 
I99h. THE RECORDS OF THIS OFFICE INDICATE THAT THE TOTAL OF ALL VOTED INCREASES, OVER AND ABOVE THE TAX 
L.lhll'l'ATION ESTABLISHED BY THE CONSTITUTION OF MICHIGAN IN ANY LOCAL UNITS OF SANILAC COUNTY, IS AS FOLLOWS: stretch Gauze 

Bandage 

I VOTED YEARS 
UNIT W E  INCREME USE INCLUSIVE 

COUNTY OF SANllAC 0.20 M AMBULANCE-€MER 19931998 
0.50 M PUB WETY COMM 1982-1996 
030 M ORUQ TASK FORCE l W l S 9 7  
0 . m ~  PARKS 1S4-1997 Sterile Pads 

r'xr'-2Ss1 31'x3"-2ss 
or 4"x4"~10's 

MRGREEN TOWNSHIP NONE M 

2"x4 yds. 
or 3"x4 vds. 

GREENLEAF TOWNSHIP 1.00 M FIRE PROTECTON 1-1- 
1.00 M ROAD MAINTENANCE 18931ssB 

CAS3 CITY SCHOOLS *18.00 M OPERATINQ 1S951m 
-4.75 M DEBT 

UBLY SCHOOL8 '18.00 M OPERATINO 1 - m  
4.00M DEBT 1992-2007 

Bacitracin HURON INTER 2-00 M SP ED INDEFINITE 
1.49 M WO ED INDEFINITE 

TUSCOU INTERMEDIATE 280M SP ED INDEFINITE 
1.75 M VO ED INDEFINITE 

I m m. 1 a cu J /a 12 CAROL A. DALE, 
* niple Antibiotic 2 1 9  ri~a' 2 5 9  * 2 * Ointment * * 10L * * 1 O t  * 
* 
* 

Cream * Ointment 
1 oz. ' *  

COUNTY TREASURER 

'NOT SPREAD ON HOMESTEADS AND FARMLANDS 
-ESTIMATED MILLAGE, SCHOOL WARD WlLL SET MILLAGE IN JULY 

'1 I II: t i l  ,lX''I'l( I N  WILL BE CONINJCTED AT THE FOLLOWING POLLING PLACES: 

EVERGREEN TOWNSHIP 
Township Hall. 5514 Shabbona Road 
2nd Building W. of k c k e r  Road 
Shabbona Road 

GREEN LEAF TOWNSHIP 
Township Hall, Gilbert Road 
2 miles N.  of Cass City Road 
Clare Brown, Clerk 

Ar thu r  Severance, Clerk 
1 tic l'oll\ of w i d  election will he open at 7 o'clock a m. and will remain open unt i l  8 o'clock p 111 of said day of election 

Linda I .  Kozfkay 
Sanilac County Clerk 
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Your neiuh bor saw 

No talent needed 
for horse events 
For the last 2 weeks of July and the first week of August, 

most of  America is caught up with Olympic fever, includ- 
ing Josh Ouvry. 

Ouvry, a Cass City resident for the past year and a half, 
‘\as been following the games in Atlanta since the opening 
ceremonies. But he added, “How can you not, they are on 
40 hours a day.” 

Staying up late one night, 
Ouvry said he turned on the 
television and was “shocked 
to see the Olympics still on 
at 2 in the morning.” 

Track and field and swim- 
ming are among Ouvry’s fa- 
v.orite events. Watching 
-ymnastics has not been all 

that bad eithcr. He said he 
enjoys track and field the 
most because “it  takes talent 
(to participate).” 
His least favorite events are 

the equestrian competitions. “I think the horse thing is the 
stupid one.” 

He said he does not like the equestrian events because he 
doesn’t think i t  takes talent to “ride a horse and tell i t  what 
to do” 

Furthering his contempt for the equestrian events Ouvry, 
rho will attend Michigan State University in the fall, 

doesn’t think they should even hc in the Olympics. They 
are not alone though, Ouvry does not th ink  synchronid 
swimming should he an Olympic went either. 

While at MSU, Ouvry plans to study chemical engineer- 

from Regency‘s 
fine collection of 

h VI 
I \  I\ 

Wedding 
Invitations and 

Accessories. \ 
Cass City Chronicle 

Phone 872-2010 
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i MEDICAL EQUIPMENT 
Medicul Equipment For The Home 

Complete Sales Scrvicc Rcntd 
Oxygen Equipment 

Hospital Beds, Whccl Chairs, Walkcrs 
Full Linc Of Mcdical Equipment 

For T ~ C  I - ~ O I I I C  
Credentialed Rcspiratory 

Therapists On Stiif‘f‘ 
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SOUTH AFRICAN Bev Van Wyk (seated left) recently en- 
joyed a month-long visit with friend Paula Byron (seated right) 
of Cass City. The pair, along with Byron’s mother, Marie 
(standing left) and Marie’s sister, Sue Love, spent much of 
their time on the road touring more than a dozen states. 

Hartwick reunion held Sunday 
‘I’hc descendants of Eclwald clay for thclr annual I-ciinion. nkl Allison Ncwbegin, 

and Ruth Hiirtwick inet at thc c‘o-hosts w c r ~  C‘harlcs and daughter of Michele and 
hoI11c 0 1 ‘  John and Ruth Kathlccn Hartwick of Cass Tom Newbegin of Clifford. 
Jaw(,rski of ()wendale Sun- C’ity. l’hc i’irst reunioii was Guests were present from 

hcld i n  IO5cj at thc hoinc of‘ C‘ass City, Lapeer, Clifford, 
Owendale, Jay and Elainc C’ranc. D a v i s o n , VBS set ‘Iliis was thc 38th gel-to- Fairgrovc, Metamora, Ubly, 

getticr. ‘I’hc oldcsl r i i h h c r  

Ilarrwick of* Cass c‘ i ly  und 

Car;. Port Hope, and fro; 

Ncxt year’s reunion will he 
Aug. 12- 16 attcnciing w;is Arlan Florida. 

at church 

I 1-800-532-8063 
I 5 1 7-872-21 2 I ext. 250 

We Accept Medicare, Blue Cross 
& Other Insurances 

6528 Main St., Cass City 
d 

Re-Elect 

Vriciitioii Hihlc School is 
sliitcd ~ O I .  A u ~ .  12-16. 91.30 
3.111. Io IlOOtl cacti day, at St. 
Pancratius Catholic Churc ti. 
4292 S. Sccgcr St., C ‘ m s  C’ity. 

‘I‘hc prograiii is opcn to all 
childrcn agcs 3 ycars to ttic 
f’ourth gradc. ‘ T i )  rcgistcr, cal l  
thc church at 872-3330, o r  
cont;wt Jariccn Mills at ( 5  17) 
66s-240 I .  

Exports 
increase 

U.S.  exports 01’ lrt)/.cn po- 
tatoes to South Aiiicrica rosc 
draniritically last year. About 
90 percent o f  the 1’ro/.cn PO- 
tatous will hc cut to satisl’y 
the growing dcniand f o r  
Frcnch fries. l’hc l k p a r t -  
nient o f  Agriculture a t -  
tributes the incrcascd de- 
mand to increasing eco-  
nomic stability and ii rise in 
thc number of  South Amr i -  
c 21 11 I’as t - fo od I C  s I ;I ii r;i n t s . 
The already-high nuriikcr of‘ 
eateries ix  cxpeckd  to dotthlc 
in thc next I O  year\. 

Linda 1. Kozfkay 
For 

Sanilac 
County Clerk 

Republican 

Servant,.. 
Vote for Experience on 

August 6!! 

“Muke the Right Connection” 

County 
Clerk 

Kozf  LindaL* kay c . 

rhc youiigcst w x  3 ii;onth- held in- July.  

Courtesy of Byron family 

South African visitor 
enjoys whirlwind tour 
Bcv Van Wyk spent about 

17 hours flying from her 
home i n  South Africa to 
Michigan, whcrc she was re- 
united with friend and 
former exchange student 
Paula Byron of Cash City for 
a month-long visit. 

But her travels hadn’t even 
begun, thanks to the Byron 
family, which took the 21- 
year-old on a whirlwind tour 
of the country. 

“I am tired. It was good, 
though. This is a very beau- 
tiful country,” Van Wyk com- 
mented Friday as she pre- 
pared for the trip back home 
to Strubensvalley, a city of  
about 4 million people lo- 
cated wcst of Johannesburg. 

Byron, a 1994 Cass City 
High School graduate who 
now attends Northern Michi- 
gan University, explained she 
met Van Wyk while both of 
them were exchange students 
i n  Australia 3 years ago. 

Since then, the pair have 
written, faxed each other and 
made an occasional phone 
call, according to Paula’s 
mother, Marie. 
“Paula would mail her Ore0 

cookies and Bev would mail 
Paula jade bracelets,” she 
said. 
Which led to Van Wyk’s ar- 

rival at thc Byrons’ Elmwood 
Road home a month ago. 

The adventure began with 
a tour of the Cass City area, 
with stops at the Sanilac 
Petroglyphs and thc Octagon 
Barn near Gagetown. Van 
Wyk also toured othcr arcas 
o f  the Thumb. and visited 
Fr an ke n m u t h , S a g i n a w , 
Birch Run and Mackinac Is- 
land. 
Van Wyk, Paula and Marie 

Byron and Marie’s sister, Sue 
Love of Eastpointe. then 
emharked on a cross coun- 
try drive. 

l h e  group spent a day in 
Gattlinhurg, Tenn., and cn- 

joyed a helicopter ride. Next 
up was a stop in  Chatta- 
nooga, where they visited the 
Chattanooga Aquarium and 
1,ookout Then i t  Mountain. was on to Florida 

and Disney World, thc Magic 
Kingdom and Epcot Center. 
Love noted i t  was an inter- 
esting trip in  that the group 
arrived as Hurricane Bertha 
was approaching. 
The group continued its ad- 

venture with a visit to a 
Cherokee reservation i n  
North Carolina, followed by 
a trip to Virginia, where thcy 
saw the Natural Bridge, one 

acknowledged Cass City is a 
far cry from the hustle and 
bustle of her hometown. “It’s 
nice (here), but it’s too quiet 
for me,” she added. 

Van Wyk hinted this prob- 
ably won’t be her last trip to 
America. In fact, she’s con- 
sidering returning to further 
her education, possibly to 
study law. 

She said it’s likely she 
would have eventually vis- 
ited the United States even i f  
she hadn’t met Paula Byron. 
But i t  wouldn’t have cam- . .  

Marie Byron said the sec- 
ond phase of the tour - the 
east coast - was made pos- 
sible by her husband Mike’s 
business connections and 
friends in Boston (his home- 
town) and in New York. 

The group flew to Boston, 
then traveled to Salem, 
Mass., where they visited 
witch trial museums, the Ply- 
mouth Plantation and a rep- 
lica of the Mayflowcr. 
Van Wyk and her cornpan- 

ions then experienced their 
first New York cab ridc and a 
ride on the subway, as well 
as visits to  the Hard Rock 
Cafe, Planet Hollywood, thc 
Statue of Liberty and Trump 
Tower. e 

Van Wyk indicated shc thor- 
oughly enjoyed her visit to 
the states, although she 
didn’t know what to expect 
hcfore arriving. “Before I 
left, I hadn’t even thought 
about it,” she said. “1 just 
came over, and what I saw, I 
saw.” 

It was a study in  contrasts 
for the South African, who 

Your house. 
Your car. 
Your business. 
You. 

McVey Agency Inc. 
4546 Leach St., 
Cass City, Mich. 
(51 7 )  872-4860 

For your insurance needs- 
Belng fn good hands 
is the only place to be: 

“I’m getting a degree with the 
right t&<for &e career I want. 

App1 iout iorls, Mamgernerit, Adntinis trat ive 
Assis tant ,  Word Processing Specialist, and 

0 Honcst-  to-goodncss Einployrnent Assistance for  life. 
0 Ncw flexible schedules, less class time. 
8 Practical prograins help y o u  s t x t  exriirig sootier. 
Q Sma\l, frienL]ly college wI,crc s‘)I,’rc Inip”rt;,nt* 
0 Caring iiisinictors, with real career cxpcriciicc. 
0 North C:entr;ll accrcditcd.” 

To Learn m e  abut t+’s hottest business, 
your degree. . . even while working &d health, and technical careers, cdl w 

write for this FREE BOOKLET 

6667 Main St., CUSS City, MI 48726 

Buincss L d r s h i P .  o u r  unique “career-ready” 
training m d  education will prepare you to get 
that gc )od Job SC)C)II. 

(;:dl LIS ai Baker College. We’ll help you get 

at your current job! 

Many classes available ON-LINE. 
Call or visit our web site for details. 51 71 8 72 1 1 29 

Paid for by the cornmitee to Re-Elect Linda I. Kozfkay. County Clerk, 
325 Pineridge Lane, Sandusky, MI 48471 

* f  
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Innovative Farmer Dr. Guyer: wheat mold 
outbreak worst in centurv 

tour slated Aug. 22 
Deadline for submitting items in the calendar is the Fri- 

The Innovative Farmers by the Corn Marketing Pro- day before publication* 
cr have set the date of Thursday, 

Aug. 22, for their 1996 “In- 
tegrated Cropping Systems” 
Tour. Currently, there are 81 
farmer members who are in- 
volved in a 5-year project 
designed to develop alterna- 
tive cropping systems that 
reduce erosion, reduce oper- 
ating costs, improve water 
infiltration and reduce com- 
paction. 

Tour participants will be 
able to board buses for the 
tour at the Tuscola County 
Extension Office, the Mu- 
n-icipal Parking Lot in  Pi- 
geon, and the fairgrounds in 
Bad Axe. 

Innovative Farmer mem- 
bers will be available to re- 
view this year’s project and 
how the production plots 
were designed and devel- 
oped. Additional sites to be 
visited include a study to 
evaluate the affect of row 
width on white mold in soy- 
beans, comparison of I O  her- 
bicide programs for dry 
beans in 5 tillage systems, 
comparison of Bt vs non-Bt 
corn and corn planted with 
the cross-slot system devel- 
oped in New Zealand. 

Discussions will also be 
held on soil nitrate-N miner- 
alization and relationship 
with soil temperature. 

gram of Michigan, Saginaw 
Bay Water Quality Demon- 
stration Project, Michigan 
Agricultural Stewardship 
Association, MI Department 
of Environmental Quality, 
North Central Kcgion Sus- 
tainable Agriculture Com- 
mittee, MSU Extension, 
Michigan Integrated Food 
and Farming Systems 
Project, and the Innovative 
Farmers’ sponsoring part- 
ners of Huron, Tuscola and 
Sanilac Counties. 
For more information, con- 

tact thc MSU Extension - 
Project Officc, 1460 South 
Van Dyke, Bad A x e ,  M I  
48413. Phone: ( 5  17) 269- 
6099. 

Thursday, August 1 

Friday, August 2 

Monday, August 5 

The Friends of the Library meet, 9:30 a.m. at Rawson 
Memorial Library. 

Alcoholics Anonymous and AI-Anon, Good Shepherd 
Lutheran Church, 8 p.m. 

Dcford Community Church Vacation Bible School, Au- 
gust S-9,li: 15 - 8:30 p.m. at the Deford Community Church, 
1392 Kingston Road, Deford. Ages 3 through 6th grade. 
This year‘s focus is “Honoring God” with the Olympic 
theme! VBS Open House is August 11. 

Novesta Twp. Board meeting, 7:30 p.m. 

Wednesday, August 7 
Duplicate Bridge 7 p.m. at Charmont. Last week’s win- 

ners: Lyle and Marilyn DeRousse. 

Wet we at her con d i t i  o n s 
combined with warm tem- 
peratures have created the 
worst outbreak of wheat scab 
mold in 100 years, according 
to Dr. Gordon Guyer, direc- 
tor of the Michigan Depart- 
ment of Agriculture. 
And like their counterparts 

throughout the Midwest, 
Thumb farmers have not es- 
caped the effects of heavy 
June rains. 

“It’s definitely a factor in 
thenumb. It’s here, the lev- 
els are varying, so I can’t say 
how bad it is,” said Kurt 
Anderson, MSU Extension 
dairy agent for Tuscola and 
Huron counties. 
“Yields will be off. They’re 

going to be reduced,” he 
added. 

Joyce Muz, water quality 
agricultural agent at the 
Tuscola County MSU Exten- 
sion Service Office, agreed. 

“There’s definitely a prob- 
lem,” she said. “Generally, 
statewide, the farther north 
you get, the less of a prob- 
lem there is, but they’re still 
finding a problem here.” 

“The winter was really 
tough on the wheat, and then 
this. It’s not been a banncr 
year for the wheat (farmers),” 
Anderson added. “It’s been 
tough.” 

The wheat harvest is well 
underway in the Thumb, al- 
though rainy weather that 
moved in late in the week- 
end will cause some delays. 
“We’re going to need some 
dry, sunny weather to get 
going again,” Anderson said. 

Agriculture department of- 
ficials said wheat scab 
(Fusarium graminearum), a 
mold, can produce a sub- 
stance called vomitoxin. 
While vomitoxin can affect 
flavors of foods or baking 
quality, its most significant 
effects are poor weight gain 
and feed refusal in livestock 
fed affected wheat, espe- 
cially hogs. 

Vomitoxin rarely poses a 

the growth of the mold dur- 
ing its invasion of the kernel. 
The occurrence of scab does 
not automatically mean that 
vomitoxin is present, but 
when all the factors occur - 
as they did in June - it’s 
more likely vomitoxin will 
be present in harvested 
wheat. Farmers who sell their 

wheat and choose to have it 
tested, should be advised that 
levels of vomitoxin that may 
be present can change up 
until the time it is dried and 
stored. The following are 
guidelines offered by MSU 
Extension to help avoid or 

Additional information on 
wheat scab is available by 
calling the Tuscola County 
Extension Service Office at 

As a result of recent con- 
cerns, MDA has initiated an 
accelerated sampling pro- 
gram for wheat, corn and fin- 
ished feeds to better deter- 
mine the extent of the 
vomitoxin problem and to 
assist producers. 

As an added precaution, 
MDA food inspectors will bk 
sampling wheat ,at 
Michigan’s food processink 
companies before it is used 
to make flour, pastries and 

(517) 672-3870. 

health risk to humans be- 
cause food processing meth- 
ods greatly decrease its con- 
centration. People are ad- 
vised, however, to refrain 
from eating raw wheat dur- 
ing years when wheat scab 
may be present. 

Guyer said many grain el- 
evators and milling compa- 
nies are testing each load of 
wheat as it is delivered. Oth- 
ers, which do not have test- 
ing equipment on site, are 
sending wheat samples to 
independent testing facilities. 

“Purchasers of grain need 
to know the incidence and 
concentration of vomitoxin 
so the wheat can be properly 
stored,” said Guyer. “Farm- 
ers who intend to keep their 
wheat for livestock feed 
should also have it tested.’’ 

Vomitoxin-infected wheat 
can be used if  it ik diluted 
with clean grain, following 
guidelines established by the 
Food and Drug Administra- 
tion. 
Certain conditions promote 

the development of wheat 
scab. If wheat is flowering 
with spores present during 
warm, humid weather, mold 
can set in. These conditions 
were present at the same time 
over much of the Midwest in 
early June. 

Vomitoxin, also called 
deoxynivalenol or DON, is 
produced as a by-product of 

minimize mold problems in other food products. 

McLaren points to, wheat: 
.Minimize insect damage 

to growing crops and grains 
in storage. Take appropriate 
control measures when nec- 
essary. 

.Take extra precautions 
when storing weather- 
stressed or insect-damaged 
crops to minimize mold 
growth in storage. 
.Harvest crops on time. Do 

not leave mature crops in the 
field any longer than neces- 
sary. 
.Store feeds properly. Dry 

grains to the appropriate 
moisture level. 

.Inspect grains regularly 
for excessive temperature, 
mold growth and insect dam- 
age. 

_. 

Wedding 
Announcements A 

e e experience in office 
puter program that would 
meet the county’s needs. The 
program is widely used now 
and has enabled Tuscola 
County to become one of the 
most efficient and up-to-date 
counties in the state in record 
information and processing. 

Catalogs loaned 
overnight . Incumbent Ginny McLaren 

s seeking reelection as 
ruscola County Register of 
keds.  
McLaren, 42, a Republican, 
aid she is the only candidate 
‘or this office with experi- 
mce. She cited her 15 years 
I f  experience in the register’s 
Iffice, including 8 as thc reg- 
ster, which have given her 
nvaluable experiencc and 
mowledge i n  mccting the 
iublic’s needs. She feels that 
:xperience, knowledge of thc 
)ecords and county, and thc 
lands-on ability to h e  a 
Norking membcr of‘ the of- 
ice from day one are the true 
jualifications of  the job. 
“This is not just a supervi- 

Free Subscription 
with each order 

Cass City 
Chronicle 

Phone 872-201 0 

She is quick to add, though, 
that she still maintains one of 
the lowest budgets for man- 
dated services in the county, 
She also credits her staff for 
their efficiency and dedica- 
tion in helping to accomplish 
the goals she set. 
McLaren said her goals for 

the future include winning 
reelection in the Aug. 6 and 
Nov, 5 elections, and then 
working to develop an on- 
line service between the 
county offices and the pub- 
lic for immediate access of 
the public records. She feels 
this program would be 01 
great benefit to local govern- 
ment and businesses working 
in the real estate field, includ. 
ing banks, realtors and ab. 
strac tors. 

McLaren, a resident 0: 
Tuscola County for over 32 
years, has been active in vol- 
unteer events and civic orga- 
nizations such as Walk for 
Warmth, 4-H, Christmas in 
July, American Cancer and 
Muscular Dystrophy drives, 
food bank collections, and 
many more, She has been 
elected as an officer and 
chairperson to several state 
government associations and 
was presented with a Con- 
tinuing Education Award 
from Michigan State Univer- 

Speakers far this year’s 
project will include Pat Hart, 
MSU Plant Pathologist; Gary 
Powell, MSU Crop and Soil 
Sciences Department, and 
Maury Vitosh, MSU Fertil- 
izer Specialist. Other speak- 
ers will be available from the 
Soil Doctor, Trans-Till and 
Cross-Slot planting system. 

The cost of the tour is $5 
per person, which includes 
lunch. The tour is sponsored 

Ginny McLaren KEEP 14YEARS DRAIN 
CODE ADMINISTRATION 
EXPERIENCE WORKING 

FOR YOU! 

sory position and uniortu- 
nately, you can’t learn every- 
thing y o u  need to know 
about the office in a class- 
room. I’ve worked in every 
position in  the office and 
with each one came experi- 
cnce and knowledge that 1 
otherwise wouldn’t have 
had. It’s irreplaceablc.” 

She citcd one  of  her major 
accomplishments as ending 
free services to businesses 
that cost the taxpayers more 
than $30,000 yearly. She also 
points at her involvement in 
legislation that helped bring 
State allocatcd fees back to 
Tuscola County. 

“Between the policy 
changes and return of fecs, 
Tuscola County seems to 
have benefited to the tune of  
more than $190,000 in just 
the last few years alone.” 
Acknowledging that one of 

her goals in  her previous 
election was computerizing 
the office, she said that has 
now been acc om p I i shed . 
McLaren was instrumental in 
helping to develop a com- 

cheerleadi ng at Mi I1 i ng ton 
High School. She and her 
husband, Ric, have been 
married 22 years, have 3 
children, one grandchild, and 
reside in the Millington area. 

“I love my job and serving 
the public, and working with 
kids just seems to bring it full 
circle. The records are the 
past, the people are the 
present, and the kids are the 
future. That’s really what the 
job and life are all about, pre- 
serving the past for the fu- 

WHOLE 
HOUSE 
FULL OF 

WINDOWS $1199* 
‘Based on 6 double hungs & 1 plcture window 1200 sq. in. - 

m 
WHh window purchase for sub-structure 

WlNWwS Free Garden Window 
Free Screendocks 
Free Double Strength Glass $ Roo Free lhermo Glass 

EACH MO. Free Trim Work 

FOR YOUR ENTIRE HOME 

1; As $35 RR Mo. 

AS $1,799* - -  
LOW J 
AS VALID WITH NEW PHONE PURCHASE ONLY 

bmmzmmd 

E L LU LA RONE’’ 
Add Insulation And Beauty 

Cover Soff iVFacia With A 
To Your Home 

Vinyl Wrap And Never Paint 
Again 

Trim/New Caulk 
Cover Exterior Window 

New Gutters/Downspouts 
In Choice of Color 
New Shutters With Every 
Siding Order (Limit 2 Pair) 

#Based on 24’x36’ ranch at 12% 
Interest, 84 mo. financing I ‘Prm avaikbk to rmw 

customers who actlvate 
mth CellukrOne Lake CAR0 Caro Centre (Near Central Shop-Rite) 

SALE ENDS AUGUST 15.1996 
1-800-288-4385 

STATE LICENSE #2101109016 
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DEAN MCBRIDE, 13, of Cass City spent Thursday after- 
noon at Helen Stevens Memorial Pool trying to cool off. The 
pool offers many sessions of open swimming as well as swim- 
ming lessons and water aerobics. 

I BAD TO THE BONE... 
For no-holds-barred racing performance, I accept no substitutes. The Kawasaki 
KX80 & KX125 are proven leadcrs in 
motocross engineering , 
Test drive a winner. The Kawasaki KX8O 
& KX 125, available right here. 

I 
Hurry! Only 2 Left 

. 2-Stroke, Liquid-Cooled Engine 
Kawasaki Integrated Power-Vdlvc 

Bottom-Link UNI-TRAK“ Linkage 
High-Tensile-Steel Perirnctcr Frame 

System 

Don’t Make A $100.00 Mistake, 
Shop At  he them’s  Before You Buy!! 

LAETHEM’S-CAR0 
“Your One Stop Shop” On M-24 In Car0 

“ IY% K a w a d i  Motors Corp , IJ S A Al- 
way5 wcilr ii hclmci and ilppropriatc nppnrcl 
Sclccwd nrtdels id Ninia’a gL Cruisers Avail- 
ahlc AI llugc Saving> 

Something to do for everyone 

Attendance down at park 
by Rebecca Messer 

Staff Writer 

Not as many area residents 
have been attending the pro- 
grams offered by Cass City 
parks and recreation this 
summer. 

Whether it be at the pool 
taking swimming lessons, 
joining arts and crafts or par- 

ticipating in a summer rec- 
reational sports league, atten- 
dance has been down. Even 
though attendance is down, 
parks and recreation employ- 
ees continue to work hard to 
provide activities for every 
interest and every age level. 
Sarah Wright, director of 

the arts and crafts program, 
and her staff have been kcep- 

THEARTSAND CRAFTS program in 
Cass City has offered a variety of ac- 
tivities for children of all ages this surn- 
mer. Kyle Swanson, 7, of Cass City 
plays pin drop Friday afternoon dur- 
ing carnival day, while his friend, Kyle 
Hartwick, 8, of Cass City watches. 

Sr. Citizens’ Menu 

ProposaI 1 
Help Fire, Ambulance, and 
Law-Enforcement Officers 

communicate with each other 
to save lives. 

Help is available ... IF THE 
CALL CAN BE HFARD! 

~~ 

Paid for by the Citizens for Safer Communicetions 420 Court Street Cam, MI 48723 

Senior citizens are asked to 
make reservutions on the day 
of the meal between 8 a.m. 
and 9 u.m. by cal l ing 
Berenice Sowden, 872-2397. 

AUG. 2-5-6-9 

Friday - Baked ham, dilled 
potato, broccoli/cukes/sour 
cream, hot roll, lemon pic 
square. 

Monday - Oven fried 
chicken, potato salad, baked 
beans, French bread, pine- 
apple tidbits. 

Tuesday - Roast beef/ 
gravy, mashed potatoes, 
Harvard beets, tomato 
wedges, variety bread, apple 
p i.e . 
Friday - Beef stew, stewed 

tomatoes, carrots, potatoes, 
onions, biscuit, fresh banana. 

ing area children busy this 
summer with a variety of ac- 
tivities. 

Although attendance has 
been down this year, plenty 
of children are still taking 
advantage of what arts and 
crafts have to offer. 

In addition to offering nor- 
mal arts and crafts such as 
basket weaving, copper tool- 
ing and plaster molds, the 
program has offered special 
days to keep area children 
busy. 
T-shirt day was the first spe- 

cial day organized by Wright 
and her staff. More than 70 
children had the opportunity 
to create their very own t- 
shirt by one of 2 methods. 
They could either color sand 
paper and iron it on their shirt 
or use a spin art machine 
donated by a local craft store 
that spun an array of colors 
onto the shirts. 

About 21 children rode 
bikes in the Fourth of July 
parade. Two recent activity 
days were treasure hunt day 
and carnival day. Twenty 
clues were hidden through- 
out the recreational park and 
the children were broken into 
groups of 9 to find the hid- 
den treasure. Candy was 
passed out to the winning 
team. 
The arts and crafts program 

has also offered activities for 
preschool age children, as 
well. Two of the special days 
were nature scavenger hunt, 
where the preschoolers had 
a bag and brought back any- 

thing from nature they found 
interesting, and obstacle 
course day. 

Upcoming events are sum- 
mer Olympics day, Aug. 2, 
and an end of the summer 
picnic, Aug. 15. 

Most of the activities are 
geared for children age 7 to 
12. There is no fee to join 
and interested children can 
join activities at any time. 

Also offered from the arts 
and crafts building is a sum- 
mer recreational sports 
league. Coordinator Aaron 
Hewitt works with children 
age 7 to 16 throughout the 
summer, but he added he will 
accept all ages. 

“Pretty much if they can 
shoot or play the sport we let 
them play,” he said. 

Five different sports, bas- 
ketball, softball, soccer, in- 
line skating and golf, are of- 
fered Monday through 
Thursday. Friday, Hewitt 
said, is mystery day. 
“I try to come up with a dif- 

ferent sport or activity to do 
for Fridays,” he said. 
All sports are offered from 

3 to 4 p.m. with the excep- 
tion of golf, which is from 9 
to 11 a.m. at Northwood 
Shores Golf Course. 

Hewitt said attendance has 
been low for him also. “We 
started out with 20 or 30 kids, 
but lately because of camps 
and vacation Bible school, 
we’ve had maybe IO.” 

Because of the low atten- 
dance, keeping the activities 
going has been difficult, 

Hewitt said. “Even if the 
kids show up,” he explained, 
“if they walk up and see no 
other kids there, they don’t 
stay.” 
The sports program will be 

offered through Aug. 16. 
Swimming is another popu- 

lar activity for children dur- 
ing their summer break. At- 
tendance, however, has been 
low also. Pool co-director 
Jennifer Fruendt attributes 
the poor attendance to the 
weather. 

“We haven’t had as hot a 
summer as in past years,” she 
said. 

While attendance at open 
swim has been down, the 
swimming lessons and other 
activities offered at the pool 
have had good attendance, 
she said. 

The pool offers Red Cross 
swimming lessons, levels 
one through 7. The swim 
lessons are offered in 4, 2- 
week sessions throughout the 
summer. The fourth session 
starts Aug. 5. Lessons cost 
$10. 

One of the more popular 
programs this summer, ac- 
cording to Fruendt, has been 
the water aerobics offered 
from 6 to 7 p.m. Monday, 
Wednesday and Friday, “We 
have actually had a pretty 
good following for aerobics.” 
Also offered are infant and 

preschool aquatics and pri- 
vate swimming lessons for 
children as well as adults. 
The pool will close for the 
summer during the week of 
Aug, 18. 

Several face charges 
The following people were 

recently arraigned on felony 
charges in Tuscola County 
District Court: 

*Jonathan Swinton, 42, 
Vassar, was charged with car- 
rying a dangerous weapon 
(shotgun) with unlawful in- 
tent and possession of a fire- 
arm in the commission of a 
felony July 26 in Juniata 
Township. 
Bond was set at $3,000 and 

a preliminary examination 
was scheduled for Aug. 5 at 
9:30 a.m. 

*Maxim0 Sandoval, 43, 
Akron, faces one count of as- 
sault with a dangerous 
weapon (beer bottle) June 29 
in Akron Township. 
Bond was set at $5,000 and 

a preliminary exam was 
slated for Aug. 5 .  

@Inmate Robert J. Engle, 
51, was arraigned on a 
charge of extortion May 20 
in Indianfields Township. 

He faces a preliminary 
exam Aug. 5 .  Bond was set 
at $5,000. 

*Jeffrey S. Pritchard, 23, 
Vassar, is charged with mali- 
cious destruction of property 
valued at more than $100 
(1994 Chevrolet Lumina) 
July 5 in Vassar Township. 
Bond was set at $2,000 and 

a Dreliminary exam was 

scheduled for Aug. 5. 
.Edward M. Palmer, 18, 

Caro, was charged with 3 
counts of conspiracy to com- 
mit breaking and entering 
with intent to commit lar- 
ceny, 3 counts of breaking 
and entering with intent to 
commit larceny, and 2 counts 
of larceny in a building stem- 
ming from break-ins last 
December in Dayton Town- 
ship. 
Bond was set at a combined 

$3,000. A preliminary exam 
will be held Aug. 5. 

*Daniel J. Spencer, 36, 
Caro, faces charges of oper- 
ating a motor vehicle while 
under the influence of liquor, 
third offense, driving while 
his license was suspended or 
revoked, possession of an 
open intoxicant in  a motor 
vehicle, driving without in- 
surance, and unlawful use of 
a registration plate July 12 in 
Ellington Township. 

His preliminary exam was 
scheduled for Aug. 5. Bond 
was set at $2,000. 

a URGENT 
The evidence proves that it’s time for a change in the 

County Treasurer’s Office 
TheTrue & Documented Job Performance of the 

Current Sanilac County Treasurer: 

1 FACT SOURCE 
Spent $14,430.65 for elaborate furnishings without 
Board of Commissioner’s approval. 

Copy of Statement - Invoices 
452 180 and 454358 April & May 1996 

$2,326.50 in IRS Tax Penalties Paid From General 
Fund Without obtaining Board of Commissioner’s 
approval. 

IRS Letter and Voucher - May 1996 

Auditor’s Financial Statements 
Auditor’s Management Letters - 5 years 

”Illegal Investnients” (Do not adhere to State 
Laws and Attorney General Opinions). 

Mingled County Business with Political Activity. Letters to Schools Disbursing Taxes - 
May 1996 - Asking for support on official 
letterhead. 

School Taxes Not Paid Out In a Timely Manner Auditor’s Management Letter - 1994 

Vote for an Accountant - - Not a Politician! 
HIRE MCGUIRE FOR COUNTY TREASURER 

Paid for by the Committee to Elect Douglas D. McGuire County Treasurer 
3 S. Elk St., Sandusky. MI 48471 * 
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HOON K. 
JEUNG, M.D. 

Surgeon 
Speclalist in Stomach 
and Bowel Problems 

Saturday - 9 to 12 noon 
9 a rn to 5 p rn Daily 

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

FAMILY RURAL 
HEALTH CARE 
‘‘We’re h e w  fur your 
health care needs” 

Richard A. Hall, D.0. 

4674 Hill St., Cass City 
John Zawacki PA-C 
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Closed Thursday 
6230 Hospital Drive 
Cass City, MI 48726 

Phone 872-461 1 

Phone 872-4725 
Office Hours: 

Mon.-Fri. 9 a.m.-5 p.m. 

Alignmenls Mufflers 
9 Brakes -011 Changes 

Phone 872-5084 
Pigeon Phone 453-3531 

Green boasts perfect 
record ;of attendance 

When the Michigan House 
of Representatives broke for 
the summer, Rep. Mike 
Green recorded a perfect at- 
tendance record for the first 
half of the year. 
In fact, Green, R-Mayville, 

has been present every day 
since the start of the 88th leg- 
islative term in January 1995. 

Speaker Paul Hillegonds 
applauded Green’s commit- 
men t. 

“Representative Green’s 
hard work on the floor and 
in committee is a testament 
to his dedication to the 84th 
District,” said Hillegonds, R- 
Holland. “His drive and ini- 
tiative assure constituents 
that they have a concerned 
and responsible voice in Lan- 
sing,” 

The Legislature resolved a 
number of issues before the 
June recess including pas- 
sage of a comprehensive ju- 
venile justice package which 

gives trial courts more dis- 
cretion in trying and sentenc- 
ing young violent offenders. 

A 1 so approved we re 
interdistrict schools of 
choice, Friend of the Court 
reforms to strengthen en- 
forcement of court-ordered 
child support and visitation, 
and a no-file, no-form option 
for state income tax payers. 

As a representative of an 
agricultural district, Green 
has concentrated on legisla- 
tion to enhance the farming 
and food processing indus- 
tries. He is the sponsor o f  
laws which establish aquac- 
ulture as a farming enterprise 
and exempt seed registries 
using accepted certification 
methods from liability for 
bad crop seed. 

This year, he introduced 
legislation to protect dairy 
producer9 hy  tightc:ning 
guidelines for licensiiig dairy 
plants. 

Green is vice chair of the 
House Agriculture and For- 
estry Committee and a mem- 
ber of the human services, 
transportation and insurance 
panels. 

Green said that under a Re- 
pub1 ican-con trolled legisla- 
ture, Michigan taxpayet 
have enjoyed 2 1 tax cuts, re- 
ductions i n  government 
spending, a balanced budgit 
and greater freedom to 
choose schools for their chil- 
dren. 

“The list of achievements 
goes on and on,” he said, 
“This fall, legislators will 
work to resolvc difference. 
about the proposed gradu- 
ated license system and ex- 
plore ways to offer appren- 
ticeship programs for train- 
irig arid hiring skilled work- 
ers. It should he a busy and 
c h al I e n g i ng time ,” 

CAITIE BARNES of Cass City enjoys 
a picnic at the park last Thursday. 
Rawson Memorial Library held the 
picnic in honor of the library’s sum- 
mer readers. A group of summer read- 
ers raised $350 during a read-a-thon 
recently at the library. 

MARY AND NICHOLAS Shantz ate hot dogs, potato chips 
and orange drink during the picnic also. About 100 people 
attended the picnic and played games afterward. 

NFIP offering 
flood insurance 

Michigan Athletic & Rehabilitation Center 
Chris Putnam is an Athletic Trainer at 

Michigan Athletic and Rehabilitation Cen- 
ter. Chris graduated from Ovid-Elsie High 
School. He continued his education at Cen- 

tral Michigan University where he received 
his Bachelor of Science degree in Sports Medi- 

cine. Chris had his internship at Dow Chemical in Midland 
and started with M.A.R.C. in January of 1996. Chris resides 
in Pigeon. 
At M.A.R.C. Chris Derforms treatment under the direction of 

0 
b l . 3 .  C. 

1 Professional and Business 

( .  I DIRECTORY 
In view of‘ recent flooding, 

disaster officials are remind- 
ing homeowners, renters and 
business owners throughout 
the Midwest that they rnay 
purchase flood insurance 
coveragc t hroug ti t tic Na 
tional Flood Irrsui iiircc Pro- 
gram (NFIP) administered 
by the Fedcral Insurance 
Administration, a part of the 
Fedcral Eriiergency Manage- 
ment Agency ( I X M A ) .  

“Ycar i n  and year out, 
flooding is the leading cause 
of property loss from natu- 
ral disasters in this country,” 
said FI‘MA Director Jarnes 
Lec Witt. “Hut  all too often, 
honieowiici s Icar-n af‘tcr the 
fact that protcctiun against 
flood loss is not part of their 
norrniil insurance protection 
paukagc. 

Witt pointed out that thcre 
are about I O  niillion house- 
holds situated in designaied 
f lood  ha/ard iircas i n  the 
United States, yet only 25 
percent of them arc insured 
against floods. 

In  Michigan, 2 1,546 poli- 
cies are currently i n  force, 
representing nearly $ I  .h hil- 
lion in coverage. Since 1’378. 
$24,634,939 has hceri paid 
for 6,802 Michigan claims. 
Flood insurance is available 

only to rcsidents o f  w n i i i i i i -  

nitics which have agreed to 
adopt and enforce sound 
flood plain managcnicnt 
practices. 
To find out whether a coin- 

munity is participating in the 

NFIP program, homeowners 
can contact their local offi- 
cials, insurance agents or 
lonciing institutions, or they 
can call the NFIP general in- 
forniation toll-free hotline, 1- 
800-427 4661 

Bcirctits of federally- 
backed tlood insurance in- 
cludc: 

Eligibility lor secured fi- 
nancing to buy, build or im- 
prove structures in special 
tlood hazard areas - Lending 
institutions that are federally 
regulated or insured must see 
evidence of NFIP coverage 
hcf‘ore they grant secured fi- 
n i t  nc in g.  

Reduced risk of flooding 
- Buildings substantially 
damaged by flood, if rebuilt 
to NFIP new construction 
standards, have less risk of 
damage from flooding and 
are eligible for NFIP cover- 
age at a reduced rate. 

Protection against being 
uninsured in  the event of a 
flood - Standard 
homeowners insurance poli- 
cies do not compensate for 
flood damage. 

Less expensive than fed- 

eral disaster loans - ,4verage 
annual premiums for NFIP 
coverage are significantly 
less expensive than loan pay- 
ments, even when those 
loans are granted under fa- 
vorahle terms. Also, flood 
damage from events that are 
not federally declared disas- 
ters is still covered by NFIP 
policies. 

Homeowners who carry 
national flood insurance are 
covered for any flood-related 
damage to the ground level 
or upper floor(s) of their 
homes and their contents. 
Coverage for flood-caused 
damage to basements is lim- 
ited to basic items such as 
furnaces, water heaters, 
washers and driers, etc. 
Flood insudince coverage is 

available for the personal 
belongings of renters, and for 
both structures and contents 
of businesses. These policies 
may be obtained from l i -  
censed insurance agents, the 
same ones who sell auto or 
homeowners policies. If you 
need guidance, you may call 
the toll-free FEMA number, 
1-800-427-466 I ,  for a refer- 
ral to an agent near you. 

Anderson, lbckey, 
3ernhardt, Doran & CO., P.C. 

Certified Public Accountants 
Gary Anderson, CPA (Caro) 

Robert Tuckey, CPA (Cass City) 
Jerry Berrihardt, CPA (Caro) 
TtiWTiii5 Lh ra r i ,  CPA (Caro) 

Valerie Janiiesori, CPA (Cass City) 
715 E. Frank St., Caro, MI 

Phone 673-31 37 
6261 Church St , Cass City, MI 

Phone 872-3730 -------- 
COUNSELING 

DOUGLAS 
PANKRATZ, M.D. 

Board Certified 
Orthopaedic 

Surgery 
*Specializing in 

Joint Replacement, 
Arthroscopic 

Surgery & 
Fracture Care 

4672 Hill Street 
Cass City, MI 48726 

HOURS BY 
APPOINTMENT 

a Physical Therapisi. He performs fitness evaluations and oversees 
the operation of the fitness program. Aside from his skills in Sports Medicine, Chris ha 
a background in rehabilitation of the industrial worker. Chris has received training in 
ergonomics and enjoys this work area. As a skilled professional at M.A.R.C., Chris is 
available to help with your rehahilitation needs. If we can be of assistance, call us at 517- 
872-2084. 

/ 

LOCATED IN HILLS & DALES HOSPITAL, 4675 HILL ST,, CASS CITY 

DOYOU HAVE A 
DRINKING PROBLEM? 

ALCO ti OL IC S 
ANONYMOUS 

MEETINGS 
AND AL-ANON 

Every Friday Fveriing - 8:00 p.m. 

Good Shepherd Lutheran Church 

I Cass City ‘1 (517) 872-4320 
ICII---- 

INSURANCE nm- 

Harr(s-Hamprhlr0 I I (517) 269-9551 
. . . . . . . .. - . I 1  - 

I N.Y.Yun, M.D. I 
Physician & Surgeon 

Office Hours: 
Mom-Fri. - 9 a.m. to 5 p.m 

Thurs. - Closed 
Sat. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
6232 Hospital Drive 

Cass City 
1 Office 872-4733 

Res. 8724257 ------- 
HEALTH CARE 

2OMMUNITY RURAL 
HEALTH CENTER 

HEALTH CARE 
$50 fee 

Including physician’s fee 
and clinic room 

No appointment necessary 
Open 6 a.m. - 10 p.m. 
HILLS & DALES 

GENERAL HOSPITAL 
072-2 1 2 1 

Physician on site 24 hr./day 
for emergency care. 

FOR NON-EMERGENCY DR. PAUL A. GOLSCH 
Optometrist 

0 Glasses iri about an hour 
0 Eye examinations 
0 Glasses & Corilact lenses 

Outside prescriptions filled 
* Vision insurance plans welcome 

100 W t iurori Ave , 
Bad Axe 269-9759 

461 N S a t e  St Caro 673-8155 
25 S Elk, Saridusky 648-3354 
I------- 

PHY SIC1 ANS 
----I--- 

You Find Need the Service in This. or . . Product . Action Guide1 I SERVICE DIRECTORY 

Automotive Rust Proofing 
Svstems &Waxing 

Sandy Tierney, Owner $-4+ Up To 60% Off At1 Serta Bedding -- Including Serta Perfect SIeeDer’ 
I SERVICE 

872-1101 
Washers, Dryers, 

Dishwashers, Microwaves, 

Gravel Guards 
Running Boards 

Phone. 269-9585 
Rock Kote Stone Chip Protection 

- 

PRICES $‘ 
STARTING 

ASLOWAS w\- 
SERTA FIRM Comfwtdsupport 

’ 
I All Brands 

Stoves, Refrigerators, 

7 17 1 Severance Rd. 
1 I Sat. 9 a.m. - 12 p.m. I 

PODIATRISTS 
-------- 
-------- 

at a super price 

‘149 
349 

FULL- SIZE 
Ea. Pc 
WEEN-SIZE $ 
2Pc  set 

TWINSIZE 3 KING- Pc Set SIZE $479 
Ea Pc 

1 1  WINDOW CLEAN IN^ I 8 7 2 - 3 4 9 0 

1 1 KITCHEN AND LAUNDRY I I FULL LINE OF MAGIC CHEF I ’ I 

Cass City I Dr. Jeffrey Crowley 
Chiropractor 

4452 Doerr Rd 
(across from Shell Gas Station) 

Phone 872-4241 

SUPREME 
W I N’DOW C LEAN I N G NORTHEASTERN 

FOOT CLINIC 
Dr. Judi Ecker 

Dr. Thomas Bobrowski 
“YOUR FAMILY FOOT 

CARE CENTER” 
4672 Hill St., Cass City 

072-4327 or 
3592 Center, Essexville 

895-8594 
----I-- 

v ETE R I N A R I A N s i  
-c-c---- 

[ESERV~CE-J 
Cass City Wrecker 

Service/Auto Electric 

Blaine deBeaubien, Prop. 
Phone 872-2251 

I 6597 Main. Cass Citv I 

Specializing in auto L truck electrical wiring. 
Certilied Mechanic 

Storms - Screens - Windows 
Janitorial Service Floors 
Eaves & Gutters Cleaned 
Hi-Riser Service & Rental 

Estimates on Commercial, 
Residential & lndustrigl Work 

Complete Insurance Coverage 
Security Services Available 

1120 Gratiot, Saginaw 
Call 79017609 

CALL US TODAL 
Fuelgas 

Division of Thermogas 
961 N.VanDyke Rd., Bad Axe 

Phone 269-9955 
S.H. Raythatha, M.D. 

Dr. Ray 
Total Family Care 

4672 Hill St. 

24-HR. SERVICE 

mm 
PLUMBING & HEATING, INC 

CASS CiTY TIRE 
Hercules and Cooper 

TIRES PERFECTSLEEPER I t . 7 -  
Edward Scollon, D.V.M. 

Veterinarian / I  Farm and 

Cass City 
Phone 872-501 0 

I Tire repair I I  6528 Main 
FULL Ea Pc SIZE 

$ 219 
OUCEN SIZE J $429 2 P c  set 499 
KING SIZE $ 

1WlN SIZE Ea Pc JPc Set 699 9579 

To Place An Ad 

in The 

Action Guide 

Call 872-201 0 

Pet Animals 
Phone 072-2935 I Office Hours: Mon.-Fri. 8-5 I I DAN’S POWER & STOVE I [  FLOORING It All Starts With Low Prices!! SUPERSTORE!! - 

To place an ad in 
the Professional 

Directory 
Call 872-2010 

Fireplaces, Stoves, Chimneys 
Chimney Sweeping & Repairs 

Gas, Wood Fireplaces; 
Stoves & Fireplace Inserts 

Sales & Service 
6509 Main, Cass City 

Phone 872-31 90 

Warju’s Flooring 
Carpet, Pad, Labor 
1227 E. Caro Rd. 
Caro, MI 48723 
51 7-672-3563 

ALL PETS 
VETERINARY CLINIC 

P.C. 
Susan Hoppe D.V.M. 
4438 S. Seeger St. 

Phone 872-2255 
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Coach Torn Oesch an. 
nounced that mandatory 
football practice for Cass 
City students in grades 9- 
12 starts Monday, Aug. 12, 
at 6 p.m. 

Physical cards must be 
turned in before candi- 
dates can practice. For 
further information, con- 
tact Oesch at 872-5369. 

996 PAGE NINE 

Maurer to IFootball 1 play with Chip 
Shots 

practice 
starts Aug. 12 I all stars 

@- I 

MEN'S GOLF LEAGUE Dick Peterson 
Bob Stickle 

2 MAN GOLF LEAGUE 98 
68 

133 
127 
119 
118 
112 
1 09 
105 
101 
98 
98 

*93 

SCRATCH FLIGHT EARLY DIVISION 
FLIGHT #4 

Dave Hoard 
Jerry Toner 
Don Ouvry 
Jason McCallum 
Bill Kritzman 
Newell Harris 
Mark Swanson 
Terry Wiseman 
Mike Murphy 
Craig Helwig 
Dale McIntosh 
Rich Tate 
Clark Erla 
Mike Becking 

135 
134 
126 
122 
116 
115 
115 
110 
104 
102 
1 00 
91 
88 
82 

Burns/Jeung 
WilliamsoniRieman 
Becking/Glaza 
Wall ace/Aple y 
StricklancUSchel ke 
HendPeters 
BlissBaker 
Maharg/Pas ieczny 
Pe P. Dillon/Morgan terson/Zdrojews ki 

S tickleAwankovi tsc h 
HerrordFole y 
W. Dillon/Retherford 
Martinmost 

157 
157 
137 
125 
120 
116 
116 
11s 
113 
109 
1 00 
73 
63 
56 

Bert Althaver 
Anton Peters 
Clayton Sawdon 
John Niebrzydoski 
John Agar 
Mick Dawson 
Bruce LeValley 
Dave Hutchinson * 
Dickie Green 
George Bushong 
Phil Robinson 
Bye CHAMPS AGAIN - Cass City's Cole Carbide Industries 

team, composed of (from left) Craig Kelley, Paul Ulfig, Joel 
Palmateer and Jeff Krol, won the Chicago Bulls 3-011-3 
Shootout for the second straight year July 20-21 in Chicago. 
The team repeated last year's performance, going undefeated 
in 5 games. 

Ryan Maurer 

Ryan Maurer, 6-foot, 175- 
pound defensive back frorrl 
Ubly High School, has been 
selected to participate in the 
Michigan High School 
Coaches Association al I-s tar 
football game Aug. 3. He 
will be on the east sauad. 

*Points to be adjusted. 
FLIGHT #I LATE DIVISION 

Dan Dickinson 134 fiesday Morning 
Elwyn Helwig Ladies' Golf 130 _ _  

K. SmitMBiddinger 147 
138 ChappelPasant 

Cass City 
Chronicle 9 872-2010 

Ken Zdrojewski * 121 
Jim Apley 117 
Fred Leeson 112 

111 Jim Peyerk 
Ernie Bellew 110 
Don Hilbig I09 
Doug Zdrojewski 107 
Chris Moses 107 

1 os Tom Wallace 
Daryl Iwankovitsch 94 

93 John Maharg 
Russ Biefer "68 

McCallum/Randall 129 
#1 - l8 J. HillakerMurphy 128 

Port Austin Players D. ZdrojewsWK. Martin 126 
C. HillakerLaming 123 

121 Hartel/Commcn t 
95 Doerr/Haire 
91 Hoolrnoner 
80 Wrighflrieskorn 

D. Srnith/Regnerus 73 

I Elect I 

.-.- 1- 
1 Nelle Maharg 

Joan Montgomery 
Mary Rabideau 
Ardis Haist 
Toby Weaver 
Fran Bellew 
Linda Helwig 
Bunny O'Berski 

89.0 
88.5 
87.0 
81.0 
75.0 
71.0 
62.5 
55,O 

PRICE REDUCTION!!! present 'zittle Women 

NOW $79,900 Was 
$80,800 

dren and their appreciation. 
Who can forget tom-boy Jo - FLIGHT #2 (Rose Hoelzle, Cass City) 

and her sacrificing her hair 
to help finance her Marmee's 
(Terry McGrath, Port Austin) 
trip to Washington. Her 
beautiful scenes with Beth 
(Amy Kalls, Bad Axe) and 
Little Amy, (Ann Kelly, Port 
Austin) and her confronta- 
tion with Meg (Debi Curson, 
Sandusky) are all here. 

Rounding out this cast of 
members from Huron, 
Tuscola and Sanilac counties 
are Jason Gaffke, Port Hope; 
Bill Pietscher, Port Austin; 
Jeff Yaroch, Kinde; Sue 
Surian, Cass City; Marcy 
McKenzie, Port Austin, and 
Alex Randall, Bad Axe. 
The play is under the direc- 

tion o f  Penny Pearson, Port 
Austin, and is being done in 
repertory with "Winnie-the- 
Pooh." Show dates are Fri- 
day, Aug. 2; Sunday, Aug. 4; 
Thursday, Aug. 8, and Satur- 
day, Aug. 10. 
For more information, call 

the theater, 5 17-738-52 17. 

Flight #2 - 18 Holes 

Rick Doerr 
Jim Hobbs 
Jim Smithson 
Gene Konieczny 
Jack Burns 
Rick Hollis 
Brian Reinhardt 
Dan Hittler 
Dick Haley 
Craig Bellew 
Dick Wallace 
Jack Hool 
Gene Kloc 
John Riddle 

131 
128 
125 
120 
I13 
1 1 1  

"1 10 
106 
1 0s 
101 
97 
94 
92 

*84 

73.5 Jean Pasieczny 
Peg Veldman 72.5 
Barb Wilson 69.5 

64.0 Lil Jaroch 
62.0 Pat Posluszny 
56.5 June Licht 
43.0 Marie Scott 

Commissioner 

EYE CARE 
& EBMR 

Flight #3 - 9 Holes 

Eleanora Rees 82 
76 Jane Hool 

Noreen Krug 70 
Betty Zulauf 67 
Blanche Rumptz 64 
Mary Lou Maurer 63 
Arlene Regentine 58 

FOR EVERYONE FLIGHT #3 

Extra Options Included In This Home: 68 x 28 ARBOR T E M C E  
MODEL M90 I6 

( 5 )  Pr. Residential Shutters Corner Window Seat-Bedroom 2 (61 Can I i o h i c  . 

Doug O'Dell 
Stan Guinther 
Phil Moses 
Charles Tunis 
Gary Robinson 
Jon Zdrojewski 
Duane Henn 
Craig Weaver 
Cas Pasieczny 
Bill Ewald 

135 
126 
125 
I17 
I16 
112 
107 
106 
104 
100 

1 Professional eye 

1 Prescript ions filled 
1 Large selection of 

exams 
Member of the 

Wa trousv ille United 
Methodist Church 

Crestwood Shinelcs 
6/ I 2  Roof  Pitch 
Small Gable Over Dlnlnp R w n l  
Hydrock Exterior 
R-30 Ceiling Insulation 
(2)  Frost Free Faucets 
( 1 ) Exterior Receptacle 
IR Bath in Uti l i ty Root11 
Sieel Atrium h r  WlScreen 

Corner Window Scat-Master Bath 
Octagon Window 
! I )  Witidow Mailtle 
Upgraded ( 'nrpct in p W/Paddi ng 
Ceramic Tile ~ Hall Bath 
12" Marble Look Tile-Small Entry 
White Painted W W ~  Blfolds 
Mirrored C'losrt Sliders 

Flight #4 - 9 Holes 

Shirley Grifka 72 
Dani Hicks 65 
Phyllis Ridge 52 
Verna Mae MacRae 5 1 

43 Marian Harm . 
Virginia Ruthko 37 

lrames 

No-line bifocals 
Glasses repaired 
Blue Cross & VSP 
participant 

DAVID C. 
BATZER II, O.D. 

Professional Eye Care 
Bad Axe Cass City 

1 All types of contacts 

269-7263 872-3404 

Hard working, I honest and fair 1 
rand for by the cornmlttre 

111 elrci Drnnls Henry 

MANUFACTURED MODULAR HOMES 
"We Service Afler The Sale" 

1400 E. Caro Rd., Caro Ph. (517) 672-1400 
-IN CASS CITY- 

Phone: 872-2191 

Beef 
SIRLOIN I  YO, 1/2?40 or I 

I I INTRODUCTORY SPECIAL TIP 
ROAS 

$189 lb. $7,000 Limited time 
offer - Airboats 

starting at only. .. 
I - w/coupon 7-30-96 thru 8-3-96 only 

Michigan New Crop 
These prices will not be repeated 

Who wants to  befirst to  own one? 
In Cass City at 

-bLLJa 
w v / v  U .  

' 
DELI MENU 

ALL LUNCHES $2.99 UNLESS NOTED 
Mednesday 7-31 -96 ALL DINNERS $3.99 UNLESS NOTED 

'hursday 8-1-96 

1. B.L.T. Club Sandwich ($2.29) 
2.2 pc. Chicken, Potato Wedges & Salad 

1. Sloppy Joe on Bun ($1.99) 
2. 2 pc. Chicken, Potato Wedges & Salad 

1.2 pc. B.B.Q. Ribs, Potato Wedges & Roll 
2.2 pc. Fish (Cod), Potato Wedges & Roll 
3.2 pc. Chicken, Potato Wedges 8 Roll 

1. Smoked Brats ($1.89) 
2.2 pc.Chicken, Potato Wedges & Salad 

Wednesday 7-31-96 

Thursday 8-1-96 

Friday 8-2-96 

1. Baked Pork Chops, Scalloped Potatoes, Salad & Roll 
2.3 pc. Chicken, Scalloped Potatoes, Salad 

1. Meatloaf, Mashed Potatoes, Gravy, Salad & Roll 
2.3 pc. Chicken, Mashed Potatoes, Salad & Roll 

1.3 pc. B.B.Q. Ribs, Potato Wedges, Salad & Roll ($4.29) 
2.3 pc. Fish (Cod), Potato Wedges, Salad & Roll ($4.29) 
3 . 3  pc. Chicken, Potato Wedges, Salad & Roll 

1.3 pc. Chicken, Potato Salad, Cole Slaw & Roll 

:riday 8-2-96 

Saturday 8-3-96 
Saturday 8-3-96 

_. 

snow, ice and 

For n w r e  information call 

(517) 872-2007 
(517) 658-2560 

Ask for E l i  S in1 iisori 

Airboats starting at 12' 

Monday 8-5-96 Monday 8-5-96 

Tuesday 8-6-96 

1. Chicken Salad on Croissant Roll with Fruit & Chips 
2.3 pc. Chicken, Potato Salad, Cole Slaw & Roll 

1. Hamburger with Chips & Pickle (Reg. $1.69, Cheese $1.80, Deluxe $1.99) 
2.2 pc. Chicken, Potato Wedges 8. Salad 

1 .  Taco Salad (Small $2.49, Large $3.99) 
2.2 pc. Chicken, Potato Wedges & Salad 

Tuesday 1. Lasagna, 8-6-96 Salad & Roll 
2.3 pc. Chicken, Potato Salad, Cole Slaw & Roll 
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Congratulations To Our Area 
4-H: C M P I O N S  Mrs. Thelma Jackson 

Phone 658-2347 

Thursday afternoon Mrs. 
Mary Beardsley and Mrs. 
Elsie Blades visited their 
cousins, Mr. and Mrs,  
Michael Papp, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Shultz and John Cook, 
all of Frankenmuth. 

Mr. and Mrs. Olin Bouck 
attended the Witherspoon 
family reunion at Lighthouse 
Park and later visited Mrs. 
Dorothy Sprague and Lynne 
Peterson at Lakeside Sunday. 

Debbie LeValle and Lind- 
say of Vernon, and Tiffany 
Silver of Bay City were Sun- 
day guests of Reva Silver. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt 
attended the Purdue family 
reunion Sunday at Fuller 
Park. 

Mark Farrelly was a Mon- 
day afternoon guest and Cliff 
Ross was a Tuesday fore- 
noon guest ofAllen Farrelly. 

Sharon Depcinski of St. 
Louis, Mo., spcnt a week and 
a half with Mr, and Mrs. Ray 
De pcins ki . 

Gladys Briolat and Arnold 
Grifka were Thursday guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza. 

Sue Sofka of Davison and 
Winnifred Sofka were Sun- 
day guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Steven Sofka, Krysten and 
Thomas at Harrison. Other 
guests were Betty Cornett, 
Coleen Cornett and David 
Longuski of Bad Axe. 
Mr. and Mrs. FrankTerry of 

Elkton were Tuesday guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Konkcl and Marney. 

Mrs. Curtis Cleland was a 
Friday guest of Mrs. Alex 
Cleland and Carol Laming. 

Art Morel1 was a Wednes- 
day guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Shagena. 

Ten members of the 
Wcdnesday Morning Break- 
fast Club met at Pat's restau- 
rant in  Ubly. 

Mr. and Mrs  Allen 
Dcpcinski went to the 
Zinger-Smigielski Funeral 
Home i n  llbly Sunday 
evening to pay respects to 
Gerald Wills. 

Mrs. John O'Henley was a 
Thursday afternoon guest of 
Mrs. Martin Sweeney. 

Mr, and Mrs. Gordon 
Canham and Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Canham of Niagara 
Falls, Canada, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Wills of Port Austin and 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Wills of 
Las Vegas, Nev., spent the 
weekend with Mrs. Gerald 
Wills and Monday attended 
the funeral of Gerald Wills at 
the Zinger-Smigielski Fu- 
neral Home in Ubly. Inter- 
ment was inValley Cemetery 
in Ubly. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Rump t z we re Wed ne sd ay 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Archie Rumptz. 

Bobbie Allen and Allen 
Farrelly were Tucsday guests 
of Cheryl Allen. 
Mr. and Mrs. Randy Smith, 

Nicholas and Brian of 
Mansfield, Ohio, and Betty 
Depcinski and friend, Joe 
Myers, of Gladwin joined the 
rest of the Depcinski f'amily 
for the weekend. Other Sun- 
day guests were Mr. and Mrs. 
Greg Krozek of Kinde. 

Reva Silver was a Tuesday 
guest of Mrs. Gerald Wills. 

Allen and Mark Farrelly 
spent Friday forenoon golf- 
ing at Verona Hills Golf 
Course. 
Mrs.Alcx Particka and Mrs. 

Melvin Particka went with a 
group from St. John's Catho- 
lic Church i n  Ubly to 
Chcsaning Wednesday to sec 
the Roy Clark show on the 
Chesaning Show Boat. 
Sue Sofka of Davison spent 

the weekend with Winnifred 
Sofka. 

Mildred Porter and Bob 

and Mrs. Glen Shagena 
Monday morning and later 
attended the funeral of 
Gcrald Wills at the Zinger- 
Smigielski Funeral Home in 
Uhly. 
Mrs. Martin Sweeney spent 

from Saturday till Thursday 
with Dr. and Mrs. Tom 
Collins at their cottage at 
New Era and also visited 
Loretta Belsinger at White 
Hall. En route home Thurs- 
day she visited Mabel Gar- 
dener at Unionville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Bouck 
of Pigeon and Mrs. Clarence 
Miller of Cass City visited 
Mr, and Mrs. Olin Bouck. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Silver 
ofTaylor, Ohio, were Sunday 
guests of Reva Silver. 

Mr. and Mrs. Danny 
Schultz, Shannon, Sabrina 
and Samantha of Canton 
were wcckend guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Hewitt. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Majeski 

of San Diego, Calif., Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Bezemek and 
Allen Farrelly were Saturday 
evening guests of Laura 
Kul ish. 
Mrs. Jerry Cumin, Janessa, 

James, Joey and Joshua of 
Fountain Hills, Ariz., spent 3 
weeks with Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Depcinski and visited other 
relatives. Other relatives at 
the Ray Depcinski homc 
were Nancy Carpenter, Dean 
Jr., Michael, Jessica and 
Timothy of Hay Market, Va. 
They also visited relatives in 
Caro and this vicinity. Dean 
Carpenter came later and re- 
turned home with his wife 
and family. 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Clam 

were Sunday afternoon 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Glaza. 

Mrs. Curtis Cleland and 
Mrs. Hiram Keyser attended 
the Friends of the Library 
picnic in  Cass City hosted by 
the librarians in  Cass City. 

Thirteen members of the 
Traveling Breakfast Club 
met at Pat's Restaurant in 
Ubly Thursday morning for 
breakfast. The group will 
mcet at the Crossroads Res- 
tauran t next Thursday. 

Mrs. Kevin Robinson was 
a Wedncsday guest of 
Ordcan Michalski. 

Mrs. Glen Shagena was a 
Tuesday guest of Mary 

CFS now 
eligible for 
Blue Cross 

Catholic Family Service's 
Bad Axe and Caro counsel- 
ing Centers are now partici- 
pating Blue Cross providers. 

If in need of counseling, 
call CFS and schedule an 
appointment. 

As always, if you do not 
have insurance to cover 
counseling, CFS has a fee 
scale that is based on ability 
to pay and family size. 

Catholic Family Service is 
a non-denominational 
United Way Agency serving 
mid-Michigan in 1 1 counties 
with other Thumb offices in 
Bad Axe and Sandusky. In  
Bad Axe call ( 5  17) 269-793 1 
and Car0 (5 17) 673-5352 for 
an appointment. 

~ I 
From these businesses who supported the McKay ofTaylor visited Mr. Bcardsley. 

I-- Livestock Auction at the Tuscola County Fair. 
EMIL RUMMEI 

INSURANCE 
AGENCY 

Vassar 823-247 1 

DOUBLE D 
GAS & DIESEL 

REPAIR 
Cass City 872-4540 

WICKES 
LUMBER 

Car0 673-3 12 1 

EDW- 
SCOLLON, DVM 

Cass City 872-2935 

ANDERSON, 
TUCKEY, 

BERNHARDT, 
DORAN & CO. 

Caro Cass City 
673-3 137 872-3730 

SANDUSKY MICHIGAN 
VALLEY 

IRRIGATION 
673-6741 Vassar 

KRITZMANS', 
INC. 

Cass City 872-3470 

NEW Friday, August 2 

Saturday, August 8 

First 10,OOO adults 21 and older 

First 10 OOO kids 14 and under 

6Ieat181-s Food Drive 
AM. 8 snd 4, call (31 8) 882-4000 
Ir mope lnformatlon 

HOLLAND 
Sadusky 8 10-648-4050 

KEITH MICHELLE 
BIDDINGER 

Law Once 
Cass City 872-5601 

CHEMICAL 
BANK 

Cass City 872-4355 

LaFAvE STEEL 
SUPPLY, INC. 

Cass City 872-2163 

RUSSELL 
FARMS 

Cass City 872-2419 

CASS CITY ERI" INDEPENDENT 
BANK 

EAST MICHIGAN 
Car0 Marlette 
673-5656 635-3541 

CASS CITY 
TIRE 

Cass City 872-5303 

FOOD OIL & 
GAS CO. CENTER 

Cass City 872-2191 Cass City 872-2065 

CELLULARONE THUMB 
NATIONAL 

BANK 
& TRUST 

Cass City 872-431 I 

FARlM CREDIT 
SERVICES OF 
EAST CENTRAL 

MICHIGAN 
Car0 673-6 128 

DIAMOND 
ELECTRIC 

SUPPLY 
Car0 673-5334 

LAKE 
HURON 

For tickets call 

517-75414800 I car0 673- 1666 
- 1  0 patronrze These Area Businesses That Haue 

Continued To Su~pOrt Our Communities! 
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r Huron voters to Busy primary election 
:;set in Sanilac Countv elect prosecutor, 

U 
e 0 

and Wheatland townships. 
Also vying for the seat is 
Snover Republi'can Theresa 
Glaza. 

I n  addition, Republicans 
Elfrieda Conrad, Cynthia 
Tecplc, Timothy M. 
Woelkers and Kevin R.  
Wormwood are battling for 
the commissioncr's seat in 
District 4 (Elmer, Watertown 
and Washington townships), 
and incumbent District 5 
Commissioncr Carl D. Black 
faces a challenge from Karl 
Stacer for the right to repre- 
sent Sanilac and Lexington 
townships. Both candidates 
are Republicans. 

. Voters in Sanilac County 
will have a busy primary 

; election, with races set for 
' county prosecutor, sheriff, 
r clerk, treasurer, road coni- 

missioner and 3 county 
board seat:. 

Also at stake are 3 ballot 
questions, including what 
county officials are calling a 
crucial millage request to 

Among those facing a chal- 
lenge is Republican incurn- 

. bent District One Commis- 
:sioner John Merriman of 
: Deckerville, who represents 
Evergreen, Green 1 eaf, Aus- 

. tin, Argyle, Moore, Minden 

' 

' fund county operations. 

Other county officials fac- 
ing opposition are: (set ofice 
name in bold) 
Prosecutor 
Inc. James V. Young-R 
Dale Ostertag-R 

partment, medical care facil- 
ity, community mental 
health, Cooperative Exten- 
sion Service and 4-H pro- 
grams. 

A combination of factors 
has forced officials to go to 
the voters for funding, ac- 
cording to District One Com- 
missioner John Merriman. 
A major revenue source - 

interest on the delinquent tax 
revolving fund - is dwin- 
dling, he explained, adding 
the county will use $500,000 
from the fund to balance this 
year's budget, leaving only 
$75,000 available for 1997. 

In addition, the county is 
spending $600,000 a year in 
an effort to build up the 
county pension fund. 

If approved, the county 
would levy a total of 5 mills 
for operations. That's the 
same tax levied 22 years ago, 
Merriman pointed out, not- 
ing the HeadleeAmendment 
has steadily chipped away at 
the tax, resulting in the cur- 
rent levy of 4.3395 mills. 

Merriman said the addi- 
tional tax being requested 
Aug. 6 would generate 
$5 17,000 the first year. The 
increase translates into about 
$25 dollars per year for the 
average household in Sanilac 
County. 

Voters will .also decide a 
pair of millage renewal ques- 
tions. The ballot questions 
are renewal of .2 of a mill for 
4 years for library services, 
and .2 of a mill for 4 years 
for senior citizen services. 
Both millages would be lev- 

ied in 1996 through 1999. 

cornmisstoners 
A trio of races for county 

board seats and a contest for 
prosecutor will highlight the 
Aug. 6 primary election in 
Huron County. 

Incumbent Prosecutor 
Leslie Hagen faces a chal- 
lenge from attorney Mark 
Gaertner for the Republican 
nomination. The winner will 
run unopposed in the general 
election in November. 

Hagen, 32, has served as 
prosecutor since Jan. 1 ,  
199 1. She previously 
worked as a Midland County 
assis tan t prosecuting at tor- 
ney and has also been em- 
ployed with the Michigan 
Court ofAppeals in Lansing. 

In 1992, Hagen was ap- 
pointed by Gov. John Engler 
to a 3-year term on 
Michigan's Domestic Vio- 
lence Prevention and Treat- 
ment Board. Last year, she 
was appointcd to a second 
term on the board, which 
worked closely with the state 
Legislature in 1994 to ensure 
passage of 22 new domestic 
violence laws. 

Gaertner, 41, cites his 12 
years of prosecuting experi- 
ence. He was Huron 
County's chief assistant 
prosecutor from 1991 to 
1992, and i n  1992-1994 
served as special prosecutor 
for the Citizens Grand Jury. 

Previously, he served over 
7 years as a Saginaw County 
assistant prosecutor, 2 years 
of which were spent running 
the Drug Enforcement Divi- 
sion and 2 years as the chief 
trial attorney. 

Krohn, Larry Schmitt Sr. and 
David Wolfc, and Democrat 
Orville Liedke. 

District 4 is comprised of 
Chandler, Meade, Oliver and 
Colfax townships. 

In District 5 ,  reprcsenting 
Verona and Sigcl townships, 
incumbent H.W. 
Weitenberner is being chal- 
lenged by Richard Peterson 
and Robert Hogan for the 
Republican nomination. The 
winner will run unopposed in 
November. 

Likewise, District 7 Com- 
Martha missioner 

Thuemmel, who represents 
Lake, Hume, Pointe Aux 
Barques, Dwight and Lin- 
coln townships, faces a chal- 
lenge frorn fellow Republi- 
can Kurt Damrow. Again, 
there are no Democratic can- 
didates. 

Sheriff 
Inc. Virgil Strickler-R 
James Merriman-R 

Mark J. Gaertner Leslie Hagen 

Clerk 
Inc. Linda 1. Kozfkay-R 
Laurie L. Turnbull-R Scollon, May 

battle for seat lkeasurer 
Inc. Carol A. Dale-R 
Douglas D. McGuire-R 

0 

Road Commissioner 
(one seat) 

considered incorporating the 
dispatch center with a 
planned jail expansion, how- 
ever, estimates revealed a 
new building will be less ex- 

with Norma J.'Bates, John E 
Fields, Mary K .  Nowland 
Raymer and Patrick Trisch 
for the Republican nomina- 
tion. The winner will run 
unopposed in the Tuesday, 
Nov. 5 ,  general election 

Among county offices, the 
primary election will decide 
a race for drain commis- 
sioner. The candidates are 
incumbent Sarah M. Pistro 
and newcomer Dennis C. 
Henry, both Republicans. 

Incumbent Register of 
Deeds Ginny McLaren, 
meanwhile, is being chal- 
lenged by Orvil A. Beecher 
for the Republican nomina- 
tion. The winner will face 
Democrat Barbara E. Gaul in 
November. 

Harold Donaghy-R 
Jack Gillig-R 
Roy W. Goheen-R 
Lynne NOH-R 

pensive. 

The surcharge translates 
into a cost of $2.67 per 
month per household, or 
about $32 a year. If ap- 
proved, the surcharge would 
be in place for 5 years. State 
law requires another vote to 
continue the surcharge after 
that period. 
Residents currently pay a 4- 

percent surcharge on their 

MILLAGES 

Sanilac County officials say 
deep cuts in county services 
will be unavoidable if a pro- 
posed millage increase of 2/ 
3 of a mill for 6 years is de- 
feated. 

Among the non-mandated 
services that could be af- 
fected are central dispatch/ 
91 1,  road patrol, health de- 

AREA TOWNSHIPS 

Primary races are also set in  
a pair of area Huron County 
townships. 

In  Brookfield Township. 
incumbent Treasurer Rohcrt 
McPhail faccs a challenge in 
the Republican primary frorn 
newcomcr Susan Albrecht. 
All other township officials 
are running unopposed on 
the Republican ticket. 
In Grant Township, incum- 

bent Supervisor Betty 
Powell's decision not to seek 
reelection paved thc way for 
a race between newcomer8 
Janice I,. Brandel and 
Michael J. Mandich, both 
Republicans. 

In addition , i n c u m ben t s 
Donnic MetAger and David 
Ellicott, and chailenger 
Marshall L. Sheldon - all 
Rcpublicans - are vying for 
a pair of trustee seats. 

The township's other Rc- 
publican incumbents are all 
running unopposed. 

: John Merriman phone bills each month, the 
most allowed under state law 
without a public vote. 

Law enforcement officials 
say the dispatch equipment 
upgrade is desperately 
needed to replace an anti- 
quated system that fre- 
quently fails, causing com- 
munication problems for po- 
lice, fire and ambulance per- 
sonnel. 
County Controller Michael 

Hoagland said much effort 
has gone into drafting a no- 
frills, cost effective proposal 
that will meet the minimum 
needs of the county. 
The total project, including 

new equipment, the dispatch 
center and operational costs, 
is estimated at $2.2 million, 
which will be bonded over a 
1 0-year period. 

Residents are also being 
asked to approve 3 millage 
renewals - .2397 of a mill 
for 6 years for the medical 
care facility, .4871 of a mill 
for 4 years for hridges/local 
streets, and .9741 of a mill 
for 2 years for primary roads. 

Theresa Glaza 
I 

MICHELLE I? BIDDINGER 
Attorney at Law 

is pleased to announce the addition of 

JOSEPH A. VAN AUKEN 
Attorney at Law 

BALLOT QUESTIONS 

County residents will de- 
cide the fate of 4 ballot ques- 
tions, including a proposed 
16-percent increase in  the 
surcharge on base phone bills 
to fund central dispatch up- 
grades. 

The project includes con- 
struction of a new, indepen- 
dent central dispatch center 
on a Cleaver Road site. 
County commissioners had 

TOWNSHIPS 

Evergram - All incurn- 
bents are seeking reelection 
unopposed, however, town- 
ship voters will decide a mill- 
age request. 
The township board is ask- 

ing residents to approve a 
special one-mill tax for 4 
years to fund road iniprove- 
ments. Residents previously 
approved a one-mill levy for 
10 years to complete work on 
Germania Road. That mill- 
age is expiring. 

OTHER RACES 

County commission races, 
meanwhile, include a battle 
for the District 4 seat vacated 
by incumbent Alvin Long. 
The candidates are Republi- 
cans Fred Duggan, Warren 

Mr. Van Auken is currently accepting new clients 
in Cam and Cass City. 

h 

4455 Doerr Road, Ste. #3 
Cass City, MI 48726 

(517) 872-5601 

451 N . State St., Ste. #1 
Caro, MI 48723 
(517) 472-5601 

Voltage 
effects 

Vote 

Margaret 
for 

Ford 
Republican 

reviewed 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  
I> * * Livestock will not be both- 

er& by stray voltage if' it is 
less than 2 volts at the point 
of contact, according to a 
new publication being re- 
leased by Michigan Statc 
University. 
A Review of Stray Voltage: 

Effects on Livestock, E- 
2606, was produced by MSU 
agricultural engineers and 
the Michigan Agricultural 
Electric Council (MAEC). 
The findings are summarized 
in Stray Voltage, Questions 
and Answers, E-2605. Both 
publications are available 
through county MSU Exten- 
sion offices, 
The review was prepared by 

MSU agricultural engineer 
Truman Surbr oo k, professor 
of agricultural engineering, 
and Robert Fick, visiting as- 
sistant professor and MAEC 
managing director, 

Fick says the publications 
are an update on research 
that has bccn at the forefront 
of the stray voltage issue. 
That research contirms the 
accuracy of the U S ,  Depart- 
ment of Agriculture 1991 
handbook, which focused on 
the same issue. 

The MAEC consists of  
MSU agricultural engineer- 
ing faculty members and ex- 
perts from the Michigam Pub- 
lic Service Commission. 
Consumers Power Company, 
the Detroit Edison Company, 
the Michigan Gas an Electric 
Association, the Michigan 
Rural Electric Cooperatives 
and the Telephone Associa- 
tion of Michigan. 

_ _  

'* VOTE FOR EXPERIENCE : Greenleaf - Primary races 
arc set for township supervi- 
sor and trustee in Greenleaf 
Township . 

In  c u 111 bc n t S u pcI v i so r 
Curtis Cleland Jr. is not seek- 
ing reelection, sctting thc 
stage for a contest hctween 
Repu bl icans Margaret Ford 
and Ralph Hoxie. Threc 
other Republicans, incum- 
bents Vera Nicol and Mark 
Battcl, and newcomer Brian 
Sweeney, are vying for a pair 
of trustee seats. 

I n  addition, voters are be- 
ing asked to renew one mill 
for 4 years, 1997 through 
2000, to continue funding for 
fire protection. 

Wedding 
Announcements 

~~~ 

Catalogs loaned 
overnight. 

Free Subscription 
with each order 

m s s  City 
Chronicle 

Phone 872-201 0 

:* 
: * * * TOWNSHIPVOTE 

At the township level, vot- 
ers in Novesta Township are 
being asked to okay a request 
of one mill for 3 years to fund 
road improvements. 

One mill raises about 
$15,000 in the township. 
The request marks township 

officials' third attempt in re- 
cent years to get a road mill- 
age passed. Voters in August 
1994 rejected a request of 2.5 
mills for 5 years. Likewise, 
a reduced proposal of 2 mills 
for 4 years was defeated 3 
months later. 

FOR GREENLEAFTOWNSHIP SUPERVISOR 

Concerned Resident 
Degree in Business Management 

Self Motivated 
Excellent Communication Skills 

United States Air Force Vet 
REMEMBER THAT'S MARGARET FORD 

* * 
+ * Dedicated 
- * * * 

+ The only candidab with experience - over 15 years 
Enforced collection of statutory fees from businesses, ending free seMces 

Instrumental in help bringing over 190,OOO new dollars into Tuscola County, 

* * * * * * * 

that cost taxpayers over $3O,OOO yearty. 

Has lived and worked in the county for 32 years 
' Volunteer for many civii organizations. 
' Elected as Chairperson & Board Member to several State Government Associations. 

, * Married 22 years, 3 children, 1 grandchild 

dnly for Seniors! 

Only on Thursdays! 

Only at Health Mart! 
introducing Health Mart Silver Certificates! 

Seniors Save on Thursdays at Health Mart. 

Health Mart Silver Certificates can be used as coupons on Thursdays to save ten 
percent off of the cash register.totaI for any qualified senior customer.. 

:: * 
;; * 
:: f 

* * * - -. 
:; * 
:: * Vote August 6th * * The coupon applies to all merchandise, including prescription insurance co-pays. 

Transfer a prescription from another pharmacy on Thursday, and double the value of 
the discount! A transferred prescription makes the discount for that Thursday 
worth lWENTY PERCENT! 

(you must be sixty years of age or older to qualify for this discount offer!) 

:: * T h e  Candidate that lives, works, and believes in Tuscola County!" * 
" 1  * * 
:" * 
:* * Paid for by the Committee to AeElect 

Gimy Mcbren Register of oeeds 
2343 W. Barnes Rd., Millingtm, MI 48746 

* * 
(Valuable Coupon) r. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

:: ' I 

Responsible Government M-& W m  Icsw 
Seniors Save On Thursdays at Health Mart! 

HEALTH MART SILVER CERTIFICATE 
Coupon 

I 0 percent $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ ~ $ ~ ~  10 percent 

District 2 Commissioner 
Stan 

h 

"OLD WOOD DRUG" A G F A e  FILM STORE HOURS: 
HOfHlMC ESCAPES AGFA FILY 

BOOKMART 
Books, Cards, Photo 6 G l h  

6498 Maln St. 

Mon lhru Fri 9 a m . 6 p rn. 
Sat 9 a m  - 4 p m  

Sun 1230pm - 4 p m  
OPENEVERYOTHERSUNDAY 

NEW SHERIDAN 
HEALTH MART PHARMACY 
Jonalhrn Shores, R. PH. CASS CITY, MI 48726 (517) 872-2075 - *  

I I 
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Legal Notices DNR now accepting applications Kuhert A .  'l'reriiain LYL Associates. P.C. is 
nttziiipijtip to collrct a deht and any in- 
~ I J I I l l ~ t ~ O I l  ohtairtetl will he used for that 
purpose, 

Rokr t  A. 'I'rrmiiin & Associates, P.C.'. is 
attempting to collect il deht and any i n -  
forination ubtaitietl will he used for that 
purpose. 

Robeft A. ' remain & Associates. P.C, is 
attempting to collect a debt and any in- 
forniation obtained will be used for that 
purpose. for 1996 antlerless deer permits MOR'I'GAGI:. SAL!< - 1)efault has been 

made in the conditions of a mortgage 
made by ROBERI I) .  JOHNSON I I  & 
JOIENE M. JOHNSON, HUSBAND 
AND WIFE, to 1INI'IF.I) S I'ATES O F  
AMLRICX, ArI'INC; THROUGH THE 

TION, U.S. L)EFI'. OFAGKICUL,TURE 
now known as IJSDA. RUKAl,IXVEI,- 
0PMI"'f  Mortgage. dated August 8, 
1 9 0 ,  and recorded o i i  August 8, 1990. 
i n  Libcr 605. on page 1.58. '1'USCC)I.A 
County Records, Michigan. on which 

' mortgage there IS claimed to be due at 
the date hereof the sum uf sixty nine thou- 
sand five hutidred fifty four and 931100 
Dollars ($69,554.93). including interest 

Under the powor of salr contained in  
said ttiortgiige and the statute in  such case 
made and approved, notice is hereby 
given tlint said rnortpapc will he fore- 
closed by a salt. of the tiiortpaged prc- 
riiises, or sotne part of them, at public 
vendue. at the Front entrance of the Court- 
house in  thevillage o f  Caro. 'luscola, MI, 
at I I :W AM on Septrmkr 1.7. 1996. 
Said premises arr situatrd i n  VILIAGlI 

01: FAIRGROVE. 'l'IJSCOI,A County. 
Michigan and are drscrihrd as: 

FARMERS, HOME ADMINISTRA- 

I at 9.000% per annum. 

MORTGAGE SALE - Default has been 
made in  the conditions of a mortgage 
made by JAMES 11. REARDSLEY & 
CORRINE M.  BEARDSLEY. HIS 
WIFE, to UNITED STATES OF 
AMERICA, ACTING THROUGH THE 

TION, U.S. DEFT. OFAGRICUL'I'UHE 
now known as USDA. RURAL DEVEL- 
OPMENT Mortgagee, dated Novemher 
13. 1986. and recorded on Novernbcr I 3. 
1986. in Liber 565 .  on page I INS, 
TUSCOLA County Records, Michigan, 
on which mortgage there is  cla/med to  be 
due at the dale hereof the sum of fifty 
threc thousiind eight hundred one and 40/ 
100 1)ollars ($53,801.40). including in- 
trrcst at 9.5008 per annum. 

Under the power of sale contained in  
said mortgage and the statute in  such case 
made and approved. notice is herrby 
giveti that s?id mortgage will be fore- 
closed by a sale of  the tnortgagrd pre- 
mises, o r  some pan of them, at puhlic 
vendue, at the f:ront entrance of the Court- 
house in  thevillage of Caro, Tuscola, MI, 
at 1 I :OO AM on September 13. 1996. 

Said premises are situated in TOWN- 
SHIP 01: INL)IANFIELDS, I'USCOI .A 
County. Michigan and are described ;IS: 

FA RM ER S , HOME A UM IN I STR A - 

MOK'I'GAGF. S A I I  - Default has been 
tnntlc i n  the cunditions of a mortgage 
~ n a d c  by RIIYMUNDO V MARI'INEZ 
R hlhKlA G MARTINIX. HIS WIFE. 

STAI'LS OF AMERICA. 
ROUGH THE FARMERS, 

HOMF A D M IN IS T R AT ION , U . S . 
IN,:PI' OF AGRICULTURE now known 

hloitgagee, dated April 27. I97 I ,  and re- 
Lwrtled on April 27. 1971, in Liber 260, 
on I l i ige 192. TUSC0I .A County 
I<rcords, Michigan, uti which mortgage 
tlicrc i s  claimed to be due at the date 
hereof the surii nf fourteen thousand seven 
Iiundre? sixty three and 37/100 Ihllars 
(514 ,763 .37) ,  including interest at 
7.250% per annum 

llttder the power of sale contained in 
~ ( 1  Iti(lrtgilgt' ilnd the statute i n  such case 
tiiade nnd npprovcd, notice is herehy 
given that said iiiortgage will be fore- 
closed by ;I sale o f  thy mortgaged pte- 
riiises. or  wine part of therii, at puhlic 
vcndue. at the Front entrance of the Court- 
Iiousc in  thc.Villape of Caro, Tuscola, MI. 
;it 1 1 :oO A M  on Septerriher 13, 1946. 

Smd prt.tiiises are situated iri  CR'Y OF 
VASSAK. TUSCIOI .A County. Michigan 
;ind are drscrihed as: 

iis USI)A, RURAL DEVELOPMENT antlerless deer that should be' 
harvested to maintain the 
deer in that DMU. Regula- 
tions are established to re- 
move the annual production, 
without changing the size of: 
the herd. In DMUs with too 
many deer, wildlife manag- 
ers establish regulations to 
carefully remove enough,, 
antlerless deer to reduce the? 

The desired number or ' 

antlerless deer to harvest by: 
DMU, along with the hunter 
success rates in the previous 
hunting season, is used to,. 
determine the number of'  
antlerless deer hunting li- 
censes that should be issued 
for each DMU. Hunters ap- 
ply for these licenses in a lot- 
tery drawing with an appli- * 
cation deadline of Sept. 24. 
Application may be made at+ 
any of more than 1,700 hunt-;: 
ing and fishing license agents 
through the state beginning 
Aug. 1 .  

Wildlife managers are cur- 
rently evaluating deer statis- 
tics to develop recommenda- 
tions on the number of li-, . 
censes to issue. The recom-. 
mendations will be available, 
in August for public review 
and comment. Antlerless li- ~ 

cense quota recommenda- 
tions will be presented by the ; 
Wildlife Division in August, 
for decision by the DNR Di- 
rector in early September. ,I 

size of the herd. ?$ 

deer herd is' still above popu- 
lation objectives, even with 
heavy winter losses. The 
Wildlife Division is recom- 
mending antlerless deer quo- 
tas in 169 DMUs, an increase 
from the 134 DMUs open in 
1995. 

Since biological, environ- 
mental, and social conditions 
vary in different parts of 
Michigan, deer are managed 
differently in different parts 
of the state. Deer are man- 
aged within DMUs, with an 
average size of about 350- 
400 square miles each. Ev- 
ery year, wildlife managers 
assess deer population 
trends, public attitudes and 
impacts of the previous 
year's hunter harvest to es- 
tablish qualitative population 
objectives in each of these 
DMUs. 
Hunting regulations are es- 

tablished to meet deer pdpu- 
lation objectives, In DMUs 
where there are too few deer, 
wildlife managers may rec- 
ommend that no antlerless 
deer be taken by hunters. The 
herd i n  these units, with 
"bucks-only" hunting, may 
increase 10-40 percent the 
year after this regulation, 
since the removal of antlered 
bucks after does are bred has 
little impact on the size of the 
herd, In areas where the same 
number of deer are desired, 
wildlife managers deter- 
mined the number of 

The Wildlife Division of the have antlerless deer hunting ning Aug. 1. 
Michigan Department of the 1996 firearm and The Wildlife Division is 
Natural Resources is corn- muzzleloading deer seasons. developing license quotas to 
pleting its recommendations The DNR will begin accept- allow the taking of antlerless 
for thc decr management ing applications for the draw- deer under permit in many 
units (DMUs) which will ing of these licenses begin- areas of the state because the 

VILLAGE OF FAIRGROVE LOI' 26 OF 
t1 I1 .I ,C KFSI S LJ R DI V IS ION, PART 0 1: 
' W E  NOK'I'tIWI'ST QUAK'T'ER OF 
' I ' H L S  NC)K'I't4EASI' QUAR'I EH O F  
SEC'TION 20.  TOWN 1 3  NORTH, 
HANGE X EAST, Ac'COK1)INC; ' 1 ' 0  
THE PIAT RF,Cwrm:t) I N  LIBER 3 
OF 1'1,ATS. PAGE 27-28, 1USCOLA 
COUNTY RLXWRIIS SUBJEc"I' TO 
EASEMENTS, RIGHTS OFWAY ANI) 
RESTRICIIONS OF REC'ORI) 

COMMENCING A'f A POINT 978 12 
tEFI EASTAND 193.63 FEEI'SOU I'H 
Of: NOR'I'HWISSI' CORNER OF SEC 
3 ,  ?OWN I2 NORTH. RANGE 9 EAST, 
THENCE SOUTH 160 FEET. THENCE 
EAST 62 43 FEET, THENCE NORTH 
I60 FBEI'ANL) THENCE WES'I' 62 4.7 
1:LiLX 1'C) THE PLACE 01; REGIN- 

SHIP OF INI>IANFIF,L,I)S 
NING VILLAGE OF CARO, TOWN- 

T h e  redetiiption lwnod shall be 6 months 
11oi t i  the ciait: ol .such sale, unless deter- 
intnrd ahandoned i n  accordance with 
I Y 4 X C ' L  600 1241(a) in  which case the 
icdcriipirori pcriod shall he 70 days from 
the dxtr ot such sale I h e  redemption pcrtod shall he 6 months 

froin the date of such sale, unless deter- 
mined abandoned i n  accordance with 
t94RCI. 6003241(a) in  which caw the 
redemption period shall be 30 days t i o n i  

the date of such sale 

'Ihe redrrnptiori Ivriod shall be h months 
f r o m  the date of such sale. urtless deter- 
mined ah;inrlonrd i n  ncuorcliince with 
1948Cl. 600 32Jl(a) i n  which case the 
redrrtiption period sh;tll he 30 days from 
thc h t E  of SUCII ~ i ~ l t .  

1)A'I'ED J u l y  3 I ,  1996 

1)ATl~I) July 3 I .  I996 

XI'I'OKNkY FOR. Mortgagee 
A'ITORNl~Y FOR: Mortppee 

Robert A. 'l'rttnitiii LQ Assoc1;itt's. F'C 
401 South Woodward Avrtiuc 
suite 3 0 0  
Rirriiingharii. M I  48000.h61 h 

Robert A Tremain Rt Associates, PC' 
401 South Woodward Avenue 
suite 3 0 0  
R~r~i~inghi~ni .  MI 48009-6616 

ANTLERLMS DEER season applications now being taken, 

ExDerts to sDeak at 
Thanks fer calling 

feature story ideas 
872-201 0 With 

USIM, RURAL UEVELOPMEN'I' 
Mortgagee 

7-3 1-5 

I I 
m a  area dairy seminar 

When vou S o  far 19% has not been 
very kind to  'I'hunib area 
dairy produccrs. The unre- 
lenting rains that began in 
early spring and continued 
through most of June have 
resulted i n  poor quality hay 
and haylagc and delayed 
corn planting to the point that 
an early frost could spell big 
troublc f o r  this year's corn 
and corn silage crops. Every- 
one knows that providing 
dairy cows with high quality 
hay, haylage and corn silage 
is a key factor for profitable 
dairy production. 'Ib further 
cast doubt on the profitabil- 
ity of dairying, grain riiarkets 
arc cxpcricncing all tirile 
high prices and mycotoxins 
are showing up in  some 
feeds. The horizon is not 
cornpl ct c 1 y dark, how cvcr, 
because steadily climbing 
milk prices offer a glimmer 
of hope for profitable dairy- 
ing. 

Whethcr dairy producers 
will expcricnce boom or bust 
for the tcmaindcr o f  1996 
and 1997 ieniains a tig ques- 
tion mark. To help Thumb 
arcs dairy producers reduce 
thc size o f  that  qucstion 
mark, Michigan Statc Uni- 
versity Extension is sponsor- 
ing a seminar Friday, Aug. 
16, from I O  a.m. to 2:30 p.m. 
to update dairy farmers on 
strategies that will help mini- 
milt the negative impact of 
low quality forages, myc- 
c) t o x i n con tam i na t i o n ,  high 
grain prices, and other chal- 
lenges to profitable dairying. 
Some o f  MSU Extension's 

top specialists will headline 
the program. Dr .  Herb 

Bucholtz will be on hand to 
discuss profitable feeding 
strategies for 1996-97; rnak- 
ing the most milk out of this 
year's forage crops will be 
addressed by Dr. Mike Allen; 
Dr. Patrick Hart will dicuss 
the mycotoxin problems in 
this year's feed supplyo and 
Dr. Rich Leep will provide 
an update on the 1996-97 
hay market and the feeding 
value of alternative forage 
crops. In addition, Walt 

Dr. Abdole - Allergist ..................... 8 & 22 
Dr. Bartnik ..................................... 6 & 20 

Dr. Swong ............................................. 13 
Dr. Carney - Cardiologist ... 7, 14, 21 & 28 

Dr. Tuckey - OB/GYN .......................... 2i 
Dr. Roberts - Dermatology ................... 2 1' 

care endugh 
to send 

Wosje, general manager of 
MMPA, will be'on hand to 
discuss current and future 
trends in milk prices and 
Fred Hinkley will discuss the 
current and future trends in 
the grain markets. Area dairy 
agents, Craig Thomas, Kurt 
Anderson and Craig Burns, 
will also be on hand to pro- 
vide information on profit- 
able culling guidelines and 
evaluating and allocating 
your feed inventory to maxi- 
mize profit, 
The program will be held at 

the Colony House at the 
junction bf Bay City- 
Forestville Rd. and M-53, 
near Cass City. Dairy pro- 
ducers interested in attending 
the program are encouraged 
to preregister ($10, includes 
lunch; preregister by 
Wednesday, Aug. 14) by call- 
ing MSU Extension area 
dairy agents CraigThomas in 
Sandusky, (8 10) 648-25 15, 
Kurt Anderson in Bad Axe, 
(517) 269-9949, or Craig 
Burns in  Corunna, (517) 
743-225 1. Registrations at 
the door on the day of the 
program will be $15. 

-0- 

Community Rural Health Centei 
24 Hour Primary Care For quality cards and gifts. 

For Clinic Appointments & 
P/ease call: 

872-2127 Ext. 227 
. .  

I 

Vote YES on 
Sanilac County Millage 

WHY is it needed? 
The Headlee Amendment has reduced 

All Federal Revenue Sharing has been 

New programs, such as 9WCentral 

the 5-mill county tax to just 4.34 mills 

eliminated (a total of over $500,000.00 a year) 

Dispatch are seriously underfunded 

Ixl 

WHY should you vote for it? 
Real County operating expenses have 

been significantly reduced in the past four years 
Any additional cuts will mean serious 

cuts in programs the County residents want and 
need t 

be cut are some of the most valued (Some pro- 
grams are required by law and cannot be cut, or 
significantly reduced, such as the Courts and jail) 

Lxl 

The non-mandated services that CAN 

THANKYOU! 
KEEP CAROL IN TREASURER'S OFFICE 

You KNOW What She Can Do 
CASS CITY 4-H LIVESTOCK CLUB 

Salutes and Thanks the Following Supporters 
of the 1996 Tuscola County Fair 
Youth Livestock Show and Sale 

CELLULAR ONE SHOPPERS GUIDE - CARO 
THUMB NATIONAL BANK TUCKEY ENG. 
MICHIGAN LIVESTOCK EXCHANGE SANDUSKY m W  HOLLAND, INC. 
GEORGE PERVIS - BIRCH RUN MOSS STOCK FARMS 

ANDERSON, TUCKEY, BERNHARDT PCA ED HALL 
MICHELLE BIDDINGER- A m y .  RUSSELL TRUCKING 

DR. ED SCOLLON, DVM 
VIGOR0 INDUSTRIES 
BOB & MARY ANN HIRN 
L. WALTHER & SONS, INC. 

ERLA PACKING DR. STEVEN KHOURY, DPM - CAR0 
THUMB AREA HARVESTOR 
ORR LUMBER - NORTH BRANCH 
DICK COULTER, INC. - NORTH BRANCH 
BAVARIAN INN - FRANKENMUTH 
LIWLESON FARMS 
EMIL RUMMEL AGENCY, INC. KELLY & CO. REALTY 

WRUBLE ELEVATOR LaFAVE STEEL SUPPLY, INC. 
ROBERT DeLONG FARMS CASS CITY TIRE 
DOUBLE D GAS & DIESEL REPAIR KRITZMANS', INC. 

MICHIGAN VALLEY IRRIGATION CO. WICKES LUMBER - CAR0 

SEVEN RUSSELL FARMS CASS CITY OIL & GAS 
LAURA McRAE FARM BUREAU 

LAPEER GRAIN KEN McRAE 

RON KILBOURN - DEFORD 
WAL MART - CARO 

DIAMOND ELECTRIC - CAR0 CHEMICAL BANK 

NON-MANDATED services 
include: * 

Central Dispatch/91 I , Road Patrol, 
County Health. Department, County Medical Care 
Facility, Community Mental Health, Co-operative 
Extension Service and 4-H programs 
THE COST will be about $25 per aver- 

age household 

Millage and save our County Services 
w[ Vote YES on t h e  County 

Paid for bv the  Committee to Save and Preserve County Services 

RE-ELECT SANILAC COUNTY TREASURER 

Strong Leader CAROL Am Republican 

DALE - - 
20YEARSOFGOV'TEXPERlENCE-PROVENRECORD 

$4 Million Investment Interest Earned For County 
Member State-wide Task Force to Re-write Property Tax Law 

Successful Negotiator - Delinquent Tax Notes Each Year 
Reduction in Staff - Thousands of Dollars in Savings 

"DO NOT FAIL TO RE-ELECT DALE - COUNTY TREASURER" 
Paid for by corninittee to Re-Elect Dale Sanilac CountyTreasurer. 



Krohn, Bishop 
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Margaret Heidger St. Joseph’s Catholic Church Dwaine peters 1x1 in Argyle. 
State Rep. Mike Green re- 

cently announced that War- 
ren Krohn and Harry W. 
Bishop were reappointed to 
2 state commissions by Gov. 
John Engler. 

Krohn, of Elkton, serves on 
the Michigan Board of Vet- 
erinary Medicine, which is 
responsible for the licensure 
and examination of veteri- 
narians and veterinary tech- 
nicians. His term as a repre- 
sentative of the public ex- 
pires Dec. 3 1, 1999. A part- 
time real estate agent and 
former farmer, Krohn is ac- 
tive in local politics. 

Bishop, a Port Austin resi- 

dent, was reappointed to the 
Michigan Employment Rela- 
tions Commission. The 
commission provides labpr 
mediation services to assist 
private and public employers 
and labor organizations in 
reaching amicable settle- 
ments. 
Bishop’s term ends June 30, 
1999. He has extensive ex- 
perience in labor relations, 
including his work with the 
MERC fact finding and 
grievance arbitration panel. 
He also served as the associ- 
ate executive director of per- 
sonnel and labor relations at 
the Michigan Association of 
School Boards for 17 years. 

Margaret Diane Heidger, 
53, of Kingston died Satur- 
day, July 27, in Marlette 
Community Hospital. 
She was born July 24,1943, 

in  Caro to Raymond and 
Koberta (Putman) Goodman. 

She is survived by her son, 
Herbert C. (Christie) Heidger 
Jr. of Vassar; 2 granddaugh- 
ters; a stepson, David 
(Monica) Allen of Fostoria; 
a special friend, Jim Gilmore 
of Kingston; a sister, 
Catherine (Raymond) 
Russell of Vassar; a brother, 
Larry (Teri) Goodman of 
Mayville, and several nieces, 
nephews and cousins. She 
was preceded in death by an 
infant son, David. 
Funeral services were held 

Tuesday, July 30, at the 
Kranz Funeral Home, 
Kings ton, with Pas tor 
Ronald C .  Wigand of Car0 
First Baptist Church officiat- 
ing. 
Memorials may be made to 

the family discretionary 
fund. 
Interment was in East Day- 

ton Cemetery. 

WITH MORE THAN 25 years experience working as trea- 
m-er for the Elkland Township Board, Art Randall is more 
than qualified to keep track of the township’s finances. 

~ ~ . _ _ ~ ~  

(Darlene) Grot6of Ubly and 
Mrs. Vale (Kelly) Groth of 
Ubly; 20 grandchildren; his 
mother, Mrs. Mary 
Osantowski of Ubly; one sis- 
ter, Mrs. Emmet (Helen) Pe- 
ters of Ubly; one brother, 
Raymond Osantowski and 
his wife Blanche of Jeddo, 
and several nieces and neph- 
ews. 

Baltimore, Tim (Jo) 
Regnerus of Utica, Dennis 
(Linda) Regnerus of Cass 
City, Paul (Virginia) 
Regnerus of Cass City, Dawn 
(Richard) Rick of Cass City, 
Suzanne Regnerus and Bill 
Regnerus, both of California, 
Rebecca Hennessey of Cass 
City, Renee Pomeroy of 
Decker, Rochelle (Paul) 
Brown of Cass City, Virgil 
(Amy) Peters of Grand Rap- 
ids, and many cousins. We 
was preceded in death by his 
grandparents, George and 
Peggy Regnerus. 
Funeral services were held 

Monday, July 29, in  Little 
and Kranz Funeral Home, 
Cass City, with the Rev. Dave 
Edwards officiating. 

Burial was i n  Elkland 
Township Cemetery, Cass 
City. 
Memorials may be made to 

the Ronald McDonald House 
in Detroit. 

9 Nurses Therapists Nurses Aides I 

Thumb Area Home Care Art Randall still on 6240 MAIN ST., CASS CITY, 48726 872-2300 

I =800~358=4749 
Monday-Friday 8 a.m.-4:30 p.m.; 

RN on call 24 hours. 
1 ‘Wwlng is part of the cure,” E 

the job after 25years 
He was preceded in death 

by his father, one son, 
Patrick, i n  1987, and one 
brother, Robert Osantowski, 
in 1994. 

Funeral services were 
scheduled for ‘10 a.m. 
Wednesday at St. Ignatius 
Catholic Church in Freihurg. 
Msgr. Francis Murray will 
officiate, 
Burial will be in the church 

cemetery. 
The Zinger-Smigielski Fu- 

neral Home was in charge of 
arrangements, 

and, according to Randall, 
they have not necessarily 
made his job  easier or 
quicker. 
“It’s nice to be able to push 

a button and theoretically get 
the right answer, but the ad- 
vent of computers is not 
shortening my amount of 
work. In fact, I spend more 
time now than before.” 
He added he does see some 

advantages to the system 
such as the voter registration 
features. “Parts of i t  are 
fine,” he stated* 
While in office, Randall es- 

timates he has served with 5 
supervisors, 3 clerks and 10 
trustees. 
“Not as many people as you 

would think. In local gov- 
ernment,” he explained, “no 
one wants the jobs and be- 
cause of that they end up 
staying a iong time.” 

Although there have been 
few changes in the system or 
in the township since Randall 
took office, he said one thing 
that did affect his work was 
Proposition A. 
“The homestead act created 

an astronomical mountain of 
work. It was very confusing. 

No one could hand me a 
form and say ‘Here, that’s it.’ 

by Rebecca Maser 
Staff Writer 

In 25 years the Cass City 
area has seen a few changes, 
but one thing has remained 
the same. 

Art Randall has been 
-1kland Township treasurer 
1% about the last 25 years. 
He was appointed to his po- 
sition to finish the term of 
Mac O’Dell. Randall 
said he is not exactly sure 
what year he got started or 
why he has stayed so lpng. 
Part of the reason, he said, is 
nobody has really run against 
him and being on the board 
‘-3s become a habit. 

It’s one of those jobs that’s 
thankless, but someone has 
to do them,” 
In hi’k 25 or so years on the 

board, Randall said not much 
has changed. The township’s 
main concerns, roads, 
ditches, dust control, fire pro- 
tection, have stayed rela- 
tively unchanged. 
%e thing that has changed 
how the board and town- 

ship keep track of things such 
as collection of tax money. 
What was once done by hand 
is now done by computer. 

The township switched to 

People still don’t understand 
it .” 

He said the worst part was 
the government kept chang- 
ing things about the act be- 
fore i t  was put i n  effect. 
During the inaugural period 
of the act, he said, his phone 
rang off the hook for 3 
months. 

The small growth that 
Elkland Township has seen 
in the last 25 years has not 
given the board any new 
problems. Randall said there 
is a little more demand for 
dust control and people say- 
ing, “I want my road fixed”, 
but he added, “I think those 
things have always been 
there .” 
One thing that has changed 

“drastically” he said, is the 
dollar amount he collects in 
taxes. During his first few 
years in office he estimates 
he collected about $300,000 
in taxes. Now he collects 
about $2 million and at its 
peak he collected about $3 
million. 

During his years on the 
board, Randall said he is 
most proud of the new fire 
hall, which is “not so new 
anymore” and kiacktopping 
the cemetery roads. 

Veneta Kling 
Veneta Marie Kling, 86, of 

Owendale, died Friday, July 
26, at Scheurer Hospital in  
Pigeon. 
She was born July 3 1,1909, 

the daughter of Wilbert and 
Maude (Fourn i er) 
McCullough. She married 
Matthew C. Kling in Bowl- 
ing Green, Ohio, Sept. 5, 
1929. He died May 2,1981. 
‘ A graduate of Owendale 
High School, Mrs. Kling 
worked at Automotive Indus- 
tries in Owendale until it 
closed. She had been active 
as a troop leader and camp 
director with area Girl 
Scouts, was an honorary life- 
time member of the 
Owendale Women’s Club 
and a past member of the 
Owendale-Gagetown Senior 
Citizens. She was a member 
of the Owendale United 
Methodist Church and the 
United Methodist Women. 

Surviving are a daughter, 
Nancy (George) Whaley, 
Gagetown; a son, Roger 
(Kathryn) Kling, Owendale; 
7 grandchildren and their 
spouses; 5 step-grandchil- 
dren and spouses, and 15 
great-grandchildren. She was 
preceded in death by 3 sis- 
ters, Ivadale, Verena and 
Berniece. 
Funeral services were con- 

ducted Monday, July 29, at 
the Owendale United Meth- 
odist Church, Rev, Carol M. 
Blair, pastor, officiated. 

Burial was in Grant Town- 
ship Cemetery. 
Memorials may be made to 

the Owendale United Meth- 
odist Church or the 
Gagetown Girl Scouts. 

EA0 & FOOT RAISED COMPLETELY HEAD & FOOT RAISE0 INTERMEDIATELY 

Barcia co-sponsors HEAD RAISED SLIGHTLY FOOT RAISED SLIGHTLY 

Income Averaging Bill Every night should have 
U.S. Congressman Jim 

Barcia (D. Bay City) has co- 
sponsored H.R. 3783, the 
Income Averaging Bill for 
Farm Income, which will al- 
low producers to average 
their incomes over 2 years to 
compensate for the highs and 
lows of the farm economy. 
“As an industry, agriculture 

is unique in  that it is subject 
to the whims of Mother Na- 
ture and can enjoy an ex- 
tremely productive season 
next to one wiped out by 
floods, drought or disease,” 
Barcia said. 

“For example, farmers are 
experiencing torrential rains 
this season and will have to 
cover the expenses of rnul- 
tiple years. It would be a 
shame if they had to face a 
higher tax rate next year as 
they try to recoup this year’s 
losses. For these reasons, I 
think it’s necessary that we 
allow farmers to average 
their tax load over strong and 
weak income years to com- 
pensate for this inconsis- 
tency.” 

“Income averaging for the 
agriculture industry was in 

effect before 1986, so we 
know that it is workable and 
effective for farmers,” Barcia 
continued. “It is especially 
appropriate to reinstate it 
now, since the top marginal 
tax rate has increased and 
we’re experiencing record 
high commodity prices. fur- 
ther, as farmers move into a 
market based economy with 
the passage of the F m  Bill, 
we need to ease the transition 
period they will undergo by 
passing this legislation. To 
preserve the American tradi- 
tion of the family farm, we 
need to assist farmers in the 
eve.r evolving role of their 
profession.” 

The bill has the,support of 
the American Farm Bureau, 
the National Grange, the 
National Pork Producers 
Council, the National 
Cattlemen’s Beef Associa- 
tion, and Women in Farm 
Economics. 

its lirtle ups and downs. 
Some adjustable have a Flex-a-Bed is sold right here in 
famous name on top but a dozen town., .‘for about the price of a top 
manufachrers underneath. MY quality flat bed. Avoid the TV 
not stick With an alLAmericm pitchmen. Come see it here today! 
original! Flex-a-Bed makes its 
own from top to bottom. + ,and it’s 
great! You select the most com- 
fortable position at the touch of 
a button, change whenever you 
want. A pait of twins, side by side, 
make up to look like a king-size 
bed, yet allow each of you to raise 
or lower your side independently. ers about 4 years ago cornpi 

9 
Your Farm Bureau Insurance agent will S O  S. Main, Rankenmuth, MI 40734 Sat lbap 

+I: 51 7-652-2675 or 1-800-968-7287 Sunday 1 p-5p 
make sure you have the protection you 
need: life, home, auto, farm, business, boat, 
retirement, IRA’S, and more. Call today. 

Rich Ypma LUTCF 
6703 Main Street 

C a s  City, MI 48726 
Phone: 872-4326 

Ms&/n# p u r  tuturv mom pd/ctabk INVITATION TO BID/INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS 

Owner: VILLAGE OF CASS CITY 
6506 Main Street 
P.O. Box 123 
Cass City, Michigan 48726 

Marcus Osantowski 
Marcus Theodore 

Osantowski, 61, of Austin 
Township, Ubly, died Mon- 
day, July 29, at his residence 
after a long illness. 
He was born April 20, 1935, 

in Austin Township, son of 
Mary (Sadro) Osantowski 
and the late Frank 
Osantowski. He married 
Joan DoerrAug. 13,1955, at 

Separate sealed bids for the 1996 SIDEWALK PROGRAM will be 
received until 1O:OO a.m. Thursday, August 15, 1996, at the Cass City 
Municipal Building, 6506 Main Street, Cass City, Michigan 48726, and 
will be read at that time. 

L .- 
Chronicle Liners 
Work Like Magicf 
Cass City Chronicle 
Phone 872-201 0 Specifications, a location map and estimated square feet of sidewalk to 

be replaced can be obtained at the Municipal building (above address). 

Bids shall be submitted on the Bidder’s standard proposal form and shall 
include insurance certificates indicating the Bidder’s insurance cov- 
erage for the following: NOTICE )5 In The November Election!c- ~ ~ ~ -~ 

The Novesta 
& Surrounding 

Area Old 
Settlers’ Reunion 

at 
Deford United 

Saturday, August 10 
Potluck dinner at Noon 

Welcome all 
Friends and Relatives 

Methodist Church I 

Lawrence Englehart, Pres. 

Comprehensive General Liability Insurance 
Automobile Insurance 
Workman’s Compensation 

* * Over 25 years with the Sheriff Dept. * 
* Saginaw Valley State University 

‘ * Recipient of the Life Saving Award * Formed A Consolidated Dispatch 
I+ -k Assisted In The Formation Of The 

Graduate 

Thumb Narcotic Unit 

Bids to be itemized. 

Time of Completion to be indicated. 

Payment for the project will be upon acceptable completion of the project 
and after submittal of the Contractor’s Affidavit stating that all labor and 
materials are paid in full. * * Expanded the D.A.R.E. ProgramTo 

All County Schools * Started The Victim/Witness Advocacv Questions concerning this project will be handled through the Cass City 
Municipal Building, 6506 Main Street, Cass City, Michigan 48726. 
Telephone (51 7) 872-291 1. 

b 

c”. ;* Vote your party in the p-y and 
remember m e  in November! 

Your support will be greatly appreciated! 
Paid for by the committee to re-elect Tom Kern 

+ 

**m** **e** **-*. 

The Owner reserves the right to waive any informalities or to reject any 
or all Bids. 

Lou .S. LaPonsie 
Village Manager 
Village of Cass City 



4 872-5082 
* Licensed & Insured 
* Guaranteed Workmanship 
* Free Written Estimates 
* Over 20 yrs. Experience 
* Call Jim today 

Thank You! 8-5- 12-tf 

Well Drilling 

- drilled & repaired 

LIMBS STUMPS 
Call Anytime 

or 1-5 17-673-53 13 
1-800-322-5684 

2" to 5" 

Farm 
Equipment [ 

CASE 600 for parts, $150 or 
best offer. Call 872-2254. 

Arrow j k ~ ~ ~ i ~  stockyard ELECTRIC MOTOR and 
power tool repair, 8 a.m,to 
5 p.m. weekdays, 8 a.m. to available 

Rates noon Saturdays. John Blair, 
118 mile west of M-53 on Mon.-Fri. 4 - 9 p.m. 

Sat. - P.m. Sebewaing Road. Phone 

~ Crankshaft straightening 

' 

8- 12- 13-tf 872-3866 8 - 6 -22- tf 269-7909. 

1872-4614 I 
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CALL 872-2010 TO PIACE AN ACTION AD 
Transit (nonbusiness) rates. 
;lo words or less, $1.75 each 
insertion; additional words 8 
Cents each. Three weeks for 
the price of 2-cash rate. Save 
money by enclosing cash with 
mail orders. Rates for display 
want ad on application. 

( Automotive '> 

Household Services Services Notices Services Notices 
FOUND - set of keys July 
4th, corner of Ale and Pine. 
Call 872-2446. 5-7-3 1 - 1 

Interior & Exterior 
Painting 

LEE MORGAN 
PA1 NTB NG 

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 
*INTERIORS 
*EXTERIORS 

*WOOD GRAINING 
*TEXTURING 

A*LnLg pia-, IMPROVEMENT Erla Packing 
6233 Church St. 

Cass City 
Phone 872-2 19 1 

Custom Butchering 
Fridays only 

USDA Inspected Plant 
Custom Curing, Smoking, 

Cutting, Wrapping and 
Freezing 

We Make Venison Sausage 
8- 10-3 1 -tf 

FOR SALE - Green beans, 
lettuce, beets, squash, dill, 
Swiss chard, okra, collards, 
pickles, peppers. 2 miles 
south, 112 east. 2-7-3 1-3 

YARD SALE - 6305 Main 
St., Aug. 1 and 2, 8:30 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. Rowing machine, 
bedding, clothes, 3-wheel 
bicycle, table, pictures, 
something for everyone. 

14-7-3 1 - 1 

VFW HALL available for 
rental occasions. Call Jim 
Ceranski at 872-435 1. 

5-2-2 1 -tf 

Factory Outlet - Vinyl 
windows, Roofing, Siding, 

and New Construction 
"FREE ESTIMATES" 

51 7-672-2600 
1-800-826-2801 

*Farmers Harvest Discount* 
10% off special 

Bring in ad 
5-7-2 1 -tf 

FOR SALE - Whirlpool 
washer and dryer, microwave 
and microwave cart, hutch, 
large dresser, old humpback 
trunk. Call 872-2'369. 

2-7-3 1-3 

K-9 CONCEPTS Dog obe- 
dience classes: offering 
puppy, beginner, advanced 
obedience, and conformation 
classes. Classes start Aug. 
13. Far more information 
call ( 5  17) 673-7737 or ( 5  17) 
673-4 158, leave message, we 
will return your call. 

A 5-7-24-3 

Ross Kraft 
Cass City,Mich. 

(517) 872-3601 

.WINDSHIELDS, auto and 
truck, new and used. Also 
chip repair. D & G Glass, 
872-2822. 1-7-3 1 - 1 

GARAGE SALE - Friday, 
Aug. 2, 9-?. Saturday, Aug. 
3, 8-3:OO p.m. 5 1/2 west of 
Cass City, 3580 Cass City. 
Girls' clothes, infant to 6X, 
adult clothes, strollers, desk, 
Little Tykes playhouse, L/H 
golf clubs, lots of miscclla- 
ncous. 14-7-3 I - 1 

(51 7)  872-3840 
8-7-3:9 

1986 PONTIAC Sunbird, 
150,000 miles, 4 cylinder, 
automatic, AM-FM cassette, 
has new battery, new back 
brakes and wheel cylinder 
and drums. Good car - only 
needs tune-up. $500 or best 
offer takes it! 872- 1234 any- 
time. 1 -7-3 1 - 1 

FOR SALE - 2 wood stoves. 
Call 872-36 15. 2-7-24-3 

SEVERAL FAMILY yard 
sale - Aug. 3, 9 a.m.-4 p.m. 
4619Van Dyke Rd. 1/4 mile 
south of Evergreen Park. 

14-7-3 I - I 

Ronold E. Palmer 
Builder 

New buildings, old 
buildings, rcroflng, 
siding, pole barns 

NO JOB TOO BIG OR I 
TOO SMALL 

2805 Crawford Rd. 
Cass City, Mich. 48726 

(5  17) 872-4780 

KEEP COOL with All- 
Temp. Call for tune up on 
your ajr conditioner. Free in 
home estimate on new sys- 
tem, 673-5557. 8-6-7-tf 

WIVE Zertified Master Mechanic 
Computer AI ignmen t s 

Computer Balance 
& Rotation 

Front End parts 
Shocks & Struts 

Brakes 
Tun e- ups 

Free Estimates 
All your tire needs from 

wheelbarrows 
to tractors 

See us today 

Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 

5- 12- 1 8-tf 

ANTENNA 
INSTALLATION 

SERVICE 
Also Radios, VCRs, 
CBs, Marine Radios, 

Stereos, TVs 

Schneeberger's 
PHONE 872-2696 

Appliances-TV-Furniture 
8-6-19-tf 

Carpet & Upholstery 

S tainmaster 

*Flood removal 
Don Dohn 

4394 Maple #3 
Cass City 

Phone 872-347 1 8-7- IO-tf 

~ 

GARAGE SALE - Aug. 1 
and 2. Extra small to extra 
large women's clothes, kids' 
clothing, dresser with mirror, 
old and new stuff. 4 miles 
west of Cass City, south on  
Cedar Run Road, 1st house 
on left. Jean Deering and 
Julie Vollmar. 14-7-3 1 - 1 

THE C.C.H.S. Class of 1986 
is holding its 10-year class 
reunion Aug. 17, 1996. 
Please help us find the fol- 
lowing students: Lorie 
Bishop, Rod Burgett, An- 
thony Bruce, Deb 
Cortimillia, Chip Creason, 
Brian Emmons, Kris 
Hagerman, Derick Harmon, 
Tom Hastings, Ben Hoffman, 
Diane Keyser, Dave Kitchen, 
Mary Kulinski, Dave 
Lockhard, Gary Long, Scott 
Long, Rhonda Mattice, Dan 
McLellan, Lisa Meyer, Lori 
Michalski, Lonnie Muska, 
Tom O'Bee, Todd Potrykus, 
Leroy Sellers, Vicki Thane, 
Bryan Toner, Sandy Vliet, 
Steve Walther, Ron Woo- 
druff, Duane Wright, Patty 
Saldan and Melinda Yost, 
Please call Barbie Merchant, 
517-872-2328, i f  you can 
help us find any of these 
classmates. Thank you. 

5-7-3 1-2 

1983 FORD BRONCO, full 
size 4x4, V-8, automatic, in 
good condition for year. 
Make offer. Call 517-872- 
495 8. 1-7-3 1-3 

NEIGHBORHOOD GA- 
RAGE sale - Chestnut Blvd. 
and Hemlock Lane. Lots of 
girls' and junior girls' back 
to school clothes. Exercise 
equipment, furniture and 
much more. Thursday, Aug. 
1.  Everything must go. 9 a.m. 
to 7 p.m. Special sale after 5 
p.m. 14-7-3 1 - 1 

Real Estate 

FOR SALE - Double wide 
mobile home in Pine Crest 
Mobile Estates Adult Park, 
Caro, New roof, interior re- 
modeled, washer-dryer-re- 
frigerator-stove stay, 2 bed- 
rooms, 1 1/2 baths, garage, 
very pleasant location. Call 
(5 17) 672-4900. 3-7- 17-3 

FOR SALE - 1994 Cutlass 
Supreme SL, 2-door, black, 
loaded, leather interior, un- 
der warranty. Call 8 10-672- 
9024. 1 -6-26-tf 

Francis Builders 
New Homes or 

Remodeling, Roofing, 
Siding, Barns, Pole 

Buildings 
Licensed and Insured 
Phone 872-2921 

or 872-4696 
8-2-26-tf 

Thomas Roofing 
Serving the area 

for 25 years 
LICENSED 
INSURED 
BONDED 
872-2970 

Cass City 
8-3-2s-tf 

HUGE 4 family garage sale 
- Aug. I and 2, 9:OO a.m.- 
5:OO p.m. On the corner of 
Pine and Sherman Streets. 

14-7-31-1 

( Wanted to Buy) 
OLD ORIENTAL RUGS 
wanted - Any size or condi- 
tion. 1 -8OO-443-7740. 

6-7- 17-3 

FOR SALE - Storage barns, 
all sizes, horse barns, dog 
houses, craft items. Will de- 
liver. Call 872'2608, 3rd 
house on Hurds Corner Rd., 
north of M-81.  Harold 
Deering . 2-9-23-tf 

LOCAL, COUPLE seeks pri- 
vate investor to take 1st po- 
sition in Land Contract. Con- 
tract is $ I 1,000, 1 I ?% inter- 
est, monthly payment of 
$400. ACV of property is 
$3 3,000. Serious i nd i v i d u a1 
pleasc. Phone (517) 872- 
1823 anytiiiic. 3-7- 17-3 

GARAGE SALE - 6279 
Church St. Lots of baby stuff, 
household items, clothes, 
Home Interior. Aug. 1-3, 8- 
5 p.m. 14-73 1 - I 

To Give Away ) 

MIKA'S CUSTOM 
MOLDINGS 
Hardwood Molding 

Furniture Repair 
Woodworking 

Reproduction Design 
Kiln-Dried Hardwood 

GARAGE SALE - A u ~ .  1-2- 
3,. 8:OO-5:OO. Adult and 
children's clothing, and mis- 
cellaneous. Most items $ I  
and under. 6048 DeLong Rd. 

14-7-3 1 - I 

LOST DOG - Answers to 
Elvis. Black Lab. Choke 
chain collar. Last seen in the 
Colwood and Hurds Corner 
Road area. Call 673-6395. 

5-7-3 1 - 1  

FOR SALE - Darton bow 
with overdraw, sights, quiver, 
arrows and release, 4 years 
old. 65% let off, 5S# to 6?#, 
872-4585. 2-7-24-2 

Windows, 
Mirrors, 

Plate Glass, 
Repair & Replace 

mands. 872-'2428.7-7-3 1- 1 water analysis or service. 
Paul's Pump Repair 673- 

Services 4850 or 800-745-485 1. For Rent 
8-6-28-tf 

SERVICE 
Let YOUR 'tree problem 

be 01 JRS [ 
We're insured for your 

FOR RENT - 2 one-bedroom 
apartments available in  
Marlet te. Both apart men ts 
have hardwood floors, high 
ceilings with fans and large 
s u n n y  windows. $400 and 
$450 per month. ( 8  10) 549- 
7205. 4-7- 17-tf 

FOR SALE - Bennett piano, 
hpproxirnately 100 years old; 
hood burning cook stove, 
approximately 70 years old. 
call 872-22 1 1. 2-7-24-3 

Mtztqqe?buce 
Beauty Salon 

Open Mon.-Sat. (app't. only) 
Evening app'ts. available 
KATHY SWEENEY 

0 w n er /O p er a t or 

4821 Huroh Line Rd. 
1/3 mi. east of 

CemeteryElkton Rd. 

(517) 872-4898 

8- 1 2-20-t 

GARAGE SALE - Wednes- 
day, July 31, from 3 p.m.4 
p.m. and Thursday, Aug. 1 ,  
from 9 a.m.-4 p.m. at 46.53 
Hospital Drive. Toddler bed. 
and railing, baby gate, high 
chair, Fisher Price t o y s .  
Boys' clothing, size 24 
months - 10/12. Girls cloth- 
ing, 24 months - 3T, window 
air conditioner, twin beds, 
g I ass ware. 14-7-3 1 - I 

HAULING CRUSHED 
stone for driveways, etc. 25 
to 50-ton loads. Call 872- 
2672 * 5-7- 17-3 

4556 Green Rd., Cass City 
872-3976 

8-4- 13-t 

ACE GLASS 
872-2822 ' 

8-7-31-1 SALE - from now thru fall. 
Old Maytag wringer washer, 
many antiques, many Christ- 
mas tins, sheets and pillow 
cases, many miscellaneous 
items. 4280 S. Elkton Rd., 7 
1/2 miles north of Cass City. 
872-2230. 2-7-3 1-3 

I 24Hour FOR RENT - 3-hedroom, 2- 

' 1  WRECKER hat h mobile home o n  5 acres. 
Absolutely n o  pets, no more 

I SERVICE than 2 childre'n. Call 872- 
2007. 4-7-3 1-3 

872-2251 day 
872-5606 night 

APARTMENT FOR RENT 
- good renters wanted. Mrist 
have ref'erenccs. 81 0-659- 
8432 or 8 IO-hS9-7279. 

4-7-3-tf 

GARAGE SALE - A u ~ .  2-3, 
8-5. Something for cvcryone. 
6 miles south of M-81 - M- 
53, 1 mile east Deckerville 
Rd., 1 1/4 south Hadley Rd. 

14-7-3 1 - 1 

EXTERIOR PAINTING - 
Barns, roofs, tool sheds, 
grain bins. Tree trimming. 

. Hendrick Paint Services, 
Cass City, 872-20 19. 

8-5-3-tf 

9-7- 17-3 

OWN YOUR OWN apparel 
or shoe store. Choose: Jean/ 
sportswear, bridal, lingerie, 
hesternwear, ladies', men's, 
large sizes, infadpreteen, 
pe ti tc, dancewear/aerobic, 
maternity, or accessories 
store. Over 2000 name 
brands. $26,900 to $38,900: 
inventory, training, f ix tures, 
grand opening, etc. Can open 
15 days. Mr. Loughlin (612) 
888-6555. 2-7-3 1 * 1 

Livestock 
ST. JOHNS horse auction 
and trailer sale. 9 miles north 
of St.  Johns on U.S. 27. 
Regular sales July 6 and July 
20. Registered catalog sale 
Aug. 3. Tack 11 a.m., horses 
1 p.m. All consignors and ,  
vendors welcome, Call for 
more information. 517-838- 
2300. 10-7-3-5 

~ 

FOR RENT - upstairs apart- 
men t , part i a I1 y f u  rn  ish ed , 
suitable for one person. No 
pets. Call 872-22 I I .  

4-7-24-3 

GARAGE SALE -Aug. 3-4, 
9:OO-5:00, 1 mile east to 
Schwegler, 3 112 north. Ce- 
ramic items, lots of toys. 

14-7-3 1 - 1 

WATER PUMP SERVICE- 
All types repaired. Dis- 
counts on new pumps and 
tanks. Emergency service. 
Call Paul's Pump Repair, 
673-4850 or 800-745-485 1.  

8-6-28-tf 

You cull, we haul 
CASS CITY WRECKER/ 

AUTO ELECTRIC 
AAA Affiliated FOR RENT- Cass City Mini 

Storage. Call 872-39 17. GARAGE Z L E  - Thursday 
and Friday, 10-4, 2213 N. 
Cemetery, 3 3/4 south of 
Cass City. Hutchinson. Fur- 
niture and miscellaneous. 

14-7-3 1 - I 

4-3-13-tf 

"CLASSY? ONE AND TWO bedroom 
apartments for rent. Main 

~ 

H A R D W O O D / F I R E -  
WOOD - $35 face cord. 
Call 872- 1 140. 2- 10-5-tf 

Smith 
Refrigeration 

and 
Appliance Repair 

% Ctreet. Phone 872-4532 be- +- 

tween 8:30 and 5:OO. Secu- &- CUTS 
rity deposit and first month's k &- 

FOR RENT - We are now 
taking applications for studio Booth 
1 and 2 bedroom apartments &- Smoke-Free .% 
at the Northwood Heights 9r 
Apartments i n  Cass City. 

Hex Tanning rcn t. 4-6-26-tf 

Walk-in or 

. ~~~~ 

MULTI-FAMILY yard sale - 
Saturday, Aug. 3, 8:OO-5:OO. 
4616 N. Seeger St. Furniture, 
child's car seat, clothing, etc. 

14-7-3 1-1 

Hodse demolition & removal 
Footings - Waterlines - I ( Help Wanted ) 1 AM NOW taking orders for 

tomatoes. Will be ready in 
about I week. $8.00 bushel. 
872-291 2. 2-7-3 1 - 1 

DISCOVERY TOYS needs 
consultants for busy fall sea- 
son. Great money, fun, flex- 
ible hours. Training pro- 
vided. Call immediately, 
Joan Nelson, manager, 517- 

1 1-7-24-6 323- 18 10. 

Complete septic systems 
Sand - Gravel - Topsoil 

Variety of fill - 
Any size fill job 
FreeEstimates 
872-4502 

8- 1 -23-tf 

Gas & Oil Furnaces 
All Gas Appliances 

HEATING . 

and 
COOLING 

SPECIALIST 
Paul L. 
Brown 

Owner 
State Licensed 

24 Hour Emergency 
Service 

CALL 51 7-872-2731 
8 - 3 -30- t 

All makes and models 

Call 872-3092 
8-3- 15-tf 

Ray Armstead and Co. 
Payroll Processing 

Complete Bookkeeping 
and Accounting Services 

Tax Preparation 
Computer Consulting 

6545 Church St., Cass City, Michigan 
Ph: 5 17-872-4532 Fax: 5 17-872-5 140 

Appointment * 
--_I. -I- 

87-CLASS 
872-5277 

next to Cass Theater & 

Equal Housing Opportunity. &. 

FOR RENT - Masonic S 
Terriple Refreshment Hall - 
parties , d i n n tlr s , r n  ee t i n g s . 
No alcoholic bevcrages. Call 3~ 
Bob Hunter, 872-2836. % 

872-2369. 4-6-5-tf 

4-4-3-tf 6 

BABY-SITTER wanted in 
my home, Monday thru Fri- 
day, 8-5. Send letter of in- 
terest to Box D, C/O Cass 
City Chronicle, P.O. Box 
115, Cass City, MI 48726. 

11-7-24-3 

Robert Bliss Electric, Homes I Farms InC. 
Builder Commercial * 

Notices Industrial 
New and rewire 

STATE LICENSED 

Licensed & Insured 
Rep1 acemen t Windows 

Vinyl Siding 
BINGO - Every Sunday at 
St. Pancratius Hall ,  S. 
Seeger, Cass City. Doors 
open 5:OO p.m.,  gamcs start 
at 5:30.  "No smoking" ef- 
fective M a y  5.  Phone 872- 
5410. Knights of Columbus 
Council No. 8892. 

5-4-24- t f 

BINGO - Every Wednesday 
night. Open 6:OO-early bird 
6:30 - regular bingo 7:OO. 
Post 3644 VFW, Weaver St. 

WANTED - baby-sitter in  
my home, 8:30 p.m. till 11 
p.m. Monday thru Thursday, 
one child, in Cass City. 872- 
3267 before 2:OO. 1 1-7-3 1-3 

D M.OTEL I I Phone872-4114 New Construction & 
Remodeling I U 

5§! 
Homes & Businesses 

@ I Bruce ATTN: Cass City - Postal 
Positions. Permanent full- 
time for clerldsorters. Full 
benefits. For exam, applica- 
tion and salary information 
call: (708) 906-2350 Ext. 
6742,8 a.m. to 8 p.m. 

1 1-7-3 1-3 

DAVE'S SMALL ENGINE 
REPAIR SERVICE 

TUNE-UPS 
REPAIR 

OVERHAULS 
Repair all makes & 

models push mowers, 
riders, trimmers, chain 

saws & tillers 

Phone: 51 7-673-3957 
1275 Riley Rd., Cam, MI 48723 8-4-24-tf 

1 ! 
: Brown i 
I Water Well ; 

COLQR 7V 
P#ON€ AIR CONDiTlONlNG 

0 1 Drilling 'i 
* and 1 
I 1 

BOOKKEEPER position 
available for health care set- 
ting, computerized office. 
Knowledge of Medicare, 
Medicaid and private insur- 
ance a must. Submit resume 
or apply i n  person. 
Tendercare Cass City, 4782 
Hospital Drive, Cass City, 
Mich. 48726. E.O.E. 

11-7-31-1 

Attention Land Owners!! TUESDAY SPECIAL 
All You Can Eat 
Liver & Onions 

$4.25 
LUNCH BAR 

11:3O a.m. - 1 :3O p.m. $4.75 
WEDNESDAY SPECIAL 

Spaghetti 62 Breadsticks 
All You Can Eat 

$4.25 
{ours: Mon.-Thurs. 11-8 p.m. 
3-i. 11-10 p.m.; Sat. 1 1-9 p.m. 

Sunday 9-3 p.m. 
NORTHWOOD SHORES 

RESTAUR ANT 
6106 Beechwood Drive 

872-5642 

---- . _ I__~-~ - - -  

Top prices paid for standing timber and timber lands. 
Let our foresters assist you in managing your wooded 
property. We offer payment in advance and are fully 
insured. Estimates on five acres or more, anywhere in 
Michigan. 

+ L 

4 I, 1 

t Call ' I IICARPET BRlTE I Drys Faster 
Stays Fluffy 
Smells Good 

13 vrs. Experience 

i 

i 

I 

24 hr:  
service I 

1 
s City, Mich. 1 

1 
i 

4 
1 

I ! 
I '  

Tnrck Mount II 
ASSISTANT MANAGER 
for local company in  Bad 
Axe. Full time, full benefits. 
Send resume to: Box 55,  C/O 
Cass City Chronicle, P.O. 
Box 1 1 5 ,  Cass City, MI  
48726. 1 1-7-3 1-2 

Wlxttaker Timber Corporation 
3623 E h w d  Rd. 
Cas City, Mxhigan 48726 

Phone ( 5  17) 872-3065 
Evenings (5 1 7) 872-3405 Larry Harper Upholstery Cleaning 

Spot Removal 
Odor Killing Experts 

4205 Little Rd. 
Cass City, MI 48726 

.= 

Lumber S a w o  b g s  Veneer h g s  Firewood K- - A 8-7-6-tf 1 
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CALL 872-2010 TO PUCE AN ACTION8 AD 
REPORTER - Ready to move 
from a weekly or small daily to 
a 9,000 circulation daily news- 
paper? Need solid 
grammarlspelling skills for 
writing position on 9,000 circu- 
lation daily. Pay from $1 6,640. 
Resume, clips, references to: 
Editor, The Daily flews, P.O. 
Box 340, Greenville, MI 
48838. 

WEB PRESS MANAGER - 
Ne  wspaper lComm e r c ia l  
Printing Company, Steuben 
County, Indiana, is seeking 
Web Press Manager. Book 
printing experience a plus. 
Competitive wage s/b en e f i t 
package. Send resume - Attn: 
Personnel, Steuben Printing, 
P.O. Box 180, Angola, IN 
46703. EOE. 

CASH FOR L A N D C O N -  
TRACTS. Highest prices ever 
from Michigan's largest buyer. 
Avoid the middleman. Cat1 
First National Monday through 
Saturday and get more cash'! 
1-800-879-2324. 

ARE YOU RECEIVING PAY- 
MENTS from a Land Contract 
You Own? Sell Now! We Pay 
Cash for Land Contracts 
Nationwide. R&J Funding, 1. 
800-543-5443. / 

Helr, Wanted < Help Wanted '> ( Help Wanted ) r Work Wanted 3 
MANUFACTURING com- 
pany in Cass City is taking 
applications for surface 
grinder operators. Steady 
employment and benefit 
package. No experience nec- 
essary. Please send resume to 
Box C25, C/O Cass City 
Chronicle, P.O.Box 1 15, 
Cass City, MI 48726. 

I 1-7- 17-tf 

EXPANDING THUMB area 
company has immediate 
openings for blow molding 
machine operators. Send re- 
sume or apply at Regency 
Plastics, 4 147 N. Ubly Road, 
Ubly, MI 48475. 1 1-7-3 1-2 

NURSE AIDE looking for 
hourly employment in home. 
Write PO. Box 8 1, Cass City, 
MI 48726. 12-7-3 1-3 

NOW HIRING 
Local company now has 10 full-time 
positions available for cable activ- 
ist technician. Must be self moti- 
vated and willing to work. No ex- 
perience necessary. Company will 
train. Over $40,000 per year first 
year potential. Call (5  17) 426- 1000 
for interview time. 

1 1-7-24-2 

G.D. HANDYMAN looking 
for side jobs, including build- 
ing decks, staining decks, 
drywall, siding, or just odd 
& end jobs. Free estimates. 
Call 872-2633. 12-7- 17-3 

WANTED - Baby-sitter for 
2 girls, in Kingston area, 7 
a.m.-5 p.m. Call 517-761- 
7 152, leave message. 

11-7-24-3 

MARION: (Between Cadillac 
& Clare). 47.56 acres, 1,822 ft. 
W. Branch Clam River 
(stream), 1,160 ft black top, 
rolling, tillable, seeded in alfal- 
fa. Excellent deer hunting, 
$49,000, $1 0,000 down, $500 
per month. The Land Co. (61 6) 
824-31 00. 

NEWSPAPEWCOMMERCIAL 
PRINTING Company has a 
position opening in its 
Carnerdstripping department. 
Color stripping a must. 
Competitive wages and bene- 
fits. Ideal location to raise a 
family. EOE. Send resume 
with work history to: Steuben 
Printing Company, Attn: 
Production Manager, P.O. Box 
180, Angola, IN 46703. 

EXPANDINGTHUMB area 
company has immediate 
openings for Tool & Die 
people. Four year apprentice- 
ship program available. 
Send resume or apply at Re- 
gency Plastics, 4 147 N. Ubly 
Road. Ubly, MI 48475. 

11-7-31-2 

OWN YOUROWN HOME 
NOW! No downpayment on 
Miles materials. Innovative 
construction financing. Call 
Miles Homes today, 1-800- 
343-2884, ext. L. 

(Card of Thanks 5 
"WORKERS NEEDED to 
stuff envelopes." Send a 
S.A.S.E. to R & D Associ- 
ates, P.O. Box 302, Lyons, 
IN. 47443. 11-7-17-4 

THANK YOU, Thumb Na- 
tional Bank, for buying my 
feeder calf at the Tuscola 
County Fair. Angela 
S toec kle. 13-7-3 1 - 1 START EARNING TOP IN- 

DUSTRY PAY! Exp'd and 
Inexp'd OTR. $2,000 sign-on 
bonus (exp'd), company-spon- 
sored training, comprehensive 
benefits. Gainey Transporta- 
tion Services, Inc. 1-800-326- 
8889. 

PROFESSIONAL DRIVERS. 
TLC Group. Regional, Local & 
OTR positions. New equip-: 
ment, good paylbenefits. 2, 
years CDL "A." Call Recruiting, 
at 1-800-333-5599. 

DRIVERS - All '94-'96 conven- 
tionals. Start 28 cents-30 
centslmi. based on experi- 
ence. $40 tarp pay. Top bene- 
fits. 23 with 6 months recent 
OTR experience. MELTON 
TRUCK LINES 1-800-635- 
8669 Ext. AF-1. 

CASS CITY People's 
Choice now accepting appli- 
cations for all shifts. 

I 1-7- 17-3 

~~ 

I WANT TO thank all the 
people for their prayers and 
cards while I was in the hos- 
pital, especially Bill Eberline 
and Harry Stine. Grant 
Hutchinson. 13-7-3 I - I 

BROADEN YOUR WORLD 
with Scandinavian, European, 
South American, Asian, 
Russian high school exchange 
students arriving August. 
Become a host family/AISE. 
Call 1 -800-SIBLING. 

Real Estate For Sale 
HELP WANTED - Experi- 
enced mason and masonry 
laborer. (5 17) 673-4465. 

11-7-17-3 I WOULD LIKE to take this 
opportunity to thank family 
and friends for their prayers 
and cards while I was in the 
hospital. A special thanks to 
Pastor Meyer for his visits 
and prayers. Thanks to the 
staff at Bay Medical also. 
Judy Hahn. 13-7-3 1 - 1  

NAPLES, FLORIDA WATER- 
FRONT PATIO HOME. New 2 
bed/2 ba wlden, 2-car gar. 
patio home in gated comm. 
Spacious floor plan. Town 
Center: for residents wlshops, 
services, car wash, tennis 
complex, pools, fitness center 
& Activity Dir. No membership 
fees. Spacious floor plan. Built 
solid. DiVosta Homes Inc. 
licensed R.E. Broker. Near 
beaches. $1 37,900. Call Glen 
Thomas (941) 594-9233. 

HAROLD IVES TRUCKING 
needs motivated individuals to 
enter our Training Program. 
Call 1-800-999-801 2 for com- 
plete information. Experienced 
drivers call: 1-800-842-0853. 

HELP WANTED - Apply in 
person at Michigan Peat 
Company, 7385 Polk Rd., 
Minden City. 2 miles west 
and 2 miles south of Minden 
City. 11-7-24-3 

CRUISE SHIP JOBS! 
Earn $300/$900 

weekly. Year round 
positions. Hiring 
both men/women. 
Free roomhoard. 
Will train. Call 7 
days. 1-504-64 1 - 

7778, ext. 1127C29 
11-7-17-4 

20/20 WITHOUT GLASSES!, 
Safe, rapid, non-surgical, per- ; 
manent restoration in 6-8! 
weeks. Airline pilot developed.' 
Doctor approved. Free infor- 
mation by mail: (800) 422: 
7320, ext. 216, (406) 961- 

http://www.visionfreedom.com' 
5570, FAX (406) 961-5577.' 

TEED. SAT I S FACT IO N G U A R A N -: 

SO COLORADO RANCH 
112AC - $65,900. Gently 
rolling fields, trees, panoramic 
views of lake, Pikes Peak, 
Green Horn Mtn. & front range 
of Rockies. Very private, abun- 
dant wildlife. TeVelec. Owner 
financing. Call (719) 485- 
0656. Red Creek 8:30-8:30. - 

WAITING FOR YOU! 

HOTTEST BIZ IN USA. 
$1 00,OOOt computer related, 
publicly owned manufacturer 
of Children's Software & 
Games, seeks dealer for your 
area. PfllF/T. No experi- 

r e,q u ired . encelselling 
Minimum investment required. 
1-800-843-4759. 

I 

HIGH RISK, Mortgages, Re- 
finance, purchase homes, 
vacant land, mobile's on land, 
cash in hand, consolidations, 
foreclosure, OK. CALL CON- 

5715, Open Sat. 9-3 p.m. 
TINENTAL MTG. 1-800-561 - 

ATTEN TI ON H 0 M E 0 W N- 
ERS, we have CASH for you; 
slow or poor credit NO PROB? 
LEM, Pay-off Bills, Land 
Contracts, Taxes, Foreclosure, 
Bankruptcy, NO PROBLEM4 
CASH out on Investment 
Homes. Call Today for your 
Free credit analysis and rate 
quote. NO APPLICATIO 
FEE, TAMER MORTGAG 
COMPANY at 1-800-285-5284 
OR 1-81 0-626-1 296. W t  
CAN'T HELP IF YOU DON'T 
CALL. , 

2 

Priced under $30,000 - 2 acres. 2 bed- Neat Home - Large master bedroom. 3 
room mobile. 24'x14' garage. Stove & bedrooms, full basement, lots of storage 
refrigerator stay. CC-285 space. 1 car garage. CCT-I37 

ALL STEEL BUILDINGS, 
never put up, with blueprints. 
(1) 40x20 was $5,600 will sell 
for $2,200, (1) 40x37 was 
$6,450 will sell for $3,900. 
Open ends, can deliver. 1-800- 
292-01 11 . 

< Work Wanted > 
HIGH SCHOOL, BOY look- 
ing for lawn and other odd 
jobs in town area. 872-4892. 

12-7- 17-3 

STEEL BUILDINGS: 5,OOOt 
sizes. 40x60~14, $9,413; 
40x75~14, $1 1,734; 50x60~12, 
$1 0,069; 50x1 00x1 6, $1 7,133; 
60x80~14, $1 5,493; 60x 
100x1 6, $1 9,716. Quality- 
Service. Free brochures. 
Sentinel Buildings, 1-800-327- 
0790, ext. 79. 

CARS UNDER $150. All mod- 
els. Seized and auctioned by 
DEA, FBI, IRS; trucks, boats, 
computers, furniture and 
more, Available your area. Call 
Now! 1-800-451 -0050 ext. 
4399. 

NEED MONEY? Receiving 
Payments on a SETTLE- 
MENT? We will buy your 
FUTURE PAYMENTS for 
CASHTODAY. Call R&P 
Capital Resources at 1-800- 
338-581 5. FAST CLOSINGS. 

HOUSECLEANING - 8 
years' experience. 683-3207 
after 3 p.m. 12-7- 17-3 

Out of the pages of Country Home Gorgeous Victorian Home - Very taste- 
Magazine - Adorable home. Vcry spa- fully decorated. Open staircase. Elec- 
cious, newer carpet, thrcc level deck, tricity, plumbing updated. Hardwood 
fenced in back yard. Beautiful landscap- f]oors. Fireplace, formal dining. Reduced 
ing, stone fireplace. Full basement. 2 t(~$145,OOO. CCT-141 
car garage. CT- 147 

LOTS NEEDED IN TOWN AND OUT 
R M L S  
w y 5 4 * u ~ u * v r c ~  

BARGAINS ON GOVERN- 
MENT FORECLOSED 
HOMES. Save up to 50% or 
more. Minimum or no down 
payment. Repossessed prop- 
erties sold daily. Listings avail- 
able now! 1-800-338-0020 ext. 
4399. 

INVESTMENT COMPANY 
BUYS Land Contracts. Sen 
Direct! No fees or cornmis: 
sions. Fast and professional 
service. Call 1-800-641 -1 71 7, 
8am-9pm, 7 days a week. 

LOVING MOTHER of one 
will baby-sit your child in 
my country home. Experi- 
enced with children, meals 
are provided. 3 miles east of  
Cass City. Call 872-9805 
any time. 12-7-3 I - 1 

For Sale by Owner 

HOME/PROPERTY OWNERS 
Need Debt Relief? .No appli- 
cation fee Avoid high broker 
fees Pay Taxes Credit card 
debt Land contract-balloons * 
Home improvement c 
Commercial properties * 
Vacant land. For East Cash 
Call 1-800-968-3626. First 
National Bank of Michigan. 

FRIENDLY TOYS & GIFTS 
has openings for dealers. No 
cash investment! Fantastic 
toys. Exclusive gifts, home 
decor, Christmas items. Call 
for catalog and information. 1- 
800-488-4875. 

OUR GROWTH MEANS 
OPPORTUNITY FOR 10 
DRIVERS! Guaranteed home 
3 weekendslmo., Freightliner 
Conventionals, excellent start- 
ing pay. Must have 1+ years 
OTR experience including 
cross border. Call Lou, M-F, 
8am-5pm: 1-800-345-31 54. 
FREDRICK. 

DISPLAY ADVERTISING 
REPRESENTATIVE. Looking 
for ad sales professional! 
Experience in newspapel 
advertisinglmedia sales and 
knowledge of ad agency pro: 
cess preferred. Excellent 
opportunity for goal-oriented 
individual. Compensation 
package includes base salary 
plus bonus, mileage reim- 
bursement, company-paid+ 
benefit plan and excellent 
retirement plan. Please send 
resume with references and 
salary history to: Box W, 8 2 t  
N. Washington Ave., Lansing 
MI 48906. EOE L 

A BANK TURN YOU DOWN$ 
H O M E O W N E R S  C A S $  
FAST! 1ST and 2ND MORT; 
GAGES, PURCHASE OR 
REFINANCE, LOANS B$ 
PHONE, SAME DAY APPE 
ROVAL, FirstlSecond Hom 
Income Property, Lan? 
Contract Refinancing, Homq 
Improvements, Bill Consolida.; 
tion, etc. Any Worthwhilg 
Purpose, Slow Credit OK: 
Fast Easy-Call 24 Hours, AAa 
Mortgage & Financk 
Corporation 1-800-968-2221: 
Statewide Services. Open Sac 
9-1; Sun. 1-4. Free Qualifying 
Appointment. 4 

,LOANS FOR HOMEOWN: 
ERS Closed In f Days. Self: 
employed OK. Slow Cred? 
OK. Home or Rental p ropew 
Any worthwhile purpose. N$ 
Application Fee. Call today fof; 
a FREE ANALYSIS. 1-80@ 

6 
4 

Peaceful Country Living - in a beau- 
tifully decorated, 2 story farmhouse 
located 5 minutes from Cass City on 
1.2 acres. 3 bedrooms, 2 full baths, 
23'x 14' living room with gas frreplace. 
Main floor laundry, basement, lots of 
storage. All new windows, siding and 
foam insulation. Many shade trees, 
garage and 2 out-buildings. 

53 12 Milligan Road. 
Asking $92,500 

CALL FOR APPOINTMENT 
872-3044 or 872-4381, ext 236 

New on the Market - Built in 1995, this ranch has 1,500 
square feet of living space. Beautifully decorated and 
landscaped. Merrillat cherry cabinets. Garden tub in 
master bath. 6-panel doors throughout. A must see. 
TCC I 1  80 

Beautiful Condo Overlooking the Woods - Large lawn 
area with garden spot. Full walk-out lower level. Very 
nicely decorated throughout. If you have been think-  
ing about a condo, you have to look at this one. 
TClCl1173 

BUILDERS LICENSE COU- 
RSE. Money back guaranteed 
you will pass the Michi an 
builders license exam. f 9 5  
includes complete course 
materials. Prepare now for 
next exam. Information: 1-800- 
541 -1 030. 

DOCTOR BUYS LAND CON- 
TRACTS and loans money on 
real estate. Fast closing. 
Immediate cash. Deal directly 
with Doctor Daniels & Son, 1- 

61 66. 
800-837-61 66, 1-81 0-335- 

New on the Market - Location, Location, Location! Less 
than 2 miles from town on hardtop road. 2 story home 
featuring 3 bedrooms, 1st floor laundry, attached ga- 
rage. Workshop, barn and 4 acres af land. Cy2QO8 

New on the Market - Very nice home featuring 3 bed- 
rooms, 2 baths, some hardwood floors. Newer gas 
furnace and hot water heater. Partial basement. 2 car 
garage. Newly decorated throughout. $67,000. 
TCC1181 

* >  +. 

SSOCIATES 

2 baths and 2 1/2 car garagc (In 5 X r C S .  lures 4 bcdrooIns, 3 baths, oI,c-car ga- 
rage and ccntral air. I n  likc-ncw condi- 
I i ( )n I h r( )ii ghoul, 

This is a must hcc properly. 

TWO, 5 ACRE PAHCELS 
on Cemetery Road. Land con- 
tract, easy terms, $9,500 each. 

ONE-HALF ACRE LO1 on 
Kelly Rd. Only $5,500, 

- - - 1 - - - -  

J out our low 

6703 Main St,, Cass City (Parkway Building) 

Not A Drive-by - This 3 bedroom ranch sits o n  3.3 acres 
with a little woods behind. Very nicely decorated and 
well cared for home. Largc 2 car garage just added in 
1990. Priccd to scll $56,800. Cy2007 

New on the Market - Just off blacktop and only 4 1/2 
miles frorn town. This 14'x60' mobilc with a 14'x60' 
addition fcaturcs 4 bcdroonis, fami ly  r o o i i i  and 8 acres 
of land. $39.500. MHhSC, 
Year 'Round Home with Canal Frontage - 2 bedroom ranch. 1 1/2 car 
garage. Boat house. $53,000. Cy2000 
New on the Market - Handyman home in Caro country. 2 bedrooms, 
basement. Set on 5 acres bordering state land. Cy2009 
Business Opportunity - Very nice building in a great Main St. location. 
Beauty shop and barber shop. COM975 
Investment - Commercial building in town, presently leased. COM982 Commercial-Home units from 

$1 99. Lamps-Lotions-AcceG 
sories. Monthly payments 109 
as $18. Call today. F R f E  
NEW color catalog. 1-80&: 

f 
e. 

462-91 97. 

PLACE YOUR S T A T E W I ~  
AD HERE! $239 buys a 2@ " 4  

word classified ad of fe r ig  
over 1,4 million circulationj 
Contact this newspaper fq 
details. 5 

4 

Call 
Cass City 51 7-872-2248 
or Caro 51 7-673-2555 
Kelly W. Smith, Broker 

Farm Commercial Residential n- 
EOUAL HOUSIHC 
OPPORTUNITY R M L  s Listings Wanted 

RWIAL MICHIGAN USflHG SERVICE 
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New pastor Rev. Lee: 

Laity leadership crucial to 
growth of Methodist Church 

‘Ilic IJnitcd Methodist dc- 
iioiiiination has x e n  its con- 
gi-epiitions dwindle, but there 
IS i i r i  effort underway to re- 
\t:t \,LL thc trend. 

I t ’ ;  an area that is particu- 
lar ly  iniportaiit to the Rev. 
K i i  ;uig M. Lee, who recently 
bcg:in serving as pastor of the 
Kir)g.c;ton and I k f o r d  United 
Mt.ttiodist utiurches. 

th ir ik  we’rc going to see 
sotiie changes and prow,” 
1 , t ~ -  recently coirimcnted i n  
his office at the Kingston 
c.hrrrch. “ I  would like to see 
c’\t‘.ry church grow, atid I 
tioI)c to see that happening 
t IC1 c * ’*  
“If y o u  ask me to  say one 

word to rcflect m y  undcr- 
statding of‘ ministry, then I 
~ c ‘ o i i l d  say that i t  is disciple- 
stki\),*’ hc said. “‘I’here arc 
initiiy things i n  our  denonii- 
n;rlioii t l i a l  trouhle rile. F3ut, 
oiir is tlir: declining number 
o t t I 1 i s s i on ar i e s he I n g se n t 
01.11 to iriany parts o f  this  
coiiritry, and iiiany parts in 
t h .  world. 

“ I  h e l iuve  the words of 
Jt:stis Christ in  the Gospel o f  
b1:itthew 28: 18-20 applies 

“1 t ’s a strong movcment. 1 

not  o n l y  to thc clergy, but 
also the la i ty :  And Jcsus 
came and said to them, ‘All 
authority in heaven and on 
cartli has heen h.  vivcn to me. 
(io therefore and makc dis- 
ciples o f  all nations, haptiz- 
iiig them in the namc of the 
Fatticr, arid of’thc Son and of 
tlic H o l y  Spirit, teaching 
thcm to observe all that I 
h:tw cornrnnnded you; and 
lo, I ani with you always, to 
tho close of the agc’. 

I, A IT Y I, E A DE HS II I P 

“Wc nced to huild up strong 
laity leaciurship (because) it’s 
the i r in i ti is t r y , their church ,” 
Lee continued. “When they 
th ink  the pastor takes care of 
cvcrything, there’s no way, 
the numbers decline. 

“I always belicvcd that i t  is 
n o t  thc shepherd, but a lamb 
who gives birth to  a lamb. 
‘I’here is no doubt that lead- 
ership of the laity is crucial 
for thc growth of ministry.” 

A big part of Lee’s minis- 
try is encouraging people to 
cxprcss and use their own 
talents and spiritual gifts to 
build up the church as a 

whole. 
Towards that end, he is a 

strong believer that everyone 
should make a sincere effort 
not t o  make prejudgments 
about other people, including 
new pastors. 
“I think we have to be aware 

of the fact that everyone has 
an opinion,” he said. “We 
need to slow down and make 
some judgements, make 
some evaluations and make 
some observations” rather 
than prejudging someone. 

Lee, who holds 2 services 
each Sunday -- one for the 
1 %member Deford congre- 
gation and the other for the 
1 14-member Kingston con- 
gregation - has served the 
ministry full-time since 
1988. 
Born in Seoul, South Korea, 

he moved to the United 
States as a teenager in order 
t o  join his parents, who were 
i n  the ministry in the Bay 
Area of San Francisco. 

EDUCATION 

He graduated from the Uni- 
versity of California at Ber- 
keley in 1982 with a Bach- 

elor ofArtsA3achelor of Sci- 
ence double major degree in 
philosophy and psychology. 

He went on to earn his 
master’s degree in religion 
from the School ofTheology 
at CI aremon t, Claremon t , 
Calif., in 1984, and his Mas- 
ter of Divinity Degree and 
Master of Theology Degree 
in  socio-Christian ethics 
from the Princeton Theologi- 
cal Seminary, Princeton, 
N.J., in 1988. 

Lee is continuing work on 
his Doctor of Ministry de- 
gree through the Candler 
School of Theology at 
Emory University in Atlanta, 
Ga. 

Between 1974 and 1988, 
Lee served as a volunteer 
counselor at the Zion Korean 
United Methodist Church in 
Sunnyvale, Calif.; youth pas- 
tor at the West Covina Ko- 
rean UMC in West Covina, 
Calif,; youth pastor at the 
Korean Community Church 
of New Jersey; and youth 
pastor at KUMC of 
Haverto w n , Penn . 
In 1988, he entered the min- 

istry full  time as associate 

This ad 
‘75 DODGE motor home, 20’ long, 360 engine, au- 

tomatic, cab air, CB radio, good tires, 59,000 
miles, $4,500. 1984 Bayliner boat, 16’ cabin style, 
85 force mtr. with life jackets, anchor, ship to shore 
radio, compass, $3,400. Eagle 6000 fish finder 
with transducer and mount, $125. Ranch King 
riding lawn mower, 11 hp., 38 inch cut - good 
shape, 2 years old, $400. 

Published just once in 
the Chronicle SOldm 
J ‘75 Dodge Motor Home 
J ‘84 Bayliner Boat 
J Eagle 6000 Fish Finder 
J Ranch King Riding Lawn Mower 

ALL AT THE LOWEST COST 
OF ANY PUBLICATION 

$5.58 
RESULTS COUNT 

AND YOU CAN COUNT ON 
Cass City Chronicle 
6550 Main St. Cass City 

pastor of the Ocean Pine 
Community Church in  
Maryland and local pastor of 
the Korean Mission UMC in 
S a1 i s bury, Mary1 and. 
A year later, he became as- 

sociate pastor of an English 
speaking worship service 
and ministry in Troy, Mich., 
and in 1991, Lee was named 
pastor in charge of Bethel 
UMC in Centerline, Mich. 
More recently, he served as 

pastor of the Sterling Heights 
UMC in Sterling Heights. 

Lee, who was ordained by 
Bishop Judith Craig in 1993 
as an elder in the United 
Methodist Church, is mar- 
ried. He and his wife, Mi 
Hyun Lee, have 3 children, 
Josephine Seung-Ah, 4, .Ted 
Woo Jin, 3, and Jane1 Seung- 
Hyun, 6 months. 

$150,000 for 
farm help 
announced 

Christine White, Acting 
State Executive Director, for 
the USDA Farm Service 
Agency announced the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture 
has approved $150,000 for 
the Emergency Conservation 
Program in Michigan. 

This funding will be avail- 
able to farmers in Berrien, 
Lapeer and Tuscola counties, 
several of the counties most 
severely impacted by excess 
rain and flooding during the 
planting season. 

The Emergency Conserva- 
tion Program (ECP) provides 
financial assistance to agri- 
cultural producers to restore 
damaged cropland back to 
the prior cropping condition e 

Storm damage to cropland 
must adversely affect the 
productive capacity of the 
land and be so costly to re- 
habilitate that Federal assis- 
tance is or will be needed to 
return the land to productive 
agricultural use. 

Eligible ECP measures in- 
clude grading and shaping 
severely damaged farmland 
and restoring conservation 
structures and other similar 
installations. 

A producer qualifying for 
ECP assistance may receive 
cost-share assistance not to 
exceed 64 percent of the eli- 
gible cost of restoration mea- 
sures. No producer is eligible 
for more than $200,000 per 
natural disaster occurrence. 
White also stated Michigan 

has received funding under 
the Environmental Quality 
Incentives Program (EQIP) 
for fiscal year 1996. This 
program includes practices 
which may be used to restore 
cropland where the damages 
are not so severe or may not 
qualify under the ECP pro- 
gram. This program is avail- 
able in counties not included 
in the ECP designation. 

Producers who have suf- 
fered cropland damages 
from excess rain and flood- 
ing may contact the local 
county FSA office and re- 
quest assistance. To be eli- ’ 

gible for cost-share assis- 
tance, practices must not be 
started until an application 
has been filed at the FSA of- 
fice. 

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

LAITY LEADERSHIP is crucial for the growth of a ministry, 
according to the Rev. Kwang M. Lee, who recently began serv- 
ing as pastor of the United Methodist churches in Kingston 
and Deford. 
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Available from 11 0 or 35mm color 

copy ne atives from prints or slides. 

Envelope. Offer expires 12-31 -96. 
Attach 9 his Coupon To Order 

“OVER 200 NEW & USED CARS 
AND TRUCKS AVAILABLE” 

“Every Make and Model” 
Home 872-2i95 For Your Best Buy 

CALL M E  IDDAY! Business 269-978 1 I 

ATTENTION: 
Anyone interested in Employment or Job Services 

EMPLOYMENT SERVICE CENTER 
“A DESIGN FOR THE FUTURE” 

The Thumb Area Workforce Development Board 
Cordially invites you to a Luncheon Meeting on 

10:30 a.m. - 22:30 p,m. 
a t  

Cur0 Knights of Columbus 
903 Ryan Road 
Ca ro, M ic h iga n 

FRIDAY - AUGUST 16,1996 

SPECL GUEST State Representative Mike Green 
Co-Sponsored by: Michigan Employment Security Commission 

Thumb Area-Michigan Works 
*Lunch will be provided 

RSVP by August 8,1996 
to Doug at 51 7-635-3561 



GREAT LAKES JUNIOR COLLEGE 
OVER TEN YEARS OF OFFERING 

ALL THE CLASSES YOU NEED 
TO GRADUATE, 

11111  R l U R E  IN CARO m m m m m  

THIS FALL AT G.L.J.C. - CARO: 
& New Hospitality Ma nagemen& Computer Repa ir, and Fluid Technology 

Programs approved exclusively for GLJC by Northeastern Michigan's 
finest employers in each area! * Jump start your career with 9 Associate Degree Programs 
* Applied Computer Technology 
* Automated Accounting Applications 
* Business Administration 
* Hospitality Management 

* Legal Assisting 
* Medical Assisting 
* Medical Office Applications 
* Office Administration 

* Computer Repair Technology 
(Emphasis on Industrial & Manufacturing Electronics Technology) * Move ahead with 5 Certificate Programs 

* Accounting Procedures 
* Medical Transcription 

* Fluid Systems Technology 
* Micro Computer Applications 

* Office Assisting 

'$**.' HIGH SCHOOL STUDENTS WELCOME!!! Articulation Agreements with the 
Tuscola Technology Center and other area high schools! 

Ask about our conveniently scheduled specialty course sequences! 

Co-op & Work Study jobs with the Thumb's BEST employers!!! 
h, 'e-* 

<*.: Free Financial Aid analysis! 
A* 'w' Student friendly employer reimbursement policy! 

if.' Call our enrollment team TODAY at 673-5857 or ln80O-968-9710 

Great Lakes Junior College 
1231 Cleaver Road 

Caro, Michigan 48723 

G.L.J.C. is fully accredited by the North Central Association. 
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