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LONG-TIME CASS City DPW employee Eldon Stoutenburg, now retired, was 
honored during the village council meeting Monday night. Above, village Presi- 
dent Pro Tern Mike Weaver (right) presents a plaque to Stoutenburg in apprecia- 
tion for his 34 1/2 years of service to the village. 

Village council approves 
slight cable TV rate cut 

W 

C-TEC Cable subscribers in 
Cass City will see a rate cut 
of 30 cents a month for ba- 
sic cable television service 
following action at a monthly 
village council meeting 
Monday night. 

As expected, the council 
approved a settlement nego- 
tiated between C-TEC and 
other cable companies, and 
a Grand Rapids law firm rep- 
resenting some 40 Michigan 
communities, including Cass 
City, which joined efforts last 
year to regulate basic cable 
rates. 

The council voted unani- 
mously in favor of the pro- 
posal following a brief pub- 
lic hearing. 

Under the settlement, sub- 
scribers will see a reduction 
in  rates of 30 cents per 
month, and they will rcceive 
a one-time refund of $3.60 
in overcharges from Septem- 

ber 1993 through August 
1994. 

In  addition, rates will be 
froren until  April I ,  1995 
(An approximate 80-cent in- 
c reax  scheduled for Oct. I 
will hc postponed until April 
1995.) 
Through August 1997, in- 

creases in C-TEC’s regulated 
rates and Premium Customer 
Choice channels will be lim- 
ited to inflation plus any 
FCC-authorized cost pass- 
throughs. 
Local cable customcrs cur- 

rently pay a monthly fee of 
$21.95 for basic scrvice and 
a sccond tier of channels that 
include CNN, ESPN, Nick- 
elodeon and the Family 
Channel. The settlement rc- 
duces the total to $2 1-65. 

Village Manager Lou S.  
1,aPonsie noted the village 
had the option of not accept- 
ing the negotiated settlement. 

The village could have con- 
tinued to fight for lower 
iatcs; however, it could take 
up to 2 years for the FCC to 
revicw the mattcr, and ap- 
peals could postpone a deci- 
sion even longer, 1,aPonsie 
explaineti. fn the meantime, 
he said, C-TEC could con- 
tinue to raise rates. 

IN OTHER BUSINESS 

In other business Monday, 
the council: 

.Briefly discussed a sug- 
gestion by Trustee Cathy 
Kropewnicki that the coun- 
cil urge the Michigan De- 
partment OfTransportation to 
lower the speed limit at the 
west end of the village. 
Citing a pair of rcccnt acci- 

dents between Docrr Road 
and Comment Drive, 
Kropewnicki voiced concern 
that the specd limit isn’t re- 

BOW HUNTERS will get the first crack at the state’s deer 
herd when the archery season gets underway Saturday. 
Hunters will see a few more whitetails in the Thumb this fall 
if the number of crop damage complaints is any indication. 

duced to 35 rnilcs per hour 
until motorists entering from 
the west reach Doerr Road. 

.Noted the village is seek- 
ing bids for garbage pick-up 
and disposal. The village’s 
current contract with Waste 
Management expires at the 
end o f  this year. 

*Made no changes in Hal- 
l ow ee n ( trick - or- t re a t i  n g ) 
hours, which are scheduled 
for 5:30 to 7 p.m. Monday, 
Oct. 3 I .  

.Heard a report from Parks 
and Promotion Committee 
Chairman Matt Prieskorn, 
who noted work is underway 
on construction of the new 
girls’ league ball diamond 
being funded by Pinney 
Foundation grants of $8,000 
a year for 3 years. He added 
soil from that project is be- 
ing used to repair the boys’ 
Little League diamond. 

In addition, Pricskorn and 
LaPonsie reported the pool 
building has been painted 
and stained, with work on the 
floors i n  the  bathrooms, 
showers and locker rooms 
underway. 

.Noted appreciation for a 
letter sent by Donald 
Richards lauding the efforts 
of police officers Craig 
Please turn to back page. 

Bow season 

$65 in cash missing 

Police seek 3 men for 
accost 
Police are looking for 3 

men, 2 of whom reportedly 
attempted to force a Car0 
woman to go with them just 
outside of Cass City last 
week. 

Det. Sgt. Allan Ogg of the 
Michgan State Police post in 
Car0 stated the victim, who 
is not being identified, told 
officers the incident occurred 
Wednesday at about 9:30 
p.m. 
The woman had been at the 

bowling alley in Cass City 
and had gone for a walk, ac- 
cording to Ogg, who said she 
was walking westbound on 
M-81, just outside the vil- 
lage, when a car pulled off 
the road onto the shoulder 
behind her and 3 white males 
got out of the vehicle. 

“TWO of them approached 
her, made conversation and 
asked her to go with them to 
a party,” Ogg said. At some 
point, he added, the 2 sus- 
pects grabbed the woman as 
if  they were going to force 
her to go with them, but she 
broke free and ran back into 
Cass City. 
The woman told police one 

of the suspects struck her on 
the side of her face, and her 
clothing was torn, but she 
was not seriously injured. 
Ogg noted that during the 
struggle, the victim droppd 
her purse, and when she went 
back to retrieve it, discovered 
$65 in cash missing. 

Bolzman 
bound over 
Wednesday 
A Cass City man charged in 

the murder of his wife was 
bound over to circuit court 
following a 3-day prelimi- 
nary examination that con- 
cluded last Wednesday in 
Alcona County District 
Court. 

Nelson Oscar Bolzman, 42, 
is scheduled for arraignment 
Oct. 4 before Alcona County 
Circuit Judge John F. 
Kowalski. 

Bolzman was arrested in 
early August following a 
lengthy investigation into the 
death of his wife, Eileen 
Bolzman, 37, whose body 
was found lying in a roadway 
in Alcona County’s Curtis 
Township July 15. 

Mrs. Bolzman reportedly 
was on a camping trip with 
her family at the time of the 
murder. 

Bolzrnan has been denied 
bond. He remains lodged in 
the Alcona County Jail. 

ing woman on M-81 
Police have composite 

sketches of 2 of the suspects. 
Ogg said the victim didn’t 
get a good look at the third 
male, who stayed back next 
to the vehicle. 

The victim described the 
other 2 as white males i n  

their 20s. One of them is 
about 6 feet tall with a slim 
build and long, dark brown 
hair, and was wearing blue 
jeans and dark colored 
jacket; the other is 5 feet 10 
inches tall and weighs about 
180 pounds, with short, light 

brown or blond hair, and was 
wearing jeans, a T-shirt and 
a Detroit Tigers ball cap. 
Ogg, who was initially as- 

sisted by Cass City police, 
asks that anyone with infor- 
mation related to the incident 
contact him at 673-2156. 

Four area residents 
injured in crash 

Four area residents were Mary’s Medical Center, ports indicate. 
in-jured, one critically, in a 2- Saginaw, with head and fa- 

cia1 injuries. She was listed 
in serious conditionTuesday 
morning. 

All occupants of the COX 
vehicle were wearing seat 
belts; Dorman was not, re- 

The 6: 14 a.m. accident was 
discovered just minutes after 
it happened by a sheriff’s 
patrol unit - the only police 
car on the road in Tuscola 
County at the time of the 
crash. 

vehicle accident a half-mile 
south of Wilmot in Kingston 
Townsfip Monday morning. 

Tuscola County Sheriff’s 
deputies reported a 
westbound vehicle driven by 
Carol K. Dorman, 54, I8 1 1 
Decker Rd., Decker, ran a 
stop sign at the corner of 
bngston and Bevens roads 
and was struck by a north- 
bound vehicle driven by 
Garry L. Cox Jr., 23, 1502 
Kingston Rd., Deford. 

The impact of the crash 
caused Dorman’s vehicle to 
rotate, throwing her through 
the window of the driver’s 
side door, according to inves- 
tigators, who said she landed 
in the southbound lane of 
Kingston Road. 

Cox told deputies Dorman 
accelerated at the last minute, 
and he locked up his brakes 
in an attempt to avoid the 
collision. 

Dorman, Cox, and 2 pas- 
sengers i n  his vehicle, 
Michelle R. Rundel, 22, and 
Bethany Vanderpool, 2, also 
both of 1502 Kingston Rd., 
Deford, were all transported 
to Marlette Community Hos- 
pital by Marlettehbulance. 

Everyone was treated and 
released except Dorman, 
who was transferred to St. 

opens Saturday 

Report theft 
at Cass City 
Middle School 
Cass City police are inves- 

tigating the reported theft of 
personal property from a 
teacher’s locked cabinet at 
Cass City Middle School. 
Teacher Nesa Orth told po- 

lice she last saw her property 
July 31, and discovered sev- 
eral items missing Sept. 23. 
Taken were an electric type- 

writer, one video tape, 3 stop 
watches, 2 Polaroid cameras, 
4 rolls of film, a mini tape 
recorder and a 3Smm cam- 
era, according to reports, 
which estimate the combined 
value of the items at $881. 

Also recently, 3 tenants at 
the Cass City Apartment 
complex, 4224 Woodland 
Ave., reported hood orna- 
ments were stolen from their 

vehicles during the evening 
hours of Sept. 18. 

The victims and their ve- 
hicles are William Johnson, 
1988 Chrysler; Dolly Jaye, a 
1982 Pontiac, and Sybil 
Miller, 1984 Olds. 

Reports estimate the value 
of the ornaments at $150. 

Damage to a vehicle was 
reported last week by An- 
thony E. Dohring of Elkton, 
who told police someone 
scratched his black 1991 
Chevrolet pickup truck 
sometime Thursday evening. 

Dohring stated he believes 
the damage, estimated at 
$400, occurred while he at- 
tended a Cass City football 
game or later the same night 
at the Charmont restaurant. 

Plentiful deer damaging crops 
Archery deer hunters plan- 

ning to pursue a whitetail in 
the woods and fields of the 
Thumb can expect a season 
similar to last year’s, al- 
though there may be a few 
more deer out there. 

“If you believe all the land- 
owners and farmers I’ve 
talked to, i t  seems there are 
more deer,” cornrriented Bud 
Jarvis, a wildlift: biologist at 
the DNR’s Cass City Field 
Ofice. 

“The farmers seem to be 
cxpcriencing m o r t  crop 
damage - we’ve had more 
 ompl plaints this ycar than in 
thc last 2 or 3 years -- and 
they t h i n k  there are more 

deer out there.” 
Still, Jarvis pointed out, 

“Hunters are not going to see 
as many deer as they want to. 
But we’re looking at a pretty 
healthy deer herd in farm 
country.” 

The archery deer season 
gets underway Saturday and 
will continue through Nov. 
14. 
The regular firearm season 

is open Nov. 15-30, and the 
IO-day muzzleloading sea- 
son begins Dec. 9 i n  the 
Lower Peninsula. Archers 
can return to the field Dec. 1 
and hunt through Jan. 1. 

Although the DNR is issu- 
ing fewer antlerless permits 

to hunters statewide th s  year, 
the number of permits issued 
in the 3 upper Thumb coun- 
ties is up by about 10 percent 
in an effort to stem the tide 
of crop damage complaints. 

Jarvis said he’s received 
between 75 and I O 0  com- 
plaints from landowners and 
farmers. 

“I think I’ve issued 5 or 6 
summer s hoof i n g permits 
compared to 2 last year,’’ he 
added, noting all deer taken 
with such pennits are given 
to low income families. 
Overall, the outlook for the 

upcoming season is good in 
the Upper Peninsula and 
southern Lower. The forc- 

cast is less optimistic in the 
northern Lower Peninsula, 
where deer numbers aren’t as 
high as the DNR would like, 
Jarvis said. 

Statewide, there were both 
fewer hunters and fewer deer 
taken in 1993 compared to 
the year before. 
An estimated 722,760 fire- 

arm hunters and 334,620 ar- 
chery hunters bagged a total 
of 213,490 bucks and 
117,490 antlerless deer last 
year. In 1992, there were 
756,000 firearm hunters and 
344,520 archery hunters, and 
the total whitetail take was 
213,980 bucks and 151,640 
antlerless deer. 

The state’s second biggest 
harvest ever - 434,340 
whitetails - was recorded in 
199 1 .  Hunters bagged 
432,690 deer in 1990, and 
the record was set in 1989, 
when 452,490 deer were har- 
vested, 

Jarvis noted a couple of 
minor changes have been 
made in the hunting regula- 
tions. 

Hunters are no longer re- 
quired to wear a back tag 
(they must, however, have a 
valid kill tag in their posses- 
sion)+ Also, written permis- 
sion is no longer required to 
hunt on private property, al- 
Please turn to back page. 
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I) Brain exercise g 
by Melva E- Guinther 

STORY 1 

Boy Scouts begin 
annual popcorn sale 
The Cass City Boy Scouts’ 

annual popcorn sales get un- 
derway today (Wednesday). 
Aside from butter and light 

microwave popcorn and 
caramel corn, the scouts will 
be offering something new 
this year - buttered and fat- 

Duke and Nancy Sward en- 
tertained at dinner Saturday 
night. Guests Jane and Dan 
Hi tt ler brought several 
bottles of vintage Chardonay 
from Dan’s’own winery and 
Joe and Jean McCluskey fur- 
nished the trophy sized wall- 
eye, caught by Joe in 
Saginaw Bay, which was 
served with French Tarragon 
butter and baby red potatoes, 
After the meal, a new game, 
Sequence, purchased that 
morning at the St, Pancratius 
bazaar, was enjoyed by the 3 
couples. 

is the 1994 Fali Camporee, 
Sept. 30-Oct. 2 at Camp Pine 
Acres in Caro. Scouts will 
take part in a host of activi- 
ties, including pioneering, 
cooking and first aid. 

Mrs. Nadine Bateman of 
Torrance, Calif., was an af- 
ternoon and supper guest of 
Mrs. Marion McClorey and 
Mark Monday, Sept. 19. She 
also visited with other rela- 
tives in the area. 

Hills and Dales 
General Hospital 

PATIENTS LISTED MON- 
DAY, SEPT 26, WERE: 

June Perlaki, Roy Tuckey, 
Cass City; 

Margaret Curtis, Tina 
Decker, Caro. 

Boy Scout leaders are look- 
ing to purchase an aluminum 
trailer (10 feet by 6 feet) to 
transport Boy Scout equip- 
ment. Anyone who knows of 
a trailer for sale is asked to 
contact Nancy Wolschlager 
at 872-5397 or Deb Ross at 
872-23 18. 

Rodney Alan Adcox and 
Christene Marie Kcvresian, 
both of Millington. 

Timothy John Narsted and 
Toni Marie Ross, both of 
Millington. 

Frank Fredrick Buhl and 
Brenda Marion Budreau, 
both of Mayville. 

James Lee Wickings and 
Vickie Lee Milliken, both of 
Va ssar. 

Brian Scott Salgat and Jo- 
Ann O’Brian, both of Caro. 

Nathan Samuel Plaxco, 
Clio, and Autumn Elizabeth 
Stolz, Millington. 

Bryant earns 
nursing degree 

Saginaw Valley State Uni- 
versity announced this week 
that Janet Elizabeth Bryant 
of C a s  City was one of 224 
students to complete degree 
requirements during the 
summer session. She earned 
a Master of Science nursing 
degree. 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Maurer 

Maurers celebrate Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Damm 

50th anniversary Bonnie Jurgess, Lloyd 
Darnrn wed in Gagetown Mr. and Mrs. Mike Maurer sing of Denver, Culo., Joanie 

Of ub ly  celebrated their 50th (deceased) and Lois Hill of 
wedding anniversary at the 4 Ruth, They have 5 grand- 
p.m. Mass at St. John’s children, Brandy, Courtney 
Catholic Church in ubly. Fr. and Erin Gordon, and Adam 

and Andrea Hill. John Mullet officiated. 
Mike Maurer and Lila 

Walker were married Aug. Sheckles 

When we reach middle age 
or slightly beyond, we be- 
come acutely aware of our 
mortal bodies and their limi- 
tations. 
We suddenIy realize that we 

get but one with which to fin- 
ish our pilgrimage on earth, 
and only a few replacement 
parts are available. So we 
exercise, check our choles- 
terol and try to eat right in 
an effort to keep it going a 
bit longer. 

Until recently, though, it 
was thought that there wasn’t 
much a person could do to 
improve the brain, that it was 
pretty much downhill after 
you reach adulthood. 

But 90% of all we know 
about the brain has been 
learned in the last 15 years, 
according to Michael Gelb in 
his “Mind Mapping” pro- 
gram, and there is hope. 

The human brain is esti- 
mated to be 100,400 times 
more complex than the en- 
tire global telephone net- 
work, and the number of pos- 
sible thought patterns in the 
brain exceeds the number of 
atoms in the universe, ac- 
cording to researchers. 
Nevertheless, Gelb says that 

in  the 1960s it was estimated 
that the average person used 
only about 10% of the brain’s 
potential; in the 70s and 80s 
the estimate fell to one per- 
cent; in the 90s, l/lOth of 
one percent. 

Either we’re getting a lot 
dumber or the brain’s poten- 
tial i s  a lot greater than we 
thought. 

Furthermore, they’ve dis- 
covered that the brain actu- 
ally works a lot like a muscle. 
The more you use it, the bet- 
ter it works, and most people 
can actually have some con- 
trol over how healthy and 
alert their brains will be as 
they grow older. 
An article by Daniel Golden 

i n  a recent issue of Life 
magazine also emphasized 
the new thinking among ex- 
perts regarding the brain’s 
ability to change, even into 
old age. 

Arnold Schaibel, head of 
the Brain Research Institute 
at UCLA, is quoted as say- 
ing that “by continuing the 
learning process, we are 
challenging our brain and 
therefore building brain cir- 
cui try.” 

Without getting into the 
neurons, dendrites and syn- 
apses involved, or the differ- 
ing functions of the left and 
right hemispheres, the brain 
seems to thrive on stimula- 
tion, which forces it to de- 
velop new circuits and en- 
hances its problem solving 
capacity. 

What you need to do is get 
the mind actively involved in 
some area of thinking that’s 
unfamiliar to you. 

If you’re good at and pri- 
marily interested in the arts, 
music, etc.,  (right-brain 
dominant) you need to chal- 
lenge your brain by learning 
how to f ix  things, do logic 
puzzles, etc. 

If you’re left-brain domi- 
nant, more into language, 
math and practical subjects, 
taking up music, painting or 
sculpting will stimulate the 
gray cclls. 

Both Gelb and Schaibel 
stress the importance of us- 
ing both hemispheres of the 
brain, and cite Einstein, 
Newton, daVinci and other 
geniuses who did. 
What gets many of us stuck 

in brain ruts is being content 
with what we already know 
instead of exercising and 
challenging the brain with 
new information. 

It’s certainly worth the ef- 
fort. After all, even half a 
brain is a terrible thing to 
waste. 

Ronnie Jurgess became the 
bride of Lloyd Paul Milton 
Damrn i n  a wedding cer- 
emony at Gagetown Church 
o f  the Kuarene Aug. 27. 
The Rev. Robert Lewis offi- 
ciated. 

Parents of the bride are 
Lawton and Marcella Jurgess 
of  Harbor Beach. The groom 
is the son of Lloyd and 
Delores Damm of 
Gagetown. 

Maid of honor was 
Roxanne Peruski, sister of 
the bride. 

Best man was Andrea 
Damin, brother of the groom. 
Ring bearer was Nathan 
Haag. Ushers were Mark 
Jurgess and Mark Damm. 

The couple greeted guests 
at the St. Columbkille Hall of 
Bad Axe. 

They arc living in San An- 
tonio, Texas, where Lloyd 
Paul will be serving as a So- 
cial Worker at Brooke Medi- 
cal Hospital with the W.S. 
Ami y . 

Paul is an August graduate 
of‘ University of Michigan 
with a master’s degree in so- 
ci a1 work. 

The bride wore a wedding 
dress with Victorian collar 
hand beaded, long fitted ny- 

lon sleeves with medaliion 
filled appliques and pouf at 
top with drops of pearls on 
the edge. The skirt featured 
large appliqued roses, schiffli 
embroidered lace featured all 
around bottom semi cathe- 
dral train with window pane 
cut outs. 

She carried a wildflower 
look cascade bouquet of 
white roses, dark pink roses, 
alstromcria miniature carna- 
tions, purple statis and baby’s 
breath. The maid of honor 
carried a smalier version of 
the bride’s bouquet, and the 
flower girl carried a basket 
with a wildflower look cas- 
cade accented by aqua rih- 
bon. 

Mother of thc bridc wore a 
formal opera length gown of 
emerald green w i t h  3/4 
sleeves. Mother of the groom 
wore an evening gown of taf- 
feta, black skirt with white 
jacket accented with black 
bow. 
The groom wore a white tux 

accented in black with an 
ascot tie. The ring bearer was 
dressed identically to the 
groom, and the wedding 
party wore black tuxedos ac- 
cented in whitc. 
-._ .. - 

Engaged Engaged 

30, 1944, at St, Columbkilre 
Church in Sheridan. Atten- reports 
dants were Blanche and Jack 
Krug, Bad Axe, Noxine 
(Maurer) Williamson, Ster- 
ling Heights, and Frank 
Bukowski (deceased), Ubly. 

A dinner followed the an- 
niversary celebration at the 
Ubly Fox Hunters Club for 
their children, grandchildren, 
family and friends. 
Their children include Lana 

Gordon of Ubly, Elaine Lan- 

for duty 
Navy Petty Officer 2nd 

Class Dean P. Sheckles, a 
1987 graduate of Kingston 
Community High School, 
recently reported for duty at 
the Atlantic Fleet Headquar- 
ters Support Activity, Nor- 
folk, Va. 

He joined the Navy in July 
1994. 

Beth Tjepkema 
Brent Hall Kellie Ann 

LeRoy Jay 
A Nov. 26 wedding in Jack- 

son Free Methodist Church 
is planned by Brent Hall of 
Clark Lake and Beth M. 
Tjcpkema of Jackson. 
The bridegroom-elect is the 

son of Doug and Judy Hall 
of Cass City. He is a 1989 
graduate of Cass City High 
School. He also graduated 
from SpringArbor College in 
1993 and is an accountant 
with CMS Utility Services 
Inc. 

The bride-elect is the 
daughter of Janet Tjepkerna 
of Jackson and the late John 
Tjepkema. She is a 1993 
graduate of Spring Arbor 
College and is an accountant 
with the Free Methodist 
Foundation. 

TIME && 
at 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Willis 
of  Cass City and Mr, and 
Mrs. Donald Horiski of 
Sebewaing announce the en- 
gagenlent of their daughter, 
Kcllie Ann, tu  LeRoy Jay, 
son of Mrs. Pat Beecher of 
Cass City and the  late 
Herbert Beecher. 

A June 1995 wedding is 
being planned. 

Rawson b 
Memorial Library 

ife- Insuranc 
The only way to live 

How can you live with peace of 
mind now and in the future? 

0 . .  1 For 3 and 4 Year Olds 

Each Thursda 
in October 

1O:OO a.m. 
Register No Later Than TuesdaH Oct. 4 

The only way to live 
How can you live with peace of 

mind now and in the future? 
Protect your family with a life insurance 

plan from Farm Bureau Life Insurance 
Company of Michigan. 

Call for a prompt review of your 
insurance needs. 
Making your future more predictable. 

-FARM BUREAU I ,Y r DmA I. llrw . I“” w.< INSURANCE 4 . IU* -* Ol-u . I. Y-Y ” Phone: 872-4326 

F O R  RESULTS YOU CAN MEASURE, 

We’re pleased to announce 

NOTICE The h e 5 c o  Cherished Teddies CluF” 
Dr. Judi Ecker D.P.M. 
Member: American Medical 

Writers Association 

The biggest news in town is t h e  Charter Year of The Enewo 
Cherished Teddies Club! Applications for membearshiu are in 
gur store @t n o d  
Purchase t h e  limited edition figurine of Cherished Teddies Town 
“spokesbear” Cub E, Bear for  only $17.50, and you become a 
Bearafactor, with these other wonderful benefits: 

Y A colorful easel backdrop to display your 
favorite Cherished Teddies bears, 

Y A certif icate of Charter Year Membearship, 
Y Your Key To Cherished Teddies Town lapel pin, 
Y A 12-month subscription to The Town Tactler, 
Y The unbearably terrific opportunity t o  purchase 

\’ *, 
i 

I \ 
t w o  Membears Only Figurines! 

s t o p  in today and apply for Charter 
’ I\ 

LAST DAY TO REGISTER 
NOTICE OF LAST DAY OF REGISTRATION OFTHE ELECTORS OF 

THETOWNSHIP OF NOVESTA 
TUSCOLA COUNTY, MICHIGAN WARTS: WHY THEY SHOULD 

NOT BE IGNORED ... 
Many of my patients are surprised to hear that these 

benign skin tumors are contagious and are caused by 
a virus! 

Since these wart-causing viruses must live inside a 
cell in order to survive, they are usually picked up where 
people shed tiny skin cells which are infected with the 
virus. Public bathing facilities for example are commonly 
contaminated with this pesky virus. 

Plantars warts are usually brown, soft and spongy 
with little black spots in the center. These spots are 
tiny blood vessels which act as the wart’s feeding net- 
work. One may mistake it for a corn or callus. The 
surest way to determine a wart is to pinch it: the ex- 
cruciating pain that follows after indicates it is a plantar 
wart. 

Treatment varies from use of powerful acids, laser 
surgery or dry ice. The successful and safe treatments 
I have mentioned are available if you take your prob- 
lem to a doctor. There is little chance you can treat 
yourself safely and effectively with over-the-counter 
remedies. They are usually too weak and may actu- 
ally stimulate and cause spreading of these embar- 
rassing skin growths. 

For treatment of warts on your feet or hands, call the 
physicians at Northeastern Foot Clinic. 

All electors are hereby given notice that a Special Elec- 
tion will be held in the Township of Novesta on Oct. 4, 1994. 

Electors who wish to vote in the Special Election must be 
registered to vote no later that 5:OO Pam., Sept. 30, 1994. To 
register, visit any Secretary of State branch office, the county 
clerk’s office or the township clerk’s office. 

Electors who wish to register with the  county or township 
clerk are advised to call ahead for office hours. 

The purpose of the Special Election is as follows: 

GRANT OF FRANCHISE TO SOUTHEASTERN MICHIGAN GAS COMPANY 

Shall the Franchise granted by the Township of Novesta 
to Southeastern Michigan Gas Company, to install and maintain 
in the public streets, highways and alleys in the Township of 
Novesta for a period of thirty (30) years, all necessary pipes, 
mains and apparatus for the transmission and distribution of gas 
for all purposes to and through theTownship of Novesta be con- 
firmed? 

Kathleen Newell 
W. Wallace Kent, Jr. Township of Novesta Clerk 
Tuscola County Clerk 7681 Deckerville Road 
440 N. State Street Deford, MI 48729 
Caro, MI 48723 872-4651 

NORTHEASTERN FOOT CLINIC 
ESSEXVILLE CASS CITY 

895-8594 872-4327 
3592 Center Ave. (M-25) 4672 Hi11 St. 

1 -8OO-322-5 03 6 
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Auxiliary I? .... 

(And anyone else he can 
safety books 

As a community service 
project, the VFW Post 3644 
Auxiliary) Cass City, recently 
donated 125 drug safety 
booklets to the Drug Abuse 
Resistance Education 
(D.A.R.E.) program at Cass 
City Middle School. 

Isabel Wright, president, 
and Pat Brooks, treasurer and 
safety chairman for the aux- 
iliary, presented the books to 
Ed Pasant and MikeGogola, 
who are the sixth grade 
D.A.R.E. coordinators for 
the middk school. 

When you go shopping, 
does it make any difference 
whether you’re black or 
white? After their experience 
at Oakland Mall, two white 
teenagers think the answer is 
yes. 
They are Melissa Penz, 16, 

of Sterling Heights and Greg 
Belprez, 18, of Clarkston. 
On the afternoon of Sept. 15, 
outside the Eddie Bauer 
store, they were approached 
by a black woman, around 
30,’seeking help. 

She immediately assured 
Penz and Belprez that she 
meant them no harm, but 
they suspected a scam when 
the woman said she needed 
$5 or $10 to buy antifreeze 
for her car. 

I don’t blame the pair for 
being wary. Several times 
I’ve heard similar smelly sto- 
ries, from both minority and 
white strangers) in malls and 
on downtown streets. I just 
kept walking No one is go- 
ing to con me. 
But Penz and Belprez were 

more polite. Although 
doubtful, they listened as the 
woman pulled a pair of pants 
out of a bag. They appeared 
brand new, never worn, with 
no tags removed. The 
woman said she’d recently 
purchased them as a gift for 
her husband but now, for an 
unstated reason, wanted to 
return them for a refund. 
Obviously, the desired ex- 
change became more irnpor- 
tant when her car began to 
steam and she discovered she 
didn’t have enough money 
for an ti freeze. 
But, the woman said, Eddie 

Bauer had just refused her 
because she didn’t have a re- 
ceipt. She asked whether 
Belprez and Pew would take 
the pants into the store and 
try for better luck. 

As Penz later told me, she 
and her friend were puzzled. 
She described thc woman as 
neatly dressed and appar- 
ently sincere. I f  Eddie 
Bauer’s policy was no refund 
without a receipt, why would 
she and Belprez have any 

If you are into Shakespeare, there are a limited nuinher of 
seats available to join the students from English classes at 
Cass City High School to attend a performarice of  “Twclfth 
Night” at Stratford, Ont. 

*:; Russ Biefcr, principal, says that parents of students want- 
,:zing to join students on thc chartered bus can do  so. Tho bus 
:::leaves at 3 a.m., Oct. 20, and returns that night at 9. 
5; The cost is $35 and seats can be reservctl by calIiiig Bicf‘er 
=::at 872-2 148. 
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*:- Explain this to me if you can. Travelling horiie o t i  1-75 bc- 
p*$weeii C;r,iyling and West Branch, I was listei~it~g to thc Li- 
*2*ons-Patriots , a  f‘ootball gamc, switching statiorls bt‘twccn WJK 
‘*and 910 out of Flint, 

Suddenly, fix no apparent rcason, the Flint station stirtccj 
playing music and WJR was announcing current trat‘tic c011- 
ditivns on Michigan’s main highways. 
After fiddling with the dial awhile, I caught the  gat^ on a 

station from thc Tawas City area. I t  camo i n  I o ~ d  and clclir 
all the way to the corner of Garfield and Lhcrr Roatl. Whctl 
1 turned the corner from Doerr Road, h e  ganic stopperl a r ~ d  
another station’s riiiisic was playing. 

I nevcr did hear how the gamc cantu out. (Wisn’t I h c k y ? )  

0 -  

VF W Auxiliary President Isabel Wright (left) 
and Treasurer Pat Brooks present drug safety 
booklets to Cass City sixth grade D.A,R.E. 
coordinators Ed Pasant (left) and Mike 
Gogola. Missing from the presenta- 

tion was Cass City police of- 
ficer and D.A.R.E. Instructor 
Craig Haynes, who was un-  
able to attend. 15th Bay Shore auction 

generates record profit 
“TheVFW Auxiliary mem- 

bers feel that if the donated 
books help at least one per- 
soil, it makes the project 
worthwhile,” Wright com- 
mented. Wcathcr, bargains and good 

will comhined to bring Bay 
Shore Camp a record break- 
ing $26,000 profit at thc 
camp’s JSth Annual Benefit 
Auction, hcld Saturday, Sept. 
17. 

Selling the hundreds of 
iteins donated by camp sup- 
porters took Great Lakes 
Auc tionecr Dale Wcrtz more 
t h a n  8 hours. Following 
opening prayer at 10 a.m., a 
candy bar donated by 12- 
year-old camper Ross 
Sherman of‘ Cass City went 
on the block. It sold for $78. 
“Ycs, i t  did go a bit high,” 

conimcnted Camp Director 
1,cw Tibbits,, “but I know thc 
guy who bought i t  and un- 
derstand why he paid that 
much. It had nothing to do 
with what kind of candy i t  

Thc same buyer was also a 
contcndcr for the Auction’s 
prize winning pic of  the day, 
a rasphcl-ry offering baked by 
Mrs. Joan Bush of  Caseville. 
As bidding climbed toward 
thc $500 mark, he reluctantly 
droppcd out and let aTuscola 
C o u n t y  busincssrnan take 
hoinc the covcted dessert for 
$525.  
Second-placc in  the annual 

pie contest went to Mrs. 
S y 1 v i i i  Oc sc hg cr of‘ 
Scbcwaing for her straw- 
hcrry -rhu barb corn hi nation, 
which sold at a top bid of 
$275. An applc pie madc by 
f h I rtl - pl a c  c w i nncr John 
Elscascr o f  Rcesc sold for the 
santc pricc. 

Wcrt/ then sold individual 
picces from duplicatc pies 
madc by each o f  the winning 
cooks. Total income from all 
h p i c s  canie t o  B record 
hi-tithing $14SO. 

Quilts, afghans and othcr 

was. 

soft goods sales was another 
auction high1 ight , bringing 
the camp almost $6,500. Of 
the 48 items offered, the top 
seller was a queen-size, 
handriiade quilt in the Dahlia 
pattern, donated by the 
Elkton United Methodist 
Church. An out-of-state 
buyer offered the top bid of 
$2400. 

A low-key carnival atmo- 
sphere helped keep the 
crowd comfortable all day. 
Food booths offered a vari- 
ety of lunch and snack items, 
and youngsters rode the Bay 
Shore “Barrel of Fun” Train 
or played in the playground 
area. 

“This is really great,” said 
one young father. “We’re 
having a great day. Wc hadn’t 
really planned on buying 
anything, but we’re going 
home with a dining room 
table and chairs. And I got a 
qui 1 t .” 
All profits from the auction 

will he used to purchase 
needed equipment and fi- 
nance facility improvements 
for Ray Share Camp. Ncarly 
I200 children and youth par- 
ticipated in the camp’s sea- 
sonal ministry program this 
past summer. 

********** 
Cass City 

After all these years in the ncwspaper liusiriess I fin;illy limnif 
out that you can spcll grey or gray. It’s a case 01‘ignoranct. i h  

bliss, becausc I have being doing that fur ycars, hoping 1ti;it 
I was correct, (Or depending on tlw proof‘ reader to gct i t  
right.) 

Okay, okay. This IS a column of  t r ivia .  

boosters 
plan events 

********** The Cass City Band Boost- 
ers recently held its first 
meeting of the 1994-95 
school year. 

Brian Knoll, the new instru- 
mental director, was intro- 
duced to the group and wel- 
comed. 

, If you arc into color [ o m ,  this wcukcrld and iicxt wLhckend 
will be the tim to see rhe trces at their puak.  Thcrc arc a -  

* ready patches of trecs that h a ~ ~  leavcs in  f u l l  color. 

The Weather 
with a purchase, enter the drawing 

to win discounts on various 
in-store items. 

Sept. 27-30 
CONTEST DATES 

Oct, 18-21 
NOV. 22-25 
Dec. 20-23 

High 1,ow Precip. 
Tucsday ................................. H 1 ............ 54 ............. 0 
Wednesday .................... ... 83 ............ 59 .............. 0 
Thursday ............................... 78  ............ 50 .............. 0 
Friday ........ .................... 77 ............ 58  .............. 0 
Saturday ................................ 73 ............ S 8  .......... .29“ 
Sunday .................................. 72 ............ 58 ............ .& 
Monday ................................. 66 ............ SS .......... .07” 

3 ” 

(Recorded at C a s  City wadewater lreatiiient pl:m; ) 

The boosters approved of 
the new sweaters purchased 
by the school and band 
boosters for the middle 
school band. A thank-you 
was received from the color 
guard for their new uniforms. 

Fund raising was discussed. 
There will be a car wash Oct. 
I from 10 a.m, to 2 p.m. at 
Mr. Chips Service Stati0n.A 
rain date of Oct. 15 was set. 

The next meeting will be 
held Oct. 3 at 7 p.m. in the 
middle school band room. 

USED BYYOU 
6474 Main Cass City 

We’re turning everything you 
thought you knew about CD’s 

T h e  

H n i r e  

Net 
Let’s talk for a minute about 

the guy or gal who has a defi- 
nite opinion about whatever 
the topic of the momcnt hap- 
pens to be. N o  second 
thoughts, no gray, just black 
and white. 
The persons who see issues 

as one dimensional and arc 
surc their position is the right 
one, if not thc only onc, save 
therizselvcs a lot of grief. 

Most of us can’t be that 
positive, that sum, that my 
way is thc only way,  o r  
maybe even the right way. 

A couple of situations that 
crossed the desk spcll out the 
trouble that secing both sides 
often brings. 
The first is Proposal B that 

w i I1 be an anlendinen t propo- 
sition on the Novembcr bal- 
lot. It asks voters to approve 
the end of the automatic right 
to appeal court cases without 
approval of  the court. Sup- 
porters point out that it would 
save thc state $3 million a 
year and significantly reduce 
overburdencd courts. In  10 
tnonths  there werc 1,103 
cases appealed and only 9 
were reversed. It’s possible 
that appcal would have been 
allowed i n  these cases. 
But ifjudgcs know that they 

have the right to refuse an 
appcal of their sentenccs, 
where is the dcterrent to an 
u nj us t s c n t e nce ’? 
Do thc abuses in the system 

justify taking a chance that a 
citizcn should he tarred with 
an unjust vcrdict? When an 
individual’s rights are 
curbed, we all lose. Victims 
of‘ crimes deserve a quick 
settlenient o f  cases and 
crowded dockets that keep 
them in suspcnsc tor years 
curb their rights. too. 

The second is thc issuc of 
flying the American flag in 
thc condos in Cass City. At 
first glance i t  would s c m  
that it’s unpatriotic and 
picayunish to say that be- 

cause of the association’s by- 
laws, putting up a bracket on 
the outside of the building to 
fly the flag is prohibited. 
But we are a nation ruled by 

laws and the law of the condo 
is clear, and if  placing a 
bracket for a flag is over- 
looked, what can stop any 
owner from nailing whatever 
desired to the building? 

The folks that I have met 
from the condos seem to be 
reasonable people and I’d bet 
that they will settle this dis- 
pute easily. 

If the majority decide that 
there’s no harm in placing a 
bracket to fly the flag, thc by- 
laws will be amended to 
make it so. 

To avid patriots who want 
to show their love and sup- 
port of the country, the t’lag 
flying restrictions are absurd. 
Still it’s surc that a lot of pa- 
triots don’t equate flying the 
flag as necessary to indicate 
their regard for their country. 
It’s another black and white 

question for some, but an- 
other gray issue for the ma- 
jority of us. 

How would you votc‘! 

94alntenance 
Free ‘ VINYL PATIO 
Washable DQORWALL 

Tree Screens 
Tree Vert 
Locks 

Vents 

‘tnetirne Warranty $1699 
Security Wlih h n y  nrpiacement 

w h do *I O d  c r 

HlR A FREE IN-HOME ESTtMAfE 

Airport to 
receive grant 
Tlic Michigan Acroriautics 

c‘o 11 1 111 I 5 si o 11 I as I w ec k ap - 
proved ii $30,000 grant for 
Ihc Cam Municipal Airport. 
Thc hudgct includcs $27,001) 
ti.ricral funds, $1 ,SO0  state 
arid s 1.500 local lunds. 
7 1 ~  inonry is to hc 11xd for 

;i I I  cnvironnieriial asscssriwtit 
and ix part of$0.4 million f o r  
I iiiprovciiicn t s at 1 3 Michi- 
gan airports. 

OR CALL TOLL-FREE 1-800-61 3- 1076 
2976 Wilston St. Marlene, MI 48453 

CWe also do storm and screen repair.) 
- ~~ 

Ask.For Jim Bolsby or Randy Hund 

Upside down. 

Mutual F U I I ~ S  
Fixed and Variable Annuitios 

Variable Universal Lifc Insurance 
Retircmcnt I’lans 

I I U S  
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Blood drive 
set Oct. 4 
ut hospital 

Down Mernorv Lane Holbrook Area News 
Mrs. Thelma Jackson 

Phone 658-2347 

u 
From the files of the Chronicle 

Cass City community blood 
drive coordinator Helen 
Jezewski extends an invita- 
tion to area residents to join 
her and her crew of Red 
Cross volunteers at a blood 
drive scheduled for Oct. 4 at 
Cas City’s Hills and Dales 
Hospital, from 14x45 p.m. 

“Cass City residents really 
care about their community,” 
Jcxewski said. “I am confi- 
dent that, with everyone’s 
help, we will meet our goal. 
Our donors know that blood 
is never given to people who 
are healthy ... when someone 
needs blood, it’s because 
they are in serious trouble.” 

5 YEARS AGO the grid year. RonAnker was 
a standout on defense, Coach 
Don Schelke said. Also help- 
ing the team were Bryon 
Beecher, JoeViney and Greg 
Erla. 

Thirty-seven attended the 
fourth annual “Stick ‘Em in 
the Middle” archery contest, 
held Sunday at the home of 
Skip and Ellen Speirs. Dave 
Speirs, the winner, had 80 
points out of 90 possible. 

35 YEARS AGO 

Two of Cass City’s 3 full- 
time police officers are 
trained to use the 9mm semi- 
automatic pistol. The 
weapon has replaced the 
357-magnum revolver. 

Bow hunters will get the 
first crack at the state’s grow- 
ing deer herd, estimated at 
some 1.5 million animals, up 
by 200,000 to 300,000 over 
last year. The bow hunting 
season will get underway 
Sunday and continue 
through Nov. 14. 
Steve Hammett of Cass City 

swept top honors in National 
Off-Road Bicycle Associa- 
tion (NORBA) competition 
Saturday and Sunday at 
Sugar Loaf Mountain i n  
northwestern Michigan. 

Cass City resident Sherri 
Horner, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Louis Horner, Cass 
City, will present her work 
with the U.S. Peace Corps 
Sunday at the Novesta 
Church of Christ. Horner has 
served 14 months in the Cen- 
tral African Republic village 
of Yoaki, teaching health to 
teachers, 

The Hawk golfers topped 
Lakers at Rolling Hills Mon- 
day. Hockey was the medal- 
ist with a 41, Barker had 43, 
Francis 44, and Micklash, 48. 

A band of bandits stole 
some $2,000 in merchandise 
from Erla’s Food Center, en- 
tering after breaking a hole 
in the wall to the rear of the 
store. The thieves ate hot 
dogs and pop while in the 
store. 

The Cass City Red Hawks 
took a giant stride towards 
another Thumb B Confer- 
ence football crown Friday 
when they edged Bad Axe 
19-12 in Bad Axe. It took 2 
sparkling runs by Bob 
Wright and a heads-up play 
by end Art Randall to pre- 
serve the Hawks’ string of 
unbeaten games in the con- 
ference. 

Another fine musical pre- 
sentation may fall by the 
wayside in Cass City. The 
Cass City Community Choir, 
which has been presenting 
fine free concerts at Christ- 
mas and Easter, started prac- 
tice Tuesday. Not  enough 
persons attended to hold a 
rehearsal. 
At Erla Food Center - To}- 

let tissue, 4 for 25 cents; Sir- 
loin, Club or T-bone steak, 64 
cents Ib. 

Eighteen family members 
enjoyed birthday cake and 
ice cream at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Hiram Keyser in 
honor of Hiram’s birthday, 

Bob Cleland Sr. and Jan 
McCune of Waterford were 
Monday guests of Mrs. Alex 
Cletand and Carol Laming, 
Mr. and Mrs. Mark 

Salowitz and Penny Guigar 
were Saturday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Allen Farrelly. 

Mr, and Mrs. Harold 
€3 a1 1 a g h were Wed n e s d a y 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Gerald Wills. 

Emily, Justin and Matt 
Miller spent the weekend 
with Jack Miller at Byron. 
Mrs. Curtis Cleland visited 

Jessie Wilson Sunday after- 
noon. 

Jeri Rich of North Branch 
and Reva Silver spent 2 days 
with Phyllis Pickerel at 
Marlette. 
Becky Felmlee uf Bay City 

and Henry and Winnifred 
Sofka went to Port Huron, 
where Henry Sofka entered 
Port Huron Hospital for sur- 
gery. Winnifred and Carol 
Safka brought him home Fri- 
day. 

Staff Sgt. Dale Keyser and 

home here. 
Olive Derpinghaus of Iron 

Mountain, who  spent a 
month with Mr. and Mrs. 
Hiram Keyser, returned to 
Iron Mountain Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs.  Danny 
Schultz and daughters of 
Canton spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Francis 
Schultz in Bad Axe and with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sonny Peters 
were Friday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Allen Fmeliy. 

Mrs, John Zauner of Los 
Altos, Calif., spent a week 
with Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Peltan. 

Reva Silver was a Friday 
afternoon guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Gerald Wills. 
Mr. and Mrs, Hiram Keyser 

and Mike Keyser attended 
the funera1 of Mrs, Spud 
Keyser at Clio. 

Mrs. Jim Hewitt came 
home Tuesday evening after 
spending a couple days with 
Mr. and Mts. Dan Schultz 
and daughters in Canton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wills 
were Tuesday evening guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Gary Wills 
at Port Austin. 

Mr, and Mrs. Bob 
McLaughlin and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Walker Sr. had 
dinner in Caro Thursday 
evening. 
Chuckie Wechner and John 

Naples of Eastpoint were 
Sunday guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Konkey, Marney 

and Lois Cardenas. 
Reva Silver was a Wednes- 

day afternoon guest of 
Edanna Sweeney. 

Thirteen members of  the 
Breakfast Club met at the 
Peppermill Thursday morn- 
ing for breakfast. The group 
will meet next at Northwood 
Shores Golf Club Restaurant 
for breakfast . 

Mr, and M r s  Tony 
Cieslinski were Saturday 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Stanley Glaza. 
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 

and Mrs. Hiram Keyser were 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Keyser 
and Amanda of Fenton, 01- 
ive Derpinghaus of Iron 
Mountain in the Upper Pen- 
insula and Mike Keyser. 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Armstead 

were Monday afternoon and 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Shagcna. 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Campbell 

of Utica were Wednesday 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
Farrel I y . 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wills 

were Saturday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
Hind. Mr. and Mrs. Hiram Keyser 

were Monday afternoor 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Cleland. 

Jeff Hallock, Janice and 
family were Wednesday ~ 

evening guests of MI-. and 
Mrs. Jack Walker Sr. 

Larry Silver of Bay City 
was a Sunday dinner guest of 
Reva Silver. 

Becky Felmlee came fron. 
Bay City and picked up 
Henry and Winnifred Sofka 
and took them to Highland, 
where they spent the week- 
end with Mr. and Mrs, David 
Main and John. Saturday 
they celebrated John Main’s 
10th birthday. Other guests 
were Marty Felmlee and Jill 
and friends, Mike and Karen, 
of Bay City, Sue Sofka of 
Davison, Bonnie Main and 
granddaughter, Leslie, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Steven Sofka 
and Kristin. 

Newly elected officers for 
the Hills and Dales Hospital 
Auxil iary are Jeannine  
Hobart, president, and Bar- 
bara Jackson, vice-president. 
Beverly Little installed the 
officers at the Charmont 
Monday. 

The Wolverine Blood Re- 
gion provides blood and 
blood products to 32 hospi- 
tals throughout its 27-county 
service area. To continue 
meeting demands, Red Cross 
must draw approximately 
300 units per day. Currently, 
Red Cross has lass than a 
one-day supply of blood on 
its she1ves.A 2 or 3-day sup- 
ply is ideal. 

To become a blood donor, 
you must be at least 17 years 
or older, weigh at least 110 
pounds and be in  good 
health. 

25 YEARS AGO 

John Blocker, Main Street, 
Cass City, has 2 casts on his 
feet. He broke the bones in 
both heels when a scaffold- 
ing folded under and he fell 
15 feet. 

Richard Erla of Cass City 
has been elected chairman of 
the Tuscola County selective 
service board. 

Mrs. James Bauer, Cass 
City, has been selected for 
listing in “Who’s Who of  
American Women” for 1970- -. Jim Barcia aide to hold 
/ I .  friend of Melbourne, Fla,, 

Vic Guernsey, < .  one of the constituent hours Oct. 3 spent a week with Mr. and WEDDING INVITATIONS 
LUXURY DESIGN E R STY LING 

AT BUDGET PRICES 

10 YEARS AGO sponsors ot the campaign to  
raise $7,500 to restore a corn- 
plete sports program at the 
high school, reported this 
week that $2,410 has been 
collected. 

Mrs. Gerald Whittaker and 
Mrs. Rodney Krueger were 
i n  Sebewaing Saturday 
evening- to attend an OES 
Friends Night meeting. 

An aide to Congressman 
Jim Barcia will be holding 
constituent hours in Huron 
and Tuscola counties in Oc- 
tober and November, 

The days and times are: 
Oct. 3, from 10 a.m. to noon, 
and Nov. 10, from 2 to 4 
p.m., at the Tuscola County 
Courthouse Annex Building, 
Caro; and Oct. 3, from 2 to 4 

Mrs. Hiram Keyser and vis- 
ited relatives and friends in 
the area before returning to 
duty in Melbourne. 

Mx. and Mrs. Gerald Wills 
were Sunday evening guests 
of Reva Silver. 

Mr. and Mrs. FIoyd Spears 
and Mr. and Mrs. Gerard 
Marchand ofwaterford spent 
a week at the Marchand 

p.m., and Nov. 10, from 10 
a.m. to noon, at the Huron 
County Board of Commis- 
sioners Office, Bad Axe. 

Wet weather has caused a 
corn root worm problem 
with area farmers and spray- 
ing doesn’t help. 

Dr. James Bradford has 
joined Dr. Robert Green in 

Cass City Red Hawks de- 
feated Emlay City 26-0 Fri- 
day night in the first win of 

Cass City. 

E T H E  CASS -amma CITY CHRONICL 
Anyone with a question or 

concern about an issue be- 
fore the W,S. House of Rep- 
resentatives, or who has a 
problem with an federal 
agency is welcome to attend. 

GENERAL E L E C T I O N  - T U E S D A Y .  NOVEMBER 3 ,  1 9 9 4  

NOTICE OF CLOSE OF REGISTRATION 
NOTICE I S  H E R E B Y  G I V E N  THAT LOCAL CLERKS W I L L  B E  AT THE 
LOCATIONS LISTED BELOW ON: 

TUESDAY, OCTOBER 11,1994 

In the heating F o r  the  purpose o f  receiving applications f o r  registration of t h e  qualified 
electors i n  s a i d  township or c i t y .  Electors wlio w i s h  t o  vote i n  t h e  
General E l e c t i o n  must be registered to v o t e  no l a t e r  than 5 : O O  p.m. on 
TUESDAY, OCTOBER 1 1 ,  1994. To register to vote. visit any S e c r e t a r y  o f  
S t a t e  Branch O f f i c e ,  County Clerk, Township o r  C i t y  Clerk’s Office. 

& 

SECRETARY OF STATE’S OFFICE - SANDUSRY, CROSWELL & MARLETTE ( C a l l  ahead for 
office hours ) .  

SANILAC COUNTY CLERK‘S OFFICE, COURTHOUSE, 60 W. Sanilac Avenue., Sandusky. 
Office hours 8 : O O  a . m .  t o  4:30 p . m . ,  Monday through Friday, (810) 648-3212. 

OFFICE HOURS FOR TOWNSHIP AMD CITY CLERKS’ A S  SPECIFIED BEJAW. 

LINDA I .  KOZFKAY 
SANILAC COUNTY CLERK 

In addition to t h h s  o m c e s , T  
following s t a t e  proposals w i l l  be on t h e  ballot: 

- 

PROPOSAL A 

A PROPOSAL TO CONVENE A CONSTITUTIONAL CONVENTION FOR THE PURPQSE OF 
DRAFTING A GENERAL REVISION OF THE STATE CONSTITUTION 

Shall a convention of elected deJegates be convened i n  1995 t o  draft a 
general r e v i s i o n  of the  s t a t e  constitution for presentation to t h e  state‘s 
v o t e r s  for  their approval or rejection? 

are 
PROPOSAL B 

A PROPOSAL TO LIMIT CRIMIffAL APPEALS 

The proposed c o n s t i t u t i o n a l  amendment would restrict a criminal defendant 
who pleads guilty or n o l o  contendere ( n o  c o n t e s t )  from appealing h i s  or her 
conviction without the permission of the court. Current ly ,  someone who 
pleads guilty or no contest t o  8 crime has the automatic r i g h t  Lo appea l .  

Should this proposal be adopted? 

--. m vow tavor. PROPOSAL C 

A REFERENDUM ON PUBLIC ACT 143 OF 1993 -- AN AMENDMENT TO MICHIGAN’S AUTO 
INSURANCE LAWS 

Public Act 1 4 3  of 1993 would: 

1 )  Reduce auto insurance rates by 16% (average) f o r  6 months for 
policyholders reducing personal injury (medical) insurance t o  SI million- 
Extra coverage made available at added c o s t .  

2) Permit Insurance Commissioner t o  waive company‘s obligation to reducp 
rates i f  statutory formula would be in excess o f  1989 - 1992 s t a t e  average: 

3) P l a c e  limits on personal i n j u r y  (medical) benefits. 

4 )  Limit fees paid to hea l th  care providers. , 
r 

5 )  L i m i t  right to sue by setting h i g h e r  standards for the recovery o f .  
damages f n r  “pain and suffering“ and prevent uninsured drivers and drivers: 
over SOX at f a u l t  from collecting damages. 

6) 

Should the law be approved? 

Allow rate reductions for accident-free driving n i t h  same insurer. 

ooli 
ient 
gas 

Geothermal heating and c 
is four times moFe effic 
than propane or natural 

PROPOSAL P 

A PROPOSAL TO ESTABLISH A MICHIGAN STATE PARKS ENDOWMENT FUND. INCREASE THE* 
MAXIMUM AI,L.OWABLE AMOUNT OF FUNDS I N  THE MICHIGAN NATUHAL AESUUKCES TRUST 
FUND AND ELIMJNATE THE DIVERSION OF DEDICATED REVENUE FROM TBE MICIlIGAW 
NATURAL RESOURCES TRUST FUND. 

The proposed constitutional amendment would: 

1 )  
royalties, bonuses and r e n t a l s  collected by t h e  
oil and gas or mining of minerals on state-owned land. 

2) Require t h a t  money in Endowment Fund be used to operate, maintain and 
improve Michigan state parks. 

3) L i m i t  accumulated principal of the Endowment Fund t o  $800 m i l l i o n  with 
annual adjustments €or i n f l a t i o n .  

4) Increase the maKimurn principal of the Michigan Natural Resources Trust 
Fund from $200 million t o  $400 million. 

5 )  the Michigan Natural 
Resources TrupC Fund. 

Should t h i s  proposal be adopted? 

E s t a b l i s h  a Michigan S t a t e  Parks Endowment Fund to be funded by certain 
state from the drilling of 

Eliminate the diversion o f  dedicated revenue from 

There are several energy choices when it comes to heating and cooling, but only one is 
four times more efficient than the rest: Geothermal. 
Geothermal is the most advanced, cost-effective heating and cooling system available. It 
uses the earths constant temperature to create an even, cornfortable temperature in your 
home. Geothermal can save you up to 60% on your annual heating, cooling and hot water 
costs. It’s easy to operate and requires virtually no maintenance. Plus, it’s good to the 
earth, using a natural and renewable energy source that’s clean and safe with no open 
flames or fumes. 
Geothermal: It’s your best bet. 
To learn more about Geothermal, call. Detroit Edison‘s 
Heating and Cooling Information Center at 1-800-833-2786. Debit 

Edison Arthur Severance, Clerk 
EVERGREEN TOWNSHIP 
6331 Severance Road 
Decker, MI 4 8 4 2 6 -  
(517)  872-3530 

Clare  Brown 
GREENLEAF TOWNSHIP 
4323 Cumber Road 
Ubly, MI 48475  
( 5 1 7 )  658-8658  
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Down under 
Australian exchange student enjoying year here 

gree heat, later stepping out 
of a plane at Tri-City Airport 
into minus-30 degree 
weather, wearing a skirt, 
long-sleeved shirt and san- 
dals. 

“I think when 1 get home 
it’s going to be hard to ad- 
just to summer. Winter’s not 
something I’m used to,” she 
acknowledged, adding Aus- 
tralian schools never have 
snow days. “We have heat 
days.” 
At home, Malthouse gradu- 

ated from St. Brigid’s, a pri- 
vate, all-girl school with 600 
to 700 students. 

Americans think only about 
themselves and their country, 
which isn’t true, she said. 
And when the United State 
tries to help another nation, 
they are accused of trying to 
police the world. “I think 
that’s really unfair because if 
America doesn’t do some- 
thing, nobody will.” 

Aside from gaining a new 
outlook on world affairs, 
Malthouse said her exchange 
experience has given her a 
new perspective on people, 
thanks to the Rotary pro- 
gram, which organizes ac- 
tivities, including travel, that 
enable exchange students 
from different countries to 
get to know one another, 

The interaction has con- 
vinced her there’s a common 

denominator among nations 
that goes far beyond culture 
and tradition. “Everybody 
feels the same inside; they’re 
still human, they still can get 
hurt if you’re rude to them.” 

‘&YOU can’t come here and 
not be changed,” she con- 
cluded. “This year’s done a 
lot for me; how I look at the 
world, how I look at my own 
country. And how I look at 
America, definitely.” 

“It gives you a sense of pa- 
triotism in your own country 
- you just don’t appreciate 
something until it’s gone. It 
really makes you love youl 
country.” Malthouse grinned 
and added, “and your par- 
ents.” 

“It’s been fun. I wouldn’t 
change a thing about it.” 

- 

any expectations when she 
prepared for her trip to this 
country, but admits Cass City 
was a surprise. “I had no idea 
that America had small 
towns,” she said. 
“I like that. I like the small 

town atmosphere. It’s like 
everybody here is so friendly, 
and after a week, everybody 
knows who you are. It just 
seems like a nice little place 
on the outskirts of the world.” 

It’s also very different. 
Malthouse pointed out one of 
her most difficult adjust- 
ments has been getting used 
to a society that seems “a lot 
more rushed and organized.” 
In Australia, she explained, 

there’s no big hurry. “The 
attitude is, if it’s too much 
hassle, forget it. No worries.” 
It’s a philosophy that carries 

into every aspect of life in the 
land down under, according 
to the exchange student, who 
loves football, but said high 
school athletics get a lot 
more attention here. She was 
surprised to learn there’s an 
admission charge at school 
sport events, “At my school,” 
she noted, “they’d have to 
pay you to come to a game.” 

Trudi Malthouse has come 
to love being a high school 
senior. 

And why not, the teen has 
had plenty of practice; she 
graduated from a private 
high school before coming to 
the area, she took part in  
commencement exercises 
with the Cass City High 
School Class of ’93, and now 
she’s member of the Class of 
’94. 
“I’m getting pretty good at 

it,” the personable 17-year- 
old joked recently. 

Malthouse, a Rotary Ex- 
change student, arrived in 
Cass City last January from 
the land down under. She has 
since lived on a dairy farm 
and in the Gagetown area, 
and currently resides in Cass 
City with David and Betty 
Smith, her third and final 
host family. 

In January, she’ll return to 
hcr hometown of Perth, a city 
of 1.2 niillion people in 
Western Australia. 

MISSES UNIFORM 

She said she’s enjoyed at- 
tending Cass City High 
School, in part because it’s 
easy to get to know everyone. 
Still, she misses wearing a 
uniform to school. “I hate 
getting up and deciding what 
I have to wear today.” 

A5 for school work, 
Malthouse said her studies 
her? haven’t been too diff- 
cult compared to home, 
where the final 2 years of 
high school are more like at- 
tending college classes. 

She indicated it was rela- 
tively easy to get settled in 
because American teenagers 
“just come up and talk to 
you. They don’t judge you. 
“They love my accent,” she 

added. “They love to make 
fun of me, but I like that, 
too.” 
Malthouse tried not to have 

Your neighboGuys - +  

* .  

Time change And while she looks for- 
ward to seeing her family and 
friends again, she says leav- 
ing won’t be easy. 

“I think I want to go home 
for about a month, see every- 
body and then say, I’m go- 
ing back to America,” 
Malthouse remarked, flash- 
ing a quick smile, “It’ll be 
f u n ,  going back with my 
American accent.” 

She recently talked about 
her experiences here since 
leaving Australia’s 100-de- 

still welcome SHE MISSES HOT weather, kangaroos, eucalyptus trees and 
lamb, but that hasn’t stopped Australian exchange student 

in Cass City. 

! % Trudi Malthouse from savoring every moment of her time 

a 
$On groundwater Pollution 

NOT TOO SERIOUS The semi-annual time change is scheduled the last of 
October, when clocks will be turned back one hour to East- 
ern Standard time. 

The time change is welcomed by Don and Fay Craig to- 
day and was really appreciated by Don when he was a 
letter carrier in the Detroit are 

Back then, he recalled, be- 
fore the time change, we of- 
ten went to work in the dark 
and it was dark again when I 
got home. With the time 
change it was daylight when 
I went to work, at least. 

It doesn’t mean as much to- 
day, although both Don and 
his wife agree that it is nice 
to have the long daylight eve- 
nings in the summer. 

The Craigs moved to Cass 
City from Eastport in May of 
1993 and live in the conda- 
miniums. Craig is not a stranger in the Thumb area. He 
has a brother that lives in the Elkton area. Fay has no roots 
in the area, lived all her life in the Detroit area. However, 
she says she likes the small town atmosphere she found 
since coming to Cass City. 

There are 2 daughters in the family, Linda and Sally. 

“As far as dating, we don’t 
get that serious. If you see a 
guy with a girl, go back in 3 
weeks and he’ll probably be 
free,” she continued, adding 
dates typically involve less 
travel back home. “We like 
to entertain more at home.” 
Despite living in a big city, 

Malthouse said Perth doesn’t 
have stores that stay open 24 
hours a day. 

“All our shops close at 6 
o’clock except Thursday, 
when they’re open ‘till 9,” 
she said. “That probably ex- 
plains why I spend more 
money here. A lot more 
money.’’ 
On a more serious note, the 

teen briefly talked about 
America’s involvement in 
Haiti. 

There’s an impression 
among some nations that 

a. 

@Farm 4 program set Thursday 
:* 

Farm managers, agricul- 
tural advisers and others in- 
terested in farmstead surface 

kbnd groundwater pollution 
prevention can view a 
Farm*A*Syst video confer- 
ence Thursday. 

The noon-to-3 p.m. pro- 
gram is being co-sponsored 
by Michigan State University 
Extension and the University 
of Wisconsin Cooperative 
Extension, and will be avail- 
able for viewing at most 
MSU Extension county of- 
fices. 

The program will focus on 
Farm*A*Syst programs in 
10 states and will include an 
in depth analysis of agricul- 

c; tural pollution abatement 
programs in Michigan and 
Ontario. 

Conference participants 
will find out how to identify 
potential pollutant sources - 
- fertilizer, manure, pesti- 
cides, septic systems, fuel, 
solvents, milkhouse wastes, 
etc. - - and how to reduce 
pollution risks from them on 
their farm. 
People interested in the pro- 

gram should contact their 
county extension office or  
Wilma Miller, Michigan 
Farm*A*Syst program coor- 
dinator at (517) 355-01 17. 

Farm * S * S y st was orig i - 
nally developed by the Uni- 

versity of Wisconsin. The 
information has since been 
tailored to Michigan agricul- 
ture. 

The program format has 
been approved by MSU Ex- 
tension specialists, the 
Michigan Soil Conservation 
Service, Michigan Soil Con- 
servation Districts, the 
Michigan Department of 
Natural Resources and the 
Michigan Department of 
Agriculture (MDA). 

MDA, in its support of 
Farm*A*Syst, offers pesti- 
cide recertification crcdits to 
farm owners who usc the 
material. 

Real Estate Vernita Kniaht Trust Household 

Located 3 Mocks north ol traffic light on Seeger Street in Cas$ City, 1 Mock west at 4637 Kennebec Drive. 

Saturday, October 1 at 9:30 a.m, 
REAL ESTATE 

WHOPPER - Walbro Gorp. employee 
Wade Smith, 27, of Mayville, displays the 
terrific tomato he grew this summer. The 
hefty specimen weighed in at 2.14 
pounds. Hunter, 27, has served with 

the infantry for IO years. The 
1485 Cass City High School 
graduate saw action in Per- 
sian Gulf as a member of the 
forces involved in Operation 
Desert Storm. 

uuv 
Tape Rental 

w WmRmIlk 
To be sold at completion of personal property auction at approxlrnately 3 o’clock 

1 1/2 story, 3 bedroom brick home with attached 2 car garage located at 4637 
Kennebec Dr. on beautifully landscaped lot. Large living room with fireplace. Pan- 
eled family room and kitchen with lots of cupboard space, stove and dishwasher. 3 
bedrooms with 2 downstairs and 1 upstairs. Full bath on each floor. Excellent stor- 
age and closet space. Finished basement. Natural gas boiler. This house is in 
excellent condition and will make someone a very nice home. TERMS - $5,000.00 
deposit day of sale of Real Estate with balance due on or before thirty days. 

NO DEPOSIT 
TAPE PLAYER RENTAL 
NO MEMBERSHIP FEE 

PREVENTING 
CONSTIPATION 

Constipation is a common nuisance affecting millions of 
Americans. Preventing constipation is also important for 
medical reasons. Studies show that a person can signifi- 
cantly cut down on the risk of colon cancer, probably by 
the quicker elimination of any cancer-causing chemicals. 

There are numerous methods of preventing and treating 
constipation. The first is by developing good bowel hab- 
its and a routine time to use the bathroom. Another simple 
measure is to increase the amount of water you drink. 
Physical activity is also helpful. 
Good dietary habits are especially important. By eating 

foods high in fiber, a person will help keep his body 
healthy in many ways. First, fiber makes the stool larger 
and softer and bowel movements will be more frequent. 
Bulkier stools will also decrease the chance of develop- 
ing diverticula which is a very common problem as a per- 
son grows older. Other advantages of fiber are that it will 
help lower the cholesterol, decrease the risk of colon can- 
cer, and will cause a more steady rate of absorption of 
food. This is especially important in diabetes. 
If other measures are needed, there are a variety to choosc 

lrom. Some medicines, such as milk of magnesia, help 
draw extra water into the gut to keep the stool softer. There 
are “stool-softeners” and lubricants, such as mineral oil. 
Laxatives work by stimulating the coloil to empty but 
they can hami the colon if used on a long term basis. 

This is one of a series of articles brought to you 
in the interest of better heulth by 

HOUSEHOLD Cedar chest 
2’x4‘ oak ireme. h l e d  mirror 
Kerosene Large collection lamp d jewelry including wshrrne 

jewelry & small watch pln 
cut glass C ~ l  bowl 
Load cryslal med bowl 
Waterkud @aSS bird 
Sweral etched QI~SS poblets. phles. k t r y  

Glass bowls 
dlshes 

2 Apple *ss 6 bllskeb pear ghm paper weights 

Noretaka 8 pleee Umqr 
RosenW German plates. cops & 8aucem - 
Wedoewood cream & sugar 
Wkw Hand peinted depresdon Nrppon glass woa plate pitcher 

Hand Cups 6 palntad sawern Nippn teapl  

Hand palnld plater 

8 plecs settlnga 

Whirlpod t0.1 eu. ?I. refrlgerator - like new 
Philm upright freezer 
Kenrmre upright freezer 
Nwge auto. washer 
Norge elec. dryer 
Apt. size Hardwlck elec. stow 
G.E. 19’ edor N whemote controls 
SR 3090 VCA wlremote 
Mamntr AMFM 500 casselte player w n  
Magk speakers Chef mkrowave 

2 mcwm sweepers 
Clodc radio 6 others 
Applrtrnces including Kitchen Aid mix 

master, food processor, blender, others 
Grinneil Brothers piano L bench - nke 
6 pc, bedroom set lncludhg lwin beds, 
chesls 01 drawers - like new 

Wood double bed - complete 
Wood shale bed - cmdete 

Humldffler 
Dehumidifier 
Tau0 & fkm lamps 
B l l o o r f a n s  
Sound Design cessetle L record player 
Records 
2 drewer IL 4 drawer file caMnets 
Large quantity of bedding 
Dishes, pots 6 pens 
Blnoculerr 
Large quantity of books 
h m h g  baking dlshas 
Pyrex dishes 
Farbemare 
Smra l  pieces sllwr-type serving dishes 
Other 1847 Rogers Roger &os. B r a .  pieces dlvetware Muding set chlld‘s 

Other set, salad pleces forb, of allvemare etc. 

Metal sheivina 

~ 

6,000 Movies 
I NEW RELEASES 1 21 Sgt. Todd Hunter 

The Crow Savageland 
Hostage for a Day 
Naked Gun 33 1/3 

Mother’s Boys 
Kavik the Wolf Dog 

The Snapper 

Kindel drisser Qa&n hose; w/reels C U M  
Many garden W s  & o t k r  hand tools 
Foldlng chairs 
Others 

Qermen diehes ineluding large planer 
Sovoml Hal plecos including 8  up teepol 
3 ~urwtels + Apple Tree Boy. Apple Tree Girl. 

Cheats of drawers 
Kindel wood desk - very nice 
Wood desk wileather inlaid b p  - &e 
Matchina droo leaf rnahoaanv e d  tabk Teltii Her Secret - _  

G e m  china figurlne 
S e w d  hand painled Andrea flgurlnes ANTIQUES & Coffee tables 

WoDd reading stand 
wod cabinet 
Book case with doors 
Large m)od bo& shen 
Small rwnd wood sewing stand 
Magazine stand end mag. rack 
Book shelves 
2 couches - nice 
2 mslching swivel rockers 
Occasional chalr & matching loot stod 
Several msional chairs 
2 bar stools 
Chrome table 6 chairs 
Mirrors 
Barmeters - new & old 
Plctures b. frames 

I COMING ATTRACTIONS I 
Surviving the Game 

Attack of the 50 ft. Woman 
Bad Girls 

China Moon 
Trading Mom 

Puppet master 5 
DISNEY MOVIES 

WILDLIFE AND HUNTING TAPES 
Complete set of World at War (W.W.ll), Victory at Sea 

(W.W.11) and fen Thousand Day War (Vielnam) 

COLLECTIBLES 
4 matching, ornate wood chairs 
Caned 2 Queen httm Anne wood chalrs chair 

2 smell wood bedsldr tsblea 
Small oak drop leaf table 
Chest 01 drawers w/2 hardkerchief 

Walnut wteleg drop leal table 

Singer treadle aewlng mechine 
Wardrobe 
small wood arpbwd 
Plant stand 

drawers 

Wood & Sl8nd 

FURS 
Bwtrm able 
Burtrwn W e t  
Perskrn Lemb mat 

Y .  A, 
Mark Wiese AUTOMOBILE 

1078 chevy Caprlce CIassk 4 door, 
nvtomatic, air, 67,350 miles. sharp like riew HARRIS-HAMPSHIRE 

6815 E. Cass City Rd., Cas City 
(51 7) 872-4351 Dave Milligan -Trustee 

Copeland lunch wagon 
Phone 51 7-872-2937 

Clerk - Hillaker Auction Service. 
Terms of perional property - Cash or check with IO. Everything settled for day of sale. Not responsible for 
accidents. 

Auctioneer - Hillaker Auction Service 
Phone 51 7-872-5375 or 51 7-872-301 9 

Cass City 

HILLS & DALES GENERAL HOSPITAL 
4675 HILL STREET CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 48726 
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0-G celebrates homecoming 
with upset win over Peck, 13-6 

SENIOR ANGlE WILDMAN highlighted the Owen-Gage 
homecoming half-time show Friday when she was crowned 
the school’s 1994 queen. Classmate Matt Jaworski was voted 
king. 

through,” said a delighted 
Coach Arnie Besonen fol- 
lowing the game. 
The Bulldogs (2-2) will try 

for their 2nd NCTL win this 
Friday when they entertain 
Carsonville-Port Sanilac. 

“Carsonville is small and 
quick, but if our line executes 
like they did Friday we 
should be alright.” 

Peck was given the first 
scoring opportunity Friday 
when Austin Brinkman 
coughed up the pigskin after 
hauling i n  a Ryan 
Radabaugh 3rd down pass 
that was g o d  for a would- 
be first down, on the Bulldog 
35-yard line. 

Peck then swiftly drove 
down to the 5-yard line, 
where they possessed a first 
and goal. But the Bulldog 
defense, aided by a Pirate 
fumble that netted a 6-yard 
loss, stiffened, resulting in a 
25-yard field goal attempt 
that sailed wide of the left 
crossbar. 

Besonen’s gridders 
mounted one of their better 
drives of the opening half on 
their next series. 

The Bulldogs mounted 3 
straight first downs on a long 
Tkacz scamper, a 20-yard 
pass completion to Mark 
Damm and a roughing the 
passer call that spotted the 
Bulldogs deep into Peck ter- 
ritory. The drive fizzled, 
however, when Radabaugh 

0 - G  hoopsters win 2, prep 
for tough Peck Thursday 

Coach Dean Roller’s 
Owen-Gage cage team had 
little trouble last week dis- 
posing o f  North Central 
Thumb League foes Akron- 
Fairgrove and Caseville. 

The Bulldogs defeated thc 
Eagles Thursday, 48-28. Ear- 
lier in the week the Vikings 
feil victims to the ‘Dogs, 5 1 - 
37. 

In both contests the Bull- 
dogs simply overpowered 
their NCTL counterpart 
while running their season 
mark to 6-2, 3-1 in confer- 
ence play. 

The Bulldogs will receive 
their biggest test of the sea- 
son thisThursday whcn they 
travel to face league leader 
Peck, who boast a lofty 6-1 
mark and unblemished 
NCTL record at 5-0. 

OWEN-GAGE - T. Smith 
7-0 (0- 1 )  14; M, Ahfalter 2- 
0 (0-0) 4; S4 Roemer 3-0 (2- 
2) 8; A. Wildman 3-0 (3-8) 
9; B - Kovach 1-0 (0-0) 2; K. 
Powers 3-0 (0-2) 6; J. Win- 
chester 2-0 ( 1  - I ) 5. 

-m------ 

TOTALS - 2 1-0 (6- 16) 48 

CASEVlLLE - A. Stahlo-3 
(0-0) 9; M. McCrimmon 4-0 
( 1 - 1 )  9; M. Leach 1-2 (0-0) 
8; S. Guster 0-0 (2-2) 2. 
TOTALS - 5-5 (3-5) 28. 

“We’re starting to come to- 
gether, but I’m not sure if  
we’re physical enough to 
handle Peck,” says Roller. 
Against the Eagles, Owen- 

Gage jetted to a 10-5 first 
period lead and were never 
headed despite registering 
only 18 first half points. 

“We were very sluggish in 
the first half,” said Roller af- 
ter wards. 
The Bulldogs were held to 

3 baskets from the ficld, a 
pair from Jennifer Winches- 
ter and one from Tonya 
Smith, in the initial quarter. 
However, pressure dcfense 
limited the hosts to a trey 
from Amy Stahl and a put 
hack from Misty 
McCrimmon to grab a 5 
point advantage heading into 
the 2nd stanza. 

The Bulldog defense con- 
tinued to hound the hosts 
throughout the maiden half 
as another basket by 
McCrimmon and Melissa 
Leach’s trey ended the scor- 
ing for the loscrs in the open- 
ing half. 
Owen-Gage added to its 18- 
10 half-time lead with an 18- 
8 run to start the final half. 
Senior Angie Wildman and 
freshmanTonya Smith paced 
the visitors’ spurt, scoring all 
but 2 of the Bulldogs’ 3rd 

period tallies. 
Owen-Gage secured the 

win with a 12-10 run in the 
4th period. 
Smith led the Bulldogs with 

a game high 14 points. 
Wildman added 9, while 
sophomore Susie Roemer 
collected 1 I rebounds and 
chipped in 9 points. 

The Eagles got 9 points 
each from Stahl and 

visitors to a 28- 17 half-time 
edge with 13 points bcfore 
the in termission. 
The Bulldogs, who led 12- 

I 1  after one period, sealed 
the win with an 11-6 run in 
the final 8 minutes. 

The Vikings managed to 
slice the visitors’ lead to 40- 
31 entering the final stanza 
as Katie Latimer registered 7 
of her team high 1 1  points 
- . ~  McCrimmon. shortly after the break. 

AKRON-FAIRGROVE 

Tuesday, Roller’s troops 
traveled to face Akron- 
Fairgrove and came away 
easy winners, 5 1-37. 

Senior leader Angie 
Wildman, who recorded a 
game high 19 points, led the 

But the Bulldog defense, 
thanks in part to Kate Pow- 
ers, who had 10 rebounds 
and 9 blocked shots, limited 
the hosts to baskets by 
Kierstcn Clark and Stephanie 
Brink wcr  the final 8 min- 
utes. 
“We shut their inside game 

down at the end,” sard Koller. 
Besides Wildman, who also 

had 6 steals, the winners had 
Smith in double digits col- 
lecting 17 points and Melody 
Abfalter chipped in 10. 

0-E A-F GAME 

OWEN-GAGE - T. Smith 7- 
0 (3-4) 17; M. Abfalter 5-0 
(0-2) 10; S. Roemer 1-0 (0- 

was intercepted in the Pirate 
end zone. 
Peck was rewarded another 

scoring shot shortly after the 
interception. 
After the Pirate offense was 

stopped on 3 consecutive 
running plays, the visitors’ 
were forced to punt. Owen- 
Gage was guaranteed good 
field position near midfield. 
However, the high and short 
Pirate punt touched a Bull- 
dog defender and the visitors 
recovered for a first down 
near the midfield stripe. 

Brinkman snuffed that Pi- 
rate scoring opportunity 
when he picked off an errant 
Chris Curry pass. 
With 2:55 remaining till the 

intermission, Tetil put Owen- 
Gage on top with a 12-yard 
run that capped a 35-yard 
drive. John Richmond’s kick 
for point after was blocked 
and the score entering the 3rd 
period remained 6-0. 

Tetil, a hard hitting junior 
linebacker and halfback, 
gave the hosts some breath- 
ing room near the end of the 
3rd period when he hauled in 
a Peck punt and raced up the 
visitors’ sideline 35 yards for 
his 2nd touchdown of the 
evening. Richmond’s kick 
for point after spotted the 
hosts to a 13-6 edge. 

The Pirates got one score 
back late in the 4th period on 
Jim Walsh’s one-yard run. It 
would prove to be too little 
too late. Walsh led all the Pi- 
rate rushers with 62 yards in 
23 carries as the visitors 
dropped to 1-3 on the season. 

Tetil, who is sure to see 
some all-league recognition, 
led a slew of Bulldog play- 
ers with 17 tackles (12 solo). 
Bill Schlak controlled the 
contest between the tackles 
for the winners, recording 9 
stops from his noseguard 
position. Schlak also blocked 
a Peck punt. Several Bull- 
dogs helped the winners de- 
fensive cause with 7 tackles, 
including Damm, Chad Jahr 
and Phil Fahrner. 

First downs 8 10 
Rushing attempts 28 35 
Rushingyards 174 78 
Passes complete 3 4 
Passes attempted 4 16 

0-G Peck 

AKRON-FAIR. - D. 
Maguire 2-1 (1-2) 8;  K. Invented 
~atimer4-1(0-2) 11;S.Butts The c lar inet  w a s  
2-0 (0-0) 4; K- Clark 1-0 ( I -  invented about 1700 by 
2) 3; R. Prime 3-0 (3-4) 9; G e r m a n  ins t rument  
K. Trisch 1-0 (0-0) 2. maker Johann Christoph 
TOTALS - 13-2 (5-10) 37. Denner. 

GANG TACKLING by the Buildogs Friday, like this errort 
against Peck’s Jim Walsh, resulted in a 13-6 homecoming 
victory. Owen-Gage held the Pirates to just 78 yards rush- 
ing on the evening. 

Fabulous 
Four‘s 
Fearless 
Forecast 
Sept. 30 
Millington vs. Cam 
Bad Axe vs. B.C.A.S. 
Lakers vs. Marlette 
Cros-Lex vs. Cass City 
Mayville vs, H, Beach 
Sandusky vs. Pinconnin 
Reese vs. Deckerville 
C.P.S. vs. Owen-Gage 
Peck vs. North Huron 
Dct. 1 
Ubly vs. U.S.A. 
Last week 
Season 
4ccuracy percentage 

,<* * 

John 
Haire 

vlillington 
3.C.A.S. 
A e r s  
30s-Lex 
4 arbor €3 each 
i and us k y 
k e s e  
2 s .  
Jorth Huron 

J.S.A. 
1-4 
:a-1 1 
‘2%) 

Clarke 
Haire 

caro 
B .C.A.S. 
Lakers 
Cros-Lex 
Harbor Beach 
S and us ky 
Reese 
Owen-Gage 
North Huron 

U.S.A. 
6-4 
31-8 
79% 

- r 
Tom 

Montgomery 

caro 
I3 .C.A.S. 
Lakers 
Cros-Lex 
Harbor Beach 
Sandusky 
Reese 
C.P.S. 
North Huron 

U.S.A. 
5-5 
2s- 14 
54 7 0  

3 U O  
3,C.A.S. 
,akers 
:ass City 
larbor Beach 
teese )i ncon n i ng 

X S .  
lJorth Huron 

J.S.A. 
.- 6 
!4- 1s 
12% 

NOTICE 
OF SPECIAL ELECTION 

For 
Grant of Franchise to 

Southeastern Michigan Gas Company 

October 4, I994 
at Novesta Township Hall 

7 a.m. - 8 p.m. 
Kathleen Newell 

7681 Deckerville Rd. 
Deford, MI 48729 

Township of Novesta Clerk 

872-4651 

How far will we go to build the region’s 
best Pediatric Intensive Care Unit? 

II 4 A few months ago we went to leading hospitals in Cincinnati, Boston, As far as We have to, and Durham to find three outstanding pediatric specialists for the 
St. Luke’s Pediatric Intensive Care Unit (PICU). 

We found them. And we’re pleased to announce that Dennis Cotcamp, M.D. (Children’s Hospital Medical Center, Cincinnati, Ohio); 
Kristan M. Outwater, M.D. (New England M e d i d  Center Hospitals, Boston, Massachusetts); and Hani Zrelk, M.D. (Duke University Medical Center, 
Durham, North C a r o h )  have joined our PICU team. 

These accomplished physicians bring their skills in respiratory care, anesthesiology and cardiology to a hospital already known for its 

commitment to the highest level of pediatric intensive care, a hospital pledged to go the distance to build the best. 

01% St. Luke’s Healthcare Asscxlation All rights reserved. 
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Lakers 
league, 
Hopes were high that this 

was the ycar that the Cass 
City Red Hawks would crack 
the stranglehold of Elkton- 
Pigeon-Bay Port on the grid- 
iron. Alas, it proved to be just 
a fantasy as the Lakers 
crushed the Hawks Friday, 

What’s more, things don’t 
look much brighter for this 
Friday when Cros-Lex 
comes totown. The Pioneers 
have a win ovm the Lakers 
and their only loss has been 
a one-point decision to Bay 
City All Saints. 
Every loss is tough to take, 

but Friday’s results against 
the Lakers were especially 
disappointing for Hawk fans 
in that the winners domi- 
nated the game from early in 
the first quarter and the 
Hawks couldn’t get on the 
scoreboard until after the 
winners had charged in front, 
22-0, 
Ahout thc m l y  consolation 

for Hawk fans was that the 
team didn’t curl up and die 
when the outcome was all 

30-20. 

but certain. 
YOU CAN’T SEE HIM but Jason Morgan made this stup Jason Morgan scored a 

a 13-yard run and then ran 
for the extra points. W ~ S  

on Brian Gola, one of 26,lO solo, he was credited with against 
the Lakers. Watching the play, number 20 is Kevin Storm, 

with 3:06 left 

and Justin Hulburt, number 55. Stanton match& that with a 

Hawk golfers split 
non-league matches 

The Cass City golf team 
split non-conference 
matches last week w i t h  
Deckerville and Sandusky 
pnd will return to league play 
Fonight (Wednesday) when 
@ey host Elkton-Pigeon-Bay 
Port. Friday, the Hawks will 
travel southwest to c o m p t e  
in  the Vassar Invitational 

Wednesday, Sept. 21, the 
young Red Hawk team 
hosted Deckerville of thc 
Thumb CAmerican division 
and took 4 points, winning 
both match play and stroke 
play, 17 1-204. 
“It’s the same old story. We 

need our 4th and 5th players 
to step up some,” said Coach 
Jeff Hartel this weck. 

Freshman Chad Tatc re- 
corded medalist honors 
against the Eagles, posting a 

City’s Rolling Hills Golf 
Coursc. 

Following Fate were Chad 
Zawilinski (43 ) ,  Davc 
Murphy (45), Ben Hahbs 
(4h), Ryan Bennett (47) and 
Mike Peruski (48). 

Monday, Sept. 19, Cass 
City travelcd to Woodland 
Hills Golf Course, where 
thcy wcre defeated by the 
Sandusky Kcdskins in match 
play ( - A )  and stroke play 

Again ‘late paced the 
Hawks with a steady round 
of 37 that was good for low 
r o u n d  on the afternoon. 
However, Dave Murphy’s 
scorc of 49 would be the only 
other Hawk score M o w  SO.  

Rounding out the scoring 
for  thc Hawks were: Pcruski 
( S 2 ) ,  13enncri and Zawilinski 

153-191. 

~ ~ 

First Big Week Of The 
ShurFine Canned Goods Sale! 

Prices will never be lower 
again this year. By the 
case or by the piece. 
*Good while siipplies Lastf 

ERLA’S 
505 Double FOOD CENTER We Gladly 

Coupons Cass City Acce t WIC Everyday 
ONb a stat Phone: 872-2191 E FooBStamps 

RED HAWK CHAD TATE strokes a 
putt on the 4th hole of Wednesday’s 
match with Deckerville. The freshman 
standout has recorded scores of 37,33, 
36 and 37 during league play this sea- 
son at Rolling Hills Golf Course. 

1 $-Month 1 30-Month 1 
Call or visit the office nearest you today to take advantage 

of these great rates! Available for a limited time only! 
872-2105 

6241 Main Street 

MUTUAL SAVINGS BANK, f.s.b 
Safety and Dependablllty Slnce 188; 

FDIC I f i r u d  Locations Throughout Michigan 

da 
to1 

‘sh € 
1 

lawks’ 
Cros-I 

TD run frqm the one. Mid- 
way through the final period, 
the Hawks scored a pair of 
touchdowns on passes from 
Chad Diegel to Kevin Storm, 
one for 5 yards and the other 
fTom 7 yards out. 
The Hawks put themselves 

in a huge hole in the fist half. 
After an exchange of punts, 
the Lakers staged their first 
scoring drive. Starting on 
their own 33,2 running plays 
covered 30 yards. After 
picking up another first down 
to the Hawk 30, a pass gave 
the Lakers a first and goal on 
the 8. Three plays late! 

Stanton circled end for the 
touchdown. A pass from 
Matt Esch to Heath Krohn 
was good for the extra points. 
Although the Hawks picked 
up some yardage between 
the tackles, the Lakers 
crushed every attempt to run 
wide. The Hawks had little 
to cheer about offensively in 
the first half, A pair of first 
downs were picked up, one 
by Tim Warneck and the 
other by Jason Morgan, each 
with sprints of about 10 
yards. 

The crusher for Cass City 
came late in the second quar- 

Win, lose on road 

1 

ho 
ex 

Pe 
is 

ter. Taking over on the 50- 
yard-line with 2:42 left, the 
Lakers scored in just 51 sec- 
onds. Gola dashed for 28 
yards on 2 runs and Stanton 
scored from the eight. 
Morgan put on a defensive 

show for the team with 26 
tackles, 10 unassisted. He 
also picked up 71 yards on 
13 runs. Cory Ulfig averaged 
6.6 yards with 59 yards in 9 
tries. 

Jv WINS 

The Cass City junior varsity 
won, 22-6, over the Laker SV. 

:S 

n 
in 
ext 

The JV is now 3-1 with the 
only loss coming on a recov- 
ered quarterbackpitch on the 
last Pinconning. play of the game against 

CC-LAKERS 

cc L 
First downs 10 16 
Rushing attempts 44 51 
Rushing yards 174 300 
Passescomplete 4 4 
Passing attempts 10 8 
Passing yards 27 37 

0 1  Fumbles lost 
Penal t ies/y ds. 3 -25 2 - 30 

~ ~ ~~ ~~ 

Hawk hoopsters at hornemfinally 
Cass City will enjoy some 

home cooking for a change 
after playing 7 of its first 9 
games on the road, including 
last week’s games in which 
the Hawks earned a split by 
measuring Ctos-Lex, 54-46, 
and bowing before potent 
S an dusk y, 5 0- 24. 

The Hawks now enjoy a 
stretch of 7 straight games at 
home starting withTuesday’s 
game with Memphis and 
Saturday’s game at 3 p.m. 
against Marlette. 
The Hawks racked up their 

4th win in 8 gamesThursday 
with a close decision over 
Cros-Lex. In the first half the 
Hawks racked up 2 of their 
better offensive quarters of 
the season. In the first period, 
paced by Peyten Daniel’s 7 
points, the Hawks notched 
15 points. In the second, 6al- 
anced C a s  City scoring net- 
ted 16points. 

Despite the offensive 
splurge, the teams played al- 
most even as the Pioneers 
matched Cass City almost 
basket for basket and at the 
intermission trailed by a 
single point, 3 1-30. 

The Hawks added to the 
margin in the third period, 
sparked by Cori Britt, who 
came off the bench to score 
4 points and snare 6 re- 
bounds late in the period and 
early in the fourth quarter. 
Going into the final quarter, 

Cass City led by 5 points and 
added to its lead with the 
help of foul shots, convert- 
ingSof 1 1 .  

Coach Marty Daniel said 
that the team played better 
for longer intervals to post 
the win. Peyten Daniel was 
the top Hawk scorer with 15, 
followed by Lisa Burns with 
10. Farley was the top point 
producer, with 17, for Cros- 
Lex. 

SANDUSKY GAME 

Sandusky, the team re- 
garded as the best in the 
Thumb in  pre-season esti- 
mates, lived up to its billing 
Saturday with a convincing 
win. The Redskins had too 

CC-SANDUSKY GAME 

CASS CITY - W. Mayer 1- 
0 (0-0) 2; KVanVliet 1-0 (3- 
4) 5;  A. Cooper 1-0 (0- 1) 2; 
J .  Caister 1-0 (0-0) 2; J .  
Wright 0- 1 (2-2) 5; P. Daniel 
2-0 (4-5) 8. 
TOTALS - 6-1 (9-12)24. 

SANDUSKY - L. Vopacz 1- 
0 (0-0) 2; J. Morningstar 1-1 
@-O) 5 ;  B.J. Jones 2-0 (0-0) 
4; A. Stoutenberg 1-0 (0-0) 
2; A. Anton 2-0 (0-0) 4; L. 
LeGault 8-0 (0-0 16; E. Hull 
1-0 (2-2) 4; S. Biniecki 6-0 
(1-2) 13. 
TOTALS - 22- 1 (3-4) 50. 

CC-CROS-LEX 

CASS CITY - K. VanVliet 
I - 1 (3-7) 8; J. Caister 4-0 (0- 
0) 8;  L. Burns 4-0 (2-2) 10; 
J .  Wright 2-0 (3-5) 7; A. 
Schelke 0-0 (2-2) 2; P. Daniel 
6-1 (0-1) 15; C. Britt 2-0 (0- 
1)  4. 
TOTALS - 19-2 ( I  0- 19) 54. 

CROS-LEX - DcVruendt 1 - 
0 (0-0) 2; Brown 5-1 ( 1 - 1 )  
14; Hartzcll 1-0 (0-0) 2; 
Studaker 0-0 (2-4) 2; Farfey 
7-0 (3-5) 17; Brown 0-1 (0- 
0) 3; Mathis 2-0 (0-0) 4; Lee 
1-0 (0-0) 2. 
TOTALS - 17-2 (6-10) 46. 

the Redskins off the boards 
i n  the first quarter and 
handled the Sandusky press 
well. But the team could do 
nothing on offense and was 
Ji l l  held Wright. to a 3-point bucket by 

The offense came to life in 
the secand quarter featuring 
balanced scoring that netted 
10 points. The Redskins 
countered with 13 points, 6 
by LeGault. 

Coach Daniel said he was 
pleased with the defensive 
effort in the first half. 

I n  the third quarter the 
Redskins exploded to salt 
away the game. A big 22- 
point quarter was led by Sara 
Biniecki, who scored 10 of 
her 13 points in the &minute 
stretch, 

After that it was mop up 
time and the Redshns bench 
saw much of the action. 

JV RESULTS 

The C a s  City junior varsity 
provided plenty of excite- 
ment for fans, winning and 
losing games in overtime. 

much of everything for the The Hawks topped Cros- 
Hawks. There was too much Lex, 36-33, and lost to 
Lamara LeGault, with 16 Sandusky, 42-36, The JV 
points and great ball han- record is now 3-6. 
dling. Most of all there was L 
too much height for the :; 

::::3=:?!?=.?7 ..,.(..... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Hawks to counter. 
Cass City did well to keep 

The freshmen girls lost to 
Sandusky in their only game 
of the week, 47-36. Their 

, . . . ..... ‘.....i..-.-.i-...~~.. 

.............. .:.:.:.:.:,:.:*. ......,...;.. :....: ....... 

THUMB C NATIONAL 
School W L w L 
EPBP 3 0 5 3  
Marlette 2 1 5 3 
 ass City 2 1 4 5 
BCAS 2 1 4 4  
Bad Axe 0 3 2 5 
Cros-Lex 0 3 0 7 

School W L W L 
Sandusky 3 0 8 0 
D’ville 2 1 5 2 
Uhly 2 1 3 4  
H. Beach 1 1 6 1 
R ee se 1 2 3 3  
Mayville 0 2 3 4 

0 2 0 6  USA 

School w L w L 
Pcck 5 0 6 1  
Port Hope 3 1 5 1 
O--ljage 3 1 6 2 
N. Huron 3 2 5 3 
A-lY 3 2 3 4  
Ct’S 2 2 3 4  
Kirigston 0 5 1 6 
Caseville 0 5 0 7 

THUMB C AMERICAN 

NORTH CENTRAL “D’ 

THURSDAY 
EPBP 54, Marlette 36 
Cass City 54, Cros-Lex 46 
BCAS 62, Bad Axe 38 
Sandusky 57, Ubly 29 
D’ville 61, USA 47 
9. Beach 55, Reese 35 
Peck 57, Port Hope 34 
3-Gzge A-F 47, 48, CPS Caseville 45 28 

N. Huron 71, Kingston 39 

Sandusky SATURDAY 50, Cas City 24 

FWDAY 
EPBP 30, Cass City 20 
Kcese 24, BCAS 7 
Cros-Lex 14, Oscoda 7 
D’ville 30, Sandusky 14 
Mayville 30, Ubly 26 
N. Huron 14, Kingston 8 
0-Gage 13, Peck 6 

USA 24, H. Beach 6 
Marlrite 30, Bad Axc 8 
CPS 53. Taylor L&L 28 

SATURDAY 

THUMB C NATIONAL 
School W L W L 
BCAS 2 0 3 1  
Cros-Lex 1 1 3 1 
EPBP 1 1 3 1  
CZS City 1 1 2 2 
Marlette Bad Axe 

0 1 3 1 0 2 4 2 

THUMB C AMERICAN 
School W L W L 

2 0 4 0  Rccsc 
USA 2 0 3 1  
D’ville 2 I 3 1 
Mayville 1 I 1 3 
H. Bcach I 2 2 2 

Sandusky 0 3 0 4 
Uhly 1 2 2 2  

NORTH CENTRAL ‘D’ 
School W L W L 

N. Kingston Huron 2 I 0 1 2 3 1 I 
fec k 1 1 1 3  
0-Gage I 2 2 2 

0 1 2 2  c PS 

ARE YOU THINKING 
OF BUYING 

A NEW HOME? 
Join Our Experienced Mortgage Stuff 

For A Free Seminar Designed To 
Answer your Financing Questions 

With Chemical Bank‘s new “HOME BUYER PROGRAM” 
produced in Conjunction with MGJC, you can learn about 

the  basics of buying a home. 

WHEN: Tuesday, October 18, 1994 
WHERE: 

TINIE: 

Detroit Edison Energy Center, Community 
Room, 4100 Doerr Road, Cass City 
7:OO p.m. to 9:OO p.m. 

YOU CAN ALSO I4zzAmv ABOUT: 
a Budgeting for the purchase 

Down payment requirements - often as low as 5% 

The many financing options and payments available 
The application process 

The closhg process 

The responsibilities of home ownership 

RSW: Space is limited+.. 

To reserve your seat call 
CHEMICAL RANK BAY AREA 

and ask for Dick Wallace at (517) 872-4355 
As a special bonus, participants will receive a coupon for 

$100 off our closing fee on a new mortgage loan. 

MEMBER F.D I C ,’ EQUAL HOUSING. EQUAL OPPORTUNITY LENO€R 
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Valued at $722.000 nt counci[ 
1 

1 * 
City Middle School Stude(t 
Council has elected 3 returp- 
ing officers for the second 
year of student government, 
and is seen as an asset to ef- 
fective student government 
and continued programs. : 1 

The newly elected represen- 
tatives and alternates are iii 
place, serving their classes 8s: 
the “voice” of the students.: 
R. B. Partlo, advisor to the< 
council, states: “This year’s 
council may be the best s t k  
dent body government selecl’ 
tion of representatives and’ 
officers elected to their posi-: 
tions for the past 10 years of 
council activity.” 

Elect stude 
Sanilac polic e harvest pot The Cass City Middle 

School Student Council re- 
cently elected officers for the 
1994-95 school year. 

Acting on citizen tips and a 
Drug Enforcement Adminis- 
tration-assisted fly-over, the 
Sanilac County Drug Task 
Force harvested some 
$722,000 worth of marijuana 
in 6 townships over a recent 
4-day period. 

Sanilac Township residents 
with manufacture of rnari- 
juana. 

The seizures were an- 
nounced Sept. 20 by drug 
task force officials, who rc- 
ported seizures in  Worth, 
Marlette. Moore, Sanilac, 
Buel and Wheatland town- 
ships ranged from 10 plants 
to 662 plants. Thc marijuana 
was discovered growing in  

corn and bean fields, along a 
fence line and outside one 
S nover Road residence. 

Portions of the plants were 
retained for testing by the 
Drug Enforcement Adminis- 
tration, which has a nation- 
wide testing prograrn which 
tracks the THC content o f  
domestically grown mari- 
juana. 

In all, 722 marijuana plants 
were seized over 4 days this 
month in  Sanilac County. 
The plants have an estimated 
street value of $1,000 each. 

So far in 1994, a total of  

1,068 marijuana plants, with 
a combined street value of 
more than $1 million, have 
been seized by the Sanilac 
Drug Task Force, compared 
to 465 plants seized in 1993, 
The increased seizure activ- 

ity this year is the direct re- 
sult of more citizen tips be- 
ing called in and improved 
inter-agency cooperation, 
officials said. 

Citizens who discover 
marijuana plants can contact 
the drug task force anony- 
mously and toll free at I -  
8W-544-DRUG. 

Mandy Chappel, last year’s 
student council vice-presi- 
dent, was elected to serve as 
president this year. Kara 
Mellendorf was last year’s 
treasurer and was elected to 
the vice-president position. 
Shelly Ulfig, last year’s sec- 
retary, will now be in charge 
of publicity. Tivo new ofic- 
ers for student council are 
Dave Hobbs, secretary, and 
Brad Roche, treasurer. 

This is the first year Cass 

As a result of the seizures, 
arrest warrants will be pre- 
pared seeking to charge 2 CASS CITY Middle School student 

council officers are: (from left) Brad 
Roche, Shelly Ulfig, Mandy Chappel, 
Kara Mellendorf and Dave Hobbs. College Night 

Oct. d i n  Car0 
FOOTBALL = BASKETBALL 

SCHEDULES 
The Tuscola County Coun- 

selors’ Association will be 
hosting a College Night Pro- 
gram Oct. 6 from 7 to 9 p.m. 
at the Tuscola Area Skill 
Center, one mile north of M- 
8 1 on Cleaver Road in Caro. 

able to students who cannot 
afford a post-secondary cdu- 
cati0n.A special session will 
look at career planning for 
the ’90s. 

Students considering col- 
lege and their parents are 
encouraged to attcnd. There 
will be no better opportunity 
to get so much information 
on so many schools at one 
time. The ‘I’uscola County 
College Night is one of the 
largest held in the state of 
Michigan. 

For more information, 
please contact Lenore 
Lemanski, counselor at the 
Tuscola Area Skill Center, 
673-5300, Curtis Cleland or 
Wayne Dillon at Cass City 
High School. 

Representatives from large 
public universities in Michi- 
gan, area community col- 
leges, many private colleges 
and vocational schools, and 
branches of the military will 
be on hand with information 
about the opportunities they 
offer for people of all ages 
to continue their education. 

A representative of the 
Michigan Department of 
Education will provide infor- 
mation on financial aid avail- 

Bas ke t ba I I Football 
CROS-LEX 

at 
CASS CITY 

Friday, 
Sept. 30 

MARLETTE 
at 

CASS CITY 
SaturdaK 

Oct. I 
Starting at 3 p.m. 

Pumpkin Ball 
slated in Car0 

The fast -approac hing 
Pumpkin Ball will be a tale 
of dining, dancing and guests 
dressed in their finest. Tick- 
ets are on sale for the annual 
event, set for Saturday, Oct. 
8. 

The ball, one of the high- 
lights of the 14th Tuscola 
County Pumpkin Festival, 
opens with a social hour at 
6:30 p.m. The adults-only 
evening will continue with 
dinner at 7 p.m. and dancing 
from 9 p.m. till one a.m. 

Volunteers will transform 
the Knights of Columbus 
Hall, 903 Ryan Road, Caro, 
into a park-like setting, 
pumpkin ball chairperson 

Beth Grccnc said, complete 
with ivy, flowers and deco- 
rative windows. 
“It’s going to be a differcnt 

menu, a really upbeat menu,” 
she said. And, o f  course, 
there still will he pumpkin 
pic for dcsscrt. 
After dinner, ii widc variety 

of live music is planncd. ‘I’hc 
band “C‘han~pagne” appeals 
to many musical tastes. 

Tickets f o r  thc Pumpkin 
Ball cost $37.50 per couple. 
They arc available at down- 
town Caro businesses 
Garnblcs and Next Door 
Neighbor, or by calling chair- 
person Grccnc at 673-5 103. 

BASKETBALL SCOREBOARD 
(Home games in bold type) 

Tues., Aug. 30 .............. Cass City 46, Reese 27 Tues., Oct.11 .......................................... U.S.A. 
Thurs., Sept. 1 .Cass City 36, Harbor Beach 50 
Tues. Sept. 6 ................ Cass City 42, U.S.A. 39 

Sat., Oct. 15 ........................................ Bad Axe 
llies., Oct. 18 ............................................ Ubly ’‘OREBOARD 

. ............................................ Sat., Sept.10 .............. Cass City 35, Bad Axe 29 
Tues., Sept.13 ........ Cass City.02, DeckerviIle 46 Sept.2 .................................. Cass City 6, Caro 14 

16 ............................ ............. cass city 30, Bad Axe 6 Sat., Sept. 17 Cass City 46, Lakers 60 
23 ............................... cass city 20, Lakers 30 Thurs., Sept. 22 ........ Cass City 54, Cros-Lex 46 
30 .................................... ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ l l - ~ ~ ~ i ~ ~ t ~ ~  Sat., Sept. 24 ........... Cass City 24, Sandusky 50 

Tues., Sept. 27 ................................... Memphis Oct. 7 .............................................................. Ubly 
Sat., Oct. 1 ........................................... Marlette 14 ............................. (Homecoming) Marlette 
Sat., Oct. 8 ........................................ All Saints 21 .......... (Parents! Night) Bay City All Saints 

.............................................. Harbor Beach 

Sat,, Oct. 22 Lakers 
Tueg., Oct. 25 ...*...* ....................... ....... Mayville 

cass city 28, 8 Thurs., Sept. 15 CaSS ctf$ 24, Brown City 55 Sat., OCt. 29 Cros-Lex 
Tues., NOV. 1 ..................................... Open Date 
Thurs., NOW 3 ..................Marlette Jv& Fresh- only 
Fri., NOV. 4 ........ Marlette at Palace, Auburn Hills 
Tues., Nov. 8 ..................................... Open Date 
Fri., Nov. 11 ......................................... All Saints 

All games start at 7:30 p.m. 

9 .......................... ..... ....................................... 

First county tire 
collection slated 

SPONSORED BY 
THESE HAWK BOOSTERS 

AI Swiderski 
General Agency I Phone 673-1488 

Ken Martin Electric 
Phone 872-4 7 74 

Tuscola County will host 
its first tire collection Satur- 
day, Oct. 1, at the Wal-Mart 
parking lot in Caro, Sharon 
Mika, recycling coordinator, 
said. “We will accept car and 
pickup truck tires at a cost of 
$1.25 per tire. Semi-truck 
and tractor tires are $5.00 per 
tire and larger tires are $1 .SO 
per inch width of tirc. The 
collection will be held for 
one day only, from 9 a.m. to 
4 p.m. This collection is not 
for commercial businesses 
and please, no rims,” Mika 
said. 
Residents can help to clean 

up and improve the quality 
of the environment in  
Tuscola County. This recy- 

nate potential mosquito 
breeding sites as well as rc- 
duce solid wastc. 

The tircs will he shredded 
and used as fuel, in  an ap- 
proved incirieralor and madc 
into other products such as 
thc mailbox post manufac- 
tured by Lopcr Corporation 
in Millington that is sold at 
most lumber yards in  Tuscola 
County. 

“Residents who have SO or  
more tires may contact 
Heritier Drainage of Turner 
at 1-800-53 I-4S94 for infor- 
mation on having their tires 
picked up,” said Mika. 

If  you have a n y  qucstions, 
contact Sharon Mika at the 
MSU Extension Office in  

Charmont 
Restaurant, Bowling & Motel 

Phone 872-4200 

ARRIS 

AMPSHIRE AGENCY. INC. 

Andersonnuckeyl 
Bernhardt & Co., P.Cl 

Phone 872-3730 

Mr. Chips Food Store 
Phone 8 72-5688 &,a Eslablished 1924 

Phone 872-4351 
Km- 

Anrod Screen 
Cylinder Co. 
Phone 872-2 10 1 

Hills and Dales Hospital 
Phone 872-2721 0- - 

h;ne B 72-43 77 

People’s Choice Market a IGA Foodliner 
Phone 872-2645 

Coach Light Pharmacy 
Phone 872-3613 

Backroads DJ 
Faron & Jo Alexander 

Phone 872-5404 
@ Phone 872-4346 

Quaker Maid Dairy Store 
Phone 872-4600 

Dr. Hoon K. Jeung, M.D. 
Phone 872-467 1 

Dan’s Power & Stove 
Phone 872-3790 

Bartnik Sales & Service 
Phone 8 72-354 1 

Rolling Hills 
Golf Course 
Phone 872-3569 

Sally Doerr 
Dance Studio 

cling project helps to climi- Caro at 673-5999 ext. 228. 

I 
Dr. David Batzer II, O.D. 

Phone 872-3404 
d ’  Phone 872-533 7 Phone 872-2248 1 New books 

at the library 
BeARD 

Chrysler/Plymouth/Dodge/Jeep Eagle f Phone 8 72-2 184 

Double I) 
Gas & Diesel Repair 

Phone 872-4540 

Schneeberger’s 
TV & Appliances 

Phone 872-2696 

GGGa 
Plumbing and Heating 

Cass City 872-5084 
Piaeon 453-353 I 

Kirn Electric 
Phone 872-3827 

Detroit 
Edison 

~~ 

KTo-lnbody 
Insurance Agency 

Phone 872-57 14 

Cass City Chronicle 
Phone 8 72-20 IO A goorl part of p t  Me. 

Phone 1-600-477-4 74 7 THE BEST TOYS, BOOKS, AND VIDEOS FOR KIDS by 
Joanne Oppenheim (non-fiction). This book answers the 
question of what to buy and when! Based on the natiorially 
recognized consumer newsletter, THE OPPENHElM TOY 
PORTFOLIO, this indispensable resource is guaranteed to 
take the guesswork out of finding the best products for kids 
from infancy to age 10. With reviews of more than 1,000 
expert - and kid - tested new and classic products, this f u n ,  
easy-to-use guide includes toys, books, videos, computer:;, 
and audio tapes. It also has a special section on products 
for kids with special needs, niulticultural toys, books, and 
videos, and books in Spanish. 

ERLA’S 
FOOD CENTER 

-IN CASS CITY- 

Phone 872-2197 

Kritzmans’ Inc. 
Phone 872-3470 

Simpson Excavating 
Phone 872-4502 

Cass City Floral 
Phone 872-3675 

Little’s Funeral Home 
Phone 872-2195 

Special Scents 
Phone 872-3434 

Cass City Oil & Gas 
Phone 872-3 122 

Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 H Thumb National 

Bank 81 Trust 
Phone 872-43 7 1 

POWERMARKETING FOR SMALL BUSINESS by Jody 
Hornor (non-fiction). No book is better at providing useahlc 
suggestions and advice for the day-to-day application o f  
marketing principles to small-business opcrations thar, 
Hornor’s. Hornor has more than 20 years of marketing ex- 
perience, and now conducts marketing seminars. This guide 
is straightforward and filled with contagious enthusiasni, 
offering numerous worksheets, checklists, sarnples, arid 
examples that make market research techniques, market - 
ing plans, advertising strategy, and sales and distribution 

Dr. Paul Lockwood, D.C. 
Phone 872-2765 

Phone 872-21 11 
v Dr. Robert Green, D.D.S. 

Dr. Nicholas Nahernak, 
D.D.S. 

Phone 8 72-2 18 7 

Walbro Corp. ml Phone 872-2731 
Dr. Paul Chappel, DDS. 

Phone 872-3870 
v tactics understandable and practicable. 
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No. 1300 

Ting’ey Rubber BO 0 T S $1 OzsE! 

WORK $ 
BOOTS 

NO. 1400 Tingley 10 inch 

Cass City Bowling Leagues 
Cole Carbide 6 
C.C.  Sports 5 
C.R. Hunt 4 

Cole Carbide 8 
Warju Flooring 7 
New England Life 7 
Brent wood 7 
Summers 6 
Pro - Temp 5 
Soundz by Greg 5 
Charmont Motel 3 
Kingston 3 
Homesteaders ‘ 1  

High Series &Games: G. 
Goodwine 734 (257-244-, 
233), J. MiIletics 726 (26’7-1 
235-224), T. Comment 697 
(247-227-223), M. Jackson 

Robinson 674 (243-2241, K. 
Pobanz 673 (235-231), D. 
Orton 672 (258-2451, T. 
Schnell 669 (269-214), R. 
Rabideau 650 (2561, D. 
Miller 646 (232-2121, R. 
Lewis 636 (242-2131, G. 
Williams 636 (240), B .  
Kingsland 610 (233-217), J. 
Storm 608 (224), J. Kroll603 
(233), R, Hull 590, L. 
WenzIaff 5 8 5  (249), J ,  
Langenberg 582 (215), A. 
Ruggles 581 (230), J. 
Howard 580, M, Zawilinski 
568, K. Zawilinski 567, W. 
Smith 559 (219), L. 
Tomaszewski 558, C. Anthes 
557, T. Yost 556, C. Kelley 
553, M. Miracle 550, B .  
Anthes 235, K. Beachy 213, 
C.  Altizer 212, E. Schulz 
21 1. 
High Team Series & Game: 

Milletics Surveying 3322 & 
1125. 

685 (247-222-2 16), C. 

Morel1 504. 
200 Game: L. Erla 206. 

FRIDAY NIGHT 
MIXED DOUBLES 

Sept. 23 

Double Trouble 24 
Kingston Mini Mart 14 
Wilbee Folks 14 
Old Folks 13 
Town & Country 10 
The Family 9 

‘I SUNDAY NIGHTERS 
Sept, 18,1994 

High Rollers 4 
Town & Country 4 
Tu Hard 3 
Sberidan Rollers 3 
In & Out 3 
Alley Cats 3 
Schott’s Accounting 1 
Sugar Makers 1 
D.J.’S 1 
New Comers 1 
The L.T.’s 0 
Sweet Guys 0 

High Series & Games: G. 
Smith 655 (218-26&), Doug 
O’Dell 606 (213), T. Com- 
ment 606 (263), D. 
Dickinson 590 (211), P. 
McIntosh 578, C .  Kelley 
577, K. Pobanz 576 (21 3), D. 
Miller 575 (212-213), S. 
Grifka 235 ,  C. Zawilinski 
224, F. Kapral 221, T. 
Furness 2 12. 

High Team Series: Miller 
Eggs 2833. 

High Team Game: Cole 
Carbide I02 1 + 

Men‘s Caribou 
INSULATED BOOTS 

Leather Top - Rubber Bottom - Sizes 8 to 13 
Removable Foam/Thinsulate Liner - By Rod & Gur 

Men’s High Series: M. Lon- 
don 548, J.  Navarro 543. 

Men’s High Game: J.  
Navarro 223. 

Women’s High Game & 
Series: B. Watson 574 & 210. 
High Team Series & Game: 

‘DoubJeTrouble 2082 & 736. 

, .Men’s High Series: E. 
&tchinson 634, J. LaPratt 
5?6, K. Schott 620. 

{Men’s High Game: K. 

Elhtchinson 227-222, F. 
€&yes 2 1 3, J. LaPratt 22 1, G. 
Jkkson 224. 

&omen’s High Series: J .  
Kklley 542. 

yomen’s High Game: 3. 
Kelley 201. 
YighTeam Series & Game: 

Ti& Hards 2044 & 759. 

SChott 237-213, E. CHARMONT LADIES 

Cass City Tire 10 
Dee’s MP Rockets #2 10 
Live Wires 9 
Wild John’s 8 
Charmon t 6 
Fiz7,a Villa 5 
Board’s 4 
Elmwood What Knots 4 
Thumb Nat’l Bank 3 
Cable-ettcs 1 

ECUMENICAL 
CHURCH LEAGUE 

Sept. 24 

Neighborhood Gang 8 
Pi nti ppers 6 
Antiques 4 1/2 
Stouts 4 
Little Kids 4 
Woodsp li t ters 4 
Holy Rollers 4 
Out Of Control 4 
All In The Family 3 1/2 
Last Resorts 2 112 
Ladies Four 2 
Alley Cats 1 112 

TUESDAY MORNING 
, LADIES’ LEAGUE 

Sept. 20 High Team Series: Cass 
City Tire 301 6. 

High Team Game: Pizza 
Villa 1065. 

High Series: V. Mills 510, 
L. Shake 507, N. Davis 497, 
B. Erla 493, D. Mathewson 
499, S.  Humpert 479. 

High Games: E .  Erla 188, 
N. Davis 186, I), Mathewson 
186, L. Comment 179, L. 
Shake 179, V. Mills 179, M. 
Bowman 173, M. Moore 
171. 

Charmont 1 1  
RANS 9 
Pin Heads 7 
Alley Hoppers 5 

High Series & Game: C. 

HighTeam Series & Gamc: 

TUSCOLA 
GET TOGETHERS 

Sept. 19 

Slaughter 487 & 186. 

Charmont 1706 & 602. 

200 Games: C. Zawilinski 
212, 236; D. Miller 206; D, 
Speirs 2 10, 204. 

500 Series: D. Englehart 
577; D. Miller 586; D. Speirs 
545; C. Little 506. 

600 Series: C. Zawilinski 
607. 

THURSDAY NITE TRIO 
Sept. 22 

General Cable 13 
Martin Electric 10 
Northon Construction 10 
IGA 9 
Pioneer Seeds 8 
Nelesco 8 
Mycogen Plant Sciences 7 
Hyatt Farms 6 
Babich Beef 5 
Marlette Oil & Gas 3 

MERCHANTS 
Sept. 21,1994 

Miller Eggs 12 

C + i n o n t  Motel 7 

Charmont 8 
Bbard Pro Temp Racing 7 

B!entwood Graphics 7 

AA U W slates 
RIF progrum 
for October 

Milletics Surveying 1.1 
Charmont 9 Men’s Monkey Face 

WORK GLOVES 
The local branch of the 

American Association of 
University Women (AAUW) 
recently hosted several 
women from theThumb area 
for a buffet dinner. 

Social Coordinator Connie 
Herndon’s hostesses were 
Evelyn MacRae, Ann Craig 
and Celia House. Food was 
prepared by AAUW mem- 
bers. 

President Pat Smith wel- 
comed the guests. An infor- 
mational meeting followed, 
reviewing upcoming local 
events for the fall and winter 
months. 

Sue Dyer, chairperson of 
the Reading is Fundamental 
(RIF) program, reported ,the 
first presentation of books 
will  be in  mid-October. 
Clifford, a favorite dog of 
young readers, will distribute 
Clifford books to all first and 
second graders in the Cass 
City SchooIs. 
This year’s Halloween Car- 

nival is scheduled for Satur- 
day, Oct* 29, at the middle 
school. Chairperson Connie 
Iwankovitsch’s committee 
includes Evelyn MacRae, 
Janeen Mills and other mem- 
bers. All area children are 
invited for games, prizes and 
treats. 
Friday,Oct. 14,AAUWand 

thevillage Bach Festival will 
co-sponsor Detroit’s Spain 
Middle School. Their march- 
ingkoncert band will per- 
form for Cass City elemen- 
tary and middle school stu- 
dents. Co-chairs are Jane 
Hittler and Marlene Erla. 

Fresh wreaths will be sold 
again this year. Proceeds sup- 
port the AAUW’s many 
school projects, Co-chair Pat 
Smith announced the 
wreaths will be available for 
distribution at Thanksgiving 
time. Wreaths may be or- 
dered from any AAUW 
member. Following the din- 
ner and meeting, Evelyn 
MacRae introduced local 
historian Jack Esau. He cn- 
tertained the group with dia- 
logue and slides portraying 
Cass City’s growth and 
progress from the 1860’s to 
the present. 

The October meeting will 
be held Tuesday, Oct. 11, at 
Jordan College. AAUW 
members are women gradu- 
ates of an accredited univer- 
sity or college. Guests are 
welcome at all meetings. 

Special 87 pr. 

High Team Series: General 

High Team Game: Martin 
Cable 1726, 

Electric 608. 

Duane O’Dell 671, G .  
Robinson 648, K. Martin 
606, D. Doerr 601. 

210 Games: D. Doerr 253, 
Duane O’Dell 234-246, G. 
Robinson 232-223, K. Mar- 
tin 248-224, R. Doerr 223, J. 
Hacker 214, K. Kilbourn 
23 1,  R. Root 234. 

6 8  575 Saries: R. DWK 541, 
By ”Dickies” - Limit 12 pr. 

Men’s Long Sleeve 
UNLINED 

COVERALLS 
Interest Rates have Dropped 

6Y0 - 0 Money Down 
:No Payments lii March - FREE ESTIMATES $1 399 Sizes 

18-1 9-20 
by “Dickies“ 

Navy - Green - Fisher Stripe 

THURSDAY MORNING 
COFFElE LEAGUE 

Sept. 22 I 

BAY WINDOWS 
s239 EXTRA 

With Window 
l’urc h as c 

for Sub- Structure 

E’s & V’s 12 
H1 Roth 10 1/2 
Sal’s Country Clipper 8 1/2 
AIDES 7 
Dairy Barn 6 
Dee’s MP Rockets 4 

High Series & Game: D. 
Smith 518 & 186. One Group - Close Out 

: Windows $5 Each Per Month 
I Free Garden Window 

Free ScreensLocks 

*Free Thermo Glass 
Free Trim Work 

Free Double Strength Glass 
$1 3gg Values to 

$36.95 
MERCHANETTE 

LEAGUE 
Sept. 22,1994 

Hurry for these great buys! 
Car0 Chiropractic 11 
Clean Up Crew 9 

Rolling Hills 7 
Cass City Sports 7 
Hills & Dales 5 
Crowley Chiropractic 4 
Cass Tavern 4 
Nel’s Kitchen 4 
Allen Home Care 1 

FormYou 3 8 Men’s Zipper 
Hooded 

SWEAT SHIRT $lg4*g9 Gray - Hack - Navy SOFTUFF oiled leather upper 
trim double - silicone treated 

Treebark 1000 denier Water-Tite 
Cordura side panels 5 TOLL FREE 1-800-288-4385 

State License 21 01 10901 6 
/ *  Based on 6 double hungs & pic- 
! ture window, 1200 sq. in. 

High Actual Team Series & 
Game: Caro Chiropractic 
1947 & 684. 

500 Series: G. Corcoran 
561, I? McIntosh 556, L. &la 
536, L. Leiterman 507, J .  

Sizes 8-13 $7 995  
Reg. $89.95 

Ladies‘ 

Our Entire Stock 
FALL DRESSES 

Sale Ends Sat., Oct. 8th 
_ _ - -  - 

Get Quick 
Results With 

The Chronicle’s 
Classified Ads % I I complicate Regnancy. 



TUSCOLA 
COUNTY 

PUMPKIN 
FESTIVAL 

October 6, 7,  8 & 9, 1994 
Rent a Hague Metered 

Conditioner or a , L 1 ~ u r a s t i l l  Drinking on all normal installa- 
tions of Hague Water Water System I FREE I Conditioner or 

for 30 days I Durastill Drinking 
*Introductory offer I Water Systems 
---------------I--- 

MIDWEST WATER 

COMINGSOON 6 :I Mm &ss- 
Home Entertainment & :+' 

* *  Appliance Sales & Service 
RCA - Toshiba - Pioneer - I 

Gibson - White- 
Westinghouse - Crosley ' 

1223 E. Cam Rd. 

Thus. 8100 Register Pumpkins 
5:30 Pie Eating Contest 
6:OO Prince & Princess Crowning 
7:OO Lip Sync 

1:OO Horse-Drawn Wagon Rides 
3:30 
5:OO Downtown Entertainment 
9:00 Open Dancing 

8 : O O  3 on 3 Basketball 
9:00 
11:OO Cutest Punkin' Baby 
1 :00 Pumpkin Fun Bowl 
6:30 Pumpkin Ball 

12: 15 Plymouth Fife and Drum 
1:30 GRANDPARADE 

Fri. 9:00 Arts&Crafts 

Teen Dance - Jr. High 

Sat. 9:00 Arts  &Crafts 

Classic & Antique Car Show 

Sun. 1O:OO AixplaneRides 

AND SO MUCH MORE To DO & SEE!!! 

LAETHEM'S - CAR0 
On M-24 517-673-3939 

Nothing Runs& I Deere. 

Fabric Shop 
'Pumpkin Festival Special* 
Vhen making a purchase, 
you will drawporn a 

€DIT SERVICES 
OF IAST CENTRAL MlCHlOAN 

651 N. h b  St., Cam, Michigon 48723 
Phone: 51 7-67341 28 

M '  

For More Pumpkin Hours: Mon. - Fri. 9 a.m.-8 p.m. 
Sat. 10 a.m.-4 p.m. Closed Sundaj 

Other hours By Appointment 
1227 E. Caro Rd., Caro Festival Information 

Call 673-2511 
b 

1 

Wear Your 
14th Annual 

Tuscola County 

I 

I WITH THIS AD 

GOLSCH 
OPTOMETRIST 

20% to 70% off 
Over 100 exciting programming 

options, including movies, 
sports, news and kid's TV. Visit 

us today or call now for more 

10°/o OFF 
ANY PURCHASE STOREWIDE 

Frames now in mop;ress 

467 N. STATE STREET I 

CARO,MlCHlGAN 1 HOMES AMERICAN 
MADE CO. 

1400 E. Cum Rd 9 C'um, MI f \ M o m  - Frl. 9-5 Sat. 930-5  

QhLLLk' 

! WELCOME 
1991 PLYMOUTH VOYAGER 

V-6, Auto, LE, Loaded 
7-passenger 

$10,500 plus tax 
-$500 Rebate 

TO CARO'S 
14th ANNUAL 

PUMPKIN FESTIVAL 
"Please enjoy your 

visit to our 
wonderful community" 

0- 
I 
I 

Pumpkin Festival 
C asafina Handcrafted 

European Giftware 
Buy First piece at regular price 

Get Second at 112 price 
with this coupon I 

m h 

Call Gary at 
673-7758 

DWIGHT'S AUTO 
SALES 

1525 E. Caro Rd. 

i ~ + Largest Showroom In The Thumb + 
Specidizing In Handicap Items 

800-821-1822 
L 121 N. 5 17-60;3-8448 

Stale SI (Mini Mall), Caro 
1 

& Electronics 
224 N. W e  - Car0 - Phone 673-3421 THE CRAFT HOUSE I 

196 N. Sbte St, Caro Ph. 673-5244 - 
i "Stop in and see 1 

us for the best deal" fl Hours: Mom-Thurs. 9 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. 

Closed Sunday 
Fri, 9 a.m. - 7 p.m.; Sat. 9 a.m. - 4 

P% WINTER \ OCTOBER P% Welcome BRING THE 
WHOLE 
FAMILY! 

BIRTHSTONE 
SPECIAL 

1 
I 

1994-1 995 
RESORT VACATIONS 

Prices Now Available 

1 

To Our 
Town 25% off 

I CriFtorn Framing I'rintc 
Mallirq S a i r w l  Glass 
Folk Arf Acrcwories 

Detroit Depart IJ res 
Antigua, Aruba, Barbados, Cancun, 

Cozumel, Grand Cayman, 
Ixtapa,Manzanillo, Playacar, Puerto 

Vallarta, St. Kitts & Nevis, St. 
MaartenISt. Martin, Star Clipper 

Oct. Birthstone Rings, 
Earrings & Necklaces 
"Layaways are welcome 

for the Holidays 

C A R 0  CHAMBER 
OF COMMERCE 

"Odd Sizes 
0 u r Specialty " 
189 N. State St , Caro, MI 48723 

5 17-673-5826 

'proninp. . . t o w r \ c ? o u  htllcr!" 

Cam Mini Mall 

McCon key 
Jewelry and Gift Shop 

i 267 N. State, Caro 

"Our members are 
ready to serve you" 

---..--------.--- 
( 5 1 4 )  673-8000 1-800-745-3117 

ADVENTURES 
CAR0 MINI MALL 

673-5211 

k l A d  
672-2070 0 
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“Calico Kittens” 
The purrr.. . fect 

gift for any 
occasion 

PAGE ELEVEN 

“Mary Moo Moo1’ 

Great selection to choose from 
Collectibles 

1995 ag report passes 
Letter to the editor 

Farm aid outlook good 
Couple chose 
to circumvent 

Congressman James A.  
Barcia announced Friday the 
U.S, House has passed the 
1995 Agricultural Appro- 
priations conference report, 
which includes a disaster re- 
lief provision for Michigan 
farmers, by a vote of 287- 
107. 

The report now makes its 
w9y to the Senate, where i t  

expected to be adopted. 
t T m  very happy that the 
$next step has been taken for 
:farmers in the Thumb and 
:mid-Michigan to see a return 
!on their investment and hard 
n -  

work this season,” Barcia sured the delegation that thc 
said. 
“The amount of rainfall this 

year was just astounding and 
destroyed many of the lead- 
ing crops in Michigan such 
as dry beans and sugar beets. 
This disaster relief will help 
farmers to recoup their losses 
from Mother Nature and start 
fresh next season.” 

In a meeting with Agricul- 
ture Secretary Mike Espy 
earlier this year, Barcia and 
others briefed Espy on the 
extensive flood damage to 
crops in Michigan. Espy as- 

administration fully sup- 
ported disaster relief assis- 
tance for the state, and that 
the agriculture department 
will act as soon as the presi- 
dent signs the Agriculture 
Appropriations bill into law. 

“At this point, affected 
farmers should contact their 
local ASCS office to report 
darriagc to their crops, so that 
their claims can be processed 
as soon as the bill is passed,” 
Barcia said. “I know many 
have done this already, which 
will make the process of 
claims all the faster.” 
Forty-four Michigan coun- 

ties have been recommended 
for disaster designation by 
state ASCS Director Jim 
Byrum. 

condo bvlaws a/ 
are well aware of this proce- 
dure, proof being Mr. and 
Mrs. Long’s request in writ- 
ing to plant a tree on com- 
mon ground and was ap- 
proved by the board. 

Condominium living re- 
quires acceptance of living in 
a controlled environment. 
The point of this is that when 
you choose to buy into a 
condo, you voluntarily agree 
to adhere to restrictions of 
choice known as by1aws.k- 
tide XI Section IV, item J of 
our bylaws makes i t  the duty 
of the Board of Directors to 
enforce the provisions of the 
condominium documents. 

Dear Editor: 

This letter is in response to 
last week’s letter regarding 
the “illegal and unpatriotic 
conduct” by the Condo- 
minium Association Board 
of Directors. Mr. and Mrs. 
Long do not know any of the 
board members well enough 
to make such a slanderous 
statement. Mr. and .Mrs. 
Long must not have realized 
that a member of the board 
was a career military person 
before moving here to enjoy 
h s  well deserved retirement. 

;‘Walk for Life’ set 
Saturday 

The second annual Walk for 
ife, benefitting the Thumb %, egnancy Counseling Cen- 
r, is scheduled for this 

kpekenci. 
The event will be held Sat- 

urday from 9 a.m. to noon. 
The one-mile course begins 
and ends at 194 N. State St. 
An Caro. 

I 
in Car0 
families experiencing a cri- 
sis pregnancy. The center 
provides peer counseling and 
spiritual and emotional sup- 
port in providing alternativcs 
to abortion. 

The Walk for Life event is 
a primary fund raiser for the 
center. 

All walkers and pledgers 
are encouraged to partici- 
pate. Additional information 
is available by calling 672- 
4673. 

$30,000 grant 
What Mr. and Mrs. Long 

have conveniently omitted in 
their letter was that at clos- 
ing for their condo, they were 
furnished with Northwood 
Lake Condominium disclo- 
sure documents which in- 
clude condominium bylaws. 

Mr. and Mrs. Long make 
reference to a specific bylaw 
that “no co-owner shall make 
alterations in exterior appear- 
ance or make structural 

approved, for 
Mr. and Mrs. Long chose to 

circumvent the existing by- 
laws which 74 of the unit co- 
owners choose to adhere to. 

consortium 
The Thumb Pregnancy 

Counseling Center, located 
in Caro, serves women and 
E 

The Thumb Area Consor- 
t ium/Growth Alliance wi I I 
receive a $30,OOO grant from 
the U.S. Department of Dc- 
fense (DoD) to promote eco- 
nomic development i n  the 
Thumb, Congressman James 
A. Barcia announced Friday. 

“This grant means more 
jobs, more economic devel- 
opment and more govern- 
ment contracts going to the 
Thumb,” Barcia said. “The 
ThumbArea Consortium has 
a strong history in  creating 
jobs and new investment, and 
I’m glad they can continue 
to help area business pros- 
per.” 

The Thumb Area Consor- 
tium, a non-profit organiza- 
tion based in Marlette, works 
to promote new investment 
and create jobs in theThumb. 
The $30,000 grant is part of 

the DoD Procurement Tech- 
nical Assistance Cooperative 
Agreement Program a@ is 
c.alled a Solicitation for Co- 
operative Agreement Pro- 
posal (SCAP). It is designed 
to help organizations procure 
govcrnmcnt related contracts 
for local business. 

Through phone calls and 
letters, Barcia urged thc dc- 
fense department to award 
the Thumb consortium the 
full  amount of funding. 

Mr. and Mrs. Long, please 
explain to the board, by do- 
ing their duty, how you can 
justify the accusation that 
they are doing something “il- 
legal” and their conduct is 
“unpatriotic.” 

SHOOT FOR THE STICKS - This blue heron was photoed 
on the floating green at Northwood Shores Golf Course. The 
birds have been spotted near the ditch by the par 27 track. 

modifications.” 

4 charged in district court Mr. and Mrs. Long should Sincerely, ’ WEDNESDAY and THURSDAY 
Wed. Double Punch On Movie Goer  Card  

Free  Buttered Popcorn 2nds 
Thurs. Regular Price This  Double 

John Candy Comedy Western (7:30) 
“WAGON’S EAST” 

Bridget Fonda & Nicholas Cage (9:15) 
“IT COULD HAPPEN TO YOU” 

STARTS FRIDAY (5 LAUGH DAYS) 
All Evenings (Except Sat.) 7:30 

Saturday 7:30 & 9:20 
Closed Mon. & Tues. This Week 

have stated the rest of the 

Bond in the case was set at 
$2,000. A preliminary ex- 
amination was scheduled for 
9 a.m. Friday. 

.Mark A. Main, 29, Vassar, 
faces charges of operating a 
motor vehicle while under 
the influence of liquor, third 
offense, violating liccrise rc- 
strictions, and operating a 
motor vehicle without a li- 
cense, license plate and in- 
surance Sept. 16 in  Tuscola 
Township. 
Bond was set at $2,000 and 

a preliminary exam was third offense, Sept. 10 in Arequestin writingtomake 
slated for Friday morning. Almer Township. any changes must be made 

*Randall L. Stevens(,n, 34, Bond was set at $ 1 0 .  A before, not after, adding or 
yare, was  arraigned on preliminary exam is to be changing any of the common 

elements. Mr. and Mrs. Long mharges of  operating 1110- held Friday rriorning. 

tor vehicle while under the 
influence of liquor, third of- 
fense, violating license re- 
strictions and failure to 
change the address on his 
drivcr’s license Sept. 11 in 
Caro. 

Bond was set at $1,000. 
Stevenson faces a prelimi- 
nary exam on the charges 
Friday 111 or 11 i n  g . 

.Robert N. McLeod 11, 32, 
Caro, is charged with oper- 
ating a motor vehicle while 
under the influence of liquor, 

bylaw: “to his unit or make 
changes in any of the com- 
mon elements, limited or 
general, without the EX- 

PROVAL of the Board of 
Directors, including without 
limitation exterior painting 
or the erection of antennas, 
lights, aerials, awnings, 
doors, shutters, newspaper 
holders, mailboxes, basket- 
ball backboards or other ex- 
terior attachments or modi- 
fications. 

PFSSS WRITTEN AP- 

John G.  Cech 
6 107 Golfview Ln. 
Cass City, MI 48726 
Co-owner & Board member 

The following people were 
recently arraigned on felony 
charges in Tuscola County 
District Court: 

*Matthew D. Favazza, 17, 
Deford, was charged with 
larccny in a building in con- 
iicction with the alleged theft 
of helmets from a fire station 
i n  Kingston Aug. 17-18. 

Elkland 
treasurer 
sentenced 

* T* ,hur ica ,  slee ti&t. 
 hi safety of the L world 

is in ha hands 
Elkland Township Trca- 

surer Arthur Randall, Cass 
City, was recently sentenced 
in Tuscola County District 
Court on 2 misdemeanor 
counts of willful neglect of‘ 
dll t y. 

He was sentenced Sept. 14 
to pay $2,S62 i n  court costs, 
ti ncs and rcs t i tu tion. 
R ~ ~ i d a l l ,  S1, was originally 

chargcd with 3 counts for 
failing to duposit the prop- 
erty tax ofAllen Merchant in 
a timcly riianncr i n  Fcbruary 
1990, February 1991 and 
Fcbruary 1992. 

IN THE LOOR WHhT CORCH LIGHT 
PnRRmRCY HRI FOR YOU! & 

1*11...1 1111111 

SOON: Tom Hanks “FORREST GUMP“ THE 

COLLECTION 

Library ‘Fun 
Day’ slated 9 MONTHS 

SAME AS CASH The Fricnds of the Library 
arc planning a “Fun Day” at 
Rawson Memorial Library 
Oct.  28. Featured will be a 
“Mini” book sale of papcr- 
hack books. Anyone having 
paperbacks, cspccially west- 
erns and mystcrics, to do- 
nate, is askcd to leave them 
at thc library. 
‘I’he Fricnds of‘ the Library 

meet the first Thursday of 
each month at the library. 
Thcir purpose is to promote 
the library through volunteer 
work, money raising activi- 
ties and assisting with events 
at the library. Anyone inter- 
ested in joining the group is 
invited to attend the next 
meeting, Oct. 6 at I :30 p.m. 

RCA Home TheatrerM mcfl Model VRG72HF 
4-Head Hi-Fi Stereo VCR 

VCR Plus+’ Programming System 
H Simplified On-Screen Progranlrning 
I On-Screen VCR Setup Menu 
H Master Touch* Universal Remote 
H Alpha-Numeric Digital Display 
II 181-Channel Tuning Capability’ 
I 8-EvenVl-Year Prograrnmablc Timer 
I VHS Index Search System 
II Time Search 

Elapsed-Time Counter 
Digital Aulo Tracking 

VR672HF 

W One of the largest 
Precious Moments’ 

collectible centers in 
the area. 

Collectors’ 
Christmas 
Ornaments 

and 
Magic Lighted 

& Motion 
Ornaments 

Christmas is 
only 88 days 
away!!! 

&~r&’ d W.M Collectibles mcfl Model G35850CK 
also.. . 
Cards, RCA 35” Home Theatre 

Stereo Monitor- Receiver 
I Optimum Contrast Screen 

Advanced Color Picture-ln-Picture‘ 
Channel Guide, Zoom, Pan And Freeze 
SRS <@>I  Sound Rclrieval Systcm 

woo!woo! 
Yuletide Central. 

Our 1 st-in-a-series Keepsake 
Ornament, Yuletide Central, is 

perfect for the train enthusiast on 
your list. It features a red brass bell 

and wheels that can turn. 

2O-WattI Stereo Amplifier 
Broadcast Stereo With dbx’ Noise Reduclion/SAP 
Master Touch* Universal Remote (50-Butlon) 

W Dual Antenna Inputs 
G35850CK 

13-Jack VideolAudio Monitor Panel With S-Video Connector 

1c\(5n Model VH332 RCA 2-Head VCR 
I VCR plus+’ Proorammino Svstem 

Jim Ceranski I 8-EvenV1 -Year Programmable Timer 
Time Search 

4 On-Screen Elapscd-Time Counter 
W Digital Auto Tracking 
VR332 

p 4-0 H AR RIS-H AMPSHl RE 
681 5 E Cas3 City Rd , C a s  City 

(517) 8724351 COACH LIGHT PHARMACY 
MIKE WEAVER, Owner Emergency Ph. 872-3283 Ph. 872-3613 

HOURS: Mon. - Thurs. 8:30 a.m. - 6 p.m.; 
Friday 8:30 a.m. - 8 p.m.; Saturday 8:30 a.m. - 6 p.m. 

Your Familv Discount Drua Store 
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Bach Festival 
returning here Obituaries 

Betty Kim 

- for 6th season Mrs, Betty Kirn, 67, a life- 

The Village Bach Festival 
will return to the Thumb 
communities of Cass City 
and Car0 Nov. 22,25,26 and 
27 for its sixteenth season. 

Members of the chamber 
orchestra and soloists gather 
for theThanksgiving holiday 
to rehearse and perform J.S. 
Bach’s music and other ba- 
roque, as well as modern 
chamber composers, in the 
First Presbyterian churches 
of Cass City and Caro. 

In celebration of the six- 
teenth season as a Michigan 
chamber music festival, sev- 
eral major works are planned 
with vocal and instrumental 
soloists and a guest string 
quartet. 

Frank Kowalsky, clarinet 
soloist, returns after several 
years absence and will be 
featured as soloist in Aaron 
Copeland’s, “Concerto for 
Clarinet.” Priscilla Peebles, 
mezzo-soprano, also returns 
as guest vocal soloist. The 
Everest Quartet will be heard 
for the first time in C a s  City, 
featuring 2 familiar members 
of the Village Bach Festival 
orchestra, Jeanne Preucil 
Rose and Stephen Rose. The 
quartet is in residence in 
Midland I Odessa, Texas. 
They will premiere, in 
Michigan, a new work by 
Paul Schoenfield. 

Funeral services will be 
conducted Thursday at I 
p.m. at Salem United Meth- 

long resident of the Cas City 
area, died suddenly Sunday, 

Nov* 22 at the First PresbY- Sept. 25, at Hills and Dales 
terian Church, Don General Hospital, after an ill- 
Jaeger, conductor of the Vil- ncSS of several nionths. 
lage Bach Festival, Will per- She was born April 20, 
form as Soloist with the 1927, in Novesta Township, 
Everest Quartet on the oboe. the daughter of Homer and 
Jaeger began his musical Ca- Eva (Brown) Hewer. 
fCXX as an oboist, Winning a Miss Hewer married 
Fulbright Scholarshi€) to Stanley Kim Jr.Aug. 4,1950, 
study the oboe in  Holland for i n  Cass City, where they 
a year. made their home. 

Marilyn Mason, chairman Mrs. Kim, a graduate of 
of the organ departnient of central Michigan University, 
the UniVerSity Of Michigan, taught in  the Deford and 
returns to Caro to perform cas City schools for Over 30 
Bath organ works on the yeas, retiring in 1989. She 
Aeolian Skinner pipe organ was a member of Tuscola 
Of the First Presbyteriali County RetiredTeachers As- 
Church. sociation and Friends of the 

She was also a 
the Village Bach Festival member of Salem United 
proves to be interesting and Methodist Church of Cass 
rewarding with music nlak- City, where she was organist 
ing of the highest order,” said and choir member for over 
Holly Althaver, chairman of 50 years, membership chair- 
the festival. “It is ever a feast man and a member of the 
of the spirit to hear the mu- United Methodist Women. 
sic for those who come to Surviving are her husband, 
share the  talent of these Stanley; one son, Michael 
gifted per for mer s .” and wife Barbara of Cass 

The festival is made pos- City; 2 daughters, Miss 
sible, in part, by a grant from Melinda Kirn of Part Huron 
the Michigan Council for and Mrs. Kathy Smith and 
Arts and Cultural Affairs, husband Paul of Deckerville; 
Ticket information may be 3 granddaughters, Whitncy, 

obtained by calling (5 17) Meredith and Kally; 2 sisters, 
872-2131, extension 269, or Mrs. Hazel Seeley and Mrs. 
by mail to the Village Bach Audrey Katzenberger, both 
Festival, P.O. Box 27, Cass of Cass City. One grandson, 
City, MI 48726. one brother, Alva, and 2 sis- 

v 

“Each successive season of  Library. 

tcrs, Ruthie and Helen, pre- 
ceded her in death. 

bdist Church with the Rev. 
Robert Garrett, pastor, and 
the Rev, Clare Patton of Car0 

Deadline for submitting items in the calendar is the h i -  
day noon before publication. 

officiating. 

Cemetery, Cass City. 
Registration for pre-school story time continues at Interment will be in Elkland 

Rawson Memorial Library until Oct. 4. 

Thursday, September 29 

Friday, September 30 

American Red Cross Blood Bank at Wcsleyan Church, 
3248 Washington St., Kingston, 1 :OO-6:45 p.m. 

Tuscola County Health Department flu clinic Caro 
Church of the Nazarene 9:OO a.m. - 1l:OO a.m. and I :OO 
p.m. - 3:OO p.m. 

Alcoholics Anonymous and Ai-Anon, Good Shepherd 
Lutheran Church, 8 p.m. 

Saturday, October 1 
Cass City School Band Boosters car wash at Mr. Chips 

Smetanka Craft Show at Colony House, 1O:W a.m. - 4:OO 
Service Station, 1 O:OO a.m. till 2 p.m. Rain date Oct. 15. 

p.m. 

Sunday, October 2 
Smetanka Craft Show at Colony House, I0:OO a.m. - 4:oO 

p.m. 
American Bikers Aiming Towards Education holds 4th 

annual Toy Run at Ralph’s Tavern, Owendale, starting at 
4 p.m. Hog roast is at 5:30 p.m. 

Monday, October 3 
Cass City School Band Boosters meeting at Middle School 

Novesta Township Board at town hall, 7:30 p.m. 
band room, 7 p.m. 

Tuesday, October 4 
Tuscola County Health Department f lu  clinic at Cass City 

American Ked Cross Blood Bank at Hills and Dales Hos- 
VFW Hall, 9:30 a+m. - 11;30 a.m. 

pital, 1 p.m. - 6:45 p.m. 

Wednesday, October 5 
Duplicate Bridge, 7 p.m. at Charmont. Evcryone wel- 

come. Last week’s winners, Jackie Freihurger and Phyllis 
Ridge. 

Arrangements were made 

by Little’s Funeral Home, 
Cass City. Richard Shaner 
Memoials may be made to 

Salem United Methodist Funeral services were held 
Church or Rawson Memorial Tuesday, Sept. 20, at the 
Library. Dearborn Chapel of the 
Fred Henderson 
E Lynn Henderson, 82, of 

Kingston, died Monday, 
Sept. 19, in his home after a 
long illness. 
He was born Oct, 10, 191 1, 

i n  Kingston, son of Fred 
Lynn and Rhea (Dockham) 
Henderson. He married 
Marjorie Campbell Oct. 29, 
1933, in Manistee. 

Henderson spent most of 
his life farming. He worked 
for the Statc Highway De- 
partment for 10 years, then 
returncd to farming. He was 
a life member of the Caro 
chapter of the Masons. 

He is survived by his wife; 
4 daughters, Shirley Cline of 
Toledo, Ohio, Janet Cartier 
of Kingston, Kay (Joe) 
Bennett of St. Charles, 
Mich., and Susan Schafer of 
Tulsa, Okla.; 2 sisters, 
Kathleen Chandler of 
Sandusky and Emma Merritt 
of Bay City; one brother, 
Jerry D. Henderson of 
Northville; 15 grandchil- 
dren; 13 great-grandchil- 
dren; 2 great-great-grand- 
children, and several nieces 
and nephews. He was pre- 
ceded in death by his son, 
Fred Lynn Henderson 111, 
March 13:,1980, and a sis- 
ter, Helen Cullen. 

Funeral services were held 
Thursday, Sept. 22, in Kranz 
Funeral Home Chapel, 
Kingston, with the Rev. Lynn 
Chappell of Kingston United 
Methodist Church officiat- 
ing. 
Memorials may be made to 

Kingston United Methodist 
Church or the Marlette Hos- 
pice. 

Interment was in Kingston 
Cemetery. 

Shirley Wills 

Shirley J. Wills, 65, of 
Caseville died Wednesday, 
Sept. 21, in a fire at her 
home. 

She was born Sept. 13, 
1929, in Harbor Beach, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Stocks. 

She married James J .  
Minard in 1948. He died in 
1975. In 1982 she married 
Howard L. Wills, who pre- 
ceded her in death in 1993. 

Mrs. Wills was a 1948 
graduate of Harbor Beach 
High School. 

Surviving are 2 sons, Rob- 
ert Minard and his wife 
Vanessa of Hamtramck and 
Dennis Minard and his wife 
Judy of St. Clair Shores; a 
stepson, Terry Wills of Chi- 
cago; a stepdaughter, 
Marlene Rives of Bay City; 
2 brothers, Harold Stocks of 
Port Hope and Guy Stocks of 
Harbor Beach; 7 grandchil- 
dren, and 3 great-grandchil- 
dren. 

She was preceded in death 
by a sister. 

Arrangements were made 
by MacAlpine Funeral 
Home in Bad Axe, 

Howe-Presbyterian Funeral 
Home, Dearborn, for Rich- 
ard G ,  Shaner. 

He is survived by his wife, 
Wanda (Nichols) Shaner; a 
son, Michael and his wife 
Joanne; 2 grandchildren, and 
2 brothers, Wayne and Will- 
iam. 

Burial was in Elkland 
Township Cemetery, Cass 
City, 

For food, housing programs 

Grants awarded to HDC 
The Human Development 

Commission in Car0 will re- 
ceive 2 grants totalling 
$41,358, Congressman 
James A. Barcia (D-Bay 
City) announced last week. 
A grant of $31,358 from the 

U.S. Department of Health 
will fund HDC’s Community 
Food and Nutrition Program. 
The second grant of $lO,OOO 
is from the U.S. Department 
of Housing and Urban Af- 
fairs and will provide hous- 
ing counseling services to 
home buyers, homeowners 
and renters. 

Both programs will serve 
eligible residents in Huron, 
Lapeer, Sanilac and Tuscola 
counties. 
“The Human Development 

Commission leads the way in 
providing vital social ser- 
vices for residents of the 
Thumb, and I’m very 
pleased it is receiving this 
grant to continue such good 
work,’’ Barcia said. 

The $31,358 grant will be 
used to implement the Rural 
N.E.E.D. (Nutrition, Educa- 
tion, Empowerment and De- 
livery) program. 

Goals ot the program are to 
coordinate a database f 
&ea food pantries to avoid 
waste of food, provide edu- 
cational information to :se- 
niors about nutrition, and set 
up outreach services to 
people with chronic food 
needs, including the elddtly, 
low-income residents, 
women and children. 
“The second grant will fbnd 

HDC’s home counseling 
vice, which assists peagjL 
with questions and conc@s 
about renting or buy$@ a 
home,” Barcia said.” 0.: 

Thumb Burner Se 
your new furnace 

or your old furnace tuned up 
before the cold winter hits. 

CALL TO DAY! 
*! 

. . 7  

I .  

) I  WE HAVE A 24 HR. SERVICE DEPARTMENT 
a ‘a 

Energy Efficient 
Gas & Oil 
Repairs on most makes Licensed Contractor 

Duct Work 

C A D I L L A C  @ 

CREATING A HIGHER STANDARD TM 

1995 CADICCAC SEDAN DEVILLE 
DeVille Federal Emissions - Heated front seats 4.9 liter V-8 SPFI engine *Auto. transmission 

wloverdrive *Chrome wheels - License plate front mount provision Leather seating area 
*DeVille Option Package B Neutral shale leather *Calypso green 

24 MO. 
LEASE 

00 ‘479 PER MO. + TAX 

1995 CADILLAC ELOORAOO 
Eldorado Power lumbar support- 50-State Emissipns 4.6L V.8 DOHC Northstar engine *Auto. 

transmission w/overdrive - Chrome wheels Sport interior License plate front mount provision 
Leather seating area Neutral shale leather Calypso green 

24MOm 
LEASE.. . . . . . . . . . , . e 

00 $499 PERMO. + TAX 

FIRST MONTH’S LEASE PAYMENT $499.00, PLUS $550.00 REFUNDABLE SECURITY DEPOSIT PLUS $2667.00 
DOWN PAYMENT FOR A TOTAL OF $3716.00 DUE AT LEAS€ SIGNING. Tax. license. title fees and insurance 
extra. GMAC must approve lease. Example based on $41,138 MSRP. including destination charge. Monthly 
payment is based on 8 capitalized cost of $36.645.00. Your monthly payment may k higher or lower. Total 
of monthly payment$ i6 $1 1,976.M. Paymentr may be slightly higher in Alabama, Arhanus. California. New 
York. Texas and Virginia. Option to purchase at lease end for $24,588.80. Lessee pays for encersive wear 
and tear and use. A miloage charge of $.lS/mile applies over 24.000 milec. See your padciprting dealor 
for qualification details. 

1995 CADILLAC SEVILLE SCS 

FIRST MONTH’S LEASE PAYMENT $479 00, PLUS $525.00 REFUNDABLE SECURITY DEPOSIT PLUS $2576.00 
DOWN PAYMENT fOR A TOTAL OF $358000 DUE AT LEASE SIGNING. Tax. license. title fees and insurance 
erlra. GMAC must approve lease. Example based on $38,062 MSRP. including destination chrrp.  Monthly 
payment is  based on a capitalized cost of $35.425.00. Your monthly payment m y  be higher or lower. Total 
01 rnonlhly payments is  $1 1.496.00. Payments may be slightly higher in Alabama, Arkansas, California. New 
York. Tekas and Virginia. Option to purchase at lease end for $24.939,20. Lessee pays for excessive weir 
and tear and use, A milsa~s charge of $.lS/mile applies over 24.000 miles. See your participating dealer 
lor qualilication delails. 

Seville SLS - Power lumbar support 50-State Emissions Heated front seats 4.6L V.8 OOHC 
Northstar engine *Auto. transmission w/overdrive Chrome wheels -Sport interior Leather 
seating area *Neutral shale leather *Dark cherry 

1994 CADILLAC SEDAN DEVILLE 
- DeVille Federal Emissions - 4.9 liter V-8 SPFl engine -Auto. transmission wloverdrive Chrome 
wheels Leather seating area DeVille Option Package B Neutral leather Calypso green 

24 Mom 
LEASE I 

00 “399 PERMO. t TAX 

FIRST MONTH’S LEASE PAYMENT $33Y.W. PLUS $425.00 AEFUNOABLE SECURITY DEPOSIT PLUS $2819.00 
DOWN PAYMENT FOR A TOTAL OF $3643.00 DUE AT LEASE SIGNING. Tax. license, title fees and insurance 
extra GMAC inust approve lease. Eaarnple based on $36.023 MSRP. including destination charge. Monthly 
payment is  based on a capitalized cost of $33,565 00. Your monthly payment may be higher or lower. Tolal 
ot inonthly payments is $9,576.00. Payments may be slightly higher in Alabama, Arkansas. California, New 
York. Teras and Virginia Option to purchase at lease end for $26.152.70. Lessee pays for excessive wear 
and tear and use, A niilerge charge of $ 15/rn1le applies over 24.000 miles. See your participating dealer 
tor qualification details. 

24 MO. 
LEASE.. . . 

00 ‘549 PERMO. t TAX 

FIRST MONTHS W E  PAYMENT $549.00, PLUS $600 00 REFUNDABLE SECURW DEWSIT PLUS $2702 00 
DOWN PAYMENT FOR A TOTAL OF $3851.00 DUE AT LEASE SIGNING. Tax, licenre, title fees and insurance 
extra. GMAC must approve Iease. Example based on $44.973 MSRP. including doctination charge. Monthly 
pnyment is bawd on a C8pbliZad cost of $39,960.00. Your monthly payment may be higher or lower. Total 
of monthb payrnenb is $13,176.00. P8ymenb may b. slightty higher in Alabama. Arkanus. California. Now 
York Texas and Virginia. Option to purchase at I r a n  end tor $30,176.88. Lessee pays for rxce~sive wear 
and tear and use. A mileage charge of $.lWmiIe applies over 2 4 . W  mileg See your paacipating dealer 
for qualification details. 

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE WE-ARE 
OPEN FOR SALES & SERVICE 

ON SATURDAY FROM 9 A.M.-5 P.M. 1 I 
CfiDlllfiC-GEO 

700 N. STATE ST. CAR0 PH. 673-2171 
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Students attend 
prayer session 
Wednesday morning, Sept. 

2 1,  at 7 a.m. over 75 students 
gathered at the Cass City 
Middle School flag polc to 
pray for their families, 
school, city and nation. It 
was noted by Family Life 
Radio that Cass City had the 
biggest response from area 
school districts who reported 

tiated, student organized and 
student led. Each year more 
and more teenagers are get- 
ting together who want to see 
God do a mighty work as 
they commit themselves, 
their friends, their school and 
the nation to Christ. 

The effort is base.d on the 
local school campus, be- 

in. 
This was all part of an in- 

ternational event to spend 
time in prayer to God for the 
many needs present at this 
time. Spokepersons said the 
teenagers of Cass City are 
taking a stand to do their p a t  
to draw the families of this 

cause this is where ihe battle 
for kids’ minds and hearts is 
hardest fought and often lost, 
and it is where youth spend 
most of their time. Young 
people are often inundated 
with ungodly philosophy and 
values, according to spokes- 

OVER 75 STUDENTS gathered at the Cass City Middle 
School for the SYATP rally. Cass city reportedly had the 

school, community and na- 
tion to a right relationship 
with God. 

spiritual warfare. 

Small groups of teenagers 
have long gathered on their 

schoo’ 1990 the campuses first organized to pray+ “See In 
you at the pole ~ a l i y ”  

:ELKLAND TOWNSHIP fire fighters responded to a vehicle 
:fire Thursday morning at the corner of Cemetery and Kelly 
:$oads. The 1978 Ford pickup, owned by William Brown, 

(SYATP) established a legacy 
that continues to build upon 
the momentum of prayer. I t  
has grown from a local gath- 
ering, to a national event, and 
this year tu an international 
event. Teenagers gathered to 
pray that God will move back 
into their families, their 
schools, their cities and their 

:Cass , I  City, was a total loss. 

Bad Axe High School will 
host a College Night pro- 
gram Monday, Oct. 3. The 
evening will begin with a 
general session in the gym at 
7:OO p.m. for late announce- 

U 

preservation, both coming in 
late September, and regretful 
acceptance of the resigna- 
tions of Anne Scott and Su- 
san Russell. 

appliances at the she1ter;Vic- 
tinis of Crime Acts (VOCA) 
training session in  Lansing 
and a teleconference on do- 
mestic violence and family 

Members of the Thumb 
Area Assault Crisis Center 
Advisory Council learned at 
their Septcrnber meeting that 
United Wav of Tuscola 

- I  . .  

MSU Extension sets 
Toronto tour Nov. 11 gin at 7: 15. 

Approximately 50 repre- 
sentatives of Michigan col- 
leges and universities will be 
on hand to answer questions 
and provide information 
about their respective 
sc hods. 

The annual convention of 
the 8th District Woman’s 
Christian Temperance Union 
will be held at the Caro 
Nazarene Church, 1494 
Purdy Rd., Thursday, Oct, 6. 

‘The 8th District inc udes 
unions from Huron, anilac, 
Tuscola, Saginaw, St. Clair 
and Lapeer counties. The 
business meeting will con- 
vene at 2 p.m: 

The evening service at 7 

s’ 

p.m. will feature the Rev. 
Dale Byers of the Cass City 
Baptist Church. He will 
speak on “Suicide Aware- 
ness,” Pastor Byers had a son 
commit suicide and out of 
that tragedy have come semi- 
nars and a book, “Suicide - 
How God Sustained a Fam- 
ily.” 

The WCTU opens the 
evening service to the pub- 
lic. All ministers and 
churches are invited. 

Other action at the Sept. 7 
session included: the an- 
nouncement of the hiring of 
Diane Santhany, group facili- 
tator at the Center, who is 
already actively interacting 
with support groups in  Hu- 
ron, Lapeer, Sanilac and 
Tu sc 01 a c ou n t i e s ; ann ou nce - 
ment of grants received from 
the Janks Foundation and 
MSHDA for furniture and 

:in a tour slated for N&. 11: 
i13. 
- The tour gives travelers the 
Jkeedom to visit Toronto’s 
downtown area for shopping, 
xheater and fun. Theater pro- 
ductions to choose from in- 
klude the famous “Phantom 

’ the Opera,” “Miss 
ugon,” “Show Boat,” and 
hazy for You.” The trip 
so includes a tour of the 

rair. 
Tour price includes round 

trip transportation, 2 nights’ 
lodging, guided tour of the 
“Sky Dome” and admission 
to the Royal Wintcr Agricul- 
ture Fair. 

Regis t r a t i o r 1  dead l i  ne i s 
Oct. 1 1 .  Cost per person 
(double occupancy) is 
$15 1 .IN. Other special rates 
arc available. 

To register, visit or call 

4 - 1  L -I. 

NEED A NEW CAR OR TRUCK? 

& E !  i““ 
“OVER 200 NEW & USED CARS 

AND TRUCKS AVAIIABLE” 

“Every Make and Model” 

Thinking of selling your home? 

Ron Ouvry 
Home 872-2495 For Your Best Buy 

Business 269-978 1 CALL M E  TODAY! 

We’ve got Problems! Problems! Problems! 
Our list of buyers is greater than our list of sellers. 

For fast action, please list with us! 
Call Holly or Sue 

Real Estate Professionals 
at Kelly & Co. Realty 

for a Free Market Analysis 

TOMATO TREE - Cass City area resident Fred Burk re- 
ports this giant cherry tomato plant, measuring 12 feet long 
and 10 1/2 feet wide, sprouted on its own in a former chicken 
yard at his Robinson Road home. “It just keeps growing 
and growing,” he sa . 

JJ’s DIFFERENCES - 
4 LIFETIME WARRANTY 

FREE DELIVERY 
GUARJIfjTEED LOWEST PRICE T ’ .  

C .  

BAR STOOLS 
FUTONS 

: + Osentoski Realty having sold our home, we will sell at public auction at the location, 6 1/2 
:;:+ miles south of Cass City on S. Cemetery Road, or 1 mile east of Deford, 1/2 mile south on  
a: 4 :  S. Cemetery Road to 465 S. Cemetery Road, the following list of personal property on: 
+ >  

SATURDAY, OCT. 1 1994 
. I  

c 1  
- 4  * ,  

* *  
4 .  

I .  

e.: & I  .i Commencing at 1 2 : ~  noon 
”. I - .  ‘ I  NOTE: This is quality furniture in like new condition. 

Lunch Wagon on the grounds 
* I  

:: B I  :I 26 inch Panasonic color TV w/remote New nat. gas water heater 
. ‘I‘ Matching living room couch & loveseat New ceiling fan (white) 

6 oak coffee & end tables, brass trim Gas chain saw 
, -‘ :. .I Brass display units w/glass shelves Gas leaf blower 
:. , .  . Living room couch (green) Sears 3/8 inch drill 
:” , Oak library table wldrawer Sears washer & dryer (elect.) 
, -: .. Hanging swag lamp Sears circular saw 
.’ Pig motif canister set Gas grill 
; Pig motif salt 8. pepper shakers 3.5 hp lawn rnow6r (1 yr. old) 

, . .  .* Pig motif cups & plates Tow straps 
~, Pig motif wall clock (frying pan style) Large vise 
: ’ Pig motif towels & hot pads 1 ton chain fall 

~ Brass bakers rack Orange hunting clothing 
. I Brass & glass tea cart U p r igh t freezer 
. .  Dining room set (oak & glass) Small ref rigerator 

r .  -. -. Misc. cups & saucers (some old) Softballs 
New sinks a :  ’ :  3 pc. bedroom set 

-: 7 :  Wood rocking chair Cassette playerlrecorder 
Cedar chest Car speakers (large) 

, , Triple dresser & mirror Car amplifier { 180 watt) :* I .  . I  :. Day bed (white & brass) New shower controls 
Craft items 

:* . 4  :. Stuffed animals Binoculars 
:* . .  Clocks Misc. tools 

I ,  I .  Portable radios Mail box 
+ .  ~ - Stained glass supplies Garage door opener (motor) 
‘ ‘ d  Stained glass wall items Fifth wheel trailer hitch 
~ “ I  4 Wicker baskets Step bumper trailer hitch :::: Tool boxes with tools Automotive waxes & misc. 
:a I *  : *  Brand new faucets (Delta 8. Epic) Lamps 

1 ”  : Ceramic tile (new) Plywood storage cabinet 
*. I ,  I. Claw foot piano stool OTHER ITEMS TOO NUMEROUS TO MENTION 
; 1 4  ;: Pots & pans (Germany) GUN: Remington 12 gauge, pump, model 1187, 
,I , ’  shot 8 times. 

I .  

.: Day bed mattress & linens 

t i  

, I - ’  

. *  ‘ 
I’,’ JERRY &: DREW ALLEY owners 1 *  
4 .  

I I  

, .  1 -* 4 

I -  

a .  Oseriloski Aucliori Set vice LirClmu.nH!s m n c l  L Y i h i  a c l l r q  .I ..I. mpmnll er,lr 
,“# ”l*<rn.  , I O  p”r.nl.** 01 11.b11~1,., P m n ,  C.IICII, , \ 1 1 1 1 7 1  I357 

. . . . . . . . . .. . - - -. . 

1 S8aU.mar.il “*ad. ,I .”I. 

lake p r , I * r ~ ~ *  o w ,  
p,.n,.o “,.ll,, 

0 5 t r i  I O ’ , K I  
.I,ClIOI, 51 1 r ” l C f  

.. . - 

\[ g l c l l *  I( I . .  ‘: . .  : I 
7 t  .I I ,  .* la@!! -1, 

4 .. J, YOU11 AUC’I’lONEEIIS X 1 l I I )  S l ’O‘[ ’ ’ l ’ I~~l~S:  h1:ii.l in. 1 ) : i v i t l  K. 1ii.n O s t ~ i i l o ~ k i  St I ) o n  hloort! 
-’ Xtrctin1lcet-s ; ~ j i r l  ulvt-lts : i (*t i i ig i is  , + ; i l ( *  : I ~ ( , I I I +  o i i l s )  i i r i r l  : I ~ S L I I I I ( ~  iio p \ i : i r i ~ i i i t ~ ~ * <  01’ 1 i i i i ) i I i l i v s .  

RECLINERS 
GLIDERS 

0 

1820 W. Cam Rd. ( M a l )  
1 Mile West Of Cam Ph. 672-2611 HWRS: 

Mon. 10-8,Tues. &Wed. 10-6,Thurs. 10-8, Fri. 10-6, Sat. 10-6, Sun. 12-5 
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CALL 872-2010 TO PUT AN ACTION AD TO WORK ' 

new this year; 2 man post 
hole digger with 1 0  auger; 
Duracraft bench band saw; 
2500 watt generator. Can 

contact 5:30 at 7 872-4129 days from or 7:30- leave 
nies sage. 2-9-28- I 

FOR SALE - 12' aluminum 
fishing boat. 2 swivel seat. 

PAGE FOURTEEN 

40 Acres - no buildings - choice building site - ' 
$28,000. Terms. 1 mile off M-81 highway. 

B.A.Calka, Realtor I 1 

6306 W. Main St., Cass City, Michigan 48726 

3-9-28-2. Telephone: 872-3555 
i 

Tasting 

-~ 

P L U M B I N G - H E AT I N G 

seminar 
sluted 

. .  I 

Y 

Sales 
Transit (non-business) rates, IO ( Automotive 1 f General General words or less, $ 1  S O  each inser- RealEstate ' I For Sale 

/ Merchandise J Merchandise ) 
FOR SALE - 1983 Olds, 
cutlass SupremeV-6 door, 

tjon; additional words 8 cents 
each. Three weeks for the price 
of 2 - cash rate. Save money bv 

The Family and Commu- 
nity Education Council from 
Michigan State University 
Extension invites area resi- 
dents to join them at their Fall 
Kick off program - aTasting 
Seminar of Culinary Herbs, 
Oct. 5 at 7 p.m. at the MSU 
Extension office, 362 Green 
Street, Caro. 

Lillian Kuperus of Cass 
City, a graduate home econo- 
mist of Bowling Green State 
University, Ohio, will be 
conducting the seminar. She 
is currently attending Zona 
Spray's Cooking School, one 
of 15 cooking schools 
throughout the world and 
accredited by the Interna- 
tional Association of Culi- 
nary Professionals. 

Kuperus will demonstrate 
how to become a profes- 
sional in your own kitchen 
using techniques and con- 
cepts of 10 of the most com- 
monly used herbs. Partici- 
pants will have the opportu- 
nity to sample distinctive fla- 
vors and blends from appe- 
tizers to desserts. Cost of the 
program is $2 per person at 
the door, 

More information is avail- 
able by contacting Betty 
Pattullo at 673-5999 (ext. 
228). 

LARGE GARAGE SALE - 
1 day only, 112 off day, Sept, 
29, 8 a.m. to 7 p.m. Many 
new i tems added. Baby, chil- 
dren, adult clothing, dishes, 
furniture, books, toys. 4 
miles south of Cass City on 
Cemetery Road to 
Deckerville Road, 2 miles 
east to Crawford Road, 2 
miles south to Mushroom 
Road, then 1/2 mile east. 

14-9-28- 1 

SHARP - 4 bedroom GL . 
try home with garage. Ned! 
remodeled, on 112 acre 
Paved road. Ubly Schools 
B914. $54,900. Call Paul 
8 10-346-2700 or 346-21 32 
Red Carpet Realty. 3-9r7-4 

SALE - water conditioners, 
' 24,000 grain softeners, 

$600. Salt free conditioners 
available. Also iron and sul- 
fur removal. Repair on all 
makes. Call for free analy- 
sis. Paul's Pump Repair, 673- 
4850 or 800-745-485 1 .  

2-5-5-tf 

;il enclosing cash with mail order;. 
Rates for display want ad on ap- 
plication. 

new tires. Call after 7 p.m. 
872-3340. Runs well, $800, 
make offer. 1-9-28- 1 NO 

HUNTING 111 Ill 
CHOLESTEROL too high'? 
Lower it with Heart-Flo fish- 
oil capsules. Available at 
Coach Light Pharmacy. 

2-9-21-2 
Automotive 1 1986 FORD VAN in excel- 

lent condition, good tires, 
runs good, make offer. Call 
872-3315, ask for Bud. 

1 -7-7-tf 

1982 DODGE B-250 Maxi 
Van, $750. Call 872-2 195. 

1-9-28-2 
SIGNS 111 FOR SALE - AKC Brittany 

pups, liver and white, cham- 
pion blood lines, first shots 
and wormed. Ready week of 
Sept. 25. 683-2910. 

2-9-2 1-3 

ForRent .I 
1986 SUZUKI 250 Quad 
racer. Good condition. 
$1,475 or best. 872-4192. 

2-8-24-6 

1991 DODGE Cummins 
turbo diesel; 1984 Buick Re- 
gal. Call after T O O ,  872- 
2058. 1 -9- 14-3 

Your choice 

2-color 
Red 81 Black 
4 for$I  

35C each 

CASS CITY Mini Stor? "- 
now renting 20 new untts P I  

new building. Call 872- 
4-5 - 1<9- t 1 REPAIRING KIRBY vacu- f RealEstate 3917. 

ums since 1977. We use 
genuine Kirby parts. All 
used Rirbys sold with 1 year 
warranty. Need paper bags, 
belts, shampoo? Will ship 
parcel post. Free estimates 
on all repairs. Daniel Mess- 
ing, 269-7562 - evenings 

2-7-27- 1 1 479-6543. 

FOR SALE -AKC registered 
male Labrador puppies , 
Ready Sept.25. $150. Call 
872-3352. 2-9-14-3 

-~ ~ 

FOR SALE - Franklin 35 
foot Deluxe travel trailer. 
Awning, screen room, air 
conditioning , excel 1 en t con - 
dition. Call 872-2436. 

2-9-14-3 

1983 F 150 CLUB cab, new, 
300 L6, needs work. $1,200. 
872-41 59, leave message. 

1-9-28- 1 

For Sale FOR RENT I Luxury apart- 
ment, h, carpet, one bedroom, cable, extra in C ~ O .  s!oor- 

age, utility room. $345. Call 
Tom now, 781-3351. ' 

4-8-$- tf - 

FOR RENT - Masonic 
Temple Refreshment Hall - 

8 MILES NORTHEAST of 
C a s  City - 3,'4 acre, comes 
with a very well maintained 
home, breezeway and at- 
tached 2 1/2 car garage. New 
carpet and windows in past 

~ 3 years, 24'x14' barn with 
FOR SAI,E - Luxair oil fur- concrete. Also 12'xlO' stor- 
nace, very good working age shed. $52,000. Call Janet 
condition. John Deere 20' at Coldwell Banker, (810) 

clers; I 6' set of harrows; New 
Holland silage blower. Jerry 
Decker. 872-3 167. 2-9-28- 1 

FOR SALE -Tread mill, $50 
or  best offer; electric Olyrn- 

parties, dinners, meetings. 
NO alcoholic beverages. 
cdl Lynwood Lapeer, 872- 

harrows on wheels with lev- 664-8524. 3-9-74 3191. 4-4-34f 

RUDD ELECTRIC like new 
hot water heater, 50 gal., $75. 
872- 5034. 2-8-3 1-4 FOR SALE - '81 Diesel Olds 

88 car, power windows and 
doors, new tires and muffler. 
1979 Chcvy 3/4 ton pickup 
with cap, new tires and muf- 
fler, runs good. Call 375- 
4087. 1-9-2 1-3 

~~ ~ 

FOR SALE - 22' 1977 mini  
motor home on Ford chassis; 
brown plaid sofa and chair. 
872-3843. 2-9- 14-3 

~~ 

FRIGIDAIRE white electric 
stove, 2 ovens, excellent con- 
dition, 40 inches wide. Ask- 
ing $50. Forester wood stove 
for sale, air tight, good con- 
dition, $200. 872-5 192. 

2-9-2 1-3 

Black Ink 

SHAKLEY PRODUCTS in 
harmony with nature. Leave 
your name and number, we 
will get back with you. Se- 
nior citizens discount. 1-800- 
884-3588. 2-9-14-6 

2 5 ~  each 
1989 RS Cavalier, white with 
black bra, loaded, great gas 
mileage, low miles, asking 
$4,500 or best offer. Call af- 
ter 6 p.ni. 872-4693. 

1-9-28-3 

$8,500.00 COMPLETE FRONT storm 
door corn bination, 36", 
white. New steel fire door, 
32", undercoat only. 872- 
3393, 2-9-2 1-3 

FOR SALE - Storage barns, 
all sizes, horse barns, dag 
houses, craft items. Will 
deliver. Call 872-2608. Sec- 

10 ACRES some woods - I I I  
pia 2 195. typewriter, $15. Call 872- 300' off blacktop road - 

Choice building site. Will sell on 
ond house south of Hurds 

Harold Deering. 
USED-BY-U all Corner Rd. off Css City Rd. 

City. 2-9-7-4 
donations. Main St., Cass 

2-9-23 -tf 

I Professional and Business I 
I DIRECTORY I 
1 I 
---------------e 

ACCOUNTANTS PHYSICIANS 

Anderson, Tuckey, 
ernhardt & Co., P.C. 

Certified Public Accountants 
Gary Anderson, CPA (Caro) 

Robert Tuckey, CPA (Cass City) 
Jerry Bernhardt, CPA (Caro) 
Thomas Doran, CPA (Caro) 

lerie Jamieson, CPA (Cass City) 
715 E. Frank St., Cam, MI 

Phone 673-31 37 
6261 Church St., Cass Cily MI 

Phone 872-3730 
---c---- 

COUNSELING -------- 

TERRENCE 
CHERWIN, D.O. 

Orthopaedic Surgeon 
Joint Replacement 

Sports Medicin e 
Hand Surgery 

Arthroscopic Surgery 
204 E. Mundy 

Bay City 
89210099 

Chimp ra cto r 
5986 E. Cass City Rd 

Cass City (M-81) 
Phone 872-4241 

600 aid Fender, amplifier, 
Sears, Silvertonc, Sunn 
sound equipment, antique 
buffet with table and 6 chairs, 
picnic table with umbrella, 
park bench, pool table - 
equipped, mini Indy race car, 
tools, household and ma- 
sonry, hospital bcd - single 
size, 8 foot tables - sturdy, 
deep freeze, antique trunk, 
almost new wrap around 
couch set, country blue with 
queen sofa bed and 2 reclin- 
ers, old set of dishes (accom. 
6), with extras, new winter 
coats, man's large, woman's 
medium, Kirby vacuum - all 
rebuilt, wheelchair, 2 barbe- 
cue pits, large and small, 
rocking chairs, commercial 
waffle iron, canning jars, in- 
terior doors (different sizes), 
overhead projector, toaster 
own, drop leaf table (old), 
new nature books, brand new 
men's and women's golf 
clubs with leather case and 
covers, short car trailer, long 

40Acres with 65'xllO' feedlot, well and electric, south: 
20 acres tiled. A-337 I DOYOU HAVE A 

D R I NKl NG P ROBLEM? 
ALCOHOLICS 
ANONYMOUS 

MEETINGS 
AND AL-ANON 

Every Frlday Evening - 8:OO p.m. 

FOR SALE BY OWNER 
2 acres of commercial property with 

old time country store on lot. 
Across from the Nazarene Church 

Good Shepherd Lutheran Church 
Cass City 

HEALTH CARE 
--I------ 

IC-.---- 

HOON K. ' 

JEUNG, M.D. 
Surgeon 

Specialist in Stomach 
and Bowel Problems 

9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Daily 
Saturday - 9 to 12 noon 

Closed Thursday 
6230 Hospital Drive 
Cass City, MI 48726 

872-3490 
Phone 872-461 1 

on M-81 in Ellington. 
IMMEDIATE CARE 

CLINIC 
for non-emergency health care 

$40 fee 
Including physician's fee 

and clinic room 

872-2040 
Land Contract Available 

$9,000 or best offer or will consider trade. 

38 Acres, 3 bedroom home, 24x32 pale barn, 16 

40 Acres close to Cass City, several building 

36Acres more or less, Kingston area, 40x80 pole barn, 

338 

great hu n ti ng/recreation, A-24 1 

woods, 22 into soybeans. OW-54 

I I I NO appointment usually I 
Find the Service or Product Act i 0 n G u i d e I I Wee~en,",~~~s~ry,ridays to 1 
You Need in This. . . . 6 a.m. Mondays, and holidays 

HILLS & DALES 
GENERAL HOSPITAL 

872-2 1 2 1 I S E RVlC E D I RECTO RY - - - - - - - - 
S.H. Raythatha, M.D. 

Dr. Ray 
Total Family Care 

4672 Hill St. 
Cass City 

Phone 872-501 0 
Office Hours: Mon.-Fri. 8-5 

I N.Y.Yun, M.D. 1 
Physician & Surgeon 

Office Hours: 
MOL-Fri. - 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Thurs. - Closed 
Sat. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
6232 Hospital Drive 

Cass City 
Office 872-4733 
Res. 872-4257 

--.I------ 

PODIATRISTS 

NORTHEASTERN 
FOOT CLINIC 
Dr. Judi Ecker 

Dr. Thomas Bobrowski 
"YOUR FAMILY FOOT 

CARE CENTER" 
4672 Hill St., Cass City 

072-4327 or 
3592 Center, Essexville 

-------- 

895-8594 

car trailer. Call 872-4820. 
2-9-28- 1 INSURANCE 

c-.c----  [I-]/ f Household mA-1 

APPLIANCE & 
REFRIGERATION 

FLOWERS Allen Witherspoon 
New England Lde 
NEL Growth Fund 
NEL Equity Fund 

NEL Income Fund 
Money Market Serl8S 

Phone 872-2321 

Sales @ T I  Buds and Blossoms Tuff -Kote Dinol 
4u to mot ive Rust Proofing 

Systems &Waxing 
RUMMAGE 

SALE 
Cass City 

Presbyterian Church 

9 a.m. - 5 p.m. 
GOOD VALUES 

Oct. 6 & 7 

14-9-28-2 

GARAGE SALE - Couch, 
antique tables, gym pad with 
weights, sewing machine, 
kids' clothes, 2 computers, 
toys and much more.  
Wednesday, from 4 t o  8 p.m., 
Thursday, 9 to 5 and Friday 
9 to 5 .  4290 North Lamton 
Rd., Deford. 14-9-28-1 

I Flowers - Plants - Balloons I 
Sandy Tierney, Owner 

4546 Leach St., C a s  City, MI 48726 SERVICE I 872-1101 

[ 4615 Oak Cass city I -------- I Gravel Guards 
Running Boards 

40 Acres tiled every 50 ft., 6 bedroom home, large liv-;: " 

rage - 2 car. OW-59 
ing and dining room, full basement, hip roof barn, 

qock Kote Stone Chip Protection OPTOMETRlST 

3R. PAUL A. GOLSCH 
Optometrist 

Glasses in about an hour 
Eye examinations 
Glasses & Contact lenses 
Outside prescriptions filled 
Vision insurance plans welcome 

-------- I Phone 269-9585 
Wdshcrs, Dryers, 

Dishwashers, Microwaves, 
Stoves, Rcfrigerators, 

All Brands 
7 17 1 Severance Kd. 

Cass City Muffler 
& Brake Shop 

Blaine deBeaubien, Prop. 
Phone 872-2251 

6597 Main, Cass City 

Mufflers - S m s  - Lifetime Guarantees 
Minor engine repairs - Certilled Mechanic 

827 Van Dyke, Bad Axe I 
APPLIANCE 

SALES & SERVICE 
FULL LINE OF MAGIC CHEF 

KITCHEN AND LAUNDRY 

WINDOW CLEANING I 
SUPREME 

WINDOW CLEANING 
100 W. Huron Ave., 
Bad Axe 269-9759 

461 N. State St., Caro 673-8155 
25 S. Elk. Sanduskv 648-3354 

Storms - Screens - Windows 
Janitorial Service Floors 
Eaves & Gutters Cleaned 
Hi-Riser Service & Rental 

Estimates on Commercial, 
Residential & Industrial Work 

Complete Insurance Coverage 
Security Services Available 

1120 Gratiot, Saginaw 
Call 790-7609 

Fuelgas 
Junction of M-53 and M-81 

Cass City 
Phone 872-21 61 

---c-c-- 

PHYSICIANS 
------e- 

~~ 

BALU, K., M.D. 
Obstefn'cian & Gynecologist 

70 North Elk Street 
Sandusky, MI 48471 

Office Hours: 
Mon., Tues., Thurs., Fri. 

9 to 5 - Appointments only 
After Hours Call 

Phone (810) 648-4733 

(81 0)  648-3770 

24-HR. SERVICE 

6 i E a  CASS CITYTIRE 
Hercules and Cooper 

TIRES 
9 Tire repair 

9 Alignments Mufflers 
Brakes 411 Changes 
Cerlrfred Mechanrc 

4 bedroom home, large rooms, 24x24 family room,: 
open staircase, windows, wiring, plumbing, roof all up-: 
dated. This home would be great for large family - 1: 
acre. OW-58 I GARAGE SALE - Saturday, 

Oct. 1 ,  9:OO-2:00, 6339 
Brenda Dr. Clothes - infants', 
boys', girls', maternity, toys, 
household items and boy's 
bike. 14-9-28- 1 

PLUMBING 8 HEATING, INC 
6528 Main 

Phone 872-5084 
Pigeon Phone 453-3531 To Place An Ad 

in The 

Action Guide 

Call 872-201 0 

I DAN'S POWER & STOVE 

Fi re places, Stoves , Chimneys 
Chimney Sweeping & Repairs 

STIHL Chainsaws & 
Outdoor Power Equipment 

Sales & Service 
6509 Main, Cass City 

Phone 872-31 90 

3-FAMILY garage sale - rain 
or shine, in shed. Furniture, 
toys, baby stuff and miscel- 
laneous. 4892 N. Cedar Run 
Road, Cass City. Friday, 
Sept. 30. 9 a.m.-7 p.m., Sat- 
urday, Oct. I ,  9 a.m.-4 pm. 

14-9-28- I 

Edward Scollon, D.V.M. 
Ve fe rin aria n 
Farm and 

Pet Animals 
Phone 872-2935 

4849 N. Seeger St., Cass City 

TO PLACE 
AN AD IN THE 

PROFESSIONAL 
DIRECTORY 

CALL 872-201 0 

Warju's Flooring 
Carpet, Pad, Labor 
1227 E, Caro Rd. 
Cam, MI 48723 
51 7-672-3563 

f=l AND AUCTIONEERXNG 
Lou*L Call 872-4377 3-9-28- 1 O~POAlU#TV I 
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CALL 872-2010 TO PUT AN ACTION AD TO WORK FOR YOU 

~ - ._. 

Sebewaing Road. Phone 
269-7909. 8- 12- 13-tf , ~~ 

Francis Builders 
New Homes or 

Remodeling, Roofing, 
Siding, Barns, Pole 

Buildings 
Licensed and Insured 
Phone 872-2921 

or 872-4696 
S-2-26-tf 

C Services 3 ( Work Wanted 1 Services C Services 1 Notices For Rent Notices Notices 

LOST - tri-colored collie, 3 
years old, lost in the 
Elmwood and Cemetery 
Road area, trained therapy 
dog, Call 269-8393, after 6 
p.111.872-4644. 5-9-28-3 

~ \ / 

John's Small LOVING MOTHER of one 
will do baby-sitting in 
Deford area. Lots of toys and 
fun .  References. Call 872- 
5686. 12-9-28-3 

Interior & Exterior 
Painting f-Ga-, 

A*LmLm IMPROVEMENT 

Certified Master Mechanic 
Computer AI ignmen ts 

Computer Balance 
& Rotation 

Front End parts 
Shocks dk Struts 

Brakes 
Tune-ups 

Free Estimates 
All  your tire needs from 

wheelbarrows 
to tractors 

See us today 

WATER PUMP, Water Well, 
Water Softener Service, All 
types repaired. Rebuilt 
pumps. 10% discount on 
new pumps and tanks. In- 
home emergency service. 
Call 673-4850 or 800-745- 
485 1 anytime. 8-6-5-tf 

'ROOMMATE WANTED - 
'male/female. Lovely 3 bed- 
'room, 2 bath home, fully fur- 

' nished, washer, dryer, etc., 
''garage. 4 miles east of Cass 
City. $300 a month, first and 

-'-last negotiable, plus 1/2 of 
electricity. Available Oct. I .  
Leave message (517)  872- 

, 2850. 4-9-2 1 -tf 

Engine Repair 
ALL MAKES & MODEL: 

6426 Cass City Rd. 
Cass City, Mich, 

Across from stockyard 
Reasonable Rates 

Mon.-Fri. 6 - 9 p.m. 
Sat. 9 a m ,  - 5 p.m. 

872-3866 
8-6-22- 

Factory Outlet 
Vinyl windows 

Roofing, Siding, and 
New Construction 

"FREE ESTIMATES" 
51 7-672-2600 

1-800-826-2801 
5-7-2 1 -ti 

Card of Thanks > 
&DRUNK DRIVING# 

Is a short drive 
WE WOULDLIKE to thank 
our relatives and friends for 
the flowers, food, money and 
the visitations at the funeral 
home at the time of our great 
loss. The Janet Faye 
Sherman family. 13-8-28-1 

Ross Kraft 
Cass City,Mich. 

(517) 872-3601 

Licensed Residential 
Builder 

Ronold E. Palmer 
Builder 
Insured 

Remodeling * Roofing 
Siding * Windows 

Pole Buildings 
2805 Crawford Rd. 

Cass City, Mich. 48726 

r 

( 5  17) 872-4780 
8 -9- 3 0- t f 

v I Whitman I ! home worth 
$1,000 + I. BEDROOM apartment - 

, single occupancy only, $150 
- per month plus security. All 

utilities except gas. 872- 
3471. 4-9-28- 1 

f Well Drilling 
4 andpump ; 

I 
I 

4 ! 

insurance rates? 
Please Don't 

Drive Drunk!!! 

FHA, VA MORTGAGE 
LOANS AVAILABLE 

Also Conventional Loans 

y o u r ~ h m  m n g q e P  
CAR0 FINANCIAL 

SERVICES 

'at U-FpfqaLuk~yOufor 

Fasci: 
Soffil 

' Siding 
872-5082 

* Licensed & Insured 
* Guaranteed Workmanship 
* Free Written Estimates 
* Over 15 yrs. Experience 
* Call Jim today 

Thank You! 8-5- 12-tf 

Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 

5- 12- 1 s-tf 

.! BEDROOM APART- 
,MENT for rent, Hillside 
,North Apartments. Kitchen 
ap pl i ances , carpet i n g , 
drapes, air conditioning, stor- 
age, coin-operated laundry. 
2,all 673-8 15 1 . 4-9-28- tf 

EARN EXTRA $1,000 be- 
fore Christmas dernonstrat- 
ing for Christmas Around the 
World and Gifts by House of 

code 4487. Also booking 
catalogs and in home shows. 

Lloyd. 1-800-484-7944 

5-9-2 1-4 

673-8482 I Cass City MuMer 
& Brake 

872-2251/5606 
5-8-31-tf 

"WNY Sweepstakes ! 
Gain the advantage! In- 
crease your percentages of 
winning. CALL 1 -8OO-rn2- 

cago Illinios. 
Immediate Hire Victory 
Expmss (Dayton area), hir- 
ing inexperienced appli- 
cants for OTR drivers. Our 
tuition-free training will have 
you earning in one month. 
1-800-543-5033 for infor- 
mat i o n. 

54621 C.L.I.M.B. InC., Chi- I 1 103 E. Car0 Rd., Car0 
5-6-8- 17 

FOR RENT - The Paint 
Store has a wallpaper 
steamer for easy removal of 
old wallpaper. Call 872- 
2445, 4- 1 1 -2-tf 

~~ 

Smith 
t 1 Simpson Excavating 

Dozer landscaping - All 
types of backhoe work 

House demolition & removal 
Footings - Waterlines - 

Complete septic systems 
Sand - Gravel - Topsoit 

Variety of fi l l  - 
Any size fill job 
FreeEs ti ma tes 
872-4502 

I 

service 1 i t 9 

c 

I 

! 

BINGO - Every Sunday at 
St.  Pancratius Hall, S. 
Seeger, Cass City. Doors 
open 5:OO p.m., games start 
at 5:30. Phone 872-5410. 
Knights of Columbus Coun- 
cil No. 8892. 5-12-31-tf 

( Wanted to Buy ) 

Happy Sweet 16 
Mike Brown 

Classy Cuts Refrigera tion 
and 

Appliance Repair 

.. * 
Notices 

Walk-in hair cuts 

Monday thru Friday 
Saturday 

7 a.m. - 1 p.m. + Gift Certificates 
Available * 

Located in Erla's 
Shoppirig Plaza 

7 a.m. - 9 p.m. ' :FOUND - Set of keys on 
Severance Road. Call 872- 
3543. 5-9-28-3n 

A 8-7-6-tf 
A11 makes and models 
Call 872m3092 

F.E. Franzel 
8-3- 1 5 -tf 

SENIORS' 

Cass City VFW Hall 
'AUTUMN DANCE 

Friday, Sept. 30 
7100 - 11 :OO 
Dennis & His 
Music Makers 

$5.00 per person 
Lunch Served 

5-9-2 1 -2 

Amerlcan Land Lkplda- 
tors: Lots, homesites, ac- 
eragekacant land. For sale 
by owners across the coun- 
try. Call for FREE LIST 
(800) 480-0090 SeIIerS - 1- 
(800) 364-66 12. 

Vacant Land - We buy, sell 
and broker any size parcel, 
anywhere in Michigan. We 
only buy and sell vacant 
land. Krausmann Real Es- 
tate 81 0-391 -4427. 

WANTED - Used couch, 
chair and end tables for col- 
lege student. Call 872-3565. 

6-9-2 1-3 

With love, 
Your family 

5-9-28- 1 
8-1 -23-tf 

Carpet & Upholstery 

*Flood removal 
Don Dohn 

4394 Maple #3 
Cass City 

Phone 872-347 1 8-7- 10-tf 

Thomas Roofing 

LICENSED 
INSURED 
BONDED 

Serving the area 
for 23 years 

872-2970 
Cass City 

CASH - paid for silver coins, 
dimes through silver dollars 
before 1965 - scrap gold - 
dental - rings - etc. The Coin 
Shop. Phone 872-3919. 

6- 10-28-tf 

FOUND - 2 female grey 
stripe tiger cats, 1 young, 1 
older, last Friday i n  high 
school parking lot, 872- 
3142. 5-9-28- 1 

Well Drilling 87mCLASS 
2" to 5" wells 

drilled & repaired 
Pump Sales 
& Service 

(517) 843-5811 
8-9- 15-tf 

"We'd like to get 
snippy with you" 

5-6-29-t 1 
WRIGHT 

HYPNOSIS 
CENTER 

Designed to fit your 
personal needs- 

Stop smoking, lose 
weight, learn to cope 
with stress, illness, 

pain, death, etc. 
3hone M. Louise Wright, 

certified hypnologist- 
h ypnot herapi st. 
S 17-872-4226 

5-9-28-2 

{ To Give Away ) _ .  
I . .  5 1 -YEAR-OLD female BINGO - Every Wednesday 
.:&eks roommate to share ex- night. Open 6:W-early bird 
::penses in nice apartment in 6:30 - regular bingo 7:OO. 
; : Cass City. Phone 872-5314. Post 3644 V W ,  Weaver St. 

5-9-2 1-3 5-2-26-tf 

Postal And Government 
Jobs. $23/hour plus bene- 
fits. No experience, will 
train. To apply call 800- 
886-6640 24 hours. 

FREE PUPPIES - Lab and 
Shepherd mix, 6- weeks-old. 
Also, free kittens. Call 872- 
2538 from 3 to 5 .  7-9-21-3 

MIKA'S CUSTOM 
MOLDINGS 
Hardwood Molding 

Furniture Repair 
Woodworking 

Reproduction Design 
Kiln-Dried Hardwood 

Top Quality Gravel, 
Crush Gravel, Sand, Black 

Dirt, Septic Systems, 
Basements, Driveways, 
and Any Other type of 

Back Hoe Work 
FREE ESTIMATES 

Call John 872-3 149 
LEBIODA 

EXCAVATING 
8-4-28-tf 

VOLUNTEER TUTOR 
TRAINING 
Oct 8 and 15 

Call 872-5406 
9:oo to 3:oo 

to pre-regis ter 
5-9-1 4-4 

Farm Services Homeowners Get Cash 
Qulck for bills, foreclosures, 
land contract payoffs, or any 
mason. Slow or poor credit 
no problem. We buy land 
contracts. Call your finan- 
cial specialist NOW at 
Tamer Mortgage Company. 
NO APPLICATION FEE. 1 - 
800-285-5284, (8 1 0) 557- 
7280 LET US TAME YOUR 
FINANCIAL PROBLEMS. 

Equipment HENDRICK'S PAINT Ser- 
vice - Call 872-20 19. 

8-6-8-tf 

ELECTRIC MOTOR and 
power tool repair, 8 a.m.to 
5 p.m. weekdays, 8 a.m. to 
noon Saturdays, John Blair, 
1/8 mile west of M-53 on 

FOR SALE - Massey 
Ferguson back hoe with front 
bucket, good shape. 665- 
9957. 9-9-28- 1 

( Help Wanted ) 4556 Green Rd., Cass City 
872-3976 

8-4- 13-tl 

Ken Martin 

HELP WANTED - Mature 
reliable stock person. Please 
apply i n  person, Erla's Food 
Center, Cass City. 11-9-14-3 

Zero Downpayment. 
HOMEBUYERS: your credit 
could qualify you for a no 
down payment mortgage. 
Call your financial specialist 
at Tamer Mortgage Corm 
pany. NO APPLICATDN 
FEE. 1-800-285-5284, 
(81 0) 557-7280. 

LISTINGS WANTED ON ALL Electric, Inc. 
Homes - Farms 

Commercial 
Industrial 

New and rewire 
STATE LICENSED 
Phone 872-4114 

4 180 Hurds Corner Road 
8-8- 10-tf 

~~ ~- 

FULL TIME DELIYERY 
person for furniture and ap- 
pliance. Send applications to 
Box S, care of Cass City 
Chronicle, Cass City, MI 
48126. 11-9-14-tf 

TYPES OF REAL ESTATE 
You CAN Own Your Own 
Home! No downpayment 
on Miles materials, attrac- 
tive construction financing. 
Call Miles Hornas today, 1- 

Doctor Buys Land Cow 
tracts and makes loans or 
real estate. Fast funding. 
Best safety and value. Reli- 
ab18 personal service. 
(8 1 0) 335-8 1 66 or 1 -800- 

Money To Loan! Home- 
owners Cash Fast! 1st and 
2nd mortgages, purchase or 
refinance. Home or Rental 
Property. Slow Credit O.K. 
Bill Consolidation, etc. 
Fast. Easy. Call 24 hours, 
Allstate Mortgage & Fi- 
nance Corp. 61 6-957- 
0200. Free Qualifying 
Appointment. 1-800-968- 
2221. 

Cash For Land Contracts. 
Unbeatable prices! Call 
First National weekdays 
8am - 9pm, Saturday 9am - 
4pm. 8004742324. Bo- 
nusll Free guidebook to 
first 500 callers! 
Wolff Tanning Beds New 
Commercial - Home Units. 
From $1 99.00. Lamps-Lo- 
tions-Accessories. Monthly 
payments low as $1 8.00. 
Call today. Free New Color 
Catalog. 1-800-462- 91 97. 

Waterproof Or Remodel 
Your Basement! Eliminate 
seepage, mold, mildew, that 
cold damp feeling and take 
advantage of the additional 
living space! Free esti- 
mates anywhere in Michi- 
g a n ,  absolutely no 
obligation. Call All-Service 
Remodeling, "The Base- 
ment, Specialists, " for an 
3270. appointment. 1-800-968- 

Place Your Statewide Ad 
Hem! $239 burs a 25 word 
classified ad offering over 
1,403,000 circulation. Con- 
tact this newspaper for de- 
tails. 

800-343-2884 e&. 1. 

837-61 66. 

WANTED: Enrichment 
Teachers for Creative 
Writing, Too Busy to 

Workout Workout, Xmas 
Cooking, Chinese Cooking, 

Guitar. 
Create a Class. 

Apply at the: 
Tuscola Area Skill Center 

Adult Continuing Ed. 
Office 

1401 Cleaver Road 
Caro, MI 48723 

Monday - Thursday 
5:OO - 9:oO p.m. 
or Call 673-5300 

ask for Lynda McIntosh 
11-9-28-3 

ATT'ENTION: Looking for a 
mature individual who is 
seeking an opportunity in the 
high tech world of home en- 
tertainment, We will do dl 
training. No experience riw- 
essary. For interview call 
51 7-872-5333, Moriday-Fri- 
day, 10 a.m. to 4 p.m. Infor- 
mation about opportunity 
and pay will be given during 
interview. Limited positions 
available. 1 1 - 9 - 7 4  

SHAGENE 
EXCAVATING 

Sand - Gravel - 
Topsoil - Fill - 

Back-Hoe work 
Truckmg 

87213648 
8-4-20-tf 

MAIN STREET 
AUTO CARE 

Hand Wash 
4 Hand Wax 
4 Engine Detail 

Motor Homes 
Travel Trailers 

Pick up 6: Delivery 
in City Limits 

Hours 7:30 a.m. - 5:OO p.m. 
6254 Main St. 872-4350 

8-6- 15-tf 

Country & Golf Course View - Set o n  the edge o 
Cass City. Lovely home fcaturing 3 bedrooms, 2 I/: . - ' 

Ideal Retirement Home - Close to downtown. Nke 
2 bedroom ranch home. Very maintenance free. 2 car 
garage. Why not take a look, TCCllO4 

baths, terrace deck, covered deck, screened patio, open 
breezeway. 2 car garage. Cali today. TCC1109 I 1 &I 

~ ~ 

Erla Packing 
6233 Church St. 

Cass City 
Phone 872-2 19 1 

Custom Butchering 
Fridays only 

USDA Inspected Plant 
Custom Curing, Smoking, 

Cutting, Wrapping and 
Freezing 

We Muke Venison 8-10-31-tf Sausage 

Gas & Oil Furnaces 
4 All Gas Appliances 

and 
HEATING 

COOLING 
SPECIALIST 

Paul L. 
Brown 
Owner 

State Licensed 
24 Hour Emergency 

Service 
CALL 517-872-2734 

8-3 - 30-1 

Country Ranch - Set on 5 wocded acres. 3 bedroom, South of Cass City - Unique 2 story stone home with 
1 112 baths, full basement. 2 car garage plus a pole 4 bedrooms, large family room, hasement plus 15 acres 
barn with electric, heat and cemcnt floor. Make an of land and large outbuilding.Movc in day of closing. 
appointment. Cy 101 4 F698 

Restaurant For Sale - Prime location, progressive community, excellent business, completely 
remodeled. Seller motivated. COM956 
New on the Market - Stately built 3 bedroom, 1 1/2 story home in  Cass City on a large corner 
lot. This home has been newly redecorated, carpeted, has central air, 1 1/2 car garage plus 
more. Call for your private showing. TCC1092 
1987, 3 bedroom Ranch Home in Minden City. Other quality points are full bath i n  master 
bedroom, vaulted ceiling, 2 car attached garage, cement drive, large back yard. To473 
Sportmen's Paradise - Walleye fishing, duck and goose hunting, boating, ice fishing all at 
your back door. 2 bedroom ranch, attached 1 car garage, Beautiful view of Saginaw Bay at 
Fish Point. Cy 1037 
Seasonal Dairy Barn Restaurant For Sale - Excellent location. Built new in 1988. Priced to 
sell. COM957 
New on the Market - Estate home in Cass City. 3 bedroom, formal dining rooni. Needs TLC. 
$2 1.900. TCC 1 122 

Call 
Cass City 517-872-2248 
or Caro 51 7-673-2555 

Kelly W. Smith, Broker 
Farm Commercial Residential 

Listings Wanted 

WANTED: Enrichment 
Teachers for Windows and 

Mac Software: Word & 
Word for the Office, 

PageMaker, Micro Soft 
Works and Lotus 123. 
Qualifications: 2 years 

working experience with 
software. Will consider 

other software. 
Create a Class. 

Apply at the: 
Tuscola Area Skill Center 

Adult Continuing Ed. 
Office 

140 I Cleaver Road 
Caro, MI 48723 

Monday - Thursday 
5:OO - 9:OO p.m. 
or Call 673-5300 

ask for Lynda McIntosh 
1 1 -9-28-C 

____I_.- 

24 Hour 
Wrecker Service 

872-2251 day 
872-5606 night 
CASS CITY 

MUFFLER & BRAKl 
R-4-27-1 

GARY WILLS CONSTRUCTION 

Bath & Kitchen Remodeling 
Formica and Ceramic 

LICENSED & INSURE0 BUILDER 
20 Years' fxpetience 

(51 7) 872-3505 7676 Gilbert Road 
Cass City, Mich. 48726 EQUAL woufimc 

OPPORTUNITV I .  

Jim Doerr 658-8625 8-8-4-tf 
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Deer plentiful as Got a bow season opens 
Gripe? Hunters: The Chronicle 

will publish the picture of 
the first deer brought to the 
office for the bow and gun 
seasons, and any other tro- 
phy animals. All hunters 
encouraged to call the of- 
fice at 872-2010 to report 
their success for publishing 
in our Deer n l e s  column. 

-- 

though verbal permission is 
still a must. 

Sunday hunting rules re- 
main the same in theThumb; 
no hunting allowed on pri- 
vate land i n  Huron and 
Sanilac counties, and no 
hunting on lands of another 
in Tuscola County. 

The Chronicle 
Welcomes 

Letters 
to the 
Editor 

I 

AMONG THOSE recognized at the 
Young Riders Second Annual Awards 
Night were (front) Casey Mangel, (back 
row, 1eft)Andrea Mangel, Susy Graham, 
Jamie Luana and Linda Yost. 

Cass City's Student of the Week is Michelle 
Brown, daughter of Jim and Judy Brown. 
Michelle is in the 12th grade. Her favorite 
classes and sports are Spanish Ill, softball 
and academic games. She also co-ops for 
Thumb National Bank. Michelle has been 
chosen for her courteous behavior towards 

Michelle Brown her fellow students. 

BOB WALPOLE (Center), Walbro EMC president, Saginaw 
Valley State University Board of Control, was the keynote 
speaker Tbesday, Sept. 20, at Northwood Shores Golf Course. 
Walpole informed over 60 guests of SVSU policy. awards night 

IRA? TV rates cut tion at thc fair. 
Tiffany Cybulski, Jason 

Jones and Chad LaJoie re- 
ceived merits for their help 
and participation at meet- 
ings. Most Improved was 
Katie Wood. Most Dedicated 
was Sarah Jones, and Sally 
Lockwood was the Best 
Barnkeeper. 

Those who had done spe- 
cial reports are Sarah Jones, 
Casey Mangel, Jordan 
Saldana and Dena LaJoie. 
Nathan Izydorek got the 
Trivia Award. Certificates for 
participation at the fair went 
to Bethany Baughman, 
Deborah Baughman, Carrie 
Cybulski, Susie Graham, 
Nathan Izydorek, Tonia 
LaJoie, Sally Lockwood, 
Jamie Luana, Andrea Man- 
gel, Casey Mangel, Jordan 
Saldana and Katie Wood. 
Mark Mangel, John Luana, 

Kay Graham, Peggy and 
Eddie LaJoie, Linda Yost, 
Marylin Lockwood and 
Shelby Saldana received 
Certificates ofAppreciation. 

The special Young Riders 
Award went to Linda Yost. 

The Young Riders leaders 
are: Edie Izydorek, Mary 
Jones, Lezley Mangel, 
Cheryl Ldoie,  Jane Luana 
and Sue Baughman. 

The club meets at the 
Edison Building on the sec- 
ond Tuesday of each month 
at 6:30 p.m. 

The Young Riders of 
Tuscola County, a horse 4-H 
Club, held their second an- 
nual Awards Night Tuesday, 
Sept. 13 ,  at the Detroit 
Edison building in Cass City. 

After a potluck supper, 
awards were given for ac- 
complishments during the 
past year. 
Receiving trophies for high 

point, top teen, and top youth 
were Jamie Luana, Andrca 
Mangel and Casey Mangel, 
respectively. Clovcrbud 
awards went to Jimmy 
Luana, Selina Izydorek and 
LaShae LaJoie for participa- 

Checkwith 
state Farm 

Ernest A. Teichman, Jr, 
6240 W. Main 
Cass Phone City, 872-3388 MI 48728 

*Recognized Sgt. Donald 
Miller, who recently corn- 

Haynes and L.J. Eaton at an pleted an advanced rifle 
Aug. 26 accident involving training course presented by 
Richards' wife. He also Washtenaw Community Col- 
lauded Haynes and the vil- lege, and police counter 
lage DPW for its quick work sniper training through East- 
in removing a downed limb 
near his home July 22. 

CHRYSLER Dodge Jeep 

DOWNTOWN CASS CITY 
I ncal Number (517) 872-2184 

ern- MichiganUniversity. 

Youngest 
The youngest Prime 

Minister In the history of 
Canada was Charles 
Joseph Clark, elected in 
1979 when only 39 years 
old. 

@Presented a plaque of ap- 
preciation to Eldon 
Stoutenburg, who recently 
retired from the village DPW 
crew after 34 1/2 years of 
service. I State Farm Life 

Insurance Company 
Home Office Bla3ninQtOn IllinoiS 

"We take the time to make it shine" 

This ad ran in the June 20 issue 
'75 DODGE motor home, 20' long, 360 engine, au- 

tomatic, cab air, CB radio, good tires, 59,000 
miles, $4,500. 1984 Bayliner boat, 16' cabin style, 
85 force mtr. with life jackets, anchor, ship to shore 
radio, compass, $3,400. Eagle 6000 fish finder 
with transducer and mount, $125. Ranch King 
riding lawn mower, 11 hp., 38 inch cut - good 
shape, 2 years old, $400. 

No-till drills 
available now 
TheTuscola Soil Conserva- 

tion District has 2 15 ft. John 
Deere 750 no-till drills avail- 
able for wheat planting this 
fall. 

Soil Conservation Techni- 
cian Jim Kratz will be main- 
taining and transporting the 
drills for the district as well 
as providing technician assis- 
tance. Anyone interested in 
renting the drills should con- 
tact Kratz at the District Of- 
fice at 1075 Cleaver Road in 
Caro or phone 673-8174. 

Published just once in the June 20 
issue of the Chronicle sold... 

J '75 Dodge Motor Home 
J '84 Bayliner Boat 
J Eagle 6000 Fish Finder 
J Ranch King Riding Lawn Mower 

ALL AT THE LOWEST COST 
OF ANY PUBLICATION 

YE S!!! shores 

Sunday Brunch 
Starting Again 0 

2 
Golf Course & Restaurant 

October 9 
$ Children EYE CARE 

& EYEFEAR 
w $3.50 

FRIDAY FISH SPECIAL $595  
All You Can Eat 

includes soup, salad, roll, choice of potato 

REMEMBER TO BOOK 
HOLIDAY BANQUETS EARLY! 

Call Today 

$5.58 FOR EVERYONE 

RESULTS COUNT 
AND YOU CAN COUNT ON 

Professional eye 

Prescriptions filled 
Large selection of 

All types of contacts 
No-line bifocals 
Glasses repaired 
Blue Cross & VSP 

- participant 
DAVID C. 
BATZER II, 0.D 

Professional Eye Care 
Bad Axe Cass City 

exams 

frames 

269-7263 872-3404 

Cass City Chronicle I 8 7 2 - 5642 6550 Main St. I Cass City 

e 4805 Beechwood Drive, Cass City, Mich, 
872-5642 P 
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