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Good, but not perfect 

Area United Wav record 
best among 5 in county 

Call it the Community i 

I Chest Or it the Ruising $6,000 at the time was a monumental task. In the same 
Way, it was always the or- I paper that announced the money collected, another story was 
Novesta Townships United 

ganization that raised the 
most money per capila of 
any of the 5 United Ways in 
Tuscola County, Art 
Holmberg, long time United 
Way board member,pointed 
out. 
It’s one of the best, but not 

perfect. The annual charity 
drive has not always met its 
goal, but it has always raised 
substantial funds for needy 
organizations. 

For many years the Com- 
munity Chest in Cas City 
was synonymous with for- 
merCass City School Super- 
intendent Willis Campbell, 
dho headed the drive year 
after year. 

Campbell knew every- 
body, Holmberg recaired, 
and he just sent letters to 
individuals to help out with 

- -  

boasting thet Wulhro Corporation ~ U S  expanding and the av- 
erage weekly payroll had zoomed tu $4,500. 

the drive. Folks he could 
depend on to help. 

For many years the drive 
started in Cass City with a 
kickoff dinner at a local res- 
taurant sponsored by the 
Pinney State Bank and The 
Cass City State Bank, since 
consolidated as a branch of 
Chemical Bank Bay Area, 
Today’s United Way could 

use a Willis Campbell, be- 
cause finding persons to 
help out in the rural areas has 
been a problem, Dale McIn- 
tosh, this year’s president, 
reports. 

Although the United Way 
has an enviable record, 

things were not always rosy, 
rosy, rosy, In the mid-50’s 
for instance, several times 
the drive fell short of its 
goal. The goal then seems 
modest today, but probably 
was greater than that of 
today’s, considering infla- 
tion. 

In 1954 the goal was 
$6,000 and the drive fell 
short, raising $5,537.20. 
The same held true in 1955, 
when it fell just short again. 
Raising $6,000 at the time 
was a monumental task. In 
the same. paper that an- 
nounced the money col- 
lected, another story was 

boasting that Walbro Corpo- 
ration was expanding and 
the average weekly payroll 
had zoomed to $4,500. 

In 1956 the United Way 
was reported to have just 
exceeded its $6,000 goal and 
that started a string of suc- 
cesses that has continued. 

With the success came 
rapidly expanding goals. In 
1961 it was $7,000 and 10 
years later swelled to 
$10,500. In 1981, bolstered 
by good times and increased 
employment in the commu- 
nity, the United Way 

Please turn to back page. 

3 injured in Thursday crash 
A 92-year-old Cass City 

man remains hospitalized 
following a 2-vehicle colli- 
sion just east of the village 
Thursday. 

Clayton A. Hartwick, 6644 
Garfield Ave., was listed in 
serious condition Monday at 
St. Mary’s Medical Center, 

Saginaw, a hospital spokes- 
woman said. 

Hartwick was in a car 
driven by his wife, Virginia, 
77, according to Tuscola 
County Sheriffs deputies, 
who reported Mrs. Hartwick 
was eastbound on Cass City 
Road (M-81) just east of 
Woodland Avenue when 

she turned left into the path 
of a westbound vehicle 
driven by Gail R. Soule, 45, 
of Caro. 

All three occupants were 
transported by Cass City 
ambulance to Hills and 
Dales General Hospital. 

Clayton Hartwick was 
transferred to St. Mary’s by 

Flightcare Helicopter, Vir- 
ginia Hartwick was admit- 
ted, and Soule was trans- 
ferred to Car0 Community 
Hospi@l. Both women have 
since been discharged. 

Both the Hartwicks and 
Soule were wearing seat 
belts at the time of the 3:35 
p.m. accident, reports state. 

BURIED IN THE bottom of a 20-foot ditch is this car in which Herbert Beecher was 
found dead Friday morning at his farm home on Mushroom Road, Deford, 

RICHARD ERLA 
D - Commissioner 

CHRIS KISCHNICK ELSIE HICKS 
D - Register of Deeds 

GINNY McLAREN 
R - Register of Deeds R - Commissioner 

Hicks-Erla vie for commissioner 

Sheriff, clerk, register of 
deeds offices up forgrabs 

The offices of Tuscola 
County sheriff, clerk and 
register of deeds are all up 
for grabs in Tuesday’s gen- 
eral election. 

Also contested are 3 
county board seats, includ- 
ing District 2, where a for- 
mer longtime county clerk 
and a retired businessman 
will battle for the right to 
represent Elmwood, 
Elkland, Novesta and King- 
ston townships. 

Among those seeking 
countywide office are in- 
cumbent Sheriff Tom Kern, 
48, a Reese Democrat com- 
pleting his first term, and 
Republican William N. 
MacNicol Jr., 49, of Caro. 

Both candidates are vet- 
eran law enforcement offi- 
cers; Kern has served with 
the sheriff‘s department 
since 1970, and MacNicol 
has been a Michigan State 
Police trooper for 25 years. 

The office of clerk is an- 
other hotly contested race, 
with pelores Gangler, a 
Unionville Republican, 
squaring off against Demo- 
lcrat Margie White of Caro. 

Gangler, 49, has 12 1/2 
years experience in the 
clerk’s office, including 8 
years as deputy clerk. 
White, 38, is a member of 
the county planning and 
park and recreation com- 
missions, and is Great Lakes 
Junior College placement 
coordinator. 

Incumbent Clerk Erma 
Brown decided not to seek 
re-election. 

In the race for register of 
deeds, it’s incumbent Ginny 
McLaren, a Millington Re- 
publican, and Democrat 
Chris Kischnick of Vassar. 

McLaren, 38, was ap- 
pointed register of deeds in 
the summer of 1988 and then 
went on to win election to 
the post. She has worked in 
the office for 12 years, in- 
cluding 3 1/2 years as deputy 
register of deeds. Kischnick 
has worked at various jobs, 

including cashier, baker, 
shop worker and quality 
control management. She 
currently is employed as a 
paralegal for the law firm of 
Learman, Peters, Sarow & 
McQuillan in Bay City. 

Countywide officials run- 
ning unopposed are Treas- 
urer Patricia Donovan, a 
Democrat from Fairgrove, 
and Prosecutor James Reed, 
a Car0 Republican. Also 
running unopposed is Dep- 

uty Drain Commissioner 
Sarah Pistro, 42, Caro, who 
is running for the post va- 
cated by retiring Drain 
Commissioner Stan Henry 
after defeating 2 other Re- 
publican candidates in the 
primary . 

DISTRICT 2 RACE 

County board seats are 
contested in districts 2,4 and 
6. 

In District 2, incumbent 
Republican Elsie Hicks, 66, 
Deford, is seeking election 
to the post she was appointed 
to after Mary Lou Bums 
resigned to serve as Tuscola 
County Friend of the Court. 

Challenging for the seat is 
Democrat Richard Erla, 67, 
Cass City, a retired owner of 
Erla’s Packing and Food 
Center, Cass City. , 

’ “Tuscola County has been 
very good to me and I felt as 
though I could give back 
sqmething,” Hicks com- 
mented. “I’ve been twice 
appointed to fill terms (on 
the board) and I decided I 
would like to run for a term 
for myself.” 
Hicks has 28 years experi- 

ence in county government, 
including 19 years as clerk, 

She indicated she believes 
problems in the county, such 
as well-publicized disputes 
between the county board 
and circuit Judge Patrick R. 
Joslyn, can and should be 
settled so that officials can 
concentrate on what’s im- 
portan t. 

“I think we need under- 
standing, we need to begood 
listeners and we need to sit 
down as ladies and gentle- 
men. I think any problem we 
have can be solved if we use 
that approach,’’ she said. “I 
just think we have a great 
potential. and we can’t be 
consumed by differences.’’ 
The county’s potential also 

is on the mind of Erla, who 
would like to see economic 
expansion that compliments 
the Thumb’s agricultural 
strengths. 

“We’re in an agricultural 
area and I feel that we can 
have some praessing plants 
in this area and utilize the 
products we are producing 
-beans, soybeans, corn.. .Ii 

he remarked. “That’s what I 
would strive to get.” 
No tax increases, spending 

money wisely aird senioI 
citizens issues also are im- 
portant, Erla said, adding he 
believes it’s time for a 

change in government on 
the cQunty level as well as 
nationally. 
In District 4, which covers 

Indianfields and Wells 
townships, Republican Mi- 
chael J. Hogan, 40, Wells 
Township, is challenging 
incumbent Democrat Com- 
missioner Norma J. Bates, 
61, of Indianfields Town- 
ship. 

In District 6, representing 
Tuscola and Vassar town- 
ships, the candidates are 
Republican Marvin Ruppre- 
cht, 53, of Tuscola Town- 
ship, and incumbent Demo- 
crat Robert Russell, 70, of 
Vassar Township. 
Please turn to back page. 

BEWARE - THE Cass City Jaycees Spook House returns 
this Halloween for those who dare to enter the Cultural 
Center basement (enter from the alley behind Kritzman’s). 
Hours will be Friday from 7 to 10:30 p.m. and Saturday from 
7 to 11 p.m., with a special young children’s night Friday, 
from 5 3 0  to 7 p.m. Prices are $2 for those age 13 and over and 
$1 for 12 and under. 

Found in car in ditch 

Herbert Beecher succumbs to 
heart attack at farm home 

Herbert 0. Beecher, 61, of 
Deford was found dead in 
his car Friday morning after 
suffering what was appar- 
ently a fatal heart attack. 

Police on the scene, judg- 
ing by equipment found in 
the car, theorized that he 
probably went into a field a 
little less than a mile from 
his home to repair some 
fences on the property. 

He was found by his wife, 
who went looking for him 
when he failed to return to 
the house. The c p  went 
head first into a 20-foot deep 
drainage ditch and the vic- 
tim was pinned inside. 

After a fireman used a farm 
tractor to pull the car from 
the ditch, the jaws of life 
were used to free him. Fire 
fighters from Kingston and 
the Elkland Township Fire 
Department were at the 
scene, as was the Cass City 
Mercy Ambulance Service. 

Mr. Beecher was born 
Sept. 23, 1931, in Ellington 
Township, the son of the late 
Leroy and Helen Beecher. 
He married the former Patri- 
cia Urquhart Nov. 12,1961, 
in  Caro. He was a graduate 
of Car0 High School and 
served with the U. S.  Army 
in Germany. He was a Car0 

police officer and raised 
Hereford cattle on his farm. 
He was also involved with 
antique tractors. 

Surviving besides his 
widow are: 2 daughters, 
Mrs. Don (Sandy) Hunt of 
Webberville and Mrs. Mark 
(Shelley) Newsome of 
Clarkston; a son, Leroy, at 
home: his mother, Helen 
Beecher of Caro; a brother, 
Dale, of Davisburg; 5 sis- 
ters, Mrs. Robert (Iola) 
Cragg of Fairgrove, Mrs. 
Richard (Janet) Fullmer and 
Louise Brown, both of Caro; 
Barbara Allen of Las Vegas, 
Nevada. and Mrs. Kenneth 

(Carolyn) Hayes ofFt. Polk, 
Louisiana; his mother-in- 
law, Mrs. Emeline Urquhart 
of Caseville, and several 
nieces and nephews. 

Preceding him in death 
were his father, in 1984, 2 
brothers, Jay in 1951 and 
Keith in 1989, and a sister, 
Marie Findlay, this year. 
Funeral services were held 

Tuesday at Collon Funeral 
Home in Caro, the Rev. 
Calvin Blue officiating. 
Burial was in Ellington 
Township Cemetery. 
Memorials can be made to 

the American Cancer Soci- 
etv. 
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Students seek 
donations 
for UNICEF 

Cass City 
Personal Items Carnival set 

The Cass City branch of the 
American Association of 
University Women will hold 
its annual Halloween Cami- 
Val Friday from 6 to 8 p.m. in 
the Cass City Middle School 
cafeteria. 

There will be games, re- 
freshments and prizes. 
The carnival is for children 

from pre-school through 
grade 6. 
The children are invited to 

wear costumes. 
All proceeds are used for 

school enrichment pro- 
grams for C a s  City stu- 
dents. 

Cass City sixth graders will 
be seeking donations for 
UNICEF (United Nations 
Children’s Fund) over the 
next week, Oct. 28 through 
Nov. 4. 

About 140 kids will take 
part in the effort, which will 
involve students taking col- 
lection canisters throughout 
their neighborhoods. 

Dollars collected this year 
will go to Africa - emer- 
gency relief in Liberia and 
Mozambique, primary 
health care in Namibia and 
child survival and develop- 
ment in Zambia; Asia - 
basic services in Cambodia; 
Latin America- integrated 
basic services in El Salva- 
dor, and water and sanitation 
in Mexico. 

I I Call your local news to the Chronicle office - 872-2010 

The local Woman’s Chris- 
tian Temperance Union met 
at the home of Mrs. Joyce 
Cameron Oct. 23. Everyone 
was requested to vote this 
year. The next gathering 
will be a potluck Thanksgiv- 
ing dinner at Mrs. Martha 
Remsing’s home on Eliza- 
beth St. Nov. 20. Visitors 
are welcome. 

Ruth Henke of Waterford, 
who was born in Cass City, 
visited Ila Cook last week. 
3enke stopped at the Chron- 
cle to check on some genea- 
ogical information about 
he Lang and White fami- 
ies. 

Monica Sue Stover was 
born Oct. 10 at 6 5 2  p.m. at 
Huron Memorial Hospital, 
Bad Axe. She weighed 8 
pounds, 1 1/2 ounces and 
was 22 inches long. She i s  
the first child of Mark and 
Brenda (Schember) Stover 
of 62 Lakeside Drive, Cass 
City. Her grandparents are 
Charles and Amy Stover, 
Marcia Schember and Lyle 
S chember , Grcat-grandpar- 
ents are Wally and Evelyn 
Hendra,Ruth Dorman, Clar- 
ence and Kate Schember. 
Mother and daughter came 
homeOct. 14. 

Vote For 
SHARON 

WENZLAFF 
Kingston Twp. 

Clerk 
Republican 

Paul and Alice Phillips 

Phillips to celebrate 
Dean’s list 
announced 

- 

golden anniversary 
Paul and Alice (Fischer) the armed forces. 

Phillips of Decker will cele- The couple lived in the 
brate their 50th wedding Decker area, where Paul 
anniversary with a family retiredas arural mail carrier. 
dinner Nov. 1 at Krzysiaks 

They have 2 children and 6 
grandchildren. The daugh- 

were married Nov- 3 9  ters are Paula Marshall of 
19429 in Neosho, Mo., Marlette and Pam Ross of 
where Paul was stationed in Cass city. 

Mr. and Mrs. Scott Siewert 
Great Lakes Junior Col- 

lege has announced students 
that maintained a 3.5 grade 
point average for the sum- 
mer term. 

Among them are Melinda 
Sams and Cheryl 
Zawilinski, both of Cass 
City; Daniel Baugher, Paul 
Lalko and Donna Moore, all 
of Kingston, ahd Rosalie 
Bitterling and Janice Smith, 
both of Ubly. 

Hills and Dales 
General Hospital 

PATIENTS LISTED 
MONDAY, OCT. 26, 
WERE: 

Jplieann Salowitz, Ubly, 
and Scott Siewcrt, Bad Axe, 
were married Saturday, 
Sept. 5,at St. Joseph Church 
in Argyle. 
The Msgr. Francis Murray 

officiated at the double-ring 
ceremony. 
The bride is the daughter of 
Mark and Barbara Salowitz 
of Ubly , and the groom is the 
son of A1 and Ruth Pangborn 
of Bad Axe. 

Organist was Jane Moore 
of Cas City, and the soloist 
was Ron Zdrojewski of 
Palms. 

Tim Salowitz of Warren, 
brother of the bride, wag the 
reader. 

and a silk illusion veil with 
wire edging. 

She carried a bouquet of 
gardenias, red roses, white 
mini carnations and freesia 
with accents of spiral pearls, 
a rosary, Boston fern, ivy 
and baby’s breath. 
Dee Kritzman of Cass City, 

friend of the bride, was the 
matron of honor. The brides- 
maids were Kathy Salowitz, 
Utica, sister-in-law of the 
bride, Lisa Koglin, Port 
Hope, and Lynette Guigar, 
Ubly, friends of the bride. 
Junior couples were Kim 
and Becky Pangborn, Bad 
Axe. 

The bride’s attendants all 
wore cranberry colored 
dresses with lace bodices, 
satin bows on the sleeves, 
and satin skirts with sweep 
train, accented with a candy 
box bow in the back. 

Kelly Salowitz of Utica, 
the bride’s niece, was the 
miniature bride. 

Best man was David Ri- 
vard, Elkton, friend of the 
groom. The groomsmen 
were Alan Salowitz of 
Utica, Paul Salowitz of 
Ubly, and Chris Sa1owit.q of 
Ubly, all brothers of the 
bride. 

The junior couples were 
Shawn and Stephen Salow- 
itz, nephews of the bride. 
Miniature groom was 
Mathew Wilkins, Romeo 
Plank, friend of the couple, 
Ushers were Tim Salowitz 

of Warren, brother of the 
bride, and Ron Pangborn of 
Bad Axe, uncle of the 
groom. 
After the wedding, a recep- 

tion with buffet dinner was 
held at the Fox Hunters Club 
in Ubly. 

The couple is residing in 
New Baltimore. The bride is 
an inspector at AMP Indus- 
tries, Mt. Clemens, and the 
groom is a foundry worker at 
Wolverine Bronze, Rosev- 
ille. 

I Rid larby S h m O W d a f f .  
3425 h St, KingRon. MI 48141 

Farm 
homeowners 

insurance 
a good buy. 

CALL ME 
Ernrat A Telchmm, Jr. 

6240 W. Maln 
Cass city, Mlch. 
Phone 872-3388 

Jasper Whitsett, Cass City; 
Wanda McConnell, Caro; 
Jami Sting, Deford; 
Sue Nelson, Kingston. 

Marriage licenses 
Jeffery Donald Kluesner 

and Lisa Marie Spencer, 
both of Kingston. 

James Richard Warack, 
Gagetown, and Cheryl Lynn 
Char, Plymouth. 

Robert William Reed, 
Akron, and Peggy Lee Don, 
Fairgrove. 

Donald Darrel Home and 
Robin Rae Marr, both of 
Caro. 

The altar was decorated 
with 2 vase arrangements of 
carnations and gladioli, and 
a unity candle arrangement 
designed with red roses and 
minicarnations with accents 
of baby’s breath. The 4 
family pews were decorated 
with pew bows with pink 
mini carnations ,and baby’s 
breath. 

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a 
white crystalleni gown with 
a sweetheart neckline and 
basque waist heavily 
trimmed in lace and beads. 
The full cathedral-length 
skirt had multi-layers of 
crystalleni wire ruffles, cas- 
cading around the bottom of 
the entire train. The elbow- 
length satin sleeves were 
also trimmed in lace and 
beads. 

Mr. and Mrs, Lawrence Summers CREATIVE TWIST, LACE & PEARLS USED TO 
MAKE A TREETOP OR STANDING ANGEL 

Nov. 5 at 1O:OO a.m. or 6:OO pm. 
COST: $9.00 t Materials 

CREATE A DELIGHTFUL OLD WORLD SANTA 
Summers celebrate 
50th anniversary Nov. 12 at 1O:OO a.m. or 6:OO p.m. 

COST: $9.00 + Materials 
LEARN TO MAKE A COUNTRY ANGEL 

WITH BURLAP AND LACE 
Nov. 7 at 1O:OO a.m. 

COST: $8.00 t Materials 
LEARN TO MAKE AN EASY, ELEGANT 

Lawrence A. and Margaret when a reception was held in 
A. Summers of Gagetown their honor at the Masonic 
celebrated their golden Hall in Cass City. 
wedding anniversay Oct. 18, They were married in 

Now you can avoid this dilemma 
by carrying a ForethoughPAlert 
identification card which con- 
tains your vital information on 
microfilm. FerndaieOct. 3,1942. Their 

at tendan ts were Clinton 
Summers of L’ Anse, Mich., 
and Marjorie Cummings 
Riddle of Casper, Wyo- 
ming. 
The Summers have 3 chil- 

dren, Larry and wife Carol 
of Gagetown, Marilyn 
Pierce and husband Roy of 
Marysville and Ghy and 
wife Gwen of Grayling. 
They also have 6 grandchil- 

FABRIC PHOTO ALBUM 
Nov. 13 at 1O:OO a.m. 

COST: $8.00 t Materials 
MERRY OLDE GENTS, CREATE OLD FASHIONED 

You can enroll in the Forethought 
Alert program FREE just for 
talking to us about Forelhought 
funeral planning*! 

SANTA ORNAMENTS WITH PAPIER MACHE 
Nov. 16 at 1O:OO a m or 6.00 p m 

COST: $9.00 + Materials 

COME IN AND SEE OUR SELECTION 
OF FINISHED GIFT ITEMS. 

Call us today ... 
KRANZ FUNERAL HOME 

3452 Washington St. 
Kingston, MI 48741 

(51 7) 683-221 0 
Her headpiece was a mini- 

cap, which was also heavily 
trimmed in lace and pearls 
with a triple wire ruffle puff 

1 by Melva E. Guinther 67315244 
These word quizzes were 

inspired by one passed along 
by Pat Wells. All of the 
answers in the first set are 
words that end with the let- 
ters “ice.” Example: Two 
times = twICE.. In the sec- 
ond set, each word ends with 
“ade.” See how many you 
can come up with. 

dren. 
Mr* and Mrs. Summers 

have lived at their Rescue 
Road home for 46 years. 

209 N. State, Caro D. Leaf of a plant 
E. Good place for a costume 
F. Procession of cars 
G. Green mineral PINE CONE SHOP 

New Location - We’re in the front of the Hahn Building 
DRlED FLOWERS - WREATHS 

BASKETS - WEED ARRANGEMENTS 
Hours: Mon. - Fri. 10-5; Sat. 10-1 

Cass City 6240 W. Main St. 872-2 155 

(((-A-MALE CONTRACEPTION 111 
111 (VASECTOMY) Ill 1. Perform repeatedly 

2. Shelter or rest for travel- 
ers 
3. Evil intent 

action 
5. Cut into small cubes 
6. Business work room 
7. Preconceived opinion 
8. A very short time 
9. Black candy 
10. Steep cliff 
1 1 .  Mouth 
12. Oriental staple 
13. Astronomical occur- 
rence twice a year 
14. Plant fluid 
15. Rodents 
16. Surrender for the sake of 
something else 
17. Abnormal yellowing 
18. Application of herbs 
19. Join by interweaving 
strands 
20. Toothpaste 

A. Arched passageway 
B. Dig 
C. Class or rank 

4. Recommendation for 

ELECT Ill CENTER I11 
I.1 111 Directed by Board Certified Urologist 111 ELSIE HICKS 

Sity M e  Givgis M D .  COUNTY COMMISSIONER 
Elmwood, Elkland, Novesta & Kingston 

District 2 
Republican 

WHERE EXPERIENCE COUNTS 
Personal : 

Lifetime resident of Tuscola County 
Member of Deford United Methodist Church 
Member of Tuscola County Farm Bureau 
Member of Daughters of the American Revolution 
Married: 3 children, 6 grandchildren 

Serving as County Commissioner 

Acting on Human Development Commission 
Executive Committee of Republican Party 

28 years of County Government experience 
18 years County Clerk - acting as clerk of Bd. of Comm. 

Continued good fiscal policy 
County long term planning 
Better relations between Board and Oepts. 

Present : 

Acting on Personnel Committee Paid for by the committee to o l d  Elsie 
Hidrs, 192 Crawford. Deford. MI 

Past: 

Future Goals: 

Call for more information and to sign up 
for FREE nurse consultation and film review. Ill Ill 

111 673-5488 L I  
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FA M I L I E S 
1. Extras lo pkg. 

or 
2 - 5x7 SUPER SPECIAL 

11x14 only $20.00 w/pkg. 

ITMcConkey : Jewelry & Gift Shopp F 

1 pose 1 + 8x10, 2.- 5x7 or 

each - from same 

2. $25.00 must be paid 
on photographing 

W e  

3. Order must be Paid ORDERING DATES - Nov. 17-20 
DELIVERY OF FINISHED ORDERS - Dec  El 1 ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ : ! ~ u f ~ r e  

retouching, spray 01 loliers) 

Oct 27-31 
Week 2 - Plain background 
Nov. 3-7 date. 

You Choose Best 
Of 2 or 3 Poses 

Choose €it her 
Christmas or Plain 

WHEN - Week 1 9 X-mas background only 

Background 

Tell your family d friends 

CALL8 72-51 81 

1 FREE RING CLEANING : 
I 
I 

& INSPECTION 
I 

Check out our Class Ring Specials : 
i 
I, 

!\. c\ Sale runs thru Dec. 4. 1992 HAEBLER STUDIOS % 6458 Main St., Cass City Main Street Cass Citv 872-3025 
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I ?  “If I t  Fitz .... 
Rabbit Tracks 

(And anyone else he can 

By Jim I Fitzgerald 

“Did the earth move for 
you, too?” I asked my wife. 

Not only did the earth 
move for me, I also heard 
bells gong, sirens whoop and 
horns honk. 

When my wife agreed it 
had been the same for her, 1 
rolled over in bed and 
reached for the note pad and 
pen that conscientious jour- 
nalists keep handy for re- 
cording newsworthy events. 
Glancing at the clock, I 
wrote: 

“After 37 years of mar- 
riage, the earth finally 
moved for us at 2:30 a.m. 
Friday, Oct. 16, 1992.” 

Strangely, although the 
earth had stopped moving, 
we could still hear the bells, 
sirens and horns. “This is 
even better than in the mov- 
ies,” I said. 
“That noise is car alarms,” 

she said. 

and lightning,” my wife 
explained. 

The next day I phoned a 
scientist friend. She said it 
was most likely vibrations 
from the thunder that set off 
the noise. If you jiggle a 
locked parked car, its alarm 
may sound. The same prin- 
ciple must apply to the elec- 
trically controlled bells in a 
jiggled church tower. 

But in the past 15 years 
there have been countless 
thunderstorms in my secu- 
rity-conscious neighbor- 
hood. Never before did 
thunder cause the earth to 
move enough to make bells 
gong, sirens whoop and 
horns honk. What was so 
different this time? 

Probably the thunder 
clapped unusually close to 
the cars and church, the sci- 
entist said. 

That unromantic theory 
rules out a candle-lit dinner, 
an insinuating wine and 
other foreplay. 

FROZEN 
DISAPPOINTMENTS 

sauce on them. Previously 
I’d only seen that particular 
frozen breakfast after it was 
melted, fresh out of the 
microwave, looking as deli- 
cious as it tasted. I should 
never have seen it frozen. 

It looks like it was pur- 
chased in a Tricky Gifty 
shop by some joker who’s 
going to a party and wants 
the host to think a dog 
pooped on the carpet, I can 
no longer eat waffles and 
applesauce for breakfast. 
The Milky Ways were also 
disappointing. I returned to 
bed and asked my wife why 
she bought bite-sized bars 
instead of full-size. She said 
it was because she’s not a pig 
and wants onlyalittlebarfor 
dessert. I said she should 
quit complicating my life 
and asked how many bite- 
size bars it took to equal a 
reasonably sized bar. She 
asked how many romantic 
couples make pillow talk 
with ice cream bars. 

Naturally, I was reminded 
of last month when I took a 
walk along a creek and met a 
talking frog. The frog said if 
I would kiss her, she would 
turn into a beautiful princess 
and give me the best sex of 
my life. I put her in my 
pocket and kept walking. 
The frog couldn’t under- 
stand why I didn’t kiss her. 
She said she’d make the 
earth move for me if I turned 
her into a beautiful princess. 

‘ .  The 4 amendments and capsule comments about them. 
* Proposal A 9 tax limitation as backed by Richard 
. , Headlee. 

No. - 2 classes of taxes added to the muddle that we struggle 
.: with each year. A citizen’s nightmare, an accountant’s 
<bonanza. 

- Proposal B - to limit the terms of elected officials. 
’: No. - nation-wide it might make sense. For Michigan to 
,-‘,lose its clout in Washington to congressmen with more 
::seniority doesn’t. 
3 Proposal C - cut and cap property taxes. 
*: I .  Yes, reluctantly. - Not because it  promises 30 percent tax 
-:cut in 5 years. We are going to pay one way or the other. The 

hope is that whatever tax replaces it  is spread more equitably 
than the current one with all its exemptions. 

Proposal D - to change insurance laws. 
No. - because we have to vote one way or another. Its 

provision to cap medical expenses is long overdue. But the 
savings are mostly illusionary and any insurance company 
can apply for an exemption to the law and the benefits are 
reduced. Nowhere have I heard disputed that AAA insur- 
ance company will make $17 million if the law passes and 
is spending some $4 million to make it happen. 
That makes me suspicious. 

*********** 

LAURA BRYANT (left), the Cass City Business and Profes- 
sional Women’s 1992 Woman of the Year, accepts her award 
from Helen Bartle, chairman of the club’s Woman of theyear 
Commit tee. 

Woman of the Year 

It’s no secret that county-wise, the Democrats have bcen 
making inroads in traditionally strong Republican Tuscola 
County. However, Elkland Township has always remained 
in the GOP camp. 

Nothing’s changed, at least with 18 area industrial and 
professional persons. At Cass City Rotary last week a straw 
vote was taken on the presidential election. President Bush 
received 13 votes, Ross Perot, 3 votes, and Bill Clinton, one 
vote. There was one vote for “none of the above.” 

She was mostly right. The 
siren whoops and horn 
honks were signaling that 
many thieves apparently 
were simultaneously break- 
ing into dozens of cars 
parked in the street below 
our open bedroom window. 

But what about the gong- 
ing bells? 

Anyway, back in the bed- 
room, instead of lighting up 
a cigarette in the wake of the 
storm, I got up and went to 
the refrigerator. The day 
before I’d spotted an un- 
opened box of Milky Way 
ice cream bars in the freezer. 
I opened it cautiously, in 
case it was mislabled. 

I was careful because re- 

BPW Club honors Bryant *********** 
FIRST TIME IN 

15 YEARS The Red Fox is an expensive looking restaurant on Ply- 
mouth Road, about 8 miles west of Plymouth, the Detroit 
suburb. And looks are not deceiving. The food is fair togood 

* and features fancy fixings of staple dishes. “Raspberry 
Chicken” is an example. 
Sorry, I can’t recommend it unless money is no object. At 

?birthday party there Sunday for my daughter, B.J., and my 
sister-in-law, Madeline Miller, the average cost was (gulp) 
$30 a plate. 

Retired Cass City business ceremony was attended by Bryant and Diana Taylor, 
owner Laura Bryant has 21 women, including and daughter-in-law Janet 
bcen named Woman of the Bryant’s daughters, Pamela Bryant. 

“I think that’s coming from 
the church in Greektowo,” 
she said. 

But those bells only gong 
for scheduled services, not 
at 2:30 in the morning. And 
our neighborhood car 
thieves usually don’t travel 
in bands, like with Robin 
Hood. They wisely steal 
cars one at a time becausc 
police headquarters is only a 
couple of blocks away and 
many alarms going off at the 
same time might make a 
bunch of cops mad at crime 
for waking them up. 

Year by the C a s  City Busi- , i 

ness and Professional 
Women’s Club. 

The 1992 award was pre- 
sented during a meeting of 
the club Monday night at the 
Charrnon t. 

Bryant and her husband, 
Lloyd, are former long-time 

cently I accidentally opened 
a box of waffles with apple- 

“At my age, I’d rather have 
a talking frog,” I said. 

High Low Precip. 
Tuesday .............................. 38 ...... 34 2’know 
Wednesday .......................... 48 ...... 28 .......... 0 
Thursday ............................ 58 ...... 50 .......... 0 
Friday ................................ 76 ...... 52 .......... 0 

Sunday ................................ 54 ...... 45 .......... 0 
Monday .............................. 62 ...... 32 .......... 0 

Saturday ............................ 54 ...... 34 .......... 0 

(Recorded at Cass City wastewater treatment plant) 

owners of the Gamble store I I Come dressed ,in costume 
Friday & Saturday and get 50c Board has rejected a ruling 

in favor of Morones, saying 
that they already have 
shifted the arrival time from 
8 a.m. to 8:30 for her. Ac- 
cording to Robert Mueller, 
Morones’ attorney, they 
don’t want to face the pros- 
pect of 10,000 mothers ask- 
ing for similar concessions. 

There has to be more to 
this than what’s on the sur- 
face. Does this lady have a 
dum-dum supervisor? You 
know the kind. Full of his 
own importance and every- 
body had better shape up or 
else. Or is the lady the kind 
of person whose tardy arri- 
Val is just the start of another 
day when she is a pain to her 
bosses and her co-workers, 
while she waits for the first 
click of the clock that indi- 
cates closing time? 

There’s no way of know- 
ing where the blame be- 
longs, perhaps to both man- 
agement and employee? 

It’s sure that flexible 
hours are being adopted 
more and more in industry 
these days. Let me boast a 
little and tell you at the 
Chronicle we have had flex- 
ible hours for years. 

What I’m really boast- 
ing about is the people that 
work here. With good 
people you never have a 
problem. We have workcrs 
come in at 7 a.m. and others 
at 1 1  a.m. Some work the 
first couple of days a week, 
others work a couple of days 
during the week and often 
full days Saturday and Sun- 
day. 

Vacations are taken most 
times at the worker’s con- 
venience. I rarely know that 
someone’s on vacation until 
I ask why he or she failed to 
come to work that day. 

That sounds like a hit- 
or-miss proposition; very 
poor planning. What it re- 
ally is, is a picnic for Clarke 
and me. There never has 
becn someone taking off on 
a vacation for days or for a 
week without talking it over 
with thc staff, noi with 
managemcn t. 

They know the job and 
what it  takes to get it  donc. 
Without being told, they 
arrangc schcdules and re- 
sponsihilitics so that the 
work gcts done without 
missing a beat. 

I’m surc that if  all flcx- 
iblc schcduling worked as 
well, cvery company would 
have i t  and thcre ncver 
would be a court case over 5 
minutcs lost here and there. 

in town. Bryant has been a 
member of the Business and 
Professional Women since 
19M. 

Monday night’s award 

Did you catch the story 
that appcared the other day 
involving a woman named 
Lcsbhia Morones who has 
won the first round of her 
fight to keep from being 
docked 10 percent of her pay 
for 6 months because she 
was late to work at her job at 
the Dcpartment of Motor 
Ve hides? 

... 
off any lunch or dinner special 

DEADLY DONUTS & 
ALSO 

So what the heck was going 
on? 

“Just before the earth 
moved, there was thunder 

Cass City 
School menu 

SPIDER CIDER 25c 
1 Sewed by Witches 

of -and the 
Sisters of Sommers’ “Your Partner in Education” NOV. 2-6 

Not late once or twice, 
Monday - Ravioli, Green you understand, but 54 times 

Beans, Fruit, Milk, Dinner between Dcccniber 1991 
Roll. and May 1992. On 41 of the 
Tuesday - 2 Tacos w/ Meat times she was late 5 minutes 
& Cheese,Corn, Fruit, Milk. or less. 

Wednesday * Chef Salad 
with Breadstick, Fruit, Milk. The reason was, she says, 

Thursday - Tuna on Bun, that she has 5 children ages 7 
Coleslaw, Fruit, Milk, Po- to 1 1 tO get off to school, and 

BAKERY & RESTAURANT 
Main St., Cass City 

. -  - 
day care doesn’t open until 8 
a.m. That leavcs her 30 

oni Pizza, Mixed Vege- minutes to get aCrOSS town 
tables, Fruit, Milk. and sometimes she just 

The State Personnel 

heese&Pepper- 

2nd Entree - Hoagie w/ doesn’t make it- 

Visit Thumb National Bank and view the art work 
on display from the Cass City and Deford second 
grade students. 
Thumb National’s “Home Town People” continue 

to support the educational process in our area. 
T’humb National Bank is involved with the Student 
Savers Prograin with elementary age children and 
continues on toward their college education with 
the new Student Checking Account. 
Whi le  you’re admiring the art work, register to win 
a hand painted pumpkin by guessing t h e  number 
of pumpkins that can be found in the bank lobby. 
Thanks to the second graders for t h e  wonderful art 

work! 
Stop in today--Thumb National Bank 

QUALIFIED TO REMAIN YOUR SHERIFF! 
.Lifelong resident of Tuscola County 
Graduate of Reese High School 
*4 years Army National Guard - Infantry 
Certified Police Officer - Graduate of Delta College 

*Associate Degree from Delta College 
mB.A. in Police Administration from Saginaw Valley State 

University (Graduated Magna Cum Laude) 
4 8  years experience on road patrol and jail operations, 

14 of those years as a command officer 
a 4  years as Tuscola County Sheriff, responsible for the 
management of 44 employees and a 1.5 million dollar 
budget 

@Active member of numerous boards within the county, 
such as Thumb Narcotics Board, Community Correction 
Advisory Board, D.A.R.E. Board and others 

including a specialized school for sheriffs 

Police Academy 

*Numerous seminars in command and administration, 

QUALIFICATIONS OF TUSCOLA COUNTY UMDERSHERIF~ JAMES K, FYVIE 
*Llfeiong resldent of Tuscola County 

*.Graduate of Mlilington High School 
e6 years U.S. Army Reserve 
*Certified Police Offlcer - Graduate of Delta College 

*Associate Degree - Criminal Justice - Delta College 
.Attended Saginaw Valley State Universlty towards a B.A. in 

Police Academy 

Public Administration 

,.Graduate of FBI Natlonai Academy 
$*Licensed Emergency Medical Technician 
*Numerous supervlsoryladministrative seminars 
*4Y2 years Vassar Clty Police Officer 
014 years with Tuscola County Sheriff Department, 4 years 

010 years founder and C.E.O. Vassar Area Ambulance 
as Undersheriff for Sheriff Kern 

Service 

RE*ELECT SHERIFF TOM KERN NOVEMBER 3 
c 

MEMBER FDIC 

PIGEON CASEVnLE flL CASSCm 
453-3113 8562247 W W .  872-43 1 1 



PAGE FOUR 
~~ 

Mrs. Thelma Jackson Holbrook Area News Phone658-2347 

CASS CITY CHRONICLE - WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 28,1992 CASS CITY, MCMGAN 

Appeals court affirms 
Judge Joslyn ‘s decision 

Sheriff offers 

guilty to delivering less than 
50 grams of a controlled 
substance. 

The defendant appealed 
his sentence, claiming that it 
was disproportionate and 
that the sentencing discre- 
tion of the trial court was 
improperly limited by a lo- 
cal policy. 

Halloween 
safety tips 

Kingston Twp. 
Vote For 
NANCY 

RUGGLES 

Treasurer 
For 

The big day is almost here. 
The costumes are ready, and 
the children of Tuscola 
County are ready to haunt 
the streets. 
Sheriff Tom Kern reminds 

phrcnts and children that fun 
can turn to tragedy if proper 
precautions are not used. 

“It’s really a matter of 
common sense,” Kern said. 
“There are things you really 
nccd to watch out for when 
allowing your kids to go 
trick or trcating..” 
The sheriff offers these tips 

to make this Halloween a 
safe and fun one: 
* Young children should be 

escorted by an adult, and 
should go out before dark. 
* Costumes should not be 

too restrictive; masks that 
cover the entire face and 
rcstrict vision should not be 
used. 
* Whcn designing or pur- 

chasing a costume, you 
should use reflective or light 
colored materials, 

* Older children should 
still be supervised by an 
adult, but if that is not pos- 
sible, a time limit should be 
set and stuck to. 
* Never let children go into 

a neighborhood that they 
and you are unfamiliar with. 

* Encourage children not 
to cat their treats while trick 
or treating; wait until they 
bring them home so they can 
be inspected. 

* Discard any unwrapped 
candy or anything that looks 
as if it  may have k e n  tam- 
pered with. 

Kern said that every year 
tragedies occur that could 
have been avoided by sim- 
ply following the rules of 
common sense. 

‘.‘The children of Tuscola 
County deserve to have a 
safc, fun  Halloween,” he 
addcd. “We’ll do our part, 
but you need to do yours, 
too.” 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Jackson 
oFAnaheim, Calif., Mr. and 
Mrs. Dean AdamsofSpring- 
field, Mo., Mr. and Mrs. 
John Mcrgyland family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard Bukowski 
and family of Lake Orion, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tony Tittjung 
and family of Sterling 
Heights, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Kulish and family of Flush- 
ing, Mr. and Mrs. Gerry 
Grifka, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Grifka, Mr. and Mrs. Davc 
Olshovy and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Chct Leppek, Mr. and 
Mrs. Archie Rumptz, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Rumptz and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Clem Briolat met at 
Whitey’sin Ubly Sunday for 
a family dinner and get-to- 
gether. 

Mrs. Tom Collins of Alle- 
gan spent the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Sweeney . 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Campbell 

of Utica were Tuesday 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
Farrel I y . 
Judy Ann Hosner of Geor- 

gia, Mrs. Jim Doerr, Mrs. 
Curtis Cleland, Angie Doerr 
and Courtney visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Haas at 
Maumee, Ohio Sunday. 

Ruth Ann Regal and Mrs. 
Deb Spooner and daughters 
of Plymouth, Mikeand Greg 
Moore of Snover spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Evans Gibbard. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bryce Hagen 

went to Coral Gables in Bad 
Axe for dinner Tucsday 
evening in honor of their 
wedding anniversary . 
Mrs. Jim Doerr, Mrs. Cur- 

tis Cleland and Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Jackson visited Bruce 
Holcomb and Ann Klink- 
man at Tendercare. 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Hoxie, 

Beth, Rob and Ryan and 
Justin and Matt Miller spent 
from Saturday till Tuesday 

browse through 
our large selection 
of wallpaper 
sample books 

ti 

we’ll 
help you 
bring magic 
into your 
home 

Kinney Wallpaper 
30% 1 Off 

in Springficld, Ill., whcrc 
thcy visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Ackerman. 

Edanna Swccncy visited 
Mrs. John O’Hcnley I’hurs- 
day forcnoon. 

Mrs. Hiram Kcyscr spcnt 
Thursday aftcrnoon at thc 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Clcland. 

Janic Mair. and John of 
Highland, Susan Sofka of 
Davison, Bccky Fclmlec, 
Jennifer and Jil l  of Bay City 
spcnt the October 24 wcck- 
end with Winifrcd and 
Henry Sofka. 
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Stinko of 

Willis, Pam and Robin of 
England spent Thursday 
with Mr. and Mrs. John 
Walker. 

Franklin Swccney of Lan- 
sing was a Thursday ovcr- 
night guest of Edanria 
Swceney and David. 
Judy Anri Hosner of Gcor- 

gia, Mr. and Mrs. Eugcne 
Clcland of Bad Axe, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jcrry Clcland, Jamic 
Docrr and Courlncy wcre 
Tucsday evening gucsts of 
Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Clcland, 
Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Glua  

wcre Wedncsday dinner 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Stanlcy Glaza. 

Gcorgie Barbcr I11 of 
Royal Oak spent Tucsday 
and Wednesday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Evans Gibbard. 
Other Tuesday guests wcrc 
Carl Gibbard, Jr. and Ryan 
of Bad Axc, Greg, Mike, 
Heathcr and Katic Moore of‘ 
Snover. 

Mary Beardsky, Rose 
Wills and Mr. and Mrs. Cliff 
Jackson visitcd Loretta 
Brown, Linda Mika arid 
Morris Brown Wednesday 
afternoon. 

Mrs. Robcrt Harris of 
Auburn Hills was a Sunday 
overnight guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bryce Hagcn and spcnt 
Monday and Tucsday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Bcn Mcske at 
Port Hope. Mrs. Harris and 
Mr. and Mrs. Meske visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Hal Conkey 
near Casevillc Monday. 

Mary Beardsley was a 
Thursday gucst of Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Shagcna. 
Judy Ann Hosner, Mrs. Jim 

Doerr and Mrs. Curtis Cle- 
land and Courtney Docrr 
were Tuesday lunch gucsts 
of Mr. and Mrs. Rick Kukak 
at Brown City. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hcwitt 

were Wednesday overnight 
and Thursday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Brcdow. 
Mr. and Mrs. Dean Adams 

of Springfield, Mo. lcft 
Sunday aftcrnoon after 
spending a few days with 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Rumptz and other relatives 
and attending a family gct 
together at Whitey’s in Ubly 
Sunday. 

Edanna Sweeney and 
David visited Elsie 
Englehart at Sebewaing 
Tuesday. 

Darlene Terrassi and Julie 
were Saturday afternoon 
guests and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dennis Bartle and Tom of 
Cass City were Saturday 
evcning gucsts of Mg. and 
Mrs. Allen Farrclly. 

Judy Ann Hosncr of War- 
ren Robbins, Ga. left  
Wednesday afternoon after 
spending a wcck visiting 
relatives and friends in this 
area e 

Mrs. Martin Swceney at- 
tended a baby shower for 
Elizabeth Lynn Sageman, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Sagcrnan of North 
Carolina at the home of Ida 
Sageman ncaf Ubly Sunday.  

Mr. and Mrs, Arnold 
Lapccr wcrc Monday cvc- 
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Jackson. 
Mr. and Mrs. John Michal- 

ski of Deford, Mr. and Mrs. 
Davc Michalski and Mr. and 
Mrs. Kevin Robinson wcrc 
Sunday dinncr gucsts of 
Mrs. Ray Michalski. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don 
McKnight of Bad Axc wcrc 
Monday evening guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. J im Hcwitt. 

SUR PR IS E 15 I I U  H DAY 
PARTY 

Susan Sofka of’ Davisori 
and Mrs. and Mrs. Hcriry 
Sofka lcft Thursday fore- 
noon and Sharon Chudy,  
Janic Main of Highland and 
Bccky Fclrnlec of Bay City 
lcft Thursday cvcning to 
spcnd a fcw c h y s  wilh hqr. 
and hlrs. Don Evcririan arid 

Kxen a t  Foristell, Mo. Fri- 
day Pat Everman, Winifred 
Sofka and Susan Sofka went 
to the Science Centcr in St. 
Louis. When they rcturned 
to Pat Everman’s home, she 
was surprised to see the 
house decorated and guests 
waiting tu help her cclcbrate 
her birthday. 

Othcr guests were Shirley 
Stahlhutand friend Bob, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gary Stahlhut and 
family and Cheryl and Allen 
of Troy, Ill. 

Saturday, Janie Main and 
Sharon Chudy of Davison, 
Pat Everman of Foristell, 
Mo. and Winifred Sofka 
went to St. Charles, Mo. for 
craft shopping and left to 

return to Michigan Sunday. ********** 

Paul S wecney of Saginaw 
was a Saturday guest of 
Edanna Sweeney and 
David. 

Judy Ann Hosner of War- 
ren Robbins, Ga. was a Sat- 
urday dinner guest of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Doerr and Jeff. 

Mrs. Glen Shagena visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Laming 
in Cass City Saturday after- 
noon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wills 
were supper and evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
Hind. 

Georgena Williamson of 
Sandusky was a Sunday af- 
ternoon and supper guest of 

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold 
LaPeer. 
Judy Ann Hosner of Geor- 

gia, Mrs. Jim Doerr, Mrs. 
Curtis Clcland, Mrs. Glen 
Shagena and Mrs. and Mrs. 
Cliff Jackson visited Bertha 
Shagena at Tendercare in 
Cass City. 

Clara Bond, Tom Arm- 
stead, Susan and Paul Rubey 
of Cass City, Karen Damm 
of Pigeon, Debbie Seibel 
and David of Big Rapids, 
and Bette Lou Hurford of N. 
Ft. Myers, Fla., were among 
the friends and relatives at- 
tending the funeral of Jean- 
nette Bond Shadko in Bcn- 
zonia, Mich., Tucsday, Oct. 
20. 

I Republican I n  upholding Joslyn, the 
court of ameals stated 

Paid fur by Nancy Rugglcs Campaign. 
5721 E. Sanilac Kd.. Kulgstm, MI 48741 

1. 

Johmon’s sentence fell 
within the recommended 

GENERAL ELECTION NOTICE 
TO THE QUALIFIED ELEaORS: 
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT A GENERAL ELECTION WILL BE HELD IN ALL 
PRECINCTS IN TUSCOLA COUNTY, MICHIGAN ON 

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 3, 1992 

For the purpose of electing the following Partisan Officers, Viz: 
NATIONAL: President and Vice President of the United States 

CONGRESSIONAL: United States Representatbe in Congress 

LEGISLATIVE: Representative in State Legislature 

STATE: 2-Board of Education, 2-Regents of U of M, 2-Trustees MSU, 2-Governors WSU 

COUNTY: Prosecuting Attorney, Sheriff, County Clerk, County Treasurer 
Register of Deeds, Drain Commissioner, Surveyor 81 County Commissioner 

TOWNSHIP: Supervisor, Clerk, Tmasurer and Trustees 
ALSO ANY OTHER PARTISAN OFFICES WHICH MAY BE NOMINATED AT THAT TIME. 

AND ALSO TO ELECT THE FOLLOWING NON-PARTISAN OFFICERS, VIZ: 
Justices of the Supreme Court Judges of the Court of Appeals 

ALSO ANY OTHER NON-PARTISAN OFFICES AS MAY BE ELECTED AT THAT TIME 
~ 

ALSO TO VOTE ON THE FOLLOWING STATE, AND LOCAL PROPOSALS: 
STATE PROPOSAL A 

A PROPOSAL TO LIMIT ANNUAL INCREASES 
IN HOMESTEAD PROPERTY TAX ASSESS- 
MENTS AND PROVIDE SEPARATE TAX LIMITA- 
TIONS FOR DIFFERENT PROPERTY 
CLASSIFICATIONS 
The proposed constitutional amendment would: 
1) Limit for each homestead property (excluding 

new construction) the annual assessment in- 
crease to 5% or the rate of inflation, whichever 
is less, until the property is sold. Whenever prtr 
perty is sold, adjust assessments according to 
current market value of property. 

2 )  Create separate millage rollback calculations 
for determining the maximum revenue increase 
allowable for two classes of property: residen- 
tiallagricultural and all other property 
classifications. 

3) Permit the use of the combined inflation rate 
for 1991 and 1992 to calculate millage rollbacks 
for determining the maximum property tax 
revenue increase allowable in 1993. 

Should this proposal be adopted? 
[-I YES 0 NO 

~- 

STATE PROPOSAL B 
A PROPOSAL TO RESTRICT I LIMIT THE 
NUMBER OF TIMES A PERSON CAN BE 
ELECTED TO CONGRESSIONAL, STATE EX* 
ECUTIVE AND STATE LEGISLATIVE OFFICES 
The proposed constitutional amendment would: 
1 ) US. Senator: two times in any 24year period. 
2) US. Representative: three times in any 

12-year period. 
3) Governor, Lieutenant Governor, Secretary of 

State or Attorney General: two times per 
off ice. 

4 )  State Senator: two times 
5 )  State Representative: three times 
Office terms beginning on or after January 1, 
1993 would count toward the term restrictions. 
A person appointed or elected to an office 
vacancy for more than 1/z of a term would be 
considered elected once in that office. 
Should this proposal be adopted? 

0 YES 0 NO 

TUSCOLA COUNTY 
JUNIATA TOWNSHIP PROPOSITION 

Shall the Township of Juniata levy (2) mills ($2.00 for each $l,OOO.OO valuation as  equalized) 
for the years 1993-1994, inclusive, to b e  used only for road maintenance and improvement 
with i n J u n iata Towns hip? 

CI YES 0 NO 

STATE PROPOSAL C 
A PROPOSAL TO EXEMPT PROPERTY FROM A 
PORTION OF SCHOOL OPERATING PROPERTY 
TAXES AND LIMIT ANNUAL INCREASES IN ALL 
PROPERTY TAX ASSESSMENTS 
The proposed constitutional amendment would: 
1) Exempt property from the following propor- 

tion of school operating property taxes: 10% in 
1993; 15% in 1994; 20% in 1995; 25% in 1966 
and 30% in following years. 

2) Require the State to reimburse school districts 
for the property tax exemptions described in 
paragraph (1) above, up to the millage rate levied 
in 1991. 

3) Limit for each parcel of property (excluding new 
construction) the annual assessment increase 
to 3% or the rate of inflation, whichever is less, 
until the property is sold. Whenever property is 
sold, adjust assessment according to current 
market value of property. 
Should this proposal be  adopted? 

0 YES c1 NO 

STATE PROPOSAL D 
A PROPOSAL TO AMEND MICHIGAN’S AUTO IN- 
SURANCE LAWS 
The proposed legislative amendment would: 
1) Reduce auto insurance rates by 20% (average) 

for policyholders accepting $250,000 in personal 
injury protection. Extra coverage made available 
at added cost. 

2) Require profit refunds when underwriting profits 
exceed 5% 

3) Permit insurance Commissioner to waive com- 
pany’s obligation to reduce rates or refund pro- 
fits if needed to assure fair rate of return. 

4) Allow policyholders to waive residual liability 
insurance. 

5) Limit fees paid to health care providers. 
6) Allow rate reduction for five consecutive claim- 

free years. 
7) Require coordination of benefits with health 

insurance. 
8) Limit right to sue by setting higher standards for 

injuries and prevent drivers over 50% at fault 
from collecting damages. 

Should the proposal be adopted? 
u YES ri NO 

TUSCOLA COUNTY 
COLUMBIA TOWNSHIP PROPOSAL 

Shall the Township of Columbia levy (1.5) one and one-half mills ($1.50 per $1,000.00 of 
State Equalized valuation) for 4 years, 1993 to 1996 inclusive, for the purpose of road con- 
struction, repairs, improvement and maintenance? 

J YES L-1 NO 

ALSO TO VOTE ON ANY OTHER PROPOSALS WHICH MAY APPEAR ON THE BALLOT AT THAT TIME 

I, Patricia Donovan, Treasurer of Tuscola County, Michigan, hereby certify that as of September 28, 1992, the records of this office indicate that the total of 
all voted increases over and above the tax limitations established by the Constitution of Michigan, in any local unit of government aff.ecting the taxable property 
located in Tuscola County, Michigan, is as follows: 

ASSESSMENT JURISDICTION OPER. DE8T BLDG. SP. EQUC. VO. EMJC OPER. SENIOR ROAD BRIDGE MEDKARE RD. IMP. TOTAL 
VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED VOTED 

COLUMBIA TOWNSHIP 
Akron-Fairgrove Schoal 23.87 

Car0 SchoQl 24.44 2.14 
Cass City School 21.90 0.85 

Unionville-Seb School 25.50 4.00 
J U N I ATA TOWNSHIP 

Owengage School 25.99 2 .oo 

Akron-Fairgsove School 23.87 
Car0 School 24.44 2.14 

Reese School 22.50 3.00 
Vassar School 22.50 1.18 

2.58 1.74 1.40 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 32.40 
2.58 1.74 1.40 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 35.11 
2.58 1.74 1.40 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 31.28 
2.58 1.74 1.40 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 36.52 
2.58 1.74 1.40 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 38.03 

2.58 1.74 1 .oo 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 32 .OO 
2.58 1.74 1 .oo 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 34.71 
2.58 1.74 1 .oo 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 33.63 
2.58 1.74 1 .oo 0.20 0.89 0.49 0.25 0.98 31.81 

A Dated this 28th day of September, 1992 

- .  .~ 

The Polls for the said election will be open from 7 o’clock a.m., and remain open until 8 o’clock p.m., of the same election day. 

TUSCOLA COUNTY CLERK 
~ 

AKRON TOWNSHIP 
Pauline Gainforth, Clerk 
6800 N. Vassar Road 
Unionville, MI 48767 

ALMER TOWNSHIP 
William A Reavy, Clerk 
2866 N Unionville Road 
Akron, MI 48701 

ARBELA TOWNSHIP 
Mary C Warren, Clerk 
8935 Birch Run Road 
Millington, MI 48746 

COLUMBIA TOWN SH I P 
Janice Vogel, Clerk 
6925 Colling Road 
Unionville, MI 48767 

DAYTON TOWNSHIP 
Opal Hunter, C l e r k  
3395 Shay Lake Rd 
Mayville, MI 48744 

DENMARK TOWNSHIP 
Rachel S. Kamm, Clerk 
3099 VanBuren Road 
Reese, MI 48757 

ELKLAND TOWNSHIP 
Norma Wallace, Clerk 
4693 North Seeger Street 
Cass City, MI 48726 

ELLINGTON TOWNSHIP 
Frederick J. Bardwell, Jr. Clerk 
2979 Dutcher Road 
Caro, MI 48723 

ELMWOOD TOWNSHIP 
Elaine Seibel, Clerk 
6803 Colwood Road 
Gagetown, MI 48735 

FAIRGROVE TOWNSHIP 
Karen R .  Goodchild, Clerk 
3076 West Gilford Road 
Caro, MI 48723 

FREMONT TOWNSHIP 
Rita Talsma, Clerk 
6112 Lincoln Road 
Mayville, MI 48744 

GILFORD TOWNSHIP 
Robert Beach, Clerk 
3405 North Bradford Road 
Fairgrove, MI 48733 

I N D I AN FI E L DS TOWNSHIP 
Samuel W. Anderson, Clerk 
111 Joy Street 
Caro, MI 48723 

JUNIATA TOWNSHIP 
Thomas A. Hile, Clerk 
1726 South Ridge Road 
Caro, MI 48723 

KINGSTON TOWN SH I P 
Victoria Wolak, Clerk 
2083 South Kingston Road 
Kingston, MI 48741 

~~ ~- 

KOYLTON TOWNSHIP 
James R. Borek, Clerk 
5019 S. Phillips Road 
Clifford, MI 48727 

MILLINGTON TOWNSHIP 
Clayton Beagle, Clerk 
8553 State Stree t  
Millington, MI 48746 

NOVESTA TOWNSHIP 
Nursie L. Kloc, Clerk 
6195 Severance Road 
Cass City, MI 48726 

TUSCOLA TOWNSHIP 
Mary Lou Blasius, Clerk 
7343 Buell Road 
Vassar, MI 48768 

VASSAR TOWNSHIP 
Betty Kochalka, Clerk 
6205 South State Road 
Vassar, M I 48768 

~ 

WATERTOWN TOWNSHIP 
Barbara Marr, Clerk 
1101 Barnes Road 
Fostoria, MI 48435 

WELLS TOWNSHIP 
Marion Huff, Clerk 
2555 Caro, Murray MI 48723 Road 

WISNER TOWNSHIP 
Larry D. Beach, Clerk 
3733 North Bradford Road 
Fairgrove, MI 48733 

CITY OF VASSAR 
Dianne B. Johnston, Clerk 
287 East Huron 
Vassar, MI 48768 
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Veteran 4-H leader says 

‘Couldn ‘t put a 
worth OIZ 4mH’ 

In all her years as a 4-H 
.adult leader, Virginia 
Auslander has seen trends, 
as well as volunteers, come 
and go. 

q But one thing has never 
changed, she says, and that’s 
the worth of 4-H. 

“I couldn’t put a value on 
it,’’ remarked the Decker 
p e a  woman, who was re- 
Eently recognized for 40 
years of service as a 4-H 
volunteer. “To me, a4-H kid 
is, well, special,” she said. 
“Later on i t  shows, when 
they come back and thcy 
say, ‘I learned this and I 
learned that in 4-H’.” 
“I’ve heard i t  said that a kid 

who’s in 4-H is not as apt to 
get into trouble,” Auslander 
continued, adding she 
agrees. “They’ve got some- 
thing to think about and 
work for.” 

The Shabbona native got 
her own start in 4 - H  at the 
age of 14 as a member of the 
Laing 4-H Club in 1931, 
which marked the Sanilac 
County 4-H Fair’s inaugural 
year. 
A us lan der remained active 

with the club for only a 
couple years, returning to 4- 
H 20 years later as an adult 
leader and head of the Ever- 
green Guys and Gals 4-H 
Club. 

“We had quite a club at tha t  
time,” she recalled. Thcre 
were always a good dozen 
kids involved, shc said, in-  
cluding her daughter, Janct. 

Auslandcr and hcr hus- 
band, Clair, entertaincd 
weckly club mcctings at 
their home. Her specially 
was cooking and baking, 
which were among thc 
staples of 4 - H  activitics in 
the earlier years. 

Today, youths can com- 
pete in a wide varicty of 
projects ranging from gar- 
dening to pockct pcts to 
buymanship. “There’s cvc- 
rything now a days. You 
can’t imagine,” Auslander 
remarked, “whereas i t  uscd 
to bc cattlc and clothing and 
cooking - that’s all wc 
had.” 

The 4 - H  vctcran has fond 
memorics of hcr days a s  a 
leader, including trips to thc 
state show in Lansing and 
othcr 4 - H  outings. 

At hcr homc, she said, club 
mcmbcrs “would makc 
cookies, pics, cakes, and I ’ d  
let thcm gct suppcr.” Once 
thcy wcre finished, i t  was 
down to the river for sotric 
fun, a favoritc activity. 

“I had a lot of mothcrs say, 
‘I wouldn’t Ict thosc kids 
mcss up m y  kitchcn the way 
you do’,” Auslandcr said. 

Others Get Quick Results With 
The Chronicle’s Classified Ads- 

You Will Too! 

ACTION PACKED CARDS 
~ r> Baseball 

and 
Football 

on Card Sets 
THIS WEEK ONLY 

20 to4OYo OFF 
99c 

Tape Rental 

I NEW RELEASES I 
Folks 

Batman Returns 
Basic Instinct 
Cutting Edge 
NO DEPOSIT 

TAPE PLAYER RENTAL 
NO MEMBERSHIP FEE 

“But i t  ncvcr bothcrcd mc. 
(The mcss) will clcan up.” 

Shc wasn’t rilonc in hcr 
cnthusiasm. “(Clair) was a 
lcadcr in horscs for ycrus 
and, of coursc, our son was a 
mcrnbcr. Hc h a d  horscs,” 
shc addcd. 
Thc Auslandcrs’ daughter, 

Janct, was a 4 - H  mcmbcr for 
10 years, followcd by 25 
ycars as il Icadcr. All 5 of 
thcir grandchi ldrcn wcrc 
also longtimc4-H mcmbcrs. 

Auslandcr smilcd. “Wc 
lugged i\ lot of kids iwound” 
ovcr thc ycars, shc com- 
mcntcd, and i t  was a lot of 
fun. “You havc to cnjoy 
working with kids. YOU 
havc to tx a kid a t  hcart, I 

Her irivolvcrncnl in 4-H 
cxpandcd to othcr arcas, 
including serving as supcr- 
intendent of foods and  cloth- 
ing at thc county fair, and iis 
;I mcrnbcr of thc 3-H Coun- 
cil. 

Latcr, shc joincd thc 
county Iliir board, rind shc’s 
continucd to bc a n  activc 
mcrnbcr f o r  morc t h a n  20 
ycars. 

During thai tirnc, shc has 
sccn many  changcs, cspc- 
cially among youths.  Kids 
arc joining 4 - t i  :I[ yoiingcr 
agcs thcsc ,claps, which is 
good, shc said. “ I  th ink  t h a t  
it’s tiardcr today to kccp kids 
i n  4-H bccause thcrc arc too 
m a n y  oihcr things”out thcrc 
to do. “So many arc work- 
ing.” 

That’s not to say 4 - H  has 
outlived its usefulness. 
“This was the best year we 

had,” she pointed out, add- 
ing thcre are more than 
1,000 kids participating in4- 
H in the county, an increase 
ovcr recent years. 

The interest doesn’t sur- 
prise Auslandcr, who says4- 
H gives youth practical ex- 
pcricnce as well as guidance 
that stays with them as they 
enter thcir adult years. 
“This is why I think it’s so 

important to get these little 
kids interested,” she said. 
Many 4-H members, she 
added, come back later and 
offer thcir time as leaders. 

Auslandcr indicated she 
still enjoys working with 4- 
H youth at the fidir, as well as 
cooking at various events 
and planting flowers at the 
hiirgrounds (she put in more 
than 50 flats this year). 
Clair, mcanwhile, continues 
to serve as carctaker of the 
fairgrounds during the sum- 
mer months. 
“Your tirnc isn’t your own 

when you’re in 4-H, but I’ve 
ncvcr regretted a day I’ve 
bccn in it,” she said. 
(‘1 cnjoycd it. I still do,”she 

concludcd. “It’s quite re- 
warding.” 

guess.” 

VIRGINIA AUSLANDER, Decker, has invested 40 years in 
4-H as a volunteer adult leader, 4-H.Council member and fair 
board member. A member of the Laing 4-H Club in the early 
1930s, she still has the certificates she received for completing 
canning and clothing project requirements (above). 

$50,000 grant announced 

Ag safety effort continuing 
The “Farming Safely in the 

Thumb” program will con- 
tinue, thanks to a $50,000 
grant from thc SETDivision 
of the Michigan Department 
of Labor, announced Dale 
Hippensteel, administrator/ 
health officer for the Huron, 
Sanilac and Tuscola county 
health departments. 

The tri-county area has 
cxperienced sevcral ag-re- 
lated fatalities and numer- 

ous injuries this summer. 
The rate of occupational 
deaths in agriculture in the 
U.S. rose from 42/100,000 
workers in 1990 to 44/ 
100,000 workers in 1991 
nation-wide, according to 
the National Safety Council. 
This rate is almost 5 times 
greater than the average of 
all industries. 

“Farming Safely in the 
Thumb will offer safety 
education/training pro- 

grams for the entire agricul- 
tural community. The pro- 
gram is implemented by 
Geraldine R. Smith and 
Sandra Koglin, both of 
whom may be reached at the 
Huron County Health De- 
partmen t. 

Some of the activities 
planned for 1992-93 in- 
clude: 

4-H Tractor and Farm 
Machinery Safety Courses 
for youths IO years and older 

“First-on-the-Scene” 

Farm Safety Camps for 
Chemical Bank reports w o r ~ s  

3rd quarter income up youthsages9to Classroom Safety l2  Pres- 
Gilbcrt A. Currie, chair- 

man of Chemical Financial 
Corporation, reported third 
quarter 1992 net income of 
$3,541,000, which was 
$3 1 1,000 or 9.6 percent, 
over the $3,230,000 earned 
in the third quarter of 199 1 .  
Net income for the 9 months 
cndcd Sept. 30, was 
$IO,@ 1,000, up 18.2 pcr- 

Agriculture 
tour is in 

cent over the $9,045,000 
earned in the comparable 
1991 period. 

On a per share basis, net 
income for the current quar- 
ter was $0.8 1, a 6.6 percent 
increase over 1991 third 
quarter earnings of $0.76. 
Per share earnings for the 9 
months ended Sept. 30, 
1992, were $2.46, which 
represents a 16.0 percent 
increase over the $2.12 per 
share earned in the first 9 
months of 199 1. 

entations 

farmers 
Quarterly newsletter to 

Farm Women’s Seminars 
Public Awareness Cam- 

paign 
Safety videos, educational 

materials, safety decals and 
group safety presentations 
are all available to any size 
group or individual. 
More information is avail- 

able by contacting Koglin or 
Smith at 269-9721 or 800- 
833-8550. 

Agricultural tourism has 
the potential to help farmers 
and rural businesses diver- 
sify. A recent study in Wis- 
consin found that city 
people are especially inter- 
ested in farm tours, picnics 
and seeing how local prod- 
ucts are made. , 

Dr. Judi Ecker D.P.M. 
-POD I AT R I ST- 

Poor Circulation? A Simple 
Walk Can Be A Major Hurdle ... 

When clogged arteries 
affect the heart, it’s call 
“coronary artery disease.” 
When the legs and feet are 
affected, it’s known as “pe- 
ripheral vascular disease.” 
When the vessels carrying 
blood to and from the legs 
become blocked, pain or 
loss of function may follow. 
One of the first symptoms 

of circulatory disease may 
be ” in t 8 r mi t t e n t c I a u d ic a - 
ti o n . ” This conditio n al I o w s 
people to walk only short 
distances before experi- 
encing pain in the muscles. 
After a brief rest the pain 
stops and walking can be 
resumed. Higher vascular 
obstruction, such as in the 
aorta may cause pain in t he 
buttocks and upper thighs 
and frequently is accom- 
panied by impotence. 

Risk factors for arterial 
obstructive disease in- 
clude: smoking, hyperten- 
sion, high cholesterol, high 
triglylcerides, age and ac- 
tivity level. Diabetes plays 
an enormous role in this 
disease; making periodic 
visits to a Podiatrist crucial! 

Fortunately, there is a 
relatively simple, non-inva- 
sive test which can be per- 
formed in the doctor’s of- 
fice. The test only takes 
30-40 minutes and can 
give the physician great in- 
sight on one’s circulatory 
status. 

If you feel you may be 
experiencing the effects of 
inadequate blood flow, call 
the physicians at North- 
eastern Foot Clinic for an 
examination. 

NORTHEASTERN FOOT CLINIC 
4672 Hill St., Cass City 

872-4327 

Program offers 
help to area’s 
disabled farmers 

Farmers in Michigan’s 
Thumb area who have 
physical disabilities that 
preclude or diminish their 
ability to farm can get help 
to stay in farming. 

A pilot program called the 
Michigan AgrAbility Pro- 
gram (MAP) is offering to 
help farmers in Bay, Huron, 
Saginaw, Sanilac and Tus- 
cola counties remain on the 
job. 

The program is being of- 
fered by the Michigan State 
University cooperative Ex- 
tension Service and the 
Easter Seal Society of’ 
Michigan, Inc. 

MAP, funded under a spe- 
cial provision of the 1990 
Farm Bill, is open to farm- 
ers, farm family members 
and farm workers who have 
had an amputation or suffer 
from paralysis, heart dis- 
ease, arthritis, joint or lung 
disease, multiple sclerosis, a 
severe vision problem or 
some other disabling condi- 
tion. The program will help 
any farmer or farm worker 
who, has a disability, 
whether it  is the result of an 
injury or an illness. 

“In the past, many disabled 
fqmers or workers were 
forced off the farm because a 
disability was too painful or 
made traditional farming 
too difficult,” said Howard 
Doss, MSU Extension agri- 
cultural safety specialist. 
“However, with today’s 
technology, farm equipment 
and tools can be tailored to 
fit the individual farmer’s 
need, making it possible to 

ties.” 
MAP director Karen Del- 

bosque said under the provi- 
sions of the 1990 Farm Bill, 
MAP can provide educa- 
tional assistance but not the 
equipment needed to over- 
come or reduce the disabil- 
ity. There may be other 
sources for funding for 
needed equipment, she said. 

Cass City 
students get 
a free book 
Recently, all second grad- 

ers in the Cass City school 
system received a free book 
of their choice through a 
Reading is Fundamental 
program sponsored locally 
by the Cass City Branch of 
the American Association of 
University Women. 

In her presentation, Susan 
Dyer, chairman of the local 
project, pointed out that by 
learning to read, the children 
would be able to read direc- 
tions in craft project books, 
cookbooks, drawing books 
and those with experiments. 
Directions were ’followed, 
with class members helping, 
to make a Clifford puppet 
for their class. Tahani 
Khoury assisted in the distri- 
bution. 

Anyone interested in help- 
ing with a future RIF distri- 
bution is encouraged to con- - -  

overcome many disabili- tact Susan Dyer. 

Notice 
The Regular November 

meeting of the Cass City 
Village Council will be 
held November 30, 1992 
at 7 :OO p.m. at the Munici- 
pal Building, 6737 Church 
Street, Cass City, Michi- 
gan. 

Joyce A. LaRoche 
Village Clerk 

Some people say heating your addition 
or renovation is a real bear. 

Not when you add Su pplemental Resistance Heat rn 

4 

Why redo your entire home heating system when you remodel or add on? Supplemental 
Resistance Heat is an affordable, flexible, easy-to-install alternative. 
Supplemental Resistance Heat keeps hard-to-heat areas warm and comfortable. In addition, 
you can control the heat in specific rooms without affecting the temperature of your entire 
home. It’s safe, clean, quiet, economical heating. 
For even more savings, ask about Detroit Edison’s special rate options and incentives. 
Find out more from Detroit Edison’s Heating and Cooling Information Center. 

1-800-833-2786 

Edison 
A good part of p u r  life. 
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Bulldogs collect wins 
12,13; Caseville next 
The Owen-Gage Bulldogs 

collected wins number 12 
and 13 last week, easily 
defeating Port Hope and 
Kingston in North Central 
Thumb League play. 

Coach Dean Roller’s 
cagers withstood a poor first 
half against visiting King- 
ston Thursday and posted a 
50-33 victory. 
“This is the second game in 

a row we’ve had a poor first 
half,” said Roller after the 
win. 
Despite shooting only 20% 

(8-40), the Bulldogs cap- 
tured a 20-16 lead at the 
intermission as Angie 
Wildman and Jill Susalla 

each scored 2 baskets plus a 
charity toss during the open- 
ing half. 
Owen-Gage got on track in 

thc third period as Lori 
Ondrajka drove the lane for 
9 of her game high 14 points, 
which helped the hosts to a 
19 point edge by the 
quarter’s end. 

Roller credited his team 
defense, which held the 
Cardinals to a single basket 
by Penny Caverly in the 
third frame, for the win. 

Besides Ondrajka, Mich- 
elle Tkacz and Cadi Salcido 
scored in double digits for 
the winners, posting 12 and 
10 tallies, respectively. 

Kingston was led by 
Melanie Kramer’s 11 
points. 

Earlier in the week the 
Bulldogs traveled to Port 
Hope and trounced the Blue 

As customary, senior 
Tkacz paced the winners 
with 17 tallies as the Bull- 
dogs put this game away 
quickly, leading 13-4 after 
one quarter and 33- 15 enter- 
ing the final stanza, when 
Roller cleared his bench. 

Owen-Gage’s Salcido was 
the only other player from 
either team to finish in 
double figures, netting 10. 

The Bulldogs should have 

Stars, 45-26. 

Victory 

little trouble closing out 
their November schedule 
with a win Thursday as they 
travel to mect winless 
Caseville. 

OWEN-GAGE - L. On- 
drajka 6 (2-4) 14; M. Tkacr, 
6 (0) 12; A. Wildman 3 (1-2) 
7; C. Salcido 3 (4-6) 10; A. 
Martindale 1 (0) 2; J. Susalla 
2 (1-4) 5 .  
TOTALS - 21 (8-16) 50. 

KINGSTON - P. Cavcrly 
1 (0-1) 2; M. Kramer 5 (1 -5) 
11; S .  Campbell 3 (0) 6; C. 
Gilmore 3 (0) 6; J. Chappcl3 
(0-1) 6; A. Wroubel 1 (0) 2. 
TOTALS 16 (1-7) 33. 

Owen-Gage evens season mark, 4-4, 
with 36-22 win over Taylor Lite-Life 

Coach Arnie Besonen’s 
Owen-Gage Bulldogs re- 
turned to the win column 
Friday with a 36-22 victory 
over Taylor Lite-Life. It was 
the ‘Dogs’ first triumph 
since defeating Peck back 
on Sept. 18. 

“Feels good to win again. 
Mike Tkacz led the offense 
running north and south 
rather than east and west,” 
said Besonen. 
Tkacz had a career outing, 

gaining 135 yards on 11 
carries and leading the de- 
fensive effort with 6 tackles 
and one quarterback sack. 
The Bulldogs will wrap up 

their 1992 season Friday 
when they entertain North 
Branch Wesleyan. The 
game is rated a tossup as 
both schools are 4-4 on the 
year and field strong defen- 
sive units. North Branch is 

led by all around performer 
Arron Ferrier. 

Matt Mandich, who col- 
lected just 39 yards rushing, 
scored 3 touchdowns and 
one 2-point conversion, 
while Joe Tkacz added 4 
point-after kicks for the 
winners, who built a 36-8 
lead late in the final frame. 
The Bulldogs’ other points 

came on a one-yard run by 
quarterback Ryan 
Radabaugh to start the scar- 
ing parade and Mike Mer- 
chant, who jetted 15 yards 
for the visitors’ only score in 
the second quarter. 

The Crusaders’ points 
wcre accounted for by Chris 
Shimanek, who scored on 
runs of one and 3 1 yards and 
on a 10-yard pass reception 
from Steve Frost. Shimanek 
also tallied the losers’ lone 
2-point conversion with 

Michigan milk production 
I 
* up by 112 million pounds 

Dairy herdsin Michigan 
produced 442 pounds of 
milk during September, up 
112 million pounds from a 
year ago, according to the 
Federal/S tate Michigan 
Agricultural Statistics Serv- 

Space 
crops 
The Dec. 15 Space Shuttle 

mission will include an ex- 
periment that hopes to dis- 
cover if plants are capable of 
reproduction and growth in 
outer space. Scientists are 

ice. 
Milk per cow averaged 

1,300 pounds, increasing 35 
pounds from a year ago. The 
Michigan dairy herd was 
estimated at 340,000 head, 
unchanged from September 
1991. 

The preliminary value of 
milk sold averaged $13.40 
per hundredweight (cwt.) in 
September, 50 cents more 
than last year. Mid-month 
,September slaughter cow 
prices averaged $46.50 per 
cwt., $1.30 less than the 
previous year. 

Dairy manufacturing 

only 52 seconds till the inter- 
mission, where they trailed, 

Besonen credited his de- 
fense for the win. 

“Our defense held us in 
there just like it has all year 
long.” 

Besides Tkacz, hard hit- 
ting Eric Susalla collected 6 
stops and Austin Brinkman 
was iq on 5 tackles and had 
one fumble recovery. 

2 1-8. 

OG - TAYLOR 

OG T 
First downs 13 11 
Rushing attempts 43 31 
Rushing yards 271 134 
Passes complete 1 3 
Pass attempts 2 5  
Passing yards 14 16 
Passes int. by 0 0  
Fumbles lost 1 3’ 
Penal ties 9 5  
Penalties, yds. 105 70 

BULLDOG LORI ONDRA JKA races toward 2 of her game 
high 14 tallies against Kingston in Thursday’s NCTLcontest. 
Trailing the play is Carli Salcido. 

studying the effects of plants in MichirranDroduceYd 
weightlessnesson thedevel- i .6 million poinds’of butter 
OPment of seeds. NASA has in August, 9 percent more 
planstouseplantstoprovide than a year ago. Ice cream 
food and to clean the atmos- output totaled 3.0 million 
Phere f o r a S m ~ u t s  in space gallons, 2 percent more that 
for extended periods. August 1991. soccer tournament . 

CHAMPIONS I Cass City Special Oylmpians Geoffrey 
Morgan (left) and David McPhail proudly display their gold 
medals won recently in Warren, Mich., during the state 

JV CHEERLEADERS have worked hard this season. Front 
row, from left: Karla Kidney, Melissa Keller, Jennifer Lam- 
ing. Second row: Coach Chris Weippert, Becky Perkins, 
Diana Kocan, Erica Frederick. Missing: Charity 
Gascy znski. 

turn 
your house 

into a dream home 

with 
wallcoverings by 

Kinney Wallpaper 30%OFF- 
6544 MAIN ST. - CASS CITY 872-2445 

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

Environment 
issues won’t 
go away 
The president of the Michi- 

gan Farm Bureau said that 
he expects environmental 
issues will continue to pres- 
sure the agricultural indus- 
try, regardless of who wins 
the presidential election. 

Jack Lmrie, speaking on 
the Michigan Farm Radio 
Network “Ag Focus” pro- 
gram, said wetlands preset- 
vation will draw particu1A.r 
attention over the next few 
years. 

“On wetlands, Farm Bu- 
reau has taken an activist 
position in trying to protect 
the rights of farmers to farm 
their own land,” he said. 
“The issue of protecting pri- 
vate property rights has been 
on our front burner for sev- 
eral years. The sole future of 
our agricultural industTy 
hangs in the balance over the 
resolution of questions 
about wetlands as well as 
issues like chemical and 
pesticide use.” 

Laurie said Gov. Clinton 
has not made agriculture :a 
major focus of the carrl- 
paign. 

“However, one of the few 
things we’ve seen refer- 
enced in this campaign that 
has a direct impact on agri- 
culture is Gov. Clinton‘s 
support for individuals hav- 
ing the right to file suits 
against farmers if they be- 
lieve that the bureaucrats 
who are charged with en- 
forcing environmental rules 
and regulations are ndt 
doing a good enough job,” 
Laurie said. 

Ill 
111 Elect Delores Gangler 

Tuscola County Clerk 
Republican Candidate 

“I feel that on the job experience 
is the greatest quality a candidate 

can have. My many years of 
experience and dedication are 
truly proven qualities to serve 
YOU the public. I know what it 

means to serve the public. I have 
for over 12 years and enjoyed 

every minute of it. “ 

Ill 

“A FRESH NEW APPROACH WITH OLD FASHIONED EXPERIENCE.” 
DELORES GANGLER’S EXPERIENCE MEASURES UP: 

Ill 
12 1/2 years experience in the County Clerk’s Office 
Deputy County Clerk 8 years 
Has knowledge of the internal operation of the County Clerk‘s Office 
Has attended numerous seminars and workshops sponsored by the County Clerk‘s 

Delores will be YOUR full time County Clerk 
Has Bi-partisan support 
Dedicated to and enjoys serving the public 
Lifetime resident of Tuscola County 

Association and State Court Administrative Office 

YOU CAN’T BUY EXPERIENCE BUT YOU CAN VOTE FOR IT!! 
”Your support on November 3rd will be appreciated. ” 

Paid lor by Committee to Eled Delores Gangler. 

Ben Franklin r- 
I m II 

Craft Classes 

Friday, November 6 - 6-8 p.m. 
CREATIVE TWIST BASKET 

Saturday, November 21 - 10 a.m.42 noon $ 
DAISY KINGDOM SWEAT SHIRTS !i 

Sat., Oct. 31 - - - Join Us  For Some Witches Brew! ’I; 
NOW OPEN 8:30 a.m. - Mon. - Fri. 

4 

1* 

c 
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Mark Nov. 13 on calendar 

Hawks revive hoop title 
chances with Marlette upset 

bucket and a free throw. 
But Storm fouled out and 

Marlette started closing the 
gap. With 12:38 left in the 
game, they trailed by just 2 
points. Kelli VanVlict con- 
verted a pair of free throws, 
Darcie Monroe hit a bucket 
and a free throw and Jodi 
LaRoche added a rebound 
bucket to preserve the win. 

Coach Marty Daniel said 
that Barb Kelley played her 
best game of the year. She 
controlled the boards all 
night, he added. Daniel also 
was pleased with the ball 
handling of the team against 
the Red Raider press as 
Storm, Schember, Monroe 
and VanVliet did a fine job 
of not allowing pointsoff the 
Marlettepress. It wasagame 
played with tournament 
type intensity by both teams. 

Cass City shot 42 percent 
from the field and 56 percent 

from the h u l  I m .  Marlette 
shot 33 percent from the 
field and 52 perccn t from the 
charity circle. 
Storm, with 13 points, and 

Schember and Barb Kelley, 
with 11 each, led the Hawks. 
Carrie Ross netted 18 for 
Marlette. 

Cass City jumped in tront 
in the first quarter, 15-6, and 
at the half there was nodoubt 
about the outcome. Cass 
City was in front, 26-10. 

Daniel used his starters 
sparingly in the last half and 
his top scorers, Schember 
and Storm, were on the 
bench in the last quarter. 
Cass City shot just 38 per- 

Mark your calendars. Fri- 
day, Nov. 13, the Blue Bay 
Conference basketball 
championship will likely be 
decided. Provided that Cass 
City can get by the Lakers 
Thursday, the title will be 
determined on the final 
night of the regular season, 
when Marlette plays the 
Hawks in Cass City. 

That delightful turn of 
events became possible 
when Cass City defeated 
Marlette last Thursday for 
the first time in 3 games, 46- 
4 1. Cass City trails Marlette 
by a game and if form is 
followed, the best that the 
team will be able to do is 
gain a share of the champi- 
onship. That's a big im- 
provement, as Cass City's 
chances appeared remote 
after losing the first 2 games 
against Marlette. 
The win over Marlette was 

a reverse over what hap- 
pened when the teams met 
€or the first time at Marlette. 
In that game Cass City fell 
behind early and trailed all 
game, then rallied to put the 
game up for grabs before 
losing by a point, 38-37. 

This meeting the Hawks 
bounded in front after the 
opening minutes behind 
their 2 scoring aces, Jodi 
Schember and Jenny "Thun- 
der" Storm. In the first half 
Storm scored 10and Schem- 
:ber, 5, to account for 15 of 
:the team's 19 points. The 
:Red Raiders kept pace in the 
:half behind Carrie Ross, 
:who scored 5 field goals. At 
:the intermission Cass City 
:was ahead by apoint 19-18. 
:: The Hawks appeared to 
:have the game under control 
:as they stretched the lead to 
110 points as Schember 
$ashed a pair of 3-pointers 
:and Barb Kelly scond a 

1 

I 

cent from the floor and 44 
percent from the foul line. 
The Hatchets shot a miser- 
able 21 percent from the 
floor and 52 percent from 
the foul line. 
The only player in double 

figures for the night was 
Storm, with 12 points. No 
Bad Axe player scored more 
than 6. BAD AXE GAME 

-- 

CASS CITY- 
MARLETTE 

CASS CITY - J. Schember 
1-3 (0) 11;  J. VanVliet 0 (2) 
2; D. Monroe 3-0 (1) 7; J. 
Storm 6-0 (1) 13; J. LaRoche 
1-0 (0) 2; B. Kelly50 (1) 11. 

MARLETTE - B. Stoick 
2-0 (1) 5;  T. Schubach 1-0 
(0) 2; C. Dudek 1 - 1 (1) 6; N. 
Ruggles 3-0 (2) 8; C. Ross 9- 
0 (0) 18; N. Cilk 1-0 (0) 2. 

TOTALS - 16-3 ( 3 4 6 .  

TOTALS - 17-1 (4) 41. 

Daniel was far from 
pleased with his team's per- 
formance Tuesday, Oct. 20, 
saying that his charges 
failed to play with desire or 
intensity. Much of that 
probably stemmed from the 
opposition. The Hawks 
played Bad Axe at home and 
the Hatchets this year sim- 
ply do not have the talent to 
compete with Cas  City. 
The Hawks registered their 
third decision of the year 
over the visitors, 38-18. 

CASS CITY - J. Schember 
1-1 (0) 5; K. VanVliet 1-0 
(1) 3; D. Monroe4-0 (1) 9; J. 
Storm 5-0 (2) 12; A. White 
1-0(0)2;B. Kelley2-0(0)4. 
TOTALS - 14-1 (4) 35. 

BAD AXE - K. Rambo 1-0 
(0) 2; J. Chumbler 1-0 (0) 2; 
D. Rubringer 3-0 (0) 6; K. 
Gorney 1-0 (0) 2; H. Geiger 
2-0 (2) 6. 
TOTALS - 8-0 (2) 18. 

Final game at Brown City 

Hawks roll over Marlette 
to finish 2nd in Blue Bay 
The Cass City Red Hawks 

will wind up the season Fri- 
day with a non-league game 
against Brown City and it 
will conclude a fairly suc- 
cessful year for the grid 
squad. 
The Hawks ran roughshod 

over Marlette, 29-8, last 
Friday and now have a 5-3 
record, 4-2 in the Blue Bay 
League, and a second place 
finish behind undefeated 
Laker High. 

The game was played in 

DARCIE MONROE defends against Danna Rubringer of Bad 
Axe, Waiting for a chance to get into the action is Kelly Gorney. able to give his bench some 

valuable game experience 
preparing for next year in the 
final quarter and a half. 
Marlette went to the air to 
avoid a shutout as Mark 
Lefler tossed to Tim Willis 
for 19 yards and a touch- 
down and then the same 
combo connected for the 2 
extra points. 

On defense, 23 players 
were credited with at least 
one tackle. Greg LeValley 
showed the way with 9 tack- 
les, 3 unassisted. A junior, 

JV WINS 

Cass City's JV squad 
feated Marlette, 28-24. 

de- 

CC M 
First downs 11 9 
Rushing attempts 37 30 
Rushing yards 251 19 
Passescomplete 1 10 
Passing attempts 10 19 
Passing yards 22 168 
Fumbles lost 0 0  
Penalties 10 6 
Penalties, yds. 130 65 

- -  

VOTE 
CHRIS KISCHNICK 

for , 

REGISTER OF DEEDS ideal weather and the Hawks maybe you have played: dominated the visitors from 
the opening whistle. Al- baseball a 

racketball 
volleyball though the Hawks were 
handball picking up yardage in big 

Democrat 
* Associates I2egre.e - Paralegal 

Graduated Summa Cum Laude 
* Two years law office experience 

Experience and knowledge w/legal documents 
Member of the Democratic Party 

* Strong believer in Cooperation and Compromise 

chunks on theground, it was 
the defense that chalked up 
the first of the 4 C a s  City 
touchdowns. John Phillips I intercepted a Hatchet pass in 

but YOU haven't Played 2 the Bad Axe right flat and 
x ran untouched for 27 yards 

kickball 
so ftbal I 

baske tball 
s tic kball 

and football 

ball, until You have 

dlA &d *e,i +A& Tom Davis, was next with 7 
FINAL LEAGUE 

STANDINGS * Dedicated to serving the Public the way government omces should 
"I FIRMLY BELIEVE IN A PUBLIC OFFICE FOR THE PUBLIC, 
A COMMITMENT TO THE CITIZENS OF TUSCOLA COUNTY." 

I t  is time for a change! 
Pdd for by the committee to elect Chris Wschnick, P.O. Box 329. Caro. MI 48723 

BLUE BAY for 17 1 yards, an average of 
13.2 per attempt. Jason CONFERENCE 
Walther ran the ball 7 times W L W L  
for 73 yards for an average of EPBP 6 0  8 0  
10.4. Cass City 4 2 5 3  
It wasn't needed, but Cass Bad Axe 2 4  2 6  

City was ineffective in the Marlette 0 6  1 7  

played 3 and the score. ,E PAINTBALL 5 ThenexttimeCassCity got 
longest of the year for the 
Hawks. 

Morgan added his third 
touchdown of the evening 

. -  . .  . .  
for the nineties, 2 the ball the team scored 2 again. With 5 1 2  left in the 

3 quarter, Jason Morgan 

*entakE score from 9 yards out. 

2 exUa 2 points. 

R.A.M.B.O. x capped a sustained march to 

X Brandon Toner ran for the 
mda.-sMIlemr*adrb.ed-*.lom X The Hawks made it 22-0 

-a awn- warm kmha 

$xxxxxyx~xxxxxxxxI(. 
New books at 

the library 
A clean coffee pot 

makes a great place to 
steam asparagus spears. 

__ ~~~ ~~~ 

IN TODAY'S WORLD YOU DON'T "ASK" 
FOR A PERSON'S VOTE = YOU "EARN" IT 

I f  You prepare yourself, you educate your- 
self and then you give freely of your time, 
talent and energy for the benefit of your 
community" 

A BRILLIANT MADNESS: LIVING WITH MANIC- 
DEPRESSIVE ILLNESS by Patty Duke (non-fiction). With 
medical writer Gloria Hochman, Patty Duke focuses on the 
turbulence that manic-depression has caused her. The text is 
organized in alternating chapters, with Duke providing the 
personal testimony and Hochman detailing the causes, 
diagnosis, and breakthroughs .in treating the illness. Duke 
went through it all - rages, anorexia, alcoholism, divorces, 
suicide attempts. Her children's growing-up years, about 
which she still feels great guilt, were a nightmare. Yet today, 
she has overcome most of her demons and is able to live 
peacefully (with the help from lithium, an understanding 
husband, and a good income). 

RETIRIEMENT 
You can't retire to faraway places if you The Candidate Who Has 

don't have enough money. A-policy from Farm 
Bureau Life Insurance Company of Michigan 
c ~ n  a l ~ ~  be YOU retirement fund. cd today to 
find out more. 
M a h g  y o u  h w r m  FARM "'mq M l W f i A W E  Phone-269-991 1 or 872-51 52 more predictable. - -. ly - - - . YLln 

Rich Ypma 
P.O. Box 40 

Bad Axe, MI 484 13 

Proven Her Value To 
Tuscola County. 

Margie Sattelberg White 

Which Candidate Is Committed To The Future Of Tuscola County? 
THE OTHER CANDIDATE 

- 12 years as Clerk for Circuit Court 
- Since May in Clerk's off ice 

MARGIE WHITE 
Graduate, Cass City High School 
Business Administration Degree 
Including: Management 

Emphasis: Accounting, Computer Operations 
7 yrs. Experience as an Administrator 
Former Executive Director - Caro Chamber of 
Com rnerce 
Former Election Official 
Placement Coordinator - Great Lakes Jr. 
College 
Chairperson, Tuscola County Parks and 
Recreation Corn m ission 
Member, Tuscola County Planning Commission 
President, Tuscola 2001 , Inc. 
Board Member - Tuscola Ccunty Economic 
Development Corp. 
First Female Officer, Caro Rotary Club 
Organizer, Tuscola County Airport Authority 
Member, Tuscola County Co-op. Extension 

Advisory Board 
Member, Tuscola County Recycling Advisory 
Group 
Past Member, Private Industry Council 

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING ********** 

SECOND HONEYMOON: A PIONEERING GUIDE FOR 
REVIVING THE MIDLIFE MARRIAGE by Sonya Rhodes 
(non-fiction). Second honeymoon is filled with well-meas- 
ured advice and the latest research findings on such topics as 
men's need for affiliation and women's contrasting need for 
autonomy at mid-life, the stages a mid-life marriage must 
move through to remain vital (i.e., conflict, repair, and 
renewal), and who is most likely to carry on a mid-life affair 
and what type of marriage can weather such an assault. The 
author shows readers ways to improve their marriages, 
drawing from years of clinical work with couples, and 
interweaves the real-life stories of conflicted couples at 
work on their marriages. 

The Village of Gagetown intends to submit an applica- 
tion for a Rebuild Michigan grant to the Michigan Depart- 
ment of Commerce, Community Development Block 
Grant program. This is a competitive program of which 
$20 million is available for public infrastructure projects. 
The activities must be designed to benefit low/moderate 
income persons. 
The Village of Gagetown intends to apply for a grant of 

$72,000 to be used for the improvement of the Village's 
water system. The Village would supply an $18,000 
contribution to the project. 
A public hearing will be held at 7:OO p.m. on November 

2, 1992 at the Gagetown Municipal Building, located at 
6437 Lincoln Street, Gagetown, Michigan, to provide 
residents an opportunity to submit their views. The 
application includes the Village's community develop- 
ment and housing plan. 

A copy of the application is available at the Clerk's 
Office, 6437 Lincoln Street, Gagetown, Michigan 48735. 

Elery Sontag 
Villaae Clerk 

********** 
TRUMAN by David McCullough (non-fiction). McCull- 
ough takes us through the disappointments of late-blooming 
Harry's teens and twenties: dashed dreams of going to West 
Point or becoming a concert pianist, his (initially) unre- 
quited courtship, and his shackling to the family farm. 
Stubbornly optimistic, he seized the opportunity to join the 
army in 1917, a decision of "his own doing entirely and the 
turning point in his life."That's because while captaining an 
artillcry battery in Europe he fell in with Jim Pendergast, of 
Kansas City's notorious political machine, who afforded 
.Truman his start in local and then state politics. McCullough 
concentrates on his subject's private life and public activity 
on the political stump (as distinct from analysis of domestic 
or foreign policy). He also touches on the whistleetop 
campaign of 1948, and the Byzantine plot to put Truman's 
name on the ticket in 1944. 

-ELECT- 
MARGIE WHITE 

TUSCOLA COUNTY CLERK 
"Because real public semice is more than a 9 to 5 Job. " 
Paid for by the committee to elect Margie White, 101 Weeden Rd., Caro, MI 48723 
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7 face charges in district court *’ 

NORTHEASTERN 
~ FOOTCLINIC 

Dr, Judi Ecker 
Dr. Thomas Bobrowski 

4672 Hill St., Cass City 
872-4327 or 

3592 Center, Essexville 

“YOUR FAMILY FOOT 
CARE CENTER” 

895-8594 

approve 

Crmu Houri: 
M. furs.  f h u f ~ .  Fn 

p 10 5 . Agqmnlmenls W y  
Ahrr  Houri Cat1 
( J l J )  WCJ770 

referendum 

Farm and 
Pet Animals 

Phone 872-2935 
4849 N. Seeger St., Cass City 

I I The following people were Bond was set at $10,000 malicious destruction of facturing marijuana Sept. 28 ; 
arraigned recently on felony and a preliminary exam was police property. in Tuscola Township. 
charges in Tuscola County 
District Court: 

.Richard D. Burks, 37, 
Davison, faces 2 counts of the Camp Tuscola Correc- a.m. 

slated for 9 a.m. Friday. 
*Paul w. Halt, 37, is 

charged with escape from S m a 22- to Mf n USA first degree criminal sexual tional Facility, Care, Sept. 

Bond was set at a combined Bond was set at $4,000. A 
$1 1,000 and a preliminary preliminary exam is set for 9 
exam will be heldFriday at 9 a.m. Friday. 

According to court rec- *Benjamin Grzemkowski. ‘ 

Local pharmacy delivers 
Michigan dairy producers 

have approved a referendum 
for the continuation of the 
Michigan Dairymen’s Mar- 
keting Program, according 
to Bill Schuette, director of 
the Michigan Department of 
Agriculture (MDA). 

A total of 1,407 ballots 
were cast in the referendum 
conducted by MDA Sep- 
tember 21 through Oct. 2. 
Fifty-three ballots were dis- 
qualified. 

Michigan dairy producers 
approved the referendum to 
continue the Michigan 
Dairymen’s Market Pro- 
gram for another 5 years. 
There were 1,185 producers 
voting yes (87.518 per- 
cent) representing 
1,623,168,867.01 pounds 
(89.907) and 169 producers 
voting no (12.481 per- 
cent) representing 
182,202,162.21 pounds 
(10.092 percent). 
The law requires that more 

than 50 percent of the voting 
producers, representing 
ovcr 50 percent of the vol- 
ume of milk produced by 
those voting, must approve 
thc referendum to pass. 

Additional information 
about the referendum may 
be obtained by contacting 
MDA’s Marketing and Mar- 
ket Development Division 
at (517) 373-1058. 

Hurray, 
J 

“no problem.” She took my 
mfne and address and a 
week lakr, “ the Oils were 
delivered to me. in Lansing!!! 
The next time that I am in 

Phoenix, I rim going to go 
back to these stores and tell 
them that I now have all the 
oils I need and that they 
came to me via Cass City, 

Michigan. 
Ironically, they are all 

made by the same company 

Sincerely yours, 

Martha (Martinek) Parsons 
Casa Grande, Ark. 

conduct. 
Bond in the case was set at 

a combined $4,000 and a 
preliminary examination 
has been scheduled for 9 
a.m. Friday. 
Burks is accused of engag- 

ing in sexual penetration 
with 2 victims under the age 
of 13 years, according to 
court records, which state 
the offenses allegedly oc- 
curred in 1989 and Oct. 4 in 
Vassar Township. 

*Gary Romain, 31, 
Snover, was arraigned on 
one charge of second degree 
criminal sexual conduct 
involving alleged sexual 
contact with a victim under 
the age of 13 years in Octo- 
ber 199 1 in Akron. 

24. 
His bond was set at 

$30,000, and a preliminary 
exam will be held Friday at 9 
a.m. Carolyn L. Gohsman, 34, 

Cass City, is charged with 
assault and resisting and 
obstructing a police officer. 
Bond in the case was set at 

$2,000 and preliminary 
exam has been scheduled for 
9 a.m. Friday. 

Court records state Gohs- 
man allegedly assaulted 
Marvin D. Klein, Cass City, 
and resisted arrest by a Cass 
City police officer Oc t. 18 in 
Cass City. 

*Dennis A. Binder, 19, 
Unionville, was arraigned 
on charges of assault and 

Attn: Editor 

There is still a lot to be said 
about “Small-Town, USA,” 
Recently I went out to pur- 
chase cinnamon oil to make 
candy. After making 2 trips 
to Phoenix and being told 
that it was all sold out, I 
asked if it could be special 
ordered, I was told that they 
could only order in “very 
large quantities”. I then 
asked if they could put a few 
bottles under the counter 
and I would pick them up the 
next week. I was told that 
was “against store policy”, 
so I asked if someone could 
call me when the next order 
came in - that too was 
“against store policy.” 

Then I remembered that 
Mike Weaver had furnished 
me with candy oils several 
years ago. I called Coach 
Light Pharmacy. Mike was 
not available, but I talked to 
a very pleasant young lady 
and explained to her what 
had happened to me. I asked 
her if she could mail me 
somecinnamon oil. She said 

Heilig honored for 15 
years of safe driving 

Is George Bush 
really to blame? 

Robert Heilig, a delivery 
driver for United Parcel 
Service, was recently recog- 
nized by the company for 
completing 15 years driving 
without an accident. 

He presently provides de- 
livery service in the Peck/ 
Melvin area. 

Jack Baker, center man- 
ager, presented the 15-year 
safe driving award at a cere- 
mony honoring Heilig’s 
achievement. 
Heilig and his wife, Penny, 

live in Croswell. They have 
2 children, Christena, 5, and. 
Adam, 4. 

Bush Bashers: , best bet. 
Frank 0. Bullock 
Zephyrhills, FL Many people seem to 

blame George-Bush for ev- 
ery problem our nation 
faces. One of them he seems 
to be most criticized for is 
the economy. We all know 
that conditions are not the 
way we would like, but I 
think that we the people are 
greatly at fault for the situ- 
ation. 

RED HAWK HOME 
FOOTBALL = BASKETBALL 

Basketball at Cass City High School 

CASS CITY 
Thurs., Oct. 29 

vs LAKERS 
For at least the last 20 years 

we have been buying more 
and more foreign products. 
Today it is almost impos- 
sible to buy American made 
products in many lines. This 
has brought about the clos- 
ing of thousands of busi- 
nesses and the loss of mil- 
lions of jobs. 

Is George bush to blame for 
this? 

At about the same time, by 
order of the courts, busi- 
nesses began hiring more 
and more women, thus 
flooding the job market. 

Is George Bush to blame 
for this? I think not. 
So I say buy American and 
vote for Bush. He is still your 

CASS CITY VS UtUKtKVILLL 

Nov. 3 
Professional and Business 

Tues., DI R ECTO RY GIRLS’ BASKETBALL 

All aames start at 6 p.m. except Oct. 20 at 6:15 --- ----- 
ACCOUNTANTS 

- 

Tues., Sept. 1 .............. Cass City 56, Mayville 16 

Thurs., Sept. 10 .............. Cass City 44, Lakers 36* 
Tues., Sept. 15 .............. Cass City 55, Reese 30 

Thurs., Sept. 24 ............ Cass City 37, Marlette 38’ 

Thurs., Sept. 3 ............ Cass City 54, Deckerville 42 

Thurs., Sept. 17 Cass City 59, Bad Axe 24* 
Tues., Sept. 22 Cass City 33, Ubly 30 

Tues., Sept. 29 Cass City 56, Mayville 32 

- 
m .......... -DOARDAND 

...................... 
SCHEDULES ................ 

Anderson Tuckey 
Bernhardt & Co., P.C. 
Certified Public Accountanls 

Gary Anderson, CPA - 673-3137 
Robert Tuckey. CPA - 872-3730 

Jerry Bernhardt - 673-3 137 

715 E. Frank SI., Caro, MI 
and 

6261 Church SI., Cass Clry, MI 
Phons 8724668 

Rlchard A. Hall, D.O. 
Osteoparhic Physiuarl 

4674 Hill St. 
Cass City, Michigan 

872-4446 
oflies 8724725 Horn 0724762 

Dr. E,  Paul Lockwood 
Chiropracfic Physician 
Mon., Tues., Wed., Fri. 

VARSITY FOOTBALL Thurs., Oct. 1 .............. Cass City 55, Lakers 38* 
Tues., Oct. 6 .................. Cass City 52, Bad Axe 23* 
Thurs., Oct. 8 ............ Cass City 31, Marlette 40* 

Thurs., Oct. 22 .............. Cass City 46, Marlette 41 

Thurs., Oct. 29 ........................................ Lakers* 
Tues., Nov. 3 ...................................... Deckerville 

Tues., Nov. 10 ............................................ Reese 

Thurs., Oct. 15 ................ Cass City 53, Lakers 48* 
Tues., Oct. 20 ............ Cass City 35, Bgd Axe 18” 

Tues., Oct. 27 ........................................... Ubly 

FrL, Nov. 6 .............................................. Bad Axe* 

Fri., Nov. 13 ............................................ Marlette* 

-------- 
COUNSELING HDC plans 9.12 only I------- - 

DO YOU HAVE.A ’ Phone 872-2765 
DRINKING PROBLEM? 

ALCOHOLlCS ANONYMOUS cas city for Appointment 
AND AL-ANON 

Ever Friday Evening - 8:W p.m. 
GoKShepherd Lutheran Church 

Fri., Sept. 4 ........................ Cass City 20, Caro 18 
Fri., Sept. 11 ................ Cass City 6, EPB Lakers 13 
Fri., Sept. 18 .............. Cass City 20, Bad Axe 12 
Fri., Sept. 25 .................... Cass City 34, Marlette 14 
Fri., Oct. 2 .............. Cass City 16, EPB Lakers 26 
Fri., Oct. 9 .............................. Cass City 6, Ubly 16 
Fri., Oct. 16 .................... Cass City 22, Bad Axe 6 
Fri., Oct. 23 .................... Cass City 29, Marlette 8 
Fri., Oct. 30 .......................................... Brown Citv 

trip for 
area seniors HOON K. 

Surgeon 
JEUNG, M.D. 

Specialist in Stomach 

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 
and AL-ATEEN 

Tuesday Evenings 8:OO p.m. 
St. Pancratius Parish Hall Basemen 

I Cass City 
I 
-I- L --- - - 

HEALTH CARE 
IMMEDIATE 

NON-EMERGENCY 
HEALTH CARE 

$25 fee 
Including ph sician’s fee 

and clln/c rmm 
Cash basis, and we will give 

you a statement. 
No Apphmenf Usually 

Necessary 
6:OO-8:30 p.m. Fridays 
2:30-890 p.m. Saturdays 

10.00 a.m.43:30 p.m. Sunday 

HILLS AND DALES 
HOSPITAL 

-------- 
The Human Development 

Commission has arranged 
for an early Christmas ex- 
cursion to Crossroads Vil- 
lage in Flint Dec. 4. 

and Bowel Problems 
9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Daily 

Saturday - 9 lo 12 noon 
Closed Thursday 

6230 Hospital Drive 
Cass City, MI 48726 
Phone 872,461 1 

872-3490 

*Indicates league game. 
Home games in bold 

SPONSORED BY THESE HAWK BOOSTERS Designed especially for 
areaseniors, theone-day trip 
will feature a tour of the 
village’s country shops and 
sparkling seasonal decora- 
tions, a visit to the opera 
house, a ride on the Huckle- 
berry Railroad, and an old- 
fashioned dinner. 

The round-trip ticket, 
priced at $34 per person, 
also includes motorcoach 
transportation. 

Reservations are required 
for this excursion, and may 
be made by calling Sandi in 
Car0 at (517) 673-4121 or 
Betty in Sandusky at (313) 
648-4497. Full payment is 
due when reservations are 
made. 

Kritzmans ’ Inc. 
Phone 872-3470 Charmont 

Phone 872-4200 S.H. Raythatha, M.D. 
Dr. Ray 

Total Family Care 
4672 Hill St. 

Cass City 
Phone 872-5010 

Off ice Hours: Mon.-Frl. 8-5 

LaFave Steel Supply 
Phone 872-2 163 

Phone 673-1488 . 
Chemical Bank Bay Area 

Phone 872-4355 
Anrod Screen Cylinder Co. 

Phone 872-2 10 1 

Cro wley Chiropracfic & 
Dr. J. L, Crowley, D. C. $# 

e’ Phone 872-424 1 

Phone 872-4884 
Bartniks Sales & Service 

Phofle 872-354 I 
THUMB AREA 

HOME CARE AGENCY 
Nursing, Phxslcal, Occupational 

& s m  Therapy 
Nurw Aides 

Medicare, Medicaid & 
Hue C m s  Certified 

Your h l / y  w e d ,  pivale, 
mporn,  f~llservl~e 
H m e  Care Agency 
1-800.3584749 

Ken Martin Electric, Inc. 
Phone 872-4 1 14 

~- - - 

N.Y. Yun, M.D. 
Physician 8 Surgeon 

Office Hours: 
Mon-Fri. - 9 a m. to 5 p.m. 

Sal. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
6232 bb8phd Drive 

Csar Clty 
Offlcs 8724733 
Re& 8724257 

ThUK. - Closed 

.~ 

Dr. David C. Batzer 11, O.D. 
Phone 872-3404 

Erla’s Food Center 
Phone 872-2191 

People’s Choice 
Phone 872-4346 Fuelgas Division 

of Emro Propane Co. 
Phone 872-2161 

BeARD 
Chrysler- Plymouth- Dodge 

Phone 872 2 184 

Departures for the trip will 
occur from the Sandusky D 
& C parking lot at 1:30 p.m., 
and from the Ames parking 
lot in Car0 at 2 p.m. 

Participants are advised 
that cancellations made af- 
ter Nov. 16 will forfeit half 
of their payment, while 
those cancelling 24 hours or 
less in advance will forfeit 
their entire payment unless a 
replacement can be found. 

Sr. Citizens’ Menu 
Senior citizens are asked to 
make reservations on the day 
of the meal between 8 a.m. 
and 9 a.m. by calling Ann 
Stepka, 8 72 -533 7. 

NOV. 2,4,6 

MONDAY - Pasta with 
meatballs, Italian vegetable 
blend, tossed salad with 
tomato/onion/pcpper, Ital- 
ian bread, applesauce. 

WEDNESDAY - Crispy 
fish, broccoli bake, carrot/ 
raisin salad, biscuit, sliced 
peaches. 

FRIDAY - Tuna noodle 
casserole, peas & carrots, 
cole slaw, rolls, cherry 
chcesecake. 

Phil’s Barber Shop 
Phone 872-4 167 

Allen Wltberspoon 
Nsw Englrnd life 
NEL Growth Fund 
NEC Equity Fund 
NEL tncoms Fund 

Money Markd Soram 

Phone 872-2321 
4615 Oak Cass CiW 

Gazebo Gourmet Coffee Shop 
Phone 872-3337 

Dr. Jeffrey Crowley 
Chiropractor 

5986 E. Cass City Rd. 
Cass City (M-81) 
Phone 872-4241 

Brooks Lai~dscaping 
Phone 872-2932 Rolling Hills Golf Course 

Phone 872-3569 General Cable Company 
Phone 872-21 1 1 6uds & Blossoms by Sandy 

Phone 872-3935 

- 

Schneeberger TV 
Appliance and Furniture 

Phone 872-2696 

-. . 

OPTOMETRISTS Dr. Robert Green 0. D.S. 
Dr. Nicholas Nahernak D. D.S 

Phono 872-2 18 I 

POD I ATR ISTS -------- Dr. David Baker 
Optometrist 

Cass City Chronicle 
Phone 872-2010 GGGa 

Plumbing & Heating 
Cass Cify - 872-5084 

Pigeon - 453-353 I 

4624 Hill St. 
Cass City Hills & Dales General Hospital 

Phone 872-2121 CC Muffler & Brake Shop 
Phone 872-225 1 

Office Hours: 
Mon.-Fri., 9:OO-4:30 

072-3404 @% HURON BUSINESS PRODUCTS INC. 
Special Scents 
Flower Shoppe 

Phone 872-3434 

..... 

Cass City Oil & Gas 
Phone 872-2065 (5 17) 872-5655 e 1-800-626-2867 

FAX (5 17) 872-5657 BALU K., M.D. 
Obslelrtcian 4 Gynecologrsl 

70 Nwlh Elk Streal 
Thumb National 6ank 

& Trust Co. 
Phone 872-43 1 1 

Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 

IGA Foodliner 
Phone 872-2645 

SUduSLy. MI 484 ? 1 
Edward Scollon, D.V.M. 

Veterfnanan Phone (313) 640-4733 

Walbro Corporation 
Phone 872-2 13 1 

Dr. Paul Chappel 
Phone 8 72- 38 70 Phone 872-2248 

I 



CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

Cass City Bowling Leagues Your neighbor sags 

Cummins undecided on 
SATURDAY SPINNERS 

SR. 
Oct. 17 

tosh 626 (2251, M. Weltin 
621 (211-223), C. Bellew 
605 (232), R. Kerkau 604 
(225), J. Howard 591 (223), 
L. Tracy 585, P. Robinson 
584 (224), J. McIntosh 222, 
R. Engelhardt 220, J. Smith- 
son 214, K. Koch 211. 

High Team Series: Phil's 
Clippers 2842. 

High Team Game: Phil's 
Clippers 1008. 

Milletics Surveying 10 
New EnglandLife 8 1/2 

SATURDAY SPINNERS Humes 420. 
JR. Girl's High Game: Joie 

Humes 172. 
High Team Series: Miller 

Sharks I1 14 Eggs 1727. 
1 1  High Team Game: Mrller Newcomers 1 1  Eggs632. 

Terminators 
10 Tigers 

Strikers 8 
8 Star Bowlers 

The Strikers 8 
5 New Beginnings 

Boy's High Series: Timo- 
thy Boy's Karr High 325. Game: Chris 

Rienas 147. 

Oct. 24 

Scorpions 5 

Jacques Seeds 21 1/2 
Nelesco 19 112 
Bush w ackers 18 112 
Northon Const. 18 
Cass City IGA 16 1/2 
Kilbourn Service 16 
Deford Country Groc. 15 

High Series & Games: 
Doug O'Dell660 (255), D. 
Beecher 214, D. Smith 217, 
J. Hacker 582 (218), E. 
Schmaltz 604 (211), D. 
Doerr 649 (219-242)' R. 
Kilbourn 221. 

High Team Series: 
Northon Const. 19 14. 

High Team Game: Kil- 
bourn Service 660. 

how to vote in election 
High Series & Games: T. 

Comment 669 (234, 222, 
213), M. Lutz 659 (249, 
228), M. Jackson &I9 (246, 
218), J. Milletics 626 (261), 
D. Miller 614 (215,213), K. 
Beachy 597 (222), R. Hull 
596 (237), R. Rabideau 591, 
P. Robinson 583, J. Storm 
578, B. Anthes577(216),L. 
Spiekerman 576 (210), R. 
Kerkau 574, S .  Hammett 
570, C. Peters 569 (211)' J. 
Navarro 55 1.  

High Team Series: Char- 
mont 2808. 

High Team Game: King- 
ston State Bank 950. 

MERCHANTS' "B" 
Oct. 21 

Final Standings - Round #1 

Hot Babies 12 
Terminators 1 1  1/2 
Fiercesome Foursome 8 
Miller Eggs 7 
Crushers 6 
Pin Busters 5 1/2 
Strikers 5 
Handicaps 5 
Studs 5 
Deford Country Groc. 2 
Mess Meisters 2 

Boy's High Series: Chad 
Zawilinski 461. 

Boy's High Game: Chad 
Zawilinski 179. 
Girl's High Series: Rhonda 

Pringle 4 1 1.  
Girl's High Games: 

Rhonda & Robin Pringle 
141. 

High Team Series: Miller 
Eggs 1594. 

High Team Gamc: Miller 
Eggs 572. 

Nancy Cummins, 21, of Gagetown has something in 
common with many Americans in that she is still undecided 
on her choice for president. 
You know, she points out, Bill Clinton is better for change. 

He has some different ideas, 
but ...,... George Bush has done a 
lot for this country. Although 
some people might not think so, 
she added. 
This will be her first time vot- 

ing and she is registered. I don't 
get into politics much, she ex- 
plained, and I haven't had a 
chance to really study the 
propositions yet. 

Cummins does keep a busy 
schedule. She operates "The 
Glass Slipper" together with her 
sister, Lynn. In addition, she is 
taking a correspondence course 
in literature. Long term, she said, she would love toget into 
writing and publishing. 
Besides the 2 sisters that operate the new store in Cass City, 

there is one other sister, Janice Brandel, in the family. 
.The women are daughters of Mr. and Mrs Don Cummins, 
who have an interest in the store. Don Cummins is a long- 
time employee at Walbro Corporation and recently retired 
@om active farming. 

TUESDAY 
AFTERNOON 

LADIES' LEAGUE 
Oct. 20 

Girl's High Series: Erika 
Comment 165* 

Girl's High Game: Jamie 
Ceranski and Erika Com- 
ment 69. 
High Team Series: Termi- 

hators 860. 
High Team Game: Termi- 

nators 302. 

Sutter's Bakery 27 
S ti 1 ley ' s 17 
Charmont 16 
Alley Hoppers 15 
Country Gals 14 
High Series: J. Sullins 504. 
High Game: N. Rabideau 

193. 
High Team Series: Sutter's 

Bakery 18M. 
High Team Game: Sutter's 

Bakery 674. 

FRIDAY NIGHT 
MIXED DOUBLES 

Oct. 23 

Town & Country 42 
Rhonda's General Store 35 
Cass City Oil & Gas 33 

32 Old Folks 
The Kids 27 

24 The Family 
Helter Skelter 23 
Bye 8 

Men's High Series: J. 
Navarro 558, R. Hull 534,L. 
Gyomory 528, B. Fields 
526. 

Men's High Games: B. 
Fields 203, R. Hull 202. 

Women's High Series: B. 
Watson 574, L. Sefton 516. 
Women's High Games: B. 

Watson 24 1 ,  L. Sefton 192. 
High Team Series: 

Rhonda's General Store 
1937. 

High Team Game: The 
Kids 690. 

Build a Halloween 
tradition with your 
kids. We have a 
uni ue selection of 
caris and specialty 
items. Come in soon 
and prepare ourself 
for a scary x alloween! 

Coach Light 
Pharmacy 

Cass City 872-3613 

Gilligans 
Charmont Motel 
Mac Tools 
Hyatt, Inc. 
Micro EDM 

27 
22 
19 

15 1/2 
15 

SATURDAY SPINNERS 
SR. 

Oct. 24 

15 Hot Babies 
Terminators 12 1/2 
Miller Eggs 11 

9 Strikers 
Fiercesomc Foursome 8 
Crushcrs 8 
Pin Busters 7 1/2 
Studs 6 
Mess Meisters 6 
Deford Country Groc. 5 
Handicaps 5 

Boy's High Series: Chad 
Zawilinski 492, 

Boy's High Game: Chad 
Zawilinski 192. 

Girl's ,High Series: Joie 

SUNDAY NO ROLLERS 
Oct. 18 

CHARMONT LADIES Charmont 12 
Baord Chrysler 7 Ubly Card & Gift 10 

Schott's Accounting 9 
Family Affair 7 
Team #6 6 
Team #1 5 
Cole Carbide 3 
Gutter Dusters 2 

Deford Country Gro. 22 
Smart Graphics 20 
Thumb Nat'l Bank 19 
Wild John's 19 
Cable-cttes 18 1/2 
Elmwood What Knots 18 
Live Wires 18 

17 1/2 Board's 
Charmont 16 
Pizza Villa 14 1/2 

7 1/2 Cass City Tire 
High Team Game: Cable- 

ettes 1038. 
High Team Series: Deford 

Country Gro. 2989. 
High Series: D. 

Mathewson 534, B. Kil- 
bourn 509, P. Corcoran 507. 

High Games: B. Kilbourn 
200, P. Corcoran 191, D. 
Mathewson 182, M. Hacker 
176, D. Sweeney 176. 

High Series & Games: R. 
rabideau725 (246,244,235) 
M. Lutz 669 (257,214), M. 
Weltin 630 (226, 210), T. 
Comment 573, T. Czekai 
215. 

CASS 
_ _  - 

THURSDAY ONLY 7:30 Only 
" B a rg ai n N it e" Tee n/Ad u It $2.0 0 

ROBERT REDFORD & SIDNEY POITIER 
"SN EA KE RS" 

o o e m e m m e e e m m ~  
e The Want 
: AdsAre 
: e Newsy Too! 

em 

a 

0 
e 
0 

a m  

Men's High Series & 
Games: M. Weltin 662 
(237), T. Comment 622. 

Women's High Series & 
Games: A. Caraballo 516 
(180). 

High Team Series: Team 
#12238. 

High Team Game: Team 
#1759. 

THURSDAY NITE TRIO 
Oct. 22 

Martin Electric 24 
Pioneer Seeds - 23 
Gilligan ' s 22 
Kilbourn Tech 22 

STARTS FRIDAY OCT. 30,31, NOV. 1 &5 
LAUGHS FOR HALLOWEEN WEEKENt 

Fri., Sun., Thurs. 7:30 Only 
Saturday 7:30 & 9:30 

kurt martin 
russell short TUSCOLA 

GET TOCETHERS 
Oct. 19 The only thing 

Martin wanted wus 
a nice, quiet 

family vacation. 

Instead, he got ... 

CAPTAIN 

RON 

Phil's Clippers 29 
Cole Carbide 28 
Gagetown Inn 28 
Charmont Motel 28 
Erla's Inc. 27 
Charmont 27 
Cass City Sports 27 
Spaulding Builders 20 
Miller Eggs 18 
C.R. Hunt 13 

High Series & Games: R. 
Rabideau 636 (215-222), M. 
Grifka 583 (245), P. McIn- 

MERCHANTS' "A" 
Oct. 21 

Gilligans 23 1/2 
22 B ren twood 

Ma thew son 21 
Charmont Motel 19 
W ttrju Flooring 18 
Kritzmans' 17 
Kingston State Bank16 1/2 
Summers 15 
Charmont 14 1/2 

GENERAL ELECTION 
To the qualified electors of the Townehipa/City of: EYW- AND QW34LEW 

SOON: "LAST OF THE MOHICANS" 
D i s ne y 's 

"MIGHTY DUCKS" 

WTICB IS GIYEN, that a 
of nidrigan on 
V I 2  : 

-ION w i l l  k held in the County of Sanilac, State 
3, 1992, for the prpose of electing the following officers, 

Save 40% or more on selected SALE' I LA-2-BOY furnishings now thru Monday! NATIONAG - President a d  ViceE%esident of the United States. 
-1- - Representative in CQngretJS (5th District). 
E I S L A T m  - S t a t e  Representative (83rd Di8triCt). 
STATe - 2 of S t a t e  Board of education, 2 Marbra of ~oard of Regents of the 

University of Michigan, 2 m r s  of Michigan State University Board of Truateeer 2 m r s  
of myne S t a t e  university Board of Governors. 

Ikedst County Road cumksionert Drain Comnissioner, County Surveyor, County Comnissioners. 
W I P  - Supervimt, Tamship Clerk, -hip Treasurer, lbwnahip "steea, Twmhip 

- Prosecuting Attorney, Sheriff, County Cletk, County Treasurer, Register of 

Constable. 

Ne're wrapping up October by cutting back 
pr im!  Save on a storewide selection of 
@ish chairs, sleepers, sofas and mom! 
Including many one-of-a-kinds and limited 
quantity items! Get here early! After Morrday 
... tbse prices will be just a memory. 

LA-2-BOY' 
RECUNERS FROM $249.95 
Choose from lhebestseledion of genuine 
LhZ-bf  rediners at the b t  prices ever! 

HGH-LEG 
RECUNERS FROM $1 99.00 
Chaksof distlnctbn, traditional?( styled 
at prkm that are very unWitionalt 

L A - Z ~ B W  

A vast seledion of styles, fabrics 
anddorsat lnaedsble swings! 

RECLINING 

SWIVEL ROCKERS FROM $229. 

SOFAS FROM $599.00 

*OCCASIONAL $ 
TABLES FROM 89.95 

Upright sitthg or fully indined, double 
your comfort at a comforthg prlael 

Aseledion of codaan, sofa, and end 
tables in a variety of wwds and lintshes. 

TABLE 6 
FLOOR LAMPS FROM '99.00 
Brighten your home and saw with these 
ceramic,brassandgbstyies! 

-PARTISAN OFFI-1 VIZ: 2 Justices Of the Supreme Court1 Judges Of the Court Of 
Appeals, Township Library Boards and City Cwncil W r s .  

AND AL90 To VWm QN T€lE FoLLmIw PROPOSALS: 
STATE - A - Limit A n n d  Increases in Hatestead w r t y  Tax Assessments a d  

Pr0paa.l B - R e s t r i c t / L h n i t  the Nm&r of Times a Person Can Be Elected to 

Proposal C - E x q t  Property Fran a Portion of School Operating Property Taxes 

Proposal D - Amend Plkhigan's Auto Insurance Laws. 

Provide Separate Tax Limitatiorrs for Different Property Classifications. 

CongrWioMl, State Executive and State Legialative Offices. 

and Limit Annual  Increases i n  A31 P r o p t t y  Tax Assessments. 

S M L A C  COUNTY PROPOSAL E 
I, CAROL A. DALE, County Treasurer of tbc County of 
Skilac, Nichigan hereby certify that am of OCTOBER 
7, 1992, the reeords of thie officr indicate that 
the total of a l l  voted Incream, over and above 

TAX MILLAGE PROPOSITION FOK 
COUNTY-WIDE PUBLIC SAFETY 

COMMUNICATIONS SYSTEM 

For the purpose of providing funds for a Public the tax liaitation eetabliehed by the Constitution . 

of Nichigan in any local unita of Sanilrc County, 
to be as fo l lor~:  

Safety Conkmicat ions  system for all M i c e ,  
Fire, and Emergency Medical scrvice agencics in 
Sanilac County, shall the limitation of ihc total  
atnount of taxes which may hc assesscd agilitlst all  
the property in the County of Sanilac, Stntc of 
Michigan. be increased by not more than S/I 0 of 1 
mill (0.5) of  the assesscd valuation. as cqualizcrl. 
of all propcrty within the County for cach ol thc 
years 1992 through 1996. inclusive'! 

Evergreen Tarnship 01.00 II R o d  1-91-95 
Green1m.f tornehip 01.00 II Rd. Ilrint. 1989-92 

01.00 II Fire 1989-92 
01.00 I Rd, Irint. 1993-96 

baa C i t y  sCh00l~ 21.90 I! Operrtirq 1993-92 
00.11 n Debt 1%-92 

Ubly Scboolr 01.00 II Bum 1992-93 
00.74 II Debt 1%5-93 

20.2116 II Operating 1989-93 
04.00 U Debt 1991-o) 

tluron Interd ir t ,  01.00 fl Sp Ed fndef. 
01.49 U Vo Ed Indef. 

Tuscolo In terd ir te  01.75 II Vo M Indef. 

SANILAC COUNTY PROPOSAI, F 

TAX MILLAGE PROPOSITION 
FOR COORDINATION OF 

AMBULANCE-EMERGENCY 
SERVICES IN SAMLAC COUNTY LA-Z-BOY 

SLEEP SOFAS FROM $699.00 
For h e  purpose of providing funds for  thc coordi- 
nation o f  ambulance-emergency scrviccs within 
Sanilac County, advanccd training o f  cnicrgcncy 
mctlical pcrsnnnel. physician supcwision, antl 
amhulancc-life suppon cquiprnent undcr thc d -  
rection and supervision of  the Sanilac Mcdicnl 
Control Board, shall thc limitation of thc total 
amount of  taxes whichmay be asscsscd against all  
DroDertv in thecounty of Sanilac, Statc of Mich-  

' LA-z-Bor 
LOVESEATS FROM $499.00 
Agreat ptbe on styles kombadftional 
to mntemporary. Perfect for smaller rooms. .. -. . 

ban-, be"increascd as provided by Articlc IX, SCC- m.60 II SpEd Iadcf. 

Carol A, Dale 
tinnhof the 1963Constitiitionof Michigan,hy not 
more than 2/10 of  1 mill (0.2) ol thc asscsscd 
valuation, as cquali~ed.  of all property within thc 
County for each of thc years 1993,1994.19Y 5 antl 
1996 inclusive? 

Countt Treasurer 

THE E L E C T I ~  WILL BE CONDUCI'ED AT THE FOLLCWING POLLING PLACES: 
GKEENLEAF lOWNSl4II' 

NO MONEY DOWN AND NO PAYMENTS 
OR FINANCE CHARGES FOR 90 DAYS 

KENEWALOF TAX KATE LIMITATION mERmEN TOWNSH1P GREENLEAF TWINSHIP 
INCREASE I)KC~I'OSITION Township Hall - 2nd Building 

W. of Decker 6 Shabbona Rds. 
Township Hall, G i l k r t  Rd. 
2 miles N. of Cass City Rd. 

Arthur  Severancer Clerk Clare Brown, Clerk Shall thc limitation on thc total amount 01  I;ixcs 
which may he assesscd cach ycar against tiropcrty . .  ~ 

in thc Township of Grccnlcaf. County of Sanilac, 
Statc o f  Michigan, hc increascd as provided in 
Scction '6 or Article Ix, of the Constitution of 
Michinan of 1963. cflcctivc January I .  1993. Tor a 

The Polls of sa id  election will be open at 7 o'clock a.m. and 
will remain open until 8 o'clock p.m. of said day of election. , 

p c r i o i o f  four (4) yearc. from I 993 ttr;ouRlr I WM 
inclusive, hyone(1)mil l  of thc asscsscti valuarion 
as equalizcd, for the p i i ~ ) ~  of Firc Protcction in 
Grccnlcaf Township? 

Linda I. Kozfkay 
Sanilac County Clerk 
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Volunteers, donations needed 

Plans underway for annual jl 
Christmas basket program : 

“The reasoning for this is 
twofold: the task of deliver- 
ing Christmas baskets is a 
difficult oneduring this busy 
time of the year and giving 
certificates will ensure re- 
cipients will be receiving 
items they can use.” 
The food certificates will 

be very specific in nature 
and will be designated for 
nutritional items, Woern 
noted. 

“We will be contacting 
grocery stores throughout 
the county asking them to 
participate,” she continued, 
adding stores will be asked 
to donate a loaf of bread 
when the Christmas food 
certificate is used.” 

individuals directly can ob- 
tain names and addresses 
along with “Christmas 
wishes”from the DSS office 
by calling 673-9126. Dona- 
tions can be taken to thc 
chosen recipient(s) or deliv- 
ered by the DSS. Donated 
items will be delivered by 
the DS$ the week before 
Christmas. 

Groups that put items to- 
gether for the needy are 
asked to contact the DSS, 
with information about their 
efforts so the results of this 
year’s projects can be re: 
ported accurately. 

“Your help will make the 
holiday season a special 
time of year for our elderly 
as well as our most precious 

The news story written be- 
low was sent by letter to 
various businesses and indi- 
viduals in the urea and has 
caused some confkion that 
we want to clarifj at once, 
Susan Woern from the De- 
partment of Social Service 
said this week. 

We regret, says Woern, 
that some of the recipientsof 
the letter were disturbed 
because they felt it inter- 
fered with the area Toys for 
Tots and Elkland-Novesta 
Urrited Way program. 

I want to state emphati- 
cally, she added, that in no 
way does our department 
want to solicit funds that 
would go to any of these 
Cass City area campaigns. 
Helping out those less fortu- 
nate is a joint efSort and we 
share names and informa- 
tion with the Cass City vol- 
unteers. 

cia1 Services. 
In addition, Toys for Tots 

campaigns sponsored by the 
the Thumb Area Mudrun- 
ners, Marines and other 
groups will deliver toys to 
children in the county. 

According to Susan 
Woern, DSS volunteer serv- 
ices coordinator, area resi- 
dents can help both pro- 
grams enjoy another suc- 
cessful year. 

“We need delivery help in 
many areas,” she said. “Toy 
donations can be put in the 
various drop boxes that will 
be placed throughout the 
county or brought to the 
DS S . Drop box sites will be 
announced through the news 
rn edia .” 

Donations of non-perish- 
able food items, gifts for the 
elderly/disabled and cloth- 
ing items of hats, scarves, 
mittens and gloves for chil- 
dren are needed. 

“Cash donations will also 
be greatly appreciated as we 
gradually move in the direc- 
tion of food certificates,” 
Woern said. 

Residents or organizations resource, our c~ildren ,” 
that would like to give to Woern said, 

HINTS OFHALLOWEEN can be seen throughout the area, including this display 
in front of the Gil and Rilla Burns home, Elmwood Road, Cass City. The couple’s 
children, Gilbert John, 5, and Amber, 4, took advantage of Sunday’s mild weather 
to play outdoors. 

Plans are underway for the 
18th annual Countywide 
Christmas Basket Program, 
which will once again be 
coordinated by the Tuscola 
County Department of So- 

Compile list of Michigan . 
HOW ARE 

GALLSTONES Obituary farms with hay for sale 
I 

Again this year, the Michi- 
gan Hay and Forage Coun- 
cil, in cooperation with the 
Michigan State University 
Extension Service, will 
compile a list of farms with 
hay for sale in Michigan. 
There is a wide disparity of 

hay yields in the State this 
year, with much of central 
and southern Michigan re- 
ceiving ample rainfall, 
while most of Northern 
Michigan was very dry. This 
list will be used to help 
northern producers in need 
of hay to locate hay in the 
rest of the State. 

“Last year the majority of 
the hay on this list was sold 
by March,” said Dennis 

Stein, Tuscola County Ex- 
tension Director. 
The list will again be com- 

piled by the Qsceola County 
Extension Office. Sellers 
wanting to list their hay for 
sale may either mail or call 
in the necessary informa- 
tion. 

Ill TREATED? I II Jeannette Shadko 
Jeannette Elizabeth 

Shadko, 82, the first woman 
county extension director to 
serve in Michigan, died Sat- 
urday morning in The 
Maples Medical Care Facil- 
ity, Frankfort. 

She was born Nov. 15, 
1909, in Sanilac County, the 
daughter of Charles Edwin 
and Ethel (Hunt) Bond. 

In June 1933, she married 
Michael Shadko in Peck. He 
diedin 1976. 

Mrs. Shadko was a gradu- 
ate of Cass City High 
School. She attendedLapeer 
County Normal and gradu- 
ated from Wayne State Uni- 
versity with a B.S. in family 
living education in 1941. 
She also was elected to the 
Phi Upsilon Omicron Honor 
Society. She was employed 
for 12 years by J.L. Hudson 
Co. in Detroit. She also 
served as president of the 
Detroit Chapter of Home 
Economists in Business and 
president of the Detroit Fed- 
eration of Home Ekono- 
mists. 

In 1954, she moved to 

northern Michigan and 
joined the Michigan State 
University Cooperative Ex- 
tension Service field staff. 
She worked in that position 
for 20 years, the last 2 as the 

In 1967, she graduated 
from Michigan State Uni- 
versity with a rnaster.’s de- 
gree in Home Economics 
Extension and was elected 
to Omicron Nu Honor Soti- 

Due to her various accom- 
plishments, she received 
numerous awards. 
She is survived by one sis- 

ter, Clara Sweet of Wixom; 
one nephew; 4 nieces, and 
many friends. 
She was preceded in death 

by 2 brothers, Charles and 
Hubert Bond, and one sister, 
Roberta Bond. 
A service of remembrance 

was held Oct. 20 at the First 
Congregational Church in 
Benzonia with the Rev. For- 
rest Hoppe officiating. Bur- 
ial was in the Benzonia 
Township Cemetery. 
Memorials may be made to 

the Benzie County Animal 
Welfare League or the 
American Cancer Society. 

’ county extension director. 

The time-honored cure for gallstones has been surgery-- 
remove the gall bladder and it will not cause further 
problems. For most people that is still the best choice. 
For some, however, there are alternative methods when 

a person needs treatment for gallstones. Gallstones are 
very common and most people with stones do not need 
treatment if they have no symptoms. 

A new method of treatment is shock wave lithotripsy. 
This method uses ultrasonic waves focused on the stones 
to break them up. The smaller stone fragments will pass 
more easily down the ducts. It is most useful when there 
is only asingle stone and it is not too big. These people have 
up to 80% resolution at one year. 

There are a couple medicines which are used as well. 
They are only useful for cholesterol stones, but these 
comprise 75% of all stones. Unfortunately, the results are 
relatively poor. After taking the medicine for two years, 
only about 14% have complete resolution of the stone. The 
expense of the medicine is also a factor, costing over 
$10,000 per year. 
The medicines have side effects of diarrhea, possible liver 

damage and an elevation in the cholestcrol. These reasons 
make it the choice mainly in people who are at increased 
risk from surgery. 

Today, many surgeons do laparoscopic surgery for the 
gall bladder which requiresonly a very small incision. This 
is an excellent choice for pcople who meet the criteria for 
this procedure. Ask your surgeon about it. 

This is one of a series of articles brought 
to you in the interest of better health by 

The mailing address is: 
Michigan State University 
Extension, Osceola County 
Courthouse, P.O. Box 208, 
Reed City, Mich, 49677. 
The telephone number is 
(6 16) 832-6 139. Individuals 
may also contact this office 
directly, or their local 
Michigan State University 
Extension office, and the 
information will be for- 
warded for them, said Stein. 

5 GENERATIONS from the Cass City- 
and Gagetown areas are represented-’ 
above. Pictured are (back row, left to : 
right) Tara Gruber, Lori Gruber, Reva i 
Dillon, (seated) Iva Peterson and Taylor, 
Tara’s son. 

Wet snow 
The list will be published in 

the Michigan Hay and For- 
age Newsletter, as well as be 
made available to anyone 
looking for sources of hay. 

blamed for 
lost power 

Wet, heavy snow was 
blamed for downed power 
lines that affected 500 cus- 
tomers last week in Cass 
City. 

Detroit Edison spokesman 
Scott Simons said the heavy 
snowfall caused a large tree 
branch to down lines on 
Leach Street south of Third 
Street at about 3:30 p.m. 
Oct. 20. 

A tree trimming crew was 
needed to clear the area be- 
fore restoration efforts could 
begin, Simons said, adding 
power was restored by 7 
p.m. 

The list should becompleted 
by late November and may 
be requested from the 
Osceoh County Extension 
Office at the above address 
or phone number. 

From 7-9 p.m. 
Oct, 29 & 30 

at Hardee’s Restaurant 

HILLS & DALES GENERAL HOSPITAL 
4675 HILL STREET CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 48726 

Chronicle Liners 
Work Like Magic! 
Cass City Chronicle 
Phone 872-201 0 

7 DIDYOUKNOW ... $ We could build a wall 12 feet tall running 
from New York City to Los Angeles with all $ the paper offices throw away? 9 FACT: 

9 Approximately 180 Ibs. of high grade recy- 4 clable paper is thrown away by office work- $ ers each year. 
$ DID YOU KNOW ... # Of those office buildings and industrial 6 companies who participate in recycling, we 6 regain 3 million tons of paper that will be + recycled? 8 FACT: 9 We save 3 cubic yards of valuable landfill 
4 space by every ton of recycled paper. 

There are many more ways to save at the # work place. 
# 1. Don‘t use disposable cups. Bring a 6 mug* 
/ 2. If you must use disposable cups, make 6 it paper, not Styrofoam. 

3. Use both sides of your copier paper. # 4. Cut your lighting in half. # 5. Post environmental notices on a bulle- # tin board. Everyone can benefit by the $ education and better use the knowledge to 
4 conserve and recycle. 
f l  If your business is interested in cutting its # enery usage, contact your local electric 

$ “We will recycle your toner cartridges and # provide the same limited warranty as the 6 new cartridges. 

company for an energy audit. 

MAKE HALLOWEEN FUN 
FOR Jt EVERYONE 

Please 
Plan Your 

Trick or 
Treat i n g 

BY RECYCLING YOUR TONER CARTRIDGES 
(SAME LIMITED WARRANTY AS NEW CARTRIDGES) 

Hours: 530 till 7:OO p.m. 
Saturday, Oct. 31 

The Cass City Village 
Thanks You For Your 

Co-operation - - - Using 
The Officially Sanctioned Hours. 

- n  , -, 

THIS MESSAGE H S E N  BROUGHT 
TO YOU BY AN ENVIRONMENTALLY 
CONSCIOUS MERCHANT. 

111 - 1 - 1 7  

111 6513 Main Street, 
Cass City 

WRnnW. 

111 - PRODUCTS INC, - 
(51 7 )  872-5655 1-800-626-2867 

FAX (5171 872-5657 -7 rcoanm+. 
Cass City Village Council 111 (517) 872-5655 1-800-626-2867 

FAX (517) 872-5657 
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Cass City Middle 
School honor roll 

For water, barrier-free Dro-iects 

Gagetown, county seeking 
Pupils named to the Cass 

City Middle School honor 
roll for the first marking 
period are: 

Foster, Kara Gaymer, Steve 
Harper, Ron Hawlcy, Elissa 
Hendrick, Dave Hobbs, 
Frank Homing, Jason 
Humpert, Laura Kundinger, 
Ashley Little. 

Steve McIntosh, Tara 
McNeil, Shannon Mordan, 
Joel Nicol, Julie O'Berski, 
Susan O'Hara, Amanda 
Osborn, K a y  Otulakowski, 
Paul Powell, Matt Ross, 
Scott Ruggles, Kevin 
Schott, Sarah Spencer, 
Adam Stoeckle, Marissa 
S weency, Rebecca Th- 
ompson, Jeremy Walther, 
Jason Wright, Eber Hollin- 
shead. 

All A's: Ryan Downing, 
Nathan Haag, Rose Hoclzle, 
Danielle Laming, Kara 
Mellendorf, Amanda Mor- 
rish, Becky Oesch, Shelly 
Ulfig, Amy Vencma, Eric 
Zawilinski, Nicolette 
Zawilinski, Sara Zorn. 

Kundinger, Chard Lenhard, 
Bccky Lowe, Missy Lowe, 
Matt Miller, Jason Mohr. 

Laura Osantowski, Roger 
Rockwell, Kurt Romstad, 
Leah Shagene, Tim Sher- 
man, Chris Smith, Ryan 
Smith, Suzanne Smolark- 
iewicz, Craig Swiderski, 
Nathan Weippert, Adam 
Wiles, Matt Zigich, Heather 
Woidan. 

All A's: Tammy Acker, 
Tom Beardon, Lori Brown, 
Kristy Hicks, Ryan Hutchin- 
son, Cheryl Laming, Lind- 
say Maharg, Janis Mastie, 
Nathan Matt, Andrea Rea. 

Rebuild Michigan grants 
Water system improve- 

men ts and barrier-free 
county buildings are the 
focus of grants being sought 
by the village of Gagetown 
and Tuscola County. 

Officials representing the 
village and county recently 
announced their plans to 
submit separate applica- 
tions for Rebuild Michigan 
grants. 

Gagetown officials intend 
to apply for a $72,000 grant 
and would match that 
amount with an $18,000 
contribution to pay for im- 
provements to the village's 
water sys tern. 
The improvements include 

a new well, said village 
Clerk Elery Sontag. 

A public hearing on the 
application has been sched- 
uled for Monday at 7 p.m. at 
the Gagetown Municipal 
Building, 6437 Lincoln St., 
Gagetown, to provide resi- 
dents with an opportunity to 
present their views. 

County officials, mean- 
while, hope to receive 
$80,000 to make 3 county 
buildings barrier-free. 

The county tentatively 
plans to provide a match of 
$15,000 - $10,000 in cash 
and $5,000 in in-kind work 

Council meet 
cancelled 

The monthly Cass City 
Village Council meeting 
scheduled for Oct. 27 has 
been canceled, and the No- 
vember regular session has 
been rescheduled. 

The next meeting will be 
held Nov. 30, instead of 
Nov. 24, starting at 7 p.m. at 
the village municipal build- 
ing. 

with staff support, said Mi- 
chael Hoagland, county 
controller. 

If approved, the money 
would be used to eliminate 
architectural barriers in the 
courthouse annex, sheriff's 
department and cooperative 
extension buildings. 

With the exception of the 
courthouse, the projects 
would result in every county 
building being barrier-free, 
according to Hoagland, who 
said preliminary estimates 
indicate doing the same at 
the courthouse would be 
cost prohibitive. 

However, he pointed out 
the needs of citizens unable 
to enter the courthouse 
could be met at the annex 
L..,:1 A:- Pr 

A public hearing on the 
county proposal has been 
slated in conjunction with 
the County Board of Com- 
missioners next meeting, 
Nov. 10 at 10 a.m. at the 
annex building. 

According to James 
McLoSkey, executive direc- 
tor of the Tuscola County 
Economic Development 
Corp., the village and 
county grant applications 
will be submitted to the 
Michigan Department of 
Commerce's Community 
Development Block Grant 
Program, a competitive pro- 
gram in which$20 million is 
available for public infra- 
structure projects. 

McLoskey said pre-grant 
applications submitted by 

5TH GRADE 

B or Better: Emily Bennett, 
Angie Bogart, Steve Boldi- 
zar, Jason Damm, Adam 
Dorland, Travis Eyer, Lind- 
say Gaszczynski, Andrea 
Gohsman, Sheila Guilds, 
Jalah Khoury, Shawn Klink- 
man, Russell Matt, Ryan 
McIntosh, Jessica Meeker, 
Justin Miller, Kim Morrish, 
Cari O'Hara, Leann Otu- 
lakowski, Brooke Ouvry, 
Stephanie Pierce, Bethany 
Ray, Sarah Rutkoski, Kristy 
Ryan, Travis Schneeberger, 
David Sutter, Tracy Talaski, 
Bryce VanVliet, Katie 
Wood, Rachel Warden. 

All A's: Nicole Docrr, 
Amber Dunn, Jesse Hil- 
laker, Melissa Homakie, 
Paul Langmaid, Brad Ro- 
che, Megan Romstad, Aaron 
Volz. 

6TH GRADE 
B or Better: Amanda 

Apley, Doug Ball, Aaron 
Barrigar, Aaron Bell, Vicky 
Benjamin, Amanda Board, 
Nate Brown, Keith Caverly, 
Manda Chappel, Carey 
Chard, Shelly Crow, Jim 
Dale, Kyle Daniel, Brad 
Deering, Joe DeLong, Matt 
Derfiny, Taylor Deigel, 
Brian Doran, Becky Dore, 
Brenda DuQuesnay, Sheri 

8TH GRADE 

B or Better: Katie An- 
thony, Pam Baker, Beth 
Bashur, Ashlie Chappel, 
George Cole, Patty Davis, 
Mandy Deering, Sam 
Hobbs, Brooke Hurley, Jo- 
seph Khoury, Marica Klaus, 
Chad LaJoie, Bccky Lam- 
ing, Joni Laming, Pam Leit- 
crman, Josh Little, Josh 
Lounsbury, Ray Meredith, 
Sarah Miller, Terri Moore, 
Dave Murphy, Matt Oesch, 
Jamie Parsell, MikePeruski, 
Rachel Peters, Brent 
Ruggles, Brad Speirs, 
Daniellc Westfall, Renee 
Zawilinski, Kari 20rn. 

All A's: ColIier Bogart, 
Jessica Frederick, Kurt 
Iwankovitsch, Matt Klink- 
man. Gia Mellendorf. Todd 

CONCERT MASTER WILLIAM Preucil Jr. will 
perform atasolorecitalSunday,Nov. l ,a t3p.m.at  the 
First Presbyterian Church in Cass City. It will be a 
benefit performance fbr the Village Bach Festival. He 
will be accompanied by Arthur Rowe. Tickets are $30 
each for the performance. After the recital, a benefit 
luncheon is slated at the home of Lambert Althaver. 
Attending both functions will  cost $50. Reservations 
can be secured by calling 517 872-2131, extension 269. 

Gagetown and the county 
have already been approved, 
allowing both governmental 
units to proceed with the 

uul lu l l l~ .  

"Hopefully, this will be a 
good service to the public," 
he added. "We think it will 
be." actual application process. 

7TH GRADE 

B or Better: Jennifer Beck- 
with, Ryan Bennett, Josh 
Brinkman, Stephanie 
Burleson, Colleen 
Cartwright, Christina Doerr, 
Jamie Englehart, Julie Erla, 
Jennifer Eyer, Jonathan 
Fobear, Tom Fulcher, Maria 
Garety, Cara Graichcn, 
Andy Green, Tara Guern- 
sey, Shannon Haley, Cyrus 
Healy, Melissa Hcinlein, 
Rachel Hoard, Emily Hop- 

Area high school, 
extension office win 
water quality grants 

Kingston High School and Other projects will focus 
the Huron County Extension on cvaluation of land use 
Service arc among the re- practices and local zoning to 
cipients of 28 grants, to- determine what the changes 
talling more than $525,000, mean in tcrms of water qual- 
awardcd for projects aimed ity in the watershed; inten- 
at improving water quality sive monitoring of Saginaw 
within the Saginaw Bay Bay water quality to deter- 

mine the impact of zebra National W atcrs hed. 
The grants were an- mussels; and construction of 

nounced by the Department model on-farm pesticide 
storage structurcs as ex- of Natural Resources. 

Kingston High School will amples of cffective and 
use its $427.50 award to test practical pesticide storage. 

per, Drew Kelly, -Aaron Milligan. 

MAC NICOL 
for TUSCOLA COUNTY SHERIFF 

Select a new and effective Law Enforcement Team 

25 yrs. Experience, Trooper Michigan State Police 
20 yrs. Labor Representative Troopers Association 

28 yrs. Experience, Michigan State Police 
20 yrs. Administrator - Post Commander 

BILL MAC NlCOL - SHERIFF CANDIDATE 

LT. BEN PAGE - UNDERSHERIFF SELECTION 

"A PROVEN LABOR - MANAGEMENT TEAM" 

and evaluate water quality 
of the Cass River, while 
Huron County Exlension 
officials plan to use their 
$4,300 grant to produce a 
video about agricultural 
practices that reduce nutri-  
ents, pesticides and sedi- 
ment loading on the bay. 

Other Thumb recipients 
include Recsc High School, 
awarded $890 to test and 
evaluate water quality, and 
the Mitten Bay Girl Scout 
Council, which will receive 
$2,808 for hands-on eco- 
logical student workshops. 

"The Saginaw Bay Na- 
tional Watershed Initiative 
will offer a unique opportu- 
nity for federal, state and 
local government and citi- 
zens to work together, to 
develop, strengthen and 
expand coordination efforts 
to enhance the restoration 
and protection of thc Sagi- 
naw Bay Watershed," DNR 
Director Roland Harmes 
said. 

"We've had very good 
public interest in the initia- 
tive to date, as well as strong 
organizational support and 
financial commitment from 
EPA, during this first-of- 
it's-kind water quality pro- 
gram." 

The grant funding was 
made available to the DNR 
through a $1.6 million Envi- 
ronmental Protection 
Agency grant awarded to the 
DNR when the EPA funded 
the Saginaw Bay Watershed 
as the first project under the 
National Watershed Initia- 
tive Program in July. 
The grants funded this year 

will focus on a number of 
projects intcnded to educate 
the public about water qual- 
ity issues and to cncourage 
them to take action to restorc 
and protect the watershcd. 

ELECT 
MAC NICOL SHERIFF . 

Vote Republican November 3rd Ir 
Paid for by the Committee to elect Mac Nicol Sheriff, 51 1 W. Lincoln St., Caro, MI 48723 

I Kingston Township 
MARY LOU WOLAK 

For 
TREASURER 

Serving as your Treasurer I have: 
invested township funds, earning $45,000.00 in interest for the township 
received reports from the township auditor stating "the treasurer's records 

attended training workshops 
* familiar with the new county wide computer system for property taxes 

were in excellent order" 

0 the r Bac kg r o u nd : 
Bachelor of Arts degree in Business from Michigan State University 
Actively involved in Wolak's Dairy Farm 
Treasurer of Elementary Parent Teacher Organization & Noah's Ark 

* Served in various other leadership roles in church and community groups 

If elected I will continue tu serve the residents and taxpayers of 
Kingston TownshN with the highest standards of professionalism. . 

Thank you for your support. 

Preschool in Kingston 

112 OFF 112 Off 
Halloween 

Trick or Treat 
Bag 

with every 
Hall0 ween 
purchase 

ADULT & 
CHILDREN'S Chi I dren's 

Halloween 
Costumes FABRIC 

7 

COSTUMES 

Now $5" 
"My commitment four years ago, was to serve you 
in an honest, effective & efficient manner, and I 
have made that my ropprioriryeverysingle day. By 
managing and funding my own campaign, my Qnly 
obligations are to you, the taxpayers1 With a more 
than 65% increase in real estate recordings since 1 
ook office, the job hasproven to be an even greater 
challenge and reward than I expected. I thank you 
for having given me this opportunityand I wouldap- 
preciate your continued support on November 3rd, 
so that I can renew that commitment as your 
Tuscola County Register of Deeds. " 

RE-ELECT 

Regular 
Regular 
Value 

1 $1 0.00 

Ginny Investigate 
microwave 
oven theft 
Cass City police arc inves- 

tigating the reported theft of 
a microwave oven from a 
local doctor's office last 
week. 

Pam LaBclle, Cass City, 
rcportcd the theft occurred 
last Wednesday at her place 
of employment, the officc of 
Dr. Yun, 6232 Hospital Dr,, 
Cass City. 

The oven belongs to an- 
other employee, Rcbccca 
Peruski, also of Cass City,  
according to reports, which 
state the of'ficc staff told 
police they bclicve thc ap- 
plirlncc was taken sorrictinlc 
around 3 p.m. 

McLAREN 
Register of Deeds 

Republican 
EXPERIENCED 

' 4 years experience as your Register of Deeds. 
* 11 1/2 years in-office experience, including 3 1/2 as Deputy Register. 8r Halloween 

" " DEDICATED " 
' A hands-on, working, elected official. 

Recipient of the Continuing Education in County Government Award. 
" Executive Board Member of the Michigan Association of Registers of Deeds - 3 yrs. 

Serving as Chairman & Vice-chairman of Legislative 8. Education Committees for state-wide 
county government associations. 

Reflectors 
Halloween Suncatchers 

COACH LIGHT PHARMACY " EFFECTIVE " 
Established 8 programmed Register of Deeds computer system. 

* Restructured Uniform Commercial Code records. 
" Participates in and has obtained new legislation for county government. 
* Implemented office policies to discontinue unlawful practices that cost the county over $40,000 a 

PLEASE VOTE NOVEMBER 3rd, AND RE-ELECT AN ELECTED OFFICIAL THAT WORKS FOR YOU! 
year in lost revenue. 

Paid for by the Committee to Re-Elect Ginny McLaren. 2343 W Barnes Rd , billlington, MI 48746 

MIKE WEAVER, Owner [B] Phone 872-3613 
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Down Memorv Lane CALL 872-2010 TO PUTADS TO WORK 

 DAN'S POWER & STOVE 
Fireplaces, Stoves, Chimneys 
Chimney sweeping b repairs 
STlHL chainsaws & outdoor 

(-1 Y 

From the files of the Chronicle 
Transit (non-business) rates, 
10 words or less, $1.50 each For Rent ( Automotive I 
insertion; additional words 8 
cents each. Three weeks for the 

Merchandise FOR SALE - 198 1 Granada, 
$300. Call 872-3753 after4. 

1-1 0-2 1-3 

Merchandise 

CASS ClTY Senior Citizen 
Apartments are now taking 
applications for one bed- 
room apartments. Laundrj 
room, security intercom and 
doorlock system, bathroom 
safety features, private 
patio, master TV antenna 
hook-up. Rent based on in- 
come, as low as $271, in- 
cludes heat, water, sewer, 
trash pick-up, stove, refrig- 
erator, carpeting and drapes. 
Call now for an application. 
872-2009. Equal Housing 
Opportunity. 4- 10-28-tf 

Beverly Ann Hrabec, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Hrabcc, Cass City, was 
crowncd queen of the Ferris 
State College Homecoming 
weekend Friday night. 

Andrew Cross, 89, retired 
painter and decorator and a 
rcsident of the Thumb area 
87 years, died Oct. 17 in 
Stevens Nursing Home. 

price of 2 - cash rate. Save 
money by enclosing cash with 
mail orders. Rates for display 
want ad on application. 

FOR SALE - Clarinet, one 
year old, $475. Call 872- 
3753 after 4. 2-10-21-3 

5 YEARS AGO of Edith Little. Plans were 
made for the "Winter Fan- 
tasy of Fashions," a style 
show to be held in the high 
school cafe tor iu m. 
An organizational meeting 

to form a Cass City Jaycette 
chapter was held Oct. 14. 
Beth Howard was elected 
president: Mary Beth Swid- 
erski, vice-president; Con- 
nie Klinkman, secretary; 
Yvonne LeValley, treas- 
urer, and Darlcne Russell 
and Peggy Ulfig, directors. 

Luella Smith from Snover 
played the harmonica and 
the piano for a members 
sing-a-long when the 
American Association of 
Retired Persons met last 
week. 

17 1/2 ACRES - Backs up to 
Cass River, currently 
farmed. 3/4 mile north of 
Shabbona on Decker Road. 
$15,000, negotiable, terms. 
Adjacent land also avail- 
able. Owner, 3 13-625-9368. 

3- 10-7- 12 

If all goes well, Jordan 
College's new Thumb cam- 
pus will be moved to the 
village, with classes starting 
as early as next August. 

The United Parcel 
Service's Cass City branch 
will begin moving into their 
new building, located on a 3- 
acre tract in Cass City's 
Industrial Park, Nov. 6, with 
service at the new location 
expected to begin Nov. 9, 
Mrs. Harriet Rayl, 84, was 

honored as "Woman of the 
Year" of the Cass River 
District at a meeting of the 
8th District Women'sChris- 
tian Temperance Union's 
107th convention. The 
WCTU president crowned 
Mrs. Rayl, the club's oldest 
member. 
Area residents woke up to 

more than an inch of wet 
snow last week. The early 
snowfall led to a number of 
downed power lines locally. 

The 1987 Rolling Hills 
Golf Club champions are 
Max Hammond (senior 
flight), Dale McIntosh 
(championship flight), and 
Fred Leeson (1st flight). 

FOR SALE - King of Sports 
dog food, 50 Ibs. 26% 
$1 1.45 tax inc.; 25 Ibs. 26% 
$6.00 tax inc.; 10 Ibs. 26% 
$3.15 tax inc.; 50 lbs. 21% 
$10.45 tax inc.; 25 Ibs. 21% 
$5.75 tax inc. Dcalcr Jim 
Mallory, 3483 Linden St., 
Kingston, Mich. A n y  
amount iivailahlc. Wil l  dc- 
livcr 500 pounds or morc. 
Phone 683-2438. 2-10-21-4 

( Automotive 3 
WOOD STOVE for sale, 
$40. Call 872-2725 after 
5:OO. 2- 10- 14-3 

FOR SALE - Remington 
hunting jacket, down-filled, 
size M, worn once. Newly 
reupholstercd wing back 
chair. Call 872-3 167. 

2-10-21-3 

FOR SALE - 1984 Chevy 
Cavalier, cruise, air, excel- 
lent running condition, high 
miles, somerust, price ncgo- 
tiable. 872-5014. 1 -  10-14-3 For Rent FOR SALE - 2 1977 Chevy - 

Blazers. 1 runs, 1 for parts. 
$650. Phone 872-2560. 

1 - 10-2 1 - 3 

35 YEARS AGO 
1-BEDROOM apartment, 
stove and refrigerator. Call 

4-10-7-tf 872-33 15. 
The first village home mail 

delivery in the history of 
Cass City was made 
Wednesday to some 600 
homes and business places 
in the village. Stan Kirn 
handled home delivery and 
Dick Root, business places 
and parcel post. 

The Dairy Farmers Coop- 
erative Association went on 
strike' Wednesday and 
members of the association 
have been asked to hold 
back their milk from the 
market. 

The Woman's Study Club 
met at the home of Mrs. 
Floyd Reid Tuesday and 
heard reports from 5 Boy 
Scouts who attended the 
Scout Jamboree at Valley 
Forge this summer, The 
boys were Bob Johnson, Jim 
Rawson, Dick Albee, Jim 
Ross and Jim Hutchinson. 
Marvin McCormick, who 
also attended the jamboree, 
was unable to attend the 
mecting. 

Jim Wallace, chairman of 
the Christmas pageant for 
1957, said that committees 
and other program notes will 
be announced as soon as 

Hillside 
Apartments 

FOR SALE - Storage barns, 
all sizes, craft items. Will 
deliver. Call 872-2608. Sec- 
ond house south on Hurds 
Comer Rd. off Cas City Rd. 

2-9-23-tf 

1985 BUICK Ccntury Lim- 
ited, 4 cylindcr, 4 door, 
110,000 milcs. Vcry clean 
car. 872-3798 after 5 p.m. 

1 - 1 0-2 1 -3 

FOR SALE - Frcsh red and 
whiic poiaiocs, and buticr- FOR RENT- Masonic 
nutsquash. Call 872-5480or 2- 10-2 I -3 Temple parties, Refreshment dinncrs, mcctings. Hall - 

No alcoholic beverages, 
872-5367. 2 bedrooms, kitchen 

appliances, air 
conditioning, drapes, 

storage, coin-op 
laundry, all carpeted 

I 

Call Lynwood LaPeer, f72- 
For Sale I 3191. 4-4-3-tf 

- 

FOR SALE - 1985 4 dr. 
Sunbird. Auto, A/C, Rear 
def., AM/FM. Very clean. 
Days 872-3919, Nites 872- 
2635. 1 - 10-28-tfn 

25 YEARS AGO Shop Cass Cio! 
We can meet or beat big 
city prices. Guarantees 
and low prices are OUT 

system for making happy 
customers. 

C.C. MuffIer & 
Brake Shop 

6597 Main, Cass City 
872-225 1 

2-3-204 

I 
Dry hardwoodfirewood 

R 0 ~ 3 M  FOR RENT I Call 872-3283 
or 872-3315 . 

4- 10-7- tf 

George Dillrnan, a familiar 
figure on the Cass City busi- 
ness and industrial scene, 
has accepted a position as 
office manager at 
Schneeberger's Appliance 
in Cass City. 
Three persons were killed 

in 3 separate accidents in 
Tuscola County Monday 
night, Oct. 23, in less than 
one hour and a half. They 
were George Jackson, 6 1,  of 
rural Cass City, Sandra Lee 
Ridell, 17, of Attica, and 
Thomas J. Pruner, 32, of 
Birch Run. 

Helen McGrath of Cass 
City was one of 232 persons 
to earn degrees from Central 
Michigan University at the 
end of October. She re- 
ceived a Bachelor of Sci- 

$150.00 a month plus share 
of utilities. $50.00 security 
deposit & references re- 

$30 face cord 
Picked UP- Some delivery -- 

Dwight's 
Auto Sales 

1988 Plymouth Reliant 
LE, 4 door, 4 cyl., Auto, 

w/Air Cond., AM/FM 

available 

Phone 872-3065 
Whittaker Timber coy. (Ask for June) Or 673-4 1 10. 

4-10-28-1 Notices I 2- 10-7-4 

1986 Ford Mustang LX, 
4 cyl., 5 spd., w/Air 
Cond., Tilt, Cruise, 
AM/FM, Low Miles 

10 YEARS AGO 

A fire Sunday morning left 
a family of 6 with only the 
clothes they were wearing. 
The home of Theron and 
Luana Roach was de- 
stroyed. 
Thirty members and guests 

attended the Oct. 19 potluck 
dinner meeting of the Cass 
City Zonta Club at the home 

STIHL - ECHO - 
McCulloch - Homelite, new 
and used, parts and service. 
Bars, sprockets and chains 
for most makes and models. 
Rex Binder Sales, across 
from Big Wheel. 673-4367. 

2- 10-28- 1 

2-10-14-3 4783. 

Wedding 
Announcements 

L 

Catalogs loaned 
overnight . 

Free Subscription 
with Each Order 

1986 Ford EXP, 4 cyl., 
5 spd., Loaded 

Call Gary 
673-7758 

1 - 10-28- 1 

FOR SALE - 1981 Chevy 
Malibu, $300.00 or best of- 
fer. 872-2586. 1-10-28-1 

HUNTERS - For sale, 17' 
camper trailer, self-con- 
tained. Call 872-2595. 

2- 10-28-3 Laethem 1111 
~ -- 

FOR SALE - 1979 Chevy 
vah, heavy duty. 2805 E. 
Deckerville Rd., 673-6135. 

1 - 10-28-3 
REFRIGERATOR for sale. 
Call 872-5635. 2-10-28-3 CAR0 L RENZ 

(5171 I Equipment Co. LEASE 
246 Columbia 

18 H.P. WHEEL HORSE 
tractor with snow blower 
and heathouser and 20 h.p. 
Wheel Horse tractor with 
mower. Also burning barrels 
and dishwasher. Call 872- 

1972 CHEVROLET 3/4-ton 
pickup with sleeper cap. 
Looks good, runs good. 
$850 or best offer. Jack 
Doerr, 6720 Third. 872- 
2711. 1 - 10- 14-3 

673-3939 or BUY 
3 bedroom ranch, full  basement, all new 
thermal windows. Asking price $62,000. 
Call ST. CLAIR REAL ESTATE 

Ask for Lynette 
673-6132 or 673-661 1 

3-10-28-1 

BEET EQUIPMENT 
Chain bed conversion kits, w/slip clutch & 

2-rolh, $4,760 
Plastic tubing to cover grab rob, new thh 

year 
30 4310 4R, short chain bed, 6 rolls 
JD 4310'8 rdls, extended elevetor, modifb- 

tlon kits 
30 4310 4A, 7 rolls, extended elevator 
(2) 30 4310 4R, star whl. bed, nlce ahape 
JO 431 4R lifter Idt., built by'Heaston 

0 Hesston 4R harvesters 
(7) lnexpenslve defoliators 

0 New AJloway defoliators 4R 
Several uaed cleaning beds for 4310 

herveuten 
Alloway 4R gear b o x  

COMBINES b HEADS 
* '79 IH 1480,2750 hm, eir, AHHC, (2) rotors, 
stone trap, feederhouse reverier, corn head 

'81 IH 1480,2160 hrs., A/C, revewtr, Diaf- 
A-Metlc, stone trap, rice tires, flex head with 
air reel 

'74 JD 4400 dsl., o'hauled, rotary screen 
* '77 JD 4400, dsl.. 2550 hrs., air 

'64 JD 106 caster bean elevator, spike 
JO 45, field ready, 6760 
JD 46 lele model 
'68 Gleaner F, o'hauled, flex knife 

1 JD 216 rigid platform, 82,000 
JD 43'5 corn head for 95, nice drape 

4 JD 20' quick-tech rigid platform, 81,900 
14) JD 220 flex platrorm, 6 3 , ~  ta-$7,eob 

0 IH 810 13' rigid platform humshiet 
IH 810 18%' dummy head w/lnnss pick up 
Tiger Jaw 20' knife kit, used, $300 

I I 5131. 2- 10-28-3 

CHEST FREEZER, washer, 
drycr, storm windows and The Cass City 

1 Legal notice I 
MORTGAGE SALE - Dcfrult having 

k e n  made in the tcrmi and conditiarr of 
a certain mongagc made by GORDON 
K. BENDER AND SHARON J. 
BENDER. his wife, of 2350 S. Kirk, 
Vossar. Michigan. Mortgagor. to 
CIRYSLER FIRST FINANCIAL 

gee dated the 31st dry of January. 1990. 
and mxordcd in the office of the Registex 
of Deeds, for the County of Tulcolr and 
Sure of Michigan, on the 7th d ~ y  af 
February, A.D., 1990, in Liber 599 d 
Tuscola County Recordi, a~ page 1352, 
on which there is claimed to be due. at the 
date of this notice, for principal and inter- 
est, the im of Fifty Six Thousand Seven 
Hundred Eighty-Seven and 17/1oorha 
Dollars ($56,787.17). 
And no suit or procoodinga 4t law or in 

quity having hen instituttd to mover 
the debt secured by said mortgage a any 
pmthercof. Now,thertfore, by vinw of 
the power of sale con~ined in said mmt- 
gage. and pursuant to the mute of the 
Shtc of Michigan in such case nude and 
provided. notice ir hereby given &At ~1 

Ihe201hdryofNovember,A.D., 1992,at 
1 1 :OO o'claclr a.m. said mortgage will bt 
forccloscd by taleat public auctim,bthc 
highcstbidder,rtthefrontcntrrnccofthe 

SERVICES CORPORATION, M W a -  

Coufihoue thc ValRC of Cam. TU#- 

scrccns. 5339 Cass City Rd. ,  
Esthcr Rcagh,  872-3078. Chronicle 

Phone 872-201 0 
2- 10-21 -2 

WATERPUMP 
WATER WELL 

WATER SOFTENERS FOR SALE - limited supply 
of popple seasoned and non- 
seasoned logs. Cut you 
own. $10 per face cord. Call 
872-4502. 2- 10- 14-4 

Installation & Service (F] 
TRACTORS 

I '92 JD 4960, MFWD, 18.4Rx46, 300 hrs., 
5-yr. warranty 
'90 JO 4665, MFWD, 3-yr. warranty 

remaining 
'84 JD 4850, MFWD, 18.4~42, PS, M)[lo hrs. 
'84 JD 4650, MFWD, 18.4~42, PS, 3100 hrs. 
'79 JD 4640, PFWD, PS, 4900 hrs., f8 .4~42  
71 JD4000, CAB duals 
'64 JD 3020, dsl., rblt. eng., repainted 
'76 AC 7080, 3250 hrs., $16,000 
'76 Case 2670, 4WD, 3OOO hrs., duals 
'68 Ford 8oO0, dsl., cab, rblt. eng. 
'79 AC 7020, rblt. eng. b trans. 
'76 Stsiger PTDO, 20.8~38 Cat eng., PTO 

avrllebls 
'73 JD 4430, quad, cab, 

\ 10%offormore J 
IN-HOME SERVICE MISCELLANEOUS Paul's Pump Repair 

Ron Blunt Drilling 
Call 673-4850 aii time 

or 1 -8OO-74d5 1 
2- 1 - 16-tf 

NEW Richardton Carts 
Bulldozer, 14' to fit 4w0, $3,000 
Bush Hog H.D. rotary cuttef, ti', 3-pt. hltch. 
Freeman 8 rear blade, Cat I, $300 

6 Brent 476-bu. grein carti on hand for sale 
or rent or lease 

JD 620 rain drill, 20'' Spt., 24x10" spacing 
4 IH 800 8-btrn. hinge plow w/burrter bar 

WII-Rich 42" field cult. w/6bar spike 
6 IH 710 8-16, on-land, spg. reset 

IH 720 &16, toegls trip 
NEW 3 pt. snow blower, 8' 

Strut Sale 
Cass City 
Muffler 

& 
Brake 
Shop 

L, Must See Family Home - All remodeled inside with 
I bedrooms, dining room; large kitchen, newer 
hingles and gas furnace. $56,900 - TCC1030 

HUNTING EQUIPMENT - 
2 guns with cases, k e r -  
slayer 16 gauge and 32 
Winchester carbine with 
shells. 2 suits hunting 
clothes, 32-34. Clark 
Seeley. Phone 872-3588, 

2- 10-28-3 
- 

cola County, Mchigm. of h e  premhu 
L described in mid mortgage, or so much 

Act Find the Service or Product I YOU Need in This. 

I thereof as may Ix necessary to pay the 
LaFAVESTEELSUPPLY - 
Come see us for all of your 
steel & hydraulic needs. 
872-2163. 2- 10-28- 1 n 

amount due, an aforesaid. QI laid mort- 
gage, with the interest thereon at sixteen on Guide I md one quarter percent (16.25%) per - I I annum and all lcRil cans, cham- and 

I SERVICE DIRECTORY 
expcnsu. includiig the rttomey-fux d- 
lowcd by law, 4nd a h  any rum which I may bc paid by the undmigncd. ncccs- FOR SALE - Whirlpool 

electric dryer, $75. Call 872- 
2650, Ask for Mary or Nan- 
nette. 2- 10-28-3 

Set on the edge of the Golf Course - 3 bedroom, 2 
1/2 bath home, screened patio with hot tub off master 
miroom, deck, insulated and heated garage. $79,900 
* TCClO5O 

' Wh-ich ;aid prenkcs arc dtscr ih  IS fol- 
lows: All that c e d n  piece or parcel d 
land situated h the Township 7f Juniatr, 
in the County of Tuscola and State d 
Michigan and described as follows, to 
wit: 

Canmencing 938.62 fcct South of the 
East 1 /4 comer of Scctim 18. Tom 12 

24-HR, SERVICE 

Phone 8 7 2 4 M 4  

All struts 
in stock or not 

SCHWEITZER OR- 
CHARDS - Now selling 
Empires, McIntosh, Cort- 
land, Red & Yellow Deli- 
cious, Ida Red, Jonathon, 
Northern Spy, Winesap, 
Red Rome and cider. Open 
daily9-5, Sunday 1-5. Seven 
miles east of Owendale, 1/2 
north to 3 168 Grassmere Rd. 
269-7008 Operated by Ted 
Leipprandt and Steve Zag- 
orski. 2- 10-28- i 

$100 KRITZMAN'S 
SERVICE 
6590 Main St. 

Cass City, MI 48726 

Major Appliance Service Center 
Audio-Video-Electronis 

Antenna Systems 
Factory Authorized on 

many brands 
We Specialize in Service 

Mon.-Fri. - 8-5 
Sat. - 8-12 

(51 7) 872-4800 

over invoice F h w m  - Rants - Balloons 
S d y  Twnsy. Owner 

4 W  L w h  St.. Caaa City, MI 48726 
I I 

6 i 

279.12 feq-thcncc Nonh 55 degrees 
0'43" W, 216.71 feet; thence Wcst 
105.78 feet; thence North 144.26 feet; 
thence East 283.62 fcct to the pint  of 

SALE GOOD 
OCT. 13.-NOV, 13 I Tuff-Kote Dinol I beginning' 

The redemption period shall bc six (6) 
mwrlhs from the date of such srlc, unlem 
determined abandoned in accordance 
with 1 W8CL 600.3241 I, in which case 
h e  redemption period shall be 30 daya 
from h e  date of such sale. 

Automotive Rust Proofing 
Systems 8 Waxing 

Gravel Guards 
Running Boards 

Rock Kole Stone Chip Protection 
Dared. Fnda y, Scptcmber 1 1 ,  1992 

Phone 269-9585 
M. muMANN (p32465) 

Attorney for Mortgagee 
6810 S. Ccdar. Suite 16 

. .  . - 

power equipment 
Lawn & arden equipment 
SNAPPEb mowers 8 Idlers 

Sales & Service 

DARK PINE dining room 
drop-leaf table, 42"x60", 4 
chairs, one deacon's bench. 
Excellent condition, $375. 
Call 872-3101. 2-10-21-2 

PIANO FOR SALE - Phone 
872-5635. 2- 10-21 -3 

Nice in town home, set on a city lot with 3 bedrooms 
full basement, natural gas heat, 1 1/2 car garage, nicc 
play yard in back of home. $42,500 - TCClO51 

2- 10- 14-3 

(Household Lansing, MI 4891 1 1 1 W I N D O W 5  (517) 694-3300 
6509 Main, Cass City 

Cass City Muffler 1 - 1  Phone 872.31 90 * Sales d SUPREME 
WINDOW CLEANING 

CIIRYSLEK FIRST CREDI'T C O W -  
RATION MORTGAGEE 

5-  10-7-5 

Mufflers - Shoekr - Lilslirm guaranlws - 
Mimn rnpns repin * Csrlilisd Mwhank 

Blaine dehsubien, Prop. 
Phone 872-2251 

6597 Main, Cass City 

APPLIANCE 
SALES & SERVICE 
Fa1 L M  Of UAGCC C M F  
KITWEN AN0 LAUNOAY 

AUCTION SALE - Estate c 
Ed/Leona Braucr Saturda: 
Oct. 31, 10 a.m. Mot( 
home, 445 Moline tract0 
lawn and gardcn tools, ar 
tiques, all household good 
1 mile east of Deford, 1 mil 
south to Gilford Rd., fir 
place east on north side, or 
miles south of Cass City 1 
Gilford Rd, first place ea 
on north side. 14-10-28- 

Storms-Weens-Windomr 
Janitorial Servloe FIm:s 

Eaves L Gutters Cleaned HI-Riser 
Sewice S Rental 

Erllmates on Commerdal, 
Residential 6 InduslrW Work 

Complete Insuranoe Coverqr: 
Security Services Available 

FOR SALE - Cabbage, 
ready now, 50 cents a head. 
3712 Sebewaing Rd.,  
Owendale, 9 miles north, 2 
1/2 east on Sebewaing Rd. 
Call 375-4293. 2- 10- 14-3 

' m SfRVC€ CASS CITY TIRE 
Hercules rnd Cooper 

TIRES 
9 Tim R O ~ ~ I I  

AI' nrrynlr Mutllerr 
9 Bi%w od Changoa 

Cnc~lW MKhanc 

Phone 872-5303 

WHif  HE S € l l  
CALL US TODAY @ Fuelgas fi Call Cass City 517-872-2248 or 

Caro 51 7-673-2555 
Kelly W. Smith, Broker 3-10-28-1 

Farm Commercial Residential Listings Wanted! 

~~~~ ~ ~~ ~ 

FOR SALE - White Philco 
rcfrigcrator, 18 cu. ft., green 
vinyl recliner. Call aftcr 5, 
665-9960. 2- 10- 14-3 

J ~ n d i O n  d M.53 
*nd M-01 
Corn City 

Phone 872-21 61 

11 20 Gratiot, Saginaw 

790-7609 
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.-: CALLING 872-2010 PUTS AN ACTION AD TO WORK 
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I 
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I 
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I 

( Help Wanted ) 

The best is I 
yet to come. 
Isn't it Nifty 
to be Fifty! 

( Helpwanted 1 
PART-TIME driver with 
CDL license,experienced in 
operating semi and tandem 
trucks. Must be able to oper- 
ate loader. Send resume with 
references to Box E, c/o 
Cass City Chronicle, 6550 
Main, Cass City, MI 48726. 

11-10-144 

I ROOFING& 
SIDING 

For all your roofing, siding, 
gutters, soffits and fascia needs! 
M I  Jim for a free estimate and 

see what he can do for you1 
Licensed and insured. 

CASS CITY 
SIDING 
872-5082 

8-6-34 

Smith 269-7909. 8- 12- 13-tf 

Call 872-3092 
8-3- 15- tf 

! : andpump i 8 

A Repair i 

( Wanted to Buy ) ( Services Notices Notices Notices Notices 
WANTED - Part-time jani- 
tor and kitchen help. Write 
Box W, care of Cass City 
Chronicle. 11-10-28-1 

CASH - paid for silver coins, 
dimes through silver dollars 
before 1965 - scrap gold - 
dental - rings - etc. The Coin 
Shop. 6-10-28-tf 

I .BINGO - every Wednesday 
:. night. Open 6:OO-early bird 

6:30 - regular bingo 7:OO. 
I Post 3644 W, Wcaver SL 

I 5-2-264 

WANTED - Volleyball 
' players for Thursday night 

'league in Sandusky. Call 
(517) 635-7850 and ask for 

,Greg. 5- 10-21 -2 

BINGO - Every Thursda) 
at SL Pancratius Hall, S 
Seeger, Cass City. Door: 
opcn 6:00 p.m. early-birc 
6:30, regular bingo 7:OO 
Phorie 872-54 10. Knights 01 
Columbus Council No, 
8892. 5-1 2-3 1 -tl 

Licensed Residential 
Builder 

Ronald E. Palmer 
Builder 
Insured 

Remodeling * Roofing 
Siding * Windows 

Pole Buildings 
2805 Crawford Rd. 

Cass City, Mich. 48726 
(5 17) 8724780 

5-9-30-d 

T & C Collision 
5097 Koepfgen Road 
Cass City, MI 48726 

(5 17) 872-42 15 
1 mile west, 1 1/4 north 

15 y e a d  experience 
Chuck Mester 
Tom Russell 

Managers 
Complete glass service 

Free estimates 
8-4-3-tf 

Jewelr 
PARK RANGERS - SWU- 
rity, maintcnancc, gcncral 
staffing, n o  cxpcricncc rc- 
quired. For information call 
219-922-8824, Cxt. R1876, 
9: 00 -9 : 00 * 11-10-21-3 

14K - Stone - Bead 
Chains - Rings 

Earrings - Bracelets 
Etc. 

For quality and 
value please call 

Lily Cheng 
8724071 

5- 10-28-tf 

OLD ORIENTAL RUGS 
wanted. Any size or condi- 
tion. 1-800-443-7740. 

6- 10-28-2 TMMEDIATE JOB open- 
ings available. Must have 
good transportation, neat in 
appearance and a willing- 
ness to grow with new area 
business. Call Cable Now 
for appointment, 872-5333. 

1 1 -8-26-tf 

HARVEST 
AUCTION 

Monday, Nov. 2 
7 p.m. 

Good Shepherd 
Lutheran Church 
Fellowship Hall 

All items homemade. 
5-10-28-1 

WANTED - Pin ball ma- 
chine, any condition. Will 
pick up. Call 5 17-879-22 13. 

- 4  I WALD 
WANTED - assistant carpet 
layer. Call 872-33 15, ask for 
Bud. 11-7-29-tf ,OST - Black male Lab 6-lO-28-3 VACUUM CLEANERS - 

wearing bright pink collar. Repairs and service is im- 
Last seen Bay City- WANTED - Snow ma- portant to you. 17 yeas in 
Forestville - Cemetery Rd. chines. Yamaha S M ,  Mer- the business. For all your 
uea. Family pet. Please call cury, Brand and &brand. 6- 1 0-28-3 needs. call US: 269-7562 or 
372-5 176. 5-10-28-1 269-9695. 

< Work Wanted ) 
__ 

COMPUTER OPERATOR 
- Need money fast? Make up 
to $150 per day using your 
computer skills, Work with- 
out pressure. Call any time 
!-800-643-1350. 11-10-7-8 

LOOKING FOR a job - 
cooking, cleaning, Call 872- 
4722. 12-10-14-3 

Certified Master Mechanic 
Com pu ter Alignments 

Computer Balance 
& Rotation 

Front End parts 
Shocks & Struts 

Brakes 
Tune-ups 

Free Estimates 

All your tire needsfrom 
wheelbarrows 

to tractors 
See us today 

Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 

5- 12-1 8- t f 

479-6543 evenings. 
8- 10- 14-1 2 

To Give Away ) 
FREE - Coon hound pup- WILL BABY-SIT in my 

home located east of Cass 
City. Have references. Call 
872-3625. 12-10-28-3 

Your loving sister 
5-10-28-1 

Elmer H. Francis 
Building Contractor 

New Homes or 
Remodeling, Rwfing, 

Siding, Barns, Pole 
Buildings 

Licensed and Insured 
Phone 872-2921 

8-2-26-tf 

FOR RENT - Hi pressure 
washer and water sand blas- 
br. Clean your home, deck, 
garage, driveway, boats, etc. 
Rental on daily basis. Call 
872-5456.. 5-7-29-tf 

SALES OPPORTUNITY - 
Exciting, fast paced part- 

7- 10-28-3 

Services 
WOLAK 
Kingston 

0 
. I  
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NO HUNTING 
SIGNS 

Red and Black ....... $.35 ea. 
4 for $1.00 

Black ink ......... $.25 
5 for $1.00 

CASS CITY 
CHRONICLE 

**** 

5-9-304 

time d e s  position (15-20 
hours per week) selling for 
the Beauty Industry leader, 
NEXXUS Hair and Skin 
Care Products. Established 
customer base, with lots of 
potential for growth for the 
right individual in the Cass 
Citv area. If vou are an ag- DEPENDABLE 3 6 - y ~ r -  

. .  

RESPONSIBLE 15 yearold 
looking for baby-sitting 
jobs. Can baby-sit children 
ages 3-12. Call 872-2428 
aftcr school. References. 

12- 10-21 -2n 

Township . 
Clerk 

- . 

Thomas Roofing 
Serving the area 

for 21 years 
LICENSED 
INSURED 
BONDED 

872-2970 
Cass City 

8-3-25-tf 

24th Annual 
Kountry Kitchen 

Bazaar and Lunch 
Saturday, Nov. 7 

1O:OO a.m. - 3:30 p.m. 
Decorations, gifts, wood crafts, 

cookie-walk, much more. 
Trinity United 

Methodist Church 
Houghton & Seegar 

5-1 0-28-2 

5-10-28-1 I 

Cass City 
Mufflbr & 12-6-24-20 you're worth, contact us to 

learn about our very pro- 
gressive compensation pro- 
gram and benefits.. Send 
resume to: Sales P.O. Box 
40722 Detroit, Mich. 48240. 

11-10-7-4 

C Card of Thanks ] 
How About That? Looks like a seller's market in Cass 
City. That's right, we have buyers coming in every day 
looking for homes both in and out of town. Low interest 
rates, families moving into this area make this the ideal 
time to come in and let us put your home on the market. 
Do it today! We have a buyer for your property. 

Brake IN MEMORY of Maggie 
Weippert we would like to 
thank our friends, relatives 
and neighbors for their help, 
food, flowers, gifts of 
money and prayers. 

Special thanks to Pastor 
Fruendt for his visits and 
prayers, to Roger and Bev 
Little, the ambulance serv- 
ice for their assistance and to 
the VFW Post 3644. 

Special thanks to the Lu- 
theran Ladies Aid for thc 
wonderful luncheon and for 
the VFW Ladies Auxiliary 
memorial service. We ap- 
preciate all you have done 
for us. God bless. The family 
of Maggie Weippert. 

13-10-28-1 

Ken Martin 
Electric, Inc. 

Have you 
winterized 
your car? 

If  not, come 
see us at 

CC MuDer 
& Brake Shop. 

We offer a 
FREE 

12 point 
Car Care 
Inspection 

Just call or stop in 

~- - 

WATER PUMP, Water 
Well, Water Softener Serv- 
ice. All types repaid.  
Rebuilt pumps. 10% dis- 
count on new pumps and 
tanks. In-home emergency 
service. Call 673-4850 or 
800-745-4851 anytime. 

5-6-5 - tf 

WLEW 1340 AM and 
Cruise 102.1 FM is now 
accepting applications for a 
full time sales representa- 
tive. Anyone experienced 
and interested in full time 
advertising sales should 
send a letter of application 
and resume to the attention 
of Sales Manager - Matt 
Aymen, Thumb Broadcast- 
ing Inc., 935 South Van 
Dyke, Bad Axe, Mich. 
484 13. Health insurance, 
established account list, gas 
expense provided, Thumb 
Broadcasting is an equal 
opportunity employer. 

11-10-21-2 

Homes - Farms 
Commercial 

Industrial 
New and rewire 

Hunting Land on M-53 - 30 wooded acres where the 
deer are. $27,900. A-223 

2 Story Home - Elkton - Residence or 2 apartments. 
$29,900. 0-29 SHAGENE 

EXCAVATING 
Black Dirt - Top Soil 
Gravel - Sand - Fill 

Back-Hoe work 

872-3648 
Cass City 

8-9- 16-tf 

STATE LICENSED 
Phone 872-4114 

4 180 Hurds Corner Road 
8-8- 10-tf 

Grocery-Party Store - Get into business for yourself, 
Walk-in coolcrs and equipment. Immediate possession. 
30's. 41 19 S. Seeger, Cass City. Costume 
Several Factory - Industrial Buildings. Contracts 
available or lease. 

A L ' S  APPLIANCE - EXP- 
rienced. Very low local 
service call rates! All appli- 
ances, microwaves, garage 
openers. water heaters, 
whirlpools, hot tubs, some 
household heating, remod- 
eling, mobile home repaics, 
water conditioning and 
pumps, sewing machines, 
TV antennas and more. Call 
1-800-300-3242. 8-10-284 

Party 
Little Red Schoolhouse - Hunting Lodge - Hideaway 
surrounded by state land. 1.5 acres, new well & septic 
- 30's. C-635 

Saturday, Oct. 31 

Golden Fawn Bar 
Argyle 

872-2251 ELECTRIC MOTOR and 
power tool repair, 4 p.m. to 8 
p.m. weekdays, 8 a.m. to 5 
p.m. Saturdays. John Blair, 
l/8 mile west of M-53 on 

BABY-SITTER needed in 
my home for 3, 4 and 10- 
ycar old, 4 days a weck, day 
hours vary. Call 872-4084. 

11-10-21-3 

"Mufflers - Brakes 

Suspension - 
Electrical - Minor 

Engine Repair" 

- Shocks - 

5-10-14-3 

Music by Windfall 

9:30 p.m. - 1:30 a.m. Truck Driving Training: 
You can be working in 8 
weeks. Job placement, finan- 
cial aid available for those 
who qualify. Call 1-800-325- 
6733. Eaton Roadranger 
Training Institute. 

Happy Jack Flea Gard: 
Patented electronic device 
controls fleas in homes 
without pesticides. Results 
overnight. At TSC Stores. 

Wanted: Owner-Operators 
of One Ton and 314 Ton pick- 
ups to deliver travel trailers & 
5th wheel campers nation- 
wide. Semi-tractors also. 

Gulf Shores, AL - Escape 
from the cold, spend the 
winter on our beautiful 
beaches. Monthly rentals 
from $400 to $950. Sugar 
Sands Realty, 1-800-824- 
6462. 

Vending Route - Local 
proven earner - min invest- 
ment. Call Mr. Roberts, 1- 

The Orlglnal Partyilne is 
back! TalMisten to conversa- 
tions from girls/guys in 
Michigan. Not a goo#. No 
credit card needed. 1-800- 
377-0002. $2/min. 18+. 

Cadillac Area (20  miles 
northwest) 5 acres, wooded 
county road. Electric, perfect 
for retirement or retreat cabin. 
Close to state forest and 
Manistee River. Excellent 
hunting area $5,995, $500 
down, $100 per month on a 
10% land contract. Call 
Wildwood Land CO. 9 am. to 
9 p.m. 616-824-3122. 

We Pay Cash for Land Con- 
tracts. Free 24 hour record- 
ing explains how you can get 
more cash faster, and pay no 
fees. Call, 1-800- 428-1 31 9. 

Wolff Tanning Beds. New 
Commercial-Home Units 
From $1 99.00. Lamps -Lo- 
tions-Accessories. Morithly 
payments low as $1 8.00. Call 
Today. Free New Cclor 
Catalog 1 -800-228-6292. 

A Doctor Buys Land Con- 
tracts and gives loans on 
Real Estate. Immediate ser- 
vice 31 3-335-61 66 or 1-800- 

Place Your Statewide Ad 
Here! $300 buys a 25 word 
classified ad offering over 
1,700,000 circulation. Contact 
this newspaper for details. 

(21 9)522-7551. 

800-329-8782. 

837-6 1 66. 

f=T AND AUCTIONEERING -. - 

HOSPITAL JOBS - Start 
$7.30/hr., your area. No 
experience necessary. Must 
be 18. For info, call 1-900- 
820-8633, ext. 4242,6 a.m.- 
8 p.m,, 7 days. $12.95 phone 
fee. 1 1 - 10-28-2 

U 

oPPomuwln 
Call 8724377 

3-10-28- 1 EOUAL HOUSING ID Required 
5-1 0-2 1-2 1 

i i Brown and 
Appliance Repair 

1 Water Well ; 
FOR SALE BY B.A. CALKA REAL ESTATE 

HELP WANTED - Looking 
for housekeeper who will do 
any type of housekeeping. 
Requirements: May some- 
times do cooking, must be 
dependable and have refer- 
ences. Call 872-4654 and 
leave message. 11-10-28-1 

BUILDING SITE!!! 
5.7 ACRES - surveyed and perked - excellent location - only 2 1/2 miles from Cass City on M-81 - priced to sell. W 

i t Cass City, Mich. ' 
i CUSTOM COMBINING. 

Call 872-5029. 8-10-14-3 IMMEDIATE POSSESSION!! 
In Cass City: Executive home with over 2500 square feet of living area; formal dining room - FAMILY ROOM - 
den - sliding glass doors lead to large PATIO - intercom - 3 bathrooms; laundry room off kitchen; FIREPLACE in 
living room; master bedroom 13 1/2x 22' with built-ins; natural gas forced hot water heating system; extra large garage 
(2 car); beautiful setting overlooking the countryside - nicely landscaped; immediate possession - EXCELLENT 
FINANCING AVAILABLE - priced to sell. Your inspection invited. 

\ 
t 

i Call 
1 
* Toll Free A ! 

Steve Wright Painting 
HELP WANTED - Taking 
applications for direct care 
staff in AIS home. Certified 
or uncertified. 872-2380. 

11-10-28-1 CLOSE IN to Cass City: 2 acres - recently redecorated home; almost all of home with new carpeting; laundry room 
off kitchen; extra large bedroom downstairs with built-ins - 3 bedrooms; basement; furnace about 8 years old - barn 
for storage, etc. $52,500.00, possible land contract. 

4842 Hemlock Lane 
Cass City, Mich. 48726 

Commercial - Residential 
Custom Wallpapering 

Airless Spray 
Phone (517) 872-4654 

8-4-15-tl 

AGGRESSIVE SALES 
PERSON - needed. Must be 
self starter, motivative, and 
willing to take on a chal- 
lenge. Requires determina- 
tion, phone skills, interper- 
sonal skills, and at least 2 
years of successful sales 
experience. Send resume 
identifying experiences and 
references to: Cass City 
Chronicle, P.O. Box GL, 
6550 Main, Cass City, MI 
48726. 1 1 - 10-28-2 

160 ACRES: Near M-53 with roomy RANCH TYPE HOME - 3 bedrooms; extra large living & dining room with 
FIREPLACE; large basement; 2 bathrooms; 26x64', 2 story frame building suitable for barn; workshop; approximately 
$20,000 or more in hardwood - many other features - will sell 80 acres with buildings for $149,500 or will sell 80 acres 
of hunting land with natural POND for $47,500, no buildings. High and dry - beautiful setting. 

8-6-174 ! 6 

FARM BUREAU Insur- 

4 

SPECIAL!! Large ranch type home with over 2400 square feet of living area; custom built home - large functional 
kitchen with many cabinets; FAMILY ROOM- SUNKEN LIVING ROOM-RECREATION ROOM;4 bedrooms; 
2 beautiful stone FIREPLACES with blowers; sliding glass doors lead to WOODEN PATIO; 2 1/2 bathrooms; 
basement partially finished off I large 2-car garage with electric door openers; utility building for garden tools and lawn 
equipment - nicely landscaped - many other features - IMMEDIATE POSSESSION. REDUCED TO $96,000. First 
deposit takes it. 

DozRr landscaping - All 
types of backhoe work' 
Home demolition & removal 
Footings - Waterlines - 

Complete septic systems 
Sand - Gravel - Topsoil 

Variety of fill - 
Any size fill job 
Free Estimates 
872-4502 

8- 1 -23-tf 
AUCTIONEERING - SW 
Lorn "Slim" Hillaker. Top 
dollar €or your property. 
Phone 872-3019, Cass City. 

Erla Packing 
6233 Church St. 

Cass City 
Phone 872-2 19 1 

Custom Butchering 
Fridays only 

USDA Inspected Plant 
Custom Curing, Smoking, 

Cutting, Wrapping and 
Freezing 

We Make Venison Sausage 

8-10-34 

8- 10-3 1 -Lf 

Interior & Exterior 
Paint in g SPECIAL $28,000.00 

FURNISHED HOME - In Cass City, 5 r w m ,  one story home with 2 bathrooms; natural gas forced hot air furnace 
8 years olds - large picture window; porch enclosed; small basement; comes with double door refrigerator, gas range, 
beds, easy chairs, kitchen table and 4 chairs, sofa, TV, many other items too numerous to mention - - - All this for 
$28,000. Possession on short notice. 

Attention Retirees!!! 

RN/LPN - If you enjoy pre- 
ventative medicine and 
working with the elderly, 
contact director of nursing at 
Tendercare, Cass City at 
57 1-872-2 174 or 5 17-872- 
3678. TDD, EOE. 

11-10-18-2 
Ross Kraft 

Cass City, Mich. IN CASS CITY - - - NEW LISTING - - - Very comfortable one story home with 2 bedrooms; well insulated - has to 
be seen to be appreciated - 2 car garage - many other features - - - priced to sell at $45,000. Terms. Land Contract 
possible. 

HUNTING LAND - - - 22 Acres - close in to C a s  City - CASS RIVER brders pro rty - some woods - ideal 
recreational land - - - desirable - - - Offered for $24,000, OPEN TO OFFERS. Many E r ,  etc. 

(517) 872-4122 
84-8-30 WANTED 

Person to play Santa 
Claw in Cass City 
during Christmas 
season, Friday eve- 
ning and Saturday af- 
ternoon hours. Inter- 
ested candidates send 
resume to: 

EX1 
FIR 
base 
OP 

,CUTWE HOME with over 3,000 square feet of living area; 4'large bedrooms; 3 bathrooms; MARBLE 
SPLACE; built-ins; formal dining room; family room; comes with appliances - Andersen windows; walk-out 
mnent; extra large lot - nicely landscaped - large 2 car garage attached; laundry room 1st floor; many other features 
EN TO OFFERS. 

Carpet & Upholstery 

t- Licensed DuPont 
rfA S t aim as ter NEAR CASS CITY on M-53 Cass River frontage - 10 112 ACRES - mostly wooded - secluded- Cass City School 

District - Mobile home 12x6O'plus 12~24'addition - 3Ox60'pole building -excellent hunting, fishing, camping, pasture - Your inspection invited!!! Priced to sell at $38,500.00. TERMS 
cl can ed 
in your 

driveway 

* F l d  removal 
Don Dohn 

4394 Cas Maple City #3 

Phone 872-3471 8-7-IO-tf 

Cass City Chronicle 
Care of Cass City 
Retail Committee 

P.O. Box 115 
Cass City, 48726 

11-10-28-2 

B.A. CALKA. Realtor 872-3355 OR 872u3230 
/ 

6306 E. Main St., Cass City, Michigan 48726 m REALTOR- Our 4 1 st year serving Sanilac, Tuscola & Huron Counties OPPOATUN,fY EOUAL HOUSIMC 
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* KATHY NEWELL 
for 

Novesta Township Clerk 
# Resident of Novesta 
Township since 1971 

# 1980 - Graduated from 
Cass City High School * 1986 - Associate degree as a 

legal secretary from 

# Licensed Standardbred horse 
trainer since 1976 

1 # Thumb Area Horsemen's 
Ass'n. secretary since 1980 

~ Great Lakes Junior College 

~ 
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4 important Few local contests Candidates battle for proposals face in Huron County 
offices in 3 townships voters Tuesday With most local races hav- 

ing been decided in August, 
Huron County voters will 
have a relatively quiet gen- 
eral election Tuesday. 

Among the exceptions is 
the office of register of 
deeds. Republican incum- 
bent Frances Holdwick, 
Harbor Beach, faces a chal- 
lenge from independent 
candidate Greg Lamson of 
Sebewaing. 

In addition, there are 3 
contested seats on the Board 
of Commissioners, includ- 
ing the post representing 
District 2, which includes 
Bingham, Grant and Sheri- 
dan townships. Seeking the 
office are Republican Gary 
Krug, Bad Axe, and Demo- 
crat David Jaroch of Ubly. 

In District 4, meanwhile, 
Alvin Long, a Bad Axe 
Republican who defeated 2 
opponents in the primary, 
faces Democrat challenger 
Orville Liedke, Elkton; and 
in District 1 ,  Republican 
incumbent Bruce W. Kuhl 
of Sebewaing will square off 

against challenger Cierala 
Elston, a Unionville Demo- 
cmt. 
Running unopposed are: 
District 3 - Republican 

incumbent R. Dale Wertz of 
Bay Port. 

District 5 - Republican 
incumbent Robert R. Hogan 
of Bad Axe. 

District 6 - Newcomer 
Glen Townley, a Harbor 
Beach Republican who un- 
seated incumbent Robert C. 
Witherspoon, Port Hope, in 
the primary, and 

District 7 - Republican 
incumbent Martha 
Thuemmel, Port Austin, 
who emerged victorious in a 
primary race. 

Likewise, Huron County 
incumbents Sheriff Michael 
L. Gage, Prosecutor Leslie 
A. Hagen, Treasurer 
Roberta Moetelli, Clerk 
Helen Lemanski and County 
Surveyor Russell Brown are 
all running unopposed in the 
general election. 

There are no countywide 
ballot proposals. 

Voters will be faced with 4 
special proposals in 
Tuesday's election, 3 to 
amend the state constitution 
and one to amend state law. 

Two of the amendments 
concern placing a limit on 
taxes. Proposal A, which is 
endorsed by Richard 
Headlee, limits the annual 
assessment increase on 
homestead property to 5 
percent or to the rate of infla- 
tion, whichever is less. It 
also creates a different tax 
for business and non-busi- 
ness property, 

Proposal C ,  known as the 
cut and cap proposal, is 
endorsed by Gov. John 
Engler. It exempts from 
school operating property 
taxes 10 percent in 1993; 15 
percent in 1994; 20 percent 
in 1995; 25 percent in 1996, 
and 30 percent thereafter. 

come from. 
Proposal B limits the num- 

ber of times a person can be 
elected to office: 2 times in a 
24-year period for U.S. 
senator; 3 times for U.S. 
representative in a 12-year 
period; governor, lieutenant 
governor, secretary of state 
and attorney general, 2 
times per office. 
Office of state senator will 

be limited to 2 times and 
state representative, 3 times. 

Proposal D calls for a re- 
duction in auto insurance 
rates by an average of 20 
percent and is coupled by a 
limit on personal injury pro- 
tection, It also limits the 
amount paid for medical 
services and prevents driv- 
ers from collecting damages 
if they are over 50 percent at 
fault. 

Kills bees 

There are no area township 
ballot proposals, but races 
for offices in Novesta, 
Koylton and Kingston town- 
ships will be decided in 
Tuesday's general election. 

In Novesta Township, 
Kathleen Newell, a Demo- 
crat, and Republican Pennie 
L. Rienas are vying for the 
office of township clerk. 
The post is being vacated by 
longtime Clerk Nursie Kloc, 
who is retiring. 
In addition, 2 trustee seats 

are being sought by 3 candi- 
dates; incumbent Timothy 
Knoblet and newcomer Ar- 
lene Paladi, both Republi- 
cans, and Democrat Ronald 
Patera. 

Running unopposed in the 

township are Supervisor 
Maynard Stine and Treas- 
urer Ralph A. Zinnecker. 

Likewise, the offices of 
clerk and trustee are being 
contested in Koylton Town- 
ship. 

The candidates for clerk 
are incumbent Republican 
James Borek and challenger 
Lynne L. Keeler, who filed 
as an independent candi- 
date. Seeking 2 trustee 
scats, meanwhile, are in- 
cumbents Donald F. Ashton 
and Douglas R. Kramer, 
both Republicans; inde- 
pendent candidate Thomas 
M. Beltz and write-in candi- 
date Faye Stoll. 

In Kingston Township, 

Republican Lewis King will 
squareoffagainst William J. 
Zimba, Democrat, for the 
post of supervisor. 
For Clerk, incumbent Vic- 

toria E. Wolak faces a chal- 
lenge from Sharon 
Wenzlaff, Republican, and 
incumbent Treasurer Mary 
Lou Wolak, Democrat, is 
being challenged by Hcpub- 
lican Nancy Jo Ruggles. 

Running unopposed for 2 
vacant trustee scats arc 
Francis J. Lis, Democrat, 
and Gary S .  King, Rcpubli- 
can. 

Only the incumbents are 
running for office in 
Elkland, Ellington and 
Elmwood townships. 

3 contests for commissioner 
It requires the state to reim- 

burse school districts for the 
money lost and limits as- 
sessment increases to 3 per- 
cent or the rate of inflation, 
whichever is less. 
There is no provision in the 

amendment that outlines 
where the lost revenues will 

Emergency rescue squads 
are being trained to spray a 
mixture of liquid dishwash- 
ing detergent and water to 
free people and pets from 
wasps and swarming bees. 
The mixture stops the bees 
from stinging and kills them 
within 60 seconds. 

Sanilac voters to decide Muxlow vs. Barcia for 
U.S. representative 2 requests for millage 

Voters in Tuscola, Huron 
and Sanilac counties will 
have a hand in deciding who 
will be the next 5th District 
U.S. representative. 

Battling for the post, va- 
cated by retiring veteran 
Congressman Bob Traxler, 
are Democratic state Sen. 
James Barcia and Republi- 
can state Rep. Keith 
Muxlow. Both men won 
their respective party prima- 
ries in August. 

Muxlow, a 58-year-old 
businessman and former 
farmer, served as mayor of 
Brown City for 8 years. He 
was elected to the House of 
Representatives in 1980 and 
has been assistant GOP floor 
leader for the last 4 years. 

Barcia, 40, is a Bay City 
native. He was elected to the 
state House of Representa- 
tives in 1976 and served 3 
terms before winning elec- 

tion as 34th District state 
senator in 1982. 

Sanilac County voters will 
decide 3 county board races 
and a pair of countywide 
millage requests Tuesday. 

But the general election 
will probably seem tame 
compared to the primary, 
when voters ousted 3 of 5 
incumbent county commis- 
sioners along with the in- 
cumbent drain commis- 
sioner and an incumbent 
road commissioner. 

Primary clection results 
along with redistricting 
means the county will seat at 
least 6 new commissioners. 
Races set next week are in 

districts 4 , 5  and 6.  
The candidates in District 4 

are former commissioner 
Dclla Wright, a Sandusky 
Republican who unseated 
incumbent Elfrieda Conrad 
in the primary, and Dcmo- 
crat Challenger Kenneth J. 
Mater, also of Sandusky. 

In District 5, Republican 
newcomer Carl D. Black, 
Croswell, who defeated in- 
cumbent Daniel Dean in 
August, faces a challenge 
from Democrat Diana C. 
Pynnoncn. 

In District 6, Melvin 
Democrat Helen B. Takacs 
-the only incumbent to run 
unopposed in the primary - 
is being challenged by for- 

mer commissioner Robert 
L. Warren, a Republican 
from Brown City. 

Among those running un- 
opposed are Deckerville 
Republican John Merriman 
in District 1 , which includes 
Evergreen, Greenleaf and 
Argyle townships. Merri- 
man unscated incumbent 
Eugene Foote, Snover, in 
the primary. 

Also running without op- 
position are Minden City 
Republican George Booms 

in District 2, Marlette Re- 
publican Richard Thrall in 
District 3, and former com- 
missioner James D. Young, 
Lexington Republican, in 
District 7. 
One countywide race is set. 

Vying for road commis- 
sioner are Democrat Wil- 
liam A. Gilboe, Peck, and 
Carsonville Republican Jer- 
ome Essenmacher, who de- 
feated Road Commission 
Chairman Stanley C. Alex- 
ander, Peck, in August. 

Incumbents Prosecutor 
James Young, Sheriff Virgil 
Strickler, Treasurer Carol 
Dale, Clerk Linda Kozfkay 
and Register of Deeds Es- 
ther Lee are all unopposed, 
as is drain commissioner 
candidate James Bower- 
man, Carsonville Republi- 
can. He unseated incumbent 
Harold Donaghy, Sandusky, 
in the primary. - 

MILLAGE REQUESTS Brown and trustees Mark 
Battel and Vera Nicol. 

The millage request is re- 
newal of one mill for4 years, 
which would raise about 
$9,000 a year for fice protec- 
tion in the township. 

NO RACES 
Sanilac County voters are 

being asked to approve 2 
millage requests. 

Proposal E asks for .5 of a 
mill for 5 years. The levy 
would raise about $296,000 
annually for the purpose of 
funding a public safety 
communications system for 
all police, fire and emer- 
gency medical service agen- 
cies in the county. 
Proposal F requests .2 of a 

mill for 4 years and would 
raise some $118,000 for 
coordination of ambulance- 
emergency services within 
the county, advanced train- 
ing of emergency medical 
personnel , physician super- 
vision and ambulance-life 
support equipment under the 
direction and supervision of 
the Sanilac Medical Control 
Board. 
For the owner of a $50,000 

home, Proposal E translates 
into an additional tax of 
about $12.50 a year and 
Proposal F, $5 a year. 

In state elections, incum- 
bent Republican Dick Allen, 
54, Caro, is running unop- 
posed for the 84th District 
seat after narrowly defeat- 
ing challenger Julia Heilig, 
48, of Ubly, in the primary. 
The district is composed of 

Tuscola and Huron coun- 
ties. 

In the 83rd District, which 
covers all of Sanilac County 
and a portion of Lapecr 
County, Kim Rhead, San- 
dusky, is running unop- 
posed. 

Rhad  defeated 5 other 
Republican candidates in 
theprimary toclaim theseat, 
vacated by Keith Muxlow, 
who retired to run for Con- 
gress this year. 

- \  2 ; '  
4 Democrat 

Area United 
District 2 . 

1 Tuscola 
:< County 

Commissioner 
* -  

# Former Corporation President 

Way record 
4 - 
1s good 
t 

zoomed. The ambitious 
$14,000 goal was swept 
aside and an amazing 
$17,583 was raised, much of 
it through employee deduc- 
tion programs. 

Since that time there has 
been a gradual increase in 
the United Way goals, until 
3 years ago, when it reached 
$18,000. That was met, but 
in 1991 the United Way 
board dropped the goal back 
to $17,000 because of eco- 
nomic conditions. That's 
the goal this year. 
The name United Way was 

first adopted in Detroit in 
1949 and Los Angeles be- 
came the first community to 
adopt the United Way name 
formally in 1963. 

The swelling United Way 
goals have been accompa- 
nied by an increase in the 
agencies and causes that the 
money collected supports. 
Over 20 different local proj- 
ects are funded at least in 
part by the United Way. 

This year's drive started 
Oct. 1 and is expected to be 
concluded by the end of the 
month. 

# Member of St. Pancratius Catholic Church 
# Former President of Chamber of Commerce 
#Distinguished Service to the State of Michigan Award 
# Former President of Cass City Rotary Club 
# Listed in "Who's Who in the State of Michigan" 

Your Support Appreciated 
Rd br by b r n # l * l  m E b a  IM Ella 101 bmmu.rom.  433 h m n  SI, C.N Gy, Lkhgmn 4 7 7 6  

County races NOTICE 
spark interest 

GREENLEAF TWP 

Also Tuesday, voters in 
Greenleaf Township will 
elect a new supervisor and 
treasurer, and decide the fate 
of a millage renewal re- 
quest. 

Vying for the office of 
supervisor are Republican 
Curtis Cleland Jr. and inde- 
pendent candidate Alfred 
Kosowski. Incumbent Ger- 
ald Bock did not seek re- 
election. 
Likewise, longtime Treas- 

urer Aletha Fox is retiring. 
Independent candidate Eve- 
lyn Zmierski is challenging 
Republican P .  Louis Laming 

Novesta Township in election 
registered voters will vote I 

November 3 Commissioners running 
unopposed are: 

District 1 - Republican 
newcomer James D. 
Schafer, 37, Unionville, 
who defeated incumbent 
and board Chairman Terry 
L. Houthoofd, Akron, in the 
primary. 

District 3 - incumbent 
Republican Kenneth G. 
Hess, 60, of Juniata Town- 
ship. 

District 5 - newcomer 
Republican Donald P. 

at 

Novesta Township Hall 
in Deford on Deckerville Rd. 

Barrier Free 
Polls open 7 a.m. to 8 p.m. 

Nursie Kloc 
Novesta Township Clerk 

McLane, 52, of Fremont *ormepost. 
Township, who defeated Seeking election unop- 
incumbent Commissioner Posed are Clerk Clare 
Michael L. Green, 41, of 
Fremont Township, in the : ' . . . . . . Protect Your Principal. 

Beat Rising Costs. - 
primary; and TheWantAds 

District 7 - incumbent : 
I 

N~~~~ T ~ ~ !  : William A. Worth, 66, of 
I 

hnfused about which way to turn? If 
vou'te like most people, you go back and 
orth between wanting to keep your 
noney safe and wanting to stay ahead of 
ising costs. 

Ask your registered representative today 
how the Principal Plus approach can be 
part of your financial future. 

Millington. 

? Our students of the week are: Mich- 
elle Brown, 10th grade, daughter of Jim 
and Judy Brown, and Estee' Eisinger, 
12th grade, daughter of Linda and John 
Smentek. Michelle enjoys basketball 

Newell E. Harris 
6815 E. Cass City Road 

Cass City, Michigan 48726 
51 7-872-2688 

Jow, there's a financial approach that can 
relp you beat inflation and guarantee 
lour. principal. 

and softball and Estee' enjoys debate 
and drama. Both have been chosen 
because of their design and execution 
of the main hallway showcase and one 
other showcase. Both plan to go on to 

With the Principal Plus strategy. you 
nvcst in a Fortis Masters Annuity and 
illocate your principal to achieve a 
:ombination of safety and growth 
Ipportunity. 

Estee' Eisinger & Michelle Brown college. 
The Student of the Week is S8/8Ct8d bv the Cass City Student Council. 

~~ 

Puttlng Prlnclprl Plus to Work for You 
Fortis Flnantlal Croup 

Fortis Investors. IM. [fund managcrncnt since 1949) 
Fortis Advisers. Inc. (brokerldcaler; mernkr S I X )  
Fonir Bcmfilr Insurance Co. (issuer nf FFGs 

insurance p d u c t s )  

Amunts  exchanged. withdrawn or annuitizcd from Ihe 
fixed account will be incrcowd or decreased by a 
rnsrkct v ~ l u c  adju~trwnt. unlrt i  held to the lull length 
of the guarantee pcrind. A dccrcosc may affect 
principal. Withdrawal- during the fin1 w e n  yean 
following purchru pnyiirent may be rubject lo a charge; 
withdrawals brfore age 59- In wbjcct lo certain tu 
penalties. 

T h i s  investmcnt approach dors not w w r c  a profit and 
will nnt protcct iigJinst IIW in a declining innrket. 
Because invcstrnent return and sham value flucluate. an 
investor's shares. whcn rcdccrncd. may bc worth more 
01 less than their original cost. 

For more complete inrorniation. including chargea and 
erpcnsei. send for rhe Fortis Serics Fund. Inc. and Forth 
Bencfitg Mailers Annuity prospecluscs froin h i i J  
Investnri. Inc . P.O. Rot M284, St. Paul. MN SS164. 
(800 )  800-2638. Read them cuefully before investing 
w sendini money. 

$1 00,000 
beginning principal 

A 
Guaranlssd Fixed Mulual Fund 

$52,000 81 6 80% 
lor 10 years 

Accounls Portfolios 
w?, ooo 

Af mafun'ty 

CH RYSlER Dodge Jeep 

DOWNTOWN CASS CITY 
Local Number 151 7) 872-21 84 

COMMISSIONER 
Paid for by the 

Committee 
to Elect Gary V., Krug, 
2585 Bad Axe Rd., 
Bad Axe, MI 48413 

The inrcrcst rnte and guarintcc p c r i d  qhown above 
are for illustration only and are not ineaiit to rhow the 
actual current rate, Plci~$c see your rcgittercd represenla- 
live o( call Fortis Financial Group at I-800-800-2638 for 
currmt rates for each guarantee ~nd .  



~ i t t l ~  Goes 
All The Trimmings For Your 

Cheer That 
A Long Way... HOME 
STEVE WRIGHT PAINTING A 

4842 HEMLOCK LANE 

CASS CITY, MI 48726 
C o w m c f A L  - RESIDENTIAL 

COUNTRY LIVING AT ITS BEST! 

GENTLEMAN'S FARM - Featuring 3 bedrooms, 
2 bathrooms, 2 car garage, breezeway, 20 acres 
of land, tool shed, chicken coop, horse barn and 
fenced in barnyard, in-ground pool for the kids. 

OWNER SAYS "MAKE AN OFFER!" 

Call Cass City 517-872-2248 or 
Caro 51 7-673-2555 

Kelly W. Smith, Broker 

LISTINGS NEEDED on all types of 
Homes, Farms, Hunting Land 
Call one of our. .. 
HOMETOWN PROFESSIONALS! 

NOW The Most Authentic, Delicious 
Pizza In The Thumb Has 2 for 1 

GET ONE FREE V'O 
$8.99 BUY ONE 14" ONE ITEM PIZZA 

For Only 
Additional items $1 .OO - We use only the finest ingredients available! 

NO COUPON NECESSARY 

PARKWAY 
DRIVE-THRU 

872-5448 
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