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STUDENTS AT CASS CITY Schools are doing their bit to welcome back the troops from Saudi 
Arabia. They are creating posters to display in the windows of stores on Main Street with erection 
slated Thursday. A huge flag has been created by students in the first grade under the direction 
of Sherry Dillon, teacher, and Sue Sobczak, volunteer parent. Displaying the flag are 4 of the 
students who helped. Fromleft,Summer Osentoski, Jonathon Bock, Kerry Shagena and Eli Healy. 

Owen-Gage smerintendent 

Offer Kirby 1991 -2 contract 
Owen-Gage Board of Edu- 

cation members approved 
renewal of school Supt. 
Harley Kirbyk Contract for 
the 1991-92 school year, but 
tabled action on the 
district’s developmental 
preschool program Monday 
night. 
There was little discussion 

preceding a unanimous vote 
to offer Mrhy~ther  con- 
tract. 

A committee composed of 
bard President Jack Brink- 
man and trustees Tom Fritz 
and Bill Kretzschmer was 
appointed to make a recorn- 
mendatiw to the full board 
regarding salary at a later 
date, 

Turning to the preschool, 
the board was expected to 

. a  

outline details Monday re- 
garding how the district 
plans to opcFate the program 
next year. 

However, Kirby indicated 
a decision couldn’t be made 
yet because school officials 
are waiting to receive word 
on the possibility of the 
Huron Intermediate School 
District taking over the pro- 
gram* 

If ISD officials agree and 
Owen-Gage officials decide 
to go with that option, Kirby 
said, the local preschool 
program might be moved to 
Lakers due to an increase in 
the number of at-risk stu- 
dents that would be served in 
a county-wide program. He 
noted that the state provides 
some $2,500 in funding for 
each at-risk student. 

Ubly High 
School names 
top students 
Renee LeCureux and Paul 

Krumenacker have been 
named valedictorian and 
salutatorian, respectively, 
of Ubly High School’s Class 
of 1991. 

LRCureux, daughter of 
James and Eileen LeCureux, 
has a grade point average of 
3.986 following 7 semesters 
of college prep curriculum, 

She has attended Ubly 
Community Schools since 
kindergarten and has re- 
ceived medals of highest 
achievement in Algebra I 
and 11, and integra€ed math, 
chemistry, animal science, 
American lit. and Writer’s 
Workshop. She also re- 
ceived the Society of 
Women Engineers Math and 
Science award in 1990. 

LeCureux has been a 
member of the National 
Honor Society for 2 years 
and an active member of the 
Student Council for 4 years, 
serving as her junior class 
president and as Student 
Council executive vice- 
president her senior year. 

Leadership in Action semi- 
nar at Central Michigan 
University and has partici- 
pated in the high school 
marching, concert and pep 
bands for 4 years. She also 
competed at the solo and 
ensemble festival, and she 
was the recipient of the 
Gerald Parks Marching 
Band award. 
As a senior, she was elected 

to the homecoming court 
and was also a member of 
the Ubly Quiz Bowl team. 

LeCureux has k e n  a 

She attended the 1990- 

2 years, holding the offices 
of chapter secretary and 
parliamentarian. She has 
been a member of the Coun- 
try Buddies 4-H Club for 8 
years. 

She has played basketball 
throughout her high school 
career and was named to the 
1990 Thumb C AU Confer- 
ence Honorable Mention 
Team as well as being 
named the team’s Most 
Valuable Player. She has 
also played softball all 4 
years, receiving honorable 
mention as a junior, 
LeCureux, a member of St. 

John’s Catholic Church in 
Ubly, plans to attend Michi- 
gan State University and 
major in engineering. 

Krumenacker, son of Carl 
and Linda Krumenacker, 
following 7 semesters of 
college prep cumculum, has 
a grade point average of 
3.902. 
He also has attended Ubly 

Community Schools since 
kindergarten. 

Krumenacker has earned 
medals of highest achieve- 
ment inEnglish,purnalism, 
physical education, biology, 
American history and 
health. He has been a student 
aide for 2 years. 

He has been a member of 
the National Honor Society 
for 2 years, serving as treas- 
urer. He was president of his 
freshman class and has been 
active in journalism for 2 
years, serving as editor of 
the school newspaper and 
co-editor for the yearbok. 
Krumenacker attended the 

Leadership in Action Semi- - 
member Of the mly  for Please turn to back page. 

In other business during the 
90-minute monthly session, 
the board votcd 5-1 in favor 
of hiring somconc at a pay 
rate of $15 per hour to re- 
move snow behind 
Gagetown Elementary 
School whcn necessary. 
Trustee Tom Fritz cast the 
lone dissenting ballot. 
The vote came after a brief 

discussion in which a major- 
ity of bard-members and 
elementary Principal Wil- 
liam Britt disagreed with 
Kirby’s assessment that the 
school’s tractor/snow 
blower could be used behind 
the school. 
Britt indicated the school’s 

snow blower doesn’t work 
well in the lot behind the 
school due to gravcl and 
uneven areas. 
Also Monday, the board: 
*Adopted the Huron Inter- 

mediate School District’s 
proposed special education 

curriculum for students in 
gradcs 9 through-12. , 

*Notcd Brinkrnan and 
Kretxschmcr have each ac- 
cumulated at least 75 points 
in the Michigan Association 
of School Board’s “Keys to 
Better Boardsmanship” pro- 
gram, making them both 
eligible to receive the 
association’s Award of 
Mcrit. 

*Tentatively okayed a re- 
quest from Trip Club co- 
sponsor Faith Fahrner to al- 
low 20 high school students 
to take a trip to Toronto 
April 29-May 1. The trip, 
which will be funded by 
money raised by the stu- 
dents, is subject to final 
approval from the superin- 
tendent and high school 
principal. 
*Approved the recommen- 

dation of Debie Thorpe as 
the high school’s “student of 
the month.” 

Rawson library moving 
into electronic age 

Finding a specific book, 
magazine or video title at 
Rawson Memorial Library 
will soon be as easy as 
punching a few computer 
keys. 

Officials currently are 
implementing an automatic 
circulation system and on- 
line catalogue at the Cass 
City library. 
The computerized system, 

funded bya$14,837Library 
Service in Construction Act 
grant, initially will be used 
primarily to check materials 
in and out, according to li- 
brary Director Barbara 
Hutchinson, who said the 
system eventually will re- 
place the library’s card cata- 
logue. 

In fact, Hutchinson added, 
one computer station will be 
available soon for patrons 
interested in using the com- 
puterized catalogue right 
away. 

Currently, volunteers are 
busy attaching bar codes- 
similar to those used at vari- 
ous stores-an all perma- 
nent library materials, in- 
cluding books, magazines 
and videos. In addition, all 
patrons are being asked to 
pick up an application at the 
library for new library cards, 
which will also bare bar 
codes. 

With the new system, 
Hutchinson explained, a 
special light pen is used to 
“read” the barcodes, each of 
which is lied to a record in 
the computer’s data base. 
Once read, information 
from a specific bar code will 
instantly be displayed on a 
computer screen. 
For example, the bar code 

on a library card will reveal 
the patron’s name, materials 
they’ve check out, materials 
they’ve reserved, overdue 
materials, fines and other 
information. 

It will take some ume to 
attach the bar codes to all of 
the library’s 23,000 to 
25,000 materials, but 
Hutchinson indicated the 
task is proceeding smoothly. 
“Our target is to have every- 
thing on by the 15th of 
May,” she said. 

Implementing the compu- 
terized card catalogue will 
be the next step, she contin- 
ued. “Probably within a year 
we’ll do away with the card 
catalogue completely.” 

Having to use a computer 
“sounds scary to a lot of 
p p l e ,  but we’ll all be here 

to help, and although it all 
may seem intimidating at 
first, it really is very easy,” 
Hutchinson remarked. 

She said patrons will be 
able to search for materials 
on the computer by simply 
punching in an authors name 
or the subject or a key word 
from a title. The computer 
will then respond by listing 
all available materials. 
Rawson Memorial Library 

is the third area library to 
implement an automatic cir- 
culation system, The others 
are located in Bad Axe and 
Kingston. 

‘The.advantages are that 
you can find materials much 
easier,” Hutchinson said, + 

noting the computer in- 
stantly tells a patron what 
materials are available and 
what has been checked out. 
Aside from speed, she 
added, the new system will 
also save time now spent on 
tasks such as updating and 
maintaining the existing 
card catalogue. 

“It will definitely free up 
some (staff) time that wecan 
use for programming, per- 
sonal help to the patrons and 
so on.” 

ASSISTANT LIBRARIAN Ann Craig uses a special light 
pen, connected to a computer, that CLread~” bar codes placed 
on *library materials and new library cards. The equipment 
is part of the new automatic circulation system being imple- 
mented at Rawson Memorial Library. 

- 

At CarnDbell Elementarv School 

Volunteer work rewarding for Long 
When it comes to finding a 

place and time to relax, 
probably few area residents 
would head for the nearest 
elementary school in the 
morning. 

Ask Dennis Long, how- 
ever, and chances are good 
he’ll gladly say the clanging 
of lockers and the sound of 
children talking and laugh- 
ing is music to his ears.  
For the past 5 months or so, 

Long, 42, has spent 12 to 15 
hours a week at Campbell 
Elementary School, volun- 
teering his time as an assis- 
tant to Chapter I reading 
specialist Cathy C o o p  
each weekday morning be- 
fore returning home and 
then, later, heading off to his 
second shift job at Michigan 
Sugar Company’s Caro 
plant. 
“It’s a blast watching these 

little guys and gals,” the 
Deford area resident com- 
mented Friday at thc school 
as he worked on a batch of 
buttons to be given as 
awards to students. “No- 
body has more energy at 9 in 
the morning than a bunch of 
5-year-olds ,** 
Friday marked Long’s last 

morning at thc school. Hc 
explained he rcccntly was 
promoted to warehouse 
supervisor and was to bcgin 
working first shift Monday. 
“Unfortunately, I’m going 
to have to give up my day  job 
here,” he joked. 
Long’s “day job” has con- 

sisted of a variety of tasks; 
everything from clerical 
duties such as filing and sta- 
pling bmklcts to creating 
bulletin boards, word flash 
cards and special game 
boards designed to help stu- 
dents overcome their diffi- 
culty with reading. 

ROLE MODEL 

“I’m going to miss him 
greatly,” Cooper said. “It’s 
so nice for us to have a man 
showing such dedicatio- 
he’s an excellent role 
modcl.” 

Cooper, who noted the 
local Chapter I reading pro- 
gram serves some 120 stu- 
dents in grades K-6, said she 
has appreciated Long’s ef- 
forts, which have allowed 
her to spend less time on 
activity projects and more 
time helping students. 

“There are just so many 
tasks that require a lot of 
extra time,” she said. 

And Long’s artistic ability 
has been a big plus. “I 
wouldn’t be able to begin to 
do this,” Cooper com- 
mented. “He takes story 
characters and enlarges 
them so they come alive for 
the students.” 
The rcading specialist said 

Long’s efforts have made a 
difference. 
“We have seen an increase 

in (students’) motivation 
and their desire to do better. 
They find thc activities fun 

to do; it isn’t drudgery.” 
The same is true from 

Long’s perspective. 
“It’s like free therapy,” he 

said. “It’s very relaxing- 
there’s no pressure. Any- 
thing you do they appreciate 
so much.” 
Taking an active role in the 

school district isn’t some- 
thing new for the Long fam- 
ily, which has pitched in 
when Dennis would take an 
unfinished project home 
with him. 
His wife, Carol, is a school 

bus driver and long-timc 4- 
H leadc who was hired in 

cation aide. She previously 
volunteered her time to help 
Cooper out, which led to 
Dennis’ involvement. 

Septem b r as a special edu- 

VERY WILLING 

Carol was “keenly aware 
of the amount of materials 
we prepare,” Cooper re- 
marked, adding the Longs 
are “a family that’s very 
willing to help benefit (the 
school), and with not a lot of 
glory *” 

“The way I like to think 
about it is I’m freeing 
(teachers) up” to work with 
the kids, Dennis, who re- 
cently became a grandfa- 
ther, said. “Plus, our kids 
have used the various pro- 
grams over the years. I’m 
just putting something 
back.” 
The Longs have 4 children, 

Sabrina, 22, Anthony, 20, 
Shawna, 12, and Aaron, 10. 

Dennis noted he’s gotten 
plenty of help on his school 
projects at home. ’ 

“It’s a family thing,” he 
said. He grinned and added, 
“We’re pretty dull-every 
weekend we sit around with 
magic markers:” 
“It’s fun; we enjoy it (and) 

i t  shows the kids at an early 
age that they can make a 
difference with little 
things.” 

Although Long plans to 
continue doing what he can 
to hclp at the school, his time 
will be limited with his new 
job. He suggested that other 
arca parents might want to 
consider volunteering some 

time. 
“It’s not that hard to do; 

anybody can do it,” he said. 
“You don’t have to be a 
certified artist to help out 
here.” 

“I’m going to miss it-all 
these kids running around,” 
he continued. 
Cooper Please pointed turn to back out that page. the 

ccI’M JUST PUTTING something back,” Dennis Long 
(above) says of his volunteer work at Campbell Elementary 
School over the past several weeks. 

* !  
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Engaged Literacy council slates Townsend 
receives 
degree 

Cass City 
tutor training session slates benefit concert 

The Junior Youth Group of The Sonshines, a 9-mem- 
Personal Items 

The Tuscola Literacy 
Council, in conjunction with 
the Car0 Presbyterian 
Church, is sponsoring a new 
Tutor Training Session in 
Car0 March 16,23 and 30. 
There is an urgent need for 
tutors in the Caro/Cass City 
area. 

The 12-hour course in the 
Michigan Method of Liter- 

will be provided. A 4-hOu.r 
seminar in basic math uain- 
ing will be held March 30 
from 8 a.m. to noon. This 
math training is for all tutors 
new or old who want to 
expand their tutoring exper- 
tise in the math area; refresh- 
ments will be provided. 

Anyone wishing further 
information on the volun- 
teer literacy training Dro- 

the Good Shepherd Lu- 
theran Church, Cass City, is 
planning a benefit concert to 
help the Cas City Support 
Group for Operation Desert 
storm. 

ber group of vocalists and 
musicians from the church, 
will perform a variety of 
gospel, folk and patriotic I 

music. 
The price of admission is a 

boxed or canned food item 
which will be given to the 
families of area servicemen 

Timothy M. Townsend, 
son of Robert and Carole 
Townsend of Deford, has 
successfully completed a 
Bachelor of Science degree 
in aeronautical-astronauti- 
cal engineering at Massa- 
chusetts Institute of Tech- 
noloav. 

I Call your local news to the Chronicle office - 872-2010. 

Mrs. Gloria Rwkafellow 
and son Jared of Olivet and 
Mr. and Mrs. Keith t l a r k  
and son Adam of William- 
ston spent the weekend with 
the Russell Schneeberger 
family. Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Bond of Williamston spent 
Saturday night. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Root 
were in East Lansing Satur- 
day to attend the graduation 
of their daughter Barbara. 
She received a master’s 
degree at Michigan State 
University. Miss Root is 
visiting in Florida this week 
and will be moving to Chi- 
cago. 

The concert will be held 
Sunday beginning at 7:30 

and women. p.m. at the church 

Lori Lomas 
Lauren Page 

acy Training will be held gram or anyone w h o n k s  
March 16 and 23 from 8 help reading can call 872- 
a.m.to 4 p.m. at the Car0 5406, or toll-free 1-800- 

m. and a s ,  fichatd Presbyterian Church; lunch 437-9650. 

Salem United Methodist 
Mrs. Muriel Holik of Cass 

City celebrated her 86th 
birthday Saturday at the 
hhzpah Church fellowship 
hall. Forty-nine family 
members, including her 8 
children, attended. A noon 
meal was served. 

Women air March meeting Hampshire announce the 
engagement of their daugh- 
ter, Lori Lomas, to Lauren 16 attend Lutheran Men’s Choir 

at Trinity meet The Salem United Meth- church, with a Central 
odist Women recently held American meal by Helen 
their March meeting at the Bade and her committee. 
home of Yvonne Sherman. Joan and John Chapin will 

show slides of their visits to 
The group held a fund- Central America, 

raiserMarch3 forthesagan- 
ing Indian Mission. After a 
chili and stew dinner, Dale 
Wertz. auctioneer from Bay 

Page of Murray, Utah, 

ate of Cass City High School 
Ms. Lomas is a 1977 g d u -  ladies aid meeting 

Trinity United Methodist 
Women met March 4 for a 
St. Patrick’s Day meal, 
served by Group 3 under the 
leadership of Virginia 
Hartwick and Midge Th- 
ompson. 

The Sacred Heart Men’s 
Choir from Car0 presented a 
program of original music 
and classic favorites. 

Devotions were led by 
Shirley Wagg. 

Plans are underway for a 
mother-daughter salad buf- 
fet to be held April 20 under 
the chairmanship of Pam 
Powell. 

sionary League district re- 
treat at Bethlehem Lutheran 
Church in Saginaw April 27. 
A committee was named to 

review the Ladies Aid 
Constitution. Deb Ruggles 
was accepted as a new 
memkr. 

and is employed with Cali- 
fornia State University, San 
Bernardino. Page is a mem- 
ber of the U.S. Air Force 
assigned to the Headquar- 
ters Air Force Audit 
Agency. 

The couple will reside in 
Colton, Calif., following a 
July 20 wedding. 

The Ladies Aid of Good 
Shepherd Lutheran Church 
met March 4 with 15 mem- 
bers and one guest present. 
Lois Moslander opened the 
meeting with a reading, “In 
His Service.” 

Several ladies will attend 
the Lutheran Women’s Mis- 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Hulien 
of Caseville left Sunday 
from Bishop Airport for 
Pensacola, Fla., to spend 
some time, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Brewton 

and daughter of Taylor were 
weekend guests of his par- 
ents, Mr, and Mrs, Louis 
Nemeth. 

For health 
insurance, 
check with 

A video explaining the 
LWML mission projects for 
the next 2 years was shown. 
Refreshments were served 

by Jackie Guinther and Lois 
Moslander. 

State Farm. 

Call: Ernest A. Teichman, Jr. 
6240 W. Main 

Cass City, Mich. 
Phone 872-3388 

Patti and Debbie Timmons 
and Wayne Cwry spent 
Sunday, March 3, with Mr. 
and Mrs. Gaylord Weer.  
They helped the LaPeers 
celebrate their 53rd wed- 
ding anniversary. 

20 named to 
dean’s list Bakery & Restaurant 

Announces 
SAMANTHA AUTEN 
as the Baby Picture Winner 

Samantha is the daughter 
of Les and Donna Auten 

We thank all babies who paflic@ated and all 
those who voted. Over 500 ballots were cast. 

The Jordan College 
Registrar’s Office reports 
that 20 Thumb campus stu- 
dents have. been named to 
the dean’s list, the largest 
number in 8 years. 

Area residents named to 
the list are Deb Montgomery 
and Wendy Mellendorf, 
both of Cas City; Alice 
Heronemus and Marilyn 
King, both of Decker; Mi- 
chael Walkiewicz of Deford 
(straight As); Penny 
Meredith and Janet Wil- 
liamson, both of hover, and 
Kimberly Ratcliffe and 
Carmen Jenkins, both of 
Kingston. 
In order to be named to the 

list, a student must complete 
12 semester hours or more of 
credit and achieve a mini- 
mum grade point average of 
3.5. 

Mag’u Peg 
/: I I 

Main St. 
re visited 

State Farm Mutual Automobils 
lnsurancs Conpany 

Horn O H i ,  Bbmington, lilinoia 

L .-. .-. P. r. .-. .-. 

set March 20 ung- Authors? 
Fun Fair 

Thursday March 2 1 st 

Campbell Elementar 
5:OO - 8:OO p.m. 

ames, Food, Cake 
Walk, Face Painting 
Tickets presak - 5 for $I .oO, 

at door - 4 for $1.00 ‘r For childm through 6th grade. 

88 pp 9.9 p p $3 9 

7 I by Melva E. Guinther I The Tuscola Intermediate 
School District is sponsor- 
ing a workshop on Attention 
Deficit Hyperactivity Disor- 
der, scheduled for March 20 
at the Tuscola Area Skill 
Center in Caro. 
Registration, due by March 
18, is available by contact- 
ing Sharron McLean at 673- 
5300’ (ext. 301). 

Those who may be inter- 
ested in attending include 
parents who have a child 
who is of average to above- 
average intelligence, but 
who seems to be having dif- 
ficulty achieving in school 
and exhibits behavior con- 
cerns at home. 
Attention Deficit Hyperac- 

tivity Disorder is character- 
ized by developmentally 
inappropriate levels of inat- 
tention, impulsiveness and/ 
or hyperactivity. Children 
may also be easily dis- 
tracted, disorganized and 
unable to stay on task. , 

On a recent afernoon, Es- 
ther McCullough and Agnes 
Milligan, bothofwhom were 
involved in the Cass City 
business scene for many 
years, got together with 
Ruth Esau to reminisce 
about Cass City’s Main 
Street in years gone by. 

This is how they remem- 
bered it. 

as he strode up North Seeger 
to his beautiful house (now 
the Iwankovitsch home), 
gave Agnes a maroon school 
sweater, which her great- 
niece, Jenny, still wears as a 
cheer leader’s adjunct - still 
good quality and still ma- 
roon for CCHS! 
Grover Burke’s Drug Store 

came next. Mac McCull- 
ough, an Argyle school 
teacher, worked there week- 
ends and summers. (Inci- 
dentally, he met Esther and 
they were married the next 

In there someplace 
Corprons had a hardware 
store, and then came the post 
office, which was connected 
to the drug store with a base- 
ment landing which held the 
telephone. 
Bailey and Graham owned 

a fine barbershop with a hall 
opening to the Wood Drug 
Store. The hall held a beau- 
tiful staircase with a big 
newel post leading upstairs 
to many interesting services 
and offices - Dr. Schenck’s 
Dentistry, Marie Sword’s 
Beauty Shop, the Women’s 
Study Club’s library, staffed 
by Mrs. Stafford, the late 
Mrs. James Milligan’s 
mother. Also there at one 
time were Barnes Construc- 
tion Co. and Champion 
Advertising Co.. 
Over the Burke Drug Store 

was Dr. Fritz’s Dentistry, 
along with some dwelling 
apartments. 
Around the corner on See- 

ger S t. were the fire depart- 
ment and the jail, and later 
the library. 

Yea.) 

TO BE CONTINUED ***** 

SOMMERS’ 
Bakery & Restaurant 

6538 Main St. am3577 - “Cass City is famous for 3 
things”, wrote School Supt. 
Harley Holmes to (then) 
Esther Tarnoski of Naper- 
ville, Ill., in 1927 as he of- 
fered her a contract to teach 
home economics in the high 
school, (1) its wide Main St., 
(2) its new school, (3) 
Nestle’s Plant. 

Esther accepted, and ar- 
rived to take the position 
vacated by Helen White 
Baker, She found a town 
that looked like this on the 
south side of Main St.: 
Gilligan’s was the Gordon 

Hotel, operated by Basil and 
Hazel Middleton and their 3 
charming daughters, 
Frances, Jackie and Julie. 

Hills and Dales 
General Hospital -HOMEOWNERS- I MCCONKEY, 

Are you receiving 
savings on 

c] Mature-Person Discount -- 55+ 
0 Nonsmoker Discount 
0 Smoke Detector Discount 
0 Fire Extinguisher Discount 
c] DeadlBolt Lock Discount 
0 Central Station Burglar 

Alarm Discount 
El Central Station Fire 

Alarm Discount 
0 Direct Police/Fire 

Station Discount 

SAVINGS - SERVICE 
“That‘s our Policy” 

JEWELRY AND GIFT SHOP PATIENTS LISTED 
MONDAY, MARCH 11, 

WERE: 

Barbara Vollmar, Fred 
Periso, Cass City; 

Brandi Shephard, Gerald- 
ine Milligan, Veronica 
Fritz, Caro; 

Dorothy Caverly, Gerald 
Wilkinson, Kingston; 
Bonnie Nowaczyk, Owen- 

dale; 
Wilbert Kuhl, Unionville. 

Large Selection 

.. Confirmation 

Communion 
and 

GI FTS 
The two 1,350 foot tow- 

ers of the World Trade 
Center in New York City 
occupy only two acres, but 
can accommodate 130,000 
people. 

The Cass Tavern was owned 
Marriage Licenses by Gage and Haven and was 

Jason Ewdd and a fine clothing store for men. 
Kit Errin Vmdem&, both Cas City Floral was the 

Gowen family restaurant. of Caro. 
Randy Grover Russell and Next door was the 

and the A & P was managed 

there someplace was the 
Knapp/Douglas Furniture 
Store, the Pastime Theater 
and, Of C O U m  Fort’s Store, 
where Esther purchased the 
groceries for the home 

ways give her a treat. 

ful linens and employed 
Agnes Milligan 2 summers. 
Mr. Cathcart,a stately figure 
who looked like Mr,Chips 

Lynn Marie Myers, both of and mahling Meat Market, 
Akron. 

R ~ ~ ,  and N~~~ Marie 
Thurston, Vassar. 
Frank p m i s  Galvin 11 and 

both of Millington. 

Michelle Evelte Ray, both 
of Kingston. 
Bill Raymond Albee, Vas- 

sar, and Janice Esther goods store that sold 
James, Mayville. 

william John Hunter, 
taro, and Kristina me 
Beller, Fairgrove. 

Steven Paul Vollmar and 

Luke Wilma Bierlein, by Keith McConkey* In 

Clara Catherine Bellman, 

David Allen Sowinski and 

Cadicarts Owned a 

Musical Plaques 

Rosaries Cross Necklaces 

Prayer Books Figurines 

Picture Frames 
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for $4.00. 

In Michigan - $12.00 a year, 2 years 
$22.00. 

In drer parts of the Unit4 States - 
$1%00a year,or2years$28.00. Payable 
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For information regarding newspaper 
advertising and commercial and job 
printing, telephone 872-201 0. 

Hand& Communion veib 
in stockor m y  be ordered. 

Lace purses andanklets d o  avaifubfe 

Insurance AHency McCONKEY. 
6265 Church St. Cass City JEWELRY AND GIFT SHOP 

Phone 872-3025 Cass Cily 

HELP! I need a good recipe 
for punch. If you have one, 
please give me a call or mail 
it before next week. 

872-51 14 
Shelley Atkerson, both of 
Caro. + NOTICE 

Public Hearing 
Novesta Township 

Annual Meeting 
- onthe * W o  Mechanics * ‘Batteries 

on Duty * Tires * 15 Minute * V-Belts 
Oil Change to 100 inches * Muffkrs  (For aU makes of cars) 

SEE US FOR YOUR AUTO CARE NEEDS 

Tentative 91 1 System 
at 

Township Hall Will be held at the 
Tuscola County Board of 

Commissioners’ meeting 
April 23 at 10 a,m, 

In the Board Room, 207 Grant 
‘ Street, Caro, Michigan 48723 

SATURDAY, MAR. 23 
MR. CHIPS at 1 :00 p.m. 

Budget Hearing will be held. 

SERVICE CENTER NURSIE KLOC 
TOWNSHlPkLERK Phone 872-3850 Cass City 
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“If It Fitz. , , . I I  

Growing old 
By Jim Fitzgerald 

The man on the phone, in 
Maine, said he’d call me 
back, so I gave him my 7- 
digit number. He asked for 
my area code. Oh, Lord. The 
area code isn’t printed on my 
new office phone. I hur- 
riedly hissed to the young 
woman at the next desk: 
“What’s our area code num- 
ber?,’ She gave me a strange 
look that demanded an ex- 
planation of how I possibly 
could be so dumb I didn’t 
know my own area code. I 
wanted to slap her young 
face. It 
took aminute to wheedle the 
number out of the young 
woman, and the man in 
Maine surely interpreted my 
hesitation as stupidity. So 
now there were two people 
astonished by the incredible 
fact that I could live in the 
Detroit area all my life, use 
the phone regularly as an 
integral tool of my profes- 
sion, and not know the area 
code for Detroit. 

Kennedy .... was nuts over 
the girl singer in my band in 
Chicago. One of the great 

m y  THE m y  
WOULDN’T 

Thecampaign to see if separate tournaments for private and 
public schools has state-wide support took a step forward last 
week when the committee headed by Don Schelke and 
Wayne Dillon shipped out a questionnaire to all schools in 
the state. 

BLEEP men of all Gme. 
Except for me.” 
JFK was my hem, and Jerry 

Lewis was my idea of a 
world champion loud- 
mouthed jerk. And 30 years 
later I learn they were wom- 
anizing best buddies, with 
an assist from the tax-sup- 
prted Marines. I’m not sure 
I wanted to live long enough 
to see the last shreds of 
Camelot flushed down the 
sewer by J e n y  Lewis. 

As for my area cde,  
what’s depressing is that I 
knew it the day before I 
didn’t know it, and I knew it 
again the next day. I know it 
right now - 313. But when 
that man from Maine asked 
for it, the only phone number 
I could bring to mind was 
22651. That hasn’tbeen my 
phone number since 1944 
when I moved out of my 
parents’ home at 1020 Pine 
Grove Ave. in Port Huron. 
We had that Same number 
when we lived at 928 Huron 
Ave. in the same city. I can 
remember all those 45-year- 
old numbers easily, but 
today’s numbers keep slip- 
ping away. 

Because I’m about to take a 
long motor vacation, I’m 
reminded of perhaps my 
most embarrassing loss of 
memory. A couple of years 
ago I stopped at a Holiday 
IM in Alabama. When the 
mom clerk asked for my 
auto license number, I’d 
forgotten it. I would have 
read it to him from the car 
registration in my wallet, 
but I’d forgotten my reading 

I would have asked the 
clerk to read the number off 
my registration, except I’d 
forgotten my wallet. When I 
went out to the car to get my 
glasses and wallet, I’d for- 
gotten where I parked. 

glasses. 

*$******** 

Oh, for the days when a dollar was wor th..... at least 75 
cents. Juanita Burk brought in a receipt for a Chronicle 
subscription for 1949 that had been saved by her father-in- 
law, Lawrence Burk. 
For the year the cost was $2. 

+*+*+***** 

What makes March Madness on the high school level so 
eat is that every once in a while David rises up and slays 

Goliath. It happened again Friday when Marlette, with a 
couple of regulars not playing, defeated Frankenmuth, the 
eighth ranked team in the state. 

CAST MEMBERS OF the upcoming Owen-Gage Drama 
Club production of “Anne of Green Gables’’ include (seated 
above, left to right) Joe Dubs, Maelin Damm, Julie Warack, 
Debie Thorpe, Kathy Wildman, Bryan Metzger, (standing, 
left) Patti Timmons and Brandy Parks, 

.********* 
You read a b u t  theclose security when travelling by air, but 

it doesn’t really hit until you take a trip. When you buy a 
ticket or get aboarding pass these days, you must have photo 
proof that you are who you say you are. 
Although this doesn’t have anything to do with security, it 
, I think, worth noting. At a location some 2 hours north of 

Vancouver in British Columbia, which, of course, is on the 
west coast, the 3 television stations that everyone watches 
are the 3 large Detroit outlets. 
None of them has super station status, either. 

After the obliging clerk 
finally reunited me with my 
car and got me safdy into a 
room, I left it to drive across 
town for a dinner engage- 
ment. When I returned to the 
Holiday Inn, my door key 
wouldn’t fit the lock. When 
I complained to another 
obliging room clerk, I 
learned I was at the wrong 
Holiday Inn. 

Onward and Upwad. 

0 - G  students to present play 
A cast of 25 from the 

ow endale-Gagetown 
Drama Club will present 
“Anne of Green Gab1es”at 7 
p.m. March 21 and 22 at 
Gagetown Elementary 
School. 

The admission price is $3 

for adults and $2 for stu- 
dents. 
“Anne of Green Gables” is 

a humorous account of an 
orphan girl adopted by a 
spinster sisterbrother 
couple, who were expecting 
a boy, to help with chores. 

Anne melts their hearts with 
her adolescent charm and 
girlish ways. AGING ATTIRE OF 

THE STARS 

Seniors plan 
hat parade 

-- 

The Weather It’s all part of growing old. 
For people my age,several 
facts of aging are depress- 
ing. For example, it is de- 
pressing to see June Allyson 
on television selling diapers 
for people my age. 

Forty years ago, I would 
have hooted and scoffed at 
the ridiculous prediction 
that cute, perky, forever- 
young June Allyson some- 
day would appear on televi- 
sion to suggest that she wore 
diapers for important social 
occasions, and mayk I 
should, too. 
Also depressing was a re- 

cent Esquire article in which 
Jerry Lewis bragged that he 
and president John Kennedy 
chased women together. 
“The best years in my life I 
had with JFK,” Lewis said. 
“I used to get on a Marine 
chopper, and they’d fly me 
to the South Lawn so that I 
could bypass the press. 

High Low Precip. 
Tuesday ............................ 46 ...... 37 .... trace 
Wednesday ........................ 46 ...... 20 .. 1.5”sn 
Thursday .......................... 30 ...... 10 .......... 0 

Sunday .............................. 36 ...... 23 .... trace 

Friday ................................ 37 ...... 31 .. 1.5”sn 
Saturday ............................ 40 ...... 28 .... S”sn 

Monday ............................ 32 ...... 14 .......... 0 
(Recorded at Cass City wastewater treatment plant) 

Local students still lead Thirty-five members of the 
Owen-Gage Senior Citizens 
club enjoyed a potluck meal 
Thursday at the parish hall 
of St. Agatha’s Church in 
Gagetown. 

Ten blood pressure read- 
ings were taken, and mem- 
bers had a moment of silent 
prayer for Helen Rocheleau. 

Members will k having a 
“Dinner Out” meeting April 
18 at the Lutheran Church in 
Bach. There are 2 more 
meetings before then for 
members to sign up. 

The next meeting, March 
21, will feature an Easter hat 
parade. 

In other business, Jennie 
Deneen thanked the group 
for the birthday gift she re- 
ceived, and a get well card 
was sent to Josephine Bart- 
nik. =There also was some 
discussion a b u t  the club’s 
bingo games. 

Door prizes were won by 
Orville Mallory and Audrey 
Cummins. 

1 

CROWLEY 
CHIROPUCTI 

W e  create through 
education, gentte 

techniques & personal 
care, a healthy and 

painflee body. 

in stock market game 
lio value of $143,582 in 2 
weeks. 
The stock market competi- 

tion is coordinated through 
the Center for Economic 
Education Offices at Central 
Michigan University. Par- 
ticipating students are given 
a simulated account of 
$lOO,OOO and can trade 
stocks on the New York, 
American and over-the- 
counter (NASDAQ) ex- 
changes. 
The winning team after 10 

weeks will receive lunch at 
the Detroit Economics Club, 
tours of the Detroit Free 
Press, Roney & Company 
and the Federal Reserve 
Branch Bank in Detroit, and 
will be recognized at the 
Securities Traders Associa- 
tion banquet next year. 

Cass City High School 
remains in first place in a 
regional and state stock 
market simulation after 2 
weeks of competition. 

The first-place team is 
composed of Brad Gray, 
captain, and members Kent 
Winter and Jeff Jeung. The 
students arc taking part in 
the simulation in Ron 
Nurnberger’s classroom. 

The Cass City students 
have traded primarily in 
Chrysler, First City Bank of 
Texas, Homefed Corp,, LA 
Gear and SPX Corp., and 
have accumulated a portfo- 

This Week’s Special 
PLEASE Call For 
An Appointment 
CASS CITY 

5986 E. Cass City Rd., (M-81) 
(in the Allen Health Center) 

Delta Gold 

POTATO CHIPS 
872-4241 

’ wpdintments taken 
Mon. & Wed. 9-1 & 3-7 p.m. 
Fri. 9-3 p.m. Sat. By Appt. 

DR, CROWLEY 
B.S.D.C. e e B e  - 

QZaker 
Maid 

Mon. thru Sun. 0 a.m - 11 p.m. 

Results With I The Chronicle’s I Have we told you 
lately how important 

you are? I NOTICE OF 
PUBLIC HEARING I When I breezed into 

town some 40 years ago 
people were talking about 
the weather and parking 
meters. They still are. 

It’s still either too hot, 
too cold, too wet or too dry, 
or on those rare spring days 
when everything comes 
alive, just right. 

The parking meter de- 
bate swirled around whether 
to install meters in the 
1950’s. It was a hot issue 
then and it’s fairly warm 
now. 
Meters were installed by 

the council in a “special 
meeting” with a voice vote. 
A mceting like that today 
would be cause for a lawsuit, 
but that was a different time. 

As might be expected the 
installation was received 
with mixed emotions by 
business people in the com- 
munity although the major- 
ity probably thought that 
they were okay. For most of 
them the endorsement was 
lukewarm at best. 

The vast majority of the 
shoppers were disappointed 
when the meters started to 
operate. 

But these same shoppers 
were annoyed, before the 
meters came, h a u s e  folks 
who lived in upstairs apart- 
ments and businessmen 
themselves (would you k- 
lieve it?) parked on Main 
Street. 

One bcnefit of the meters 
is the revenue produced has 
established off-street park- 
ing lots for convenient free 
parking. 

Today the meters produce 
about $300 a month and a 
lenient control policy makes 
it unusual, except for the 

more flagrant violator, to be 
ticketed. 

Several business owners 
tell customers if they get a 
ticket while shopping in 
their store to bring it in and 
they will pay it. 

That doesn’t mean that 
all of them wish the meters 
were no more. Those that 
favor meters say that the 
meters keep the parking 
spaces open for those who 
are spending money in town. 

Others say that there is no 
parking problem in Cass 
City and point to the parking 
available when the meters 
are covered in December 
each year. They also see that 
most neighboring towns 
have discontinued the me- 
ters as have major shopping 
meccas such as downtown 
Bay City. 

During the turbulent 40 
years under discussion, the 
debate sometimes has been 
fierce, with each side sure 
that it was correct. 

You don’t find that very 
much now. Most folks just 
aren’t that sure which is 
right, meters or no meters. 

You can count this 
writer among them. We just 
don’t know how much of a 
deterrent to business these 
meters are. 

It’s sure that they don’t 
help any. The fact that 
community after com m u- 
nity has pushed them into 
the ash can is strong motiva- 
tion for following suit. 

Right now there is no 
strong push to take meters 
away and, like the weather, 
we’ll probably just continue 
to jaw about it and wonder 
which is the right path to 
take. 

Notice is hereby given that a Public Hearing will be held I at 7:OO porn., Monday, March 25,1991, at the Municipal 
Building, 6737 Church Street, Cass City, Michigan, on 
the proposed street improvements and special 
assessments for curb and gutter to be made on Rose 
Street from Ale to Oak and on Hill Street from Church to 
Dale. 

Joyce A. LaRoche 
Village Clerk 

* 
0 8.75 /o When you do business with us, 

you’ll’ find friendly people who will 
treat you with respect and offer you 

first class banking service. 
Thank you for doing business with us! 

IRA’S and Keogh Plans 
Tax Deductible Contributions 
Accumulation Free of Current 

Many Retirement Options 
Income Tax 

For Details: 

After All 
WE WANT TO BE YOU-R BANK 

Thumb National rn Ba-jj-&&rnm 
~ HARRIS & COMPANY’ 111 Pigeon 453-31 13 - Cass City 872-437 7 

Casevile 856-224 7 
MEMBER FDIC mm 

Luaew. 
~ Newell Harris 

6815 E. Cass City Road 
*Current Rate I 872-2688 

Cass City 
Ill 
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Sr. Citizens Menu’ 
Senior citizens are asked 

to make reservations on the 
day of the meal between 8 
a.m. and 9 a.m. by calling 
Ann Stepka, 872-5337. 

Cass City Bowling Leagues 
1 

l6 Paul’s Urethane Sys. 8 Charmont 
7 Parkway Drive Thm 14 Henon Builders 
7 12 Charmont Motel Brinkman Farms 

Cass City Sports 12 D & D Construction 2 
C.R. Hunt 9 
D & S  9 High Series.& Games: M. 

High Series: D. Smith 497, 
S .  Soldane 496. 
High Game: D. Smith 187. 
High Team Series: AIDES 

1800. 
High Team Game: AIDES 

640. 
THURSDAY NITE TRIO 

March 7 

The Family 42 
Town & Country 41 
Hell Raisers 36 
Dream Team 26 
Bee Gee’s 21 

High Rollers 13 
8 The Pin Heads 

Boys’ High Series: R. 
Pringle 436. 

Boys’ High Games: R. 
Gnagey 187, C. Tate 172. 

Girls’ High Series: T. 
Patera 442. 

Girls’ High Game: T. 
Patera 154. 
High Team Series: P2 M H 

1566. 
High Team Game: Pin 

Destroyers 544. 

MARCH 18-20-22 

Monday - Swiss S& 
Sandwich, Mashed Pota- 
toes, Salad Bar, Hamburger 
Bun, Cantaloupe. 
Wednesday - Liver & On- 

ions w/Gravy , Parslied Pota- 
toes, Cauliflower w/Cheese, 
White Bread, Cranberry 
Cake. 
Friday - Breaded Fish, Au 

Gratin Potatoes, Coleslaw, 
Dinner Roll, Mixed Fruk. 

High Series: M. Lutz 717, 
D. Doerr 632, K. Pobanz 
630, M. Grifka 617, Doug 
O’Dell588. 
High Games: M. Lutz 290- 

224, D. Doerr 232, K. 
Pobanz 246, M. Griflca 21 1, 
DougO’De11210,E. Schultz 
230, S .  Hammett 220, L. 
Tracy 217, J. Howard 236. 
High Team Series: Spauld- 

ing Builders 2723. 
High Team Game: 

Kermit’s Krushers 974. 
CHARMONT LADIES 

Jackson 695 (235-235-225), 
J. Storm 661 (277), R. Hood 

638 (227-21 l), S .  Hammett 
618 (228), P. Robinson 609 
(255), M. Lutz 603 (210), R. 
Kerkau 596 (236)’ K. T i m  
593, J. Mathewson 582, D. 
Ouvry 566, K. Schott 564 
(219), P. Harmer 563, G. 
Robinson 557 (230), R. 
Rabideau 554, C. Altizer 
550, K. Frappart 225, L. 
Morgan 223. 

655 (254-226), M. Grifka 

Men’s High Series: L. 
Tracy 584. 
Men’s High Game: L. 

Tracy Women’s 246. High Series: L, 

Zajac 504. 
Women’s High Game: D. 

Smith 189. 
High Team Series: Town 

&Country 1821. 
High Team Game: Dream 
Team 661. 

Charmont 14 
Northon Const. 13 
Martin Electric 13 

Deford Country Gm. 10 
Nelesco 10 
Kilbourn Tech 10 
Rms ter Ranch 9 
Cass City IGA 9 
Quaker Maid 8 If2 
KilbournService 7 1f2 
Fuelgas 4 

Jacques Seeds 12 

Cara balla 2 Owen-Gage school menu 
MARCH 18-22 Thursday - Turkey 

Noodle Casserole, Peas, 
Salad Bar, Fruit. 

Friday - Grilled Cheew 
Peas, Salad Bar, Fruit. 

This week’s High Rollers are Paul Brown and Anna 
Caraballa. 

Brown, who bowls for the Cass City Jaycees on 
Wednesday nights, tossed the 6-member league’s 2nd 
highest single game score last week at 214. 
Caraballa bowls for the Kritzman squad on Thursday 

nights. She tossed a 3-game 
total of 5 17. Caraballa holds a 154 average. 

# 

SATURDAY SPINNERS 
Jr. League 

End of Second Half 
Monday - Chili, Crackers, 

Salad Bar, Dessert. 
Tuesday - C hips/Cheese, 

Green Beans, Baked Beans, 
Salad Bar, Fruit. 

Wednesday - Sloppy Joe, 
Corn, Baked Beans, Salad 
Bar, Fruit. 

MERCHANTS’ “B” 
March 6,1991 

Burnettes 14 
Board Chrysler 12 
Cable-ettes 11 
Continental Rental 9 
ServiStar 9 
Charmont 8 
Cas City Tire 7 
Gilligan ’s 7 
Thumb National 7 
Live Wires 5 
Pizza Villa 4 
Truemner Salvage 3 

High Series: B. Kingsland 
650, K. Anthony 620. 
High Games: B. Kingsland 

277, D. Beecher 234, K. 
Anthony 233-225, D. D o e ~  

Charmont 15 
Mr. Chips 11 
Jaycees 10 

10 Warju Flooring 
Engineered Tools 6* 
Northern Sun 4* 

The Strikers 19 
Tigers 17 
Ultimate Warriors 17 
The Sp&d Balls 15 l/2 
Bad Bovs 15 

Bread, butter, pearmt 
butter, jelly, chocolate and 
white milk served each day. 
(Menu subject to change). 

214. G ~ e l i ’ s G a n g  14 lr;! 
High T ~ i m  Series: Char- First Timers 13 1/2 

mont 1786. Pin Busters 12 
High Team Game: Char- Hiph Bowlers 11 1l2 

High Series: R. Kerkau 
596, R. Rabideau 563. 

High Games: R. Kerkau 
237, E. Robinson 214, P. 
Brown 213. 

SUNDAY NIGHTERS 
March 3,1991 

Don Erla Foods 13 
Pin tippers 13 
No Goods 10 
Chevy Bunch 9 1n 
Wright Turn Bowlers 9 
Mallory Music 8 
Mixed Emotions 7 
Tenth Frame 7 
4-Fun 3 

mont MERCHANETTE 663. Thi Dynamite Lithe Bowlers Rollers 10 lb 9 H FRANK’S E8 TheL.T.3 15 
SweetGuys 14 
Schott’s Accounting 13 
High Rollers 11 
Town & Country 11 
Sugar Makers 10 
Misfits 9 
Sweeney’s Brew Crew 8 
Alley Cats 5 
Try Hards 

rA 
~- 

LEAGUE Ninja Turtles 71/2 FA 

~ SERVICE March 7,1991 
Boys’ High Series: B. 

Cass City Sports 15 Russell 278. 
Quaker Maid 13 Boys’ High Game: B. is back to serve you 
car0 ChiroDractic 12 Russell 148. 

Team High Game: Servi- 
Star 1050. 
Team High Series: Board’s 

3073. 
High Individual Series: P. 

Corcoran 529, B. Kilburn 
502, P. McIntosh 497, B. 
Howard 470, N. Davis 472, 
D. Sweeney 473. 
High Individual Games: P. 

Corcoran 206, P. McIntosh 
193, B. Kilbourn 191, S.  
Badder 175, G. Suzor 175, 
D. Meismer 18 1, B. Vollmar 
171, D. Sweeney 181, N. 
Davis 179. 

NIGHT OWLS 
March 6 

Bowler Boys 29 
Cole Crew 22 
Pros 21 
Lush Boys 8 

Croft-cl& 12 
Kritzman’s 11 
Herron Builders 11 
Sobczak Construction 10 
Rolling Hills 9 
Harry Lenda, Inc. 9 
Clean Up Crew 8 
Miller’s Chicks 6 
IGA Foodliner 4 

Girls’ High Series: J. Eyer 

Girls’ High Game: K. 

High Team Series: Tigers 

High Team Game: Tigers 

183, 

Gaymer 95. 

643. 

332. 

Men’s High Series: D. 
Romain 600, L. Turner 528, 
B. Kilboum 507. 

Men’s High Game: D. 
Romain 204. 

Women’s High Series: J. 
Yost 547. 

Women’s High Game: 1. 
Yost 204. 

High Team Series: Wood- 
choppers 1993. 

..* . A T.* * m 

High Series: J. Schwartz 
5 10, T. Babish 503, G. Kuck 
500. 
High Game: T. Babish 203. 

High Team Series: Pros 
1404. 

High Team Game: Cole 
Crew 5 14. 

Men’s High Series: P. Voss 
573. 

Men’s High Games: P. 
Voss 214, J. LaPratt 213. 

Women’s High Series: K. 
Hutchinson 499. 

Women’s High Game: J. 
MrPtwrlv 3fK 

High Team Series & 
Game: Car0 Chiropractic 
2366 & 842. 
500 Series: J. Lapp 545, A. 

Caraballo 517, J. LaRoche 
509, S. DeLong 508, G. 
Corcoran 503 
200 Games: J. Lapp 208, S. 

DeLong 205. 

SATURDAY SPINNERS 
Sr. League 

End of Second Half 
nign learn time: wood- A V a V Y A  WU J Y W W .  

High Team Series: High chopprs692, THURSDAY MORNING 
High Team Game: High 104-104-104. March 6 March 7 

Rollers 2066. Dan Williams - a triplicate MERCHANTS’ “A” COFFEE LEAGUE 
Rollers 7M. 

All the same top-rate services 
for all your automotive needs 

Rolling Thunder 26 1/2 
P 2 M H  24 1/2 
Pin Destroyers 21 1/2 

20 Hammer Time 
Miller Eggs, Inc. 21 

TUSCOLA Charmont 
GET TOGETHERS Kritzman’s 

March 4 Croft-Clara 

14 
14 
13 
13 
12 
10 
10 
10 

H.I. Roth 30 
Kingston Mini Mart29 1/2 
AIDES 28 
Deford Country Groc. 28 
Fort’s 26 1/2 
Pin Pals 26 
Sal’s Country Clipper 23 
Bye 1 

SUNDAY NITE 
DIRTY DOZEN 

_ _  
FRANK’S SERVICE 

March 3 New England Life 
B.A. Calka 18 Brentwmd 

K’s & 2’s 14 Kermit’s Krushers 17 Board Chrysler 
Woodchoppers 13 1/2 Spaulding Builders 17 mngston State Bank 
Sandbaggers 13 Miller Eggs 16 Gilligan’s 

Frank Spencer, Owner 
872-2866 FRIDAY NIGHT Fiercesome Tigers 4083 Cemetery Sharp Shooters MIXED DOUBLES 

March 8 The Cruisers 16 
Ball Dusters 

Cass City Oil & Gas 44 Wild Bowlers 

Enter The Diamond Crystal “Soft Water” Sweepstakes and You Could Win An Alaskan Cruise For Two, 
W ~ I S C O u # m  W U E S  

Or One Of Four (oleman Campers,=20 Sets Of luggage, Or 1,000 Hip Packs. 

I 55t Off Any Diamond Crystal ResinGard”, n. .,c- 

1 - - - - - - - - I D - D - - - - ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~  Enter to win a cruise to Alaska. And at the same time save 5% on Diamond Crystal ResinGard@ or r 40088 
1 RedmOut” Water Softener Pellets. Both ResinGard and RedmOut Pellets are high purity salts with a special I MANUFACTURER‘S COUPON EXPIRES 9/30/91 

cleansing agent to keep your water softener cleaner and to help it last longer. Plus, RedaOut Pellets can 
help eliminate rust from your water. You’ll get softer water and maybe even a cruise to Alaska! 
1 NO WRCMY NKBIARV To enter tmplcte by hod on entry bbnk or tox titk l K e w  troller hitch L wiring (52,535 opproximotc retail volue) 

moil ywr  entry cne per envelope to Alorkan I r u i v  gmmroy, P 

ore not t ronhoble h i r e  ir for rpring of 1992 some rertrittioni opply P r i m  

cirtumitontec tach prize ir worronred by the 

I 
1 
I 

Or RedaOut@ Pellets, Sterling” Salt Crystals 
or Sterling@ Solar Water Softener Salts. 

- print your nom Dddrers phone number ond birth dote on o 3” x 

lankintown PA 19M6 Mothim topm of [ompbtd entrlsr ore imlgibk 
2 O p n  to Ul r d e n h  
Fomly Gu&‘ IIK thair%tributors other tompanier orvn~lted mth 
the iweepltoker 04 ttmir immdmtc fomibr 
3 PRlZtS AND APPROXlMAlf WAIL VALUES GRAND 
PRIB One CIUIY for two to Almko The trip n a 7 doy 

VotKwver h trip induder oir tronsprtotion lrom o 

w d  ond 
0 DOL 628 

18 ond dder except empbywr 01 A h 0  bh In( 

IKON0 PRIZt 20 sets of AnwrKon Tourister lwgc ($1,085 opproximte 
retoil volue) THIRD PRIZE 1 OOO nylon hip po(ki (SI? I O  opproximte 
refad value) 
4 Sweeprlokes begins 3/1/91 Winnn will k wkted in o rondom drawing 
10 be Field MI or obout 9/1/91 b fomily Gut& Inc from omon 011 eligible 

moy vary from tllurtrotion rhown due to model rhonger ovailobtlity ond other 

manuforturer ond 15 nor the rerponribilnty of Ah 
hlt Inc or fomily Guide In( 
7 Sweeprtoker ir rupervired by Family Guide Int 

rweeprtaker ar t  final htrantr agree that family 
Guide In( Akto Solt Inr their ogenrier 

inlurier or lo rw of ony hind reiulting from 

entrm postmorkJ!y 8/15/91 ond received by 8820/91 

mil m d  required to rlgn on Affdovir of Eligibility and 

forfeit prize Winmn entry and pcceptantr of ri le conrtttuter 
permniion to UIC their names photqrophr ond [kenerrer for 

whore detirionr on 011 matierr relating to the 

dirtributorr and emplayeer shall not be liable for 

occeptance or uie of prizes 
II For a Itrt of molor prize wlnnerr (avoiloble 

1 NAME: 

1 ADDRESS: 

1 PHONE NUMBER. 

AGE: Fornily t u d e  IIK. is not rsrponrible for lost bte 
mndwsad or ilbbk entrter Winners will be notified by 

c r u 4 4  day bnd potkoge af Almko tuilim) frm 

mpr airport ntorMt the winner r horn to 
Vontwvtr and oll mok whik on rrulu/twr Trip 

Rekole of hb i l i ty  within IO days follwing notifitotion or - 
mll be for Ihe spring of 1992 Dote to br 
determid  by *Inner wm to avaibbdify 
Grotuitnr ground trompiatwn, Irompwtatlon 
to/from oirprts ora not inrludcd (53,146 
opproximte retail volut) FIRST PUlZf 4 
Iokmon “lolorod0 folding tomperr ir~luding 
lrelght ond h l e r  prep Winner rerponribk lor c ~~~~- I Iubnrimd in tanplmmrrilh ll* knar d Ihk dU w dy il ndrmd by dmibulwr of WT md#nba w a l p  off IpcciftQly wth#bd by A h  bh k leh rdw lllp &I to Akm Wt hw , M kr 430955, El b q  TX 88543-0951 
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guilty to attempted second 

Down Memory Lane 

700 N. State St., Cam Ph. 673-2171 

From the flles of the Chronicle 

FIVE YEARS AGO 

Cass City had a 9% voter 
turn-out for Monday’s elec- 
tions. Village president is 
Republican Larry L, Davis. 
Also unopposed and elected 
as clerk and treasurer was 
Republican Joyce LaRoche, 
and assessor is Republican 
Dan Erla. The 3 trustees are 
Elwyn Helwig, Dorothy 
Stahlbaum and K. Michael 
Weaver. 

Cass City native and vet- 
eran astronaut, Lt. Col. 
Brewster Shaw Jr., has been 
appointed to the staff of the 
commission which is 
charged with investigating 
the January crash of the 
space shuttle Challenger. 

+ Nelson “Moose” Willy 
will retire May 22, after 32 
years, from the Wastewater 
Treatment Plant. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bliss Sr. 
of Cass City have been 
spending a few weeks in 
Holiday, Ha., where Patrick 
Bliss of Anchorage, Ak., 
joined them. He will return 
with them to Michigan for a 
visit. 

TEN YEARS AGO 

The Cass City School 
Board authorized a new 
contract for Supt. Donald 
Crouseat its regularmeeting 
.donday night at the high 
school despite the objec- 
tions of Dr. E. Paul Lock- 
wood and Thresa Burnet&. 
Beth Ann Childs and Karen 

Dawn Sims have been 
named valedictorian and 
salutatorian, respectively, 
of the senior class at King- 
ston figh School. Childs, 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
‘&.win Childs of Kingston, 
will graduate with a 3.% 
grade point average. Saluta- 
torian Sims is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Eugene R. 
Sims of Livonia. She will 
graduate with a 3.95 grade 
p i n t  average. 

Fifteen members of the 
senior-hi youth of Salem 

UM Church met Sunday 
evening with Pam Harris, 
Mike Loomis led devotions. 
Lonnie Wilson was in 
charge of games and refresh- 
ments were served by Deb 
Parrotr. 

Cass City was eliminated 
from the district volleyball 
finals by top seeded Bad 
Axe. Three seniors and one 
junior were singled out for 
outstanding play. Junior 
Kris m t o r  was 100 per- 
cent on serves. Lori Gohs- 
man was 90 percent on 
serves. All-league Beth 
Sieradski was excellent on 
spikes and Padgett 
Randall’s dinks were tops 
for the Hawks, 

25 YEARS AGO 

“Fire Upon the Earth” was 
the title of the program pre- 
sented by guest speaker, 
Mrs. Ivan MacRae, at the 
regular meeting of the 
WSCS at the Methdst 
Church Monday evening. 
There were 42 members and 
guests present at the dinner 
meeting, for which Mrs. 
Dale Brown and Mrs. Jack 
Kilbourn were hostesses. 

An unoccupied house was 
completely destroyed by 
fm Sunday morning despite 
attempts by Gagetown vol- 
unteer firemen to save the 
building. The house, lo- 
cated on Lincoln Street, 
Gagetown, was owned by 
Charles Grady. 

Lloyd Severance of 
Decker has been elected 
president of the Deford local 
of the Michigan Milk Pro- 
ducers Association. 

The March meeting of 
Cass City B & PW Club 
featured colored slides of 
Sweden. Miss Katherine 
Crane, civic participation 
chairman, was. director of 
the program. President 
Betty Carmer was in charge 
of the meeting. 

35 YEARS AGO 
Dave Ackerman, teacher at 

I -  Established 7924 

SERVICE IS OUR BUSINESS 
We want to be your agent 

Life Insurance IRA’S 
Home Owners Business 
Auto Insurance Hospitalization 

AGENTS 
Jim Ceranski - Mark Wiese 

Call 872-4351 
6815 E. Cass City Rd. Cass City 

Cass City High School, was 
guest speaker at the Cass 
City Gavel Club meeting 
Tuesday evening. Acker- 
man traced the history of 
Cass City from the time 
Cooper and Wright, the first 
men in Cass City, estab- 
lished a sawmill here. 
John and Jerrold Perry will 
b presented with the “God 
and Country” award at the 
First Presbyterian Church 
on Sunday. This award is a 
church award, in coopera- 
tion with the Boy Scouts of 
America. They are the sons 
of Mr, and Mrs. Harold 
Perry. 
Joan Holmberg, a junior in 

the School of Music at the 
University of Michigan, has 
been chosen to play the lead 
in two campus productions 
now in rehearsal. 
The second major fire this 

year in the village of Cass 
city, Monday, completeJy 
demolished the Ben Fran- 
klin Store owned by Otto 
Prieskorn. Unofficial esti- 
mates place the loss at about 
$50,000. Two adjoining 
stores, Hulien’s and 
Freiburger’s Grocery, were 
badly damaged by smoke. 

I Letters to the editor I 
Coach faulted for 
some of year’s woes 

Hi! I’d like to console this 
year’s Cass City basketball 
team. You weren’t as bad as 
your record indicated this 
season. I’ve been watching 
basketball in the Thumb for 
25 years or so, which makes 
me feel kind of ancient, 

Anyway, the competition 
in the Thumb this year was 
probably as good as it’s ever 
ken. This year’s Cass City 
team was probably the best 
2-19 that I have witnessed. 
I’ve Seen some lousy teams, 
teams that couldn’t bring the 
ball up the court by them- 
selves. As my coach used to 
say, ‘They couldn’t score 
lo0 points if they were out 
there alone.” 

I thought that the team 
played as hard as they could 
in every game that I saw. To 
be quite truthful, I thought 
that some of this year’s woes 
were the fault of the coach. 
Not taking anything away 
from Ron, because he has 
been successful in the past. 
But, times have changed. 
Basketball in the Thumb is a 
little more wide open and 
aggressive than it was 10 
years ago. The control game 
which worked say, with 
Tonti and Comment, is out 

Kritzman opens 
repair business 

There’s a new business in 
the Schnmberger building 
on Main Street, where Mike 
Kritzman has purchascd the 
repair service that he oper- 
ated for Schneeberger’s for 
2 years. 
Kritzman brings both prac- 

tical and theoretical experi- 
ence to his business. He has 
b n  involved in electronics 
for 12 years. Before special- 
izing in electronics, he was 
an electrician. 
Kritzman has an associate 

degree in electronics from a 
Florida college, where he 
lived before joining 
Schneeberger’s. 

Coming to Cass City was 
almost like coming home for 
thenew owner. He isanative 

of Bad Axe. 
Helping with the business 

is Kritzman’s wife, Cheryl. 
An experienced associate in 
the business is Pat Peters. 

Mike Kritzman 

Your neighbor says 

Cass City needs 
a children’s store 
The Cas City Chamber of Commerce has formed a com- 

mittee to try and find out what shoppers in the area feel that 
the community needs to better serve its customers. 

The Chronicle asked this 
question of your neighbor, 
Mary Bellew, a Cass City 
resident, as she was shopping 
Monday afternoon. 
Gee, she said, I’ll have to 

think about that. Really, it’s 
hard to come up with some- 
thing on the spur of the 
moment, she added. 

But after several moments 
of reflection, Bellew did tell 
what she felt was needed 
most. The mother of 2 small 
children, Jessica and Derek, 
she feels that C a s  City could 
use a children’s store, one that sells quality children’s 
clothing, she explained. 
Bellew’s husband, Craig, is a pharmacist at Hills and Dales 

General Hospital, where he is active in community affairs 
and a member of Cass City Rotary. 
The family has lived in Cass City for a b u t  3 years. 

News Too! 

of date. Every single time 
that the coach “took the air 
out of the ball this year,” it 
back-fired. This year I’ve 
seen a coach that almost 
deliberately disrupted the 
flow of a game. Why do you 
have practice if you have to 
bark out signals the whole 
game? Can’t you, for once 
in your life, just sit back and 
let the kids play, like the 
Lakers coach, or that lady 
from Harbor Beach? She 
was impressive, I thought. 
You’re the coach, a grown 
man; you’re supposed to 
build character, but as far as 
I can see, you destroy it. 
They’re just kids. You can’t 
have guys quitting every 
year. Somebody’s got to 
give, that’s their only 
chance in life to play basket- 
ball. Just because a kid 
doesn’t meet your expecta- 
tions is no reason to chase 
him off, I’m sure that when 
you were in high school, you 
had a few differences of 
opinion fiom your coach. 
Better luck next year, guys. 

That’s all I have to say. 

Jeff Trischler 
Cas City 

Thank-you 
for support 
To whom it may concern, 

I would like to thank the 
town of Cass City for the 
support and letters and cards 
I received from Old Wood 
Drug and Mr. and Mrs, Doug 
VanAllen, 
Your support of the Armed 

Services is one of the most 
important things to me while 
I was in Saudi Arabia and 
now while I’m in Turkey. 
The only thing more impor- 
tant to me was the love and 
support of my family, 
Mother, Father, Grandma, 
brothers and sister. 
Once again I would like to 
thank you for your support, 

Sincerely, 
SSGT Scott A. Reed 
21st USAFAD 
APO NY 09379 (Turkey) 

Thank-you, 
Cass City 

I would like to thank the 
people of Cass City for their 
support. We didn’t ask for 
this war; we are just doing 
our jobs. 
Now I may not agree with 

the President on how this 
was handled. Now all I can 
hope for is a speedy end and 
to come home. 
Again I would like to thank 

the schools for the packages. 
Also to all the people that 
have written over the last 6 
months. 
Hopefully, this will be over 

soon, so all of us over here 
can be back home with our 
families. 

Spc. Pete Garnet 
United States Army 

Editor’s note: This letter 
was written Feb. 10 and re- 
ceived March 4,  according 
to the family, which mted 
Garnet arrived safely at Ft.  
Benning, Ga., Friday. 

ENDS THURSDAY 7:30 ONLY 
“Bargain Night” $2.00 TeeWAdutts 

The Avon Lady Took Him Home 
‘“EDWARD SCISSORHANDS” 

STARTS FRIDAY, MAR. 15,16,17 & 21 
Evening & Matinee Schedules 

Friday 7:30 Only 
Saturday 2:W - 7:30 - 9:20 

Sunday 5:w & 790 
Child $1 5 0  Teen/Adults $3.00 

In the wilderness 
the meatest adventure of aU 

v 

is survival. 

5 GENERATIONS -Five generations of the Margaret Boag 
family recently posed at the Tendercare nursing home, Cas 
City, where Boag, 95, a long-time Cass City resident, resides. 
Pictured above are (clockwise from right) Mrs. Boag, her 
great-great-granddaughter, Chelsie Hinkle, her great- 
granddaughter, Kelly Hinkle, and her granddaughter, Karen 
Dieckmann, all of Mt. Clemens, and her daughter, Donna 
Miller, of Marle tte. 

In circuit court 

Caro man sentenced to prison 
A Can, man was sentenced 

to prison Friday in Tuscola 
County Circuit Court for his 

counts of delivery of mari- 

Terry L. Holcomb, 25, 
received concurrent terms 
of 24 months to 48 months 
for each count, according to 
c o d  mor&, which state 
the defendant also was or- 

Dec. 21 p€eas of guilty to 2 

juana- 

day, Gerald L. Rich, 27, of 
Caro, pleaded guilty to car- 
rying a concealed weapon 
(pistol) in a motor vehicle 
Feb. 25 in Caro. 

A pre-sentence investiga- 
tion was ordered and sen- 
tencing was set for May 10. 
Bond was continued at 
$10,0oO. 
Also, Marilyn A. Jones, 18, 

Ferndale, pleaded guilty to a 

charge of attempting to un- 
lawfully driveaway an auto- 
mobile. 
Sentencing was scheduled 

for May 10 by the court, 
which ordered a pre-sen- 
tence investigation. 

According to court rec- 
ords, Jones’ offense oc- 
curred Jan. 11 in Koylton 
Township and involved a 
1985 Chevrolet Astro Van. 

dered to undergo substance 
abuse counseling. 
Holcomb was convicted of 

delivering marijuana in 
Car0 Aug. 28 and e t .  3. 
Richard A. Hartman, 19, of 

Fairgrove, was sentenced to 
5 years probation and 180 

duct. 
Hartman also was ordered 

to undergo mental health 
counseling and pay a $30 
victim crime fee, $30 per 
month oversight fee, $300 
fine and $300 in court costs. 
In addition, the defendant 
was ordered not to be in the I SHOWTIMES 

Fri.-Sat. 7 p.m. & 9:15 p.m. Sun. 3:OO & 7:30 p.m. I Mom -Thurs. 7:30 0.m. 

KING RALP-H I Court records state Hart- 
man was charged with at- 

Saturday and Sundav Matinee I tempting to engage in sexual I 
I WHITE FANG I contact with a child under 

the age of 13 years in June 
1990 in Juniata Township. 
Also sentenced was Ed- 

ward - _  D. Carlisle, - -  59, of I National Premier I 

I 
- -  I TEENAGE MUTANT Vassar, who was ordered to 

serve one year in jail for his 
NINJA TURTLES written pl& of nocontest to 

a charge of operating a mo- 
tor vehicle while under the 
influence of liquor, third 
offense, Sept. 2 in Vassar 
Township. 

In other proceedings Fri- 

Junior 
JAMIE TORDAI 

This week’s student of the week is 
Jamie Tordai. Jamie is the son of Jerri 
& Frank Tordai and is presently at- 
tending an auto body class at the skill 
center where he has had perfect at- 
tendance. Our congratulations to 
Jamie. 

7he Student of the Week is sekcted by the Cass City Student Council. 
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Bulldogs bow to A-F 

Kadv ends 4-vearf varsitv career 
the winners. Owen-Gage 
was led by K d y ,  17 pints, 
and Jason Torres, 15 points. 

was so well regarded by 
Coach h i e  Besonen in 
football that he nominated 
him as an all-state candi- 
date. 
He was honorable mention 

all-league in the North Cen- 
tral League in basketball as a 
junior 

A 3-point student, he plans 
to attend Saginaw Valley 
State University, where he is 
undecided about a major in 
physical education or sports 
medicine. He is senior class 
student council representa- 
tive. 

Asked if he planned to play 
sports at college he said, no, 
it's education time now. 

Regardless of whether he 
does or does not, it's certain 
that he can look back at an 
outstanding career. It's 
equally certain that he will 
be missed by all of his 
coaches and the Bulldog 
fans. 

GREAT CAREER 

Coach Brian Wright will 
have some big shoes to fill 
next year with the loss of 
Kady and so will the base- 
ball and football coaches. 
Kady is one of the rare ath- 
letes who earned 4 letters in 
each sport. 

In his basketball career he 
has scored 455 points and 
has more than 50 assists. He 

I 

Players who notch 4 years 
of varsity play in 3 major 
sports just don't come along 
that often. 

4 teens face breaking 
and entering charges - 

$4,ooO for Oswald and 
$8,000 for Krawczak. 

In other arraignments, 
Cass City resident Ida M. 
Remsing, 18, 4129 N. 
Cemetery Rd., was charged 
with 2 counts of delivery of 
LSD and one count of deliv- 
ery of marijuana. 
Bond was set at a combined 

$20,000 for the defendant, 
who faces a preliminary 
exam on the charges March 
20 at 9 a.m. 

Court records state 
Remsing allegedly deliv- 
ered the drugs in Cass City 
Aug. 22 and Aug. 28. 
Roy 0. Dean, 21, of Caro, 

faces a charge of fust degree 
retail fraud. 

Bond has been set at 
$2,000. A preliminary exam 
will be held March 20 at 9 
a.m. 

Records state Dean is ac- 
cused of stealing property 
valued at more than $100 
from a store in Indianfields 
Township March 8. 
Facing an identical charge 

is Karin A. Sackman, 42, 
Vassar, who is accused of 
taking property from a Car0 
area store March 2. 
Bond has been set at $1 ,O00 

for Sackman, who was to 
have undergone a prelimi- 
nary exatn on the charge 
today. 

Yvonne M. Lynch, 29, 
Munger, has been charged 
with receiving and conceal- 
ing stolen property over 
$100. 
She also was to have under- 

gone a preliminary exam 
today. Bond in her case has 
been set at $1 ,ooO, 

Lynch allegedly received 
and concealed a stolen rifle 
Feb. 26 in Wisner Town- 
ship, court records state. 

Also recently, Johnny L. 
Willson Jr., 26, Lapeer, was 
charged with stealindre- 
taining a financial transac- 
tion devise without consent 
Nov. 11 in Caro. 
His bond was set at $1,500. 

A preliminary exam in the 
case was to have been held 
today. 

All 3 defendants also have 
been arraigned on 2 counts 
each of breaking and enter- 
ing an occupied dwelling 
with intent to commit lat- 
ceny and larceny in a build- 
ing in connection with2Feb. 
4 break-ins. 
Court records state the trio 

are accused of stealing a 
cassette tape deck, stereo 
receiver, TVs and a VCR 
from a house at 125 N. 
Quanicassee Rd. in Gilford 
Township, and a TV, VCR, 
phone and jewelry box from 
a residence at 143 N. Quani- 
cassee. 
Bond was set at $4,000 for 

Snyder and Gwizdala, and 
$3,000 for Oswald. 

In addition, Snyder, 
Oswald and Ronald J. 
Krawczak, 17, +of Munger, 
have been charged with 
breaking and entering an 
occupied dwelling with in- 
tent to commit larceny and 
larceny in a building in con- 
nection with the Jan. 17 
break-in of a residence at 
4403 Fairgrove Rd. in Fair- 
grove Township. 

The defendants are ac- 
cused of stealing TVs, a rifle 
and a radio from the resi- 
dence, according to court 
records, which state bond 
was set at $3,000 for Snyder, 

Four teens were arraigned 
recently in Tuscola County 
District Court on charges of 
breaking into one or more of 
4 county residences. 

Three of the defendants, 
Chad A. Snyder, 18, Bay 
City, Scott J. Oswald, 18, 
Bay City, and Kevin P. 
Gwizdala, 17, Munger, face 
charges of breaking and en- 
tering an occupied dwelling 
with intent to commit lar- 
ceny, larceny in a building, 
malicious destruction of 
property and unlawfully 
driving away an automobile. 

The fust 2 charges stem 
from the Jan. 29 break-in of 
a house at 5632 W. Gilford 
Rd. in Fairgrove Township, 
according to court records, 
which state the trio took 
bowling balls, a bowling 
bag, camera, watches, key- 
board, TV, microwave 
oven, radio, guns, phone, 
safe, file box, calculator and 
jewelry. 

The remaining charges 
involved an auto belonging 
to Richard Starkey, records 
state. 
Bond was set at $3,000 for 

Snyder and Oswald, and 
$4,O00 for Gwizdala, All 3 
were to have undergone a 
preliminary examination 
today (Wednesday). 

CONGRATULATING MIKE KADY at the end of his illustrious cage 
career at Owen-Gage is Coach Brian Wright, 

Tsrmarm 

-+*.<- 
- Electronic Air Cleaner OSENTOSKl 

Stop air plluti6n inside your hornc! Lxnnox' Elcctronic 
Air Clcancr traps much of the airbrne dust, dirt, bacteria 
and pollen that infiltrate your home froin outdmrs. I t  also 
rcmvcs panicle-borne dors  that conw froni cmking and 
~obacco smoke. 

For a clean, fresh, healthy 
indoor environment, call: 

Located at the East City limits of Bad Axe on M-142 

THURSDAY, MARCH 14,1991 
commencing at 1 1  :00 a.m. sharp Lunch Wagon on the grounds 

IH 510 24x6 plain dnll D/D opcnors 

Vankunl 1617 dnll 
(2) IH 510 18x7 grain drills w:soeder 

IH 800 6 row cycM pldnlor, inwcbcrde 

and s&r 

SO opeoers 

dry IorUlirer cross aupor 

Krause 1467 14 tl ofisel disk 
A m o  25 h Hdottsot disk 
John b r e  loo0 21 1/2 tl held wlavatci 
WII r h  250028 Il hold cxrlllvaloc 

Bady 18 1R ll mounted held cullNalW 
white 485 22 112 n held wIbvalol 
JD 1010 30 112 tl held culbvalol (Hal fdd) 
JD RG630 6 row mlwator 
AC 1200 21 1/2 h k l d  wluvalol 
IH 350 X, tl vlbrabne harrow 
Noble 8 row k t  aNIvalor ((OM) 

JD 325 4F mounted plow 

WII rm 2500 31 fl hold cuIlrvatD( 

USED TRACTORS ~ H E T L E ~  1990 ,Wm Oeere 47550 M F D. power 
&iH, 149xMR1 r a d $ .  184X42Rl 
r lhals. U s .  3 r m k S  with paver 
bey&, NOTE Trarmfwable wwphls. AM-FM. 5 year 314 warranry hour5 

1980 1% 35880 ab, air. heat. 

1966 16 9 ~ 3 8 R 1  ~ohn h e  arm. 2950 12 4~2tlR1 MFO. cab. hont aw. Ora. heat. 

2 rmwrtes. 6 wetghk, 3 point. 21oc) hours. 

16 Qx38A1 arm. 3 WWB. 3204 hours 

1985 8S PTO F d  HP. U 5 A  TL 16 9x24Rl Ires. 

3 point PTO. 6x4 bats,  
1534 hours. 52 HP 

lenders. 1- WWQhk.  3480 I-mJrS 

hH lo&. 

1872 10 4&A1 IHC 106611 b r a ,  YAR duats. cab AM wnan FM. front 4 b a t .  

1976 IK 1 W D  cab. air, heal. dtl kck .  
16 4x38R1 brm. 2 m o r n ,  looOr W6Qhghts. 
1986 AM IHC radlo. 656 3980 QaS b u r s  hydro W m  badoc. 

16 QxWR1 We&. 3 p 1 .  PTO, 81 
mated bucket. 1 remote. 4% hours. 

r w l  E 4  PTO AC 8550. HP 20 81r38R1 radials. duals. 

3 polnl. 3 rerow. 235 PTO HP. 
UBO hours 

1982 AM FM. Versaole. tez PTO 555 HP. 3 p n t .  3620 4 hours 1emoW 

1975 IH 674 Rcwacq gas, 15 Sx38RI 
or-. 3 p n t .  500 PTO. 2 rea  WWS. 
Lll M. SB PTO HP. 384s hwrs 

1973 IH 7660 18 4xMR1 ores. duals. 
3 pmt 2 rwnoltls. ditl k c k .  5 0 0 / 1 ~  

1067 PTOs IH 656 0%. hydra, 16 9x30R1 Drm. 

2 wttels. 2oQa kadw w172 in matma1 
bucket 

1973 John h e  444300. cab. ar. heal. 
18 4x38A1 bres. d&. O d - r a g e .  
2 r m - .  3280 howl 

1075 IH 14660 18 4x38A1 radials. duds. 
3 polnt. dual PTO'n w q h @ .  5776 hours 

MS. 3 pint, cab. air, hear. PTO. 
3035 howr 

bres, 72 in m f w W  h - t .  3 p m t .  
2680 hours 
i h 8  IH 186D Hydro. 16 Qx38R1 Ur-. 
3 point. 2 wkb. cab, air, heat. 100 HP 

John bere  0 It hml blade 
~ohn Deere 148 kadw w/84 m matend 

krdrel (hardly u r d )  

i o n  w r u ~  4.210, 18 4 x 3 8 ~ 1  radials. 

l ee0  Fud  545 IndusbJ-kader. 16 9x28Rl 

PLUMBING & HEATING, INC. 
Pigeon Bad Axe Cass City 

453-2577 269.809 1 072-5084 
USED MATERIAL 
HANDLING 
Haybuster H- 1M rDck plckcr 
(3) DMI 031 2 mnbr dump wagons 
Case 1835 skrdhdec 
NH 445 skdoader (30 HP) 
NH L779 diesol skidloador 
(2) NH 791 manure spteadcrs 
Wostorn 6 ll srym blade 
NH 518 rnanuro spreador 
NH 790 rnanuro sproadcr 
IH 550 mnure spreader 
NH 795 manure sproador 

NEW EQUIPMENT 
M &W W A  grain cart. holds 520 bus 

T o p  Air 150 gal 3 p n l  sprayw w/rollor 

Hoam 1 2 a  boan plck up 

w~th 

pump a d  o k t r c  mVds 

extensms. 23 1 x26Fl3 bros 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 
USED LAWN 
& GARDEN ROOF REPLACEMENT USED HAY & FORAGE 

NH 851 round b l w  (1200 balcs) 
NH 855 rwnd h lo r  
NH 2€a tab 
NH 273 bloc 
NH 1495 5 P haybine plancLitiOs 
p r h l  cab bough1 MW in 1982 

(2) NH 489 9 h haybno 
NH 1495 5 P hayhw hydro gas, 

NH NO 8 lorape b x  w/gear 
Rex lotape b x  wigoar 
D m  torage b o x  wlgear 
NH ??OW hay plck up 
NH a %Ill d7oppor 
NH 4799 H haybne 
NH 495 12 H haybine 
Gehl600 lotage harvostor w'2 heads 
NH M b W  
NH 71 7 choppor wl2 row head 
NH 7I7dwppec wi2 heads 
Heslon No 10 slacker 
Farmhdd 2 whoel rake 
NH 28 Mower 

paLd cab header gone through nice 

USED TILLAGE 
(2) Ford I 4 2  5 F  18 in aulo plow 
IH 7106F 16 in auto I T F plow (exc) 
White 549 5F 18 in aulo plow 
Whim 348 3F 16 in mounled plow 
Whim 548 SF 16 in auto plow 
John b e r e  -7F 16 in auto V a l  plow 
IH 3 lurrow 16 in mounted plow 
IH 55 13 H hi dear chisel plow 
Brillan 7 shank subsoiler 
Case IH 4 15 15 tl packer rnulchor 

IH 31515 H packer mulcher hyd 

Brilllon 7 shank muller chisel plow 
JD RM 6 row culavatlr w/rdling shiclds 
JD 835 6 row beol culbvator whunnol 

IH 133 6 tow VT wlbvatw wlrolling shiclds 
Noble 6 row VT culbvatol w/rolling shields 
Kqslulde 8 row loM VT wlllvalar w/rolling 

(2) IH 133 8 row fold arllrvalor wlrolling 

IIi 183 6 row VT culllvator w/rolling shields 
Ncble 6 raw buet culuvator wlopen lop 

Alloway Woslgo 2050 12 row 12 lold row culbvator told min LI cullrvator 

& i d y  1600 28 112 h fieM culuvator 
w/spray lank 

WiI r& 2500 24 tl held wluvalor 
w/4 bar ievelor 

IH 45 18 1/2 tl t d d  tuluvalor 
w/3 bar m u l c h  

Brillton 26 tl crow(00l wlupacker 
John b e r e  230 22 tl 9 in disk 
Olrver 241 12 H disk 

(done 100 acres) 

tooth m b d  

shields 

ShlOldS 

shleMs 

shmlds 

Gilson 53073 16 tip gardon Ifadof 

Dynarnatk I t  HP P p a r  shitl wlrear 

Sirnplaty 6216 16 HP gear shin 
Cddei w ( 4 0  in NO ckch 2 38 in bllur 

Cam1 Cadcl 36 54 in in honl SMW Made throwor 

Cadol 42 in snow ttirOW8f 
W m l  Horse B 81 L f  w(36 in d w h  
Cadel 55 rrdor w:26 in M)ck 
Cadet 782 Hydro wI44 in W k  
Case 220 Hydro w144 in d e c k  
Cadel 782 Hydro w/W in W k  
Cadel Cadol 38 BO in tiyrdo Idler w/36 in dock 

(2) Cadet 1450 Hydro wi44 in d w k  
(2) Cadot282 Hydro wr36 in deck 
JO 110 wOB in W k  
Cadst 1 M  w142 in deck 
Cadet 1610 Hydro w/44 in d o c k  
Cadel 682 Hydro w/44 in dock 
C a t  126 goar shin w/42 in dack 

wi44 in W 

discharge dock L blowor 

CASS CITY HIGH SCHOOL 
The Board of Education of Cass City Public Schools will receive sealed bids for roof 
replacement of the Cass City High School located at 4686 North Seeger; Cass City, 
Michigan 48726. 

Bids are to be addressed to Board of Education of Cass City Public Schools and will be 
received until 4:OO p.m. local time on April 1, 1991 at the office of Superintendent. 
They will be publicly opened at 4:30 p.m. at same location. CONSIGNED: 

1481 IHdlosol baclpr 184LL5ur&, 
snapwl duals cab air heal. 2 remoles 
8 Iron1 wolghk. 3397 hwrs. nlte  

Hough 70 payloaber. gas. W/4 in 1 W e t  
1962 M M  Jot Star w/loader. w& hont 

12x28 or-. 3 pant. PTO. rear wflet 
Internalmd A bador whyd operated 

snow blade new rubber, runs liko MW 
John W r o  55 mmbtne w/10 H header 
Martin k a n  h a d  cab round back 
Case 1170 diesel tractor cab 18 4xYH 1 

NH 352 grinder mixer 
IH 360 32 tl harrow wkveler 
Glenm 26 ll 
While 253 21 H disk 
JD RG430 4 row culbvvalw 
Oliver 32 tl held culhatw w13 haf he le t  I 

14H wmdkxonbuckbox 
AC 770 4 row a ~ r  planter 
JD IH 16tl GE-3 running hyd disk gear 

JD 565 running war 
Kewanee 8 ton running gear 
Ferulizer spraader. 4 5 ton 
JO 14 h swing haytune 
1 0 0  gal wafer tank on runnino gear 
Daym 40 tl Hal semi wallet 8 tf wide 
2 a x h  

1977 insrnatmnd buck 18 H Diamond 
plale bod 5.2 rear good rubtrcr 

1974 GMC truck 2 O t t  bed 5t2rear 
power stoenng excellon1 rubbw 

1973 Flrd L600 truch 14 tl Diamood plate . 
W radio Muxe  cab power stoorlng 

Ures and duals 

cullrvator w/3 tw lovclor 

: 

gK.3 rubber 

Snow Birds 
hold picnic 
in Florida 

A single combined proposal will be received for all work. 
USED HARVESTING 
EQUIPMENT Interested bidders may obtain instructions to bidders, specifications, drawings, and 

proposal forms by depositing with the Architect Twenty-Five Dollars ($25.00) for one 
(1) complete set. There is a $5.00 mailing fee (which should be issued as a separate 
check) for those contractors who wish to obtain sets by mail. 

1 9 8 1  IH 1- axial bow mmbne cab. a r  
heal. 4 wheel drive, rock trap. sbaw 
chopper. aaxrmulalw. Baxbr kit. 
electmhydraulic auto header mnbd 
16 Qx26R1 and 67x34 W30 ores, 

IOss 1768 Ueaner hours, E cmkne. cab. 16 9x26R1 

WES. boh c y l i h ~ ,  lo n head, b a n  
head wllnnes m . u p  

John W e  4310 4 row beet harvesler, 
2 sur wheal nd 7 spiral rdk. 3 nBw 
charu. hyd cy1 to rats8 and bww 
dwchrge W a l u  

IH 743 4 rOw corn head (changed over 10 

IH 810 16 112 H header 
Heath lOs0 4 row bean windroww 
Nrm Idea 323 1 ruw pcckw (done 100 

New Idea 312 2 row plckln 

q- b h )  

aues) 

The 31st annual Huron 
County Picnic was held Feb. 
28 in Palmetto, ma., with 
141 Snow Birds in atten- 
dance. 
Roll call showed Bad Axe 

with 38 persons present and 
Harbor Beach with 20. Port 
Austin and Ubly tied with 18 
each. 

Carolina Fealko, the host- 
ess, introduced the Palmetto 
Kitchen Band, which pro- 
vided a half-hour of lively 

The Bid Documents, including plans and specifications, are on file at the following 
locat ions 

Architect's Office Owner's Off ice 
Toshach Sobczak Spence Forsythe Arch. 
122 N. Washington Ave. 
Saginaw, Michigan 48607 

Cass City Public Schools 
4868 N. Seeger 
Cass City, Michigan 48726 

(51 7) 752-731 1 (51 7) 872-2200 

USED PLANTING 
& SEEDING en tertainmen L 

Merchants from Huron 
County added to the fun by 
donating give-aways. 
The oldest persons present 

were Hal Conkey, 92, Irma 
Rocheford, 9 1, Ralph 
Brown, 89, Angus McKen- 
zie. 88.CatherineProtzmm, 

John W e  70008 row planter, prateless. 
transport. inSeCWbd9, monitor, cross 

auger 

FREE BEAN SOUP WILL BE SERVED Builders & Traders Exchanae 
Tri-City Builders & Traders 
334 S. Water 
Saginaw, Michigan 48607 

Dodae Report 0 ff ices 
Dodge Plan Room 
G-5080 W. Bristol Rd. 
Flint, Michigah 48507 

INVENTORY LIST SUBJECT TO CHANGE DUE TO NORMAL BUSINESS ACTlVllTY - -7 

SALE DAY PARTS SPECIAL I 88,' S&ord McMullep, 87,' 1 15% DISCOUNT OFF ON ALL NEW PARTS 
and Joe Ruth, 87. purchased March 14,1991 at the Bad Axe location. Cash sales only 

Wedding anniversaries 
celebrated Were Etta and 
Glen Toner, 65th, Catharine 

TERMS: No financing without prior approval on day of sale. Any financing plan or program IS available O n  
qualifled units toqualifled buyers. Prior arrangements must be made with: 

A bid security in the form of a certified check, cashier's check, of surety company bond 
in an amount of at least 5% of the total bid payable to the Owner must accompany the 
proposal as security for the acceptance and execution of the contract. A performance 
bond and payment bond, asdescribed inthe Instructions to Bidders and in the amounts 
detailed in the Supplementary General Conditions will also be required. 

and Hal Conkey, Mth, h a  
and Secord McMullen, OSENTOSKI FARM EQUIPMENT, INC. 

Phone 51 7-269-6449 62nd. Bad Axe, Michigan 
Officers voted in for 1992 Any i t e m s  purchased without prior financing arrangements wi l l  be cash or checks wi th  proper ID 

are President Sylvester 
Pitcher, Vice-president 
John Coursey, with Treas- 
urer Tony Cieslinski and 
Sxretary Betty Zulauf. 

Eighteen bags of oranges 
were given out and the meet- 
ing was closed. Next year 
the group will meet again, 
same place, Feb. 27. 

All other requirements for bidding are detailed in the Instructions to Bidders. 

Cass City Public Schools 
James Turner 

Secretary Q AUCTIONEERS e 
Aucttoneers and clerks acting a5 sales agents only and assume no guarantees or liabilities 
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Hawks upset effort falls short, 
Marlette wins in overtime 
Besides being one of those 

years whcn the talent was 
thin, the 1990-9 1 basketball 
season will be remembered 
as one where everything that 
could go wrong did. 
Cass City bowed out of the 

district class C tournament 
at Sandusky Thursday when 
the team lost in overtime to 
Marlette, 55-53. 
The loss was typical of the 

way the season went in close 
games. The Hawks found a 
way to lose in the closing 
minutes. It happened with 
Caro, Lakers and North 
Branch this season. Cass 
City was in front until the 
dying moments and then 
lost. 
If there was a silver lining 

to all of this for Cass City 
fans, it was that the team 
with only 2 wins all year 
kept trying and improving, 
Coach Ron Nurnbergersaid. 
The players could have 
packed it in but they didn’t. 

The game was a series of 
spurts for both teams all 
night. Itlmkedasifthefinal 
Hawk spurt was going to 
carry them to an upset. 
With AI Dadacki and Chris 

Herringshaw carrying the 
scoring load and the Hawk 
guards handling the Red 
Raider press well, the teams 
battled to a stand-off in the 

The Red Raider outside 
shooting, which had been 
hcld in check all night, 
suddenly came to life. Chris 
Gallagher hit a 2-pointer. 

The Hawks missed the 
front end of a one and one 
and Brent Wehner hit a 3- 
pointer. Cass City missed a 
shot instead of holding the 
ball as instructed, Gallagher 
then hit a 3-pointer to tic it. 
Cass City held thc ball until 
the final IO seconds, but was 
unable to get a decent shot. 

In the overtime Cass City 

scored first on a bucket by 
Perry. Marlette tied it on a 
bucket by Mark Lefler. 
Perry put the Hawks in front 
again with another basket. 
Gallagher then hit a 3- 
pointer to put Marlette 
ahead by a point 

Mark Irrer was called for 
traveling in a call that 
Nurnberger said the film 
showed was in error. 
Cass City then fouled and 

when only the front end of 
the one-and-one was con- 
verted, had one last chance 

to tie or win. The shot 
bunced off the rim. 

Gallagher led all scorers 
with 23 points. For Cass City 
Herringshaw netted 15 and 
Greg Levalley, 9. Tuckey 
and Perry scored 8 each. 
Tuckey also led the team 
with 8 rebounds. Othex scor- 
ers for the Hawks were h e r ,  
7, and Dadacki, 7. Cass City 
was exceptional at the free 
throw line, sinking 18 in a 
row before the critical 
misses at the end of the game 
for a 90 percent average, 

Gagetown man 
hurt in crash 

In the opening moments of 
the second quarter Cass City 
staged its first spurt of the 
night, outscoring Marlettc, 
6-3, in the first 4 minutes to 
take a 19- 16 lead. 

Marlette countered that to 
run off 6 unanswered points 
to go in front 22-19. At the 
half the Raiders were in 
front 27-23. 
Cass City moved to within 

a point midway through the 
third quarter but Marlette 
answered the challenge to 
take a 37-33 lead going into 
the final quarter. 

Cass City played some of 
its finest ball of the season 
for the first 6 minutes of the 
last quarter. Here’s the way 
the rally went. Hemngshaw 
scored and the bucket was 
countered by Jason Bell. 
Steve Tuckey slipped in a 2- 
pointer from the pivot and 
Herringshaw knotted the 
score at 39-all with 5 lr;! 
minutes left. 

Chris Storm temporarily 
stopped the rally by canning 
2 free throws. Mark Irrer 
then ripped in a 3-pointer, 
Herringshaw added 2 more 
buckets and Troy Perry then 
pushed the Hawk lead to 49- 
41 with a bucket and 2 free 
throws. 
With 2 minutes to go it 

Mini-fair set for 
Sanilac 4-H’ers A Gagetown man sought 

his own treatment for minor 
injuries following a one- 
vehicle accident Saturday in 
Denmark Township. 

Thomas M. Halasz, 18, 
7110 Huron Line Rd., was 
driving west on M-46 near 
Bradford Road when he lost 
control of his vehicle on the 
icy roadway, according to 
Tuscola County Sheriffs 
deputies, who reported his 
vehicle left the north side of 
the road and struck some 
road markers, then crossed 
Bradford Road and hit a 
guard rail. 
Halasz was wearing a seat 

belt at the time of the acci- 
dent, reports indicate. 

CLOSE CHECKING BY the Cass City Red Hawks held Marlette in 
check for most of the game until crunch time. Applying the pressure to 
Brent Wehner is Cas City’s Greg Levalley. 

A 4-H Achievcrs Mini-Fair 
will be hcld April 20 at the 
Sanilac Career Center. This 
is thc timc for all 4-H’ers to 
bring their projects to be 
evaluated, and get a head 
start on the fair. 

Included this year at the 
“mini-fair” will be ccram- 
ics, crafts, ATV, elcctric, 
leather, woodworking, trac- 
tor safety, computers, recy- 
cling wcarablc and non- 
wwrable, small engines, fun 
sewing, fun crocheting and 
fun knitting and cducation 
exhibits along with regular 
projccts - - sewing, knitting, 
crochcting and recycling. 

More information is avail- 
able by calling the Sanilac 
County Cooperative Exten- 
sion office at (313) 648- 
2515. 

The committee is also 
looking for willing hands - - 
4-H and adults - - to help 

with Spring Achicvcmcnt. 
Helping out will also give 
mothcrs/fathers and leadcrs 
a bettcr chancc to 1c;un 
about thc areas of intcrcst. 

Interested pcrsons arc 
urged to contact Collcen 
Moore at (313) 648-5143, 
Sue McAllister at (3 13) 633- 
9489 or Sharon Bush a t  
(3 13) 648-458 1 . 

ittle League sign-up days set 
All boys and girls who will mer, according to Lours Tuesday, Mar. 19, from 6 to 
be years old by Aug. I and Was, one of the league 8 p.m. at the Cass City Inter- 

mediate School Cafeteria. will not be 13 until after 
*“g* invited to play Registration Will be held Registration a fees maximum are $8 per of 
Little League ball this sum- ~ u r ~ ~ y ,  m. 14, a d  $16 Der family. 

YOUR %20# 
Professional and Business 

DI R ECTO RY 
FOR PLUS TAX 

- - -  
ACCOUNTANTS PHY SIC1 ANS 

BALU K., M.D. 

U 

I 
Obstetrlclen 6 Gynecologisr 

70 North Elk Stroot 
Sandurky,Mt 4M71  

Ofllcr Hour#: 
Mon.. Tuea., thurl., FrI. 

0 to 5.  Appalntmrnt Only 
Alter Houn Call 
(313)uemro 

Phon. (31 3) 648-4733 

Anderson Tuckey 
Bernhardt & Co., P.C. 
Certified Public Accountants 

Gary Anderson, CPA - 873-3137 
Robert Tuckey, CPA - 872-3730 

Jerry Bernhardt - 673-3137 

71 5 E. Frank St., Caro, MI 
and 

6261 Church St., Cass Clty, MI 
Phone 8724668 

4 TIMES & GETA SPARE $1 4.95 
CYLINDER FOR ONLY. .... 

p r m r r r r r I r ~ ~ r ~ i r m I r r r r r 1  

TO SIGN UP FOR OUR SPECIAL OfFER BRING IN W S  COUPON BEFORE APRIL 15,1991, 
AND GET YOUR REFILL DISCOUNT CARD WORTH OVER a.00 IN SAVINGS. 

ONE REFILL DISCOUNT CARD FREE with this C O U ~  I I 
I 
1. 

E NAME 

COUNSELING Dr. Jeffrey Crowley 
Chiropractor 

5986 E. Cass City Rd. 
Cass City (M-81) 
Phone 872-4241 

’1 ADDRESS r- 
II 

ZIP I 
I 
I CITY 

Sinply fill out this coupon and bring it to one of the FUELGAS I 
I locations listed below before April 15, 1991. Bring your 20 Ib. ’ cylinder with you and start saving right away. 

~ - - - ~ I I I ~ ~ - - ~ r n r n I - m r n ~ ~  
PROPANE, APPLMNCES& HEATING SNCE 7947 

OPEN 8 to 5 DAILY + ’til NOON SATURDAYS 

STATE - 

C A S  CITY 
961 N. Van Dyke Rd. Junctim M41& M-53 

Phorre 872-21 61 
UNIONVILLE 
4234 M-25 (on coal mine mmer) 
Phone 674-8775 

DO YOU HAVE A 
DRINKING PROBLEM? 

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 

Every Frlday Evenlng - 8:OO p.m. 
Good Shepherd Lutheran Church 

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 
Tuesday Evenlngs 8:OO p.m. 

St. Pancratlus Parlsh Hall Basemen’ 
Cass City 

AND AL-ANON 

Harold T. Donahue 
M.D., A.A.F.P. 

4674 Hill Streot 
Cass City 

872-2323 
on- t w r r  rwhaays 

* r e  fh,uMdly 

SEBEWAING, WHICH DOMINATED the regular season in the Cass City Jaycee 
basketball league, roared to an easy victory in the post-season league tournament. 
Sebewaing defeated Breatwood, 100-58, and Shetler’s, 123-105, to take the title, In 
other action, Charmont topped Board’s, 56-54, before losing to Shetler’s in the semi- 
finals, 67-62. Shetler’s also defeated Cass City No Name, 89-82. 
The winning team, front row, from left: Jeff Williamson, John Meininger Jr., Kurt 

Scharich and Adam Deering, Back row: Tom Williamson, Keith Strieter, sponsor 
John Meininger Sr., and Tom Koch. (Photo by Doug Hyatt.) 

DENTISTS 

R, Paul Chappel, DDS, PC 
Family Dentistry 

Comprehensive Orthodontics 
6240 Hill St., Cass City 

Phone 872-3870 

Richard A. Hall, D.O. 
Osfeopalhrc Physician 

4674 Hill SI. 
Cass City. Michigan 

072-444 6 
On- 872-4725 HUW Il?.4?62 

Hoon K. Jeung, M.D. 
Surgeon 

Specialist in Stomach 
and Bowel Problems 

9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Daily 
Saturday - 9 to 12 n m  

Closed Thursday 

6230 Hmpltal Drlve 
Cass City, MI 48726 

Phone 872-461 1 
Home 872-3138 

HEALTH CARE 

IMMEDIATE 
NON-EMERGENCY 

HEALTH CARE 
$25 fee 

Including physidan’s fee 
and clinic room. 

Cash basis, and we wlll give 
you a statement. 

No Appomnent Usually 
Necessary 

6:OO-830 p.m. Fridays 
230-830 p.m. Saturdays 

1Q:OO a.m.-0:30 p.m. Sunday 

HILLS AND DALES I HOSPITAL Dr. E. Paul Lockwood 
Chiropractic Physician 
Mon,, Tues., Wed., Fri. 

9-1 2 only 
Phone 872-2765 -88 
City for Appolnlmenl 

HOME CARE . . - - - - -  - - - - _ _ ~ ~ ~  

HOME CARE AGENCY 
Nursing, Physical, Ocarpational 

a Speech m e q y  
Nurse Aides 

Medicare, Medicaid b 
Blue Cross Certified 

Your k a l l y  owned, private, 
nonprdlir, full service 
Home Care Agemy 
(51 2) 674-8746 

1 (800) 358-4749 

N. Y. Yun, M.D. 
Phpkian d Surgeon 

otfice Hours: 
Mon.-Fri. - 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Thurs. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
Sat. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
6232 H0rQlt.l M v e  

cam Clty 
ocHoll8724733 
Rea. 8724257 

VETERINARIANS 

INSURANCE - 

Allen Witherspoon 
Naw Englad Lde 
NEC G r m h  Frnd 
NEC E~uf ty  Fund 

NEL lncrw Fund 
Monsy Markel Ssrwl 
Phone 872-2321 

461 5 Oak Cass City 

COMPANION ANIMAL 
HOSPITAL 

4438 S. Seeger St 
Cass City - Phone 872-2255 

Carol Gdkr-Ellls, D.V.M. 
Rod Elll8, D.V.M. OPTOMETRIST 

Dr. David Batzer 
Optometrist ~ ~ ~~~~~ 

dward Scollon, D.V.M. 
Vs fennanan 
Farm and 

Pet Animals 
Phone 872-2935 

1849 N S q e r  St C a s  C I ~  
-_I__--. - 

4624 Hill Sf 
Cass City 

office HOUr8: 
Mon -Frl , 9 00-4  30 

872-3404 
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Leadership 
forum set 
Thursday 

CALL 872-2010 - FOR lbrook Area News * . [ General ] [ General Transit (nonbusiness) rates. 10 
words or less, S1.2S'cach inser- 

each. Three we& for the price 
ticm; additional words 7 cents Merchandise Merchandise 

The 1991 Tuscola County 
Leadership Forum will be 
held Thursday at the Tus- 
cola Area Skill Center. 

There will be 30 students 
attending, representing 
Reese, USA, Ahon-Fair- 
grove, Cass City, Vassar, 
Caro, Millington, Kingston, 
Mayville and the Tuscola 
Area Skill Center. 

Two students from each 
school have met throughout 
the year to plan this event. 

There will be a main 
speaker, Sheri McClosky 
from the FHA, who will talk 
a b u t  student leadership, 
and 8 student-held discus- 
sions, each 50 minutes long 
and designed to allow stu- 
dents alone to discuss their 
ideas, concerns and possible 
solutions. There will be a 
recorder for each group SO 
their concerns can be heard 
and followed up on at the 
State Conference. 
There will also be 9 infor- 

mation seminars with a key 
speaker knowledgeable on a 
particular topic to share in- 
formation that could be 
beneficial to either the indi- 
vidual student or the 
student's school. 

Allotted time for each 
school to meet with their 
school board members and 
superintendent to discuss 
concerns the students may 
have is also planned. 

Council proceedings 

! 
f Mrs. Thelma Jackson 

Phone 658-2347 
. - + ^ *  .--A- 

Mr. aid Mrs. Ed Williams visited Mrs. Clayton Edanna Sweenev. 

of %ash rate. Save money by 
enclosing cash with mail or- 
dwr. Rates for display want ad 
on application. 

FORSALE-Tandem~ixles GOLF CARTS for de 

12' mobile home. Call 872- 
3610 after 6 p.m. 2-3-13-2 

with tires and from fione872-3585. 2-3-13-1 , Check Out 
the 

DESSERT CAKE 
WINDOW 

Always something new 
FOR SALE - bicycle trailers 
with 75# payload capacity, 
dismantled for transporting , 

and winter storage. VOWS 
Bicycle Sales & Service, 
883-3897, Sebewaing. 

Automotive 1 NAME PINS, desk name- 
plates and plastic signs in 
various sizes made to your 
specification. For informa- 
tion and prices, contact 
Mrs. Buschlen at 872-2121. 

of Sterling Heights, Mr. and 
Mrs. Archie Rumptz and 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Maurer 
returned home Tuesday af- 
ter spending a month in Flor- 
ida where they visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Glaza, Mr. 
and Mrs. Arnold W e e r  and 
Mr. and Mrs. Cass Grifka at 
Holiday, Ha., and other 
places of interest. 

Mrs, Curtis Cleland and 
Jeff Doerr visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Cleland Tuesday 
evening. 

Darlene Terrassi and girls 
were Monday afternoon 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
Farrelly. 
Reva Silver was a Tuesday 

guest of Edanna Sweeney. 
Kathy Martinez and Al 

Wagner were Wednesday 
afternoon guests of Mrs 
George Jackson and Don. 
Randall Knowles and Ruth 

Karg of Bad Axe were 
Monday forenoon guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt. 

Emily, Justin and Matt 
Miller spent the weekend 
with Jack Miller at Byron. 
Mr. and Mrs, Kevin Robin- 

son, Chris and VeronicaLira 
ofLima,Peru, wereMonday 
cvening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs, John Michalski and 
family at Deford, 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shagena 

J w  Konkel was' a Wednes- 
day supper and evening 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Konkel and Marney and 
Lois Cardenas. 
Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson 

were Wednesday afternoon 
guests of Clara Vogel and 
George Rolston in Cam. 
Mr. and Mrs. Greg Moore 

and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dan Gedert and girls, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dan Taylor and 
Brian, Dan Gibbard and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Talaski Jr. were Satur- 
day supper and evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Evans Gibbard in honor of 
Mrs. Tom Talaski's birth- 
day. 
Mrs. Bob McLaughlin and 

Mrs. John Walker visited 
Frances Walker at 4 Seasons 
Nursing Home Thursday. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Cleland 

and daughters of Bad Axe 
were Saturday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Curtis Cleland. 

Mrs. Ray Depcinski and 
Edanna Sweeney visited 

ling Sunday afternoon. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gerard 

Marchand of Drayton Plains 
spent a few days at their 
home here. ' 

Mr. and Mrs. Don 
McKnight of Bad Axe and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt 
spentMondayafternmnand 
had supper in Bay City. 
Mr. and Mrs. Orville Glaza 
were Wednesday supper and 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Stanley Glaza. 

Mrs. Steve Rickett, Cory 
and Caitlyn of Redford spent 
the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Doerr and Jeff and 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Curtis 
Cleland Saturday. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gordon 

Maurer of Ruth and Clara 
Bond were Monday supper 
and evening guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Cliff Jackson. 
Mr. and Mrs. Evans Gib- 

bard were Tuesday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Bailey at Brown City. 

Mrs. Bob Cleland Jr. and 
Mrs. Ken Osentoski were 
Sunday guests of Mrs. Her- 
bert Hichens, &. Alex 
Cleland and Carol Laming. 
Eugene Otulakowski was a 

Thursday evening guest of 
Mr. and Mrs. Evans Gib- 
bard. 

Mr. and MrS. Marshall SPU- 

Wheeler at Autumnwmd 
Nursing Home at Decker- 
ville Friday evening to help 
Mrs. Wheeler celebrate her 
birthday. 

Mary Ginther of Flint and 
Brenda Tyrrell of Midland 
spent the weekend with 
Kathryn Tyrrell. 
Mrs. Evans Gibbard was a 

Thursday guest of Stella 
Leszcz ynski. 

Mrs. Jeff Kanaski came 
home Tuesday after spend- 
ing 5 ,days in Huron Memo- 
rial Hospital in Bad Axe. 
Mrs. John Walker visited 
Mrs. Kanaski Satur&y. 

Patsy Recor and grand- 
daughters were Wednesday 
afternoon guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Curtis Cleland. 

FOR SALE - 1978 Ford 
pickup 4x4, $900 or best 
offer. Call 872-5073. 

SOMMERS' BAKERY 
& RESTAURANT 

1-2-27-3 I Phone872-3577 I ext. 212. 2-2-17-tf 2r3-6-3 

I I 2-3- 13- 1 1 [ RealEstate ForSale ) FOR SALE - 1988 Chev- 
rolet Caprice Classic 

casscity 

Brougham door, loaded* FOR S A L E  - smith- 
Call 872-2566. 1-3-4-3 typewriter, *; 

- -  
FOR SALE BY OWNER 

green swivel rocking chair, 
FOR SALE - 1984 Ford $30. Call 872-2869 after 6 
pickup, short box, stepside, 
V8 stick with overdrive, 
AM-FM, with box cover. 
call 658-8719. 1-3-13-3 

p.m. 2-2-27-3 

HYDRAULICHOSES 
LaFave Steel 
Supply , Inc. 

8260 Van Dyke 
Cass City, MI 

Hydraulic hoses 114" to 
1 1/4" made to size. 
4 & 2 wire and also 
0-Ring Flange Fittings 

FOR SALE - '85 Cavalier, 
good M y ,  new clutch , good 
p.ansportation. Call 872- 
4487. 1 -3- 13- 1 

3 bedroom ranch, family room, 1 1/2 
baths, partially finished basement, one 

mile from Cass City. Built in 1977. 
Make offer. 

afiet 5:OO p.m. 
C ~ S S  872-3715 

3-3-13-1 

Mr. and Mrs. Allen Far- 
relly were Tuesday evening 
guests of Mr, and Mrs. Den- 
nis Bartle and Tommy. 
Reva Silver was a Monday 

evening guest of Beverly 
Rockefeller. 
Mr. and Mrs. David Hacker 

were Friday evening guests 
of Mrs. Earl Schenk. 
Ray Depcinski was a Tues- 

day evening guest of Don 
Jackson. 

Virginia Zimmer and 
friend Marie of Marlette 
were Saturday guests of 

FOR SALE - 1979 Buick 
Electra, $300. Call 872- 
4543. 1-3-6-3 

FOR SALE - 1964 F o ~  

Call 
(517) 875-9163 

2-2-27-4 
Comet, needs restoring, all 
original, complete. ~ o o d  FOR S a  - Combination 
buy. $400. Phone 517-635- storm left hand 

1-3- 13- In 3413. opener. Call 872-2889. 
2-3- 13": 

FOR SALE - 1988 S-15 
Jimmy Ciera Classic, 4x4, 
loaded, 1987 Ford Thunder- 

low miles, both excellent. 
bird, Turbo - COUP, loaded, 

Call (5 17) 658-8853. 
1 -3- 13-3 

Satellite N. 

The regular meeting of the 
Cass City Village Council 
was held Feb. 25, 1991 at 
7:OO p.m. All Trustees were 
present. 
The minutes of the regular 

January and Special Meet- 
ing of Feb. 13, 1991 were 
approved BS presented. 

Tom Meismer, owner of 
Gilligan's, was present to 
q u e s t  that the Village ap- 
prove a dance/entertain- 
ment permit for his estab- 
lishment. The q u e s t  was 
referred to the Rules Com- 
mittee. 

Joel Chamkrlain and 
Robert Gentner of Ye0 & 
Ye0 presented the 1990 
Audit Report and stated that 
the Village has complied 
with all State and Federal 
guidelines and is financially 
sound. A motion was made 
by Trustee Tuttle and sup- 
ported by Trustee Helwig to 
accept the 1990 audit report 
from Yea & Yeo. Motion 
carried 7 yeas, 0 nays. 

Proposals were received 
from Anderson, Tuckey, 
Bernhardt & Co., P.C. of 
Car0 and Ye0 and Ym, P.C. 
of Marlette for the 1991 
Audit. These proposals will 
be opened and reviewed by 
the Budget and Finance 
Committee. 

A motion was made by 
Trustee Weaver and sup- 
ported by Trustee Prieskorn 
that the bills be approved as 
presented. Motion carried 7 
yeas, 0 nays. 

A motion was made by 
Trustee Helwig and sup- 
ported by Trustee Karr that a 
Public Hearing be held 
March 11,1991 at 7:OO p,m. 
to review a 5-year commu- 
nity re-creation plan. Motion 
carried 7 yeas, 0 nays. 

The Rules committee re- 
ported that Ordinance #117 
section 7 regulates un- 
authorized use of dumpsters 
within the Village. 
The Planning Commission 

minutes were reviewed. 
The Manager's report was 

reviewed. 
The council extended con- 

gratulations to Office Craig 
Haynes for receiving the 
Officer of the Year Award 
from the Thumb Narcotics 
Unit. 

The Region VI1 Michigan 
Municipal League meeting 
will be held in Imlay City 
April 25,1991. 

A motion was made by 
Trustee Tuttle and sup- 
ported by Trustee Helwig 
that the meeting be ad- 
journed. Motion carried 7 
yeas, 0 nays. 

Excellent Condition 
3 bedroom ranch, full finished basement, French doors 
lead to deck, beautiful oak cabinets w/plate rail, deco- 
rated in neutrals, ready to move in.-Only $64,200. 
ccTo63 

FOR SALE - 1972 Ford 2-ton 
truck with 300 Ford 6-cyli.n- 
der engine ; also several an- 
tique wood stoves. Call 

1-2-27-3 (517) 872-5105. 

4-H 
ALL YOU CAN EAT 

SPAGHETTI SUPPER 
MARCH 14,1991 4:30 - 7:OO p.m. 

Masonic Hall, Maple St., Cass City 

Sponsored By 
CASS CITY LIVESTOCK 4-H CLUB 

Adults $3.50 - Family $10.00 
Children 5-12 $2.50 

Children under 5 Free 

Ad Sponsored by Thumb National Bank 

ovrr2wdunnclr 
of cnetrtrfnmmt. 

RICK'S 
EARTH STATION 

KIRBY VACUUM - The 
world's finest. Have you 
seen our new model? The 
Generation I11 moves easily 
and freely. For free gift and 
home demonstration, please 
call 269-7562, evenings 

your current Kirby? We 
offer quick service at a low 
price. We ship parcel post 
any parts, bags, belts, any- 
thing for Kirby vacuums. 90 
days Same as cash on new 
vacuums. Have many other 
Kirby models in stock. For a 
clean, quick sweep, call us 

1433E.CuoRd..C~o 6134783 

479-6543. Need repairs for 

2bedroomranch withbeautiful country kitchen. Large 
finished basement with 3/4 bath. Attached garage and 
large garage and workshop. Only 1 mile from Cass 
City. $48,500. CC150 

(General] 
Merchandise 

FOR ALL YOUR 
STEEL NEEDS 

AND ALUMINUM 
Cass City- Nice 3 bedroom 2 story home fully insu- 
lated, new storms and h n s .  Asking $29,900. 
ccTo61 

3-3- 13- 1 Call us 
LaFave Steel 
Supply, Inc. 

8260 Van Dyke 
Caw City, Mich. 

(517) 872-4163 
FAX # 

5 17-879-2a78 
2-2-279 AND AUCTIONEERING 

Call 8724377 EOUAL HOUSING 
OPPORTUMm rt il FAMILIES - Clubs, Day- now. -2-1-23-14 

care - Caterers - Fund -is- Others Get Quick Results With The 
Chronicle's Classified Ads- 

You Will Too! 

ers: Cut food costs. Free 
delivery. No membership. 
1-800-248-2667 - 8: 00 till 5: 00, 

2-2-6-12 

Beautifully Crafted 
rich looking 

Business Cards 
Designed to make the 

first impression a good 
one. . . and a lasting one 

WATERPUMP 
WATER WELL 

WATER SOFTENERS 
Installation & Service 

10% off or more 

IN-HOME SERVICE 
Paul's Pump Repair 
Ron Blunt Drilling 
Call 6734850 anytime 

2- 1 - 1 6-tf 

- . - w d -  Friday 

FISH FRY! Cass City 
Chronicle 

Phone 872-2010 
m 2- 1-17-tf 

Fresh 

PAN FRIED HERRING DINNER 
Lake Superior Herring 

2 SNOWMOBILES for the 
price of one, Arctic Cat, 
$500 or best offer. Call 872- 
4 192. 2-3-6-3 

~~ ~ 

with Salad Bar only $4.95 
NEW! Children's Menu 

Check it out! ALUMINUM 8 ft. camper 
top for full size pickup. call '0' SALE - Couch* .re- 

cliner, exercise trampoline, 8724 192. 
matching sectional, chair 2-36-3 Sommers' Bakery 
and ottoman, with corner 
table, TV-stereo console, 
45s (records), traverse rods. 
Call 872-2555. 

2-2-27-3 

Action Guide I Find the Service or Product 
You Need in This. . . . I FOR YOUR 

FABRICATING 
NEEDS CALL K.R.K. 
FABRICATING AND 

MACHINING, 
. Division of LaFave 

Steel Supply, Inc. 
Industrial, Commercial, 

Agricultural, 
Residential 

8260 Van Dyke Road, 
Cass City, MI 48726 

(517) 872-2164 

(517) 872-2878 
FAX # 

Hburs : Weekdays 
8 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Saturdays: 8 a.m. to 
12 p.m. 

(Closed for lunch 
12-12 : 30) 

2-2-274 

Come in 
and browse 
through our 

large 
selection of 

Wedding 
Invitations, 
Accessories, 
Gift Items 

and 
much more! 

Cass City Muffler I I DAN'S POWER &  STOVE^ i 

& Brake Shop Fireplaces, Stoves, Chimneys Tuff-Kote Dinol 
Chimney sweeping 8 repairs 
STlHL chamsaws 8 outdoor 

Lawn & garden equipment 

Mufliers . Shocks. Ldetlrne guarantees . 
Minor engine repairs - Cendied Mechanc 

Phone 872-2251 

Aulomo tive Rust Proofing 
Blaine deBeaubien, Prop. power equ~pmenl Sys terns 6 Waxing 

Gravel Guards 
6597 Maln, Cass City SNAPPER mowers 8 tillers Running Boards 

Huntsville Park - 2 bedroom home ready to move right 
in. Stove, refrigerator, drapes-curtains, all stay. Vinyl 
replacement windows put in in 1990, natural gas heat. 
only $6~00. MH564 Sales & Service Rock Kote Stone Chip Protection 

Phone 269-9585 Hercules and Cooper 6509 Main, Cass City 
Phone 872-3190 827 S. Van Dyke, Bad Are 

CASS CITY 
CHRONICLE 

Catalogs loaned overnight 

The Want 
Ads Are 

NewsyToo! I Joyce A. La Roche 
Village Clerk FOR SALE - 1978 Camaro, 

small block 400, automatic, 
chromes and wide tire, his/ 
her sunroof. $600 fm. 1978 
Chevelle Malibu Classic, 
350, automatic, stereo, sun- 
roof,dualexhaust, sharpcar. 
$850 firm. 1970 Marlette 
mobile home, 3 bedrooms, 
rec rmm, expando, on 3.7 
acres of land. $19300. In- 
quire at 6328 River Rd., 
Cass City. 2-3 - 13-3 

SUPREME 
WINDOW CLEANING Cass City school menu Flowers - Plants - Balloons 

Sandy 6 Tom Tkrnsy. 0wn.n 
4 9 6  L e a d  Si., C u r  Cay. MI 48726 

Jundmn d M.53 

Phom 872-3935 Phone 872-2161 
MARCH 18-22 

Monday - Barbecued Rib 
w/bun, Corn, Fruit, Milk, 
Tuesday - Waffles & Sau- 

sage,TaterTots,Fruit, Milk. 
Wednesday - 3-Meat Sub, 

Baked Beans, Fruit, Potato 
Chips, Milk. 
Thursday - Cheese &Pep- 

peroni Pizza, Peas, Fruit, 
Mik 

Friday - Macaroni & 
Cheese, Green Beans, Fruit, 
Milk. 
2nd Entree - - - Hot dog w/ 

Bun. 

24-HR, SERVICE 
Call C a s  Clty 517-872-2248 or 

Kelly W. Smith, Broker 
Farm - Commercial * Residential Listings Wanted! 

This space could 
be yours for 

as little as $1.75 
per week. 

1120 Gratlot, Saginaw 
Call 

790.7609 

PLUMBING 4 I4EATiNG. INC. 
6528 Main. 

PhOnb 871-5084 
Pigaon Phone 453-3531 (Menu subject to change). 
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CALLING 872-2010 PUTS ACTION AD TO WORK FOR YOU 

Ladies Auxiliary 
Irish Luncheon 
Corned Beef/Cabbage 

and dessert 
All you can eat 

Sunday, March 17 
12:oO noon - 2:30 p.m. 

VFW Hall Cass City 

Adults - $3.50 
6-12 YTS. $1.75 

I 5-3-6-2 

work Wanted) [ Services 1 [ Notices 1 I ForRent 1 
FOR R J Z ~  1 beboom FOR RENT - storage, Cass above Coach City Mini-Storage. Call 872- 
Light Pharmacy, heat in- 3917. 4-1-25-tf 

~~ ~ 

FOR RENT - Hillside North 
Apartments - 1 bedroom 
apartment, kitchen appli- 
ances, storage, air condi- 
tioning, coin-op laundry. 
Equal Housing Opportunity, 
Call 673-8 15 1. 4-3-6-3 

I CLEAN HOUSES and 
offices. Kathy McMiUen, 
call 8724651. 12-3-13-3 

ALL-TEMP Service & 
Sales Co. - Appliances, re- 
frigeration, heating and 
qooling. $15.00 trip charge. 
ADC accepted. G u a r a n t e  
work, financing on new 
purchases, 24 hour. Call 

'ANCAKE SUPPER 
Wednesday, March 20, 

199 1 
4:30 - 7:30 p.m. 
All You Can Eat 

Adults $3.00 
6-12 years $2.00 

Under 5 - free 
at CASS CITY 

GUNCLUB 
Tickets at door 

or call Pennie Rienas. 
Proceeds to Deford Cub 

Scout Pack #I3593 
for summer camp. 

BINGO - Every Thursday 
at St. Pancratius Hall, S. 
Seeger, Cass City. Doors 
open 6:OO p.m. Early-bird 
6:30, regular bingo 7:Oo. 
Phone 872-5410. Knights of 
Columbus Council No. 8892. 

673-5557. 5-2-27-tf 

5-3-13-1 

5-12-31-tf 

SATELLITE SYSTEMS 
shoppers - stop in at Rick's 
Earth Station for a quality 
satellite system. Installed 
in your yard in less than a 
week. We will meet or beat 
the competition's price. 1/4 
mile west of Deckerville 
Rd. on M a l ,  Caro. Phone 
673-4783. 8-1 1-7-tf 

s b d  

Erla Packing 
6233 Church St. 

Cass City 
Phone 872-2191 

Custom Butchering 
Fridays only 

USDA Inspected Plant 
Custom Curing, Smok- 
ing, Cutting, Wrapping 

and Freezing 

FOR SALE - Hay, $1 per 
bale. Phone 872-3530 or 872- 
-079. 2-1-2-ntf 

NEW ON THE market - 
exquisite executive home. 
Reasonably priced, Bay 
window, French doors, 
many more extras. Call 
Connie McNaughton at 
Kelly & Co. 872-2248 or 
home 872-4061 TCC 1008 

3-3- 13-1 

clided. Call 872-3613. 
4-3-6-2 I Notices 1 

WANTED - house or office 
cleaning jobs, ask for 
Helen. Call 375-2797. 

12-2-27-3 
FOR RENT - The Paint 
Store has a wallpaper 
steamer for easy removal 
of old wallpaper. Call 872- 
2445. 4-11-2-tf 

HOUSEHOLD SALE - 
March 16-17,9:00 till 6:O. 
4303 b r r  Rd. Washer & 
dryer, living m m  set, bed- 
room set, various furniture 
pieces. 14-3- 13- 1 

FOR RENT - 1 bedrmm 
apartment, furnished, new 
carpet, new paint, refrigera- 
tor, stove. Call 872-3315, 
ask for Bud. 4-3-6-tf 

FOR SALE by owner - brick 
ranch, convenient to all 
schools, fully landscaped 
including h i t  trees, 16x32 
indoor pool, large patio, fin- 
ished basement with fue- 
place, air conditioning, 
natural gas hot water heat, 
excellent storage space in- 
cluding 6 ft. cedar closet, 
attached 2 car garage, 3 
large bedrooms, country liv- 
ing l/2 mile from downtown 
on a 143x226 lot. Call for an 
appointment, 872-2555. 

3-3- 13-3 

HILLSIDE 
APARTMENTS 

- ~~ ~ 

FOR RENT - in town - Cass 
City, unique, 1 bedroom 
mother-in-law apartment. 
Available May 1. Heat in- 
cluded, $325 per month. 
Call 8724908, 4-3-13-4 

GARAGE SALE - March 
21-23, 9:OO till 590. Baby 
clothes, miscellaneous. 
3375 E. Cass City Rd. 

14-3-13-2 

2 bedrooms, kitchen ap- 
pliances, air condition- 

ing, drapes, storage, 
coin-op laundry, all 

carpeted. 

"$1 00.00 Reward!" for any 
wet basement we can't per- 
manently dry out. Hydroflo 
System: The Basement 
Waterproofing Alternative. 
Serving Michigan Since 1972. 
In West Michigan call: 1-800- 
748-0500 and Eastern 
Michigan call: 1-800-782- 
8070. 

NEW 
COCONUT 
44MOUNDS" 

FILLING 
Donuts & Cakes 

SOMMERS' BAKERY 
& RESTAURANT 

Cass City 
Phone 872-3577 

5-3-13-1 

Call 872-3283 
or 872-33 15 

4-3-64 

We Make Venison Sausage 
8- 10-3 1-t f FOR RENT - Masonic Tem- 

ple Refreshment Hall - par- 
ties, dinners, meetings. No 
alcoholic beverages. Call 
Ted Furness, 872-4509. 

OFFICE SPACE for rent. 

4-2-17-tf 

FOR SALE - farmland, 150 
acres of grade-A non-tiled 
~d in Section 35, Grant 
Township. Call 872-2429. 

3-3-6-3 

FOR RENT - 3 bedroom 
executive ranch home, 
nested in the woods, Call 
Kelly & Co. Realty 872- 

FOR FENT - 1 bedroom 
apartment, partly furnished. 
Single person preferred. 
Call 872-3343. 4-1-234 

2248. 4-1-23-tf 

Carpet & Upholstery 
Cleaning 
*Licehsed DuPopt 

Stainmaster 
applicator 

*Auto Interiors 
cleaned 

Truck Owner Operators - 
Mayflower is looking for am- 
bitious, hardworking people to 
join our growing fleet of owner 
operators. Experienced or in- 
experienced, t ra in ing is 
FREE! (includes CDL orienta- 
tion). Pay package industry's 
best; tractor purchasdease 
programs available. Call 1 - 
800-648-7825. Ext NB-2. 

1 ForRent 1 
J 

. ~~ 

FOR SALE - large lot, 1/2 10x14 $105 per month. 
block from park, across FOR RENT - bedroom 14x16'~ $168 per month. Call 
street from elementary apartment - Northwood weekdays 8 a.m.4 p.m. 517- 
school. Just $300.00 down He@& Apartments. Call 872-2163. Located south of 
and $150.00 per month. Call 517-872-2369. Equal Housing Colony House on Van Dyke. 
872-3928. 3-7-25-tf Opportunity. 4-2-13-tf 4-11-7-tf in your 

driveway 
- I C .  u v Y . Yl J . . UU.."YUUJ 

night. Open 6:W-early bird 
6:30 - regular bingo 7:OO. 
Post 3644 VFW, Weaver St. 

1 wanted to BUY 1 
WANT TO BUY - clean 2- 

FOR SALE BY 5-2-26-tf quart canning jars: Mrs. W 
Uon Dohn L - t h ~ r  Batki, -call 872- 

2916, 6-3- 13-3 Brissette-Wheeler House -- 
Nine elegant chambers, with 
private baths in  Historic 
Downtown Three Rivers. Mur- 
der mystery weekend, roman- 
t ic  packages, specia l  
occasions, bridal suites. Call 
(61 6) 278-81 47. 

HAPPY 4394 Maple #3 
Cass City 

84-15-tf Phone 872-3471 B.A. CALKA REAL ESTATE WANTED - silver coins, 
dimes, quarters, halfs 1964 
and back - silver dollars 
1878 to 1935. Paying top 
price. The Coin Shop, 6439 
Main. Phone 872-3919. 

6-9-21-tf 

-1 
LOOK THEM OVER!!! 
REDUCED FROM $69,900 to $62300. 

Smith 
Refrigeration 

IMMEDIATE SALE!! 
SPECIAL!!! RANCH TYPE home in very good con- 
dition - very neat in andout - 3 bedrooms; lotsof storage 
& closet area - BASEMENT OVER 3/4 finished off - 
1 1/2 bathrooms; 8 l/2 years old - 2 car garage 

attached, electric door openers; Sun deck - many other 
features - - - $62,500.00, other incentives valued up to 
$l,OOO,OO. List. #16,739 

SunCity Vacatlon. Nevada 
sunshine, welcoming neigh- 
bors, golf, swimming, crafts, 
beautiful mountains. Wonder- 
ful senior vacation for two, 
$399 plus tax weekly, Sun 
City Las Vegas, 1-800-843- 
4848. 

and 

21st birthday 
PFC Larry A. Curtis 

from your Family 
S-3- 13- 1 

[To Give Away Appliance Repair 
All makes and models 

Call 872-3092 
8-3-15-tf 

DEAN'S GARAGE DOOR- 
Service - Dean Wisenbach, 
phone 872-4560 or 872-3197. 
Residential and commer- 
cial doors, door openers. 
Free estimates. 8-7-25-tf 

FREE TO GOOD home - 
One-year-old beagle/min 

LOST DOG - male, German pin, neutered, l icend,  all 
Shepherd mix, black, from shots. Good watchdog, 
CassCity Gun Clubarea,red daughter allergic - can't Draftsperson/HVAC/Electrl 

cal: Fishbeck, Thompson 
Carr & Huber, an engineering 
and scientific firm, is seeking 
afull-time draftsperson with at 
least 3 years of HVAC/Electri- 
cal hand drafting using iqk on 
mylar. Full benefits are of- 
fered and compensation is 
commensurate with ex- 
perience. Send resume to: 
Director of Human Resour- 
ces: Fishbeck, Thompson, 
Carr & Huber, Inc., 6090 East 
Fulton, Ada, Michigan, 49301. 
EOE. 

collar, f;iendy, answers to 
the name Bear. Call 872- 
2488. 5-3- 13- 1 What you want we have here in Hills and Dales 

Subdivision-4911 Huron St.,CassCity-Lot 146x150 
- Formal Dining rmm, 2 FAMILY ROOMS - great for 
entertaining - CUSTOM BUILT HOME -- over 2400 
square feet of living space - Shown by appointment 
only. Call B.A. Calka, Realtor, for personal showing. 
L# 1 6,733 

I Services ] 
On - the - Farm 

Service Arthur Brown 
Cass City 

Well Drilling 
and 

Pump Repair 
STATE LICENSED 

Phone 673-3800 
' 8-1-27-tf 

Steamaster Carper 
8c Upholstery 

Cleaners 
Experienced, Fast, 

Courteous, Inexpensive 
Residhtial & Commercial 

Car-& van interiors 
Water & fire damage 

10% Senior Discount 
Licensed DuPont 

Stainmaster Applicator 
PAULXESSLER 

Tractor Tire Repair 
Chloride Pumping 

Goodyear Farm Tires 

Call today 

PRIVACY & ELEGANCE 
In Northwood Village & Estates Subdivision - 6214 
Beechwood Dr., Cas City, Michigan - 3 bedrooms 
with lots of closets & storage room - basement; brick 
courtyard - many other features - over 2500 square 
feet of living area - Shown by appointment only. Call 
B,A.Calka, Realtor, for personal showing, L#16,728 

Cass Cit Tire 
Phone 8 2-5303 

5-5-30-tf 
7 Wolff Tanning Beds - No 

money down. Easy financing. 
Sunbeds, tanning lotions, ac- 
cessories and massage oil. 
Factory direct from largest 
U.S. tanning products 
manufacturer. Call for free 
color catalog 1-800-722- 
8663. 

WANTED - Long time stu- 
dent of the sinking of the 
Titanic is still looking for 
any and all memorabilia 
about it. Will consider any 
and all items no matter how 
off the wall, Le., postcards, 
sheet music, books, 
magazines, photos, what 
have you? (313) 982-2392 

SAW SHARPENING - 
Bruce Silvernail, 5205 Be- 
vens Rd. Discount prices 
for winter months. Phone 

a o o e o o o a e e e o o o o  

683-2732. 8-1 1-7-tf 

e 
T 8~ c Collision : 

engine repair, all makes. 
Pickup and deliver. 1 1/2 
west of Cass City. Hank's 
Repair, phone 872-5456. \ 

Simpson 
Excavating 

Dozer landscaping 
All types of 

backhoe work 
Footings - waterlines 

Complete septic systems 
Sand - Gravel - Topsoil 

Variety of fill - 
any size fill job 
Free estimates 

8-3-6-4 

8 7 2 - 4 5 0 2 
8- 1 - 2 3 4  

PAINT BRUSH SPECIAL!!! 40 Acres with 3 bedroom home; basement; tool shed - 3 miles from Kingston - HANDY 
MAN'S SPECIAL - - - $52,900. Possible land contract - - - Immediate Possession. Listing #16,705. Michigan Deer Spectacular. 

March 15 (opens 4 p.rn.) 
Lansing Center. Antler con- 
tests, seminars, products for 
sale, deer & turkey calling. 1- 
800-733-3990, 

4 GOOD INVESTMENT HERE!! 1 Acre -Ranch type home with 3 bedrooms; all new dry wall; new bathroom; new 
roof; new siding; new circuit breaker box; over $4500 in new kitchen cabinets; 2 new doors on garage with elec. door 
opener; priced to sell $24,500. Terms. Listing #16,712 

REDUCED TO $s,OOO CASH -Frame home 24x%', 2 bedrooms; gas forced hot air furnace; water hauled - new bridge 
to property - reduced from $13,000 to $8,000 for immediate sale - Listing #103. 1 Acre. 

after i:oo p.m. 5-2-13-8 e 
0 
0 
e 
0 

5097 Koepfgen Road : 
Cass City, MI 48726 

(517) 872-4215 

1 mile west, 1 1/4 north 
e 0 

e 15 years' experience 
e 

BALL GLOVE 
LACING A Wonderful Family Ex- 

perience. Australian, 
European, Scandinavian, 
Japanese high school ex- 
change students arriving in . 
August. Become a host fami- 

" 

ly/American Intercultural Stu- 
dent Exchange. Call 
1 -800-Sibling. 

COUNTRY HOME: 5 Acres -mostly wooded - Custom builtRanch type with dining room -alum. siding; 3 bedrooms; 
FLREPLACE; laundry room f"st level - full basement; 2 car garage attached; your inspection invited. $69,500. 
L#l6,732 
14 Acres: Large family farmhouse with new furnace; new roof on barn, $45,000. L#16,737 

IN CASS CITY: Frame 2 story home - very neat in and out - 4 bedrooms; Den - OPEN STAIRWAY - dining room 
- natural gas furnace; garage - hardwood floors; basement; garage; corner lot - $42,500.00. L#16,731 

$1.40 per lace 
$1.50 per glove Chuck Mester 

Tom Russell : 
e Managers e 

: Let us pay your deducti- 
e ble, based on 5% of total,, 

bill with this couwn. 

0 
BIGELOW 

HARDWARE 
Cass City 872-2245 

5-3-13-1 
Single? Listen and respond 
to hundreds of singles from 
your touchtone phone. 1-900- 
420-9009 (Code 99 for East- 
ern Michigan. Code 73 for 
West e rn/Ce nt r al M ic h ig an) 
$1.49/minute. 

IN CASS CITY: Brick front with aluminum siding; 3 bedrooms; FIREPLACE; breezeway - sun deck - 2 car garage 
attached; nicely landscaped - priced to sell. L#16,708 

JUST OUTSHIE OF CASS CITY: RANCH TYPE home with over 1700 square feet of living space; FAMILY 
ROOM 16x24' with Cathedral Ceiling - large BRICK FIREPLACE - dining room - 1 1/2 bathrooms; basement; 2 
car garage; priced below reproduction - - - $69,500. SCHWEGLER ROAD. L#16,724 

A Man's Ambition - - - A Woman's DREAM!!! 

Auto Loans! Bad Credit OK! 
Free information. Call now! 1 - 
800-437-8929 No one 
ref used ! \ 

&RING YOUR HORSE!! 
20 ACRES - practically new 30x40' pole building - concrete floor; 90 drilled well - 4 horse stalls and room for 4 more 
. 2  water hydrants - Cass River frontage - only 2 1/2 miles from Cass City. Listing #16,721 ATTENTION - RN's 

needed all shifts, full time, 
part time, any time, 
weekends or weekdays 
only, 4-hour, 8-hour and 
new 12-hour shifts with pre- 
mium pay. Call Curt at 
(517) 872-2121. ll-9-26-tf 

The Department of Natural GARY WILLS 
CoNSTRUCT1oN 

Licensed/Insurd Builder 

All Homeowners! $Speedy 
Cash$ Any purpose, low 
rates, credit corrected, E2 
dept consolidation. Express 
Mortgage, money from your 
home fast! Call 369-CASH, 
ask for Dept. 50. Outside 
(31 3) Call 1 -800-LOAN-123. , 

WATER FRONTAGE - - South Shore Sand point - 4 bedrooms; Family Room - Living Room - over 200' water frontage 
- reduced from $185,000 to $165,000 for quick sale. Immediate Possession. 

RANCHTYPE homewithalum. siding; 1 1/2bathrooms; hardwoodfloorscarpeted - 17x24'FAMILY ROOM -kitchen 
with built-in oven and range - drapes and curtains remain and washer and dryer remain. Large garage attached; nicely 
landscaped - extra large lot 99x132'. Priced to sell at $58,500. Terms. L#16726 

., I'ARTER HOME: In Cass City - - - one story - extra large kitchen; extra large bedroom - lo0 Amp electric service 
- large basement; walking distance to stores, churches, schools - $26,500. 

PAINT BRUSH SPECIAL!! 1 1/2 story home with 3 bedrooms; natural gas furnace; basement; dining room; refrigerator 
and range remain; good income property - rentals are in demand - - $18,500. Terms. 

In Cas City - 1 block off Main St. - with aluminum siding - stone porch; basement; 4 bedrooms; 1 1/2 bathrooms; TWO 
LOTS - distant owner wants quick sale. MAKE OFFER - - Asking $39,500. 

46 ACRES - no buildings - g d  building sites - excellent hunting - $22,500 - - - $3,000 down. Your opportunity to make 
your investment grow. 

HUNTING LAND - & BUSINESSES for sale - Let us tell you about them. 
WE HAVE: SEVERAL FARMS, HOMES IN CASS CITY COUNTRY HOMES, VACANT LAND - 

We have many others to choosefrom. Call, Write or See: 

I timber in the Deford Statel I New HomedRemodeIing 
Repair, Pole BuildingalTnk 
Setting, SandGravel & Tap- 
soil, Excavatingldemolition 

Bulldozing & Grading 

Game Area, Tuscola County. 
For more information, con- 
tact the Cass City Field Of- 

Backhoe & Hydrohoe 
Free estimates I I  Reasonable rates 

fice, 4017 E. C& Rd., Cass I City, MI 48726, or phone 
WANTED - part-time sales 
clerk, 25 hours per week. 
Send reply to Box 0, care of 
Chronicle office. 

11-3-6-2 

Call Your Date - Meet some- 
one special now! For dating, 
romance, and just plain fun, 
dial 1-900-737-4444. Only 
$1.29/min. All Lifestyles. 

5 17-872-5300. 
Bids must be received by 
April 3,1991. 5-3-13-2 

M-81 east of Cass City 
Call 5 17-872-3505 

8-5-3-tf 

INCOME TAX SERVICE - FARM BUREAU Insur- 
Prompt. wrsonal atten- ance: Auto, Farm, Crop, Wolff Tanning Beds Com- 

mercial-Home units. From 
$1 99.00. Lamps- Lotions-Ac- 
cessories. Monthly payments 
low as $18.00. Call Today 
FREE Color Catalog. 1-800- 
228-6292. 

tion. %pef's Tax Service, Home, Business, Life, An- 
3371 River St., Kingston, nuities. Frank Kluger Available now with bene- 
Mich. Phone 527483-2815. (Agent), office 375-4598 or fits. See Ann Fruendt, DON, 

5-1-9-14 home 269-7854. 8-2-28-tf Apply at Tendercare, Cass - - - -~ 
C&,- 4782 Hospital Dr., 

Notice 
Rich Howe and 

Betty Howard are no 
longer with 

Howard's Heating. 

Ken Martin 
Electric, Inc. 

CakCity, Mich.Phone517- 
872-2 174. EOE. 

11-3-13-2 A Doctor Buys Land Con- 
tracts lump sum cash. Fast 
decisions. No commissions. 
31 3- 335-61 66 or 1 -800- 346- 
8080. 

Homes - Farms 
Commercial 
Industrial 

New and rewire 

RN NURSING students - 
are you looking for a way 
to use and improve your 
clinical skills? Do you need 
a flexible work schedule 
and additional income 
while you complete your 
clinical experience? Call 
Curt at (517) 872-2121. 

ll-9-26-tf 

B. A. CALKA, Realtor 87213355 or 872-3230 
Place Your Statewide Ad 
Here! $300 buys a 25 word 
classi f ied ad of fer ing 
1,660,000 circulation. Con- 
tact  th is newspaper for 
details. 

6306 W. Main St., Cass City, Mich. 48726 
or Call: Dale Brown 872-3 158 

EOUAL HOUSING 

State Licensed 
For service call 
872-2030 

5-3- 13-2 

Phone 872-41 14 
4180 Hurds Corner Road 

8-8-10-tf 



CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

Off PIZZA 

Expires 3- 19-9 I ' I  

I 
I 
I 
I 

includes Pan Pizza 
At Pltta Vllla With This Coupon 

I 

I 
I 
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Top Ubly graduates announced Obituaries 
March 10, at Hills and Dales 
Gcneral Hospital. 
He was b r n  July 20,1939, 

in Detroit, the son of Mrs. 
Phyllis (Brooks) Tyo of 
Deford and the late Forest 
Tyo. 

He marricd Miss Marilyn 
Hadeka Oct. 14, 1961, in 
Cass City, where they made 
their home. 

Mr. Tyo, an avid hunter 
and fisherman, had k e n  
employed by the Car0 Re- 
gional Center. He was a 
mcmtxr of the Royal Order 
of Moose, Caro. He served 
with the United States Ma- 
rines in Okinawa and Japan. 
Survivors include his wife 

Marilyn; 2 daughters, Mrs. 
Greg (Kathy) Hutchinson of 
Cass City and Mrs. Dan 
(Dorie) Gee of Mansfield, 
Ohio; onc granddaughter, 
Tiffany; his mother, Mrs. 
Phyllis Tyo of Deford; one 
sister, Mrs. Ronald Phillips 
of Deford, and 3 nephews, 
Michael, Mark and Donald 
Phillips, all of Deford. One 
brother, Donald Tyo, pre- 
ceded him in death, 

Funeral services were to 
have been conducted Tues- 
day at St. Pancratius Catho- 
lic Church of Cass City with 
Rev. Julius Spleet, pastor, 
officiating. 

Burial was in Novesta 
Cemetery, Cass City. 

Arrangements were 
handled by Little's Funeral 
Home, Cass City. 

Mae White 

She was a member of VFW 
Auxiliary Post #3644, Cass 
City. 

Surviving are her husband 
Frank; 4 sons, Duane White 
and Robert White and his 
wife Barb, all of Cass City, 
Kenneth White and wife 
Marie of Elkton and Thomas 
White and wife Kim of Bay 
City; 3 daughters, Mrs. 
Roger (Joann) Martindale of 
Gagctown, Mrs. Arthur 
(Jane) WassofCassCityand 
Mrs. James (Lisa) Mester of 
Shabbona; one stepdaugh- 
ter, Mrs. Francis Cook of 
Bay City; 8 grandchildren; 
her mothcr, Mrs. Anna Karr 
of Cass City; 2 brothers, 
Robert Karr of Sandusky 
and Clayton Karr of Decker, 
and one sister, Mrs. Howard 
Kelley of Cass City.. One 
brother, James, preceded 
her in death. 

Funeral services were 
scheduled to IE held Tues- 
day at Little's Funeral 
Home, Cass City, with Scott 
Tysick, pastor of the Cass 
City Church of God, offici- 
ating. 

Burial was in Elkland 
Cemetery, Cas City. 

Messing, daughter of Lloyd 
and Ann Messing, and Kelly 
Franzel, daughter of C harles 
and Sharon Franzel. 
Graduating with honors are 

Tom Donnellon, son of 
James and Noreen Donnel- 
lon; Caren Warczinsky, 
daughter of Lome and Mari- 
lyn Warczinsky; Michelle 
Oswald, daughter of Ken 
and Lauretta Roberts; Betty 
Osantowski, daughter of 
Gary and Cindy Osantow- 
ski; Mary Guigar, daughter 
of Richard and Diane 
Guigar; Tracey Lindquist, 
daughter of Gayleen Lind- 

Frank Altizer County Fair Board. 
He is survivcd by his wife; 

5 sons and their wives, h e  
and Linda Altizer of Cass 
City, Chuck A l t i m  of Caro, 
Scott and Jennifer Altizcr of 
Caro, Jim and Barbara AI- 
tiiscr of Grwnville and Bob 
AltiiscrofCaro; 5 grandchil- 
dren, Jeff, Barb, and Joc 
Pomcroy, Jessie Altixcr and 
Nicole Altizer; one great- 
grandson, Kevin Pomcroy; 
one sistcr, Mts. Richard 
(Margie) Stahl of Saginaw, 
and 4 nieces and nephews. 
Funcral services were hcld 

March 4 at Collon Funeral 
Homc, Caro, with the Rev. 
Michael Ingmwll officiat- 
ing. 

Burial was in Indianficlds 
Township Cemetery. 

nar at Central Michigan 
University and was also the 
captain of the Quiz Bowl 
team. He was an escort for 
homecoming and partici- 
pated in Honor Guard at 
graduation. 

Krumenacker has played 
football for 4 years and was 
named Thumb C All-Con- 
ference Honorable Men tion 
twice. He also played bas- 
ketball 4 years and has run 
track for 4 years, making the 
1990 Thumb C All-Confer- 
ence Second Team. He also 
was named the team'sYmost 
improved athlete. He was a 
state qualifier in track.and 
holds school records in the 
800m and the 3,200m relay. 

A member of the United 
Methodist Church of Ubly, 
Krumenacker plans to major 
in engineering at the Univer- 
sity of Michigan or Michi- 
gan State University. 
Other Ubly students gradu- 
ating with high honors are 
Holly Heleski, daughter of 
Clarence and Pat Heleski; 
Marty Swartzentrukr, son 
of Harry and Connie 
Swartzentruber; Bonnie 
Emming, daughter of 
Marvin and Regina Em- 
ming; Tracee LaBuhn, 
daughter of William and 
Rose LaBuhn; Connie 
Cook, daughter of Marvin 
and Erma Cook; Kurt Dek- 
oski, son of Kenneth and 
Patricia Dekoski; Jeniffer 

Frank Altizer, 69, of Caro, 
died Thursday, Feb. 28, at 
his South Coiling Road rcsi- 
dcncc. 
He was born June 19,1921 , 

in Carthage, 111. 
He married the former 

Mary Lou K i l b u r n  May 22, 
1953, in Cass City. 

AI t i m  graduated from 
Bad Axe High School and 
moved to the Car0 area, 
where he resided for some 
50 years. He owned and 
owrated Home Service in 
Caro. 

Altizer was very active in 
horse racing, having first 
raccd while in his early 
teens. He was a member of 
the United States Trotting 
Asmiation, Michigan Har- 
ness Horsemen's Associa- 
tion, the Northern Michigan 
Fair and Racing Associa- 
tion, the Boots and Saddle 
Club and the Tuscola 

quist and August Lindquist; 
Tammy Bock, daughter of 
Randy and Karen Bock; 
Jeanene Beaudin, daughter 
of John and Carol Beaudin; 
Stephanie Glaza, daughter 
of Joe and Marlene Particka; 
Scott Puvalowski, son of 
Bernardand Betty Puvalow- 
ski; Lori Paionk, daughter of 
Adam and Lucille Paionk; 
Tammy Volmering, daugh- 
ter of Raymond and Carol 
Volmering; Jennifer Teel, 
daughter of Les and Iris 
Teel; Jeremy Melnik, son of 
Jim Melnik and Beverly 
Melnik; Paul Messing, son 
of Michael and Joyce Mess- 
ing; Jennifer Kolar, daugh- 
ter of Albert and Dorothy 
Kolar; Lori Bensinger, 
daughter of Lanny and 
Cathy Bensinger, and 
Randy Weber, son of Ber- 
nice Weber and the hte 
James Wekr. 

Renee LeCureux Paul Krumenacker 

SPECIAL 
Corned Beef 

Thomas Tyo 

Thomas Lee Tyo, 51, of 
Cass City died Sunday, d? Cabbage 

WE DELIVER! From 4 - 9 p m. p IzzA in town only ($5.00 rmnlmm) 

Delicious 

SVSU hosts 
'Thumb Day' 
Saginaw Valley State Uni- 

versity will host a "Thumb 
Day" for area high school 
students Friday beginning at 
9:30 a.m. at the university's 
Ryder Center. 

The annual outreach pro- 
gram is designed to intro- 
duce Thumb students to col- 
lege and career information. 
Activities will include a tour 
of the university, student 
presentations and door 
prizes during registration. 

Additional information is 
available by calling the 
SVSU Admissions Office at 
(5 17) 790-4208. 

Local 6222 
retirees meet 

Members of Steelworkers 

Dennis Long Mrs. Mae Elizabeth White, 
62, of Cass City died Friday, 
March 8, at St. Mary's Hos- 
pital in Saginaw after a 
lengthy illness. 

She was born May 11, 
1928, in Lake Orion, the 
daughter of Mrs. Anna 
(Nicholas) Karrof CassCity 
and the late Ervin (Abe) 
Karr. 

Miss Karr was married to 
Frank (Bud) White June 22, 
1946, in Cass City, where 
they made their home, 

Mrs. White retired from 
General Cable Co. in 1981. 

"All students need to know 
thought behind Long's proj- 
ects have meant a lot to the 
students-much more than 
if someone had gone to a 
store and purchased game 
boards or flash cards. ence.** 

that we care about their 
progress, and this is a way to 
show them," she said, 
Long concluded, "I'm just 

glad I can make a differ- 

m 

Retirees Local 6222 met 
March 5 at the VFW hall in 
Cass City for a potluck din- 
ner and meeting. Discussion 
was held on several topics, 
including mini, trips to the 
group's learning center in 
Dawson, Pa. 
In other business, members 

chose Helen Bade, Eunice 
Englehardt and Wana Hal- 
lock to serve on a retiree's 
committee for the coming 3 
months. 
Members also held a draw- 

ing. Winners were Louis 
Nemeth and Helen Pyrek. 

SHOP HERE 
FOR $AWNGS!!! 

A0 SEPT 
Disinfect ant 

Neutralization 
Solution 

TYLENOL 
(TYLENOL EX CAPLETS) . a  

Paul Britt 
named to 
dean's list 

$389 $239 
8 02. 1 lPRlCE1 PAYMENTI 1 TERMS Paul Britt, Cas City, has 

I I1990 CAVALIER, 4 dr. RS 13,995 I $1 8R3' I been namedto the deai's list 
at Ferris State University, 
Big Rapids. 

The son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Britt of Cass City, 
he is a sophomore at Fems, 
where he is enrolled in the -!! l school's College of Tech- 

.-- 60 

- - -  48 '4~ 

7 5 4  
FA Arl 

'134"v I 48 I \I' nolony. 

f SUNLIGHT) LIQUID ) 

'I I 1989 CORSICA, V-6, auto, air 1$6,695 1 $1 47 
' 

1 f* 
1989 SPECTRUM ..$5,895 . $1 1 Y" , - . 
1988 CIERA, 4 dr., V-6, loaded $6,995 S r r r - '  - 

14 02. cans To- l  named to the list, a 
I 1985 CADILLAC FLEETWOOD 1'7,295 I * Z U U T l  3 student must achjevea mini- 

CHILDREN'S VIDEOS 11 
$B Cartoon Characters I, 

In Stock 

"EXPRESSIONS 
mum grade point average ot 

-$6,495 $1 7832 - 36 I 9' 3.5 whilecarryingatleast 12 1985 OLDS 98, full power 
TRUCKS /a credit hours during a term. 

I1 Teenage Mutant Ninja Turtles OF THE HEART" 1 I $B Superman and More 
1990 GEO TRACKER 3) concert at 

Helen Steiner Rice $599 and up! by I, only 1989 SILVERADO PICKUP $10,995 *$222w . 54 (r Deford church 
1988 CHEVY 112 TON 4x4 9.995 $20239 54 The Deford-based High- 

I Ask for 
10% Senior 

COMPACT DISCS Citizen 
HUNDREDS OF 

- - - -  - v I 

1988 S-10 PU, auto, air, tilt, cruise '6,795 $1 4g6' 48 
1986 CARAVAN LE $7,595 .,s18407 42 
1986 JEEP CHEROKEE WAGON $8,295 , $201 '' 42 
1985 SI0 BLAZER $6,495 $178= 36 
1984 C20 4x4. V-8, auto $6,195 $170°8 36 

I lightsGospel Singers w i l h  
presenting a special Easter 
conccrt at Deford Commu- 
nity Church, 1392 Kingston 
Rd., Deford, March 22 at 7 
p.m. 

Although there is no ad- 
mission, a freewill  offering 
will be taken, all of which 
will go to the Deford Chris- _ _  

MONEY 
ORDERS 

A vaila ble 
To CHOOSE FROM Prescription 

Discounts 
Drop Off - Pick-up 

For 
STATION 

GENERAL 
TELEPHONE 

We accept all 

Prepay 
Prescription 

Plans 

Pay your 

THUMB 
ELECTRIC 

Bill Here 

Thumb Distributor 

HOLLISTER 
OSTOMY 

PRODUCTS 

Pavments fiaured With 20% down at 13%. dus tax. transfer tees for term indicabd. tian Academy, a ministry of 
- I  - - u  P f l T  CIIEVROLET 

'OLDSMOBILE 4 i 
3 

the Deford Community 
Church. 

Horiski on 
dean's list 
Stacey Horiski of Cass City 

has been named to the fall 
term dean's list at Saginaw 
Valley State University. 

Horiski earned a 3.7 grade 
p i n t  average. 

She is the daughter of or 4 700 N. State St., Cam Phone 673-2171 
Connie Willis of Cass City 

flm and Don Horiski, Bach. 



CALIFORNIA RAISINSTM 

p t g g i  Hardee's Food Systems. Inc 
Only a i  Partiripating Hardds Iv Restaurants, While Supplics Last. 

A ?  

OCALRAB Licensed by Applause Licensing 



i I Raisin Oat Bran or 
I Blueberry Muffin 

ueberry or s.89 I 

PLUS TAX I iisin Oat Bran Muffin I I I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I- 

Off er good through April 7, 1991, I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
4 

Offer good through April 7, 1991. 
Please present thii coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. Up to 4 off YS per ordor. Not good in tombinution 
with any other offer. Cash value l/lOoth of 1 C. Availabh 011 
day. No subsmvtes, phase. Offer good only ot parlitipoting 
Hordee‘s restaurants. 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
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I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
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I 
I 
I 

i 

I 

Plwss present thr  coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. Up to 4 off ars per order. Not good in combination 
with any other offer. Cash value l / lOOth of 1 t. Available all 
day. No substitutes, please. Offer good only ai participating 
Hardee‘s restouronis. 
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$.99 
it 

PLUS TAX 
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*a99 
PLUS TAX 

Offer good through April 7, 1991. 
Please present this coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. U to 4 off ws par order. Not ood in combination 
withan y o i e r  off er,(ash value 1/1 oolhoh (. Avaibbledurin 
re ular breakfasthoursonly. Nowbstiutes, please. Offer goo! 
ody ot partitipaiing Hardee’s restaurants. 

Offer good through April 7f 1991. 
Please present this coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. U to 4 offers per order. Not in combination 

re ulor breakfast hours only. Nosubstiiutes, please. Offer g 2  
on\ ai participoting Hordee’s restaurants. 

wlhonyo~erof fa r . [mhva lue l / l~o  p*d 1 (.Availabledurin 

mMt 

. -  
1 I 

I 
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$la89 
PLUS TAX 

Offer good through $1.79 
April 7, 1991 . PLUS TAX Offer good through April 7,1991. 

Pieme present this coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. U to 4 off ws p r  order. Not good in combination 
with any o ier  offer. (ash volue 1/1OOth of 1 (. Available aher 
re ular breakfasihoursonly. Nosubstitutes, phose. Offer good 
ody d porticipoh’ng Hardee’s restaurants. 

Please present this coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. U to 4 offers per order. Not good in combination 
with any oter off er. (ah value 1/1OOth of 1 (. Availoble aher 
re ulor breakfast hoursonly. Nosubstitutes, please. Offer good 
on\ ai participating Hardee’s restaurants. 

I 

I 
I 
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I 
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I 
I 
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I 

I 

I 

I I Two Cheeseburgers $1.00 
I 

- h U S  TAX 
Offer good through * la59 
April 7, 1991. PLUS TAX Offer good through April 7,1991. 

Please present thir coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. U to 4 offers per order. Not good in combination 
with any o&r offer. [ash value 1/1OOth of 1 C. AvailoMe ofter 
r ulor breakfast hoursonly. Nosubstitutes, please. offer good 03 d participating Hordee‘s restaurants. 

Pleose present this coupon before ordering. One order per 
coupon. U to 4 off eri per order. Not good in combination 
with any o i e r  offer. Cash volue 1/1OOth of 1 t. Available after 
re ular breakfast hoursonly. Nosubstitutes, $em. Offer good 
on!y at participating Hardee’s restaurants. 

I 

Please present this coupon before ordering. One order per I 
wilhanyo~eroff~r.[ahvolue l/lOOthc! 1 t. Availableaher 
r ulorbretlkfasthoursonly.NosubstiMas, plePsa.Offergood I 

I 

Offer good through April 7, 1991. I 
coupon. U to 4 offers per order. Not ood in combination I 

I 

J 

I ‘ I  
I Offer good through April 7,1991, I 

coupon. U to 4 off o n  per order. Not good in combination I 
I 
I 

I 
I 
I 
4 

I 
L-------------------- ---------------------- 

Please present this coupon before ordering. One order per I 
with any o i e r  off er. Cash value 1/1OOth of 1 ( . Available after 
re ular breakfast hoursonly. Nosubstitutes, please. Offer good I 

at participoting Hordee’s restaurank. on\ ot partitipoting Hardee’s restourants. 

OlWl Horh’sFwdSptm, I~./&~V11/13318 1 @I991 Horh’s hcdSphim, l~Jh~V11/13318 
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