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Evens grant i s  $25,000 

Village council okays 
new park, new trail 

will be moved to a parcel ot 
village property located 
about one block east of the 
existing roadside park. 
In other business during the 

85-minute monthly session, 
the council: 

While a majonty 01 trus- 
tees agreed the slide would 
be popular among swim- 
mers, several also expressed 
doubts about the proposal. 

Added liability, an in- 
crease in needed supervision 
and whether the facility 
would attract more swim- 
mers than the pool can ac- 
commodate were among the 
concerns voiced, 
Still, a motion to seek the 

grant was approved on a 5- 1 
vote, with council President 
L.E. Althaver casting the 
lone dissenting vote. 

“My concern is it’s an’ 
awful lot of money to spend 
for a short amount of time 
for relatively few residents,” 
he remarked. I 

be built where a bridge cur- 
rently is located over the 
river. Unfortunately, 
Althaver noted, the bridge 
has been purchased and will 
be removed. 

Other work slated for the 
trail are 2 small bridges to be 
located over the creek north 
of Main Street, clearing and 
grading, improyements to a 
gravel parking lot next to 
Gmeral Cable Co., and the 
addition of benches, signs 
and barriers. 

In a related matter, 
Althaver suggested that the 
Rules Committee be asked 
to look into an ordinance or 
possible ordinance amend- 
ments that will prohibit use 
of the trail by motorized 
vehicles. 

NEW PARK 

The class City Village 

posed rec$ation projects. 
A spexia public meeting to 

discuss d e  projects will be 
held at 7 p.m. Thursday at 
the Vi1 1 age Municipal 
Building./ 

Truf Matt Prieskorn, 
who ch irs the council’s 
Parks an Promotion Com- 
mittee, i itiated the discus- 

Pool. 

*Approved bid specifica- 
tions for contracting resi- 
dential trash pick-up in the 
village. The village will 
request due Nov. bids, 1. which will-be 

*Noted Police Chief Gene 
Wilson, Sgt. Don Miller and 
Officer Craig Haynes were 
recently awarded certifi- 
cates for attending a seminar 
entitled “Updating in Crimi- 
nal Law and Procedures.” 

YOUTH CORPS supervisor Cliff Parrish knocks down this pole at the fairgrounds 
track while 2 Youth Corps students stand by. 
Opens Sunday 

*Learned this year’s atten- 
dance for open swim at the 
Helen Stevens Memorial 
Pool (as of July 18) totalled 
7,030 (an average of 242 
swimmers per day), an in- 
crease of 622 swimmers 
over last year at the Same 
time. 

FOOT TRAIL GRANT 

Tuscola County Fair to In contrast, the council 
voted unanimously to seek a 
similar but separate grant, 
totaling $25,000, for a 
planned foot trail along the 
old Grand Trunk Railroad 
right-of-way. The path 
stretches about 1 1/2 miles 
from the Cass River to the 
northwest corner of the vil- 
lage limits.. 
The money would be used 

for s e v d  improvements, 
including a “scenic over- 
look” structure that would 

Also Monday, trustees 
approved plans for a new 
roadside park along Main 
Street that will replace the 
park now located at the fu- 
ture Jordan College site. 

Some village residents 
have raised concerns in re- 
cent weeks regarding the 
loss of the park, but the new 
site will be equally attrac- 
tive, Prieskorn indicated. 

He said benches, flower 
boxes and an ice skating rink 

again feature family fun’  *Learned the Arts and 
Crafts program now has 208 
children registered, the most 
since 1982. The program 
has averaged 33 children per 
day since June .2Q, staff 
members Kathy Leino and 
Dawn Edzik reported. 

This is the 108th year of the 
Tuscola County Fair. Over 
the years the fair committee 
has always v’fl to kkep the 
annual event fun for the 
whole family. 
This year’s fair, July 30 - 
Aug. 5 ,  is expected to stay 
with the family tradition. 

“Our goal at the fair is to 
keep it 4-H and family orien- 
tated,” commented 12-year 
corn mi t tee member Jim 
Fitzgerald. “We try to make 
this the place where people 
can bring their kids here and 
let them loose if they want.” 

Fitzgerald, Car0 resident, 
added, “We’ve tried to 
maintain the old fashioned 
fair.” . 

Fitzgerald, a retired Bay 
City school teacher, used to 
live right next to theTuscola 
County Fairgrounds as a 
child and has helped at the 
fair ever since he was in 6th 
grade. “I used to work down 
here cooling down horses.” 
Currently, Fitzgerald over- 

sees all thebehind the scenes 
work that few people like to 
do. “I do some of the less 
glamorous things like haul- 
ing away horse and CON 
manure,” Basically Fitzger- 
ald is in charge of grooming 
the fairgrounds. “The big- 
gest amount of my work is in 
cosmetics.” 

He has been actively in- 
volved with the fair for some 
20 years. All of his work and 
efforts are strictly volunteer, 
“I usually work 5 or 6 days a 
week before it starts, getting 
things ready.” 

Fitzgerald added that vol- 
unteers such-as himself are 
vital to the fair. “Without 
volunteer labor the fair 
would die. We get no tax 
money for the fair.” 

The work Fitzgerald does 
can be very hard. He pointed 
out that he does it for the 
kids. “To me, my whole life 
has been guided towards 
young people. This is pri- 
marily for young people. 

Wildnians develop life-long 
f ,‘i * L  e rids hips a t Tusc o la Co un t y 
Fair- Page 5 .  

. 

’It’s a thrill, especially for 
thcm, They see a lot of 
things on television. Here 
they have a chance to see a 
horse that’s not in a tube.” 

Each year committee 
members visit other county 
fairs to get new ideas. Fitz- 
gerald explained having 
new events spices up the 
fair, This year a draft horse 
show will be debuting Aug. 
3 at 8 p.m. and Aug. 4 at 10 
a.m. “They’ll hitch up 2,4 
and 6 horses to a trailer and 
go through various maneu- 
vers. They’ll M expected to 
do turns and maybe back up 
with their horses.” 
Another new event is being 

put on by the Tuscola Con- 
servation Gun Club. 
“They’ll have a display of 

guns and a videotape show- 
ing the differences of assault 
type weapons and the sport- 
ing type rifle.” 

In addition, the National 
Guard is tentatively sched- 
uled to have a display of 
their own. Fitzgerald ex- 
plained he wasn’t sure what 
they may do.” 

$ast flight for Cass 
Citv’s Brewster Shaw. 3: 

CAR EVlENTS 

7-day flight the crew de- logged a total of4 13 hours in investjgating the STS 51-L 
ployed communications sat- space. Challenger accident, and as 
ellites and conducted 2, 6- HeKas since remained very head of the orbiter return to 
hour space walks as well as active in NASA affairs, in- flight team responsible for 
several other experiments. cluding serving as a staff implementing safety modi- 
With the completion of the member of the Roger’s fications to the orbiter fleet. 

second mission, Shaw has Presidential Commission Please turn page 7. 

Also, an antique and clas- 
sic car show will be, dis- 
played next to the grand- 
stand at 10:30 a.m. Monday. 
This new event is being 
coordinated by Richard 
Fullmer. Another event 
that involves cars, the demo- 
lition derby, features a new 

Please turn to page 5. 

native Brewster 

Expand industrial 
park by 30.5 acres 

The Cass City Industrial 
Park will be expanded by 
30.5 acres if negotiations for 
purchase of the parcel, lo- 
catcd west of Doerr Road, 
prove successful. 

The Cass City Economic 

The village has received 
inquiries in the past from 
prospective companies for 
land totalling 20 to 40 acres, 
but there currently are no 
parcels of that size in the 
industrial park, he said. 

Althaver said when asked 
how the purchase would be 
funded. “It’s a long-term 
investment, no question 
about it.’’ 

In other business during 
last week’s special EDC 
session, Althaver noted the 
board formally reviewed 
and approved a lease (for an 
8-year term) with Jordan 
College. 

Following discussion, the 
board passed a motion in 
favor of the Cass City EDC 
borrowing $340,000 at 1 1.5 
percent interest from 
Chemical Bank and Thumb 
National Bank to construct 
the college. Also approved 
was a contract with Herron 
hilders, Cass City, for 
$450,000 to build the facil- 
ity in accordance with plans 
and specifications presented 
by the project’s architects. 
Althaver said construction 

is expected to begin within 
the next 2 weeks. Comple-. 
tion is expected sometime 
this fall, probably late Octo- 

Dcveloprnent Corporation 
Board of Directors last week 
decided to pursue purchase 
of the land, EDC member 
and Village Council Presi- 
dent L.E. Althaver told the 
council Monday night. 

Althaver said the board, 
during a special session last 
Wednesday, voted to nego- 
tiate purchase of the land 
from J.D. Tuckey at no more 
than $2,000 per acre on ex- 
tended terms. 
“As far as the EDC is con- 

cerned, it seems like the 
right thing to do fw future 
growth,” he told the council. 

The reasoning behind the 
purchase, Althaver ex- 
plained, is a predicted need 
in the future for a parcel or 
parcels that would accom- 
modate &he needs of a larger 

Village, Manager Lou S.  
LaPonsie noted the indus- 
trial park currently consists 
of 35 acres, 15 of which are 
in use. The remaining 20 
acres, he said, are split into 
smaller parcels that are, for 
the most part, separated 
from one another. 

Further, Althaver addea, 
the Thumb is increasingly 
being looked at by compa- 
nies as a place to locate 
because of its nearness to 
larger urban areas and be- 
cause land for similar devel- 
opment is getting increas- , 

ingly scarce in some other 
areas of the state. 

“We have, at the present 
time, $15,000, which will 
come from the old IDC 
(Industrial Development 

CASS CITY NATIVE Brewster Shaw is gearing up for his 
third and possibly final mission as a space shuttle crew 
member. The launch is set for Aug. 7, but little other 
information is being released about the flight. industrial firm(s). C o rD or a t i on ) Fund , ” ber, he added. 
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Engaged i. Lutherans set 
Mission Sunday I Cass City Area Social and PerlsonalIterns 

I Y .  
A “Mission Awareness 

Sunday” will be held at the 
Good Shepherd Lutheran 
Church Sunday. 

The Rev. John Heins, 
president of the Michigan 
District, Lutheran Church 
Missouri Synod, and his 
wife, Wilma, will be the 
guest speakers. Heins will 
preach during the morning 
service and, immediately 
following, his wife will 
present a slide presentation 
in the Fellowship Hall. 
The couple toured the mis- 

sion fields in Nigeria a year 
ago. Their presentations, 
which will be followed by a 
congregational potluck din- 
ner, will center on missions. 

Lane and Cindy Chapin 
of Marlette announce the 
birth of their daughter, 
Kayla Lynn. She was born 
July 3 in Port Huron Hospi- 
tal and weighed 8 pounds 
and 15% ounces and was 
23% inches long. Grandpa- 
rents are Bob and Leona 
Brown of St. Helen and 
Newel1 and Helen Hubbard 
of Kingston. Great-grand- 
parents & Lloyd and Irene 
Bader of Snover. 

Sunday dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Smith in 
Deckerville were Mr. and 
Mrs, John Kim of New 
York, Miss Marjorie Kirn 
of Flint, Miss Melinda Kirn 
of Holt and Mr. and Mrs. 
Stanley Kirn of Cass City. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Whit- 
tenburg attended services 
at Calvary Baptist Church 
in Lansing Sunday, July 16, 
where a celebration of 20 
years of its pastor, Rev. 
Errol (Tad) Jameson, was 
held. A This is Your Life 
program was presented 
and Frank McVety of Sebr- 
ing, Fla., was a participant. 

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Blades, son Matthew and 
Mrs. Elsie Blades spent the 
weekend in Baldwin with 
Mr. and Mrs. James Pear- 
son. Mrs. Blades and Mrs. 
Pearson are sisters. 

I .  

Sundy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Lash visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Branden- 
burg and family in Lake 
Orion. It was Mr. Branden- 
burg’s birthday. 

Miss Melinda Kirn re- 
turned to her home in Holt 
Sunday and Miss Marjorie 
Kirn returned to Flint Mon- 
day after spending the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Stanley Kim. 

Saturday supper guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Morell were Mrs, Joyce 
Neal and Mrs. Jeanne 
Quinn and son Brian of To- 
ledo, Ohio. 

Laura Lee Richards ’*-” 

Benjamin J. Raymond Jr;:4 
Tammy Marotz 
Ed Schmaltz Saturday qoon, Mr. and 

Mrs. George Fisher Sr., 
Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Tracy 
and Sally and Sharon 
Finkbeiner were dinner 
guests at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Whittenburg 
in celebration of Mrs. 
Tracy’s birthday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Blades 
of Canton, Mrs. Pat Blades 
and Mrs. Dorothy Ireland 
of South Lyon s nt Thurs- 
day with Mrs. E G e  Blades. 
Mr. and Mrs. James Blades 
joined the group for’supper 
at the Franklin IM, 

Russell and Harriet,. 
Richards of Orlando, Fla,. 
formerly of Cas City, an- 2, 

nounce the engagement of.,, 
their daughter, Laura Lee, to. 
Benjamin J. Raymond J&; 
son of Benjamin and Patrit ,; 
cia Raymond of Lake City,+ 

A Nov. 30 wedding is,.: 
I I- being planned. .. A 

Tammy Marotz and Ed 
Schmaltz announce their 
engagement. She is the 
granddaughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. C.E. Marotz of Deford 
and the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. A1 Pruitt of Pontiac. He 
is the son of Howard 
Schmaltz of Flint and Mrs. 
-Kay Northon of Unionville. 
An Aug. 26 wedding is 

planned. 

Matthew, David and 
Jeremy Wright of Bay Cit 

their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Wright. 
Saturday, they spent the 
day at  Crdsroads Village. 

spent the weekend wi x Hartwick reunion 
Mrs. Laura Ball had a 

cookout Saturday. Guests 
were Mary Scoton of Holi- 
day, Fla., Mr. and Mrq Ed 
Morier of Snover, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arnold LaPeer, Mr. 
and Mrs. Laurence Bartle, 
Mr. andMrs.kHendrick, 
all of C a s  City, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ted Kain of 
Gagetown. 

held Sunday 
The 31st annual Hartwick 

family reunion was held 
Sunday, July 23, at the Cass 
City Park north pavilion. 

Kay Armstrong and 
Cathy Williams of Lapeer 
were hostesses. Sixty-five 
members and guests at- 
tended a potluck dinner at 
noon. 

The oldest present was 
Thelma Bogart of Caro and 
youngest was A. Michael 
Scott Hartwick of Holly. 

Coming from out of state 
were Bill and Melanie Van- 
Allen and daughters, Jen- 
nifer and &?Ma, from 
Waukegan, Ill. Robert 
Hartwick of Zephyrhills, 
Fla., came the longest dis- 
tance. 
A softball game and the 

swimming pool were en- 
joyed. 

Hostesses for 1990, will be 
Carol Hartwick and Noreen 
Kea ting . 

Mr, and Mrs. Jerry Jen- 
nex and 3 children of Hun- 
tin n Beach, Calif., vis- 

Mrs. Gladys Agar, Thurs- 
day. They are also spending 
time with her folks at  Char- 
levoix, 

i tedpo their grandmother, 

Mrs. Phoebe Yazir of 
Bradenton, Fla., and her 
great -aunt, Clara 
Wickware of Sarasota, 
Fla., left Wednesday for? 
their homes. Mrs. Yazir is 
the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Wiles. 

Stanley Morell received 
word that another brother, 
Emmett Morell, of San- 
dusky suffered a stroke and 
is a patient in Ann Arbor 
hospital. 

Watkins - q J ;  

Blood bank 
coming Aug. 1 

Mrs. Maxine Sickler of 
Morley came Saturday and 
is staying until Tuesday 
with her mother, Mrs. 
Gladys Agar. 

Sunday, July 16, Miss 
Melinda Kirn of Holt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Stanley Kirn, Mr, 
and Mrs. Mick Kirn and 
daughters enjoyed a cook- 
out at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Smith in Decker- 
ville. 

4 : , ! 
’ > ’ *  #to speak 

> ‘ > e  

Herb Watkins, a mission-; 
ary in San Luis Potosj,,, 
Mexico, and former mini%;., 
tgr of Novesta Church of+ 
Christ, will be speaking a\,,, 
both the morning and ever;.,: 
ning services Sunday atae,,., 
Novesta Church of Christ+,: 
2896 N. Cemetery Rd. , ,:, 

Watkins, who ministere&, 
with the Novesta congrega? , I 
tion from 1944 through-* 
1948, will speak on T h q .  
Burden of the Great Com- 
mission” during the 11 a.m. 
worship sewice. 

A carry-in potluck is 
scheduled at 1:15 p.m, ; 
During the 7:30 p.m. servrL 

ice, he will tell of his mis-:.- 
sionary work in Mexico with,. :, 
slides and a question/answer,>: 
pwiod. - .  

Former friends and ac?;.. i 
quaintances of Watkins ~ ., 
his wife, CarQlyn, are in7 ,i 

Area residents who haven’t 
given blood yet this summer 
are urged to give now, be- 
fore Labor Day weekend. 

First Aid 
class set. Mr. and Mrs. Dean Tuc- 

key and Mrs. Audrey Kat- 
zenberger attended the an- 
nual Coulter family reunion 
in Clarkston Sunday, July 
16. The reunion is the 
families of the late George 
and Nina Coulter, former 
residents of -Caw City. Over 
50 attended. Present were 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Boughton and their 
families of Detroit. 

The Red Cross Bloodmo- 
‘ bile will be at Hills and 

Dales General Hospital, 
Cass City, Aug. 1. Spon- 
sored by the hospital auxil- 

. iary, the blood bank will be 
accepting donors from 1 to 7 
p.m. 

According to hospital offi- 
cials, Labor Day weekend is 
historically one of the high- 
est blood usage periods of 
the entire year. More people 
are traveling and enjoying 
the outdoors, and that means 
an increase in the chmce of 
accidents, officials said. 

Labor Day also marks the 
. end of a “summer slump”- 

a time when blood usage is 
high and donations are 
down-at the Red Cross. 

I 

There will be an Ameri- 
can ]Red Cross Standard 
First Aid Class at  Hills and 
Dales General Hospital 
Saturday from 8 a.m. to 5 
p.m. 

Cost of the class is $15 
which includes materials 
and breaks. 

The Standard First Aid 
Class includes CPR, first 
aid for choking, shock, 
bleeding, stroke, fractures, 
bites and other emergen- 
cies. Each participant 
finishin the class will re- 

This class is required by 
many colle es, and can be 

and money. Registration 
and more information are 
available by calling Jane 
Mitchell at 872-2121. 

ceive a L d  Cross card. 

taken local f y to save time 

The press release came too 
late for the June weddings, 
and that’s a shame. If only 
we’d known.,. 

It’s from PR Associates in 
Detroit and begins, “Stuck 
for a unique gift idea for the 
bride and groom? How 
about a car phone? Or a fax 
machine? Or a maid serv- 
ice?” 

It goes on to say that, ac- 
cording to a recent informal 
survey of bridal shops, the 
gifts “most wanted” by pro- 
spective newlyweds in- 
clude: 

Wbney ... in the form of 
cash, savings bonds and 
stocks, preferably blue 
chips. (Great idea! How 
many blue chips can you get 
for 20 dollars?) 

:Crystal. .. by Waterford, 
Baccarat andsteuben. (How 
a b u t  some matching paper 
CUPS and napkins, picnic 
sty le?) 

*Maid service ... for 3-, 6-, 
9-month and one-year con- 
tracts. (I might offer to 
vacuum their apartment.) 

*China. ..traditional pat- 
terns with golden or silver 
trims. (Maybe paper plates 
to match the cups and nap- 
kins?) 

*Fumiture...in the con- 

temporary mood, country 
French and the hot new 
“salsa” designs. (Would a 
red lawn chair do?) 

*Diamonds. ..a1 ways a 
girl’s best friend. (She got 
an engagement ring, didn’t 
she?) 

*Appliances...fax ma- 
chines and car telephones, 
for BOTH the bride and 
groom. (My idea of wed- 
ding gift appliances runs 
more to toasters and can 
openers.) 

*Honeymoon Uips ...to 
France, Greece, Italy, spdn  
and Alaska. (Overnight 
lodging in the guest m m ? )  

I don’t mean to make light 
of these most wanted gifts. 
With so many couples wait- 
ing longer to get married, 
after being independent for 
several years, I realize they 
probably don’t need a third 
mixer, iron, or coffeepot. 

My daughter suggests that 
these couples combine their 
wedding reception with a 
garage sale. While getting 
rid of their duplicates, they 
could pick up some extra 
cash for their honeymoon. 

It’s worth considering. 
, But back to the press re- 

lease. It also offers some tips 
for the bride and groom. 

One suggestion is to 
schedule photographs BE- 
FORE the wedding, except 
for a few with the back- 
ground personalized in 
some way pertinent to the 
ceremony. I’ll go along with 
that. 
A wedding reception is the 

only swial event where in- 
vited guests have to wait, 
sometimes twiddling their 
thumbs for horn, for the 
hosts to show up. 

Maybe the guests could 
start opening the gifts and 
play with the fax machines 
and car phones till the 
couple arrives. \ 

Marriage Licenses 
Mark Hilligoss, Bates- 

ville, Ind., and Julie 
Beardslee, Caro. 

Charles Gray Jr. and 
Brenda Winkle, both of 
Caro. 

Richard Tuckey, Cass 
City, and Shirley modes, 
Caro. 

John Neuman, Pontiac, 
and Terri Houthoofd, 

Lewis Profit of Gladwin, 
formerly of Cass City, and 
his son, Kirk, of Ypsilanti 
played in the Sugar Springs 
Golf outing in Gladwin. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Kirn 
of Wappingers Falls, N.Y., 
came Thursday to visit his 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Stan- 
ley Kirn. They left for home 
Monday. 

Wednesday is... Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Lash visited her uncle and 
wife, Mr. and Mrs. Owen 
Zapfe, at Cheboygan Thurs- 
day and Friday. They also 
visited the Fred Zapfes and 
family. 

HILLS AND DALES 
872-21 21 

EVENT DATE TIME -~ PLACE 

Or. %irgis ~ u g .  1 9 a.m.-Noon Clinic 

Dr. Donahue Aug. 2 9 a.m.-Noon Clinic 

Dr. Isterabadi Aug. 2 9 - 11 a.m. Clinic 
A q . 3  1 -3p.m. Clinic Dr. Sy 

Dr. Jeung Aug. 4 9 a.m.-Noon Clinic 

Urologist 

- 
Thumb Area Home Care call 1(800)358-4749. 
Home Care Equipment call 1 -51 7-872-21 21 

Ext. 250 
Immediate Care Clinic usually available Fri., 6 

p.m. through Mon, 6 a.m. and Holidays. Cash 
basis only. 
‘ Myopulse and Accuscope available for aid in 
control of chronic pain, 

Physical, Respiratory, and Speech Therapy 
available. 

Mammography and Ultrasound done by trained 
Fladiological Technicians. 
Expectant Parent Classes start Aug. 3. Register 

now. 
Overeaters Anonymous meets every Monday 

Saturday dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Kim 
were Mr. and Mrs. John 
Kim of New York, Miss 
Marjorie Kirn of Flint, Miss 
Melinda Kirn of Holt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Paul Smith of De- 
ckerville and Mr. and Mrs. 
Mick Kirn and daughters of 
Cass City. Mrs. H len Lorentzen of 

Cass City d her daughter, 
Ann Mare  e Lorentzen of 

DOUBLE PRINT ‘ 

DOUBLE VALUE DAY! Friday for st.  Hills and Dales 
General Hospital 

~ 
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6uO Msm S t r o d  

N4tiaml Advorciring Repmmtrtiva 
John Iirks, pbli*ha. 

~ M ~ O d y b h W S p ~ ~ . k . D ~ 7  
win Av-4 b t  h h & ,  Miehi- 
am. 

Submiption Rica: To port offica in 
Turoda, Humn ud S a c  Camtiw - 
$10.00 a a 2  yun f a  S l&3 y u n  
far $25. $7 for air mollthr. ud 3 manthr 
fors4.00. 
In Michigan - $12.00 a ysu, 2 y u n  

s2200. 
In aher putr d rhe United S t r t a  - 

S15.Ooa yur,or2yeur S28.oO. Payable 
in advance. 

For infomarion mgircting newpaper 
r d v e e  md carnmcrcid ad job 
printing. tdoplmr. m2-2010. 

Every Wednesday receive a second 
set of prints absolutely FREE! 

”Check Our New Lower 
Photo Processing Prices.” 

offer p d  during Wednesday business hours 
* NEXT DAY or FREE VOID on Double Prints. 

’ George Nowakowski, De- 
Mrs. Stanley ford; 
Friday even- Stella Sierzputowski, 
Mr. and Mrs. S~over.  

I 

John Recor, Ubly. Amasa Gthes. 

I I 

“I hope we 

TO USERS OF VILLAOE WATER SERVICE 
During the flushing of thehydrants Wednesday andThursday, 

July 26-27, starting at 4 a.m. there may be an abundance of 
crystalized iron (rust) in the water supplied to your area of the 
vi I I ag e. Warm Only 

*With any %0° 

excluding 
wine& 

Expires July 30 

This condition does not render the water unfit or 
harmful for consumption; however, clothing washed in 
this water will probably become discolored. . 

/ I I 

High-mrage, h-cost  auto insurance is “no prablem” 
Check the colofof your water before placing your 

The village is not liable for damage caused by this 

clothing into it. 

condition. 

from ycur Auto-owners agent. 

a 
&-ormsrr -~ \ u b m c m -  

I 681 5 E: Cass City Road ’CassCity 872-4351 

Jim Ceranski ;IXe%rnW- Mark Wiese 
Richard Hampshire 

H arris H amps hi re Agency , I nc. 

Your cooperation will be greatly appreciated. 

VILLAGE OF CASS (ITY- 
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Creason benefit 
raises $4,OOO=plus % &.. 

By Jim Fltzgerald 

A strange thing happned 
last Friday when I was sup- 
posed to make a speech to 
mbre than 600 people at- 
tejding the St. Stephen’s 
alumni reunion at the Edison 
Inn in Port Huron. I didn’t 
sm* 

I was at the inn but not in 
the ballroom where I was 
being introduced by the 
master of ceremonies. I was 
a few walls away, on the 
outdoor terrace, sipping a 
cool drink with my wife and 
a few friends. I looked up 
once and saw Terrible Jean, 
a y  much older sister, rush- 
ing frantically through the 
hotel lobby, but I had no idea 
she was looking for her 
much younger brother, the 
missing speaker. 

‘The reason Terrible Jean 
is moving so fast is to pre- 
serve her reputation as the 
World’s No. 1 House 
Guest,” I explained to our 
able. “She is the only person 

who has traveled around the 
world twice without once 
meeting a mom clerk.” 
Old St. Stephen’s Catholic 

Scbool opened in 18% and 
closed as a 12-grade facility 
in 1964. The 3-day reunion 
was for all surviving former 
students. I w& assigned to 
speak for the graduates of 
3 e  1940s. Among other 
important duties, it was my 
responsibility to explain 
why Maurice Shamaly, 
C l k  of ’44, didn’t have 
curly hair until he was 60. 

SAME PLACE, 
ANOTHER TIME 

would have learned that the 
speeches were rescheduled 
ar the last minute by popular 
demand of several alumni 
who’d seen me sitting in the 
bar the night kfore but 
wanted further prmf that I 
was alive. 
Unfortunately, where I was 

supposed to be was where 
speeches were being made, 
and the only thing I dislike 
more than making speeches 
is listening to them. I figured 
600 people were lucky they 
didn’t have to listen to me, 
and it seemed reasonable to 
forsake the stuffy ballroom 
in favor of a seat on the ter- 
race, neaf the h u t i f u l  St. 
Clair River, safe from the 
fearful sound of a public 
address system. 

If I’d made a speech, it 
would have included a con- 
fession, appropriate for a 
gathering of Roman Catho- 
lics. When I was a tiny stu- 
dent, the St. Stephen’s cam- 
pus consisted of St. 
Stephen’s Church, St. 
Stephen’s School, and the 
Stucco Building, where 
lunches were e a ~ n  and 
bingo was played. In in- 
structing pupils where they 
should be when, nuns and 
priests referred to all 3 build- 
ings in an equally reverent 
tone. My confession is I 
didn’t know anything about 
construction materials and, 
until the sixth grade, I 
thought there was a ’St. 
stucco. 

Neighbors and friends of ailing Howard Muntz made short 
work of 53 acres of wheat last Tuesday. Five combines 
furnished by Dave Milligan, Pisarek Brothers and Laurie 
Farms and a host of volunteers with trucks harvested the 
field in 2 1/2 hours. 

Good turns like this are what the best in small town living 
is all about. 

were sick of &ing the& 
matronly figures in the fore- 
fmnt of group photographs. 

So help me, during one 
photo session Terrible Jean 
knelt beside a hotel bed as 
though praying for the return 
of her girlish figure, circa 
1890. In my usual, gracious 
brotherly manner, I handed 
her my car keys and said, if 
she wanted to look good in a 
picture taken in Port Huron, 
she should pose in another 
town. 

A speech a b u t  the early 
1940s surely would have 
included some reference to 
the job choice then awaiting 
most male graduates - 
Army or Navy in World War 
11. I would have recalled the 
unexpected middle-of-the- 
day instruction from the 
pastor, Father E. J. 
McCormick, for all students 
to gather immediately in the 
church. It was there he an- 
nounced that Bill McGill, a 
super athlete and one of St. 
Stephen * s best-known 
graduates, had been killed in 
action in Italy. 

I would have mentioned 
the names of many, many 
other St. Stephen’s students 
who should have lived long 
enough to make the 1989 
reunion but didn’t. 

If I’d made a speech, I 
would have told everyone 
they were lacky to be there, 

, even if the speech was lousy. 

raised approxi ma tel y 
$4,OOO and donations are 
still coming in, according to 
event co-coordinator Marie 
Osen toski. 

The benefit was Saturday 
at the Evergreen Township 
School. Creason developed 
cancer in his kidneys about 3 
years ago and since that time 
it has spread into his tail 
bone, shoulder and lungs. 

Osentoski explained that 
overall the benefit went 
well. A raffle, auction, bake 
sale and dinner were all held 
in Creason’s honor. “The 
raffle and the auction were 
temfic. The bake sale went 
over good too.” 

Osentoski pointed out that 
they sold some 1,400 tickets 
for the raffle. However, 
the dinner did slightly less 
than what was expected. 
Some 300 people attended 
the dinner and Osentoski 
thought there were going to 
be more. But the money 
received in the other events 
made up for the dinner, she 
explained. 

Osentoski added that they 
haven’t reached a concrete 
total yet because donations 
are still arriving. But so far 
Osentoski has been satisfied 
with the amount of money 
raised. 

son was able to attend. In 
weeks prior to the benefit If like to 
Creason wasn’t sure if he donate to Cmon7  
would be feeling up to it. 
But friends and family, who Creason Benefit, 
came from all Over the 
Thumb, were delighted to 

can send it to the 

4085 Germania Rd., Snover 
48472. 

Vehicle hits post 
office, 2 

++++++++++ 

It was new to me, but everybody in Ann Arbor must know 
about Zingerman’s. You certainly wouldn’t go to thedeli by 
accident.It7stuckedawayonasidestre&,422 Detroit Street, 
at the comer of Kingsley. 

It was evidently a neighborhood grocery store at one time. 
Its fame spread and it took over an adjacent house for seating. 
Even so, the place was jammed, 

I had the traditional corned beef on rye. Delicious. 
injured 
tained extensive damage 
and the post office, an unde- 
termined amount of dam- 
age. 

Nye, who was cited for 
failing to stop in assured 
clear distance ahead, told 
police the accelerator on the 
vehicle stuck. 

Defective vehicle equip- 
ment led to the arrest of 2 
motorists over the weekend. 

Police arrested James R. 
Kritzman, 42, 6944 N. 
Cemetery Rd., Cass City, 
Saturday on suspicion of 
operating a motor vehicle 
while under the influence of 
liquor. 

Kritzman was stopped on 
Leach Street north of 
Houghton Street at about 
220 a.m., according to po- 
lice, who reported his ve- 
hicle had no right rear brake 
light. 
Later the same day, Hubert 

W. Sherrod, 26, of East 
Detroit, was taken into cus- 
tody on a bench warrant out 

ren, for failure to appear. 
Police stopped Sherrod on 

Maple Street near M Street 
at about 6:30 p.m. because 
the left rear light lens on his 
vehicle was broken, reports 
State. 

of 37th District Coutz, War- 

Hrycko on 

Two Cass City men sought 
their own treatment for 
minor injuries last Wednes- 
day after the vehicle they 
were riding in left Church 
Street and struck the Cass 
City Post Office building. 

Cass City p o k e  stated 
Gary R, Nye, 20, 4640 
Elmwood kd., was driving 
west on Church Street east of 
Sherman Street at about 9 
p.m. when he lost control 
and crossed the center line, 
jumped the south curb and 
hit the building. 
Nye wasn’t wearing a seat 

belt at the time of the crash, 
but a passenger in his ve- 
hicle, Allen W. Home, 23, 
4118 S. Seeger St., was, 
according to reports, which 
indicate the vehicle sus- 

++++++++++ 
Heard from our unofficial correspondent in Germany 

again. Dave Decker enclosed a reprint of an article in 
Ward’ s Automotive Magazine saying that Mercedes-Benz 
AG is limiting its European cars to 155 miles per hour. 

The governors will not be on cars shipped to North 
America because of the speed limits already in effect in the 
USA. 

Regular readers may’ ma l l  that Decker reported earlier 
that speeds of over 100 miles per hour were comparatively 
safe because of the way roads were built. 

++++++++++ 
Whew! 
Cindy Calka and her husband, George Duba, were visiting 

last weekend and came back to her old home town via the 
airlines. 

They made it okay in the frrst of 2 DC-10 planes that left 
a few minutes apart. However, their luggage didn’t get on 
with them. It was dispatched on the second flight. 
The luggage never arrived. It was on the ill-fated plane that 

crashed when an engine exploded. 
I repeat, whew! 

+++++++++“I. 

T h e  

H aire 

Net 

Cara Prieskorn and Michael Klein made sure that they 
were not going to be harassed by well-wishers following 
their marriage and reception Saturday afternoon. 
The newlyweds took off in a hot air balloon for a definitel! 

undisclosed location. 
Absentee ballots 
Absentee ballots for the 

Aug. 8 special school elec- 
tion in the Cass City School 
District are available at the 
superintendent’s office, 
4868 N. Seeger St., during 
regular office hours (8 a.m. 
to 4:30 p.m.). 
The last day to obtain ab- 

sentee voter applications is 
Aug.5 from 9 a.m. to 2 p.m. 

SEEKING SHELTER 
FROM A FLASH 

I’m softy I failed. The 
xplanation is that the dec- 

ade speeches were origi- 
nally scheduled for Thurs- 
day evening but were post- 
poned and later canceled, 
because other program 
events ran overtime. If I’d 
been where I was supposed 
to be early Friday evening, X 

The Weather My speech also would have 
touched on the weird behav- 
ior of many women at reun- 
ions. Because it was unusual 
for my 4 sisters and me to be 
at the Same place at the Same 
time, countless family snap- 
shots were taken. Each time 
a camera was pointed, the 4 

High Low Precip. 
Tuesday ..................................... 86 ..... 64 ,.,.,,trace.. 
Wednesday ............................ .:. . 76 ..... 65 ....... 14” .. 
Thursday ................................... 68 ..... 70 ..... .lo‘‘ .. 

Monday .................................... 89 .... .68 ..... . o  

Friday ....................................... 75 ..... 60 ..... 0 
Satiirday ..................................... 84 ..... 60 ...... 0 
Sunday..’..,; ..... :...... ;;;.; ............... 88 ..... 62 ...... 0 

... 

... 

... ... 
(Recorded at Cass City wastewater treatment plant.) 

that there are no guarantees. 
No one can say to a grower 
that if you shell out the $1 
million there will be a corre- 
sponding increase in sales 
and eventually a more stable 
market for beans. 

But look at the results the 
pop companies have 
achieved. The ad men have 
taken a little flavored water 
and turned it into something 
that equates with good times 
and sexual achievement. 

Milk, which really has 
everything going for it, has 
been replaced by pop. How- 
ever the dairy industry 
seems to be waking up at last 
and its commercials appear 
to be getting across the 
message that milk is more 
than just good for you, 

A legitimate criticism of 
the new bean program is that 
it is not big enough. It 
shouldn’t be a program of 
Michigan bean growers, but 
one for bean growers every- 
where. 

That’s not even on the 
horizon and is a longer shot 
than a quarter a bag deduc- 
tion approval. It ranks right 
up there with the chances of 
a group of farmers agreeing 
on anything except that 
commodity prices are too 
low and costs too high. 

Michigan bean farmers 
will be asked to increase a 
fee for advertising from 5 
cents to 25 cents per bag in a 
vote scheduled later this 
year. 
My guess is that the pro- 

posal will fail. That’s 
strictly a guess based on no 
concrete information at all. 

It’s just based on what I 
call the farmer mentality. 
Farmers are hard- headed 
cost-wise businessmen. 
When $1 is spent on fertil- 
izer, for instance, the 
grower has to see more than 
a buck coming back. The 
cost-benefit ratio is the key. 

Sometimes it’s a little 
difficult to measure poten- 
tial benefit given the vaga- 
ries of prices received and 
weather. But compared with 
measuring the results ob- 
tained by advertising it’s a 
piece of cake. 

You could advertise 
beans for a year and see no 
apprwiable results and then 
suddenly find bean sales 
taking off. It takes time to 
establish anew awareness of 
prpduct worth in the minds 
of consumers. Instead of 
looking at beans as a tasty, 
nutritious food high in 
health benefits, the average 
consumer sees beans as 
“musical fruit.” 

It’s estimated that a 25- 
ccnt check-off would raise 
about $1 million which is a 
lot of money. Except in the 
promotion market where it 
is not that much at all. 

Ask the next bean grower 
you meet about contributing 
part of net income received 
from beans and they almost 
invariably tell you it’s an- 
other expense. Which it is, 
of course. But it also is an 
investment as important as 
the purchase of feed and 
fertilizer. An illustration: 
Stroh Brewing Co. recently 
went to court to try to gain 
access to sports’ show TV 
aduertising it claimed was 
monopolized by competing 
beer companies. 

Before coming to Cass 
City I worked on a paper and 
called on a couple of major 
chains and sat in on some 
discussions concerning 
products. When an item was 
to be added to stock one of 
the primary concerns was 
always how it could be ad- 
vertised and sold. It was as 
important as the style and 
the price. 

An additional stumbling 
block to farmers taxing 
themselves for promotion is 

dean’s list 
NOTICE More than 220 students, 

including a Gagetown resi- 
dent, have been named to the 
dean’s list at Kalamazoo 
College for the last aca- 
demic quarter. 

Raymond A. Hiycko, son 
of Thomas J. Hrycko and 
Carol M. Hrycko, both of 
Gagetown, is among the 
students who earned at least 
a 3.5 grade point average to 
receive the honor; 

I W e  De 
Dishes 

Let Us Do Yours 

* The Cass City Village Council will be holding a Special 
‘Meeting on Thursday, July 27, 1989 at 7:OO p.m. at the 
‘Municipal Building, 6737 Church Street, Cass City, Michigan, 
i o  review and hear public comments on a grant application to 
the . .  

Michigan Department of Natural Resources for the devel- 
lopment of a 1.6 mile walking trail and the installation of a pool 

1 slide at the Helen Stevens Memorial Pool, and any other 

‘I I Check Our In-Store Specials 

I RICK’S EARTH STATION 
SATELLITE SALES 6 SERVICE 

1443 E. Caro Rd., Car0 Tel, 51 7-673-4783 I I 
business f that may comebefore the council. 
; All interested citizens will have the opportunity to give 
$mitten and oral comment. Senior citizens are encouraged to 
ittend and comment. Handicapped persons needing assis- 
pnce should contact the government office before the meeting. 

Joyce A. LaRoche 
Village Clerk 

b 

The best investment you 
can make in your future 

is an education at 
Great Lakes Jr. College! 

Great Lakes Jr. College offers associate degrees 
and certificate programs in: 

For Health 
Insurance 

That’s A Cut 
Above The Rest Wtth a Chemical Bank 

Bf- Weekly Mortgage. .. 

- - - - - 
SAVE INTEREST, 

NOW ACCOUNT, 
= - - - - - - - - -. - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - 
7 - - - 

With a Bl-Wcckly I’nortgiqC from Chemlcal 
Bank. you make 26 smdlcr payments each year 
instead of 12 larger payments. As a result. you 
pay olTyout loan much hsttcr and a v c  a great 
deal of Interesl. In addllbn, you get P no scrvice 
charge Chcmlcal Bank NOW Account. To find 
WI morc. talk to a Chemlcai) Bank mortgagc 

Consider the 24 Karat Major 
Medical Plan from Time b u r -  

competition because more value 
has been built into ever). benefit 
you receive. Values like: 

Freedom to c-hoose your 
doctor and hospital 

I 15% non-smdrefs discount 
W PreSCnpt.ion drugs, ambulance 

&me. Time‘s plan outshines the 

and x-fay, coverage 
100% coverage for pre- 
admission testing, second 
surgical opinions, home 
health care and mort. 

In addition, because the 24 Kanl 
is a hospital pre-certification plrn 
it uses a system of managed healtt 
care to ensure that every hospita 
treatment and service you receivt 
is medically appropriate for you 
For more information contab: 

Harris & Company 
Newell E. Harris 

517-872-2688 
6815 E. Cass City Rd. 

P.O. Box 38 
Cass City 

mm 
TIME INSURASCE COMPANY 

ElectronidComputer 

Secretarial \ 
- -8 Repair Tech. 

We understand financial aid and how important it 
can be to your plans to attend college. We can help! 

Of BUSINESS 

Stop b y  our admissions office at 1231 Cleaver Rd., 
just North of M-81, Car0 or call 673-5857 

or visit our New Bad Axe Catripus 
315 Witelam Ph. 269-9288 

Great Lakes Jr. College enrolls students without regard to age, sex or race. 
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seniors 
in meet Your neighbor says Gagetown Area News Gen Kehoe 

Phone 665-2221 
Members of the Owen- 

Gage Senior Citizens group 
voted Thursday ‘to increase 
the amount they pay for use 
of the parish hall at St. 
Agatha’s Catholic Church in 
Gage town. 

U.S. needs the 
of Riverview was the eldest 
present and Marie (McIn- 
tyre) Kroha and family and 
Sharon (McIntyre) Morri- 
son and family, who came 
from California, travelled 
the furthest. 

Roy Livingston, son of 
Everett and Faith (McIn- 
tyre) Livingston, enter- 
tained with bagpipe music 
throughout the day, while 
Maureen Kroha danced the 
Highland Fling and the 
Hornpiper. A potluck din- 
ner was served. 

In addition to those at- 
tending the wedding of 
Suzanne Generous and 
Marty Harris reported last 
week, Sherry and Wayne 
Dillon of.Cass City also at- 
tended, 

Mrs. Grady Newberry 
had as guests last week, 2 
of her sisters, Clara Robin- 
son of Auxier, Ky., and 
Loretta Kraft of Casey, Ill., 
and a niece. Grady New- 
berry spent the weekend. 

****** 

Church in Herron. The Rev. 
James Kendziorski of- 
ficiated and burial was in 
Holy Cross Cemetery in 
Alpena. Jackie and Bill 
Goodell attended the fun- 
eral. 

The people of the 
Gagetown and Owendale 
United Methodist Churches 
celebrated the birthday of 
the pastor, Rev. Mary Neal, 
at their picnic last Wednes- 
day. 

Callers last week at the 
home of. Margaret and 
Elger Generous were Ber- 
nard Sullivan of Bad Axe 
and Ed Sullivan of Caro. 

The funeral of Lawrence 
Langlois took place Wed- 
nesday at St. Agatha 
Church. Celebrants were 
Father Julius Spleet and 
Father Stanley Surman. 
Pallbearers were nephews 
of Mr. and Mrs. Langlois. 
Organist was Wally Ten- 

busch of Rapson, Reader cently, Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
was Ted Balzar and Pisarek Sf. visited Mrs. 
Eucharist ministers were Walter Zuraw. 
Richard Langlois and Mari- Mrs. Norman Pine of 
lyn Balzar. Among those at- Port Charlotte, Fla., spent 
tending were Rose and Ar- * a week visiting friends and 
thur Rocheleau of Pontiac, relatives in the area. She 
Paul Langlois of Caro, Mrs. spent some time with 
Norman David of Harbor Mamie Russell and they 
Beach and Mr. and Mrs. were dinner guests of Ila 
John Lagina of Port Huron. and Leo Seurynck. Other 

Nine persons attended guests were Elva Pitcher 
the monthly group break- and Dee Comment of Cass 
fast at Sherwood-on-the- City, Agatha LaFave and 
Hill Thursday. Evangeline Marietta. 

Velma Helwig and Gen Gary and Mary Carolan 
Kehoe spent Thursday af- of Marlette visited Mrs. Ar- 0 

ternoon with their aunt, thur Carolan Saturday 
Mrs. Carl Sieland, of Car0 evening and attended a 
in celebration of her birth- Cass City High School class 
day. reunion at Rolling Hills 

Sister Nancy Ayotte and Golf Course. 
Yvette and Tammy Hurd Rose Ann Krause of St. 
attended a performance of Petersburg, Fla., Dee Com- 
“Godspell” at the Fischer ment of Cass City and Dick 
Hall in Frankenmuth and Edna Burdon had lunch 
Thrsday evening. Sunday at Sherwood-on- 
While in Bay City re- the-Hill. 

Saturday, July 15, 
Madeline Sontag attended 
a baby shower in honor of 
her granddaughter, Mrs. 
Mark (Jean Shope) Hutch- 
inson of Decatur, Ill. The 
party was held in the Owen- 
dale School cafeteria and 
was hosted by Mrs. John 
S h o p  of Owendale and 
Mrs. Elmer Shop  of 
Saginaw. About 20 guests 
attended. 

Becky Berry of Saginaw 
is spending the summer 
with her grandmother, 
Johanna Miklovich. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Raatz 
of Third St. have enjoyed a 
few trips this summer. 
Early in me summer they 
visited a former CCC camp 
in the Upper Peninsula, 
now a Gun Club. Mr. Raatz 
worked in CCC camps dur- 
ing the 30s. En route home 
they visited a niece in 
Niagra, Wis. In  June they 
attended a reunion of the 
Big Red I Army unit, held 
at  the Holiday Inn, Toledo, 
Ohio. The Raatzes returned 
home last week after visit- 
ing Fort Benning, Ga., 
where the 18th Infantry Re- 
giment was reactivated 
and Raatz received honors 
for his service in many 
campaigns in World War 
11. They enjoyed a tour of 
the fort with a soldier es- 
cort + 

stealth bomber 
The group voted to in- 

crease the summer rent, to 
equal that paid in the winter, 
during a potluck dinner/ 
meeting held at S t. Agatha’s 
and attended by 40 mem- 
bers. Also attending was 
Becky Berry, granddaugh- 
ter of Johanna Miklovich. 

Last week the United States’ Stealth, B-2 bomber made its 
first test flight some 18 months behind schedule. 

The airplane is special 
in its ability to go 
through enemy radar 
without being detected 
due to its radar absorbent 
coating. When in the sky 
the planes’ streamlined 
structure makes it diffi- 
cult to spat. 

Although it may be 
impressive, several 
members in the Senate 
are not so impressed with 
the plane’s sticker price 
of approximately $500 
million for just one B-2. 
The pentagon’s original plan was to build over 130 of these 
planes. 
Your neighbor, retired mechanic and carpenter Oscar 

Seeley, remarked that the plane is necessary for the U.S. 
“They’re just trying to get ahead of the other countries. If 
there was a war and you had planes like that and they didn’t, 
it would probably scare other countries out,’’ of the war. 
Seeley, a Cass City resident, added the appearance of the 

plane really impressed him. “I’ve seen pictures of that thing 
and it’s auitea bird. When it’s up in the sky you can’t see it.” 

In other business during the 
meeting, the group decided 
to increase door money by 
50 cents beginning next 
month. 

Euchre winners were 
Amasa Anthes, Mary Tho- 
mas and Leanora Shantz 
(high), and Andy Szidik and 
Mary Kuehne (low). The 
traveling prize was won by 
Amasa Anthes. 

Members of the August 
committee are Les and Mil- 
lie Munro, Margaret Beck- 
ett, Gerry Carolan and Sybil 
Miller. 

. 
I 

Watzz.. 
wade .  

KING REUNION 

All 11 children of the late 
Gladys and Bill King and 
their families gathered last 
Sunday for a reunion at the 
home of Eva (King) Goslirl 
in Unionville. 

The 85 gathered came 
from Santa Clara, Calif., 
Plymouth, Southf ield, 
Birch Run, Pigeon, Elkton, 
Sebewaing, Ceresco, Cass 
City, Owendale and 
Gagetown. 

They enjoyed a potluck 
dinner, games with prizes 
awarded and an afternoon 
of visiting . 

Eldest male was Elery 
Sontag and eldest female 
was Gertrude (King) Cle- 
ment. 

Among the 11 King 
brothers and sisters are 2 
sets of twins, Ed King and 
Eva G o s h  and Ron and 
Don King. Martin Barth- 
olomy of North Branch, a 
former neighbor of the fam- 
ily, visited. 

Although Seeley, who has 5 children, 13 kandchildren and 
one great-grandchild, does like the airplane, he said it 
probably isn’t the end of building expensive weapons. Other 
countries, “will start trying to build something to catch UP.” 
Seeley explained that the price of the plane is just a part of 

inflation. “It’s like everything else. It sounds like a lot of 
money. But it costs a lot of money today,” for everything. 

sr. Citizens Menu 

Senior citizens are aked to 
make reserva~ons on the 
day of the meal bemeen 
a.m.-9 n.m. by callingAnn 
Stepku 872-5337. 

Give Hope to a MONDAY, JULY 31 S&E FAMILY REUNION 

More than 150 peisons at- 
tended the Cameron-McIn- 
tyre reunion held last Sun- 
day at St. Columbkille 
Parish Hall, Sheridan Corn- 
ers. Chairpersons for the 
event were John and Mar- 
jorie O’Henley and Charles 
McIntyre was master of 
ceremonies. 

Members gathered are 
the descendants of 
Matthew McIntyre and 
Flora (Cameron) McIntyre 
with roots in southwest 
Scotland. 

Ron McGinnis of 
Plymouth presented a his- 
tory of the people of that 
area and Nancy McIntyre 
of Rochester Hills distri- 
buted brochures relating to 
Scottish immigrants and 
descendants. 

Flora (Ross) McKay, 92, 

Zinc 
(Gluconati) 

60 mg 

- Vitamin Turkey Ala King 
Btoccoli 
Salad Bar 

Variety Bread 

Needy Teen 
Become a Foster Parent 

Call Dale Cheesecake 

$289 Coffee, tea and milk pro- 
vided with each meal. 

(Menu subject to change). 
at 517-635-7591 

100 TABLETS ’ 100TABLETS 

Calcium & Timed Release 
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ - - - -  - - -  

1 7 1  Want Help Finding What You Want? 
Try The Want-Ads Today! [ 151 CASS CITY CHRONICLE 

****** 
Dr. and Mrs. Dale Karr 

of Boston and son Jesse are 
spending 2 weeks with the 
doctor’s parents, Marge 
and Leonard Karr. The pa- 
rents of Mrs. Dale Karr, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Kruez of 
Boston, spent last week at 
Bella Vista in Caseville and 
visited the Karrs often. Dr. 
Kurt and Cyd Karr of Ann 
Arbor were overnight 
guests Tuesday. 

After attending the 
Cameron-McIntyre reun- 
ion Sunday, Pat Tynan, 
Chris McIntyre and Flor- 
ence Kellogg, all of Grand 
Ledge, visited the Harry 
Kehoes. 

C&hy DeShano of Ves- 
taburg was named to the 
Academic All-State 
Softball Team for 1989. Sbe 
is the daughter of Linda and 
Ray DeShano and grand- 
daughter of the Les Mun- 
ros . 

Rose Ann Krauss of St. 
Petersburg, Fla., is visiting 
her sister, Dee Comment, 
and other relatives and 
friends. 

Sunday, July 16, Mr. and 
Mrs. Leroy Stapleton at- 
tended a wake service at 
the Hunter Funeral Home 
in Alpena for their aunt, 
Mrs. Mary Leipler. Mon- 
day, they attended the fun- 
eral at St. Rose Catholic 

c Cass City, Michigan 

Vitamin C 
1000 mg with 
Rose Hips T.R. 

Thir form i i  for UI. by National Bank# only. It rhould b@ u n d  for 
publication purpowr only. mnd rhould not b. raiurnrd lo the FDIC. L-Tryptophane 

500 mg 

~ $599 
, d (I*( :,;prcrplr’* -1 

I 

Comptroller of the Currency 
Administrator of National Banks 

$349 OF CONDITION 
domeslic subsidiaries of the 

~ 30TABLETS 60 TABLETS I Thumb National Bank 6 Trust Co. of Pigeon 
01 &M 0, 

in the state of !ichigan , at the close of business on June 30 I , 1989. 
publi*ed In response to Call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12. United States Code. Section 161 
Charter Number 1 5 8 1 7 Comptroller of the Currency Seventh  District 1 

Statement of Resources and Liabilities 

$499 
Century-Vite’” Multi Vitamin . . . . . . .  . io0 + 30 TABLETS S49f 

$33: 
$59‘ 
$42‘ 
$1 91 
$22! 

Oyster Shell Calcium 
500 mg wNitamin D .................... .lo0 + 30 TABLETS 

Vitamin E 400 I.U. (d,l-Alpha) . . . . . . . . . . . . .  100 SOFTGELS 

Vitamin E io00 I.U. (d,I-Alpha) . . . . . . . . . . . .  -60 SOFTGELS 

Kelp, Lecithin & Vitamin B-6. . . . . . . . . .  . loo TABLETS 

Magnesium (Oxide) 250 mg . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . loo TABLETS 

Vitamin A & D . .  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . io0 SOFTGELS 

Thousands ,of dollars - 
Cash and balances due from depository instilulions 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . . . .  

Noninterest-bearing balances and currency and coin 
Interest-bearing balances 

Securities 
Federal funds sold 
Securities purchased under agreements to resell 
Loans and lease financing receivables 

Loans and leases, net of unearned income 
LESS Allowance for loan and lease losses 
LESS Allocated transfer risk reserve 
Loans and ledses net of unearned income. allowance, and reserve 

Assets held in trading accounts 
Remises and fixed assets (including capitalized leases) 
Olher real estate owned 
Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies 
Customers’ liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding 
Intangible assets 
Other assets 
Total assets 
Losses deferred pursuant lo  12 U S C 182%) 
Total assets and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U S C 18230) 
U 

E 
9 ........ 

$43! 
$55! 

Beta-Caroteneis mg . . . . . . . . .  , . . . . .  , , . . loo SOFTGELS 

Super B-Complex . . . . . . . . .  * . . . . .  * . . .  * . .  . io0 TABLETS 

Vitamin C 500 ma . .  , . . . . .  * .  . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  io0 TABLETS $1 7! 
Fennell retires 

- 
S49! Nutra A Facial Skin Cceam . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . 2  02. 

Sunnv Maid@ Child. Chew. Multi.. . . . . . .  io0 TABLETS S29! 
CepOSltS 

In domestic onices r Interest-beariris 
Nonmterest-bearing 

e 8 h , 4 3 k  I Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Gaeth attended the retire- 
ment party for her former 
boss and superintendent, 
Allen C. Fennell, at Gladwin 
Community Schools Sun- 
day afternoon. 

I $314 Sunny Maid@ Child. Chew. Multi wllron 100 TABLETS 

WatzzB8Wade~ 
federal funds purchased 
S@CuritieS sold under agreements to repurchase 
Demand notes issued to the U S Treasuv 
Other borrowed money 1 

Mortgage indebtedness and obligations under capitalized leases 
Banks liability on acceptances executed and outstanding 
Notes and debentures subordinated to deposits 
Other Iiabllities 
Total liabilities 
Limited-life preferred stock 

THE VlTAMIG EXPERTS” 
Fennell was superinten- 

dent at Owen-Gage from 
1966-1972, then leaving for 
Gladwin, where he has been 
for the past 17 years. Ele- 
mentary Principal and Mrs. 
William Britt, Cass City, , 
and former residents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Edward Howard of 
Howell, also attended the 
ceremony. 

_. 
1 

k r p e t u a l  preferred stmk 
C o m m n  stock 
Surplus 
Undivided profits and capital reserves 
LESS Net unrealized loss on marketable equity SeCufitieS 
Total equity capital . 
Losses deferred pursuant to 12 U S C 182N) 
Total equity capital and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U S C 182%) 
Total liabilities. limited life preferred stock, equity capilal. and losses 

deferred pursuant lo 12 U s C 182%) . . 
I 

1 Here 
I DISCOUNTS Plans 
1 -  I 

1 I 5 w 

9 3  3 
Fennell was surprised with 

the honor of being the first 
inductee of the Allen C. 
Fennell Academic Hall of 
Fame. Research is being 
done to find past academic 
honor students who will also 
qualify to be inducted into 
this hall of fame which is in 
the new high school build- 
ing, and has been in opera- 
tion for one year during 
Fennell’s tenure. 

I, John H. S c h a e f e r  We, the un#rstgned directors attest to the correctness 01 
this statement of resources and liabilities We declare that it 

b s  been examined by US and to the best ot our knowledge 

kvlr . 
V i c e  P r e s i d e n t  r and belief has &en wepared In conlormance with the 14.r - - . .  

I InsIructions and is true.and correct 
ot the above.named bank do hereby declare that this Report 
of Condition IS true and coWct to the best 01 my knowledge 
and belief 

Directors 

L 

Jury 1 3 ,  1989 
[kit 
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County I fair like a big reunion, 
say Carol-and Kathv Wildman 

by Matt Rach 
Staff Writer 

9 years and this year she is a 
candidate for the 4-H 
Queen. If she wins she will 
be in various parades and 
community activities next 
Year* 
Although Carol and Kathy 

said the fair can be a lot 
work, it still brings many 
good times. “It’s work get- 
ting ready for the fair. But 
when you’re at the fair it’s 
fun.” 

has, 8 “Been helping ,(my 
mother) in the fair since I’ve 
been able to walk.” 

Carol, who is an Owen- 
Gage elementary teacher, 
explained that she is still 
friends with people she met 
at the county fair over 30 
years ago. “My favorite 
thing about the fair is all the 
people you get to see. It 
makes good friendships. It’s 
like a great big reunion 
that’s a week long,” Carol 
said. 

Carol’s mother, Sally 
Campbell, was very active 
in the fair and Carol consid- 
ers their family 3 generation 
4-H’ers. 

In addition, Carol’s hus- 
band, Don Wildman, and 
older daughter, Kim 
Wildman, were active in the 
fair during previous years. 

The Wildmans have al- 
ways participated in the fair 
through 4-H, which is pri- 
marily for young adults ages 
8- 19. Carol is the 4-H leader 
in the area and superinten- 
dent of the fair’s arts and 
crafts show. 

Kathy has been in 4-H and 
active in the fair for the past 

enough time for it. “I’m so 
busy helping my 4-H’ers. 
The timing of their show and 
the timing of ours is about 
the same.” 
Basically Card is involved 

in 4-H for the young adults 
and the opportunity to see 
them happy. “I guess I do it 
for the kids. I did it before 
my kids were even old 
enough. You get a self satis- 
fying feeling when you see 
the kids happy.” 
Overall, Carol pointed out 

that the 4-H organization in 
theareaseemstobegrowing 
but in other plaps it’s de- 
clining. “I think we’re get- 
ting more kids. In this area 
it’s on the rise but in the city 
it’s going down. In Detroit I 
think it’s almost non-exis- 

tent.” 
Although there are more 4- 

H’ers In the area, Carol 
added the number of crafts 
entered in the fair seems to 
have gone down, She ex- 
plained that the kids have to 
finance their own projects : 
and they can’t afford as 
many projects as they used . 
to. “They’re not showing as . 
many projects because of 3 

the tighter economy.” 
Carol added she feels a - 

responsibility to 4-H and 
that she’ll probably stay in it + 

even after Kathy is too old to : 
participate. “I’ve said when % 

Kathy is done, I’m done. 
teacher But I won’t. in me, Maybe but you it’s just the 

don’t want to let the kids 
down.” 

, 

here are activi- 
ties for everyone 
at the Tuscola 
County Fair. 

Events ranging, from a 
demolition derby to the best 
quilt contest will delight 
people with all sorts of 
tastes. 
But for Cass City residents 

Carol Wildmp and her 15- 
year-old daughter Kathy 
Wildman, the fair is more 
than a bunch of activities. 

It’s a chance to develop 
friendships that last forever. 
“It’s a way of meeting new 

people, getting new experi- 
enceand having fun,” Kathy 
explained. 3 

Carol and Kathy have par- 
ticipated in the fair ever 
since they can remember. 
“For most of my life I’ve 
been going to the fair,” 
Carol commented, adding 
her father, Bun Campbell, 
started a Fairgrove 4-H or- 
ganization in 1924 and her 
family used to stay the entire 
week and show animals at 
the fair. 
Kathy pointed out that she 

T 

ARTS AND CRAFTS 

In addition, there are sev- 
eral fair activities the 
Wildmans could get in- 
volved with, but they have 
seemed to develop their own 
niche in the arts and crafts 
show. “I learned, through 4- 
H, a lot of skills,” such 
knitting and sewing, Carol 
commented, adding she still 
uses those skills. 
Kathy has entered arts and 

crafts items using methods 
such as ceramics, masonry, 
painting and plaster. In 
addition she partakes in 
cooking, flower arranging 
and various educational dis- 
plays all for the fair. 

Some of the items Kathy 
entered, such as a plaster 
sculpture of some kittens, 
won her the right to go to the 
fair in Saginaw. Once a year 
4-H’ers from all over mid- 
Michigan bring their best 
stuff to the Saginaw fair. 
Carol commented that it is 
an honor if one of your proj- 
ects is picked to go to Sagi- 
naw. 

Carol added that the arts 
and crafts portion of the fair 
helps the young adults out in 
many ways. “Not only do 
they learn about arts and 
crafts, they learn sportsman- 
ship. They learn to take 
defeat with a smile.” 

Everyone who enters a 
project gets a ribbon and 
receives premiums in differ- 
ent amounts of money. 
However, the money 
doesn’t cause fierce compe- 
tition among the 4-H’ers. 
“It’s more project versus 
project than person versus 
person,” Kathy remarked. 

CAROL WILDMAN and her daughter, Kathy Wildman, sit 
next to some of the arts and crafts that Kathy will enter in the 

108th annual 

Fair set July 30-Aug. 5 
f 

twist. “We’re having a fig- 
ure 8 demolition derby,” 
Aug, 2 at 7:30 p.m.. Fitzger- 
ald explained that the cars 
will race around in a figure 8 
track and smash into each 
other at the cross. 

One element committee 
‘members have worked hard 
at keeping is the money or 
premiums given to the top 3 
finishers in eachevent. Fitz- 
geraldpointedout that this is 
difficult to do because each 
year the state has reduced 
theamount of money given 
to county fairs. This money 
was previously used for the 
premiums. 

“Every year the state has 
cut back. But we’ve never 
cut the premiums. Some 
fairs have eliminated premi- 
ums completely,” he re- 
marked, adding that they 
keep families coming to the 
fair by not cutting the premi- 
ums. To keep the premiums 
the committee has, “cut 
down on improvements at 
the fairground.” 

Fitzgerald explained that 
neither he nor the committee 
is mad at the state for cutting 
its funds. “Everybody fights 
the battle of money.” 
However, the money given 

to winners of the different 
events does not cause fierce 
competition. “There’s com- 
petition, but it’s not cut- 
throat competition. It’s 
friendly competition in 
which thekidswill helpeach 
other to do better. Some- 
times peers are very impor- 
tant in learning.” 

Despite the state cuts, the 
Tuscola fair has still man- 
aged to stay ahead. “Last 
year when we got done with 
,the expenses of the fair we 
had $5,000 left over,” he 
said. 
But this profit was quickly 

consumed by the $5,000 
debt to help pay for the 
grandstand, which was re- 
constructed after a fire a few 
years ago. 

1* YOUTHCORPS 

built so people would have 
more places to get out of the 
sun and rest. “It wasn’t 
designed specifically for 
people to eat in, although 
they can eat there.” 

Fitzgerald has always 
loved animals and someone 
shouldn’t be too surprised 
that his favorite part of the 
fair is the animal shows. 
“There’s something about a 
little kid showing a big cow 
or big horse. I just enjoy 
seeing in his or her face how 
hard they’ve worked in tak- 
ing care of the animal.” 

KATHY WILDMAN, 15, won the 
privilege to enter these cats, made out : 
of plaster, in the Saginaw fair. Although the state cut its 

funds, it has made up for it in 
another area. For the past 5 
years the state has sent 5 to 7 
young adults and one advi- 
‘sor to help groom the fair- 
grounds. 
“They are from the Michi- 

ganYouthCorpsandthey’re 
paid by the state of Michi- 
gan. They do everything 
from digging post holes to 
cleaning out the merchants 
building. I think we’ve 
painted everything under 
the sun,” Fitzgerald ex- 
plained, laughing, “Until 
we got thesc kids it was re- 
ally a struggle to get things 
done.” 

To help save money, the 
committee takes out events 
that seem to attract little 
interest. One thing that has 
been eliminated in this 
year’s fair is a professional 
entertainment group. ‘This 
year we’ll just have an ama- 
teur group.” Fitzgerald 
pointed out the professional 
groups didn’t seem to draw 
in the crowds. 

Over the years Fitzgerald 
noticed the fair becoming 
more advanced technically. 
“So many things are mecha- 
nized now, from feeding the 
cow and milking the cow to 
hauling horse manure but of 
the barn.” 
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** Air Conditioned** 
ENDS THURSDAY 8:OO Only 

Thursday is “Bargain Nite” 

Program to 
focus on 

ENJOYS THE TALENT 
SHOW Extension 

FR~DAY - SATURDAY 0 SUNDAY ONLY 

NO RULES NO RING*-W REF 
-3 FUN EVENINGS ONLY- 

HULK HOGAN 

Even though Kathy said 
she likes displaying and 
making hafts, she enjoys 
the 4-H talent show the 
most. Kathy has entered the 
talent show for the past 2 
years. One year she tap 
danced and the other she did 
a jazz routine. 

The talent show is one of 
many events for teens in 4-H 
at the fair. Other activities 
include a marshmallow 
roast, movie night anda teen 
dance. 

However, 4-H activities 
aren’t limited to young 
adults. There are adult pro- 
grams in 4-H that Carol 
eould enter but she ex- 
plained she doesn’t have 

The Blue Water 
Economic Forum will pre- 
sent a program on the ori- 
gin, development and fu- 
ture of the Cooperative Ex- 
tension Service at its next 
dinner meeting, set for 
Aug. 2 in Sandusky at the 
Sanilac County Fair- 
grounds. A reception will 
begin at 6:15 p.m. Dinner 
will be served at 7 p.m. 

Speakers will be Albert 
Hall, long associated with 
the extension service in the 
area, and Martin Nagel- 
kirk, current director of the 
Sanilac County Extension 
Service. State Representa- 
tive Keith Muxlow will 
serve as the presiding of- 
ficer. 

Family 
Movies 

on Wednesdays 
_-- I Friday & Sunday 8:OO Only 

Saturday 7:30 & 9:20 

Coming: “INDIANA JONES 
The Last Crusade” 

Another development in 
the fair this past year is the 
construction of 2 new pavil- 
ions. Both4-H and theLions 
Club have built pavilions 
next to their concession 
stands. Fitzgerald explained 
that the Lions pavilion was 

I I I = I - - - I I I D D m I = - = - m = = = - D 1 ( 1  
AS WE APPROACH THE 1989 GRAIN I 
HARVEST SEASON AND TO INSURE : 
QUALITY IN THE PRODUCTS *YOU 3 
WILL DELiVER TO OUR FACILITIES, I 

REMOVE ALL FOREIGN DEBRIS 3 
BINES AS WELL AS ALL VEHICLES : 
THAT WILL BE UTILIZED DURING 

WE WOULD LIKE TO REMIND YOU TO : 
FROM ALL YOUR EQUIPMENT, COM- I 

* Physical Evidence 
Alls Fair \ I Cocoon the Return 

True Believer Talk Radio I Who’s Harry Crumb 

Sat. Mat.- Sun. till 
5:30- Mon. & Tues. 

ALL SEATS $2.00 

fa NO DEPOSIT 
TAPE PLAYER RENTAL 
NO MEMBERSHIP FEE 
C O M I N G  A T T R A C T I O N S  

Police Academy 6 
Mississippi Burning 

1 

Street Justice 
DISNEY MOVIES 

WILDLIFE AND HUNTING TAPES 

Advertise It In The Chronicle. 

I THIS UP-COMING HARVEST SEASON. FOR THOSE i 
: WHO HAVE ALREADY COMPLETE’D THIS PRE-HAR- 3 
I TlON IS VERY MUCH APPRECIATED, AS YOU REAL- 
I IZE THAT QUALITY PRODUCTS ARE THE EXTRA I : CASH VALUE YOU DESERVE. 

I VEST MAINTENANCE CLEANING, YOUR COOPERA- I 
I 

I 
I 
I I 
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SCHOOL 
Mrs.  Thelma Jackson I 

Hobrook Area News Phone658i2347 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Kola 
were Sunday guests of ~ r .  
and Mrs. James Gage and 
family at Goodrich. 

Emily, Matt and justin 
viller left July 14 to spend a 
few days with Jack Miller 
and his mother, Bettie Tho- 
masson, at Byron. July 19, 
they all went on a camping 
Uip for 10 days in the Upper 
Peninsula and northern 
Michigan. 

Leone Taylor and h m y  
Silver and Tiffany were 
Sunday afternoon and sup- 
per guests of Reva Silver. 

Gladys Alba  of Holiday, 
Fla., Laura Ball and Mrs. 
Arnold W e e r  visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Lee at 
Marlette. 

Leann and Carrie Otu- 
lakowski, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Otulakowski, 
Stella Leszczynski and Lil- 
lian Otulakowski were 
Wednesday supper guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Evans Gib- 
bard. 

Jim Jackson was a Wed- 
nesday overnight guest of 
Scott Schmitt. 

Darren and Danella Virgo 
were Wednesday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt. 
Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson 

were Sunday evening guhts 
of Mr, and Mrs. Glen 
S hagena. 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Pearce of 

Wyandotte were Sunday 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Walker. Scott and Christo- 
pher Pearce returned home 
after spending a week with 
their grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Walker. 

Mrs. David Hacker was a 
Monday afternoon guest of 
Mrs. Earl Schenk. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Goo- 
dfeller and Mr. and Mrs, Bill 
Davis of Utica were Satur- 
day guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Wills. 
Tom Kola was a Wednes- 

day evening guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Cleatus Howe. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt, 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Laming, 
Mr. and Mrs, Curtis Cleland, 
Mr. and WS. Hiram Keyser, 
Mrs. Rhy Rienelt, Mrs, 
Evans Gibbard and Mrs. 
Keyser, Mrs. Ray Rienelt, 
Mrs. Evans Gibbard and 
Mrs. Melvin Particka spent 
Monday with Olga 
Schneeberger at the Schnee- 
berger cottage at Oak Beach ' 

for a potluck dinner. 
Kathy Martinez spent 

Wednesday afternoon with 
Mrs. George Jackson. 

Kathryn Tyrrell attended 
the Blue Water Library 
Federation meeting held at 
the St. Clair County Library 
in Port Huron. 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Cleland 

and daughters, Mary Ellen 
and Sandy, andgranddaugh- 
ter Becky of Clawson were 
Wednesday guests of Mrs. 
Alex Cleland and Carol 
Laming . 

Sharon Flannery and Bob 
Walsh of Florida were Tues- 
day guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Allen Farrelly. 

Mrs. George Jackson vis- 
ited Margaret Carlson 
Thursday forenoon. 

4 

9STH BIRTHDAY 
13 

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Ross 
and family of Harietta, 
Mich., Ruth Knowles and 
Randall of Novi, B@ Karg, 
Leslie Hewitt, Mr, and Mrs. 
Maynard Hoff, Mr. and Mrs. 

* Bill Bredow, Erica Schmitt, 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Cor- 
bishley, Charles and Chris- 
topher of Bad Axe, Ella Mae 
Becker, Bonnie Fritz and 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Becker 
of Cass City and Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Shagena met at 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Hewitt Saturday where 
they helped Leslie Hewitt 
celebrate his 95th birthday. 

Edanna Sweeney visited 
Mrs. Earl Schenk Wednes- 
day evening. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Slezak 

and family of Harper Woods 
were Wednesday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Kolar. 
Mr. and Mrs, Ralph Hoxie 

attended the Agriculture 
Expo at Lanqing Wednes- 
day. 
Gerry Rich of Harrison and 

Reva Silver spent from 
Monday till Friday with 
Phyliss Pickerel at Marlette. 

Mrs. Jim Doerr took the 
Holbrook Helpers 4-Hcook- 
ing groups on a tour of 
Sommers' Bakery Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Ck- 
land were Friday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Eu- 
gene Cleland at Bad Axe to 
watch a video from his trip to 
Scotland this summer. 

Gladys Albee of Holiday, 
Fla., Laura Ball and Mrs. 
Arnold LaPeer visited Mi. 
and Mrs. -Ed Moyer at 
Sn over Tuesday. 
Mt. and Mrs. Bob Peters of 

Mt. Morris, Claud Salsbury 
and daughter of Pontiac, A1 
Wagner and Kathy Martinez 
were Sunday guests of Mrs. 
George Jackson and Don. 

Mrs. Allen Farrelly was a 
patient at Hills and Dales 
Hospital in Cass City from 
Thursday till Monday. 

Linda Glaza of Aurora, 
Colo,, is spending a week 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Orville Glaza, and all 
were Tuesday dinner guests 
of Mr. and 'Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Ross 
and family of Harietta and 
Ruth Knowles and Randall- 
of Novi spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Hewitt. 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Shagena 

and Jeanette Osentoski vis- 
ited Evelyn Mitchell of Sil- 
ver Springs, Md., Kathleen 
Ward of Florida, Hannah 
Burns and Marion Ballad of 
Pontiac at their home here. 

Jessica Koch and friend 
Brock of Saginaw were 
Wednesday guests of 
Edanna Sweeney and 
David. 
Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Spencer 

****** 

were Wednesday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Orrin 
Wright. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wills 
were Wednesday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs.Gary 
Wills at Port Austin. 

Olive Grifka, Mary Kolar 
and Mr. and Mrs. Tom Kolar 
attended a *show Saturday 
afternoon at the Sandusky 
Fairgrounds put on by the 
Sanilac Police force. 
Reva Silver was a Tuesday 

evening guest of Beverly 
Rockefeller. 

Beth Mulder was a Wed- 
nesday guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Curtis Cleland. 

Brent Jackson of Bad Axe 
was a Thursday afternoon 
guest and Melissa Jackson 
was a Friday supper guest of 
Mrs. George Jackson and 
Don. 
Barbara Salowitz and Judy 

Lautner were Tuesday eve- 
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Allen Farrelly. * 

Mr. and Mrs. John Antos, 
daughter * Marilyn and 
granddaughter Laura of 
Utica, Mt. and Mrs. Am- 
brose Chinoski of Parisville 
and Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza were Monday after- 
noon guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed Glaza. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Antos, 
daughter Marilyn and Laura 
of Utica were Monday lunch 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Stanley Glaza. 

Don Hendrick visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Cliff Jacksonhi- 
day morning. 
Lynctte Roberts of Livonia 

was a Thursday lunch guest 
of Mr, and Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza. 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Robin- 

son of Car0 and Mr. and Mrs. 
AI Anthcs were Wednesday 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Kevin Robinson, Tracy 
and Chris. 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve Glaza 

and family of Streamwood, 
Ill., and Mr. and Mrs. 
Stanley Glaza spent a few 
days at their cottage at 
Lewiston. 

Mr. and Mrs. Do0 
McKnight of Bad Axe were 
Monday evening guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt. 

Mildred Porter of Taylor 
and Bob McKay of Detroit 
were Sunday forenoon call- 
ers at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Shagena before 
attending the Appin School 
reunion and potluck dinner 
at Ubly Park. 

Mrs. John Walker and 
Laura Blett attended the 4 
Seasons Nursing Home pic- 
nic for patients and relatives 
Friday where Big Daddy 
Lackowski entertained the 
group. 

and Mrs. Elmer Fuester in 
Cass City. Lynn Spencer led 
the discussion on Animal 
Welfare. 

Thenext meeting will be 
held at the home of Marion 
!Grey Aug. 10. 

A potluck lunch was 
served. ****** 

ELECTION 
IVOTXCE O? SPECIZU, ZLECTXON OF THE ELECTORS Of 

CAS$ CI2t PUBLIC SCHWLS 

TO BE HELD 
AUQUST 8 ,  1989 

TUSCOIA, HURON A#D SMILAC COUNTIES, WICHXQM 

APPIN SCHOOL 
REUNION 

TO THE ELECTORS or THE SCHOOL DISTRICT% 
Mr. and Mrs. Ben Meske of 

Port Hope, Mr. and Mrs. 
Elmer Fuester of Cass City, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wills, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tony Cies- 
linski, Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
S o h ,  Mildred Porter, Bob 
McKay, Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Shagena, Mr. and Mrs.Dale 
Hind, Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Wills, Edanna Sweeney and 
David, Mr. and Mrs. Bryce 
Hagen, Hazel Jurgess and 
Mi. and Mrs. Clayton Ben- 
singer were among a group 
who attended the Appin 
School reunion Sunday at 
the Ubly City Park. 

A potluck dinner was 
served at noon. Hazel 
Jurgess and Clayton Bensin- 
ger were 2 of the teachers 
who attended and were pre- 
sented with gifts. 
The next reunion will be in 

3 years at the Ubly Park. 

Mrs. Curtis Cleland visited 
Mrs. Jim Hewitt Tuesday. 
Mr. and Mrs. Amold 

LaFker were Sunday eve- 
ning guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Copeland. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Shoemaker and Mr. and 
Mrs. Evans Gibbard spent 
the weekend at Mio. 

Clarence Depcinski and 
Kevin, A.J. Batie and Ray 
Depcinski were Tuesday 
guests of Mrs. George 
Jackson and Don. 

Mr. and Mrs, Gary Ross 
and family of Harietta, Ruth 
Knowles and Randall of 
Novi, Mr. and Mrs, Charlie 
Corbishley, Charles and 
Christopher, Bob Karg and 
Mr. and Mrs, Jim Hewitt met 
at' Mr. ' and Mrk 'Bill 
Bredow's cottage at Oak 
Beach Sunday for a family 
get-together and potluck 
dinner. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Dick- 
ens and family of Warren 
were Saturday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. John Walker. 

Mr. and Mrs. John 
Zawilinski of Cass City and 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Sofka 
went to the Leisure Rest 
Home at Oil City Tuesday to 
visit Mabel Bontrager who 
was a resident at Meadow- 
lark Mobile ,Home Park 
where the Zawilinskis and 
Sokas spent the winter in 
Florida. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wills 

attended the 95th birthday 
open house for Roy Cham- 
bers at his home in Bad Axe 
Sunday afternoon. 

****** 

Please Take Notice that a special election of t h e  electors 
of Cass City P u b l i c  Schools, Tuscola, Huron and S a n i l a c  Counties, 
Hichigan, will be held in the school d i s t r i c t  on Tuesday, 
August 8 ,  1989.  

' 

THE POLLS O? ELECTION WILL OPEN AT 7 O'CLOCK IN THE M O ~ I N Q  
AND CLOSE AT 8 O'CLOCK IN THE EVENING. 

The following proposition(s) will be subniitted to the vote 
of the electors a t  t h e  special e l e c t i o n :  

MILLAGE PROPOSITION 

Shall the limitation o n ' t h e  amount of taxes 
which may be assessed against all property in 
Cas$ City public Schools, Tuscola, Huron and 
Sanilac Counties, Michigan, be increased by 2 
hills ( $ 2 . 0 0  on each $ 1 , 0 0 0 . 0 0 )  on  s t a t e  
equalized v a l y a t i o n  for the 'year 1 9 8 9 ,  t o  
provide a d d i . t i o n a 1  f u n d s  for  o p e r a t i n g  
purposes? 

THE VOTJNO P W C E ( S )  ARE As FOLfiOWSt 

PmCXNCT NO. 1 
Voting Place: High School Building in t h e  Village of Cass City 

All school electors who are registered with t h e  c i t y  or 
township c l e r k  of t h e  city or township i n  which t h e y  reside are 
eligible t o  vote at t h i s  election. 

I ,  Patricia Donovan, Treasurer of Tuscola County, Michigan, hereby 
certify that as of J w  28, 1989, the r e c o r d s  Q f ' t h i S  o f f i c e  indicate that . 
t h  total of a11 rcrted i n c r e a s e s  over and above the t a x  limitation 

government a f f e c t i n g  the taxable property Iocated in Cass City Public 
School.., Tubcola ,  Huron and Sanilac Cclunties, Michigan, is as fulluwo: 

established by the Constitution of Michigan, in any local unit of . .  

By f u r c o l a  County1 1.6  Mills for  Spec, Education - Indefinite 
1'.75 Mills for  V a c .  Education - Indefinite 

I .5 Mills fur Medical Car-e Facility 1987-1990-Inclusive 

,2  Mills fo r  Senior Citizens 19sa-i29i - Inclusive 
.9 Hills f o r  Rcaad P a t r o l  1988-1991 - Inclusive 

,5  Mills for- Er-idger b Streets 1987-1991 - I n c l u s i v e  

By EllinGton Township: 

By Elmwood Township: 1 Mill f o r -  ro+s 1986-1990' - I n c l u s i v e  

3 Mills for- Rceds,1988-1997 - Inclusive 
,5  Mills fo r  Firms 1988-1997 - Inclusive 

* 5  Mills f o r -  fire 1986-1990 - Inclusive 

By Elkland Township: *75 Mills fo r  Libr-ary 1983-2002 - Inclusive 

By Alrner  Township: 1 Mill f o r  Roads 1989-19?2 - I n c l u s i v e  
* 5  M i l l s  for  Eiis Sy:,;t~:.r;~ :'!:',:.? -1790 - Inclusive 

BY Columbia Township: 1,s M i l l s  for- Roads 1987-1989 - Inclusive 
. .  . I  

By Noverto Township: None of  Recar-d 

B y  School D i s t r i c t :  16.9 Mil l s ,  1989 C~nly 
3 M i l l s ,  1989 Only 

I ,  Roberta Moetteli, Treasurer of Huron County, Michigan, , 1989 ,  t h e  records of hefeby certify that as of June 26,  
t h i s  office indicate  t h a t  the total of all voted increases over 
and above t h e  t a x  limitation established by t h e  Constitution of 
Michigan, i n  any local  u n i t s  of government affecting t h e  taxable 

SanilaC Counties, Michigan, i s  as F follows: 
property located in Cass City Public S c h o o l s ,  Tuscola, Huron and . "  

FARMBUREAU 

The Shabbona Farm Bu- 
reau group met Thursday 
evening at the home of Mr. 

By Huron Countyt .20 Mill 
.20 kill 
.SO M i l l  
NONE 

Transit 1989 
1969-1991 Xnc. Older Citizen : 
1989-1992 Iac. Medical Care : i I  1 CASS CITY TIRE I 

6y Grant Township: 

By the School District: 1 6 . 9  mills, 1989 only 
3 mills, 1989 only  1 

Welcomes 
Scott Am 

~ CertGed 
Mec hank 

Date : I 
t d -  19119 

Tre-asurer, Huron County 
The Amazon is too wide at 
many points for a person 
on one bank to see the op- 
posite shore. 

I ,  Carol A .  Dale,  T r e a s u r e r  of Sanilac County, M i c h i g a n ,  
I 1 9 8 9 ,  the records of hereby certify t h a t  as of Junt 2 7  

t h h  office i n d i c a t e  that voted increases over 
and above the t a x  l i m i t a t i o n  established by t h e  Constitution of 
Hichigan, in any local u n i t s  of government affecting the taxable 
property located in Cas8 C i t y  Public Schools, Tuscola, Huron and 
Sanilac Counties, Michigan, i s  a s  fo l lowst  

0.2 Senior Ci t lzcn 1980 - 1991 
By Sani lac  Cobntyt 0.2 Library 1988 - 1991 

0.5 Drug Task Force 1987 - 1989 

. .  

By Evergreen Township: , 1.0 Roads 1986 - 1990 

Package 
One 8x10 
Two 5x7's 
Nine Wallet 
Size 

By Greenleaf Township: 1.0 Roads 
1.0 Fire 

1989 * 1992 
1989'-  1992 

By Lamotte Township: 1 .o Roads 6 Brldges 
0.5 Fire Dept. 

1986 - 1989 
1987 - 1989 

By Sanilac County 
Intermedlett Dis tr ic t  0.9 

2.0 
Sp - Ed 
VO - Ed 

I n d e f .  
f n d e f .  

By the School District: 1 6 . 9  mills, 1989  only 
3 mills, 1989 only .'*'*'. gn 

$l 
.*...e Quality Service at a Fair Price *:*:*:* 

.,.. . . *  ... 
... 

mz: .::. ... - SeeUsToday Date: Junc 2 7 ,  1989 
Treasurer, Sanilac County 

CASS CUTY TIRE, This Notice CS given by order of t h e  Board of Education of 
Cas8 City Publ ic  Schools, Tuscola, Huron and Sanilac Counties, 
Michigan. 

Benson E .  Hobart 
Secretary, Board of Education 
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HONEYMOON CRUISE - Cara Prieskorn of Cass City and Michael Klein of 
Poughkeepsie, N.Y., floated off into the sunset west of Cass City after exchanging 
wedding vows Saturday afternoon in Cass City. 

July 30-Aug. 

“Bigge 
Fair se 

w and better 4=H 
in Sanilac Co. 

This year’s Sanilac County 
4-H Fair will be will be big- 
ger and better than ever, 
offering something for 
young and old alike, accord- 
ing to fair officials. 

Scheduled to run Sunday 
. rough Aug. 5 ,  the fair will 

reature judging of an esti- 
mated 3,700 projects dis- 
played by some 1,OOO 4-H 
and Open Class exhibitors. 
Registration and judging 
times and lwations are 
available by calling the fair 
office at (313) 648-2515 or 

In addition, the community 
nt will be the site of vari- 

648-2470. 

ous free entertainment 
throughout the week. 
The fair will begin Sunday 

afternoon with the judging 
of 4-H dogs in the Livestock 
Arena. At 7 p.m., the 4-H 
king and queen coronation 
will begin, followed by an 
annual Gospel Sing at 7:30 
p.m. 
McDonagh ’8, Am us epents 

will put the fair into full 
swingMondayat5p.m. with 
the opening of carnival 
rides. The midway will be 
located at the fairgrounds on 
Dawson Street, a half-mile 

\ west of the stoplight in San- 
dusky. 

Also Monday, judging of 
various exhibits will con- 
tinue from 9 a.m. through 5 
p.m. At 7:30 p.m. the Buck- 
skin Jack Thrill Show, fol- 
lowed by the Bush Hog 
Racing Team (monster 
truck demonstration) will be 
featured at the grandstands. 
Among the activities slated 

for Tuesday is the popular 
single and team antique 
buggy hitch, set to begin at 4 
p.m. in the arena. At 7:30 
p.m., the tractor and pick-up 
pull-4,Ooo farm, 5,500 
open tractor, 6,500 open 
tractor and 5,400stock pick- 
up-will begin. 

Tuesday also marks the 
start of the “Great Lakes 
Lumberjack Show,” which 
will consist of 4 shows per 
day through Saturday. 
-. 

kick-off events Saturday. At 
noon, a team draft horse 
hitch will be held in the 
arena, and at 3 p.m., a pedaJ 
pull for kids ages 4 to 11 in 
front of the grandstands. 
The 4-H and I T A  livestock 

sale will begin at 1 p.m., and 
a small animal sale at 3:30 
p.m., both in the arena. A 
demolition derby is sched- 
uled to begin at 7 p.m. 
This year’s gate admission 

policy is the same as last 
year. Monday through Sat- 
urday admission will cost $4 
per persons (2 years old and 
up) and includes gate adds -  
sion, parking, all grandstand 
shows and all carnival rides 
for the day. Admission will 
be charged starting Monday 
at 2 p.m., and Tuesday 
through Saturday at 8 a.m. 

Professional and Business 

DIRECTORY- Times are to be announctd. 
A host of judging events 

Wednesday will be followed 
at 7:30p.m. by the ATV and 
lawn mower pull in front of 
the grandstands. 

A talent contest will be 
held Thursday in the Com- 
munity Tent beginning at 6 
p.m. An hour later, a pony 
pull will begin in the outside 
arena, and at 8 p.m., the 
GMC Truck/True Value 
Hardware Country Show- 
down will start. 

A bicycle rodeo (location 
to be announced) and a trac- 
tor operators contest in front 
of the grandstands are set for 
10 a.m. Friday. Also at the 
grandstands, a horse pull 
will begin at 1 p.m., corona- 
tion of the Sanilac County 
bean queen will be at 7 p.m., 
and a tractor and pick-up 
pull will get underway at 
7:30 p.m. 

An Open Class Horse 
Show slated for 9 a.m. will 

Shaw gearing u 
for 3rd mission 

P -~ 

ACCOUNTANTS PHYSICIANS 

Andemon, Tuckey 
Bemhardt a, co., P.C. 

CmlMd R M c  Aaxwntanls 
Gary -, CPA - 673-3137 
Robert Tudtey, CPA * 872-3730 
Jerry Bemhardt. CPA - 673-3137 

BALU K., M.D. 
Obstetridan & G-ogist 

Pbns (313) 64&4733 

70 NWBI Elk 
-, MI 48471 

“When you’re there. YOU 

In addition, Shaw currently 
serves as Astronaut Office 
Liaison with the Depart- 
ment of Defense for classi- 
fied payloads. 

The elder Shaw, who said 
his son has been kept busy in 
recent weeks training for the 
upcoming launch, also said 
this could be Brewster’s fi- 
nal shuttle flight. “He thinks 
this is the last one,” he re- 
marked. e 

As has been true in Shaw’s 
previous shuttle missions, 
his parents, other family 
members and some friends 
will travel to Florida to at- 
tend the launch, 

Cass City resident Dale 
McIntosh, who’s shared a 
close friendship with Shaw 
since thc pair’s high school 
days, attended the 1983 
launch and hopes to see next 
month’s take-off, 

“I’m trying to work things 
out. I want to go,” McIntosh 
remarked last week. “It’s 
spectacular. It’s really an 

actually s& how dangerbus 
that is. It’s an eerie feeling; 
you’re holding your breath,” 
he said. “It’s just a. . .relief 
for it (shuttle) todisappear in 
the clouds.” 
Shaw’s father agreed, add- 

ing, “You’re concerned till 
he gets out of sighC’ 

715 E. Frank St., Cam, MI 
and 

6261 Church St. 
Cass Clty. MI 

phOrnm4680 d 

$=99 COUNSELING Harold T. Donahue 
M.D.# A.A.F.P. 
’ 4674 Hill Street - 

DO YOU HAVE A 
DRINKING PROBLEM? Cass City 

-ALCOHOUCS ANONYMOUS 072-2323 
Every Friday Evening - 8:OO p.m. =eeptThudY 

AND AL-ANON officehouBweeMays 

Good Shepherd Lutheran Church 

Thieves take 
picnic table At your Music Headquarters 

MIKE WEAVER, Owner Ph. 872-3613 
LIGHT PHARMACY A picnic table was reported 

stolen recently from Anrod 
Screen Cylinder, 6160 
Garfield Avenue, Cass City. 

Greg Biddinger reported 
the table, valued at $75, was 
taken sometime between 
July 14 and July 17, Cass 
City police resorted. 

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 
Tueday Ewnlngs 8AKI p.m. 

St Pamatius Parish WI Elamnmt 
-city 

Dr. J. Geisstnger 
Chiropractor Emergency Ph. 872-3283 

%h& 
Mon., Tugs., Thurs., Fri. 
9-12 a.m. and 2-6 p.m. 

Sat. 9-12 a.m. 
21 N. Almer, Caro, Mich. 
Across from IGA store 

DENTISTS Alfalfa field 
R. Paul Chappel, DDS, PC 

Family Dentistry 

6240 Hill, C a s  Citv 
Comprehensive orthodonoics 

day slated Phone Caro 6734464 
An Alfalfa Demonstration 

Plot Field Day will be held 
July 26 at the Richard Eisele 
farm from 10 a.m. until 2 -- 

I . I  

4674 Hill St. 
HEALTH CARE Cass City, Michigan 

0724446 
y.111. awesome thing to see.” 

north Of Kinde On 
Road. 

The farm is located One McIntosh acknowledged 
east and 1/2 that thoughts of the January 

1986 Challenger explosion 
will probably be on his and 

olhce 8724725 Mofw 872-4762 
IMMEDIATE 

HEALTH CARE 
NONlEMERGENCY 

$25 fee 
Including physician’s fee 

and clink room. 
Cash Basis, and we will give 

yw a statement. 
No Appointment Usually 

Necessary 
2:30-8:30 p.m. Saturdays 

1O:OO a.m.-8:30 p.m. Sunday 
HILLS AND DALES 

‘ 6:00-8:30 p.m. Fridays 

Exclusively at Parkway 

I‘ Only at Parkway “BABY BUD” 

plus tax Special 
TmSHIRTS 

L-x L 

Hoon K. Jeung, M.D. 
Surgeon 

Specialist in Stomach 
and Bowel Problems 

9 a.m. to 5 p-m. Daily 
Saturday - 9 to 12 m 

Closed Thursday 

6230 Hospital Drive 
Cam City, MI 48726 

Phone 87241  1 
HOM 872-3138 

Beth Doran, Extension other people’s minds when 
livestock agent, remarked, the shuttle takes off. 

- 7  

“Hay crops are grown on 
more acres than any other 
crop except corn in Michi- 
gan. If we include pasture 
land, forages are grown on 
more acres that any other 
crop in the state.” 

Doran said 12 different 
varietiesof alfalfa have been 
established. The seed repre- 
sentatives will be on hand to 
discuss the characteristics of 
the plot varieties. 

Extension Agricultural 
Agent Roger S wartzen- 
druber added “Forage qual- 
ity is one of the most signifi- 
cant factors affecting prof- 
itability of the dairy farm.” 

“Alfalfa production and 
quality- is a must for live- 
stock producers to increase 
their profitability. Exten- 
sion staff will be available to 
discuss forage establish- 
ment, practices and the 
importance of forage qual- 
ity.” 

Announce 
2ndquarter . 

earnings 
Gilbert A. Currie, chair- 

man of Chemical Financial 
Corporation today an- 
nounced the company’s 
second quarter earnings. 

Net income for the second 
quarter of 1989 was 
$2,708,000, up over 30% over 
the $2,083,000 earned in the 
second quarter of 1988. 
Earnings per share for the 
second quarter of 1989 were 
$0.95, an increase of 28.4% 
over the $0.74 per share 
earned during the second 
quarter of 1988. Year to 
date 1989 earnings and 
earangs per share were 
$5,119,OOO and $1.79, respec- 
tively, as compared to 
$3,9%,ooO and $1.41 for the 
same 1988 period. The net 
earnings increase of 28.2% 
and earnings per share in- 
crease of 27% has primarily 
been attributable to im; 
provements in the corpora- 
tions’s net interest mar- 
gins. 

Twelve-7 11’2 02. bottles )I 11111 & dep. 
- .  .- 

I 

Reg. $1 000 Manager’s Special $7gg 
HOME CARE- 

d 

THUMB AREA 
HOME CARE AGENCY 

Nursing, Physical, Occupational 
& SpeeChTheraw 

Nurse Ades 
Medicare, Mediiid & 
Blue Cross Certified 

Your locally owned, private, 
nonpmtif, full SBNiOB 
Home Care Agency 
(517) 674-8746 

Or. E. Paul Lockwood 
Chiropractic Physician 

OM# Hwm: MM., Two., Wd. ,  
Fri. 0.12 clooll .nd 2-5 p.m. 

Cl0rrd:mnbynd [Murdmy 
 phot^ 872-2765 C- 

1 CltyforAppointment 

-We also carry- 
.Batman .Batman 

Pins Hats LJ’ 24pk. cans & dep. 
Mike Weaver 

Safe And Effective 
Expectorant I 1(800)3584749 I Beatrlz G. Martin, M.D. 

Internal Mediclne 
Expectorants arc rnedicincs 

which loosen sputum (phlcgm) 
in the lungs. Expcctorants may 
also increase sputum volume 
and h e  ease w i h  which sputum 
is removed from the lungs during 
episodes of coughing. 

INSURANCE . 
4672 Hill St. 
Cass City, MI 

Phone 8724331 Alien Wlthervpoon 
New Englad Ute 
NEL Growth Fund 
NEL Equity Fund 
NEL l m  Fund 

Money Market Series 
Phone 872-2321 

4615 Oak Cass City 

OPfOMETRlsT 

OFFICE HOURS: 
Mon.-Fri. 8 a.m.-5 p.m. ’ 

Saturday 8 a.m.-noon Bccause o f  a lack of definite 
findings as to h e  exact actions o f  
expactorants, there has bcen some 
disagreement in h e  past as u) the 
lherapcutic value of expcctoranrs. 
Recently,  however,  the U.S. 
Food and Drug Administration 
(FDA) announced that one in- 
gredient had becn found to be 
safe and effecrive as an cxpec- 
torant through i u  effect of  in- 
creasing sputum volume. The 
ingredient i s  guoifenesin, the 
most widely used ingredient in 
nonprhscription cough and cold 
rnedicincs. Products containing 
orher cxpaclorant ingredients have 
a period of time during which 
h e y  can be reformulated 

Accsptlng Mew Patients 

N. Y. Yun, M.D. 
Phpldan 8; Swgeon 

office Hours: 
l Mom-Fri. - 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Thurs. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
Sat. - 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
6232 tloaphal Drive 

cau city 
0724733 

*8.07242S7 

Dr. David Batter 
Optometrist 

4624 Hill St. 
Cass City 

Office Hours: 
Mom-Fri., 9:00-4:30 

872-3404 
. .  

Dr. G. W. McNiven 
Dr. R. R. Watson 

optometrists 
Primary Virion Center P.C. 

0724374 or 0724375 
Hours: Monday thru 

Friday 9-5 
Special 

Appointments Available 

6505 E. Man, C ~ M  C i  

Guaifenesin is also approved 
as a prescription drug for use by 
individuals who have chronic 
bronchitis, to help loosen lung 
sputum and thin bronchial %re- 
lions. 

VETERlNARi ANS II SUPER SUBS II CHICKEN SALAD II SANDWICH COMPANION ANIMAL 
HOSPITAL 

4438 S. Seeger St. 
Cass City - Phone 872-2255 

Carol OaIkeEllIr, D.V.M. 
A d  Elh, D.V.M. 

TTY our New 

Special Sauce 
and Seasoning Made Fresh Daily 

Persistent coughs of more 
ban one wcck, accompanied by 
olher symptoms (such BS fever or 
rash) should bc evaluated by a 
physician. 

Watch for the return of Home Video Movies 
Edward Scollon, D.V.M. 

Veterinarian 
Farm and 

Pet Animals 
Phone 072-2935 

48MN. &, Cnr CRY 

This space cwld 

be yours for 

as little as $1.75 

per week. I 

. .  
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FLIGHT 1 
Ken Zdrojewski 
Jerry Toner 
Newel1 Harris 
Dave Hoard 
Dave Lovejoy 
Rich Tate 
Clint House 
Dick Wallace 
Paul Chappel 
Don Ouvry 
John Maharg 
Jim Peyerk 
Bill Kritzman 

. Dale McIntosh 
: Billy Coston 
’ TomCraig 
: BradGoslin 
’ ElwynHelwig 

Jim Fox 
. GeneKloc 

FLIGHT 4 
. Randy Sherman 

Jim Apley 
Don Erla 
George Ridge 
Tim Cummings 
Clark Erla 
Don Schelke 
Fred Leeson 
Doug Herringshaw 
Jerry Houghton 
Jack Burns 
Don Work 
Jason McCallum 
Jim Smithson 
Don Hilbig 
Mark Swanson 
Kim Glaspie 
Russ Biefer 
Clarke Haire 
Myles Smith 

FLIGHT 3 
Keith Adelberg 
Todd Comment 
Anton Peters 
John Haire 

I 
I Shots I I 

Brian Reinhardt 13; 
142 Tom Wallace 132 
139 Dan Hittler 131 
137 Ken Jensen 130 
134 Ron Geiger 123 
132 George Bushong 122 
1n MikeLefler 119 
1% PhilGray 116 
124 Dick Peterson 105 
123 Daryl Iwankovitsch 104 

120 Keith Pobanz 67 
117 
117 FLIGHT4 
115 John Agar 16!5 
119 Mike Diegel 152 
108 Phil Moses 148 
103 Dieter Roth 144 
102 Dave MCNaughton 142 
gg Scott Murphy 139 

Don Hazard 138 
Craig Bellew 129 

152 Stan Guinther 127 
14  Jack Burns 126 
141 Jim Ceranski 116 
141 J.R. Boldizsar 107 
137 John Niebrzydoski 107 
132 Dave Weeks 87 

126 Daryl Codling 69 
122 I Russ Comer 36 
117 

116 
110 LEAGUE HONOR ROLL 

123 Bob Stickle 94 
120 Bert Althaver 84 

131 Ken Tiseo 82 

116 *Points to be adjusted. 

110 
105 
102* 
98 
96 
95* 
78 

164 
140 
135 
134 

Low Actual Round for 
Year - D. McIntosh - 33. 

WEEKLY 

Flight 1 - Paul Chappel - 
Flight 2 - Jim Apley - 36. 
Flight 3 - Dan Hittler and 

Flight 4 - Mike Diegel and 

37. 

Brian Reinhardt - 43. 
Dieter Roth - 43,. 

b Pitching and defense key 
for Yankees’ title repeat 
The Yankees successfully 

defended their title as cham- 
pions of the Cass City Little 
League program with an 
impressive 9- 1 mark. The 2- 
time winners have compiled 
a regal 19- 1 record over the 
past 2 seasons. 

Finishing runners-up were 
the Tigers, who stamped a 7- 
3 mark into the history bmk. 

“Pitching and defense are 
always big keys,” said Yan- 
kee Coach Dan Ulfig. The 
Yankees scored 136 runs, 
while allowing only 54 runs. 

Pitching duties for the 
champs .were shared by 
Shawn Zawilinski and Jason 
Morgan, Much of the of- 
fense was accounted for by 
sluggers Corey Ulfig, Mor- 
gan, Noms Lounsbury and 
Andy Cherniawski. 

Morgan and Cherniawski. 
each belted 2 round trippers, 
while Ulfig led the team 
with a sensational ,892 aver- 
age. 

The Tigers were paced 
throughout the year by vet- 
erans Jim Hempton, Scott 

Iwankovitsc h, Alan White 
and Tom Dewey. 

Hempton and Dewey 
handled most of the pitching 
duties, with spot appear- 
ances by White and 
Iwankovitsch. 

The Tigers’ season was 
highlighted by a perfecr 
pitching performance by 
Hemp ton. 

Coach Mike Murphy said 
every player on the squad 
pitched in on the offense 
end. 

Church softball league near 
a c  os’e after tough 
The men’s church softball 

league has had an up and 
down season. When the 
summer began, the league 
struggled with the rain, 

“On Friday, which is our 
last regular season night, 
we’ll make up our first game 
of the year,” which was 
cancelled by rain, remarked 
church league president 
Carl Nicol. 
“Compared to our last 5 

years, this is our worst year. 
But the competition is a lot 
better,” Nicol commented, 
adding the league has a rov- 
ing president fiom year to 
year and it makes things 
complicated. “Last year 
there were no rain outs. The 
roving president is too much 
for one person to handle.” 

Although getting the 
games organized was diffi- 
cult, once the teams were on 
the field the play was com- 
petitive. “The teams we 
have are strong teams.” 

As of Friday, 5 of the 8 

CLASS mNGS 
Choose from Atlas or Athena styles. 
Personalized with your name, 
activity, mascot and gemstone. 
Order now for September delivery. 
Offer good thru July 31, 1989. 

OFFERED EXCLUSIVELY BY 

R. JOHNS, LTD. 

95 McCONKEY $54 VALAD’UMTM ONLY JEWELRY AND GIFT SHOP - 
PhmO 872-3025 c8& ClIy 

Diamonds and Cubic Zirconia$ arc availablc for an additional cnarge. 

V 
;tat@-of-the art tanning and lamp technology gently gives you a 
rniform tan in just 3 to 4 sessions (depending on skin- type). And, 
vith just one or two visits per week, you keep your tan year-round. 

6 STYLISTS TO SERVE YOU! 
From left: Sandy, Kim, Kathy, Louise, Angel, Bonnie 

0 Last 4 Days - July Special 
Highlight Painting - $1 0 

We also carry a complete line of these fine products: Kendra, Attractions, 
Nexus. Nucleic A-Natural Woman. Featuring Trevor Island Products. 

teams have chances of win- 
ning their division. The 
league is divided into the 
American and National 
leagues, with 4 teams in 
each section. 

In the National division, 
Colwood United Brethren is 
1 1-3 and in first place; Evan- 
gelical Free is 2nd at 9-5; 
Shabbna Methodist is 3rd 
and has a 3-1 1 record, and 
Deford Community C h w h  
is last, being 0-14. 

Lamotte Missionary and 
the Cass City Catholics are 
tied for fust with -104 rec- 
ords in the American league. 
The Church of Christ is 3rd 
at 9-5 and Cas City Mis- 
sionary is last. 

There are 3 games left in 
the regular season, which 
began May 30, and it will 
end Friday. Then Aug. 1 all 
the teams will begin the 
single elimination play-offs. 
The championship game is 
scheduled to be Aug, 8. 

“When it gets in the play- 
offs, everyone is eligible. I 
think Deford is the only 
team that probably doesn’t 
have a shot at,” the champi- 

Car0 man 
sentenced for 
LSD delivery 
A 23-year-old Cam- mam 

was sentenced in Tuscola 
County Circuit Cowt last 
week to 225 days injail, with 
participation in a work re- 
lease program, for his con- 
viction June 13 on a charge 
of delivering LSD. 

Richard Law, 149 W. 
Grant St., also was ordered 
to Serve 9 months of proba- 
tion for the offense, which 
occurred March 29,1988, in 
Kingston, court records 

\ 

State. 

2 men 
arraigned 
on charges 
Two men were arraigned 

over the weekend on sepa- 
rate charges in Tuscola 
County District Court. 
Scott W. Tewksbury, 21, of 

Vassar, was arraigned on a 
charge of uttering and pub- 
lishing. 

A preliminary examina- 
tion in the case was sched- 
uled for Friday at 8:30 a.m. 
Bond was set at $8,000. 

Court records state the of- 
fense allegedly occurred 
March 26, 1988, in Elling- 
ton Township, and involved 
a $1,450 check drawn on 
First Interstate Bank of Ore- 
gon. 

Also arraigned was Bra- 
dley G, Fromwiller, 19, of 
Otisville, who facesa charge 
of breaking and entering an 
uwccupied dwelling with 
intent to commit larceny. 
His preliminary exam also 

has been scheduled for 8:30 
a.m. Friday. Bond was set at 
$5,000. 
Fromwiller is charged with 

breaking into a house at 
564b Hanes Rd., Vassar, 
May 3 ,  records state. 

Every year, foreign visitors 
spend about $14 billion in 
the US. 

season 
onship, Nicol pointed out. 
The church league is dif- 

ferent compared to most 
fastpitch softball leagues in 
some of its rules. If players 
are caught using profanity 
they will be ejected from 
that game and the succeed- 
ing game. Also, each team 
has a prayer before every 
game and each player must 
go to church 3 out of 5 con- 
secutive Sundays. 

Nicol also listed some of 
the players which were 
doing exceptionally well 
this year. From United 
Brethren, Bob Tobey is 
leading his team with a SO0 
batting average. Also Doug 
McArthur leads the team 
with 15 runs scored and is 
tied with Bob Wright in 
RBIs, each having 11. Also 
Colwood’s Dale Smith, has 
26 strikeouts in 65 innings 
pitched. 

The Cass City Catholics 
also have their share of top 
hitters. Gary Robinson 
leads the team, batting S71; 
Ed Robinson is at ,545, and 
Mike Ware has 535. 
Lamotte has one of the more 
balanced attacks, with sev- 
eral players batting in the 
.4m. 

CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

The Cass City Little League Champion Yankees are: front 
row, from left, Tim Marker, Anthony Walther, Shawn 
Zawilinski, MIke Bolton, Blake Hall. Back row, Jim Bolton, 
coach, Corey Ulfig, Norris Lounsbury, Andy Cherniawski, 
Jason Morgan, Mike Marshall, Doug Hall, coach, Dan Ulfig, 
manager. Missing from picture: Brent Morley. 

The Liftle League Runners-up Tigers are: kneeling, left to ’ 

right, Bill Hennessey, Corei Spencer, Dave Murphy, Alan ,. 

White, Aron Romstad. Standing, left to right, Coach Pat :. 
Murphy, Tom Dewey, Shawn Rienas, Bob Gengler, Scott 
Iwankovitsch, Jim Hempton, Mark Levalley, Coach Mike 
Murphy. Missing from picture: Mike Jackson. 
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Competition underway 

Newlv established horseshoe 
league draws area pitchers 

can come out and try it,” 
Robinson said. He noted 
horseshoe pitching is par- 
ticularly suited to persons 
who like to bowl. “It really 
helps out your timing,” he 
said. 

of people interested in it, but 
they just didn’t have any 
place to go.” 

finished in the fall,” he said, 
adding Dick Szarapski, 
Charlie McPhail, George 
Lapp, Leonard Zimba and 
Tom Stimpfel helped out 
with the work. 

Aside from regular league 
play, Robinson said he 
hopes to make state-sanc- 
tioned tournaments an an- 
nual part of the local horse- 
shoe pitching scene. 

Two were scheduled this 

day and Sunday, was sanc- 
tioned by the M-46 Associa- 
tion; the second, sanctioned 
by the Wolverine Horseshoe 
Pitching Association, is 
slated for Aug. 12 and 13. 
Also, open pitching will be 

available throughout the 
summer at the gun club from 
6 to 9 p.m. Thursdays. There 
is no charge, but pitchers 
must provide their own 
horseshoes. ’ 

The only organized horse- 
shoe pitching league in the 
area began its first year of 
competition 3 weeks ago at 
the Cass City Gun Club. 

Members of the Cass City 
Horseshoe League are meet- 
ing Tuesdays at 7 p.m,, ac- 
cording to Phil Robinson, 
Cass City, who spearheaded 
formation of the league. 
Eleven men from the Cass 

City, Caro, Deford, King- 
ston and Brown City areas 
are participating this year. 
Robinson hopes to see that 
number, as well as participa- 
tion by women, senior citi- 
zens and younger pitchers 
increase over the next few 
years. 
“I’d like to see 3 or 4 new 

members every year,” he 
remarked. “I’d like to have 
20 guys-that’s my goal, 
Plus, I’d like to see some 
women get into it.” 

“Another year and I think 
we’ll have a pretty good 
turnout,” Robinson contin- 
ued. “I think there are a lot 

After deciding to stari a 
league locally, Robinson, a 
Cass City Gun Club member 
and avid horseshoe pitcher, 
set out to install 20 new 
horseshoe pits at the gun 
club, located 4 miles south 
and one mile east of Cass 
City. 

. .  

Cass City Horseshoe 
League 7-18-89 

W L T  
Bill Bender 4 1 2  
Les Auten 5 2 0  
Phil Robinson 5 2 0 
HankLangenburg 4 3 0 
GeorgeLapp 2 4 1 
Paul Auten 2 5 0  
Tom Stimpfel 1 6 0 
*Jim Smithson 2 1 0 
*JohnMc&ther 2 1 1 
*ChuckGray 1 2 1 

1 2 1  *Ron Gray 
*Has games to make up 

High game actual --Les 
Auten and Phil Robinson 

High game with handicap 
(92) 

--Phil Robinson (152) 

“We started last spring and year. The first, held Satur- “Anybody that wants to try 

M-46 tourney winners named I 
Two Cass City residents The first, second and third City and Wally Koski of 

are among 15 horseshoe place winners, following Lamer. 
pitchers who placed during competition Saturday, were 
an M*46 Horseshoe Asso- (first group) Lloyd McLane Following the second day 
ciation tournament held of Mayville, Ron Haines of of competition Sunday, the 
over the weekend at the Cass Gladwin and Nelmer Wright first, second and third place 
City Gun Club. of Pigeon; (second group) winners were (first group) 

Judy Dennis of Brown City, Willard Wilbur, Bryan 
A total of 40 pitchers par- Willard Wilbur of Imlay Shanks of Mt. Morris and 

ticipated in the 2-day event, City and Bill Bender of Bill Bender, and (second 
hosted by the newly estab- Brown City, and (third group) Phil Robinson, Les 
lished C a s  City Horseshoe group) Phil Robinson of Auten and Ron Shanks of 
League. Cass City, Les Auten of Cass Wyoming. TUESDAY NIGHT IS league pitching night for members of 

the newly established Cass City Horseshoe League. Above, 
(from left) John McArther, George Lapp, Paul Auten and 
Ron Gray take aim and fire, at the Cass City Gun Club, 

\ 

Applications available a 1 

BIG for fall turkey season Impression 
With Photo Posters 

Turkey permit applica- 
tions for this fall’s hunting 
season are available from 
requesting license dealers, 
Department of Natural Re- 
sources district offices and 
the DNR Informatiun Serv- 
ices Center, Box. 30028, 
Lansing 48909; phone 5 17- 
373- 1220. 

The deadline for applica- 

Recent successful breed- 
ing of Michigan’s wild tur- 

tion is Aug. 1. ’ -\ 

keys,combined with several 
mild winter$, has led to a 
substantial increase in the 
turkey population. 

The season will be Oct. 4 to 
Nov. 14, an increase of 12 
days from last year, and 
hunters will have a choice of 
13 hunting periods, corn- 
pared to 6 in 1988. 

Six areas, encompassing 
5,671 square miles, will be 
designated for turkey hunt- 
ing. This is an increase from 

16x20 89.99 last year when there were 
only 2 sites in the Upper 
Peninsula, covering 973 
square miles. This year is 
also the first time a fall hunt 
has been scheduled in the 
northern Lower Peninsula 
since 1968. 
With the expansion of tur- 

key hunting areas, the num- 
bcr of fall turkey permits 
i m s e d  .to 5,900, com- 
pared to 1,350 permits in 
1988. 
The bag limit for the 1989 

20x30 
4.99 

-Offer Good thru July 3 

fall huntis either one or 2 
birds (any sex), depending 

year, the bag limit was 2 

on hunting periods and 

upon the hunt area. Last 

birds. 
For detailed information 

A GROUP OF AREA residents led by Phil Robinson, Cass City, spent a good part 
of the past year installing 20 new horseshoe pits at the Cass City Gun Club in 
anticipation of starting a local horseshoe pitching league. * 

dates, conkc< the DNR’s 
Wildlife Division, Box 
30028, Lansing 48909: 
phone 517-373-1263. 

I I Cass City 1 
LADIES’TUESDAY NIGH? 

SUMMER LEAGUE 
July 18, 1989 

1r 
11 
11 

1 
1 

Country Girls 
Pinheads 
Thumb National 

Our Pleasure 
Pin Moyers 
The Bad Girls 

Gagetown Gales 1 INSTANT. 
CREDIT! 

SLJDEWCASEMENT 
AIR CONMflONER 

High .Games: N.  Haa 
181-154-167, D. Mathewso 
167, J. Fullman 158, N. Wal 
163, J. Yost- 190-161, Lis 
Erla 160-187-175, Kri 
Talaski (triplica 141-14: 
141), L. Beachy 165, B. Vo 
lmar-172, J. Wright 154. 

High Series: N. Haag 50: 
J. Yost 500, L. Erla 522, I 
Vollmar 450. 

High Team Game: Pi 
Movers’ 592. 

High Team Series : COUI 
try Girls 1664. 

DAVID BILLS CAUGHT AND RE- 
LEASED this trophy size smallmouth 
bass while fishing in the Cass River last 
week. Bills. wouldn’t divulge exactly 
where he landed the 18”, 3.5 # beauty, 
but did reveal he was using a “Mr. 
Twister” lure. David, 13 years old, is 
the son of Tom and Janene Bills. 

SERVICE GIBSON 
EXTRA VALUE 

AIR CONDITIONER 

AFTER 
THE 

GIBSON 15.8 CU. FT. 
CHEST FREEZER 

~ift-out storm W e t  
step Divider/Dmin Pon 
Defrost main & Hose Adapter 
f b w ~  Cord Retdm 

.Lockwith- 
sotetv Key 

SALE! ’ 

ONLY Now “449 ONLY “79 mwr Limlted 

ONLY 9319 
Ib, a 

BAY SHORE FAMILY CAMP 
TO OPEN JULY 29 

Family relationships will be nourished in 
good, old-fashioned fun and fellowship when 
Bay ShoreUnitedMethodist Churchcampin 
Sebewaing opens its 1989 Family Camp 
(Assembly), scheduled from Saturday, July 
29 to Sunday, August 6. 

Programs designed to help families laugh, 

offered to all age groups, with special empha- 9:oo + 10: 1s 

children’s activities and experienced nursery Lunch 12:15 
care are available on the grounds. Planned Family Activities 1:30 - 5:30 

6:OO Adult Bible study will concentrate on hus- Supper 7:30 
band-wife relationships and what Bible study 
leader John Harnish describes as a “a com- Day August 3 

rnon-sense look at the book of Revelation.” 

play and grow together spiritually will be SCHEDULE 
Morning Bible Studies 

sis directed toward youngsters. Daily 10:15 - 11145 

Frectime activities include canoeing and swimming, and RV sites are available. 
F0r.a detailed brochure, phone Bay Shore Camp office at (517) 883-2501, 
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By 6ill Myers 
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Chamber Fun Day 
scheduled Aug. 2 
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Farm truck NOTICE OF MORTGAGE F O R E  
* CLOSUREANDSALE 

destroyed 
by fire 

DEFAULT HAVING BIEN 
MADE in the conditiotu of a certain 
Mortgage ma& tha 25th day of 
Jmuary, 1988, bp md bttween 

RIA, a ri@c mn, 4069 Dnuy 
Rod, stcrim8 Heights, Michigan 
48078, *I Mortgagor, and DEBO- 
RAH LEIGH LAURIA, of 4225 
Parkride Circle, Sterling Heights, 
Michigan 48078, as Mortgagee; pnd 
recorded April 14, 1988, at Libtr 
581, Page 234, Tuscola County 
Register of D d s  on which Mort- 
gage claims to be due and unpaid at 
the date of this Notice TWELVE 

CHARLES THE- LAU- 

! 

THOUSAND AND N0/100 - - - - - 
($12,000.0) - - - - - DOUARS 

including principal and internst; No 
suit orproaceding at law or in equity 
presently having btcn instituted to 
recover the debt, or any part of the 
deb, secured by said Mortgage, md 
the power of sale and raid Mortgage 
contained having borne optrative 
by reason of raid default. 
NOTlCE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 

on August 29,1989, at 1O:O a,m. in 
the forenoon in the f m t  door of the 
Courthousc in Cnro, Michigan, that 
king the place for holding Circuit 
Court for the County of Tuscola, 
there will bc offered for sale and 
sold to the hightst bidder, at pblic 
auction, for the purpose of satisij- 
ing the amount unpaid and due 011 

thc premises, together with legal 
costs and charges of sale including 
attorney fees, the land and premises 
in said Mortgage mentioned and 
described as follows, to wit: 

Pan of the Southeast quarter of 
Section 2 1 , Town 13 North, Range 
1 1 East, described IS btginning at a 
pint on thc South line of said Sec- 
tion 21, which is East, 318.00 feet 
from the South quarter comer of 
said Section 21; thence continuing 
along said South line, East 3 18.00 
fctt; thmce at right angles to said 
South line, North 1470.02 fcct to a 
trrvene line along the South bank of 
the North branch of White Creek; 
thcnct dong said traverse line, 
North 89 degrees 59’50” West, 
323.67 feet to thc terminus of said 
traverse line; thence parallel to the ’ 
Nonh and South quarter line of said 
Section 21; South 00 degrees 
13’16” East, 1470,M feet to the 
place of beginning. Said property 
extending Northerly to the Center- 
lint of mid North b d  of whire 
Creek. Noverta Township, County 
of ’hscola, Michigan. 

A grain truck was de- 
stroyed by fire early Friday 
evening at Merchant Farms, 
Koepfgen Road, C a s  City. 
The truck was engulfed by 

flames whenElklandTown- 
ship frre fighters arrived, 
fireman Milt Connolly said, 
adding the blaze ’apparently 
started when some hay or 
straw got into the vehicle’s 
muffler. 

Connolly, who had no 
damage estimate, cautioned 
area farmers to exercise ex- 
treme care when using 
trucks in their fields. 

A good time is guaran- 
teed, spokesmen for the 
Cass City Chamber of Com- 
merce said this week as they 
revealed plans for the 3rd 
annuzl Fun Day sponsored 
by the Chamber. 

The event is scheduled 
for Wednesday, Aug. 2, at 
Rolling Hills Golf Course 
starting at 4 p.m. Chamber 
members stress that it is not 
necessary to be a golfer to 

euchre or cribbage. A steak 
dinner with all the trim- 
mings will be offered for just 
$7.50 and persons wishing 
to play golf will enjoy re- 
duced green fees of ju’st 
$3.00. 

Chamber sponsors are 
issuing a special invitation 
to women to come and enjoy 
the fun. Entertainment Will 
be furnished by Clyde Leit- 
erman. 

come and share in the run, 
Folks not wishing to play 

can enjoy the spectacle of 
golfers trying to tee off with 
a bag over their heads or 
shooting with the opposite 
hand ordinarily used or with 
a series of otheqhandicaps 
designed to take the skill out 
and put the fun and luck in, 
Winners will be; awarded 
plaques. 

Non-golfers can play 

inconsequentialize belief. 
On’these dark days of the 
language I can almost sym- 
pathize with Woody Allen 
when he said, “Not only is 
there no God but just try to 
get a plumber on Sunday.” 
“Your columns amuse and 

stimulate and divert me 
from abnormalized health.” 

Myron Kandel, who is on 
Money Line on CNN nightly 
coined a phrase, “financial 
economy .” 

****** 

****** 
Between Detroit and Lan- 

sing, Michigan is earning all 
sorts of distinctions. 
The Catholics have closed 

30 churches in Detroit. 
The schools are so deep in 

the red they are laying off 
1,600 employees, mostly 
teachers. 

Mayor Coleman Young 
this spring wished that one 
day he might have a son. Not 
long afterward his adminis- 
trative assistant presented 
him with a 5-year-old boy 
along with a whopping bill 
for support, which the court 
approved. Incidentally this 
assistant draws $85,000 a 
year in salary (for her labors, 
perhaps?). This is $2500 
more than Federal Reserve 
Board members get, being 
untalented. (Robert Heller 
recently quit his job on the 
Fed because of the pay.) 

Federal auditors discov- 
ered the state unemploy- 
ment fund had overpaid as 
much as $151 million in 
claims through sloppy office 
work last year. It will not be 
recovered from the recipi- 
ents. ****** 

Going back to 7 business 
cycles since. 1954 the fmn of 
Kleinworth Benson reveals 
that the real yields of 30- 
year governments have al- 
ways exceeded the inflation 
rate, “Real: in this case 
means the interest rate mi- 
nus the inflation rate. 
Even in the gloomy days of 

1980-’81 when inflation 
was running wild, real yields 
were 2.76% 
In the last cycle, July ’80 to 

May ’8 1, the real yield has 
averaged 4.75%. 
Historically, real yields are 

around 3.5%. 
Meanwhile, holders of 

governments have enjoyed 
serene slumbers. Stock 
owners toss and turn a lot. 

Dear Bill: 
Since your column often 

digresses from financial 
matters, here are some 
medical terms for the lay- 
man: 

I Artery - - Study of fine 
paintings 
Colic - - A sheep dog 
Congenital - - Friendly 
Dilate - - To live long 
Fester - - Quicker 
Grippe - - A suit case 
Hangnail - - A coat hook 
Outpatient - - A patient 

Post-operative - - A letter 
who has fainted 

carrier. 
Delray Beach, F1. 
CATHERINE STRELOW 

****** Organic farm 
field day set Cattlemen On the front page of the 

Lapeer (Mich.) County 
Press, in a 48-pt. head the 
phrase, CRISIS SITU- 
ATION. 

Why must we add these 
filler words like this? 
Weathercasters speak of 
“thundershower situations,” 
school teachers tell of 
“learning experiences,” and 
so on and so on. Bad enough 
to have crises and thunder- 
storms without the added 
pain of lousy language. 

Come, Try 
Our to host tour The Organic Growers of 

Michigan will be hosting 
their 10th annual Organic 
Farm Field Day July 29 
from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. at the 
farm of Dean and Kathy 
Berden, 2725 N. Wheeler 
Rd., Snover . 

The event is co-sponsored 
by the Organic Crop 11% 
provement Association 
(OCIA), Purity Foods Inc. 
of Okemos, Eden Foods 
Inc. of Clinton, and Spe- 
cialty Grain of Dearborn. 

The field day will feature 
internationally recognized 
industry leaders who will 
address various aspects of 
the emerging organic in- 
dustry. 

David Reibling, farmer 
and owner of Oak Manor 
Farms in Tavistock, On- 
tario, will offer information 
and advice on on-farm pro- 
duct processing and retail 
sales. Thomas Harding, 
president of AgriSystems 
Internatiogal, Wind Gap, 
Pa., will provide an over- 
view of organic agricul- 
ture, focusing on the politi- 
cal and business aspects in- 
fluencing the industry’s de- 
velo ment. Pieter Jan van 
W i n  of Holland will ad- 
dress the relationship bet- 
ween Europe and North 
America regarding organic 
food production, inspection 
and certification, ern- 
phasizing the development 
of mutually acceptable U.S. 
and European standards. 

Further Wormation 1s 
available by calling Dean 
Berden at (313) 672-9497, or 
Ann Sinclair at (517) 635-, 
2864. 

The Thumb Cattlemen’s 
Association will post a tour 
and steak fry for all beef 
producers Aug. 17. The 
group will depart at 7:30 
a.m. from the Colony 
House, near Cass City. 

/!DAILY SPECIAL ~ 

****** 
A friend who is probably 

tired of my extolling bonds 
as investments in this col- 
umn, writes: 

“In 1981 my wife had 
30,506 shares of Gulf and 
Western which was worth 
$484,000. Price per share, 
$1 5,875. 

It was split 2-1 in May 
1988, so she then had’ 
61,012. In mid June it was 
worth $60 a share, for a total 
of $3,660,720,” 
Just to rub it in some more 

my friend mentioned hat 
the dividend total in those 
ye&$ was $207,354. 
I am properly humble. 

****** 
From a fellow-sufferer 

from the way the language is 
treated these days, comes a 
note. The writer is the famed 
Rev. Dr. Blair Sutphin of 
Saint John’s Church in 
Pompano Beach, Ha. Blair 
is such a wordsmith that he 
delivers his sermons in 
blank verse. He writes: 

“I’ve got a sermon called 
The Worst of the Im.”Even 

. the official Creed of the 
Presbyterians has been 
changed so that Christ is no 
longer “the son of God“ but 
now the “normalization of 
divinity.” I maximize my 
displeasure at this attempt to 

At 9:30 a.m., the group will 
tour Bill Stoneman’s feedy- 
ards near Breckenridge. He 
operates a 3,500 head feed- 
lot and hosted the 1989 first 
Michigan Bull Test. 

The ngxt tour stop will be 
Ada Beef Company in Ada. 
Ada Beef processes 300 
head daily and specializes in 
dual grading systems *for 
dairy and beef carcasses. 

Bill Myers is a retired 
editor and investment 
counselor. 

Art Club 
celebrates 
75 years 

The Cass City Art Club 
met Wednesday, July 19, at 
Rawson Memorial Library 
to celebrate 75 years the 
club has been in existence. 

Mary Kirton reviewed 
club activities when she 
first joined. .. 

There were 7 present 
members, 2 former mem- 
bers and a guest. 

The afternoon was spent 
reminiscing. Hostesses 
were Velma Cleland and 
Clara Seeley. 

Bertha Shagena had a 
cake decorated for the oc- 
casion and Clara Seeley 
furnished ice cream. 

At Plrtsi Vl lb With Thle Coupon 

One coupon per tmlly- 
Not good wlth any other coupon. 

Expires 8 - 2 - 89 The day’s festivities will 
conclude with a steak fry at 7 
p.m. at the Dennis Hagen 
home, west of Ubly. 

Costs are $20 per person 
for the tour and $10 per per- 
son for the steak fry. 
For more information or 

preregistration, contact 
Terry Krohn, 3545 
Richardson Road, Elkton; 
Mi 4873 1, or call (5 17) 375- 
41 12. Preregistration is due 
by Aug. 4. 

THE PIZZA VILLA 
Phone 8724371 Open 6 a.m. to 9 p.m. Daily 

Frl. & Sat. Open 24 Hf8. 872.4440 
NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN 

that the perid of redunpion from 
said sail M determined mder Michi- 
gan Compiled Laws, Section 
6.3240 is 12 months from date of 
sale. 

H I G HE R HORIZONS 111: 1 
Dated: July 19,1989 
KIM DAVID GLASPIE 

Attomy for Mortgagor 
4455 Dotrr Road, #2 
Clrr City, MI 487% 
T ~ c :  (517) 872-4358 

1-26-4 

Auction Sale m 5 

set of 
color prints I CHILD DEVELOPMENT 

CENTER [FREE OPENING IN SEPTEMBER I;; I 
- - -  - -  ’ blocks south ofhaffic light in Cass City on Seeger St., 2 blocks west at [REAL ESTATE1 6396 Seventh St. 

On North Seeger Street 111 
Saturday, August 5 - 12:30 p.m. Quality Day Care Programs for Ill 

Infants Toddlers Preschool 
Kindergarten E I e menta ry 

(Before and After School) 
For more information 81 enrollment 

Please Call 
Kathy McDougall 

or 872-5403 

ATTENTION: INVESTORS-HOME BUYERS 
This investment home will be offeted for sale at Public Real Estate 

Auction on the premises located at 6396 7th Streel, Cass City, 
Michi an. 
Twoyots being described as follows: Lot 17 and Lot 18 of A. H. Ale’s 

Addition to the Village cf Cass City, Michigan. 
This property is not in the Corporate Limits of Cass City. No Village 

taxes to pay, 1988 County Real Estate taxes were $429.1 0. 
Older type two story home with full basement, natural gas forced air 

furnace and hot water heater. Large utility room with washerdryer 
hook up and space for deep freeze. Large kitchen with many 
cupboards, full bath. Spacious paneled living room. 1 large bedroom 
down, 3 bedrooms on upper level. This home has all storm-screens 
and has been recently insulated and winterized. Large n0w car 

arage-work-shop with trussed rafters and heavy duty cement floors. 
715’ rock bottom well with Gould submersible water pump and Well- 
X-Trot water storage tank. 

TERMS: This property is bein; offered for sale on CASH basis. Make ar- 
rangement for financing. $2,500.00 security on date of sale and @lance of 
money on or before 30 days from dateof sale. Abstract will be certified to date 
for purchaser’s approval. For home inspection phone 51 7-872-3664 or 872- 
301 9. 

HCOMlNG Aug. 6-1 2- 
THE HURON 

COMMUNITY FAIR 
\ 

Real Estate for sale at 3 p m  I 
HOUSEHOLD 
G.E. 25” cdor TV - new 
Whirlpool auto. washer 
Whi rml  e k .  dryer 
Whirlpool 9 eu. ft. freezer 
Whirlpool 13 w. fi. refrigerator 
Hardwkk gas range 
New Home sewing machine 
Singer sewing machine 
2 vacuum sweepers 
Wood kitchen table w/4 chairs 
Wood wardrobe 
2 chests of drawers 
3 double beds - wmplete , 
Couch - Occasional chairs 
China,cabinet - Record player 

Lamps - Clocks - Mirrors 
Knickknack shelves 
Large quantity bedding - Rugs 
Many pots & pans - Dishes 
8 suitcases - 2 flm fans 
Window fan - Elec. heater 
Cassette player & tapes - 2 irons 
Cotfee maker - Toaster - Knife 

2 dressers - Rocking chair 
Lamp stand - Feather pillows 
Fancy work - Many records 
Over 50 blue glass fruit jars 

Several crocks - 2 cookie jars 
Odd wood chairs - Others 

w/glass tops 

MISCELLANEOUS 
Alum. cement mixer w/motor 
Craftsman 3 1/2 hp. rotary mower 
Wheel barrow - Snake 

Wash tub - forks - Rakes - Hoes 
Shovels - Garden hose 

sharpener 
mh8S 

ANTIQUES & 
COLLECTIBLES Saws - Step ladder 
2 very old violins wlcases 
Hall tree - Blanket chest 
Foot stools - Chest of drawers Others b F  

WILLIAM HAZEN GUINTHER Owner‘ 
Clerk - Hillaker Auction Senrice 
Terms - Cash or check with ID. Everything settled for day of sale. Not responsible for accidents. 
Auctioneers - Lorn & Clark Hillaker 

phone 51 7-872-301 9 
. . . . . __ . . . 

, .. ., . 

’ \  
1 
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Area man takes own life ' *  

Obituary Down Memory Lane A Cass City man died a few 
hours after attempting to end 
his own life early Thursday 
afternoon at the Station Bar, 
(332 W. Main St., Cass 
City. -- 

According to Cass. City 
Police Chief Gene Wilson, 
John F. Anderson, 31, was 
found in the men's restroom 
at the bar at about 1 p.m., 
suffering from an apparent 
self-inflicted gunshot 
wound to the head. 
-. He - was - rushed by Cass 

Anderson was born Feb. 1, sisters, Jean Anderson and 
1958, in Toul, France, the Mrs. George (Belinda) 
son of Wayne Lee and Betty Mester, both of Deford; one 
(Kreuzer) Anderson of Cass brother, Jim Anderson of 
City. He came to the United Cass City; 4 nephews, and 3 
States as a baby with his nieces. 
parents and to-Cass City 
from Florida when he was a Funeral services were held 
young boy. . Monday at Little's Funeral 

Home, Cass City, with the 
Anderson attended Cass Rev. Allen Fruendt, pastor 

City High School, and was a of the Good Shepherd Lu- 
lance corporal in the U.S. theran Church, officiating. 
Marine Corps serving in the Interment, with full mili- 
Pacific Theatre. * tary honors, was in Elkland 

From the files of the Chronicle 
of Huntington, W. Va.; 4 
daughters, Mrs. Jay (Lois) Edith Surbrook 
Sugden of St. Helen, Mich:, 
Mrs. Wayne (Evelyn) Whit- 
taker of Cass City, Mrs. 
Ronald (Sharyn) Perry of 
Shawnee, Kan., and Mrs. 
Earl (Eleanor) Dietzel of 
Marlette; 18 grandchildren, 
and 11 great-grandchildren. 
Fow sons, 4 brothers and 
one sister preceded her in 
death. 

Funeral services were 
scheduled Wednesday at 2 
p.m. at the,Cass City Mis- 
sionary Church, with Rev. 
Bruce Pearson, District 
Superintendent of the Mis- 
sionary Church, Michigan 
District, and Rev. Clifford 
Jordan, pastor of the Cass 
City Missionary Church, 
officiating. 

Interment was to be in 
Elkland Cemetery, Cass 
City. 

Arrangements were by 
Little's Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Edith Lillian 
Surbrook of Cass City, 84, 
died. Sunday, July 23, at 
Hills and Dales General 
Hospital after a lengthy ill- 
ness. 

She was born Sept. 27, 
1904, in Evergreen Town- 
ship, Sanilac County, the 
daughter of Albert and Eva 
(Churchill) Kitchin. 
Miss Kitchen married Rev. 

Lewis Surbrook June 15, 
1926, on the homestead 
farm where she was born. 
They pastored 4 together in 
many Michigan Missionary 
churches for 65 years. She 
was a member of the Cass 
City Missionary Church and 
of the Missionary Women's 
International. . 
Surviving are her husband; 

2 sons, Ray Surbrook of 
Cass City and Rev. Mark 
Surbrook and his wife Linda 

_ _  
I .  YEARS fr;y::Fere 17 present at * 25 YEARS AGO 

the Pioneer Senior Citizens 
cooperative dinner Th urs - 
day at Sanilac County Park 
No. 3. After dinner, a short 
meeting was held with 
Emerson Bailey in charge. 
The secretary's and 
treasurer's reports were 
given by Mrs. Edna Geister. 
Readings were presented by 
Marion Gray. 

& m y  Sgt. Kenneth Guilds, 
son of Charlotte Kitchin of 
. Deford, has arrived for duty 
,I Fort Benning, Ga. Guilds, 
an infantryman with the 
197th Infantry Brigade, was 
previously assigned in Kitz- 
ih en, West Germany. 

#he Holik family reunion 
was held Sunday at the Bud 
Schneeberger cottage near 
Caseville, with 64 persons 
present. The oldest family 
member attending was Mrs. 
ditchell Holik of Cass City. 

The youngest was Anton 
Scbneeberger, son of Steve 
and Pat Schneeberger, Cass 
City. Coming the farthest 
was Dale Holik of St. Louis, 
Mo. 
Elkland Township firemen 

wete called Tuesday after- 
noQn to extinguish a grass 
fire a l p g  Deckerville Road. 
jssistant Fire Chief Milt611 
ionnolly said the fire was 
apparently started by some- 
one throwing a cigarette 

Gagetown firemen termed 
their three-day Gagetown 
Firemen's Field Day a SUC-, 
cess after pocketing a net 
profit of $575. Winners of 
the cash prizes were: Robert 
Dunn, Flint, Joan Hurley, 
Gagetown, and SuAnn 
Comment, Gagetown. 

At the Cass City Village 
Council meeting, Bernard 
Frieburger and Dr. D, E. 
Rawson were appointed to a 
committee to investigate a 
tree planting program in the 
village. 

David Ackerman of Cass 
City will be one of 400 stu- 
dentsoto receive bachelor's 
degrees from Western 
Michigan University Fri- 
day. He is a 1959 graduate of 
Cass City High School. 
Ackerman is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Dave Ackerman of 
Cass City. 
Rona Rayl, daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. Harold Rayl, fin- 
ished in the State Finals with 
560 points as the "Number 
One Quizzer" in the State 
YFC Bible quizzes held in 
Lansing. 

City-Mercy Ambulance Surviving are hisparents; 2 Cemetery, C a s  City. 
personnel to St. Mary's 
Medical Center, Saginaw, 
where he died during the 
early evening hours. 

Also assisting at the scene 
were state police and the 
Tuscola County Sheriff's 
Department. 

A witness told police that 
Anderson had been at the bar 
only a short time before he 
walked into the restroom 
and fired a handgun, accord- 
ing to Wilson, who said 
Anderson had been served 2 
drinks, but finished neither. 

Jeff Leinweber, co-owner 
of Cass City ServiStar Hard- 
ware, where Anderson had 
been employed for the past 
year, expressed shock at the 
tragedy. 
"It's still pretty tough," he 

remarked Monday, adding 
he had no clue Anderson 
might be considering taking 
his own life. 

"He was a person who 
would always be there for 
the customers," he re- 
marked. "There were a lot of 
people who liked him and 
would (ask) for him at the 
store." 
"I think he didn't realize he 

had as many friends as he 
did," Leinweber added. 

TEN YEARS AGO 

Ten ladies attended the 
Cass River Women's Chris- 
tian Temperance Union 
meeting at the home of Elsie 
and Georgia Thpmpson last 
Thursday. Devotions were 
given by Mrs. Harriet Rayl, 
The next meeting is with 
Mrs. Edith Toner. 

Jamie Doerr of Ubly will 
be among 34 Michigan teen- 
agers who will be going to 
Japan as part of a Japanese 4- 
H twn exchange. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. James D. 
Doerr, Ubly, and will be a 
sophomore at Cass City 
High School this fall. 

IN OUR COMMUNITY 

Call 1-800-422-5245 
Karen Spry earns During the early morning hours of 6-1%89, suspects 

entered private property located on Almer Drive just 
east of the Village of Car0 and vandalized private 
property and a cat. 

Thc tires were slashed, the antenna broken off and 
satanic-type writing was put on the vehicle. There was 
writing on a garage door, yard light, and mailbox. The 
writing had to do with satanic drawings and numbers. 

The suspects used an orange grease pencil and the 
writing was very neat. 

Crime Identification Number TC-10-89 

I 

OakZand degree at 
While attending Oakland, 

she was employed as a sys- 
tems analyst at Core Indus- 
tries, Bloomfield Hills. 
After graduation she ac- 
cepted a position working 
for Electronic Data Sys- 
tems. Bloomfield Hills. 

Spry and her husband, 
Tim, and son Douglas re- 
side in Rochester Hills. 

Karen is a 1977 Cass City 
High School graduate and 
the daughter of Jim and 
Geri Perry, Cass City. 

Former Cass City resi- 
dent Karen (Perry) Spry 
has received a bachelor's 
degree with honors in Man- 
agement Inf:+vation Sys- 
tems from Oakland Univer- 
sity, Rochester. . 

For health 
insurance 
that provides 
Ontome when 
see me. 
Pf!#spitalized, 

Dr, Sang H. Park began his 
practice in Cass City last 
Thursday. The specialist in 
obstetrics and gynecology 
was chief resident at Miser- 
cordia Hospital in the 
Bronx, N.Y., before moving 
here. 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Speirs 

had as weekend guests, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gerald Apple, 
Marla and Mark, of Gar- 
retsville, Ohio. The men 
served in the Army Air 
Force during World War 11 
and were in the same prison 
camp in Germany. 

35 YEARS AGO 

Paul Holmberg, Jim Ross, 
Jim Huff and Jim Fritz are 
spending two ,weeks at 
Camp Iroquois at Sand 
Lake. 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Rienstra 

and sons, Mr. and Mrs Ray- 
ford Thorpe and Mrs. Loren 
Trathen enjoyed a picnic 
dinner at the state park near 
Port Austin Sunday. 

Dr. William Selby of Lin- 
coln Park will open an office 
for the prac tice of optometry 
in Cass City Aug. 9, accord- 

Anyone with any information can call 1-800-422- 
5245 or 673-8160 between 9:OO a.m. and 5:OO p.m., 
Monday thru Friday. Rewards will be paid for informa- 
tion leading to the arrest and conviction of this crime. 

Ernest A. Teichrnan, Jr. 

: Cass City, Mich. 
,- PPone 872-3388 

Call: 6240 W. Main 

State Farm Mutual AutOmOblle insurmce Company 
Home Office Bloornington llllnols 

ing to an announcement 

Frederick Martin, son of 
Mr. and MS. Mar- 

notified fiat hc has &en 

f Whatever yoljr printing needs, we serve them 
: right! Latest modern offset and btbrpress 
hqUlPmWt to aSSlJre YOU Of the best results 

tin of Cass City, has ken 

:PRINTING SERVICE madethisweek- 

* .  I _.- -_.-I - 

Karen (Perry) Spry 

1 awarded the bankers' short ' 1 : -  i r i  every way. 
course scholarship given 

1 * e  >* The Cass City Chronicle 1 annually by the Pinney State Aluminum Soffit 

Steel Ent. Door w/ lock, Window, 
It Shingles, Pre-Built Trusses etc. 

~ t - m n e  972-2010 Bank. 

SPORTS AND 

YOUR EYES 
Poor sports performancs 

sometimes signals under- 
developed visual skills thal 
may keep your eyes "off ths 
ball." 

These underdevsloped 
visual skills may be the 
reason that you miss easy 
shots br free throws during 
that pick-up basketball 
game, Or your "hits at bat' 
are inconsistent on the cor- 
porate baseball team. 
Some examples: Do you 
find that you miss balls thai 
mme at you from certain 
angles or directions? +Are 
you swinging at the ball be- 
fore it arrives at the opti- 
mum spot? On the tennis 
court, does the ball conned 
with the wood of the rackel 
instead of the strings? 
Some athletes tend to tire 

half-way through the game. 
Their performance often 
deteriorates at that time. 
This may be related to fo- 
cusing difficulties, or exert. 
ing excess energy to gel 
both eyes to work as a 
team. Diminished depth 
perception can throw ofl 
location, direction and 
speed judgements. 

The only way to know 
whether there is a vision. 
related problem is to have a 
complete visual examina- 
tion that indudes sports- 
related tests. See your op- 
tomet ri st. 

I 1 
Utility A lumin urn 

COIL STOCK/ 
24" X 50 FT. 

While on color 

ALUMINU 
GUTTER 

20' & 30 ifl'stock 

79F Offer valid Tuesday, July 25 thru Saturday, July 29 
ea. 

SUPPLY L I M E D  

mber Deck Packages #1 COILSTOCK 

$4395 Cigarette Cartons 
"1 189 

Kings 
and 
100s 

tax 

10' x 12' 12'x 14' 
Deck Package Deck Package Deck Package 

24gg5 33gg5 

FREE 
6141 East Cass City Rd. [a ;;;;: ALUMINUM SIDING 

.019 - White Deluxe Quality 
PRIMARY 

VISION 
CENTERS 
. CASS CITY 

PH. 872-4375 
BAD AXE 
269-9708 
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Letters to the editor Some band CALL872-20IOFORADS 
Transit (nonbusiness) rates. 
10 words or less, $1.25 each 
insertion; additional words 7 
cents each. Three weeks for 
the price of 2 - cash rate. Save 
money by enclosing cash with 
mail orders. Rates for display 
want ad on application. I 

students General > f General I: 
[Merchandise) (Merchandise], want to play Micklash responds to BEAGLE PUPPIES for FOR SALE‘ - 1978 Hoinda 
sale, purebred, shots, Goldwing, great shape, lo@ 
wormed, parents good hun- of new parts put on, luggage 
ters. Call 872-5480. 2-7-263 bags. Call 872-4585 after 

5:o. 2-7-12-3 

Dear Editor, 
To Arlan E. Hartwick and 

everyone else who -over- 
looked the Cass City “Vol- 
unteer” band. 

I We tried our best, and 
maybe we didn’t sound like 
the High School band - but 
just because the High 
School band didn’t play, 
doesn’t mean that all of us 
didn’t want to play. Some 
of us did, but the rest say 
they can’t, or don’t want to, 
or they are “too” busy. 

It isn’t the director’s fault 
either - he can’t force the 
kids, but the parents and’ 
other people that complain 
about a band not in the 
parade should get on their 
backs, not the people who 
tried. The people that did 
play in the parade were in 
High School at one time, but 
they are not getting any 
grade for it. That goes to 
show you that nobody cares 
anymore, except for some 
of us. We tried. 

school millage concerns [ Automotive J 
FOR SALE - 1979 Chev- 
rolet, 4 door. Phone 872- 
2369. 1-7-193 

BUY NOW 
BEAT THE RUSH 

Good selection of 
Used Guns 

*Single shot 

*Semi-automatic 
+ *Pump 

, .  
Paul’s Pump Rep& 

112 hp Myers shallow or - 
deep well jet pumpS180 

1/2 hp submersible I .  

30 gallon bladder tank $1 16 
42 gallon bladder tank $143 I. 

I .  

Pumps $336; 

the two (2) mill request cost 
me? 

Anrwer - A one (1) mill 
tax levy is one dollar for 
each $1,OOO of state 
eqqalized values. State 
equalized value is 50% of 
actual value. So, if your 
property is valued at 
$4O,OOO, two (2) mills will 
cost W.00 per year. If your 
property is valued at 
W,oOO, two (2) mills will 
cost $60.00 per year. 

Qu~~t ion #6 - Is there any 
tax relief for senior citi- 
zens? 

A ~ S W C ~  Most senior citi- 
zens receive a refund of a 
portion of their propertyi 
taxes. The following figures 
help to see: if you qualify. 

Household income less 

$4,999 - Tax over $100 re- 
funded. 

Household income $5,ooO- 
$5,999 - Tax over $180 re- 
funded. 

Household income $6,OOO 
and up - Any tax over 3.5 
percent of income is re- 
funded. 
Question #7 - Is there tax 

relief for the average citi- 
zen? 

Answer - You may 
be eligible for a rebate from 
the State of Michigan. Any 
Michigan taxpayer may 
claim relief from property 
taxes. You may claim this 
refund when filing your 
State income tax return by 
using form 1040 CR4. Tax 
in excess of 3.5 percent of 
household income is re- 

Dear 1Mr. Haire: 
In answer to some ques- 

tions that have been asked 
of me regarding the status 
of the Cass City Public 
Schools, I wish to share 
these responses with the re- 
sidents of the C a s  City 
Community. 
Question +1 - Why d m  

the school need millage this 
year? 
Answer - The Cass City 

Public School is an in-for- 
mula school district. The 
state funds we receive are 
based on the state aid fund- 
ing formula. In the past few 
years, the percentage of 
state aid increase has not 
ke t pace with the rate of 

aid formula increase has 
been in the area of 2% in 
recent years. The state aid 
formula for the current 
school year of 1989-90, has 
not even been d e v e l o r  by 
our legislature, but scus- 
sion to date indicates in- 
formula schools can expect 
about a 1.6% increase in 

eation #t - HOW does 
ass City’s spending com- 

pare with the rest of the 
state? 
Anrwer - According to the 

latest state department of 
education information, 
Cass City ranks 511 out of 
525 school districts, in the 
state, in the area of per stu- 
dent ex nditures. Only 14 
school &r ic t s  in the state 
spend less, per student, 
than C a s  City. In a recent 
Detroit News article, Cass 
City was listed as one of the 
20 poorest school districts 
in Michigan. 

Queetion RS - HOW does 
Cass City’s millage com- 
pare with other schools in 
OUT area? 
Answer - Cass City has 

the lowest millage rate in 
Tuscola County. Even with 
fhe increase and assuming 
all other school increases 
are ap roved, C a s  City 
will stfl have the lowest 
millage rate in the county. 
Question #4 - Since the 

basic function of the Cass 
City Public Schools is to 
provide educational in- 
struction, how well do our 
students perform? 
Answer - Here is some in- 

formation to answer this 
question. 

a. Approximately 75% of 
this year’s graduating class 
are going on to advance 
their education. This is a 
very high percentage. 

b. Cass City students con- 
sistently score above the 
state average in Math and 
Reading on the Michigan 
Assessment Tests. 

c. Cass City students con- 
sistently score above the 
state average on the college 
ACT tests. From this year’s 
ACT results 35 graduating 
seniors were state scholar- 
ship qualifiers. 
Question f 5  - What will 

mR ation. In fact the state 

Anrwer - My response to 
this question begm with 
another question, What 
helps make a community, 
like C a s  City, a healthy 
and viable area in which to 
live? The answer to this in 
part, is its schools. In my 
o inion the school system 
aPong with local gouem- 
ment, its health system, 
business, industry and 
moral values all contri- 
bute to the vitality of a com- 
munity. When one of these 
areas is unhealthy, it af- 
fects the total community 
in a negative manner. Our 
community needs a strong 
and healthy school district, 
because our future rests 
with our children. 

FOR SALE - 1972 Plymouth 
Satellite, runs good. Best 
offer. Call 872-3985. 1-7-26-1 

THUMB PAWN 
815 S. Hooper, Caro 

Phone 673-5997 
2-7-26-1 

For prompt service anytime : 
Call 673-4850 Paul at 

2-10-7-tf , I  

” .  

FOR SALE - 1981 Buick 
Skylark, automatic, 4 door, 
air, low mileage, $1900. Call 

FOR SALE - 1984’Chrysler 
LeBaron, excellent condi- 
tion, air, AM-FM stereo, 
undercoat, low miles. Call 

872-2434. 1-7-26-3 

*872-3146. 1-7-26-3 

VAN FOR SALE - la7 FOkd 
Club Wagon XLT, dark blue 
and white, tinted windows, 
overdrive, premium sound 
system. Excellent condi- 
tion. $10,900.00. Call 658- 
2332. 1-7-26-3 

STILL LOTS O F  summer 
merchandise. on sale at 
Georgine’s in Cass City, 
phone 872-5396, 2-7-2&1 

LARGE SELECTION 1 

QUALITY . 

USEDaTIRES 
FOR SALE - 2 pair gold 
drapes, 144” wide, 80” long. 
Call 6S8-8453. 2-7-26-1n 

- - -  

than $3,OOO - All property funded at 60 percent. 
taxes refunded. Question #8 - I do not have sinerely 

Household income $3,ooO- any more children in school 
$3,999 - Tax over $40 re- so wh should1 support the Iknneth J. Micklmh, 

dass City Public Schools 
funded. 

Household income $4,OOO- cost me more money? 
schoo r when it is golng to Superintendent 

\ 

Marla Zmierski 
1989 Graduate 13” . 14” 15” , 

See us today 
FOR SALE - 1984 Chrysler 
Laser, 2.2 turbo, air condi- 
tioning, power brakes, 
power steering, ,power win- 
dows, stereo cassette 
player, 5 sped. Asking 
$2900. Cd18?2-2868. 1-7-19-3 

FOR SALE - 1976 Mot0 
Guzzi 850 Eldorado - full 
dress with trailer. Needs 
clutch and battery. $1500 
firm. Call 872-2969. 1-7-26-3 

~- 

FOR SALE - Like new, 
brown and orange flowered 
davenport, $150. Phone 872- 
3907. 2-7-261 

w-, - 
ktters to the Editor 
The Chronicle weE 

comes letters to the 
editor. 

Letters must include 
the writer’s name. ad- 
dress and telephone 
number. The latter is 
in case it is necessary 
to call for verification, 
but won ’t be used in the 
ne4spaper. 

Names will be with- 
held from publication 
upon request, for an 
adequate reason. 

The Chronicle re- 
serves the right to edit 
letters for length and 
clarity. 

We will not publish 
thank you letters of a 
specific nature, for in- 
stance, from a club 
thanking merchants 
who donated prizes for 
.a raffle. 

Cass City Tire 
6392 Mam St. 

Phone 872-5303 
2-6-21-6 Pay more for less? 

The Thumb 
Yam Shop 

P miles north of M-81 and 
M-53 intersection and 1/2 
mile west on Rescue Road. 

~. 

Opposed to tax increase 
. t  

NAME PINS, desk name:: . 
plates and plastic signs in” 
various sizes made to your 
specification. For informa- 
tion and prices, contact 
Mrs. Buschlen at 872-2121; 
ext. 212. 2-2-17-* , 

SEVERAL USED c h a i  . I 
saws, riding mowers an&. 
lawn tractors for sale --‘- 
Sales, Ready Caro, to go. phonee734367. Rex Binder. . ’ 

2-7-19-3 

Dear Editor: 
The Cass City School sys- 

tem droppedtheVocational 
Agriculture Dept. from the 
school - here in an area of 
rich land and heavy farm- 
ing. This doesn’t seem wise 
to me. 

The teachers are asking 
a 16 2/3% decrease in work- 
ing hours - from 6 hours to 5. 

The working days are 
gear@ to a maximum of 
180 days per year. Snow 
days and other things re- 
duce this some. 
The Japanese, it is 

claimed, have a compul- 
sory 240 days r year 
school system. & length 
of hours taught each day, 
no doubt exceed MU hours. 

A Japanese automobile 
plant is now located at Flat 
Rock, Mich. I have rela- 
tives living near there, and 
they report that the 
Japanese workers there re- 
fuse to send their children 
to the public schools, Some 
are reported going to Cran- 
brook, in Bloomfield Hills. 
The others are establishing 
schools of their own be- 
cause the public schools are 
not teaching enough to suit 
them, This explains in part 
the reason why Japan is 
taking over the world with- 
out firing a shot. Do we 
want educated young 
people, or kids who know 
Sports? 

Some of the young people 
at Cass City pack in a heavy 
load of school work and ac- 
quire a quality education 
anyway. To reduce the 
hours of the teachers and 
tax the public more to pay 
for le&, doesn’t make it 

eas for this to continue. 
Ais does not fit me, but 

many elderly people with 
low income have houses 
with high taxes. Some of 
these peo le sell out and 

necessity. 
I am opposed to any more 

increases in school taxes 
until the schools in Cass 
City get their act together. 

move to ti e Sun Belt - by 

I’m willing to pay more to 
get more, but unwilling to 
.pay more for less. 
The School Board and the 

schcml superintendent have 
my sympathy in this di- 
lemma. 

Open daily 12:OO till 
9:OO p.m. FOR SALE - 1986 Dodge 

Charger 2.2, excellent con- 
dition, $3750.00. Call 872- 

FOR SALE - 1986 Ford 
Ranger pickup, good condi- 
tion, air conditioned, cruise 
control, tilt wheel, $4,O00. 
Call (517) 872-2959. 1-7-2&3 

3385. 1-7-26-3 Phone 26943097 

l? ACRES O F  wheat straw 
for sale. Can be windrowed. 
Call evenings 665-2249. 

2-3-12-tf 

2-7-12-3 

Sincerely. 

Willard L, Dodson FOR’SALE - 1972 Dodge 
pickup and 125 Yamaha dirt 
bike, $200 each. Call En&.:. 
5487 befote 2 p.m. or 87%:- 
2422. 2-7-19-3 

Give a Gift 
Subscription to Don’t blame seniors 

Coming Auctions Cass City Chronicle 
Birthday, Anniversary 
Service personnel 
College students 

order. 
Gift card sent with every 

for millage failure MAKING hectagon tables, “1 
birdhouses, doghouses, toy :: 
chests, cedar posts, picnic ‘ e  

tables, lawn swings, wish- I ,; 
ing wells, clothes line poles, :: 
lawn chairs, wooden ;: 
flowerpots. 4351 Rescue * 

BLUEBERRIES - Turner 
Blueberry Farm, 201 Albin 
Rd., Caro. You pick. How$ 
8:OO a.m.8:00 p.m. 7 days. 
Go east on E. Dayton Rd., 
north on Albin Rd. 1 mile. 
Call 673-6447. 2-7-264 

Dear Editor: 
When I read the column, 

“Your Neighbor Says,” in 
this week’s Chronicle, I 
wondered where Mrs. 
Iwankovitsch got the idea 
that parents are the only 
ones that are concerned 
about the education of the 
children. She especially 
blames senior citizens and 
people without children for 
the failure of the millage. 

Now, as a senior citizen I 
would like to respond. 

I am the mother of 5, all 
of whom graduated from 
Cass City High school. I am 
the grandmother of 10,s of 
whom live in the Cass City 
School District. These 3 
compare in age to Mrs. 
Iwankovitsch’s children. I 
can assure you that $and- 
parents (senior citizens) 
are very concerned a b u t  
the quality of education our 
grandchildren are receiv- 
ing. We live in the coun 

when bussing is threatened, 
alonE with other things, a 

and- are very concern 2 

Saturday, Aug. 5 - Real 
estate and personal prop- 
erty will be sold at the resi- 
dence at 6396 Seventh St., 
Cass’ City, by William 
Hazen Guinther. Hillaker 
Auction Service. 

it is AGAIN now. 
A few years ago there 

was a financial roblem in 
the Cass City !khool. We 
were told by the school 
board that the g q n l  fuad 
did not include m y  iinancing 
for bussin . I think you re- 
member &e problem. Then 

titions were circulated gr 2 things. l-A spctfic mil- 
lage for the g e n d  fund. 3-A 
rptcific millage FOR BUS 
SING. My husband and I 
signed them. 

NOW! - when the ballots 
were produced for the vot- 
ers, the 2 separate millages 
requested on the 
were added togeg:tiL? 
the total listed as one miil- 
la e for the general fund. 

no specific funds for bus- 
sing, even thoup the peti- 
tions requested it. The total 
amount was at  the disposal 
of the school board as they 
wished. I was disturbed by 
this and discussed it with 
the chairman of the school 
board. I am sure he remem- 
bers our discussion. To me 
this was not re resenting 

The millage assed. Now I 

threatened again with li- 
mited bussing. 

T% is meant that there were 

the Wishes of ti e people. 

seeourrur ar  childrenare 

Road,*Cass City. Call 872- ‘.. 
2-9-21-tf , 2039. 2-1-25-tf :: 

FOR SALE - Canning 
supplies, pressure canner, 
Victorio strainers, 
blancher, quart - jars, 
crockpot, clean. Call 872- 
3680, 4585 Oak St., Cass 
City. . 217-%1 

The state of Kansas is 
named from the Kante In- 
dians who - l ied there. 

LOW COST HOUSING. 
MINI-FARM RealEstate ForSale 1 

deals! ! 
MAINTENANCE FREE! 
Beautifully landscaped comer lot, 3 bedrooms, living 
mom, kitchen and dining area with built-in dishwasher 
and garbage disposal. Full finished basement - over 
1800 sq. ft. of living space, family room with bar and 
Poacock wood stove, over $8,000.00 spent on family 
room not including labor, French doors off of dining 
area onto 18x22 deck. Call today! TCC948 

BREATHTAKING VIEW - Yes, the view from this 
home is beautiful, you can see for miles! Tastefully 
decorated throughout, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 2 wood 
stoves, 2-car garage, large deck with patio doors off the 
dining area, garden spot, plus lots more! TCC 

JUST REMODELED! 
Immediate possession on this lovely 3 - W o o m  home, 
new carpets’ and paint throughout, aluminum sided, 
natural gas heat and hot water, nursery off the master 
bedroom, plus lots more! Call today and take a peek! 
4239 Seeger St. TCC946 

STARTER HOME! 
3 4  bedrooins, 14’x17’ living mom, formal dining room 
plus breakfast nook, country kitchen, 1 bedroom down 
and 3 possibles up. Wood and oil heat, large backyard, 
plus older 1 1/2-car garage. Asking $29,900.00 - make 
offer. 4534 Oak St, TCC918 

SWIMMING POOL! Yes, this home has a pa01 in the 
back yard, 3 large bedrooms, 24’x24‘ great room, all 
brick exterior, hardwood floors. Note: Most of this 
home has been remodeled or updated. House sets on 
a double lot, M’x24’ garage. A must see! 4276 Ale 
Street! Tcc945 

2 BEDROOM TRAILER & GARAGE 
Action Guide Find the Service or Product 

You Need in This. . . . 
SERVICE DIRECTORY 

I 
udr m d  Blorrornr 

Plants - Balloons 

The secluded 4 ac-res you’ve been looking for. You 
must see all the trees and shrubs and split rail fence, $‘s 
truly beautiful. Tiny picturesque barn and shed in back 
with a fenced-in corral. The picture above is of added 
on 1-car garage. Exceptional building site later on. 
Trailer, bachelor owned and he’s ready’ to retire. Priced 
at $29,900. Furniture included with trailer. CCl05 

Yes! Our school needs 
funds to operate, but the 
ballots are secret and no 
one knows who votes for or 
against the millage. Please 
don’t blame senior citizens 
for the failure. We are just 
as concerned about our 
grandchildren’s education 
and transportation as we 
were our children’s. Con- 
sidering the terrible things 
ha pening to some children t$p ay, walking or waiting 
on corners is not safe. 

TuffeKote Dinol HANDYMAN’S SPECIAL 
LAND CONTRACT TERMS 

CASS CI1Y TIRE 
Harcular and caoprr 

TIRES 
flrm Fkprlr 

Allgnmntr Muf fm 
Bnkaa Oll Changes 
C@,rtltbd Mactmnk 

Phonm 872=5308 I & M y  1 Tom Tlomry, Ow~‘mn 
4548 Llroh St., clu UV, MI 4871 I P h o ~  872493S 

Phone 2684585 
827 8. Van Dykr, Bad Ax# 

Thank you 
Lmille V. Lounsbury 
(Senior Citizen) 
C a s  City 

APPLIANCE WINDOW ClUWlNG 
SALES & SERVICE 

C U L U N L  Or M A G S  CHLC 
SUPREME 

WINDOW CLEANIN0 HOW MUCH LAND DO YOU WANT? EDITOR’S NOTE The 
whiter is mistaken about the 
previous votes. In 1982 
there were 3 votes. The first 
millagemquest was turned 
down. The second try in- 
cluded 3 separate propsi- 
tions. Money for transprta- 
tion, money for exmcur- 
ricular activities and money 
for other operations were 
presented 8s individual bal- 
lot propositions. All were 
defeated. 

On the third try the mil- 
lage was lumped together 
again and resulted in pas- 
sage of 4 extra mills for 
operation. 

1 

Make an offer on this 2-bedroom home and the amounl 
of acreage that you want. Asking $47,500 for house, 
buildings and 35 acres. Nice brick fireplace in living 
m m .  Natural flowing well. Great location for pond 
CClOl 

--- WSlrnl 
mut 1v1 U L b  1 O’x70’ $800 I labor + Materials I I A CALLUSTODAY 

1120 Grrtlot, 8rglnrw 
Call 

790.7609 

Thb space could 
be yours for 

as little as $1.75 
per week. 

AND AUCTIONEERING 

EQUALWJSWO or if no Call answer 872-4377 8724352 3-7-26-1 Kelly W. Smith, Broker 
Farm Commarchl Reildantlrl Llrllngs Wintodl 
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We clean the Thumb 
Free Scotchgard with 

carpet cleaning 
Car, van, RV 

interior cleaning 
Competitive prices 

E x p r t  Service 
Phone 872-4614 I 8-5-10-tf 

PAGE THIRTEEN 

WANTED - silver coin& i295. 12-7-26-1 : 
dimes, quarters, halfs 1% 4 

and back - silver .dollars WILL DO sewmg, repah ' 

1878 to 1935. PaYlng top work, zippers, will make . 
Price. The Coin Shop' 6439 new outfits, baby to adult 
Main. Phone 872-3919. sizes. Call 8724594. 

12-7- 12-3 6-9-21 -tf I -  

[-I [-I (Notices) 
TO GIVE AWAY - to good 
home, a grey female mit- 
tens cat. Has been spayed. Excavating 

7-7-19-3 

HAPPY BIRTHDAY 
Mom, Grandma 

& Great-grandma 

STILL LOTS O F  summer 
merchandise on sale a t  
Georgine's in Cass City, 
phone 872-5396. 5-7-26-1 

_ _  

GARAGE SALE -Thursday 
only 8:30 till 5 9 ,  6429 
Seventh St. 14-7-26-1 

@?QR SALE - first cutting 
by, $1.00 per bale. Call 
I&an Hutchinson 872-2914, 
L. .. I 2-7-12-3 

BARN SALE - 4791 Lamton 
Rd., 9:Oo till ? Clothes, 
stereos, miscellaneous 
items. All I week through 
Friday. 14-7.26-1 

MOVING SALE 
gravel, processed stone, 
sand, black dirt, topsoil, 
septic systems, ditch 

driveways, water line, 

' 

digging, basements, 

Friday 86 Saturday 

9:OO a.m. till dark 

Aug. 4-5 
GARAGE SALE - July 27, 
28,29, Thursday and Friday 
9 to 5, Saturday 9 to 11 a.m. 
6805 E. Cass City Rd., 3% 
miles east of Cass City. An- 
tiques, ' antique tools, 
drapes, boys' clothes, toys, 
playpen, lots of miscellane- 

14-7-26-1 

GARAGE SALE - July 27, 

ous . 

28, 29, 9:OO to 6:OO. Baby 
through adult clothes, 
knickknacks, truck side 
rails, and more. 4 miles 
east, 3 miles south, 3 east, 
1/2 mile north of Cass City 
on Leslie Rd. 

YARD SALE - Thursday 
and Friday 9:00-5:00. 6328 
River Rd., Cass City. 

14-7-26-1 

14-7-26-1 

. ,  

I Services 1 FOR SALE - loveseat, 
brown tones, 2 matching re- 
&hers in gold tones. Call 
872-3298. 2-7-12-3 

CUSTOM 
SLAUGHTERING etc., stump removal, w 

Super E backhoe, dozer 
grading, brush hogging 

Call john, 872-3149 
Call Beth, 872-2861 

FOR SALE - feeder for pigs 
with 12 feeding bales, water 
trough, electric fence box, 
200 bales of alfalfa. All for 
$550. Call 517-686-9850. 

9-7-26-2 

LARGE 2-FAMILY 
MOVING SALE C A S  CITY HOME - 4 bed- 

rooms, 'many extras. Im- 
mediate occupancy. Priced 
low. Call 616-696-1180, 9-5, 
or 616-696-9603 nights and 
weekends. 3-7-26-3 

~ 

F0.R SALE ' -  12' aluminum 
silo cover, 1981 Ford Es- 
ma. Call 872-3857. 2-7-12-3 .' ; 

BEEF-PORK-VEAGLAMB 
CURING, SMOKiNG AND 

PROCESSING 
Love, Nancy & Family 

5-7-26-11 
25 years of accumulation 

Lots of tools, dinner bell, 
%wheel trailer, carpet 
tools, saws, chainsaw. 

TUESDAY & FRIDAY GARY WILLS 
CONSTRUCTION 

LicensedAnsured Builder ERLA 
Packing Co., Inc. FOR SALE - Case tractor, 

recently overhauled, runs 
like a sewing machine, 
good for baling hay. 4-horse 
trailer, real good condition, 
can be used for 2-horse 
trailer. Harry Wilson, 3070 
Crawford Rd. Call after 

~ 

6 : 00, 872-3222. 9-7- 12-3 

Thinking about 
buying or selling? 

Household items - 
chairs, sofa, bed and 
many more items. 

New Homes/Remodeling . 

84-9-t.f soil, ExcavatindDemolition ' 

Repair, Pole BuildingsRruss 
CaSS City 517-872-2191 Setting, hd/Gravel & Top- 

USDA Plant 1074 
~~~ 

VING SALE - Thursday 3 Friday (July 27,28), 10 
a.m. to 4 p.m. 4619 Van 
Dyke Rd. 14-7-26-1 2667 Warner Road, be- 

tween Deford and Cass 
City. Cemetery Rd., to 
Severance Rd., 1 mile 
west to Warrfer. 

Watch for balloons 
andsigns 

14-7-26-2 

Bulldozing & Grading 
D & D Handy Wash Look out world 

Here comes Jason 
Happy 16th birthday 

Love, 
Grandma and Grandpa 
Whaley 5-7-26-1 

PORCH SALE - 2 
homemade uilts, a few an- 
tiques inc1uLg grain cra- 
dle and walking plow, 
w.ringer washing machine, 
McCulloch 610 chain saw, 
rowing type ezercising 
machine, some clothing, 
Roseville pottery tea set 
and other articles. Thurs- 
day and Friday, July 27-28. 
-:east, 1/2 south of Cass 
+y. 14-7-26-1 

Free estimates 
Reasonable rates 

5% Senior Citizen Discount 
Call 

or 

Dwight R. Loeding * 

072-5004 

673-%5 * 

3-7-26-tf 

Hand wish - Wax 
Shampoo - Paint Sealant 

Fabric Protection f H e h  Wanted) GARAGE SALE - Wednes- 
day and Thursday, July 2 6  
27,9:00-5:00. Children's c)o- 
thing - 1-6, stroller, baby 
dressing table, toys, teen- 
age boys' shirts, 45 RPMs, 
old two hand saw, mifror, 
light fixtures, autumn leaf 
dishes, books, player piano 
rolls, many other items. 
6599 Pine. 14-7-26-1 

M-81 east of Cass City Bring in this ad - 
Call 5 17-872-3505 GREATLAKES Junior Col- 

GARAGE SALE - Wednes- 
day and Thursday, July 2& 
27, 9:OO a.m.-8:00 p.m. 
Large variety, canning 
supplies, welder, 8 ft. fish- 
ing boat, radios, tractor, 
kerosene heater, plus many 
more items. 5949 E. Gilford 
Rd., Deford, one mile south 
of Deckerville Rd. off 
Kingston Rd. 14-7-26-1 

8-5-3-tf lege, Caro, is accepting re- 
sumes for potential full and 
part-time instructors with 
degrees in data processing, 
secretarial science I and 
marketinglmanagement . 
Bachelor's degree re- 
quired, master's preferred. 
Mail resumes to Academic 
Dean, Great Lakes Junior 
College, 1231 Cleaver Rd., 
Caro, MI 48723. EOE 

11 -7-12-4 

Good thru Aug 9,1989 
Call for appointment 

or 517-872-5306 
Closed Sunday 

517-872-4778 

8-7-26-2 

LISTINGS NEEDED - Call 
for free appraisal. Our ex- 
perience is your insurance. 
Osentoski Realty, Cass 
City, phone 872-4377. 

3-5-28-tf 

I SO YOU'RE THIRTY 
AUCTIONEERING - see 
Lorn "Slim" Hillaker. Top 
dollar for your property. 
Phone872-3019, Cass City. 

8-10-3-tf 
GXRAGE SALE - July 28- 
29, 10 a.m.-5 p.m., 6337 
Bbechwood Dr. Books, 
sha l l  appliances, infant 
and children's toys and clo- 
thing, men and women's 
clothing, maternity clothes 
plip miscellaneous items. 

14-7-26-1 

Smith Refrigeration FOR SALE - 2-story house 
in country on 1-acre lot near 
Gagetown, Cass City 
schools, with barn and %car 
garage. Call 665-2566 or 872- 
4258. 3-7-194 

Chuck O'Dell 
Excavating 

Over 20 years' experience 
Septic systems installed 

and cleaned 
sand - gravel - ponds 
ditching - hydrahoe - 

dozer - backhoe 
Phone (51 7) 872-303 1 

4323 Krapf Rd. 
Cass City, Michigan 

8-6-3-tf 

YARD SALE - July 27 thw 
29. Tent, electric stove, 
waterbed, carpet pad, lawn 
edging, GI Joe toys, miscel- 
laneous. 1/2 mile south, De- 
ckerville Rd . on M-53. 

14-7-26-1 

+ and 
Hope you never 
lose your birdie 

5-7-26-1 I '  GARAGE SALE - Friday 
only 8:OO till 5:00. Clothes, 
all sizes, clean, books, 
winter jackets, men's and 
women's, lots of miscel- 
laneous. 4441 Ale St. 

14-7-26-1 

Appliance Repair WANT - baby-sitter, de- 
pefidable adult, for occa- 
sional evenings out. Call , 

872-3509. 11-7-26-3 B J's AUCTION 
Now open in 

Kingston 
2 blocks east of 

caution light 
Every Saturday night 730  
All used merchandise 

All makes and models FOR SALE - 2-bedroom 
house on 20 acres of land. 
Located halfway between 
Elkton and Cass City. Ask- 
ing $38,OOO. Will take offer. 
Call269-8230after3:30p.m. 

3-7-12-3 

,itRAMICS AND yard sale 
- July 27, 28, 29, 8:OO a.m.- 
6:OO p.m. Ceramics, VCR, 
Harlequins, new charcoal 
grS.1, women's clothing to 
size 46, radios, pickup 
cover, dishes, etc. 2 miles 
north of the Gagetown 
Park. No early sales. 

14-7-26-1 

Call 
872-3092 

8-3-15-tf 
GARAGE SALE - 1 day only 
Wednesday, July 26, 8:00 
till 4:W, 6350 Pine St. h t s  
of old goodies, pine cup- 
board, pie safe, well pump, 
trunk, graniteware, 
jewelry, old picture 
frames, baskets, Avon, 
much more. 14-7-26-1 

NOW TAKING applications . 
for assistant varsity foot- , 

ball coach at  Kingston High 1 
School. Send resume to 5790 : 
State St., Kingston, or call : 
Wayne Wright at  683-2550. 

11-7-26-2 a 

GARAGE SALE - 2% east 
of 53 on Bay City- 
Forestville Rd., Wednes- 
day,$ Thursday, Friday. 
Baby crib, TV, clothing, 
lamps, typewriter, miscel- 
laneous. 14-7-26-1n 

Ken Martin 
Electric, Inc. Arthur Brown 

Cass City 
Well Drilling 

[ ForRent 1 
Homes - Farms 

Commercial 
Industrial 

New aqd rewire 

Jim Knowlton, 
auctioneer 

5-7-264 

___ 

ATTJZNTION Men and " 
Women - The Farm Bureau 
Insurance Companies will ' 
be hirifig three new sales :e 

representative! in this area 
in the near future. Licens- 
ing, training, and financing 
are provided. We are serv- ', 
ing Michigan with insur- ' *  
ance for auto, home, life, * 

FOR RENT - office space, 
located 8260 N. Van Dyke; 
3% miles north of M-81 on 
M-53. 10x14 - $105 p r  
month. 14x16 - $15. per 
month including utilities. 
Call 517-872-2581. 4-11-94 

Real Estate For Sale -- and BINGO - Every Thursday 
at  St. Pancratius Hall, S. I 
Seeger, Cass City. Doors 
open 6:OO p.m. Early-bird 
6: 30, regular bingo 7 :OO. 
Phone 872-5410. Knights of 
Columbus Council No. 8892. 

State Licensed 

Phone 872-4114 
4180 Hurqs Corner Road 

8-8-10-tf 

Summer Specials!!! PumpRepair 

Phone 6 7 3 - r n  
STATE LICENSED 

37 ACRES near Cass City, Ranch type home with aluminum siding; 3 bedrooms; Gas 
Tired hot air furnace, plus wood burning stove in garage 26x26 with electric door 
-opener; large basement plus 14x65'4ab for m~bile home set-uf! - LARGE POND I stocked with fish - several fruit trees; Burglar Alarm; many other features - - - all this 

FOR RENT - Masonic Tem- 
ple Refreshment Hall - par- 
ties, dinners, meetings. No 

~, ..:,. ,. , 8-1-n-U .farm, business, and much. *' 
more. No experience is 
necessary. For confidential 
interview call 673-4 155. 

11-7-26-1 ' 
alcoholic beverages. Call 1 Ted Furness, 872-4509. 

I for $74,500.00. Terns. 
Loaded- wholesale or retail 

Sand, Gravel, Top Soil 
Dozer & Backhoe work 
Septic systems, water 

lines, driveways 

This and That 

Call 872-4502 
Free Estimates 

8-2-8-tf 

7 4-2-17-tf 

FOR RENT - storage, Cass 
872- 40 ACRES - PAINT BRUSH SPECIAL!!! Frame old home - 1 1/2 story - basement; ~',~~mMini-Storage. 

4-' .25-tf 

118 ACRES - More than $30,000. spent on remodeling home; barn; tool shed; granary 
:- 75 tillable acres - some tile - some woods - a real good buy at $80,000.00. Terms. 

drilled well - Let us tell you about this one - - - excellent hunting - $34,000.00, Terms. 

STOP IN AND 
CHECK OUT OUR 

Air Conditioning 
Service 

See the experts at 

Cass City Tire 
Phone 872-5303 

5-7-142 

HELP WANTED - Live-in 
motel manager, couple pre- 
ferred, apartment plus 
wages. No experience 
necessary. Write Box 0, 
care of Cass City Chronicle. 

1 1-7-12-3 
FIREPLACE AND ANDERSEN WINDOWS!!!! FOR RENT - The Paint 
:20 ACRES near Cass City; ALL BRICK RANCH TYPE HOME approx, 1440 square Store has a wallpaper I feet - basement - 1 1f2 bathrooms; approx. 22'x56 Quonset building for workshop or steamer for easy refnova1 
%<storage - plus 2 bedroom home that needs some work - could be rented out for additional of old wallpaper. Call m- 

FOR RENT - 2-bedrim 
condo in Cass City, $so0 per 
month with 2-year lease. 

FOR RENT - Storage 

4.1 1 -2-t f 
setting - $77,000,00 Terns. 

HOMES available right now!! Stop at office for more dekls .  
4-7-19-2 

.;-income - - - wood burning insert; laundry room 1st floor; White Creek thru corner of 

*:WE HAVE SEVERAL BUSINESSESkOR SALE - party Stores, Gas Station for 
345,000, etc. 

NOAH'S ARK Preschool is 
acceDting resumes for a 
Propjam Director. Posi- 
tion is 2 days per week - 2 
hours per day. Qualifiea- 
tions are  60 semester hours 
from an accredited college 
with at  least 12 hours in 
Child Development or re- 
lated course work are re- 
quired. Send transcripts to: 
Noah's Ark Preschool - 
P.O. Box 52, Kingston, MI 
48741. 11 -7-19-2 

BOOKKEEPER with 15 
years' experience, now av- 
ailable to help with your 
business or personal needs 
by the hour or by the day. 
References available. Call 
8724538. 8-7-k9-3 

~- 

Happy 16th 
Shelly 

Invitations 
and 

Announcements 
for all social occasions 

space, above Paint store. 

after 5:00m 4-7-lSffn 

RO~ECRANS Apartments I in Gaaetown - starting at  

Cau Dale Damm, 872-2446 
:+den - family room - extra large family size kitchen; 4 piece bathroom and 2 - 1/2 

'garage 3 yrs. old - utility building - FIREPLACE - 36x60' approi. barn - treed lot - 

::5 ACRES - blacktop road - 1 1/2 story stately home with Vinyl Siding - 4 bedrooms; 

,.bathrooms; Forced hot air fumace plus Shenandoah Wood Burning stove; 24x48'4 car 

c- 

~ f.$300.00 monthly income from rentals - $57,500,00. 

RIJ(l\IE 
Carpet & Upholstery 

Cleaning 
Free estimates 

Truck mounted equipment 

$265 Gonth. Heat included, 

665-2673. EHO 4-8-24-tf 

FOR RENT - one-bedroom ' 

4 bedroom home with basement; 1 1/2 bathrooms; new furnace; new water 
roof on 36x60' barn approx. - all tillable productive soil; $49,500.00 terms 
hold land contract. Immediate Possession. 

near public school. Call 517- 

Asher home - solid home with 4 bedrooms; 1 1/2 bathrooms; apartment upstairs. In- 
eludes heat, electric, 
$260.W/month PIUS security 
deposit. Call 872-2691. '*hold land contract with responsible family. 

.- PRICE REDUCED!!! Home in the Country on 2 acres with 3 k i rooms - lots of closets 
*! and storage room; open look kitchen and dining area - extra large living roam; wooden FOR RENT - one-bedroom 
:*deck off living room with sliding glass door; well insulated - small horse barn - comes apartment - first floor. 
k; with range, refrigerator and dishwasher. Let us take you for a personal tour of this fine $210*OO/month Plus security 

deposit. Call 872-2691. 

room; 2 car garage - 2 large lots - treed - waking distance to 
- - Immediate possession. ASKING $49,900. - - - Seller may 

4-7-12-3 

I -  home - onlv $40.OOO.00. - - - -  - 

fW ork Wanted) Love, Mom, Dad - and Wendy 
5-7-26- 1 

loaned overnight 

Matching accessories 
including matchbooks, 

napkins, thank you notes 

BABY-SITTER wanted - 
Auto interior beginning end of August, 2 
COmmercial 1/2 hours before school each 
Reasonable day. Call 872-3060. 12-7-26-3 

: 
: 

KINGSTON Noah's Ark 
Cooperative Preschool is 
accepting children for fall 
registration. There is a $15 
registration fee. School will 
run 2-3 days per week. 
Phone Irene: 683-2248 or 
Ellen : 683-2758. 5-7-26-2 

rates 
Flooding 

Don Dohn 

Phone 872-347 1 

Cass City Chronicle 
Phone 872-2010 WILL DO baby-sitting in 

my home in Cass City by 
the day or week. Have clean 
home, fenced-in yard. Call 

12-7 -26-4 872-5372. 

ELECTRIC motor ancI 
power tool repair, 4 p.m. to 
8 pm. weekdays, 8 a.m. to 
5 p.m. Saturdays. John - )\ 8-4-15-tf w Blair, 118 mile west of M-53 
on Sebewaing Road. Phone 
269-7909. 

WILL DO baby-sitting in a 1 

well-experienced with 2-6 i 
vear olds. Call anytime 872- I 

my home. 1 am reliable and 
LAFAVE STEEL 

4-7-12-3 - SUPPLY, INC. 
'5 ACRES - near Cass City - Home has been remodeled - 5-6 bedrooms; 1 4-piece 
>bathroom and 2 1/2-bathrooms; Forced hot air heating system plus Shenandoah Wood 
-1 buming stove - 24x48' 4-car garage - other buildings; FIREPLACE - 36x60' barn - 
';attractive setting - - - priced to sell at $57,500.00. 

white painted country home with a wing to 

For all your steel needs: 
back fabricating, machine shop, 

872-2446. welding, hydraulic hose ac- 
4-6-28-tf cessories. 

8260 Van Dyke Rd,, Cass City 
Phone 517 872-2581 

RENT - 
"$!:Et 

- 

room and dining room; FAMILY ROOM 
porch; basement; sellers spent over $15,000 

flowers, etc. Small tool shed, and other buildings - vacant 

zft R ~ ~ ; ~ w ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ;  Monday thru Friday prime location in Cass City. 
Phone 872-4377 or 872-2352 

4-7-31-tf evenings. !:!:&: Closed 
for lunch 12:00-12:30. 

For Fast, Efficient 
Repairs on your 

& Satellite 

A 9  System ' Call 
Rick's 

Earth Station 
1433 E. Caro Rd. 

T~ Give Away, GROUPOF 10people-want I-) hoeing jobs, beans or beets 
by acre or bphour. Call 453- 

FREE PUPPIES - Can be 3314, ask for Terry - 

HEALTH CARE aide will 

Seen after 5:m at  a 7 4  12-7-262 
7-7-26-3 

/ 5-10-19-tf GRANT-APARTMENTS - 

UNIONVILLE Apartments 

in Owendale, starting at  
$265 month- Heat included, 
near Public schools. Call 
517-678-4401- EHo 4-8-24-tf 

; Beautiful setting in the woods, and beautiful HOME in Northwood Village & Estates 
:-on Hospital Drive - over 2100 square feet - best of cabinetry in kitchen, etc., 3 bedrooms; 
:2 1/2 bathrooms; FAMILY ROOM WITH FIREPLACE - 2-car garage attached - many 
:other features - price reduced from $99,OOO to $92,000 - $15,OOO, down payment- 
.*possession on short notice. Personalized Napkins 

Wedding 
Anniversary 
Graduation 

do in-home care starting 
September. Call 12-7-124 313-771- 
5729 * 

(Help Wanted) - in Unionville, starting at  
$260 month. Heat included, I near Public schools. Call 

It,:. We have many other listings on homes, country homes, farms, vacant land - 
recreational land - river property - businesses, e=., not shown here, *** INTRODUCING *** 

HOUSE OF LLOYD 1989 
Over 2000 items 292 page catalog 
*Home Decor *Ladies' Ready-to-Gear 
*Toys, Gifts, Candles 
'Christmas Around the World 

517-67;-2&41 EX0 4-8-24-tf 

FOR RENT - 2-bedroom I apartment, very nice. Call 

Many colors and designs 
with your name 

See our new catalog for 1981 .' B.A. CALKA, REALTOR I WOULD LIKE to thank 
the many friends and rela- 
tives who visited me the 
last few weeks and brought 
me plants, flowers and 
odies ,  and to the nurses 5 a Huron Memorial Hospi- 

tal who gave me excellent 
care, your kindness is 
deeply appreciated. Mar- 
ion Perry. 13-7-26-1 

I I 1 8924676. Gerald Stilson. C A S  CITY CHRONICLE 
Phone 872-#110 

5-1-13-t 
4-7-12-3 6306 West Main Street 

Cass City, Michigan 48726 EQUALHOUSIm Notice8 Now hiring demonstrators and booking parties 
(home or catalog parties). 

Fantastic opportunities for you. Call today! 
Sharon Vandenbossche 872-4245 

11-7-19-4 

BINGO - every Wednesday 
night. Open 6 : 00 - early bird 
6:30 - regular bingo 7:OO. 
Post 3644 VFW, E. Main St. 

5-2-26-tf 

Call 517-872a3355 P OPPORTUMTY 
I AM NOT responsible for 
any debts other than my 
own. Deborah L. Wilding. 

5-7-26-3 
Our 37th year serving Tuscola, Sanilac and Huron Counties 
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COME TO THE F F  

* TUSCOLA COUN TY 
I 

SUNDAY, JULY 30 THRU SATURDAY, AUGUST 5. 
SUNDAY, JULY 30,1989 
Co-Sponsoring Merchant - 
MOORE MOTORS 

(Give away drawing - Service & Auto 
Accessory - Ford & m e  on Display) 

1O:N a.m. - ANTIQUE CARS in the park 
2:30 pm. - PICKUP PUU 

Pay at grandstand only 
7.90 p.m. 4-H TALENT SHOW 
1W p.m. 4-H DOG SHOW 

MONDAY, JULY 31,1989 
Co-Sponsoring Merchant - 
VITA PLUS FEEDS 

Etc.) 

TUESDAY, AUGUST 1,1989 
Co-Sponsoring Merchant - 
McDONALD'S 

of Grimace@, Hamburglar@, Birdie@, - 
Games and Prizes fw Kids) 

(Drawings for Hats-Jackets-Sweatshirts- 

9:oO a.m. - 4-H HORSE SHOW 
8:OO p.m. - HARNESS RACING 

(Drawings every two hours - Appearance 

"Kids' Day' Reduced Rates on Midway 
9:OO a.m. - 4-H SWINE SHOW 
%:OO am. - 4-H HORSE SHOW 
9:OO a.m. - 4-H & OPEN DAIRY SHOW 
2:OO p.m. - HARNESS RACING 

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 2,1989 
Co-Sponsoring Merchant - 

(New Car Display - Free Drawings 
Every Hour - Accessofies, Rust Proofing 

9:oo a.m. - OPEN H O ~ S E  SHOW 
9:oO a.m. 9 OPEN L 4-H SHEEP SHOW 

2:OO p.m,- HARNESS RACtNG 
730 p.m. - FIGURE '8' DERBY 

8:OO p.m. - DEMOLITION DERBY 

PAT CURTIS CHEV.-QLDS.-CAD., INC. 

8 senrice) 

9:oO 8.m. - BEEF SHOW 

I 

THURSDAY, AUGUST 3,1989 
Ct+Sponrotlng Merchant - 
TERRA INTERNATIONAL 

(Drawing for Custom Application - Chemical 
Fertitizer Products) All Gates ~d Afternoon 
Grandstand Free to all Senior Citizens until 6 p.m. 

9 : s  a.m. - 4-H & FFA SMALL ANIMAL SALE 
1:30 p.m. - 4-H 8 LIVESTOCK SALE 
2:oO p.m. - HARNESS RACING 
6:OO p.m. - DRAFT HORSE HITCH CUSSES 

830 p.m. - BEAN QUEEN PAGEANT 
9 a  p.m. - POSSE DRILL TEAM 

f:OO p.m. - SUE'S SCHOOL OF DANCE 

FRIDAY, AUGUST 4,1989 
WSponsorlng Merchant - 
METHEM EQUIPMENT CQ. 

(The Latest Models of John Deem Lawn and 
Garden Equipment on Display - Free Drawings 
Every Two Hours - Grand Prize Drawings at 
830 p.m. \ 

10W a.m. - DRAFT HORSE HALTER CLASSES 
1:OO p.m. - TRACTOR PULLING 
5 W  p.m. - PEDAL PULLING 

' 

730 p.m. - TRACTOR PULLING 
SATURDAY, AUGUST 5,1909 
bSponsorlng Merchant - 
HOWARD BELL, INC. 

Every Two Hours) 
(Experimental Cars on Display Prize Drawings 

9 W  a m .  - PHBA HORSE SHOW 
1O:OO a.m. - LIGHT HORSE PULLING 
1:OO pm.  - HEAW HORSE PULLING 
6m p.m. - MOTORCYCLE PRACTICE & 

7:3O p.m. -MOTORCYCLE RACING 
TIME TRIALS 

I ALL WEEKLONG 



Supplement To: Cass City Chronicle 

Cass City E A  Foodliner 
6121 Cas City Road, Cas City, Michigan 48726 

-r *\p- Phone: 872-2645 -Y 

Store Hours= Mon.-Wed.: 8;30 to  7; Thurs. & Fri.: 8:30 to 9; Sat-: 8:30 to  6; Closed Sunday. 
* Beer * Wine j, Pkg. liquor * Lottery Tickets * Food Stamps * W.I.C. Coupons * Bakery * Deli j, 

Shredded * I  

4 

c\I 

m 
c one at  regular price. r 

& d Y Che 
When you buy \IC !hen you buy 

01 ne at  regular price. 
UI mit 1 Free with COUpon. 
I rnit 1 coupon per family. 
CcbupOnemSak 
#r Ihr 29.1989. 

Limit 1 Free with coupon. k Limit I coupon per family. 
Coupon explres Sat,, 
July 29,1989. 

Vhenyoubuy 
me at  regular prlce. 
;ood Week Of July 24,1989. 
lniy a t  ICA stores. 
uppiier Code No. 09357200 
.imk I Free wlth mupon. 

b +A w xi. 4% P 

0 

@ I Ib.Pkg 
Rice I a n ci 

Lon Grain 
ace c o b  

Oven Fresh Soft Tw 

Tender Green- 
Broccoli b - J  

r 
I 

M 

When you buy ' 3 
one at  regular prim. r 
Limit 1 ~ r e e  wlth coupon. CC limit 1 coupon per family. 
couponexpires*; I -  = 

July 29,1989. z 

ai ; $  
3 '  0 

2 

P 
f 7  Kool-Aid 
2 Koolers 2 a When you buy 

, one at regular prlce. 
only A t  Your  local IGA store, 

Limit I ~ r e e  wlth m u m .  

When you buy 
one a t  regular price. 
Limit 1 Free with coupon. 
Limlt I coupon per family. P[: Limit 1 coupon per family. 2 
Coupone IresSat,, 2 Coupon expltes Sat, 
JUlV 29.189. July 29,1989. ,-* ~ x 

IAJ L When you buy 
Good Week Of July 24,1989. 

one a t  regular price. 
Limlt 1 Free with coupon. 

8 

i 

21.5 02. Family Size 

When you buy 
one at regular vrice. 

0 - When you buy 0 Whenyoubuy 
v- 
I V 

Wlhen you buy ED one at  regular price. one at  regular price. onie at  regular price. 
pc: 
2 Coupon expires Sat., 

. Llmlt 1 Free withcoupon. 
Limit 1 coupon per family. 

I- Limit I Free with coupon. 
Limit I coupon per family. 
Coupon expires Sat., 

July 29,1989. JUlY29,1989. 

IEar 

' Bun Size .Smoked, Polish Or Be 

EcKrich CD 
Franks U# - rh Smoked Sausage; 

When you buy-- - 3 Whenyoubuy one at  regular price. a 
U 

Coupon explres Sat., 2 
F one at  regular price. 

Limit 1 ~ r e e  wlth coupon. 
Limit 1 coupon per family. 

Limlt 1 Free wlth coupon. 
Llmlt 1 coupon per family. 
Coupon expires Sat., 
July 29,1989. 

K ' July 29,1989. 

919.57 IGAl 1B 



WIUI Coupon on Page 1,; 
One A t  Regular Prtce, 

I 
1 X T Z Z L n e  I - 

Auto Drlp of Reg. / Perk Asortecg -- Reg. ti Dlet Flavors 
- - - -  

All Master Blend 
Coffee 

Save .40 
Asorfed Scents 

Stick or Solid Antl-PeEpimt or . 
Right Guard 
Deodorant> 2-2.5 OZ. 

#r 

\>* " 

299 
*ASSOreed Scents 2.5 Ot.  

Dry idea . 
RoI I-On ................... 

Save 2.40 
135-24 - ZOO Speed 

Fuji 
Film 

&tlC 2 Pack 

52a 

Svlvania 

Soft White 
ight Bulbs 

60,75 or I00 Watt - 4 Pack 

save .20 
General Purpose 

'C' or 'l3'Slze - 2 Pack or 
9 Volt Single 

Everea dv 
Batteries 

t+ 

4 

.Save .20 
Sylvanla .50/150 watt @Each 

3-Way 
light Bulbs.. . . . . . . . .  

c' ,. Regular or W / Raisins 

General Mil 
Y Benefit 

Cereal 
*I 2.5-1 5 02. 

24g 

Is 

t % *  

'i 

Whlte or Wheat 08 Ct ,  / 7 02. 

I 79 

I 79 

Armel 
Pita Bread ............ 

Macaroni & 
Cheese.. ............... ib. 

StoUfFet'S .Hot To Go! 

= -  Availal 

Eckrlch .Sliced 

Roast . .... 459: 
......... 

t.../ i 
!.i..i 

Beef. - .  + .  , - .  ib. 
3; a;;@ 

I* .?!k 

... 7 Butter ball , ?'* 

-Turkey 
Salami.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

Land 0 Lakes 

Ib. 31 9 

Ccilby Longhorn 3 25) 
Ciieese.. ............... 'Ib. 
i?' 

2 4 ~ '  
le Only In Stores With Participathg D;f?ii Deptr, 

1 4  

* L  - d  



L 

Potatoes 
2 Ib. Bag 

N ) *  Cheese 24 02. Ctn. 

Assorted Varie t ies 

Banquet 
Supreme 
Entrees 

7.5-8 02. Pkg. 

Assorted Flavors 

FAME 
Ice Cream 

1/2 Gallon Ctn. 

1 49 

Assorted Reg. & Llght Varietie 

Kraft 
Natural 
Cheese 

8 oz. Chunk 

1 ' 5 g  
2% Lowfat I 
FAME 

I Milk 
Gallon Jug 

1 7s 

\ Peactie 
60 a. Site 

\ \  
\;, i !/ 

9 3 Ib. Bag 

I 49 Medium Yellow 
Cooking Onions. 

Q I C e C I  018 02. Foil Pan . 

I 49 Fruit Topped 
Crumb Cake.. . -. . + .  

e G r e a t  FOr AOulckSnack e 4  lnch/5.5 oz 

59 Cherryor 3 Peach Pies.. . . 
Dutch 
apple Pie .............. 

6m P m 
I G m t  Wlth C h m  a 1 0  Inch/& OZ 

I6 02. Loaf 

Great For Hamburgers I 

Wheat Sandwic h.1 
8Ct. i.2 

eClasslc 027 02. Plastic Dome . . - 

799 German 
Chocolate Cake. 

1 !W WJ- 
Available Only In Stores With Particiiating In-Store Bakery Beptse 

v Dellclous 

Cool&Crisp 
. Cucumbers 

Macklnaw Milling Co. 

Whole Wheat 
Bread 
20 02. Loaf 

1 OS 
Soft Twirl ResMurant 12 Ct. 

Hamburgeror 1 1  9 - -  

4 -- ?,/ 
Hot Dog Buns ..... I 

!\ 3r 
' I  0 ,  

3'c' 



- -  

Sliced Bacon. p"".:,. I ( Sausage ................. I 
M 

*Save Up lo .30 Ib. 
Swtft Premlum 06-9 Ib. Avg. 

.Save Up To -30 
Farmer Peet .Slleed *I2 02. Pkg. 

I 29 Luncheon 
Turkeys. .............. ib. Meats ..................... Lil' Butterbal 

I I Meat Wieners.. ... ................... 
*Save Up To -30 Ib. 
individually Oulck ~rozen *New Seafood Sensation! 

.Sa* UpTO -20 Ib. 
AMlour Cold Star 

Boneless 
I .................. Fi I lets. Ib. ................. Ib. 

Granadero 
.Save Up TO -40 6aveUpTo.40 
20 ct. Family Pack 

I 89 
Whole, Halve or Spears *Quart Jar 

89 claussen 
I Hash Browns ...... 2 1  Dill Pickles 
Si m plott 

............ 

P 

.Save Up To .Po 
m n  BBO or HOt 'N SPICY 18 02. 

.Save up TO .40 
I 

279 
* 8 0 ~  Pkg. 

Eckrich 
I Hard Salami .......... Pork Sausage..,.. m -, . Chic ken Wings.l .- 

HOMlel 12 02. Pkg. 

4 
I 
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16" DELUXE HEDGE TRIMMER. 16" double- 
edged blades cut in either direction, trims a 
wide variety of shrubbery. Wrap-around grip 

8124 

DELUXE HEAVY-DUTY E m -  
ER. 1.25 hp motor, 8" blade, 
adjustable side handle, cord 
grip and cutting guide. 

i4- u 
RAINPULSE 85 IMPACT SPRINKLER. Adjusts to water all or any part of an 85' di- 
ameter circle. Dial and diffuser pin control distance and spray. Water saver arm vir- 
tually wasteful side splash. Series connection base-connect another hose and 

RAINSHOWER 40 OSCILLATING SPRINKLER. Non-puddling sprinkler. Covers up 
to 40' x 66' (2600 sq. ft.) Patented Turbo-Heart mechanism gives uniform coverage 

SPOTRAIN 35 5-PATTERN SPRINKLER. Dial 5 multi-pattern sprinkler. 5 sprinklers 
in one: 35' diameter circle or half circle, 35' square, 15' x 40' rectangle, or 6' x 60' 

s p r i n k I er. 1160 2-c 

in all watering positions. 1015 2- D 

strio. 2150 2- E 

I CORDLESS ORASS SHEAR Hardened 
steel blades cut clean and fast. Trims 
JP to 30 minutes on a slngle charge. 
ilecharger included. 8288 2-6 

BRAS§ HOSE NOZZLE. Adjustable nozzle for Ilght us8 or 
lightweight hose. Spray to full stream. N-29C 

s u m  13.991 
I 518" x 50' SOFT & SUPPLE0 PRE- 

MIUM RU66ERlVlNYL REINFORCED 
GARDEN HOSE. Heavy-duty fiveply 
construction. Heavy-duty brass coup 

112" x 50' EARTH QUENCHERTM BLEED- 
ER-SOAKER HOSE. For even irrigation. Re- 
duces evaporation under mulch. Lay hose 
on ground, or bury a few inches below sur- 
.face. ERt250 2-1 

W UTILITY KNIFE. ~ e t r a c -  

2.88 
6.99 

table, 3 cutting positions. 
Two extra blades in han- 
dle. 10-099SP 7-E 

ERS. Drop forged steel, 
Fully polished. vinyl grip I handles. 113 7-F 

10" GROOVE LOCK PLt- 
8.88 

13.89 

BOX SAW. 18" length. 
Super-fast cutting teeth 
cut clean. 15-334SP 7-G 
LEATHER HAMMER & 
TAPE HOLDER With I BELT. Rivet reinforced. 7-H 

16 Or. NAIL HAMMER. 
Fully polished octagon 
face and neck, hickory 
handle. DO16 7-1 
10" CHROME PLATED 
ADJUSTABLE WRENCH. 
1-118" solid grip. capacity ACIIOV jaws give 7-J 

12.89 
8.99 

RULE. Positive toggle 
lock. Cushioned blade I return. 8325 7-K 
3 Plece AUGER BIT 

13.99 SET. 1/4n, 318" and 112" 
sizes in a plastic hang- 
UD roll. 49999 7-L 

CURVED HANDLE WlRE SRUSH. 3 x 19 rows of 1" bristles 
set in 1" x 13%" wood handle. 67-0952, 1930 7-0 I 

+ 
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W 

49.99 
14.89 

52" CEILING FAN. Your choice of the Seville with a polished 
brass finish or the Crown with an antique brass finish. Both have 5-A 
four blades. 

4 BULB CEILING FAN LIGHT KIT. 4 bulb tulip light design. 5-0 
Y401A 

H F3221 PB, H F3221 AB 

- 

4,49 
65 or 120 Watt MISER FLOODLIGHT. 1.49 Uses fewer watts to produce the illumi- 

6,88 20" Designed 3-SPEED for durability PORTASLE and BOX long FAN. life. 19.99 
Stabilizing support feet and thermally- 12" 3-SPEED OSCILLATING FAN. Push- 

WEATHERPROOF LANTERN With BATTERY. It floats! 
Break-resistant case features watertight switch. Ln- 
cludes 6-voit batterv. 1Q8W B 4-A 

protectedhotof. Very fine mesh grille for button controls, lowest 3150s possible energy 5-E 
added safetv. 5-D consumption. 4723 

4 Pack INSIDE FROST LIGHT BULBS. Your choice of 40,60, 75 or 
100 watts. 40A, 60A, 75A, 100A 4-8 75PAR/FUWM, ISOPARIFLMIM 4-C 1 nation of a standard floodlight. 

I 

I 
FIRE EXTINGUISHER. 
All-purpose fire extin- 
guisher for the home. 

SMOKE DETECTOR. 
Test button & low battery I indicator. 0905 5-G 

I10 5- F 

OUSTBUSTER CORDLESS VACUUM. 
Powerful motor picks up messes eas- 
ily. Large, easy-to-empty bowl. Wash- 
able filter. Lightweight, comfort-grip 
handle. Continuously 9330 recharges 5- in L 
storage base. 

11" x 17" BULLETIN BOARD. Easy to 
hang natural cork bulletin boards are 
useful at home, office, church, school 
and clubs. 1900 

.BOARD. 17" x 23" BULLETIN 19010 5-1 2.8i 

MERMU! 
r, / - m u 1  

I UNBREAKABLETMQUART BOTTLE. 
Holds 34.2 02. Insulated, stopper main- 
tains temperature. Rugged molded-in 
side handle for firm grip. 4415 4-E 

lI.88 
4.88 

CO M BIN AT ION PA 0 LOCK. Key I es s 
convenience. Smooth 3-number dial- 
ing. Strong double-wal I construct ion. 
Stainless steel outer case. 15000 5-J 

112 Gal. THERMAL JUG With SPOUT. 
Easy to handle. Keeps drinks cold or 
hot for hours. Up & out spout for easy 
pouring. &year warranty. 1522 4-F 

24" SUP'R BRUTEM PUSH BROOM. 
Tough palmyra bristles. Ideal for 
sweeping wet or dry shavings, rubbish, 

I 
* -  

ASSORTED 4' x 6' CARPET REMNANT 
RUG RUNNER. Fine quality broadloom car- 
peting to-wal I. for hails, high traffic areas, over watl- 1 S486 ,.I 

__*_ __x _x__I_______ _ _ _  _ _ _  _ _  - _ _  - - 

MURPHY OIL SOAP. Cleans wood sur- 
faces and more! 01180 5 P  

50' GREENLINE PLAsTlC COATED STEEL 
WIRE CUTTHESLINE. Greater flexibility with 
no loss of strength. Low tensile, for ease in 

WHITE CANVAS WORK GLOVES. 8 OL canton flannel with 
light blue wrist. 49A J I 1%" WAROED PADLOCK. Durable laminat- 

ed steel body. Self-locking shackle. Pair of 
500-0 4-1 keys included. 

78 
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