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Rain hurts 

farmers, 

washes 

out roads 
The reported 3-5 inches of 

rain that fell last Saturday 
and early Sunday was bad 
news for farmers and for 
roads. 

“We went from dry to 
rather wet to extremely wet 
conditions, ” commented 
Tuscola County Extension 
Director Bill Bortel. 

The mostly seriously af- 
fected crop was dry beans, 
if in standing water, since 
it is the most sensitive to 
excess moisture. I f  it gets 
too hot too soon, the beans 
will cook. 

If the soil gets baked, that 
would tnake it hard for 
plants to push through the 
crust. 

Bortel predicted many 
bean fields that got too wet 
will have to be replanted. 

The rain also caused 
hardships for farmers who 
still have dry beans, soy- 
beans and corn to plant, 
who were already behind 
schedule because of the wet 
spring. 

Each day of delay now 
means a reduced chance 
yet to,be planted crops will 
have a chance to riprn bc- 
‘ore the first frost. Thc 
latest corn and soybeans 
can be planted with a 50 per- 
cent chance, at best, they 
will ripen before the frost is 
July 1, Bortel said. Dry 
beans can be planted up to 
July 10 and still have a 50-50 
chance of ripening. 

The heavy rains meant a 
“lot” of washouts, accord- 
ing to Tuscola County Road 
Commission Clerk Jim 
Aiklovic, who didn’t have a 
specific number available. 

They were scattered 
throughout the county, 
mostly dirt roads but a few 
asphalt ones as  well. 

Road Cornmission work- 
ers  were repairing the dam- 
age Monday and Tuesday. 

One casualty was the veh- 
icle of Mathijs Arens 11, 18, 
of Carsonville. Tuscola 
-heriff’s deputies reported 
Ire was northbound on 
White Creek Road, south of 
Legg Road, at 1:30 a.m.  
Monday when his vehicle 
bottomed out when it hit a 
washout, resulting in exten- 
sive damage to the under- 
side. 

Arens said he was driving 
30-35 miles per hour when 
he hit the washout. 

Teacher remembered 
after 40 years 
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KEVIN ANTHONY, SITTING ON HIS HOSPITAL BED 
Saturday, felt much better than when he first went there 
June 12. “It felt like I was inside a microwave oven,” he 
said of his being struck by lightning. He went home 
Tuesday. 

At Hills &Dales 

Layoffs one sign 
of financial crunch 

By Mike Eliasohn 

From a business 
standpoint, hospitals used 
to be not much different 
than hotels. As long as most 
beds had someone in them, 
they were making money. 

That still is true for 
hotels, but for hospitals, the 
longer a bed is occupied by 
one patient, it may mean 
the more money it is losing. 

F - 
HILLS AND DALES General 

Hospital Director of Finance Keith 
Adelberg often has financial reports 
piled on his desk as he keeps track of 
whether the hospital is running in the 
red or black. 

The rules of the game 
have changed, so much so 
that when Hills and Dales 
General Hospital Director 
of Finance Keith Adelberg 
was asked by the Chronicle 
if the hospital will be in bus- 
iness five years from now, 
he responded, “That’s what 
employees a re  asking. It all 
depends on if we can con- 
tain costs and keep doctors 
here.” 

One sign of the changing 
times is that the Cass City 
hospital has fewer 
employees than it once did. 
Nineteen have been laid off, 
leaving the equivalent of 
125 full-time employees. 
Some have been called 
back temporarily when the 
number of patients in- 
creases. Those who lost 
their jobs were nurses 
aides, licensed practical 
nurses and housekeepers. 

Some employees who 
didn’t lose their jobs a re  
working fewer hours. 

For the fiscal year that 
ended March 31, the hospi- 
tal lost $38,896. 

A drastic change came 
April 1, when the federal 
government started a 2?4 
year phase-in of a new 
method of reimbursing hos- 
pitals for the cost of treat- 
ing Medicare (elderly) pa- 
tien ts. 

It marks the latest 
change in the way hospitals 
a re  paid for their services. 

like most hospitals, gets 
most of its revenue from 
three sources. During the 
1983-84 fiscal year, 42 per- 
cent of its gross revenue of 
$5.96 million came from 
Medicare; 25 percent from 
Blue Cross, and 10 percent 
from Medicaid. Much of the 
remainder comes from 
other private insurance 
companies. 

Medicaid, which pays for 
health care for the poor, is 
funded equally by the state 
and federal governments. 

In what might be called 
the good old days, the vari- 
ous insurers reimbursed 
hospitals based on the hos- 
pital’s costs to provide the 
service. 

HILLS AND DALES, 

But as hospital costs es- 
calated, they changed their 
method of reimbursement. 
They now pay on the basis 
of “costs,” rather than 
“charges. ” 

If they all paid on the 
basis of charges, Adelberg 
explained, Hills and Dales 
would have had a profit of 
$460,000 in 1983-84, rather 
than a loss. 

the insurers a re  now saying 
what they will pay for and 
how much, which doesn’t 
reflect the total cost of run- 
ning the hospital. 

For instance, Hills and 
Dales’ malpractice insur- 
ance premium last year 
was $36,082. Medicare, 
which represents 42 per- 
cent of the hospital’s busi- 
ness, previously would 
have paid 42 percent of that 
premium. Now it only pays 
5.1 percent. 

Medicaid puts a limit on 
how much of inflationary 
cost increases it will ab- 
sorb, Hills and Dales’ costs 
went up 5.8 percent last 
year, Adelberg said, which 
was less than the national 
average for hospitals, but 
Medicaid only paid on the 
basis of a 5.5 percent in- 
crease. That meant a loss 
of $37,000 in reimburse- 
ments. 

In fact, Medicaid only 
pays fixed fees for services, 
which is less than the 
“costs” that Medicare and 
Blue Cross paid. That was 
an additional loss of $45,000. 

in an effort to further con- 
trol insurers’ costs, is what 
are called diagnosis related 
groups (DRGs).. Medicare 
started phase-in of its DRG 
program April 1 and 
Medicaid will do the same 
starting Oct. 1.  Blue Cross 
has a pilot DRG project un- 
derway at selected hospi- 
tals and presumably will 
implement such a program 
statewide. 

The Medicare and 
Medicaid DRG programs 
will be in effect nationwide. 

Patients insured by Med- 
icare or Medicaid will be 

Please turn to page 16. 

IN SIMPLE TERMS, 

THE NEWEST CHANGE, 

l’wgce a survivor 

Anthony survives 
bout with lightning 

W 

If Kevin Anthony were a 
cat, he would have seven 
lives left. 

He has been struck by right foot. struck. 

said. It spanned the gap be- Contrary to myth, light- 
tween his hands and exited ning does strike twice. Mo- 
through his left knee and ments later, a second bolt 

lightning twice and is still 
around to tell about it. 

The last time was Tues- 
day, June 12, shortly after 
8 p.m. 

The Spencer Road, Ubly, 
resident was in the process 
of connecting the antenna 
wire to his television when 
the 30-foot antenna tower 
outside was struck by light- 
ning. 

Anthony, 30, had a 
jackknife in his right hand 
and was holding the wire in 

. his left. His hands were 
about six inches apart. “I 
could watch the arc ,”  he 

That wasn’t all it did. “I 
remember flying over the 
chair and hitting the firep- 
lace. It was a thrill.” The 
bolt of electricity threw An- 
thony about 10 feet, and “If 
the fireplace was not there, 
I think I would have gone 
outside. ” 

While flying through the 
air, his daughter, Michelle, 
4, got tangled in his legs. 
“That part I don’t re- 
member .” 

His wife, Jean, was in the 
kitchen, with their son, 
Christopher, 2, when the 
lightning struck. 

FOR ANTHONY, WHO 
was conscious through his 
ordeal, “The only part that 
scared me was the first five 
or 10 minutes. I didn’t know 
if I was having a heart at- 
tack or not. I couldn’t even 
get off the floor.” 

Fortunately, he didn’t 
have a heart attack. His 
pain subsided, but didn’t go 
away. (His doctor has told 
him the electric shock ex- 
panded his heart, which 
causes pressure that he 
feels. The heart is being 
treated with drugs.) 

More jobs in Tuscola 
County i s  j ob  of new 
development director 

First of two parts 

Lydia iVkienga’s job is 
jobs. 

As the first director of the 
Tuscola County Economic 
Development Corp. -- she 
started March 26 -- “Our 
main goal is to get jobs into 
the county.” 

That means such things 
as  working to keep busines- 
ses here, helping them ex- 
pand and developing new 
ones, aiding commercial 
development and promot- 
ing tourism. 

She recently met with 
Cass City Retail Committee 
members to explore ideas 
for Cass City’s downtown. 

Kingston merchants are  
also interested in downtown 
improvements, she said, 
and Car0 is exploring estab- 
lishment of a downtown de- 
velopmen t authority 
(DDA) to finance 
downtown improvements. 
Vassar already has a DDA. 

For Miss Wielenga, 
whose background includes 
downtown development, 
such improvements can 
have a double benefit. 

The obvious one is the be- 
nefits to merchants if a bet- 
ter downtown means more 
shoppers. 

In addition, an attractive 
downtown can be an incen- 
tive for tourists to stop. 

Compared to the 
shoreline areas that Huron 
and Sanilac County have, 
Tuscola County seemingly 
doesn’t have much to offer 
tourists, “but we have the 
roads that lead to those 
(shoreline) communities.” 

“They’re all nice small 
communities,” she said of 
the towns in Tuscola 
County, and people from 
the big cities like to stop in 
small towns, 

“We don’t have the 
beaches, but they (tourists) 
have to come back (from 
the beaches). We can be- 
nefit from the tourism pos- 
sibilities. Tourists spend 
money, that’s a fact, and 
dollars make jobs.” 

Farms which offer bed 
and breakfast and pick- 
your-own fruit and vegeta- 
ble farms are  possibilities 
for attracting tourists. 

Miss Wielenga may be 
working with the EDC di- 
rectors in Huron, Sanilac 
and Lapeer Counties on a 
tourism marketing plan for 
the Thumb, and also on 
promoting business and in- 
dustry. “One of the things 
fairly clear is that as  a 
county, it’s hard to do mar- 
keting and have an im- 
pact.” 

ALTHOUGH HER JOB 
is to promote Tuscola 
County, she commented, 

“If we get a business in the 
county, that helps the whole 
Thumb,’‘ so that works for 
other counties as well. 

“One thing we have to get 
over is competition (bet- 
ween communities),” she 
continued. “I think there is 
a growing understanding 
what helps one helps all.” 

An example of such coop- 
eration, is the call she re- 
ceived from the Sanilac 
economic development di- 
rector. An industry in that 
county needed an already 
existing building for quick 
expansion and there wasn’t 
one suitable in Sanilac, so 
she is working with the firm 
to find a suitable building 
in Tuscola. 

She is compiling a list of 
vacant industrial buildings 
and building sites in the 

county. The Michigan De- 
partment of Commerce 
wants that done for all 
counties with the goal of en- 
tering all such information 
on a computer. 

Most promising avenues 
for industrial expansion, 
Miss Wielenga said, are  
auto parts suppliers -- Tus- 
cola being close enough to 
auto manufacturers who 
want parts delivered “just 
in time,” to avoid 
warehousing costs -- and 
ones that make use of the 
area’s agricultural re- 
sources. 

One of her tasks is to 
serve as a clearing house 
for businesses seeking in- 
formation about obtaining 
and whom to contact to 

Please turn to page 4. 
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Being struck by lightning 

was only the start  of his 
ordeal. His wife called his 
brother’s wife, who called 
for an ambulance. 

The Cass City ambulance 
was dispatched, but on the 
way to the fire hall, the 
emergency medical techni- 
cian who was to go on the 
run was in an accident. The 
ambulance went to that ac- 
cident. 

The Ubly ambulance was 
then dispatched. It was 
about 40 minutes from the 
time Anthony was struck 
by lightning until it arrived 
and took him to Hills and 
Dales General Hospital. 
The ambulance crew took 
his blood pressure and told 
him it was “past stroke 
level. ” 

chargrd from the hospi- 
tal Tuesday and now must 
spend a couple of weeks at 
home recuperating before 
he can return to work. He 
spoke to the Chronicle from 
his hospital bed Saturday. 

By then, he still had chest 
pains and he was corlnected 
to a heart monitor. His 
other injuries consisted of 
what he called welder’s 
burn to his eyes from seeing 
the intensely bright arc  and 
a slight burn to his knee 
where the iightning exited. 
“I figured I’d lose my toes 
(from where the arc  also 
exited), but they’re still 
there. )’ 

Anthony does plumbing, 
heating and electrical work 
for Peruski Hardware in 
Ubly, is co-owner with his 
brother, Kim, of Anthony’s 
Party Shoppe on M-53, 
south of M-81, so works 
there part-time, and also 
feeds some cattle. 

As an electrician, among 
other things, Anthony 
knows enough not to con- 
nect an antenna to a televi- 
sion during a lightning 
storm. 

The irony was there 

Please turn to page 10. 

ANTHONY WAS DIS- 

DOWN THE HOLE -- All the water in the back yard at the 
Robert and Lillie A d a m  home at the corner of Church and 
Oak Streets had to go some place. Mrs. Adams stands by 
the sinkhole that was created in their back yard Sunday 
morning, It measures about 10 feet across and six feet 
deep. Possibly a cistern was located there, 
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Cass City Social and Personal Items 
Phone 872-3698 Mrs. Reva Little 

Twenty-nine youth from 
the Ehangelical Free 
Church will be attending 
church camps during the 
summer and include Bay 
Shore camp at  Sebewaing, 
Romeo, Spring Hill camp 
at  Evart and Harakel camp 
at Fairview. Attending will 
be Connie and David 
Clayton, Catherine and 
David Coe, Amy and Mike 
Francis, Mike, Tina and 
Tracy Furness, Steve Ham- 
mett J r . ,  Jeff and Andy 
Jeung, Douglas and Mike 
Kelley and Diana and Julie 
Loomis. Others listed are  
Kathy and Terri Leino, Tim 
Lockwood, Annmarie 
Lynch, Matt, Troy and 
Shawna Peasley, Amy, 
Darren and Steve Ross, 
Brent and Greg Sturtevant 
and Laura Taylor. Camp 
sessions begin June 25. 

Chris McConnell of 
Berkley, son of Mr, and 
Mrs. David Nordquist, is 
spending the summer at  the 
home of his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Vern McCon- 
nell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Perry were in East Lansing 
June 9 to attend graduation 
of MSU students. Their 
grandson, Bradley Holt, 
was graduated from the 
school of business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dorus 
Klinkman had as supper 
guests Monday evening, 
her sister, Beatrice 
Sternberg of Bad Axe, and 
their brother and his wife, 
Mr, and Mrs. Robert Jarvis 
of Apache Jct . ,  Ariz. The 
Jarvises are  leaving to 
make their home in Arizona 
permanently. Mr. and Mrs. 
Dorus Klinkman, Janet 
McGuire and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Klinkman and family 
attended a picnic Sunday at  
the Jarvis cabin near Oak 
Beach. 

Mrs. Cindy DeRocco and 
daughters Rachel and 
Andrea of Utica and Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry R. 
McClorey and daughter 
Shannon of Gagetown were 
visitors Sunday at  the home 
of Mrs. Glenn McClorey. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Perry 
and son Troy returned 
home Monday from 
Chicago where they spent 
the week end with Mr. 
Perry’s sister, Janet Perry. 

Mr, and Mrs. Harold 
Perry were in Plymouth 
Friday and attended the 
Mayflower induction at  the 
Athletic Hall of Fame. 
Saturday they visited rela- 
tives and friends in the De- 
troit area. 

VERA and JAMES 
MacTAVISl1 Mr. and Mrs. Bill Robin- 

son of Council Bluffs, Iowa, 
arrived at  Lena Patch’s 
Wednesday to spend a few 
days with friends in this 
area.  They spent Thursday 
with relatives in Saginaw 
and returned home Satur- 
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Craig spent the week end 
with their daughter and 
son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ron Decker near Big 
Rapids, and returned home 
Monday. 

A family dinner was held 
Saturday, June 9, at the  
Bavarian Inn in Franken- 
muth to celebrate the 50th 
wedding anniversary of 
Mr. and Mrs. James Mac 
Tavish of N.  Sccgcr Street, 
Cass City. 

MacTavish and Vera 

was employed at Mac and 
Leo Service and Mrs. Mac- 
Tavish, a registered nurse, 
worked at Plcwant Home 
Hospital and Hills and 
Dales General Hospital. 

l‘hcy arc mc.mt)ers of 1 ) ~ ~ -  
ford Coininunity Church. 

Richard Spaulding of 
Flint spent Thursday with 
his brother, Cleo Spaulding. Visitors Friday at  the 

home of Mrs. Glenn 
McClorey were her grand- 
son and -family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert McClorey and 
sons Robbie and Billy of 
Owendale. 

Kathy and Terri Leino 
and Douglas Kelley leave 
Saturday for Ames, Iowa, 
to attend the Evangelical 
Free Church Centennial 
National Youth Council for 
a week. 

Harry Wentworth, Ruby 
Thorne and Lena Patch at- 
tended the 50th wedding an- 
niversary of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gail Wentworth in Dryden 
Saturday. 

Mudge were married June 
9, 1934, at the home of her Marriage Licenses Mr. and Mrs. Max Agar 

were in Lapeer Tuesday of 
last week to attend a reun- 
ion of cousins of Mrs. Agar. 
Fifteen attended from 
Canada, Pontiac, Flint, 
Mayville, Lapeer, Capac 
and Cass City. 

brother, Clare Mudge, in 
Grosse Pointc Park. They 
lived in Detroit until mov- 
ing to Cass City in 1937. 

Mr. and Mrs. MacTavish 
have one daughter, Ann 
(Mrs. James)  Sting, Col- 
umbus, Ind.; one son, 
James,  Cass City, and three 
grand c h i 1 d re n , a 1 1 a t t t k  n d 
ing college. 

Their family, plus M r .  
and Mrs. Ottornar Sting of 
Owendale and James 
Haggerman of Three Hiv- 
ers were at  the dinner. 

Both retired, MacTavish 

1 ) a l c b  W. I3olsky, Carsoti- 
ville, arid Susan M .  Thane, 
Cam.  

Dale S. Marshall, Mar- 
lettc, and Margaret A. Gid- 
dings, Mayville. 

1)avid J .  T t r h s h ,  Caro, 
and Jill A. L3aucr, Vassar. 

Paul A .  ICegncrus, Cass 
City, arid Virginia M.  
Gibas, C a s s  City. 

Valcntino A.  Piazza, Vas- 
sa r ,  and Connie J. Esckel- 
son, Vassar. I 

Jay €3. Frilcy, Caro, and 
Judith E. Marleton, Caro. 

Timothy B. Noah, 
Houma, La., and Kathleen 
N.  Clark, Houma. 

llavid €1. Matthews, 
Mayville, and I3onnie S. 
White, Mayville. 

Robert H. Thompson, 
Marshalltown, Iowa, and 
April A .  Childs, Mayville. 

Jeffrey A .  Croft, Pontiac, 
and Koxanntk I). Kochler, 
Kingston. 

Ralph 1,. See J r . ,  Irnlay 
City, and Sheryl I , .  Christle, 
C’ a r 0 . 

Stanley E. Woodruff, 
Cass City, and Teresa M.  
Turnbull, Cass City. 

Larry I,. VandcMark, 
Akron, and Gloria J .  Hill, 
A k riin 

Mrs. Edward Stoutenburg 
Frederick McClorey was 

home for the week end from 
the VA Hospital in Ann 
Arbor. 

Graydon Agar of Old- 
smar,  Fla., called his pa- 
rents, Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Agar, Father’s Day and to 
report the birth of the first 
grandchild of the Graydon 
Agars. A girl, Lauran 
Christine, was born June 15 
to Mr. and Mrs. Michael 
Manning, the former Holly 
Agar, of Jacksyvi l le ,  Ark. 
The baby is the ninth great- 
grandchild of the Max 
Agars. 

Twenty-seven junior and 
senior high youth attended 
a barbecue Wednesday 
evening, June 13, at the 
home of Rev. and Mrs. 
Eldred Kelley. They en- 
joyed a song fest directed 
by Joni Umpfenbach and a 
scavenger hunt. Rev. Kel- 
ley led the devotions. Gifts 
were presented to Gary and 
Cindy Bader and Mr.  and 
Mrs. Paul Bliss who have 
been in charge of the youth 
groups for the past year. 
Joni 1Jmpfenbach will con- 
tinue her work with the 
senior high group for the 
coming year. There will be 
no further group meetings 
until September. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Culon of Canada visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee €€endrick 
from Wednesday till Satur- 
day. The couples are  
neighbors in Florida. 

Trinity United Methodist 
Church was the scene of a 
candlelight wedding ser- 
vice Saturday, May 19, at 
seven o’clock when Susan 
E. Knight, daughter of Mrs. 
Dorothy Knight of Cass City 
and David Knight of Caro, 
became the bride of Ed- 
ward J .  Stoutenburg, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Eldon 
Stoutenburg of Cass City. 
Rev. James Et. McCallum 
officiated. 

Given in marriage by her 
brother, Tim Knight of East 
Lansing, the bride wore a 
gown with a high neckline 
and long sheer bishop 
sleeves. The fitted bodice 
featured a Schiffle embroi- 
dered yoke with Chantilly 
lace ruffles falling over the 
shoulders. The gently 
shaped A-line skirt and 
semi-cathedral train of 
chiffonet were touched with 
tiers of Chantilly lace ruf- 
fles. A matching wreath of 
flowers held her fingertip 
veil secure. She carried her 
mother’s white Bible co- 
vered with an orchid and 
two sweetheart roses. 

Matron of honor was 
Karen Brown of Grand 
Rapids, friend of the bride. 
Maid of honor was Kim 
Witherspoon of Ypsilanti, 
friend of the bride, and 
bridesmaids were Elaine 
Stoutenburg of Canton, sis- 
ter of the groom, and Julie 
Fishman of Bloomfield 
Hills, friend of the bride. 

Their floor-length gowns 
of chiffon over taffeta fea-  
tured dropped shoulders 
trimmed with lace and tiny 
ribbon bows. The full skirts 
ended in a ruffle of the same 
material. Each gown was a 
different color, blue, laven- 
der, yellow and pink. The 
wreaths they wore were 
identical to the bride’s. 
They carried lighted brass 
hurricane lamps decorated 
with daisy mums, greens 
and ribbon streamers to 
match their gowns. 

Flower girl was Heather 
Brown and Jackie hiZikula 
of East Lansing was 
candlelighter a 

Best man was Skip 
Speirs, friend of the groom, 

and groomsmen were Ear-  
ney Stoutenburg, brother of 
the groom, Dave Heacock 
and Jerry Langmaid, 
friends of the groom. 

Ushers were Joel Eaton 
of Farmington Hills, cousin 
of the bride, and Scott Mil- 
ler, Cass City, cousin of the 
groom, 

Helen and Don Green 
leaf, cousins of the bride, 
were pianist and organist 
and Lewis Tibbits of Scbe- 
waing sang “A Wedding 
Prayer,” “The Wedding 
Song” and “The Lord’s 
Prayer.” 

For her daughter’s wed- 
ding, Mrx. Knight chose a 
floor-length gown of light 
blue crepe with ;I jacket of 
deeper blue lace. Thr 
groom’s mother wore tht  
same shade of blue with a 
sleeveless lace coat. Both 
mothers wore orchid cor- 
sages. 

Following the ceremony, 
the newlywed couple 
greeted friends and rela- 
tives at ;1 rcccption at  the 
Novesta Church of Christ. 
Thc decorated cake was 
made by the groom’s 
cousin, Mrs. Art Caister. 

The groom attended Kirt- 
land Community College 
and is now employed at  
Walbro Engineering. The 
bride is a graduate of 
Michigan State University 
with a degree in education. 

After a wedding trip 
through northern Michigan 
and Canada, they are  mak- 
ing their home in Cass City. 

Mrs. Andrew Kozan at- 
tended a special meeting of 
the DAV Auxiliary Monday 
evening at  the home of Mrs. 
Everett Heatley, Cleaver 
Road. Caro. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman 
Blue and family of Mil- 
lington were Sunday after- 
noon visitors a t  the Vern 
McConnell home. Mr. and 
Mrs. Stan Guinther were 
evening callers. 

A district get-together of 
Lutheran youth groups will 
be held Sunday in Cass City 
Recreation Park.  Eight 
churches a re  participating. 
A pig roast will be held, 
serving a t  5 p.m. At 7 p.m. 
there will be a couple of con- 
certs and a dance is 
scheduled from 9 until 11 
p.m. 

Tony Doerr of Austin, 
Tex., is spending a month 
with his mother, Mrs. 
Philip Doerr. 

Mr. and Mrs. Garrison 
Stine spent Tuesday and 
Wednesday of last week in 
Ionia with their sons, Scott 
and Randy Stine. 

Mr. andMrs. E. Carmack 
Smith had with them for the 
week end, their grand- 
daughters, Penny Wheeler 
of Brighton and Betsy 
Wheeler of Fenton. Satur- 
day afternoon callers were 
Mr. and Mrs. Dean Stine 
and family of Hastings. 

Ernie Wilhelmi of 
Plymouth brought his 
mother, Mrs. Lilah 
Wilhelmi, home Saturday 
after she had spent a week 
with relatives in the Detroit 
area.  pHe returned home 
Sunday. 

The Chronicle will 
only use photographs 
with wedding stories if 
they are  received within 
two months of the wed- 

Photographs can be in 
black and white or c!olor. 

Mrs. Philip Doerr spent 
the week end of June 8-10 
with the Robert Doerrs in 
Kalamazoo. 

Mr. and Mrs. Garrison 
Stine had their entire fam- 
ily with them over the week 
end, Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
Stine and family of Hast- 
ings, Scott and Randy Stine 
of Ionia and joining them 
Sunday were Mr .  and Mrs. 
Ivan Stine and son of Ubly, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roger 
Nicholas and family of 
Kawkawlin and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ken Marker and fam- 
ily of Essexville. 
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6550 Main Slrwt Jim and Julie (Groth) 
Mulligan of Norfolk, Va., 
were called home June 3 by 
the death of his brother, Ed 
Mulligan of Troy. They vis- 
ited Dale Groth arid the 
Robert Groths Sunday and 
Monday, June 10-1 1 , before 
returning to Norfolk. 

Mrs. Charles Tuckey re- 
turned home Sunday after 
spending a week with Mr. 
and Mrs: R. Charles Tuc- 
key and sons who were 
movingfrom Ann Arbor to 
Dexter. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
McArthur were Father’s 
Day guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert McArthur. The fam- 
ily also celebrated the 
birthdays of Stanley McAr- 
thur and Robert McArthur 
which are this week. 
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Robin L . Ha u buns t r ic k er  , 
Rtv3c. 

Kent D. Graf, Caro, and 
Lisa A. Baur, Fl int .  

Clifford Crossett, Caro, 
and Melody A. Putnam, 
Caro. 

Gary L. Zuehlsdorff and 
Kathleen M. Coffman, both 
of Portland, Ore. 

Robert L. Brashaw, Vas- 
sa r ,  and Catherine L. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Ware 
had a s  dinner guests Thurs- 
day evening, Mr. and Mrs. 
David Ware, son Mike and 
daughter, Lisa Patera,  Mr. 
and Mrs. J im Ware and son 
DannSThey celebrated the 
birthday of Mrs. David 
Ware. 

Mrs. Konrad Konwalski 
is the replacement for Mrs. 
Patrick (Mary) Rabideau 
in charge of the meal-site 
for senior citizens. Noon 
meals a re  served Monday, 
Wednesday and Friday at  
Good Shepherd Lutheran 
Church. The food is brought 
here from Mayville. Senior 
citizens who wish to attend 
are  to call Mrs. Konwalski 
a t  872-2845 before 9 a .m.  

. .  - 
telephone 872.2010 Walker, Vassar 

Mr. and Mrs. William 
Patch of Harrison spent 
overnight Saturday with 
Lena Patch. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Hen- 
nessey, Sue Parker and 
children attended open 
house for Laurie Carbb in 
Flint Saturday. 

Cpl. James and Lori Jen- 
sen announce the birth of a 
daughter, Misty Lynn, June 
1 at  the Naval hospital a t  
Camp Pendleton, Cal. She 
weighed eight pounds and 
13 ounces and was 19l/2 in-. 
ches long. Grandparents 
a re  Ken and Georgine Jen- 
sen and Tom and Norajean 
Little of Cass City. Great- 
grandparents a re  Mr. and 
Mrs. Melvin Skarman of 
Duluth, Minn., Mr. and 
Mrs. A.G. Jensen of Phenix 
City, Ala., Mr, and Mrs. 
Wesley Boy1 of Kingston 
and Beatrice Little of Cass 
City. J im is stationed at 
Camp Pendleton with the 
US. Marine Corps. 

New Pieces of 

ROW POTTERY In. 

Mellody Putnam.June 23 
Bonnie White-June 30 

Julie Helwig-July 7 
Linda Heard -July 21 

Mandy Stevenson. Aug 4 -8 
“ B rides - T o- Be” 

Have Received A $5 00 
Gift Certificate For Registering 

At Next Door Neighbor 

,I John Bayley of Chino Val- 
ley, Ariz., arrived in Cass 
City Saturday to spend 
some time with his sister 
and brother-in-law, Mr. and 
Mrs, George W. Cook, 

-1 

I 

e 

Miss Rose Cook of Perry 
spent the week end at the 
home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. George W. Cook, 
to celebrate Father’s Day. 

Will Be 
Closed 

For the Day 

218 N. Stat& Car0 Pn. 673-3200 

ST. MICHAEL’S Mrs. Royce Russell and 
Mrs. George W. Cook spent 
from Wednesday through 
Friday at Alma College. 
They attended the Synodi- 
cal of the Covenant which 
includes Presbyterian 
churches in Michigan, 
Ohio, and Kentucky. 

INEZ and LESLIE BEACH 

on 
Wednesday, SUMMER Inez and Leslie Beach of Stanley Beach, 

5938 Walsh Road, Middletown, R.I., and Ross 
Gagetown, will celebrate Beach, East Lansing; three 
their golden wedding an- grandchildren, and one 
niversary Saturday with a great-grandchild, 
dinner a t  Sherwood on the 
Hill in Gagetown hosted by Hills and Dales 
their children. 

Little gets 
religious June 27th FESTIVAL I degree 4 = H  Livestock Beach and Inez Crawford Hoepital 

were married June 23,1934, 
in Gaeetown. BIRTHS: bachelor’s degree .~ in re]@- - . *  Club Dean Little received a Parrish Grounds 

T h G  have two children, ous education from wear 
Lakes Bible College in 
Lansing May 26. 

He has moved back to 
Cass City and is renovating 
a house on Cedar Run Road. 
Little and his wife Patricia 
are expecting a child in 
January. 

He is the son of Keith and 
Wanetta Little, 5163 E. 
Kelly road, and a 1974 Cass 
City High School graduate. 

Little is looking for a job 
working with young people. 

WllMOT June 12, to Mr. and Mrs. 
David (Jeanette) Ertman, 
Deford, a boy, Benjamin 
Alan. 

June 12, to Mr. and Mrs. 
Daniel (Patricia) Reidel of 
Sebewaing, a boy, Jeffery 
Daniel. 

June 17, to Mr. and Mrs. 
Scott (Judy) Martin, De- 
ford, a girl. 

picnic Sunday 
3 miles north of Kingston, Corner of 

Kingston and Bevens Roads 
The Cass City 4-H Lives- 

tock Club is holding its an- 
nual alumni and 4-H family 
picnic at the Cass City Re- 
creation Park Sunday, 
starting at  1 p.m. 

Everyone is asked to 
bring their own table ser- 
vice and a dish to pass. 

It will be under the trees 
near Church Street. 

SATURDAY, JUNE 23 
Mass at 4 p.m. 

Barbecue Chicken Dinner’ 
PATIENTS LISTED MON- 
DAY, JUNE 18, WERE: 

Mrs. Bette Hurford, Her- 
bert Ludlow, Edward 
Doerr, Otto Bacon, Mrs. 
Shirley Tuckey and Mrs, 
Beatrice Howard of Cass 
City ; 

Mrs. Norma Connolly of 
Deford; 

Mrs. Mary Lorencz of 

Potato, Salad Bar, Dessert, Beverage 

Adults $5.00, Under 12 $2.50 
Serving 5 to 8 p.m. 

SHELBY MUSIC EXPRESS 

Beer - Pop - Raffle 
Sponsored in Community lnterest by 

2 for 1 i 
SPECIAL I 

I 

3 Months s35°!am 1 
22 pieces ot Body I 11 A Great Selection of Sportswear II 

i 

ville. 1. ----,----------.-,- 1-1-a- 

Conditioning Equipment 
Francis Freeman of 1 Expires 6-29-84 

RodneySmithofDecker; 1 4 
Russell Hyde of Union- i Esther’s Health Spa 

. Owendale; 

Gagetown; 
6434 W Main Cass City 1- Mrs. Ina Reid of Caro; 

I 
VIS4 

The Trade Winds 
61 42 E. Cass City Road Phone 872-4050 Fine Wornen s Apparel The Cass City State Bank 
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Pav for the Full Cost 

Rabbit Tracks 
By John Haire 

(And anyone else he can 

So much for chic 
\ 

f 
By Jim Fitrgerald I 

home where he belongs.” 
Fried said business has 
been hurt by Rollins’ 
snobby tongue, and he was 
almost not kidding when he 
said the only one who 
should be barred from the 
Menage is Rollins. 

So there you are.  On me, 
my clothes aren’t dull 
enough to be rejected by 
the Menage, and on my 
overgrown son, they’re not 
Garage Sale enough. And I 
would have enjoyed Men- 
age, which is spacious, at- 
tractive and friendly, if it 
weren’t for the never-ceas- 
ing, always-blasting disco 
music that makes talking 
impossible. I like soft jazz 
and quiet conversation. 

So, on the way home, 
Nerd and I stopped a t  the 
scruffy little Club 101 in the 
old Tuller building in 
downtown Detroit to hear 
the marvelous Kris Lynn 
sing better than Nancy Wil- 
son. We apologized for our 
fashion statement. 

Last Saturday night, 
when I went to the Menage 
disco in downtown Pontiac, 
I wore the muted plaid 
sport shirt with the middle 
button missing that I’d put 
on when I got up that morn- 
ing to rearrange furniture. 
The fashion statement I 
wanted to make was that 
my wife gets angry when I 
dirty more than one shirt in 
one Over day. and below the shirt 

I wore the navy jacket and 
blah-beige trousers I often 
wear to summer funerals. 
My intention was to appear 
dull enough to be denied ad- 
mittance to Menage. But I 
did want Menage manage- 
ment to realize that I own 
a spiffy blue pin-striped 
suit, so I told my son Nerd 
to put it on and come with 
me. 

Nerd is three inches tal- 
ler than his father and 20 
pounds skinnier. He used 
a safety pin to keep the too- 
short pants from falling 
over his feet, upon which he 
wore sandals that showed 

land County’s most notori- 
ous divorce case. He 
wanted me to know he is a 
responsible, successful, 
self-made businessman. 
Which he surely is. 

But he also wanted me to 
know that once he asked his 
wife what she contributed 
to their partnership in re- 
turn for all the riches he 
lavished upon her. And she 
said she was the ,mos t  
beautiful woman in the 
world and he should be 
grateful to have such a 
breathtaking “ornament on 
his arm.” 

“She didn’t mention that 
she looks good because I 
bought her a new nose, a 
new chin and new breasts,” 
the husband said. 

How’s that for juicy gos- 
sip? But I couldn’t print it 
with names and addresses 
without first giving the wife 
a chance to deny her hus- 
band’s charges. And I am 
constitutionally unable to 
ask a woman if her nose, 
chin and breasts are true or 
false. What business is it of 

There’s no use waiting any longer for the Chamber of 
Commerce to plant flowers in front of buildings on the main 
stem. 

The Chamber isn’t doing it this year as it has in the past. 
It would be great if the plots that need it get a little tender 
loving care. 

The cost is small and it does help make Cass City a more 
pleasant place to shop. 

a*****  

It has been a fouled up year weather wise. Sunday there 
was more water in the Cass River than it usually gets in the 
spring. It rained so hard that ditches were filled. The water 
flowed over the number 2 tee a t  Rolling Hills and uprooted 
the markers and sent them spinning along on the tide. 

Actually the water did very little damage on the course. 
Nothing compared with what the vandals accomplished the 
previous week. 

SANILAC COUNTY 4-H’ERS visit Washington D.C. from June 9-16 
for learning and leadership training to enable them to better promote 
citizenship responsibilities and activities when they returned. Those on 
the trip, from left, were Grant Burgess, Holly Burgess, Jeff Eager and 
Sherry Wood, Brown City; Patrick McFarlane, Sandusky ; Lisa Steeb, 
Croswell; Julie Smith, Becky Severance, Decker; Kelly Rexer, Brown 
City; ’ Tanya Darr, Decker; Marcie Kautz, Croswell; Michelle 
Magraw, Marlette; Terri Darr, Decker; Monica Janes and Linda 
Boy ne, Mar let t e .  

*e**** 

Idle thought. One of these years the real heroes of the 
annual Harold Isard Open played a t  Rolling Hills will be 
pictured, instead of the tourney winners. 

They are the women who each year volunteer to fix the 
goodies that the players devour after the round is over. 

Some of them have been a t  it every year since the event 
began. 

No way will I try to name them. Suppose I missed one? 
Oh, woe! 

Men hospitalized 
his big toes to their best ad- mine? 
vantGe.  His a rms  stuck so Anyway, my Saturday @veri 
far out of the coat sleeves Night Plot at  Menage was 

*I**** 

with serious burns There has been progress since the last July 4 Festival. 
You’ll find it all detailed in the special sections coming your 
way next week. 

If out of area friends are  interested in Cass City they will 
enjoy this annual progress report. Make a note to send them 
a copy. 

that he appeared to be car- 
rying two white brooms. 
His shirt was blatant 
Hawaiian. 

It was a t  the behest of 
several editors that I vis- 
ited Menage, which is not 
my type of saloon. They 
lightheartedly suggested it 
would make a funny col- 
umn if I tried to get inside 
but couldn’t. I went along 
with the idea because I used 
to be an editor and I re- 
member how I pouted when 
a reporter failed to realize 
that my lighthearted 
suggestion was actually a 
direct order. 

Glitzv. hev-look-at-me 

to be turned away because 
my clothes were too dull or 
because my son’s were too 
Salvation Army. Richard 
Rollins, a co-owner, has re- 
cently gained the Menage 
much publicity by insisting 
that only dazzlingly dres- 
sed customers be allowed 
inside. Don’t you believe it. 

Nerd and I were wel- 
comed, and so was 
everyone else. No one was 
rejected during the three 
hours we were there, and 99 
percent of the customers 
were dressed for a Kiwanis 
picnic or the senior prom. 
The wildest thing I saw was 
“a well-known 

contract for 
military parts 

Two Sandusky men re- tal, Sandusky. The Foote 
main in the hospital with brothers were then flown 
serious burn injuries as the by helicopter to the St. still under investigation. 
result of a motor home exp- Mary’s burn center. 
losion June 10 in Evergreen Their father,  Robert 
Township. Foote Sr., 48, and mother 

Ronald Foote, 17, of 75 W. Donna, 48, of 75 W. Custer, 
Custer Road, was in critical were admitted to McKenzie 
condition this Wednesday and kept overnight. 

sion has not been deter- 
mined, and the accident is 

Corrections 
It was Kent Haag of Car0 

who was sentenced in Tus- 

The Walbro Automotive 
Products Group in Caro has 
received a contract to pro- 
vide $76,132 worth of elec- 
tric fuel pumps for the U.S. 
military services. 

The firm was awarded 
the contract by the Defense 
Construction Supply Center 
(DCSC) of Columbus, Ohio. 

With an inventory of over 
385,000 items, the center 
last year bought over $992 
million worth of items for 

The Weather 
High Low Precip. 

Wednesday . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 90 . . . . . 58 . . 0 
Thursday. . .  . . .  . .  . .  . .  . . . .  . .  . . 76 . . .  . . 44 0 
Friday . . .  . .  . . .  . .  . .  . .  . .  . . ..... 76 , , . . _  42 . . 0 
Saturday . . . . . . . . . . . . . . + .  . . . . 84 . . . . . 60 2 
Sunday,. , . . . , , . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 83 . . . . . . 62 . . 1.27 
Monday.. . . . . . . . , . . . . . . . . . . . . 85 . . , , . , 59 0 
Tuesday . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 88 . . . . . . -50 0 

. . 

. . 

. . 

. . 
(Recorded at  Cass City wastewater treatment plant.) 

morning at  St. Mary’s Hos- 
pital in Saginaw, with sec- 
ond- and third-degree burns 
over 60 percent of his body. 

His brother., Robert 
Foote Jr . ,  26, of 95 W. Cus- 
ter,  has been upgraded 
from critical to serious con- 
dition. He has second- and 
third-degree burns over 30 
percent of his upper ex- 
tremities. 

Robert and Ronald were 
working on the engine of 
the motor home when the 

Robert Jr.’s wife Sandra, 
25, and their children, Jen- 
nifer, 7,  and Robert 111, 5, 
were treated and released. 

The accident occurred on 
Shabbona Road, a half-mile 
east of Decker Road a t  5: 15 
p.m. The Footes were com- 
ing back from Franken- 
muth when they decided to 
stop to pick wild asparagus, 
according to Deputy Steve 
Lautner of the Sanilac 
County Sheriff’s Depart- 
rnnnt 

cola County Circuit Court 
for breaking and entering 
and larceny in a building, 
not Kenneth Haag as re- 
ported in last week’s 
Chronicle. 

places “like Mgnage should stockbroker” in tennis the military. 
be left to gossip columnists, shorts. 
and I’m lousv a t  gossis. I’ll Richard Rollins was 

Tammy Laurie, the 
newly hired home 
economics teacher a t  
Owendale-Gagetown High 
School, graduated from 
Michigan State University, 
not Central Michigan Uni- 
versity, as was reported. 

give you a kreat-example. nowhere to be seen and, be- 
Several weeks ago, a t  his fore leaving, I asked why. 
request, I visited with the Gary Fried, another co- 
husband involved in Oak- owner, *said Rollins “is GIMMICK 

On WEDNESDAV during the week of your Birthday, or on the Day of your 
Blrthday, receive a complimentary dinner with the purchase of a Second 
Dinner of equal or greater value from our dinner menu. 

L l l L L l L .  vehicle exploded. 
They and five other fam- “It ( the motor home) I t  was Dale Smerdon, not 

ily members, who were in wouldn’t start  and they Kevin Smerdon, on the 
the vehicle when it tried to fix it, and it just sixth grade honor roll at  

Cass City Intermediate exploded, were taken to blew,” he said. 
McKenzie Memorial Hospi- The cause of the explo- School. 

T he 

H ;ire 

-- 

Please present valid I.D. for verification 
CALL F O R  RESERVATIONS 

6625 r h d  s m i  ( , d g r f o n  n 66 5- 99 7 I Edward H. Doerr 

Does Your 

One of the reasons that 
employees are striking De- 
troit Edison is because the 
utility wants to make 
changes in health benefits. 

Edison wants the worker 
to pay part of any increase 
in costs for health care in- 
surance. 

Lee Iacocca says that 
Chrysler needs relief from 
health care benefits. The 
union says that health be- 
nefits are sacrosanct, not 
to be touched and so it goes. 

Health insurance has 
skyrocketed past the ability 
of many individuals to pay 
for it and been a cost factor 
that has driven smaller 
businesses to the wall. 

I suppose that if you have 
a secure job with 25 years 
or so seniority, demanding 
full health care is to your 
advantage. 

There may be a few indi- 
rect results that hurt a little 
for even the veteran 
employee. If a younger 
member of the family is 
looking for a job, benefit 
packages may be keeping 
him on the outside looking 
in. 

Industry is choosing to 
pay overtime rather than 
hiring extra persons. It’s 
cheaper to pay overtime 
than it is to pay benefits for 
an additional employee. 

Even for the fully co- 
vered employee these in- 
surance programs aren’t 
free. Every hospital must 
collect its costs. 

That brings us to the area 
that really is driving costs 
up the wall. It’s to the med- 
ical industry’s advantage 
to provide as much health 
service as can be wrung out 
of every case covered by in- 
surance. 

According to one report I 
read, now that second opin- 
ions are covered for elec- 
tive surgery the number of 
cases has decreased mar- 
kedly. It’s against human 
nature to expect physicians 
to worry about cutting costs 
when it’s their income that 
feels the squeeze. 

By far the biggest abus- 
ers of the insurance system 
are the users. Just  because 
it’s “free” they use it time 
after time when they could 
get by without it. 

That’s why a deductible 

on every policy is the only 
cost cutting device sure to 
reduce costs. 

Sooner or later I would 
think it’s going to be neces- 
sary to make it profitable 
for the user to see that 
health insurance is used 
only sary. when it is really neces- 

The average doctor now 
makes about $100,000 a year 
and if a sane insurance pol- 
icy were made mandatory 
for every user they might 
have to get by on a little 
less. 

On the brighter side they 
would not have to work as 
hard. 

‘ 1  of Contents tosses? 
Replacement cost cover- 
age in a Michigan Mutual 
h o m e o w n e r s  p o l i c y  
means you’ l l  get new 
items for used items de- 
stroyed by fire or other 
insured causes. Ask us 
about Replacement Cost 
Coverage for your con- 
tents. 

Doerr Agency 
6265 MainSt. 

Cass City 
Phone 872.361 5 ON THE CORNER IN PIGEON 

SINCE 1895 
Being on the corner in downtown Pigeon since 1895 has helped us to become 

a familiar bank in the upper thumb area. However, it’s our people that have made 
Thumb National Bank and Trust the bank you’ve come to trust for nearly 90 
years. We’ve tried hard to meet the growing financial needs of our customers 
over the years, adding new services to provide you with the highest interest 
rates allowable for your hard earned money, and providing you with loans when 
you needed them. Thumb National’s people have gotten to know our customers 
on a first name basis in Pigeon, and are trying to get to know all our customers 
who bank at our Cass City branch. Stop in at our Cass City branch and say hello. 
They’d like to get to know you, so they can better help you with your financial 
needs. The people you’ve grown to trust, are the people at Thumb National Bank 
and Trust. On the corner in Pigeon since 1895, and building a strong foundation 
in Cass City. Member FDIC. 

Open Every Day 
530 a.m. for breakfast 

3 Pancakes with 
2 Strips Bacon or $1 89 
2 Sausages ‘ I  - 

Good Till 11 a.m. Everyday 

I COUPON -------_- I 
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’ $20°0ff I , 
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on any large I 
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At Pizza Villa i 
With This Coupon I 

Take Out Orders Only 1 

Expires 6-3084 I 
One coupon per family I 

I 

I 

I 
I 

I 

Phone 872-4440 

- - -A I - - - - -  COUPON ---------- 

-------- 

“OUR PRIDE IS SHOWING” 



PAGE FOUR CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY. JUNE 21,1984 CASS CITY. MICHIGAN 

Coach Light windows damaged; 
.* U 

item stolen from burned home 
Three large windows 

Coach Light Pharmacy, 
6480 Main Street, were 
damaged, apparently by 
BB shots. 

Owner Mike Weaver re- 
ported to Cass City police 
Friday morning that the 4- 
by-6 foot front windows 
were damaged since 6 p.m. 
Tuesday, June 12. 

The holes, number un- 
specified in the police re- 
port, were 1-inch in diame- 
ter. Replacement cost of 
the windows was estimated 
at  $200-300 each. Also dam- 
aged was a 4-by-6 inch pane 
of glass in an outside light. 

Theft of a 6-foot wide 
brush cutter, valued at 
$600, from Hunt Construc- 
tion, 4452 West Street, was 
reported to village police 
Friday afternoon. 

It was taken since June 8 
from an outside storage 
area.  

Shirley Purvis of 1665 
Froede Road, Deford, re- 

ported to sheriff’s deputies 
June 12 that a rotary tiller 
and sewing basket and sci- 
ssors were stolen during the 
previous two weeks, while 
she and her family were liv- 
ing elsewhere because their 
house had burned. 

The tiller, worth $489 
when new, was outside a 
shed. The basket and sci- 
ssors were oustide the 
burned house. The thefts 
were discovered - _- June 11. 

A nine and a 12-year-old 
boy were to meet with the 
juvenile diversion officer 
after breaking two windows 
in a Gagetown area home 
and stealing $7.75 from a 
truck. 

The vandalism took place 
at  the home of Lyn A. 
Bolzman, on Dale Road, 
Gagetown, while he and his 
wife were at  work June 12. 
He reported the damage to 
sheriff’s deputies at 6 p.m. 
that day. 

A rear garage window, 
worth $25, and a sliding 
glass patio door, $100, were 
broken. Pry marks were 
found where an unsuccess- 
ful effort was made to 
break a door open to enter 
the house. 

The van inside the garage 
was entered, the glovebox 
contents ransacked, and a 
basketball taken, which 
was later returned. 

Investigating officers 
learned the two boys ear- 

lier, about 4 p.m., took $7.75 on a charge of operating a 
from a truck parked at  Dale motor vehicle under the in- 
and Green Roads, which fluence Of liquor after Stop- 
aided them in finding the ping her Pickup on Main 

Street, just east of Wood- boys. 
The boys returned the land Avenue, at 2: 15 a .m.  

money to the truck owner. Saturday after it was ob- 
One of their fathers agreed served crossing the Center- 
to make restitution to line. 
Bolzman and the case was She was released from 
turned over to the diversion the county jail later that 
officer . day after posting $100 bond. 

TWO 15-year-old boys will District court arraignment 
be petitioned into probate was scheduled June 25. 
court, charged with break- Village police arrested 
ing into video game Mark J. Mozden, of 6192 E. 
machines at the Charmont. Deckerville Road, Deford, 

Owner Clare Comment on a charge of operating a 
reported to Cass City police motor vehicle under the in- 
June 11 that two machines fluence of liquor after stop- 
were broken into during ping his Station wagon at  
daytime business hours and 3:45 a.m. Tuesday on 
$25-30 in quarters taken. Schwegler Road near Milli- 

A week earlier, he also gan Road after it was ob- 
reported, other machines served weaving. 
had been broken into and District court arraign- 

ment information was not $10-15 taken. 

the damage from breaking A W e a r - o l d  boy told 
into the machines was not CaSS City police a t  5: 25 p.m. 
available. The machines Sunday that he had been 
are  owned by Arlen Ban- shot in the posterior with a 

BB. The boy who shot it, nick of Bad Axe. 
Police determined who according to the victim, 

the boys were by checking then laughed and ran into a 
with local stores to find out house. 
who had brought in large The boy with the gun, 11,  
numbers of quarters. told police he was aiming at 

Each boy said the other a trash barrel. 
one had broken into the cause Police use took of air the guns gun within be- 
machines. 

Cass City police arrested village limits is a violation 
Patricia J .  Kababik, 31, of of village ordinance. 
5095 Pringle Road, Decker, Susan Baker of 6839 Her- 

Monetary loss because of immediately available. 

ron Drive told village police 
Monday that the right front 
tire on her car was cut Fri-  
day night. The tire was 
worth $70. 

Children are 
needed for 
baby contest 
Infants and toddlers a re  

needed for the Cass City 
High School Class of 1986’s 
Beautiful Baby contest. 

The competition will be 
held in the park July 4 from 
11 a.m.-5 p.m. People will 
pay 25 cents a vote for the 
most beautiful baby. 

To be eligible, a child 
must be three and under. 
Parents should send a re- 
cent photo of their child to 
Class of ’86 c/o Joe Leeson, 
4669 Hospital Drive, Cass 
City 48726. Photos will be 
accepted up to July 4.  

The winning child will re- 
ceive a trophy. Proceeds 
will help pay for the junior- 
senior prom. 

LYDIA WIELENGA, a native of Kalamazoo, is the new 
director of the Tuscola County Economic Development 
Corp. Her job is to work on activities that will create jobs in 
the county. 

More jobs in Tuscola County 
job  of development director 1 Advertise It 

In 

The Chronicle. 
a lower interest rate than 
other forms of financing. 

EIIC doesn’t sell the 
bonds. The seller and the 
recipient of the loan funds 
from their sale bear the 
risk. 

Lately, there hasn’t been 
much activity in sale of 
such bonds, Miss Wielenga 
explained, because Con- 
gress is considering 
taxing the interest paid on 
such bonds, possibly ret- 
troactive to any sold since 
Jan.  1, which removes the 
advantage of that form of 
firrancing . 

shares a small one-room of- 
fice in the Broadcast House 
building on Cleaver Road, 
Caro, with her secretary, 
Teresa Whitaker. 
As a full-time agency, it 

got started with a $38,580 
federal Job Training 
Partnership Act from the 
Thumb Area Employment 
and Training Consortium, 
which also gave similar 
grants to the EDCs or 
county development groups 
in Huron, Sanilac and 
1,apcer Counties. 

The initial grant expires 
June 30, but with only about 
$18,000 of it spent, Miss 
Wiclcnga hopes the remain- 
der can be carried over into 
the new fiscal year, which 
starts July 1 .  

For the 1984-85 fiscal 
year,  it has a JTPA grant 
pending from the consor- 
tium of $48,031, and has 
applied for an additional 
$14,794 to come from a diffe- 
rent J T P A  program. 

The remaining source of 
revmu(’, an estimated 
$7,000 for the EDC office’s 
first year, is from fees for 
issuing EDC bonds. 

The KI)C has a board of 
directors, with whom she 
meets once a month. 

MISS WIELENGA, 29, 
received a bachelor’s de- 
gree in landscape architec- 
ture from Michigan State 
University, then formed a 
business with a friend in her 
native Kalamazoo, which 
became involved in 
beautification and develop- 
ment of downtown Zeeland. 

The firm was later con- 
sulted for other projects in 
Zeeland and became in- 
volved in historic preserva- 
tion projects elsewhere in 
Michigan. 

She then decided to re- 
turn to school and enrolled 
at  Westcrn Michigan Uni- 
versity to work on a mas- 
ter’s degree in public ad- 
ministration. 

Since coming to the 
county seat, she said, “The 
main thing since I’m new in 
the county is, I’ve been get- 
ting to know the people, the 
movers and the shakers.” 
She has found those aren’t 
always the persons with the 
titles. 

“I  really like it a lot,” 
Miss Wielenga said of her 
new job. “It’s definitely 
challenging and I’m glad I 
took it.” 

Next week: What the 
Sanilac and Huron County 
economic development di- 
r ( h ( - t  ors arc doing. 

MISS WIELENGA 
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PHARMACIES 

f c 
The Itch 
Reliever! 

4 02. 

L Rea. $4.27 

NEW! 
- 7 -  

A Delicious and Natural 
Way to Lose Weight 

ALMOST DONE -- Raising of this manhole on Sherman Street, done 
Monday, marked the end of construction of the sewer line extension 
and sewage lift station in the southeast corner of Cass City. Smoothing 
the cement was Karl Zawilinski. Some electrical parts, not yet deliv- 
ered, must be installed, and testing and grading done before home- 
owners can have their homes connected to the sewer lines. Deadline for 
completion is July 31. Contractor for the, $62,579 project is Andrew 
Barnes Jr. 60 Tablets 

Pay $1 99 

$419  
6 

f RICHARD’S 
Reg. $4.99 f 

[ Satellite Sales & Service $ 2 8 9  A 

f 18 Years of Knowing the Customers’Needs 

f Fast pain relief for 
sunburn plus a 
moisturizer for dryness .  

Dermoplast“ 
First Aid for 
minor burns, 
insect bites 

r;zg;z:, and 
mlYYrlLn cr 

dry-+ scratches 

Dermophst $ 2 9 9  B 3 oz , 

Channel Master and 
Winegard antennas a n d  
satellite reception equip- , 

ment available to view at 
store or demonstration at 
home. 

Call today for detai ls!  

VHF - UHF FM 
Deep Fringe Antenna 

BATTER I ES CIannd Master’ 
SATELLITE RECEPTION 

CH 8098 ~- 

General Purpose 

EQUIPMENT Reg. $4.07 

Financing Available 
SATELLITE SYSTEMS $ 3 6 9  

Now $40°0 per month 4 

ANY SIZE 

MONEY 
ORDERS 

25$ 

Ty I e no1 

/E  ACCEPT ALL PRE-PAY 
PRESCRIPTION PLANS CHEWABLE 

#1 Satellite Dealer in the Thumb 
$337 

TV Appliance and Sound Room 
Cass City Owner 

Dick Jones Ph. 872-2930 i 
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, , ,,, A .  ” ”  Motorcvcle rider Pedaling Around 

Michelle, 
my belle 

By Mike Eliasohn 

injured in crash 
A motorcycle rider was 

injured in a 7:40 p.m. acci- 
dent Monday south of Cass 
City. 

Reported in serious con- 
dition Tuesday afternoon at  
Hills and Dales General 
Hospital was Basil G. 
Taylor, 70, of 2615 Kingston 
Road, Kingston. 

Sheriff’s deputies re- 
ported he was turning right 
from northbound Cemetery 
Road onto Kelly Road when 
Susan V. Rosinski, 26, of 
4281 Ale Street, who was be- 
hind him, also started to 
turn right. She turned in- 
side of Taylor, who was 
moving slowly, and his 
motorcycle sideswiped the 
left side of her car.  

Ms. Rosinski was tic- 
keted on a charge of being 
unable to stop within an as- 
sured clear distance ahead. 

to use due care and caution, 
was reported by officers to 
have been taken to Hills and 
Dales, but the hospital had 
no record of her being 
treated there. 

east of English Road, a t  
11:30 a.m. last Thursday 
when a deer ran into the 
right side of his vehicle. 

Harvey R. Bell, 32, of 6810 
Shabbona Road, Deford, 
was westbound on Decker- 
ville, east of Kingston 
Road, at 5% a.m. last Wed- 
nesday, according to de- 
puties, when his car hit a 
deer. 

John A. Emmons, 28, of 
5825 Howard Street, De- 
ford, was southbound on 
Dodge Road, north of Kelly 
Road, at 9:50 p.m.June 11, 
according to state police, 
when his car  hit a deer. 

Scenery is nice, but  I 
think the best part of my 
vacation was the lunch I ate 
in Northport. 

A nutritionist would 
blanch and hcaven knows 
what a vegetarian would 
do. Lunch that day con- 
sisted of a third of a pound 
hamburger with cheese arid 
bacon. 1 can’t remcmber 
ever having catcri a ham- 
burger that tasted better. 

It now goes on my all- 
time best meal list. The 
best fried chirkcn I ever ate 
was at a restaurant in 
Three Rivers (so crispy, 
the crispy part was a meal 
in itself), the best steaks at 
a restaurant in Detroit and 
one near Phoenix, Ariz., 
and the best corned beef 
sandwich at a delicatcsscn 
in thc Eastern Market in 
Detroit, 

The next best part of my 
vacation was  the evening I 
spent in my motcl room i n  
C: h a r 1 ev o i >I, r c :id i n g news. 
papers and watching color 
telcvision, two luxurics I 
don’t nornially havv ( a 
color ’l’V and having an 
evening during which I 
don’t h a w  work to do, that 

1 he 7‘V had cahlc, so I 
w t i  tc hcd a ha If. hou t* mot or 
sports ~vrapr ip  on ESPN 
and two movies on HUO. 
The iiiovics were “Grease 
2“ (Michvlle l’fcifvr, whose 
name I ’ m  probably rnis- 
spcblling, was t lit. hcst par t )  
and “Thc Year of Jiving 
Ilangcroiisl y . ” 

My first stop during my 
tour of thc northern part of 
the lower pcninsula was Ito- 
g t n  City, where I visited 
an ex-collcgr_. roommate. 
We hadn’t secn each other 
in  15 ycars. I’m happy to 
say tic’s the ow who lost 
the hair. 

His life tiax changcd 
much mot-c than rninp dur- 
ing thc intilrini. H c  is now 
a doctor with a wifc and 
three kids,  tht, oldcst of 
which is i n  kindcrgarten. 
(Arc kids that age always 
that noisy‘?) A s  hc put i t ,  
he ’ s now do 111 c s t i c a t ed + 

Tom doesn’t fit the 

drives an old foreign 
economy car,  doesn’t play 
golf and despite living a few 
blocks from 1,ake Huron, 
doesn’t own a h a t .  (His 
partncr does, though - -  call 
it a srnnll yacht. ) 

Tom’s hobby is clcc- 
tronics. Hc has a satellite 
dish that can pick u p  about 
1 00 ch a n n t 1 s , \, i (t tw u :I s sc t t c 
recordclr i ind a gizmo that 
broadcasts many of tho 
programs i n  stcreo. 

Television rnanufactur- 
ers, he told me, are starting 
to produce stcrco TVs and 
within thci next few years, 
TV stations will start 
broadcasting h i  stoi-co. 

Now, h ~ w ~ v e r ,  s o ~ n c  
cable progr*arus a r ~  t)road- 
cast in stcrco from thc 
home station to the satellitc. 

is!; 

stereotype of a doctor. 1IC 

to the local outlet, which 
doesn’t have the cquipnitnt 
to feed the transmission 
into homes in stereo. Tom’s 
gizmo pulls the stereo sig- 
nal from the satcllite. 

From Rogers City, I went 
to Cheboygan, Harbor 
Springs (to see how the 5 
percent live), Petoskey, 
C h a r 1 e vo ix , T r a verse C i t y , 
thc Leelanau Peninsula, 
Frankfort and Cadillac (thc 
last two on my way home).  

The prett‘icst town, I 
think, was Northport, near 
the tip of the Leelanau 
Peninsula. It is what one 
would call “quaint. ” 

Traverse City had the ni- 
cest downtown, a far coli- 
trast to many cities where 
the downtown is dying, if 
not already dead. 

The Traverse City,  I’ctos- 
key and llarbor Springs 
areas have the image of 
prosperity and big tnoncy. 
a sharp contrast to thc Ro- 
gers City area, where the 
biggest employer is the 
U S .  Steel c‘o. Iitncstone 
quarry. Although the 
economy is a little better 
now, my ex-roommate told 
me, the uncmploymcnt rate 
there because of the dcpre- 
ssed steel industry was as  
much as  35 p c n w t .  

CAR-DEER 

Deputies reported that 
Paul Festian, 56, of Akron, 
was eastbound on Decker- 
ville Road, west of Dodge 
Road, a t  3 p.m. Sunday 
when his car collided with 
a deer. 

Michael J .  Jones, 20, of 
5675 Pringle Road, Cass 
City, was eastbound on M- 
81, east of Schwegler Road, 
a t  11:30 p.m. Saturday, 
Cass City police reported, 
when his vehicle hit a deer. 

Caro state police re- 
ported that Michael J. 
Davidson, 28, of Marlette, 

SUMMER STAFF -- The 1984 municipal pool staff is 
front row, from left, Suzy Scollon, Laura Richards, Diane 
Russell, Whitney Walpole and Nancy Tonti. Back row, Bob 
VanCamp, Mark House, Tim Homer and Phil LaPonsie. 

When tea was first intro- 
duced in the American col- 
onies, many housewives 
served the tea leaves with 
sugar or syrup after throw- 
ing away the water in which 

Two persons were in- was westbound on M-46, they had been boiled. 
jured i n a  3:55 p.m. acci- 
dent Saturday south of 
Kingston. 

Deputies reported a car 
driven by Henry L. McCon- 
nell, 40, of Silverwood, was 
eastbound on Lanway 
Road, and one driven by 
Darren W. Hatfield, 18, of 
6394 Lanway, Kingston, 
was westbound. Both driv- 
ers were driving down the 
center of the road and when 
they crested a hill, their 
autos collided head-on. 

Hatfield was treated and 
released from Marlette 
Community Hospital. A 
passenger in the McConnell 
auto, David McConnell, 4 
months, of the same ad- 
dress, was transferred 
from Marlette to Hurley 
Medical Center, Flint, 
where he was treated and 
re1 e a sed. 

Deputies reported Karen 
Ann Dutz, 21, of Mount Clc- 
mens, was injured in a 1 : 30 
p.m. accident last Thurs- 
day. 

She was southbound on 
Cemetery Road, south of 
Bay City-Forestville Road, 
when, she told officers, she 
momentarily fell asleep. 
Her car was going off the 
road when she woke up. She 
tried to steer it back on the 

**AIR CONDITIONED** 

JUNE 21-24(4 DAYS) 

Friday-Saturday-Sunday . . . . . . . . . .7:30 & 9:30 

THURSDAY thru SUN DAY 

THURSDAY IS “BARGAIN NITE” - 8:OO 

July 4 will soon bc hcre, 
which nicans it’s almost 
time lor II “knee high by the  
Fourth of Ju ly”  photo. To 
get it in that weck’s paper, 
I ncctl to take i t  no later 
than Friday, Junc 29. 

If you have 11 candidate 
and someone willing to he 
in  the photo, plcasc givc me 
a call. 

CRAFTS AND RECREATION program directors 
working with Cass City children this summer are Libby 
Dickinson (left) and Michelle Jones. Hours are 9 a.m.-noon 
and 1-4 p.m. Monday through Friday. The program is in- 
tended for children ages 6-12. 

Kinney pleads guilty to _I 

COMING NEXT THURSDAY 
One Full Week Only 
THIS IS THE STORY OF A SMALL TOWN 

WHO BROUGHT THEM BACK. 
THAT LOST ITS DREAMS, AND A BIG-CITY KID 

pavement, but it went into 
the west side ditch and rol- robbing bank in Gagetou7n led over onto the roof. 

Ms. Dutz, who was tic- 
tributing marijuana with- keted on a charge of failure Ralph I’. Kinney plcridcd 

guilty in Tuscola County 
Circuit Court Monday to a 
charge in  connect ion with 
the March If; arrncd rob- 
bery of the First of America 
Hank branch i n  (;agctown. 

Kinney, 33, of :Wt3 Cerriet- 
cry Road,  Chss City,  
pleaded guilty to assault 
with intcnt to rob while 
armcd, u.hich carrics a 
niaxiinum pcnalty of lifc in 
prison. 

Judgc Patrick IC. Joslyn 
acceptcd his plea and 
scheduled sentencing July 
23. He continued to deny 
bond , w h i c h ni e a n s K i n ne y 
will rcniain in thc county 
jail. 

As part of a plea bargain 
with thc prosecution, two 
other rharces in uonnection 

more than $ I  ,000 was  taken, 
will he dismissed. l‘hey are 
armed robbery and posses- 
sion of a firearm in coiri- 
mission of a felony. 

Kinney was captured 
May 2 in Fort Worth, Texas, 
and brought back to Michi- 
gan. 

I n  other cascbs Monday: 
Patricia G. Gricc, 41, of 

5955 Bruce Street, Ilcford, 
pleaded guilty to delivery 
of marijuana Oct. 13, 19x3, 
in Novesta township. Her 
plea was accepted and scn- 
tencing scheduled July 9. 
Bond was continued. 

As part of a plea bargain 
with the prosecution, a 
charge of delivcty of 
marijuana Aug. 8, 1983, in 
Novcsta Township, will be 
dismissed. 

abetting forgery of a state 
warrant for $116 Oct. 29, 
1983, in Caro. She was cre- 
dited with 95 days served. 
She had pleaded guilty to 
the charge. 

The Sept. 6, 1983, sen- 
tence of David S. Bacon, 18, 
of 6211 Fulton Street, Caro, 
was reviewed and he was 
then sentenced to 60 days in 
the county jail, with credit 
given for 10 days served. 

He was placed on five 
ycars’ probation last Sep- 
tcmber for larceny in a 
building. €€e had pleaded 
guilty to the charge, to ste- 
aling guns from a Bond 
Road, Kingston Township 
home June 22, 1983. 

out remuneration on or 
about Nov. 9 and Dec. 15, 
both in Cass City. 

Judge Richard F. Kern 
accepted his plea and 
scheduled sentencing July 
9. 

Terry L. Wilson, 21, of 
3257 Washington Street, 
Kingston, pleaded guilty 
May 22 to impaired driving 
April 12 in lndianficlds 
Township. 

He was sentenced Mon- 
day by Judge Kern to five 
days in the county jail, to 
be served week ends, 
placed on probation for 
one year, fined $252 and as- 
sessed $173 court costs. He 
is to pay $60 restitution for 
screening done by the prob- 
ation officer. 

Wilson’s license was sus- 
pended for six months ex- 
cept for driving to and from 
work and treatment ses- 
sions. He is to attend an al- 
cohol self-help group and 
receive counseling. 

CARS 

1983 C H E W  CAMARO 2-28 Factory Loaded, “Everything.” 
1982 OLDS 88 4 Door, Locally Owned, Only 9,000 miles. 
1982 CAMARO 2-28 INDY 500 PACE CAR “King of the Road.” 
1982 CH EVY CH EVETTE “Somebody Cared.” 
1982 CHEVY CHEVETTE “Previous Owner Heartbroken.” 
1982 PONTlAC GRAND PRlX Locally Owned, “Previous Owner Heartbroken.” 
1982 CHEVY CHEVETTE Only 17,000 miles, “Brand New.” 
1982 PLYMOUTH RELIANT K One Owner, Nice Car, “Priced to Sell.” 

1982 C H E W  IMPALA 4 Door, Locally Owned, “Priced to Sell.” 
1981 PONflAC PHOENIX 2 Door, Locally Owned, Nice Car, “Priced to Sell.” 
1981 C H E W  CITATION “Somebody Cared for this One.” 3 to Choose From. 
1981 PONTIAC BONNEVILLE Only 23,000 miles, 46~uxury  to Spare.” 
1979 PONTIAC GRAND PRlX 1 Owner. “Priced to Sell.” 2 to Choose From. 
1979 PONTIAC TRANS AM “Looks New - Drives New”, must see to believe. 
1979 OLDS 88 ROYAL 1 Owner, “Priced to Sell.” 

1978 DODGE OMNI Locally Owned, Good Economy. 
1977 CHEVY IMPALA “Priced taseil.” 

2 to Choose From. 

L)IS’I*KIC‘I’ COUK‘I‘ 
. . . . . . . 

with the r*&bcry, in which Karen Sue Ogden, 19, of 
322 Wells Street, Caw, was 
sentenced to 155 days in  the 
county jail for aiding and 

Dale P. Doyen, 28, of 6360 
€loughton Street, Cass City, 
pleaded guilty last Wednes- 
day to two charges of di: 

I HELD OVER! JUNE 22-28 Peace Corps 
seeks forestry, 
farm helpers 

The Michigan Employ- 
ment Security Commission 
(MESC) is extending the 
application period for the 
Michigan Youth Corps an 
additional week through 
Friday. 

MESC Director S. Martin 
Taylor said because the 
final legislation for the 
Youth Corps has, not yet 
passed, the program has 
not received the publicity 
that it might have. “As a 
result, we are  extending the 
application process to en- 
sure that every young per- 
son who wants to work has 
a chance for a Youth Corps 
job. ” 

To qualify for the Youth 
Corps, young people must 
be unemployed Michigan 
residents, 18 to 21 years old. 

Hiring preferences will 
be given to those from 
families where the princi- 
pal wage earner is un- 
employed. In  addition, 
older applicants will be re- 
ferred to jobs before 
younger ones. 

MESC offices, including 
those in Caro, Bad Axe and 
Sandusky, will accept ap- 
plications for the Youth 
Corps program during nor- 
mal weekday working 
hours from 8:15 a.m.-4:30 
p.m. 

Sunday -- 2:30 t i l l  6:OO Adults ... $1.50 -- -- 
~ - 

~ . . , - --- I 1970 CHEVY CORVETTE WUST SEE TO APPRECIATE)~ \ STARTS FRIDAY, JUNE 22nd.. . . 
IT’S BRAND NEW TRUCKS and VANS 

1982 FORD 1 h  TON PlC)(UP Explorer Package, 6 Cylinder, Manual Overdrive, 

1982 CHEVY l/2 TON PICKUP 23,000 miles, Looks New, Drives New. 
1981 CH EVY ?!/2 TON PICKUP Locally Owned, “Hardly Used - Never Abused.” 

1980 CHEVY l/2 TON PICKUP Locally Owned, “Hardly Used - Never Abused.” 

1979 FORD COURIER PICKUP Good Economy, “Priced to Sell.’* 
1979 CHEVY 
1979 FORD VAN “Good Work Van,” 
1978 DODGE 4x4 20,000 miles, “Looks New, Drives New.” 

1978 CHEVY 3/4 TON PICKUP Looks New, Drives New, “Priced to Sell.” 
1977 C H E W  3h TON PICKUP Locally Owned, Only 25,000 Miles, Like New. 

“Priced to Sell.” 

2 to Choose From. 

2 to Choose From. 

TON SHORT BOX “Loaded with Luxury,” Priced to Sell. 

CHECKOUT THE LOW TIRE PRICES AT OUVRY TIRE CENTER 

AND TERRIFIC! 

DOLLY 
PARTON 

SY LVESTER KEEP THAT GREAT GM FGLING 
WITH G€NUIN€ GM PARTS 

STALLONE UVRY 
HEVROLET ---- in 

”RH I N ESTONE” 
W 1 Mile’East Of Cas City Cas City Ph. 51778724301 

18 New Songs 
I Next Fri.: ”BREAKIN“ & ”HOT DOG“ 
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The YMCA Thumb Sing- 
les Club will conduct a 
party Saturday at the 
Maple Vallev Glementarv 
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good cabinet 

C o mm o dit y 

1 Ray Armstead Jr. 
Certified Public Accountant 

6312 Main Street 
Cass City, Michigan 48726 

Offlce Hours: 9-5 Mon .Fri., Sat. 
9-12, Other hours by Appointment 

51 71872.4532 

HEALTH TIPS 

How to maintain a 

Singles cluh 
dance Sat. 

Rod Ellis, D.V.M. 
Carol Galka-Ellis, D.V.M. 

distribution Gen Kehoe Gagetown Area News Phone 665-2221 may end 
At its June 13 meeting, 

the Human Development 
Commission Board of Di- 
rectors were informed Tus- 
cola County United Way 
has allocated $1,500 to the 
Foster Grandparents Prog- 
ram and $1,200 to the Tus- 
cola County Assault Crisis 
Center. 

It was also reported that 
HDC had been allocated a 
grant in the amount of 
$3,000, for a Rural Com- 
munity Assistance Prog- 
ram.  This funding was re- 
ceived from the Illinois 
Community Action Agency 
Association and will be 
utilized to assist selected 
villages or townships in the 
four-county area with 
water and wastewater 
problems. 

The Human Develop- 
ment Commission July 2 
will take over operation of 
the Easy Transit Bus Sys- 
tem which serves Caro, 
Almer and Indianfields 
Townships. 

A main topic of discus- 
sion at  the meeting was the 
surplus commodity dis- 
tribution program. 

For the past several 
months, HDC has received 
minimal reimbursement 
from the Department of 
Education for the operation 
of this program. Notifica- 
tion has been received that 
the agency’s funding will 
be reduced by over 60 per- 
cent beginning July 1. 

This reduction, along 
with the potential reduc- 
tions in the Community Ser- 
vices Block Grant Funding 
(operating support funds) 
may rbsult in the elimina- 
tion of the program, ac- 
cording to HDC Executive 
Director Mary Ann Van- 
demark. 

HDC will be submitting 
correspondence to the De- 
partment of Education and 
area legislators in an effort 
to retain the current level 
of funding for the program. 

Local residents con- 
cerned with the possible 
elimination of this program 
should express their con- 
cerns to local legislators 
and to the state Depart- 
ment of Education. 

School in Sinduskv fr;; ’ I 

to your family, according 
to Harper-Grace Hospitals 
in Detroit. 

The best way to stock 
your medicine cabinet is by 
a process of elimination. 
Remove any prescription 
medications that you or 
family members are  no 
longer using. Check all 
tubes of ointment, vitamins 
and other medicines for the 
expiration dates on the con- 
t a i ne r s. Over -the -count e r 
medications also have expi- 
ration dates. 

Remember to check your 
refrigerator if you have re- 
cently had a child on a 
liquid form of an antibiotic 
_-  these usually have shelf- 
lives of two weeks or less. 
Discard all old prescription 
medications and outdated 
products by flushing them 
down the toilet. 

To stock the medicine 
cabinet, consider the fol- 
lowing recommendations 
given by Robert Toteff, 
M.D., chief of family prac- 
tice medicine for Harper- 
Grace Hospitals. 

--Aspirin or 
Acetaminophen (aspirin 
substitute), both in adult 
and child forms. 

--A topical ant isept ic 
such as  iodine tincture. 

--An antibacterial topical 
ointment containing 
neomycin or bacitracin, for 
abrasions and minor skin 
infections. 

--An antidiarrheal medi- 
cation. 

--An antacid for stomach 
upset or “heart burn. ” 

--Petroleum Jelly (Vas- 
eline). 

--An over-the-counter an- 
tihistamine and cough 
syrup, unless one is specifi- 
cally prescribed by your 
doc tor. 

--A mild laxative for con- 
stipation. 

--Syrup of Ipecac for 
poisoning. This is an ex- 
tremely important item to 
have even if you do not have 
small children in the house- 
hold. 

--Other items such as  
nose drops, eye drops may 
be included to suit your 
family needs. 

Your local pharmacist 
can aid you in the selection 
of medicines for your home 
medicine cabinet, taking 
into consideration normal 
family activities, sui ta bie 
products with the longest 
shelf-life, secure packaging 
and the prescription history 
of individual family mem- 
bers. 

The non-medicinal con- 
tents of your home 
medicine cabinet should in- 
clude : 

--An eye cup or ear  
syringe for irrigating 
foreign objects. 

--Adhesive bandages of 
various sizes. 

--Assorted gauze pads 
and rolls. 

--A thermometer, both 
oral and rectal. 

--An ice bag for sprains 
and severe bruises. 

--A hot water bottle or 
heating pad for pain such 
as  abdominal cramps, and 
a copy of a first aid manual 
and the number of your 
local poison center. 

After you have assem- 
bled your home medicine 
chest, you should make 
sure the medications are  
stored in a cool dry place 
(not the refrigerator, un- 
less specified by your phar- 
macist) .  Keep all 
medicines tightly closed in 
their original containers, 
and check with your phar- 
macist about the storage 
life of your various medica- 
tions. Then, remember to 
clean out your medicine 
cabinet every six months 
to insure fresh, effective 
medicines when you need 
them. 

8:30 p .m-12:30  a . m .  Have you recently taken 
Music will be provided by the time to clean out your 

the  Hilites. Refreshments medicine cabinet and stock 
will he served and guests it? You should. Outdated 
are  invited. medicines could be deadly 

Mass., to spend two weeks 
with Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Goodell. It was the first 
meeting of the Goodells and 
their granddaughter 
Meghan. Sunday guests for 
Father’s Day were Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Beauchamp and 
Joshua of Bay City, and the 
Henry Renzios of Pontiac. 

Postmasters Jeanette 
McDonald of Owendale and 
Mary Downing attended an 
all-day meeting in Grayling 
last Tuesday. 

Arnold Karr of Syracuse, 
Ind., was a recent visitor at 
the home of his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Leonard Karr. He 
assisted his father with 
farm work. Sunday, the 
Karrs were Father’s Day 
guests of Dr. and Mrs. Kurt  
Karr in Ann Arbor. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Bur- 
don were guests for dinner 
Thursday of their son and 
daughter-in-law, Tim and 
Barbara Burdon of Mid- 
land, in double celebration 
of Barbara‘s birthday and 
Father’s Day. 

Mr.  and Mrs. Les Munro 
were guests of the Max Kre- 
gers of Sandusky for 
Father’s Day. 

Guests of Mrs. Elma Mik- 
lovich Saturday and Sun- 
day were her son, Ken 
Crorey, and family and her 
sister, Mrs. Ella Pattullo of 
Port Huron. Sunday, they 
were entertained by 
another son, James Hauk 
of Akron. 

The Wednesday Ladies’ 
Golf League of Sherwood 
on the Hill was entertained 
last week by the Scenic 
Ladies’ League of 
Caseville. 

Mrs. Berniece Deeg was 
honored Sunday for her 
June birthday when she 
was a gucst of Mrs. Robin 
Periso for dinner at a Bay 
City restaurant. 

Mr.  and Mrs. Chuck 
Wright hosted a graduation 
party Sunday at the Gate- 
way Sportsman’s Club in 
Unionville for their son 
Scott. In  addition to his 
God-parents, Mrs. Norma 
Selkcr of Bay City and 
James Beutel of Pincon- 

ning, his grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Wright 
J r .  of Cass City and Mr. and 
Mrs. Nathan Joles of 
Gagetown, other guests 
were the Paul Hunters of 
Pinconning, the William 
Downings, and Mrs. Doris 
Bang, numbering 250 in all 
from Pontiac, Millington, 
Bay City and other points. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Seurynck’and Mr.  and Mrs. 
Harry Comment were en- 
tertained Father’s Day by 
the Clare Comments a t  
their summer home in 
Caseville. 

Mrs. Gerry Carolan ac- 
companied her daughter, 
Phyliss Conners of 
Caseville, Sunday and they 
visited Gary Carolan, who 
is a patient in Crittenton 
Hospital in Rochester, hav- 
ing been injured in an auto 
accident Thursday morn- 
ing. Mrs. Carolan and Mrs. 
Conners were guests for 
dinner of Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Watterworth and family of 
Lapeer. Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Champagne of Elkton were 
also guests. 

The Eugene Comments 
celebrated their first wed- 
ding anniversary when 
they were dinner guests 
Saturday of Mr.  and Mrs. 
Gary Diebel and sons of 
Cass City. 

Adam Follman of 

Orange, Calif., arriveL 
Monday to spend several 
days with relativcs. He is a 
brother of Mike Follman 
and Mrs. Eva Taschner and 
he will attend the wedding 
of Mrs. Taschner’s grand- 
daughter. 

Dinner guests Saturday 
of Mr .  and Mrs. Harry 
Kchoe were Mr. and Mr 
Jack Bieth and Michael 01 
Highland, and Steven 
Kehoe of Ann Arbor and 
children, Brian, Nicole and 
Justin of Brighton. The 
Kehoes were overnight 
guests. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene 
Comment and Mr. and Mrs. 
Harry Kehoe called Mon- 
day at  the funeral home in 
Houghton Lake on the f a r  
ily of Bob Tyo. Mr. Tyb, 
brother of Mrs. Bill 
(Marge) Bliss J r .  of Cass 
City, died Sunday. The fun- 
eral was in Higgins Lake 
Monday with burial in De- 
troit. 

Mrs. Velma Helwig en- 
tertained her family Satur- 
day at a buffet dinner to 
celebrate the birthdays ( 

John Helwig and Mark Rut- 
koski. Guests were Herb 
and Kay Rutkoski and sons 
and John and Noreen Hel- 
wig all of Cass City and J im 
Helwig, Gagetown. 

Mrs. Charlie (Helen) 
Wright underwent surgery 
Monday, June 11, at Palm 
Beach - Martin County 
Medical Center in Jupiter, 
Fla.  

Several members and a 
few guests of the Gagetown 
Women’s Study Club had 
lunch last Monday at the 
House of Ing in Bay City. 

Professional and Business 

DIRECTORY WOMEN’S SOCIETY 

St. Agatha Women’s Soc- 
iety held its regular 
monthly meeting in the 
parish hall Tuesday, June 
12, a t  2 : O O  p.m. with 21 
ladies and Deacon Bud 
Kuhr attending. 

President Gen Kehoe 
conducted the meeting. The 
recent Study Club luncheon 
and Memorial Day lunch 
by the men were reviewed. 
The parish quilt was pre- 
sented, finished by Mary 
Wald and Millie Munro. 

The nominating commit- 
tee presented a slate of of- 
ficers who were elected by 
unanimous ballot. Presi- 
dent Harriet Kuhr, vice- 
president June Leiterman, 
treasurer Lori Seurynck 
and secretary Shirley 
Lenhard will be installed in 
ceremonies a t  a luncheon 
meeting July 10 a t  Sher- 
wood on the Hill, following 
11:OO a.m.  Mass at St. 
Agatha’s. 

Hostesses Shirley 
Lenhard and Marian Com- 
ment served’cake and cof- 
fee. 

Anderson, Tuckey, 
Bernhardt & Co., P.C 
Certified Public Accountant: 

Gary Anderson, CPA - 673-3137 

J e w  Bsrnhardt, CPA .673-3137 
Robert TuCkOy. CPA .872-3730 

715 E. Frank St., Caro, Mi. 
and 

6261 Church St. 
Cass City, Mi. 

Phone 872-4668 

Dr. G. W. McNiven 
Dr. R. R. Watson 

Oprornetris ts 
Primary Vision Center P.C. 

872.4374 or 872-4375 
Hours: Monday thru 

Friday 9-5 
Special 

Appointments Available 

6505 E Main, Cass City 

Dr. W. S. Selby 
op t om e If is t 

Hours 8.5 except Thursday 
8.12 noon on Saturday 

4624 Hili St. 
Across from Hills and Dales Hospital 

Phone 872-3404 

Bendrey, Brining, 
Sweeney and 
Nartker, P.C. 

Certified Public Accountants 
Gary E. Bendrey, CPA 

Douglas P. Brining, CPA 
Harold D. Sweeney, CPA 
Joseph H. Nartker, CPA 
6144 E Cass City Rd , Cass City 

Phone 51 7-872-2005 

64 Wastland Dr , Bad Axe. MI 48413 
Phone 51 7-209-9909 

47 Austin S t ,  Sandusky, MI 48471 
Phone 31 3-848-4931 

Harold T. Donahue 
M.P.,A.A.F.P. 
4674 Hill Street 

Cass City 
872.2323 

Office hours everyday 
but Thursday 

I DOUG OLDHAM 

GOSPEL CONCERT ****** 
Mrs. Harry Comment en- 

tertained for bridge last 
Tuesday, her Hospital Au- 
xiliary Club. 

Mrs. Alma Wald and 
Mary Wald spent from 
Thursday to Saturday with 
the William Merz family of 
Saginaw. Saturday, Mr. 
and Mrs. Merz hosted a 
party for their son Richard, 
who graduated from Arthur 
Hill High School in 
Saginaw. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon 
Wolfgang and Meghan ar-  
rived Friday from Mellis, 

WEDNESDAY, JULY 4 Dr. J. Geissinger 
Chiropractor 

Mon., Tues., Thurs., Fri. 
9-12 a.m. and 2-6 p.m. 

Sat., 9-12 a.m. 

21 N Almer, Caro. Mlch 
Across from IGA Store 

Phone Car0 673.4464 

Weinlander, Fitzhugh, 
Bertuleit & 

Schairer, PC 
Certihed Public Accounrants 

7:OO P.M. 

at Cass City High School 
Tickets - Advance $5.00 person 

At the Door $6.00 person 

Children 11 and Under Free 
Advance tickets available at many Cass 
City businesses and most area churches. I 

1600 Center Avenue 
P.O. Box 775 

Bay City, MI 48707 

Walter G. Weinlander, CPA 
Stewart J. Reid, CPA 

Robert L. Hennessey, CPA 
Phone Toll Free 
1*800*624-2400 

Richard A. Hall, D.O. 
Osteopathic Physician 

6545 Church Street 
Cass City, Michigan 

872-4446 
Office 872”4725 Home 872.4762 

Eastern Star 
adds four 

Counseling - 
Saib A. lsterabadi 

M.D., FRCS 

Surgeon, General & Thoracic 
Outpatient Clinic 

Hills 8r Dales Hospital 
Each Wed. 8 a.m. - 1 p.m. 

4674 Hill Street 
Cas$ City, Michigan 48726 

DO YOU HAVE A 
DRI N KING PROBLEM? 

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS 
AND AL*NON 

Every Friday Evening. 8 00 p m 
Good Shepherd Lutheran Church 

Cass City 

I Dental 

Four members of Echo 
Chapter, Order of the East- 
ern Star,  Clarence and 
Maxine Merchant and 
Elmer and Jane Fuester, 
were presented with their 
life membership certifi- 
cates by Worthy Matron 
Betty Murphy at  the regu- 
lar chapter meeting last 
Wednesday. 

Past worthy matrons and 
patrons of Echo Chapter 
were honored, as  is the cus- 
tom annually. 

A collection for the ES- 
TARL fund, an education 
fund administered by 
Grand Chapter to which all 
chapters contribute 
amounted to $26. 

Hegular meetings will re- 
sume in September. 

were Kefres hments 
served at  the close of the 
meeting by Ruth Whittaker 
and her committee. 

Hoon K. Jeung, M.D. 
General Surgery 
9 a.m. . 5  p.m Daily 

Saturday - 9 to 12 noon 
Office Hours by Appointment 

6230 Hospital Drive 
Cass City, Mich. 48726 

Phone 872-461 1 Home 872-3138 

1 Specials good thru Sunday, June 24,1984. 

1 1  Cube $ 1 8 9  I 
Steak e . . . . . Ib. i 

! 

Steak . e e . .  . Round $ 1 6 9  Ib. I c 
k! iYAL \\ 
GROUP, P.C. 

P.S. Kurnar, M.D. 
Dionisia A. Sy, M.D. 

Ped i at ri cs 

David E. Eoglr, D.D.S. 
Leonard W. Sarod, D.D.S. 

Raymond C. Hausbeck, D.D.S. 
Dmlynn M Shmuck, D.D.S. 

429 N. State St.,  Car0 
Ph. 673.3838 

Complete Dental Care Facility 
Now Serving Tuscola County Area 

Weekend Emergency 

Phonr Ssginaw 799 6220 

i Farmer Peet Polish 

Kielbasa $ 1 4 9  f I 
Ib. i Dogs e a e 0 e a e e 

~~ 

(hfonts, Children 
arrd 

Adolescents) 
1184 Cleaver Road 

Caro 
Monday thru Friday 

By Appointment 
Ph. 673-31 17 

Koegel $ 1 7 5  1 
Koegel $ 1 3 5  1 Viennas. e e 

Big Bologna. . . 
Ib. 

Ib. 

C A R 0  FAMILY 
DENTAL CENTER 
Dalton P. Coe, D.D.S. 

Darrell M. Sheets, D.M.D., 
Assoc. 

204 W Sherman Car0 

Mon , Wed I 8 00-4 30 
Tues - 8 00-6 00 

Thurs - F r i  - 8 00-3 30 
Saturday by Appointment 

Phone 673-2939 
Emergency 072-2443 

Choir to Dr. E. Paul Lockwood 
Chiropractic Physioan 

Office Hours Mon , Tues , Wed,  Fri 
9 12 noon and 1 30 5 00 p m 

Saturday 9 12 a m 
Closed All Day Thursday 

Phone 072.2765 C i s s  Clty 
lor Appolntmrnl 

sing at 
area church 

Sang H. Park, M.D. 
Obstetrics & Gynecology 

4672 Hill Street 
Office Phone 872-2800 

Home Phone 872-3705 

(Specialist in all women’s 
problems and delivery ) 

Office Hours by Appointment 

“Promise” will appear in 
concert at the Novesta 
Church of Christ on Cemet- 
ery Road, south of Cass 
City, Sunday, a t  7:30 p.m. 

“Promise,” sponsored by 
Great Lakes Bible College 
in Lansing, is a 31-voice 
choir selected by auditions 
each year and is comprised 
of music students from high 
schools in Michigan and 
surrounding states. 

The program will include 
a variety of contemporary 
gospel songs, skits and pro- 
duction numbers. Admis- 
sion is free. 

R. Paul Chappel, DDS, PC 
Family Dentistry 

Comprehensive Orthodontics 

6240 Hill, Cass City Historical Phone 872-3870 

S o c k  E y 
meets Monday 

The Cass City Area His- 
torical Society will meet 
Monday evening at  Raw- 
son Memorial Library at 
7:30. 

Tentative program par- 
ticipants will be Avis 
Youngs, Katie Crane, War- 
ren Wood and Jack Esau, 
who will tell the way it was 
50 years ago as  they cxperi- 
enced working in and 
around Cass City. 

There will be an election 
of two new directors to re- 
place retiring president 
Evelyn MacRae and trus- 
tee Robert Dilman. The 
public is invited. 

N. Y. Yun, M.D. 
Physician & Surgeon 

Office Hours: 
Mon.-Fri. - 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Saturday - 9 a.m. to 1 p.m. 
6232 Hospital Dr., Cass City 

Res. 872-4257 
Office 872-4733 

I M M ED1 ATE 

HEALTH CARE 
NON-EMERGENCY 

$25 Fee I Missionary 
Church y h r z s  
B i b k  school 

Including physician’s fee and 
clinic room 

No Appointment Necessary 
r 1 

6 8 30 p m Fridays 

10 OOa m 8 30 p rn Sunday 
2 30 8 30 p m Saturdays 

HILLS AND DALES 
HOSPITAL 

“Jesus is my answer” is 
the theme for vacation 
Bible school at the Cass 
City Missionary Church on 
Koepfgen Road. 

It will be Monday through 
Friday of next week from 
6:30-8:30 p.m. Children 
needing a ride can call 872- 
2729 or 872-4 102, 

There will be a program 
Sunday, July 1, starting at 
7:30 p.m., with parents and 
friends in v it ed . 

: I  

I I 
! 

-I 
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1 Mr. Kelly’s Market & I  

Beernwine To Go 
I I Package 6473 Liquor Lincoln Street - Gagetown - Phone 665-2521 i 

Open 7 days a week - 8 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

1 I 
~. 

Allen Witherspoon 
New England Life 
NEL Growth Fund 
NEL Equity Fund 
NEL Income Fund 

Money Market Series 

Phone 872-2321 
4615 Oak Cass City 

Edward Scollon, D.V.M. 
Veterinarian 

Call for Appointment for 
Small Animals 
Phone 872-2935 

4849 N Seeger St , Cass City 

High-quality buttons are 
perhaps the quickest tip-off 
about the quality of clothes. 
Good buttons are bone, 
leather, pearl or metal. 
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in Croswell 

Mrs. Thelma Jackson 

Phone 658-2347 For Life 
Insurance 

the StaEteprrn 
A fun rally sponsored by 

the Upper Thumb Samers Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza were Sunday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Glaza. 

Mrs. Cliff Robinson came 
home Tuesday after spend- 
ing a week with Dorothy 
Dickinson a t  Le High, Fla. ,  
and Harold Dickinson at  
Fort Myers, Fla.  

Archie McPhail and a 
friend from Cass City took 
Charlie Brown to the Har- 
vest Table restaurant in 
Bad Axe for dinner Monday 
in honor of Charlie Brown’s 
83rd birthday. 

Mrs. Harold Polcga and 
Dawn were Monday fore- 
noon and lunch guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord 
LaPeer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Shagena were Saturday 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Gracey in Bad 
Axe. 

Mrs. George Jackson of 
Oxford, Clara Scheurer of 
Pigeon, Mr. and Mrs. Wal- 
lace Warner and Hill of 

Elkton, Mrs. George 
Jackson, Mr. and Mrs. Mel- 
vin Peter and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Piotter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ron Piotter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Piotter 
and John Piotter attended 
the wedding of Miss Karen 
Warner, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Mitch Warner, 
and Matthew Brown, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wilhert 
Brown of Bad Axe, a t  Our 
Savior Lutheran Church a t  
Bad Axe at  4 o’clock Satur- 
day. Others attending the 
reception a t  Ubly Fox Hun- 
ters Hall were George and 
Brent Jackson of Oxford, 
Joe Hickey, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Jackson and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Glaza, Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Ackerman, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Becking. Wally 
Tenbush was the organist 
and Janet and Carol Peter 
sang several selections. 

Mr.  and Mrs.  Cliff 
Jackson were Sunday after- 
noon and supper guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Hen- 
dricks a t  Port Austin. 

weeks with their grandpa- dinner guests of Dr. and 
rents, Mr. and Mrs. Jack Mrs. Jerry Hart and family 
Krug, and to visit other in Bad Axe in honor of 
friends and relatives. Father’s Day and Mr. and 

Reva Silver was a Thurs- Mrs. Krug’s wedding an- 
day evening guest of Be- niversary. 

Mrs. David Hacker was a verl y Rockefeller . 
Jack Ross and Floyd Friday afternoon guest of 

Zulauf of Ubly and Bryce Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schenk. 
Champagne were Tuesday Mr.  and Mrs. Cliff 
gucsts of Mr. and Mrs. Earl  Jackson visited Mrs. Ewald 
Schenk. Beyer a t  Pigeon Thursday 

Jackson visited Mrs. Lynn Jean Matthews and De- 
Hurford at  Hills and Dales bbie Masters were Friday 
Hospital in Cass City Fri- evening guests of Mrs. Alex 
day afternoon. Cleland and Carol Laming. 

Reynold Tschirhart spent Reynold Tschirhart at- 
Monday and Saturday a t  tended the funeral of Clar- 
the homes of Lema ence Murray at  St. Joseph 
Tschirhart and Mr. and Catholic Church a t  Rapson 
Mrs. Herbert Tschirhart a t  a t  10 o’clock Friday. 
Ruth. Mr. and Mrs. Harold Lee 

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold of Marlette were Sunday af- 
1,aPeer attended a gradua- ternoon guests of Mr. and 
tion open house for Darlene Mrs. Arnold LaPeer. 
Franzel a t  the home of Mr. Mr. and Mrs. Evans Gib- 
and Mrs. Norman Franzel bard and family attended a 
a t  Reese Sunday, June 10. graduation open house for 

Becky and Cheryl Lam- Bill Outlakowski a t  the 
ing were Friday overnight home of Mr. and Mrs. 
and Saturday guests of Mr. Eugene Otulakowski Sun- 
and Mrs. Evans Gibbard day, June 10. 
and family. Mrs. George Jackson and 

Mrs.George Jackson vis- Don were Thursday even- 
ited Margaret Carlson ing guests of Mr.and Mrs. 

Melvin Peter and family. Saturday forenoon. 
Mrs. Lynn Spencer at- Two adults and six Hol- 

tended a Presbytery meet- brook Helpers 4-H mem- 
ing a t  the Holly Presbyte- bers met a t  the Petroglyphs 
rian Church Tuesday. Park Tuesday forenoon. 

Brcnda and Carrie Tyr- Roy Elie of Port Crescent 
re11 participated in a 4-H state park, who is a State 
talent show on Cable TV Park manager, and Pa t  
Channel 9 from Port Huron Livingston, Sanilac County 
Wednesday at 5 o’clock. 4-H agent, were also pre- 
The show was filmed a t  the sent. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tyr- Rees in Port Huron. 
Kelly Kutkowski, Mrs. re11 spent the week end a t  

Melvin Particka and Ted AuGres. 
and Mrs. Curtis Cleland at- Mrs. Curtis Cleland vis- 
tended the “Foods For ited Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Fun” 4-H supper a t  the San- Tracy and Mr. and Mrs. 
dusky fairgrounds Wedncs- George King and J im 
day evening. The food was Thursday. 
of German origin. Mrs. Earl  Schenk was a 

Mickie and John Tyll of Wednesday guest of Mrs. 
Colorado and Mr. and Mrs. Dave Sweeney. 
Jack Krug were Sunday Mr. and Mrs. Ward Ben- 

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff afternoon. 

Jerry Gibbard of Bad Axe, 
Diann Howard of Argyle 
were Sunday dinner guests 
of Mr.  and Mrs. Tom Gib- 
bard. 

Mr. and Mrs. Torn Kolar 
attended a graduation open 
house for Jean Anthony, 
K . N . ,  at  the Ubly TVO Hall 
Saturday evening. 

Mr.  and Mrs. Olin Bouck 
were Tuesday supper 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Clif- 
ford Connors of Filion. 
Wednesday, they visited 
Mrs. Minnie Witherspoon 
a t  Filion and Mrs. Dorothy 
Peterson Sprague at  
Lakeside, Port Austin, and 

- - -  
will take place June 22-24 in 
Croswell. Anyone interested in a 

week end of camping is wel- 
come. All RVs are  wel- 
come, and they must be 
self-contained. 

Camping will be a t  the 
Old Airport on Stanborn 
Street, three blocks west of 
the stoplight. Participants 
can enjoy Croswell Pioneer 
Days and campground ac- 
t ivities. 

kelman of Cass City and 
Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Jackson 
were Monday afternoon 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Hendrick at  Port 
Austin. 

Glen Shagena visited 
Leslie Hewitt Tuesday 
evening. 

Mr. and Mrs.  Bob Cleland 
of Pontiac spent from Fri- 
day through Sunday with 
Mrs. Alex Cleland and 
Carol Laming. 

Mrs. Bob Swackhamer of 
Bad Axe and Clayton 
Campbell were Wednesday 
guests of Sara Campbell 
and Harry Edwards. 

Lillian Otulakowski of 
Cass City and Mrs. Evans 
Gibbard visited Sally and 
Frances Czarnecki in Port 
Huron Monday. 

Mrs. Vern Crane of Pon- 
tiac, Lynn Fuester and Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Fuester of 
Cass City were Sunday af- 
ternoon guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Martin Sweeney. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Glaza spent three days at  
their cottage a t  Lewiston. 

Bernice Gracey spent 
from Friday till Tuesday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Persells in Rochester. 

Ira Robinson entered 
Huron Memorial Hospital 
in Bad Axe Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marty 
Felmlee, Jennifer and Jill 
of Bay City and Sue Sofka 
of Davison spent the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Sofka. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Kon- 
.kel and Marney were Satur- 
day evening guests of 
Charlie Brown. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gaylord 
LaPeer and Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Jackson were Monday 
supper and evening guests 
of Mr.  and Mrs. Arnold 
LaPeer. 

Reva Silver was a Satur- 
day evening guest of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gerald Wills. 

Mr. and Mrs. Evans Gib- 
bard and family attended a 
graduation open house for 
Sara Otulakowski at the 
home of Mr.  and Mrs. Stan- 
ley Otulakowski Sunday. 

Carol Peter and a friend 
from Saginaw spent the 
week end with Mr.  and Mrs.  
Melvin Peter and family 
and Saturday, attended the 
Warner-Brown wedding at  
Our Savior Lutheran 
Church in Bad Axe. 

Mr. and Mrs. J im  Booms 
of Harbor Beach were Sun- 
day afternoon guests of Mr.  
and Mrs. Angus Sweeney. 

Mrs. Lynn Spencer at- 
tended the Synodical meet- 
ings at  Alma College from 
June 13-15. 

Ryan Gibbard spent 
Thursday with Mr .  and 
Mrs. Carl Gibbard. 

Carrie Tyrrell attended 
the 4-H Jr. Livestock Show 
at  Marshall Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Cle- 
land were Tuesday supper 
and evening guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Orrin Wright. 

Mickie and John Tyll of 
Grand Junction, Colo., and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Krug 
were Friday evening guests 
of Mrs. Dave Sweeney and 
David. 

Mrs. Kenneth Hazard 
was a Wednesday forenoon 
guest and Virgil Cham- 
pagne was a Wednesday af- 
ternoon guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl  Schenk. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Hendricks of Port Austin 
were Tuesday supper and 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Cliff Jackson. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don 
McKnight of Bad Axe were 
Wednesday evening guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hewitt. 

Reynold Tschirhart was 
a Sunday guest of Mr. and 
Mrs. Gil Maurer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Lam- 
ing were Sunday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Evans Gibbard and family. 

Kristen Gage of Goodrich 
spent from Saturday till 
Monday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Kolar. 

Mr .  and Mrs. Lawrence 
Spencer of Sacramento, 
Calif., are spending a week 
with Mr. and Mrs. Lynn 
Spencer and visiting other 
relatives and friends. 

Mr.  and Mrs. Jerome 
Pawlosky and sons of Mt. 
Pleasant were Sunday 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Kolar, 

Martin Bartholomy of 
North Branch was a Wed- 
nesday evening guest of 
Mr.  and Mrs. Angus 
Sweeney. Ralph Hoxie and Brian 

spent and Mrs. the week.end Lynn Spencer. with Mr. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Gib- 
bard Jr, and family and 

From the company and 
agent who’ve earned your 
trust through car and home 
insiirance Ask me about 
LIFE 

Ernest A. 
Teichman Jr. 

6240 W. Main 
Cass City, Mich. 
Phone 872-3388 

Lutheran 
Ladies Aid 

were supper guests of Mr. 

Margie of Elkton. 
Mr. and Mrs. Olin Bouck 

spent two days recently Fifteen members and One 

Aid met June 4 in the Cass land. Mr. and MrF. R~~ Davis City Recreation Park for a 

and Mr.  and Mrs. olin potluck picnic dinner and 
Bouck spent the week end meeting. 
with M ~ .  and Mrs. earl Pet- It was decided the annual 
terson at Lost Lake near 9-10. rummage A bake sale sale will be also 
Lincoln. 

Miller were Tuesday dinner The meeting be 
guests of the Olin Boucks. 

and Mrs. Floyd Farvcr and plans sale 

with Mr. and Mrs. Ernest guest of the Good Shepherd 
Bouck and family at  Hart- Lutheran Church Ladies 

Mr.  and Mrs. Clarence be then. 

Sept. lo. 

I 1 

FARM BUREAU 

The Shabbona Fa rm 
Bureau group met Thurs- 
day evening a t  the home of 
Mr .  and Mrs. Orrin Wright. 
Lynn Spencer led the dis- 
cussion on “unified policy. 
front needed to serve all ag- 
riculture. )’ 

The July 12 meeting will 
be held at the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Hendrick in 
Cass City. 

A potluck lunch was 
served. 

............................................................................... ............................................................................. .............................................................................. ............................................................................. ................................................................................................................................. ......................... .............................................................................. ............................................................................. 

Your neighbor says 

I would like to visit 
Sweden and Austria 

Where would Joye Strye 
go if she could go anywhere 
for vacation? 

“Let’s say I’d go to Swe- 
den,” she responded. The 
reason, she explained, is 
because her father lived in 
that country from about 
age 8-12 and shared his 
memories of the country 
with his children when they 
were growing up. Her 
father was born in Michi- 
gan; his mother was from 
Sweden. 

Where else would Mrs. 
Strye like to go? She has 
seen Austria in travelogs 
and “it seems to be so 
serene and a beautiful 
country. ” 

The favorite place she 
has been was the Vatican in 
Rome and the Blue Grotto 
in Capri. 

She recommends persons 
of any religion should visit 
the Vatican, that “the re- 
verence of any religion 
would come through.” 

“I truly believe,” Mrs. 
Strye continued, “...in the 
end, we’ll all walk into one 
big room and it will all be 
one faith, a belief in God.” 

The favorite places she 
has visited in this country 
have been the New England 
states because “so many of 
the towns are left and not 
remodeled, with so many 
different (architectural) 

periods Mrs. . Strye ” has been col- 
lecting antiques since she 
was 12. She also sells and 
appraises them, as an au- 
ctioneer and conducts 
priced house sales (where 
items are  priced, instead of 
sold at  auction). 

Vacation for her and her 
husband, Robert, this year, 
will be an antique buying 
trip through Canada and 
Pennsylvania. 

The Stryes, who live in 
Caro, have three children, 
Ronald, Arizona, Randall, 
Saginaw, and Rodrick, 
Caro, all married; four 
grandchildren and a fifth 
on the way. 

Mrs. Alex Cleland visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Clc- 
land Thursday afternoon. 

Mickie and John Tyll of 
Grand Junction came 
Tuesday to spend two 

I 1 TRS-80” Two-Disk Desktop Computer I 1 AM/FM Car Cassette 
By Realistic‘”: 64K Model 4 by Radio Shack 

I 
J 12” Monitor 

Save 11995 
$60 Reg. 179.95 

I I  Typewriter-Style Keyboard 
..... .......... ..... 

Enjoy your favorite tunes at the 1 1  
park or beach+ and save $7.07. ..... 
AFC for no-drift FM, rotary tone 
control. #12-668 Batteries extra 

;<<$ ..... ...... ...... ..... ..... ........... ...... ..... ...... ..... 

24-watt output! Auto-search, 
Dolby*B NR. DIN-size chassis 
fits in many dashes. #12-1904 
‘TM Dolby Laboratories Licensing Gorp 

Perfect for busy managers. Do word processing, manage 
inventories and investments, more. 12-key datapad. Ex- 
pand with more memory, graphics or hard disk. #26-1069 

I Cassette-Based 64K Model 4. Save $100. Learn to pro- 
gram in BASIC or use our ready-to-run cassette tape soft- 
ware. #26-1067. Reg. $999, Sale $899 Cassette recorder extra 

AM/FM Stereo Phono With Cassette Deck 
Clarinettea-108 bv Realistic 

Save 
$100 

18995 Reg. 289.95 # ......... I I I 1 

I -Quality Line Printer Cut 3I0’o I I I 
DWP-410 by Radio Shack 

$895 
Reg. 1295.00 

Prints 300 wordslmin u te. 
Forwardheverse line 
feed, underline, back- 

Bob 
I 

I 
Lef ler I i 34% off! Record cassettes off radio or from 2-speed changer. Space- 

saving “tower” design with matching 15”-high two-way speakers. 10- 
LED level meter, Auto-Magic’”’ FM, hi-filter, aux input. #13-1213 space. #26- 1 250 H - 

t 
200-Proiect Lab Kit 1 Cassette Recording TaDe Sale! 1 1 I I Slim-Line Stereo Receiver 

By Science Faif By Realistic 

Cut 33’10 Half Price 
14 60 Min. 90 Min. q;l 

n-- a a n r  , 2,,99 2,*79L-$4T- ...... ..... ..... .......... . . . . .  . . - . .  ..... ..... ..... ..... ..... ..... ..... ..... 
..... ..... ..... .......... ..... . . . . .  

299- 
..... 

12 watts per channel, minimum rms into 8 ohms 
from 20-20,000 Hx,  with no more than 0.5% THD 

Only 3” high! 5-LED signal-strength meter, / I  11-step bass and treble controls. #31-1969 

--%/ neg“ 44*y3 IReg. 1.99 Each Reg. 2.79 Each 
...... .. . . .  

Build a radio, alarm, organ, more! Easy, I Special oxide for high output and wide frequency 
safe and solderless. #28-249 Batteries extra . . . . .  ..... ..... response. Stock up! #44-6021603 .. . . .  ..... 

Direct-Drive Turntable I Card-Size Solar-Powered Calculator I ! Save $31.95 on 10-Band Equalizer 
By Realistic - cut 27% 

6-395 by Realistic EC-406 by Radio Shack 

Save $30 3Oo/o 695 ;.eg9; 
9985 Off 

Never Needs Batteries 
Handy 4-Key Memory Reg. 129.95 

mtttttttt g3] $88 
Reg. 119.95 

tonearm, $29.95 magnetic cartridge, 
Front-access controls, straight-line 

dust cover. #42-2977 
Powered by light indoors or out! 8-digit LCD, I square root and percent keys. With case. #65-904 

Twenty sliding tone controls let you empha- 
size vocalists or certain instruments, cut 
hiss or rumble. #31-2005 

to our I 
Sales Team 

1 

CASS CITY FORD 1 The Want Ads 
Are Newsy Too! SALES AND SERVICE I 

! 6392 Main St. Cass City 872-2300 
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Check For Our 
Many In Store 

Specials In 
All Departments. 
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1 

Rug Doctor Steam Cleaning 
Equipment to Rent 

We Have New Pack Garden Seeds 
In Stock Now. 

ci- - - 
Food Stamps & WlC 

Coupons Gladly Accepted 

PACKAGE LIQUOR 
Beer & Wine To Go 

* 

\ 

New books at 1 
the librarv 

Down Memory Lane 
FROM THE FILES OF THE CHRONICLE 

I J 

NEW STORE HOURS: 
Open to 7 p.m. Mon., Tues., Wed.; Thurs. and Fri. to 9 p.m 

Sat. to 6 p.m. 
-I 1 

CASTAWAY: A STORY OF SURVIVAL by Lucy Irvine 
(non-fiction). In the case of Gerald Kingsland, a modern 
Crusoe, and his young “wife” Lucy Irvine, recruited 
through a London newspaper ad, a year spent together on 
an idyllic desert island just south of Papua, New Guinea, 
meant exchanging the stresses of civilization for those of 
basic survival. After months on short water rations and an 
unbalanced, barely subsistence-level diet that seriously 
impaired their health, the timely succor of nearby island 
natives averted disaster. The couple’s physical hardships 
were aggravated by emotional problems due to a wide age 
gap, radically different temperaments and backgrounds - 
differences that even interdependence and shared 
adventures never wholly eliminated. The Scottish author - 
the younger and hardier of the pair - fell under the island’s 
spell. 

THE LAST WALTZ by Nancy Zaroulis (fiction). Against 
backdrops of Boston, Nahand and Newport in the late 1800s 
and early lms, two women play out turbulent lives. Poor, 
plain, well-bred Marian Childs meets proud beautiful Isabel 
January in a bizarre situation that makes them instant 
enemies, a relationship that gradually turns to intimate 
friendship over the years. Daughter of one of Boston’s most 
prominent Brahmin families, Isabel has been jilted by 
Lawrence Cushing, magnetically handsome rake and ne’er- 
do-well, who comes back into her life at intervals, always 
with disastrous results. For both Isabel and Marian, fate 
brings one cruel blow after another, for Zaroulis deftly 
arranges dramatic ( i f  predictable) events at steady 
intervals. 

SEVEN SILENT MEN by Noel Behn (fiction). Prarie 
Port, Mo., is a law-abiding town, positively dull by FBI 
standards, until it is hit with “the perfect crime” one 19’71 
night. Someone has managed to blow the vault of the bank 
from underground caves that snake in from the rolling 
Mississippi, then escape by flooding the caves with water 
dangerously diverted from the power plant + Fledgling 
agent William Butler Yates is chief among the host of the 
colorful characters introduced by Behn, and enough bodies 
pop up in the river to keep us immersed, 

of the Old Settlers was held 
in the Deford Methodist 
Church June 20. A prog- 
ram, directed by Mrs. 
Rinerd Knoblet included 
quartets, duets, readings 
and a cornet solo. 

Several Cass City drivers 
were in the money at  Owen- 
dale Speedway Saturday 
evening. Lyle Truemner 
won the semi-feature. He 
also was a heat winner as  
was Chuck Holm. Smokey 
Wright of Ubly won the fea- 
ture. 

FIVE YEARS AGO 

Gagetown Cub Scouts 
met at  the Gagetown park 
for an end of the school year 
pack meeting Thursday. 
Cub Scouts who earned 
badges were David 
Erickson and Marshall 
Sheldon, bobcat, and Troy 
Reehl, Billy Ehrlich and 
Marshall Sheldon, wolf. 

Ubly lost its third straight 
Babe Ruth game Monday 
by dropping a 9-8 dxision 
to Cass City. Kevin Down- 
ing went the distance for 
the winners. Mark Jahn 
started for Ubly and was 
relieved by Chris Foreman. 

Cass City Lions and 
Lionesses met June 9 at  the 
Arrowhead Country Club, 
Caro. Lion of the Year 
award for outstanding ser- 
vice, loyalty and dedication 
to Lionism was presented 
to Peter Rienstra by club 
President Jim Guinther. 

Jack Esau and daughter, 
Mary Beth of Kalamazoo, 
left Saturday on a three- 
week trip to England and 
Scotland. 

Peat MOSS 4 0 I b . $ 1  Bag 
59 

I 

1 N O W O ~ S ~ I ~ :  I 
401b. $ 1 59 

401b. $ 1 99 
TOP Soil e a Bag 

COW Manure Bag 
Get a $2.00 Rebate! Limit 5 bags with any 

35 YEAKS AGO 

B.F. Benkclman J r . ,  Irv 
Parsch, Raymond McCul- 
lough and Dr. E.C. Fritz 
spent from Saturday until 
Thursday fishing at West 
Branch. 

Fred €3. Auten, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Meredith €3. Auten 
of Cass City, is one of 190 
seniors to receive degrees 
from Bowdoin College, 
Brunswick, Maine. 

Mrs. Levi J. Helwig and 
daughters,, Lenora, Wenola 
and Joyce,and Veron Gin- 
grich were Sunday after- 
noon callers at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Hel- 
wig. 

Mr. and Mrs. R.D. Keat- 
ing spent the week end in 
Ypsilanti with Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Keating. their son 
and daughter-in-law. 

n IExtra It has always been our goal to 
save you money on your weekly 
grocery bill.. . With our new ESP 
prices, you save even more ... 
look for the ESP Savings Tags 
throughout our store! 
Thmoe am item. that h a v e  a t e m m r i l y  r d u c s d  c o w  to 
uo fm our oupplien h t  we pau d- on rn IOU. 
The80 m a .  will tm in effect eo long ao fho rsducsd coat 
10 aveibM. to uo The average kngth of time king tarr 
to mix W H k l  

TEN YEARS AGO 

The Cass City High 
School class of 1949 held its 
25th year reunion Saturday 
night at Wildwood Farms. 
About 35 of the 81 graduates 
attended the gathering with 
J im Wallace of Midland as  
master of ceremonies. En- 
tertainment was provided 
by Charles Kircher of Ann 
Arbor, who played the 
clarinet. 

Carol Lynn Clarke, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Lyle Clarke of Cass City, 
was listed among the 496 
students named to the 
Searcy, Ark., Harding Col- 
lege dean’s list for the 
spring semester. 

The Church Softball 
League swung into high 
gear after opening last 
week. The Cass City 
Methodists showed plenty 
of power a s  they blasted 
their way to a 10-6 decision 
over Missionary Thursday. 
Randy Kozan pitched the 
win and veteran Roger 
Root suffered the loss. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Jackson of Sand Lake spent 
Tuesday until Thursday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Glen 
Shagena. 

Reg. Now Save 

French’s Instant Potatoes 4 varieties .89 e 72 i r e  

The movie to be shown at 1:30 p.m. this Thursday for 
children will be “Rabbit Hil l .”  Old Settlers 

exc harige 
memories 

Alcohol seminar set 
NO Salt Alternative 11 02. 2.69 2,27 4 2 t  Tuscola County area bar 

owners can learn how to 
prevent drunk driving 
when the techniques of al- 
cohol management (TAM) 
seminar comes to the 
Eagles Hall, 651 South 
State, Vassar, Tuesday. 

The eight-hour seminar, 
sponsored by the Michigan 
Licensed Beverage Associ- 
ation (MLBA), is the first 
of its kind in the nation to 
teach bar and restaurant 
employees how to monitor 
customers’ drinking be- 
havior. 

It also includes informa- 
tion on the clinical effects 
of alcohol, recognizing the 
signs of intoxication and 
ureventing service to 

minors. 
TAM is funded by the 

MLBA and a $50,000 federal 
grant made available by 
the state Office of Highway 
Safety Planning. Also in- 
volved in development of 
the program are the Associ- 
ation of Chiefs of Police, 
Michigan Liquor Control 
Commission, Association, Michigan 
Sheriffs’ 
Michigan State Police and 
the Ottice of Substance 
Abuse Services. 

Michigan alcoholic be- 
verage licensees and their 
employees may register for 
the seminar by calling 1- 
800-643-6722. Cost is $15 per 
person. The seminar begins 
a t  10 a.m. 

Memories of Deford were 
brought alive at  the Old 
Settlers Reunion Saturday 
by the 40 people present, 
many of whom had connec- 
tion with the village in the 
past. 

Neva Cones Zinnecker 
said that her father, Emery 
Cones, owned the general 
store and attended the De- 
ford School and later be- 
came a teacher there. This 
was her first reunion. 

Other first-timers were 
from the John Clark fam- 
ily: Leila, Josephine, Della 
and Donald. Leila Clark 
Huffman related memories 
of the Clark family. 

All Soap Powder 15702. 6.77 5.84 936 

Cookie Crisp Chocolate Cereal 11 02. 1.79 1.59 2 0 ~  

Donkey Kong Cereal 17 OZ. 2.43 2.21 22C 

Reynold’s Foil 12 in. 75 ft.  

2.89 2.66 23C MOP & GIO Floor Wax 
The largest familv at- ’ 

Y 

Lysol Spray 1 8 ~ ~ .  3.17 2.88 29C tending w& five brithers 
and two sisters of the Craw- 
fords. Also represented 
were the Hicks and Mar- 
tins, who have attended for 
several generations. 

Martin Goldie 
McLaughlin, who is 91, was 
the oldest in attendance. 

Besides many memories 
exchanged, persons gave 
several readings and Clare 
Crawford played “Silver 
Threads” and “When You 
and I Were Young, Maggie” 
on the violin. Audley and 
Charlotte Homer per- 
formed a duet of “I Know 
Who Holds Tomorrow. ” 

Officers reelected were 
Albert Englehart, presi- 
dent; Grant Kellcy, vice- 
president, and Leta Gelatt, 
secretary and treasurer. 

Mardell Ware gave the 
memorial for 18 persons 
who died in the last year. 

The 75th reunion is plan- 
ned for the third Saturday 
of June, 1985. 

25 YEARS AGO 

HOME FORSALE Tom Gruber and Bill 
Johnston announced this 
week that they have be- 
come partners in the bar- 
bershop formerly owned 
and operated by Mr. 
Johnston. 

Mr.  and Mrs. Mack Little 
were guests of honor at a 
surprise lawn party Sunday 
afternoon celebrating their 
30th wedding anniversary. 

The 49th annual reunion 

LaChoy Chicken Chow Main Bi-Pack 42 OZ. 2.47 2.27 2oC 

look for more ESP Savings in All Departments 
look for the Green Tag 

Commodity 
d is t rib ut io 11 

Retiring, going north, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, natural white 
stone fireplace, gas or wood heat. Central air, full 
basement, 2V2 car garage, extra large lot, excellent 
locat ion. 

Tuesday 
The Human Develop- 

ment Commission will con- 
duct a surplus commodity 
distribution Tuesday, June 
26, at the Lions Club pavil- 
ion at  the east end of the 
Cass City Recreation Park.  

Hours will be from 9:30- 
11:30 a.m. ,  or until the sup- 
ply * is exhausted. Com- 
modities will be distributed 
at that time at  the fair- 
grounds in Caro and Vas- 
sar. 

Individuals must report 
to the distribution site in 
person and present their 
surplus commodity regist- 
ration card. Those unable 
physically to go to the dis- 
tribution may have some- 
one pick up their surplus 
commodities only if the 
card is shown. 

If an individual has not 
yet received this card,  they 
must register at the HDC 
office in their county prior 
to the day of the distribu- 
tion. The telephone number 
for the HDC office is 673- 
4121. Registration is by ap- 
pointment only. 

All households who are  
receiving a form of public 
assistance, such as  AFDC, 
General Assistance, food 
stamps or SSI, may be elig- 
ible to receiye the com- 
modities. 

Households who have re- 
ceived services through the 
HDC, persons living on 
fixed incomes or unemploy- 
ment benefits may also be 
eligible to receive the com- 
modities, in accordance 
with federal poverty in- 
come guidelines. 

The surplus commodities 
have been made available 
to HDC from the federal 
government. 

APPOINTMENTS ONLY 

872-3520 

i NOW OPEN 
+ + Hairs-TolU 
i 

Styling Salon 

i 
+ + 

for 
Men -Women -Teens - Children 

ALL THE NEW STYLES FO 

+ 
4 + 
+ 4 

: A NEW YOU 

A = - -  \ -B- 

sCoupon 
------ {a Bonus Coupon 

”NEW“ %E .GRANULATED i 
i + 

4 
i 

F A M E  w 

Tomato I 
Juice - 

1 FAME 

I Limit 1 -10 Ib. Beg 

Come In and Give Us a Trv 
4 I + Owner & Stylist Joan Tomich 
4 + Bring In This Coupon ! Stvlist Jeannette 4 

i With 

” FOR $5.00 OFF i Shope Wright,Jean and Denise 

$ !  On Any Perm thru June I Osen toski + 
:I 

i Tuesday thru Friday 9-5 - Sat. 9-3 + Wednesday Men’s Night 5-9 - Walk-Ins Welcome 
CALL 872-2230 4546 LEACH ST.,CASS CITY 
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Elmquist 
project 
engineer Phone 672-9489 

Shabbona Area News 
Marie Meredith I c I Donna J .  (Griffith) 

Candice Chcrniawski. Elmquist has been named 
by Rockwell International 

ger entertained their as project engineer in 
families Sunday for charge of Minuteman I1 
Father’s Day. missile software develop- 

The Pioneer Group will ment a t  the Hill Engineer- 
meet Thursday, June 28, at  ing Test Facility, Ogden, 
the Sanilac County Park for Utah. 

Mr. and Mrs. MerriH Kre- 
Mrs. Frank Pelton rc- 

turned home after spending 
a week at  Nashville. She 
was accompanied by Mrs. 
Raymond Wallace and 
Mrs. Bernell Doerr of Ar- 
gyle. 

Mrs. Andy Hoagg, Mrs. 
Robert Wheeler and Mrs. 
Gordon Ferguson were in 
Saginaw Monday. They cal- 
led on Mrs. Robert Behr. 

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Dor- 
man were Father’s Day 
dinner guests of Mr.  and 
Mrs. Dean Smith and fam- 
ily. 

Word was received last 
Tuesday of the death of 
Verna Hyatt MacMillian of 
Saginaw. Her funeral was 

attended the services in 
Saginaw. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
Smith attended the monthly 
meeting of the Gideons 
Tuesday evening. They met 
a t  the Whipple Tree in San- 
dusky. 

Mrs. DeWayne Kyser of 
Shepherd spent overnight 
Friday with her sister, Miss 
Grace Wheeler. Saturday, 
Mrs. Kyser, Miss Wheeler 
and Mrs. George Krause at-  
tended the Sandusky High 
School class reunion. 

Misses Julie Smith, 
Becky Severance, Tanya 
and Terri Darr spent last 
week a t  Washington, D.C., 
as delegates from Sanilac 

Mr. and Mrs. Merrill Kre- 
ger and family attended 
open house a t  the homc of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Par ry  at  
Croswell Saturday in honor 
of their sons, Don, who 
graduated from Marquette, 
and Jack,  homc from 
Washington state. 

Mrs. Ryerson Puter- 
baugh and daughter Lana 
attended the graduation of 
Kathy Puterbaugh Thurs- 
day a t  Almont. 

Mr. and Mrs. Voyle Ilor- 
man were Sunday supper 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Mika in honor of Father’s 
Day. 

Mrs. Andy Hoagg and 
Mrs. Robert Wheeler spent 
Saturday in Pontiac visit- 

a noon dinner. 
The HLDS Women’s De- 

partment meeting has been 
postponed for one week. It 
will be Thursday evening, 
June 28, with Velma Cle- 
land. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Smith 
and Donnie visited John 
Dunlap Sunday a t  the Tus- 
cola County Medical Care 
Facility, Caro. 

Dalton Puterbaugh re- 
turned home Monday after 
three weeks in Huron 
Memorial Hospital, Bad 
Axe. 

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Rucrkle and Mr. and Mrs. 
Randy Smith and family 
were Saturday evening 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Smith. 

Mrs. John Dunlap visited 
her sister, Miss Edith 
Schwcrin, a t  Auburn 
Heights for a few days. 

Mr. and Mrs.  Jeff Moore 
and family were Sunday 
evening guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Smith. 

The daughter of Donna 
Wernette of Cass City re- 
ceived a B.A. degree in 
mathematics and M.S. de- 
gree in management from 
California State Univer- 
sity. 

She lives in southern 
California with her daugh- 
ter, Lorisa. PICTURES of the 42 officers in the Tuscola County Sheriff’s De- 

partment are on display on a weekly rotating basis at several Tuscola 
County banks. One of the banks is the Cass City State Bank. The photos 
were taken by Carl Miller of Carl’s Studios. Making the presentation at 
Cass City is Miller, left, to Dick Wallace. Sheriff Paul Berry looks on. 
About 10 different officers are displayed each week. The project 
continues through June. 

Cass River 
Friday and a few relatives County 4-H 

ing Mr: and Mrs. Mike 
Monac. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
Smith attended a Father’s 
Day dinner a t  the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leigh 
Franklin a t  Brown City. 

Mrs. Dale Leslie and 
daughters, Ann and 
Merilee, and Rick Pobanz 
attended open house Satur- 
day for Steve Blank, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Chuck Blank. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Puterbaugh and John of Al- 
mont and Kevin of LJtica 
were Sunday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ryerson Puter- 
baugh and Lana. They went 
to Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Putcrbaughs’and family for 
a cook-out and were joined 
bv Melissa Richerson and 

WCTU meets -~ 

JAMIESON TILING 
Eight members and one 

guest attended the Cass 
River WCTU meeting held 
June 15 a t  the home of Mrs. 
Beatrice Soldan. Roll call 
was answered with a scrip- 
ture verse. Harriet Ray1 led 
devotions using the topic 
“Challenges. ” 

Announcement of the 
Youth Temperance Council 
meeting was made and is to 
be held July 30 to Aug. 3 a t  
the Brown City 
campground. 

The next meeting will be 
held July 13 at  the home of 
Mildred Trisch. 

were Refreshments 
served by the hostess, Mrs. 
Soldan. 

Cut costs with soil In 
Business 

1 30 Years 

applied insecticide 
By Dennis Stein 

Tuscola County extension 
agricultural agent 

growers automatically 
apply insecticide at  plant- 
ing time without knowing if 
they actually have enough 
of a problem to warrant 
using the insecticide, There 
is a method for estimating 
whether an insecticide will 
be necessary the following 
season to control rootworm 
on fields of continuous corn. 

Between 30 to 45 days 
after the first rootworm 
adult is seen in arca corn 
fields, a count of the beetlc- 
type adults can be taken. 
It’s recommended that 60 
plants in three areas  of the 
field be checked and the 
number of adult rootworms 
counted that can be easily 
seen, especially around the 
tassle and ear  areas. 

According to Dr. Robert 

organization called the Tus- 
cola County Field Service 
Cooperative (TCFSC) that 
will perform this scouting 
of corn fields for a small fee 
on a per acre basis. 

Persons interested in 
learning more about the 
corn rootworm counting 
method or the service pro- 
vided by the TCFSC should 
contact m e  or Beth Lake, 
TCFSC manager, a t  the Ex- 
67s-5999. tension ext. office, 228. telephone 

Call  on at 872-501 6 
or 

Dave & Dale at 6 7 8 m 4  196 
s t eve 12,s 

With the increasing need 
to cut costs on the farm 
these days, growers are 
continually on the lookout 
for ways in which to do so. 
One possibility is to seri- 
ously consider if a soil 
applied insecticide is neces- 
sary on your corn fields. 

Not all corn fields will re- 
quire a soil-applied insec- 
ticide, but on the same line, 
not all corn fields can get 
by without one. The impor- 
tant thing to know is exactly 
what insects one might ex- 
pect to be active in each 
field. 

b y  Army 
4 State wheat Spec. 4 Joseph D. Stevens 

received an Army Com- 
mendation Medal for ser- 
vice while stationed at  Fort 
Carson, Colo., as a fuel and 
c 1 ec t ro n i c s s y s t e m s vehicle 
m cc h a n i c . 

€ I e  has bccn stationed a t  
Camp Casey, Korea, since 
April. 

crop could 
be record Coming Auctions 

Saturday,June 23 - A 
household auction includ- 
ing antiques will be held at 
thc Fern Maier residence, 
tK35 Third St.,  Cass City. 
Osentoski Auction Service. 

Saturday, Junc 30 - The 
personal property and real 
estate of Bertha M. West 
will be sold at the resi- 
dence, 6712 Main St., Cass 
City. Hillakcr Auction Ser- 
vice. 

Saturday, July 7 - Items 
from the E.B. Schwaderer 
home will be sold at  6201 
Dale St., Cass City. Hill- 
aker Auction Service. 

After a cool wet spring, 
growth and development of 
Michigan’s 1984 winter 
wheat crop has benefitted 
from warmer tempera- 
tures. However, crop prog- 
ress remains behind nor- 
mal. 

Production from this 
year’s crop is expected to 
total 45 million bushels, an 
increase of 26 percent from 
last year, according to the 
Michigan Agricultural Re- 
porting Service. The fore- 
cast for this year’s crop is 
2 percent above the record 
crop of 1953. 

Yields are expected to av- 
erage 50 bushels per acre, 
1 bushel above last season. 
If this yield is realized it 
will equal the record estab- 
lished in 1981. Early June 
warm weather should be- 
nefit wheat development. 

Michigan’s farmers ex- 
pected to harvest 900,000 
acres, an increase of 23 pcr- 
cent from a year ago. 

Nationally, winter wheat 
production is forecast at  
1.97 billion bushels, 1 per- 
cent less than 1983’s output 
of 1.99 billion bushels. 

Certain fields a re  prime 
candidates for a soil 
applied insecticide. If the 
field is described by anyone 
of the following situations, 
insecticide would be ad- 
vised: 1)  fields high i n  or- 
ganic matter, 2 )  heavy ap- 
plications of manure have 
been made, 3 )  weeds, hay 
fields or old pastures have 
been plowed down or 4 )  a 
past history of a problem 
with soil-active pests. 

Ruppell, Michigan State 
University entomologist, 
only 14 percent of the total 
corn acres (first year as 
well a s  continuous) need to 
be treated at  planting. In 
actuality, approximately 50 
percent of t h c l  total corn 
acres are  treated. 

The count is simple to 
perform, and growers a r t  
encouraged to do so. How- 
ever, there is a non-profit 

J27047 f15286 I 1983 Cavalier Wagon 5659500 

1983 Delta 88 4 Dr. $1 o,900°0 I The main soil-active 
pests we are  concerned 
with in this area are corn 

larvae, rootworm 
wireworms, seedcorn mag- 
gots, nematodes and white 
grubs. Before you choose 
an insecticide, make sure  
you know what insects 
might be a problem, be- 
cause not all insecticides 
control the same pests. 

The most common prob- 
lem pest listed above is the 
corn rootworm. Many 

a 

1983 Camaro Sport Coupe i 
JOSEP€I STEVENS 

Stevens, who has been in 
the Army two years, is the 
son of Dale and Joyce Ste- 
vens, Cass City. His wife, 
Kelly, and their daughter, 
Stephanie Lynn, 3’2  
months, a re  living with her 
parents, David and Lynn 
Dearing, Cass City, while 
he is i n  Korea. 

1982 Cutlass Cruiser Wagon $699Soo s18135 
1981 Omega 2 Dr., Air 5549500 s15580 
1981 Omega 4 Or., Air 5449550 $1 38” 
1981 Omega 4 Dr., Vinyl Roof $4895” $1 3Soo 

1981 Olds 88 4 Dr. $79950° f24245 

1981 Olds Cutlass 4 Dr. E6750°0 $l9g3O 
1981 Chevette 4 Or. 3 To Choose From 

1980 Mustang 2 Tone L3995°0 1 0602 

1980 AMC Eagle 4 W.D: L4995°0 L14142 
1980 Chevrolet Monra f3495°0 s8832 

1980 Chevrolet YI Ton Pickup $47950° s13434 

1980 Chevrolet Impala 4 Dr. s4950°0 $l3Ss3 
1980 Malibu 4 Dr. ’ $34950° s8832 
1979 Chevette 2 Or. 1275Q00 $61” 
1979 Ford ’/2 Ton Pickup $4295” 511664 
1979 Buick LeSabre 4 Dr. 5465000 $12g2’ 

1977 Olds 88 4 Dr. 1259500 s7847 

I 

1978 Carnaro Sport Coupe f3495°0 5 1 2 2 7 5  

PAYMENTS F I G U R E 0  WITH $1000.00 DOWN PLUS T A X  AND TRANSFERS 
83’s ~ 14% . 4  Years 82’s 14% 42 Months 81’s 15% 36 Months 

80’s & 79‘s. 16.5% 36 Months 78‘s & Older 16 5% . 2 4  Months 

&] 

PAT CAI)ILLAC 

~ N I o T o R s p A # I s D r v I s I o N  
CHEVROLET= 

OLDSMOBDLE- 

C URTIS 
700 W. SWate Caro Ph. 6734 17 1 

Anthony survives 
The ATCe200S, for those who want more play than work 
f r o m  their A T C ,  but with the option of either. With a new, 
larger engine, it delivers more IQW and midrange grunt for 
the rough stuff, while retaining the  hydraulic front 
suspension, light weight and quick handling that make it 
t he  perfect dual purpose machine. AH in all, agreat machihe 
for those that want the best of both worlds. 

bout with lightning 
mother, Anthony, was his brother that the sur- 

wasn’t a storm. “It rained in that area On business, prise party and his funeral 
and then the sun out outdrove the tornado and could have been the same 

wasgoing towatch the arrived son had home been to find struck out her by day; ~~ “When you go, you 
T;d,...- 7’ 

~ 

G E T  A 3-WHEELER YOU ALWAYS 
WANTED AT A PRICE YOU CAN 
NOW AFFORD ... Plus Ilgcl5. 

‘I’€iE:RE WERE MANY 
ironies. The antenna wire 
on the outside was broken 
during the wind storm sev- 
eral  weeks ago. Anthony 
didn’t get around to repair- 
ing it until the day before 
the incident. 

The reason the TV needed 
connecting to the wire on 
the inside was because the 
carpet had been cleaned 
that day, so all the furniture 
had been moved off it. 

The lightning struck 

lightning. 
Saturday would have 

been a big day for Anthony. 
A fishing trip was planned 
that day and in the evening, 
a surprise party was plan- 
ned for his wife, who re- 
cently received her regis- 
tered nursing degree from 
St. Clair County Commun- 
ity College. She has worked 
as a licensed practical 
nurse at  Hills and Dales for 
about 10 years. The party 
was held without him. 

A kTTUnNV WUcl U A C 

EjU 
As mentioned, it was the 

second time he was struck 
by lightning. “Back when I 
was 14, I got hit riding my 
motorcycle in a thun- 
derstorm. I got blown in a 
ditch and laid there for a 
while . ” 

Asked if escaping the 
grim reaper a second time 
made him more religious, 
Anthony responded it 
hadn’t. “My wife is though. 
She said she did the prayers 
for both of us.” 

Only while supply lasts. Reg. $1395 

SUZUKI 
HONDA SALES 

Between Elkton & Bad Axe on M-142 
ELKTON 375-239 1 

about the Same time a tor- n n w i 7  ‘ 9  ” ILW IaAU 

nado struck the Bay Port - a ’ens‘ of humor about his 
Caseville area. Anthony’s ordeal, said he joked with 

s’ delight a .  

beautiful PRESCRIPTION 
SUNGLASSES!! 

ding Line Choose from Selected Frames 

* r  1. FREE with examination and first pair of glasses 

U,LIJL-V I L I L  ai CQ. ~ i i t , i i w i ~ y  J 

r It 

*$-&&Wedding Line 

/(“ I Limited to single vision lenses; previous orders, discounts and funded 
programs not included. Offer valid for individuals 16 years or older. 

1nvitationS 



PAGE ELEVEN CASS CITY, MICHIGAN CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, J U N E  21,1984 

Heavy Duty 
Liquid Laundry 

Detergent 

Dutch 
S I  99 

$1 59 

3gc Per Pound 

2gC 

lalifornia White 

Potatoes 8Ib.Bag 
jed California 

P I u m s 
40. 1 Golden Ripe 

Bananas PerPound 

Whole 

Watermelons 
$ 2 2 9  

each 

Sunshine 

A C heez-l ts 
loo*. Box 89 

. -  
el Monte 2 - 7  

'Green Beans 
'Sweet Whole Kernel or Peas Cream Style 2/99 C 

16-1 7 02. 
'Corn Cans 

Pillsbury 
4 Varieties 

Milk 
Bars 
$1 9 02. 39 
Box 

Country 
Hearth 

Buttermilk 

Bread 

Spread 
Country ' Ib. 59 c 
Crock 

McDonald's Low Fat 

- - /  - k i \  McDonald's All Flavors 

McDonald's 

Sour Cream Tropical 
1602. 89c Pops 

12 ct. 9gc Ctn. 
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From Argyle to Oregon 
CASS CITY MICHIGAN 

Retired teacher inspires exlstudent 40 vears later 
When Thelma Sickler 

started teaching at Palmer 
School near Argyle in the 
fall of 1943, she was only a 
year out of Cass City High 
School and not much older 
than some of her students. 

But the positive influence 
the young teacher had on 
her students was long re- 
membered by one of them 
-- for about 40 years. 

Thelma Sickler, now 
Thelma Gaeth, retired 
from teaching at Unionville 
Elementary School at the 
end of the 1981-82 school 
year. She and her husband, 
Norbert, live in Sebcwaing. 

She graduated from high 
school in 1942 and then at- 
tended Tuscola County Nor- 
mal School in Car0 for a 
year, which was all that 

was necessary to begin 
teaching in those days. 

Her first tcaching job was 
at Palmer School, four 
miles east of Argyle and a 
half-mile south. She taught 
thwc thrcc years and one 
of her students during those 
years, i n  grades 5, 6 and 7, 
was Violet Phillius. 

Now Violet Whittaker 
and a kindergarten teacher 

in Salem, Oregon, when the 
Salem Statesman-Journal 
asked its readers to send in 
essays about their favorite 
teachers, she had no trou- 
ble remembering her favo- 
rite teacher. It was Thelma 
Sickler. 

Her essay was one of 
more than 200 submitted to 
the paper and one of nine 
winners published in its 
April 8 edition. It is pub- 
lished below. 

ning entry, Mrs. Whittaker 
received a $100 gift certifi- 
cate from a Salem 
bookstore, as  did Mrs. 
Gaeth. 

Mrs. Gaeth didn’t know 
anything of the contest until 
she received a letter from 
the Statesman-Journal 
shortly after the winning 
essays were published. 

She and- Mrs. Whittaker 
had not stayed in contact 
over the years, but a 

their addresses. Mrs. 
Gaeth wrote Mrs.  Whit- 
taker, who in response 
wrote a six-page letter tel- 
ling her what had happened 
to her and her family. 

All but one of the books, 
a Bible, that Mrs. Gaeth or- 
dered as  her prize arrived 
May 30. As she and her hus- 
band, a semi-retired elec- 
trician, like to go traveling 
with their travel trailer, the 
six books she received were 

ing ones about the national 
parks, Alaska and Hawaii 
and a campground direc- 
tory. She will receive the 
Bible later. 

teaching job, Mrs. Gaeth 
said, “When you have them 
(the same students) three 
years, it’s a pretty close- 
knit family.” The then Miss 
Sickler next taught fourth 
grade two ycars in San- 
dusky. 

She and Norbert, who 
was from Unionville, were 
married in 1948 and they 
moved to Sebewaing, 
where she taught fourth 
grade for five years. 

She then left teaching to 
raise her family. Her chil- 
dren are  Neil Gaetki’of Sebe- 
waing and Sharon (Mrs. 
David) Matthews of De- 

OF HER FIRST 

cker. She has two grand- 
children. 

After an absence of 17 
years from the classroom, 
Mrs. Gaeth returned in 
1970. The Unionville and 
Sebewaing merged during her districts ab- 

sence, so she taught in the 
new district’s sole elemen- 
tary school in Unionville. 

Mrs. Gaeth completed 
work on her bachelor’s de- 
gree from Central Michi- 
gan University after re- 
turning to teaching. She 
continued her education 
and earned 20 graduate 
hours of credit. 

At Unionville Elemen- 
tary School, she first taught 
fifth grade, then fourth and 
fifth and finally fourth be- 
fore retiring. 

FOR IIER WIN- mutual friend had both all about traveling, includ- 

The Winning Essay 
By Violet Whittaker 

She was young - too 
young - to be our 
teacher, but there she 
was on that first day of 
school, standing beside 
the door of the old red- 
brick schoolhouse, 
greeting each of her new 
pupils as  they eagerly 
arrived. 

We knew right away 
that it was going to be a 
good year, for she ac- 
cepted us just as  we 
were - tousled, patched, 
war-time country kids. 

She liked us!  She 
smiled. She was beauti- 
f u l !  Immediately I fell 
in love with her for I had 
found a friend. Jubil- 
antly I started swinging 
back and forth between 
rows, then slipped and 
crashed to the floor ... she 
only smiled understand- 
ingly in my direction. 
Never again did I cause 
havoc. 

She provided a clean 
classroom with walls de- 
corated and windows 
shining. Plants, pic- 
tures, maps, posters, 
books and tools were all 
there. The Palmer al- 
phabet, both in rnanus- 
cript and cursive, was 
displayed above the 
blackboards for all to 
memorize and imitate. 
Good handwriting 
emerged as if by magic. 
Her own beautiful work 
on the board inspired us. 

She had supplied a 
woodshop corner with a 
bench especially for the 
many boys. They 
supplied the wood, tools 
and tinker parts, and 
kept the school in good 
repair. 

Our new teacher made 
a useful friend of the old 
pot - bell ied stove that 
warmed our bones in 
winter. There we not 
only dried our mittens, 
but heated soup, baked 
potatoes and roasted 
wieners. 

She also served as cus- 
todian. Often we helped 
her sweep the oiled 
floors, carry firewood 
and coal buckets, fetch 
water, dust and wash the 
boards. 

She was nurse to 
bleeding noses, mashed 
fingers, frostbitten 
hands, bruised faces and 
occasional concussions. 

Assuming - probably 
because she was so 
young - that we were in- 
telligent, industrious, 
obedient, considerate 
people, worked won- 
ders. Discipline prob- 
lems did not exist under 
her kind leadership. All 
students from beginners 
to eighth graders as- 
sumed responsibility for 
several tasks. When we 
learned something, we, 
in turn, taught the next 
person. 

Students were allowed 
to work independently 
and progress as  rapidly 
a s  possible through 
textbooks. Many ad- 
vanced several grades. 

After noon every day 
she read to us from all 
kinds of books: “Black 
Beauty,” “Huck Finn ,”  
“The Brothers Grimm,” 
the classics. We rushed 
in from baseball to lis- 
ten. We trudged away 
from winter snow forts 

to hear her. 
She loved music and 

taught a roomful of re- 
luctant non-singers to 
carry a tune acceptably. 
We still sing those songs. 

Her intense pat riotism 
rubbed off on us. We  
wrote to soldiers. On 
Saturdays she took us to 
collect milkweed pods 
for life jackets. 

During winter she 
taught us all to knit. (My 
mother still hasn’t 
washed the white 
“washcloth” my little 
brother knit - for each 
row was a variegated 
shade of grubby-gray 
which she cherishes! ) 

Our teacher involved 
our school in sports con- 
tests with other schools. 
When it was our turn to 
travel to see them, she 
would pack the whole 
student body into her old 
Plymouth. The big boys 
rode on fenders and the 
little tykcs squeezed into 
the car trunk. We  made 
it somehow. 

She taught us  rever- 
ence for our creator. 
“Beyond the blue sky 
God dwells. Someday we 
shall meet Him and give 
an account of our life’s 
deeds.” The Bible which 
the Gideons brought was 
treasured even more 
than the old worn dictio- 
nary. 

My favorite teacher - 
Miss Thelma Sickler - 

made school days the 
highlights of our years. 
And what became of me 
as  a result? I decided 
that I would become a 
teacher ! 

STUDENT PORTRAIT -- The 25 students in eight grades 
at Palmer School the first year Thelma Sickler taught 
there, one year after graduating from Cass City High 
School. 

THELMA GAETH in a recent 
photograph. She retired in 1982 after 22 
years of teaching. 

EIGHTH GRADE students at Palmer School stand with 
their teacher, Thelma Sickler, who is at right. 

prints free! 
Bring in your 

Kodacolor original roll and of 

other popular 
sizes film 110, brands, 126, 

135 and Disc, 
H.ite, processing 
mnting rnd set of and mints get 

v -  free! Regular-size 3x prints Only. 
b 

VIOLET PHILLIPS (center) when 
she was a fifth grader at Palmer 

PALMER SCHOOL, east of Argyle, as it looked during the 1943-44 school School* Now Violet-whittaker, she is a 
year. Outhouses are at far left and right. There was an outside pump for water. kindergarten teacher in Salem, 
Miss Thelma Sickler’s Plymouth, mentioned by Violet Whittaker in her essay, Oregon. 
is next to the building. (Photographs courtesy of Thelma Gaeth and Sebewaing Blade) 

The female pigeon cannot 
lay eggs if she is alone. If no 
other pigeon is available, 
her own reflection in a mir- 
ror will suffice. 

How can low cost insurance 
guarantee al l  your valuables are covered? 

No problem. SEALED BIDS 
Auto-O\s tiers Pcrsonal Articles Protection assures you that 
your‘ \ aluablc belonging5 are covered against financial loss. 
And, i t ’r  otl’crcd at a low cost, too. So ask your  “no 
problcfii** Auto-Ownc‘r5 agent how you can protect your 
\~aluahlc articlcr such as ar twork and Jewelry the same,. safe 
u ay ~ ‘ O U  prot cct y o u r  horrie. 

The Tuscola County Board of Commissioners will receive sealed 
bids for the sale and removal of a 2 story single family house to be 
removed from the premises located at 239 E. Sherman Street, Caro, 
Michigan. Building can be inspected by appointment. Contact Tuscola 
County Department of Public Works - telephone 673-5999 ext. 209. 

Site must be left free and clear of debris and filled to existing grade. 
Basement floor to be broken up. 

A Performance Bond of $200 or cash is required, refundable upon 
satisfactory completion of project. Bidder shall furnish necessary 
liability insurance. 

Bids to be delivered to Tuscola County Department of Public Works, 
207 East Grant Street, Caro, Michigan 48723. 

The Board of Commissioners reserves the right to reject any or all - 
bids and waive any informality in any bids should it consider same to 
be in the best interest of the County. 

Deadline to receive bids - July 20,1984 at 4:OO p.m. 
Bid Opening - July 23,1984 at 9:00 a.m. - Courthouse Annex. 

Award Bid - July 24, 1984 at 130 p.m. - Board of Commissioners 
meeting. 

I 

Discount Coupon 
One to a Customer 

Call or Stop By 

Harris- Hampshire Agency, Inc. 
6815 E Cass City Road Cass Ci ty  872-4351 

Men - Women - Children 

PERMS 
Quality MQ Products Sold 
Walk-ins Always Welcome 

Call 872-4722 For An 
Appointment Ahead of Time [Others Get Quick Results With1 

DANA’S DOWNSTAIRS 
BARBER SHOP Chronicle’s Classified Ads 1 

t You Will Too! t I Corner Main 8. Seeger, Under Osentoski Realty 
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Season completed 

0 bituaries Minor League 
I" *-,Y-. P icks all=stars 
/ 

d# A d 
GEORGE JOHNSON Elder William Randolph 

Hardin presiding. 
Burial was in Kingston 

Cemetery. 
C I  IAKLES KO'l'SC€I 

Charles Kotsch, 78, of 
Kingston, died June 12 in 
Marlette Community Hos- 
pital after a short illness. 

He was born Nov. 26,1905, 
in  Elco,Pa., thc son of Jacob 
and Ann  (Zadula) Kotsch. 

He married Mary Kapral 
in 1931 in Detroit. They 
came to Kingston in 1970. 

Kotsch was a retired 
switchman and conductor 
for the C & 0 Railroad. 

He is s u r v i v 4  by his 
wife; two sons, Richard, 
Anchorage, Alaska, and 
Charles J r . ,  Kingston ; four 
grandchildtwi, Charles 
Norman, Khristine Marie, 
Kenneth John Kotsch. and 
Jason Michael Mayor, and 
numerous nieces and 
nephews. Iltl was preceded 
in  death by a daughter, 
Frances M .  Mayor. 

Funeral scrviccs were 
held Saturday morning a t  
St. Michacl Catholic 
Church, Wilmot, with 
Father Williani O'Shea of- 
ficiating. A scripturc rcad- 
ing was given that cvctiing 
at Harm on -1 La n cc E'u ne r a 1 
Home, Kingston. 

Burial w a s  in the church 
cc met c r  y . 

George H. Johnson, 7 1, of 
Silverwood, died June 12 in 
Car0 Community Hospital 
after a long illness. 

He was born Aug. 9, 1913, 
in Holden, Mo., the son of 
Robert and Mary (Sites) 
Johnson. 

He married Willetter 
Mentor in 1940 in Kansas 
City, Mo. They came to Sil- 
verwood in 1976. 

Johnson was a machinist 
for Allis-Chalmers Co. in 
Milwaukee, and retired 
eight years ago. He be- 
longed to the Masonic 
Lodge and was royal poten- 
tate at the Mecca Chapter 
of the Shriners in Mil- 
waukee, Wis. 

Johnson is survived by 
his wife; three sons, 
Robert, David and George 
J r . ,  all of Milwaukee; seven 
daughters, Georgetter , 
Mary, Nelleca and Melody, 
all of Milwaukee, Ruth and 
Linda, of Silverwood, and 
Katherine, of Madison, 
Wis.; two sisters, Nellie 
Barnes of Silverwood and 
Henrietta Douglas of At- 
anta,  and five grandchil- 

dren. He was preceded in 
death by a son, Clyde. 

Funeral services were 
held Saturday afternoon at 
Harmon-Lance Furicral 
Home, Kingston, with 

The Cass City Boys' 
Minor League, which con- 
cluded its season last week, 
will play its all-star game 
a t  6 p.m. Wednesday, June 
27, on the minor league 
diamond. 

The game will pit the Na- 
tional League (Cubs, 
Giants and Pirates) against 
the American League 
(Orioles, Tigers and Yan- 
kees ) . 

Players were selected by 
the coaches based on their 
ability and sportsmanship. 

Players selected were : 
National League -- Cubs, 

Mike Furness, John Gib- 

son, Kevin Smerdon, Allen 
Prosowski; Giants, Rusty 
Hrycko, Billy Sattelberg, 
Jeff Schembcr, Keith 
Smith, and Pirates, Wen- 
dall Guinther, Ryan Cross, 
Kubacki. Mark Kubacki and Rich 

lar season games were: 
Orioles defeated the Pi- 
rates, 17-5; Giants over the 
Cubs, 11-4 (shortened by 
rain to four innings); Ti- 
gers over the Yankees, 8-1, 
and in a makeup game, 
Yankees over the Cubs, 26- 
4. 

American League -- 
Orioles, Tom Czekai, Kent 
Winter, Greg Woodward, 
Delbert Masterson; Tigers, 
Todd Diebel, Ben Schott, 
Greg Levalley, Jeff Hoc- 
key, and Yankees, David 
Bills, Nat Spencer, Paul 
Ulfig, Bart Hall. 

Results of the final regu- 

Final standings : 

W L  
5 0  Tigers 
3 2  Orioles 

Giants 3 2  
Yankees 3 2  
Pirates 2 3  
Cubs 0 5  

IT TOOK FIVE extra holes to break a tie with a team 
headed by Dale McIntosh for this squad to win the annual 
Harold Isard open Monday at Rolling Hills Golf Course. 
The teams finished at four under par in the scramble. 
From left: Keith Adelberg, Maynard Stine, Jim Smithson 
and Jim Fox. Croft-Clara Kings second 
Five from area 
MSUgraduates 

in Flint Fastpitch League 
The Croft-Clara Kings 

played .500 ball this past 
week as  they split the 
league doubleheader and 
were 2-2 in the week-end 
tournament a t  Corunna. 

a single, a sacrifice, and In Corunna last week end, 
three scored more in the singles. bottom of AUL the the with Kings two wins finished and two fourth 10s- 

first and again in the sixth ses. 
The wins came against to knot the score at 2-2. 

The Kings Scored in the Deer Run of Ada, 3-1, and 
top of the ?Inth when Dean Irish Pub of Lansing, 3-2. 
Elbers tripled and then Nite Cap of Flint and the 
scored on a grounder which Brewers of Ann Arbor gave 
the shortstop mishandled the Kings their losses, 3-1 
just long enough for Elbers and 4-3 respectively. 
to score. In the bottom of The Kings will travel to 
the 9th, AUL's leadoff hitter Scottville this weekend to 
singled but Jeff  Hartel stop- play in a 10-team double 
ped their threat to score by elimination tournament, 
picking the runner off first. 
The next two batters went FLINT FASTPITCH 
down quietly. Ken Martin W L  
got the win. 

collect four hits off Hughie Croft-Clara 
Harris in the second game AUL 
and went down 2-0. Craig American Coll. 

hits together for the scores. Snitko 

Croft-Clara could only Nite Cap 
9 1  8 2  

2 8  1 8  

8 2  
3 6  

Helwig only ave up five Wendy's 3 7  
hits, but Nite gap  put their Nestor's Club 

Melanie Part  icka, 
Cumber Road, Ubly, re- 
ceived a B.S. degree in biol- 
ogy and graduated with 
high honors. She will attend 
Wayne State University 
medical school this fall. 

She is the daughter of 
Melvin and Charlotte Par- 
ticka and a 1980 Cass City 

High School graduate. 
Joanne Thomas, of De- 

ckerville Road, Cass City, 
graduated with high hon- 
ors, receiving a B.A. degree 
in education. 

Jeffrey Currier, of De- 
ckerville Road, Cass City, 
received a B.S. degree in 
geology. 

Five area students 
graduated from Michigan 
State IJniversity in various 
ceremonies Junc 8-9. 

1,auric Ware, 6581 'l'hir(1 
Street, rewived a bachelor 
of science degree in diete- 
tics. She is in Belgium for 
10 weeks doing missionary 
work with the Greater 
Europe Missions and be- 
gins a one-year dietetics in- 
ternship in Saginaw after 
she returns. 

The Kings are  now tied 
with AUL for second place 
in the Flint Fastpitch 
League after beating AUL 
3-2 in nine innings and then 
losing to Nite Cap 2-0. Rev. James Rule 
In the first game, Croft- 

Clara jumped out to a 2-0 
lead in the first inning with ordained elder Walbro sets 

Rev. James Hulc, pastor 
of the Argyle, Decker and 
Shabbona United Methodist 
Churches, was elected to 
Elder's Orders and re- 
ceived as  a full member of 
the Detroit Annual Confer- 
ence of the United 

Iethodist Church Tuesday, 
June 12, as the 143rd con- 
secutive annual session of 
the conference began at Ad- 
rian College. 

Saturday, he was or- 
dained an elder in thc IJn- 
ited Methodist Church by 
Bishop Rdsel A .  Ammons, 
resident bishop of the 
Michigan Area of the tJn- 
ited Methodist Church. 

Thc son of Cecil and 
*ielen Kule of Calumet, 
Rev. Rule graduated from 
Calumet High School in 
1962. He received a €33. de- 
gree from Northern Michi- 
gan University in 1979 and 
a master of divinity degree 
from Asbury Seminary, 
Wilmore, Ky . ,  i n  1982. 

After grad ii a t ing from 
high school, Kule scrvtld in 
the Army for three years, 

en he and his wife oper- 
ated a photography studio 
in NeEaunee in the Umer 

He has bccn swving at 
the Shabbona, Argylcl and 
Decker churches, his first 
pastoratc, siticc June, 1982. 
Bishop Amtiions has ap- 
pointed him to scrvc them 
a t  least onc mort' year. 

Mrs.  K u l t  is the former 
Peg Ricca, thc daughter of 
Joseph and Helen Iiicca of 
Calumet. She and her hus- 
band are  the parents of one 
child, Michael, 17. 

Tkem @ish second quarter undefeated 
8 C  dividend The Tigers finished their 

season with a 5-0 record by 
defeating the Yankees 11-1 
last Thursday. 

The Tigers put together a 
7-run rally in the fifth in- 
ning to secure the victory. 

The board of directors of 
Walbro Corp. June 11 de- 
clared a second quarter di- 
vidend of 8 cents per share 
payable July 31 to stockhol- 
ders of record June 29. 

Walbro recently com- 
pleted the successful offer- 
ing of an additional 300,000 
shares of ~oinnion stock, 
raising the total number of 
shares outstanding to 
1,468,143. The 8-cent di- 
vidend will be paid on all of 
these shares, continuing 
the year-long trend of 8 cent 
per share quarterly di- 
vidends. 

In announcing the second 
quarter dividend, Walbro 
President and Chief Execu- 
tive Officer Lambert E. Al- 
thaver noted that the ba- 
lance of 1984 continues to 
look favorable for the com- 
pany, with demand for car- 
buretors for gasoline trim- 

mers and outboard agplica- 
tions remaining strong. 

He also pointed out that 
new programs for float feed 
carburetors will begin in 
the third quarter. In addi- 
tion, shipments of throttle 
bodies for automotive fuel 
injection applications are  
now at sgheduled levels. 

Sales of electric fuel 
pumps for automotive af- 
termarket applications are  
at high levels. Production 
of electric fuel pumps for 
new autoniotive original 
equipment applications is 
scheduled to rise in the sec- 
ond half of the year, Al- 
thaver said. 

Demand for custom man- 
ufactured parts, which in- 
clude aluminum and mag- 
nesium diecastings and 
precision injection-molded 
plastics parts, also remains 
strong, he added. 

Colony House 
presents 

Delivering key hits for 
the Tigers were Jeff Hoc- 
key, Greg Levalley, Billy 
Little, Billy McPhail, and 
Jeff Swiderski. 1,AURIE WARE 

Miss Ware is the daugh- 
ter of James and Joan Ware 
arid is a 1979 Cass City High 
School graduate. 

Mark Osentoski, S. Van 
Dyke Road, Ubly, received 
a bachelor of science de- 
gree in engineering. He is 
getting married next week 
and moving to Arizona later 
in the month to begin an 
engineering job with 
Motorola. 

Osentoski is the son of 
Jerry and Audrey Oscn- 
toski and a 1979 Cass City 
High School graduate. 

Catholics 
upset in 
church loop 

In a Cass City Church 
League upset last week, the 
Deford Green team beat the 
Catholics, 7-6. 

Winning pitcher was 
Mike Wilson. Gary Robin- 
son took the loss. Peninsula until he entkked 

the ministry. REV. JAMES RULE 

I I Chip 1 
Shots I 

I 
I 

Evangelical Free Churcn 
defeated Trinity United 
Methodist, 9-6, Roger Root 
took the win. Mike Stec was 
the losing pitcher. 

HOUSEHOLD & ANTIQUE 

Auction Sale Lamotte downed the Bap- 
tists, 20-7, with Vern Jacobs 
the winning pitcher. The 
loss went to Bill Bader. 

The standings : 

FLIGHT I 
Linda Herron 17 
Toby Weaver 16 
Dotty Scollon 15 
Mary Rabideau 14 
Linda Marshall 14 
Linda Helwig 13 
Colleen Krueger 13 
Michelle Zdrojewski 12 

Velma Pomaville 8 
Elaine Proctor 6 

Nelle Maharg 10 

Vera Ferguson 
Enid Craig 
Jan Kritzman 
Pat  McIntosh 
Naomi Barnes 
Joann Brown 

12 
12 
12 
9 
8 
6 

16 
16 
16 
14 
14 
14 
14 
10 
8 
8 
8 

Joe Stampley 
and W L  

4 0  
4 1  
4 1  
3 2  
2 3  
2 3  
2 3  
2 3  
1 4  
0 5  

Lamotte 
Catholics 
Colwood 
Evangelical 
Trinity United 
Shabbona 
Deford Blue 
Deford Green 
Church of Christ 
Baptists 

Saturday, June 23 Country Feeling FLIGHT I11 
Marilyn Carpenter 
Lil Jaroch 
Marilyn Biefer 
Mary Lou Murdock 
Ruth Grassmann 
Verna May MacRae 
Max Clara 
Shirley Buschlen 
Clara Gaffney 
Jane Fuester 
Phyllis Ridge 

1 p.m. sharp 
Located 3 blocks south of the stoplight in Cass City, 2'12 blocks east at 6635 Third Street, 

Cass City, Michigan. Friday, June 22 FLIGHT I1 
Jean Palmer 16 
Georgine Jensen 16 
Doris Golding 14 
Eleanora Rees 13 
Norma Wallace 13 

HOUSEHOLD 
Norge Washer 
Whirlpool Dryer 
Dining room table and 6 chairs 
5 piece bedroom set (bed, dresser, vanity, 

5 piece blonde bedroom set (bed, dresser, 

3 piece bedroom set (bed, dresser, chest) 
2 drop leaf wood tables 
Eureka vacuum cleaner 
Old bissel carpet sweeper 
2 Duncan Phyfe style end tables 
Freezer - 2 matching end tables 
Assorted pictures and lamps 
Zenith stereo console - Motorola TV 
Quasar I I  color TV - Assorted books 
Assorted tables and chairs 

table and 2 chairs) 

vanity and chair, bed stand) 

2 couches - Buffet - Hutch - Mirrors 
Yale safe - Chaise lounge 
Assorted cookware and dishes 
Assorted silverware and glassware 
Cuckoo clock - Assorted gardening tools 
Assorted men's tools 
Grandfather clock (must see to appreciate!) 
Mixer - Electric mantel clock 
Set of encyclopedias - Stepladders 
Lawn cart - Blankets, quilts, towels 
Costume jewelw 

ANTIQUES 
Hall mirror, wood frame - Assorted dishes 
Sewing machine - Antique table 
Overstuffed chairs (good condition) 
Old barometer - Green Depression plate 
Vienna-Austria dish - Vinegar cruet 

Show -- 9-10 p.m. 
Dance -- 10 p.m. - 1 a.m. 
Advance Tickets - $10.00 

At Door - $12.00 

LITTLE LEAGUE 

W L  
6 6 1  

Orioles 6 1  
5 2  
4 4  
0 6  1 6  

Sandy Robinson 13 RinDeLong Cubs 

Phone 872.3300 
8430 N. Van Dyke 

Cass City There are more than ten 
thousand golf courses in the 
United States. 

I1 

1 1  
I 1  I I  

) I  

THINGS WE PRINT 

BUSINESS CARDS 
ACCOUNTING FORMS 

S TA TE M EN TS 
ENVELOPES 

WANTED 1 1  
I I I  1, 

MEN, WOMEN, CHILDREN 
PROGRAMS I I  I I  at ;I 

:I RICHARDS' BARBER & STYLING 
I I I  ' 6592 Houghton Street (Corner of Houghton & Maple), Cass City :I Two hair stylists to serve you. Call 872-4094 for an 

I1 
I I  

appointment. Walk-ins are always welcome. 1 1  I I  VOUCHERS 
Precision cuts, wash, blow dry for one low price. I1 BROCHURES :I 

Also permanent waves. I I  

LETTERHEADS I I  

BOOKLETS I I  

I '  

1 1  I I I  I $1 00 Off All Cuts With This Coupon 
"----v----w-w* 

I Phone 872-2010 I I  Coupon Good June 1,1984 through June 30,1984 II )LCI.ILL.ICIv-L- 
p- I - - I I - - VALUABLE COUPON - - n L - - L - - - - rn - 

FERN MAIER, OWNER 
Russell Tibbits, Guardian and Conservator 

Auctioneers - Ira, David and 
Martin Osentoski 

Cass City 872-2352 or Bad Axe 269-9577 
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TURN DISCARDS INTO CASH - USE LOW COST CHRONlCLECLASSlFlED ADS 
[General) 
Merchandise 

Transit (nonbusiness) rates. 
10 words or less, $1.25 each 
insertion; additional words 7 
cents each. Three weeks for 
the price of two - cash rate. 
Save money by enclosing 
cash with mail orders. Rates 
for display want ad on 
application. 

I General 1 General 1 Automotive 1 [Merchandise) LMerchandise) 1980 TC3 Plymouth Hori- 
zon, 4 speed, sun-roof, AM- 
F M  stereo, new tires. Ex- 
cellent condition. $3100 or 
best offer. Call 872-2650. 

1977 LINCOLN Continental 
Town car,  2 door, loaded. 
Call 872-2672. 1-6-21 -3 

1-6-7-3 

FOR TALE - Kitchen Aid 
dishwasher, excellent con- 
dition, portable, model 
KDR 66 avocado, butcher- 
block top, $200 or best offer. 

2-6-21-3 Call 872-4083. 

STRAWBERRIES - $1.00 
quart or 7 5 ~  pick your own. 
Phone 665-2536 Gagetown. 

FOR SALE I 25” -console 
TV, in working condition, 
cabinet very good condi- 
tion, $75 or best offer. Call 
872-2922. 2-6-21 - 3  

2-6-21 -3 

FOR SALE - 2 2  acres ai- 
falfa, good heavy stand. I 
mile east of M-53 on Bay 
City-Forestville Rd. Call 

2-6-14-2 872-2254. 

1982 HONDA, 650 Night 
Hawk, corner of M-81 and 
M-53, across from Fuelgas. 

FOR SALE: - 8-ft. black 
aluminum pickup cover. 
Like new $275. Call 872-2645 
ask for Greg. 

2-6-7-4 

2-6-2 1 - 1 

JUST ARRIVED! Lee 
Matcrnity Jeans -- Stripes 
too! Ben Franklin, Cass 
City. 2-6-2 1 - 1 

FOR SALE - cedar posts, 
peeled or unpecled, 8-ft. 
finished picnic tables; lawn 
swings. Call 872-2039. 4351 
Rescuelid., Cass City. 

2-4-26-tf 

FOR SALE - Boat ~ motor - 
trailer, 15’/~ ft. figerglass 
tri-hull, 55 Chrysler motor. 
Excellent condition, usc 
very little, $2,500. Call 87& 
3690. 2-6-21-1 

FOR RENT - new - electrrc 
or manual typewriters by 
the week or month. Also 
leave your typewriters and 
other office equipment a t  
our store for repair. Used 
typewriters for sale. 
McConkey Jewelry. 

2-4-6-tf 

FOR SALE - Andersen 
Thermal pane window, 
6’x4’ slider $175.00. Phone 

2-3434 or 872-2596. 2-6-21 -1 

FOR SALE - 3-year-old re- 
gistered black female Lab- 
rador Retriever. Healthy, 
friendly, $175. Also free to 
loving home - male half- 
Labrador, 7 weeks old. Call 

2-6-14-3 872-4028. 

Automotive 1 
~ ~~ 

FOR SALE - 197% Nova, 
good engiiie, needs body 
work, F ~ 5 0  or best offer. 
Phone 872-2677. 1-6-21-tfn 

FOK SALE - ’71 Impala, 2- 
door, power brakes, power 
steering, runs good, some 
rust, $500 or best offer. 
Phone 872-5179. 4394 Wood- 
land. 1-6-14-3 

FOR SALE -Star Craft Star E 
Flite 6 camper.Cal1 872- 
4275. 2-6-1 4-3 

1976 MERCURY Marquis, 
full power, cruise, low 
mileage, looks and runs 
great. AM/FM stereo. $2700 
or best offer. Call 872-3683. 

1 -6-2 1 -3 
1970 FORD LTD, new 
shocks, battery, $250 or best 
offer. 3978 N .  Decker, De- 
cker. l -6- 14-3 

FOR SALE ~ Yamaha 100 
twin road bike, 3700 miles, 
excellent condition. Asking 
$300. Will trade for used car  
of equal value (preferrably 
Chrysler product with Slant 
6) .  6622 Gage St., 
Gagetown. 2-6-2 1-1 

POTATOES 
Extra large no. 1 grade 

white cooking and baking 
potatoes, 50 lb. bag. . $7.49 

New sweet and cooking 
onions 

Fresh fruits and 
vegetables 

Garden seeds - red and 
white seed potatoes 

Garden supplies 
Clearance sale - all 

flower, vegetable and 
berry plants, berry boxes 
and crates 

~ 

TEENAGERS’ 
NEEDLEPOINT CLASS 

Starts Monday, July 9, 
1:30p.m. 

4weeks - $16.00 
includes materials 

P r e - r e g i s t r a t i o n  a n d  
deposit required. 

Sunny Side of 
the Street 

STILL WHITE? Get a tan- 
wearing a bathing suit from 
Ben Franklin .... there’s still 
a good selection! 2-6-21-1 
WATERBEDS - New mod- 
els on display. 10 percent 
off on percale waterbed 
sheets during Sugar Festi- 
val week end. Buy factory 
direct and save. Waterbed 
Manufacturers of Michi- 
gan, 8625 M-25, Sebewaing. 
Call 883-3385. Open week- 
days until 5:30. Saturday 
and Sunday until 5:00. He- 
stonic waterbed on display. 

FOR SALE -old cedar rails, 
approximately 11-ft. long, 
$3 each. Dale Brown, phone 

Phone 872-2070 
2-6-14-4 

I 

2-6-2 1-1 

872-3158. 2-6-14-3 

. .  . 

FOR SALE - Montgomery 
Ward Compact 5 apartment 
size freezer, 5 years old, 
good condition, $125. Call 
872-2571 after 5 p.m. 

2-6-21 -3 

Real Estate 1 
ForSale 1 

I ForRent I LISTINGS WANTED - If 
you have a home, farm or,, 
business you’d like to sell, 
call toski Kelly Realty W. Smith - office a t  till Osen- 5:OO 

872-4377 and after 5 : O O  87 
2248. 

JJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJ- 
3-2-24-tI 

FOK RENT - 2 bedroom 
trailer on 2 acres, large gar- 
den area,  $250 month. Kids 
and pet welcome. Located 
in Wilmot.Call683-2005. Av- 
ailable immediately. 

. A _ . _  

FOR SALE - ’69 Nova, 
many new parts, $300. Huns 
good. Call 872-4086 before 
3:OO p.m. and ask for 

FOR SALE - 1974 Ford 250 
pickup, power brakes, 
power steering, automatic, 
V-8, good condition. Also, 
body parts: Ford pickup 
hood, fits 1973-79; Ford pic- 
kup grill, 1973-77; Chevy 
Impala hood, 1977-79; Vol- 
are grill, 1977. Call (517) 
635-2181 after 7 p.m. 

1-6-21 -3 

Wayne. 1-6-7-3 
.. . . 

FOR SALE --Bicycle, boy’s 
24”, 5 speed, just repaired. 
Call 872-2994. 2-6-21-1 

FOR SALE - 1975 Chevy 
Malibu station wagon. 
Good second car.  Phone 
872-2438. 1-6-21-3 

1977 CHRYSLER Cordoba. 
Phone 872-2431. 1-6-14-3 

1972 CHEVY NOVA, 350 en- 
gine, Needs little work, 
$350. Phone 872-4029. 

1-6-14-3 

BEAUTIFULLY CRAFTED 
BUSINESS CARDS 

Designed to make that first 
impression a lasting one! 

Highest quality 
raised printing 

See our new catalog. 

Cass City Chronicle 
2-2-9-tf 

CASH in the Pocket For 
baseball cards, gold rings 
and other things. Joe’s 
Pawn Shop, Bad Axe. 
Phone 269-9893. Closed Sun- 
day and Wednesday. 

FOR SALE - AKC regis- 
tered Pekingese puppy, 8 
weeks old, male, $125, Call 

2-64 1 - 1 

678-4 159. 2-6-21-3 

‘JJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJ 
4-b-14-3 - J 

J FOR RENT - Storage mace  
Real Estate J 

J CLARK’S FARM 
PRODUCE MARKET 

4 miles east of Cass City 
1 4  mile south of M-53 
Open 7 days a week 

c! 
J 
J I 
J 

for snowmobiles: Sars, J 
trailers, etc. Behind Paint J 
Store. Phone 872-2346 after 
5:~O.IMeDamrn.  4-5-24-31 

THE HALF WAY HOUSE 
J Located between Cass City and Caro, this is a like new 
J home for $37,500. 3 bedrooms, 1% baths, large living 

c.,--- 

ARE YOU READY for “Old 
fashioned ice cream”? 
Malts, sodas, sundaes, 
banana splits and cones. U- 
Foun-Dit Donut, Sandwich 
and Ice Cream Shop. 
Corner of M-81 and Decker- 
ville Rd, Open 7 days till 10 
p.m. 2-6- 14-2 

APARTMENT FOR KENT 
- 2 bedroom. $200 month 
plus security deposit. Call 

4-6-21 -2 872-4378. 

J room. Huge uriiiry room, I U L ~  UI ull1ig;S ~ - a y i i i g ,  I M J  CI u 

J basement. Private landscaped setting. 627-CY J 
J 
J Motivated Seller - Must transfer - This is a good buy, 
J Make an offer on this one-story home in the country J 
J with approximately 10 acres and a large pond next to J 
J state land and the river. Home has new roof and paint. J 
J Lots of garage space and outbuilding. Partial base- J 
J ment, woodburner and more for only $35,900. 601-HF 
J 

7 

J Approximately 20 acres on the river. A two bedroom J 

ranch style home with attached garage and pole barn. 
Located between Caro and Cass City. All appliances 
included plus wood burner. SAILOR-HF 1 

FOR SALE - ‘78 Chevy 
Scottsdale short box 4x4 
pickup, $3600. Call 683-2192 

1-6-74 
HOUSE FOR RENT - 3 bed- 
room, Cass City area,  $250 
per month, plus utilities. 
Call 313- ~651-7689. 4-6-7-3 

FOR RENT - 2 bedroom 
house. 4335 West St. $240 
month. Phone 683-2175. 

4-6-1 4-3 

’74 CHEVY MALIRU, high 
mileage. Runs good. Ask- 
ing $200. Call 872-4748 after 

FOR SALE ~ Ford 9-inch 
370 gear and positive-unit. 
Call after 6 - 872-4007. 

6:30 p.m. 1-6-7-3 

1-6-7-3 

~~ 

Puzzled? 
Give a gift subscription to 

The Cass City Chronicle 

READY FOR summer fun? 
Get your beach toys at Ben 
Franklin, Cass City ! . *  

All 
Baseball 
Gloves 

and Bats 
20% off 

now thru June 30th 

2-6-21-1 J 
-1 FOR RENT - office space, J 

McLeod Realty, Inc. J 
Birthdays , anniversaries Sunbeam 

Gas Grills 
2 and :< room units, aii car- 
peted. Main Street. Heat 
and lights furnished. Hahn 
Huilding, 6240 W. Main, 
C‘ass City. Phone 872-2155 ~ 

residence 872-3519. 

FOR RENT - 3 carpeted, bedroom 
a part men t , 
paneled, stove, re- 
frigerator. More informa- 
tion 872-3989 after 6. No 
pets. 4-6-7-3 

4-12-21-tf 

J 
J 
J 

J 

844 Hooper St. Across from 7-1 1, Caro, 
Phone 673-6106 

8498 State Rd., Millington, Phone 871-4567 ar 
REALTOR 

J 
J EQUAL HOUSING 

@ OPPORTUNITY J 
J 

Commercial - Residential - Farm JJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJJ~~ J 

FOR SALE - 1978 Vega 
Fifth Wheel camping 
trailer. Excellent condition 
$7500. Call 872-3030 between 

Bigelow Hardware after 4 .  
8 : 00-4 00 corltact 

2-6-21 -3 
- 

Beginning 
Needlepoint Class 

starts June 26 
1:OOp.m. -6weeks-$24 

(includes materials) 
Pre-registration and 

deposit required 
N E; E DLE PO I N T TI P 

There is a right and 
wrong to needlepoint 
wool Usually this can be 
felt by lightly running 
the wool through the tips 
of your fingers. One way 
will feel smoother - 
thread the smoother end 
through your needle. 

SUNNY SIDE OF 
THE STREET 

Cass City - Ph. 872-2070 
2-6-7-3 

Gift card mailed with 
each order 

I SPICES AND‘ 
HERBS 

Allspice to Woodruff 
“By the ounce” 

for 
canning -cooking -crafts 

(next to Cass City Sports) 
Special Scents 

872-3434 

2 burner, electric ignition 
GOOD USED lawn mowers 
for sale and 250-gallon oil 
tank. Call 872-3932. 2-6-21-3 Special $139.99 

Albee * & i  FOK SALE - Multi-colored 
striped sofa and matching 
chair. Good condition. $100 
or best offer. Also Harle- 
quin romance paperbacks 
5 for $1 .OO. Call 872-3776. 

2-6-21-1 

BIGELOW 
HARDWARE 

Cass City - Phone 872-2245 
Jerry & Betty Stilson 

Home Center 
Cass City Ph. 872-2270 

2-6-21-1 

FOR SALE - Girl’s 10-speel 
All-Pro 26”, boy’s 20” Con- 
cord, heavy duty frame, $25 
each. Call after 5:OO p.m. 
872-3363. 2-6-2 1-1 n 

i Real Estate t FOR RENT - srnalltwo bed- 
1974 20 FOOT Slickraft fish- room house in cass city.  
inc twin 65 hp Me!?’, References and deposit. I$ NEED MONEY? $1  I power tilt, VHb’ radio, SI- Ca11665-2549 anytime.’ 
Tex Graph, compass, 4-6-7-3 
shoreline trailer, depth fin- 
der. Excellent condition, START YOUK own busi- 
$6500. Call 872-4348 7:oO- ness a t  6473 Main St., Cass 
6:00 p.m. - 872-3841 after City. It’s on the ground 
6:OO p.m. 2-6-7-3 floor. Easy access to park- 

ing, gas heat, reasonable 
FOR SALE -electric organ, rent, busiest section in 
Farfifa, $425. Call after 6:00 town. Start small - get big. 

4-6-2 1-3 872-2248. 2-6-7-3 Call 872-3535. 

WE BUY GOLD, SILVER, DIAMONDS, SILVER- 
WARE, RIFLES, SHOTGUNS, TOOLS, SPORTS 

EQUIPMENT, T.V.’S, TYPEWRITERS, LEATHER 
COATS, CHAIN SAWS, LAWN MOWERS, ETC. 

We also give cash loans on any of the above. I I LUNCHEON SPECIALS at  
U-Foun-Dit. Koegel’s foot- 
long hot dogs, $1.29. 
Stacked ham and cheese, 
stacked beef, pork bar- 
becue on bun, your choice 
$1.49. Try our homemade 
Coney sauce. All at U-Foun- 
Dit, corner of M-81 and De- 
ckerville Road, Caro. Open 
daily8a.rn.-lOp.m. 2-6-21-1 I I 2-6-2 1 - 1 

THUMB PAWN 
815 Hooper Caro 673-5997 

UNION VILLA APARTMENTS 
Unionville, Michigan t Location for business or residence. Just outside of 

Caro. 30x50 building - office and work area. Possible c-07 
Terms. f STHAWBIERICIES - Sweet 

and plentiful. Pick your 
own 45y lb. June 25 thru 
mid-July. Open 8 to 6 daily 
- including Sundays and 
July 4th. Containers fur- 
nished. Picnic and play 
area.  Call 313-688-3559 for 
daily picking conditions. 
Reynolds Berry Farm, 5861 
Cedar Creek Rd., North 
Branch, 7 miles south of 
Marlettc to Rurnside Rd., 4 

I You Need in  this..^^^^^^ Action Guide I Find the Service or Product NOW LEASING 9 Dondd Smi& 

f ‘REAL ESTATE BROKER 
758 N. STATE ST. 

New 1 and 2 bedroom apartments. Reasonable 
rental rates. 

Rent includes sculptured carpeting, all heat, water and 
sewer. Range and refrigerator, rubbish removal, 

drapes and garbage disposal. 

CAR0 PH. 673-8153 3-6-21-1 f EQUM HOUSING 
OPPORTUHITV Conveniently located on M-2.5. Call 517-683-2613. 

4-4-12-tf 1231 Englehart Rd , Deford 

Phone 872-4 176 
Monday thru Saturday 
Hrircrts h r m r  MILO-Up 

Clare‘s Eunoco Service 
*Tune Ups .Minor Repairs 

*Tires .Batteries 
.Grease 8 Oil 

Certified Mechanic 
Call 872-2470 

Clothes Caboose 
Infants’ Toddlers’ 

3 mo. - 24 mo. 2T - 4T 
Children’s 4-6X and 7.14 

Maternity Clothes also Available 

120 W. Lincoln St., Caro 
Phone 673-8266 

miles west and h mile 
south. 2-6-21 -tf 

. -. 

PERSONALIZED MATCH 
BOOKS AND WEDDING 

NAPKINS J -  

Luscious colors 1 L&S Standard Senrice See new catalog for 
latest designs 

Cass City Chronicle 
5-2-9tf 

SEARS Kenmore heavv 

6528 Main 
Phone 872-5084 

Plgeon Phonr 453-3531 

Certified Mechanics 
Complete Car Care Service 

Custom Sewing Fabric 
.Alterations Crafts 

Wrecker Service 1 1 Notions I 

HomeCommercial-Industrial 
Cass City Area 

TRASH COLLECTION 
Call Collect 31 3.798.8025 

“Big Enough To Serve Vou” 

Located in the heart of the woods in Northwood 
Estates, bi-level home is fully exposed on the west side 
of home, full walk-out family room. Hot water heat, 
plenty of custom built closets and cupboards. Over 1 
acre of land for your peaceful enjoyment of life! Call 
today. -- _-.-_---- -. ...~ 

Village Service Center 
Tires V.Belts Batteries 

Tune Ups Brakes Mufflers 
Certified Mechanic 

FREE 
In-Town Pick Up 6 Delivery 

Phone 872-3850 

177N State 
Caro 

Phone 
873-5214 

See us 
For Your 

Craft 
Supplies! I 10 ACRES - 3% wooded 10 acre parcel with spring fed 

pond. All perked and ready to go, excellent hunting and 
recreation land. Priced from $8,OOO and up. Land 
contract terms. 

and pets, firewood, pasture or just plain peaceful 
living. Located west of Deford, Michigan. Good land 
contract terms. 

I 
I 

I 

I 
I 

Cass River - 800’ of year round enjoyment, swimming, 
fishing, canoeing and ice fishing. 3 bedroom, 3 
bathroom home with full walk-out basement. This 
home is ideal for the family that enjoys life and nature 
so call US today for the home on the river. 

Rich’s Disposal 
Residential & Commercial 

Rubbish Removal 
Container Service Available. Croft-Clam lumber, Inc. 

Cass City 872-2141 
Andrrsrn Windows 

Dexter loch 
Pro finirhd Powling 

Mon.-Fri. - 8 a.m.-5:30 p.m. 
Sat. - 8 a.m. - 3 p.m. 

* 

I. 

Call 683-2233 New Location 
218 N. State St.. Caro. Mi. 

Phone 673-3200 
I J 

We also now have a 
BACK DOOR ENTRANCE 

E l Tuff=Kote Dinol 
SQU t R R EL’S 

NEST 
Kitehrn & Bath Boutique 

Phone 673-5026 
Open: Men.-Sat. 9-5, Fri. 9-9 

Automotive Rust Proofing 

System 6 Waxing 

Gravel Guards I Running Boards 

Rock Kote Stone Chip Protection 

Buy your carpet or linoleum, then 
call us for expert installation We 
also do custom and repair work. 
Factory trained, “We Do It Right ” 
Satisfaction guaranteed. 

J.J.’s Flooring Service 
Cass City - 51 7-872-3758 

Maintenance free. Yes this lovely ranch style home is 
situated on a beautifully landscaped lot with plenty of 
trees, flowers and nice garden. 3 bedrooms, 2 
bathrooms, fireplace in recreation rmm. Built-in china 
cabinet. char-broiler in the kitchen for your year round 

Phone 269.9585 
847 S. Van Dyke Bad Axe 

A 

grilling. Land contract. f 
Kelly Smith - 872-2248 i 
Marv Hobart - 872-4661 1 
Bill Hamilton - 872-4625 
Martin Osentoski - 872-3252 

CASE, KUBOTA 
8 NEW HOLLAND 

Sales and Service 
RABIDEAU MOTORS 

Farm Division 872-2616 

HAIR BENDERS 
Specidizing in 

Cutting Sryling Perms 
Tues 8 Fri - Ba m -6 p rn 

Wed 8Thurs - & a m  8 3 0 p m  
Sat - 7a.m 3 p m 

6350 Gariield Phone 872.3145 

Warju’s Flooring 
Carpet and Linoleum 

Installat ion 
6196 Lakeside Dr 

Cass City. MI 

Phone (51 7) 872-351 1 



CASS CITY, MICHIGAN 

IN ‘ITY: ‘‘It? story room home - very neat in and Out 
- close to schools, churches, playground, stores, etc. Hard- 

porch; garage - offered to you for $42,500.00. 
wood floors carpeted - basement; all modern kitchen; sun 

CASS CITY CHRONICLE-THURSDAY, JUNE 21,1984 

KINGSTON : SPECIAL ! ! Very neat one story home with 
aluminum siding; 3 bedrooms; carpted - gas 
furnace; gas hot water heater; Formal Dining Room; 
built-in dishwasher; front porch; basement; very 

PAGE FIFTEEN 

COUNTRY HOME: llh story with bedrooms; base- 
ment; 1% car garage attached; newly decorated - 

TURN DISCARDS INTO CASH -USE LOW COST 

desirable location - nicely lan-clscam large lot for the 
children to play ---- all this for $30,000.00. 

CHRONICLE CLASSIFIED ADS 

Have a Merri-Mac Party. 

Do your Christmas shop- 
ping early. I do home shows 
or take book parties. 

baby-sitting job by the 
hour. Have certified 
mother’s aide card. Call 
665-2536 Gagetown. 

Erla 
Packing Co., h c .  

USDA Plant 1074 12-6-2 1-3 5 17-872-2 191 Cass City 

( Services 7 f Services 1 (Household Sales 1 
6-FAMILY YARD SALE - 
June 21-22-23, 8 to 6. New - 
used - antiques, 3-wheel 
adult bicycle, furniture, 
clothes, tools, ladies to 44, 
crafts, toys, many dishes 
and miscellaneous. Will 
deal. 4216 Sherman Street. 
Marie Spencer. 14-6-21-1 

SHOP A BLOCK of garage 
sales: Thursday and Fri- 
day, June 21-22, 9-5. The 
block on Maple Street, 
south of Garfield, 14-6-21-1 

-- 

Notices 
J L  

. -  
\ 

FLEENOR APPLIANCE INTERIOR - 
Service - washer, dryers, Painting - free estimates. 

Contact Terry Klein phone stoves, water heaters, re- 673-4908 or Lowell , Smith 
frigerators. 4260 Woodland 673-4731. 
Ave., Cass City. Phone 872- 
3697. 8-3-29-tf 

8-6-14-2 

FINAL GARAGE SALE - 

Friday, Saturday, must sell 
all items at  low, low prices. 
2’//4 miles south of light, 3301 

2 FAMILY (moving) Patio 
and Porch Sale - Thursday- 
Friday, 9-5, June 21-22,4286 

GARAGE SAL,E - June 21- 
22-23, 9 till 5. Misses 16, 
junior and men’s clothes, 
antique dishes, dishes, fur- 
niture, shoes, books, 
bedspreads and numerous 
other items. 1 mile east of 
Deford, one mile south on 
Cemetery Road, 1st place 
east on Gilford Road, on 

Cemetery. 14-6-2 1-1  

Oak St. 14-6-21-1 

south side. 14-6-21 -1 

GARAGE SALE ~ June 21- 
22-23,9 till 6. 4139 Leach St., 
between 7th and Elizabeth. 
Books, couch, typewriter, 
bowling ball, new jewelry, 
organ, kitchen table and 
chair, clothes, record 
player, humidifier and mis- 
cellaneous items. 14-6-21-1 

- June  21-22,9 a.m.  to 6 p.m. 
4319 West Street, Cass City. 
Sponsored by Cass City Gun 
Club Auxiliary. 14-6-21-1 

GARAGE SALE -- Zenith 
Stereo with 2 speakers, 
lawn furniture, 10-speed 
boy’s bicycle and much, 

-much more. 4911 Huron St. 
Thursday, 21st and Friday, 

LARGE RUMMAGE SALE 

22nd, 9-5. 14-6-21 -1 

GARAGE SALE - Lots of 
glassware, jewelry, 
bedspreads, drapes, lots of 
ladies’ clothing. 3 blocks 
south of Sunoco Service Sta- 
tion at  corner of Third and 
Maple. Starting Thursday, 
10 till 5. 

Rummage Sale - Den 
mother’s blouse size 40, lots 
of extra large and smaller 
men’s pants and shirts, 
women’s dresses, pants 
and blouses from size 24% 
to small, also 4 long dres- 
ses, new maternity swim 
suit size 16. Thursday */z 
price. Friday - bring groc- 
ery sack and fill for $1.50. 
Last week was $10 - now 
$5.00 record player and car 
spot light. 6370 Houghton St. 

M-U LT I -FA M fLY Gar age 
Sale - Thursday-Friday 
from 8-9, Saturday 8-1. 1M 
miles south on Cemetery 
Road. Lots of tools, saws 
and saw blades; also buzz 
saw blades, curtains, 
bedspreads, dishes, baby 
clothes, larger size clothes. 
Lots of books, all kinds. 
Many other items. Carl 
Reed Jr. 

14-6-21- 1 

MEN- AND-- WOMEN’S 

14-6-21-1 
.~ ~ 

14-6-21-1 

FREE HOME WATER 
analysis - Water King water 
softeners and salt on sale a t  
Fuelgas, 4 miles east of 
Cass City on M-53. Phone 

NEW STORE HOURS : 
weekdays 7:30 a.m.-5:30 
p.m. Friday 7:30 a.m.- 
9 p.m. and Saturday 7:30 
a.m.-5:00 p.m. at Bigelow 
Hardware, Cass City. 
Phone 872-2245, 5-6-21-1 

READY FOR summer fun? 
Get your beach toys at Ben 
Franklin, Cass City! 5-6-21-1 

5-1-20-tf 872-2161. 
- - ~ - - 

~- 

FOR SALE - 3 bedroom 
country home, 2 car  gar- 
age, Frankenmuth Schools, 
1.8 acres, land contract. 

LOT FOR SALE-with 28x32 
new garage on Pine St. 
Phone 872-3055. Terms av- 

Call 652-8745. 3-6-2 1 - 1 

ailable. 3-6-2 1 -3 

Arthur Brown 
Cass City Ken Martin 

Electric, Inc. 
Residential and Commercial 

Wiring 

State Licensed 

Free Estimates 

Phone 872-4114 
418QHurds Corner Road 

8-8-10-t f 

Well Drilling 

Pump Repair 
and 

STATE LICENSED 

For sale - 279 acres, 60 acres 
of woods, 220 tillable, 3 bed- 
m m  home. Terms available. 

- 

GARAGE SALE - Girls’, 
women’s, men’s clothing, 
old cash register, sw-ag 
type dining room light, pre- 
cast cement steps, jelly 
jars, crafts and miscellane- 
ous items. Thursday and 
Friday from 9 to 5. 4 south, 
1% west of Cass City on 
Severance Rd. Vi Patera.  

GARAGE SALE -Thursday 
and Friday. 4 north and 2% 
east of Cass City. Boy’s 20” 
dirt bike, Hoover vacuum 
cleaner, cement mixer, 
bowling ball, clothing - 
boys’ sizes 8-10, girls’ 10 and 
up, men’s and women’s. 
Books and miscellaneous. 

GARAGE SALE - Girls’ 
clothes 6-12, boys’ 12-18, 
men’s and women’s, porta- 
ble dishwasher, dishes 
(some old) and miscellane- 
ous. Thursday only 9-6,6429 

14-6-21-1 
-. ~- ---I 

14-6-21-1 
- -  - - 

7th St. 14-6-21 -1 

For sale - 4 building lots, on 
blacktop road, close to town. 
Will build to suit. Financing 
available. 

Phone 673-3800 
8-1-27-tf 

Free Estimates SHARPENING SERVICE 
- 2 miles south, 1 1/4 west at 
5870 W. Kelly Rd. Ed 
Spencer, 872-4512. 8-9-15-tf 

THUMB Carpet 
Cleaning - Dry foam Or 

wall steam. cleaning. Also upholstery Free esti- and 

For sale - 80 acres, 25 acres 
woods, 45 acres tillable, good 
building spots. 

Ron Chappel - 872-5422 

Zemke Realty -after 6:OO 
3-6-14-3 

f Real Estate I on roofing, siding, 
insulation, aluminum doors 
and windows and aluminum 

or Fiber Glass awnings 
ForSale J PATIO AND Yard Sale - 

June 22-23, 8 a.m. thru 5:30 
p.m. 6679 Houghton Street. 
Dishes, ladies’ clothing, 
household furnishings, and 
some appliances. 14-6-21-1 

GARAGESALE - 3-family. 
Thursday, Friday, Satur- 
day. Dishes, grill, chil- 
dren’s clothing 7 to 12, clo- 
thing men’s and women’s, 
miscellaneous items. 6680 

- - .. - . . . 

Third St. 14-6-21- 1 

mates. Call 611 free 1-800- 
322-0206 or 517-761-7503. We 
welcome BankAmericard - 
Master Charge. 8-3-20-tf 
-___ 
Blown Insulation 

New Remodeling construction 

Addit ions 
Garages 

Roofing, Siding 
Pole Buildings 

FREE ESTIMATES 
Leiterman Builders 

Cass City 
Phone 872-3721 

Licensed and Insured 
84-15-tf 

COUNTRY LIVING in the 
Thumb - Ranch home, new 
in 1977, 3 bedrooms, base- 
ment, 2 acres, 3 car  30x40 
garage, fireplace, 14x20 
breezeway, paved road, 
paved drive, beautiful land- 
scaping, $61,000-$10,000 
down, 10 percent interest 
contract. Phone 872-3948. 

3-5-3 1-6 

TV Repair 
All makes 

Antenna and Towers (free 
atimates). Appliance Repair 

31 3-672-9440 
Call Any Time 

AL’S TV SALES 
& 1453 SERVICE Main St. 

Snover, Mich. 
A1 and Bryan Pudelko 

8-1-5-tf 

Elkton Roofing 
& Siding Co. 

Phone 269-7469 
5-7-2 1 -tf 

CUSTOM BUILT home - 10 
minutes north of Cass City 
on paved road, 2000 square 
feet, large kitchen and liv- 
ing room, 3 bedrooms, 1% 
baths, situated on 5 acres. 
Priced in the 60’s. Phone 
75-4576. 3-6-2 1-3 

WANTED - 2 or 3 bedroom 
apartment. Phone 872-2300. 

5-5-3 1-tf 

FOR SALE BY B.A. CALKA REAL ESTATE ....... Strawberries 
AUCTIONEERING - S= 
Lorn “Slim” Hillaker. Top, 
dollar for your property. 
Phone 872-3019, Cass City. 

8-10-3-tf 

You pick or ready picked. 

4 miles north of Imlay 
City on Van Dyke Rd. 

Valley View 
Fruit Farm 
Call 313-724-8026 

Open 9 a.m.-7 p.m. 
Closed Sundays 

5-6-214 

RICH’S DISPOSAL - Resi- 
dential and Commercial 
Rubbish Removal, Con- 
tainer service available. 
Call 683-2233. 8-2-12-tf 

GARAGE SALE -Thursday 
and Friday, 9 till 4. 6674 

YARD SALE - Saturday 
only, June 23. 6386 Sever- 
ance Rd., 4 miles south and 

mile west. 30” electric 
stove and many other 
items. Doug Van Allen. 

PORCH AND Yard Sale - 
6567 Elizabeth St. Thurs- 
day-Friday, 9 till 5. 

Huron St. 14-6-21-1 
~- -- 

14-6-21-1 
-_ 

146- 14-2 

[ Wanted toBuy 1 
possession on short notice - $32,900. terms. 

RETIREE SPECIAL!!! Frame one story home with 
aluminum siding; 2 bedrooms; with beautiful brick FIRE- 
PLACE and new brick chimney - lots of kitchen cabinets; 
all carpeted - 100 AMP service - circuit breakers - offered to 
you for $14,000.00 terms available. 

BUYING AND SELLING 
guns, gold rings, antiques, 
tools, coins, baseball cards, 
swords and knives. Joe’s 
Pawn Shop, downtown Bad 
Axe, 100 ft.  south of stop- 
light, phone 269-9893. 6-6-21-1 

LOW COST HOUSING ---- 2 bedroom home carpeted - 
natural gas furnace; well insulated - family in need of 
larger home - may TRADE --- $16,000. 

AUCTIONEER 
EXPERIENCED 

Complete Auctioneering 
ServiceJIandled Anywhere. 
We Make All Arrangements. 

Our Experience Is Your 
Assurance. 

Ira, David & 
Martin Osentoski 

Phone 
Cass City 872-2352 Collect 8-2-23-tf 

STILL WHITE? Get a tan 
wearing a bathing suit from 
Ben Franklin., . . there’s still 
a good selection! 5-6-21-1 

TWO INCOME HOME: REMODELED - $365.00 income - 
SPECIAL at $29,900.00 - a  good investment here! WILL SELL YOU 2 Acres or 20 Acres with 28x50’ brick 

home with Andersen Windows; all large rooms; 3 bed- 
rooms; large bathroom and laundry room; 2 sets of sliding 
glass doors lead to PATIO --- FIREPLACE - 200 AMP 
service - Patio 14x16’ --- Your inspection invited! ! ! ! Sellers 
will finance on land contract. Located only 2% miles from 
Cass City. 

TWO INCOME HOME with practically new aluminum 
siding and roof; separate meters - good income --- $43,000.00 
terms. (To Give Away) 

Bingo 

Every Sunday 
Everybody welcome 

Doors open 6:00 p.m. 
Bingo at  6:30 p.m. 

St. Pancratius 
Church 

5-7-5-tf 

FREE - 5 young rabbits. 
Call 872-3771. 7-6-21-1 60 ACRES - Close to Cass City - BRICK HOME with lots of 

remodeling done; new carpeting - large barn; garage, etc. 
$65,000.00 - seller will hold land contract - Immediate 
Possession. 

MOVING SALE 
Saturday, June 23rd Only 

From 8 a.m. to 6 p.m. 
6805 Herron Drive, 

Cass City. 
Household  i t e m s ,  

clothing, (Children 6 
adults), picnic table, GE 
electric stove, side-by- 
side refrigerator, Maytag 
electric dryer, dirt bike, 
games, books, toys and 
much, much more! 

146-21 -1 

UNIONVILLE: SPECIAL! ! ! 3 story frame Unique 
home with several cupolas on the roof; FIREPLACE - 4 
bedrooms; carpeting; 1% bathrooms; Vestibule with 
open STAIRWAY - lots of natural OAK trim - built-ins; 
well insulated; many other features; REMODELED 
recently - plus large storage building - could be 
converted into an apartment --- Zoned Business and 
Residential ----Lot 99x165’ - $45,000.00. 

FREE TO good home - 
mixed Collie puppies. Call 
872-2920, ask for Sally. 

7-6- 14-3 
FREEKITTENS-- black 
and calico. Phone 872-2691, 

7-6-21 -3 

DOCTOR’S HOME: RANCH TYPE HOME with aluminum 
siding; 7 rooms; Marble FIREPLACE; new Andersen 
Windows; Family room; 15x17’ Sun Room - 26x30’ 
Recreation room; 3 bedrooms; 24’ swimming pool - two car 
garage with two electric door openers - nicely landscaped - 
$69,500.00. 

WORK WANTED - Bac- 
khoe and bulldozing, ce- 
ment work, wood base- 
ments, new homes, pole 
buildings, arages, Ron’s 

Call 872-5422. 8-6-14-4 I 
Building an 5 Construction. [Help Wanted) 79 ACRES: Close in to Cass City - Newly decorated home 

with 3 bedrooms; gas furnace; large barn- OWNER 
RETIRED FROM FARMING ---- $60,O00.00 will hold land 
contract. IMMEDIATE POSSESSION. 

.- 

4TH OF JULY 1st annual 
“Beautiful Baby Contest” 
sponsored by class of ’86. 
Age limit 3 years and 
under. Send picture entries 
to Class of ’86, c/o Joe 
Leeson, 4669 Hospital Dr., 
Cass City, MI. 48726. First 
place trophy awarded. 
Judging done at  park at fes- 
tival. 5-6-14-3 

SPECIAL!! Reduced from $49,500. to $39,500. for 
IMMEDIATE SALE! ! ! In Cass City - Newly decorated 
home - practically new furnace; can be used as 1 large 
family or two INCOME - basement; garage - extra large 
landscaped lot - VACANT ---- All of this for 539,500.00 - 
IMMEDIATE POSSESSION. 

STARTER HOME IN CASS CITY: Cute two bedroom home 
- comes with refrigerator and range; basement; furnace 
and electric water heater - corner lot -- $21,000. FMHA 
Approved. 

I_--- 

HELP WANTED - typist 
with knowledge of Scott’s 
Stamp Catalogs. Send res- 
ume to Box 69, Caseville, 

Applications are now be- 
ing accepted through June 
22, 1984 for a part-time Gen- 
eral Office Clerk p i t i o n ,  
approximately 22% hours 
per week, the Tuscola 
County Courthouse Com- 
plex. 

Starting rate $4.9807 per 
hour. Applicant must be an 
accurate typist, proficient 
in math, also prior office 
experience, is desirable, 

Tuscola County is an 
Equal Opprtunity Employer. 

Applications a r e  avail- 
able a t  the Personnel Of- 
fice in the Courthouse Annex, 
207 E. Grant St., Caro, MI 
between the hours of 1:OO 

MI. 48725. 11-6-14-2 
- -. .~ 

- 

Custom Butchering 
BEEF & PORK 

(Hogs are scalded - not 
skinned 1 

Check our prices on 
half or whole 

Meat Wholesale and Retail 
Gainor’s Meat 

Packing 

- -  

FOUR-FAMILY Garage 
Sale - 1% miles west on M- 

CLOSE TO CASS CITY: Blacktop road - 1% story very neat 
in and out home: 3 bedrooms; lots of storage room; 
FORMAL DINING ROOM: hardwood floors: laGe familv ‘ 81, deep well Pump, baby 
size kitchen; Birch cabinets; breezeway; garage attached“; 
basement; 16x24’ storage building; treed 11h Acre lot - 
priced to sell right away for $49,500.00. 

bike seat, water skis, ice 
auger, miscellaneous 
items, June 21, 22, from 

FIVE-FAMILY Garage 
Sale - 2% miles east of Cass 
City, 7650 Cass City Rd. 
Honda mini-bike, conven- 
tional Maytag washer, don- 
key planters, men’s, 
women’s, children’s clo- 
thing, cash register $50, an- 
tiques, miscellaneous 
items too numerous to men- 
tion. Thursday-Saturday, 9- 

+5. Mrs Susan Chappel, 
phone 872-5422. 14-6-21-1 

YARD SALE - Friday and 
Saturday 9 to 5. Many infant 
items, barbecue grills, 
couch, matching chairs. 
4897 N. Seeger St. 14-6-21-1 

GARAGE SALE - Where - 
3245 E, Elmwood Rd., just 
off M-81. What -Everything 
from fine china to 3 piece 
suits. When - June 21, 9-5, 

YARD SALE - Thursday- 
Friday, June 21-22, 9 to 5. 
Miscellaneous, pool table, 
books, clothing - including 
girls’ sizes 8-12. 4829 N. 

9:oo. 14-6-21-1 
-~ ~~ _- 

- -_ -_ . . 

-. . - -. ---. ~- 

June 22, 9-5. 14-6-2 1 - 1 

Seeger St. 14-6-2 1-1 

TWO HOMES FOR THE PRICE O F  ONE! ! ! Situated on a 
parcel of land 400x400’ - or will sell separately - let us tell 
you about it! ! ! ! $40,500.00 for both homes. 

GAGETOWN: Very nice home - neat in and out - 11% story 
with 2 bedrooms; front porch; open stairway - natural gas 
furnace; basement; new 16x24’ garage with electric door 
opener; cute kitchen arrangement - $21,000.00. 

1 mile north, 1 mile west of 
Bad Axe. 

Phone (517) 269-8161 
269-9375 

Dave Reed - 872-2827 

ELMER - H.--FRxW 
licensed builder. New 
homes or remodeling. Roof- 
ing, siding, barns, pole 
buildings. Phone 872-2921. 

8-9-30-t f 

8-6-21 -5 

Beginning 
Knitting 

Starts Wednesday, July 11 
10:00 a.m. 

Some materials included 
Pre-registration and 

deposit required. 

4 w ~ k s  - $16.00 

Sunny Side of 
the Street 
Phone 872-2070 

58-14-4 

COLONIAL HOME on Schwegler Road - 2 story - Vinyl 
siding; 3 bedrooms; 1% bathrooms; Dining Room; 
FIREPLACE with wood-burning stove - circular driveway - 
-- $37,500.00. 

RIVER ROAD --- 2-3 bedroom home - one story - new well 
with own water system; several new Andersen Windows; 
insulated - garage attached --- VACANT - $26,500.00 terms. 
Seller will hold land contract. 5 ACRE ESTATE with over 3300 square feet of living space 

surrounded with beautiful trees, shrubs and flowers; 4-5 
Bedrooms - 4 bathrooms; Flag stone patio; FAMILY 
ROOM WITH WET BAR - 2 car garage with openers; 20x40’ 
in ground swimming pool; many other features ---- priced to 
sell. 

I 40 ACRES - Practically all wooded - mixed woods - trails 
- excellent hunting and trapping - ideal for Church Camp 
- Recreational Use - or just Private Hunting Grounds --- 
Seller will Finance on land contract. 

COUNTRY ESTATE: will sell 4.7 Acres or 17 Acres - 
BEAUTIFUL QUAD LEVEL home with over 3,200 
square feet of living space - 3% BATHROOMS; 2 
kitchens; inter-com - FAMILY ROOM with BRICK 
FIREPLACE with wood insert - 18x20’ FORMAL 
DINING ROOM; many built-ins; plus another 
FIREPLACE IN BEDROOM (Master); Large 2 car 
garage; electric door opener; built-in desk, appliances - 
POND STOCKED WITH FISH - Patch of woods - black- 
top driveway - 6 miles from Cass City _--- Seller will hold 
land contract. IMMEDIATE POSSESSION! ! ! ! 

RANCH TYPE HOME IN NEWER SUBDIVISION - 3 bed- 
rooms; large kitchen with dining area - garage attached; 
seller will hold land contract ---- $48,500.00 terms. IM- 
MEDIATE POSSESSION. 

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING p.m. through and Friday. 4:30 p.m. Monday 

11-6-21-1 BEEF-PORK-VE AL-LAMB JUST ARRIVED! Lee 
Near Gagetown: 24x64’ RANCH TYPE HOME with walk- 
out basement; 8 rooms; 4 bedrooms; 2 bathrooms; forced 
hot water heating system; gas fired; BRICK FIREPLACE 
with heatilator; 20x24’ FAMILY ROOM: comes with 
appliances - large wooded lot 125x500’; $89,500.00 terms. @Wanted) Maternity Jeans - Stripes 

too! Ben Franklin, Cass PROCESSING 
CURING, SMOKING AND 

City. 5-6-2 1-1 
& FRIDAY 13-YEAR-OLD girl wants . .  . IN C A S  CITY: Stately 2 story home with aluminum 

siding; aluminum storms and screens; 4 bedrooms; 11h 
bathrooms; FORMAL DINING ROOM; wall to wall 
carpeting; very desirable family home with lots of room in 
and out - extra large landscaped and treed lot; 11h car 
garage with lots of storage room; this home has had good 
care with “parklike grounds” - Asking only $55,000.00. This 
one won’t last long! ! ! ! 

BAY CITY-FORESTVILLE ROAD - RANCH TYPE HOME 
with Brick and Aluminum siding; 6 rooms; Luxaire 
Furnace with forced hot air; all large rooms; 11h bath- 
rooms; 1680 square feet of living space plus full basement; 
24x24’ two car garage attached; lot nicely landscaped 
198x200’ - $75,000.00 terms. 

PAINT BRUSH SPECIAL! ! ! Presently part rented for 
beauty shop; 1 apartment has 4 bedrooms carpeted - lower 
apartment yith 2 bedrooms; needs some work- $lO,OOO.00 
with $1500.00 down payment ---- Immediate Possession. FOITND - Collie. Elmwood I 3*i-z1-zl PROFESSIONAL CARPET lum for his visits and 

Rd., June 15, nice dog. Call 
5-6-21 -1 Services 1 872-5321. 

AND UPHOLSTERY 
CLEANING 

FIRE RESTORATION 
Commercial & Residential 

Fast, courteous and 
inexpensive. 
Free Estimates 

prayers. The meals were 
very attractive and deli- 
cious. Irma Chisholm. 

WE-WANT TO express our 
sincere thanks to Little’s 
Funeral Home for their ser- 
vice and guidance during 
the death of our husband 
and father, Ronald L. Fee. 
A thank you also goes to 
Rev. Eldred Kelley for his 
comforting words and spe- 
cial memorial service. A 
special thanks to the 
pallbearers. Also we’d like 
to thank all relatives, 
friends and neighbors for 
their cards, flowers, money 
and food. And a special 
thanks’to Shari Bock and 
Sue Gibson for organizing 
of the luncheon they put on. 
Everything was greatly ap- 
preciated. Sadly missed by 
his wife Joan and daughters 
Missy and Ronda. 13-6-21-1 

13-6-2 1-1 Before Buying or Selling PIANO TUNING and re- 
pairing on all makes of 
pianos. 20 years’ experi- 
ence. Member of the Piano 
Technicians Guild. Duane 
Johnston, Bad Axe, Mich. 
48413. Phone 269-7364. 

8-2- 1 -tf 

Arts and Crafts 
See, Call or Write to: Street Vendors Mick Zawilinski 

Phone 872-3725 
8-6-16-tf B.A. Calka Real Estate wanted for 

Cass City Sidewalk Days 
July 19-20-21 

Chuck Gage 
Welding Shop 

Heli-arc welding 
Specializing in aluminum, 
stainless steel, blacksmith- 
ing, fabricating and radi- 
a tor repair. 

Also portable welding 
~ l l  types of welding 

7062 E. Deckerville Rd. 
Deford, Michigan 

Phone 872-2552 
8-5-15-tf 

6306 W. Main St., Cass City 
Phone 872-3355 

LARGE CAPACITY 
HY DRA-HOE 

For economical pond digging, 
ditch cleaning, burying fence 
rows, stone piles, etc. 
Also septic tank cleaning and 

installation, basement digging, 
sand and jpwel. Small bulldozing 
work 

Chuck O’Dell 
& Son 

Phone 872-3031 or 872-5355 
8-5-24-13 

Call 872-3030 
5-6-21-4 WE HAVE A LARGE SELECTION OF FARMS - BUSINESSES AND 

LARGER & MORE EXPENSIVE HOMES, VACANT LAND 
not shown here - please call office. 

SCRATCH PADS 
Now in stock 

- 

LISTINGS WANTED ON ALL TYPES OF REAL ESTATE 
I WE SELL FARMS AND HOMES AT 6 

Serving the Thumb Area for over 30 years 
Cass City 
Chronicle 

5-5-3-3 
. 

An Equal Opportunity Lender We buy Land Contracts REALTOR (I, 
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to doctors, patients, but loses money 
Hospital’s immediate care clinic helpful 

I>r. Marcus Welby may 
h a w  been the last doctor 
who didn’t mind working 
on week ends. 

Nowadays, however, 
most doctors are  no diffe- 
rent than anyone else. As 
much as possible, thev me- 
fer not to have to work on 
wcck ends. 

So what can one do if he 
or shea or someone in their 
family gets ill on a week 
end or suffers a minor in- 
jury? 

“There is always the hos- 
pital emergency room, but 
they arc  expensive. and are  
suppostd to be for big 
emergencies ”- auto acci- 

dents, heart attacks, etc. 
There is now a solution, 

the immediate care clinic 
(ICC) open weekends at  
Hills and Dales General 
HosDital, intended for 
treatment of minor injuries 
and illnesses. 

The clinic is open Fridays 
from 6-8 : 30 p.m ; Saturdays 
from 2:30-8:30 p.m., and 
Sundays from 10 a.m.-8:30 
p.m. It is open holidays 
which are  on Mondays and 
some holidays that occur 
during the week. 

The hospital contracts 
with Master Care Corp. of 
Grand Rapids to provide 
the service. It in turn hires 

the physician who is there 
on week ends. Since last Oc- 
tober, it has been the same 
physician, Dr. Michael San- 
toro, MD. 

The hospital started the 
clinic about six months ago. 
Prior to that, it contracted 
with Master Care to pro- 
vide a physician to staff the 
emergency room on week 
ends, which meant higher 
emergency room rates 
applied even for treatment 
of m ino r pro b le rn s . 

For the patient, the ad- 
vantages of the ICC are  not 
having to find a doctor on 
week ends and a cheap fee. 
The cost of visiting the 

CARE CLINIC -- Dr. Michael Santoro, MD, physician at, 
the Hills and Dales General Hospital Immediate Care 
Clinic, examines Bill Thane of Wilmot, who injured his lip 
while playing ball Saturday afternoon. 

1984 S-15 SIERRA CLASSIC Loaded, Bucket Console, Black 

1983 DODGE OMNl 

1983 LE SABRE 

1982 CENTURY LIMITED 4 Dr., Loaded, Super Car A t  A Reasonable Price 

REDUCED 
1982 PONTIAC TRANS AM Black, Loaded $1,500.00 

1982 CHEV. CHEVETTE 4 Or., Nice Car S A V E  $500.00 

REDUCE0 
1981 CHEV. MONTE CARLO 36,000 Miles $500.00 

19$1 CHEV. CHEVETTE 

4 Dr., Super Clean, 11,000 Miles 

4 Or., Cruise, Air, Stereo, Reduced I n  Price 

2 Or., Clean, 32,000 Miles 

1981 OLDS. OMEGA 4 Or., Auto., Air, Clean 

1981 PONflAC 2 dr 24,000 mlles, like new 

1979 GMC ‘/z TON PICKUP V-8, Auto., 32,000 Miles 

1979 FORD % TON V.8 With Cap, Super Truck 

40 Other Used Cars & Trucks To Choose From 

THANK YOU FOR MAKING OUR GRAND OPENING 
SUCH A HUGE SUCCESS! 

I SERVICE PARTS 
I---- 

Of MERAL MOTORS CORPORATIW 

KEEP THAT GREAT EM FEELING 
WITH GENUINE GM PARTS. 

HOWARD BELL, 
BUICK - PONTIAC - GMC 

clinic is only $25, plus the 
cost of any medicines or 
supplies and added proce-- 
dures (X-rays, laboratory 
tests, etc. 1. 

FOR THE HOSPllAL, 
there are  advantages and 
disadvantages. 

It views the clinic as  a 
service to the community 
and as  a recruitment tool 
for doctors, since they can 
come to Cass City knowing 
they won’t have to be on 
call week ends. 

The disadvantage is that 
the clinic so far is a money 
loser. It had to pay Master 
Care $61,000 during the hos- 
pital’s last fiscal year, ac- 
cording to Director of Fi- 
nance Keith Adelberg. 

The expense would be re- 
duced if the clinic attracted 
more patients. It has been 
promoted outside the Cass 
City area and is the only 
such clinic in the upper 
Thumb. 

If it attracted enough pa- 
tients, the clinic could even 
turn into a money maker 
for the hospital, which pre- 
sently is running in the 
red. 

Because of the Hills and 
Dales’ present financial 
condition, Adelberg said, 
its board of directors consi- 
dered dropping the service, 
but decided against it. 

hospital from 6 p.m. Friday 
until t; a .m.  Monday. In ad- 
dition to being the care 
clinic doctor, he also is the 
emergency room physician 
during that time. He sleeps 
at  the hospital and eats his 
meals there. “Sometimes I 
sit on the lawn, but I’m al- 
ways available,” he said. 

Santoro. a 1978 Albany 

SANTORO IS A T  THE 

sprains, strains and infec- 
tions are  most common. 
“Stuff you normally see in 
a doctor’s office during a 
normal day.” 

He stressed that persons 
shouldn’t view him as a re- 
placement for regular 
physician. “You should 
have a doctor in the com- 
munity willing to take care 
of you. I’m just here as  a 
convenience. ” 

The MD had praise for 
the ancillary services that 
he sometimes has to make 
use of, such as  x-ray, 
laboratory, and cardiopul- 
monary. He feels they a re  
a t  least as  good as in a 
larger hospital. He a k o  
praised the nursing staff. 

All that, plus the friendly 
atmosphere, he said, and, 
“You can come to this 
emergency room and you 
get much better care” 
(than in a big hospital). 

ALTHOUGH IT MrGHT 

seem like an easy job for 
the physician to be working 
only on weekends, he 
pointed out that his 60 hours 
a t  the hospital, plus the 
time he spends Fridays and 
Mondays driving from and 
to his home in Royal Oak, 
a Detroit suburb, consume 
almost five full days. 

It also means being away 
from his wife during that 
time. 

Santoro does maintain a 
small private practice in 
Royal Oak, but it’s secon- 
dary in time and income to 
his job with Master Care. 

“I like doing this kind of 
work,” he said of what he 
does at Hills and Dales. 

What does he like best? 
“I particularly enjoy sew- 
ing lacerations. It’s an art. 
The more complicated, the 
better.” 

Another thing he likes 
about his job is, “It’s im- 
mediately gratifying.” 

Less income 
forces hospital 
staff cut 

classified into a DRG, 
based on the reason they 
came to the hospital. 

For each DRG, there is a 
flat rate that Medicare and 

(New York) Medical COT- Medicaid pay. What 
lcgp graduate, also can fill problems for hospi- 
in for \ocal doctors if they tals is the rate does not 

can’t be located, but doesn’t severity of the illness or 
arc gone for a hours or allow for variations in the 

make their rounds. If they amount Of care provided. 
are to be absent for the There is an “authorized 
wclekcnd, they usually have length Of stay” for each another local doctor sub for DRG. the hospital If the patient less than stays the in 
them. 

L ) ~ ~ , ~ ~  a nornlal 60-hour authorized stay, the hospi- 
span, Santoro said, he tal can conceivably make a 
might see 15-20 care clinic profit. If he or she has to 
patients and 15 more in Stay longer than the au- 
emergency. thorized stay, however, the 

the tmcrgcncy room, loss, since Medicare or 
which is located in the am- Medicaid won’t pay more. 
bulatory care center, the ADELBERG 

the hospital. (patients) out into the 
Care clinic patients, pro- street. They still have to 

p r o b l e ~ a t ~ r ~  
fore meet they,]] discharge go home.,, criteria be- 

non -e mer genu y 
have to wait when there is It is the doctors, Of 
an emrrgency. course, who decide when a 

OF patient is ready to be dis- 
ailments does Santoro treat charged* Physicians On the 
a t  the clinic? Sore throats, H’lls and staff, the 
ear infections, bronchitis, finance director said, a re  

“cooperating quite well” 

The clinic rrlakes use of hospital has to absorb the 

ad(iition on the east end of “We’rp not pushing them 

KIND 

NEW WINDOWS are being installed in 
patients’ rooms at Hills and Dales General 
Hospital by Doug Thane (left) and Frank Mc- 
Comb, Energy savings from the double pane 
windows with venetian blinds in between will 
pay for them in six years. Sixty-one windows 
are being installed. 

with the new re  uirements. 
He added, “The main 

point is, the doctors can 
make or break a hospital.” 

In practical terms, he 
explained, DRGs will mean 
patients spending more 
time recovering at  home 
and less in the hospital and 
more surgery done on an 
out-patient basis. “The so- 
called, in by 9, out by 5 
theory.” 

It isn’t just Medicare and 
Medicaid that are  forcing 
that change. Blue Cross, for 
instance, now will only pay 
for a tonsillectomy done on 
an out-patient basis. 

THE 
changes are  good for the 
insurers, it means more 
empty beds and less re- 
venue for the hospital. 

The changes are  already 
having an effect. In April 
and May, the first two 
months of the new fiscal 
year, Hills and Dales ad- 
mitted about as  many pa- 
tients as  the same months 
in 1983, but the number of 
days beds were occupied 
had declined by 573. 

With conventional 
sources of revenue either 
declining or not keeping up 
with the actual costs of run- 
ning the hospital, in order 
for Hills and Dales to stay 
in business, it will have to 
cut costs and increase re- 
venues from other sources. 

Two steps, already men- 
tioned, are employee 
layoffs and reduction in 
hours worked. 

There is the cost contain- 
ment program, described 
in last week’s Chronicle, 
one aspect of which is re- 
warding employees for 
suggesting ways of cutting 
costs. 

ALTHOUGH 

ANOTHER PART IS 
reducing energy consump- 
tion. Measures already 
taken have resulted in a re- 
duction of energy con- 
sumed, though because of 
increases in utility rates, 
that doesn’t necessarily 
mean less money spent for 
heat and electricity, only 
less of an increase. 

Double pane windows are  
presently being installed, 
the cost of which should be 
paid for in six years 
through reduced energy 
usage. 

For Hills and Dales to 
continue to serve the people 
of the Cass City area,  Adel- 
berg concluded, “We have 
to look at ways to be more 
efficient and to get more 
doctors. ” 

More physicians will 
mean more persons using 
hospital services, which 
will mean more revenue. 
Three more doctors a re  
needed, according to Hills 
and Dales Administrator 
Ken Jensen. 

The hospital is exploring 
various means to increase 
revenue, he said, including 
providing extended, senior 
citizen home care and hos- 
pice care;  alcohol and drug 
treatment ;. having more 
specialists conduct clinics; 
increasing the amount of 
ambulatory (out-patient) 
surgery, and real estate 
ventures. 

C A S  CITY, MICHIGAN 
i 

I like to visit with old-tim- 
ers about stocks and bonds. 

They have an instinctive 
“feel” that I’ll put up 
against all the technicians 
and the chartists and the 
boys fresh out of Harvard 
Business School. 

This visitor was Earl  
Newberry, a local man, 
long-since retired from the 
hurly-burly of Wall Street. 
He is now concerned with 
getting his assets put in a 
living trust fund and his as- 
sets are  mostly in bonds 
that take less attention than 
stocks. But he must have a 
favorite or two, I felt. 

“What are  you buying, 
Earl? Or are you selling?” 

“Here’s one I like-rated 
A i  . Revenues, earnings 
and dividends have gone up 
every year for 37 years. 
And the dividends aren’t 
taxable. Citizens Utilities. ” 

It’s a stock written up in 
this column previously. 
Since then it has had a 35 
percent rise in price. It is 
traded over the counter. 

There are  two classes of 
stock - A, on which stock 
dividends only a re  paid, 
and B, which has cash di- 
vidends. Stock dividends 
are  geared to the same 
level as  the cash one. Yield 
is around 7 percent. 

You pay no tax on the 
stock dividends until you 
sell them. Keep them over 
a year they’re long-term 
capital gain, and you avoid 
60 percent of the tax. 

Citizens is a small utility 
offering five types of ser- 
vices: Electricity, phone, 
water, gas and wastewater 
treatment. Most of the op- 
erations are  in small towns 
in California, Hawaii and 
Arizona. Head of the com- 
pany fights the regulatory 
commissions tooth and nail 
and gets more rate in- 
creases than the big com- 
panies. “Why don’t more com- 

panies offer the stockholder 
a choice of stock dividends 
or cash? ” 1 asked. 

“They can’t. Citizens did 
it under an old law. 
Eastman Kodak tried to get 
permission soon after Citi- 
zens did it, but they had 
changed the law by then.” 

This doesn’t stop a com- 
pany paying only stock di- 
vidends, as  a few of them 
used to. Just why com- 
panies that can use the cap- 
ital, such as  banks and in- 
surance companies, don’t 
do it is a mystery. 

They’re probably afraid 
the stockholders will holler. 
I agree. They will. 

At First National Bank of 
Lapeer, where I was on the 
board for some 25 years, we 
always paid stock di- 
vidends, because the bank 
was growing and we needed 
a bigger stock of capital. 
Otherwise we would have 
had to issue more stock. 

Every year we paid out 
stock dividends equivalent 
to our earnings, in those 
days about 5 percent on the 

book value - which hap- 
pened to be the price of the 
stock. 

Fourteen years of 5 per- 
cent stock dividends and 
your holdings doubled if 
you hung onto it all ar” 
didn’t sell any. 

We took care of the com- 
plaints by offering to buy 
privately any stock di- 
vidend shares a t  the cur- 
rent market. Nobody took 
the offer and the hollering 
died down. 

Now, if we had paid the 5 
percent in cash, if you were 
in a 40 percent bracket, you 
kept only 3 percent of i t .  
Keeping only 3 percent 
year, it would have taken 
23-24 years for your money 
to double. The stock di- 
vidend route, it took 14. 

Eventually, when the 
shares were sold there’d be 
capital gains to pay, but 
that would be a fraction of 
taxes paid on regular di- 
vidends, first because you 
had deferred the tax, anr] 
second because it is noi 
only 40 percent of the regu. 
lar rate on ordinary in- 
come. 

Take a specific case. You 
own 100 shares of stock, 
worth $20 a share. 

1) Stock dividends paid 
yearly of 5 percent. So you 
get 5 shares of stock worth 
$100. You let the stock ac- 
cumulate for 14 years. The 
stock compounds, same a 
money does. After 14 years 
you have 198 shares. At $20 
a share it’s worth $3,960. 

2) Cash dividends of ,5 
percent paid yearly. Tax 
rate of 40 percent. Balance 
left of $100 dividend - $60. 
Reinvest the dividend after 
tax for 14 years a t  after-tax 
rate of 3 percent. Total re- 
ceived - $1,025. 

The stock dividendr; 
worth $1,960 would be taxa 
ble a t  capital gain rate of 16 
percent (if you’re in a 40 
percent bracket 1. That nets 
you $1,646. 

Recap: Via stock di- 
vidends - $1,646; via cash 
dividends - $1,025; percent 
morevia S.D. -6Opercent. 

Hewitt gets 

straigh,t A’s 
Teresa Hewitt, a former 

Cass City resident, re- 
ceived straight A’s in her 
final semester at Central 
Michigan University. 

Miss Hewitt graduated 
May 12 and received a 
bachelor’s degree in 
therapeutic recreation. She 
works at the Lapeer Count 
Medical Care Facility. 

A 1980 Cass City High 
School graduate, she is the 
daughter of Amor West, 
4181 Sherman Street. 

Work worth more 
“An ounce of work i s  worth 
many pounds of words.” 

St. Francis D e  Sales 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

por 8-pack 

I 
I 
L 
1 

AddiiionalQmr~tities $ 1 89 P e r 8 - P a c k  

Offer Expires June 30,1984 
Stam bm: 

Quaker Maid Dai7 
I 
I 

$1.00 all on thm bpreks 

Quaker I 
M a i d  
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